



# The County of El Dorado

**Chief Administrative Office**

*Terri Daly, Chief Administrative Officer*

**Procurement & Contracts Division**

Phone (530)621-5830 Fax (530)295-2537

TO: ALL BIDDERS

RE: BID # 15-345-002  
Institutional Clothing Bedding and Toiletries

The apparent low qualified bidders for the subject bid are:

Bob Barker Company of Fuquay Varina, NC	All Categories
Pacific Care Products of San Francisco, CA	Category D: Toiletries only
Victory Supply, Inc. of Lexington, KY	Categories A, & B: Clothing and Footwear
Robinson Textiles of Gardena, CA	Category A: Clothing only

A spreadsheet is attached for your review.

This item is scheduled to be heard by the Board of Supervisors on Tuesday, 10/21/2014. Board of Supervisors Policy C-17, section 5.6.5, contains the procedure for the protest process. Copies are available upon request.

Following Board of Supervisors approval, blanket purchase orders will be issued to each bidder for the awarded period.

All bids are on file in the Procurement & Contracts Office, and are available to review between 8:00 a.m. – 12:00 p.m. and 1:00 p.m. – 5:00 p.m., Monday through Friday.

For questions, please contact Eric van Leeuwen, Buyer II (530) 621-5834.

Thank you for your participation in the competitive bid process.

Terri Daly,  
Chief Administrative Officer and Purchasing Agent

Bid # 15-345-002 - Institutional Clothing, Bedding and Toiletries

Evaluation \*

Category A - Clothing				(C) Bob Barker Company Fuquay Varina, NC	(D) Pacific Care Products San Francisco, CA	(F) Victory Supply, Inc. Lexington, KY	(H) Robinson Textiles Gardena, CA				
Bid Item #	Description	Unit of Measure	Estimated Annual Quantity	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
1	<b>V-Neck Shirts -</b>	Each	822								
	(Small - Large)		183	\$4.82	\$882.06	No Bid	No Bid	\$4.99	\$913.17	\$3.70	\$677.10
	(X-Large)		138	\$4.82	\$665.16	No Bid	No Bid	\$5.11	\$705.18	\$4.55	\$627.90
	(2X-Large)		183	\$4.82	\$882.06	No Bid	No Bid	\$5.31	\$971.73	\$4.55	\$832.65
	(3X-Large)		210	\$4.82	\$1,012.20	No Bid	No Bid	\$5.38	\$1,129.80	\$4.55	\$955.50
	(4X-Large)		39	\$4.82	\$187.98	No Bid	No Bid	\$6.49	\$253.11	\$4.55	\$177.45
	(5X-Large)		32	\$4.82	\$154.24	No Bid	No Bid	\$6.49	\$207.68	\$4.55	\$145.60
	(6X-Large)		32	\$4.82	\$154.24	No Bid	No Bid	\$6.49	\$207.68	\$5.90	\$188.80
	(8X-Large)		5	\$7.22	\$36.10	No Bid	No Bid	\$7.31	\$36.55	\$5.90	\$29.50
	<b>Sub-total</b>					\$3,974.04	No Bid		\$4,424.90		\$3,634.50
2	<b>Pull-on Trousers</b>	Each	1199								
	(Small - Large)		404	\$5.98	\$2,415.92	No Bid	No Bid	\$6.74	\$2,722.96	\$5.00	\$2,020.00
	(X-Large)		471	\$5.98	\$2,816.58	No Bid	No Bid	\$6.74	\$3,174.54	\$5.47	\$2,576.37
	(2X-Large)		204	\$5.98	\$1,219.92	No Bid	No Bid	\$6.99	\$1,425.96	\$5.47	\$1,115.88
	(3X-Large)		108	\$5.98	\$645.84	No Bid	No Bid	\$6.99	\$754.92	\$5.47	\$590.76
	(4X-Large)		12	\$5.98	\$71.76	No Bid	No Bid	\$8.04	\$96.48	\$5.47	\$65.64
	(5X-Large)		0	\$5.98	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$8.04	\$0.00	\$5.47	\$0.00
	(6X-Large)		0	\$5.98	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$8.34	\$0.00	\$6.90	\$0.00
	(8X-Large)		0	\$8.52	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$8.34	\$0.00	\$6.90	\$0.00
	<b>Sub-total</b>					\$7,170.02	No Bid		\$8,174.86		\$6,368.65
3	<b>Crew-Neck Pullover Sweat Shirt</b>	Each	264								
	(Small - Large)		60	\$6.45	\$387.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$4.98	\$298.80	No Bid	No Bid
	(X-Large)		36	\$6.45	\$232.20	No Bid	No Bid	\$5.24	\$188.64	No Bid	No Bid
	(2X-Large)		108	\$7.47	\$806.76	No Bid	No Bid	\$6.21	\$670.68	No Bid	No Bid
	(3X-4X -Large)		60	\$7.47	\$448.20	No Bid	No Bid	\$6.64	\$398.40	No Bid	No Bid
	(5X-Large)		0	\$8.22	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$6.91	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid
	(6X-Large)		0	\$9.15	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$7.44	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid
	<b>Sub-total</b>					\$1,874.16	No Bid		\$1,556.52		No Bid
4	<b>Sweatpants Gray</b>	Each	40								
	(Small - Medium)		20	\$6.45	\$129.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$7.22	\$144.40	No Bid	No Bid
	(Large - XLarge)		16	\$6.78	\$108.48	No Bid	No Bid	\$7.22	\$115.52	No Bid	No Bid
	(2XLarge)		3	\$7.14	\$21.42	No Bid	No Bid	\$9.34	\$28.02	No Bid	No Bid
	(3XLarge - 5XLarge)		0	\$8.33	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$10.74	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid
	(6X-Large)		0	\$9.15	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$12.24	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid
	<b>Sub-total</b>					\$258.90	No Bid		\$287.94		No Bid
5	<b>Thermal Top</b>	Dozen	25								
	(Small - X-Large)		2	\$34.33	\$68.66	No Bid	No Bid	\$31.47	\$62.94	No Bid	No Bid
	(2X-Large)		5	\$34.33	\$171.65	No Bid	No Bid	\$32.21	\$161.05	No Bid	No Bid
	(3X-Large)		7	\$40.98	\$286.86	No Bid	No Bid	\$34.11	\$238.77	No Bid	No Bid
	(4X-Large)		5	\$40.98	\$204.90	No Bid	No Bid	\$35.44	\$177.20	No Bid	No Bid
	(6X-Large)		6	\$40.98	\$245.88	No Bid	No Bid	\$37.11	\$222.66	No Bid	No Bid
<b>Sub-total</b>					\$977.95	No Bid		\$862.62		No Bid	

6	Blue Jeans	Each	130								
	(28" - 42" waist)		128	\$13.69	\$1,752.32	No Bid	No Bid	\$13.24	\$1,694.72	No Bid	No Bid
	(44" - 50" waist)		2	\$14.69	\$29.38	No Bid	No Bid	\$14.24	\$28.48	No Bid	No Bid
	(52" - 56" waist)		0	\$16.28	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$15.81	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid
	<b>Sub-total</b>				\$1,781.70		No Bid		\$1,723.20		No Bid
<b>Category A - Clothing</b>				<b>(C) Bob Barker Company Fuquay Varina, NC</b>		<b>(D) Pacific Care Products San Francisco, CA</b>		<b>(F) Victory Supply, Inc. Lexington, KY</b>		<b>(H) Robinson Textiles Gardena, CA</b>	
<b>Item #</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Unit of Measure</b>	<b>Estimated Annual Quantity</b>	<b>Unit Price</b>	<b>Extended Price</b>	<b>Unit Price</b>	<b>Extended Price</b>	<b>Unit Price</b>	<b>Extended Price</b>	<b>Unit Price</b>	<b>Extended Price</b>
7	Men's Gym Shorts	Each	546								
	(Small - Large)		234	\$3.38	\$790.92	No Bid	No Bid	\$4.11	\$961.74	\$4.25	\$994.50
	(X-Large)		180	\$3.38	\$608.40	No Bid	No Bid	\$4.11	\$739.80	\$4.25	\$765.00
	(2X-Large)		120	\$3.95	\$474.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$4.61	\$553.20	\$4.25	\$510.00
	(3X-Large)		12	\$3.95	\$47.40	No Bid	No Bid	\$4.61	\$55.32	\$4.25	\$51.00
	(4X-Large)		0	\$4.54	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$4.97	\$0.00	\$4.25	\$0.00
	(5X-Large)		0	\$6.25	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$4.97	\$0.00	\$4.25	\$0.00
	<b>Sub-total</b>				\$1,920.72		No Bid		\$2,310.06		\$2,320.50
8	TriStitch Jumpsuit Uniforms	Each	60								
	(Small - XLarge)		48	\$11.23	\$539.04	No Bid	No Bid	\$12.47	\$598.56	\$11.50	\$552.00
	(2-XLarge)		0	\$11.23	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$12.47	\$0.00	\$11.50	\$0.00
	(3-XLarge)		12	\$11.23	\$134.76	No Bid	No Bid	\$13.34	\$160.08	\$11.50	\$138.00
	(4X-Large)		0	\$11.23	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$13.34	\$0.00	\$11.50	\$0.00
	(5X-Large)		0	\$11.23	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$14.34	\$0.00	\$11.50	\$0.00
	(6X-Large)		0	\$11.23	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$14.34	\$0.00	\$11.50	\$0.00
	<b>Sub-total</b>				\$673.80		No Bid		\$758.64		\$690.00
9	Disposable Coveralls	Case	10	\$30.58	\$305.80		\$0.00	\$42.00	\$420.00	No Bid	No Bid
	<b>Sub-total</b>				\$305.80		No Bid		\$420.00		No Bid
10	Multi-Purpose Nightshirt	Each	170								
	(Small - Large)		131	\$4.32	\$565.92	No Bid	No Bid	\$4.97	\$651.07	No Bid	No Bid
	(X-Large)		0	\$4.32	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$4.97	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid
	(2-XLarge)		0	\$4.32	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$4.97	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid
	(3-XLarge)		39	\$4.32	\$168.48	No Bid	No Bid	\$6.97	\$271.83	No Bid	No Bid
	(4X-Large)		0	\$4.32	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$6.97	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid
	(5X-Large)		0	\$4.32	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$6.97	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid
	(6X-Large)		0	\$4.32	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$6.97	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid
	<b>Sub-total</b>				\$734.40		No Bid		\$922.90		No Bid
11	Men's Brief's (Fruit of the Loom)	Case	6								
	(Small - Large)		6	\$17.35	\$104.10	No Bid	No Bid	\$16.91	\$101.46	No Bid	No Bid
	(X-Large)		0	\$17.35	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$16.91	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid
	(2X-Large)		0	\$25.93	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$23.91	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid
	(3X-Large)		0	\$28.93	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$23.91	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid
	<b>Sub-total</b>				\$104.10		No Bid		\$101.46		No Bid
12	Men's Brief's (White Poly/cotton)	Dozen	369								
	(Small - Large)		206	\$9.83	\$2,024.98	No Bid	No Bid	\$9.69	\$1,996.14	No Bid	No Bid
	(X-Large)		129	\$9.83	\$1,268.07	No Bid	No Bid	\$9.69	\$1,250.01	No Bid	No Bid
	(2X-Large)		5	\$11.56	\$57.80	No Bid	No Bid	\$11.04	\$55.20	No Bid	No Bid
	(3X-Large)		29	\$12.35	\$358.15	No Bid	No Bid	\$11.87	\$344.23	No Bid	No Bid
	(4X-Large)		0	\$12.35	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$11.87	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid
	(5X-Large)		0	\$13.90	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$13.24	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid
	(6X-Large)		0	\$13.90	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$13.24	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid
	<b>Sub-total</b>				\$3,709.00		No Bid		\$3,645.58		No Bid

Category A - Clothing				(C) Bob Barker Company Fuquay Varina, NC		(D) Pacific Care Products San Francisco, CA		(F) Victory Supply, Inc. Lexington, KY		(H) Robinson Textiles Gardena, CA	
Item #	Description	Unit of Measure	Estimated Annual Quantity	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
13	Men's Boxer Shorts	Dozen	91								
	(Small - Large)		32	\$13.68	\$437.76	No Bid	No Bid	\$12.91	\$413.12	No Bid	No Bid
	(X-Large)		36	\$15.42	\$555.12	No Bid	No Bid	\$13.97	\$502.92	No Bid	No Bid
	(2X-Large)		3	\$17.12	\$51.36	No Bid	No Bid	\$15.31	\$45.93	No Bid	No Bid
	(3X-Large)		20	\$18.54	\$370.80	No Bid	No Bid	\$15.31	\$306.20	No Bid	No Bid
	(4X-Large)		0	\$21.00	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$16.74	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid
	(5X-Large)		0	\$22.48	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$16.74	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid
	(6X-Large)		0	\$24.32	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$19.11	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid
	<b>Sub-total</b>				\$1,415.04		No Bid		\$1,268.17		No Bid
14	Sports Bra	Dozen	109								
	(Size 32)		19	\$20.18	\$383.42	No Bid	No Bid	\$19.44	\$369.36	No Bid	No Bid
	(Size 34)		31	\$20.18	\$625.58	No Bid	No Bid	\$19.44	\$602.64	No Bid	No Bid
	(Size 36)		25	\$20.18	\$504.50	No Bid	No Bid	\$19.44	\$486.00	No Bid	No Bid
	(Size 38)		18	\$20.18	\$363.24	No Bid	No Bid	\$19.44	\$349.92	No Bid	No Bid
	(Size 40)		7	\$20.18	\$141.26	No Bid	No Bid	\$19.44	\$136.08	No Bid	No Bid
	(Size 42)		5	\$21.32	\$106.60	No Bid	No Bid	\$20.95	\$104.75	No Bid	No Bid
	(Size 44)		4	\$21.32	\$85.28	No Bid	No Bid	\$20.95	\$83.80	No Bid	No Bid
	(Size 46)		0	\$21.32	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$20.95	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid
	(Size 48)		0	\$21.32	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$23.41	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid
	(Size 50)		0	\$21.32	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$23.41	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid
	(Size 52)		0	\$24.75	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$24.11	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid
	<b>Sub-total</b>				\$2,209.88		No Bid		\$2,132.55		No Bid
15	Girls' Panties	Dozen	214								
	(Small Size: 5 - 7)		170	\$6.98	\$1,186.60	No Bid	No Bid	\$6.91	\$1,174.70	No Bid	No Bid
	(Medium Size: 8 - 10))		39	\$8.12	\$316.68	No Bid	No Bid	\$7.91	\$308.49	No Bid	No Bid
	(Large Size: 11 - 14)		5	\$8.66	\$43.30	No Bid	No Bid	\$8.81	\$44.05	No Bid	No Bid
	(XLarge Size: 15-18)		0	\$8.95	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$9.61	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid
	<b>Sub-total</b>				\$1,546.58		No Bid		\$1,527.24		No Bid
16	Women's Panties	Dozen	103								
	(Small Size: 5 - 7)		76	\$7.12	\$541.12	No Bid	No Bid	\$6.91	\$525.16	No Bid	No Bid
	(Medium Size: 8 - 10))		27	\$7.99	\$215.73	No Bid	No Bid	\$7.91	\$213.57	No Bid	No Bid
	(Large Size: 11 - 14)		0	\$8.75	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$8.81	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid
	(XLarge Size: 15-18)		0	\$9.88	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$9.61	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid
	<b>Sub-total</b>				\$756.85		No Bid		\$738.73		No Bid
17	Women's Brief's (Fruit of the Loom)	Dozen	88								
	(Small Size: 5 - 7)		72	\$14.10	\$1,015.20	No Bid	No Bid	\$13.47	\$969.84	No Bid	No Bid
	(Medium Size: 8 - 10))		16	\$14.10	\$225.60	No Bid	No Bid	\$13.47	\$215.52	No Bid	No Bid
	(Large Size: 11 - 14)		0	Not Avail	Not Avail	No Bid	No Bid	Not Avail	Not Avail	No Bid	No Bid
	(XLarge Size: 15-18)		0	Not Avail	Not Avail	No Bid	No Bid	Not Avail	Not Avail	No Bid	No Bid
	<b>Sub-total</b>				\$1,240.80		No Bid		\$1,185.36		No Bid
18	T-Shirt - 100 Preshrunk Cotton	Dozen	169								
	(Small- XLarge)		123	\$25.37	\$3,120.51	No Bid	No Bid	\$17.11	\$2,104.53	No Bid	No Bid
	2XL - 4XL		40	\$31.89	\$1,275.60	No Bid	No Bid	\$32.11	\$1,284.40	No Bid	No Bid
	5XL - 6XL		6	\$37.00	\$222.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$33.11	\$198.66	No Bid	No Bid
	7XL		0	\$45.00	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$72.11	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid
	<b>Sub-total</b>				\$4,618.11		No Bid		\$3,587.59		No Bid

Evaluation \*

Category A - Clothing				(C) Bob Barker Company Fuquay Varina, NC		(D) Pacific Care Products San Francisco, CA		(F) Victory Supply, Inc. Lexington, KY		(H) Robinson Textiles Gardena, CA	
Item #	Description	Unit of Measure	Estimated Annual Quantity	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
19	T-Shirt (Heavy weight - colors)	Each	888								
	(Med-Large)		243	\$2.89	\$702.27	No Bid	No Bid	\$2.71	\$658.53	No Bid	No Bid
	(X-Large)		180	\$2.89	\$520.20	No Bid	No Bid	\$2.71	\$487.80	No Bid	No Bid
	(2X-Large)		231	\$3.99	\$921.69	No Bid	No Bid	\$3.87	\$893.97	No Bid	No Bid
	(3X-Large)		180	\$4.22	\$759.60	No Bid	No Bid	\$3.99	\$718.20	No Bid	No Bid
	(4X-Large)		60	\$4.22	\$253.20	No Bid	No Bid	\$4.11	\$246.60	No Bid	No Bid
	(5X-Large)		0	\$4.22	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$4.11	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid
	(6X-Large)		0	\$4.22	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$4.47	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid
	<b>Sub-total</b>				\$3,156.96		No Bid		\$3,005.10		No Bid
20	T-Shirt (Heavy Weight - white)	Dozen	107								
	(Medium - Large)		32	\$20.12	\$643.84	No Bid	No Bid	\$17.11	\$547.52	No Bid	No Bid
	(X-Large)		31	\$20.12	\$623.72	No Bid	No Bid	\$17.11	\$530.41	No Bid	No Bid
	(2X-Large)		18	\$34.48	\$620.64	No Bid	No Bid	\$32.11	\$577.98	No Bid	No Bid
	(3X-Large)		23	\$34.48	\$793.04	No Bid	No Bid	\$32.11	\$738.53	No Bid	No Bid
	(4X-Large)		3	\$35.92	\$107.76	No Bid	No Bid	\$32.11	\$96.33	No Bid	No Bid
	(5X-Large)		0	\$35.92	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$33.11	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid
	(6X-Large)		0	\$35.92	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$33.11	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid
	<b>Sub-total</b>				\$2,789.00		No Bid		\$2,490.77		No Bid
21	T-Shirt (Outerwear)	Each	572								
	(Medium - Large)		72	\$2.77	\$199.44	No Bid	No Bid	\$2.51	\$180.72	No Bid	No Bid
	(X-Large)		256	\$2.95	\$755.20	No Bid	No Bid	\$2.51	\$642.56	No Bid	No Bid
	(2X-Large)		160	\$3.28	\$524.80	No Bid	No Bid	\$3.31	\$529.60	No Bid	No Bid
	(3X-Large)		148	\$3.77	\$557.96	No Bid	No Bid	\$3.39	\$501.72	No Bid	No Bid
	(4X-Large)		0	\$3.77	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$3.91	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid
	(6X-Large)		0	Not Avail	Not Avail	No Bid	No Bid	\$3.91	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid
	(6X-Large)		0	\$4.25	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$4.11	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid
	<b>Sub-total</b>				\$2,037.40		No Bid		\$1,854.60		No Bid
22	Terry Sport Sock (low cut)	Dozen	191								
	Men's (#M4595)		115	\$5.25	\$603.75	No Bid	No Bid	\$5.41	\$622.15	No Bid	No Bid
	Ladies/Juveniles (#A4595)		76	\$5.25	\$399.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$5.41	\$411.16	No Bid	No Bid
	<b>Sub-total</b>				\$1,002.75		No Bid		\$1,033.31		No Bid
23	Sock - Over-The-Calf (one size fits all)	Dozen	558	\$6.98	\$3,894.84	No Bid	No Bid	\$5.97	\$3,331.26	No Bid	No Bid
	<b>Sub-total</b>				\$3,894.84		No Bid		\$3,331.26		No Bid
<b>Category A Totals</b>					\$48,152.80				\$47,343.36		\$13,013.65
Additional Purchases Discount			\$500.00	5.00%	\$475.00	0.00%	\$0.00	10.00%	\$450.00	3.00%	\$485.00

Bid # 15-345-002 - Institutional Clothing, Bedding and Toiletries  
 Evaluation \*

Category B: Footware				(C) Bob Barker Company Fuquay Varina, NC	(D) Pacific Care Products San Francisco, CA	(F) Victory Supply, Inc. Lexington, KY	(H) Robinson Textiles Gardena, CA												
Item #	Description	Unit of Measure	Estimated Annual Quantity	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price								
24	Durable Canvas Deck Shoe (Whole Sizes: 3 - 16) (Half sizes: 5.5 - 11.5)	Pair	365	\$3.86	\$1,408.90	No Bid	No Bid	\$3.91	\$1,427.15	No Bid	No Bid								
			365									\$0.00	No Bid	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid			
			0																
<b>Sub-total</b>					\$1,408.90		\$0.00		\$1,427.15		No Bid								
25	Thong (heavy duty x-strap) (Small = Sizes 6 - 7) (Medium: Sizes 8 - 9) (Large: Sizes 10 - 11) (Xlarge) = Sizes 12 - 13 (2Xlarge = Sizes 14 - 15)	Dozen	52	\$8.56	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$12.32	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid								
			0									\$8.56	\$59.92	No Bid	No Bid	\$12.32	\$86.24	No Bid	No Bid
			7									\$8.56	\$59.92	No Bid	No Bid	\$12.32	\$86.24	No Bid	No Bid
			7									\$8.56	\$77.04	No Bid	No Bid	\$12.32	\$110.88	No Bid	No Bid
			9									\$8.56	\$248.24	No Bid	No Bid	\$12.32	\$357.28	No Bid	No Bid
			29																
<b>Sub-total</b>					\$445.12		No Bid		\$640.64		No Bid								
26	Men's Canvas Velcro Shoe (Whole Sizes: 4 - 17) (Half sizes: 5.5 - 11.5)	Pair	1488	\$6.28	\$9,344.64	No Bid	No Bid	\$4.99	\$7,425.12	No Bid	No Bid								
			1488									\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$4.99	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	
			0																
<b>Sub-total</b>					\$9,344.64		No Bid		\$7,425.12		No Bid								
27	Heavy Duty Canvas Step-In (Whole Sizes: 6 - 15)	Pair	1190	\$5.42	\$6,449.80	No Bid	No Bid	\$5.21	\$6,199.90	No Bid	No Bid								
			1190																
<b>Sub-Total</b>					\$6,449.80		No Bid		\$6,199.90		No Bid								
28	EVA Clogs (Whole Sizes: 4 - 17) (Half sizes: 5.5 - 11.5)	Dozen	28	\$48.90	\$1,369.20	No Bid	No Bid	\$44.20	\$1,237.60	No Bid	No Bid								
			28									\$48.90	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$44.20	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid
			0																
<b>Sub-total</b>					\$1,369.20		No Bid		\$1,237.60		No Bid								
29	EVA Step-Ins (Whole Sizes: 6 - 15)	Pair	760	\$4.90	\$3,724.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$3.97	\$3,017.20	No Bid	No Bid								
			760																
<b>Sub-Total</b>					\$3,724.00		No Bid		\$3,017.20		No Bid								

Category B Totals				\$22,741.66		#VALUE!		\$19,947.61		No Bid
Additional Purchases Discount	\$500.00	5.00%	\$475.00	0.00%	\$0.00	10.00%	\$450.00	0.00%	\$0.00	

Bid # 15-345-002 - Institutional Clothing, Bedding and Toiletries  
 Evaluation \*

Category C: Mattresses, Covers, Pillows, Pillowcases, Linens & Towels				(C) Bob Barker Company Fuquay Varina, NC		(D) Pacific Care Products San Francisco, CA		(F) Victory Supply, Inc. Lexington, KY		(H) Robinson Textiles Gardena, CA	
Item #	Description	Unit of Measure	Estimated Annual Quantity	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
30	Flame-Check Mattress - (30"x75"x4")	Each	253	\$38.02	\$9,619.06	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
31	Flame-Check Mattress - (25"x75"x4")	Each	100	\$35.15	\$3,515.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
32	Snag-Free Thermal Blankets	Each	76	\$9.97	\$757.72	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
33	Blanket (poly/acrylic/cotton blend)	Case	12	\$89.44	\$1,073.28	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
34	Pillowcase (T-130 thread count)	Dozen	9	\$8.82	\$79.38	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
35	Sheet (white T-130 thread - flat)	Dozen	81	\$34.24	\$2,773.44	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
36	Sheet (fitted poly/cotton blend)	Dozen	5	\$59.16	\$295.80	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
37	Pillow (lightweight poly core/soft vinyl)	Case	50	\$21.38	\$1,069.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
38	Towel (white - regular grade 25"x50")	Dozen	66	\$32.54	\$2,147.64	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
39	Towel (white- budget grade 24"x48")	Dozen	54	\$22.32	\$1,205.28	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
40	Sheet (white percale flat sheet 66x115)	Dozen	4	\$56.75	\$227.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
41	Washcloths (white regular grade 12x12)	Dozen	46	\$3.18	\$146.28	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
42	Towel (White - regular grade) 22" x 44"	Dozen	70	\$18.48	\$1,293.60	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Sub-total					\$24,202.48		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid
Additional Purchases Discount			\$500.00	5.00%	\$475.00	0.00%	\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00

Bid # 15-345-002 - Institutional Clothing and Bedding and Toiletries  
Evaluation \*

Category D: Toiletries				(C) Bob Barker Company Fuquay Varina, NC		(D) Pacific Care Products San Francisco, CA		(F) Victory Supply, Inc. Lexington, KY		(H) Robinson Textiles Gardena, CA	
Item #	Description	Unit of Measure	Estimated Annual Quantity	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
				43	Toothbrush - super shorty	Case	78	\$5.88	\$458.64	\$7.20	\$561.60
44	Toothbrush - nylon bristle	Case	8	\$9.53	\$76.24	\$14.40	\$115.20	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
45	Toothpaste - Nature Mint 6.4 oz	Case	18	\$36.25	\$652.50	\$36.00	\$648.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
46	Toothpaste - Nature Mint .85 oz	Case	55	\$19.84	\$1,091.20	\$17.28	\$950.40	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
47	Sanitary Toothbrush Caps	Case	8	\$7.33	\$58.64	\$36.00	\$288.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
48	Deodorant - alcohol free 1.6 oz	Case	19	\$6.12	\$116.28	\$10.20	\$193.80	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
49	Deodorant - maximum security	Case	3	\$36.22	\$108.66	\$36.00	\$108.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
50	Comb 5" black	Case	13	\$3.52	\$45.76	\$7.20	\$93.60	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
51	Toe Nail Clipper - no file	Case	8	\$7.00	\$56.00	\$9.00	\$72.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
52	Finger Nail Clipper - no file	Case	4	\$7.00	\$28.00	\$13.20	\$52.80	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
53	Maxi-Pad - beltless, powder free	Case	15	\$28.85	\$432.75	\$14.68	\$220.20	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
54	Lip therapy Vaseline .35 oz	Case	5	\$79.88	\$399.40	\$72.15	\$360.75	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
55	Tampons - individually wrapped	Case	15	\$32.73	\$490.95	\$29.99	\$449.85	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
56	Sta-Rite Ponytail holder	Cards	46	\$12.00	\$552.00	\$1.30	\$59.80	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
57	Shampoo total Body (Dail body & hair)	Case	7	\$40.80	\$285.60	\$39.00	\$273.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
58	Razor - twin blade disposable	Case	20	\$36.94	\$738.80	\$39.00	\$780.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
59	Shampoo - individual .34 oz	Case	19	\$50.88	\$966.72	\$42.00	\$798.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
60	Shampoo - Pert Plus Dandruff	Case	12	\$22.80	\$273.60	\$17.95	\$215.40	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
61	Barbicide - EPA registred	Case	4	\$87.48	\$349.92	\$76.00	\$304.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
62	Clorox - Disinfecting wipes	Case	20	\$37.11	\$742.20	\$50.21	\$1,004.20	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
63	Shave Cream - brushless .85 oz	Case	2	\$34.28	\$68.56	\$21.60	\$43.20	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
64	Soap - antibacterial deodorant 1.25 oz.	Case	17	\$54.56	\$927.52	\$49.50	\$841.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
65	Hand sanitizer - antimicrobial hand gel	Case	11	\$66.81	\$734.91	\$41.77	\$459.47	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
66	Antacid - calcium carbonate	Case	255	\$5.00	\$1,275.00	\$6.00	\$1,530.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
67	Non-Aspirin - regular strength 325 mg	Case	48	\$6.25	\$300.00	\$8.00	\$384.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
68	Ibuprofen - 200 mg	Case	23	\$16.55	\$380.65	\$9.00	\$207.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
69	Golf Pencil - 3" no eraser	Case	73	\$4.02	\$293.46	\$7.20	\$525.60	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
70	Toothpaste - fluoride .6 oz	Case	19	\$15.94	\$302.86	\$15.84	\$300.96	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
71	Soap - antibacterial deodorant .5 oz	Case	2	\$39.95	\$79.90	\$55.00	\$110.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
72	Deodorant - freshscent gel pack .12 oz	Case	2	\$42.95	\$85.90	\$42.00	\$84.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
73	Deodorant Stick maximum security	Case	34	\$40.18	\$1,366.12	\$36.00	\$1,224.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
74	Tampons - w/ cardboard applicators	Case	4	\$42.90	\$171.60	\$49.50	\$198.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
75	Laundry Bags - biodegradable 26x33	Case	6	\$62.88	\$377.28	\$44.12	\$264.72	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
76	Hairbrush - vented 7 3/4"	Case	38	\$4.18	\$158.84	\$4.00	\$152.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
77	Soap - Dial basic liquid	Case	12	\$52.65	\$631.80	\$39.00	\$468.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
78	Conditioner Packets - Dial .25oz	Case	3	\$50.65	\$151.95	\$78.00	\$234.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
79	Shampoo - Suave, green apple, 12 oz Lotion - Suave cocoa butter skin therapy	Case	12	\$13.92	\$167.04	\$12.68	\$152.16	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
81	Custom Kits	Kit	5400	\$1.66	\$8,964.00	\$1.75	\$9,450.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Sub-total					\$24,461.45		\$24,304.01		No Bid		No Bid
Additional Purchases Discount			\$500.00	5.00%	\$475.00	8.00%	\$460.00	\$500.00	\$475.00		