From: Patrick Weddle

To: Pera, Robert@Wildlife

Cc: Myrna Tow; Kaylee Runkle

Subject: Re: @ Checks from Superior Courts
Date: Wednesday, May 1, 2024 12:58:23 PM

This Message Is From an External Sender
This message came from outside your organization.

Report Suspicious

Bob
Thanks for this. I will check with Myrna and agendize with Kaylee.

Patrick Weddle
916-425-7986
Shingle Springs, California USA

On May 1, 2024, at 9:55 AM, Pera, Robert@Wildlife
<Robert.Pera@wildlife.ca.gov> wrote:

Hi Pat. | checked with the court and the individual has a total of $7,500 to be paid,
which means there is still about $6,400 coming. The request | would have would
total about $1,000

Reconyx Hyperfire 2 License Plate Camera (X2) - $459.99¢ea - $920.00 total

(https://www.bhphotovideo.com/c/product/1503651-
REG/reconyx hl2x_hyperfire 2 license.html)

128gb SD card (X2) - $20ea - $40 total

(https://www.bhphotovideo.com/c/product/1692696-
REG/sandisk_sdsdxxd_128g_ancin_128gb_extreme_pro_uhs_i.html)

From the linked supplier they offer free shipping and has $91.20 in tax with a total
of $1,051.16

Thank you,
Lt. Bob Pera
California Department of Fish and Wildlife
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Law Enforcement Division

Alpine / Amador / El Dorado Counties
1701 Nimbus Rd

Rancho Cordova, CA. 95670
530-621-2705

robert.pera@wildlife.ca.gov

ublic afety nd Resource gProtection Hince 18717

From: Patrick Weddle <pweddle@icloud.com>

Sent: Friday, April 26, 2024 1:12 PM

To: Pera, Robert@Wildlife <Robert.Pera@wildlife.ca.gov>

Cc: Myrna Tow <myrna.tow@edcgov.us>; Jim Davies <jimdaviesforestry@gmail.com>;
Mike Denega <mdenega@comcast.net>; Dennis Byrne (byrne49@aol.com)
<byrned9@aol.com>; Joby Cefalu <jobycef@gmail.com>; Larry Robinson
<Flamelarry@yahoo.com>

Subject: Re: @ Checks from Superior Courts

WARNING: This message is from an external source. Verify the sender and exercise caution when
clicking links or opening attachments.

Bob

Just let me know your request and | will get it on the agenda
Pat

Patrick Weddle

916-425-7986
Shingle Springs, California USA

On Apr 26, 2024, at 10:46 AM, Pera, Robert@Wildlife
<Robert.Pera@wildlife.ca.gov> wrote:


mailto:robert.pera@wildlife.ca.gov
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Thank you Myrna. What would be the correct process to potentially
get an agenda item for the commission for a request for some
equipment to be purchased by the commission with some of this fine
money?

Lt. Bob Pera

California Department of Fish and Wildlife
Law Enforcement Division

Alpine / Amador / El Dorado Counties
1701 Nimbus Rd

Rancho Cordova, CA. 95670
530-621-2705

robert.pera@wildlife.ca.gov

ublic afety fAnd Resource gProtection Hince 18717

From: Myrna Tow <myrna.tow@edcgov.us>

Sent: Friday, April 26, 2024 10:40 AM

To: Jim Davies <jimdaviesforestry@gmail.com>; Mike Denega
<mdenega@comcast.net>; Dennis Byrne (byrne49@aol.com)
<BYRNE49@AQOL.COM>; Pera, Robert@Wildlife

<Robert.Pera@wildlife.ca.gov>; Joby Cefalu <jobycef@gmail.com>; Larry

Robinson <Flamelarry@yahoo.com>; Patrick Weddle

<pweddle@icloud.com>
Subject: @ Checks from Superior Courts

WARNING: This message is from an external source. Verify the sender and exercise
caution when clicking links or opening attachments.

Just wanted you to know that we just received two checks from
Superior Courts. They will be deposited into your account today!
Have a great weekend!

WARNING: This email and any attachments may contain private,
confidential, and privileged material for the sole use of the
intended recipient. Any unauthorized review, copying, or
distribution of this email (or any attachments) by other than the
intended recipient is strictly prohibited. If you are not the
intended recipient, please contact the sender immediately and
permanently delete the original and any copies of this email and
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any attachments.



