

**BID 21-680-035
Ammunition**

Category 1: Federal Ammunition						(A) San Diego Police Equipment Co. San Diego, CA		(B) Dooley Enterprises, Inc. Anaheim, CA		(C) Miwall Corporation Grass Valley, CA	
Bid Item #	Part #	Description	Estimated Annual Usage	Rounds per Case	Est. Annual # of Cases	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension
1	XM193X	Federal, 5.56mm x 45mm, 55 grain, MCBT (M193 Ball Ammunition in 10 round stripper clips)	150,000	500	300	\$204.25	\$61,275.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
2	P40HST1	Federal, HST .40 Cal. 180 grain HST	70,000	1,000	70	\$379.80	\$26,586.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
3	AE40R1	Federal, (American Eagle) .40 cal. 180 grain FMJ	100,000	1,000	100	\$304.95	\$30,495.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
4	P45HST1	Federal HST .45 ACP cal. 230 grain, +PJHP	25,000	1,000	25	\$427.90	\$10,697.50	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
5	F-130-RS	Federal 2 3/4" 12 gauge Rifle Slug	1,000	250	4	\$162.10	\$648.40	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
6	AE45A	Federal (American Eagle) .45 ACP, 230 grain FMJ	15,000	1,000	15	\$341.33	\$5,119.95	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
7	AE38K	Federal (American Eagle).38 special +P, 130 grain FMJ	2,000	1,000	2	\$390.14	\$780.28	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
8	F-130-00	Federal 12 gauge classic, 2 3/4" , 00 buckshot, 12 pellet	4,000	250	16	\$154.80	\$2,476.80	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
9	AE223	Federal (American Eagle) .223 Rem. 55 grain, FMJBT	15,000	500	30	\$204.25	\$6,127.50	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
10	LE223T1	Federal Tactical Bonded .223 Rem. 55 grain, Bonded, SP	10,000	200	50	\$234.26	\$11,713.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
11	T223A	Federal Tactical Tru .223 Rem., 55 grain, Hi Shock SP	13,000	500	26	\$276.42	\$7,186.92	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
12	53921	Speer Gold DOT 38 Special +P, 135 grain GDHP-SB	1,000	1,000	1	\$407.38	\$407.38	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
13	53833	Speer, Lawman 38 special +P 158 grain, TMJFN	1,000	1,000	1	\$319.10	\$319.10	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
14	LE308T1	Federal .308 cal. Win. 165 grain Tactical Bonded	10,000	200	50	\$318.54	\$15,927.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
15	24446	Speer Gold DOT .223 Rem. 55 grain GDSP	10,000	500	20	\$269.88	\$5,397.60	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
16	P9HST1	Federal 9MM, 124 grain, JHP	2,500	1,000	3	\$344.54	\$861.35	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
17	AE9N1	Federal 9MM, 124 grain, FMJ	2,500	1,000	3	\$283.55	\$708.88	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
18	TGL12	Federal 12 gauge Top Gun Target, 2 3/4" #9	1,000	250	4	\$76.20	\$304.80	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
19	P9HST2	Federal 9MM, HST 147 grain JHP	42,000	1,000	42	\$344.54	\$14,470.68	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
20	AE9FP	Federal 9MM, 147 grain, FMJ	121,000	1,000	121	\$216.85	\$26,238.85	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
21	AE9AP	Federal 9MM, 124 grain, FMJ round nose	1,000	1,000	1	\$216.85	\$216.85	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
22	AE9DP	Federal 9MM, 115 grain, FMJ	1,000	1,000	1	\$216.85	\$216.85	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
		Subtotal					\$228,175.69		\$0.00		\$0.00
		Less 5% LVP				0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00
		Less Terms Discount				0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00

BID 21-680-035
Ammunition

		Evaluation (Does not include Sales Tax)					\$228,175.69		\$0.00		\$0.00
Terms Delivery ARO						Net 30 Days 180-420 Days ARO		NO BID		NO BID	

**BID 21-680-035
Ammunition**

Category 2: Winchester Ammunition						(A) San Diego Police Equipment Co. San Diego, CA		(B) Dooley Enterprises, Inc. Anaheim, CA		(C) Miwall Corporation Grass Valley, CA	
Bid Item #	Part #	Description	Estimated Annual Usage	Rounds per Case	Est. Annual # of Cases	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension
23	RA45T	Winchester, Ranger .45 Cal. JHP 230 grain, T-Series	5000	500	10	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$100.89	\$1,008.90	\$0.00	\$0.00
24	AASC129	Winchester 12 gauge, AA Trap 1 1/8" oz. load, #9 shot	2,000	250	8	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$81.36	\$650.88	\$0.00	\$0.00
25	AAM129	Winchester 12 gauge, AA Trap 1 1/8" oz. load, #9 shot	2,000	250	8	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$81.36	\$650.88	\$0.00	\$0.00
26	RA1200	Winchester 12 gauge 00 Buckshot, 9 pellet, low recoil	10,000	250	40	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$123.57	\$4,942.80	\$0.00	\$0.00
27	XB1200	Winchester 12 gauge 00 Buckshot, 9 pellet	10,000	250	40	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$123.57	\$4,942.80	\$0.00	\$0.00
28	RA12RS15	Winchester 12 gauge Slug, 1oz. Low recoil	8,000	250	32	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$134.29	\$4,297.28	\$0.00	\$0.00
29	X12RS15	Winchester 12 gauge, 1oz. Super-X Slug	8,000	250	32	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$134.29	\$4,297.28	\$0.00	\$0.00
30	XBP12	Winchester 12 gauge Black Powder Blanks, Super-X	1,000	250	4	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$228.66	\$914.64	\$0.00	\$0.00
		Subtotal					\$0.00		\$21,705.46		\$0.00
		Less 5% LVP				0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00
		Less Terms Discount				0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00
		Evaluation (Does not include Sales Tax)					\$0.00		\$21,705.46		\$0.00
		Terms Delivery ARO				NO BID		Net 30 Days 3-120 Days ARO		NO BID	

**BID 21-680-035
Ammunition**

Category 3: Hornady Ammunition						(A) San Diego Police Equipment Co. San Diego, CA		(B) Dooley Enterprises, Inc. Anaheim, CA		(C) Miwall Corporation Grass Valley, CA	
Bid Item #	Part #	Description	Estimated Annual Usage	Rounds per Case	Est. Annual # of Cases	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension
31	83276	Hornady, .223 Rem. 55 grain TAP	90,000	200	450	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$135.00	\$60,750.00
32	80965	Hornady, .308 Win. 168 grain TAP AMAX	10,000	200	50	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$210.00	\$10,500.00
33	82300	Hornady, .338 Lapua 285 grain ELD-M	1,000	120	8	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$470.00	\$3,916.67
34	8270	Hornady, 50 BMG 750 grain AMAX	1,000	100	10	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$520.00	\$5,200.00
35	80905	Hornady, .308 ELD	1,000	200	5	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$210.00	\$1,050.00
36	80985	Hornady, .308 GMX	1,000	200	5	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$330.00	\$1,650.00
37	81505	Hornady, 6.5 Creed 147 grain ELD	1,000	200	5	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$235.00	\$1,175.00
38	80725	Hornady, .308 ELD	1,000	200	5	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$210.00	\$1,050.00
39	83295	Hornady, .223 GMX - Discontinued	1,000	200	5	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
40	80295	Hornady, .223 GMX 53 grain TAP PATROL	1,000	200	5	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$185.00	\$925.00
41	8452	Hornady, .9MM 124 grain - Discontinued	5,000	500	10	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
42	90215	Hornady, .9MM +P 124 grain Flexlock	4000	500	8	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$220.00	\$1,760.00
		Subtotal					\$0.00		\$0.00		\$87,976.67
		Less 5% LVP				0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00
		Less Terms Discount				0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00
		Evaluation (Does not include Sales Tax)					\$0.00		\$0.00		\$87,976.67
Terms Delivery ARO						NO BID		NO BID		Net 30 Days 120 Days ARO	

BID 21-680-035
Ammunition

Category 4: CCI Ammunition						(A) San Diego Police Equipment Co. San Diego, CA		(B) Dooley Enterprises, Inc. Anaheim, CA		(C) Miwall Corporation Grass Valley, CA	
Bid Item #	Part #	Description	Estimated Annual Usage	Rounds per Case	Est. Annual # of Cases	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension
43	0047	CCI Velocitor .22 cal, Long Rifle 40 grain Copper Plated Hollow Point (CPHP)	5,000	5,000	1	\$492.20	\$492.20	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
44	925CC	CCI Copper .22 cal, Long Rifle 21 grain CHP	5,000	5,000	1	\$754.35	\$754.35	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
		Subtotal					\$1,246.55		\$0.00		\$0.00
		Less 5% LVP				0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00
		Less Terms Discount				0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00
		Evaluation (Does not include Sales Tax)					\$1,246.55		\$0.00		\$0.00
Terms Delivery ARO						Net 30 Days 180-420 Days ARO		NO BID		NO BID	