From

Toi ron Faia.
Subject: RE: EMD SETTLEMENT
Date: Wednesday, May 24, 2003 1:13:48 A

Thank you so much
Sent from Yahoo Mail on Android
On Wed, May 24, 2023 at 8:28 AM, Aron Faria
<Aron.Faria@edcgov.us> wrote:

Good moming,

Iwas just told that the county has tentatively accepted your request. We are drafting a response now and will be contacting you about how to move forward. 1 just wanted to give you that update, let me know if you have any questions.

Aron Faria

Supervising Hazmat Specialist

El Dorado County Environmental Management Department
(530) 621-6656

Aon.faria@edcgov.us

From: Aron Faria

Sent: Tuesday, May 16,2023 9:30 AM

To: Stefka Dimitrova <sdkimports@yahoo.com>
Subject: RE: EMD SETTLEMENT

Good moming,

Thank you for sending that over. T have sent this document up the chain and we will work on expediting this request. Ill let you know as soon as I find out how to move forward with issuing a check.

Aron Faria

Supervising Hazmat Specialist

El Dorado County Environmental Management Department
(530) 621-6656

Aron.faria@edegov.us

From: Stefka Dimitrova < (@yaho
Sent: Monday, May 15, 2023 12:25 PM
To: Aron Faria <. a@edegov.us>
Subject: RE: EMD SETTLEMENT

Hiconfirm if received my email from this morning, please.
Thank you.
Stefka Dimitrova

Sent from Yahoo Mail on Android

On Mon, May 15, 2023 at 8:53 AM, Stefka Dimitrova

<sdkimports@yahoo.com> wrote:

efka D. Dimitrova

American Gas
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please contact me via

email: sdkimgorts@yahoo.com |

 Phone: 91 6/342-0402

va Date: 05//3/;2’0;&3

Signature

Stefka D. Dimi
i

Good morning Aron Faria,

Tam using my oldest phone to email it, because I lucked my new phone.

However I receiving phone calls

Please call me when you get a chance. Thank you

ent from Yahoo Mail on Android
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On Thu, May 11, 2023 at 1:33 PM, Aron Faria
<Aron.Faria@edcgov.us> wrote:

Good afternoon,

‘Thanks for sending that over. After passing it along to upper management it was determined that your $20,000 settlement offer was not accepted. The amount that will be accepted to close out the settlement order is $25,000. If you would like to agree to that amount, please send us an updated signed
settlement letter for $25,000.

Aron Faria

Supervising Hazmat Specialist

El Dorado County Environmental Management Department
(530) 621-6636

Aron faria@edegov.us

From: Stefka Dimitrova <sdkimports@yahoo.com>
Senr Tuesday, May 9, 2023 5:02 PM

ron Faria <Aron Faria@edcgov.us>
Sllb]ecl. EMD SETTLEMENT

WARNING: This crail and any atachment may contan privat,confidenia, and pivleged matral forte sole u o he itended ecipient. Any unauthorizedreview; copying,or disrbuton of thiscmil(or any atachments) by oer thn the inended recipien i ety proibited. I you s ot
the intended recipient, pleas ender andp elete the original and any copies of this email and any attachments.

WARNING: This email and any attachments may contain private, confidential, and privileged material for the sole use of the intended recipient. Any unauthorized revie
intended recipient, please contact the sender immediately and permanently et he original and any copies of this email and any attachments.

copying, or distribution of this email (or any attachments) by other than the intended recipient is strietly prohibited. If you are not the
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From: Aron Faria

To: Stefka Dimitrova

Subject: RE: Re Amercian gas, judgment settlement
Date:

Tuesday, May 9, 2023 10:01:00 AM

Good morning,

According to upper management, the lowest we can go is $25,000. Please let me know if you want to proceed with settling for this amount.

Aron Faria

Supervising Hazmat Specialist

El Dorado County Environmental Management Department
(530) 621-6656

Aron faria@edcgov.us

From: Stefka Dimitrova <sdkimports@yahoo.com>
Sent: Tuesday, May 9, 2023 9:58 AM

To: Aron Faria <Aron.Faria@edcgov.us>

Subject: RE: Re Amercian gas, judgment settlement

Can | ask for settlement of
$20 000.00 one time payment, please.

It's very hard this days to do any net income.
This winter was bad news, before that was a Covid, Caldor fire ,sale taxes was raised, district taxes too on 1.5%.

And
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Can | ask for settlement of
$20 000.00 one time payment,
please.

It's very hard this days to do any net
income.

This winter was bad news, before
that was a Covid, Caldor fire ,sale
taxes was raised, district taxes too
on 1.5%.
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| do appreciate ,thank you.

Sent from Yahoo Mail on Android

On Mon, May 8, 2023 at 3:42 PM, Aron Faria
<Aron.Faria@edcgov.us> wrote:
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Good afternoon,

Upper management has looked over your request. Your current offer of $15,000 has been rejected. The $30,000 judgement can be settled for $25,000. If you agree with
that amount please send a revised letter stating that amount to me and | will get the process moving. If you have any other questions or concerns, feel free to contact me.

Aron Faria

Supervising Hazmat Specialist
El Dorado County Environmental Management Department
(530) 621-6656

Aron.faria@edcgov.us

From: Stefka Dimitrova <sdkimports@yahoo.com>
Sent: Friday, May 5, 2023 11:44 AM

To: Aron Faria <Aron.Faria@edcgov.us>

Subject: Re: Re Amercian gas, judgment settlement

Aron Faria
Do you need me to mail the original letter to?

Let me know, please
Stefka Dimitrova

On Fri, May 5, 2023 at 11:36 AM, Stefka Dimitrova

<sdkimports@yahoo.com> wrote:

Sent from Yahoo Mail on Android

WARNING: This email and any attachments may contain private, confidential, and privileged material for the sole use of the intended recipient. Any unauthorized review,
copying, or distribution of this email (or any attachments) by other than the intended recipient is strictly prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please contact the

sender immediately and permanently delete the original and any copies of this email and any attachments.
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From: Aron Faria

To: sdkimports@yahoo.com
Subject: American Gas Judgement 5.23.18
Date: Wednesday, May 3, 2023 2:43:00 PM

Good afternoon,

Thanks for speaking with me today. As is turns out, a simple email will not be sufficient. Please send
us your written request with your signature in order to move this matter further. Please include the
following in your response to our department:

e Your name, address and facility name (American Gas)

e Our department information — Environmental Management Department 2850 Fairlane Ct.
Building “C” Placerville, CA 95667 Attn: Aron Faria

e Case number —PC 20180261 Entered into record on May 23, 2018

e A description of what you would like to do to settle the judgement. If you would like to pay a
lump sum, please state the amount and timeframe for the payment. Currently the amount
owed is $30,000.

e Sign and date the letter

If you have any questions, feel free to contact me. Once the letter has been completed you can mail
and/or email the signed letter to me.

Aron Faria

Supervising Hazmat Specialist

El Dorado County Environmental Management Department
(530) 621-6656

Aron.faria@edcgov.us
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