
Bid # 12-405-013 - Diesel Fuel
* Evaluation

Location/Category

Category I - Equip/Vehicle Tanks - (West 
Slope)  

As of 
10/31/2012

DOT Placerville - 2441 Headington Rd 3.2978$          $0.1600 $3.4578 3.2978$          $0.0500 $3.3478 3.2978$          $0.0360 $3.3338
Winterization Additive $0.0250 $0.0250 $0.0250 $0.0250 $0.0250 $0.0250
Sub total $3.4828 $3.3728 $3.3588
Local Vendor Preference 5.00% ($0.1741) 0.00% $0.0000 5.00% ($0.1679)
Terms Discount 0.00% $0.0000 0.00% $0.0000 0.00% $0.0000

Net Total $3.3087 $3.3728 $3.1909

Category II - Equip/Vehicle Tanks - 
(South Shore Locations)

DOT Meyers - 1121 Shakori Road 3.2978$          $0.2200 $3.5178 3.2978$          0.075 3.3728           3.2978$          0.0668 $3.3646
Winterization Additive $0.0250 $0.0250 0.025 0.0250           0.0300 $0.0300
Sub total $3.5428 3.3978           $3.3946
Local Vendor Preference 5.00% ($0.1771) 0.00% 0.0000 5.00% ($0.1697)
Terms Discount 0.00% $0.0000 0.00% 0.0000 0.00% $0.0000

Net Total $3.3657 3.3978$         $3.2249

Category III - Equip/Vehicle Tanks - 
(West Shore Locations)

DOT Tahoma - 7101 Wilson Road 3.2978$          $0.3500 $3.6478 3.2978$          No Bid No Bid 3.2978$          $0.3000 3.5978
Winterization Additive $0.0200 $0.0200 No Bid No Bid $0.0200 0.0200
Sub total $3.6678 3.6178
Local Vendor Preference 5.00% ($0.1834) 5.00% (0.1809)
Terms Discount 0.00% $0.0000 0.00% 0.0000

Net Total $3.4844 No Bid 3.4369
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(B) Ramos Oil Company,  
West Sacramento, CA
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Placerville, CA

(D) Flyers Energy
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(D) Flyers Energy      
Sparks, NV
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Category IV - Generator Fuel Tanks 
(West Slope Locations)

2441 Headington Road 3.2978$          $0.3700 $3.6678 3.2978$         No Bid No Bid 3.2978$         No Bid No Bid
Winterization Additive (All locations) $0.0250 $0.0250 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

360 Fair Lane (Building B $0.3700 $3.6678 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Winterization Additive (All locations) $0.0250 $0.0250 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

300 Forni Road, (Main Jail) $0.3700 $3.6678 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Winterization Additive (All locations) $0.0250 $0.0250 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

300 Fair Lane (Sheriff's Dept) $0.3700 $3.6678 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Winterization Additive (All locations) $0.0250 $0.0250 No Bid No Bid No Bid  No Bid 

Sub total $14.7712 No Bid No Bid No Bid  No Bid 
Local Vendor Preference 5.00% ($0.7386) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Terms Discount 0.00% 0.0000 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Net Total 14.0326 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Category V - Generator Fuel Tanks (East 
Slope Locations)

1121 Shakori Road 3.2978$          $0.4800 $3.7778 3.2978$         No Bid No Bid 3.2978$         $0.4500 $3.7478
Winterization Additive (All locations) $0.0250 $0.0250 No Bid No Bid $0.0200 $0.0200

1051 Al Tahoe Blvd. $0.4200 $3.7178 No Bid $0.3000 $3.5978
Winterization Additive (All locations) $0.0250 $0.0250 No Bid $0.0200 $0.0200

1041 Al Tahoe Blvd $0.4800 $3.7778 No Bid $0.3000 $3.5978
Winterization Additive (All locations) $0.0250 $0.0250 No Bid $0.0200 $0.0200

1360 Johnson Blvd. $0.4800 $3.7778 No Bid $0.3000 $3.5978
Winterization Additive (All locations) $0.0250 $0.0250 No Bid $0.0200 $0.0200 

Sub total $15.1512 No Bid $14.6212 
Local Vendor Preference 5.00% ($0.7576) No Bid 5.00% ($0.7311)
Terms Discount 0.00% $0.0000 No Bid 0.00% $0.0000

No Bid
Net Total $14.3936 No Bid $13.8901

 

(A) Hunt & Sons (B) Ramos Oil

(A) Hunt & Sons (B) Ramos Oil

(D) Flyers Energy

(D) Flyers Energy
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Category VI - Equipment & Generator 
Fuel Tanks (Union Mine Plant)

5700 Union Mine Road 3.2978$          $0.2000 $3.4978 3.2978$          No Bid No Bid 3.2978$          No Bid No Bid
Winterization Additive (All locations) $0.0250 $0.0250 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Sub totaal $3.5228 No Bid   No Bid 
Local Vendor Preference 5.00% ($0.1761) No Bid  No Bid
Terms Discount 0.00% $0.0000 No Bid  No Bid

Net Total $3.3467 No Bid No Bid

(A) Hunt & Sons (B) Ramos Oil (D) Flyers Energy
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