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Statement of Daniel T. Smith Jr., P.E. to the El Dorado  
County Board of Supervisors in Regards to Public Hearing for Design 

Review DR00-0011, November 4, 2008 
 
 
 
Members of the Board: 
 
My name is Dan Smith.  I am a registered Civil and Traffic Engineer in California.  
I am retained by the friends of Shingle Springs.  I’ve submitted a detailed formal 
statement on the project FEIR for the record.  I will highlight here just the critical 
issues. 
 
The project involves a driveway to Mother Lode Drive that is less than 50 feet 
downstream of the intersection with South Shingle and the eastbound freeway 
off-ramp.  Depending on how you interpret the relationship of the street 
nomenclature in the new General Plan to that in the County Standards, the 
driveway would need to be located at least 150 feet and more likely 250 feet from 
the intersection to conform.  Caltrans standards in the Highway Design Manual 
require that even a right-in/right-out driveway be located at least 200 feet from 
the intersection.  Thus, the project involves considerable compromise to the 
standards of both agencies.  These standards that would be compromised are 
based on scientific research of traffic operations and safety considerations and 
are representative of accepted operations and safety based standards in the 
industry. 
 
County staff have discretion to waive the County standard.  But that discretion 
must be exercised reasonably.  If the project were a low traffic intensity use, a 
waiver for the driveway might be reasonable because the traffic conflicts that 
compromise safety would be infrequent.  However, this project, a gas station and 
mini-mart is as high a traffic intensity use as could be imagined for the site, a 
circumstance that creates a high potential for traffic safety conflicts.  The 
proposed use is the traffic equivalent of building a 15 to 25–story office building 
on the footprint of the mini-mart plus fueling canopy, depending on whether daily 
or peak hour traffic is considered.  Nobody reasonable would suggest approving 
a 15 to 25 story office tower on this site or waiving a driveway standard to do so.  
But, from a traffic perspective, this is exactly what the County is being asked to 
do. 
 
The FEIR says waiving County driveway standards on Mother Lode is necessary 
because enforcing the driveway standards would completely deny access to the 
site.  This is nonsense.  The project also proposes a driveway to South Shingle.  
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Waiving standards for that driveway is less consequential and more reasonable 
because that driveway is upstream of the critical intersection.  If development on 
the site can’t survive without access from both streets, then the wrong kind of 
development is being proposed for the size and constraints of the site.  A 
reasonable use for the site might be, for example, a one or two story office 
building accessed solely via a driveway from South Shingle. 
 
Now consider Caltrans standards (a copy of the relevant Highway Design Manual 
section is attached).  They require a minimum of 200 feet from the intersection to 
the Mother Lode Driveway.  The County is doing a Caltrans Project Study Report 
for improvement of the interchange in the next few months.  That PSR will have 
to identify this project’s Mother Lode driveway, if approved here, as a Design 
Exception.  The FEIR says, if Caltrans doesn’t approve the Design Exception, 
Caltrans will have to pay to reacquire the access rights.  That is wrong.  The 
interchange improvement is a County-sponsored project.  It is the County that will 
have to pay.  And Caltrans is unlikely to grant design exception since it realizes 
the County has knowingly created need for that exception just months before 
filing the PSR.  So the County would be shooting itself in the foot by granting an 
exception to its design standards that it is not obligated to grant and that it 
reasonably should not grant. 
 
Finally, consider the mitigation the FEIR proposes to overcome the operational 
and safety defects the Mother Lode driveway would cause.  It proposes 
construction of a deceleration/right turning lane between the intersection and the 
driveway.  But that lane itself won’t conform to Highway Design Manual 
standards.  The manual indicates that transitions to turning lanes should be 
accomplished in a distance of 120 feet.  But there is less than 50 feet from where 
traffic can begin transitioning to where the driveway begins.  Ergo, vehicles won’t 
have fully transitioned into the right turn lane before beginning their turn into the 
driveway.  Hence, the proposed mitigation won’t solve the operational/safety 
problem it purports to mitigate.  Because there will be a large speed differential 
between vehicles coming off the freeway off ramp and going straight on Mother 
Lode when the light at the intersection is green and those trying to turn into the 
gas station/mini-mart, the project will cause an increased potential for high-speed 
collisions that cause significant injuries and property damage, not just minor rear-
enders.   
 
In sum, we trust you will realize this is the wrong project for this site and will deny 
the application and reject certification of the FEIR. 
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