

**Bid #07-863-011 Truck Tires & Related Services - East Slope  
Evaluation\***

**Schedule A: New Tires (Highway Tread)**

			Lilly's Tire Service South Lake Tahoe, CA
Tire Size	Load Range	Ply	Unit Price
4.80/4.00-8	A	2	\$ 14.66
8.25R15TR	J	18	\$ 261.04
225/70R19.5	F	12	\$ 251.19
245/70R19.5	F	12	\$ 262.64
265/70R19.5	F	12	\$ 291.24
10.00-20	F	12	\$ 193.68
10.00R20	G	14	\$ 274.80
10.00R-22.5	G	14	\$ 258.39
385/95R24	N	24	\$ 953.04
385/65R22.5	J	18	\$ 506.39
425/65RL22.5 (VS)	L	20	\$ 532.17
255/70R22.5	H	16	\$ 254.41
11R22.5	H	16	\$ 271.82
11R24.5	H	16	\$ 337.99
315/80R 22.5	L	20	\$ 596.12
315/80R22.5	L	20	\$ 596.12
315/80R22.5	L	20	\$ 373.61

**Schedule B: New Tires (Mud & Snow Tread, Drilled for Studs)**

			Lilly's Tire Service South Lake Tahoe, CA
Tire Size	Load Range	Ply	Unit Price
225/70R19.5	F	12	\$ 327.99
10.00-20	F	12	\$ 202.16
10.00R20	G	12	\$ 243.13
10.00R-22.5	G	12	\$ 371.67
255/70R22.5	H	16	\$ 352.96
315/80R22.5	L	20	\$ 520.19
315/80R22.5	L	20	\$ 480.59
11R22.5	H	16	\$ 339.77
11R24.5	H	16	\$ 379.77
11R22.5	G	14	\$ 324.77
11R24.5	G	14	\$ 364.77

**Bid #07-863-011 Truck Tires & Related Services - East Slope  
Evaluation\***

**Schedule C: New Tires/Traction Tread**

			Lilly's Tire Service South Lake Tahoe, CA
Tire Size	Load Range	Ply	Unit Price
14.00-20 (Rotary Plow or Blower) - Alliance	L	20	\$ 567.41
14.00-20 (Rotary Plow or Blower)	L	20	\$ 547.99
385/95R24 (Rotary Plow or Blower)	N	24	\$ 953.04
16.9-24	D	8	\$ 329.59
19.5L-24	E	10	\$ 468.79
15.5-25	F	12	\$ 319.99
17.5-25	F	12	\$ 502.66
18.4-30	D	8	\$ 718.66
14.00-24 (Rotary Plow or Blower)	L	20	\$ 382.24
14.00-24 (Motor Graders)	F	12	\$ 382.24
14.00-24 (Motor Graders)	F	12	\$ 278.86
14.00-24 (Motor Graders)	F	12	\$ 278.86
14.00-24 (Motor Graders)	F	12	\$ 394.56

**Bid #07-863-011 Truck Tires & Related Services - East Slope  
Evaluation\***

**Schedule D: New Tires/Special Equipment**

			Lilly's Tire Service South Lake Tahoe, CA
Tire Size	Load Range	Ply	Unit Price
8X2.2	A	2	\$ 16.99
145/70-6	A	2	\$ 14.83
4.10/3.50-4	A	2	\$ 15.92
4.10/3.50-6	A	2	\$ 17.10
5.30/4.50-6	C	6	\$ 18.26
6.50-10 (forklift)	E	10	\$ 76.79
4.80/4.00-8	A	2	\$ 21.59
4.80-12	B	4	\$ 28.79
7.50-15NHS (smooth)	F	12	\$ 141.59
12-16.5 skid steer extra reinforced side wall	F	12	\$ 117.59
12.5/80-18	E	10	\$ 436.22
11L16	E	10	\$ 115.99
7.00-12 (forklift)	E	10	\$ 101.59
160/50-20			No Bid

**Schedule E: Recaps Mud & Snow Tread, Drilled for Studs**

			Lilly's Tire Service South Lake Tahoe, CA
Tire Size	Load Range	Ply	Unit Price
10.00-20	F	12	\$ 133.10
10.00R20	G	14	\$ 133.10
225/70R19.5	F	12	\$ 104.20
11R22.5	H	16	\$ 133.10
11R24.5	H	16	\$ 146.20
315/80R22.5	L	20	\$ 141.91

**Bid #07-863-011 Truck Tires & Related Services - East Slope  
Evaluation\***

**Schedule F: Recap Highway Tread**

			Lilly's Tire Service South Lake Tahoe, CA
Tire Size	Load Range	Ply	Unit Price
10.00-20	F	12	\$ 113.10
10.00R20	G	14	\$ 113.10
255/70R22.5	H	16	\$ 108.38
11R22.5	H	16	\$ 113.10
11R24.5	H	16	\$ 134.20

**Schedule G: Recaps/Traction Tread**

			Lilly's Tire Service South Lake Tahoe, CA
Tire Size	Load Range	Ply	Unit Price
14.00-20	L	20	\$ 264.92
14.00-24	L	20	\$ 264.92
16.9-24	D	8	\$ 264.92
19.5L-24	E	10	\$ 330.17
15.5-25	F	12	\$ 268.10
17.5-25	F	12	\$ 359.26
18.4-30	D	8	\$ 379.60

**Schedule H: Recaps/Special Equipment**

			Lilly's Tire Service South Lake Tahoe, CA
Tire Size	Load Range	Ply	Unit Price
6.50-10 (forklift)	E	10	\$ 91.70
7.50-15NHS (smooth)	F	12	\$ 89.90
8.15-15 (forklift)	F	12	\$ 119.27
7.50-15NHS (forklift)	F	12	\$ 112.67
12-16.5skid steer extra reinforced side	F	12	\$ 132.23
11L16	E	10	\$ 108.76
12.5/80-18	E	10	\$ 168.75
7.00-12 (forklift)	E	10	\$ 109.08

**Bid #07-863-011 Truck Tires & Related Services - East Slope  
Evaluation\***

**Schedule I: Radial Casings**

			Lilly's Tire Service South Lake Tahoe, CA
Tire Size	Load Range	Ply	Unit Price
225/70R19.5	F	12	\$ 55.00
11R22.5	H	16	\$ 100.00
11R24.5	H	16	\$ 100.00

**Schedule J: New Tubes**

		Lilly's Tire Service South Lake Tahoe, CA
Tire Size		Unit Price
145/70-6		\$ 4.59
4.10/3.50-4		\$ 4.59
4.10/3.50-6		\$ 4.74
4.80-8		\$ 8.97
5.30/4.50-6		\$ 5.10
6.50-10		\$ 15.29
4.80/4.00-8		\$ 8.97
4.80-12		\$ 8.49
7.00-12		\$ 16.14
7.00-15		\$ 17.84
7.50-15NHS		\$ 17.84
8X2.2		\$ 8.49
8.15-15		\$ 14.99
7.50-16LT		\$ 11.04
11L16		\$ 18.69
12.5/80-18		\$ 26.10
9.50R16.5LT		\$ 13.60
8.25-15		\$ 14.99
8.25R-15		\$ 14.99
10.00-20		\$ 25.49
14.00-20		\$ 47.59
14.00-24		\$ 46.32
16.9-24		\$ 43.38
19.5L-24		\$ 48.54
15.5-25		\$ 49.39
17.5-25		\$ 51.99
18.4-30		\$ 41.09

**Bid #07-863-011 Truck Tires & Related Services - East Slope  
Evaluation\***

**Schedule K: Flat/Spot Repairs**

			<b>Lilly's Tire Service South Lake Tahoe, CA</b>	
<b>Tire Size</b>	<b>Svc.</b>	<b>Loc.</b>	<b>Unit Price</b>	
Truck 8.25-20 through 11.00-24.5 (each)	Flat Repair	Vendor Shop	\$	21.50
Truck 8.25-20 through 11.00-24.5 (per hour)	Flat Repair	County Yard	\$	50.00
Equipment 14.00-20 through 17.5-25	Flat Repair	Vendor Shop	\$	27.50
Equipment 14.00-20 through 17.5-25 (per	Flat Repair	County Yard	\$	50.00
Truck 8.25-20 through 11.00-24.5 (each)	Spot Repair	Vendor Shop	\$	21.50
Truck 8.25-20 through 11.00-24.5 (per hour)	Spot Repair	County Yard	\$	50.00
Equipment 14.00-20 through 17.5-25	Spot Repair	Vendor Shop	\$	27.50
Equipment 14.00-20 through 17.5-25 (per	Spot Repair	County Yard	\$	50.00

**Schedule L: Section Repairs**

		<b>Lilly's Tire Service South Lake Tahoe, CA</b>	
<b>Tire Size</b>	<b>Unit of Measure</b>	<b>Unit Price</b>	
10.00-20	each	\$	21.50
10.00-22.5	each	\$	21.50
11.00-24.5	each	\$	21.50
14.00-20	each	\$	27.50
14.00-24	each	\$	27.50
16.8-24	each	\$	27.50
19.5-24	each	\$	27.50
15.5-25	each	\$	27.50
17.5-25	each	\$	27.50

**Bid #07-863-011 Truck Tires & Related Services - East Slope  
Evaluation\***

**Schedule M: Dismount/Balance/Mount**

		Lilly's Tire Service South Lake Tahoe, CA
Tire Size	Service	Unit Price
8.25-20 to 11.00-24.5	Bubble Bal. (ea)	\$ 12.50
8.25-20 to 11.00-24.5	Spin Balance (ea)	No Bid
8.25-20 to 11.00-24.5	2 Pc. Rims (ea)	\$ 12.50
8.25-20 to 11.00-24.5	Dismount/Mount Vendor Shop (ea)	\$ 21.50
8.25-20 to 11.00-24.5	Dismount/Mount Co. Yard (per hr)	\$ 50.00
14.00-20 to 19.5-25	Bubble Bal. (ea)	No Bid
14.00-20 to 19.5-25	Spin Balance (ea)	No Bid
14.00-20 to 19.5-25	2 Pc. Rims (ea)	No Bid
14.00-20 to 19.5-25	Dismount/Mount Vendor Shop (ea)	\$ 27.50
14.00-20 to 19.5-25	Dismount/Mount Co. Yard (per hr)	\$ 50.00

**Schedule N: Install Studs in Snow Tires**

		Lilly's Tire Service South Lake Tahoe, CA
Tire Size	Unit of Measure	Unit Price
7.50-16 and up	each	\$ 24.00

**Bid #07-863-011 Truck Tires & Related Services - East Slope  
Evaluation\***

**Schedule O: Install Studs in Snow Tires**

		Lilly's Tire Service South Lake Tahoe, CA
Service	Unit of Measure	Unit Price
Dismount, Mount & Repairs	per hour	\$ 50.00
Alignment	per vehicle	\$ -
Toe Set	per vehicle	\$ -
Foam Fill Tires	per lb.	No Bid
Tractor Tire Sealant	per lb.	\$ 3.00
Disposal Fees Light Truck Tires	each	\$ 3.00
Disposal Fees Semi-Truck Tires	each	\$ 16.00
Disposal Fees Backhoe Tires	each	\$ 30.00
Disposal Fees Grader Tires	each	\$ 30.00
Disposal Fees Snow-blower tires	each	\$ 30.00
Emergency Svc. Calls	per hour	\$ 50.00

No Bid - one or more bidders did not quote this item.