
* Evaluation

Location/Category

Category I - DOT
(West Slope Location)  10/9/2018 10/9/2018 10/9/2018 10/9/2018

Equipment / Vehicle Fuel Tanks -
2441 Headington Rd Placerville, CA 2.7075$          $0.0830 $2.7905 2.7075$          $0.0249 $2.7324 2.7075$          $0.4000 $3.1075 2.7075$          No Bid #VALUE!
Winterization Fuel Additive $0.0350 $0.0350 $0.0250 $0.0250 $0.01 $0.0100 No Bid #VALUE!
Sub total $2.8255 $2.7574 $3.1175 #VALUE!
Local Vendor Preference 0.00% $0.00 5.00% ($0.1379) 5.00% ($0.1559) 0.00% #VALUE!
Terms Discount 0.00% $0.0000 0.00% $0.0000 0.00% $0.0000 0.00% #VALUE!

Net Total $2.8255 $2.6195 $2.9616 No Bid

Category II - DOT
(East Slope - South Shore Location) 10/9/2018 10/9/2018 10/9/2018 10/9/2018

Equipment / Vehicle Fuel Tanks -
1121 Shakori Road, Meyers, CA 2.7075$          0.1290 $2.8365 2.7075$          0.0639 $2.7714 2.7075$          0.2000 $2.9075 2.7075$          0.1900 $2.8975
Winterization Fuel Additive 0.0350 $0.0350 0.0200 $0.0200 $0.01 $0.0100 0.0000 $0.0000
Sub total $2.8715 $2.7914 $2.9175 $2.8975
Local Vendor Preference 0.00% $0.0000 5.00% ($0.1396) 5.00% ($0.1459) 5.00% ($0.1449)
Terms Discount 0.00% $0.0000 0.00% $0.0000 0.00% $0.0000 0.00% $0.0000

Net Total $2.8715 $2.6518 $2.7716 $2.7526

OPIS Rack 
Average Price 

(per gal)

Quoted 
Price         

(per gal)
Net Price      
(per gal)

(B) Hunt & Sons, Inc
Sacramento, CA

(B) Hunt & Sons, Inc
Sacramento, CA

OPIS Rack 
Average Price 

(per gal)

(A) Ramos Oil Co
West Sacramento, CA

Net Price      
(per gal)

(A) Ramos Oil Co
West Sacramento, CA

Quoted 
Price         

(per gal)

(D) Flyers Energy LLC
South Lake Tahoe, CA

OPIS Rack 
Average Price 

(per gal)

Quoted 
Price         

(per gal)
Net Price      
(per gal)

(C) Dawson Oil Co
Placerville, CA

(C) Dawson Oil Co
Placerville, CA

Bid # 18-405-021 - Diesel Fuel and Fuel Additive

OPIS Rack 
Average Price 

(per gal)

Quoted 
Price         

(per gal)
Net Price      
(per gal)

(D) Flyers Energy LLC
South Lake Tahoe, CA
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Location/Category OPIS Rack 
Average Price 

(per gal)

Quoted 
Price         

(per gal)
Net Price      
(per gal)

OPIS Rack 
Average Price 

(per gal)
Net Price      
(per gal)

Quoted 
Price         

(per gal)

OPIS Rack 
Average Price 

(per gal)
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Price         

(per gal)
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(per gal)

OPIS Rack 
Average Price 

(per gal)

Quoted 
Price         

(per gal)
Net Price      
(per gal)

Category III - DOT                                                                          
(East Slope - West Shore Location) 10/9/2018 10/9/2018 10/9/2018 10/9/2018

Equipment / Vehicle Fuel Tanks -                           
7101 Wilson Road, Tahoma, CA 2.7075$          No Bid #VALUE! 2.7075$          $0.2549 $2.9624 2.7075$          $0.7500 $3.4575 2.7075$          $0.1900 $2.8975
Winterization  Fuel Additive No Bid #VALUE! $0.0200 $0.0200 $0.01 $0.0100 $0.0100 $0.0100
Sub total #VALUE! $2.9824 $3.4675 $2.9075
Local Vendor Preference 0.00% #VALUE! 5.00% ($0.1491) 5.00% ($0.1734) 5.00% ($0.1454)
Terms Discount 0.00% #VALUE! 0.00% $0.0000 0.00% $0.0000 0.00% $0.0000

Net Total No Bid $2.8333 $3.2941 $2.7621

Category IV - Generator Fuel Tanks                                       
(West Slope Locations) 10/9/2018 10/9/2018 10/9/2018 10/9/2018

Generator Fuel Tanks -  Transportation Division                                   
2441 Headinton Rd.  Placerville, CA 2.7075$          No Bid #VALUE! 2.7075$          $0.3549 $3.0624 2.7075$          $0.5000 $3.2075 2.7075$          No Bid #VALUE!

Generator Fuel Tanks -  Building B                                 
360 Fair Lane,  Placerville, CA 2.7075$          No Bid #VALUE! 2.7075$          0.3549 $3.0624 2.7075$          $0.5000 $3.2075 2.7075$          No Bid #VALUE!

Generator Fuel Tanks -  Building C                                 
2850 Fair Lane Court,  Placerville, CA 2.7075$          No Bid #VALUE! 2.7075$          0.3549 $3.0624 2.7075$          $0.5000 $3.2075 2.7075$          No Bid #VALUE!

Generator Fuel Tanks - Placerville Jail                                                                 
300 Forni Road, Placerville, CA 2.7075$          No Bid #VALUE! 2.7075$          0.3549 $3.0624 2.7075$          $0.5000 $3.2075 2.7075$          No Bid #VALUE!

Generator Fuel Tanks - Sheriff's Office                                
300 Fair Lane Placerville, CA 2.7075$          No Bid #VALUE! 2.7075$          0.3549 $3.0624 2.7075$          $0.5000 $3.2075 2.7075$          No Bid #VALUE!

Generator Fuel Tank - EDH Senior Center                    
990 Lassen Lane, El Dorado Hills, CA 2.7075$          No Bid #VALUE! 2.7075$          0.3549 $3.0624 2.7075$          $0.5000 $3.2075 2.7075$          No Bid #VALUE!
Winterization Fuel Additive (All locations) No Bid No Bid 0.025 $0.0250 $0.01 $0.0100 No Bid No Bid
Sub total #VALUE! $18.3994 $19.2550 #VALUE!
Local Vendor Preference 0.00% #VALUE! 5.00% ($0.92) 5.00% ($0.96) 0.00% #VALUE!
Terms Discount 0.00% #VALUE! 0.00% $0.00 0.00% $0.00 0.00% #VALUE!

Net Total No Bid $17.48 $18.29 No Bid

(B)  Hunt & Sons, Inc               
Sacramento, CA

(B)  Hunt & Sons, Inc               
Sacramento, CA

(A)  Ramos Oil Co                                            
West Sacramento, CA

(A)  Ramos Oil Co                                            
West Sacramento, CA

(D)  Flyers Energy LLC     
South Lake Tahoe, CA

(D)  Flyers Energy LLC     
South Lake Tahoe, CA

(C)    Dawson Oil Co       
Placerville, CA

(C)    Dawson Oil Co       
Placerville, CA
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Location/Category OPIS Rack 
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(per gal)

Quoted 
Price         

(per gal)
Net Price      
(per gal)

OPIS Rack 
Average Price 

(per gal)
Net Price      
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Quoted 
Price         

(per gal)

OPIS Rack 
Average Price 
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Category V - CAO Facilities                                 
(East Slope Locations) 10/9/2018 10/9/2018 10/9/2018 10/9/2018

Generator Fuel Tanks -                                            
1121 Shakori Drive, Meyers, CA 2.7075$          No Bid #VALUE! 2.7075$          $0.3549 $3.0624 2.7075$          $0.7500 $3.4575 2.7075$          $0.1900 $2.8975

Generator Fuel Tanks - So Lake Tahoe Jail                                                           
1051 Al Tahoe Blvd., SLT, CA 2.7075$          No Bid #VALUE! 2.7075$          $0.3549 $3.0624 2.7075$          $0.5000 $3.2075 2.7075$          $0.1900 $2.8975

Generator Fuel Tanks - Juv. Treatment Ctr  -   
1041 Al Tahoe Blvd., South Lake Tahoe, CA 2.7075$          No Bid #VALUE! 2.7075$          $0.3549 $3.0624 2.7075$          $0.5000 $3.2075 2.7075$          $0.1900 $2.8975

Generator Fuel Tank - SLT Sheriff's Off.                                                     
1360 Johnson Blvd.  So. Lake Tahoe, CA 2.7075$          No Bid #VALUE! 2.7075$          $0.3549 $3.0624 2.7075$          $0.7500 $3.4575 2.7075$          $0.1900 $2.8975
Winterization Fuel Additive (All locations) No Bid #VALUE! $0.0250 $0.0250 $0.01 $0.0100 $0.0000 $0.0000 
Sub total #VALUE! $9.2122 $9.8825 $8.6925 
Local Vendor Preference 0.00% #VALUE! 5.00% ($0.4606) 5.00% ($0.4941) 5.00% ($0.4346)
Terms Discount 0.00% #VALUE! 0.00% $0.0000 0.00% $0.0000 0.00% $0.0000

Net Total No Bid $8.7516 $9.3884 $8.2579

Category VI - Environmental Management 
(West Slope Location) 10/9/2018 10/9/2018 10/9/2018 10/9/2018

Equipt. & Gen. Fuel Tank - Union Mine Plant                                                        
5700 Union Mine Rd., El Dorado, CA 2.7075$          No Bid No Bid 2.7075$          0.2449 $2.9524 2.7075$          $0.5000 $3.2075 2.7075$          No Bid #VALUE!
Winterization Fuel Additive (All locations) No Bid No Bid 0.025 $0.0250 $0.01 $0.0100 No Bid No Bid
Sub total  $0.0000  $2.9774  $3.2175  #VALUE!
Local Vendor Preference 0.00% $0.0000 5.00% ($0.1489) 5.00% ($0.1609) 0.00% #VALUE!
Terms Discount 0.00% $0.0000 0.00% $0.0000 0.00% $0.0000 0.00% #VALUE!

Net Total No Bid $2.8285 $3.0566 No Bid

(B)  Hunt & Sons, Inc               
Sacramento, CA

(B)  Hunt & Sons, Inc               
Sacramento, CA

(A)  Ramos Oil Co                                            
West Sacramento, CA

(A)  Ramos Oil Co                                            
West Sacramento, CA

(D)  Flyers Energy LLC     
South Lake Tahoe, CA

(D)  Flyers Energy LLC     
South Lake Tahoe, CA

(C)    Dawson Oil Co       
Placerville, CA

(C)    Dawson Oil Co       
Placerville, CA
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