The County of El Dorado

Chief Administrative Office

Procurement & Contracts Division
Phone (530)621-5830

TO:. ALL BIDDERS

RE: BID # 2025-0158
Diese! Fuel and Winterization Fuel Additive

The apparent low qualified bidder for the subject bid is Hunt and Sons, LL.C of Sacramento,
CA.

A spreadsheet is attached for your review.

This item is scheduled to be heard by the Board of Supervisors on Tuesday, 11/18/2025. Board
of Supervisors Policy C-17, Section 3.3.1, Subsection F, contains the procedure for the protest
process. Copies are available upon request.

Following Board of Supervisors approval, a purchase contract will be issued for the
awarded period.

This notification is posted on the following websites:

https:pbsystem.planetbids.com/portal/48157/portal-home

https:/iwww.edcgov.us/Government/Contracts/Pages/Bid-Resuits. aspx

All bids are on file in the Procurement & Contracts Office, and are available to review by
appointment between 8:00 a.m. — 12:00 p.m. and 1:00 p.m. — 4:00 p.m., Monday through
Friday.

For questions, please contact Rick Blake, Sr. Buyer rick.blake@edcgov.us.

Thank you for your participation in the competitive bid process.

s

Michele Weimer (Oct 22, 2025 12:35:1% PDT)
Purchasing Agent

330 Fair Lane Placerville, CA 95667
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BID #2025-0188
DIESEL FUEL WINTERIZATION FUEL ADDITIVE

Efuels,
dba; Ramos Qil Co

Hunt & Sons, Inc
Placearville, CA

City / State West Sacramento, CA Sacramento, CA
ARO Delivery 1 Day ARO 2 Days ARC
Local Vendor Preference No No

Tarms Net 45 Days 2%/20 Days
Category | - DOT QP15 Rack Quoted |\ oiprice | Quoted |\ Price
{West Slope Location}) 20/20/2025 Piice {per gal) Price {per gal)

{per gal) (per gal) (per gal)
Equipment / Vehicle Fuel Tanks -

2441 Headington Rd Plagcerville, CA $ 30361 $0 1300 $3 1661 | $0.0198 $3.0560
Subtotal B $3.1861 $3.0560
Local Vendor Freference 0.00% $0.00 | 0.00% $0.00 |
Terms Discount 0.00% $0.0000 | 2.00% 0611
Net Total | 531661 $2.9949

Efuels, Hunt & Sons, Inc
dba: Ramos 0il Co Placerville, CA
Clty / State West Sacramento, CA Sacramenta, CA
ARQ Delivery 1 Day ARO 2 Days ARO
Local Vendor Preference No No
Terms Net 45 Days 2%120 Days
Category Il - DOT OPiS Rack || Quoted | \erprice | QUoted | et orice
{East Slope - South Shore Locatlon) 20/20/2025 Ekies {per gal) Friga {per gal)
{per gal) {per gal) {per gal)
Equipment / Vehicle Fuel Tanks -
1121 Shakori Road, Meyers, CA $ 303611 |MNo Bid 00589 $3.0850
Winterization Fuel Additive No Bid 0.0200 $0.0200
Sub total $3.1150
Local Vendor Preference 0.00% 0.00% $0.0000
Terms Discount 0.00% 2.00%
Net Total $3.0527
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BID #2025-0158
DIESEL FUEL WINTERIZATION FUEL ADDITIVE

Efuels,
dba; Ramos Qll Co

Hunt & Sons, Inc
Placerville, CA

City / State West Sacramento, CA Sacramento, CA
ARQ Delivery 1 Cay ARO 2 Days ARQ
Local Vendor Preference No No
Terms Net 45 Days 2%/20 Days
Category Il - DOT @rJB Rack Quoted | etprice | QUOtd | net price
(East Slope - West Shore Location) 20202025 Rrice {per gal) Pilce {per gal)
(per gal) (per gal) (per gal)
Equipment / Vehicle Fuel Tanks -
7101 Wilson Road, Tahoma, CA $ 3.0361 | INo Bid £0 1999 $3 2380
Winterization Fuel Additive [No Bid $0 0200 $0.0200
Sub total $3.2560
Local Vendor Preference 0.00% 0.00% $0.0000
Terms Discount 0.00% 2.00% 1.0651
Net Total $3.1909
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BID #2025-0158
DIESEL FUEL WINTERIZATION FUEL ADDITIVE
Efuels, Hunt & Sons, inc
dba: Ramos QIl Co Placerville, CA
City / State West Sacramento, CA Sacramento, CA
ARO Delivery 1 Day ARO 2 Days ARO
Local Vendor Preference Ne No
Terms Net 45 Days 2%/20 Days
Category IV - Generator Fuel Tanks GHlo Rark Quqted MNet Price Qthed Net Price
(West Slope Locations) e Price | pergaly | P | (oergal)
{per gal) (per gal) (per gal)
Building A,
330 Fair Lane, Placerville, CA $ 3.0361 $0.3500 $3.2861] $0 2999 $3.3380
Building 8
360 Fair Lane, Placerville, CA $ 30361 $0.3500 $3.3861] $0 2988 $3.3360
Building C
2850 Fair Lane Court, Placervilie, CA | $ 30367 $0.3500 $3.3861] $0.2999 $3.3360
Facilities :
3000 Fairlane Ct. Placerville, CA | $ 3.0361 $0.3500 $3.3861] $0.2998 $3.3360
HHSA -
3057 Briw Road, Placerville, CA | & 3.0361 $0.3500 $3.3861| $0.2993 $3.3360]
HHSA :
937 Spring Street, Placerville, CA | § 30361 $0.3500 $33381] $0 2999 $3.33680
Piacerville Library
345 Fair Lane, Placervile, CA | § 30361 $0.3500 $3.3861] $02998 $3.3360
Placerville Main Jail "
300 Forni Road, Placerville, CA L5 3.0361 $0.3500 $3.3861] $0.2999 $3.3360
Sheriff's Office
200 Industrial Drive, Placerville, CA 3 3.0361 $0.3500 $3.3861] $0.2999 $3.3360|
Winterization Fuel Additive - {
Not Needed on West Slope | $0.0000 $0 0000 0 L $0 0000
|
Sub total ] $30.4749 $30.0240
Local Vendor Preference | 0.00% $0.00] 0.00% $0.00
Terms Discount _ 4} 0.00% $0.00] 2.00% 6005
Net Total ] $30.4749 $29.4235
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BID #2025-0158 4
DIESEL FUEL WINTERIZATION FUEL ADDITIVE
Efuels, Hunt & Sons, Inc
dba: Ramos Ol Co Placerville, CA
City I State West Sacramento, CA Sacramento, CA
ARO Delivery 1 Day ARO 2 Days ARO
Locat Vendor Preferance No No
Terms Net 45 Days 2%/20 Days
Category V - Generator Fuel Tanks 200’:;1230!';;;‘5‘ Q;f?;:d Net Price Q:r?:;d Net Price
{East Slope Locations) (per gal (per gal) (per gal) (per gal) {per ?al}
South Lake Tahoe Jail
1051 Al Tahoe Blvd, SLT, CA $ 3.0361 No Bid $0.2899 $3.3360
South Lake Tahoe JTC
1041 Al Tahoe Bivd. SLT, CA $ 3.0361 No Bid $0.2999 $3 3380
South Lake Tahoe Sheriffis Office
1360 Johnson Bivd, SLT, CA $ 30361 | Mo Bid $0.2899 $3.3360
Winterization Fuel Additive (All locations)
Adtic Flow Plus or Equivalent Mo Bid $0.0200 $0.0200
Sub total $10.0250
Local Vendor Preference 0.00% 0.00% $0.0000
Terms Discount 0.00% 2.00%
Net Total $0.0000 $9.8274
Efuels, Hunt & Sons, In¢
dba: Ramos Qil Co Placesvilte, CA
City / Stata West Sacramento, CA Sacramento, CA
ARO Delivery 1 Day ARO 2 Days ARC
Local Vendor Preference No No
Terms Net 45 Days 2%I20 Days
Category VI - Equipment & Generator OPIS Rack ngleu Net Price Qu?tEd Net Price
Fuel Tanks {West Siope Location) 20/20/2025 feHEs (per gal} Feige {per gal)
{per gal} (per aal) (per gal)
EMD - Union Mine Septage Plant
3700 Union Mine Rd., El Dorado, CA $ 3.0361 0.3500 3.3861] 0.2989 (5 3.3380
Public Safety Facility ’
200 Industrial Road, Placerville, CA $ 3.0361 0.3500 3.3861| 0.2999 | & 3.3360
HHSA
3037 Briw Road, Placerville, CA ] 3.0361 0.3500 33861 02959 |$ 3 3360
Sub total §$10 1583 $10 0080
Local Vendor Preference 0.00% §00000 | 000% $0 0000
Terms Discount 0.00% $0 Q000 2.00%
Net Total $10.1583 T $9.8078
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