Bid # 17-425-040 Office Furniture- Category | - Maxon

Evaluation*

Estimated i i
. . D) Sierra Offi m
Systems Furniture Product Discount Usage . (B) Weste'zrnlCOntract ) (D) Sierra Office Systems
(A) Seats and Stations Furnishings (C Office Depot, Inc. Products, Inc.
$75,000.00) Roseville, CA Rancho Cordova, CA Sacramento, CA Sacramento, CA

Percentage off MSRP No Bid No Bid 68.00% 70.00%
Discount #VALUE! No Bid $51,000.00 $52,500.00
Product Sub-total #VALUE! $24,000.00 $22,500.00
Design and Other Services
Hourly Design Services over 10 hours (based on 200 total
hours) 200 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE! $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Hourly Call Back for Technical Assistance (based on 20 total
hours) 20 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE! $60.00 $1,200.00 $0.00 $0.00
Hourly Rate for Installation / Assembly 100 No Bid No Bid $60.00 $6,000.00 $85.00 $8,500.00
Hourly Rate for Reconfiguration (based on 50 total hours) 50 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE! $65.00 $3,250.00 $85.00 $4,250.00
Quick Ship Program Discount off List (based on $1,000 in
purchases) $1,000.00 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE! 68.0% $680.00 69.00% $310.00
Storage of Product Over 30 days (based on 50 sq ft of area) 50 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE! $1.50 $75.00 $0.00 $0.00
Subtotal #VALUE! No Bid $35,205.00 $35,560.00
Less: LVP 5% 0% $0.00 0% $0.00 0% $0.00 5.00% ($1,778.00)
Less Terms Discount 0% #VALUE! 0% #VALUE! 0% $0.00 4.00% ($1,422.40)

No Bid No Bid $35,205.00 $32,359.60

*Evaluation is exclusive of sales tax
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Bid # 17-425-040 Office Furniture - Category Il - Office Master Chairs
* Evaluation

(A) Seats and Stations

(B) Western Contract
Furnishings

(C) Office Depot, Inc.

(D) Sierra Office
Systems Products,

Roseville, CA Rancho Cordova, CA Sacramento, CA Inc.
Unit of
Bid ltem Measure Description Model # Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price
Chairs
Paramount Series multi-function task chair w/
1 Each standard seat pan and back rest, no arms, w/ PC
Mechanism 7780-PC Mech No Bid No Bid $295.00 $312.38
Paramount Series multi-function task chair w/
2 Each expanded seat pan and back rest, no arms, w PC
Mechanism 7878-PC Mech No Bid No Bid $332.00 $358.58
Yes Series Mid Back, Multi-Function Exec chair, no
s Bach arms, w/ PC Mechanism
' YS84-PC Mech No Bid No Bid $239.00 $252.00
4 Each Discovery Back db Series Multi-Function Task chair, ) )
no arms, w/PC mechanism DB74-PC Mech No Bid No Bid $320.00 $343.35
Classic Lab Stool, tilting back rest, back height
5 Each adjustment, seat slider, Grande Spider package, no
arms CLS61 No Bid No Bid $236.00 $248.85
Sub-total Chairs $1,422.00 $1,515.16
Arm Kits
6 Each Ultra Mobility Arm Kit w/ Memsoft arm pads KR251M No Bid No Bid $57.00 $57.23
Each Height and Width Adjutsable T-Arms w/ Smooth fore- ) )
7 aft, side to side KR445 No Bid No Bid $97.00 $97.13
8 Each Ultra Mobility are w/ memosoft arm pads KR200 No Bid No Bid $91.00 $91.88
Sub-total Arm Kits No Bid No Bid $245.00 $246.24
Percentage OFF
Additional Purchases MSRP 51.00% 48%
Additional Purchases: Percentage Off MSRP $1,000.00 1,000.00 1,000.00 $490.00 $520.00
Sub-total Additional Purchase $490.00 $520.00
SubTotal - Office Master No Bid No Bid $2,157.00 $2,281.40
Discount Terms 0% 0% 0% 4.0%
#VALUE! #VALUE! $0.00 ($91.26)
Local Vendor Preference (5%) 0% 0% 0% 5%
#VALUE! #VALUE! $0.00 ($114.07)
|TOTALS - Office Master Chairs No Bid No Bid $2,157.00 $2,076.07

* Evaluation total is exclusive of sales tax
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Bid # 17-425-040 - Office Furniture - Category Ill - Hon

Evaluation*

Sample Accumulative Order at List Price
Percentage off MSRP
Subtotal

Less: LVP 5%
Less Terms Discount

*Evaluation is exclusive of sales tax

(A) Seats and Stations
Roseville, CA

(B) Western Contract
Furnishings
Rancho Cordova, CA

(C) Office Depot, Inc.
Sacramento, CA

(D) Sierra Office
Systems
Placerville, CA

$140,500.00 140,500.00 $140,500.00 $140,500.00

No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE! 55.00% ($77,275.00) 52.50% ($73,762.50)
No Bid No Bid $63,225.00 $66,737.50

0% $0.00 0% $0.00 0% $0.00 5% ($3,336.88)
0% #VALUE! 0% #VALUE! 0% $0.00 4% ($2,669.50)
No Bid No Bid $63,225.00 $60,731.13
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Bid # 17-425-040 - Office Furniture - Category IV - PL Furniture

Evaluation*

Sample Accumulative Order at List Price
Percentage off MSRP

Subtotal - Product

Delivery / Assembly / Install charges
Round trip Charges from Vendors place of
business to all West Slope Locations
(Placerville, Shingle Springs, Diamond
Springs, Zip Codes: 95667, 95682, 95619
Round trip Charges from Vendors place of
business to all East Slope Locations (South
Lake Tahoe, Zip Code: 96150
Hourly Rate for Assembly / Install (one man,
one hour)

Subtotal - Delivery/Assemble/Install
Total- Product/Delivery/Assembly/Install

Less: LVP 5%
Less Terms Discount

*Evaluation is exclusive of sales tax

(A) Seats and Stations

(B) Western Contract
Furnishings

(C) Office Depot, Inc.

(D) Sierra Office Systems
Placerville, CA

Roseville, CA Rnacho Cordova, CA Sacramento, CA
$67,000.00 67,000.00 $67,000.00 $67,000.00
60.00% ($40,200.00) 57.00% ($38,190.00) No Bid #VALUE! 60.00% ($40,200.00)
$26,800.00 $28,810.00 #VALUE! $26,800.00
$150.00 $150.00 $170.00 $170.00 No Bid No Bid $90.00 $90.00
$285.00 $285.00 $375.00 $375.00 No Bid No Bid $135.00 $135.00
$64.00 $64.00 $88.00 $88.00 No Bid No Bid $45.00 $45.00
$499.00 $633.00 No Bid No Bid $270.00
$27,299.00 $29,443.00 $27,070.00
0.00% $0.00 0% $0.00 0% #VALUE! 5% ($1,353.50)
0.00% $0.00 0% $0.00 0% #VALUE! 4% ($1,082.80)
$27,299.00 $29,443.00 No Bid $24,633.70
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Bid # 17-425-040 Office Furniture - Category V - Ergonomic Solutions

* Evaluation
(B) Western Contract
(A) Seats and Stations Furnishings (C) Office Depot, Inc. |(D) Sierra Office Systems
Roseville, CA Rancho Cordova, CA Sacramento, CA Placerville, CA
Unit of
Bid Item Measure Description Model # Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price
Ergotron: WorkFit
Ergotron Work Fit-A Sit Stand Workstation with
Each suspended keyboard, single monitor 24" or less 24-390-026
1 (5-15Ibs) No Bid No Bid $429.00 No Bid
Ergotron Work Fit-A Sit Stand Workstation with
Each suspended keyboard, dual monitor 24" or less 24-392-026
2 (12-18Ibs) No Bid No Bid $477.00 No Bid
Ergotron WorkFit-S Sit Stand Workstation with
Each work surface+, suspended keyboard, single 33-350-200
3 monitor 24" or less (25lbs or less) No Bid No Bid $482.00 No Bid
Ergotron WorkFit-S Sit Stand Workstation with
Each work surface+, suspended keyboard, dual 33-349-200
4 monitor 24" or less (25lbs or less) No Bid No Bid $520.00 No Bid
Ergotron Tall User Kit for WorkFit-S and WorkFit-
5 Each A workstations with dual monitors 97-615 No Bid No Bid $43.00 No Bid
|Sub-total Ergotron products #VALUE! #VALUE! $1,951.00 #VALUE!
Ergotron: Delivery / Install Charges
Round trip Charges from Vendors place of
Trip business to all West Slope Locations (Placerville,
Shingle Springs, Diamond Springs, Zip Codes:
95667, 95682, 95619 No Bid No Bid $75.00 No Bid
Round trip Charges from Vendors place of
Trip business to all East Slope Locations (South Lake
Tahoe, Zip Code: 96150 No Bid No Bid $125.00 No Bid
Hourly Rate for Assembly / Install (one man, one
Hour — hour) No Bid No Bid $60.00 No Bid
|Sub-total Ergotron Delivery/Install #VALUE! #VALUE! $260.00 #VALUE!
Ergotron: Additional Purchase Discount
"ISE": Pertcentage off MSRP , Based on
$1,000.00 in additional purchases $1,000.00 No Bid No Bid 42% No Bid
#VALUE! #VALUE! $580.00 #VALUE!
Sub-total Ergotron Additional Purchases #VALUE! #VALUE! $2,791.00 #VALUE!
Payment Discount Terms / Local Vendor Preference
Prompt Payment Discount Terms 0% 0% 0% 0%
#VALUE! $0.00 #VALUE!
Local Vendor Preference (5%) 0% 0% 0% 0%
#VALUE! $0.00 #VALUE!
Total Ergotron No Bid No Bid $2,791.00 No Bid

17-0290 A5 of 7




Bid # 17-425-040 Office Furniture - Category V - Ergonomic Solutions

* Evaluation
(B) Western Contract
(A) Seats and Stations Furnishings (C) Office Depot, Inc. |(D) Sierra Office Systems
Roseville, CA Rancho Cordova, CA Sacramento, CA Placerville, CA
Unit of
Bid Item Measure Description Model # Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price
Workrite
Workrite Banana Board System: Mouse-Forward
platform, left or right mousing, Platform
Each Dimensions: 19w x 13d; Sliding Mouse Tray: 8w 2128-22
x 4/8.5d w/ Pinnacle 2 Adjutsable Arm (#3170-
5 22TG) No Bid No Bid $280.00 $268.40
Workrite Universal Ultra-Thin Platform, right or 981874_25‘]
- - (Discontinued)
Each left handed mousing, removable LeatheRite palm
L ST New Model
support: Dimensions: 27.75w x 11.5d Platform #UB188-25
6 Color: Black Palm Support Color: Midnight No Bid No Bid $109.00 $102.30
Workrite Pinnacle 2 Adjustable Keyboar Arm, Tilt
Indicator, Lift-N-Lock Height adjustment, Thin
Each Glide Ball Bearing Track, 3602 swivel, Height 3170-22TG
Range: Flush to 6" below worksurface; Til
7 Range: -15" to +10" No Bid No Bid $144.00 $138.05
|Sub-total Workrite product #VALUE! #VALUE! $533.00 $508.75
Workrite: Delivery / Install Charges
Round trip Charges from Vendors place of
Trip business to all West Slope Locations (Placerville,
Shingle Springs, Diamond Springs, Zip Codes:
95667, 95682, 95619 No Bid No Bid $75.00 $90.00
Round trip Charges from Vendors place of
Trip business to all East Slope Locations (South Lake
Tahoe, Zip Code: 96150 No Bid No Bid $125.00 $135.00
Hourly Rate for Assembly / Install (one man, one
Hour — hour) No Bid No Bid $60.00 $45.00
|Sub-total Workrite Delivery / Install #VALUE! #VALUE! $260.00 $270.00
Workrite: Additional Purchase Discount
"Workrite": Pertcentage off MSRP , Based on
$1,000.00 in additional purchases $1,000.00 No Bid No Bid 38% 45%
$620.00 $550.00
Sub-total Workrite Additional Purchases No Bid No Bid $1,413.00 $1,328.75
Payment Discount Terms / Local Vendor Preference
Prompt Payment Discount Terms 0% 0% 0% 5%
#VALUE! $0.00 ($66.44)
Local Vendor Preference (5%) 0% 0% 0% 4%
#VALUE! $0.00 ($53.15)
Sub-total Workrite No Bid No Bid $1,413.00 $1,209.16

* Evaluation total is exclusive of sales tax
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Cell: H36
Comment: Eric Van Leeuwen:
Bidder (D) indicated in Category V Ergonomic Solutions for Workrite, Bnid Item # 7 model # UB187-25J has been discontinued and replaced with # UB-188-25.
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