RESOLUTION NO. 033-2026
OF THE BOARD OF SUPERVISORS OF THE COUNTY OF EL DORADO

(REPEALING RESOLUTION NO. 134-2023)

WHEREAS, the California Code of Regulations, Title 24, Part 9, the California Fire Code, is updated by the
State every three years; and

WHEREAS, the 2025 California Fire Code became effective on January 1, 2026; and,

WHEREAS, California Health and Safety Code Sections 17958, 17958.5, 17958.7 and 18941.5 permits a
county to make such local amendments and modifications as the county determines are reasonably
necessary because of local climatic, geological or topographical conditions; and,

WHEREAS, the California Code of regulations, Health and Safety Code, Division 12, Part 2, Chapter 1,
Article 12, Section 13146, assigns responsibility for enforcement of safety regulations to the local level
and grants authority to delegate enforcement to the chief building official, or his or her authorized
representative, or the chief of the fire protection district, or his or her representative; and,

WHEREAS, the County of El Dorado desires to delegate enforcement of the Fire Code to the chief of the
fire authority, or the chief's authorized representative; and,

WHEREAS, the fire protection district and County have agreed to develop, implement and maintain a
memorandum of understanding that describes the roles and responsibilities pertaining to the inspection
of certain building standards found in the Fire Code; and,

WHEREAS, on August 29, 2025, The Board of Directors of the Lake Valley Fire Protection District adopted
Ordinance No. 2025-1, which adopted the 2025 California Fire Code with amendments the District
deemed necessary to deal with local climate, geological or topographical conditions.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that the Board of Supervisors of the County of El Dorado ratifies
Ordinance No. 2025-1 of the Lake Valley Fire Protection District and delegates the enforcement of the
ordinance to the Lake Valley Fire District Chief, or his or her representative.

These changes include amendments and additions to the California Fire Code in the following sections:

101.1, 105.5, 105.5.60, 105.6, 105.6.26, 105.6.27, 108.5.1, 108.5.2, 108.7, 112.5,113.4, 113.4.2, 114.4,
202, 302.1, 307.4.4, 401.2.1, 503.2.1, 503.2.5, 503.2.6, 503.3.1, 503.3.2, 503.3.3, 503.6, 505.1, 505.1.1.
507.5.1, 509.3, 510.4.2.3, 903.2, 903.2.1.1, 903.2.1.2, 903.2.1.3, 503.2.1.4, 903.2.2, 903.2.3, 903.2.4,

903.2.7, 903.2.7.2, 903.2.8.4, 903.2.9, 903.2.10, 903.2.10.1, 903.4.3, 903.6, 907.2, 907.2.1.4, 907.2.2.4,

26-0184 H 1 of 65



907.2.3.11, 907.2.4.2, 907.2.5.2, 907.2.6.6, 907.2.7.3, 907.2.8.4, 907.2.9.4, 907.2.10.3, 907.2.30,
907.6.2.1, 907.6.6, 907.9, 1203.1.3, 3306, 3307.2, 3307.6, 5001.7, 5601.2, 5704.2.9.6.1, 5706.2.4.4
5806.2, 6104.2, 6112, 6113, 6113.1, 6113.1, 6113.2, 6114, 6115, 6115.1, 6115.2, Chapter 80 NFPA 1-24
Sections 22.3, 22.10, Chapter 80 NFPA 13D Sections 5.1.1.2, 7.6, 11.2.1.1, Appendix B Table B105.1(1)
and Table B105.2, Appendix C Table C102.1, Appendix D Sections D103.1, D103.2, D103.3, D103.5,

D103.6.1, D103.6.2, D104.4, D105.2.

The Lake Valley Fire District adopts the 2025 California Fire Code, Title 24, Part 9, in its entirety, including
Appendices, incorporating those sections of the International Fire Code, 2021 edition not adopted by the

state, with the exclusions listed below:

103, 309, 311.5,311.6,318,903.3.1.2,904.1.1,1103.1-1103.1.1, 1103.3-1103.3.2, 1103.4-1103.6.2,
1105.1-1105.11.2, Chapter 26, D104.2 {exception only), D106.1 {exception only), D107.1 {exception
only), Appendix A, Appendix G, Appendix J, Appendix K, Appendix L, Appendix M, Appendix N,
Appendix Q.

Appendices not adopted can be used for reference in enforcing other sections of the 2025 California Fire
Code.

PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of Supervisors of the County of El Dorado at a regular meeting of said
BOARD, held the _3rd day of February , 2026, by the following vote of said Board

Attest: Ayes: Laine, Ferrero, Veerkamp, Parlin, Turnboo

Kim Dawson Noes: None

Clerk of the Board of Supervisors ne
By: 3 ; ;-—-——-—-—-

epu rk Mme, Chair, Board of Supervisors

26-0184 H 2 of 65



LAKE VALLEY FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT

“Serving the Community Since 1947
Chad Stephen, Fire Chief

e

Board of Directors
John Rice

Brian Hogan

Irene Kaelin

Tim Cain

Jessica Henderson

September 29, 2025

Sue Hennike, Interim Chief Administrative Officer
El Dorado County Board of Supervisors

330 Fair Lane

Placerville, CA 95667

Subject: Resolution Ratifying Ordinance No. 2025-1 of the Lake Valley
Fire District, which adopts the 2025 California Fire Code with
amendments related to local climatic, geographic and
topographic conditions.

Dear Ms. Hannike;

The Lake Valley Fire Protection District (LVFPD) is requesting the Board of Supervisors {BOS} ratify its
Ordinance No. 2025-1, which adopts the 2025 California Fire Code as amended due to specific local climatic,
geographic, and topographic conditions. California Health and Safety Code Section 13869.7 requires the
legislative body of the city or county where the ordinance will apply to ratify, modify, or deny the adopted
ordinance. The BG5S must also delegate enforcement of the ordinance to either the Fire District {or its
representative) or the Chief Building Official.

Therefore, we request the County Board of Supervisors ratify Ordinance No. 2025-1 with amendments to the
2025 California Fire Code, and delegate the enforcement of that Ordinance to the LVFPD Fire Chief.

This resolution has no direct fiscal impact to the County.

Respectfully,
Chad mn ﬁ/
Fire Chief

Respect, Integrity, Dedication, Positive Attitude and Teamwaork
2211 Keetak St., So. Lake Tahoe, CA. 96150 = {530) 577-3737 = Fax 577-3739
www.LakeValleyFire.org

26-0184 H 3 of 65



LAKE VALLEY FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT
ORDINANCE NO. 2025-1

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS OF THE LAKE VALLEY
FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICTAS FOLLOWS:

An ordinance of the Lake Valley Fire Protection District{LVFPD) adopting the
2025 Edition of the California Fire Code, incorporating the 2024 Edition of the
international Fire Code, regulating and governing the safeguarding of life and property
from fire and explosion hazards arising from the storage, handling and use of hazardous
substances, materials and devices, and from conditions hazardous to life or property in
the occupancy of buildings and premises in the LVFPD; providing for the issuance of
permits and collection of fees therefor; Repealing Ordinance No. 2022-01 of the LVFPD
and ali other ordinances and parts of the ordinances in conflict therewith.

Be it ORDAINED by the Board of Directors of the LVFPD, also known as the
Lake Valley Fire Protection District:

Section 1: FINDINGS OF FACTS

Section 2: ADOPTION OF CODE WITH EXCLUSIONS
Section 3. LOCAL AMENDMENTS

Section 4: CONFLICT

Section 5: SEVERABILITY

Section 6: EFFECTIVE DATE AND PUBLICATION

SECTION 1: FINDINGS OF FACTS

The LVFPD makes certain changes (listed below) to the California Fire Code,
2025 Edition, pursuant to Health & Safety Code Sections 13869.7, 17958.5, 17958.7
and 78941.5 during this code adoption process. Such changes are necessary
because of local climatic, geological and/or topographical conditions. The LVFPD
has adopted, pursuant to Section 18941.5 of the California Health & Safety Code, the

Ordinance 2025-1 Page 1

26-0184 H 4 of 65



findings of facts relative to these conditions by Resolution 2025-3 of the LVFPD
dated August 29, 2025.

SECTION 2: ADOPTION OF CODE WITH EXCLUSIONS

The LVFPD adopts the 2025 California Fire Code, Title 24, Part 9, in_its
entirety, including Appendices, incorporating those sections of the International Fire
Code, 2024 edition not adopted by the state, with the exclusions listed below:

Exclusions: 103, 309, 311.5, 311.6, 318, 903.3.1.2, 904.1.1, 1103.1-1103.1.1,
1103.3-1103.3.2, 1103.4-1103.6.2, 1105.1-1105.11.2, Chapter 26, D104.2 (Exception
only), D106.1 (Exception only), D107.1 (Exceptions only), Appendix A, Appendix G,
Appendix J, Appendix K, Appendix L, Appendix M, Appendix N, Appendix O.

Appendices not adopted can be used for reference in enforcing other sections of
the 2025 California Fire Code.

SECTION 3: AMENDMENTS TO THE 2025 CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE
The following Sections are hereby amended or added:

Chapter 1
Section 101.1 "Title” shall be amended as follows:

Section 101.1 TITLE. These regulations shall be known as the Lake Valley Fire
Protection District Fire Code, hereinafter referred to as “this code”.

SECTION 105.5 “REQUIRED OPERATIONAL PERMITS" 1S AMENDED AS
FOLLOWS:

105.5 Required operational permits. The fire code official is authorized to issue
operational permits for the operations set forth in Sections 105.5.2 through 105.5.60.

SECTION 105.5.60 “AUTOMOBILE WRECKING YARDS"” IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 105.5.60 Automobile wrecking yards. An operational permit is required for
the operation of autornobile wrecking yards.

Ordinance 2025-1 Page 2

26-0184 H 5 of 65



SECTION 105.6 “‘REQUIRED CONSTRUCTION PERMITS™ IS AMENDED AS
FOLLOWS:

105.6 Required construction permits. The fire code official is authorized to issue
construction permits for work as set forth in Sections 105.6.1 through 105.6.27.

SECTION 105.6.26 "AUTOMOBILE WRECKING YARDS" {S ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 105.6.26 Automobile wrecking yards. Construction permits are required for
the installation of or modification to automobile wrecking yards.

SECTION 105.6.27 “TRAFFIC CALMING DEVICES" IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

105.6.27 Traffic calming devices. Construction permits are required for the
installation or modification of traffic calming devices.

SECTION 108.5.1 "PERMIT, PLAN REVIEW AND INSPECTION FEES" SHALL BE
ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 108.5.1 Permit. A schedule of fees adopted by the district board of directors
for plan review, inspections and the issuance of permits by the district may be found in
the most current district fee schedule (Health & Safety Code 17951).

SECTION 108.5.2 “COST RECOVERY FEES” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 108.5.2 Cost Recovery Fees. Fire service fees may be charged fo any
person, firm, corporation or business that through negligence, violation of the law, or as
a result of carelessness, is responsible for the cause of the district to respond to the
scene of an incident. A dislrict board may charge a fee to cover the cost of any service
which the district provides or the cost of enforcing any regulation for which the fee is
charged (Health & Safety Code 13916). The fee shall not exceed the actual cost of
suppressing the fire and/or responding to the scene of an incident.

SECTION 108.7 “ADMINISTRATIVE COSTS” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Ordinance 2025-1 Page 3

26-0184 H 6 of 65



Section 108.7 Administrative Costs. When a test or inspection is scheduled, and the
contractor fails fo perform to the safisfaction of the authority having jurisdiction (AHJ),
the AHJ may bill the contractor for actual time spent lraveling fto and from the
test/inspection location and the time spent at the festinspection site as well as
administrafive costs.

SECTION 112.5 “APPEAL PROCEDURES AND TIMELINES” SHALL BE ADDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 112.5 Appeal Procedures and Timelines. Any person or entily who believes
they may be adversely affected by an order, decision, or determination made by the fire
code official through a writfen notice may appeal this matter within 15 calendar days of
the postmark on the notice. All such appeals shall be filed in writing with the Secretary
of the Governing Board for the district. A timely appeal shall stay further action by the
fire code official until the matfler is determined by the Appeal Board as outlined in
Section 112.1, unless the Issue poses an imminent fire or life safefy hazard lo
members of the public. The fire code official shall notify the appeflant by cerlified maif
of the date and fime of such hearing. The hearing shall be scheduled o take place no
sooner than 20 calendar days from the date shown on the certified mail. The appellant
shall have the right to appear in person or by agent at the hearing and present oral,
written and/or photographic evidence to the Appeal Board.

SECTION 113.4 “VIOLATION PENALTIES" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

113.4 Violation penalties. Persons who shall violate a provision of this code or shall
fail to comply with any of the requirements thereof or who shall erect, install, alter,
repair or do work in violation of the approved construction documents or directive of the
fire code official, or of a permit or certificate used under provisions of this code, shall be
guilty of a misdemeanor or infraction, at the discretion of the prosecuting atforney or
agency, punishable by a fine of not more than 100.00 dollars for a first vioiation; A fine
not exceeding 500.00 for a second violation of the same provision within one year, A
fine not exceading $1000.00 for each additional violation of the same provision within
one year, or by imprisonment not exceeding 180 DAYS, or both such fine and
imprisonment. Each day that a violation continues after due notice has been served
shall be deemed a2 separate offense. (Health & Safety Code Sections 13145 and

17995).

Ordinance 2025-1 Page 4

26-0184 H7 of 65



SECTION 113.4.2 “CITATIONS” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 113.4.2 Citations. The Fire Chief, or his/her duly authorized representative,
may issue citations for infractions or misdemeanor violations of this code pursuant to
Section 13871 of the Health & Safety Code of the State of California and Chapter Sc
(commencing with Section 853.6) of Title 3 of Part 2 of the Penal Code of the State of
California.

SECTION 114.4 “FAILURE TO COMPLY” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

114.4 Failure to comply. Any person who shall continue any work after having been
served with a stop work order, except such work as that person is directed to perform to
remove a violation or unsafe condition, shall be punishable by a fine or imprisonment
or both as described in Section 113.4 (Health & Safety Code Seclions 13145 and
17995).

Chapter 2

SECTION 202 “CAMPFIRE” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

CAMPFIRE. A fire which is used for cooking, personal warmth, lighting, or aesthetic
purposes.

SECTION 202 “DISTRICT" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

DISTRICT. The district and all other areas within the exterior boundaries thereof now or
hereafier established.

SECTION 202 “DRIVEWAY” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

DRIVEWAY. A pathway that serves no more than four (4) Residential Units and any
number of non-commercial or non-industrial Utility or Miscellaneous Group U Buildings
on each parcel. A Driveway shall not serve commercial or industrial uses at any size or

scale.

SECTION 202 “EXECUTIVE BODY” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Ordinance 2025-1 Page 5

26-0184 H 8 of 65



EXECUTIVE BODY. The Board of Directors of the District.
SECTION 202 “FIRE CHIEF" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

FIRE CHIEF. The Chief Execulive Fire Officer of the Fire department/district serving
the jurisdiction or a duly authorized representative.

SECTION 202 “FIRE HAZARD” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

FIRE HAZARD. Any condition, arrangement, or act which will increase, or may cause
an increase of, the hazard or menace of fire to a greater than customnarily recognized
as normal by-persons in the public service of preventing, suppressing or extinguishing
fire; or which may obsfruct, delay, or hinder, or may become the cause of obstruction,
deiay or hinderance to the prevention, suppression, or extinguishment of fire.

SECTION 202 “OPEN BURNING" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

OPEN BURNING. The buming of materials wherein products of combustion are
emitted directly into the ambient air without passing through a stack or chimney from an
enclosed chamber. Open buming does not include road flares, smudge-pots and
similar devices associated with safety or occupational uses typically considered open
flames. For the purpose of this definition, a chamber shall be regarded as enclosed
when, during the time combustion occurs, only apertures, ducts, stacks, flues or
chimneys necessary to provide combustion air and permit the escape of exhaust gas
are open.

Open burning shall also include campfires, bonfires, portable outdoor fireplaces,
ceremonial fires, and recreational fire as defined in the Fire Code.

Exception:
1. UL or ANSI listed LPG or natural gas outdoor flame devices, such as gas BBQ's

or gas fire pits that comply with the Fire Code.
2. Campfires on private lands. Where required by the fire code official, a permit
shall be issued by the fire code official.
3. Ceremoniai and/or religious burning when approved by the fire code official and
with the following safety measures:
a. Maximum 4-foot x 4-foot burn area.

Ordinance 2025-1 Page 6

26-0184 H 9 of 65



b. Minimum 10-foot clearance from edge of burn area to all flammable
material and vegetation.

c. An approved water supply is located within 500-feet of the burn area.

d. The burn area is located no less than 30-feet from adjoining property
fines.

e. An adult is present with a shovel until the fire is extinguished.

f. No burning shall be conducted during high or extreme fire weather
conditions (e.g., National Weather Service Red Flag Warnings).

SECTION 202 “TRAINED CROWD MANAGER” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

TRAINED CROWD MANAGER. Standby personnel, usually a security guard or usher
personnel, who are trained in the proper procedure fo exit people from a tent or other
place of public assemblage in an orderly and calm fashion in the event of an
emergency

Chapter 3

SECTION 302.1 "DEFINITIONS” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

3D PRINTER.

ADDITIVE MANUFACTURING.
BONFIRE.

CAMPFIRE.

HI-BOY.

HIGH-VOLTAGE TRANSMISSION LINE.
OPEN BURNING.

PORTABLE OUTDOOR FIREPLACE.
POWERED INDUSTRIAL TRUCK.
RECREATIONAL FIRE.

SKY LATTERN.

VALET TRASH COLLECTION.

SECTION 307.4.4 "OPEN BURNING RESTRICTIONS” SHALL BE ADDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 307.4.4 Open Burning Restrictions. Open burning on all lands within the
jurisdiction of the Lake Valley Fire Profection District (LVFPD), including the Local

Ordinance 2025-1 Fage 7

26-0184 H 10 of 65



Response Area (LRA), is prohibited when the California Department of Forestry and
Fire Protection (Cal Fire} issues a burn suspension in the State Responsibility Area
(SRA). This prohibition shall be made effective 24-hours following its commencement in
the SRA.

Open burning is also prohibited on all Iands within the jurisdiction of LVFPD at any time
the fire code official determines that atmospheric conditions or other local
circumstances make such fires hazardous, including factors such as high winds, low
fuel moisture, fire weather, the issuance of red flag warnings, severe threat of wildland
fire, or present risk of destruction by wildfire to life, wildlife, property, or natural
resources.

Exception: Ceremonial and/or religious burning with a permit obtained from the

fire code official.

Chapter 4
SECTION 401.2.1 “PRE-FIRE PLANS" IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 401.2.1 Pre-fire plans. Where required by the fire code official, a pre-fire
plan shall be provided and approved by the fire code official for all new commercial

structures.

Chapter 5
SECTION 503.2.1 “DIMENSIONS” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 503.2.1 Dimensions. Fire apparatus access roads shall have an
unobstructed width of not less than 20 feet (6096 mm), exclusive of shoulders, as
measured from face of curb to face of curb, except for approved security gates in
accordance with Section 503.6, and an unobstructed vertical clearance of not less
than 15 feet (4572mm). Driveways shall have an uncbstructed width of nof less than

12 feel (3657.6 mm} wide.
SECTION 503.2.5 “DEAD ENDS” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:
Section 503.2.5 Dead Ends. Dead-end fire apparatus access roads and driveways

in excess of 150 feet (45,720 mmj in length shall be provided with an approved area
for turning around fire apparatus.

Ordinance 2025-1 Page 8

26-0184 H 11 of 65



SECTION 503.2.6 “BRIDGES AND ELEVATED SURFACES” SHALL BE AMENDED
AS FOLLOWS:

Section 503.2.6 Bridges and Elevated Surfaces. Where a bridge or an elevated
surface is part of a fire apparatus access road, the bridge shall be constructed and
maintained in accordance with AASHTO HB-17, the current Ef Dorado County
Transportation Division Bridge Standard or Appendix D of the current California Fire
Code, whichever is more restrictive. Bridges and elevated surfaces shall be designed
for a live load sufficient to carry the imposed loads of fire apparatus. Vehicle load limits
shall be posted at both entrances to bridges where required by the fire code official.
Where elevated surfaces designed for emergency vehicle use are adjacent to surfaces
that are not designed for such use, approved barriers, approved signs or both shall be
installed and maintained where required by the fire code official.

SECTION 503.3.1 “NO PARKING IN FIRE LANES" SHALL BE ADDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 503.3.1 No Parking In Fire Lanes. No person shall stop, park, or leave
standing any vehicle, whether attended or unattended, except when necessary to
avoid conflict with other traffic or in compliance with the directions of the Fire Chief,
or his/her duly authorized representative, Peace Officer or official traffic control
device along the edge of any highway, at any curb, or in any location in a publicly or
privately owned or operated off-street parking facility, designated as a fire fane by the
district with jurisdiction over the area in which the place is located. The designation
shall be indicated (1) by a sign posted immediately adjacent to, and visible from, the
designated place clearly stating in letfers not less than one inch in height that the
place Is a fire lane, (2) by outlining or painting the place in red and, in contrasting
color, marking the place with the words “FIRE LANE", which are clearly visible from a
vehicle, or (3) by a red curb or red paint on the edge of the roadway upon which is
clearly marked the words “FIRE LANE™.

SECTION 503.3.2 “NO PARKING IN FRONT OF HYDRANTS" SHALL BE ADDED
AS FOLLOWS:

Section 503.3.2 No Parking in Front of Hydrants. No person shall stop, park, or
leave standing any vehicle within 15 feet of a fire hydrant except as follows: (a) If the

Ordinance 2025-1 Page 9

26-0184 H 12 of 65



vehicle is aftended by a licensed driver who is seated in the front seat and who can
immediately move such vehicle in case of necessity, (b) If the vehicle is owned or
operated by a fire department and is clearly marked as a fire department vehicle.

SECTION 3503.3.3 “FIRE LANES BASED ON ROAD WIDTH” SHALL BE ADDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 503.3.3 Fire Lanes Based on Road Width. Fire lanes shall be based on
road width as required in Appendix D as amended by the District.

SECTION 503.6 "SECURITY GATES" IS AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

503.6 Security gates. The installation of security gates across a fire apparatus access
road shall be approved by the fire code official and shail comply with the District gate
standard. Where security gates are installed, they shall have an approved means of
emeargency operation. The security gates and the emergency operation shall be
maintained operational at all times. Electric gate operators, where provided, shall be
listed in accordance with UL 325. Gates intended for automatic operation shall be
designed, constructed and installed to comply with the requirements of ASTM F2200

SECTION 5051 "ADDRESS IDENTIFICATION® SHALL BE AMENDED AS
FOLLOWS:

505.1 Address identification. Addresses for new and existing buildings shalf comply
with the District address standard as approved by the fire code official. The address
identification shall be legible and placed in a position that is visible from the street or
road fronting the property. Address identification characters shall contrast with their
background. Address numbers shall be Arabic numbers or alphabetical letters.
Numbers shall not be spelled out. Each character shall be not less than 4 inches (102
mm) high with a minimum stroke width of ¥z-inch (12.7 mm).Where required by the fire
code official, address identification shall be provided in additional approved locations to
facilitate emergency response. Where access is by means of a private road and the
building cannot be viewed from the public way, a monument, pole or other sign or
means shall be used to identify the structure. Address identification shall be
maintained.

SECTION 505.1.1 “ILLUMINATION" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Ordinance 2025-1 Page 10

26-0184 H 13 of 65



Section 505.1.1 Hlumination. Address identification shall be internally or externally
illuminated on all new commercial and industrial buildings so as to be visible from the
closest fire apparatus access road.

SECTION 507.5.1 “WHERE REQUIRED" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

507.5.1 Where required. Where a portion of the facility or building hereafter
constructed or moved info or within the jurisdiction is more than 150 feet {45.72 m) from
a hydrant on a fire apparatus access road, as measured by an approved route around
the exterior of the facility or building, on-site fire hydrants and mains shall be provided
where required by the fire code official.

Exception: For Group R-3 and Group U occupancies, equipped throughout with
an approved automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance with Section
903.3.1.1, 903.3.1.2 or 903.3.1.3, the distance requirement shall be not more
than 600 feet(183 m)

SECTION 509.3 “FIRE CONTROL ROOM" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 509.3 Fire Control Room. Fire sprinkler risers, fire alarm control panels, solar
photovoltaic power system rapid shutoff switches, and other fire detection, suppression
or similar control elements shall be located inside a single fire control room for the
building. The fire control room shall have minimum dimensions of five feet by seven
feet in size with a total usable area of not less than 35 square feet. The room shail be
located within the building on an outside wall at a location approved by the Fire Code
Official and shall be accessible from the exterior. An exterior access door with a clear
width of not less than 32 inches and height of not less than 80 inches shall be provided
for access into the room. A durable sign shall be affixed to the exterior of the door with
the words “FIRE CONTROL ROOM” in letters not less than 4 inches in height. A key
box complying with Section 506 shall be installed on the exterior side of the fire control
room door opening.

The room must be capable of maintaining a minimum temperature of 40 degrees
Fahrenheit. A clearance of 12 inches shall be provided from the fire sprinkler risers to
any adjacent walls. This room can be a shared with other building utilities or fire
protection equipment that is not incompatible. An approved cabinet or container shall

Ordinance 2025-1 Page 11

26-0184 H 14 of 65



be provided to store record plans of the fire sprinkler system and other fire protection
equipment. This room shall not be used for any other storage.

Exception: One-and two-family dwellings, manufactured homes or similar uses
defined as either a Group R-3, R3.1, or R-4 occupancy.

SECTION 510.4.2.3 “STANDBY POWER” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

510.4.2.3 Standby power. In-building emergency responder communications
enhancement systems shall be provided with dedicated standby batteries or provided
with 2-hour standby batteries and connected to the facility generator power system in
accordance with Section1203. The standby power supply shall be capable of operating
the in-building emergency responder communications enhancement system at 100-
percent system capacity for a duration of not less than 12 hours. Where required by the
fire code official, standby power supply shall be provided for a duration of 72 hours.

Chapter 9
SECTION 903.2 “WHERE REQUIRED” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 903.2 Where Required. Approved automatic sprinkler systems in new
buildings and structures when constructed or relocated within the jurisdiction shall be
provided in the locations described in Sections 903.2.1 through 903.2.12 and

Sections 903.2.14 through 903.2.22.

Exception: Agricuftural buildings not under a special use permit used for
commercial purposes.

SECTION 903.2.1.1 “GROUP A-1" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 903.2.1.1 Group A-1. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided
throughout stories containing Group A-1 occupancies and throughout all stories from
the Group A-1 occupancy to and including the levels of exit discharge serving that
occupancy where one of the following conditions exists:

1. The fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet (334 m?).

2. The fire area has an occupant load of 300 or more.

Ordinance 2025-1 Page 12

26-0184 H 15 of 65



3. The fire area is located on a floor other than a level of exit discharge serving
such occupancies,

4. The fire area contains a multi-theater complex
SECTION 803.2.1.2 "GROUP A-2" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 903.2.1.2 Group A-2. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided
throughout stories containing Group A-2 occupancies and throughout all stories from the
Group A-2 occupancy to and including the levels of exit discharge serving that
occupancy where one of the following conditions exists:

1. The fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet (334 m?);

2. The fire area has an occupant load of 100 or more.

3. The fire area is located on a floor other than a level of exit discharge serving
such occupancies.

4. The structure exceeds 3,600 square feet (334 m?), contains more than one fire
area containing a Group A-2 occupancy, and is separated into two or more
buildings by fire walls of less than 4-hour fire-resistance rating without openings.

SECTION 903.2.1.3 “GROUP A-3” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 903.2.1.3 Group A-3. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided
throughout stories containing Group A-3 occupancies and throughout all stories from the
Group A-3 occupancy to and including the levels of exit discharge serving that
occupancy where one of the following conditions exists:

1. The fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet (334 m?).
2. The fire area has an occupant load of 300 or more.

3. The fire area is located on a floor other than a level of exit discharge serving
such occupancies.

4. The structure exceeds 3,600 square feet (334 m?), contains more than one fire
area containing exhibition and display rooms, and is separated into two or more
buildings by fire walls of less than 4-hour fire-resistance rating without openings.

SECTION 803.2.1.4 “GROUP A-4" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Ordinance 2025-1 Page 13

26-0184 H 16 of 65



Section 903.2.1.4 Group A-4. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided
throughout stories containing Group A-4 occupancies and throughout all stories from the
Group A-4 occupancy to and including the levels of exit discharge serving that
occupancy where one of the following conditions exists:

1. The fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet (334 m?).
2. The fire area has an occupant load of 300 or more.

3. The fire area is located on a floor other than a level of exit discharge serving
such occupancies.

SECTION 903.2.2 "GROUP B” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

903.2.2 Group B. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided for Group B
occupancies where the fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet or as required in Sections
903.2.2.1 and 903.2.2.2.

SECTION 903.2.3 “GROUP E" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 903.2.3 Group E. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided for Group E
occupancies as follows:

1. Throughout all Group E fire areas greater than 3,600 square feet (334 m?) in
area.

2. The Group E fire area is located on a floor other than a level of exit discharge
serving such occupancies.

Exception: In buildings where every classroom has not fewer than one exterior
exit door at ground level, an automatic sprinkler system is not
required in any area below the lowest level of exit discharge serving
that area.

3. The Group E fire area has an occupant load of 300 or more.

4. In rooms or areas with special hazards such as laboratories, vocational shops
and other such areas where hazardous materials in quantities not exceeding the
maximum allowable quantity are used or stored.

5. Throughout any Group E structure greater than 3,600 square feet (334 m?)
square feet in area, which contains more than one fire area, and which is

Ordinance 2025-1 Page 14

26-0184 H 17 of 65



separated into two or more buildings by fire wails of less than 4-hour fire
resistance rating without openings.

6. For public school state funded construction projects see Section 903.2.19.

7. For public school campuses, Kindergarten through 12" grade, see Section
903.2.20

SECTION 903.2.4 “GROUP F-1" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 903.2.4 Group F-1 and F-2. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided
throughout all buildings containing a Group F-1 occupancy where one of the following
conditions exists:

1. A Group F-1 or F-2 fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet (334 m?).

2. A Group F-1 or F-2 fire area is located more than three stories above grade
plane.

3. The combined area of all Group F-1 or F-2 fire areas on ali floors, including any
mezzanines, exceeds 3,600 square feet (334 m?)square feet.

4. A Group F-1 or F-2 occupancy is used to manufacture lithium-ion or lithium
metal batteries.

5. A Group F-1 or F-2 occupancy is used to manufacture vehicles, energy storage
systems or equipment containing lithium-ion or lithium metal batteries where the
batteries are installed as part of the manufacturing process.

SECTION 903.2.7 “GROUP M” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 903.2.7 Group M. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout
buildings containing a Group M occupancy where one of the following conditions exists:

1. A Group M fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet (334 m?).
2. A Group M fire area is located more than three stories above grade plane.

3. The combined area of all Group M fire areas on all floors, including any
mezzanines, exceeds 3,600 square feet (334 m?).

4. The sfructure exceeds 3,600 square feet (334 m?), contains more than one fire
area containing a Group M occupancy, and is separated into fwo or more
buildings by fire walls of less than 4-hour fire resistance rating without openings.

Ordinance 2025-1 Page 15

26-0184 H 18 of 65



SECTION 903.2.7.2 “GROUP M UPHOLSTERED FURNITURE OR MATTRESSES”
SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 903.2.7.2 Group M Upholstered Furniture or Mattresses. An automatic
sprinkler system shall be provided throughout a Group M fire area where the area
used for the display and sale of upholstered furniture or mattresses exceeds 3,600

square feet (334 m?).

SECTION 903.2.8.4 °*‘MANUFACTURED HOMES®" SHALL BE ADDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 803.2.8.4 Manufactured Homes. An automatic fire sprinkler system shall
be required in all new manufactured homes and mufti-family manufactured homes
intended for use as a one-and two-family dwelling. The design and installation of
such systems shall be in accordance with California Code of Regulations, Title 25,

§4300.

Exceptions:
1. Manufactured homes located within an existing mobile home park
complying with California Health and Safety Code, Division 13, Part 2.1 or

2.3.

2 Manufactured homes that do not exceed 1,200 square feet in size and
serve as an accessory dwelling unit, as defined in Government Code
Section 65852.2 and 66313; when the existing primary residence on the
property is not required to comply with California Residential Code Section
R309.2.

3. Manufactured homes that do not exceed 320 square feet in size.
SECTION 903.2.9 “GROUP S-1” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 903.2.9 Group S-1. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided
throughout all buildings containing a Group S-1 occupancy where one of the following
conditions exists:

1. A Group S-1 fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet (334 m?).

2. A Group $S-1 fire area is located more than three stories above grade plane.

Ordinance 2025-1 Page 16

26-0184 H 19 of 65



3. The combined area of all Group S-1 fire areas on all floors, including any
mezzanines, exceeds 3,600 square feat (334m2).

4. A Group S-1 fire area used for the storage of commercial motor vehicles where
the fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet (334m?).

5. A Group S-1 fire area used for the storage of lithium-ion or lithium metal powered
vehicles where the fire area exceeds 500 square feet (46.4 m?).

SECTION 903.2.10 "GROUP S-2" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 903.2.10 Group S-2. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided
throughout buildings classified as parking garages where any of the following conditions
exist:

1. Where the fire area of the enclosed parking garage, in accordance with Section
406.8 of the California Building Code, exceeds 3,600 square feet (334m®).

2. Where the enclosed parking garage, in accordance with Section 406.6 of the
California Building Code, is located beneath other groups.

Exception: Enclosed parking garages located beneath Group R-3
occcupancies.,

3. Where the fire area of the open parking garage, in accordance with Section
406.5 of the California Building Code, exceeds 3,600 square feet (334m?).

SECTION 903.2.10.1 “COMMERCIAL PARKING GARAGES” SHALL BE AMENDED
AS FOLLOWS:

Section 803.2.10.1 Commercial Parking Garages. An automatic sprinkler system
shall be provided throughout buildings used for storage of commercial motor vehicles
where the fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet (334m?).

SECTION 903.4.3 “ALARMS” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

903.4.3 Alarms. An approved audible and visual sprinkler waterflow alarm device,
located on the interior and exterior of the building in an approved location, shali be

connected to each automatic sprinkler system. Such sprinkler waterflow alarm
devices shall be activated by water flow equivalent to the flow of a single sprinkler of

Ordinance 2025-1 Page 17

26-0184 H 20 of 65



the smallest orifice size installed in the system. Where a waterflow switch is required
by Section 903.4.1 fo be electrically supervised, such sprinkler waterflow alarm
devices shall be powered by a fire alarm control unit or, where provided, a fire alarm
system. Where a fire alarm system is provided, actuation of the automatic sprinkler
system shall actuate the building fire alarm system.

Exception: Automatic sprinkler systems protecting one- and two-family
dwellings.

SECTION 903.6 “WHERE REQUIRED IN EXISTING BUILDINGS AND
STRUCTURES™ IS AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 903.6 Where Redquired In Existing Buildings and Structures. An
automatic sprinkler system shall be provided in existing buildings and structures
where required in Chapter 11 and as follows:

1. When there is a change in occupancy classification that resuits in an increased
life safety or fire risk, as determined by the fire code official, and the structure
exceeds 3,600 square feet (334 m?)., an automatic fire sprinkler system shall be
installed throughout the building.

2. In existing buildings 3,600 square feet (334 m’). or greater, other than one and
two-family dwelling units, and agriculiural buildings not under special use

permit for commercial purposes, where the floor area of the building or
structure is increased, such building or siructure shall be made to conform to

Section 903.2.
Exception: When the building increase is less than 500 square feet (46.4 m?).

3. In existing buildings 3,600 square feet {334 n¥). or less, other than one-and
two-family dwelling unifs, and agricultural buildings not under special use
permit for commercial purposes, where the floor area of the building or
structure is increased to a tofal square footage over 3,600 square feet, such
building or structure shall be made to conform to Section 903.2.

Exception: When the building increase is loss than 500 square feet (46.4 mP).

SECTION 807.2. "WHERE REQUIRED — NEW BUILDINGS AND STRUCTURES”
SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Ordinance 2025-1 Page 18

26-0184 H 21 of 65



Section 907.2. Where Required — New Buildings and Structures. An approved
fire alarm system installed in accordance with the provisions of this code and NFPA
72 shall be provided in new buildings and structures in accordance with Sections
007.2.1 through 807.2.30 and provide occupant notification in accordance with
Section 907.5, unless other requirements are provided by another section of this
cade.

Not fewer than one manual fire alarm box shall be provided in an approved location
to initiate a fire alarm signal for fire alarm systems employing automatic fire detectors
or waterflow detection devices, Where other sections of this code allow elimination of
fire alarm boxes due to sprinklers or automatic fire alarm systems, a singie fire alarm
box shall be installed at a location approved by the enforcing agency.

Exceptions:

1. The manual fire alarm box is not required for fire alarm contro! units
systems dedicated to elevalor recall control, supervisory service and fire
sprinkler monitoring.

2. The manual fire alarm box is not required for Group R-2 occupancies
unless required by the fire code official to provide a means for fire watch
personnel to initiate an alarm during a sprinkler system, impairment
event. Where provided, the manuai fire alarm box shall not be located in
an area that is open to the public.

3. The manual fire alarm box is not required to be installed when approved
by the fire code official.

4. A fire alarm system is not required in one and two-family dwellings,
agricuftural buildings, and other occupancies classified as Group U not
under special use permit and/or not used for commercial purposes (e.g.
retail sales, food service, and/or special events).

5. Buildings with a floor area less than 500 square feet may be exempt, as
determined by the fire code official based on building construction
malerial and features, location, occupancy lype, and distance to
EexXposures.

SECTION 907.2.1.4 “GROUP A UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET" SHALL BE ADDED
AS FOLLOWS:

Ordinance 2025-1 Page 19

26-0184 H 22 of 65



Section 907.2.1.4 Group A Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved automatic fire
alarm system shall be installed in all group A buildings with a floor area less than
3,600 (334m®) square feet.

SECTION 9807.2.2.4 “GROUP B UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET” SHALL BE ADDED
AS FOLLOWS:

Section 907.2.2.4 Group B Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved automatic fire
afarm systern shall be installed in all unsprinkiered group B buildings with a floor area
less than 3,600 square feet (334m°®).

SECTION 907.2.3.11 "GROUP E UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET" SHALL BE
ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 907.2.3.11 Group E Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved aulomatic fire
afarm system shall be installed in ail unsprinklered group E buildings with a floor area
less than 3,600 square feet (334m°>).

SECTION 907.2.4.2 “GROUP F UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET" SHALL BE ADDED
AS FOLLOWS:

Section 907.2.4.2 Group F Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved aufomatic fire
alarm systemn shall be installed in all unsprinklered group F buildings with a floor area

fess than 3,600 square feet (334m°).

SECTION 907.2.5.2 “GROUP H UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET” SHALL BE ADDED
AS FOLLOWS:

Section 907.2.5.2 Group H Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved aulomatic fire
alarm system shall be instalied in all unsprinklered group H buildings with a floor area

less than 3,600 square feet (334m>).

SECTION 907.2.6.6 “GROUP ! UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET” SHALL BE ADDED
AS FOLLOWS:

Ordinance 2025-1 Page 20

26-0184 H 23 of 65



Section 907.2.6.6 Group | Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved automatic fire
alarm system shall be installed in all unsprinklered group I buildings with a floor area
less than 3,600 square feet (334m®).

SECTION 907.2.7.3 “GROUP M UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET” SHALL BE ADDED
AS FOLLOWS:

Section 907.2,7.3 Group M Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved automatic fire
alarm system shall be installed in all unsprinkfered group M buildings with a floor
area less than 3,600 square feet (334m>).

SECTION ©807.2.8.4 “GROUP R-1 UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET" SHALL BE
ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 907.2.8.4 Group R-1 Under 3,600 Square Feet, An approved automatic fire
afarm system shall be installed in all unsprinklered group R-1 buildings with a floor
area less than 3,600 square feet (334m?).

SECTION 907.2.9.4 “GROUP R-2, R-2.1, R-2.2 UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET"
SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 907.2.9.4 Group R-2, R-2.1, R-2.2 Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved
automatic fire alarm system shall be installed in all unsprinklered group R-2, R-2.1,

R-2.2 buildings with a floor area less than 3,600 square feet (334m?).

SECTION 907.2.10.3 “GROUP S UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET" SHALL BE
ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 907.2.10.3 Group S Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved automatic fire
alarm system shall be installed in all unsprinkiered group S buildings with a floor area
fess than 3,600 square feet (334m°).

907.2.30 "TYPE | HOOD INSTALLATIONS” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:
907.2.30 “Type | Hood Installations” The requirement of installation, or

replacement, of a Type | Hood System shall require a fire alarm/sprinkler monitoring

Ordinance 2025-1 Page 21

26-0184 H 24 of 65



system to be installed, or for the hood system fo be connected to an existing fire
alarm/sprinkler monitoring system for that building.

SECTION 907.6.2.1 “SECONDARY POWER SUPPLY” SHALL BE ADDED AS
FOLLOWS:

SECTION 907.6.2.1 SECONDARY POWER SUPPLY. Where required by the fire
code official, in accordance with NFPA 72, the secondary power supply providing a
minimum 24-hour power capacity under quiescent load (system operating in a non-
alarm condition) shall be amended to a minimum 72-hour power capacity.

Exception: The existence of an emergency back-up power supply that meets
or exceeds the requirements of California Fire Code Chapter 12.

907.6.6 “MONITORING” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

007.6.6 Monitoring. Fire alarm systems required by this chapter or by the California
Building Code shall be monitored by an approved, UL certified, Type A Full Service
supervising station in accordance with NFPA 72 and this section which gives audible
and visual signals at a constantly attended location. All sprinklered buildings shall be

monitored.
Exception: Monitoring by a supervising station is not required for:
1. Single- and multiple-station smoke alarms required by Section 807.2.11.

2 Smoke detectors in Group |-3 occupancies shall be monitored in
accordance with Section 907.2.6.3.
3. Automatic sprinkler systems in one- and two-family dwellings and other

Ff

occupancies classified as Group “U

4. Agriculture buildings not under special use permit and/or not used for
commercial purposes (e.g., retails sales, food service, and/or special
events).

SECTION 907.9 “WHERE REQURIED IN EXISTING BUILDINGS™ SHALL BE
AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

SECTION 907.9 Where Required. An approved fire alarm system shall be provided
in existing buildings and structures where required in Chapter 11 in existing buildings

Ordinance 2025-1 Page 22

26-0184 H 25 of 65



with a floor area less than 3,600 square feet (334 m”) without an approved automatic
sprinkler system, other than one- or two-family dwelling units, agricuftural building not
under special use permit for commercial purposes where a fire alarm defection
system does not exist and the floor area of the building or structure is increased

Exception: When the building increase is less than 500 square feet (46.4 m®).

Chapter 12
SECTION 1203.1.3 “INSTALLATION” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 1203.1.3 installation. Emergency power systems and standby power
systems shall be installed in accordance with the California Building Code, the
California Electrical Code, NFPA 110 and NFPA 111. All buildings, other than one-
and two-family dwelling units, and agricuftural buildings not used for commercial
purposes, with standby power, shall have a shunt trip device that disconnects all
power sources to the building, approved by the fire code official. Existing installations
shall be maintained in accordance with the original approval.

Chapter 33
SECTION 3306 “VEGETATION: SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 3306 Vegetation. Weeds, grass, vines or other growth that is capable of
being ignited and endangering property, shall be cut down and removed by the
owner or occupant of the premises. Vegelation clearance requirements in wildland-
urban interface areas shall be in accordance with PRC 4291 and the California
Wildland-Urban Interface Code (CWUICG).

SECTION 3307.2 “WHEN REQUIRED” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 3307.2 When Required. An approved water supply for fire protection, gither
temporary or permanent, shall be instafled and maintained in continuous operation
as soon as combustible building materials arrive on site, on commencement of
verfical combustible construction and on installation of a standpipe system in
buildings under construction, in accordance with Sections 3307.2.1 through 3307.4.

Exception: The fire code official is authorized to reduce the fire-flow
requirements for isolated buildings or a group of buildings in rural areas or

Ordinance 2025-1 Page 23

26-0184 H 26 of 65



small communities where the development of full fire-flow requirements is
impractical.

SECTION 3307.6 “PREMISE IDENTIFICATION” SHALL BE ADDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 3307.6 Premise Identification. Prior fto and during construction, an
approved address sign shall be provided at each fire and emergency vehicle access

road entry info the project.

Chapter 50

SECTION 5001.7 “LIABILITY FOR DAMAGES" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 5001.7 Liability for Damages. Any damages or cost resulting from the
negligence, violation of the law, careless handiing, spill or discharge of any
hazardous materials shall constitute debt against any such person, firm or
corporation causing such spill or discharge. This debt is collectible by the Fire Chief,
or hisfher duly authorized representative, in the same manner as in the case of an
obligation under contract, expressed or implied.

Chapter 56
SECTION 5601.2 “PERMIT REQUIRED" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 5601.2 Permit Required. Permits shall be required as set forth in Section
105.5 and regulated in accordance with this section. Where fireworks permits are
required, they shall be issued by the Fire Chief, or his/her duly authorized
representative, and the El Dorado County Board of Supervisors or City Council within

a city.

Chapter 57

SECTION 5704.2.9.6.1 “LOCATIONS WHERE ABOVE-GROUND TANKS ARE
PROHIBITED” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Ordinance 2025-1 Page 24

26-0184 H 27 of 65



SECTION 5704.2.9.6.1 Locations Where Above-Ground Tanks are Prohibited.
The storage of Class | and Class Il flammable liquids in above-ground tanks outside of
buildings is prohibited unfess expressly approved by the fire code official, who shall
consider Jocal conditions and safety requirements in granting such approval.

SECTION 5706.2.4.4 “LOCATIONS WHERE ABOVE-GROUND TANKS ARE
PROHIBITED” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

SECTION 5706.2.4.4 Locations Where Above-Ground Tanks are Prohibited. The
storage of Class | and Class Il liquids in above-ground tanks is prohibited unless
expressly approved by the fire code official, who shalf consider local conditions and
safety requirements in granting such approval.

Chapter 58
SECTION 5806.2 “LIMITATIONS” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

SECTION 5806.2 Limitations. Storage of flammable cryogenic fluids in stationary
containers outside of buildings is prohibited unless expressly approved by the fire
code official, who shall consider local conditions and safety requirements in granting
such approval.

Chapter 61

SECTION 6104.2 “MAXIMUM CAPACITY WITHIN ESTABLISHED LIMITS" SHALL
BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

For the protection of heavily populated or congested areas, storage of liquified
pstroleum gas shall not exceed an aggregate capacity in any one installation of
2,000 gailons (7570 L) within the limits established by law as set forth in the fire code
adoption ordinance or other regulation adopted by the jurisdiction. The storage of
liquefied petroleum gas In excess of an aggregate of 2,000-gallon water capacity
when located at least one-half (1/2) mile from property zoned or designated for
residential use and at least one-half (1/2) mile from existing residential development
with a density greater than one (1) dwelling unit per acre and at least one-half (1/2}
mile from any hotel or motel is allowed when approved by the fire code official, and a
special/conditional use permit is issued by the County of El Dorado.

Ordinance 2025-1 Page 25

26-0184 H 28 of 65



Within the limits established by law restricting the dispensing of liquefied petroleum
gas for the protection of heavily populated or congested areas, the aggregate
capacity of any one installation shail not exceed a water capacity of 2,000 galfons.
The dispensing of liquefied petroleum gas in excess of an aggregate of 2,000-gallon
water capacity when located at least one-half (1/2) mile from property zoned or
designated for residential use and at least one-half 1/2) mile from any hotel or motel
is allowed when approved by the fire code official and a special/conditional use
permit is Issued by the Gounty of Ef Dorado.

SECTION 6112 "HIGH ELEVATION LP-GAS INSTALLATIONS" IS ADDED TO
READ AS FOLLOWS:

6112 High elevation LP-gas installations. Any new LP-gas tanks installed at

elevations of 5,000 feet and above shall comply with the following:

1. A permit is required for individual LP-gas containers of 125 gallons or greater. At
the time of application by any person for a permit to install an LP-gas system as
required by this code, the applicant shall submit an LP-gas plot plan to the
District for approval and shall contain the following:

a. Stamp of approval of the prospective LP-gas supplier.
b. Tank location showing distances to structure and edge to edge of pavement
or other identifying mark.

Tank capacity in US gallons.

Location of riser pipe at building.

Property boundaries.

An outline of all existing/proposed buildings on the lot and a depiction of the

roof ridge line of any building to be supplied with LP-gas.

2. Two stage regulator systems shall be installed on all LP-gas installations in
accordance with manufacturer's instructions. All first stage regulators and
connecting pigtails shall be installed under a protective valve cover on the tank.
All regulators installed under this caver shall be listed and approved for this use
and position of mounting. A connector providing flexibility shall be used to
connect the first stage regulator to the main service valve on the tank. All copper
pigtails shall be internally tinned and use only forged flare nuts.

3. The riser from the yard piping shall be a minimum of Schedule 80 and shali be
located not more than 3 inches horizontally from the walls of the tank, and swing
joints will be used above and below tank level to provide for tank movement
(street elbows shall not be used). An approved flexible alternative is preferred in
fieu of rigid steel pipe for the tank riser. This shall inciude but not be limited to
plastic (PE), copper tubing, stainless steel. All flexible material used for the tank
riser shall be sheathed in an approved steel cover for protection. As swing joints
are eliminated with an approved fiexible alternative, sufficient slack must be
maintained to allow for tank movement and/or expansion and contraction of the
alternative material. All plastic pipe shall be buried at least 18 inches below
finished grade. An electrically continuous corrosion resistant tracer wire (min.
AWG 14) or tape shall be buried with the plastic pipe to facilitate locating. One

o 0o

Ordinance 2025-1 Page 26

26-0184 H 29 of 65



end shall be brought above ground at the building wall or riser and the other end
shall be brought above ground at the tank.

4. The second stage regulator and riser pipe shall be installed on the gable end of
the building, as close as practical to the building wall, unless this is not feasible
due to structural or topographical constraints. An approved gas shutoff valve
rated for a minimum of 125 PS! shall be installed immediately prior to the second
stage regulator. An approved gas shut off sign or other identifier shall be
installed directly above the gas shut off valve, on the building in a visible location
within three (3) feet of the eaves of the roof or roof line if no eaves are present. If
the second stage regulator or a combination first/second stage regulator is used
at the tank, then an approved gas shut off valve shall be located at the building.

5. A protective cover shall be installed over the second stage regulator and meter
(if installed) at the building. The minimum design for the protective cover shall be
equal to, or greater than, the Building Design Load (determined by the building
department), and shall be securely supported to the ground or diagonally to the
building wall. When supported to the ground, the footing for the supports shall be
found 8 inches below finished grade. Precast concrete piers may be used in lieu
of poured footings, provided they are placed on stable seil. If second stage
regulator/meter assemblies could be subject to vehicle damage, then a minimum
of 3" steel crash posts filled with concrete shall be installed for protection. Crash
posts shall have a minimurn depth in the ground of 24", embedded in concrete.

6. Observation and inspection, if any, by the District shall not constitute an approval
of the work of installation of the aforementioned protective cover, nor shall it be
deemed to create any fiability or responsibility on the part of the District for the
design or construction of the protective cover, nor to any third party or entity
whatsoever.

7. The riser pipes for the yard piping shall not be embedded in concrete, asphalt or
other rigid substance. Such substance placed around a riser shall be held back
at least 3 inches from all sides of the pipe. All exposed exterior gas piping used
for runs along walls or roofs shall be minimum schedule 80 steel pipe supported
and secured by approved straps at intervals not to exceed four (4) feet.

8. LP-gas tanks shall be permanently marked by a square or other approved equal
stake of wood or other material with a minimum dimension of 2" X 2" or a cross
sectional width of 2-inch nominal lumber.

0. Such stakes shall be of sufficient height to rise above the anticipated snow
depth, with the minimum height being 10 feet. The snow stakes shall be yellow
in color and will be placed on the opposite side of the tank from the riser, and
directly opposite the tank valves. The top twelve inches of the stake shall be
painted orange. The side of the stake adjacent to the tank shall continue with the
orange color a minimum of 18 inches from the top of the stake.

10. Installation and maintenance of alf tank stakes shall be the responsibility of the
LPG supplier. No tank shall be filled or serviced unless staked as provided in this
chapter.

11. Any supplier supplying propane to a tank must affix a label or other means of
identification to the inside of the tank valve protective cover. The label or other
device must be waterproof and contain the suppliet'’s name and emergency

Ordinance 2025-1 Page 27

26-0184 H 30 of 65



telephone number.

12. All LP-gas tanks shall be placed on approved concrete supports. Acceptable
tank supports shall include, but not be limited to: precast reinforced concrete
pads, reinforced concrete slab, or precast reinforced concrete saddles. Use of
un-reinforced cinder building blocks is specifically prohibited. If saddles are used
they shall contact a minimum of 110 degrees of the tank circumference. Asphalt
impregnated felt of not less than 3/8 inch thickness shall be installed between
the container and the concrete saddle. Support may be poured in place in lieu of
prefabricated supports. [f poured in place it shall be a minimum of 4 inches thick
and reinforced with not less than WWF 6 X 12, W16 by W26 or 4 #3 rebar in
gach direction. In areas where tanks may be subject to shifting snow, unstable
ground or other hazardous conditions, the fire code official may require
additional tank support, securing or protection.

SECTION 6113 “UNDERGROUND LP-GAS TANK INSTALLATION AND
OWNERSHIP" IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

6113 Underground LP-gas tank installation and ownership.

6113.1 Permits and plans. Permits shall be required, and plans shall be submitted for
all underground tank installations as approved by the code official.

6113.2 Underground LP-gas tank ownership. Underground LP-gas tanks shall be
prohibited from being sold to end-users and shall be retained by the LP-gas company
under a lease-type system fo ensure proper annual maintenance requirements are met

and recorded.

SECTION 6114 "NATURAL GAS INSTALLATIONS" IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

6114 Natural gas installations. Existing natural gas installations shall comply with the

following:
1. The meter assembly shall be installed on the gable end of the building, as close

as practical to the building wall, unless this is not feasible due to structural or
topographical constraints.

2. A protective cover, designed to be equal to or greater than the Building Design
Load (determined by the building department), approved by the supplier, shall
be installed over the meter assembly, securely supported to the ground or
diagonally to the building wall. Where supported to the ground, the footing for
the supports shall be founded 6 inches below finished grade. Pre-cast concrete
piers may be used in lieu poured footings, provided they are placed on stable

soil.

SECTION 6115 “VIOLATIONS" IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

6115 Violations.
6115.1 Violations. It shall be unlawful for an LP-gas supplier to provide service to a

Ordinance 2025-1 Page 28

26-0184 H 31 of 65



LP-gas installation, which does not comply with the provisions in section 6112 or 8113.

6115.2 Failure to Provide Cover. Failure by the customer to provide a cover as
required for a natural gas meter assembly is a violation of this code and will subject the

customer to a one hundred dollar ($100.00) fine.

Chapter 80

SECTION 80, NFPA 1-24, CHAPTER 22 “AUTOMOTIVE WRECKING YARDS" IS
ADOPTED, AMENDED SECTIONS AS FOLLOWS:

Amend Section 22.3 as follows:

22.3 Fire Apparatus Access Roads. Fire apparatus access roads shall be in
accordance with the California Fire Code, Section 503 and Appendix D.

Add new Section 22.10 as follows:
22.10 Storage. Stored vehicles, boats, recreational vehicles, parts, and equipment

shall not be stored within 30 feet of adjacent properly lines.

SECTION 80, NFPA, 13D-25 “STANDARD FOR THE INSTALLATION OF SPRINKLER
SYSTEMS IN ONE-AND TWO FAMILY DWELLINGS AND MANUFACTURED HOMES”
IS AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 903.3.1.3, 903.3.5.1.1

NFPA 13D, Amended Sections as follows:

Revise Section 5.1.1.2 as follows:

5.1.1.2 A supply of at least one of each type and temperature sprinkier used within the
premises shall be maintained on the property at an approved location. Spare sprinklers
shall be kept in a mounted and accessible cabinet.

Revise Section 7.6 as follows:

Ordinance 2025-1 Page 29

26-0184 H 32 of 65



7.6 Alarms. A /ocal audio/visual device activated upon water flow shall be provided on
all fire sprinkler systems in homes at an approved location on the exterior of the

dwelling.
Revise Section 11.2.1.1 as follows:
11.2.1.1 Where a fire depariment pumper connection is not provided, the system shall

be hydrostatically tested at & minimum pressure of 150 pounds per square inch gauge
for no less than a 30-minute duration without evidence of leakage.

Appendix B ~ Fire Flow Requirements for Buildings

TABLE B105.1(1) “REQUIRED FIRE FLOW FOR ONE- AND TWO-FAMILY
DWELLINGS, GROUP R-3, AND R-4 BUILDINGS AND TOWNHOUSES" SHALL BE

AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

TABLE B105.1(1) REQUIRED FIRE FLOW FOR ONE- AND TWO-FAMILY
DWELLINGS, GROUP R-3, AND R-4 BUILDINGS AND TOWNHOUSES

FIRE-FLOW AUTOMATIC MINIMUM | FLOW 1
| CALCULATION SPRINKLER SYSTEM | FIRE-FLOW DURATION '
AREA (Design Standard) {gallons per {(hours)

(square feet) E! minute) l
0 - 3,600 No automatic sprinkler 1,000 1 ]
sysfem |
 E— B —1 + —
3,601 and No automatic sprinkler | Value in Table | Duration in Table
I greater ! system B105.1(2) B105.1(2) at the
required fire-flow
‘ ' | rate |
: MAJOR SiJBDlVfSlONS (&5 PARCELS_ OR GREATER) o
| 0 - 3,600 i Section 903.3.1.3 of the [ 1060 7
CA Fire Code or Section
P2904 of the CA
Residential Code B I -
| 3,601 and greater ; Section 903.3.1.3 of the 1/2 value of
I CA Fire Code or Section Table B105.1(2)
P2904of the CA (min. 1000 2
t l Residential Code GPM)
Ordinance 2025-1 Page 30

26-0184 H 33 of 65



OTHER RESIDENTIAL DEVELOPMENT

0 - 3,600 | Section 803.3.1.3 of 500 | 1
l the CA Fire Code or

Section P28040f the

CA Residential Code

3,601 and greater ; Section 903.3.1.3 of 1/2 value of 1
f the CA Fire Code or Table
Section P2904of the B105.1(2) (min.
| | CAResidential Code 750 GPM)

TABLE B105.2 “REQUIRED FIRE FLOW FCR BUILDINGS OTHER THAN ONE-
AND TWO-FAMILY DWELLINGS, GROUP R-3, AND R-4 BUILDINGS AND
TOWNHOUSES"” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

TABLE B105.2 REQUIRED FIRE FLOW FOR BUILDINGS OTHER THAN ONE-
AND TWO-FAMILY DWELLINGS, GROUP R-3, AND R-4 BUILDINGS AND

TOWNHOUSES i
AUTOMATIC MINIMUM FIRE- FLOWDURATION |
: (Design Standard) {gallons per minute)
] -
l No automatic sprinkler Value in Table Duration in Table B105.1(2)
| system | B105.1(2) | - |
Section 903.3.1.1 of the | 50% ofthe value in | Duration in Table B105.1(2) at ]
CA Fire Code Table B105.1(2)® l the reduced flow rate
[ 1

a. The reduced fire flow shall not be less than 1,500 gpm

Appendix C - Fire Hydrant Locations And Distribution

TABLE C102.1 REQUIRED NUMBER AND SPACING OF FIRE HYDRANTS
SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

| FIRE-FLOW | MINIMUM | AVERAGE | MAXIMUM DISTANCE |
| REQUIREMENT | NUMBEROF | SPACING FROM ANY POINT ON
(gpm) HYDRANTS | BETWEEN STREET OR ROAD
Ordinance 2025-1 Page 31

26-0184 H 34 of 65



[ N HYDRANTS *P>| FRONTAGETOA
.9 | HYDRANT %9
(feet)

1,750 or less 1 300 150

_1 . 751-2,250 2 300 150
2,251-2,750 3 300 150
2,751-3,250 3 300 150
3,251-4,000 | 4 300 150
4.001-5000 5 300 | 150
5,001-5,500 5] 300 . 150
5,501-6,000 6 250 ' 150

__+ et S—— —

6,001-7,000 7 250 150
7.001 or more 8 or more 200 | 120

For SI: 1 foot = 304.8 mm, 1 gallon per minute = 3,785 Lim.

a.Reduce by 100 feet for dead-end streets or roads.

b.Where streets are provided with median dividers that cannot be crossed by firefighters pulling hose

lines, or where arterial streefs are provided with four or more traffic lanes and have a traffic count of
rare than 30,000 vehicles per day, hydrant spacing shall average 500 feet on each side of the street I
| and be arranged on an alternating basis. |
¢.Where new water mains are extended along sireets where hydrants are not needed for protection of
structures or similar fire problems, fire hydrants shall be provided at spacing not to exceed 1,000 feet to
provide for transportation hazards.
d.Reduce by 50 feet for dead-end streets or roads.
e.0ne hydrant for each 1,000 gallons per minute or fraction thereof.
' f. A 50-percent spacing increase shall be permitted where the building is equipped throughout with an
approved automatic sprinkler system in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1 of the California Fire Code. t
g.A 25-percent spacing increase shali be permitted where the building is equipped throughout with an
approved automatic sprinkler system in accaordance with Section 803,3.1.3 of the California Fire Code or
| Section P2804 of the California Residential Code.
h.The fire code official is authorized to modify the location, number and distribution of fire hydrants based
| on site-specific constraints and hazards.

Appendix D - Fire Apparatus Access Roads

SECTION D103.1 “ACCESS ROAD WIDTH WITH A HYDRANT' SHALL BE
AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Ordinance 2025-1 Page 32

26-0184 H 35 of 65




Section D103.1 Access Road Width with a Hydrant. Where a fire hydrant is
located on a fire apparatus access road, the minimum road width shall be 26 feet
(7925 mm), exclusive of shoulders (see Figure D103.1).

Exception: Driveways
SECTION D103.2 "GRADE” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

SECTION D103.2 Grade. Fire apparatus access roads and driveways shall not
exceed 15.9% in grade unless approved by the fire code official.

SEGTION D103.3 “TURNING RADIUS” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

SECTION D103.3 Turning Radius. The minimum tumning radius shall be determined
by the fire code official; and shall not include curb and gutter.

SECTION D103.5 “FIRE APPARATUS ACCESS ROAD GATES® SHALL BE
AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

SECTION D103.5 Fire Apparatus Access Road Gates. Gates securing the fire
apparatus access roads shall comply with all of the following criteria:

1. Where a single gate is provided, the gate width shall be not less than 20 feet
(6096 mm). Where a fire apparatus road consists of a divided roadway, the gate
width shall be not less than 14 feet (4268 mm).

2. Gates shall be of the horizontal swing, horizontal slide, vertical lift or vertical pivot
type.

3. Construction of gates shall be of materials that allow manual operation by one
person.

4. Gate components shall be maintained in an operative condition at all times and
replaced or repaired when defective.

5. Electric gates shall be equipped with a means of opening the gate by fire
department personnel for emergency access. Emergency opening devices shall
be approved by the fire code official.

6. Methods of locking shall be submitted for approval by the fire code official.

7. Electric gate operators, where provided, shall be listed in accordance with UL
325.

8. Gates intended for automatic operation shall be designed, constructed and
installed to comply with the requirements of ASTM F2200.

CQrdinance 2025-1 Page 33

26-0184 H 36 of 65



SECTION D103.6.1 "ROADS 20 TO 29 FEET IN WIDTH" SHALL BE AMENDED AS
FOLLOWS:

SECTION D103.6.1 Roads 20 to 29 feet in width. Fire lane signs as specified in
Section D103.6 shall be posted on both side of fire apparatus access roads that are
20 to 29 feet wide (6096 to 8534.4 mm).

SECTION D103.6.2 “ROADS MORE THAN 26 FEET IN WIDTH" SHALL BE
AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

SECTION D103.6.2 Roads more than 29 feet in Width. Fire lane signs as specified
in Section D103.6 shall be posted on one side of fire apparatus access roads more
than 29 feet wide (8534.4 mm) and less than 36 feet wide (70972.8 mm).

SECTION D104.4 *CIRCUMFERENTIAL FIRE APPARATUS ACCESS ROADS"
SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

SECTION D104.4 Circumferential Fire Apparatus Access Roads. When required
by the fire code official, a fire apparatus access road shall be constructed to
encompass the entirety of a structure and shall provide a continuous means of
emergency vehicle access.

SECTION D105.2 “WIDTH” SHALL BE ANEMDED AS FOLLOWS:

D105.2 Width. Aerial fire apparatus access roads shall have a minimum unobstructed
width of 28 feet (8534.4 mm), exclusive of shoulders, in the immediate vicinity of the

building or portion thereof.

SECTION 4: CONFLICT

That Ordinance No. 2022-01 of the LVFPD, and all other ordinances or parts of
ordinances herewith are hereby repealed.

SECTION 5: SEVERABILITY

If any Ordinance, article, subsection or subdivision thereof, provision, sentence,
clause or phrase of this code, or any application thereof, is for any reason held to be
invalid by a court of competent jurisdiction, such decision shall not affect the
remaining provisions of this code, which can be given effect without the invalid
portions and, therefore, such invalid portions are declared to be severable. The

Ordinance 2025-1 Page 34

26-0184 H 37 of 65



LVFPD hereby declares that it would have enacted this Ordinance and each of its
articles, sections, subsections, or subdivisions thereof, provisions, sentences,
clauses or phrases irrespective of the fact that one or more of them is declared
invalid.

SECTION 6: EFFECTIVE DATE AND PUBLICATION

This Ordinance shall take effect thirty (30) days after its adoption. The LVFPD Board
Secretary is directed to publish this ordinance in a newspaper of general circulation
in the District. In lieu of publication of the full text of the ordinance, a summary of the
ordinance may be published by the by the Board Secretary within fifteen (15) days
after its passage and a certified copy shall be posted in the office of the LVFPD
pursuant to Government Code Section 36233(c) (1).

The above Ordinance was infroduced at a meeting of the Board of Directors of the
LVFPD on August 29, 2025, and it was then read for the first time. A public hearing
was set for the Ordinance to be read for the second time on September 29, 2025 and
approved by the foliowing vote:

A
PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of Directors of the LVFPD this, .;Zf 4 day of
Deplenbts | 2025.

AYES: 3
NOES: &
ABSENT 7
ABSTAIN: €

John\ﬁfge, Chair of the Board

ATTEST:

Tt B lo

Irene Kaelin, Board Secretary

Ordinance 2025-1 Page 35

26-0184 H 38 of 65



LAKE VALLEY FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT

“Serving the Community Since 19477

Chad Stephen, Fire Chief
Board of Directors A
John Rice  TAAKE WALLgy
Brian Hogan -
Ireng Kaglin <2
Tim Cain -'-' _+

Jessica Henderson

4 Q”"U unll-"‘! "'

RESOLUTION NO. 2025-3

Lake Valley Fire Protection District, El Doradn County, California
Adopting Findings Supporting Amendments to the 2025 California Fire Code

A resolution for the Lake Valley Fire Protection District setting forth findings with respect to local conditions
within the District which make certain modifications and changes to the California Fire Code reasonably
necessary for fire and life safety in the District. The Governing Board of the Lake Valley Fire Protection District
finds and resolves as follow:

WHEREAS, Health & Safety Code Section 17958.5 permits a Fire Protection District to adopt an ordinance
which changes or modifies the State Housing regulations adopted pursuant to Health & Safety Code Section
17922 upon determination that such changes or modifications are necessary due to local conditions; and

WHEREAS, Health & Safety Code Section 17958.7 requires that a Board of Directors making any changes or
modifications pursuant to Health & Safety Code Section 1.7958.5 shall make express finding that such changes
or modifications are needed; and shall file a copy of such changes or modifications with the Department of
Housing and. Community Development.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED AND ORDERED, that the Board of the Lake Valley Fire Protection. District,
after having duly noticed and held public hearing, expressly finds that such changes or modifications are
reasonably necessary because of local canditions, more specifically set forth as follows:

Respect, Integrity, Dedication, Positive Attitude and Teamwork
2211 Keetak 5t., So. Lake Tahoe, CA. 96150 ¢ (530) 577-3737 » Fax 577-3739
www.LakeValleyFire.org

26-0184 H 39 of 65



FINDINGS OF FACT
2025 CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE

In connection with the amendments enacted by Section 2 and 3 relating to the Caiifornia
Fire Code and its appendices, 2025 edition, the LAKE VALLEY FIRE PROTECTION
DISTRICT (LVFPD) makes the following findings pursuant to Health and Safety Code
Section 17958.5, 17958.7, and 18941.5. The changes are reasonably necessary
because of local climatic, topographical, or geological conditions.

LVFPD hereby adopts, pursuant to Section 18941.5 of the California Health and Safety
Code, the following findings of fact:

(a) Under this adopting ordinance, specific amendments have been established
which are of a more restrictive nafure than those adopted by the State of
California (State Buildings Standards Code, State Housing & Community
Development Codes), commonly referred to as Title 24 & Title 25 of the
California Code of Regulations. The LVFPD has recognized these amendments
to the 2025 California Fire Code to address the fire problems, concerns, and
future direction by which LVFPD can establish and maintain an environment
that will afford a level of fire and life safety to all who live and work within its
boundary.

(b The International Code Council has assumed responsibility for the International
Fire Code and International Fire Code Standards. The International Code
Council provided a means for participation by all code enforcement officials
from throughout the country and industry representatives, consultants, and
other private parties interested in the International Fire Code.

(¢) The International Fire Code, being the 2024 edition thereof, published by the
International Code Council, is a nationally recognized compilation of proposed
rutes, regulations, and standards of said Organization.

(d) Said International Fire Code has been printed and published as a Code in book
form within the meaning of Section 50022.1 of the Government Code of the
State of California.

{e) Under Section 18941.5 of the Health and Safety Code, local amendments are
based on climatic, topographical, and geological conditions. The findings of fact
herein address each of these situations and present the local situation, which,
either singularly or in combination, caused the aforementioned amendments to

be adopted.

LOCAL CONDITIONS
1. BACKGROUND

a. The fire environment of a community is primarily a combination of two factors:
the physical gecgraphic characteristics of the area and the historic pattern of
development. These two factors create a mixture of environments that
ultimately determines the area’s fire protection needs.

b. The Lake Valley Fire Protection District provides fire prevention, fire
protection, advanced emergency medical and rescue services for
unincorporated El Dorade and Alpine County areas within the Lake Tahoe

26-0184 H 40 of 65



Basin.

c. The Lake Valley Fire Pratection District has fire stations at Stafion 7, located
at 2211 Keetak, Station 6, located at 1286 Golden Bear Trail. Station &
located at 1009 Boulder Mountain Court is staffed by CalFire via a lease
agreement with the District.

d. The Lake Valley Fire Protection District service area includes: California State
Highway 50 from Camp Sacramentio to the City of South Lake Tahoe
boundary; California Siate Highway 89 South from Alpine County Willow
Creek Road to California State Highway 50 in Meyers. Extending along
California State Highway 89 North, the Fire District extends from the Northern
boundary of the City of South Lake Tahoe (West Way) to Eagle Creek in
Emerald Bay.

e. The Fire District covers 85 square miles with a population of 13,000, swelling
to over 100,000 during the summer months. The Fire Disfrict has 3 fire
stations; two staffed by 24 safety personnel and one (1} fire siation via Cal fire
contract. The District has five {5) Chief Officers, including the Fire Chief, one
(1) Mechanic/Fleet Manager and one (1) Administrative Assistant. Overall,
there 30 fire total District personnel. Oversight for the Fire District is via the
five (6) members of the Fire Board of Directors.

f. Many roads are sub-standard—narrow widths, on-street parking, less than 20
feet of unobstructed pavement creating ingress and egress issues during
peak population fluctuations. Some areas are served by single lane roads,
severely restricting emergency vehicles.

d. The topography of the Fire District varies from near level to terrain in excess
of a 40 percent slope. As a rule of thumb, the rate of fire spread doubles as
the slope percentage doubles, all other factors remaining the same. Most
residential and commercial structures are in, or are surrounded by, forested
areas. Due to drought, beetle infestations, and heavy vegetation, much of the
area has dead or dying trees, confributing to fire danger. Elevation ranges
from about 6200 feet at lake level to over 7200 feet on mountain pass roads
with peaks exceeding 9000 feet in elevation,

h. Vegetation in the Fire District varies from sub-alpine forests of aspen and pine
to pine and cedar forests, with substantial brush fields of manzanita, snow
brush, and white thorn. Residential development in the Fire District is
generally concentrated in heavily forested areas. This situation allows fire to
travel easily from home to home, forest to home, or home to forest by
radiation, heat convection and/or flying embers. Often, dwellings are

. completely surrounded by highly combustible vegetation, compounding the
fire problem. Amendments are justified on the basis of the local climatic
conditions.

2. CLIMATIC CONDITIONS
a. Annual precipitation fluctuates greatly. Approximately 90 to 95 percent of the
precipitation occurs during the months of November through April, and 5 to 10
percent occurs from May through QOctober. The Fire District has experienced
major droughts in the recent past; one in 1977 - 1878, one which started in

26-0184 H 41 of 65



1989 and lasted into 1994, others from 1999-2004, and 20068-2009. Droughts
continue to cycle to this day. Lightning storms are frequent and are usually
accompanied by little rainfall, potentially creating numerous lightning caused

fires.
b. Snow storms, resulting in the loss of vehicular access and avalanches are

routine. Heavy winter snows are responsible for delays in response times and
access o buildings and patients at emergency scenes. Winter snow storms
along with heavy tourist traffic routinely bring all community traffic to a
standsfill during weekends and holidays. The neighborhoods of North Upper
Truckee, Echo View Estales, Mountain View Estates, and Tahoe Mountain
were affected by the Angora Fire of 2008 with the loss of 254 homes. The
area sees significant traffic delays due io tourist travel and is highly prone to
heavy snows, These situations impact emergency response, occupant
evacuation, and access to these populated areas.

c. During the months of June through September, the daily humidity ranges
around 30 percent, and often drops to the low teens. Low relative humnidity
has allowed for greater spread of wildfires and caused structure fires to
readily spread {o the wildland interface

d. During the months of June through September, daily temperatures exceed 70
degrees to 90 degrees Fahrenheit. Winter temperatures can drop to below O
degrees Fahrenheit. The highest recorded temperature was 99 degrees
Fahrenheit in 1988 with the lowest being negative 13 degrees Fahrenheit in
February, 2019.

e. Prevailing winds are out of the south and southwest. However, north and east
winds occur during the spring (May through June), the fall (late September
and October), and occasionally during the summer months. Wind velocities
generally range from five to fiiteen miles per hour, gusting to thirty miles per
hour during the summer months. These winds push wildfires, rapidly
increasing the spread of fire and often topple trees obstructing road access.

SUMMARY

The Fire District is subject to precipitation, relative humidity, temperature
extremes, and high velocity winds. These local climatic conditions affect the
spread, acceleration, intensity and size of a fire. Times of fittle or no rainfall and
high temperatures create extremely hazardous conditions—mainly residential
roof fires and wildfire conflagrations. Climatic conditions are one of the most
significant impacts to fire behavior and other major emergency events due to

their uncontroliable nature.

3. TOPOGRAPHICAL CONDITIONS
a. The Fire District has a varied topography and vegetative cover. It has
relatively flat areas along the shoreline of Lake Tahoe along Pope and
Baldwin Beach areas (6,225 feet at Lake level). Steep hills and mountain
peaks reaching over 10,000 feet are part of the Tahoe Basin. Vegetative
cover ranges from stands of manzanita fo dense forests of fir and pine trees
creating a heavy fuel load.

26-0184 H 42 of 65



b. The neighborhoods of South Upper Truckee and Christmas Valley off of both
State Highway 50 at Echo Summit and State Highway 89 to Alpine County
also suffer traffic delays from tourist travel and heavy snows. Echo Summit,
via State Highway 50, is a funnel for fraffic congestion and highly prone to
winter avalanches. Both situations created for delayed response.

c. The State Highway 89 corridor, north to Emerald Bay, is the most heavily
traveled road in the Lake Tahoe Basin. Of the estimated 20 million tourists
visiting the Tahoe Basin annually, roughly 4.9 million stop to take pictures of
Emerald Bay. This busy highway runs through Camp Richardson Resort,
Pope, Kiva and Baldwin Beaches and USFS historic sites. The Mount Tallac
trailnead and access to Fallen Leaf Lake, Cascade Lake residential areas,
Spring Creek summer residential areas, inspiration Point, Emerald Bay,
Vikings Holm and Eagle Falls Creek are accessed along this route. The Fire
District extends along State Highway 50, over Echo Summit on the west side
of the Sierra Crest to the Echo Snow Park-Adventure Mountain and Sierra at
Tahoe Ski Resort. The Fire District also serves the hamlets of Little Norway,
the Mount Ralston Subdivision, Echo Lakes, Philips, Sierra Pines, Bryan
Creek, Tamarack Park, Sayles Canyon and Camp Sacramento. Road access
can be congested because of steep terrain and road design to ascend or
descend these siopes.

d. The rugged terrain | causes developments to be clustered in buildable areas,
many of which are remote as a result. Access fo the communities and
recreational areas of Strawberry, Twin Bridges, Horse Tail Falls, Lover's
Leap, and the 39 mile tract result in longer response time for emergency
equipment.

e. Topographical features and ftraffic-caused delays translates to delayed
responses and fire suppression operations. Strict permitting, reasonable
zoning ordinances, and other suitable protective measures will mitigate
against these inhibiting factors and will discourage fire ignition and growth,
enabling emergency responders to successfully resolve emergency events.

SUMMARY

The topographical conditions reduce accessibility and cause delays in
emergency response. The Fire District is subject to terrain changes, steep
slopes, surface features, hazardous building operations, and other terrain risk
factors. As an example, responding to an emergency on a steep and winding
mountain road along with a multitude of visitors and travelers during fire season
delays response to the scene. Wildland fire can double in size every two minutes,
and the Fire District has seen some significant changes in spread dynamics due
to drought and other climatic conditions in the area.

4, GEOLOGICAL CONDITIONS
a. The geological processes that created the Tahoe Basin are still active. The
Fire District's entire land surface is in the high-to-moderate seismic hazard
zones. The West Tahoe Fault traverses the Fire District.
b. An earthquake is highly probable and could damage numerous structures and

26-0184 H 43 of 65



infrastructure. This catastrophic damage would put the general public at high
risk. Emergency response crews would not be able to respond to every
incident immediately. Built-in fire protection and other safety measures, such
as limitations of building height, stories, and areas, would provide a higher
level of safety for building occupants, properly, and emergency responders.
This is even more critical in high occupancy (assembly) buildings, where the
potential [oss of life is very high.

SUMMARY

The geological conditions increase the magnitude, exposure, accessibility
problems, and fire hazard the District must handle. As an example, fire following
an earthquake has the potential to cause greater loss of life and damage to
property than an earthquake itself. The response delays caused by the
earthquake damage will allow fire to spread uncontrolled until fire department

arrival.

5. OTHER CONDITIONS
a. Revisions made to address administrative policies and procedures
established in the Fire District.
b. Revisions made to include efrata and/or editorially correct code language.
¢. Revisions made to correlate with other State regulations.

CONCLUSION
Local climatic, geographic and topographic conditions described above increase

the frequency, intensity, and size of fires involving buildings in the Fire District.
Further, these conditions impact potential damage to structures from an
earthquake and subsequent fire. Therefore, it is reasonably necessary that the
Califernia Fire Code be modified to mitigate the effects of the above conditions.

2025 CFC FINDINGS OF FACT

2025 CFC Section Title Findings
1011 Tille 3e -
105.5 Required Operational Permiis 3e
105.5.60 Automobile Wrecking Yards 3e

1058 Required Construction Permits 3e
105.6.26 Automobile Wrecking Yards 3e
1056.27 Traffic Calming Devices 3e
108.5.1 Cost Recovery Fees 5a
108.5.2 Administrative Costs Sa

26-0184 H 44 of 65



2025 CFC Section Title Findings

1125 Appeal Procedures and Timelines Sa

113.4 Violation Penalties 5a

11342 Citations 5a

1144 Failure to Comply Sa

202 Campfire 5b

202 District ba

202 Driveway 5c

202 Executive Body Sa

202 Fire Chief 5a

202 Fire Hazard Sa

202 Open Burning 5h

202 Trained Crowd Manager ba

30744 Qper: Buming Restrictions 2c, 2d, 2e, 3¢, 3d,3c. 3e
401.21 Pre-Fire Plans 5a

403.1 General Sa

503.2.1 Dimensions 2b, 22, 3b, 3c, 3d, 3e, 4a, 4b
503.25 Dead-Ends 2h, 2e, 3b, 3¢, 3d, Je, 4a, 4b
503.26 Bridges And Elevated Surfaces 2b, 2e, 3b, 35, 3d, Je, 43, 4b
503.3.1 Na Parking in Fire Lanes 2a,2b, 3¢, 3d, 43, 4b
503.3.2 No Parking in Front of Hydrants 2a, 2b, 3¢, 3d, 43, 4b
503.3.3 Fire Lanes Based on Road Width 2a, 2b, 3¢, 3d, 43, 4b
503.6 Security Gates 2a, 2b, 3¢, 3d, 4a, 4b
505.1 Address ldentification 2b, 2e, 3¢, 3e, 4b
5056.1.1 Ilumination 2a,2b

26-0184 H 45 of 65



2025 CFC Section Title Findings

507.5.1 Where Required 2e, 33, 3¢, 3e, 4b
509.3 Fire Control Room 2a, b, 2d, 20, 4b
5104.23 Standby Power 23,2b, 2d, 2¢, 4h
903.2 Where Required 5b, 5¢

903.2.1.1 Group A-1 2h, 2, 3b, 3c, 3d, 38, 43, 4b
903.21.2 Group A-2 2o, 2e, 3b, 3¢, 3d, 3e, 43, 4b
903.2.1.3 Group A-3 2b, 2e, 3b, 3¢, 3d, g, 43, 4b
903.214 Group A-4 2b, 2e, 3b, 3¢, 3d, 3¢, 49, 4b
803.2.2 Group B 2b, Ze, 3b, 3c, 3d, e, 43, 4b
903.2.3 Group E 2b, 2e, 3b, 3o, 3d, 3¢, 42, 4b
90324 Group F-1 and F-2 2b, 2e, 3b, 3¢, 3d, 3¢, 4a, 4b
03.27 Group M 2b, 2¢, 3b, 3c. 3d, 3e, 43, 4b
90327.2 Group M Uphelstered Furniture or Matfresses 2b, 2e, 3b, 3¢, 3d, 3e, 43, 4b
903.2.84 Manufactured Homes 2b, 2, 3, 3¢, 3d, 3¢, 43, 4b
903.2.9 Group $-1 2b, 2e, 3b, 3c, 3d, 3e, 43, 4b
903.2.10 Group 5-2 2b. 2e,3b, 3c, 3d, 3e, 43, 40
903.2.10.1 Commercial Parking Garages 2b, 2e, 3b, 3¢, 3d, 3e, 4a, 4b
9034.3 Where Required in Existing Buildings and Structures 2b, 28, 3b, 3¢, 3d, 3e, 43, 4b
903.6 Where Required in Existing Buildings and Structures 2b, 2e, 3b, 3¢, 3d, 3e, 4a, 4b
907.2 Where Required — New Buildings and Structures 2b, 28, 3b, 3c, 3d, Je, 4a, 4b
907214 Group A Under 3,600 Square Feet 2b, 2e, 3b, 3¢, 3d, 3e, 44, 4b
907.2.24 Group B Under 3,600 Square Feet 2b, 2¢, 3b, 3¢, U, 3e,4a, 4b
907.2.3.11 Group E Under 3,600 Square Fest 2b, 28, 3b, 3¢, 3d, 3e, 45, 4b
907.24.2 Group F Under 3,600 Squzare Feet 2b, 2e, 3b, 3¢, 3d, 3¢, 43, 4b

26-0184 H 46 of 65



2025 CFC Section Title Findings
907.25.2 Group H Under 3,600 Square Feet 2b, 2e, 3, 3c, 3, 3e, 43, 4b
907.2.6.6 Group | Under 3,600 Square Feet 2b, 2e, 3b, 3¢, 3d, 3e, 4a, 4b
807.2.7.2 Group M Under 3,600 Square Feet 2b, 2e, 3b, 3¢, 3d, 3e,4a, 4b
907.2.8.4 Group R-1 Under 3,600 Square Feet 2b, Ze, 3b, 3¢, 3d, 3¢, 4a, 4b
907.29.4 Group R-2, R-2.1, R-2.2 Under 3,600 Square Feet 2h, 2e, 3b, 3c, 3d, 3¢, 44, 4b
907.2.10.3 Group S Under 3,600 Square Feet 2b, 2e, 3b, 3c, 3d, 3e, 4a, 4b
907.2.30 Type | Hood Installations 2b, 2¢, 3b, 3¢, 3d, 3¢, 4a, 4b
907.6.2.1 Secondary Power Supply 2b, 2e, 3b, 3c, 3d, 3¢, 4a, 4b
907.6.6 Monitoring 2b, Ze, 3b, 3¢, 3d, 3e, 43, 4b
2079 Where Required in Existing Buildings and Structures 2b, 2e, 3b, 3¢, 3d, 3e, 4a, 4
1203.1.3 [nstallation 23, 2b, 4b

3308 Vegetation 1a,1¢c, 1d, 18, 22
3307.1.4 Premises Identification 2b, 2, 3b, 3¢, 3d, 3¢, 4a, 4b
3307.2 Water Supply for Fire Protection 2b, 2, 3b, 3c, 3d, Je, 43, 4b
5001.7 Liability for Damages 5a

5601.2 Permit Required 5a

5704.2.9.6.1 Locations Where Above-Ground Tanks Are Prohibited 2b.2e, 3a, 3¢, 3d, 3¢, 4b
5706.24.4 Locaticns Where Above-Ground Tanks Are Prohibited 2b,2¢, 3a, 3¢, 3d, 3e, 4b
5806.2 Limitations 2b,2e, 3a, 3c, 3d, Je, 4b
6104.2 Maximum Capacity within Established Limits 2h,2e, 3a, 3¢, 3d, Je, 4b, 5a
8112 High elevation LP-gas Installations 2a,2b, 2, 2e

6113 Underground LP-gas Tank Installation and Ownership 2a3,2b, 2, 2¢

6114 Natural Gas Installations 2a,2b, 2c. 2e

6115 Violations %a

26-0184 H 47 of 65




2025 CFC Section Title Findings

Chapter 80 NFPA 1 2a,2b, 3¢, 3d, 43, 4b
Chapter 80 NFPA 13D 2a,2b,2d, 3e

Table B105.A(1) | o ng‘_ea'F':rmfgfgﬁﬁ;;‘égm?oﬂ?hgysﬂgngs' 2b, 26, 3b, 3¢, 3d, 3¢, 42, 4b
Tase 105 () | SeEe e Flowr Gberln 06 am oy |, 3,3,50.303840 4
Table C102.1 Required Number and Spacing of Fire Hydrants 2b, 2e, 3b, 3c, 3d, 3e,4a, 4b
D103.4 Access Road Width with a Hydrant 2a, 2b, 2c, 2d, 2¢. 4b
D103.2 Grade 2a,2b, 2¢, 2d, 2¢, 4b
D103.3 Tuming Radius 2a, 20, 2¢, 24, 2e, 4b
D103.5 Fire Apparatus Access Road Gates 2a, 2b, 2c, 2d, 2¢, 4
D1036.1 Roads 20 To 29 Feet in Width 23,20, 2, 2d, 2, 4b
D1036.2 Roads Mare Than 29 Feet in Width 2a,2b, 2c, 2d, 2¢, 4b
D104.4 Circumferential Fire Apparatus Access Roads 2a,2b, 2c, 2d, 2, 4b

26-0184 H 48 of 65



The foregoing resolution was approved and adopted on the 29" day of August, 2025 by the
following vote:

AYES: 4 Lo !
Signature
NOES: 0
ABSENTS: 1 e
Title
—~--CERTIFICATION OF RESOLUTION--~-

{ 5
ATTEST: I-_}”’Mﬂ l_q ) ﬂ' Cf _, Chair of the Lake Valley Fire Protection District, withess my hand on the

29 dayof ﬁ«/’fnﬁ%f’ , 2025.

- ~—~
vfro— @@
Signature

Chavydon | @od

Title

26-0184 H 49 of 65



DSP, ECF, CPCSD, LVFPD

opted dopted

Locally adopted and amended

1011 Amend with the name of the jurisdiction Administrativa need e ™
1055 N visovisi ?ﬂmdwwmmg Locelly adoptsd and arended . |Acmiisratveneed dé to addion of secion 105,555
o T K ’:’" 5
s 16 -Nmmeﬁmmmadmmmmemmrwc
! % i J o p— = {n firs access, vagslation clearances, hazardous materials,
105.5.60 ¥ ﬁmmxxm\fm 'wpamfor Lacaliy craafed and adopted (et within avtomebile wrecking yard operations. This wes
S ] b % . adanmshatadmﬁemuiumdwmun lhaDlamond
A s L PR Spt;ngsFi’qu:emmi 5 3 m?
Add section to require construction pemmit for mmmmmmmmdmmsszsm
05 B [Automobile Wrecking Yards. gL I S 105626, . R
- % r 3 e | Aiows tha fira code official t9 enfon:e he fie code (spedﬁc
% Add seclicn to requirs construction pemit for -« oy o= - |tofire access, vegetaummmms,hazmmatmals,
1.25'8‘25 '} Automobile Wrecking Yards. oy e g doptad 7 et:}mﬂunnwdywucteéandfwmod?ﬁedmmle
1‘_\" : wredmmopetaum i e
= Nhnsmeﬂreeodeoﬁuailorewuandappmadtmﬁc
] : ; h . . calming devices prior fo installation. Fire Gmemenﬂy
105627 N mﬁﬁmmm gt gt Localy created nd adoptad ..* « |permits the fire code oficia o regulsts taffc calming +
re |devices. However, apmmtsn‘tmrrenﬂyreqwredpnuﬁo
installation causmg undue hartklup fo- -
o g “aa §y -5 |Adopting this section to allow for the creation and issuance
Egas ? o : : = offaestumacmdm Secnonwssdeﬁnespermﬁs,
10?.1 N Section Added. Previously section107.5. Locally adopled snd amended |pisn chcis, mdmspewmasmmedeM&Safety
. Code 17951, SR EE
168.5.2 N |Section added. Praviously secfion 107.5.1 Locally crested and adopted mg’f:fmﬁm”m Torecoi the cost o
: ] X Seam10&7TommmeadualomlsdauwabJe
108.7 Y Section added. Previously section 107.7 Locally croated and adopted | ook bt - .
Soc::u'l112.50fChapter1dﬁ‘leFlreCodedlheDnstnctls
addedwreadasfolm - ¥l
112.5 Appeal Procedures and Timefines: The mtent o'fihls
e pmvxsmmstodan!ylhepmdummdhmelmaforaq‘
1125 Y [Section added. Previously section 111.5 Locally adopted and amended  |individual or entity to ffe a0 appeal o the Board of Appedls.
< i regarding an order, decision, or detemination by the Flre
Code Official. BasedmtheCmml‘yofElDu‘ados
Vegetation Managmenl Orchanee Baard of Appeals
timefine. : xf “
3 ; = il
Previously section 112.4. Completed the seciion by Allows. the Fire Code Official to enforce the Fire Code that
: filing i the tlenk porlions that wers not completed prolects Mo and riperty. Foen have baen updated fo
1134 N = : Loeafly adopted and amended match the fees and penailies &5 deemed approgiiate by the
by the SFM. it is beiter iaft o localities {o determine Dmmmeﬁm Thecnangetothelanguagetc
the fees/penaities for their respective aress incude the term intr ~ “
: i 1134z&tauonsnsaddedzureadasfwmﬁ3»sz .
] o &, A1, |Citations . .“ =
e 2 ,-"’:s_“ % _ ThereCh:eiorhs&erdtﬁyau&medrepmtahe{s).
11343 N . L " ! . 7 |may issue citaions for infractions of misdemeancr "
‘o] St e, Presioulsy saction 112.4.2 Locall croeted end adoptad” . iltions ofhis code purssant to Secton 10671 of he
Health and Safety Gode of the State of Califomia and .« -
chapmr&(mmdngmm&sﬁ)dmeiiof L]
Pm2afﬁmea!CadeufhaSiﬁeMCallfuma.
.-' ¥ > st ¥
Previously section 113.4, Complete the secion by -w"r AR .
g in ha blank partiens that wera not comglefed 3 e .
144 N [bythe SFMFitisbeter ek lolocatiesto . - Locelty adopted and amended *““"‘“m’“""‘““m”mmm““"“.
1 tetermine the fess/penalies foe theie respactive S 4 |Section 114.4londudq_ihepmdﬁeﬁog@daho(u.“ N
areas A 40 P )

g SN -

26-0184 H 50 of 65



Adided definitions for clarity. Provided edditional

Added definitions for: Campfire, Driveway, District,
Executive Body, Fire Chief, Fire Hazard, Open Buming, and

commercial buildings

202 P i i Lexs#fty crealed and adopiod Trained Crowd Manager. Definfticn of open buming shaff
elilonlon for comemontalreigtous buming. notincluds residential LPG, natural gas fusled, or wood
burning appliances nor ceremonial burring.
24 Added definition of campfire to Settion Locally created and adopted Added definition for clarity.
Added a section for open burning resfrictions, Due to the high fira danger that exists in E1 Dorado County
30744 Added exception o bum rastrictions for Loeally created and adopted we have weitten more stringent rules perlaining lo open fires
ceremonialreligious busming. within grass, brush, and tree covered areas.
b Provides the creation of a floor pian for the purpose of
40121 i e e Locally created snd adopted |emergency planning fo be utized by emergency response
Fire apparaius are becoming larger and taller, A verical
dlearance of 15 fost provides proper clearanca for
apparatus fo pass under without damaging apparatus
components. If also allows an extended time frame before
J having to recut the growth of the vegetation. Additional
503.21 m:m ot e Locally adopted and amended height for vegetation clearances acts as an increased buffer
for the spread of fire. A road width of 20 feet exclusive of
shoulders, as measurad face of curb to face of curb is
needed. These stuctures can be difficult to navigate with
fire apparatus and should not be counted in the total
drivable road surfaca.
it st i o s e s Thiplin et o
< - [Fire Code and Title 14 Fire Safe Requlations to y : Soulpll
325 match as they require humarousids for ire apparatus Locally adopted and amended  |inclutles fire vehicles as well as civilian vehicies. Provides
st ek s o better sccoss for ingresslegress. Additienally, adds turn
| i around for apparatys in drveways greater than 150,
Allows codes and standards for Bridgies and Elevated
Changed ihe section for Bridges and Elevated Surfaces of El Dorado County and Appendix D of the
Surfaces lo stafe and match £ Dorado Coenty cument Fire Code, whichever is mora restrictive, fo be
e Transporiation Division In addlion fo AASHTO HB- | cocdly adopted and amended | 0w cughout county agencies and is aliowed as am
17 {minémum CFC roquired) alternate means & method that is not lass restrictive than
the Fire Code. -
! - This section clearly defines the "No Parking in Fire Lanes”
56331 Added section regarding no parking i fire lanes Locally created and adopled rules and is consistent wilk the Califomia Vehicie Code.
: Lo This section cleanly definas the *No Parking in front of ire
50332 hydrants jROmting i perkang i of Localty craated and adopted hydrants" nilas and is congistent with the Caiifomia Vehicle
o5 5 7 y This section cearly defines Callfornia Fire Code Appendix D
50333 ey regesdieg firelanes bssd o Fosd Locally crealed and sdplesd a5 the reference for road ane width and ther relation o fre
lanes. ;
Created and adopted §03.8 to maintain emergency Allows fire disiricts the authority to approve gates on
access and consistency thiough all roadway gates |roadways based on the District's gatet standard, providing
5038 in El Doradg County, referring to the gate standards RER e atko the best possible smenyency accass to maintin fast
adopted by ihe FFO's 4 _ [response times.
Added section pertaining o the visual addressing of : . Allows fire ishicts the auhorty fo spprove addressing
b buidings Locally adopted and amended | . 4 on the Disticts acdressing standards.
Requires iluminated address for new commencial Increases visibilty of building address during emesgency
5514 buildings Locelly cresked and adopted |\ <o i low or no light conditions.
Added v standard Commercial properties are redired fo install hydrants at
S075.4 Eiacenant of hydkants meirrefa?ot::ipm Locally adopted and amended [~ [0 Inlervals, thus they sfiould never be outside of 150
o feet from any given hydrant at anytime (haif the distance

inbetween)

26-0184 H 51 of 65




Added verbiage to bring all of the necessary fire
controls for a bundingtamghmﬁm

Locally created and adopled

P "

Buildings are geﬂmg Thore smable in rhe county. Itis more
mmmtuhavenewbuﬂdmgswithsdaranaysm *
wmuetogmesatepowerwmmehddngs
general uffities have been shut off. When thereisan _»
emergency, rtuwtaithatmhaverapodawessloallofme
amuuhmmebwbwimpuﬁmmmmnmdﬂmﬁghfar
safely. DmtolheﬁredangerptasmthElDomdocmniy
uvmmmmtu!ﬂmyaar mwdmngewWQﬁMam
advisable. ., - | L

ot

r u. et e e

510.4.2.3

Emergency Responder Radio System Secondary
Power Supply Modification

Locally adopled and amended

Amend to 72 hour capacity for back-up power due to
weather and PGSE safety refated power u.ﬂaga& i

9032

Adds 4 requirement %t sprinkler system installation
in new buildings and stnzctures 3,500 square feet o
greater within the district

Locally adopted and amended

Administrative need due to addiion ufsecthO:!Z 22 and
903.2.23.

o] -

403.241

Adds & requirement for sprinkler system instaliation
in nav: Group A-1 bulldings and structures 3,500
squara feet or greater within the district

Locafly adopted and aimended

Due ¥ the topographic, ciimatic, and geogaphlc mn&hons

of El Dorado County and thair contiiuting factors 1o our % |
-ma*aasedramonsehmes,almgmmmefactﬂwtﬁr&s |
double in size each and avery minute, ws 8 require spmiders

tohemtﬁ!edmshudumsmoeﬂmymmaﬁuﬂsmm J
feetmulzeasmayrelaietoﬁreheha\du'mrataof |
spread. ) |

2l

803.2.1.2

Adds a requirement for sprinkler system instaltation
in rew Group A-2 buiidings and strucfures 3,600
square feet or greater within the district

“Locally adople and amended

Due to e topographic, cimatic, and geographic conditions l
of Ef Dorads Gounty and their confributing factors toour
increased response mas, afong with the fact that fires .~
double in size each and gvary minuis, we require sprinklers
to be installed in skuctures once they reach 3,600 square
feet In size as they relate to fis behavior and rate of =
spread Sy

903,213

Adds a requirement for sprinkler system instaliation
in new Group A-3 buildings and struckires 3,600
square feet or greater within the district

Locally adopled and amanded

Due to the topographic, dlimatic, and geodraphic conditions
of El Dorado County and teir contributing factors to our
increased response fimes, slong with the fact that firess
double i 51ze each end every minute, we require sprinklars
10 ba installed in structuros orice they reach 3,600 squars
foet in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of X i

[spreati | B 4

963.2.14-

Adds 2 tequirement for sprinkler systern matailation
in new Group A< uildings and stactures 3,500
square feet or grealer within the dstrict

3 bocally adopted and amended

Dua o the topographic, elimatic, and geographic condiions
of El Devado County and ihsir contributing factors fo our - -
increased responsa times, slong with the fact that fires  *
double in size sach and every diinute, we require sprinklers
fo bie instaled in struciures once ey reach 3,600 squars |
Fast it 3ize a8 they refate to fira behavior and rate of . '
spread. S By

L

w322

Praviousty section 903.2.22" Adds a requirement for
sprinkler system instaliation in new Group B
buildings and stuctures 3,600 square fest or
greater within the district

<,
Locally gdopted and amended

Due to the topographic, tlimatic, and geographic conditions
ofEIDoradqumtyandmmcontribuhngfactu'stDmr 5
lmﬁmsahnss.mmmhdmfﬁes
doubie in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers
to be insfalled in stuctures once they reach 3,600 square
feetin size as they refate to fre behavior and fate of. .
spread

903.2.3.

Adds a requirement for sprinkler system installation
innew Group E buildings and siructures 3,604
stuare foet or greater within the district

Locally adapted and ametded

Due to the topographic, cliimalic, and geographic conditions
of Ef Dorado County and their contributing facters o our
increased response times, along with the fack that fires , .
double in size each and every minue, we require sprinklers |
to be installed in struchures once they reach 3,800 square
feet msmeaslheyralatetoﬁmbehamandmtaof
spread. b o . -‘.

503.24

x o
Adds a requirement for sprinkler system Installation
in new Group F buildings and structures 3,600
sorara foet of greater within the district

Locally adopted and amendad

Due to the topographi, cimatic, and geographic conditions
of El Dorado Gounty and their contributing factors to our
increased responsa times, along with the fact that fires
double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers
lo be installed in structures once thay reach 3,600 square
feet in size as they Telate to fire bahavior and rate of
!_spfead

26-0184 H 52 of 65



/Adds a requirement for sprinkler system installation

Due to the topographic, dimafic, end geographic conditions
of E} Dorede County ard thes confributing factors o our
|increased nesponsa times, along with the fact that fires

002.27 in new Group M buildings and structures 3,600 Locelly adopled and amended | double in size each and every minute, we require sprinkiors
; square Jeet or greater within tha distict to be instellad in structures once they reach 3,500 square
feetin size 85 they relats to fire behavior snd rate of
spread.
Due %o the topographic, climatic, and gecgraphic conditions
Adds # requitement for sprinkler system Installation ot E1 Dorado County eex] their contributing fectors t our
in new Group M with Upholsiared Fumiture or Ol b o
032712 M Locally adopted and amended double In size each and every minute, we require sprinklers
attresses bulldings and structures 3,600 square .
feet or greater witin the distict SR e e e L
feet in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of
spread.
Manutactured Homes — The Intent of this coda secticnis to
ensure that manufactured homes thet sarve as a one or two
family dwellings are consistent with the prowsions found in
CRG Section 313 periaining o buitt dwellings of a similar
Praviously secion 903,285 This section was £y SRS L B i RN e i 8 whkariurisan
%3284 created ko include manesfachred residential single | Locally sdopled and amended |52 have a heightened rsk of rapid fire consumption
family R-3 In the residental sprinkler program. : due_tomeughtmhlnwredﬁmrcmm. The
rapid fire spread throughout these structures presents a
significant risk to their occupants. Residential sprinkier
systems have been incorporated $0 degrense this risk
successfully in many Califomia communities. |
Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions
A of El Dorada County and their contribizfing factors o our
Adds a requirement for sprinkler system Installaion increased response imes, along with the fact thiat fires
803.29 in new Group S bulldings and structures 3,600 Locally adopted and amendead double in size each and avery rinute, we require sprinklers
square feet or greeter within fhe dstrict to be installed in structures ance they reach 3,600 square
feet in size as they refate to fire bohavior and rate of
spread.
Due to the topographic, elimatic, and geographic conditions
; of El Dorado County and their contribuling factons te our
Adds a requirament for sprinkfor system instalialion increased response times, along with the fact fiat fres
903.2.10 in new Group -2 beldings and structures 3,600 Localfy adopted and amended double in size wach and every minute, we requim spriniders
; square foet or greater within the district 1o be installed in structures once they reech 3,600 square
faet in size as they refate to fire hehevior and rate of
spraad.
Due to the fopographie, climatic, sad gesgraphic conditions
Previously section 903.2.10. Adds 2 requirement foc B o LN R Cral ol
inkler system installation in new Commerciat e i i oe s RSt at s
g03.2.10.4 i Locally adopted and amended | double i size each and every minule, wa roquire sprinklers
N Carpgghuloge Bl gchins 1600 1o be installed in structu reach 3600
square feet or greater within the district RaC i rssmnetmyi et
feet in size as they relate fo fire behavior and rate of
spread.
90343 fﬁmﬁ“ﬁg%ﬁmg@“ﬁ dom | Locally adopted and amanded  Provices emergency noffcaton for occupant evacusion.
Due to the topographic, chmatic, and geographic conditions
Adds a requirement to install sprinkless for existing of El Dorado Counly and their contributing faciors b our
buildings that undergo & change In use of greater increased response fimes, along with the fact that fires
9038 hazard of an increass in size greater than 500 Locally created and adopted double in size each dnt every minute, we require sprinklers
square feet and the resulting square feet is greater fo be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square
than 3,600 square feat. feet in 8iz as thay relate to fire behavior and rate of
spread.
Adds a requinernent for fire alerm system
installation in new buildings and sirschires 3,500 Locally adopted and amended Administrative need due o adtilion of section 903.2.30.

9072

|square fast oe less within the district

26-0184 H 53 of 65



907.2.1.4

Added occupant protection for fice alarms in Group
A buikiings with a floar area less then 3,600, except
R3, AG buildings not used for commercial
purposes, and buildings with a fioor area of less
than 500 square feet as approved by the fire code
official. Clarified definifion of “approved”® to mean
automatic fire alam.

Locally created and adopled

|Provides proper emergency notification for occupances that
allow public use and ensures Fire Department notification in
the event of a fire or smoke.

907.2.24

Previously section 907.2.2.3 Added occupant
protection for fire alarms in Group B bulldings with a
floor area less than 3,600, except R3, AG buiidings
not used for commercial purposses, and buildings
with a floor area of less than 500 square feet as
approved by the fire cotle official. Clarified definition
of "approved” fo mean automatic firs efam,

Localty crested and adopted

Provides proper emergency nofification for occupanies lhail
allow public use and ensurss Fire Department nodification in

|the gvent of a fire or smoke.

$07.23.11

Added occupant protection for fire 2lams in Group |
E buildings with & floor area less than 3,600, except
R3, AG tuildings not used for commercial |
purposes, and buildings with a floor area of tess

than 500 square feet as approved by the fire code
official. Clanified definition of “approved” to mean
automatic fire atam,

Locally created and adopted

Provides proper emergency notification for occupancies that
allow public use and ensures Fire Department notification in
|the event of a fira or smoke,

907.2.4.2

Previously section 907.2.4.1. Addad ocoupant

| protection for fire alarms in Geoup F buildings with a
floor area less than 3,800, except R3, AG buildings
not used for commertial pumoses, and baildings
with  floor area of leds than 500 souare feet as
appraved by e fire code offical, Clarified definion
of "approved” to mean automafic fire alam.

Locally created and adopted

Provides propar emergency netification for occupancies that
allow public wse and amsures Fine Department notification in
the event of a fire or gmoke.

907.2.5.2

Added oecupant protection for fire alamms in Group
H buildings with & floor area less than 3,600, except
R3, AG buildings not ised for commercial
purposes, and huildings with a fioor area of less
than 500 square feet as approved by the fire code
official. Clarified definition of "approved® to mean
automatic fire alam,

Locaily created and adopted

|
Provides proper emergency nolification f accupancies that |
allow public usa and ensures Fire Departmant nolification in

|
the event of a fite o smoke. [

907.26.6

Added occupant pretection for fire alams in Group |
buildings with a floor area less than 3,600, except
R3, AG buildings not used for commercial
|purposes, and buildings with & fioor area of less
than 560 square feet 8s epproved by the fire code
official. Claified definition of “appraved” to mean
automatic fire alarm.

Locally created and adopted

|
|

|Provides proper emexgency notification for socupancies that
allow public use and ensures Fire Department notification in
the avent of & fire or smoka.

907.273

Praviously section 907.2.7.2. Added occupant
protection for fire lamns in Group M buitdings with
a floor area less than 3,609, except R3, AG
buildings not used for commercial purposes, and
buildings with a flaor area of less than 509 square
feet as approved by the fire code official. Clarified
definition of "approved” to mean sutomatic fire
alam,

L.ocally created and adopted

Provides proper emergency notification for cccupancies that
aliow public use and ensures Fire Department netification in
the event of a fire or amoke.

26-0184 H 54 of 65



Added occupant protection for fire alarms in Group
R-1 buildings with a ffoor area less than 3,600,
except R3, AG buildings not used for commercial

Provides proper emergency notification for occupancies that

will cause a coet recovery foe

907.2.8.4 |purposes, and buitdings with a floor area of less Locally crested and adopted allow public use and ensures Fire Dapartment netification in
than 500 square feet as approved by the fire code the event of a fire or smoke.
official, Clarified defingion of "approved” to mean
automatic fire alam.,
Added occupant protection for fire alarms in Group
R-2, R-2.1, and R-2.2 buildings with a floor arsa
less than 3,600, except R3, AG buildings not used Provides proper emergency nofification for cccupanties that
907.29.4 for commarcial purpeses, and bulldings with a floor Locally created and adepted allow public use and ensures Fire Deparfment notification in
aiea of less than 500 square fest as approved by the event of a fire or smcke. |
the fire code official. Clarified definition of
"approved” to mean automatic fire alamt.
Previously section 807 2.10.1. Added occupant |
protection for fire alarms in Group S buikdings with a
floor area less than 3,600, excapt R3, AG buildings Provides propér emergency notification for oocupancies that
907.2.10.3 not used for commercial purposes, and buldings Locally created ard adopted allow pubfic usa and ensures Fire Dapariment notification in
with a floor area of less than 500 square feet as Ihe event of a fre or smoke.
approved by the fire code ofiicial, Clarified definition
of "approved” to mean aulomatic fire alam.
o Added ocoupant probechion for Type 1 Hood Provides proper emergency nolification for accupancies that
907.2.30 syslems to be connected to & monitored fire alarm Locally croated and adopted allow pubtic use and ensures Fire Department noiification in
system when installed or replaced the event of a fire or smoke.
) ) - | Primary Secondary Alarm Power Supply Amend to 72 hour capacity for back-up power due to
Sz Modffication Locally creled and adopled | iher and PGAE safety related power outages.
Provides proper response and maintenancs "runner senvice”
of fire alam systems, NFPA 72 specifies required response
times for fire alam frouble and supenvisory signais o
les : : engure systems remain operational, A Type A UL listed
90765 gﬁﬁﬁgi’;ﬁ"ﬁ ”'ri“c:n““msy:;";“ Locally created aod adopled |contral station meets e NFPA recuired fire alam response
: ! e - ensurng an ogerationsl fie alarm; system at al fimes.
ULTypa A listing requires central stations to provide this
"runner servica® or contract with ancther entify to provide
this service to obtain the lising.
ﬁ;ﬂsﬁ?ﬂ”ﬁ%“m”" :g‘;:’ﬁﬁﬂer Provides proper emergency notification for oceupancies that
907.9 1 A : Locally crested and adopted allow public use and ensures Fire Depariment notification in
| systems to install a fira glam if they add more than ihs ovant of 8 &re or Smoke.
500 square feet to the sfructure.
This section adds a Shunt Trip power shut off devices to
1203.1.3 Shunt rip power safely devicas Locally adopted and amended ensure emergency power shut off during the use of back-up
power supplies.
Requires vegetation clearance to buildings under Local tod i Provides clearance of vegetation to buildings under
3306 construction and construction to reduce risk of fire spread.
Previousy section 3313.1. Water supplies at Waler must be on site prioe bo combustible materis! being
T consiruction sites with combustible materials on-site| ooy adopted andamended | s o ertieal construction commending.
Previcusly section 3311.3. Address requiraments Addressing for construction sites Is important to assist
Lt for construction sites Locally creted and adopte responding emergency crews.
Any damages or costs from negligent or uniawdil ,':::r.u“l mlai;m:‘;z?ngm z:e © a’:};ﬁ &g )
5001.7 practices that cause a hazardous matedals incident Locally created and adoptad I ot practics the actuni cost will £ 1 on o the

|negligent parties.

26-0184 H 55 of 65



Added safety pratection with pemmits being issued
by both the Fire Chief and Shaxiffs Department for

Allows agencies that nead to know about explosives and
fireworks to approve them and have a dear understanding

se012 N |explosives, and by the Fire et and e Boaraof | - 200PO A amanded e e be v
Supervisors or City Council for fireworks.
Established limils as required by the Fire Code for Class |
Established limits as set forth in the Fire Code. flammable and Class !l combustibla liquid storage in above-
Ll B Clarified existing language. No change in content. Locslly adogied and amended o5 nd tanks. Réguires AH approval and a
SpecialiConditional Uige Permit from the Gounty.
| Established limils as required by the Fire Code far Class |
Established limits as sef forth in the Fire Code. flammable and Class |l combustible liquid special
STIGE4 N |Clarfied exising language. No change in comtent, | L0CY adopled and amended |, 1 ons in above-ground tanks. Requires AR approval
and a Spedal/Conditional Use Permit from the County.
Administrative need to add Disirict name. Established limits
Administralive addition of Disfrict name. as required by the Fire Code Official for Flammable
5806.2 N Established hmits as set forth in the Fire Code. Locaity adopted and amended Cryogenic fluids in staionary containers. Requires AHJ
Clarified language. No change in content. approval and 2 SpedaliConditional Lise Pemit from the
County. |
Establishes distances betwean LPG storage and
|dispensaries that ase directy related to safety forresidential |
Established limits for LPG storsge and dispensing developments and high-density hotels, motels, apartments, |
6104.2 N near or adjacent to residential development. Locally sdopted and amended elc. whero 3 relgase by leak or explosion of LP-Gag woueld
Clarified language. No change in conieat. have a high probability of injury, inhalation, or desth.
Requires AHJ approval and a Special/Condificnal Use
Pesmit from the County.
Dismantied and stored vehicles present significant firs loads
b . (bguegiesfﬂummable and combustible liguids, uptiolstery.
Chapter 40 NFP, A 1 Previously reforenced 2022 edition. Provides fire 2 i oic.) and (isk fo vogetation and adjacent properties. This
2““; h N access and clsarance fo property ines for Locally created and adeplad requirement provides fire access and darance to
K i 3 Automobile Wrecking Yards. - vegetation in sutomobile wrecking yerd operations fo eid in
1;'; St firefighting operations and reduction of fire extension to -
P :‘ P adjacent properties and/or open lands. g oF
w“_‘_'.:; F ) - ¢ A%
1
Amended to include on-site sprinkier heads and wrench on-
Previously referenced 2022 edition. NFPA 130-25 site for emergent repairs, the inclusion of a local water flow |
of Chapter 80 of the Fire Code of the District has alarm 1o creste an audible alert for the fiow of water in e |
Chaptar 80, NFPA, been amendad to update various provisions event of water activation int a vacant structure, snd
130-25 M partaining to the installation of sprinkfer systems in Locally adopted and amended hydrostatic testing requirements to assure proper 13D |
one and two-famity twellings. Remaved passive sprinkler system installation decreasing the risk of water
prIger requirement, damage from pips faflure. Passive purge requirements
werne Ialm\md.
A '#"’;. : .1 - b gt el
Eornd- N A *g Codifies past practice in regards to GPM fire fow =
A §ix B Table ~ Changed 500 GPM to 1,000 GPM in major - 50 requirements that have been used for over a decade in
31051{1) 3 N subdivisions below 5000 foot elevation, to match - Locally adopted and amended - [EDC. Also provides a minimum level of available water for
wx = fire fiow precedants used in EDC for years i 3 firefighting purposes in the event of house to housa, hoise
i : 3 i to vegetation, adn/or vegelatrion to house ignition.
° - i i %, 55k |
Appandix B Table Established 2 minfmum fire fiow reguirement of Codifies past practice in £l Dorado County in incressing fire |
{052 N 1,500 GPM and reduced redution fo 50% for all Locally adopted and amended flow availability to provide additional water for fire
commercial projects. | suppression.
Appendix C Table Codifies past practics in El Dorado County in reducing fire
C102.1 Y Reduced fire hydrant spacing to 300-8, Locally adopted and amended hydrant spacing ta provide efficient fire supwession effosts
by reducing the ime required for hose opevations.
A §ix D: D103.4 LN Added an axception for tesidential driveways Vocaly st and Ameniad It i3 unrsasonable 1o require & residential drivewsay to

construct a 26 foot wide space for access to a hydrant.

26-0184 H 56 of 65



= Title 14 requires us to only actept up to 16% driveways,
Amended b meef law of grades no grouter ; i any exceptions would raquire approval by the AH.L In our £1
W ey ) ﬂm1§%MﬂahWﬂdandU@anlntaﬁaca. Y ond Dorado County Tifle 14 adopfion we allow greater than 16%
Qride with AHJ approval end hard surface.
; . 20 foot read widths shall not include curbs and gutters due
dix D: D103.3 N
Appen Add_edtaxl}omdudewrbamdguﬂm Locally adopted and amended to potenial B aa and lutmin adis. !
3 . . Where fire apparafus sccess roads congist of a divided
Appendix D: D103.5 N m’"’m 15t m‘”"’s wherg installed | ) iy adopted and amended roadwey the gate width ahall not ba s than 15 fost due (o
Bpparalus cuess app fuiming radics,
Mo parking on roads allowed on roadways less than 28 Feet
" B In width above 5000 feet. Lower than 5000 feet this does
Appendix D: D103.6.1 N Road widths 20 o 29 fest Locatly adapted and amended ot apply, Tris section Is ad a5 it sbards in the Fire
Code Appendix D saction 103.6.1 for all other elevations.
Parking on one sida only on roads from 28 fest to 36 feet
- 3 allowed. This is not required less than 5000 fest of
ApendxD:D10352| N [Poswihsmorethan Zfeetbutiessien B | | cealy adoptod and amended  [olavation. Lower than 5000 feo this doss ot apy. The
[settion 15 adopted as it stands in the Fire Code Appencix D
Section 103.6.2 for alf other elevations.
¥¥hon required by the fire code official, a fire apparatus
’ Added to require circumferential fire spparetos acoess road shall ba constructed to encompass the entirs
Appmn?xD.DWiﬁ N e Eocaly crasted and adopled re and shell provide 2 conl s o
emengency vehicle access.
Now aerial apparatus i wider than previous apparatus
i Requiras minimum 28-it width of single fire access when in operation. Additional width pesmits travel lana for
prpend DDI02 Y road whers aeral access is required, Localy adapted and anmended other emengency equipment and avacusting vehicles to
pass when aerial apparatus in in operation,
Adopted with no Amendments
101.1 N m“;dm“m"“‘ e B G Locally adopted Administrafive clarity
1028 N Refersnces, subjects ot requlated by e Code Locally adophed Administrative clarity
104.2'mrough 104.2.2 N Abifity to enforce the code Locally adoptad Administrative clarity
104.4 through 104.4.1 N Provides autharty for entry for inspection Locally adopted Administrafive darity
104.5 N Requires firs code official identiication Locally adopted New Slate code section. Administrative clarity
1047 N Retruires retertion of reconds Locally adopted Administrative clarity
A9 trough 10481 N [Poris i e il Lacally adopted Administrative dlarity
104,10 theeugh Permits fite code official to conduct investigafions ...
104101 A for the orgin and cause of fires. oo jadcped [Adminisirative clarity
;gm g‘“’“g“ N [Permits fire supprossion ackivities. Locally adopted Adminstrative carity
:gg'g': through N |Time imitation of appication Locally adopted Adminisirative carfy
105.3.2 N Provide extension of permiis. Locally adopted Administrative clarity
105.6.2 N Construction permit for sprinkler systems Locally adopted New State code section. Administrative clarity
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and : it
106.1 through 106.4 N fra and its safety lspections Locally adopted Requires parmits for new construction
Adopted this section for administrative ciarity and .
107.1 through 1791.4 N i and e saloly inspections Locally adopted State code change inclirding temporary shuctures
Adocpted this section for administrative carity and 2
108.1 througi 108.5.1 e fe sofely inspactions Letslly adopted Pemmits application of fees foriemryofm.
108.6 N Penmits foe ralund policy Locally adopted Administrative clarity
Adopted this section for administrative clarily and P .
109, S fre and e safety inspections Locafly adopted Administrative ciarity

26-0184 H 57 of 65



£ 14 e 2
Adopled this section for adrhinistrative clarity and

Maintenance of safeguards, lesting and operation of -

118 N " I.owliy;dopied equipment, re-inspaction and lesting, recordiesping, -
fire and Bfe saloly ingpections supervision, rendering equipment inoparable, avercrawding,
11 Pemits discontinuanca of utility service Locally adopled Permits discontinuance of immediate fire hazards
1i2.1 through 1124 N Provides process for appeals 4 Localfy adopted Adminstrative clarity
}}}i?““‘“” N |Provides process for complance with orders Lofatl adopted Adrinistative carity
Asphat kettles contain highly flammable substences and
T |require stringent safeguards. Managing ignifion sources
Xix] N Adopted this section for fire and lifi safety Locally adopted mm.wmdmmmmm
. number of fires in various setiings. (Cllmasc gaolagmi ;.
and topographica).
: bt General requisements relaling to smeking. Vamntpmnls‘é's
B e "3 S - g .. |condition and safely requirements, abandoned premises,
305 througn 3114 © N |Adopted this section forfire and ife sefely i Localy sdopied mﬁm“"a"; m“ﬁjm‘mﬁ“" f"‘j
3 ;’;- * R . * - ?‘ ‘ removal of hazardous matarials. (Cﬁmahc, geologwai and -
: ; l = 4 2, IDPOQTSWW’] ¥ L =
. . . New State Coda saction, General requirements for laundry
318 N Adopted this section for fire and life safiety Locally adopted carts in commercial ccaupancies,
- T ; o General requirements for roads, tunnels, snd bridges.  *
3234 N Adopted this section for fir and life safaly Locally adopted (Cimaic, geclogical, and topographical). o
= ] - P = E
161, trowgh 1162 | + N mx‘ geaas x “'"“s““":""‘ ety and = Locally adopted <~ ~ _ |Administative clrity
Emergency Rmpmder radio coverage in existing buikdings.
Al buildings will be raqu:md to allow emergency responders
to receive and fransmit emérgency radio traffic to and frorm -
I each other and the emergency dispatch center, Time
Mmlédhssacﬁminﬂislingbuidingsﬁorme ) frames ¢an he developed to come ints compliance and the |
12 ¥ safety of ol Locally adopted phasmmo!asystemmarapenoddﬁme.dewmmadbyI
mm 9 ergency the fire code official, is acceptable. The rationale behind this
section is that on aimost all emergency mponder injury of
fatality incidents communication is a key isgue. This -
situalion canbeoorrededwrmmaaddbmofradh
eqmpmenttnbmstme signal in areas that do sot have
steong sagnal (Climatic, gedogml and tnpngraphw)
3 3 }
. : Requires etlaton of fire sprinkder 3ystems in axisting
11035 oy Adopled this section for the safety of the public, Lobal occupancies with high Tife safely risk and in conformance
i F firefighters, and cther emengancy respondars fdcpted with previous Uniform Fire Codes, (Climatic, geological, and
topographical).
ik : Provides a minimum leve ofsafety wth rgard o egress
1131;;’3“}‘9“ ;- N m”mﬁgh?gﬁ;’;xm“ Locélly adopted from existing buldings housing occupanciss with & high Fle
: ,; e safety risk. {Climatic, geological, and topographical).
- g X Provides a minimurn level of safely at e storage yards
1106.1 thwough - Adopled this section for the satety of the public, Wi f -
L Localfy adoptod with high lervels of fammable ubber material, (Climatic,
1106.1.2 firefighters, and other emargency mspenders geclogical, and topographical)
Appendix D: D101.1 " Adopted this section for the sefety of the public, iR General requirements for fire apparatus access roads
through D104.1 = firafighters, and olhwer amergency responders _L""“_ T including loads (CFimatic, gecloglcal, and tapographical).
Appendix D: D104.2 ‘N Adopted this section for the safefy of the public; 1 mlﬂd Commercial andindusﬂ'ial‘devéiounent fire apparatus
(exciuding excaption) firefighters, and other emergency responders e access roads (CAmatic, gciogical, and topographicat).
Appendix 0: D104.3 4 Adopted this saciion for the safsty of the public, b M Commercial and industrial development fire apperatus -
ihrough D105.4 firefighters, and other emergency fesporiery f 8oy access roads (Climalic, geciogical, and topographical).
Appendix D¢ 0106.1 N Adopted this section for the safety of the public, Localy adopted Fire apparatus access roads for multiple-femily residential
{exciuting axception) firefighters, and cther emargency responders developments {Climatic, geological, and topographical).

26-0184 H 58 of 65



Appemfx D: D106.2 N Adopted this section for the safety of the public, B Fire apparatus access roads for mulbipte-family residential
firough D106.3 firofighters, and offver emecgericy responders il 2 developments (Climalic, geclogical, and fopographical).
7 One- or two-dwelling residential develcpments shall be
| Appendix D: 91071 N |Adopted this saction for the safefy of the public, oquinped throughou? with two sperate and approved fire
{exciuding exceptions) firofighters, and ather emergency responders Locety SoPeg {apparalus acoess roads du to opographic, geographic and
climatic condilions, BN
' One- or two-dwelling residential developments shall be
Appendix D: D107.2 N Adopted this section for the safety of the public, Locally adopted equippad throughout with two sperate and appraved fire
through D108.1 Frafighiers, and othed smargency mapontdars apparatus access roads due to topographic, geographls and
climatic conditions. g
is section for usa i i A )
Appendix E N ;f'g;‘;: Il L CUR Locally adopted Admiristraive clarty
Adcped this section for use i datermining hazard . ,
Appendix F N o e Locally adopted Administrafive ciarily
] |Adopted this section to provide giudetines for not- . " "
| Appendix | N A Locally adapted Adminisirative clarity -
Previous Appendix O. Adopled this section fo I .
Appendix P N provide giudelines foe temporary amusement uses Locally adopted Administrative dlarity
> Previous Appendix P. Adopted this section to :
Appendix G N provide giudelines for Wildiand-Urban Intréace fire Locally adopted Administrative clasity
[hazand evaluation
Grey cells are previously amended, adopted, or changed code sections that are being adopted again in this code cycle.
White cells are newly amended, adopted, or changed cede sections that differ from previous code adoptions.

26-0184 H 59 of 65



Column

OFFICIAL AD PROOF

This is the proof of your ad scheduled to run in Tahoe Daily Tribune on the dates indicated below. if
changes are needed, please coniact us prior to deadline at (530) 541-3880.

Natice ID: PEXXJuKXIT7CMhdBLW | Proof Updated: Aug. 12, 2025 at 10:27am PDT
Motice Name: 8CD06 - Fire Code First Netice LVFPD | Publisher 1D 375118

See Proof on Next Page

This is not an Irvaice. Below is an estimated price, and itis

subject to change, You will receive an invoice with the final

price upon invoice creation by the publisher,

FILER FILING FOR

Kayla Galvan Tahoe Daily Tribune

galvan@lakevalleyiive.org
(530) 577-3737

Columns Wide: 3 Ad Class: Legals

Total Column Inches: 5.07

Number of Lines: A7

08/15/2025: Other Nouce
Internet Flat Fee Charge
Affidavst flat charge
Subtotal
Tax

Processing Fee

Total

73.44
40.00
10.00

$123.44
$0.00
$0.00

$123.44

8CD06 - Fire Code First Notice LVFPD - Page 1 of 2

26-0184 H 60 of 65



Nolice of Intent to Adopt the 2025 Fre Code Ordinance

Notlce Is hereby given to he intention of the Board of Directors of the 1.ake Valiey Fire
Protection District to adopt the 2025 Californix Fire Code with local amendments.
The Board of Directers will hold #ts first hearing at 4:00pm on Fl August 29,
2025 5t the LYFPD Fire Station 7, 2211 Keetak St South Lake Tahoe, regarding
the adoption of the 2025 Cefifornia Fire Code with local amendmants, pursuant to
Haalth and Saiety Code Section 13865 and 13869.7. Cogles of the eode section
referred to. and any secondary cade sections referrsd to, adopied by reference, are
on e with the District's Administrative Assistant, and are cpen to ubllc inspection.
Adoption of tha Fire Code Ordinence will adopt tha Caftoria Fire o as cutrently
published in Title 24, Part 9, ot the California Code of Regulatiens. In some instances
the Lake Valley Fire Protection Districts proposed Firs Code Crdinance proj 3
building stendards more stringent than thass minimum building standards adopted
by the State Fire Marshal and conianed in the Calilornia Bulding Standards Code.

Published: Auguet 18, 2025

8CDO6 - Fire Code First Notice LVFPD - Page 2 of 2

26-0184 H 61 of 65



Column

INTERIM AD DRAFT

' This is the proof of your ad scheduled to run in Tahoe Daily Tribune on the dates indicated below. If
changes are neaded, please contact us prior 1o deadline at (530) 541-3880.

Notice ID: tWvzPMwLQS6GFxpeM5x4 | Proof Updated: Sep. 16, 2025 at 12:47pm PDT
Motice Name: Fire Code Second Notice

See Proaf on Next Page

This is not an invoice. Below is an estimated price, and itis
subject to change. You will receive an invoice with the final
price upon invoice creation by tha publisher,

FILER FILING FOR

Kayla Galvan Tahoe Daily Tribune
galvan@lakevalleyfire.org
(530) 577- 737

Columns Wide: 2 Ad Class: Legals

Total Column Inches: 4.98

Number of Lines: 25
09/19/2025. Cther 72.10
Internet Flat Fee Charge 40.00
Affidavit flat charge 10.00
Subtotal $122.10
Tax $0.00
Processing Fee $0.00
Total $122.10

Fire Code Second Notice - Page 1 of 2

26-0184 H 62 of 65




Notice of ntent to Adopt the 2026 Fire Code
Ordinance

Nolice i8 herabtxegiven to ihe intention of the Board
of Directors of Lake Valley Fire Protection Districl
to adept the 2025 Cnlfomnia Fire Code with facal
amandments. The Board of Directors will hold ita
second heoaring at 4:0Cpm on Menday, September
29th, 2025 at the LVFPD Fire Station 7, 2211 Keetak
&t South Lake Tahoe, CA, regarding the adoption of
the 2025 Calilornia Fire Code with local amendments,
pursuant to Heallh and Safaty Code Sectian 13889 and
13859.7. Coples of the code section referred to, and
any secondary code sections referred to, adopled by
relerence, are on file with the District's Administrativa
Assistant, and ars apen to public inspaction. Adeption
cf tha Fire Cede Ordinariee will adopt the Califomia
Flra Code as curantly published in Titte 24, Part 9, of
the Callfornta Sode of Regulations. In some lastances
the Lake Valley Fire Protection District's propesed Fire
Code Ordinance praposes buliding standards more
stringent than those minimum bullding standarda
acopted by Hie Stale Fre Marshal and containaed in the
Calfomia Bullding Starlands Code.

Published: Septembuer 1€, 2028

Fire Code Second Notice - Page 2 of 2

26-0184 H 63 of 65



9/16/25, 12:41 PM

{5

Statud,

Coumes

NOTICE OF INTENT TO ADOPT THE 2025 FIRE
CODE ORDINANCE

by Kayla Galvan | Aug 12, 2025 | News

Natice 15 harehy given to the rtention of the Acard of Cir f b ake vallay Fire Protection District (o adopt the
3075 Caiifarma Fire Code with locad amendments. The Board of Directars vl hotd 115 First hearing at :00pm on Friday
August 29' 2624 at the LVFPD Fire Staron 7, 2211 Keatak St South Loke Tatae, CA reganiirg the adopuon of the 2025
Califarnia Rre Code with local amendments, pursuant to wealth and Safery Code Section 13869 und 13869 7 Copies of
the code secuan rerarred to, and any secondary ccdo scotions refersed 10, adoptad by reference, ate on file wath the
District's ACministrative Assistant, and ave oper 10 pullicINSpECHON. Adoption of the Fre Code Orginarce wil adept
the California Sire Code a5 curreatly publisnad . Title 24, Part 9, af the Cahfgrma Code of Regulauons o some
Instanres the Lake Valley Fire Protection Districts propesed Fre Code Qrdinaree proposes b lding standards mofe
stringert than chose murmum bulding standards adapred by the State Fire Marsholand cortained in e Calforria
Ruilging Standards Code

Eire Code 2025 final document

Headguarters: Station 7 Our Mission Links

rgres et of pubti sa 2ty o Caltas Air Ambulance

people arg enw TonTen, N

f X @ @

Ly

https:!ﬂakeva]leyﬁre.orglzoz5.'081!1uﬁce-of-lntent—tc-adopt—lhe-zozS-ﬁre-code-ordinancef

ASOLTUS ~  SEQVICES ~  PREVENTION ~ CONTALT ~»  PHOTOL

Notice of Intent to Adopt the 2025 Fire Cade Ordinance - Lake Valley Fire

fF X @ a

LVED MIEWS  DOCUMERTS

Recent Posts

Job Cpaming Annguncainent.
Fire Chiel

Motice of Public Hearing
totice of Intent (0 Adopt ine
2025 hre Code Ordnance
2025 Open Burning and
Retreauenal fire Ban
Firelighter Paramad card
Lateral Frglightar Paramedsc
(Open ard Centn 5
Regry trmeny

26-0184 H 64 of 65

m




9/16/25, 12:43 PM Second Notice of Intent to Adopt the 2025 Fire Code Ordinance - Lake Valley Fire

f X @ @

REMLIFST

ABGUTUS ~  SERWCES »  PREVENTION »  CONTACT v PHOTOS  LVFD NEWS  DOCUMENTS

SECOND NOTICE OF INTENT TO ADOPT THE S
2025 FIRE CO DE ORDINANCE Secand MNet<e sfinten @

Adogt the 2025 Fire Code

by Kayla Galvan | Sep 16,2025 | Mews | O commertz
Qrdinance

oo Opening ARmUNZement,

Notica 15 heceby ghven tathe 1o nhan of ihe Beard of Tirectors f the Lake Valley £ire Protection Qistr et to adopt ihe Fire 1 f

2025 Cafornia Fire Code with local amenaments. Tre Soara of Drectors will hold its second hegring at 4.0Cpm an Matice of Pubilic Hearing
Wonclay, Septenrber 28th, 2025 at the LYFPD Fire Station 7,2211 Keetak St South Lake Tahoo, CA, regarding the
sdaprion of she 2025 Calfornla Aire O de with tocal amendmenty, pirsuant io Heatth ard Sa'aty Code Secion 1380y
and *3860.7 Copi  of the rade seetion referred 1o, and any sacandary (ode se-tons referred 1o, adopied by
reference. are on file with the Distret's Admin-strative Assistant, and are open o plbhic nspectan. Adgphon of the Frre
Code Ordinance w: | agopt the C itarma Fire Cade a3 currently published in T tle 24, Part 3, of tne Caiforma Code of
Reguiations. It* sorme ostances the take Yaley Fire Protect.en District’s progased Fire Code Ordinante proposes
buliding standards mora stringent than those Mirimum Buikiing standares adopted by the State Fire Marsha; and
contan d i the Califarna Bulidirg Standards Cod

Nomie, f Intent te Adopt the
2625 Firg Code Ordinance

2025 Gpen Burnug and
Recrastonal Frre Ban

Fira Coda 2025 final document

Headuuarters: Station 7 Cur Missian Links

Lake Tahoa Basin Fre Academy

fF X @ B e

é Stat.nk

Caunler

hﬁps:IflakevalIeyﬁre.aleOZS!OQIsecond-noticevof-intent-to-adopt—the—2025-ﬁre-code-ordinance!

26-0184 H 65 of 65




