
Bid #07-393-010 Food Product & Kitchen Supplies

Evaluation

Strauss Foodservice Francis Distributing

Placerville  CA Diamond Springs CA

Distribution Distribution

Bid Price Evaluation Bid Price Evaluation

Category I Groceries, Dry & Canned 10% 27,500.00$              15% 28,750.00$   

Category II Frozen Foods 10% 27,500.00$              15% 28,750.00$   

Category III Meats 10% 27,500.00$              15% 28,750.00$   

Fresh, Frozen & Precooked

Category IV Poultry 10% 27,500.00$              15% 28,750.00$   

Fresh, Frozen & Precooked

Category V Seafood 10% 27,500.00$              15% 28,750.00$   

Category VI Milk Products 10% 27,500.00$              15% 28,750.00$   

Category VII Refrigerated Products 10% 27,500.00$              15% 28,750.00$   

Category VIII Kitchen Supplies 10% 27,500.00$              15% 28,750.00$   

Paper, Plastics, Disposables

& Utensils

Subtotal 220,000.00$            230,000.00$ 

Prompt Payment Terms Discount 2%/21 4,400.00$                2%/21 4,600.00$     

5% Local Vendor Preference 11,000.00$              11,500.00$   

Evaluated Total 204,600.00$            213,900.00$ 

For evaluation purposes only, each category is based on an accumulative total of $25,000. 

Prime Food Vendor:  West Slope



Bid #07-393-010 Food Product & Kitchen Supplies

Evaluation

US FoodService

Reno NV

Distribution

Bid Price

Category I Groceries, Dry & Canned 11%

Category II Frozen Foods 11.5%

Category III Meats 11%

Fresh, Frozen & Precooked

Category IV Poultry 11%

Fresh, Frozen & Precooked

Category V Seafood 11%

Category VI Milk Products 12%

Category VII Refrigerated Products 12%

Category VIII Kitchen Supplies 13%

Paper, Plastics, Disposables

& Utensils

Sole Primary Food Vendor - East Slope

Prime Food Vendor:  East Slope



Bid #07-393-010 Food Product & Kitchen Supplies

Secondary Food Vendor:  West Slope

Evaluation

Francis Distributing, Inc. Mad Butcher

Diamond Springs CA Sacramento CA

Distribution  Distribution

Bid Price Evaluation Bid Price Evaluation

Category I Groceries, Dry & Canned 15%  * no bid  

 

Category II Frozen Foods 15%  * no bid  

Category III Meats 15% 28,750.00$                * 8% 27,000.00$   

Fresh, Frozen & Precooked

Category IV Poultry 15% 28,750.00$                * 8% 27,000.00$   

Fresh, Frozen & Precooked

Category V Seafood 15% 28,750.00$                * 8% 27,000.00$   

Category VI Milk Products

Subtotal  86,250.00$                81,000.00$   

Terms Discount 2%/21 1,725.00$                   

5% Local Vendor Preference 4,312.50$                   

Evaluated Total 80,212.50$                * 81,000.00$   

Category VII Refrigerated Products 15%  * no bid  

Category VIII Kitchen Supplies 15%  * no bid  

Paper, Plastics, Disposables

& Utensils

* Low Bidder by Category

For evaluation purposes only, categories bid by more than one vendor  

are based on an accumlative total of $25,000.



Bid #07-393-010 Food Product & Kitchen Supplies

Secondary Food Vendor:  East Slope

Evaluation

Crystal Dairy Foods

South Lake Tahoe

Distribution

Bid Price

Category I Groceries, Dry & Canned no bid  

Category II Frozen Foods no bid  

Category III Meats no bid  

Fresh, Frozen & Precooked

Category IV Poultry no bid

Fresh, Frozen & Precooked

Category V Seafood   

Category VI Milk Products 20%

Category VII Refrigerated Products 15%  

Category VIII Kitchen Supplies   

Paper, Plastics, Disposables

& Utensils

Sole Secondary Food Vendor - East Slope


