

**Bid #10-680-001 Ammunition
Evaluation***

Category I: Winchester Ammunition		Botach Tactical Los Angeles, CA		Adamson Police Products Hayward, CA		Advanced Tacitcal Supply Santa Maria, CA		San Diego Police Equipment San Diego, CA		Lawmen's & Shooters Supply Vero Beach,FL	
Description	Quantity (Thousan	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension
.40 cal 180 grain #RA40T	20	No Bid		\$ 330.00	\$ 6,600.00	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Subtotal					\$ 6,600.00						
Less 5% LVP				N/A	\$ -						
Less Terms Discount				Net 30	\$ -						
Evaluation			No Bid		\$ 6,600.00		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid

Category II: Federal Ammunition		Botach Tactical Los Angeles, CA		Adamson Police Products Hayward, CA		Advanced Tacitcal Supply Santa Maria, CA		San Diego Police Equipment San Diego, CA		Lawmen's & Shooters Supply Vero Beach,FL	
Description	Quantity (Thousan	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension
5.56mm 55 grain, MCBT M193 Ball Ammunition #XM193A	100	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$ 294.18	\$ 29,418.00	No Bid	
.308 Win Tactical Bonded 165 grain #LE308T1	10	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$ 272.97	\$ 2,729.70	No Bid	
HST .40 cal 180 grain JHP #P40HST1	40	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$ 274.86	\$ 10,994.40	No Bid	
American Eagle .40 cal. 180 grain FMJ #AE40R1	145	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$ 202.19	\$ 29,317.55	No Bid	
HST .45 ACP cal 230 grain +PJHP #P45HST1	14	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$ 317.05	\$ 4,438.70	No Bid	
2 3/4" 12 gauge Rifle Slug #F130RS	1	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$ 103.76	\$ 103.76	No Bid	
Subtotal									\$ 77,002.11		
Less 5% LVP											
Less Terms Discount											
Evaluation			No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$ 77,002.11		No Bid

Category III: Hornady Ammunition		Botach Tactical Los Angeles, CA		Adamson Police Products Hayward, CA		Advanced Tacitcal Supply Santa Maria, CA		San Diego Police Equipment San Diego, CA		Lawmen's & Shooters Supply Vero Beach,FL	
Description	Quantity (Thousan	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension
.223 Rem. 55 grain TAP #83276	11	\$ 286.00	\$ 3,146.00	No Bid		\$ 337.50	\$ 3,712.50	No Bid		\$ 309.55	\$ 3,405.05
.308 Win-A-Max TAP 168 grain # 80965	11	\$ 454.00	\$ 4,994.00	No Bid		\$ 462.50	\$ 5,087.50	No Bid		\$ 475.18	\$ 5,226.98
Subtotal			\$ 8,140.00				\$ 8,800.00				\$ 8,632.03
Less 5% LVP		N/A	\$ -			N/A	\$ -			N/A	\$ -
Less Terms Discount		Net 30	\$ -			2%25days	\$ (176.00)			Net 30	\$ -
Evaluation			\$ 8,140.00		No Bid		\$ 8,624.00		No Bid		\$ 8,632.03
Lawmen's & Shooter Shooters Supply bid both Category III items with a quantity of 200 rounds, not 500 rounds. The bid price (Item #1 \$123.82/200 rounds and Item #2 \$190.07/200 rounds) has been adjusted to reflect 500 rounds as shown for evaluation purposes only											

Category IV: CCI Ammunition		Botach Tactical Los Angeles, CA		Adamson Police Products Hayward, CA		Advanced Tacitcal Supply Santa Maria, CA		San Diego Police Equipment San Diego, CA		Lawmen's & Shooters Supply Vero Beach,FL	
Description	Quantity (Thousan	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension
.22 Long Rifle stinger (GLHP) #0050	5	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$ 309.13	\$ 1,545.65	No Bid	
Subtotal									\$ 1,545.65		
Less 5% LVP								N/A	\$ -		
Less Terms Discount								Net 30	\$ -		
Evaluation			No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$ 1,545.65		No Bid

*Evaluation is exclusive of sales tax.