
 

 

S12-0005/Montano de El Dorado Shopping Plaza Outdoor Music – As approved by the 
Planning Commission on March 13, 2014 
 
 
Findings 
 
1.0 CEQA FINDINGS 
 
1.1 El Dorado County has considered the Mitigated Negative Declaration together with the 

comments received during the public review process.  The proposed project, as 
conditioned, will not have a significant effect on the environment.  The Mitigated 
Negative Declaration reflects the independent judgment of the County and has been 
completed in compliance with CEQA and is adequate for this proposal. 

 
1.2 Through feasible conditions and mitigation placed upon the project, impacts on the 

environment have been eliminated or substantially mitigated. 
 
1.3 Public Resources Code Section 21081.6 requires the County to adopt a reporting or 

monitoring program for the changes to the project which it has adopted or made a 
condition of approval in order to mitigate or avoid significant effects on the environment.  
The approved project description and conditions of approval, with the corresponding 
permit monitoring requirement, is hereby adopted as the monitoring program for this 
project.  The monitoring program is designed to ensure compliance during project 
implementation. 

 
1.4 The documents and other materials which constitute the record of proceedings upon 

which this decision is based are in the custody of the Development Services Division - 
Planning Services at 2850 Fairlane Court, Placerville, CA, 95667. 

 
2.0 GENERAL PLAN FINDINGS 
 
2.1 As proposed, the project is consistent with the Commercial (C) land use designation as 

defined within General Plan Policy 2.2.1.2 because the  intent of the land use designation 
is to provide a full range of commercial retail, office, and service uses to serve the residents, 
businesses, and visitors of El Dorado County.  The proposed project will provide residents 
and visitors with entertainment services in the El Dorado Hills area. 

 
2.2 The proposal is consistent with General Plan policies, 2.2.5.2 (General Plan consistency), 

2.2.5.21 (land use compatibility), and General Plan Policy 6.5.1.2 (noise).   With the 
inclusion of Mitigation Measure NOISE-1, the use is compatible with the surrounding 
commercial uses, and nearby residential uses, and the design of the project minimizes 
noise levels to at or below the noise standards of the General Plan. 
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3.0  ZONING FINDINGS 
 
3.1 The proposed use is permitted by Special Use Permit in the Commercial (C) zone district, 

pursuant to Section 17.32.030(d) of the County Code provided that the administrative 
findings outlined below can be made by the Planning Commission. 

 
3.2 As proposed and conditioned, the project meets all applicable development standards 

contained within the El Dorado County Code. 
 
4.0 SPECIAL USE PERMIT FINDINGS 
 
4.1 The issuance of the permit is consistent with the General Plan.  The applicant’s 

proposal, as conditioned and mitigated, is in compliance with the General Plan as set 
forth in Section 2.0 of these findings. 

 
4.2 The proposed use would not be detrimental to the public health, safety and welfare, 

or injurious to the neighborhood.  With incorporation of conditions of approval and 
Mitigation Measure NOISE-1 included in the project description the project will not have 
significant impacts on surrounding residential land uses because there would be no 
increase in use of the site and noise would not be generated in excess of the County’s 
noise standards.  The project is compatible with surrounding commercial land uses. 

 

4.3 The proposed use is permitted by special use permit pursuant to County Code 
Section 17.32.030(d) which allows for uses enumerated in Section 17.32.020(e) when 
they are not fully enclosed in a building.   
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