

Bid # 13-405-023 - Diesel Fuel and Fuel

Additive

* Evaluation

| Location/Category | OPIS Rack Average Price (per gal) | Quoted Price (per gal) | Net Price (per gal) | OPIS Rack Average Price (per gal) | Quoted Price (per gal) | Net Price (per gal) |
|------------------------------------------------------------------------|-----------------------------------------|-------------------------------------------------|------------------------|-----------------------------------------|-----------------------------------------|------------------------|
| Category I - DOT (West Slope Location`) | As of 10/26/2012 | (A) Hunt & Sons, Placerville, CA | | As of 10/26/2012 | (B) Flyers Energy Sparks, NV | |
| Equipment / Vehicle Fuel Tanks - 2441 Headington Rd Placerville, CA | \$ 3.1447 | \$0.0449 | \$3.1896 | \$ 3.1447 | \$0.1400 | \$3.2847 |
| Generator Fuel Tanks - 2441 Headington Rd. Placerville, CA | \$ 3.1447 | \$0.3999 | \$3.5446 | \$ 3.1447 | No Bid | No Bid |
| Winterization Additive | | \$0.0250 | \$0.0250 | | \$0.0350 | \$0.0350 |
| Sub total | | | \$6.7592 | | | No Bid |
| Local Vendor Preference | | 5.00% | (\$0.3380) | | 5.00% | |
| Terms Discount | | 0.00% | \$0.0000 | | 0.00% | |
| Net Total | | | \$6.4212 | | | No Bid |

| Location/Category | As of 10/26/2012 | (A) Hunt & Sons, Placerville, CA | | As of 10/26/2012 | (D) Flyers Energy | |
|-------------------------------------------------------------------|---------------------|-------------------------------------------------|-----------------|---------------------|--------------------------|---------------|
| Equipment / Vehicle Fuel Tanks - 1121 Shakori Road, Meyers, CA | \$ 3.1447 | \$0.0789 | \$3.2236 | \$ 3.1447 | 0.0750 | \$3.2197 |
| Generator Fuel Tanks - 1121 Shakori Drive, Meyers, CA | \$ 3.1447 | \$0.3999 | \$3.5446 | \$ 3.1447 | No Bid | No Bid |
| Winterization Additive | | \$0.0250 | \$0.0250 | | 0.0350 | \$0.0350 |
| Sub total | | | \$6.7932 | | | No Bid |
| Local Vendor Preference | | 5.00% | (\$0.3397) | | 5.00% | \$0.0000 |
| Terms Discount | | 0.00% | \$0.0000 | | 0.00% | \$0.0000 |
| Net Total | | | \$6.4535 | | | No Bid |

| Location/Category | OPIS Rack | | Quoted | | OPIS Rack | | Quoted | |
|-------------------|----------------------------|--|--------------------|------------------------|----------------------------|--|--------------------|------------------------|
| | Average Price (per gal) | | Price (per gal) | Net Price (per gal) | Average Price (per gal) | | Price (per gal) | Net Price (per gal) |

| Category III - DOT - (East Slope - West Shore Location) | As of 10/26/2012 | (A) Hunt & Sons, Placerville, CA | | As of 10/26/2012 | (D) Flyers Energy | |
|--------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|---------------------|-------------------------------------|-----------------|---------------------|-------------------|---------------|
| Equipment / Vehicle Fuel Tanks - 7101 Wilson Road, Tahoma, CA Winterization Additive | \$ 3.1447 | \$0.2999 | \$3.4446 | \$ 3.1447 | \$0.3500 | 3.4947 |
| | | \$0.0250 | \$0.0250 | | \$0.0350 | 0.0350 |
| Sub total | | | \$3.4696 | | | 3.5297 |
| Local Vendor Preference | | 5.00% | (\$0.1735) | | 5.00% | (0.1765) |
| Terms Discount | | 0.00% | \$0.0000 | | 0.00% | 0.0000 |
| Net Total | | | \$3.2961 | | | 3.3532 |

| Category IV - CAO Facilities (West Slope Locations) | As of 10/26/2012 | (A) Hunt & Sons, Placerville, CA | | As of 10/26/2012 | (D) Flyers Energy | |
|--------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|---------------------|-------------------------------------|----------------|---------------------|-------------------|---------------|
| Generator Fuel Tanks - Building B 360 Fair Lane, Placerville, CA | \$ 3.1447 | \$0.3999 | \$3.5446 | \$ 3.1447 | No Bid | No Bid |
| Generator Fuel Tanks - Placerville Jail 300 Forni Road, Placerville, CA | \$ 3.1447 | \$0.3999 | \$3.5446 | \$ 3.1447 | No Bid | No Bid |
| Generator Fuel Tanks - Sheriff's Office 300 Fair Lane Placerville, CA Winterization Additive (All locations) | \$ 3.1447 | \$0.3999 | \$3.5446 | \$ 3.1447 | No Bid | No Bid |
| | | \$0.0250 | \$0.0250 | | No Bid | No Bid |
| Sub total | | | \$10.6588 | | | No Bid |
| Local Vendor Preference | | 5.00% | (\$0.5329) | | | |
| Terms Discount | | 0.00% | 0.0000 | | | |
| Net Total | | | 10.1259 | | | No Bid |

| Location/Category | OPIS Rack | | Quoted | | OPIS Rack | | Quoted | |
|-------------------|----------------------------|--|--------------------|------------------------|----------------------------|--|--------------------|------------------------|
| | Average Price (per gal) | | Price (per gal) | Net Price (per gal) | Average Price (per gal) | | Price (per gal) | Net Price (per gal) |

| Category V - CAO Facilities (East Slope Locations) | As of 10/26/2012 | (A) Hunt & Sons, Placerville, CA | | As of 10/26/2012 | (D) Flyers Energy | |
|------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|---------------------|-------------------------------------|------------|---------------------|-------------------|-----------------|
| Generator Fuel Tanks - So Lake Tahoe Jail 1051 Al Tahoe Blvd., SLT, CA | \$ 3.1447 | \$0.3999 | \$3.5446 | \$ 3.1447 | \$0.3500 | \$3.4947 |
| Generator Fuel Tanks - Juv. Treatment Ctr - 1041 Al Tahoe Blvd., South Lake Tahoe, CA | \$ 3.1447 | \$0.3999 | \$3.5446 | \$ 3.1447 | \$0.3500 | \$3.4947 |
| Generator Fuel Tank - SLT Sheriff's Off. 1360 Johnson Blvd. So. Lake Tahoe, CA | \$ 3.1447 | \$0.3999 | \$3.5446 | \$ 3.1447 | \$0.3500 | \$3.4947 |
| Winterization Additive (All locations) | | \$0.0250 | \$0.0250 | | \$0.0350 | \$0.0350 |
| Sub total | | | \$10.6588 | | | \$10.5191 |
| Local Vendor Preference | | 5.00% | (\$0.5329) | | 5.00% | (\$0.5260) |
| Terms Discount | | 0.00% | \$0.0000 | | 0.00% | \$0.0000 |
| Net Total | | | 10.1259 | | | \$9.9931 |

| Category VI - Environmental Management (West Slope Location) | As of 10/26/2012 | (A) Hunt & Sons, Placerville, CA | | As of 10/26/2012 | (D) Flyers Energy | |
|-----------------------------------------------------------------------------------|---------------------|-------------------------------------|-----------------|---------------------|-------------------|---------------|
| Equipt. & Gen. Fuel Tank - Union Mine Plant 5700 Union Mine Rd., El Dorado, CA | \$ 3.1447 | \$0.3999 | \$3.5446 | \$ 3.1447 | No Bid | No Bid |
| Winterization Additive (All locations) | | \$0.0250 | \$0.0250 | | No Bid | No Bid |
| Sub total | | | \$3.5696 | | | No Bid |
| Local Vendor Preference | | 5.00% | (\$0.1785) | | | |
| Terms Discount | | 0.00% | \$0.0000 | | | |
| Net Total | | | \$3.3911 | | | No Bid |