GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 1 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 2 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 3 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 4 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 5 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 6 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 7 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 8 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 9 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 10 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 11 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 12 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 13 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 14 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 15 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 16 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 17 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002

reekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
e Docusign Envelope ID: 6809A2EB-1AAF-4880-AAI97?€£5|€§25?)1g7%fhiblitl U e Soto pran Vv “

fire department which operates five staffed fire stations and serves an area of approximately

78 square miles. EDHFD utilizes no less than twenty-one firefighters and paramedics to staff
these fire stations on a 24-hours-per-day, seven-days-per-week operational schedule.

CAL FIRE operates one fire station in the south El Dorado Hills region to meets its wildfire
suppression and prevention mission. This fire station is located at CAL FIRE Station 43 in
the El Dorado area and is approximately 14.4 miles from the Project. CAL FIRE staffs two
state funded fire engines with a crew of 3-4 firefighters on a seasonal basis from this location.

The Project is located within an Insurance Service Office (ISO) Class 3 rating area. EDHFD
emergency response travel times for the first arriving unit to the Project are on-average less
than 8 minutes'2. These response times are consistent with El Dorado County General Plan
Policy 5.1.2.213 which calls for an average response time to emergency calls of less than eight
minutes in community region areas. See Table 3 for additional information on local fire station
locations and distance to the Project.

Table 3: Fire Station Data for Project
:Fire Sﬁtion Identification Address Travel Distance to Project | Staffed Year Round
EDHFD Station 87 e L oalia Plosy. 1.5 Miles Yes
EDHFD Station 85 Lo aptaueTe 4.08 Miles Yes
EDHFD Station 86 e el e 5.84 Miles Yes
EDHFD Station 91 e B s hand 5.91 Miles Yes
CAL FIRE Sta 43 g?%%!ggherbad Bifee 14.40 Miles Yes

During a major emergency incident such as a building fire, wildland fire, hazardous materials
spill, or similar event it is likely that EDHFD and CAL FIRE will dispatch multiple fire station
crews to assist in controlling the incident. Itis probable that five or more fire suppression units
would be dispatched from multiple fire stations located in the western El Dorado County
region.

2 Response times are based on an average 90 second turnout time by firefighters from their station plus travel time using the
closest roads available to the project. The response time standard the county uses to evaluate the adequacy of the project
meeting General Plan Policy 6.2.3.1 are based the closest station (Station 87) only, and not the average response times of
all resources responding to an incident.

13 See E/ Dorado County General Plan, 2004; Public Services and Utilities Element Section, P.91.

25-1836 D.6 Page 18 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 19 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 20 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 21 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 22 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 23 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 24 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 25 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002

oy . : : 7 . g j j pecific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Docusign Envelope ID: 6BCOA2EB-1AAF-4880 AAr-Cfeé‘é‘§t€’£‘2¥l’J?ﬁ?§xhibit > Plan - Reduoed. 26

California. Per GC § 51182, defensible space regulations also apply to all property in the
VHFHSZ within the Local Responsibility Area (LRA).

The defensible space requirements include, but are not limited to, the following:

+ 100 feet minimum of vegetation management (“defensible space”) around homes
* Removal of dead/dying vegetation

* Vegetation removal around chimneys/stovepipes

Depending on the area, defensible space requirements may include certain exemptions and
exceptions from code. Moreover, jurisdictions may require extension of the minimum distance
beyond property lines or as needed for insurance. The State Board provides direction for
complying with the defensible space regulations in CCR Title 14, §§ 1299.01- 1299.05 which
incorporates by reference additional information outlined in the State Board’s General
Guidelines for Creating Defensible Space. Due to the recent passage of AB 3074 (2020),
defensible space compliance will soon require more intense fuel reduction activities and the
creation of an ember-resistant zone within 5 feet of a structure. The State Board will provide
additional guidance and must amend the regulations to reflect these changes on or before
January 1, 2023.

El Dorado County Code Chapter 8.09

The County of El Dorado has more restrictive requirements, in some cases, than State statutes
and regulations pertaining to Defensible Space around homes and buildings. El Dorado County
Codes and Ordinances Chapter 8.09 pertains to all requirements and administrative actions
associated with Vegetation Management and Defensible Space. The purpose of this chapter is
to provide for the removal of hazardous vegetation and combustible materials situated in the
unincorporated areas of the County so as to reduce the potential for fire and to promote the
safety and welfare of the community. The chapter applies to all improved parcels and
designated unimproved parcels within the County, and establishes annual on-going
maintenance of those parcels to prevent vegetation from growing back and posing a fire hazard
to the community.

25-1836 D.6 Page 26 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 27 of 122



xhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
e Docusign Envelope ID: 6BCIA2EB-1AAF-4880-AAFT SESIIS KlzagSPecific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative “

intended to assist city and County planners in discussions with professionals from fire hazard
prevention and mitigation, disaster preparedness, and emergency response and recovery

agencies as they work together to develop effective fire hazard policies for the general plan.
El Dorado Hills County Water District Ordinance 2022-01 (Fire Code)

The El Dorado County Water District (EDHCWD) has adopted the 2022 California Fire Code
(CFC) with several local amendments which are more restrictive than those described in the
CFC. EDHCWD updates its local fire code ordinance in conjunction with the triennial update
to the California Building Standards Code. Specific local amendments contained within the
ordinance that may impact the Project include the following:

e Fire apparatus access road design criteria as described in Section 503.2.1

e Dead end roads and driveways as described in Section 503.2.5

¢ Fire lane marking requirements described in Section 503.3.1

e Security gate design criteria as described in Section 503.6

e Address identification criteria as described in Section 505.1

¢ LP-Gas storage tank limits as described in Section 6104.2

o Residential fire sprinkler system installation requirements found in Chapter 80.
e Fire-Flow requirements for buildings as described in Appendix B

e Fire Apparatus access road design criteria described in Appendix D.

El Dorado Hills County Water District Ordinance 2024-01 (Unimproved Parcel Maintenance)

EDHCWD has adopted local regulations related to Hazardous Vegetation Management on
Unimproved Parcels located throughout the district. Specific provisions contained within the
ordinance that may impact the Project include the following:

e Hazardous vegetation maintenance on unimproved parcels that are one (1.0) acre in

size or smaller

e Hazardous vegetation maintenance on unimproved parcels over one-acre (1.01) in size
or larger

25-1836 D.6 Page 28 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 29 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 30 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 31 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002

o ousign Envelops ID: GECOA2EB-1AAF-4880-AAR T RESES, Y AIAES

Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

See Table 5 and the subsequent description below for additional analysis on the fire risk rating

for the Project.

Table 5: Fire Risk Rating?? for the Creekside Village Map Project

No. Risk Factor Low Moderate | High |Very-High|{ Total
0-3 4-6 7-8 9-10
1 | Subdivision Design Points 3 3
2 | Vegetation Fuel Type 6 6
3 | Defensible Space 6 6
4 | Site Topography 3 3
5 | Building Construction Materials 6 6
6 | Roofing Materials 3 3
7 | Fire Protection - Water Source 3 3
8 | Fire Protection - Fire Department Capability 3 4
9 | Utilities 3 3
10 | Critical Assets / Infrastructure at Risk 0 0
Total 18 18 0 0 36

Overall Wildfire Risk Rating: Low (36)

The fire risk factors associated with the Subdivision Design Points are considered “Low” based

on the current site plan design. The Project is accessed via three connections to Latrobe Road

on the east side of the Project. Latrobe Road is a public road maintained by the County of El

Dorado. The Project is accessed by an EVA to Robert J. Mathews Drive on the north side of the

Project. An EVA is also provided on the west side of the Project and connects to Heritage Park

via a private road system. All roads within the Project will be designed in accordance with EDHFD

and CAL FIRE emergency vehicle access requirements.

The fire risk factors associated with the Vegetation Fuel Types are considered “Moderate” based

on the current site plan design. The primary vegetation types found in the Project area today

23 Based on the 2023 ICC Wildland Urban Interface Code. Additional risk factors such as defensible space, fire
department capacity and critical assets/infrastructure at risk are also evaluated as part of this risk assessment
based on local fire agency requirements. The rating scale has been simplified to describe a range of between
0-10 for ease in describing the overall risk score.

25-1836 D.6 Page 32 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 33 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 34 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 35 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 36 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 37 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 38 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 39 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 40 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 41 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 42 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 43 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 44 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 45 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 46 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 47 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002

s Evveions 5753528 1A 45a0-an B8 SPeciio Plan - Reduced Impact Aternative “

area under and around all attached decks, and requires the most stringent wildfire fuel

reduction. The ember-resistant zone is designed to keep fire or embers from igniting
materials that can spread the fire to the home. The following provides guidance for this
zone, which may change based on the regulation developed by the California Board of
Forestry and Fire Protection. See Figure 12 below to match the item number with the
corresponding zone.

1. Use hardscape like gravel, pavers, concrete, and non-combustible mulch
materials. No combustible bark or mulch.

2. Remove all dead and dying weeds, grass, plants, shrubs, trees, branches, and
vegetative debris (leaves, needles, cones, bark, etc.); Check roofs, gutters, decks,
porches, stairways, etc.

3. Remove all branches within 10-feet of any chimney or stovepipe outlet

4. Limit plants in this area to low growing, nonwoody, properly watered, and
maintained plants.

5. Limit combustible items (outdoor furniture, planters, etc.) on top of decks

6. Relocate firewood and lumber to Zone 2

7. Replace combustible fencing, gates, and arbors attached to the home with non-
combustible alternatives

8. Consider relocating garbage and recycling containers outside this zone

9. Consider relocating boats, RVs, vehicles, and other combustible items outside this
zone

Zone 1 - Lean, Clean and Green Zone

Zone 1 extends 30-feet from buildings, decks, etc. or to the property line, whichever is closer.
10. Remove all dead plants, grass, and weeds (vegetation).
11. Remove dead or dry leaves and pine needles from yard, roof, and rain gutters.

12. Remove branches that hang over roof and keep dead branches 10-feet away
from your chimney.

13. Trim trees regularly to keep branches a minimum of 10- feet from other trees.
14. Relocate wood piles to Zone 2.

15. Remove or prune flammable plants and shrubs near windows.

25-1836 D.6 Page 48 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 49 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 50 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 51 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 52 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 53 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 54 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 55 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 56 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 57 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 58 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 59 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002

Creekside Vlllage Specmc Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Docu5|gn Envelope ID: 6BCIA2EB-1AAF-4880-AAF7-EESC225C1B76& yibit U - Fire Safe Plan

E. Wildfire fuel reduction management and defensible space practices for the Project shall

follow the requirements identified in Chapter 6.

F. A Restrictive Covenant shall be filed with the final subdivision map which stipulates that
a Fire Safe Plan has been prepared and wildfire mitigation measures shall be
implemented.

G. "No Smoking" signs shall be posted at all trail entrances.

H. At all trail intersections with the roads that have vehicle access there shall be a knock
down bollard or gate with a Knox® padlock, or other approved lock, to allow for the
passage of emergency equipment onto the trail.

I. A 5-foot defensible space ember-resistant zone (Zone 0) shall be maintained around all
buildings (including fencing within 5 feet).

J. A Homeowners Association (HOA), or other acceptable entity, shall be responsible for
maintaining all private emergency vehicle access roads and wildfire fuel reduction zone
provisions described in Chapter 6. Reliable on-going sources of funding shall be
established and acceptable to EDHFD prior to the recording of the final map for the
project.

K. To mitigate the risk of wildfires originating in the Project the enforcement of the following
provisions as part of the Creekside Village Covenants, Conditions, and Restrictions
(CCR’s) managed through the future Home Owners Association shall be accomplished:

=  Prohibit smoking and other burning materials within open space areas; and

=  Prohibit wood burning campfires and recreational fires in all areas including
individual residential lots; and

= Prohibit debris burning, regardless of state and local regulations permitting such
activities, in all areas including residential lots; and

= Perform ecological thinning, and where appropriate, prescribed fire in open space

25-1836 D.6 Page 60 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 61 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 62 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 63 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 64 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 65 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002

- Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Docusign Envelope ID: 6BC9AZEB-1AAF-4880-AAF 7-EE5C225C1 7%xhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

UNOFFICIAL COPY
Contents
Article 1 Administration AR T bseabens : w3
8§ 1270000 TRIG.....ccscicnsicnarisssmmsmmsavimmssissesvassmissasassssssaosy T T e P AT e T T T 3
§ 1270.01. Definitions 3
§ 1270.02. Purpose 5
§ 1270.03. SCOPE .eevvvrereenrraearnensisesassssasassessesssssstsssesssasssessessesssassssasesassessssseesressonesstsssassasssessnesssssssassassssesssssnssrtass 5
§ 1270.04. Provisions for Application of these Regulations ........c..cocceccrmncennes T e 6
§ 1270.05. L0Cal ReBUIBtIONS . xiumvsssssssssssmmssaunsvasiros sissnsssnssssssionssiss ssusssis s ssomsss st savisssteassashavvesuvasinssnspresnatsiusasanse 6
§ 1270.06. INSPECLIONS ...veeerirircrireerninesisiieesisstnsnsssessssnasmssessesssesnsssssessesassons 6
§1270.07. Exceptions to Standards...........ccuvremisninrisnsscsnennnenes T T I T A LD T P T e T 7
§1270.08. Distance Measurements.. 3 S A R R T A A S SRR S SR 7
Article2 INBress:and EBIESS:  susssssussummmssaissvessesmsssssasasssnsssssess s s 55y o0smss s UrsUess s RS0 5 S SRa s w ST a3 F o A% 8
§ 1273.00. INEENT ...cereeeiecricsisineciestssiensnssestrcstasssasssessseessseasssssesssssssnsssnessssasnssesansssnsssssssssesassssntassssesssasnrasssnsaseas 8
§1273.01. Width.
§ 1273.02. Road Surface
§1273.03. Grades.
§1273.04. Radius ....coeerervernrnenncs
§ 1273.05. Turnarounds
§1273.06. TUrNOUtS.......ccevrrirnene
§1273.07. Road and Driveway Structures
§1273.08. Dead-end Roads..........c.u....
§1273.09. Gate ENtrances.......ccirrmeessrsessesnssnsonssnsrssosaass ’
Article 3 Signing and Building Numbering..........cccccevveemrenrecircnnacne
i D7 N U [507  r E UE SERets Sr P SO R D s SO R u S 11
0 o T S 11
§ 1274.02. Road Sign Installation, Location, and Visibility... : SRS AR RS 11
§1274.03. AdAresses fOr BUIAINGS ......ceceeerrrrrersicrresinessssiraneanescesensmsessonssessnesssssssessnessenssassesesnssncssnssesnsasseesssassen 11
§1274.04. Address Installation, Location, and Visibility. R T SR A RS AR DR EA 11
Article 4 Emergency Water Standards ...........ccccevecrreveninnnnns
§1275.00. Intent ......ccccnrrenieanne eSS R SO i ongarhndasshasians enganssrsens b s AEIAT IV FARIF Shinans e masspn samensnassnes 12
§ 1275.01. Application T T T T T T T T T T D e e e L T e e Y T e X e 12
§1275.02. Water SUPPIY. i:xiusssssssssasass sssasssnmsunssossasresvins 12
§1275.03. Hydrants and Fire VaIVES.........c.ccrvrecrnimnreninceseesisisssesencissssesssssosassessssosmoieresssssssssesnsassssssssssssssnsons 12
Article 5 Building Siting, Setbacks, and Fuel Modification .13
§ 1276100 INEENE ..cisiuverssisisssosssnssussssssussssssnssassssons osissssasssssisssnssnesssosassessnsissssssmass 13
§1276.01. Building and Parcel Siting and SETDACKS ......ccvvirisissimericsinciiminniissesiorissnsisssinsistssesssssssmssasssenss 13
§ 1276.02. Ridgelines......... ssamasadssrianeianisdiaennsnn
§1276.03. Fuel Breaks........ovveeerverirenensonnenerssninessnnas
§1276.04 Greenbelts, Greenways, Open SPaces and ParKS ... eeeeiieisiseiriesseerioemissssosiasssessssssssossnsesssasase 15
§1276.05 Disposal of Flammable Vegetation and FUEIS .........c.cccvvumciinreerencemnenissenssesssesssses 15
2 UNOFFICIAL COPY

25-1836 D.6 Page 66 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 67 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002

S ocusign Envelope ID: BBCOA2EB-1AAF-4880-AART EE S UASS Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
xhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

UNOFFICIAL COPY

(q) Hammerhead/T: A “T” shaped, three-point Turnaround space for Fire Apparatus on a Road
or Driveway, being no narrower than the Road or Driveway that serves it.
(r) Hazardous Land Use: A land use that presents a significantly elevated potential for the
ignition, prolonged duration, or increased intensity of a Wildfire due to the presence of
flammable materials, liquids, or gasses, or other features that initiate or sustain combustion.
Such uses are determined by the Local Jurisdiction and may include, but are not limited to,
power-generation and distribution facilities; wood processing or storage sites; flammable gas
or liquids processing or storage sites; or shooting ranges.
(s) Local Jurisdiction: Any county, city/county agency or department, or any locally authorized
district that approves or has the authority to regulate Development.
(t) Municipal-Type Water System: A system having water pipes servicing Fire Hydrants and
designed to furnish, over and above domestic consumption, a minimum of 250 gpm (950
L/min) at 20 psi (138 kPa) residual pressure for a two (2) hour duration.
(u) Occupancy: The purpose for which a Building, or part thereof, is used or intended to be
used.
(v) One-way Road: A Road that provides a minimum of one Traffic Lane width designed for
traffic flow in one direction only.
(w) Residential Unit: Any Building or portion thereof which contains living facilities including
provisions for sleeping, eating, cooking and/or sanitation, for one or more persons.
Manufactured homes, mobile homes, and factory-built housing are considered Residential
Units.
(x) Ridgeline: The line of intersection of two opposing slope aspects running parallel to the long
axis of the highest elevation of land; or an area of higher ground separating two adjacent
streams or watersheds.
(y) Road: A public or private vehicular pathway to more than four (4) Residential Units, or to
any industrial or commercial Occupancy.
(z) Road or Driveway Structures: Bridges, culverts, and other appurtenant Structures which
supplement the Traffic Lane or Shoulders.
(aa) Same Practical Effect: As used in this subchapter, means an Exception or alternative with
the capability of applying accepted wildland fire suppression strategies and tactics, and
provisions for fire fighter safety, including:

(1) access for emergency wildland fire equipment,

(2) safe civilian evacuation,

(3) signing that avoids delays in emergency equipment response,

(4) available and accessible water to effectively attack Wildfire or defend a Structure
from Wildfire, and

(5) fuel modification sufficient for civilian and fire fighter safety.
(bb)_Shoulder: A vehicular pathway adjacent to the Traffic Lane.
(cc) State Responsibility Area (SRA): As defined in Public Resources Code sections 4126-
4127; and the California Code of Regulations, title 14, division 1.5, chapter 7, article 1,
sections 1220-1220.5.
§(ee) Structure: That which is built or constructed or any piece of work artificially built up or
composed of parts joined together in some definite manner.
(ff) Traffic Lane: The portion of a Road or Driveway that provides a single line of vehicle travel.
(gg) Turnaround: An area which allows for a safe opposite change of direction for Fire
Apparatus at the end of a Road or Driveway.
(hh) Turnout: A widening in a Road or Driveway to allow vehicles to pass.

4 UNOFFICIAL COPY

25-1836 D.6 Page 68 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 69 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002

 Docusign Envelope ID: 68ch258-1AAF-4880-AAFQ/5E‘§?&‘°2¥5'13§96§‘$§{"E,Fi'?:?ré g:?eugfsn'mpaCt ARG

UNOFFICIAL COPY

(3) application for a use permit;
(4) Road construction including construction of a Road that does not currently exist, or
extension of an existing Road.
(d) The standards in Subchapter 2 applicable to Roads shall not apply to Roads used solely for
Agriculture; mining; or the management of timberland or harvesting of forest products.

§ 1270.04. Provisions for Application of these Regulations

This Subchapter shall be applied as follows:

(a) the Local Jurisdictions shall provide the Director of the California Department of Forestry
and Fire Protection (CAL FIRE) or their designee with notice of applications for Building
permits, tentative parcel maps, tentative maps, and installation or use permits for construction
or Development within the SRA, or if after July, 1 2021, the VHFHSZ.

(b) the Director or their designee may review and make fire protection recommendations on
applicable construction or development permits or maps provided by the Local Jurisdiction.

(c) the Local Jurisdiction shall ensure that the applicable sections of this Subchapter become a
condition of approval of any applicable construction or Development permit or map.

§ 1270.05. Local Regulations

(a) Subchapter 2 shall serve as the minimum Wildfire protection standards applied in SRA and
VHFHSZ. However, Subchapter 2 does not supersede local regulations which equal or exceed
the standards of this Subchapter.

(b) A local regulation equals or exceeds a minimum standard of this Subchapter only if, at a
minimum, the local regulation also fully complies with the corresponding minimum standard in
this Subchapter.

(c) A Local Jurisdiction shall not apply exemptions to Subchapter 2 that are not enumerated in
Subchapter 2. Exceptions requested and approved in conformance with § 1270.07 (Exceptions
to Standards) may be granted on a case-by-case basis.

(d) Notwithstanding a local regulation that equals or exceeds the State Minimum Fire Safe
Regulations, Building construction shall comply with the State Minimum Fire Safe Regulations.

§ 1270.06. Inspections

Inspections shall conform to the following requirements:
(a) Inspections in the SRA shall be made by:
(1) the Director, or
(2) Local Jurisdictions that have assumed state fire protection responsibility on SRA
lands, or
(3) Local Jurisdictions where the inspection duties have been formally delegated by the
Director to the Local Jurisdictions, pursuant to subsection (b).
(b) The Director may delegate inspection authority to a Local Jurisdiction subject to all of the
following criteria:
(1) The Local Jurisdiction represents that they have appropriate resources to perform
the delegated inspection authority.
(2) The Local Jurisdiction acknowledges that CAL FIRE's authority under subsection (d)
shall not be waived or restricted.
(3) The Local Jurisdiction consents to the delegation of inspection authority.
(4) The Director may revoke the delegation at any time.
(5) The delegation of inspection authority, and any subsequent revocation of the
delegation, shall be documented in writing, and retained on file at the CAL FIRE Unit
headquarters that administers SRA fire protection in the area.
(c) Inspections in the VHFHSZ shall be made by the Local Jurisdiction.

6 UNOFFICIAL COPY

25-1836 D.6 Page 70 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 71 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002

e S ocusign Envelope ID: BBCQAZEB-1AAF—48BO—MF(%[%%?(I)%%})/&!I‘?@?%SE&E{I%Fil?:?r(; gz?e”gf;n'mpad Alternative

UNOFFICIAL COPY
Article 2 Ingress and Egress

§ 1273.00. Intent

Roads, and Driveways, whether public or private, unless exempted under 14 CCR §
1270.03(d), shall provide for safe access for emergency Wildfire equipment and civilian
evacuation concurrently, and shall provide unobstructed traffic circulation during a Wildfire
emergency consistent with 14 CCR §§ 1273.00 through 1273.09.

§ 1273.01. Width.

(a) All roads shall be constructed to provide a minimum of two ten (10) foot traffic lanes, not
including shoulder and striping. These traffic lanes shall provide for two-way traffic flow to
support emergency vehicle and civilian egress, unless other standards are provided in this
article or additional requirements are mandated by Local Jurisdictions or local subdivision
requirements. Vertical clearances shall conform to the requirements in California Vehicle Code
section 35250.
(b) All One-way Roads shall be constructed to provide a minimum of one twelve (12) foot traffic
lane, not including Shoulders. The Local Jurisdiction may approve One-way Roads.
(1) All one-way roads shall, at both ends, connect to a road with two traffic lanes
providing for travel in different directions, and shall provide access to an area currently
zoned for no more than ten (10) Residential Units.
(2) In no case shall a One-way Road exceed 2,640 feet in length. A turnout shall be
placed and constructed at approximately the midpoint of each One-way Road.
(c) All driveways shall be constructed to provide a minimum of one (1) ten (10) foot traffic lane,
fourteen (14) feet unobstructed horizontal clearance, and unobstructed vertical clearance of
thirteen feet, six inches (13' 6").

§ 1273.02. Road Surface

(a) Roads shall be designed and maintained to support the imposed load of Fire Apparatus
weighing at least 75,000 pounds, and provide an aggregate base.

(b) Road and Driveway Structures shall be designed and maintained to support at least 40,000
pounds.

(c) Project proponent shall provide engineering specifications to support design, if requested
by the Local Jurisdiction.

§ 1273.03. Grades

(a) At no point shall the grade for all Roads and Driveways exceed 16 percent.
(b) The grade may exceed 16%, not to exceed 20%, with approval from the Local Jurisdiction
and with mitigations to provide for Same Practical Effect.

§ 1273.04. Radius

(a) No Road or Road Structure shall have a horizontal inside radius of curvature of less than
fifty (50) feet. An additional surface width of four (4) feet shall be added to curves of 50-100
feet radius; two (2) feet to those from 100-200 feet.

(b) The length of vertical curves in Roadways, exclusive of gutters, ditches, and drainage
structures designed to hold or divert water, shall be not less than one hundred (100) feet.

§ 1273.05. Turnarounds

(a) Turnarounds are required on Driveways and Dead-end Roads.

8 UNOFFICIAL COPY

25-1836 D.6 Page 72 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 73 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 74 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 75 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002

-_——— . i il Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Docusign Envelope ID: GECOAZEB-1AAF-4880-AAF 7 EESCERC Mees hoonts - ian - Beduced. 76

UNOFFICIAL COPY

(e) Where a Road provides access solely to a single commercial or industrial business, the
address sign shall be placed at the nearest Road intersection providing access to that site, or
otherwise posted to provide for unobstructed visibility from that intersection.

(f) In all cases, the address shall be posted at the beginning of construction and shall be
maintained thereafter.

Article 4 Emergency Water Standards

§ 1275.00. Intent

Emergency water for Wildfire protection shall be available, accessible, and maintained in
quantities and locations specified in the statute and these regulations in order to attack a
Wildfire or defend property from a Wildfire.

§ 1275.01. Application

The provisions of this article shall apply in the tentative and parcel map process when new
parcels are approved by the Local Jurisdiction.

§ 1275.02. Water Supply.

(a) When a water supply for structure defense is required to be installed, such protection shall
be installed and made serviceable prior to and during the time of construction except when
alternative methods of protection are provided and approved by the Local Jurisdiction.

(b) Water systems equaling or exceeding the California Fire Code, California Code of
Regulations title 24, part 9, or, where a municipal-type water supply is unavailable, National
Fire Protection Association (NFPA) 1142, “Standard on Water Supplies for Suburban and
Rural Fire Fighting,” 2017 Edition, hereby incorporated by reference, shall be accepted as
meeting the requirements of this article.

(c) Such emergency water may be provided in a fire agency mobile water tender, or naturally
occurring or man made containment structure, as long as the specified quantity is immediately
available.

(d) Nothing in this article prohibits the combined storage of emergency Wildfire and structural
firefighting water supplies unless so prohibited by local ordinance or specified by the local fire
agency.

(e) Where freeze or crash protection is required by Local Jurisdictions, such protection
measures shall be provided.

§ 1275.03. Hydrants and Fire Valves.

(a) The hydrant or fire valve shall be eighteen (18) inches above the finished surface. Its
location in relation to the road or driveway and to the building(s) or structure(s) it serves shall
comply with California Fire Code, California Code of Regulations title 24, part 9, Chapter 5,
and Appendix C.
{b) The hydrant head shall be a two and half (2 1/2) inch National Hose male thread with cap
for pressure and gravity flow systems and four and a half (4 1/2) inch for draft systems.
(c) Hydrants shall be wet or dry barrel and have suitable freeze or crash protection as required
by the local jurisdiction.
§ 1275.04. Signing of Water Sources.
(a) Each hydrant, fire valve, or access to water shall be identified as follows:
(1) if located along a driveway, a reflectorized blue marker, with a minimum dimension
of three (3) inches shall be located on the driveway address sign and mounted on a fire
retardant post, or
(2) if located along a road,

12 UNOFFICIAL COPY

25-1836 D.6 Page 76 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 77 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002

= - Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Docusign Envelope ID: 6BCOAEB-1AAF-4880-AAF7-EESC225CTB 76, i 1) - Fire Safe Plan 78

UNOFFICIAL COPY
§ 1276.02. Ridgelines

(a) The Local Jurisdiction shall identify Strategic Ridgelines, if any, to reduce fire risk and
improve fire protection through an assessment of the following factors:
(1) Topography;
(2) Vegetation;
(3) Proximity to any existing or proposed residential, commercial, or industrial land uses;
(4) Construction where mass grading may significantly alter the topography resulting in
the elimination of Ridgeline fire risks;
(5) Ability to support effective fire suppression; and
(6) Other factors, if any, deemed relevant by the Local Jurisdiction.
(b) Preservation of Undeveloped Ridgelines identified as strategically important shall be
required pursuant to this section.
(c) New Buildings on Undeveloped Ridgelines identified as strategically important are
prohibited, as described in subsections (c)(1), (c)(2), and (c)(3).
(1) New Residential Units are prohibited within or at the top of drainages or other
topographic features common to Ridgelines that act as chimneys to funnel convective
heat from Wildfires.
(2) Nothing in this subsection shall be construed to alter the extent to which utility
infrastructure, including but not limited to wireless telecommunications facilities, as
defined in Government Code section 65850.6, subdivision (d)(2), or Storage Group S or
Utility and Miscellaneous Group U Structures, may be constructed on Undeveloped
Ridgelines.
(3) Local Jurisdictions may approve Buildings on Strategic Ridgelines where
Development activities such as mass grading will significantly alter the topography that
results in the elimination of Ridgeline fire risks.
(d) The Local Jurisdiction may implement further specific requirements to preserve
Undeveloped Ridgelines.

§ 1276.03. Fuel Breaks

(2) When Building construction meets the following criteria, the Local Jurisdiction shall
determine the need and location for Fuel Breaks in consultation with the Fire Authority:
(1) the permitting or approval of three (3) or more new parcels, excluding lot line
adjustments as specified in Government Code (GC) section 66412(d); or
(2) an application for a change of zoning increasing zoning intensity or density; or
(3) an application for a change in use permit increasing use intensity or density.
(b) Fuel Breaks required by the Local Jurisdiction, in consultation with the Fire Authority, shall
be located, designed, and maintained in a condition that reduces the potential of damaging
radiant and convective heat or ember exposure to Access routes, Buildings, or infrastructure
within the Development.
(c) Fuel Breaks shall have, at a minimum, one point of entry for fire fighters and any Fire
Apparatus. The specific number of entry points and entry requirements shall be determined by
the Local Jurisdiction, in consultation with the Fire Authority.
(d) Fuel Breaks may be required at locations such as, but not limited to:
(1) Directly adjacent to defensible space as defined by 14 CCR § 1299.02 to reduce
radiant and convective heat exposure, ember impacts, or support fire suppression
tactics;
(2) Directly adjacent to Roads to manage radiant and convective heat exposure or
ember impacts, increase evacuation safety, or support fire suppression tactics;
(3) Directly adjacent to a Hazardous Land Use to limit the spread of fire from such uses,
reduce radiant and convective heat exposure, or support fire suppression tactics;

14 UNOFFICIAL COPY

25-1836 D.6 Page 78 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 79 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 80 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 81 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
== . = i ill Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Docusign Envelope ID: 6809A2EB-1AAF-4880—AA15[%¥8?§? <hibit U - Fire Safe Plan

SECTION 2: ADOPTION OF CODE WITH EXCLUSIONS

The EDHCWD adopts the 2022 California Fire Code, Title 24, Part 9, in its entirety,
including Appendices, incorporating those sections of the Infernational Fire Code, 2021 edition
not adopted by the state, with the exclusions listed below:

Exclusions: 103, 309, 311.5, 311.8, 318, 403.3, 403.5, 403.8, 403.10, 403.11, 404, 406,
903.3.1.2, 904.1.1, 1103.1, 1103.3-1103.4, 1103.6, 1105, Chapter 26, D104.2 (Exception only),
D106.1 {Exception only), D107.1 (Exceptions only), Appendix A, Appendix G, Appendix J,
Appendix K, Appendix L, Appendix M, Appendix N, Appendix O.

Appendices not adopted can be used for reference in enforcing other sections of the 2022
California Fire Code.

SECTION 3: AMENDMENTS TO THE 2022 CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE
The following Sections are hereby amended or added:

Chapter 1
SECTION 101.1 “TITLE” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 101.1 TITLE. These regulations shall be known as the Fire Code of EDHCWD,
hereinafter referred to as “this code”.

SECTION 105.5 “REQUIRED OPERATIONAL PERMITS” IS AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 105.5 Required operational permits. The fire code official is authorized to issue
operational permits for the operations set forth in Sections 105.5.2 through 105.5.525.

SECTION 105.5.65 “AUTOMOBILE WRECKING YARDS" IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 105.5.55 Automobile wrecking yards. An operational permit is required for the
operation of automobile wrecking yards.

SECTION 105.6 “REQUIRED CONSTRUCTION PERMITS” IS AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 105.6 required construction permits. The fire code official is authorized to issue
construction permits for work as set forth in sections 105.6.1 through 105.6.246.

SECTION 105.6.25 "AUTOMOBILE WRECKING YARDS" IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 105.6.25 Automobile wrecking yards. Construction permits are required for the
installation of or modification to automobile wrecking yards.

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 2

23-0015 F 5 0f 43

25-1836 D.6 Page 82 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 83 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 84 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 85 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 86 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 87 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002

Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
e Docusign Envelope ID: 6ECOAZEB-1AAF-4880-AAFT-EESC225CTBIG it ) - Firo Sufe Pran "

Section 503.3.3 Fire Lanes Based on Road Width. Fire lanes shall be based on road width
as required in Appendix D as amended by the District.

SECTION 503.8 "SECURITY GATES” IS AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 503.6 Security Gates. The installation of security gates across a fire apparatus
access road shall be approved by the fire code official and shall comply with the District gate
standard. Where security gates are installed, they shall have an approved means of
emergency operation. The securily gates and the emergency operation shall be maintained
operational at all times. Electric gate operators, where provided, shall be listed in accordance
with UL 325. Gates intended for automatic operation shall be designed, constructed, and
installed to comply with the requirements of ASTM F2200.

SECTION 505.1 "ADDRESS IDENTIFICATION" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 505.1 Address Identification. Addresses for new and existing buildings shall comply
with the District address standard as approved by the fire code official. The address
identification shall be legible and placed in a position that is visible from the street or road fronting
the property. Address identification characters shall contrast with their background. Address
numbers shall be Arabic numbers or alphabetical letters. Numbers shall not be spelled out. Each
character shall be not less than 4 inches {102 mm) high with a minimum stoke width of /2 inch
(12.7 mm). Where required by the fire code official, address identification shall be provided in
additional approved locations to facilitate emergency response. access is by means of a private
road and the building cannot be viewed from the public way, a monument, pole or other sign or
means shall be used to identify the structure. Address identification shall be maintained.

SECTION 507.5.1 “WHERE REQUIRED" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 507.5.1 Where Required. Where a portion of the facility or building hereafter
constructed or moved into or within the jurisdiction is more than 150 feet from a hydrant on a fire
apparatus access road, as measured by an approved route around the exterior of the facility or
building, on-site fire hydrants and mains capable of supplying the required fire flow shall be
provided where required by the fire code official.

Exceptions:

1. For Group R-3 and Group U occupancies, the distance requirement shall be 600 feet
(183 m).

SECTION 509.3 “FIRE CONTROL ROOM” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 509.3 Fire Control Room. Fire sprinkler risers, fire alarm control panels, solar
photovoltaic power system rapid shutoff switches, and other fire detection, suppression or
similar control elements shall be located inside a single fire control room for the building. The
fire confrof room shali have minimum dimensions of five feet by seven feet in size with a total
usable area of not less than 35 square feet, The room shall be located within the building on
an outside wall af a location approved by the Fire Code Official and shall be accessibie from
the exterior. An exterior access door with a clear width of not less than 32 inches and height
of not less than 80 inches shall be provided for access info the room. A durable sign shall be
affixed to the exterior of the door with the words “FIRE CONTROL ROOM” in letters not less

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 8

23-0015F 11 of 43

25-1836 D.6 Page 88 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 89 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002

r Docusign Envelope ID: GBCQAZEB-1AAF-4880-AAF9£%%?5§92¥8"?§§%S£$E{'%Fil?:?ré ';z?e“gf;n'mpad EUENT “

occupancy to and including the levels of exit discharge serving that occupancy where one of the
following conditions exists:

1. The fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet;
2. The fire area has an occupant load of 100 or more.

3. The fire area is located on a floor other than a level of exit discharge serving such
occupancies.

4. The structure exceeds 3,600 square feet, contains more than one fire area containing a
Group A-2 occupangcy, and is separated into two or more buildings by fire walls of less than
4-hour fire-resistance rating without openings.

SECTION 903.2.1.3 “GROUP A-3" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 903.2.1.3 Group A-3. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout
stories containing Group A-3 occupancies and throughout all stories from the Group A-3
occupancy to and including the levels of exit discharge serving that occupancy where one of the
following conditions exists:

1. The fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet.
2. The fire area has an occupant load of 300 or more.

3. The fire area is located on a floor other than a level of exit discharge serving such
occupancies.

4. The structure exceeds 3,600 square feet, contains more than one fire area containing
exhibition and display rooms, and is separated into two or more buildings by fire walls of
less than 4-hour fire-resistance rating without openings.

SECTION 903.2.1.4 “GROUP A-4" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 903.2.1.4 Group A-4. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout
stories containing Group A-4 occupancies and throughout all stories from the Group A-4
occupancy to and including the levels of exit discharge serving that occupancy where one of the
following conditions exists:

1. The fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet.

2. The fire area has an occupant load of 300 or more.

3. The fire area is located on a floor other than a level of exit discharge serving such

occupancies.

SECTION 803.2.3 “GROUP E” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:
Section 903.2,3 Group E. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided for Group E
occupancies as follows:

1. Throughout all Group E fire areas greater than 3,600 square feet in area.

2. The Group E fire area is located on a floor other than a level of exit discharge serving such
occupancies.

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 10

23-0015F 13 of 43

25-1836 D.6 Page 90 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 91 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002

e oCusign Envelope 1D 6BCOAZEB-1AAF-4880-AART LSS AgggSPecific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
xhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

Section 903.2.8.5 Manufactured Homes. An automatic fire sprinkler system shall be required
in all new manufactured homes and multi-family manufactured homes intended for use as a
one-and two-family dwelling. The design and instalfation of such systems shall be in
accordance with California Code of Regulations, Title 25, §4300.

Exceptions:

1. Manufactured homes located within an existing mobile home park complying with
California Health and Safely Code, Division 13, Part 2.1 or 2.3.

2. Manufactured homes that do not exceed 1,200 square feel in size and serve as an
accessory dwelling unit, as defined in Government Code Section 658502; when the
existing primary residence on the property is not required to comply with California
Residential Code Section R313.2.

3. Manufacttired homes that do not exceed 320 square feet in size.
SECTION 903.2.9 "GROUP S-1” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 903.2.9 Group S-1. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout all
buildings containing a Group S-1 occupancy where one of the following conditions exists:

1. A Group S-1 fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet.

2. A Group S-1 fire area is located more than three stories above grade plane.

3. The combined area of all Group S-1 fire areas on all floors, including any mezzanines,
exceeds 3,600 square feet.

4. A Group S-1 fire area used for the storage of commercial motor vehicles where the fire
area exceeds 3,600 square feet.

SECTION 903.2.10 “GROUP §-2” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:
Section 903.2.10 Group S-2. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout
buildings classified as parking garages where any of the following conditions exist:

1. Where the fire area of the enclosed parking garage, in accordance with Section 408.6 of
the California Building Code, exceeds 3,600 square feet.

2. Where the enclosed parking garage, in accordance with Section 406.6 of the California
Building Code, is located beneath other groups.

Exception: Enclosed parking garages located beneath Group R-3 occupancies.

3. Where the fire area of the open parking garage, in accordance with Section 406.5 of the
Califomnia Building Code, exceeds 3,600 square feet.

SECTION 903.2.10.1 “COMMERCIAL PARKING GARAGES" SHALL BE AMENDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 903.2.10.1 Commercial Parking Garages. An automatic sprinkler system shall be
provided throughout buildings used for slorage of commercial motor vehicles where the fire area
exceeds 3,600 square feet,

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 12

23-0015 F 15 of 43

25-1836 D.6 Page 92 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 93 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 94 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 95 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002

e ocusign Envelope ID: 6BCOAZEB- 1AAF-4880-AAL7 EEs(nlifggeSpecific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
xhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

2. Agncultural buildings not under special use permit and/or not used for commercial
purposes (e.g., retails sales, food service, and/or special events).

SECTION 907.6.2.1 “SECONDARY POWER SUPPLY” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

SECTION 907.6.2.1 SECONDARY POWER SUPPLY. Where required by the fire code official,
in accordance with NFPA 72, the secondary power supply providing a minimum 24-hour power
capacity under quiescent load {system operating in a non-alarm condition) shall be amended
to a minimum 72-hour power capacity.

Exception: The existence of an emergency back-up power supply that meets or exceed
the requirements of California Fire Code Chapier 12.

SECTION 907.9 “WHERE REQURIED [N EXISTING BUILDINGS” SHALL BE AMENDED AS
FOLLOWS:

SECTION 907.9 Where Required. An approved fire alarm system shall be provided in existing
buildings and structures where required in Chapter 11 and in existing buildings with a floor
area less than 3,600 square feet without an approved automatic sprinkler system, other than
one- or two-family dwelling units, agricultural bufiding not under special use permit for
commercial purposes where a fire alarm detection system does not exist and the floor area of
the building or structure is increased

Exception: When the building increase is less than 500 square feet.

Chapter 12

SECTION 1203.1.3 “INSTALLATION’ SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 1203.1.3 Installation. Emergency power systems and standby power systems shall
be installed in accordance with the California Building Code, the Califomnia Electrical Code,
NFPA 110 and NFPA 111. Al buildings, other than one- and two-family dwelling units, and
agricultural buildings not used for commercial purposes, with standby power, shall have a
shunt trip device that disconnects all power sources to the building, approved by the fire code
official. Existing instalfations shalf be maintained in accordance with the original approval.
Chapter 33

SECTION 3311.3 “PREMISE IDENTIFICATION” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 3311.3 Premise ldentification. Frior to and during construction, an approved
address sign shall be provided at each fire and emergency vehicle access road entry into the

project.
SECTION 3313.1 “WHEN REQUIRED” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:
Section 3313.1 When Required. An approved water supply for fire protection, either

temporary or permanent, shall be installed and maintained in continuous operation as soon as
combustible building materials arrive on site, the commencement of vertical combustible

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 16

23-0015 F 19 of 43

25-1836 D.6 Page 96 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 97 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 98 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 99 of 122



S ocusign Envelope ID: 6BCOAZEB-1AAF-4880-AART EEEISH Y

GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002

Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
xhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

3,601 and greater

No automatic sprinkler
system

Value in Table
B105.1(2)

Duration in Table
B105.1(2) at the
required fire-flow
rate

MAJOR SUBDIVISIONS (5§ PARCELS OR GREATER)

313.3 of the CA
Residential Code

(min. 1000
GPM)

0-3,600 Section 903.3.1.3 of the | 71,000 1
CA Fire Code or Section
3133 of the CA
Residential Code

3,601 and greater | Section 903.3.1.3 of the | 1/2 value of
CA Fire Code or Section | Table B105.1(2) |2

OTHER RESIDENTIAL DEVELOPMENT

0 -3,600

Section 903.3.1.3 of the
CA Fire Code or Section
313.3 of the CA
Residential Code

500

3,601 and greater

Section 903.3.1.3 of the
CA Fire Code or Section
313.3 of the CA
Residential Code

1/2 value of Table
B105.1(2) (min.
750 GPM)

TABLE B105.2 “REQUIRED FIRE FLOW FOR BUILDINGS OTHER THAN ONE- AND
TWO-FAMILY DWELLINGS, GROUP R-3, AND R-4 BUILDINGS AND
TOWNHOUSES" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

TABLE B105.2 REQUIRED FIRE FLOW FOR BUILDINGS OTHER THAN ONE-
AND TWO-FAMILY DWELLINGS, GROUP R-3, AND R-4 BUILDINGS AND

{Design Standard)

(gallons per minute)

TOWNHOUSES
AUTOMATIC MINIMUM FIRE- FLOW DURATION
SPRINKLER SYSTEM FLOW {hours)

system

No automatic sprinkler | Value in Table

B105.1(2)

Duration in Table B105.1(2)

CA Fire Code

Section 903.3.1.1 of the

Table B105.1(2)°

25% of the value in

Duration in Table B105.1(2) at
the reduced flow rate

b. The reduced fire flow shall not be less than 1,500 gpm

Ordinance 2022-01

Page 20

23-0015 F 23 of 43

25-1836 D.6 Page 100 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 101 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002

e Docusign Envelope [D: GBCQAZEB-1AAF-4880-AAF9'-%‘?§¢%¥8'?§9§5${'%Fi'?:?ré gz?e”gf;n'mpad ARG 102

SECTION D103.6.1 Roads 20 to 29 feet in width. Fire lane signs as specified in Section
D103.6 shall be posted on both side of fire apparatus access roads that are 20 to 29 feet wide
(6096 to 8534.4 mm).

SECTION D103.6.2 “ROADS MORE THAN 29 FEET IN WIDTH" SHALL BE AMENDED AS
FOLLOWS:

SECTION D103.6.2 Roads more than 29 feet in Width. Fire lane signs as specified in Section
D103.6 shall be posted on one side of fire apparatus access roads more than 29 feet wide
(8534.4 mm) and less than 36 feet wide (70972.8 mm),

SECTION D104.4 “CIRCUMFERENTIAL FIRE APPARATUS ACCESS ROADS™ SHALL BE
ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

SECTION D104.4 Circumferential Fire Apparatus Access Roads. When required by the
fire code official, a fire apparatus access road shall be constructed to encompass the entirely
of a structure and shall provide a continuous means of emergency vehicle access.

SECTION 4: CONFLICT
That QOrdinance No. 2019-01 of the EDHCWD, and all other ordinances or parts of ordinances
herewith are hereby repealed.

SECTION 5: SEVERABILITY

If any Ordinance, article, subsection or subdivision thereof, provision, sentence, clause or
phrase of this code, or any application thereof, is for any reason held to be invalid by a court
of competent jurisdiction, such decision shall not affect the remaining provisions of this code,
which can be given effect without the invalid portions and, therefore, such invalid portions are
declared to be severable. The EDHCWD hereby declares that it would have enacted this
Ordinance and each of its articles, sections, subsections, or subdivisions thereof, provisions,
sentences, clauses or phrases irrespective of the fact that one or more of them is declared
invalid.

SECTION 6: EFFECTIVE DATE AND PUBLICATION
This Ordinance shall take effect thirty (30) days after its adoption. The EDHCWD Board

Secretary is directed to publish this ordinance in a newspaper of general circulation in the
District. In lieu of publication of the full text of the ordinance, a summary of the ordinance may
be published by the by the Board Secretary within fifteen (15) days after its passage and a

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 22

23-0015 F 25 0f 43

25-1836 D.6 Page 102 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 103 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 104 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 105 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002

e Docusign Envelope ID: 6BCOA2EB-1AAF-4830-AAFFSEESIS qge Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative

1.7

1.8

1.9

1.10

xhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

2021 Caldor Fire and the 2022 Mosquito Fire. Climate change stressors, such as increased average
air temperature, precipitation variability, reduced snowpack, drought and tree mortality, will lead to
an increased frequency of large wildfires that will create adverse impacts on local communities in
the County of El Dorado, including both El Dorado Hills and Latrobe; and

Of paramount importance to the Governing Board of EDHCWD and the citizens of El Dorado Hills
and Latrobe are the protection of lives and structures from the threat of wildfire, and the safety of
public safety personnel during wildfires. The proper maintenance of defensible space on
Unimproved Parcels benefits property owners, public safety personnel, and all citizens of both El
Dorado Hills and Latrobe by dramatically increasing the likelihood that structures will survive a
wildfire, provides for firefighter safety during a wildfire, and generally aids in the protection of
lives, property, and the environment; and

The Governing Board of EDHCWD finds and declares that the uncontrolled growth and/or
accumulation of weeds, grasses, hazardous vegetation and combustible materials or obstructions on
sidewalks, streets, and on lands or lots within the EDHCWD is dangerous or injurious to neighboring
property and the health, safety, and welfare of residents of the EDHCWD. Such growth and
accumulation constitute a public nuisance in that it creates fire hazards, reduces the value of private
property, promotes blight and deterioration, invites plundering, constitutes an unattractive nuisance,
and creates a hazard to the health, safety, and general welfare of the public; and

The purpose of this Ordinance is to provide for the removal of hazardous vegetation and combustible
material from around the exterior of improvements situated in the jurisdiction of the EDHCWD to
reduce the potential for fire and to promote the public health, safety, and welfare of the community.
1t is the further purpose of this Ordinance to establish a hazardous vegetation reduction program that
provides a process to identify and abate hazardous vegetation on parcels and protect the lives and
property of the citizens of the EDHCWD, while at the same time protecting sensitive plant and
animal speccies and protecting against significant erosion and sedimentation. The removal of
hazardous vegetation in the areas subject to this Ordinance is recognized as an essential action
homeowners and property owners can take to increase the chances that homes, structures and other
property will survive a wildfire, while protecting the natural environment. Regular fuels
management and modifications consistent with the requirements of this Ordinance is necessary to
ensure adequate defensible space is achieved; and

The defensible space required by this Ordinance is necessary to significantly reduce the risk of

transmission of flame or heat sufficient to ignite the structures, and there is no other feasible

Page 3

25-1836 D.6 Page 106 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 107 of 122



e Docusign Envelope ID: 6BCOA2EB-1AAF-4880-AA ﬁ?@&’iz}g@%ﬁ

3.5

3.6

3.7

3.8
3.9

3.10

3.11

3.12

3.13

3.14

GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
pecific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
xhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

California Firc Code (CFC) means code provisions found within California Code of Regulations

Title 24, Part 9, as amended locally by EDHCWD.

Citation or Administrative Citation means a civil citation issued pursuant to the Ordinance stating

there has been a violation of one or more provisions and setting the amount of the civil penalty to

be paid by the responsible party.

Combustible Material means all rubbish, litter, or material of any kind other than hazardous

vegetation that is combustible and endangers the public safety by creating a fire hazard.

Days means calendar days.

Defensible Space means that area described in California Code of Regulations Title 14, Division

1.5, Chapter 7, Subchapter 3, Section 1299.02, Government Code 51182, Public Resources Code

Section 4291, El Dorado County Codes & Ordinances Chapter 8.09 and as otherwise described in

this Code, which is adjacent to each side of a building or Structure and must be cleared of Hazardous

Vegetation, or Combustible Material, as set forth in this Ordinance.

EDHCWD means the El Dorado Hills County Water District of El Dorado County, a political

subdivision of the State of California.

Fire Code Official means the fire chief or other designated authority charged with the

administration and enforcement of the code, or a duly authorized representative.

Fire Hazard means any condition, arrangement, act, or omission which:

3.12.1 Increases, or may cause an increase of hazard or menace of fire to a greater degree than that
customarily recognized as normal by persons in the public service regularly engaged in
preventing, suppressing, or extinguishing fire; or

3.12.2 May obstruct, delay, hinder, or interfere with the operations of a fire department or the egress
of occupants in the event of fire.

Fire Safe Plan means a document prepared for a specific project or development proposed for a

Wildland-Urban Interface (WUT) Fire Area. It describes ways to minimize and mitigate potential

for loss from wildfire exposure.

Hazardous Vegetation means any vegetation that is combustible and endangers the public safety

by creating a fire hazard. Hazardous Vegetation includes material that in its natural state will readily

ignite, burn, and transmit fire from native or landscape plants to any structure or other vegetation.

Hazardous Vegetation includes, but is not limited to, dry grass and leaves, brush, weeds, green

waste, dead or dying trees, low-hanging branches, litter, or other flammable vegetation that can

create a Fire Hazard. Hazardous Vegetation shall not include a commercial agricultural crop that is

being actively grown and managed by the property owner or his or her legal tenant.

Page 5

25-1836 D.6 Page 108 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 109 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002

" Docusign Envelope ID: 6BCOA2EB-1AAF-4880-AAFTEEESES5HageSpecific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative

3.25

3.26

3.27

3.28

3.29

3.30

xhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

Structure means any dwelling, house, building, or other type of combustible construction, whether

or not occupied, including but not limited to a wood fence located within the Defensible Space of

any other Structure.

Unimproved Parcel means a portion of land of any size, the arca of which is determined by the

Assessor’s maps and records and may be identified by an Assessor’s Parcel Number (APN) upon

which no Structure is located.

Vegetation means plants considered collectively, especially those found in a particular area or

habitat. For the purposes of this Ordinance any tree less than six inches in diameter is considered

Vegetation.

Waste means all putrescible and non-putrescible solid, semi-solid, and liquid wastes, including

residential, commercial, and municipal garbage, trash, refuse, paper, rubbish, ashes, industrial

wastes, construction, and demolition debris, discarded home and industrial appliances, manure,

vegetable or animal solid and semi-solid wastes, and other discarded solid wastes and semisolid

wastes.

Weeds means Vegetation growing upon streets, sidewalks, or private property, including any of the

following types:

3.29.1 Weeds which bear seeds of a downy or wingy nature.

3.29.2 Sagebrush, chaparral, and any other brush or weed which attains such large growth as io
become, when dry, a fire menace to adjacent improved property.

3.29.3 Weeds which are otherwise noxious or dangerous.

3.29.4 Poison oak or poison ivy when the conditions constitute a menace to public health.

3.29.5 Dry grass, stubble, brush, litter, or other flammable materials which endanger public safety
by creating a fire hazard.

3.29.6 Vegetation that is not pruned or is otherwise neglected so as to attain such large growth as
to become, when dry, a fire menace to adjacent property.

Wildfire Risk Area means land that is covered with grass, grain, brush or forest, whether privately

or publicly owned, which is so situated or is of such inaccessible location that a fire originating upon

it would present an abnormally difficult job of suppression or would result in great or unusual

damage through fire or such areas designated by the Fire Code Official.

SECTION 4: CALIFORNIA ENVIRONMENTAL QUALITY ACT (CEQA)

4.1

The subject project is Categorically Exempt (Class 4) from provisions of CEQA, pursuant to 14
CCR section 15304.

Page 7

25-1836 D.6 Page 110 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 111 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002

e Docusign Envelope ID: 6BCOA2EB-1AAF-4880-AAST 29K8{d8, K iagg Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative

53.1

532

533

534

535

5.3.6

33.7

SECTION 6:

xhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

An Unimproved Parcel located within a development subject to a Fire Department approved
Fire Safe Plan shall comply with the terms of that plan as required by CFC § 4903 regardless
of size.

Unimproved Parcels located in areas designated by the Fire Code Official as a Wildfire Risk
Area shall also be evaluated against the provisions of this Ordinance and EDCC Chapter
8.09.

Unimproved Parcels known to contain, or that the property owner believes, may contain
habitat for rare, threatened or endangered plant or animal species shall contact the California
Department of Fish and Wildlife at least ten (10) days in advance of vegetation management
work. Ifthe property owner is aware of any federal or state listed species then the appropriate
wildlife agency shall be consulted prior to beginning work. It is possible that a permit may
be required from the appropriate agencies (e.g., U.S. Fish and Wildlife Services and/or the
California Department of Fish and Wildlife) prior to work beginning on the property.
Agricultural crops and active agricultural operation (e.g., farming, grazing, nursery and
winegrape) lands as defined in the EDCC are exempt from meeting the regulations
described in this Ordinance.

Heritage Trees are exempt from meeting the regulations described in this Ordinance.

All Slash, Rubbish, or Combustible Material debris shall be chipped or removed from the
property.

The Fire Code Official may require greater clearance distances than that specified in Section
5, at their discretion, where public health safety or welfare so dictate, or where geographic,

topographic or vegetation circumstances dictate.

ACCEPTABLE METHODS OF CLEARANCE

6.1  Disking. The discs shall be set at an angle sufficient to cut the sod loose and adequately bury the

growth of weeds, grass, or noxious vegetation existing at the time. Disking shall include rototilling

or cultivating. Disking shall be done each time the growth exceeds six (6) inches in height.

6.2  Scraping. Area shall be scraped clear, and all debris shall be removed from the required clear area.

6.3 Mowing. Height of vegetation shall not exceed two (2) inches at completion. Mowing shall be done

each time growth exceeds six (6) inches in height. Mowing shall include hand-operated weed eaters,

flail, and rotary mowers.

Page 9

25-1836 D.6 Page 112 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 113 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002

e Docusign Envelope ID: sechzEB-1MF4880-AAﬁf§@é§@22¥tﬂ?E9§Pe°'f'C Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative

9.2

Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

injurious to the health or welfare of persons or to the public, including the environment, and is a
public nuisance, or is otherwise in violation of this Ordinance.
No person shall interfere with the Fire Code Official while acting in the official course and scope

of their duty.

SECTION 10:REOCCURRING FIRE HAZARD

10.1

10.2

10.3

In the case of a parcel containing a Fire Hazard where it has been necessary for the El Dorado
Hills Fire Department to Abate as a public nuisance in two consecutive years, and the Fire Hazard
is seasonal or recurring, the Governing Board of EDHCWD may declare such a parcel to be a
seasonal public nuisance.

As to such parcels constituting a seasonal Fire Hazard, the Fire Code Official may mail a notice
to the Responsible Person(s) of the property at the address that appears upon the current
assessment roll. The notice shall contain the information prescribed in Health and Safety Code
Section 14900.6.

If the nuisance is not Abated by the Responsible Person(s) within the time specified, the El Dorado
Hills Fire Department may proceed to Abate the property and recover costs for doing so, pursuant
to Health and Safety Code sections 149001 and 14902, and as provided for in this Ordinance.

SECTION 11: PENALTIES

111

11.2

11.3

11.4

Failure to comply with the provisions described in this Ordinance may result in the issuance of an
Administrative Citation by the El Dorado Hills Fire Department, or a declaration by the Board
that the condition on the parcel constitute a public nuisance to be abated at the Responsible
Person(s) expense.

Every violation of this Ordinancc is punishable by:

11.2.1 A fine not exceeding $100.00 for the first violation; and

11.2.2 A fine not exceeding $200.00 for the second violation within three years; and

11.2.3 A fine not exceeding $500.00 for each additional violation within three years.

Payment of the fine shall not excuse the failure to correct the violation nor shall it bar further
enforcement action by EDHCWD.

All fines shall be payable to EDHCWD unless otherwise directed in the Notice of Violation and
Order to Correct.

For all delinquent unpaid administrative fines, there shall be a penalty imposed in accordance with

the provisions of this Ordinance. The delinquency date for an administrative fine shall be 30 days

Page 11

25-1836 D.6 Page 114 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 115 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 116 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 117 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 118 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 119 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 120 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 121 of 122



GPA20-0001, Z20-0005, SP20-0001, TM20-0002
Creekside Village Specific Plan - Reduced Impact Alternative
Exhibit U - Fire Safe Plan

25-1836 D.6 Page 122 of 122





