

**Bid #14-863-060 Truck Tires & Related Services - East Slope
Evaluation***

Schedule A: New Tires (Highway Tread)					(A) Brannon Tire Stockton, CA		(C) Sierra Nevada Tire & Wheel Placerville, CA	
Item #	Tire Size	Load Range	Bid Required	Qty	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
1	4.80/4.00-8	A		1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$12.00	\$12.00
2	8.25R15TR	J	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$300.00	\$300.00
3	LT245/75R16	E	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$115.00	\$115.00
4	LT185/R-14	D	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$90.00	\$90.00
5	ST225/75R15	D	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$90.00	\$90.00
6	7.00-15LT	D	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$100.00	\$100.00
7	225/70R19.5	F	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$165.00	\$165.00
8	245/70R19.5	F		1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$175.00	\$175.00
9	265/70R19.5	F		1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$225.00	\$225.00
10	10.00R-22.5	F	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$275.00	\$275.00
11	385/95R24	N	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$1,050.00	\$1,050.00
12	385/65R22.5 (Michelin XZY-3 wide Base #53779)	J	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$900.00	\$900.00
13	385/65R22.5	J	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$500.00	\$500.00
14	425/65RL22.5 (Vacto Steer)	L	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$607.96	\$607.96
15	225/70R22.5	H		1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$250.00	\$250.00
16	11R22.5	H	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$350.00	\$350.00
17	315/80R22.5 (Michelin XZY-3 All Position #40200)	L	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$1,050.00	\$1,050.00
18	315/80R22.5	L	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$450.00	\$450.00
19	12R22.5 (Michelin XZY-3 #47947)	H	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$900.00	\$900.00
20	12R22.5	H	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$425.00	\$425.00
21	12R22.5	H	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$400.00	\$400.00
SCHEDULE A SUBTOTAL						No Bid		\$8,429.96

Schedule B: New Tires (Mud & Snow Tread, Drilled for Studs)				(A) Brannon Tire Stockton, CA		(C) Sierra Nevada Tire & Wheel Placerville, CA		
	Tire Size	Load Range	Bid Required	Qty	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
22	LT235/85R16 (Goodyear Wrnagler Duratrac)	E	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$142.50	\$142.50
23	LT245/75R16	E	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$149.03	\$149.03
24	225/70R19.5	F	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$200.00	\$200.00
25	10.00R-22.5	F	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$350.00	\$350.00
26	255/70R22.5	H		1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$320.00	\$320.00
27	315/80R22.5 (Michelin XZY-3 All Position M/S rate #40200)	L	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$1,100.00	\$1,100.00
28	315/80R22.5	L	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$596.77	\$596.77
29	11R22.5 (Samson GL293D)	H	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$400.00	\$400.00
30	11R22.5 (Samson GL293D)	G	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$400.00	\$400.00
31	11R22.5	G	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$350.00	\$350.00
32	12R22.5 (Samson GL293D)	H	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$450.00	\$450.00
33	12R22.5	H	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$492.88	\$492.88
SCHEDULE B SUBTOTAL						No Bid		\$4,951.18

Schedule C: New Tires - All-Season Tread - Mud & Snow Rated (Do not include dismount, balance or mount)				(A) Brannon Tire Stockton, CA		(C) Sierra Nevada Tire & Wheel Placerville, CA		
	Tire Size	Load Range	Bid Required	Qty	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
34	LT245/75R16	E	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$125.00	\$125.00
35	LT235/85R16	E	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$125.00	\$125.00
36	225/70R19.5	F	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$200.00	\$200.00
SCHEDULE C SUBTOTAL					No Bid			\$450.00

Schedule D: New Tires - Traction Tire				(A) Brannon Tire Stockton, CA		(C) Sierra Nevada Tire & Wheel Placerville, CA		
	Tire Size	Load Range	Bid Required	Qty	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
37	14.00-20 (Rotary Plow or Blower)	L	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$700.00	\$700.00
38	14.00-20 (Rotary Plow or Blower)	L	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$1,250.00	\$1,250.00
39	385/95R24 (Rotary Plow or Blower) - Bridgestone	N	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$1,446.48	\$1,446.48
40	385/95R24 (Rotary Plow or Blower)	N	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$950.00	\$950.00
41	16.9-24	D		1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$510.00	\$510.00
42	19.5L-24	E		1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$675.00	\$675.00
43	15.5-25	F	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$550.00	\$550.00
44	15.5-25 (E3 Rock) EBT Rock Dawg	H	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$750.00	\$750.00
45	15.5R25 Radial	F	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$1,450.00	\$1,450.00
46	17.5-25	F	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$715.00	\$715.00
47	18.4-30	D		1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$715.00	\$715.00
48	14.00-24 (Rotary Plow or Blower)	L	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$950.00	\$950.00
49	14.00-24 (Rotary Plow or Blower)	L		1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$850.00	\$850.00
50	14.00-24 (Rotary Plow or Blower)	L		1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$1,000.00	\$1,000.00
51	14.00-24 (Motor Graders) East Bay	F	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$650.00	\$650.00
52	14.00-24 (Motor Graders)	F	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$500.00	\$500.00
53	14.00R-24 (Motor Graders) Radial - Michelin X-Snow	F	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$2,350.00	\$2,350.00
54	14.00-24 (Motor Graders) Radial - Goodyear AS-3A	1*	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$2,400.00	\$2,400.00
55	14.00-24 (Motor Graders) G3 Rock - EBT / Rcoc Dawg	H	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$700.00	\$700.00
56	14.00-24 (Motor Graders E3 Rock)	H	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$635.00	\$635.00
57	14.00R-24 (Motor Graders) E3Rock	H	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$1,000.00	\$1,000.00
SCHEDULE D SUBTOTAL					No Bid		\$20,746.48	

Schedule E: New Tires - Special Equipment				(A) Brannon Tire Stockton, CA		(C) Sierra Nevada Tire & Wheel Placerville, CA		
	Tire Size	Load Range	Bid Required	Qty	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
58	8 x 2.2	A		1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$30.00	\$30.00
59	145/70-6	A		1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$25.00	\$25.00
60	4.10/3.50-4	A		1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$11.50	\$11.50
61	4.10/3.50-6	A	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$14.00	\$14.00
62	5.30/4.50-6	C		1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$35.00	\$35.00
63	6.50-10 (Forklift)	E		1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$85.00	\$85.00
64	4.80/4.00-8	A		1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$13.00	\$13.00
65	4.80-12	B		1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$28.00	\$28.00
66	7.50-15NHS (Smooth)	F		1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$225.00	\$225.00
67	12-16.5 Skid Steer Extra Reinforced Side Wall	F		1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$215.00	\$215.00
68	12.5-80-18	E		1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$315.00	\$315.00
69	11L16	E	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$145.00	\$145.00
70	7.00-12 (Forklift)	E		1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$115.00	\$115.00
SCHEDULE E SUBTOTAL						No Bid		\$1,256.50

Schedule F: Recaps - Mud & Snow Tread, (Drilled for Studs)				(A) Brannon Tire Stockton, CA		(C) Sierra Nevada Tire & Wheel Placerville, CA		
	Tire Size	Load Range	Bid Required	Qty	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
71	225/70R19.5	F	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$200.00	\$200.00
72	11R22.5	H	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$250.00	\$250.00
73	315/80R22.5	L		1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$250.00	\$250.00
74	12R22.5	H	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$250.00	\$250.00
75	10.00-22.5	G		1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$150.00	\$150.00
SCHEDULE F SUBTOTAL						No Bid		\$1,100.00

Schedule G: Recaps - Highway Tread				(A) Brannon Tire Stockton, CA		(C) Sierra Nevada Tire & Wheel Placerville, CA		
	Tire Size	Load Range	Bid Required	Qty	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
76	255/70R22.5	H	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$150.00	\$150.00
77	11R22.5	H	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$250.00	\$250.00
78	12R22.5	H	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$250.00	\$250.00
79	10.00R22.5	G		1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$150.00	\$150.00
SCHEDULE G SUBTOTAL						No Bid		\$800.00

80
81
82
83
84
85
86

Schedule H: Recaps - Traction Tread				(A) Brannon Tire Stockton, CA		(C) Sierra Nevada Tire & Wheel Placerville, CA	
Tire Size	Load Range	Bid Required	Qty	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
14.00-20	L	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$200.00	\$200.00
14.00-24	L	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$200.00	\$200.00
16.9-24	D	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$250.00	\$250.00
19.5L-24	E	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$250.00	\$250.00
15.5-25	F	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$300.00	\$300.00
17.5-25	F	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$300.00	\$300.00
18.4-30	D	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$300.00	\$300.00
SCHEDULE H SUBTOTAL					No Bid		\$1,800.00

Schedule I: Recaps - Special Equipment				(A) Brannon Tire Stockton, CA		(C) Sierra Nevada Tire & Wheel Placerville, CA		
	Tire Size	Load Range	Bid Required	Qty	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
87	6.50-10 (Forklift)	E	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$100.00	\$100.00
88	7.50-15NHS (Smooth)	F	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$100.00	\$100.00
89	8.15-15 (Forklift)	F	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$100.00	\$100.00
90	7.50-15NHS (Forklift)	F	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$100.00	\$100.00
100	12-16.5 (Skid Steer Extra Reinforced Side Wall)	F	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$300.00	\$300.00
101	11L16	E	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$100.00	\$100.00
102	12.5/80-18	E	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$200.00	\$200.00
103	7.00-12 (Forklift)	E	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$100.00	\$100.00
SCHEDULE I SUBTOTAL						No Bid		\$1,100.00

Schedule J: Radial Casings				(A) Brannon Tire Stockton, CA		(C) Sierra Nevada Tire & Wheel Placerville, CA		
	Tire Size	Load Range	Bid Required	Qty	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
104	225/70R19.5	F		1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$0.00	\$0.00
105	11R22.5	H		1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$90.00	\$90.00
106	12R22.5	H		1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$90.00	\$90.00
107	10.00-R-22.5	F		1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$60.00	\$60.00
SCHEDULE J SUBTOTAL						No Bid		\$240.00

Schedule K: New Tubes					(A) Brannon Tire Stockton, CA		(C) Sierra Nevada Tire & Wheel Placerville, CA	
	Tire Size	Load Range	Bid Required	Qty	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
108	145/70-6	N/A		1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$4.00	\$4.00
109	4.10/3.50-4	N/A		1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$4.00	\$4.00
110	4.10/3.50-6	N/A		1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$4.00	\$4.00
111	4.80-8	N/A		1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$5.00	\$5.00
112	5.30/4.50-6	N/A		1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$6.00	\$6.00
113	6.50-10	N/A		1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$15.00	\$15.00
114	4.80-/4.00-8	N/A		1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$5.00	\$5.00
115	4.80-12	N/A		1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$8.00	\$8.00
116	7.00-12	N/A		1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$12.00	\$12.00
117	7.00-15	N/A		1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$12.00	\$12.00
118	7.50-15NHS	N/A		1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$15.00	\$15.00
119	8x2.2	N/A		1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$20.00	\$20.00
120	8.15-15	N/A		1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$15.00	\$15.00
121	7.50-16LT	N/A		1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$20.00	\$20.00
122	11L16	N/A		1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$15.00	\$15.00
123	12.5/80-18	N/A		1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$25.00	\$25.00
124	9.50R16.5LT	N/A		1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$15.00	\$15.00
125	8.25-15	N/A		1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$25.00	\$25.00
126	8.25R-15	N/A		1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$25.00	\$25.00
127	14.00-20	N/A	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$65.00	\$65.00
128	14.00-R24	N/A	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$65.00	\$65.00
129	16.9-24	N/A		1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$50.00	\$50.00
130	19.5L-24	N/A		1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$60.00	\$60.00
131	15.5-25	N/A		1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$95.00	\$95.00
132	17.5-25	N/A		1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$95.00	\$95.00
133	18.4-30	N/A		1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$65.00	\$65.00
134	10.00R-22.5	N/A		1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$35.00	\$35.00
135	385/95R24	N/A	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$75.00	\$75.00
SCHEDULE K SUBTOTAL						No Bid		\$855.00

Schedule L: Flat/Spot Repairs (Carry In Services at Vendor shop)				(A) Brannon Tire Stockton, CA		(C) Sierra Nevada Tire & Wheel Placerville, CA		
Tire Size	Type of Service	Bid Required	Qty	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	
136	Passenger and Light Truck sizes up to and including 7.5-16	Flat Repair-Vendor Shop	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$20.00	\$20.00
137	Passenger and Light Truck sizes up to and including 7.5-16	Flat Repair-County Yard	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$120.00	\$120.00
138	Passenger and Light Truck sizes up to and including 7.5-16	Spot Repair Vendor shop	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$0.00	\$0.00
139	STEMS - (7.5-16)		X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$3.00	\$3.00
140	PATCHES - (7.5-16)		X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$0.00	\$0.00
141	Truck sizes 8.25-20 through 12.00-24.5	Flat Repair-Vendor Shop	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$40.00	\$40.00
142	Truck sizes 8.25-20 through 12.00-24.5	Flat Repair-County Yard	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$120.00	\$120.00
143	Truck sizes 8.25-20 through 12.00-24.5	Spot Repair - Vendor shop	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$15.00	\$15.00
144	STEMS - (8.25-20 through 12.00-24.5)		X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$5.00	\$5.00
145	PATCHES - (8.25-20 through 12.00-24.5)		X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$5.00	\$5.00
146	Equipment sizes 14.00-20 through 17.5-25	Flat Repair-Vendor Shop	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$80.00	\$80.00
147	Equipment sizes 14.00-20 through 17.5-25	Flat Repair - County Yard	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$120.00	\$120.00
148	Equipment sizes 14.00-20 through 17.5-25	Spot Repair - Vendor shop	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$20.00	\$20.00
149	O-RINGS - (Equipment 14.00-20 through 17.5-25)		X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$5.00	\$5.00
150	STEMS - (Equipment 14.00-20 through 17.5-25)		X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$5.00	\$5.00
151	PATCHES (Equipment 14.00-20 through 17.5-25)		X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$5.00	\$5.00
152	H D Boot		X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$20.00	\$20.00
153	Tire Foam Fill Material		X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$2.00	\$2.00
154	Tractor Tire Sealant		X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$2.00	\$2.00
SCHEDULE L SUBTOTAL					No Bid			\$587.00

Schedule M: Section Repairs				(A) Brannon Tire Stockton, CA			
	Tire Size		Qty	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
155	10.00-22.5	each	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$30.00	\$30.00
156	11R22.5	each	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$30.00	\$30.00
157	12R22.5	each	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$30.00	\$30.00
158	14.00-20	each	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$60.00	\$60.00
159	14.00-24	each	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$60.00	\$60.00
160	15.5-25	each	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$100.00	\$100.00
161	16.8-24	each	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$100.00	\$100.00
162	17.5-25	each	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$100.00	\$100.00
163	19.5-24	each	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$60.00	\$60.00
SCHEDULE M SUBTOTAL					No Bid		\$570.00

Schedule N1 Dismount/Mount / Balance (Carry In Services at Vendor Shop)				(A) Brannon Tire Stockton, CA		(C) Sierra Nevada Tire & Wheel Placerville, CA	
	Tire Size	Bid Required	Qty	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
164	Light Truck & Small Trailer Tires - Single Piece Rim - Vendor Shop	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$20.00	\$20.00
165	Light Truck & Small Trailer Tires - Single Piece Rim - County Yard	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$120.00	\$120.00
166	Light Truck & Small Trailer Tires - Two Piece Rim - Vendor Shop	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$20.00	\$20.00
167	Light Truck & Small Trailer Tires - Two Piece Rim - County Yard	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$120.00	\$120.00
168	225/70R-19.5 - Single Piece Rim - Vendor Shop	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$25.00	\$25.00
169	225/70R-19.5 - Single Piece Rim - County Yard	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$120.00	\$120.00
170	225/70R-19.5 - Two Piece Rim - Vendor Shop	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$25.00	\$25.00
171	225/70R-19.5 - Two Piece Rim - County Yard	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$120.00	\$120.00
172	11.00-22.5 thru 12.00-24.5 Single Piece Rim - Vendor Shop	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$40.00	\$40.00
173	11.00-22.5 thru 12.00-24.5 Two Piece Rim - County Yard	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$120.00	\$120.00
174	11.00-22.5 thru 12.00-24.5 Two Piece Rim - Vendor Shop	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$40.00	\$40.00
175	11.00-22.5 thru 12.00-24.5 Two Piece Rim - County Yard	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$120.00	\$120.00
176	14.00-20.00 thru 19.5-25 Single Piece Rim - Vendor Shop	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$80.00	\$80.00
177	14.00-22.00 thru 19.5-25 Single Piece Rim - County Yard	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$120.00	\$120.00
178	14.00-22.00 thru 19.5-25 Two Piece Rim - Vendor Shop	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$80.00	\$80.00
179	14.00-22.00 thru 19.5-25 Two Piece Rim - County Yard	X	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$120.00	\$120.00
SCHEDULE N1 SUBTOTAL					No Bid		\$1,290.00

Schedule N2: Balance				(A) Brannon Tire Stockton, CA		(C) Sierra Nevada Tire & Wheel Placerville, CA	
	Rim Size	Unit of Measure	Qty	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
180	Light Truck Small Trailer Tires - Bubble Balance	each	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$10.00	\$10.00
181	Light Truck Small Trailer Tires - Spin Balance	each	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$20.00	\$20.00
182	225/70R-19.5 - Bubble Balance	each	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$10.00	\$10.00
183	225/70R-19.5 - Spin Balance	each	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$20.00	\$20.00
184	11-22.5 thru 12.00-24.5 - Bubble Balance	each	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$10.00	\$10.00
185	11-22.5 thru 12.00-24.5 - Spin Balance	each	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$30.00	\$30.00
186	14.00-20.00 thru 19.5-25 - Bubble Balance	each	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$0.00	\$0.00
185	14.00-20.00 thru 19.5-25 - Spin Balance	each	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$0.00	\$0.00
188	Balance Beads / Sand Material	each	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$5.00	\$5.00
SCHEDULE N2 SUBTOTAL					No Bid		\$105.00

Schedule O1: Labor Install Studs in Snow Tires (Includes studs)				(A) Brannon Tire Stockton, CA		(C) Sierra Nevada Tire & Wheel Placerville, CA	
	Rim Size	Unit of Measure	Qty	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
189	LT245/ up to 19.5	each	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$30.00	\$30.00
190	20" and up	each	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$50.00	\$50.00
SCHEDULE O1 SUBTOTAL					No Bid		\$80.00

Schedule O2: Labor To Drill Non-Pinned Tire For Studding (Includes Studs)				(A) Brannon Tire Stockton, CA		(C) Sierra Nevada Tire & Wheel Placerville, CA	
	Rim Size	Unit of Measure	Qty	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
191	LT245/ up to 19.5	each	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$30.00	\$30.00
192	20" and up	each	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$50.00	\$50.00
SCHEDULE O2 SUBTOTAL					No Bid		\$80.00

Schedule P: Services (Service Call at county Yard and Field Locations)			(A) Brannon Tire Stockton, CA		(C) Sierra Nevada Tire & Wheel Placerville, CA		
	Service	Unit of Measure	Qty	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
193	Dismount, Mount & Repairs (hourly)	per hour	200	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$120.00	\$24,000.00
194	Front End Alignment: Light Truck (per Vehicle)	per vehicle	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$59.95	\$59.95
195	Front End Toe Set Medium to Heavy Duty (per vehicle)	per vehicle	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$59.95	\$59.95
SCHEDULE P SUBTOTAL					No Bid		\$24,119.90

Schedule Q: Disposal Fees:				(A) Brannon Tire Stockton, CA		(C) Sierra Nevada Tire & Wheel Placerville, CA	
	Description	Unit of Measure	Qty	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
196	Light truck (Up to 19.5")	each	10	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$5.00	\$50.00
197	Semi-Truck Tires (20" to 24")	each	40	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$10.00	\$400.00
198	Backhoe (25" and up)	each	10	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$20.00	\$200.00
199	Grader (14.00-24)	each	40	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$20.00	\$800.00
200	Snow-Blower (20" and up)	each	10	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$20.00	\$200.00
SCHEDULE Q SUBTOTAL					No Bid		\$1,650.00

Schedule R: Emergency Service Calls:			(A) Brannon Tire Stockton, CA		(C) Sierra Nevada Tire & Wheel Placerville, CA	
Description	Unit of Measure	Qty	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
201 Emergency Service Call at locations other than County Yard (per hour)	hourly	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$150.00	\$150.00
202 Emergency Service Call at County Yard (per hour)	hourly	1	No Bid	#VALUE!	\$120.00	\$120.00
SCHEDULE R SUBTOTAL				No Bid		\$270.00

SUMMARY - TIRES	(A) Brannon Tire Stockton, CA		(C) Sierra Nevada Tire & Wheel Placerville, CA	
		Totals		Totals
Schedule A: New Tires - Highway Tread		No Bid		\$8,429.96
Schedule B: New Tires - Mud & Snow Tread (Drilled for Studs)		No Bid		\$4,951.18
Schedule C: New Tires - All-Season Tread (Mud and Snow rated)		No Bid		\$450.00
Schedule D: New Tires - Traction Tread		No Bid		\$20,746.48
Schedule E: New Tires - Special Equipment		No Bid		\$1,256.50
Schedule F: Recaps - Mud & Snow Tread (Drilled for Studs)		No Bid		\$1,100.00
Schedule G: Recap - Highway Tread		No Bid		\$800.00
Schedule H: Recaps - Traction Tread		No Bid		\$1,800.00
Schedule I: Recaps - Special Equipment		No Bid		\$1,100.00
Schedule J: Radial Casings		No Bid		\$240.00
Schedule K: New Tubes		No Bid		\$855.00
Schedule S: Discount (Additional Purchases = \$3,000.00)	0%	No Bid	35%	\$1,950.00
SUBTOTAL		No Bid		\$43,679.12
LESS 5% LVP	0%	#VALUE!	5%	(\$2,183.96)
LESS TERMS DISCOUNT	0%	#VALUE!	1%	(\$436.79)
TOTAL - TIRES		No Bid		\$41,058.37

SUMMARY -SERVICES	(A) Brannon Tire Stockton, CA		(C) Sierra Nevada Tire & Wheel Placerville, CA	
		Totals		Totals
Schedule L: Flat/Spot Repairs		No Bid		\$587.00
Schedule M: Section Repairs		No Bid		\$570.00
Schedule N1: Dismount/Mount		No Bid		\$1,290.00
Schedule N2: Balance		No Bid		\$105.00
Schedule O1: Labor to Install Studs in Snow Tires (Includes Studs)		No Bid		\$80.00
Schedule O2: Labor to To Drill Non-Pinned Tire for Studding (includes studs)		No Bid		\$80.00
Schedule P: Services		No Bid		\$24,119.90
Schedule Q: Disposal Fees		No Bid		\$1,650.00
Schedule R: Emergency Service Calls		No Bid		\$270.00
SUBTOTAL		\$0.00		\$28,751.90
LESS 5% LVP	N/A	\$0.00	N/A	\$0.00
LESS TERMS DISCOUNT		\$0.00	1%	(\$287.52)
TOTAL - SERVICES		\$0.00		\$28,464.38
Less Items NOT REQUIRED and NOT BID by all vendors		\$0.00		\$0.00
EVALUATED GRAND TOTAL TIRES & SERVICES		No Bid		\$69,522.75

*Evaluation is exclusive of sales tax

**Bid #14-863-060 Truck Tires & Related Services - West Slope
Evaluation***

Item #	Schedule A: New Tires (Highway Tread)				(A) Brannon Tire Stockton, CA		(C) Sierra Nevada Tire & Wheel Placerville, CA	
	Tire Size	Load Range	Bid Required	Qty	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
1	4.80/4.00-8	A		1	\$16.57	\$16.57	\$12.00	\$12.00
2	4.80/4.00-8	A		1	\$16.57	\$16.57	\$12.00	\$12.00
3	4.80/4.00-8	C		1	\$16.57	\$16.57	\$17.00	\$17.00
4	4.80/4.00-8	C		1	\$16.57	\$16.57	\$20.00	\$20.00
5	P195/75R14	B		1	\$54.45	\$54.45	\$55.00	\$55.00
6	P195/75R14	B		1	\$54.45	\$54.45	\$60.00	\$60.00
7	P205/75R14	B		1	\$48.88	\$48.88	\$55.00	\$55.00
8	P205/75R14	B		1	\$48.88	\$48.88	\$60.00	\$60.00
9	ST205/75R14	C		1	\$99.85	\$99.85	\$71.63	\$71.63
10	ST205/75R14	C		1	\$99.85	\$99.85	\$65.00	\$65.00
11	ST205/75D14	C	X	1	\$75.55	\$75.55	\$50.00	\$50.00
12	ST205/75D14	C		1	\$75.55	\$75.55	\$65.00	\$65.00
13	P205/75R15	B		1	\$75.96	\$75.96	\$60.00	\$60.00
14	P205/75R15	B		1	\$75.96	\$75.96	\$70.00	\$70.00
15	P225/75R15	B	X	1	\$88.83	\$88.83	\$75.00	\$75.00
16	P225/75R15	B		1	\$88.83	\$88.83	\$70.00	\$70.00
17	ST205/75R15	C		1	\$55.55	\$55.55	\$70.00	\$70.00
18	ST205/75R15	C		1	\$55.55	\$55.55	\$76.66	\$76.66
19	ST205/75D15	C		1	\$48.23	\$48.23	\$50.00	\$50.00
20	ST205/75D15	C		1	\$48.23	\$48.23	\$70.00	\$70.00
21	LT215/75R15	C	X	1	\$106.41	\$106.41	\$120.00	\$120.00
22	LT215/75R15	C		1	\$106.41	\$106.41	\$117.98	\$117.98
23	ST225/75R15	D	X	1	\$85.80	\$85.80	\$90.00	\$90.00
24	ST225/75R15	D		1	\$85.80	\$85.80	\$89.41	\$89.41
25	ST225/75D15	D	X	1	\$61.10	\$61.10	\$65.00	\$65.00
26	ST225/75D15	D		1	\$61.10	\$61.10	\$80.00	\$80.00
27	7.00-15LT	D	X	1	\$64.45	\$64.45	\$75.00	\$75.00
28	7.00-15LT	D		1	\$64.45	\$64.45	\$80.00	\$80.00
29	8.25R15TR	J		1	\$183.58	\$183.58	\$320.00	\$320.00
30	8.25R15TR	J		1	\$183.58	\$183.58	\$280.00	\$280.00
31	LT215/85R16	E		1	\$102.52	\$102.52	\$95.00	\$95.00
32	LT215/85R16	E		1	\$102.52	\$102.52	\$110.00	\$110.00
33	LT225/75R16	D	X	1	\$110.53	\$110.53	\$95.00	\$95.00
34	LT225/75R16	D		1	\$110.53	\$110.53	\$95.00	\$95.00
35	LT245/75R16	E	X	1	\$109.11	\$109.11	\$120.00	\$120.00
36	LT245/75R16	E		1	\$109.11	\$109.11	\$130.69	\$130.69
37	LT235/85R16	E	X	1	\$110.53	\$110.53	\$126.19	\$126.19
38	LT235/85R16	E		1	\$110.53	\$110.53	\$125.00	\$125.00
39	LT245/75R16	E	X	1	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A
40	LT245/75R16	E		1	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A
41	LT265/70R17	E	X	1	\$133.18	\$133.18	\$130.00	\$130.00
42	LT265/70R17	E		1	\$133.18	\$133.18	\$135.00	\$135.00
43	225/70R19.5	F	X	1	\$296.46	\$296.46	\$180.00	\$180.00
44	225/70R19.5	F	X	1	\$296.46	\$296.46	\$200.00	\$200.00

45	245/70R19.5	F	X	1	\$291.46	\$291.46	\$190.00	\$190.00
46	245/70R19.5	F		1	\$291.46	\$291.46	\$230.00	\$230.00
47	265/70R19.5	F	X	1	\$388.08	\$388.08	\$250.00	\$250.00
48	265/70R19.5	F		1	\$388.08	\$388.08	\$368.01	\$368.01
49	7.50-16LT	G		1	\$161.11	\$161.11	\$110.00	\$110.00
50	7.50-16LT	G		1	\$161.11	\$161.11	\$150.00	\$150.00
51	7.50-R16LT	G		1	\$250.11	\$250.11	\$140.00	\$140.00
52	7.50-R16LT	G		1	\$250.11	\$250.11	\$175.00	\$175.00
53	425/65R22.5 (Vactor Steer)	L	X	1	\$783.41	\$783.41	\$607.96	\$607.96
54	425/65R22.5 (Vactor Steer)	L		1	\$782.41	\$782.41	\$610.00	\$610.00
55	255/70R22.5	H		1	\$489.18	\$489.18	\$300.00	\$300.00
56	255/70R22.5	H		1	\$489.18	\$489.18	\$250.00	\$250.00
57	11R22.5 (Hercules H-301)	H	X	1	\$307.57	\$307.57	\$350.00	\$350.00
58	11R22.5	H		1	\$307.57	\$307.57	\$350.00	\$350.00
59	11R22.5 (Goodyear G288 MSA)	H	X	1	\$556.88	\$556.88	\$486.56	\$486.56
60	11R22.5	H		1	\$556.88	\$556.88	\$299.73	\$299.73
61	315/80R22.5 (Michelin XZY3 #40200)	L		1	\$766.00	\$766.00	\$1,050.00	\$1,050.00
62	315/80R22.5	L		1	\$766.00	\$766.00	\$450.00	\$450.00
63	315/80R22.5 (Michelin XZU-S2 #77510)	L	X	1	\$843.31	\$843.31	\$748.98	\$748.98
64	315/80R22.5	L		1	\$843.31	\$843.31	\$468.68	\$468.68
65	185R-14	D	X	1	\$88.44	\$88.44	\$90.00	\$90.00
66	185R-14	D		1	\$88.44	\$88.44	\$82.00	\$82.00
67	P235/75R16	B		1	\$104.82	\$104.82	\$109.16	\$109.16
68	P235/75R16	B		1	\$104.82	\$104.82	\$111.53	\$111.53
69	12R22.5 (Continental HSC1)	H	X	1	\$665.55	\$665.55	\$750.00	\$750.00
70	12R22.5	H		1	\$665.55	\$665.55	\$410.07	\$410.07
71	12R22.5 (Goodyear G288 MSA #138864665)	H	X	1	\$590.07	\$590.07	\$559.55	\$559.55
72	12R22.5	H		1	\$590.07	\$590.07	\$360.00	\$360.00
SCHEDULE A SUBTOTAL						\$16,459.20		\$14,000.79

Schedule B: New Tires & Snow Tread, Drilled for Studs				(Mud	(A) Brannon Tire Stockton, CA		(C) Sierra Nevada Tire & Wheel Placerville, CA	
Tire Size	Load Range	Bid Required	Qty		Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
73	P205/75R15	B		1	\$64.40	\$64.40	\$87.83	\$87.83
74	P205/75R15	B		1	\$64.40	\$64.40	\$80.00	\$80.00
75	LT215/75R15	C	X	1	\$106.41	\$106.41	\$80.00	\$80.00
76	LT215/75R15	C		1	\$106.41	\$106.41	\$80.00	\$80.00
77	LT215/85R16	E		1	\$102.52	\$102.52	\$140.00	\$140.00
78	LT215/85R16	E		1	\$102.52	\$102.52	\$110.00	\$110.00
79	LT225/75R16	D		1	\$110.53	\$110.53	\$150.00	\$150.00
80	LT225/75R16	D		1	\$110.53	\$110.53	\$110.00	\$110.00
81	LT235/85R16	E	X	1	\$113.86	\$113.86	\$142.50	\$142.50
82	LT235/85R16	E		1	\$113.86	\$113.86	\$115.00	\$115.00
83	LT245/75R16	E	X	1	\$109.11	\$109.11	\$125.00	\$125.00
84	LT245/75R16	E		1	\$109.11	\$109.11	\$110.00	\$110.00
85	LT265/70R17	E	X	1	\$133.18	\$133.18	\$180.00	\$180.00
86	LT265/70R17	E		1	\$133.18	\$133.18	\$140.00	\$140.00
87	P255/70R16	B		1	\$112.95	\$112.95	\$120.00	\$120.00
88	P255/70R16	B		1	\$112.95	\$112.95	\$125.00	\$125.00
89	225/70R19.5	F	X	1	\$296.46	\$296.46	\$160.00	\$160.00
90	225/70R19.5	F		1	\$296.46	\$296.46	\$283.50	\$283.50
91	245/70R19.5	F	X	1	\$291.46	\$291.46	\$225.00	\$225.00
92	245/70R19.5	F		1	\$291.46	\$291.46	\$235.00	\$235.00
93	255/70R22.5	H	X	1	\$489.18	\$489.18	\$260.00	\$260.00
94	255/70R22.5	H		1	\$489.18	\$489.18	\$361.19	\$361.19
95	11R22.5	H	X	1	\$434.99	\$434.99	\$358.41	\$358.41
96	11R22.5	H		1	\$434.99	\$434.99	\$300.00	\$300.00
97	12R22.5	H	X	1	\$590.07	\$590.07	\$492.88	\$492.88
98	12R22.5	H		1	\$590.07	\$590.07	\$400.00	\$400.00
SCHEDULE B SUBTOTAL						\$5,910.24		\$4,971.31

Schedule C: New Tires/Traction Tread (Do not include dismount, balance or mount)				(A) Brannon Tire Stockton, CA		(C) Sierra Nevada Tire & Wheel Placerville, CA		
	Tire Size	Load Range	Bid Required	Qty	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
99	14.00-20 (Rotary Plow or Blower) Alliance	L	X	1	\$1,476.00	\$1,476.00	\$1,150.00	No Bid
100	14.00-20 (Rotary Plow or Blower)	L		1	\$508.60	\$508.60	\$700.00	\$700.00
101	14.00-24 (Rotary Plow or Blower)	L	X	1	\$937.24	\$937.24	\$850.00	\$850.00
102	14.00-24 (Rotary Plow or Blower)	L		1	\$712.32	\$712.32	\$850.00	\$850.00
103	385/95R24 (Rotary Plow or Blower) Bridgestone VHB E-2	N	X	1	\$2,069.33	\$2,069.33	\$1,446.48	\$1,446.48
104	385/95R24 (Rotary Plow or Blower)	N		1	\$1,635.01	\$1,635.01	\$835.00	\$835.00
105	19.5L-24	E		1	\$422.84	\$422.84	\$675.00	\$675.00
106	15.5-25	F	X	1	\$551.43	\$551.43	\$550.00	\$550.00
107	17.5-25	F	X	1	\$573.36	\$573.36	\$680.00	\$680.00
108	20.5R-25	1 star rating	X	1	\$1,328.82	\$1,328.82	\$1,850.00	\$1,850.00
109	20.5-25	20 ply rating	X	1	\$867.61	\$867.61	\$1,200.00	\$1,200.00
110	18.4-30	D		1	\$559.04	\$559.04	\$715.00	\$715.00
111	14.00-24 (Rotary Plow or Blower)	F	X	1	\$525.00	\$525.00	\$650.00	\$650.00
112	14.00-24 (Motor Graders)	F		1	\$347.52	\$347.52	\$475.00	\$475.00
113	14.00-R24 (Motor Graders)	F	X	1	\$886.28	\$886.28	\$1,650.00	\$1,650.00
114	14.00-R24 (Motor Graders)	F		1	\$886.28	\$886.28	\$984.06	\$984.06
115	14.00-R24 (Motor Graders)	H	X	1	\$886.28	\$886.28	\$800.00	\$800.00
116	14.00-R24 (Motor Graders)	H		1	\$886.28	\$886.28	\$1,000.00	\$1,000.00
117	14.00-24 (Motor Graders E-3 ROCK)	H	X	1	\$736.07	\$736.07	\$850.00	\$850.00
118	14.00-R24 (Motor Graders E-3 ROCK)	H		1	\$1,036.64	\$1,036.64	\$1,100.00	\$1,100.00
119	18.4-26 (Paver ALL WEATHER R-3)	E	X	1	\$1,456.05	\$1,456.05	\$900.00	\$900.00
SCHEDULE C SUBTOTAL						\$19,288.00		\$18,760.54

Schedule D: New Tires/Special Equipment				(A) Brannon Tire Stockton, CA		(C) Sierra Nevada Tire & Wheel Placerville, CA		
	Tire Size	Load Range	Bid Required	Qty	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
120	145/70-6	A		1	\$22.61	\$22.61	\$25.00	\$25.00
121	4.10/3.50-4	A		1	\$11.15	\$11.15	\$11.50	\$11.50
122	4.10/3.50-5	A		1	\$12.43	\$12.43	\$20.00	\$20.00
123	4.10/3.50-6	A		1	\$12.44	\$12.44	\$14.00	\$14.00
124	5.30/4.50-6	C		1	\$33.82	\$33.82	\$35.00	\$35.00
125	6.50-10 (Forklift)	E		1	\$63.48	\$63.48	\$85.00	\$85.00
126	4.80/4.00-8	A		1	\$13.85	\$13.85	\$13.00	\$13.00
127	4.80-12	B		1	\$24.21	\$24.21	\$28.00	\$28.00
128	7.50-15NHS (Smooth)	F	X	1	\$129.18	\$129.18	\$210.00	\$210.00
129	12-16.5 skid steer extra reinforced side wall	F	X	1	\$263.37	\$263.37	\$350.00	\$350.00
130	12-16.5 skid steer extra reinforced side wall	F		1	\$123.81	\$123.81	\$150.00	\$150.00
131	12.5/80-18	E		1	\$215.28	\$215.28	\$315.00	\$315.00
132	11L16	E	X	1	\$116.31	\$116.31	\$145.00	\$145.00
133	7.00-12 (forklift)	E		1	\$95.81	\$95.81	\$115.00	\$115.00
134	8.15-15 (forklift)			1	\$138.17	\$138.17	\$135.00	\$135.00
135	7.50-15NHS (forklift)			1	\$148.04	\$148.04	\$150.00	\$150.00
SCHEDULE D SUBTOTAL						\$1,423.96		\$1,801.50

136
137

Schedule E: Recaps Mud & Snow Tread, Drilled for Studs				(A) Brannon Tire Stockton, CA		(C) Sierra Nevada Tire & Wheel Placerville, CA	
Tire Size	Load Range	Bid Required	Qty	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
225/70R19.5	F	X	1	\$122.92	\$122.92	\$150.00	\$150.00
11R22.5	H	X	1	\$144.82	\$144.82	\$250.00	\$250.00
SCHEDULE E SUBTOTAL					\$267.74		\$400.00

Schedule F: Recap Highway Tread				(A) Brannon Tire Stockton, CA		(C) Sierra Nevada Tire & Wheel Placerville, CA		
	Tire Size	Load Range	Bid Required	Qty	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
138	225/70R22.5	H	X	1	\$124.97	\$124.97	\$180.00	\$180.00
139	11R22.5	H	X	1	\$116.84	\$116.84	\$250.00	\$250.00
140	12R22.5	H	X	1	\$132.70	\$132.70	\$250.00	\$250.00
SCHEDULE F SUBTOTAL						\$374.51		\$680.00

Schedule G: Recaps/Traction Tread				(A) Brannon Tire Stockton, CA		(C) Sierra Nevada Tire & Wheel Placerville, CA		
	Tire Size	Load Range	Bid Required	Qty	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
141	14.00-20	L		1	\$365.00	\$365.00	\$250.00	\$250.00
142	14.00-24	L	X	1	\$425.00	\$425.00	\$250.00	\$250.00
143	16.9-24	D		1	\$395.00	\$395.00	\$250.00	\$250.00
144	19.5L-24	E		1	\$436.00	\$436.00	\$250.00	\$250.00
145	15.5-25	F		1	\$375.00	\$375.00	\$300.00	\$300.00
146	17.5-25	F		1	\$475.00	\$475.00	\$300.00	\$300.00
147	18.4-30	D		1	\$476.00	\$476.00	\$300.00	\$300.00
SCHEDULE G SUBTOTAL						\$2,947.00		\$1,900.00

Schedule H: Recaps/Special Equipment				(A) Brannon Tire Stockton, CA		(C) Sierra Nevada Tire & Wheel Placerville, CA		
	Tire Size	Load Range	Bid Required	Qty	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
148	6.50-10 (Forklift)	E		1	\$88.74	\$88.74	\$100.00	\$100.00
149	7.50-15NHS (Smooth)	F	X	1	\$99.95	\$99.95	\$125.00	\$125.00
150	8.15-15 (Forklift)	F		1	\$129.95	\$129.95	\$125.00	\$125.00
151	7.50-15NHS (Forklift)	F		1	\$119.95	\$119.95	\$125.00	\$125.00
152	12-16.5 Skid Steer Rock Lug Deep	F	X	1	\$172.80	\$172.80	\$300.00	\$300.00
153	11L16	E	X	1	\$107.95	\$107.95	\$125.00	\$125.00
154	12.5/80-18	E		1	\$189.95	\$189.95	\$200.00	\$200.00
155	7.00-12 (forklift)	E		1	\$98.76	\$98.76	\$100.00	\$100.00
SCHEDULE H SUBTOTAL						\$1,008.05		\$1,200.00

156
157

Schedule I: Radial Casings				(A) Brannon Tire Stockton, CA		(C) Sierra Nevada Tire & Wheel Placerville, CA	
Tire Size	Load Range	Bid Required	Qty	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
225/70R19.5	F	X	1	\$10.00	\$10.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
11R22.5	H	X	1	\$85.00	\$85.00	\$90.00	\$90.00
SCHEDULE I SUBTOTAL					\$95.00		\$90.00

Schedule J: New Tubes				(A) Brannon Tire Stockton, CA		(C) Sierra Nevada Tire & Wheel Placerville, CA		
	Tire Size	Load Range	Bid Required	Qty	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
158	145/70-6	N/A		1	\$4.37	\$4.37	4.00	No Bid
159	4.10/3.50-4	N/A		1	\$4.37	\$4.37		4.00
160	4.10/3.50-5	N/A		1	\$4.37	\$4.37		6.00
161	4.10/3.50-6	N/A		1	\$4.37	\$4.37		4.00
162	4.80-8	N/A		1	\$5.77	\$5.77		5.00
163	5.3/4.5-6	N/A		1	\$4.37	\$4.37		6.00
164	6.50-10	N/A		1	\$8.26	\$8.26		15.00
165	4.80-/4.00-8	N/A		1	\$5.77	\$5.77		5.00
166	4.80-12	N/A		1	\$5.05	\$5.05		8.00
167	7.00-12	N/A		1	\$9.57	\$9.57		12.00
168	7.00-15	N/A		1	\$12.98	\$12.98		12.00
169	7.50-15NHS	N/A	X	1	\$12.98	\$12.98		15.00
170	8.15-15	N/A		1	\$12.98	\$12.98		15.00
171	7.50-16LT	N/A	X	1	\$11.08	\$11.08		20.00
172	11L16	N/A		1	\$14.17	\$14.17		15.00
173	12.5/80-18	N/A		1	\$20.22	\$20.22		25.00
174	9.50R16.5LT	N/A		1	\$10.38	\$10.38		15.00
175	8.25R-15	N/A		1	\$12.48	\$12.48		25.00
176	10.00-20	N/A	X	1	\$17.14	\$17.14		20.00
177	14.00-20	N/A		1	\$30.65	\$30.65		65.00
178	14.00-24	N/A	X	1	\$37.41	\$37.41		65.00
179	16.9-24	N/A		1	\$37.00	\$37.00		50.00
180	19.5L-24	N/A		1	\$38.17	\$38.17		60.00
181	15.5-25	N/A		1	\$46.60	\$46.60		95.00
182	17.5-25	N/A		1	\$46.60	\$46.60		95.00
183	18.4-30	N/A		1	\$49.10	\$49.10		75.00
SCHEDULE J SUBTOTAL						\$466.21		\$732.00

Schedule K: Flat/Spot Repairs (Carry In Services at Vendor shop)				(A) Brannon Tire Stockton, CA		(C) Sierra Nevada Tire & Wheel Placerville, CA	
Tire Size	Type of Service	Bid Required	Qty	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
184 Passenger/Lt Truck 7.5-16 (Vendor Shop each)	Flat Repair-Vendor Shop	X	1	\$12.50	\$12.50	\$20.00	\$20.00
185 Passenger/Lt Truck 7.5-16 (Vendor Shop each)	Spot Repair - Vendor shop	X	1	\$12.50	\$12.50	\$0.00	\$0.00
186 Passenger/Lt Truck 7.5-16 Stems		X	1	\$1.50	\$1.50	\$3.00	\$3.00
187 Passenger/Lt Truck 7.5-16 Patches		X	1	\$1.00	\$1.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
188 Truck sizes up to and including 24.5" rims	Flat Repair-Vendor Shop	X	1	\$25.00	\$25.00	\$35.00	\$35.00
189 Truck sizes up to and including 24.5" rims	Spot Repair - Vendor shop	X	1	\$15.00	\$15.00	\$20.00	\$20.00
190 Truck sizes up to and including 24.5" rims STEMS	Flat Repair-Vendor Shop	X	1	\$3.95	\$3.95	\$5.00	\$5.00
191 Truck sizes up to and including 24.5" rims PATCHES	Flat Repair-Vendor Shop	X	1	\$1.50	\$1.50	\$0.00	\$0.00
192 Equipment sizes 14.00-20 through 17.5-25	Flat Repair-Vendor Shop	X	1	\$50.00	\$50.00	\$35.00	\$35.00
193 Equipment sizes 14.00-20 through 17.5-25	Spot Repair - Vendor shop	X	1	\$20.00	\$20.00	\$40.00	\$40.00
194 Equipment 14.00-20 through 17.5-25 O-RINGS		X	1	\$15.00	\$15.00	\$5.00	\$5.00
195 Equipment 14.00-20 through 17.5-25 STEMS		X	1	\$9.95	\$9.95	\$10.00	\$10.00
196 Equipment 14.00-20 through 17.5-25 PATCHES		X	1	\$5.00	\$5.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
197 H D Boot		X	1	\$15.00	\$15.00	\$20.00	\$20.00
198 Foam Fill Material		X	1	\$1.15	\$1.15	\$2.50	\$2.50
SCHEDULE K SUBTOTAL					\$189.05		\$195.50

Schedule L: Section Repairs					(C) Sierra Nevada Tire & Wheel Placerville, CA	
	Tire Size		Qty	Unit Price	Extended Price	
199	14.00-20	each	1	\$25.00	\$25.00	\$25.00
200	14.00-24	each	1	\$25.00	\$25.00	\$25.00
201	16.9-24	each	1	\$25.00	\$25.00	\$25.00
202	19.5-24	each	1	\$25.00	\$25.00	\$25.00
203	15.5-25	each	1	\$25.00	\$25.00	\$25.00
204	17.5-25	each	1	\$25.00	\$25.00	\$25.00
SCHEDULE L SUBTOTAL					\$150.00	\$150.00

Schedule M Dismount/Mount / Balance (Carry In Services at Vendor Shop)				(A) Brannon Tire Stockton, CA		(C) Sierra Nevada Tire & Wheel Placerville, CA	
	Tire Size	Bid Required	Qty	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
205	Up to 19.5" (Single Piece Rim)	X	1	\$12.50	\$12.50	\$20.00	\$20.00
206	Up to 19.5" (Two-Piece Rim)	X	1	\$15.00	\$15.00	\$20.00	\$20.00
207	8.25-20 to 11.00-24.5 (Single Piece Rim)	X	1	\$20.00	\$20.00	\$35.00	\$35.00
208	8.25-20 to 11.00-24.5 (Two-Piece Rim)	X	1	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$35.00	\$35.00
209	14.00-20 to 19.5-25 (Single Piece Rim)	X	1	\$30.00	\$30.00	\$35.00	\$35.00
210	14.00-20 to 19.5-25 (Two-Piece Rim)	X	1	\$35.00	\$35.00	\$35.00	\$35.00
211	Balance Beads 6 oz. Bags (Single Piece Rim)	X	1	\$12.00	\$12.00	\$5.00	\$5.00
212	Balance Beads 6 oz. Bags (Two-Piece Rim)	X	1	\$15.00	\$15.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
213	Wheel Weights (Single Piece Rims)	X	1	\$2.00	\$2.00	\$5.00	\$5.00
214	Wheel Weights (Two-Piece Rims)	X	1	\$2.00	\$2.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
SCHEDULE M SUBTOTAL					\$143.50		\$190.00

Schedule N: Labor Install Studs in Snow Tires (Includes studs)			(A) Brannon Tire Stockton, CA		(C) Sierra Nevada Tire & Wheel Placerville, CA	
Tire Size	Unit of Measure	Qty	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
215 Up to and including 7.50-16	each	1	\$15.00	\$15.00	\$20.00	\$20.00
216 Sizes greater than 7.50-16	each	1	\$25.00	\$25.00	\$40.00	\$40.00
217 Drill for Studs on Non-Pinned Tires (Up to and Including sizes 7.50-16)	each	1	\$15.00	\$15.00	\$40.00	\$40.00
218 Drill for Studs on Non-Pinned Tires (Sizes greater than 7.50-16)	each	1	\$25.00	\$25.00	\$80.00	\$80.00
SCHEDULE N SUBTOTAL				\$80.00		\$180.00

Schedule O: WHEELS AND RIMS (All wheels and rims are to be new steel mfr.)			(A) Brannon Tire Stockton, CA		(C) Sierra Nevada Tire & Wheel Placerville, CA		
	Wheel / Rim Size	Bid Required	Qty	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
219	14" Heavy Duty Trailer		1	\$45.00	\$45.00	\$100.00	\$100.00
220	15" Heavy Duty Trailer		1	\$50.00	\$50.00	\$100.00	\$100.00
221	16" Light Truck	X	1	\$55.00	\$55.00	\$200.00	\$200.00
222	19.5" Medium Duty Truck		1	\$60.00	\$60.00	\$200.00	\$200.00
223	22.5" Heavy duty Truck (Hub Pilot or Budd)	X	1	\$65.00	\$65.00	\$400.00	\$400.00
SCHEDULE O SUBTOTAL					\$275.00		\$1,000.00

Schedule P: Services (Service Call at County Yard and Field Locations)			(A) Brannon Tire Stockton, CA		(C) Sierra Nevada Tire & Wheel Placerville, CA		
Service	Unit of Measure	Qty	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	
224	Dismount, Mount & Repairs (hourly)	per hour	300	\$55.00	\$16,500.00	\$35.00	\$10,500.00
225	Alignment (per vehicle)	per vehicle	1	\$149.00	\$149.00	\$40.00	\$40.00
226	Toe Set (per vehicle)	per vehicle	1	\$50.00	\$50.00	\$40.00	\$40.00
227	Foam Fill Tires (per pound, includes foam)	per lb.	1	\$1.15	\$1.15	\$2.50	\$2.50
228	Cut Off Foam Filled Tires	each	1	\$50.00	\$50.00	\$20.00	\$20.00
229	Tractor Tire Sealant	per lb.	1	\$50.00	\$50.00	\$2.00	\$2.00
230	Disposal Fees: Light truck	each	10	\$2.50	\$25.00	\$5.00	\$50.00
231	Semi-Truck	each	40	\$7.50	\$300.00	\$5.00	\$200.00
232	Backhoe	each	10	\$25.00	\$250.00	\$10.00	\$100.00
233	Grader	each	40	\$25.00	\$1,000.00	\$10.00	\$400.00
234	Snow-blower	each	10	\$25.00	\$250.00	\$10.00	\$100.00
235	Emergency service Call - County yard	per hour	1	\$75.00	\$75.00	\$90.00	\$90.00
236	Emergency service Call - Field locations other than County yard	per hour	1	\$75.00	\$75.00	\$120.00	\$120.00
SCHEDULE P SUBTOTAL				\$18,775.15		\$11,664.50	

SUMMARY - TIRES	(A) Brannon Tire Stockton, CA		(C) Sierra Nevada Tire & Wheel Placerville, CA	
		Totals		Totals
Schedule A: New Tires (Highway Tread)		\$16,459.20		\$14,000.79
Schedule B: New Tires (Mud & Snow Drilled for Studs)		\$5,910.24		4,971.31
Schedule C: New Tires (Traction Tread)		\$19,288.00		\$18,760.54
Schedule D: New Tires/ Special Equipment		\$1,423.96		1,801.50
Schedule E: Recaps Mud and Snow tread, Drilled for Studs		\$267.74		\$400.00
Schedule F: Recaps Highway tread		\$374.51		\$680.00
Schedule G: Recap Traction Tread		\$2,947.00		\$1,900.00
Schedule H: Recaps/Special Equipment		\$1,008.05		\$1,200.00
Schedule I: Radial Casings		\$95.00		\$90.00
Schedule J: New Tubes		\$466.21		\$732.00
Schedule O: Wheels and Rims		\$275.00		1,000.00
Schedule Q: Discount (Additional Purchases = \$3,000.00)	35%	\$1,950.00	35%	\$1,950.00
SUBTOTAL		\$50,464.91		\$47,486.14
LESS 5% LVP	0%	\$0.00	5%	(\$2,374.31)
LESS TERMS DISCOUNT	2%	(\$1,009.30)	1%	(\$474.86)
TOTAL - TIRES		\$49,455.61		\$44,636.97

SUMMARY -SERVICES	(A) Brannon Tire Stockton, CA		(C) Sierra Nevada Tire & Wheel Placerville, CA	
		Totals		Totals
Schedule K: Flat/Spot Repairs (Vendor's Shop)		\$189.05		\$195.50
Schedule L: Section Repairs		\$150.00		\$150.00
Schedule M: Dismount/Mount (Vendor's Shop)		\$143.50		\$190.00
Schedule N: Labor to Install Studs in Snow Tires (Includes Studs)		\$80.00		\$180.00
Schedule P: Services & Disposal Fees		\$18,775.15		\$11,664.50
SUBTOTAL		\$19,337.70		\$12,380.00
LESS 5% LVP	N/A	\$0.00	N/A	\$0.00
LESS TERMS DISCOUNT	2%	(\$386.75)	1%	(\$123.80)
TOTAL - SERVICES		\$18,950.95		\$12,256.20
Less Items NOT REQUIRED and NOT BID by all vendors		\$0.00		\$0.00
EVALUATED GRAND TOTAL TIRES & SERVICES		\$68,406.56		\$57,308.17

*Evaluation is exclusive of sales tax