

**Invitation to Bid #08-288-005
Evaluation**

Drop Sites/Stock Pile Locations	Estimated Tons	Granite Construction Co. Sacramento, Ca		Bing Materials Minden, NV	
		Price Per Ton	Evaluation	Price Per Ton	Evaluation
West Slope					
Pleasant Valley Road at Bucks Bar Road (Guttenberger's)	3,350	\$29.05	\$ 97,317.50	No Bid	
Missouri Flat Road at El Dorado Road (Pit)	290	\$27.50	\$ 7,975.00	No Bid	
Pony Express Trail 1/2 Mile East of Sly Park Road (Bullion Bend)	1,800	\$29.85	\$ 53,730.00	No Bid	
Carson Road at Pony Express Trail	900	\$28.40	\$ 25,560.00	No Bid	
Sand Ridge Road at Buck's Bar Road (Somerset Yard)	1,700	\$31.05	\$ 52,785.00	No Bid	
Sabana Court (Cameron Park)	1,000	\$26.70	\$ 26,700.00	No Bid	
West Slope Evaluation			\$264,067.50	No Bid	
East Slope					
Pioneer Trail at Garbage Dump Road	3,700	\$41.95	\$155,215.00	\$ 18.05	\$66,785.00
East Slope Evaluation			\$155,215.00	\$66,785.00	