
EVALUATION FOR
BID #13-863-061

FLEET TIRES
Bid #13-863-061 FLEET TIRES
**Evaluation**

CATEGORY "A" - Goodyear EVALUATION NOTES
# Size Brand Product # Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
1 P205-65R15 Goodyear-Integrity 402406477 No Bid 74.22$                               78.65$                               
3 P225-60R16 Goodyear-Eagle RSA 732354500 No Bid 90.40$                               233.63$                             
5 P185/70R14 Goodyear-Integrity 402102477 No Bid 53.73$                               65.66$                               
7 P235/55R17 Goodyear-Eagle RSA 732200500 No Bid 107.99$                             319.74$                             
9 P245/55R18 Goodyear-Eagle RSA 732026500 No Bid 125.44$                             291.16$                             

-$                                   451.78$                             988.84$                             
-$                                   (22.59)$                              (49.44)$                              
-$                                   -$                                   -$                                   

No Bid 429.19$                             939.40$                             
20% Off Retail 35% Off Retail 20% Off Retail

Less Terms Discount

Sierra Nevada Tire & 
Wheel                                   

Placerville, CA 

Evaluation Total

US Tire Sales & Serivce            
Sacramento, CA

Less 5% LVP
Evaluatuion Sub-Total

Big O Tires               
Placerville, CA 
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Bid #13-863-061 FLEET TIRES
**Evaluation**

CATEGORY "B" - Firestone/Bridestone  EVALUATION NOTES
# Size Brand Product # Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost

11 P195/75R14 Firestone-FR380 098000 45.71$                               99.00$                               66.33$                                
13 P185/65R15 Firestone-FR710 085842 69.05$                               84.62$                               82.93$                               
15 P215/70R15 Firestone-FS FR710 047167 -$                                   -$                                   -$                                   Dest. LE #030439 Discontinued
17 P215/75R15 Firestone-Dest. LE2 140310 84.71$                               132.00$                             110.99$                             
19 P235/75R15 Firestone-Dest. LE 097623 100.91$                             125.00$                             111.54$                             
21 LT235/75R15 Firestone-Trans Force 189650 103.13$                             146.28$                             157.27$                             
23 P215/70R16 Firestone-FS Dest. LE2 097725 -$                                   -$                                   -$                                   Est. LE #083224 Discontinued
25 LT225/75R16 Firestone-Trans Force 189752 90.80$                               155.64$                             174.62$                             
27 P235/70R16 Firestone-Dest. LE2 097759 103.34$                             140.00$                             136.48$                             
29 P235/75R16 Firestone-Dest. AT 027379 143.63$                             150.00$                             139.09$                              
31 LT235/85R16 Firestone-Trans Force 189633 119.96$                             190.00$                             162.77$                             
33 LT245/75R16 Firestone-Trans Force 189582 115.94$                             167.58$                             175.54$                             
35 P255/70R16 Firestone-FS Dest. LE2 097844 -$                                   -$                                   -$                                   Dest LE #147033 Discontinued
37 LT265/75R16 Firestone-Trans Force 189599 129.21$                             176.07$                             184.43$                             
39 P225/50R17 Firestone-Fire Hawk 138763 144.85$                             169.00$                             143.68$                             
41 P235/75R17 Firestone-Dest. AT 054239 166.77$                             175.00$                             171.73$                             
43 P245/70R17 Firestone-FS Dest. LE2 097827 -$                                   -$                                   -$                                   Dest. LE #087389 Discontinued
45 LT245/75R17 Firestone-Trans Force 205222 124.66$                             201.69$                             212.39$                             
47 LT265/70R17 Firestone-Trans Force 200190 137.39$                             204.55$                             219.92$                             
49 P245/60R18 Firestone-Dest. LE 108248 182.06$                             180.00$                             181.43$                             

1,862.12$                          2,496.43$                          2,431.14$                          
-$                                   (124.82)$                            (121.56)$                            

(37.24)$                              -$                                   -$                                   
1,824.88$                          2,371.61$                          2,309.58$                          

20% Off Retail 35% Off Retail 20% Off Retail
2%/20 Day Terms

US Tire Sales & Serivce            
Sacramento, CA

Sierra Nevada Tire & 
Wheel                                   

Placerville, CA 

Less 5% LVP
Less Terms Discount

Evaluatuion Sub-Total

Evaluation Total

Items labeled as "Discontinued" not evaluated for Category B.

Big O Tires               
Placerville, CA 

13-0464 A 2 of 3
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Bid #13-863-061 FLEET TIRES
**Evaluation**

CATEGORY "C" - Bridestone Tires  
# Size Brand Product # Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost

51 P185/70R14 Bridgestone B381 123455 105.22$                             130.00$                             133.90$                             
53 P225/75R15 Bridgestone Dueler AT 075336 124.59$                             145.00$                             141.40$                             
55 P215/60R16 Bridgestone-Potenza 074792 95.95$                               115.00$                             110.73$                             
57 P245/65R17 Bridgestone Dueler LT 092827 143.57$                             160.00$                             152.47$                             
59 P265/70R17 Bridgestone Dueler AT 086505 169.36$                             200.00$                             195.00$                             

638.69$                             750.00$                             733.50$                             
-$                                   (37.50)$                              (36.68)$                              

(12.77)$                              -$                                   -$                                   
625.92$                             712.50$                             696.83$                             

20% Off Retail 20% Off Retail 20% Off Retail
2%/20 Day Terms

Bid #13-863-061 FLEET TIRES
**Evaluation**

CATEGORY "D" - Labor to Install Tire Studs 
# Size   Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
61 Each 25.00$                               20.00$                               No Bid
62 Each 25.00$                               20.00$                               No Bid
63 Each 25.00$                               20.00$                               No Bid

     

Bid #13-863-061 FLEET TIRES
**Evaluation**

CATEGORY "E" - Mandated Fees & Taxes
 Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost

1.75$                                 1.75$                                 1.75$                                 
3.50$                                 2.00$                                 3.00$                                 
4.50$                                 2.00$                                 3.00$                                 
8.50$                                 5.00$                                 N/A

Evaluatuion Sub-Total
Less 5% LVP
Less Terms Discount
Evaluation Total

US Tire Sales & Serivce            
Sacramento, CA

Sierra Nevada Tire & 
Wheel                                   

Placerville, CA 

US Tire Sales & Serivce            
Sacramento, CA

Sierra Nevada Tire & 
Wheel                                   

Placerville, CA 

 
Tire Fee
Disposal Fee - Passenger Tires
Disposal Fee - Light Truck Tires
Disposal Fee - Tires 19.5" or Above

US Tire Sales & Serivce            
Sacramento, CA

Big O Tires               
Placerville, CA 

All 15" through 16"
All 17" through 18"
All 19" through 20"

Big O Tires               
Placerville, CA 

Big O Tires               
Placerville, CA 

Sierra Nevada Tire & 
Wheel                                   

Placerville, CA 
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