

**EVALUATION OF BID #15-070-022
NEW FLEET VEHICLES**

Summary

| Bid Vehicle #: Awarded Vendor: Location: Delivery: | Description | Bid Price | Prompt Payment Discount | Tax Per Vehicle | Tire Fee Per Vehicle | Total Cost per Unit |
|---|---|-----------------------|-------------------------------|--------------------|----------------------------|------------------------|
| BID VEHICLE "A" Rescinded from Bid | <i>2015 Ford C-Max Energi Sedan, Plug-In Hybrid</i> | Rescinded from Bid | 0.00 | 0.00 | 8.75 | Rescinded from Bid |
| BID VEHICLE "B" Downtown Ford Sales Sacramento, CA | <i>2015 Ford F-150, 4x4, Crew Cab, 4-Door, 6.5' Bed</i> | 29,401.00 | 0.00 | 2,205.08 | 8.75 | 31,614.83 |
| BID VEHICLE "C" Harrold Ford Sacramento, CA | <i>2015 Ford F-350, Turbo- Diesel, 4x4, Super Cab, Long Bed</i> | 34,775.00 | 0.00 | 2,608.13 | 8.75 | 37,391.88 |
| BID VEHICLE "D" Downtown Ford Sales Sacramento, CA | <i>2015 Ford Expedition, SSV Police, 4x4, 4-Door</i> | 29,597.00 | 0.00 | 2,219.78 | 8.75 | 31,825.53 |
| BID VEHICLE "E" Downtown Ford Sales Sacramento, CA | <i>2015 Ford Explorer SUV, 4x4, 4-Door</i> | 26,362.00 | 0.00 | 1,977.15 | 8.75 | 28,347.90 |
| BID VEHICLE "F" Future Ford Lincoln Roseville, CA | <i>2015 Ford Taurus SE Sedan, 4-Door</i> | 21,590.60 | -500.00 | 1,619.30 | 8.75 | 22,718.65 |
| BID VEHICLE "G" Downtown Ford Sales Sacramento, CA | <i>2015 Ford Fusion</i> | 20,514.00 | 0.00 | 1,538.55 | 8.75 | 22,061.30 |
| BID VEHICLE "H" Elk Grove Dodge Elk Grove, CA | <i>2015 Dodge Ram 1500 SLT Pick-Up, 4x4, Crew Cab, 57" Bed</i> | 29,200.00 | 0.00 | 2,190.00 | 8.75 | 31,398.75 |
| BID VEHICLE "I" Downtown Ford Sales Sacramento, CA | <i>2015 Ford Escape SUV, AWD, 4-Door</i> | 22,051.00 | 0.00 | 1,653.83 | 8.75 | 23,713.58 |
| BID VEHICLE "J" Downtown Ford Sales Sacramento, CA | <i>2015 Ford Transit Connect</i> | 21,853.00 | 0.00 | 1,638.98 | 8.75 | 23,500.73 |
| BID VEHICLE "K" Future Ford Lincoln Roseville, CA | <i>2015 Ford F-350 1-Ton Pick-Up, 4x4, Super Cab, 8' Bed, SRW</i> | 27,685.91 | -500.00 | 2,076.44 | 8.75 | 29,271.10 |

**EVALUATION OF BID #15-070-022
NEW FLEET VEHICLES**

Summary

| Bid Vehicle #: Awarded Vendor: Location: Delivery: | Description | Bid Price | Prompt Payment Discount | Tax Per Vehicle | Tire Fee Per Vehicle | Total Cost per Unit |
|---|---|-----------|-------------------------------|--------------------|----------------------------|------------------------|
| BID VEHICLE "L" Future Ford Lincoln Roseville, CA | <i>2015 Ford F-150, 4x4, Regular Cab</i> | 22,857.92 | -500.00 | 1,714.34 | 8.75 | 24,081.01 |
| BID VEHICLE "M" Future Ford Lincoln Roseville, CA | <i>2015 Ford E-350 (E3F)</i> | 30,007.56 | -500.00 | 2,250.57 | 8.75 | 31,766.88 |
| BID VEHICLE "N" Downtown Ford Sales Sacramento, CA | <i>2015 Ford F-150, 4x4, Crew Cab, 6.5' Bed</i> | 28,239.00 | 0.00 | 2,117.93 | 8.75 | 30,365.68 |
| BID VEHICLE "O" Harrold Ford Sacramento, CA | <i>2015 Ford Taurus SE Sedan, AWD, 4-Door</i> | 25,833.00 | 0.00 | 1,937.48 | 8.75 | 27,779.23 |
| BID VEHICLE "P" Winner Chevrolet Elk Grove, CA | <i>2015 Chevrolet Tahoe, SSV Street Appearance, 4x4</i> | 33,815.00 | -500.00 | 2,536.13 | 8.75 | 35,859.88 |

**EVALUATION OF BID #15-070-022
NEW FLEET VEHICLES**

THIS VEHICLE HAS BEEN RESCINDED/REMOVED FROM BID EVALUATION

Bid Vehicle: A: 2015 Ford C-Max Energi Sedan, Plug-In Hybrid, 4-Door
Quantity: TBD

Bid Price

| | |
|---|---|
| Downtow Ford Sales Sacramento, CA | Bid Price: - Terms Disc. - 5% LVP Disc. - |
| 90-150 Days ARO Terms: Net 30 Days | Evaluate - |
| Future Ford Lincoln Roseville, CA | Bid Price: - Terms Disc. - 5% LVP Disc. - |
| 77 Days ARO Terms: Less \$500-/20 days | Evaluate - |
| Harrold Ford Sacramento, CA | Bid Price: - Terms Disc. - 5% LVP Disc. - |
| 60-120 Days ARO Terms: Net 30 Days | Evaluate - |
| Winner Chevrolet Elk Grove, CA | Bid Price: - Terms Disc. - 5% LVP Disc. - |
| 90 Days ARO Terms: Less \$500-/20 days | Evaluate - |
| Elk Grove Dodge Elk Grove, CA | Bid Price: - Terms Disc. - 5% LVP Disc. - |
| 90 Days ARO Terms: Net 30 Days | Evaluate - |

**EVALUATION OF BID #15-070-022
NEW FLEET VEHICLES**

Bid Vehicle: B: 2015 1/2-Ton Pick-Up, 4x4, Crew Cab, 4-Door, 6.5' Bed
Quantity: TBD

Bid Price

| | | | |
|--|---|---|--|
| Downtow Ford Sales Sacramento, CA 90 Days ARO Terms: Net 30 Days | Bid Price: Terms Disc. 5% LVP Disc. Evaluate | 29,401.00 - - 29,401.00 | 2015 Ford F-150 Exceptions: Rear Window Defrost-None |
| Future Ford Lincoln Roseville, CA 78 Days ARO Terms: Less \$500-/20 days | Bid Price: Terms Disc. 5% LVP Disc. Evaluate | 29,942.92 (500.00) - 29,442.92 | 2015 Ford F-150 (WIE) Exceptions: None |
| Harrold Ford Sacramento, CA 90 Days ARO Terms: Net 30 Days | Bid Price: Terms Disc. 5% LVP Disc. Evaluate | 29,697.20 29,697.20 | 2015 Ford F-150 Crew Cab Exceptions: Rear Window Defrost-None |
| Winner Chevrolet Elk Grove, CA 90 Days ARO Terms: Less \$500-/20 days | Bid Price: Terms Disc. 5% LVP Disc. Evaluate | - - | NO BID |
| Elk Grove Dodge Elk Grove, CA 90 Days ARO Terms: Net 30 Days | Bid Price: Terms Disc. 5% LVP Disc. Evaluate | - - | NO BID |

**EVALUATION OF BID #15-070-022
NEW FLEET VEHICLES**

Bid Vehicle: C: 2015 1-Ton Pick-Up, Turbo-Diesel, 4x4, Super Cab, Long Bed
Quantity: TBD

Bid Price

| | | | |
|---|--------------|-----------|---|
| Downtow Ford Sales Sacramento, CA | Bid Price: | 35,424.00 | 2015 Ford F-350 |
| | Terms Disc. | - | Exceptions: Differential-Elec. Locking; |
| | 5% LVP Disc. | - | Rear Window Defroster-Not Available; |
| 90 Days ARO | Evaluate | 35,424.00 | Rear Axle-Elec. Locking. |
| Terms: Net 30 Days | | | |

| | | | |
|---|--------------|-----------|-----------------------|
| Future Ford Lincoln Roseville, CA | Bid Price: | 36,358.89 | 2015 Ford F-350 (X5B) |
| | Terms Disc. | (500.00) | Exceptions: None |
| | 5% LVP Disc. | - | |
| 78 Days ARO | Evaluate | 35,858.89 | |
| Terms: Less \$500-/20 days | | | |

| | | | |
|---------------------------------------|--------------|------------------|---------------------------------------|
| Harrold Ford Sacramento, CA | Bid Price: | 34,775.00 | 2015 Ford F-350 Super Cab |
| | Terms Disc. | | Exceptions: Rear Window Defroster-Not |
| | 5% LVP Disc. | | Standard; Keyless Entry-Not Standard |
| 80 Days ARO | Evaluate | 34,775.00 | |
| Terms: Net 30 Days | | | |

| | | | |
|--|--------------|---|--------|
| Winner Chevrolet Elk Grove, CA | Bid Price: | - | NO BID |
| | Terms Disc. | | |
| | 5% LVP Disc. | | |
| 90 Days ARO | Evaluate | - | |
| Terms: Less \$500-/20 days | | | |

| | | | |
|---|--------------|---|--------|
| Elk Grove Dodge Elk Grove, CA | Bid Price: | - | NO BID |
| | Terms Disc. | | |
| | 5% LVP Disc. | | |
| 90 Days ARO | Evaluate | - | |
| Terms: Net 30 Days | | | |

**EVALUATION OF BID #15-070-022
NEW FLEET VEHICLES**

Bid Vehicle: D: 2015 Ford Expedition SSV Police, 4x4, 4-Door
Quantity: TBD

Bid Price

| | | | |
|---|--------------|------------------|---|
| Downtow Ford Sales Sacramento, CA | Bid Price: | 29,597.00 | Exceptions: None |
| 90 Days ARO | Terms Disc. | - | |
| Terms: Net 30 Days | 5% LVP Disc. | - | |
| | Evaluate | 29,597.00 | |
| Future Ford Lincoln Roseville, CA | Bid Price: | 30,562.59 | (41G) Exceptions: |
| | Terms Disc. | (500.00) | None |
| | 5% LVP Disc. | - | |
| 78 Days ARO | Evaluate | 30,062.59 | |
| Terms: Less \$500-/20 days | | | |
| Harrold Ford Sacramento, CA | Bid Price: | 29,981.00 | Exceptions: Interior Trim Color-Dune/Tan; |
| | Terms Disc. | | Rear Axle HD Limited Slip-Not Available |
| | 5% LVP Disc. | | |
| 80 Days ARO | Evaluate | 29,981.00 | |
| Terms: Net 30 Days | | | |
| Winner Chevrolet Elk Grove, CA | Bid Price: | - | NO BID |
| | Terms Disc. | | |
| | 5% LVP Disc. | | |
| 90 Days ARO | Evaluate | - | |
| Terms: Less \$500-/20 days | | | |
| Elk Grove Dodge Elk Grove, CA | Bid Price: | - | NO BID |
| | Terms Disc. | | |
| | 5% LVP Disc. | | |
| 90 Days ARO | Evaluate | - | |
| Terms: Net 30 Days | | | |

**EVALUATION OF BID #15-070-022
NEW FLEET VEHICLES**

Bid Vehicle: E: 2015 Ford Explorer SUV, 4x4, 4-Door
Quantity: TBD

Bid Price

| | | | |
|---|---|----------------------------|--------------------------------------|
| Downtow Ford Sales Sacramento, CA | Bid Price: Terms Disc. 5% LVP Disc. | 26,362.00 - - | Exceptions: None |
| 90 Days ARO Terms: Net 30 Days | Evaluate | 26,362.00 | |
| Future Ford Lincoln Roseville, CA | Bid Price: Terms Disc. 5% LVP Disc. | 27,263.60 (500.00) - | (K8B) None |
| 78 Days ARO Terms: Less \$500-/20 days | Evaluate | 26,763.60 | Exceptions: |
| Harrold Ford Sacramento, CA | Bid Price: Terms Disc. 5% LVP Disc. | 27,342.00 | Exceptions: Rear Camera-Upgrade Only |
| 90 Days ARO Terms: Net 30 Days | Evaluate | 27,342.00 | |
| Winner Chevrolet Elk Grove, CA | Bid Price: Terms Disc. 5% LVP Disc. | - | NO BID |
| 90 Days ARO Terms: Less \$500-/20 days | Evaluate | - | |
| Elk Grove Dodge Elk Grove, CA | Bid Price: Terms Disc. 5% LVP Disc. | - | NO BID |
| 90 Days ARO Terms: Net 30 Days | Evaluate | - | |

**EVALUATION OF BID #15-070-022
NEW FLEET VEHICLES**

Bid Vehicle: F: 2015 Ford Taurus SE Sedan, 4-Door
Quantity: TBD

Bid Price

| | | | |
|---|---|---------------------|-------------------------------------|
| Downtow Ford Sales Sacramento, CA | Bid Price: Terms Disc. 5% LVP Disc. | 21,603.00 - - | Exceptions: Rear Warning Sensors-No |
| 90 Days ARO Terms: Net 30 Days | Evaluate | 21,603.00 | |

| | | | |
|---|---|----------------------------|---|
| Future Ford Lincoln Roseville, CA | Bid Price: Terms Disc. 5% LVP Disc. | 21,590.60 (500.00) - | (PD2) Exceptions: Spare Tire-Not Full Size |
| 78 Days ARO Terms: Less \$500-/20 days | Evaluate | 21,090.60 | |

| | | | |
|---------------------------------------|---|-------------------|---------------------------------|
| Harrold Ford Sacramento, CA | Bid Price: Terms Disc. 5% LVP Disc. | 22,433.00 | Exceptions: Wheels-18" Aluminum |
| 90 Days ARO Terms: Net 30 Days | Evaluate | 22,433.00 | |

| | | | |
|---|---|-----------|--------|
| Winner Chevrolet Elk Grove, CA | Bid Price: Terms Disc. 5% LVP Disc. | - | NO BID |
| 90 Days ARO Terms: Less \$500-/20 days | Evaluate | - | |

| | | | |
|---|---|-----------|--------|
| Elk Grove Dodge Elk Grove, CA | Bid Price: Terms Disc. 5% LVP Disc. | - | NO BID |
| 90 Days ARO Terms: Net 30 Days | Evaluate | - | |

**EVALUATION OF BID #15-070-022
NEW FLEET VEHICLES**

Bid Vehicle: *G: 2015 Mid-Size Sedan, 4-Door (Ford Fusion or Equivalent)*
Quantity: TBD

Bid Price

| | | | |
|---|---|----------------------------|--|
| Downtow Ford Sales Sacramento, CA | Bid Price: Terms Disc. 5% LVP Disc. | 20,514.00 - - | 2015 Ford Fusion Exceptions: None |
| 90Days ARO Terms: Net 30 Days | Evaluate | 20,514.00 | |
| Future Ford Lincoln Roseville, CA | Bid Price: Terms Disc. 5% LVP Disc. | 24,303.28 (500.00) - | 2015 Ford Fusion (POH) Exceptions: None |
| 78 Days ARO Terms: Less \$500-/20 days | Evaluate | 23,803.28 | |
| Harrold Ford Sacramento, CA | Bid Price: Terms Disc. 5% LVP Disc. | 20,973.00 - | 2015 Ford Fusion SE Exceptions: None |
| 70 Days ARO Terms: Net 30 Days | Evaluate | 20,973.00 | |
| Winner Chevrolet Elk Grove, CA | Bid Price: Terms Disc. 5% LVP Disc. | - - | NO BID |
| 90 Days ARO Terms: Less \$500-/20 days | Evaluate | - | |
| Elk Grove Dodge Elk Grove, CA | Bid Price: Terms Disc. 5% LVP Disc. | - - | NO BID |
| 90 Days ARO Terms: Net 30 Days | Evaluate | - | |

**EVALUATION OF BID #15-070-022
NEW FLEET VEHICLES**

Bid Vehicle: H: 2015 Dodge Ram 1500 SLT Pick-Up, 4x4, Crew Cab, 5'7" Bed
Quantity: TBD

Bid Price

| | | | |
|--|---|------------------|--------|
| Downtown Ford Sales Sacramento, CA 90-150 Days ARO Terms: Net 30 Days | Bid Price: Terms Disc. 5% LVP Disc. Evaluate | - - - - | NO BID |
| Future Ford Lincoln Roseville, CA 77 Days ARO Terms: Less \$500-/20 days | Bid Price: Terms Disc. 5% LVP Disc. Evaluate | - - - - | NO BID |
| Harrold Ford Sacramento, CA 60-120 Days ARO Terms: Net 30 Days | Bid Price: Terms Disc. 5% LVP Disc. Evaluate | - - - - | NO BID |
| Winner Chevrolet Elk Grove, CA 90 Days ARO Terms: Less \$500-/20 days | Bid Price: Terms Disc. 5% LVP Disc. Evaluate | - - - - | NO BID |

| | | |
|--|---|---------------------------------------|
| Elk Grove Dodge Elk Grove, CA 90 Days ARO Terms: Net 30 Days | Bid Price: Terms Disc. 5% LVP Disc. Evaluate | 29,200.00 29,200.00 |
|--|---|---------------------------------------|

**EVALUATION OF BID #15-070-022
NEW FLEET VEHICLES**

Bid Vehicle: I: 2015 Ford Escape SUV, AWD, 4-Door
Quantity: TBD

Bid Price

| | | | |
|---|--------------|------------------|---|
| Downtow Ford Sales Sacramento, CA | Bid Price: | 22,051.00 | Exceptions: Engine-16L Eco Boost, 173hp |
| | Terms Disc. | - | |
| | 5% LVP Disc. | - | |
| 90 Days ARO Terms: Net 30 Days | Evaluate | 22,051.00 | |

| | | | |
|---|--------------|-----------|-----------------------------|
| Future Ford Lincoln Roseville, CA | Bid Price: | 22,974.28 | (U9G) Exceptions: |
| | Terms Disc. | (500.00) | Engine-16L Eco Boost, 173hp |
| | 5% LVP Disc. | - | |
| 78 Days ARO Terms: Less \$500-/20 days | Evaluate | 22,474.28 | |

| | | | |
|---------------------------------------|--------------|-----------|--|
| Harrold Ford Sacramento, CA | Bid Price: | 22,766.00 | Exceptions: Air Conditioning-Front=Yes, Back=NA; Reverse Warning Sensor-Not Standard |
| | Terms Disc. | | |
| | 5% LVP Disc. | | |
| 70 Days ARO Terms: Net 30 Days | Evaluate | 22,766.00 | |

| | | | |
|---|--------------|---|--------|
| Winner Chevrolet Elk Grove, CA | Bid Price: | - | NO BID |
| | Terms Disc. | | |
| | 5% LVP Disc. | | |
| 90 Days ARO Terms: Less \$500-/20 days | Evaluate | - | |

| | | | |
|---|--------------|---|--------|
| Elk Grove Dodge Elk Grove, CA | Bid Price: | - | NO BID |
| | Terms Disc. | | |
| | 5% LVP Disc. | | |
| 90 Days ARO Terms: Net 30 Days | Evaluate | - | |

**EVALUATION OF BID #15-070-022
NEW FLEET VEHICLES**

Bid Vehicle: J: 2015 Small Cargo Van (Ford Transit Connect SL or Equivalent)
Quantity: TBD

Bid Price

| | | | |
|---|---|---|---|
| Downtow Ford Sales Sacramento, CA 150 Days ARO Terms: Net 30 Days | Bid Price: Terms Disc. 5% LVP Disc. Evaluate | 21,853.00 - - 21,853.00 | 2015 Ford Transit Connect Exceptions: Cargo Area Floor-Not Sure? |
|---|---|---|---|

| | | | |
|---|---|---|---|
| Future Ford Lincoln Roseville, CA 120 Days ARO Terms: Less \$500-/20 days | Bid Price: Terms Disc. 5% LVP Disc. Evaluate | 22,450.29 (500.00) - 21,950.29 | 2015 Ford Transit Connect (S7E) Exceptions: None |
|---|---|---|---|

| | | | |
|---|---|----------------------------------|---|
| Harrold Ford Sacramento, CA 120 Days ARO Terms: Net 30 Days | Bid Price: Terms Disc. 5% LVP Disc. Evaluate | 22,996.00 - - 22,996.00 | 2015 Ford Transit Connect XL, LWB Exceptions: GVWR-5270, Payload 1700 lbs. |
|---|---|----------------------------------|---|

| | | | |
|---|---|------------------|--------|
| Winner Chevrolet Elk Grove, CA 90 Days ARO Terms: Less \$500-/20 days | Bid Price: Terms Disc. 5% LVP Disc. Evaluate | - - - - | NO BID |
|---|---|------------------|--------|

| | | | |
|--|---|------------------|--------|
| Elk Grove Dodge Elk Grove, CA 90 Days ARO Terms: Net 30 Days | Bid Price: Terms Disc. 5% LVP Disc. Evaluate | - - - - | NO BID |
|--|---|------------------|--------|

Bid Vehicle:

K: 2015 Ford F-350 1-Ton Pick-Up, 4x4, Super Cab, 8' Bed, SRW

Quantity: TBD

Bid Price

| | | | |
|---|--------------|-----------|--|
| Downtow Ford Sales Sacramento, CA | Bid Price: | 27,261.00 | Exceptions: Wheelbase-56" Cab to Axle; Rear Window Defroster-No |
| | Terms Disc. | - | |
| | 5% LVP Disc. | - | |
| 90 Days ARO | Evaluate | 27,261.00 | |
| Terms: Net 30 Days | | | |

| | | | |
|---|--------------|------------------|------------------|
| Future Ford Lincoln Roseville, CA | Bid Price: | 27,685.91 | (X5B) |
| | Terms Disc. | (500.00) | Exceptions: None |
| | 5% LVP Disc. | - | |
| 77 Days ARO | Evaluate | 27,185.91 | |
| Terms: Less \$500-/20 days | | | |

| | | | |
|---------------------------------------|--------------|-----------|--------------------------------------|
| Harrold Ford Sacramento, CA | Bid Price: | 27,549.00 | Exceptions: Rear Window Defroster-No |
| | Terms Disc. | | |
| | 5% LVP Disc. | | |
| 80 Days ARO | Evaluate | 27,549.00 | |
| Terms: Net 30 Days | | | |

| | | | |
|--|--------------|---|--------|
| Winner Chevrolet Elk Grove, CA | Bid Price: | - | NO BID |
| | Terms Disc. | | |
| | 5% LVP Disc. | | |
| 90 Days ARO | Evaluate | - | |
| Terms: Less \$500-/20 days | | | |

| | | | |
|---|--------------|---|--------|
| Elk Grove Dodge Elk Grove, CA | Bid Price: | - | NO BID |
| | Terms Disc. | | |
| | 5% LVP Disc. | | |
| 90 Days ARO | Evaluate | - | |
| Terms: Net 30 Days | | | |

Bid Vehicle: L: 2015 1/2-Ton Pick-Up, 4x4, Regular Cab
Quantity: TBD

Bid Price

| | | | | |
|---|--------------|-----------|--|-------------|
| Downtow Ford Sales Sacramento, CA | Bid Price: | 23,352.00 | 2015 Ford F-150 | Exceptions: |
| | Terms Disc. | - | Engine-5.0L; Rear Window Defroster-No. | |
| | 5% LVP Disc. | - | | |
| 90-150 Days ARO | Evaluate | 23,352.00 | | |
| Terms: Net 30 Days | | | | |

| | | | | |
|---|--------------|------------------|-----------------------|-------------|
| Future Ford Lincoln Roseville, CA | Bid Price: | 22,857.92 | 2015 Ford F-150 (FIE) | Exceptions: |
| | Terms Disc. | (500.00) | Exceptions: None | |
| | 5% LVP Disc. | - | | |
| 78 Days ARO | Evaluate | 22,357.92 | | |
| Terms: Less \$500-/20 days | | | | |

| | | | | |
|---------------------------------------|--------------|-----------|-----------------------------|---------------------------------------|
| Harrold Ford Sacramento, CA | Bid Price: | 23,622.00 | 2015 Ford F-150 Regular Cab | Exceptions: Rear Window Defroster-Not |
| | Terms Disc. | | Standard | |
| | 5% LVP Disc. | | | |
| ? Days ARO | Evaluate | 23,622.00 | | |
| Terms: Net 30 Days | | | | |

| | | | |
|--|--------------|---|--------|
| Winner Chevrolet Elk Grove, CA | Bid Price: | - | NO BID |
| | Terms Disc. | | |
| | 5% LVP Disc. | | |
| 90 Days ARO | Evaluate | - | |
| Terms: Less \$500-/20 days | | | |

| | | | |
|---|--------------|---|--------|
| Elk Grove Dodge Elk Grove, CA | Bid Price: | - | NO BID |
| | Terms Disc. | | |
| | 5% LVP Disc. | | |
| 90 Days ARO | Evaluate | - | |
| Terms: Net 30 Days | | | |

Bid Vehicle:

M: 2015 1-Ton Chassis -Cab or Cutaway Cab & Chassis, 2WD, 14' Cargo Box
Quantity: TBD

Bid Price

Downtow Ford Sales

Sacramento, CA

Bid Price: - NO BID
Terms Disc. -
5% LVP Disc. -
Evaluate -

90-150 Days ARO

Terms: Net 30 Days

Future Ford Lincoln

Roseville, CA

Bid Price: 30,007.56 2015 Ford E-350 (E3F)
Terms Disc. (500.00) Exceptions: ?
5% LVP Disc. -
Evaluate **29,507.56**

85 Days ARO

Terms: Less \$500-/20 days

Harrold Ford

Sacramento, CA

Bid Price: - NO BID
Terms Disc. -
5% LVP Disc. -
Evaluate -

60-120 Dats ARO

Terms: Net 30 Days

Winner Chevrolet

Elk Grove, CA

Bid Price: - NO BID
Terms Disc. -
5% LVP Disc. -
Evaluate -

90 Days ARO

Terms: Less \$500-/20 days

Elk Grove Dodge

Elk Grove, CA

Bid Price: - NO BID
Terms Disc. -
5% LVP Disc. -
Evaluate -

90 Days ARO

Terms: Net 30 Days

Bid Vehicle:

N: 2015 1/2-Ton Pick-Up, 4x4, Full Size Crew Cab, 6.5' Bed

Quantity: TBD

Bid Price

| | | | |
|--|---|---|--|
| Downtow Ford Sales Sacramento, CA 90 Days ARO Terms: Net 30 Days | Bid Price: Terms Disc. 5% LVP Disc. Evaluate | 28,239.00 - - 28,239.00 | 2015 Ford F-150 Crew Cab Exceptions: None |
|--|---|---|--|

Future Ford Lincoln
Roseville, CA
78 Days ARO
Terms: Less \$500-/20 days

Bid Price: 28,741.92
Terms Disc. (500.00)
5% LVP Disc. -
Evaluate 28,241.92

2015 Ford F-150 (WIE)
Exceptions: None

Harrold Ford
Sacramento, CA
90 Days ARO
Terms: Net 30 Days

Bid Price: 28,794.00
Terms Disc.
5% LVP Disc.
Evaluate 28,794.00

2015 Ford F-150 Crew Cab
Exceptions: None

Winner Chevrolet
Elk Grove, CA
90 Days ARO
Terms: Less \$500-/20 days

Bid Price: -
Terms Disc.
5% LVP Disc.
Evaluate -

NO BID

Elk Grove Dodge
Elk Grove, CA
90 Days ARO
Terms: Net 30 Days

Bid Price: -
Terms Disc.
5% LVP Disc.
Evaluate -

NO BID

Bid Vehicle: O: 2015 Ford Taurus SE Sedan, AWD, 4-Door
Quantity: TBD

Bid Price

| | | | |
|---|---|----------------------------|--|
| Downtow Ford Sales Sacramento, CA | Bid Price: Terms Disc. 5% LVP Disc. | 25,833.00 - - | 2015 Taurus SEL, AWD Exceptions: None |
| 90 Days ARO Terms: Net 30 Days | Evaluate | 25,833.00 | |
| Future Ford Lincoln Roseville, CA | Bid Price: Terms Disc. 5% LVP Disc. | 26,938.60 (500.00) - | (P2H) None Exceptions: |
| 78 Days ARO Terms: Less \$500-/20 days | Evaluate | 26,438.60 | |
| Harrold Ford Sacramento, CA | Bid Price: Terms Disc. 5% LVP Disc. | 25,833.00 | Exceptions: Wheels-18" Aluminum Winner by Coin Flip |
| 70 Days ARO Terms: Net 30 Days | Evaluate | 25,833.00 | |
| Winner Chevrolet Elk Grove, CA | Bid Price: Terms Disc. 5% LVP Disc. | - | NO BID |
| 90 Days ARO Terms: Less \$500-/20 days | Evaluate | - | |
| Elk Grove Dodge Elk Grove, CA | Bid Price: Terms Disc. 5% LVP Disc. | - | NO BID |
| 90 Days ARO Terms: Net 30 Days | Evaluate | - | |

Bid Vehicle:

P: 2015 Chevrolet Tahoe, SSV Street Appearance, 4x4
Quantity: TBD

Bid Price

Downtow Ford Sales
Sacramento, CA
Bid Price: - NO BID
Terms Disc. -
5% LVP Disc. -
90-150 Days ARO Evaluate -
Terms: Net 30 Days

Future Ford Lincoln
Roseville, CA
Bid Price: - NO BID
Terms Disc. -
5% LVP Disc. -
77 Days ARO Evaluate -
Terms: Less \$500-/20 days

Harrold Ford
Sacramento, CA
Bid Price: - NO BID
Terms Disc. -
5% LVP Disc. -
60-120 Days ARO Evaluate -
Terms: Net 30 Days

| | |
|---|--|
| Winner Chevrolet Elk Grove, CA Bid Price: 33,815.00 Terms Disc. (500.00) 5% LVP Disc. 90 Days ARO Evaluate 33,315.00 Terms: Less \$500-/20 days | Exceptions: Wheels-18" Aluminum; Keyless Entry/Driver Door Keypad-Remote Keyless Entry |
|---|--|

Elk Grove Dodge
Elk Grove, CA
Bid Price: - NO BID
Terms Disc. -
5% LVP Disc. -
90 Days ARO Evaluate -
Terms: Net 30 Days