
Description Est.  Annual 
Usage

Unit Cost Extended 
Cost

Unit Cost Extended 
Cost

Unit Cost Extended 
Cost

Unit Cost Extended 
Cost

Unit Cost Extended Cost

Category I - -$            -$            -$            -$            -$               
Motorola XTS 1500 # Portable Radio 180 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE! 812.92$     146,325.60$   

#VALUE! #VALUE! #VALUE! #VALUE! 146,325.60$    
Discount Discount Discount Discount Discount

#VALUE! #VALUE! #VALUE! #VALUE! 0% $0.00

N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

Description Est.  Annual 
Usage

Unit Cost Extended 
Cost

Unit Cost Extended 
Cost

Unit Cost Extended 
Cost

Unit Cost Extended 
Cost

Unit Cost Extended Cost

Category II - -$            -$            -$            -$            -$               
Motorola NiMh Batteries 340 58.00$       19,720.00$  69.00$       23,460.00$  54.00$       18,360.00$   71.09$       24,170.60$  63.84$       21,705.60$     

19,720.00$   23,460.00$   18,360.00$   24,170.60$   21,705.60$      
Discount Discount Discount Discount Discount

0% $0.00 0% $0.00 0% $0.00 0% $0.00 0% $0.00

N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

Description Est.  Annual 
Usage

Unit Cost Extended 
Cost

Unit Cost Extended 
Cost

Unit Cost Extended 
Cost

Unit Cost Extended 
Cost

Unit Cost Extended Cost

Category III- -$            -$            -$            -$            -$               
Motorola Speakers / Mics 170 70.95$       12,061.50$  72.00$       12,240.00$  65.00$       11,050.00$   74.47$       12,659.90$  71.40$       12,138.00$     

12,061.50$   12,240.00$   11,050.00$   12,659.90$   12,138.00$      
Discount Discount Discount Discount Discount

0% $0.00 0% $0.00 0% $0.00 0% $0.00 0% $0.00

N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

(A) Day Wireless Systems 
Benicia, CA

(E) Pipo Communications 
Pollock Pines, CA

(F) Sandy's 
Communications         
Mission hills, CA

(G) Day Wireless         
Benicia, CA

(I) Delta Wireless, Inc.    
Sacramento, CA

(I) Delta Wireless, Inc.    
Sacramento, CA

Sub-Total

Less: Prompt Payment Discount

Less: Local Vendor Preference

EVALUATION TOTAL 19,720.00$                        23,460.00$                        18,360.00$                        24,170.60$                        21,705.60$                            

EVALUATION OF BID #12-725-045 - Motorola 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

(A) Day Wireless Systems 
Benicia, CA

(E) Pipo Communications 
Pollock Pines, CA

(F) Sandy's 
Communications         
Mission hills, CA

(G) Day Wireless         
Benicia, CA

EVALUATION TOTAL 146,325.60$                          

Sub-Total

Less: Prompt Payment Discount

Less: Local Vendor Preference

(A) Day Wireless Systems 
Benicia, CA

(E) Pipo Communications 
Pollock Pines, CA

(F) Sandy's 
Communications         
Mission hills, CA

(G) Day Wireless         
Benicia, CA

(I) Delta Wireless, Inc.    
Sacramento, CA

Sub-Total

Less: Prompt Payment Discount

Less: Local Vendor Preference

EVALUATION TOTAL 12,061.50$                        12,240.00$                        11,050.00$                        12,659.90$                        12,138.00$                            
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Description Est.  Annual 
Usage

Unit Cost Extended 
Cost

Unit Cost Extended 
Cost

Unit Cost Extended 
Cost

Unit Cost Extended 
Cost

Unit Cost Extended Cost

Category IV - -$            -$            -$            -$            -$               
Motorola Single Gang Chargers 170 120.00$      20,400.00$  119.00$     20,230.00$  103.00$     17,510.00$   No Bid #VALUE! 120.75$     20,527.50$     

20,400.00$   20,230.00$   17,510.00$   #VALUE! 20,527.50$      
Discount Discount Discount Discount Discount

0% $0.00 0% $0.00 0% $0.00 #VALUE! 0% $0.00

N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

Description Est.  Annual 
Usage

Unit Cost Extended 
Cost

Unit Cost Extended 
Cost

Unit Cost Extended 
Cost

Unit Cost Extended 
Cost

Unit Cost Extended Cost

Category V - -$            -$            -$            -$            -$               
Motorola XTS 2500 Portable Radios 20 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE! 1,829.94$  36,598.80$     

#VALUE! #VALUE! #VALUE! #VALUE! 36,598.80$      
Discount Discount Discount Discount Discount

0% #VALUE! #VALUE! #VALUE! #VALUE! 0% $0.00

N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

Description Est.  Annual 
Usage

Unit Cost Extended 
Cost

Unit Cost Extended 
Cost

Unit Cost Extended 
Cost

Unit Cost Extended 
Cost

Unit Cost Extended Cost

Category VI - -$            -$            -$            -$            -$               
Motorola CDM Mobile Radios 25 495.00$      12,375.00$  489.00$     12,225.00$  500.00$     12,500.00$   493.13$     12,328.25$  530.25$     13,256.25$     

12,375.00$   12,225.00$   12,500.00$   12,328.25$   13,256.25$      
Discount Discount Discount Discount Discount

0% $0.00 0% $0.00 0% $0.00 0% $0.00 0% $0.00

N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

(A) Day Wireless Systems 
Benicia, CA

(E) Pipo Communications 
Pollock Pines, CA

(F) Sandy's 
Communications         
Mission hills, CA

(G) Day Wireless         
Benicia, CA

(I) Delta Wireless, Inc.    
Sacramento, CA

Sub-Total

Less: Prompt Payment Discount

Less: Local Vendor Preference

EVALUATION TOTAL 20,400.00$                        20,230.00$                        17,510.00$                        No Bid 20,527.50$                            

(A) Day Wireless Systems 
Benicia, CA

(E) Pipo Communications 
Pollock Pines, CA

(F) Sandy's 
Communications         
Mission hills, CA

(G) Day Wireless         
Benicia, CA

(I) Delta Wireless, Inc.    
Sacramento, CA

Sub-Total

Less: Prompt Payment Discount

Less: Local Vendor Preference

EVALUATION TOTAL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 36,598.80$                            

(A) Day Wireless Systems 
Benicia, CA

(E) Pipo Communications 
Pollock Pines, CA

(F) Sandy's 
Communications         
Mission hills, CA

(G) Day Wireless         
Benicia, CA

(I) Delta Wireless, Inc.    
Sacramento, CA

Sub-Total

Less: Prompt Payment Discount

Less: Local Vendor Preference

EVALUATION TOTAL 12,375.00$                        12,225.00$                        12,500.00$                        12,328.25$                        13,256.25$                            
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Description Est.  Annual 
Usage

Unit Cost Extended 
Cost

Unit Cost Extended 
Cost

Unit Cost Extended 
Cost

Unit Cost Extended 
Cost

Unit Cost Extended Cost

Category VII - -$            -$            -$            -$            -$               
Motorola PM 400 Mobile Radio 64 246.00$      15,744.00$  334.00$     21,376.00$  255.00$     16,320.00$   269.76$     17,264.64$  288.75$     18,480.00$     

15,744.00$   21,376.00$   16,320.00$   17,264.64$   18,480.00$      
Discount Discount Discount Discount Discount

0% $0.00 0% $0.00 0% $0.00 0% $0.00 0% $0.00

N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

Description Est.  Annual 
Usage

Unit Cost Extended 
Cost

Unit Cost Extended 
Cost

Unit Cost Extended 
Cost

Unit Cost Extended 
Cost

Unit Cost Extended Cost

Category VIII - -$            -$            -$            -$            -$               
Motorola HT-750 Portable Radio 20 492.00$      9,840.00$    589.00$     11,780.00$  560.00$     11,200.00$   543.28$     10,865.60$  595.61$     11,912.20$     

9,840.00$     11,780.00$   11,200.00$   10,865.60$   11,912.20$      
Discount Discount Discount Discount Discount

0% $0.00 0% $0.00 0% $0.00 0% $0.00 0% $0.00

N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

(A) Day Wireless Systems 
Benicia, CA

(E) Pipo Communications 
Pollock Pines, CA

(F) Sandy's 
Communications         
Mission hills, CA

(G) Day Wireless         
Benicia, CA

(I) Delta Wireless, Inc.    
Sacramento, CA

Sub-Total

Less: Prompt Payment Discount

Less: Local Vendor Preference

EVALUATION TOTAL 15,744.00$                        21,376.00$                        16,320.00$                        17,264.64$                        18,480.00$                            

(A) Day Wireless Systems 
Benicia, CA

(E) Pipo Communications 
Pollock Pines, CA

(F) Sandy's 
Communications         
Mission hills, CA

(G) Day Wireless         
Benicia, CA

(I) Delta Wireless, Inc.    
Sacramento, CA

11,200.00$                        10,865.60$                        11,912.20$                            

Sub-Total

Less: Prompt Payment Discount

Less: Local Vendor Preference

EVALUATION TOTAL 9,840.00$                          11,780.00$                        
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