#17-725-060 Motorola Hand Held 2-Way Radios

Evaluation *
. . " I i o (G) Responsive Communication L . . 5
(A) Motorola Solutions (B) Motorola Solutions (C) Pipo Communications (D) 49er Communications (E) 49er Communications services. | (H) Command Communications (1) Precision Wireless Service
ervices., Inc. F
Schaumberg, IL Schaumberg, IL Pollock Pines, CA Nevada City, CA Nevada City, CA Aftioch: CA Spring, TX Potter Valley. CA
ntioch,
Qty Description Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price
Category | - Motorola APX 8000 Hand Held Radio Delivery ARO 3 Weeks ARO Delivery ARO 3 Weeks ARO Delivery ARO 25 Days ARO Delivery ARO N/A Delivery ARO N/A Delivery ARO N/A Delivery ARO 30 Days ARO Delivery ARO N/A
Motorola APX 8000 - Model 2.5 Hand Held Radio -
8 Includes: Rapid Charger, and Noise Cacnelling Speaker / $4,833.24 $38,665.92 $5,401.24 $43,209.92 $6,964.49 $55,715.92 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE! $6,985.00 $55,880.00 No Bid H#VALUE!
Mic.
Brand: Motorola Brand: Motorola Brand: Motorola Brand: N/A Brand: N/A Brand: N/A Brand: Motorola Bramj: N/A
Model #: H91TGD9PW6AN Model #: HO1TGDSW6AN Model #: APX 8000, Model 2.5 Model #: N/A Model #: N/A Model #: N/A Model #: APX 8000, Model 2.5 Model #: N/A
Sub-total $38,665.92 $43,209.92 $55,715.92 HVALUE! #VALUE! #VALUE! $55,880.00 #VALUE!
Prompt Payment Discount 0% $0.00 0% $0.00 0% $0.00 0% #VALUE! 0% #VALUE! 0% #VALUE! 0% $0.00 0% HVALUE!
Local Vendor Preference (5%) 0% $0.00 0% $0.00 0% $0.00 0% #VALUE! 0% #VALUE! 0% #VALUE! 0% $0.00 0% #VALUE!
Evaluated Total I $38,665.92 I $43,209.92 I $55,715.92 I #VALUE! I #VALUE! I #VALUE! $55,880.00 l #VALUE!
(A) Motorola Solutions (B) Motorola Solutions (C) Pipo Communications (D) 49er Communications (E) 49er Communications (G) Responsive Communication (H) Command Communications (1) Precision Wireless Service
h berg, IL Sch berg, IL Pollock Pines, CA Nevada City, CA Nevada City, CA Services., Inc. Spring, TX Potter Valley. CA
Qty Description Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price
20 Business Days 20 Business Days
Category Il - Motorola Hand Held Radio VHF P25 Delivery ARO 3 Weeks ARO Delivery ARO 3 Weeks ARO Delivery ARO 25 Days ARO Delivery ARO ARO Delivery ARO ARO Delivery ARO 14 Days ARO Delivery ARO 30 Days ARO Delivery ARO
Motorola Hand Held Radio VHF P25 or Equivalent -
20 E 2 d . g & X i 8 H X 3 i . ,365. ,300.00
Includes: 2 Batteries, 1 Speaker / Mic and a Rapid Charger $1,394.84 $27,896.80 $1,394.84 $27,896.80 $1,365.67 $27,313.40 $1,762.30 $35,246.00 $1,485.25 $29,705.00 $1,281.00 $25,620.00 $699.95 $13,999.00 $1,365.00 $27,300.0
Brand: Motorola Brand: Motorola Brand: Motorola Brand: Harris Brand: Bendix King Brand: Icom Brand: Motorola Brand: Motorola
Model #: H84KDFOPW6AN Model #: H84KDFIPW6AN Model #:APX 1000, Model 1.5 Model #: XG-75P Model #: KNG-P1505T2 Model #: IC-F70105 11 Model #: XTS-5000 Model Il Model #: H84KDDIPWSN
Sub-total $27,896.80 $27,896.80 $27,313.40 $35,246.00 $29,705.00 $25,620.00 $13,999.00 $27,300.00
Prompt Payment Discount 0% $0.00 0% $0.00 0% $0.00 2% ($704.92) 2% ($594.10) 0% $0.00 0% $0.00 0% $0.00
Local Vendor Preference (5%) 0% $0.00 0% $0.00 5% ($1,365.67) 0% $0.00 0% $0.00 0% $0.00 0% $0.00 0% $0.00

Evaluated Total

l $27,896.80

I $27,896.80

I $25,947.73

I $34,541.08

I $29,110.90

| $25,620.00

I $13,999.00

| $27,300.00

* Evaluation is exclusive of sales tax
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