

Bid #13-204-055 Servers  
Evaluation\*

Category I: Dell PowerEdge R720xd Server, or equivalent (SO-VM)			(A) Helm Technical Services El Dorado Hills, CA		(B) Discovery Office Systems Sacramento, CA		(C) DSA Technologies, Inc. Elk Grove, CA		(D) Questivity, Inc Santa Clara, CA		(E) Western Integrated Systems Sacramento, CA		(F) CCT Technologies, Inc. San Jose, CA		(G) EDC Systems Lafayette, CA	
Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension
Dell PowerEdge R720xd or equivalent	1	ea	\$15,501.80	\$15,501.80	\$12,867.00	\$12,867.00	\$11,150.00	\$11,150.00	\$12,207.03	\$12,207.03	\$13,277.00	\$13,277.00	\$11,773.00	\$11,773.00	\$12,452.00	\$12,452.00
Subtotal				\$15,501.80		\$12,867.00		\$11,150.00		\$12,207.03		\$13,277.00		\$11,773.00		\$12,452.00
Less 5% LVP			5%	(\$775.08)	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00
Less Terms Discount			0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00	2%	(\$265.54)	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00
Evaluation				\$14,726.52		\$12,867.00		\$11,150.00		\$12,207.03		\$13,011.46		\$11,773.00		\$12,452.00

Category II: Dell PowerEdge R320 Servers or equivalent (HSA-TL)			(A) Helm Technical Services El Dorado Hills, CA		(B) Discovery Office Systems Sacramento, CA		(C) DSA Technologies, Inc. Elk Grove, CA		(D) Questivity, Inc Santa Clara, CA		(E) Western Integrated Systems Sacramento, CA		(F) CCT Technologies, Inc. San Jose, CA		(G) EDC Systems Lafayette, CA	
Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension
Dell Power Edge R320 Server or equivalent	2	ea	\$3,663.92	\$7,327.84	\$3,409.00	\$6,818.00	\$2,881.68	\$5,763.36	\$3,106.90	\$6,213.80	\$3,387.00	\$6,774.00	\$3,034.00	\$6,068.00	\$3,210.00	\$6,420.00
Subtotal				\$7,327.84		\$6,818.00		\$5,763.36		\$6,213.80		\$6,774.00		\$6,068.00		\$6,420.00
Less 5% LVP			5%	(\$366.39)	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00
Less Terms Discount			0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00	2%	(\$135.48)	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00
Evaluation				\$6,961.45		\$6,818.00		\$5,763.36		\$6,213.80		\$6,638.52		\$6,068.00		\$6,420.00

Category III: Dell PowerEdge M610 Blade Server (IT-TS)			(A) Helm Technical Services El Dorado Hills, CA		(B) Discovery Office Systems Sacramento, CA		(C) DSA Technologies, Inc. Elk Grove, CA		(D) Questivity, Inc Santa Clara, CA		(E) Western Integrated Systems Sacramento, CA		(F) CCT Technologies, Inc. San Jose, CA		(G) EDC Systems Lafayette, CA	
Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension
Dell Power Edge M610 Blade Server	4	ea	\$5,488.80	\$21,955.20	\$5,282.00	\$21,128.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$5,310.00	\$21,240.00	\$4,456.00	\$17,824.00	\$3,775.00	\$15,100.00
Subtotal				\$21,955.20		\$21,128.00		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$21,240.00		\$17,824.00		\$15,100.00
Less 5% LVP			5%	(\$1,097.76)	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00
Less Terms Discount			0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00	2%	(\$424.80)	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00
Evaluation				\$20,857.44		\$21,128.00		No Bid		No Bid		\$20,815.20		\$17,824.00		\$15,100.00

Category IV: Dell PowerEdge M620 Blade Server (IT-TS)			(A) Helm Technical Services El Dorado Hills, CA		(B) Discovery Office Systems Sacramento, CA		(C) DSA Technologies, Inc. Elk Grove, CA		(D) Questivity, Inc Santa Clara, CA		(E) Western Integrated Systems Sacramento, CA		(F) CCT Technologies, Inc. San Jose, CA		(G) EDC Systems Lafayette, CA	
Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension
Dell Power Edge M620 Blade Server	4	ea	\$7,114.80	\$28,458.40	\$6,830.00	\$27,320.00	\$5,806.02	\$23,224.08	\$6,259.71	\$25,038.84	\$6,891.00	\$27,564.00	\$6,037.00	\$24,148.00	\$6,385.00	\$25,540.00
Subtotal				\$28,458.40		\$27,320.00		\$23,224.08		\$25,038.84		\$27,564.00		\$24,148.00		\$25,540.00
Less 5% LVP			5%	(\$1,422.92)	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00
Less Terms Discount			0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00	2%	(\$551.28)	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00
Evaluation				\$27,035.48		\$27,320.00		\$23,224.08		\$25,038.84		\$27,012.72		\$24,148.00		\$25,540.00

Bid #13-204-055 Servers  
Evaluation\*

Category V: Dell MD1200 Rackmount Server (SO-LL)			(A) Helm Technical Services El Dorado Hills, CA		(B) Discovery Office Systems Sacramento, CA		(C) DSA Technologies, Inc. Elk Grove, CA		(D) Questivity, Inc Santa Clara, CA		(E) Western Integrated Systems Sacramento, CA		(F) CCT Technologies, Inc. San Jose, CA		(G) EDC Systems Lafayette, CA	
Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension
Dell MD1200 Rackmount Server (SO-LL)	1	ea	\$10,568.00	\$10,568.00	\$10,086.00	\$10,086.00	\$8,343.75	\$8,343.75	\$8,765.39	\$8,765.39	\$10,218.00	\$10,218.00	\$8,216.00	\$8,216.00	\$9,240.00	\$9,240.00
Subtotal				\$10,568.00		\$10,086.00		\$8,343.75		\$8,765.39		\$10,218.00		\$8,216.00		\$9,240.00
Less 5% LVP			5%	(\$528.40)	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00
Less Terms Discount			0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00	2%	(\$204.36)	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00
Evaluation				\$10,039.60		\$10,086.00		\$8,343.75		\$8,765.39		\$10,013.64		\$8,216.00		\$9,240.00

Category VI: Dell PowerEdge R720 Server (SO-MC)			(A) Helm Technical Services El Dorado Hills, CA		(B) Discovery Office Systems Sacramento, CA		(C) DSA Technologies, Inc. Elk Grove, CA		(D) Questivity, Inc Santa Clara, CA		(E) Western Integrated Systems Sacramento, CA		(F) CCT Technologies, Inc. San Jose, CA		(G) EDC Systems Lafayette, CA	
Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension
Dell Power Edge R720 Server	1	ea	\$17,960.40	\$17,960.40	\$16,979.00	\$16,979.00	\$14,719.72	\$14,719.72	\$16,351.95	\$16,351.95	\$17,357.00	\$17,357.00	\$15,306.00	\$15,306.00	\$16,113.00	\$16,113.00
Subtotal				\$17,960.40		\$16,979.00		\$14,719.72		\$16,351.95		\$17,357.00		\$15,306.00		\$16,113.00
Less 5% LVP			5%	(\$898.02)	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00
Less Terms Discount			0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00	2%	(\$347.14)	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00
Evaluation				\$17,062.38		\$16,979.00		\$14,719.72		\$16,351.95		\$17,009.86		\$15,306.00		\$16,113.00

Category VII: Dell PowerEdge R720 Server (SO-LL)			(A) Helm Technical Services El Dorado Hills, CA		(B) Discovery Office Systems Sacramento, CA		(C) DSA Technologies, Inc. Elk Grove, CA		(D) Questivity, Inc Santa Clara, CA		(E) Western Integrated Systems Sacramento, CA		(F) CCT Technologies, Inc. San Jose, CA		(G) EDC Systems Lafayette, CA	
Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension
Dell PowerEdge R720 Server	1	ea	\$14,062.20	\$14,062.20	\$12,775.00	\$12,775.00	\$10,138.64	\$10,138.64	\$12,317.35	\$12,317.35	\$13,369.00	\$13,369.00	\$11,269.00	\$11,269.00	\$11,298.00	\$11,298.00
Subtotal				\$14,062.20		\$12,775.00		\$10,138.64		\$12,317.35		\$13,369.00		\$11,269.00		\$11,298.00
Less 5% LVP			5%	(\$703.11)	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00
Less Terms Discount			0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00	2%	(\$267.38)	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00
Evaluation				\$13,359.09		\$12,775.00		\$10,138.64		\$12,317.35		\$13,101.62		\$11,269.00		\$11,298.00

Category VIII: Dell PowerEdge R720 Server (SO-NS)			(A) Helm Technical Services El Dorado Hills, CA		(B) Discovery Office Systems Sacramento, CA		(C) DSA Technologies, Inc. Elk Grove, CA		(D) Questivity, Inc Santa Clara, CA		(E) Western Integrated Systems Sacramento, CA		(F) CCT Technologies, Inc. San Jose, CA		(G) EDC Systems Lafayette, CA	
Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension
Dell Power Edge R720 Server	1	ea	\$14,749.22	\$14,749.22	\$14,851.00	\$14,851.00	\$12,467.07	\$12,467.07	\$13,441.53	\$13,441.53	\$14,880.00	\$14,880.00	\$12,322.00	\$12,322.00	\$13,711.00	\$13,711.00
Subtotal				\$14,749.22		\$14,851.00		\$12,467.07		\$13,441.53		\$14,880.00		\$12,322.00		\$13,711.00
Less 5% LVP			5%	(\$737.46)	5%	-\$742.55	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00
Less Terms Discount			0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00	2%	(\$293.60)	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00
Evaluation				\$14,011.76		\$14,108.45		\$12,467.07		\$13,441.53		\$14,386.40		\$12,322.00		\$13,711.00

Bid #13-204-055 Servers  
Evaluation\*

Category IX: Dell PowerVault NX3200 Server (SO-NS)			(A) Helm Technical Services El Dorado Hills, CA		(B) Discovery Office Systems Sacramento, CA		(C) DSA Technologies, Inc. Elk Grove, CA		(D) Questivity, Inc Santa Clara, CA		(E) Western Integrated Systems Sacramento, CA		(F) CCT Technologies, Inc. San Jose, CA		(G) EDC Systems Lafayette, CA	
Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension
Dell PowerVault NX3200 Server	2	ea	\$15,050.60	\$30,101.20	\$13,666.00	\$27,332.00	\$9,799.35	\$19,598.70	\$12,868.47	\$25,736.94	\$13,943.00	\$27,886.00	\$5,858.00	\$11,716.00	\$11,675.00	\$23,350.00
Subtotal				\$30,101.20		\$27,332.00		\$19,598.70		\$25,736.94		\$27,886.00		\$11,716.00		\$23,350.00
Less 5% LVP			5%	(\$1,505.06)	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00
Less Terms Discount			0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00	2%	(\$557.72)	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00
Evaluation				\$28,596.14		\$27,332.00		\$19,598.70		\$25,736.94		\$27,328.28		\$11,716.00		\$23,350.00

Category X: Dell PowerEdge R320 Server (DOT/CP - EMD/TP)			(A) Helm Technical Services El Dorado Hills, CA		(B) Discovery Office Systems Sacramento, CA		(C) DSA Technologies, Inc. Elk Grove, CA		(D) Questivity, Inc Santa Clara, CA		(E) Western Integrated Systems Sacramento, CA		(F) CCT Technologies, Inc. San Jose, CA		(G) EDC Systems Lafayette, CA	
Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension
Dell PowerEdge R320 Server	2	ea	\$4,795.76	\$9,591.52	\$4,630.00	\$9,260.00	\$3,921.60	\$7,843.20	\$4,228.17	\$8,456.34	\$4,489.00	\$8,938.00	\$4,078.00	\$8,156.00	\$4,313.00	\$8,626.00
Subtotal				\$9,591.52		\$9,260.00		\$7,843.20		\$8,456.34		\$8,938.00		\$8,156.00		\$8,626.00
Less 5% LVP			5%	(\$479.58)	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00
Less Terms Discount			0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00	2%	(\$178.76)	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00
Evaluation				\$9,111.94		\$9,260.00		\$7,843.20		\$8,456.34		\$8,759.24		\$8,156.00		\$8,626.00

Category XI: Dell PowerEdge R320 Server (MH/PH- RM)			(A) Helm Technical Services El Dorado Hills, CA		(B) Discovery Office Systems Sacramento, CA		(C) DSA Technologies, Inc. Elk Grove, CA		(D) Questivity, Inc Santa Clara, CA		(E) Western Integrated Systems Sacramento, CA		(F) CCT Technologies, Inc. San Jose, CA		(G) EDC Systems Lafayette, CA	
Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension
Dell PowerEdge R320 Server	1	ea	\$2,826.80	\$2,826.80	\$2,502.00	\$2,502.00	\$2,176.80	\$2,176.80	\$2,273.96	\$2,273.96	\$2,500.00	\$2,500.00	\$1,453.00	\$1,453.00	\$2,320.00	\$2,320.00
Subtotal				\$2,826.80		\$2,502.00		\$2,176.80		\$2,273.96		\$2,500.00		\$1,453.00		\$2,320.00
Less 5% LVP			5%	(\$141.34)	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00
Less Terms Discount			0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00	2%	(\$50.00)	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00
Evaluation				\$2,685.46		\$2,502.00		\$2,176.80		\$2,273.96		\$2,450.00		\$1,453.00		\$2,320.00

Category XII: Dell PowerEdge T110 Server (MH-AC)			(A) Helm Technical Services El Dorado Hills, CA		(B) Discovery Office Systems Sacramento, CA		(C) DSA Technologies, Inc. Elk Grove, CA		(D) Questivity, Inc Santa Clara, CA		(E) Western Integrated Systems Sacramento, CA		(F) CCT Technologies, Inc. San Jose, CA		(G) EDC Systems Lafayette, CA	
Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension
Dell PowerEdge R320 Server	1	ea	\$1,317.36	\$1,317.36	\$1,289.85	\$1,289.85	\$1,077.23	\$1,077.23	\$1,540.28	\$1,540.28	\$1,273.00	\$1,273.00	\$1,485.00	\$1,485.00	\$1,572.00	\$1,572.00
Subtotal				\$1,317.36		\$1,289.85		\$1,077.23		\$1,540.28		\$1,273.00		\$1,485.00		\$1,572.00
Less 5% LVP			5%	(\$65.87)	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00
Less Terms Discount			0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00	2%	(\$25.46)	0%	\$0.00	0%	\$0.00
Evaluation				\$1,251.49		\$1,289.85		\$1,077.23		\$1,540.28		\$1,247.54		\$1,485.00		\$1,572.00

Bid #13-204-055 Servers  
Evaluation\*

Summary Description	(A) Helm Technical Services El Dorado Hills, CA		(B) Discovery Office Systems Sacramento, CA		(C) DSA Technologies, Inc. Elk Grove, CA		(D) Questivity, Inc Santa Clara, CA		(E) Western Integrated Systems Sacramento, CA		(F) CCT Technologies, Inc. San Jose, CA		(G) EDC Systems Lafayette, CA	
	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension
Category I - Dell PowerEdge R720xd or equivalent		\$14,726.52		\$12,667.00		\$11,150.00		\$12,207.03		\$13,011.46		\$11,773.00		\$12,452.00
Category II - Dell PoweEdge R320 Server or equivalent		\$6,961.45		\$6,818.00		\$5,763.36		\$6,213.80		\$6,638.52		\$6,068.00		\$6,420.00
Category III - Dell PowerEdge M610 Blade Server		\$20,857.44		\$21,128.00		No Bid		No Bid		\$20,815.20		\$17,824.00		\$15,106.00
Category IV - Dell PowerEdge M620 Blade Server		\$27,035.48		\$27,320.00		\$23,224.00		\$25,038.84		\$27,012.72		\$24,148.00		\$25,540.00
Category V - Dell MD1200 Rackmount Server		\$10,039.60		\$10,086.00		\$8,343.75		\$8,765.39		\$10,013.64		\$8,216.00		\$9,240.00
Category VI - Dell PowerEdge R720 Server		\$17,062.38		\$16,979.00		\$14,719.72		\$16,351.95		\$17,009.86		\$15,306.00		\$16,113.00
Category VII - Dell PowerEdge R720 Server		\$13,359.09		\$12,775.00		\$10,138.64		\$12,317.35		\$13,101.62		\$11,269.00		\$11,298.00
Category VIII - Dell PowerEdge R720 Server		\$14,011.76		\$14,108.45		\$12,487.07		\$13,441.53		\$14,386.40		\$12,322.00		\$13,711.00
Category IX - Dell PowerVault NX3200 Server		\$28,596.14		\$27,332.00		\$19,598.70		\$25,736.94		\$27,328.28		\$11,716.00		\$23,350.00
Category X - Dell PowerEdge R320 Server		\$9,111.94		\$9,260.00		\$7,843.20		\$8,456.34		\$8,759.24		\$8,156.00		\$8,626.00
Category XI - Dell PowerEdge R320 Server		\$2,685.48		\$2,502.00		\$2,176.80		\$2,273.96		\$2,450.00		\$1,463.00		\$2,320.00
Category XII - Dell PowerEdge T110 Server		\$1,251.49		\$1,289.85		\$1,077.23		\$1,540.28		\$1,247.54		\$1,485.00		\$1,572.00
<b>Total Evaluation</b>		<b>\$165,698.75</b>		<b>\$162,265.30</b>		<b>\$116,502.55</b>		<b>\$132,343.41</b>		<b>\$161,774.48</b>		<b>\$129,736.00</b>		<b>\$145,742.00</b>

\* Evaluation is exclusive of sales tax