Bid Evaluation for Herbicides

#12-675-040 Target Specialty Products
West Sacramento, CA
Item # | Usage Product Bid Product by Vendor Adjusted Unit Price Extended Price
1 3 |Accord XRT Il - 330 Gallon $ 6,698.98 | $ 20,096.94
2 5 |Applaud 70W - 1 Pound 12 Pound Container $ 36.70 | $ 183.50
3 5 |Assail - 13.5 Ounce $ 175.20 | $ 876.00
4 7 |Barricade 65 WG - 10 Pound $ 246.92 [ $ 1,728.44
5 10 [Dimension 2 EW - 2.5 Gallon $ 548.52 | $ 5,485.20
6 4 |Dimension EC - 120 Gallon $ 12,673.20 | $ 50,692.80
7 12 [Direx 4 L - 2.5 Gallon Diuron MD $ 60.70 | $ 728.40
8 86.4 |Drift Gon - 270 Gallon Monterey Stay-Put (12.5 Gallon Container) $ 8223 | % 7,104.67
9 85 |Excel 90 Surfactant - 1 Gallon NO BID $ - $ -
10 48 |Gallery 75 DF - 1 Pound $ 126.00 | $ 6,048.00
11 2 |Garlon 3A - 30 Gallon $ 2,085.00 | $ 4,170.00
12 36 |Garlon 3A - 2.5 Gallon $ 168.00 | $ 6,048.00
13 64 |Garlon Ultra 4 - 2.5 Gallon $ 202.22 | $ 12,942.08
14 22 |Goal 2XL - 2.5 Gallon $ 188.21 | $ 4,140.62
15 10 |Habitat - 2.5 Gallon $ 265.94 [ $ 2,659.40
16 25 |Hasten - 1 Gallon $ 30.56 [ $ 764.00
17 15 [Loresban 4E - 2.5 Gallon Advanced (1 Gallon Container) $ 4556 | $ 683.40
18 6 |[Manage - 1.3 Ounce No California Registration $ - 1% -
19 75 |Marker Blue Dye - 1 Gallon Brand: Blazon Blue Colorant $ 4091 | $ 3,068.25
20 22 |Milestone VM - 2.5 Gallon $ 749.33 | $ 16,485.26
21 2 |Milestone VM Plus - 30 Gallon $ 11240 | $ 224.80
22 40 [Milestone VM Plus - 2.5 Gallon $ 92.70 | $ 3,708.00
23 4 |Rodeo - 30 Gallon Accord Concentrate $ 600.00 | $ 2,400.00
24 12 |Ronstar G - 50 Pound $ 70.88 | $ 850.56
25 8 |Round-Up Pro Concentrate - 265 Gallon $ 3,908.75 | $ 31,270.00
26 3 |Round-Up Pro Concentrate - 30 Gallon $ 42750 | $ 1,282.50
27 35 |Round-Up Quick Pro - 6.8 Pound $ 69.18 [ $ 2,421.30
28 6 |Sedgehammer - 1.6 Ounce 1.33 Ounce Container $ 65.34 [ $ 392.04
29 16 [Surflan AS T&O - 2.5 Gallon $ 120.03 | $ 1,920.48
30 25 |Syl-Tac - 1 Gallon NO BID $ - |3 -
31 4 |Talstar - 1 Quart Up-Star Gold $ 1367 | $ 54.68
32 3 [Transline - 30 Gallon $ 4,638.00 | $ 13,914.00
33 4 |Transline - 5 Gallon 2.5 Gallon Container $ 383.15 | $ 1,532.60
34 16 |Turflon Ester - 2.5 Gallon $ 320.83 [ $ 5,133.28
PERCENTAGE OFF MSRP ($300) 15% $ 255.00
BID SUB-TOTAL $ 209,264.20
LOCAL VENDOR PREFERENCE No $ -
PROMPT PAYMENT DISCOUNT 0% $ -
BID TOTAL Page 1 $ 209,264.20




Bid Evaluation for Herbicides

#12-675-040
Sierra Pacific supply
Rocklin, CA
Iltem # | Usage Product Bid Product by Vendor Adjusted Unit Price Extended Price

1 3 |Accord XRT Il - 330 Gallon NO BID $ - | $ -
2 60 |Applaud 70W - 1 Pound NO BID $ - 1% -
3 5 |Assail - 13.5 Ounce NO BID $ - | % -
4 7 |Barricade 65 WG - 10 Pound $ 22223 [ $ 1,555.61
5 10 |[Dimension 2 EW - 2.5 Gallon $ 521.10 | $ 5,211.00
6 4  |Dimension EC - 120 Gallon NO BID $ - | $ -
7 12 |[Direx 4 L - 2.5 Gallon NO BID $ - | $ -
8 4 |Drift Gon - 270 Gallon NO BID $ - | $ -
9 85 |Excel 90 Surfactant - 1 Gallon NO BID $ - | s -
10 48 |Gallery 75 DF - 1 Pound $ 13231 | $ 6,350.88
11 2 |Garlon 3A - 30 Gallon $ 2,130.00 | $ 4,260.00
12 36 |Garlon 3A - 2.5 Gallon $ 17750 | $ 6,390.00
13 64 |Garlon Ultra 4 - 2.5 Gallon $ 198.75 | $ 12,720.00
14 22 |Goal 2XL - 2.5 Gallon $ 200.12 | $ 4,402.64
15 10 [Habitat - 2.5 Gallon NO BID $ - |3 =
16 25 |Hasten - 1 Gallon NO BID $ - | $ -
17 6 |Loresban 4E - 2.5 Gallon NO BID $ - | $ -
18 6 |[Manage - 1.3 Ounce No California Registration $ - | $ -
19 75 |Marker Blue Dye - 1 Gallon Brand: SPI Max Blue $ 21.65| % 1,623.75
20 22 |Milestone VM - 2.5 Gallon $ 762.50 | $ 16,775.00
21 2 |Milestone VM Plus - 30 Gallon NO BID $ - | $ -
22 40 [Milestone VM Plus - 2.5 Gallon $ 94.70 | $ 3,788.00
23 4 |Rodeo - 30 Gallon NO BID $ - | $ -
24 12 |Ronstar G - 50 Pound $ 67.75 | $ 813.00
25 8 |Round-Up Pro Concentrate - 265 Gallon $ 4,265.00 [ $ 34,120.00
26 3 |[Round-Up Pro Concentrate - 30 Gallon $ 498.00 | $ 1,494.00
27 35 |Round-Up Quick Pro - 6.8 Pound $ 65.00 | $ 2,275.00
28 6 |Sedgehammer - 1.6 Ounce $ 84.50 | $ 507.00
29 16 |[Surflan AS T&O - 2.5 Gallon $ 10450 | $ 1,672.00
30 25 |Syl-Tac - 1 Gallon NO BID $ - |$ =
31 4 |Talstar - 1 Quart NO BID $ - | $ -
32 3 |Transline - 30 Gallon NO BID $ - | $ -
33 2 |Transline - 5 Gallon NO BID $ - |$ -
34 16 |Turflon Ester - 2.5 Gallon $ 305.25 [ $ 4,884.00

PERCENTAGE OFF MSRP ($300) 30% $ 210.00

BID SUB-TOTAL $ 109,051.88

LOCAL VENDOR PREFERENCE No $ -

PROMPT PAYMENT DISCOUNT 0% $ -

BID TOTAL Page 2 $ 109,051.88




Bid Evaluation for Herbicides

Crop Production Services

#12-675-040
Awarded Product in Bold Fresno, CA
Item # | Usage Product Bid Product by Vendor Adjusted Unit Price Extended Price
1 3 |Accord XRT Il - 330 Gallon $ 5,346.00 | $ 16,038.00
2 60 |Applaud 70W - 1 Pound $ 3135 [ $ 1,881.00
3 5 |Assail - 13.5 Ounce $ 179.55 | $ 897.75
4 7 |Barricade 65 WG - 10 Pound $ 24250 | $ 1,697.50
5 10 |Dimension 2 EW - 2.5 Gallon $ 520.50 | $ 5,205.00
6 4 |Dimension EC - 120 Gallon $ 11,388.00 | $ 45,552.00
7 12 [Direx 4L - 2.5 Gallon $ 5275 | $ 633.00
8 4 |Drift Gon - 270 Gallon $ 2,997.00 | $ 11,988.00
9 85 |Excel 90 Surfactant - 1 Gallon $ 1450 [ $ 1,232.50
10 48 |Gallery 75 DF - 1 Pound $ 12150 | $ 5,832.00
11 2 |Garlon 3A - 30 Gallon $ 2,197.50 | $ 4,395.00
12 36 |Garlon 3A - 2.5 Gallon $ 17425 | $ 6,273.00
13 64 |Garlon Ultra 4 - 2.5 Gallon $ 22388 | $ 14,328.32
14 22 |Goal 2XL - 2.5 Gallon $ 196.25 | $ 4,317.50
15 10 [Habitat - 2.5 Gallon $ 296.88 | $ 2,968.80
16 25 |Hasten - 1 Gallon $ 26.50 [ $ 662.50
17 6 |Loresban 4E - 2.5 Gallon $ 102.50 | $ 615.00
18 6 |[Manage - 1.3 Ounce No California Registration $ - 1% -
19 75 |Marker Blue Dye - 1 Gallon Brand: Monteray Mark It Blue $ 2750 | $ 2,062.50
20 22 |Milestone VM - 2.5 Gallon $ 749.32 [ $ 16,485.04
21 2 |Milestone VM Plus - 30 Gallon $ 1,267.50 | $ 2,535.00
22 40 [Milestone VM Plus - 2.5 Gallon $ 98.75 | $ 3,950.00
23 4 |Rodeo - 30 Gallon Aquamaster $ 45750 | $ 1,830.00
24 12 |Ronstar G - 50 Pound $ 7750 | $ 930.00
25 8 |Round-Up Pro Concentrate - 265 Gallon $ 3,378.75 | $ 27,030.00
26 3 |Round-Up Pro Concentrate - 30 Gallon $ 453.00 | $ 1,359.00
27 35 |Round-Up Quick Pro - 6.8 Pound $ 69.75 [ $ 2,441.25
28 6 |Sedgehammer - 1.6 Ounce $ 88.50 [ $ 531.00
29 16 |Surflan AS T&O - 2.5 Gallon $ 121.25 | $ 1,940.00
30 25 [Syl-Tac - 1 Gallon $ 3550 | $ 887.50
31 4 |Talstar - 1 Quart $ 29.25 | $ 117.00
32 3 |Transline - 30 Gallon $ 4,739.00 | $ 14,217.00
33 20 |[Transline - 5 Gallon 1/2 Gallon Container Size $ 76.90 | $ 1,538.00
34 16 |Turflon Ester - 2.5 Gallon $ 316.40 | $ 5,062.40
PERCENTAGE OFF MSRP ($300) 10% $ 270.00
BID SUB-TOTAL $ 207,702.56
LOCAL VENDOR PREFERENCE No $ -
PROMPT PAYMENT DISCOUNT 0% $ -
BID TOTAL Page 3 $ 207,702.56




Bid Evaluation for Herbicides

#12-695-040 Wilbur-Ellis
Rio Linda, CA
Item # | Usage Product Bid Product by Vendor Adjusted Unit Price Extended Price

1 3  [Accord XRT Il - 330 Gallon $ 5,280.00 | $ 15,840.00
2 60 |Applaud 70W - 1 Pound 1 Gallon Container (not Pound) $ 34.00 [ $ 2,040.00
3 5 |Assail - 13.5 Ounce $ 20250 | $ 1,012.50
4 7 |Barricade 65 WG - 10 Pound $ 230.00 | $ 1,610.00
5 10 |Dimension 2 EW - 2.5 Gallon $ 505.00 | $ 5,050.00
6 4 |Dimension EC - 120 Gallon $ 11,280.00 | $ 45,120.00
7 12 |[Direx 4 L - 2.5 Gallon $ 80.00 | $ 960.00
8 2 |Drift Gon - 270 Gallon (Usage 4 Totes) Wilbur-Ellis Crosshair - (Bidder Claims to only need 2 Totes) $ 9,450.00 | $ 18,900.00
9 85 |Excel 90 Surfactant - 1 Gallon R-11 Spreader-Activator $ 21.00 [ $ 1,785.00
10 48 |Gallery 75 DF - 1 Pound $ 126.00 | $ 6,048.00
11 2 |Garlon 3A - 30 Gallon $ 1,980.00 | $ 3,960.00
12 36 |Garlon 3A - 2.5 Gallon $ 17250 | $ 6,210.00
13 64 |Garlon Ultra 4 - 2.5 Gallon $ 21250 | $ 13,600.00
14 22 |Goal 2XL - 2.5 Gallon $ 155.00 | $ 3,410.00
15 10 [Habitat - 2.5 Gallon $ 210.00 | $ 2,100.00
16 25 |Hasten - 1 Gallon $ 26.00 [ $ 650.00
17 6 |Loresban 4E - 2.5 Gallon $ 7250 [ $ 435.00

18 6 |[Manage - 1.3 Ounce No California Registration $ - 1% -
19 75 |Marker Blue Dye - 1 Gallon Brand: Luminate Blue $ 38.00 | $ 2,850.00
20 22 |Milestone VM - 2.5 Gallon $ 749.33 [ $ 16,485.15
21 2 |Milestone VM Plus - 30 Gallon $ 1,080.00 | $ 2,160.00
22 40 [Milestone VM Plus - 2.5 Gallon $ 92.70 [ $ 3,708.00
23 4 |Rodeo - 30 Gallon $ 570.00 | $ 2,280.00
24 12 |Ronstar G - 50 Pound $ 75.00 [ $ 900.00
25 8 |Round-Up Pro Concentrate - 265 Gallon $ 3,869.00 | $ 30,952.00
26 3 |Round-Up Pro Concentrate - 30 Gallon $ 450.00 | $ 1,350.00
27 35 |Round-Up Quick Pro - 6.8 Pound $ 61.20 [ $ 2,142.00
28 6 |Sedgehammer - 1.6 Ounce 1.33 Ounce Container $ 109.00 | $ 654.00
29 16 |Surflan AS T&O - 2.5 Gallon $ 11750 | $ 1,880.00
30 25 |Syl-Tac -1 Gallon $ 56.50 | $ 1,412.50
31 4 |Talstar - 1 Quart $ 29.00 | $ 116.00
32 3 |Transline - 30 Gallon $ 4,920.00 | $ 14,760.00
33 2 |Transline - 5 Gallon $ 820.00 | $ 1,640.00
34 16 |Turflon Ester - 2.5 Gallon $ 31250 | $ 5,000.00
PERCENTAGE OFF MSRP ($300) 0% $ 300.00
BID SUB-TOTAL $ 217,320.15

LOCAL VENDOR PREFERENCE No $ -

PROMPT PAYMENT DISCOUNT 0% $ -
BID TOTAL Page 4 $ 217,320.15




Bid Evaluation for Herbicides

Helena Chemical Company

#12-675-040
Awarded Product in Bold Chico, CA
Item # | Usage Product Bid Product by Vendor Adjusted Unit Price Extended Price

1 3 |Accord XRT Il - 330 Gallon $ 5,940.00 | $ 17,820.00
2 60 |Applaud 70W - 1 Pound $ 33.78 | $ 2,026.80
3 5 |Assail - 13.5 Ounce $ 182.25 | $ 911.25
4 7 |Barricade 65 WG - 10 Pound $ 220.00 | $ 1,540.00
5 10 |Dimension 2 EW - 2.5 Gallon $ 43250 | $ 4,325.00
6 4 |Dimension EC - 120 Gallon $ 12,480.00 | $ 49,920.00
7 12 |[Direx 4 L - 2.5 Gallon $ 65.00 | $ 780.00
8 4  |Drift Gon - 270 Gallon Grounded CA (275 Gallon Tote) $ 4,830.30 | $ 19,321.20
9 85 |Excel 90 Surfactant - 1 Gallon Inlet $ 1475 | $ 1,253.75
10 48 |Gallery 75 DF - 1 Pound $ 109.00 | $ 5,232.00
11 2 |Garlon 3A - 30 Gallon $ 1,839.00 | $ 3,678.00
12 36 [Garlon 3A - 2.5 Gallon $ 153.25 | $ 5,517.00
13 64 |[Garlon Ultra 4 - 2.5 Gallon $ 174.00 | $ 11,136.00
14 22 |Goal 2XL - 2.5 Gallon $ 15450 | $ 3,399.00
15 10 |Habitat - 2.5 Gallon $ 23750 | $ 2,375.00
16 25 |Hasten - 1 Gallon Agri Dex (Helena) $ 17.46 | $ 436.50
17 6 |Loresban 4E - 2.5 Gallon $ 102.50 | $ 615.00

18 6 |[Manage - 1.3 Ounce No California Registration $ - 1% -
19 75 |Marker Blue Dye - 1 Gallon Brand: Helena Spray Induicator $ 28.50 | $ 2,137.50
20 22 [Milestone VM - 2.5 Gallon $ 749.32 | $ 16,485.04
21 2 Milestone VM Plus - 30 Gallon $ 1,002.00 | $ 2,004.00
22 40 [Milestone VM Plus - 2.5 Gallon $ 92.70 | $ 3,708.00
23 4 |Rodeo - 30 Gallon $ 540.00 | $ 2,160.00
24 12 |Ronstar G - 50 Pound $ 70.00 [ $ 840.00
25 8 |Round-Up Pro Concentrate - 265 Gallon $ 3,339.00 | $ 26,712.00
26 3 [Round-Up Pro Concentrate - 30 Gallon $ 378.00 | $ 1,134.00
27 35 |Round-Up Quick Pro - 6.8 Pound $ 61.00 [ $ 2,135.00
28 6 [Sedgehammer - 1.6 Ounce $ 78.00 | $ 468.00
29 16 [Surflan AS T&O - 2.5 Gallon $ 101.25 | $ 1,620.00
30 25 |Syl-Tac -1 Gallon Dyne Amic $ 3825 [ $ 956.25
31 4 |Talstar - 1 Quart $ 25.95 [ $ 103.80
32 3 |Transline - 30 Gallon $ 4,350.00 | $ 13,050.00
33 4 |Transline - 5 Gallon 2.5 Gallon Container $ 362.50 [ $ 1,450.00
34 16 |Turflon Ester - 2.5 Gallon $ 305.00 | $ 4,880.00
PERCENTAGE OFF MSRP ($300) 20% $ 240.00
BID SUB-TOTAL $ 210,370.09

LOCAL VENDOR PREFERENCE No $ -

PROMPT PAYMENT DISCOUNT 0% $ -
BID TOTAL Page 5 $ 210,370.09




