
Bid # 13-760-068 Motor Graders

Total Cost Purchase Method -  Bid Evaluation:

Description Vendor Qty
Payment 
Factor

Annual 
Percentage 

Rate
Purchase 

Price
Extended 

Total

Quarterly 
Payment 
Amount            

Per Grader

Number of 
quartely 

payments 
Per Grader

Net Total Cost 
Purchase Bid 

Amount               
Per Grader

Total Cost 
including 
Financing

Category I - Motor Grader with Traditional Controls

No Bid (B)  Holt of California 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 28 No Bid No Bid

John Deere 872D (A)  Pape Machinery 2 0.040860 3.87% $376,748.80 $753,497.60 $15,393.95 28 $431,030.60 $862,061.20

Category II - Motor Grader with Electronic Controls

Caterpiller 160M2AWD (B)  Holt of California 2 N/A 3.2 $381,318.89 $762,637.78 $15,266.85 28 $427,471.80 $854,943.60

John Deere 872GP (A)  Pape Machinery 2 0.040860 3.87% $392,932.85 $785,865.70 $16,055.19 28 $449,545.32 $899,090.64

$769,681.65 $31,449.14 56   
* Evaluation is exclusive of sales tax

13-0778 A 1 of 1


	Bid Evaluation



