

The County of El Dorado

Chief Administrative Office

Procurement & Contracts Division
Phone (530)621-5830

TO: ALL BIDDERS

RE: BID # 2025-0137

High-Performance Cold Patch Mix - West Slope

The apparent low qualified bidders for the subject bid are:

Category "A": Granite Contraction Company of Sacramento, CA

Category "B": Crafco Inc. of Chandler, AZ. Category "B-1": Crafco Inc. of Chandler, AZ.

A spreadsheet is attached for your review.

This item is scheduled to be heard by the Board of Supervisors on Tuesday, 09/16/2025. Board of Supervisors Policy C-17, Section 3.3.1, Subsection F, contains the procedure for the protest process. Copies are available upon request.

Following Board of Supervisors approval, a purchase contract will be issued for the awarded period.

This notification is posted on the following websites:

https:pbsystem.planetbids.com/portal/48157/portal-home

https://www.edcgov.us/Government/Contracts/Pages/Bid-Results.aspx

All bids are on file in the Procurement & Contracts Office, and are available to review by appointment between 8:00 a.m. – 12:00 p.m. and 1:00 p.m. – 4:00 p.m., Monday through Friday.

For questions, please contact Rick Blake, Sr. Buyer at rick.blake@edcgov.us.

Thank you for your participation in the competitive bid process.

Michele Weimer (Aug 25, 2025 10:30:42 PDT)

Purchasing Agent

330 Fair Lane Placerville, CA 95667

Bid Evaluation #2025-0137 High Performance Cold Patch Mix - West Slope

HAULING EXPENSE CALCULATION: Cost of Driver/Truck Average Speed Rate to Haul Average Truck Capacity

\$50.00/hour 30 miles per hour \$50.00 / 30 mph = \$1.67/mile 12 tons

VENDOR (hauling cost)	Miles 1-Way	X	Round Trip	X	Hauling Rate	-	Mileage Cost per Round Trip	X	Number of Trips (204 tons @ 12 tons / trip)	-	Total Haufing	Product Bid
Bart Richard Woodward Corp. Brook, Indiana 30 Days ARO	0	Х	2	Х	\$1 67		\$0.00	X	17	+	\$0.00	No Bid - Category "A" & "B-1"
Crafco Inc Chandler AZ 2 Days ARO	38	Х	2	Х	\$1 67	=	\$126 92	X	17	+	\$2,157 64	Crafco Plant Address 4280 Pinell St, Sacramento, CA 95838
Granite Construction Co. Sacramento, CA 7 Days ARO	32	Х	2	X	\$1.67	=	\$106.88	Х	17	+	\$1,816 96	Not Stated Plant Address 4105 Bradshaw Rd, Sacramento, CA

VENDOR	Cost per Ton	X	Tons	-	Bid Total -	Terms Discount	=	Product Subtotal Bulk Cold Patch Mix	+	Hauling	-	Evaluated Total
Bart Richard Woodward Corp Brook Indiana	\$0.00	Х	204	=	\$0.00 -	\$0.00	=	\$0.00	+	\$0.00	1=	No Bid
Crafco Inc Chandler, AZ	\$0.00	Х	204	=	\$0.00 -	\$0.00	=	\$0.00	+	\$0.00	=	No Bid
Granite Construction Co Sacramento, CA	\$158 75	Х	204	=	\$32,385.00 -	\$0.00	=	\$32,385 00	+	\$1,816 96	=	\$34,201.96

VENDOR	Cost per Bag	X	Number of Bags	•	Bid Total -	Terms Discount	=	Product total Bagged Cold Patch Mix	Notes
Bart Richard Woodward Corp Brook, Indiana	\$19 50	Х	400	=	\$7,800 00 -	\$0.00	=	\$7,800 00	Seaboard Asphalt , Bond X Green GP-60
Crafco Inc Chandler, AZ	\$14 00	X	480	=	\$6,720 00 -	\$0.00	=	\$6,720.00	50# Bags = 480 Bags
Granite Construction Co Sacramento, CA	\$25 00	Х	480	=	\$12,000 00 -	\$0.00	=:	\$12,000 00	50# Bags = 480 Bags

VENDOR	Cost per Bag	Х	Number of Bags	=	Bid Total -	Terms Discount	=	Product Subtotal Bagged Cold Patch Mix	+	Hauling per Trip	=	Evaluated Total
Bart Richard Woodward Corp. Brook, Indiana	\$0.00	Х	600	255	\$0.00 -	\$0.00	=	\$0.00	+	\$0.00	ē	No Bid
Crafco Inc Chandler, AZ 50# Bags	\$12.40	X	480	=	\$5,952 00 -	\$0.00	=	\$5,952 00	+	\$126 92	=	\$6,078.92
Granite Construction Co Sacramento, CA 50# Bags	\$25 00	Х	480		\$12,000 00 -	\$0.00	Ē	\$12,000 00	+	\$106 88	=	s12,106 88 25-1509 A 2