BiD #24-0074
AMMUNITION - COUNTYWIDE

Category 1: Federal/Speer Ammunition

Dooley Enterprises, Inc.

San Diego Police Equipment Co.

Miwall Corporation

Anaheim, CA San Diego, CA Grass Valley, CA
. - Estimated Rounds per | Est. Annual # < — 4 o <
Bid # Part # Description Annual Usage Case of Cases Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension
1 AE3BK Federal, {American Eagle) .38 Special +P, 130 Grain FM.J 2,000 1,000 2 $0 00 $0.00 342G 90 $859 80 $0 00 3000
2 AE40R1 Federal, {American Eagle) 40 Caliper. 180 Grain FM.J 75,000 1,000 75 $000 s000 $314 22 $23,566 50 $0.00 30.00
3 P40HST1 Federal HST .40 Caliper, 180 Gramn HST 60,000 1,060 60 $0 00 50.00 $489 85 $29,991.00 3000 $0 00
4 AE4SA Federal {American Eagle) .45 ACP, 230 grain FMJ 15,000 1,000 15 30 00 $C.00 $369.71 55,545 65 3000 $0 00
5 P4SHST1 Federal HST .45 ACP Caliper, 230 Grain, +PJHP 25,000 1,000 25 $0 0O $G.00 3555 45 $13,886 25 $0 00 $0.00
6 AE223 Federal {American Eagle} .223 Rem. 55 Grain, FMJBT 150,000 500 300 $0 60 $0 00 26414 $79,242.00 $0 00 $0.00
7 LE132 00 Federal 12 Gauge Ammo, 2-3/4" 00 Buckshot 1,000 250 4 $0.00 $0 00 $214 32 £857.28 $0.00 $0.00
8 LE308Tt2 Federal 308 cal Win. 188 grain Tactical Bonded Tip 10,000 200 50 $0.00 $0.00 $424 81 $21,240.50 $0.00 $0.00
] F-1 30-00 Federal 12 Gauge Classic, 2-3/4" 0C Buckshat, 12 Peliet 4,000 250 16 $0.00 $0 00 $226 75 $3,628.00 $0.00 £0 00
10 PEHST2 Federal 9MM, 147 Grain, Standard Velocity 85000 1,000 85 $0 00 $0.00 $445 80 $37,901 50 $0Q 00 S0 00
1 AEIFP Federal 9MM, 147 grain, FMJ 160,000 1,000 160 $0 00 $0.00 $237 97 $38,075 20 $000 30.00
12 53921 Spear Gold DOT 38 Special +P, 135 Grain GDHP-SB 1,000 1,000 1 30 00 $0 00 $517 36 $517.36 $0.00 $0.00
13 53833 Spear, Lawman 38 Special +P, 135 Grain TMJFN 1,600 1,000 1 $0 00 30 00 $408 72 $408.72 $0.00 %0 00
14 24446 Spear Gold OOT .223 Rem. 55 Grain GDSP 50,000 500 100 $0 00 $0 00 $334 60 $33.480 D0 3000 $0 00
Subtotai $0.00 $289,209 76 S0 00
Less 5% LVP 0% $0.00 0% 3000 0% $000
Less Terms Discount 0% $0.00 0% 30.00 0% $0.00
Evatuation (Does not include Sales Tax) 3000 $289,209.76 $0.00
Net 45 Days
Terms NO BID NO BID
Delivery ARO CATEGORY 1 S0-6Days ARGbut World Evénts CATEGORY 1

ARO could be over 365 days.
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BID #24-0074
AMMUNITION - COUNTYWIDE

Category 2: Winchester Ammunition

Dooley Enterprises, inc.

San Diego Police Equipment Co.

Miwall Corporation

Anaheim, CA San Diego, CA Grass Valley, CA
. o Estimated Rounds per | Est. Annual # _— " e s .

Bid # Part & Description Hnnual Ucage Case of Cases Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension
15 AASC129 winchester 12 gauge. AA Trap 1 1/8" oz. load, #8 shot 2,000 250 8 311275 $502 00 $0.00 $0.00 30.00 $C 00
16 AAM129 winchester 12 gauge, AA Trap 1 1/8" oz. load, #9 shot 2,000 250 8 311275 $902 00 $0 00 $000 3C 00 30 00
17 XBP12 Winchester 12 Gauge Black Powder Blanks, Super-X 1,000 250 4 $309 75 $1,238.00 $000 30.00 30 00 $0 00
18 X12RS815 Winchester 12 gauge, 10z Super-X Slug 8,000 250 32 $19050 $6,086.00 $0.00 3000 so0c $0.00
19 RA12RS15 Winchester 12 gauge $lug, 1o0z. Low recoil 8,000 250 32 $190 50 $6,096.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
20 RA1200 Winchester 12 Gauge 00 Buckshot, 9 Pellst, Low Recoil 10,000 250 40 %190 50 $7,620.00 5000 060 $000 $0.00
21 XB81200 Winchester 12 Gauge 00 Buckshot, S Pellet 10,000 250 40 179 00 $7.160 00 3000 30 00 $0 00 3000
22 USASMM Winchester SMM Lugar, 124 Grain, FMJ 40,000 500 80 $127 00 $10.160.00 3000 $0 00 $000 $000
23 Q4172 Winchester 9MM Lugar, 115 Grain, FMJ 40,000 500 80 $127 00 $10,160.00 $C G0 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Subtotal $50,335.00 S0 00 000
Less 5% LVP 0% 3000 0% $0.00 0% 50C0
Less Terms Discount 0% $0.00 0% $0.00 0% 3000
Evaluation {Does not include Sales Tax) $50,335.00 $0.00 3C G0
Terms Net 45 Days NO BID NO BID
Delivery ARO 5-180 Days ARQ CATEGORY 2 CATEGORY 2
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BID #24-0074

AMMUNITION - COUNTYWIDE

Category 3: Hormnady Ammunition

Dooley Enterprises, Inc.

San Diego Police Equipment Co.

Miwall Corporation

Anaheim, CA San Diego, CA Grass Valley, CA
Bid # Part # Description Extimalec Roundsper | Estannuals Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension
Annual Usage Gase of Cases
24 83276 Horpady 223 Rem 55 grain TAP 50,000 200 450 $0.00 $0 00 $0 00 3000 $171.80 377,310 00
25 80865 Hornady. 308 Win 168 grain TAP AMAX 5,000 200 25 $000 $C.00 S0 00 $0.00 $271.00 $6,77500
26 8270 Hornady, 50 BMG 750 grain AMAX 1,000 100 1G $0 00 $0 00 $0 00 $0 00 $709.20 $7.092 00
27 860215 Hornady, Cntical Duty SMM, Luger+P, 124 Graun, FlexLock 5,000 500 10 $0 .00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $285.20 $2,852.00
Subtotal $0 00 $000 594,025 .00
Less 5% LVP 0% $0.00 0% $0.00 0% 3000
Less Terms Discount 0% $0.00 0% 30.00 0% $0.00
Evaluation (Does not include Sales Tax) $0.00 3000 $94,029.00
Terms NO BID NO BID Net 45 Days
Delivery ARO CATEGORY 3 CATEGORY 3 60-80 Days ARO
. Lo Dooley Enterprises, Inc. San Diego Police Equipment Co. Miwall Corporation
Category 4: CCl Ammunition Anaheim, GA San Diego, CA Grass Valley, CA
Bid # Part # Description Estimated | Rounds per | Est. Annual#) |\ i price | Extension Unit Price Extension UnitPrice | Extension
Annual Usage Case of Cases
2 0047 &l Nefoayr 22 oa tongikie Al amincopperEiated 5,000 5,000 1 $0 00 $0.00 $718 85 $718 BS £000 50 00
Hollow Paint (CPHP)
Discontinued by Mfg
29 832565 CCI Gopper 22 cal Lang Rifle 21 grain CHP 5,000 5,000 1 $0 00 3C.00 %0 00 30 00 $0 00 000
Subtctai 3C.00 $718.85 3000
Less 5% LVP 0% 30.00 0% $0.00 0% 50 00
Less Terms Discount 0% $0.00 0% $0.00 0% 30.00
Evaluation (Does not include Sales Tax} $0 00 $718.85 $C 00
Net 45 Days
30-60 Days ARO but World Events
Terms WO BIk ARO could be over 365 days. NGO BID)
|Delivery ARC CATEGORY 4 Bid #29 Discontinued by Mfg. - No CATEGORY 4
Replacement
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