
Evaluation

  

Category I - New Equipment

Item #

Estimated 
Annual 
Usage* Specifications Bid Extension Bid Extension Bid Extension Bid Extension Bid Extension Bid Extension

1 65 Avaya 9601 IP - Telephone Set - Grey 119.00 7,735.00 115.00 7,475.00 No Bid #VALUE! 125.13 8,133.45 122.65 7,972.25 118.00 7,670.00
2 250 Avaya 9608 IP - Telephone Set - Grey 143.00 35,750.00 173.00 43,250.00 No Bid #VALUE! 187.41 46,852.50 183.70 45,925.00 176.00 44,000.00

Subtotal Category I 43,485.00 50,725.00 No Bid 54,985.95 53,897.25 51,670.00
Less:
   Terms Discount 2% (869.70) 0% 0.00 2% #VALUE! 0% 0.00 0% 0.00 0% 0.00
   Local Vendor Preference 0% 0.00 0% 0.00 0% #VALUE! 0% 0.00 0% 0.00 0% 0.00
Evaluation: Category I

Category II - Refurbished Equipment

Item #

Estimated 
Annual 
Usage* Specifications Bid Extension Bid Extension Bid Extension Bid Extension Bid Extension Bid Extension

1 65 Avaya 9061 IP - IP Telephone - Grey 73.00 4,745.00 No Bid #VALUE! 60.00 3,900.00 125.13 8,133.45 122.65 7,972.25 71.00 4,615.00
2 250 Avaya 9608 IP - IP Telephone - Grey 137.00 34,250.00 No Bid #VALUE! 135.25 33,812.50 187.41 46,852.50 183.70 45,925.00 153.26 38,315.00
3 250 Avaya 9620 IP - IP Telephone - Grey 122.00 30,500.00 No Bid #VALUE! 151.22 37,805.00 150.00 37,500.00 138.00 34,500.00 134.50 33,625.00
4 90 Avaya 9640 IP - IP Telephone - Grey 238.00 21,420.00 No Bid #VALUE! 237.60 21,384.00 271.43 24,428.70 253.00 22,770.00 239.00 21,510.00
5 75 Avaya SBM24 Button  Model 117.00 8,775.00 No Bid #VALUE! 110.00 8,250.00 157.27 11,795.25 97.75 7,331.25 92.50 6,937.50

Subtotal Category II 99,690.00 No Bid 105,151.50 128,709.90 118,498.50 105,002.50
Less:
   Terms Discount 2% (1,993.80) 2% #VALUE! 0% 0.00 0% 0.00 0% 0.00 0% 0.00
   Local Vendor Preference 0% 0.00 0% #VALUE! 0% 0.00 0% 0.00 0% 0.00 0% 0.00
Evaluation: Category II

Bid #15-725-001 Avaya Telecommunication Equipment

7 Days ARO

30 Days ARO None Given 14 Days ARO 15 Days ARO

(F)  Advantel Networks, 
Inc.

Sacramento, CA

15 Days ARO

(E)  Synectic 
Technologies

Sacramento, CA 

105,002.50 

53,897.25 51,670.00 

15 Days ARO

(D)  Intelli- Flex, Inc.

Cypress, CA

14 Days ARO

San Jose, CA

N/A

(C)  Call One, Inc.

54,985.95 

105,151.50 

14 Days ARO

97,696.20 

50,725.00 

No Bid

15 Days ARO

128,709.90 118,498.50 

(A)  Geelers, Inc

Dublin, CA

(B)  CCT Technologies

Cape Canaveral, FL

None Given

No Bid42,615.30 
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