BID #24-680-016

AMMUNITION

Category 1: Federal/Speer Ammunition

Dooley Enterprises, Inc.

San Diego Police Equipment Co.

Miwall Corporation

Protection Plus Tactics LLC

Anaheim, CA San Diego, CA Grass Valley, CA Loomis, CA
Bid # Part # Description Af::LTfJf:ge Rot,(l;:lsseper Es(t).fgr:::l # Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension
1 53921 Speer Gold DOT 38 Special +P, 135 Grain GDHP-SB 1,000 1,000 1 $0.00 $0.00 $509.40 $509.40 $0.00 $0.00 $332.64 $332.64
2 53833 Speer, Lawman 38 special +P 158 grain, TMJFN 1,000 1,000 1 $0.00 $0.00 $385.92 $385.92 $0.00 $0.00 $635.00 $635.00
3 24446 Speer Gold DOT .223 Rem. 55 Grain GDSP 70,000 500 140 $0.00 $0.00 $329.20 $46,088.00 $0.00 $0.00 $267.12 $37,396.80
4 AE38K Federal, (American Eagle) .38 Special +P, 130 Grain FMJ 2,000 1,000 2 $0.00 $0.00 $429.15 $858.30 $0.00 $0.00 $635.00 $1,270.00
5 AE40R1 Federal, (American Eagle) .40 Caliper, 180 Grain FMJ 100,000 1,000 100 $0.00 $0.00 $355.90 $35,590.00 $0.00 $0.00 $278.46 $27,846.00
6 P40HST1 Federal HST .40 Caliper, 180 Grain HST 60,000 1,000 60 $0.00 $0.00 $479.19 $28,751.40 $0.00 $0.00 $388.00 $23,280.00
7 AE45A Federal (American Eagle) .45 ACP, 230 grain FMJ 15,000 1,000 15 $0.00 $0.00 $394.45 $5,916.75 $0.00 $0.00 $309.96 $4,649.40
8 P4SHST1 Federal HST .45 ACP Caliper, 230 Grain, +PJHP 25,000 1,000 25 $0.00 $0.00 $529.16 $13,229.00 $0.00 $0.00 $414.54 $10,363.50
9 T223A Federal Tactical Tru .223 Rem., 55 Grain, Hi Shock SP 11,000 500 22 $0.00 $0.00 $334.22 $7,352.84 $0.00 $0.00 $211.68 $4,656.96
10 LE223T1 Federal Tactical Bonded .223 Rem. 55 grain, Bonded, SP 10,000 200 50 $0.00 $0.00 $252.70 $12,635.00 $0.00 $0.00 $315.00 $15,750.00
11 AE223 Federal (American Eagle) .223 Rem. 55 Grain, FMJBT 13,000 500 26 $0.00 $0.00 $251.94 $6,550.44 $0.00 $0.00 $383.00 $9,958.00
12 XM193X Discontinued 0 500 0 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
13 LE132 00 Federal 12 Gauge Ammo, 2-3/4" 00 Buckshot 1,000 250 4 $0.00 $0.00 $208.40 $833.60 $0.00 $0.00 $283.50 $1,134.00
14 LE308T2 Federal .308 cal. Win. 168 grain Tactical Bonded Tip 10,000 200 50 $0.00 $0.00 $392.60 $19,630.00 $0.00 $0.00 $466.20 $23,310.00
15 F-1 30-00 Federal 12 Gauge Classic, 2-3/4", 00 Buckshot, 12 Pellet 4,000 250 16 $0.00 $0.00 $212.24 $3,395.84 $0.00 $0.00 $535.50 $8,568.00
16 TGL12 Federal Top Gun Target, 2-3/4", #9 1,000 250 4 $0.00 $0.00 $87.40 $349.60 $0.00 $0.00 $99.54 $398.16
17 P9HST2 Federal 9MM, 147 Grain, Standard Velocity 85,000 1,000 85 $0.00 $0.00 $423.35 $35,984.75 $0.00 $0.00 $690.48 $58,690.80
18 AE9FP Federal 9MM, 147 grain, FMJ 138,000 1,000 138 $0.00 $0.00 $257.10 $35,479.80 $0.00 $0.00 $409.50 $56,511.00
Subtotal $0.00 $253,540.64 $0.00 $284,750.26
Less 5% LVP 0% $0.00 0% $0.00 0% $0.00 0% $0.00
Less Terms Discount 0% $0.00 0% $0.00 0% $0.00 5% ($14,237.51)
Evaluation (Does not include Sales Tax) $0.00 $253,540.64 $0.00 $270,512.75
Terms NO BID Net 45 Days NO BID 5% 21 Days Days
Delivery ARO CATEGORY 1 30-450 Days ARO CATEGORY 1 90 Days ARO
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BID #24-680-016
AMMUNITION

Category 2: Winchester Ammunition

Dooley Enterprises, Inc.

San Diego Police Equipment Co.

Miwall Corporation

Protection Plus Tactics LLC

Anaheim, CA San Diego, CA Grass Valley, CA Loomis, CA
Bid # Part # Description Af::LTfJf:ge Rot,(l;:lsseper Es(t).fgr:::l # Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension
19 RA45T Winchester, Ranger .45 Cal. JHP 230 grain, T-Series 5000 500 10 $233.50 $2,335.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $504.00 $5,040.00
20 AASC129 Winchester 12 gauge, AA Trap 1 1/8” oz. load, #9 shot 2,000 250 8 $107.00 $856.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $126.00 $1,008.00
21 AAM129 Winchester 12 gauge, AA Trap 1 1/8” oz. load, #9 shot 2,000 250 8 $107.00 $856.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $264.60 $2,116.80
22 XBP12 Winchester 12 Gauge Black Powder Blanks, Super-X 1,000 250 4 $298.25 $1,193.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $630.00 $2,520.00
23 X12RS15 Winchester 12 gauge, 10z. Super-X Slug 8,000 250 32 $173.75 $5,560.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $403.20 $12,902.40
24 RA12RS15 Winchester 12 gauge Slug, 10z. Low recoil 8,000 250 32 $173.75 $5,560.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $315.00 $10,080.00
25 RA1200 Winchester 12 Gauge 00 Buckshot, 9 Pellet, Low Recoil 10,000 250 40 $164.00 $6,560.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $315.00 $12,600.00
26 XB1200 Winchester 12 Gauge 00 Buckshot, 9 Pellet 10,000 250 40 $164.00 $6,560.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $226.80 $9,072.00
27 USA9MM Winchester 9MM Lugar, 124 Grain, FMJ 40,000 500 80 $124.50 $9,960.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $144.90 $11,592.00
28 Q4172 Winchester 9MM Lugar, 115 Grain, FMJ 40,000 500 80 $124.50 $9,960.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $158.76 $12,700.80
2 WM193420CS \é"l:gghﬁa‘j’ 5.56, 55 Grain, M193 Ball, 10-Round Stripper | 45 350 840 179 $525.00 $93,975.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00| |  $819.00 $146,601.00
Subtotal $143,375.00 $0.00 $0.00 $226,233.00
Less 5% LVP 0% $0.00 0% $0.00 0% $0.00 0% $0.00
Less Terms Discount 0% $0.00 0% $0.00 0% $0.00 5% ($11,311.65)
Evaluation (Does not include Sales Tax) $143,375.00 $0.00 $0.00 $214,921.35
Terms Net 45 Days NO BID NO BID 5% 21 Days Days
Delivery ARO 5-180 Days ARO CATEGORY 2 CATEGORY 2 90 Days ARO
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BID #24-680-016
AMMUNITION

Category 3: Hornady Ammunition

Dooley Enterprises, Inc.

San Diego Police Equipment Co.

Miwall Corporation

Protection Plus Tactics LLC

Anaheim, CA San Diego, CA Grass Valley, CA Loomis, CA
Bid # Part # Description Arf:::lflflf:ge Rot,(l;:lsseper Es;'f?;:::l # Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension
30 83276 Hornady, .223 Rem. 55 grain TAP 90,000 200 450 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $168.43 $75,793.50 $252.00 $113,400.00
31 80965 Hornady, .308 Win. 168 grain TAP AMAX 5,000 200 25 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $265.61 $6,640.25 $315.00 $7,875.00
32 8270 Hornady, 50 BMG 750 grain AMAX 1,000 100 10 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $677.14 $6,771.40 $945.00 $9,450.00
3 90215 pomady, Critical Duty SMIM, LugertP, 124 Grain, 5,000 500 10 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 | | s279.44 $2794.40 | |  $579.60 $5,796.00
Subtotal $0.00 $0.00 $91,999.55 $136,521.00
Less 5% LVP 0% $0.00 0% $0.00 0% $0.00 0% $0.00
Less Terms Discount 0% $0.00 0% $0.00 0% $0.00 5% ($6,826.05)
Evaluation (Does not include Sales Tax) $0.00 $0.00 $91,999.55 $129,694.95
Terms NO BID NO BID Net 45 Days 5% 21 Days Days
Delivery ARO CATEGORY 3 CATEGORY 3 30-450 Days ARO 90 Days ARO
Category 4: CCl Ammunition DooIeXnEar::irl:’ri(s:eAs, Inc. San Dieg;aF:‘oIIJiti::gEo(’qléizment Co. M(i;v::slls(iloarl;::;agzn Protectitr;::liss:rg;tics LLC
Bid # Part # Description Arf:::lflflf:ge Rot,(l;:lsseper Es;'f?;:::l # Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension
3 0047 ﬁgl'lo\“’,eF',‘fl:fz (':ZPZHCPE)" Long Rifle 40 grain Copper Plated 5,000 5,000 1 $0.00 $0.00 | | $692.40 $602.40 $0.00 $0.00 | | $1,386.00 $1,386.00
35 925CC CCI Copper .22 cal, Long Rifle 21 grain CHP 5,000 5,000 1 $0.00 $0.00 $924.22 $924.22 $0.00 $0.00 $1,145.34 $1,145.34
Subtotal $0.00 $1,616.62 $0.00 $2,531.34
Less 5% LVP 0% $0.00 0% $0.00 0% $0.00 0% $0.00
Less Terms Discount 0% $0.00 0% $0.00 0% $0.00 5% ($126.57)
Evaluation (Does not include Sales Tax) $0.00 $1,616.62 $0.00 $2,404.77
Terms NO BID Net 45 Days NO BID 5% 21 Days Days
Delivery ARO CATEGORY 4 30-450 Days ARO CATEGORY 4 90 Days ARO
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