

**Bid #16-340-048 - Fire Suppression Services**  
**Category I - Sprinkler Sytems**  
**Evaluation**

		(A)	(B)	(C)	(D)	(E)	(F)	(G)
		Tri-Signal Integration	Foothill Fire Protection	Systems Tech Fire Protection	Jorgensen Co.	COSCO Fire Protection	Hangtown Fire Control, Inc.	Legacy Fire Protection
<b>Bid Item #</b>	<b>Description</b>							
<b>Sprinkler Systems - West Slope</b>								
01	Wet System – Quarterly Inspection	140.00	138.00	130.00	250.00	440.00	435.00	125.00
02	Wet System – Annual Inspection	140.00	415.00	227.67	350.00	550.00	725.81	140.00
03	Wet System – 5 Year Certification Inspection	425.00	540.00	292.67	1,000.00	660.00	365.63	440.00
04	Dry System – Quarterly Inspection	90.00	138.00	130.00	300.00	440.00	464.00	125.00
05	Dry System – Annual Inspection	90.00	475.00	227.50	450.00	550.00	774.13	140.00
06	Dry System – 5 Year Certification Inspection	425.00	540.00	292.50	1,400.00	660.00	243.75	440.00
	<b>Total - Sprinkler - West Slope</b>	<b>\$ 1,310.00</b>	<b>\$ 2,246.00</b>	<b>\$ 1,300.33</b>	<b>\$ 3,750.00</b>	<b>\$ 3,300.00</b>	<b>\$ 3,008.31</b>	<b>\$ 1,410.00</b>
<b>Sprinkler Systems - East Slope</b>								
07	Wet System – Quarterly Inspection	140.00	276.00	227.50	300.00	740.00	464.50	125.00
08	Wet System – Annual Inspection	140.00	475.00	325.00	400.00	850.00	774.00	140.00
09	Wet System – 5 Year Certification Inspection	425.00	690.00	390.00	1,200.00	960.00	487.50	440.00
10	Dry System – Quarterly Inspection	120.00	276.00	227.50	350.00	740.00	464.53	125.00
11	Dry System – Annual Inspection	120.00	475.00	325.00	500.00	850.00	774.17	140.00
12	Dry System – 5 Year Certification Inspection	425.00	690.00	390.00	1,800.00	960.00	325.00	440.00
	<b>Total - Sprinkler - East Slope</b>	<b>\$ 1,370.00</b>	<b>\$ 2,882.00</b>	<b>\$ 1,885.00</b>	<b>\$ 4,550.00</b>	<b>\$ 5,100.00</b>	<b>\$ 3,289.69</b>	<b>\$ 1,410.00</b>
<b>Ansul Inergen Clean Agent Systems – West Slope</b>								
13	Semi-Annual Inspection	600.00	2,460.00	1,960.00	825.00	385.00	1,700.00	650.00
14	Annual Inspection	600.00	2,460.00	1,960.00	825.00	385.00	1,700.00	650.00
	<b>Total - Ansul Inergen Clean Agent System</b>	<b>\$ 1,200.00</b>	<b>\$ 4,920.00</b>	<b>\$ 3,920.00</b>	<b>\$ 1,650.00</b>	<b>\$ 770.00</b>	<b>\$ 3,400.00</b>	<b>\$ 1,300.00</b>
<b>On-Call Sprinkler System Maintenance West Slope</b>								
15	Monday through Friday, 8:00 a.m. – 5:00 p.m.	175.00	235.00	96.00	125.00	110.00	125.00	240.00
16	After Hours, Saturday, Sunday, and County Recognized Holidays	265.00	325.00	144.00	187.50	200.00	225.00	360.00
17	On-Call Response Time Within	120 min	1440 min	180 min	60-120 min	120 min	60 min	180 min
	<b>Total - On-Call Sprinkler West Slope</b>	<b>\$ 440.00</b>	<b>\$ 560.00</b>	<b>\$ 240.00</b>	<b>\$ 312.50</b>	<b>\$ 310.00</b>	<b>\$ 350.00</b>	<b>\$ 600.00</b>
<b>Emergency Sprinkler System Services West Slope</b>								
18	Monday through Friday, 8:00 a.m. – 5:00 p.m.	175.00	235.00	96.00	125.00	110.00	125.00	240.00
19	After Hours, Saturday, Sunday, and County Recognized Holidays	265.00	325.00	144.00	187.50	200.00	225.00	360.00
20	On-Call Response Time Within	120 min	480 min	180 min	60-120 min	120 min	60 min	180 min
	<b>Total - Emergency Sprinkler West Slope</b>	<b>\$ 440.00</b>	<b>\$ 560.00</b>	<b>\$ 240.00</b>	<b>\$ 312.50</b>	<b>\$ 310.00</b>	<b>\$ 350.00</b>	<b>\$ 600.00</b>

**Bid #16-340-048 - Fire Suppression Services**  
**Category I - Sprinkler Sytems**  
**Evaluation**

	(A) Tri-Signal Integration	(B) Foothill Fire Protection	(C) Systems Tech Fire Protection	(D) Jorgensen Co.	(E) COSCO Fire Protection	(F) Hangtown Fire Control, Inc.	(G) Legacy Fire Protection
<b>Miscellaneous Sprinkler System Charges West Slope</b>							
21	Minimum Trip Charge (if applicable)	350.00	235.00	96.00	125.00	220.00	- 125.00
22	Trip Charge (if applicable)	45.00	150.00	-	125.00	-	250.00
	<b>Total - Miscellaneous Sprinkler West Slope</b>	<b>\$ 395.00</b>	<b>\$ 385.00</b>	<b>\$ 96.00</b>	<b>\$ 250.00</b>	<b>\$ 220.00</b>	<b>\$ - \$ 375.00</b>
<b>On-Call Sprinkler System Maintenance East Slope</b>							
23	Monday through Friday, 8:00 a.m. – 5:00 p.m.	175.00	325.00	96.00	125.00	110.00	150.00 240.00
24	After Hours, Saturday, Sunday, and County Recognized Holidays	265.00	487.50	144.00	187.50	200.00	250.00 360.00
25	On-Call Response Time Within	240 min	1440 min	240 min	120-180 min	180 min	120 min 240 min
	<b>Total - On-Call Sprinkler East Slope</b>	<b>\$ 440.00</b>	<b>\$ 812.50</b>	<b>\$ 240.00</b>	<b>\$ 312.50</b>	<b>\$ 310.00</b>	<b>\$ 400.00 \$ 600.00</b>
<b>Emergency Sprinkler System Services East Slope</b>							
26	Monday through Friday, 8:00 a.m. – 5:00 p.m.	175.00	325.00	96.00	125.00	110.00	150.00 240.00
27	After Hours, Saturday, Sunday, and County Recognized Holidays	265.00	487.50	144.00	187.50	200.00	250.00 360.00
28	On-Call Response Time Within	240 min	720 min	240 min	120-180 min	240 min	120 min 240 min
	<b>Total - Emergency Sprinkler East Slope</b>	<b>\$ 440.00</b>	<b>\$ 812.50</b>	<b>\$ 240.00</b>	<b>\$ 312.50</b>	<b>\$ 310.00</b>	<b>\$ 400.00 \$ 600.00</b>
<b>Miscellaneous Sprinkler System Charges East Slope</b>							
29	Minimum Trip Charge (if applicable)	350.00	325.00	96.00	125.00	880.00	125.00 125.00
30	Trip Charge (if applicable)	45.00	150.00	-	125.00	-	125.00 300.00
	<b>Total - Miscellaneous Sprinkler East Slope</b>	<b>\$ 395.00</b>	<b>\$ 475.00</b>	<b>\$ 96.00</b>	<b>\$ 250.00</b>	<b>\$ 880.00</b>	<b>\$ 250.00 \$ 425.00</b>
	<b>Totals By Bidder</b>	<b>\$ 6,430.00</b>	<b>\$ 13,653.00</b>	<b>\$ 8,257.33</b>	<b>\$ 11,700.00</b>	<b>\$ 11,510.00</b>	<b>\$ 11,448.01 \$ 7,320.00</b>

**Bid #16-340-048 - Fire Suppression Services**  
**Category II - Kitchen Hood Systems**  
**Evaluation**

Bid Item #	Description	(A)	(B)	(C)	(D)	(E)	(F)	(G)
		Tri-Signal Integration	Foothill Fire Protection	Systems Tech Fire Protection	Jorgensen Co.	COSCO Fire Protection	Hangtown Fire Control, Inc.	Legacy Fire Protection
			No Bid	No Bid				
<b>Kitchen Hood Systems - West Slope</b>								
31	Ansul – Semi Inspection	125.00			175.00	266.00	464.50	83.00
32	Ansul – Regulator Inspection	45.00			45.00	266.00	50.00	40.00
33	Ansul – 12 Year Hydrostatic Certification	75.00			125.00	266.00	-	70.00
34	Guardian – Semi Annual Inspection	125.00			175.00	199.50	348.38	83.00
35	Guardian – 12 Year Hydrostatic Certification	75.00			175.00	199.50	125.00	70.00
36	Kidde – Semi Annual Inspection	125.00			175.00	798.00	467.50	73.00
37	Kidde – 12 Year Hydrostatic Certification	75.00			125.00	798.00	125.00	73.00
38	Pyro Chem – Semi Annual Inspection	125.00			175.00	199.50	464.63	83.00
39	Pyro Chem – 12 Year Hydrostatic Certification	75.00			125.00	199.50	-	73.00
40	Range Guard – Semi Annual Inspection	125.00			175.00	798.00	467.50	83.00
41	Range Guard – 12 Year Hydrostatic Certification	75.00			125.00	798.00	125.00	73.00
	<b>Total - Kitchen Hood West Slope</b>	<b>\$ 1,045.00</b>	-	-	<b>\$ 1,595.00</b>	<b>\$ 4,788.00</b>	<b>\$ 2,637.50</b>	<b>\$ 804.00</b>
<b>Kitchen Hood Systems – East Slope</b>								
42	Ansul – Semi Annual Inspection	125.00			300.00	225.00	501.67	80.00
43	Ansul – Regulator Inspection	45.00			45.00	225.00	50.00	40.00
44	Ansul – 12 Year Hydrostatic Certification	75.00			125.00	225.00	125.00	73.00
	<b>Total - Kitchen Hood East Slope</b>	<b>\$ 245.00</b>	-	-	<b>\$ 470.00</b>	<b>\$ 675.00</b>	<b>\$ 676.67</b>	<b>\$ 193.00</b>
<b>On-Call Kitchen Hood Systems Maintenance West Slope</b>								
45	Monday through Friday, 8:00 a.m. – 5:00 p.m.	175.00			125.00	110.00	125.00	240.00
46	After Hours, Saturday, Sunday, and County Recognized Holidays	265.00			187.50	200.00	225.00	360.00
47	On-Call Response Time Within 120 min	120 min			60-120 min	120 min	30 min	180 min
	<b>Total - On-Call Kitchen Hood West Slope</b>	<b>\$ 440.00</b>	-	-	<b>\$ 312.50</b>	<b>\$ 310.00</b>	<b>\$ 350.00</b>	<b>\$ 600.00</b>

**Bid #16-340-048 - Fire Suppression Services**  
**Category II - Kitchen Hood Systems**  
**Evaluation**

	(A) Tri-Signal Integration	(B) Foothill Fire Protection	(C) Systems Tech Fire Protection	(D) Jorgensen Co.	(E) COSCO Fire Protection	(F) Hangtown Fire Control, Inc.	(G) Legacy Fire Protection
<b>Emergency Kitchen Hood Systems Services West Slope</b>							
48	Monday through Friday, 8:00 a.m. – 5:00 p.m.	175.00		187.50	110.00	125.00	240.00
49	After Hours, Saturday, Sunday, and County Recognized Holidays	265.00		187.50	200.00	225.00	360.00
50	On-Call Response Time Within 120 min	120 min		60-120 min	120 min	60 min	180 min
	<b>Total - Emergency Kitchen Hood West Slope \$</b>	<b>440.00</b>	-	<b>\$ 375.00</b>	<b>\$ 310.00</b>	<b>\$ 350.00</b>	<b>\$ 600.00</b>
<b>Miscellaneous Kitchen Hood Systems Charges West Slope</b>							
51	Minimum Trip Charge (if applicable)	350.00		125.00	880.00	-	125.00
52	Trip Charge (if applicable)	45.00		125.00	-	-	250.00
	<b>Total - Miscellaneous Kitchen Hood West Slope \$</b>	<b>395.00</b>	-	<b>\$ 250.00</b>	<b>\$ 880.00</b>	<b>\$ -</b>	<b>\$ 375.00</b>
<b>On-Call Kitchen Hood Systems Maintenance East Slope</b>							
53	Monday through Friday, 8:00 a.m. – 5:00 p.m.	175.00		125.00	110.00	150.00	240.00
54	After Hours, Saturday, Sunday, and County Recognized Holidays	265.00		187.50	200.00	250.00	360.00
55	On-Call Response Time Within 120 min	120 min		120-180 min	180 min	90 min	480 min
	<b>Total - On-Call Kitchen Hood East Slope \$</b>	<b>440.00</b>	-	<b>\$ 312.50</b>	<b>\$ 310.00</b>	<b>\$ 400.00</b>	<b>\$ 600.00</b>
<b>Emergency Kitchen Hood Systems Services East Slope</b>							
56	Monday through Friday, 8:00 a.m. – 5:00 p.m.	175.00		187.50	110.00	150.00	240.00
47	After Hours, Saturday, Sunday, and County Recognized Holidays	265.00		187.50	200.00	250.00	360.00
58	On-Call Response Time Within 240 min	240 min		120-180 min	240 min	90 min	480 min
	<b>Total - Emergency Kitchen Hood East Slope \$</b>	<b>440.00</b>	-	<b>\$ 375.00</b>	<b>\$ 310.00</b>	<b>\$ 400.00</b>	<b>\$ 600.00</b>
<b>Miscellaneous Kitchen Hood Systems Charges East Slope</b>							
59	Minimum Trip Charge (if applicable)	350.00		125.00	880.00	125.00	125.00
60	Trip Charge (if applicable)	45.00		125.00	-	125.00	250.00
	<b>Total - Miscellaneous Kitchen Hood East Slope \$</b>	<b>395.00</b>	-	<b>250.00</b>	<b>\$ 880.00</b>	<b>\$ 250.00</b>	<b>\$ 375.00</b>
	<b>Totals By Bidder</b>	<b>\$ 3,840.00</b>	-	<b>\$ 3,940.00</b>	<b>\$ 8,463.00</b>	<b>\$ 5,064.17</b>	<b>\$ 4,147.00</b>

**Bid #16-340-048 - Fire Suppression Services**  
**Category III - Fire Extinguishers**  
**Evaluation - Revised**

Bid Item #	Description	(A) Tri-Signal Integration		(B)	(C)	(D) Jorgensen Co.	
		Per Unit Cost	Extended for Annual Cost	Foothill Fire Protection	Systems Tech Fire Protection	Per Unit Cost	Extended for Annual Cost
<b>Fire Extinguishers Inspections – West Slope</b>				No Bid	No Bid		
61	Monthly Inspection (any size)	5.00	18,000.00			7.00	25,200.00
62	Annual Inspection (any size)	7.00	2,100.00			10.00	3,000.00
63	5-Year CO2 Test (any size)*	70.00	70.00			25.00	25.00
64	6 Year Halon Test (any size)*	100.00	100.00			25.00	25.00
65	12-Year Halon Inspection (any size)*	100.00	100.00			20.00	20.00
66	12-Year Hydrostatic Inspection (any size)*	25.00	25.00			20.00	20.00
67	Halon Valve Stem	20.00	20.00			10.00	10.00
68	Recharge Unit After Discharge	40.00	40.00			18.50	18.50
<b>Total - Extinguishers Inspection West Slope</b>		<b>\$ 367.00</b>	<b>\$ 20,455.00</b>	-	-	<b>\$ 135.50</b>	<b>\$ 28,318.50</b>
<b>Fire Extinguishers Inspections – East Slope</b>				No Bid	No Bid		
69	Monthly Inspection (any size)	5.00	4,800.00			7.00	6,720.00
70	Annual Inspection (any size)	7.00	560.00			12.00	960.00
71	5-Year CO2 Test (any size)*	70.00	70.00			25.00	25.00
72	6 Year Halon Test (any size)*	100.00	100.00			25.00	25.00
73	12-Year Halon Inspection (any size)*	100.00	100.00			20.00	20.00
74	12-Year Hydrostatic Inspection (any size)*	25.00	25.00			20.00	20.00
75	Halon Valve Stem	20.00	20.00			10.00	10.00
76	Recharge Unit After Discharge	40.00	40.00			18.50	18.50
<b>Total - Extinguisher Inspection East Slope</b>		<b>\$ 367.00</b>	<b>\$ 5,715.00</b>	-	-	<b>\$ 137.50</b>	<b>\$ 7,798.50</b>
<b>On-Call Fire Extinguishers Maintenance West Slope</b>				No Bid	No Bid		
77	Monday through Friday, 8:00 a.m. – 5:00 p.m.	135.00	135.00			55.00	55.00
78	After Hours, Saturday, Sunday, and County Recognized Holidays	205.00	205.00			82.50	82.50
79	On-Call Response Time Within 120 min	120 min	120 min			60-120 min	60-120 min
<b>Total - On-Call Extinguisher Maintenance West Slope</b>		<b>\$ 340.00</b>	<b>\$ 340.00</b>	-	-	<b>\$ 137.50</b>	<b>\$ 137.50</b>

**Bid #16-340-048 - Fire Suppression Services**  
**Category III - Fire Extinguishers**  
**Evaluation - Revised**

Bid Item #	Description	(E) COSCO Fire Protection		(F) Hangtown Fire Control, Inc.		(G) Legacy Fire Protection
		Per Unit Cost	Extended for Annual Cost	Per Unit Cost	Extended for Annual Cost	Rejected
<b>Fire Extinguishers Inspections – West Slope</b>						
61	Monthly Inspection (any size)	8.50	30,600.00	6.22	22,380.00	Section not Complete
62	Annual Inspection (any size)	8.50	2,550.00	11.00	3,300.00	
63	5-Year CO2 Test (any size)*	28.00	28.00	35.00	35.00	
64	6 Year Halon Test (any size)*	24.00	24.00	35.00	35.00	
65	12-Year Halon Inspection (any size)*	60.00	60.00	55.00	55.00	
66	12-Year Hydrostatic Inspection (any size)*	60.00	60.00	17.00	17.00	
67	Halon Valve Stem	7.50	7.50	10.25	10.25	
68	Recharge Unit After Discharge	24.00	24.00	11.00	11.00	
<b>Total - Extinguishers Inspection West Slope</b>		<b>\$ 220.50</b>	<b>\$ 33,353.50</b>	<b>\$ 180.47</b>	<b>\$ 25,843.25</b>	
<b>Fire Extinguishers Inspections – East Slope</b>						
69	Monthly Inspection (any size)	8.50	8,160.00	6.25	6,000.00	
70	Annual Inspection (any size)	8.50	680.00	11.00	880.00	
71	5-Year CO2 Test (any size)*	28.00	28.00	35.00	35.00	
72	6 Year Halon Test (any size)*	24.00	24.00	35.00	35.00	
73	12-Year Halon Inspection (any size)*	60.00	60.00	55.00	55.00	
74	12-Year Hydrostatic Inspection (any size)*	60.00	60.00	17.00	17.00	
75	Halon Valve Stem	7.50	7.50	10.25	10.25	
76	Recharge Unit After Discharge	24.00	24.00	11.00	11.00	
<b>Total - Extinguisher Inspection East Slope</b>		<b>\$ 220.50</b>	<b>\$ 9,043.50</b>	<b>\$ 180.50</b>	<b>\$ 7,043.25</b>	
<b>On-Call Fire Extinguishers Maintenance West Slope</b>						
77	Monday through Friday, 8:00 a.m. – 5:00 p.m.	110.00	110.00	75.00	75.00	
78	After Hours, Saturday, Sunday, and County Recognized Holidays	200.00	200.00	125.00	125.00	
79	On-Call Response Time Within 180 min	180 min	180 min	60 min	60 min	
<b>Total - On-Call Extinguisher Maintenance West Slope</b>		<b>\$ 310.00</b>	<b>\$ 310.00</b>	<b>\$ 200.00</b>	<b>\$ 200.00</b>	

**Bid #16-340-048 - Fire Suppression Services**  
**Category III - Fire Extinguishers**  
**Evaluation - Revised**

	(A) Tri-Signal Integration		(B) Foothill Fire Protection	(C) Systems Tech Fire Protection	(D) Jorgensen Co.	
<b>Emergency Fire Extinguishers Services West Slope</b>			No Bid	No Bid		
80 Monday through Friday, 8:00 a.m. – 5:00 p.m.	135.00	135.00			82.50	82.50
81 After Hours, Saturday, Sunday, and County Recognized Holidays	205.00	205.00			82.50	82.50
82 On-Call Response Time Within 120 min	120 min	120 min			60-120 min	60-120 min
<b>Total - Emergency Extinguisher Maintenance West Slope</b>	<b>\$ 340.00</b>	<b>\$ 340.00</b>	-	-	<b>\$ 165.00</b>	<b>\$ 165.00</b>
<b>Miscellaneous Fire Extinguishers Charges West Slope</b>			No Bid	No Bid		
83 Minimum Trip Charge (if applicable)	270.00	270.00			55.00	55.00
84 Trip Charge (if applicable)	45.00	45.00			55.00	55.00
<b>Total - Miscellaneous Extinguisher Maintenance West Slope</b>	<b>\$ 315.00</b>	<b>\$ 315.00</b>	-	-	<b>\$ 110.00</b>	<b>\$ 110.00</b>
<b>On-Call Fire Extinguishers Maintenance East Slope</b>			No Bid	No Bid		
85 Monday through Friday, 8:00 a.m. – 5:00 p.m.	135.00	135.00			55.00	55.00
86 After Hours, Saturday, Sunday, and County Recognized Holidays	205.00	205.00			82.50	82.50
87 On-Call Response Time Within 240 min	240 min	240 min			120-180 min	120-180 min
<b>Total - On-Call Extinguisher Maintenance East Slope</b>	<b>\$ 340.00</b>	<b>\$ 340.00</b>	-	-	<b>\$ 137.50</b>	<b>\$ 137.50</b>
<b>Emergency Fire Extinguishers Services East Slope</b>			No Bid	No Bid		
88 Monday through Friday, 8:00 a.m. – 5:00 p.m.	135.00	135.00			82.50	82.50
89 After Hours, Saturday, Sunday, and County Recognized Holidays	205.00	205.00			82.50	82.50
90 On-Call Response Time Within 240 min	240 min	240 min			120-180 min	120-180 min
<b>Total - Emergency Extinguisher Maintenance East Slope</b>	<b>\$ 340.00</b>	<b>\$ 340.00</b>	-	-	<b>\$ 165.00</b>	<b>\$ 165.00</b>
<b>Miscellaneous Fire Extinguishers Charges East Slope</b>			No Bid	No Bid		
91 Minimum Trip Charge (if applicable)	270.00	270.00			55.00	55.00
92 Trip Charge (if applicable)	45.00	45.00			55.00	55.00
<b>Total - Miscellaneous Extinguisher Maintenance East Slope</b>	<b>\$ 315.00</b>	<b>\$ 315.00</b>	-	-	<b>\$ 110.00</b>	<b>\$ 110.00</b>
<b>Totals By Bidder</b>	<b>\$ 2,724.00</b>	<b>\$ 28,160.00</b>	-	-	<b>\$ 1,098.00</b>	<b>\$ 36,942.00</b>

**Bid #16-340-048 - Fire Suppression Services**  
**Category III - Fire Extinguishers**  
**Evaluation - Revised**

	(E) COSCO Fire Protection	(F) Hangtown Fire Control, Inc.	(G) Legacy Fire Protection
<b>Emergency Fire Extinguishers Services West Slope</b>			
80 Monday through Friday, 8:00 a.m. – 5:00 p.m.	100.00	100.00	75.00 75.00
81 After Hours, Saturday, Sunday, and County Recognized Holidays	200.00	200.00	125.00 125.00
82 On-Call Response Time Within 180 min	180 min	180 min	60 min 60 min
<b>Total - Emergency Extinguisher Maintenance West Slope \$</b>	<b>300.00 \$</b>	<b>300.00 \$</b>	<b>200.00 \$ 200.00</b>
<b>Miscellaneous Fire Extinguishers Charges West Slope</b>			
83 Minimum Trip Charge (if applicable)	880.00	880.00	- -
84 Trip Charge (if applicable)	-	-	- -
<b>Total - Miscellaneous Extinguisher Maintenance West Slope \$</b>	<b>880.00 \$</b>	<b>880.00 \$</b>	<b>- -</b>
<b>On-Call Fire Extinguishers Maintenance East Slope</b>			
85 Monday through Friday, 8:00 a.m. – 5:00 p.m.	110.00	110.00	125.00 \$ 125.00
86 After Hours, Saturday, Sunday, and County Recognized Holidays	200.00	200.00	175.00 175.00
87 On-Call Response Time Within 240 min	240 min	240 min	90 min 90 min
<b>Total - On-Call Extinguisher Maintenance East Slope \$</b>	<b>310.00 \$</b>	<b>310.00 \$</b>	<b>300.00 \$ 300.00</b>
<b>Emergency Fire Extinguishers Services East Slope</b>			
88 Monday through Friday, 8:00 a.m. – 5:00 p.m.	110.00	110.00	125.00 125.00
89 After Hours, Saturday, Sunday, and County Recognized Holidays	200.00	200.00	175.00 175.00
90 On-Call Response Time Within 240 min	240 min	240 min	120 min 120 min
<b>Total - Emergency Extinguisher Maintenance East Slope \$</b>	<b>310.00 \$</b>	<b>310.00 \$</b>	<b>300.00 \$ 300.00</b>
<b>Miscellaneous Fire Extinguishers Charges East Slope</b>			
91 Minimum Trip Charge (if applicable)	880.00	880.00	125.00 125.00
92 Trip Charge (if applicable)	-	-	125.00 125.00
<b>Total - Miscellaneous Extinguisher Maintenance East Slope \$</b>	<b>880.00 \$</b>	<b>880.00 \$</b>	<b>250.00 \$ 250.00</b>
<b>Totals By Bidder \$</b>	<b>3,431.00 \$</b>	<b>45,387.00 \$</b>	<b>1,610.97 \$ 34,136.50</b>



**Bid #16-340-048 - Fire Suppression Services  
Category III - Fire Extinguishers (Continued)  
Evaluation**

			(A) Tri-Signal Integration	(B) Foothill Fire Protection	(C) Systems Tech Fire Protection	(D) Jorgensen Co.	(E) COSCO Fire Protection	(F) Hangtown Fire Control, Inc.	(G) Legacy Fire Protection
<b>Bid Item #</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>U/L Rating</b>							
<b>Fire Extinguishers – Purchase New – Both West and East Slope</b>				No Bid	No Bid				Rejected
93	ABC Dry Chemical – 2.5# ABC - Chrome	1A10BC	108.00			55.00	71.50	145.00	Section not Complete
94	ABC Dry Chemical – 2.5# ABC – w/Vehicle Bracket	1A10BC	50.00			27.00	30.35	44.75	
95	ABC Dry Chemical – 5# ABC – Wall Mount	3A40BC	55.00			48.00	33.00	59.75	
96	ABC Dry Chemical – 5# ABC – w/Vehicle Bracket	3A40BC	60.00			48.00	36.00	62.75	
97	ABC Dry Chemical – 10# ABC – Wall Mount	4A60BC	80.00			65.00	46.00	96.75	
98	ABC Dry Chemical – 20# ABC – Wall Mount	20A120BC	125.00			98.00	56.00	221.50	
99	BC Dry Chemical – 2.5# BC – w/Vehicle Bracket	10BC	50.00			35.00	28.00	49.75	
100	BC Dry Chemical – 5.5# BC – Wall Mount	40BC	70.00			55.00	30.00	84.25	
101	“K” (Kitchen) – 6 Liter – Wall Mount	2A1BCK	225.00			195.00	20.00	225.00	
102	Halotron – 2.5# – w/Vehicle Bracket	2BC	140.00			80.00	102.00	175.00	
103	Halotron – 5# – w/Vehicle Bracket	5BC	230.00			135.00	132.00	300.00	
104	Carbon Dioxide – 322 – 5#	5BC	180.00			112.00	132.00	225.00	
105	Carbon Dioxide – 330 – 10#	10BC	280.00			157.00	285.00	285.00	
106	Carbon Dioxide – 331 – 15#	15BC	330.00			183.00	420.00	315.00	
107	Carbon Dioxide – 332 – 20#	20BC	420.00			222.00	225.00	350.00	
108	Water/AFFF – 240 2.5 Gal – Water – Stainless Steel	2A	140.00			95.00	65.00	168.75	
109	Water/AFFF – 6 Liter A.F.F.	K	360.00			115.00	250.00	225.00	
<b>Total - Fire Extinguishers Purchase New</b>			<b>\$ 2,903.00</b>	<b>-</b>	<b>-</b>	<b>\$ 1,725.00</b>	<b>\$ 1,961.85</b>	<b>\$ 3,033.25</b>	
<b>Bid Item #</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Unit</b>							
<b>Fire Extinguishers – Purchase Parts &amp; Materials – Both West and East Slope</b>				No Bid	No Bid				
110	Vehicle Bracket – 2.5# Ansul	each	13.61			20.00	7.25	14.25	
111	Vehicle Bracket – 5# Ansul	each	18.28			20.00	9.25	26.00	
112	Vehicle Bracket – 2.5# Amerex	each	13.61			8.00	7.25	14.25	
113	Vehicle Bracket – 5# Amerex	each	18.28			10.00	9.25	26.00	
114	Vehicle Bracket – 10# Amerex	each	31.48			20.00	15.50	40.00	
115	Vehicle Bracket – 2.5# Badger, Buckeye	each	13.61			10.00	7.25	14.25	
116	Vehicle Bracket – 5# Badger, Buckeye	each	18.28			20.00	9.50	26.00	
117	Vehicle Bracket – 5# Heavy Duty	each	43.68			20.00	9.25	56.00	
118	Vehicle Bracket – 10# Heavy Duty	each	47.51			30.00	42.00	65.00	
119	Vehicle Bracket – 20# Heavy Duty	each	57.25			35.00	44.00	83.00	

**Bid #16-340-048 - Fire Suppression Services**  
**Category III - Fire Extinguishers (Continued)**  
**Evaluation**

			(A) Tri-Signal Integration	(B) Foothill Fire Protection	(C) Systems Tech Fire Protection	(D) Jorgensen Co.	(E) COSCO Fire Protection	(F) Hangtown Fire Control, Inc.	(G) Legacy Fire Protection
<b>Bid Item #</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>U/L Rating</b>							
120	Vehicle Bracket – 2.5# Spring Clip	each	10.31			15.00	12.20	14.25	
121	Vehicle Bracket – 5# Spring Clip	each	11.91			15.00	12.75	26.00	
122	Vehicle Bracket – 10# Spring Clip	each	24.25			15.00	12.75	40.00	
123	ABC, D, PK & BC Chemical	per lb.	5.00			4.50	1.10	5.50	
124	CO2	per lb.	3.00			1.00	1.75	2.25	
125	Amerex Class K Recharge Chemical	per 6 liters	300.00			75.00	110.50	101.00	
126	Halon 1221 Agent	per lb.	30.00			35.00	5.00	35.00	
124	Pin	each	2.00			1.50	0.75	1.50	
128	Nozzle	each	6.26			5.00	6.50	4.25	
129	Gauge	each	18.00			10.00	4.50	7.25	
130	Hose	each	21.48			15.00	8.50	12.00	
131	Valve Stem (Common)	each	16.00			10.00	25.00	7.75	
132	Valve Stem Halon	each	32.00			10.00	75.00	10.25	
133	Wall Mount (Common)	each	2.00			5.00	3.95	5.75	
134	Wall Mount for 10# Unit	each	2.00			5.00	5.95	11.50	
135	“O” Ring	each	1.00			2.00	0.50	2.00	
136	Handle	each	7.00			12.00	5.50	6.50	
137	Clip and Strap	each	4.00			5.00	2.50	5.75	
138	Fire Extinguisher Arrow Sign (small or regular size)	each	3.00			5.00	4.00	5.50	
139	Specialty Signs	each	3.00			20.00	4.00	17.00	
140	Brass Cabinet Lock	each	5.00			10.00	8.00	5.50	
141	Plexi-Break Glass for Cabinet	each	13.00			12.00	8.00	15.75	
142	Hazardous Materials Charge for Shipped Extinguishers	each	50.00			5.00	9.75	35.00	
143	Freight Charges for Shipped Extinguishers	each	35.00			5.00	7.50	40.00	
	<b>Total - Fire Extinguishers Parts &amp; Materials</b>		<b>\$ 880.80</b>	-	-	<b>\$ 491.00</b>	<b>\$ 496.45</b>	<b>\$ 782.00</b>	
	<b>Totals By Bidder</b>		<b>3,783.80</b>	-	-	<b>\$ 2,216.00</b>	<b>\$ 2,458.30</b>	<b>\$ 3,815.25</b>	