Bid #07-070-068
(B) Full Size Sport Utility Vehicle, 4 Wheel Drive, 4 Door

Qty: 1

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

So Shore Motors
So. Lake Tahoe, CA

Placerville Ford
Placerville, CA

Family Chevrolet
Shingle Springs, CA

Broadway Ford
Oakland, CA

Maita Chevrolet
Elk Grove, CA

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.
5% LVP Disc.
Evaluate

Meets Specs

Bid Price

No Bid

Bid Price: $ 26,374.00 Final order date 4/10/07
Terms Disc. $

5% LVP Disc. $ 1,318.70

Evaluate | 25,055.30 |

Meets Specs

Bid Price: $ 33,985.00 Final order date 3/15/07
Terms Disc. 500/20 days $ 500.00

5% LVP Disc. $ 1,699.25

Evaluate $ 31,785.75

Meets Specs No Bid modified after bid opening
Bid Price:

Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Meets Specs No Bid

Bid Price:
Terms Disc.
5% LVP Disc.
Evaluate



Bid #07-070-068
(B-2) Full Size Sport Utility Vehicle, 4 Wheel Drive, 4 Door

Qty: 7

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

So Shore Motors
So. Lake Tahoe, CA

Placerville Ford
Placerville, CA

Family Chevrolet
Shingle Springs, CA

Broadway Ford
Oakland, CA

Maita Chevrolet
Elk Grove, CA

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Bid Price
No Bid
Final order date 4/23/07
$ 26,627.00
$
$ 1,331.35
s 25,295.65 |
$ 33,985.00 Final order date 3/15/07
500/20 days $ 500.00
$ 1,699.25
$ 31,785.75
No Bid modified after bid opening
No Bid



Bid #07-070-068
(C) Mini Cargo Van, 2 Wheel Drive,

Qty: 1 Bid Price
VENDOR: So Shore Motors Meets Specs No Bid
So. Lake Tahoe, CA Bid Price:
Terms Disc.
5% LVP Disc.
Evaluate

VENDOR: Placerville Ford
Placerville, CA Meets Specs No Bid
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.
5% LVP Disc.
Evaluate

VENDOR: Family Chevrolet
Shingle Springs, CA Meets Specs
Bid Price: No Bid
Terms Disc.
5% LVP Disc.
Evaluate

VENDOR: Broadway Ford
Oakland, CA Meets Specs No Bid modified after bid opening
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.
5% LVP Disc.
Evaluate

VENDOR: Maita Chevrolet
Elk Grove, CA Meets Specs No Bid
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.
5% LVP Disc.
Evaluate



Bid #07-070-068
(D) Mini Cargo Van, 2 Wheel Drive,

Qty: 1 Bid Price
VENDOR: So Shore Motors Meets Specs No Bid
So. Lake Tahoe, CA Bid Price:
Terms Disc.
5% LVP Disc.
Evaluate

VENDOR: Placerville Ford
Placerville, CA Meets Specs No Bid
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.
5% LVP Disc.
Evaluate

VENDOR: Family Chevrolet
Shingle Springs, CA Meets Specs
Bid Price: No Bid
Terms Disc.
5% LVP Disc.
Evaluate

VENDOR: Broadway Ford
Oakland, CA Meets Specs No Bid modified after bid opening
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.
5% LVP Disc.
Evaluate

VENDOR: Maita Chevrolet
Elk Grove, CA Meets Specs No Bid
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.
5% LVP Disc.
Evaluate



Bid #07-070-068
(E) Mini Cargo Van, 2 Wheel Drive, 7 Passenger

Qty: 3

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

So Shore Motors
So. Lake Tahoe, CA

Placerville Ford
Placerville, CA

Family Chevrolet
Shingle Springs, CA

Broadway Ford
Oakland, CA

Maita Chevrolet
Elk Grove, CA

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Bid Price

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No

No Bid

Bid modified after bid opening



Bid #07-070-068

(F) Mini Van, 7 Passenger, 4WD

Qty: 1

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

So Shore Motors
So. Lake Tahoe, CA

Placerville Ford
Placerville, CA

Family Chevrolet
Shingle Springs, CA

Broadway Ford
Oakland, CA

Maita Chevrolet
Elk Grove, CA

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Bid Price

No Bid

No Bid

No

No Bid

No Bid

Over write on bid price



Bid #07-070-068
(G) Mini Cargo Van, 4WD

Qty: 1

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

So Shore Motors
So. Lake Tahoe, CA

Placerville Ford
Placerville, CA

Family Chevrolet
Shingle Springs, CA

Broadway Ford
Oakland, CA

Maita Chevrolet
Elk Grove, CA

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

500/20

Bid Price

No Bid

No Bid

No

No Bid

No Bid

Over write on bid price



Bid #07-070-068
(H) Cab & Chassis, 3/4 Ton, 2WD, Standard Cab

Qty: 2

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

So Shore Motors
So. Lake Tahoe, CA

Placerville Ford
Placerville, CA

Family Chevrolet
Shingle Springs, CA

Broadway Ford
Oakland, CA

Maita Chevrolet
Elk Grove, CA

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Bid Price
$ 16,894.07
$ 844.70

s 16,049.37 |

$ 17,054.00

$ 852.70
$ 16,201.30

No Overwrite on bid price
No Bid modified after bid opening
No Bid



Bid #07-070-068
(I) Sport Utility Vehicle, Midsize, 4 Wheel Drive, 4 Door

Qty: 0 Cancelled by Fleet

VENDOR: So Shore Motors Meets Specs
So. Lake Tahoe, CA Bid Price:
Terms Disc.
5% LVP Disc.
Evaluate

VENDOR: Placerville Ford
Placerville, CA Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.
5% LVP Disc.
Evaluate

VENDOR: Family Chevrolet
Shingle Springs, CA Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.
5% LVP Disc.
Evaluate

VENDOR: Broadway Ford
Oakland, CA Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.
5% LVP Disc.
Evaluate

VENDOR: Maita Chevrolet
Elk Grove, CA Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.
5% LVP Disc.
Evaluate



Bid #07-070-068
(J) Sport Utility Vehicle, Midsize, 4WD, 4 Door

Qty: 19

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

So Shore Motors
So. Lake Tahoe, CA

Placerville Ford
Placerville, CA

Family Chevrolet
Shingle Springs, CA

Broadway Ford
Oakland, CA

Maita Chevrolet
Elk Grove, CA

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Bid Price
$ 22,754.90
$ 1,137.75
$ 21,617.16
Final order date 5/14/07
$ 22,712.00
$ 1,135.60
|'s 21,576.40 |
No Overwrite on bid form
No Bid modified after bid opening
No Bid



Bid #07-070-068
(K) Sport Utility Vehicle, Midsize, 2WD, 4 Door

Qty: 10

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

So Shore Motors
So. Lake Tahoe, CA

Placerville Ford
Placerville, CA

Family Chevrolet
Shingle Springs, CA

Broadway Ford
Oakland, CA

Maita Chevrolet
Elk Grove, CA

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Bid Price

$ 20,711.90

@ ¥

$ 20,569.00

$ 1,028.45
$ 19,540.55
No

No

No Bid

1,035.60
19,676.31

Final order date 5/14/07

Change in bid price not initialed

Bid modified after bid opening



Bid #07-070-068

(L) Pick-up Truck, Compact, 2 Wheel Drive, Regular Cab

Qty: 5

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

So Shore Motors
So. Lake Tahoe, CA

Placerville Ford
Placerville, CA

Family Chevrolet
Shingle Springs, CA

Broadway Ford
Oakland, CA

Maita Chevrolet
Elk Grove, CA

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Bid Price

$ 12,778.90

$ 638.95

$ 12,139.96

$ 12,524.00 Final order date 4/9/07

$ 626.20

|'s 11,897.80 |
No Overwrite on bid price
No Bid modified after bid opening
No Bid



Bid #07-070-068
(M) Pick-up Truck, 2 Wheel Drive, 1/2 Ton, Super Cab, Long Bed

Qty: 3 Bid Price
VENDOR: So Shore Motors Meets Specs
So. Lake Tahoe, CA Bid Price: $ 16,996.90
Terms Disc.
5% LVP Disc. $ 849.85
Evaluate s  16,147.06 |
VENDOR: Placerville Ford
Placerville, CA Meets Specs
Bid Price: $ 17,003.00
Terms Disc.
5% LVP Disc. $ 850.15
Evaluate $ 16,152.85

VENDOR: Family Chevrolet
Shingle Springs, CA Meets Specs No Overwrite on bid price
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.
5% LVP Disc.
Evaluate

VENDOR: Broadway Ford
Oakland, CA Meets Specs No Bid modified after bid opening
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.
5% LVP Disc.
Evaluate

VENDOR: Maita Chevrolet
Elk Grove, CA Meets Specs No Bid
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.
5% LVP Disc.
Evaluate



Bid #07-070-068
(N) Pick-up Truck, 2 Wheel Drive, 3/4 Ton, Standard Cab, Long Bed

Qty: 3

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

So Shore Motors
So. Lake Tahoe, CA

Placerville Ford
Placerville, CA

Family Chevrolet
Shingle Springs, CA

Broadway Ford
Oakland, CA

Maita Chevrolet
Elk Grove, CA

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Bid Price
$ 17,744.07
$ 887.20
$ 16,856.87

$ 17,517.00

$ 875.85
|'s 16,641.15 |

$ 19,885.00 Final order date 3/26/07
$ 994.25
$ 18,890.75

No Bid modified after bid opening

No Bid



Bid #07-070-068
(O) Pick-up Truck, Compact, 4 Wheel Drive, 3/4 Ton, Standard Bed & Cab

Qty: 1 Bid Price
VENDOR: So Shore Motors Meets Specs
So. Lake Tahoe, CA Bid Price: $ 14,375.90
Terms Disc.
5% LVP Disc. $ 718.80
Evaluate $ 13,657.11

VENDOR: Placerville Ford
Placerville, CA Meets Specs
Bid Price: $ 14,217.00
Terms Disc.
5% LVP Disc. $ 710.85
Evaluate | 13,506.15 |

VENDOR: Family Chevrolet
Shingle Springs, CA Meets Specs No Overwrite on bid price
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.
5% LVP Disc.
Evaluate

VENDOR: Broadway Ford
Oakland, CA Meets Specs No Bid modified after bid opening
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.
5% LVP Disc.
Evaluate

VENDOR: Maita Chevrolet
Elk Grove, CA Meets Specs No Bid
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.
5% LVP Disc.
Evaluate



Bid #07-070-068
(P) Pick-up Truck, Compact, 4 Wheel Drive, 1/2 Ton, Short Bed, Extra Cab

Qty: 2

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

So Shore Motors
So. Lake Tahoe, CA

Placerville Ford
Placerville, CA

Family Chevrolet
Shingle Springs, CA

Broadway Ford
Oakland, CA

Maita Chevrolet
Elk Grove, CA

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Bid Price

$ 19,599.90

$ 980.00
$ 18,619.91

$ 19,968.00

998.40
18,969.60

&

No

No

No Bid

No initials on change of bid price

Bid modified after bid opening



Bid #07-070-068
(Q) Pick-up Truck, Compact, 4 Wheel Drive, 1/2 Ton, Long Bed, Standard Cab

Qty: 2

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

So Shore Motors
So. Lake Tahoe, CA

Placerville Ford
Placerville, CA

Family Chevrolet
Shingle Springs, CA

Broadway Ford
Oakland, CA

Maita Chevrolet
Elk Grove, CA

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Bid Price
$ 17,623.90
$ 881.20
$ 16,742.71
$ 17,497.00
$ 874.85
B 16,622.15 |
$ 20,685.00
500/20 day: $ 500.00
$ 1,034.25
$ 19,150.75
No
No Bid

Final order date 3/26/07

Bid modified after bid opening



Bid #07-070-068
(R) Cab & Chassis, 3/4 Ton

Qty: 1

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

So Shore Motors
So. Lake Tahoe, CA

Placerville Ford
Placerville, CA

Family Chevrolet
Shingle Springs, CA

Broadway Ford
Oakland, CA

Maita Chevrolet
Elk Grove, CA

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Bid Price

17,546.07

877.30

$ 16,668.77

19,816.00

990.80
18,825.20

No

No

No Bid

No intials on change of bid price

Bid modified after bid opening



Bid #07-070-068
(S) Pick-up Truck, 3/4 Ton, 4 Wheel Drive, Long Bed, Standard Cab

Qty: 1

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

So Shore Motors
So. Lake Tahoe, CA

Placerville Ford
Placerville, CA

Family Chevrolet
Shingle Springs, CA

Broadway Ford
Oakland, CA

Maita Chevrolet
Elk Grove, CA

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Bid Price
$ 20,442.07
$ 1,022.10
$ 19,419.97

$ 19,549.00

$ 977.45
|'s 18,571.55 |

No Overwrite on bid price
No Bid modified after bid opening
No Bid



Bid #07-070-068

(T) Cab & Chassis, 3/4 Ton, 4 Wheel Drive, Standard Cab

Qty: 1

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

So Shore Motors
So. Lake Tahoe, CA

Placerville Ford
Placerville, CA

Family Chevrolet
Shingle Springs, CA

Broadway Ford
Oakland, CA

Maita Chevrolet
Elk Grove, CA

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Bid Price

$ 19,996.07

$ 999.80

$ 18,996.27

$ 19,477.00

$ 973.85

|'s 18,503.15 |
No Tow package not included
No Bid modified after bid opening
No Bid



Bid #07-070-068
(U) Pick-up Truck, 3/4 Ton, 4 Wheel Drive, Long Bed, Extra Cab

Qty: 1 Bid Price
VENDOR: So Shore Motors Meets Specs
So. Lake Tahoe, CA Bid Price: $ 22,784.07
Terms Disc.
5% LVP Disc. $ 1,139.20
Evaluate $ 21,644.87

VENDOR: Placerville Ford
Placerville, CA Meets Specs
Bid Price: $ 22,517.00
Terms Disc.
5% LVP Disc. $ 1,125.85
Evaluate | s 21,391.15 |

VENDOR: Family Chevrolet
Shingle Springs, CA Meets Specs No Overwrite on bid price
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.
5% LVP Disc.
Evaluate

VENDOR: Broadway Ford
Oakland, CA Meets Specs No Bid modified after bid opening
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.
5% LVP Disc.
Evaluate

VENDOR: Maita Chevrolet
Elk Grove, CA Meets Specs No Bid
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.
5% LVP Disc.
Evaluate



Bid #07-070-068
(V) Pick-up Truck, 3/4 Ton, 4 Wheel Drive, Long Bed, Extended Cab

Qty: 1

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

So Shore Motors
So. Lake Tahoe, CA

Placerville Ford
Placerville, CA

Family Chevrolet
Shingle Springs, CA

Broadway Ford
Oakland, CA

Maita Chevrolet
Elk Grove, CA

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Bid Price

No Specification form not complete

$ 22,517.00

$ 1,125.85
|'s 21,391.15 |

No Overwrite on bid price
No Bid modified after bid opening
No Bid



Bid #07-070-068
(W) Pick-up Truck, 1 Ton, 4 Wheel Drive, Long Bed, Extra Cab

Qty: 1

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

So Shore Motors
So. Lake Tahoe, CA

Placerville Ford
Placerville, CA

Family Chevrolet
Shingle Springs, CA

Broadway Ford
Oakland, CA

Maita Chevrolet
Elk Grove, CA

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Bid Price

$ 23,577.07

$ 1,178.85

$ 22,398.22

$ 23,468.00

$ 1,173.40

|'s 22,294.60 |
No No initials on change of bid price
No Bid modified after bid opening
No Bid



Bid #07-070-068
(X) Pick-up Truck, 1 Ton, 4 Wheel Drive, Long Bed

Qty: 2

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

So Shore Motors
So. Lake Tahoe, CA

Placerville Ford
Placerville, CA

Family Chevrolet
Shingle Springs, CA

Broadway Ford
Oakland, CA

Maita Chevrolet
Elk Grove, CA

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Bid Price
$ 21,568.07
$ 1,078.40
$ 20,489.67
$ 21,169.00
$ 1,058.45
|'s 20,110.55 |
No
No
No Bid

Overwrite on bid price

Bid modified after bid opening



Bid #07-070-068
(Y) Pick-up Truck, 3/4 Ton, 4 Wheel Drive, Long Bed

Qty: 1 Bid Price
VENDOR: So Shore Motors Meets Specs
So. Lake Tahoe, CA Bid Price: $ 26,732.46
Terms Disc.
5% LVP Disc. $ 1,336.62
Evaluate $ 25,395.84

VENDOR: Placerville Ford

Placerville, CA Meets Specs
Bid Price: $ 26,067.00
Terms Disc.
5% LVP Disc. $ 1,303.35
Evaluate s 24,763.65 |
VENDOR: Family Chevrolet
Shingle Springs, CA Meets Specs
Bid Price: $ 30,985.00 Final order date 3/26/07
Terms Disc. 500/20 $ 500.00
5% LVP Disc. $ 1,549.25
Evaluate $ 28,935.75
VENDOR: Broadway Ford
Oakland, CA Meets Specs
Bid Price: $ 25,000.10
Terms Disc.
5% LVP Disc.
Evaluate $ 25,000.10
VENDOR: Maita Chevrolet
Elk Grove, CA Meets Specs No Bid
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.
Evaluate



Bid #07-070-068
(2) Pick-up Truck, 1 Ton, 4 Wheel Drive, Short Bed, 4 Doors, Crew Cab

Qty: 1 Bid Price
VENDOR: So Shore Motors Meets Specs
So. Lake Tahoe, CA Bid Price: $ 30,544.90
Terms Disc.
5% LVP Disc. $ 1,527.25
Evaluate $ 29,017.66

VENDOR: Placerville Ford
Placerville, CA Meets Specs
Bid Price: $ 30,146.00
Terms Disc.
5% LVP Disc. $ 1,507.30
Evaluate | s 28,638.70 |

VENDOR: Family Chevrolet
Shingle Springs, CA Meets Specs No 3/4Tonvs 1Ton
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.
5% LVP Disc.
Evaluate

VENDOR: Broadway Ford

Oakland, CA Meets Specs
Bid Price: $ 28,989.60
Terms Disc.
5% LVP Disc.
Evaluate $ 28,989.60

VENDOR: Maita Chevrolet
Elk Grove, CA Meets Specs No Bid
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.
5% LVP Disc.
Evaluate



Bid #07-070-068
(AA) Cab & Chassis, 3/4 Ton, 4 Wheel Drive

Qty: 1

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

So Shore Motors
So. Lake Tahoe, CA

Placerville Ford
Placerville, CA

Family Chevrolet
Shingle Springs, CA

Broadway Ford
Oakland, CA

Maita Chevrolet
Elk Grove, CA

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Bid Price
$ 26,520.40
$ 1,326.02
$ 25,194.38
$ 25,854.00
$ 1,292.70
B 24,561.30 |
No Tow package not included
$ 24,650.10
$ 24,650.10
No Bid



Bid #07-070-068
(BB) Sedan, Midsize, 4 Door

Qty: 19

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

So Shore Motors
So. Lake Tahoe, CA

Placerville Ford
Placerville, CA

Family Chevrolet
Shingle Springs, CA

Broadway Ford
Oakland, CA

Maita Chevrolet
Elk Grove, CA

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Bid Price

$ 18,448.40

$ 922.42

$ 17,525.98

$ 18,425.00

$ 921.25

$ 17,503.75
No No initials on change of bid price
No Bid modified after bid opening

$ 15,139.00 Final order date 4/20/07

500/20 days $ 500.00
s 14,639.00 |




Bid #07-070-068
(CC) Cargo Van, 1 Ton

Qty: 1 Bid Price
VENDOR: So Shore Motors Meets Specs
So. Lake Tahoe, CA Bid Price: $ 16,378.19
Terms Disc.
5% LVP Disc. $ 818.91
Evaluate $ 15,559.28

VENDOR: Placerville Ford
Placerville, CA Meets Specs
Bid Price: $ 16,306.00
Terms Disc.
5% LVP Disc. $ 815.30
Evaluate | 15,490.70 |

VENDOR: Family Chevrolet
Shingle Springs, CA Meets Specs No Overwrite on bid price
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.
5% LVP Disc.
Evaluate

VENDOR: Broadway Ford
Oakland, CA Meets Specs No Bid modified after bid opening
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.
5% LVP Disc.
Evaluate

VENDOR: Maita Chevrolet

Elk Grove, CA Meets Specs
Bid Price: $ 20,549.00 Final order date 3/23/07
Terms Disc. 500/20 $ 500.00

5% LVP Disc.
Evaluate $ 20,049.00



Bid #07-070-068
(DD) Hybrid Sedan, 4 Door,

Qty: 1

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

So Shore Motors
So. Lake Tahoe, CA

Placerville Ford
Placerville, CA

Family Chevrolet
Shingle Springs, CA

Broadway Ford
Oakland, CA

Maita Chevrolet
Elk Grove, CA

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Meets Specs
Bid Price:
Terms Disc.

5% LVP Disc.

Evaluate

Bid Price

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid



