
Bid #11-680-013 Ammunition
Evaluation*

Description # of Rounds 
(Thousands) # of Cases Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension

.40 cal 180 grain #RA40T                              
(500 rounds per case)

20 40 No Bid 165.00$    6,600.00$       No Bid

12 gauge 1 oz slug # X12RS15                      
(250 rounds per case)

6 24 No Bid 132.50$    3,180.00$       No Bid

12 Gauge 12 pellet, #X12XCOB5                  
( 250 rounds per case)

6 24 No Bid 166.67$    4,000.08$       No Bid

Subtotal 13,780.08$     
Less 5% LVP N/A -$                
Less Terms Discount Net 30 -$                
Evaluation No Bid 13,780.08$     No Bid

Description # of Rounds 
(Thousands) # of Cases Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension

5.56mm 55 grain, MCBT M193 Ball 
Ammunition  #XM193AF                                 
(900 rounds per case)

100 111 No Bid No Bid 264.05$    29,338.89$        

.308 Win Tactical Bonded 165 grain 
#LE308T1  (200 rounds per case) 5 25 No Bid No Bid 272.97$    6,824.25$          

HST .40 cal 180 grain JHP #P40HST1        
(1,000 rounds per case) 75 75 No Bid No Bid 269.42$    20,206.50$        

American Eagle .40 cal. 180 grain FMJ 
#AE40R1                                                        
(1,000 rounds per case) 

200 200 No Bid No Bid 203.81$    40,762.00$        

HST .45 ACP cal 230 grain +PJHP 
#P45HST1                                                      
(1,000 rounds per case) 

25 25 No Bid No Bid 316.89$    7,922.25$          

2 3/4" 12 gauge Rifle Slug  #F130RS             
(250 rounds per case) 6 24 No Bid No Bid 105.26$    2,526.24$          

.45 ACP, 230 grain FMJ #AE45A                   
(1,000 rounds per case) 12 12 No Bid No Bid 257.92$    3,095.04$          

.38 Special, 130 grain, FMJ #AE38K             
(1,000 rounds per case) 4 4 No Bid No Bid 208.13$    832.52$             

(B) Adamson Police 
Products                

Hayward, CA

(C) San Diego Police 
Equipment               

San Diego, CA

Adamson Police Products 
Hayward, CA

San Diego Police 
Equipment  San Diego, CA

(A) Lawmen's & Shooters 
Supply            Vero 

Beach,FL

Category II:  Federal Ammunition

Category I:  Winchester Ammunition

(A) Lawmen's & Shooters 
Supply  Vero Beach,FL
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12 Gauge Classic 12 pellet, OO buckshot # 
F-130-00                                                         
(250 rounds per case) 

8 32 No Bid No Bid 176.09$    5,634.88$          

12 Gauge, premium 12 pellet, OO #P-156-
00                                                                    
(250 rounds per case)

8 32 No Bid No Bid 239.85$    7,675.20$          

.223 Remington 55 grain, FMJBT 
#AE223AF                                                      
(900 rounds per case)

80 89 No Bid No Bid 264.05$    23,471.11$        

9-Pellet Low Recoil Tactical Buckshot 
#LE13200                                                       
(250 rounds per case)

1 4 No Bid No Bid 103.57$    414.28$             

Tactical Rifled Shotgun Slug #LEB127LRS   
(250 rounds per case)

1 4 No Bid No Bid 119.76$    479.04$             

.223, SP 55 grain #T223A                            
( 500 rounds per case) 1 2 No Bid No Bid 258.36$    516.72$             

.308 cal SP 168 grain #T308H                      
(200 rounds per case) 1 5 No Bid No Bid 184.19$    920.95$             

Subtotal 150,619.87$      
Less 5% LVP N/A -$                  
Less Terms Discount Net 30 -$                  
Evaluation No Bid No Bid 150,619.87$      

Description # of Rounds 
(Thousands) # of Cases Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension

.223 Rem. 55 grain TAP #83276HP               
(200 rounds per case) 20 100 114.64$    11,464.00$     139.66$    13,966.00$     No Bid

.308 Win-A-Max TAP 168 grain # 80965 
(200 rounds per case) 12 60 177.46$    10,647.60$     228.20$    13,692.00$     No Bid

Subtotal 22,111.60$     27,658.00$     
Less 5% LVP N/A -$               -$                
Less Terms Discount Net 30 -$               -$                
Evaluation 22,111.60$     27,658.00$     No Bid

Adamson Police Products 
Hayward, CA

San Diego Police 
Equipment  San Diego, CA

(A) Lawmen's & Shooters 
Supply  Vero Beach,FLCategory III:  Hornady Ammunition
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Description # of Rounds 
(Thousands) # of Cases Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension

.22 Long Rifle stinger (GLHP) #0050             
(5,000 rounds per case) 5 1 No Bid No Bid 313.05$    313.05$             

Speer Gold Dot .38 special +P 135 grain 
GDHP #53921                                                
( 1,000 rounds per case)

2 2 No Bid No Bid 235.12$    470.24$             

Blazer .38 Special +P 158 grain TMJ #3519  
( 1,000 rounds per case)

4 4 No Bid No Bid 209.07$    836.28$             

Speer Lawman .38 Special +P 158 grain, 
TMJ # 53833                                                   
(1,000 rounds per case)

4 4 No Bid No Bid 208.59$    834.36$             

Subtotal 2,453.93$          
Less 5% LVP N/A -$                  
Less Terms Discount Net 30 -$                  
Evaluation No Bid No Bid 2,453.93$          

Description # of Rounds 
(Thousands) # of Cases Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension

9MM Luger 115 grain, FMJ #9A                     
(1,000 rounds per case) 1 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Subtotal -$                  
Less 5% LVP  -$                  
Less Terms Discount  -$                  
Evaluation No Bid No Bid No Bid

* Evaluation is exclusive of sales tax

Adamson Police Products 
Hayward, CA

San Diego Police 
Equipment  San Diego, CA

Adamson Police Products 
Hayward, CA

San Diego Police 
Equipment  San Diego, CA

(A) Lawmen's & Shooters 
Supply  Vero Beach,FL

Category IV:  MagTech
(A) Lawmen's & Shooters 

Supply  Vero Beach,FL

Category IV:  CCI Ammunition
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Bid #09-680-018 Ammunition
Evaluation*

Category I:  Winchester Ammunition

Description Quantity (Thousands) Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension

.223 Rem. 55 grain FMJ 100 -$             -$               -$             -$             -$             -$             -$             -$             -$             -$             -$             -$             
Point 50 499.00$       24,950.00$    -$             -$             -$             -$             -$             -$             -$             -$             -$             -$             
.40 cal 180 grain 50 330.00$       16,500.00$    -$             -$             -$             -$             -$             -$             -$             -$             -$             -$             

Subtotal 41,450.00$    -$             -$             -$             -$             -$             

Less 5% LVP
Less Terms Discount

Evaluation 41,450.00$    -$             -$             -$             -$             -$             

*Evaluation is exclusive of sales tax.

Advanced Tactical Supply 
LLC

Santa Maria, CA

San Diego Police Equipment 
Co.,Inc.

San Diego, CA

Lawmen's Shooters' Supply

Vero Beach, FL

Adamson Police Products

Hayward, CA

Botech Tactical

Los Angeles, CA

LC Action Police supply

San Jose, CA
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Bid #09-680-018 Ammunition
Evaluation*

Category II:  Federal Ammunition

Description Quantity (Thousands) Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension

.223 Rem. TRU 223 64 grain 
SP

40 -$             -$             -$             -$             -$             -$             -$             -$             581.74$        23,269.60$           -$             -$             

.308 Win Tactical Bonded 
165 grain

2.5 -$             -$             -$             -$             -$             -$             -$             -$             680.00$        1,700.00$            -$             -$             

HST .40 cal 180 grain JHP 100 -$             -$             -$             -$             -$             -$             -$             -$             264.89$        26,489.00$           -$             -$             
HST .45 ACP cal 230 grain 
+PJHP

10 -$             -$             -$             -$             -$             -$             -$             -$             319.21$        3,192.10$            -$             -$             

Subtotal -$             -$             -$             -$             54,650.70$           -$             

Less 5% LVP
Less Terms Discount

Evaluation -$             -$             -$             -$             54,650.70$           -$             

*Evaluation is exclusive of sales tax.

Lawmen's Shooters' Supply

Vero Beach, FL

San Diego Police Equipment 
Co.,Inc.

San Diego, CA

Advanced Tactical Supply 
LLC

Santa Maria, CA

Adamson Police Products

Hayward, CA

Botech Tactical

Los Angeles, CA

LC Action Police supply

San Jose, CA
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Bid #09-680-018 Ammunition
Evaluation*

Category III:  Hornady Ammunition

Description Quantity (Thousands) Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension

.308 Win-A-Max TAP 168 
grain 10 -$             -$             465.17$       4,651.70$        -$             -$             485.00$       4,850.00$    -$             -$             437.50$       4,375.00$    

Subtotal -$             4,651.70$        -$             4,850.00$    -$             4,375.00$    

Less 5% LVP
Less Terms Discount 87.50$         

Evaluation -$             4,651.70$        -$             4,850.00$    -$             4,287.50$    

*Evaluation is exclusive of sales tax.

Lawmen's Shooters' Supply

Vero Beach, FL

San Diego Police Equipment 
Co.,Inc.

San Diego, CA

Advanced Tactical Supply 
LLC

Santa Maria, CA

Adamson Police Products

Hayward, CA

Botech Tactical

Los Angeles, CA

LC Action Police supply

San Jose, CA
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Bid #09-680-018 Ammunition
Evaluation*

Category IV:  Remington Ammunition

Description Quantity 
(Thousands) Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension

12 gauge 2 3/4" Tac 00 
Buckshot 5 -$           -$                -$         -$               142.85$     714.25$          -$         -$                -$         -$                -$            -$                

12 gauge 2 3/4" reduced 
recoil slug 1 -$           -$                -$         -$               114.02$     114.02$          -$         -$                -$         -$                -$            -$                

Subtotal -$                -$               828.27$          -$                -$                -$                

Less 5% LVP
Less Terms Discount

Evaluation -$                -$               828.27$          -$                -$                -$                

*Evaluation is exclusive of sales tax.

Lawmen's Shooters' Supply

Vero Beach, FL

San Diego Police 
Equipment Co.,Inc.

San Diego, CA

Advanced Tactical Supply 
LLC

Santa Maria, CA

Adamson Police Products

Hayward, CA

Botech Tactical

Los Angeles, CA

LC Action Police supply

San Jose, CA
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Bid #09-680-018 Ammunition
Evaluation*

Category V:  Hornady Ammunition

Description Quantity     
(Thousands) Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension

.223 Rem. 75 grain 20 -$        -$                589.00$       11,780.00$     -$         -$                620.00$   12,400.00$           -$         -$                625.00$       12,500.00$           

.223 Rem., 60 grain 20 -$        -$                589.00$       11,780.00$     -$         -$                620.00$   12,400.00$           -$         -$                625.00$       12,500.00$           

Subtotal -$                23,560.00$     -$                24,800.00$           -$                25,000.00$           

Less 5% LVP
Less Terms Discount 500.00$                 

Evaluation -$                23,560.00$     -$                24,800.00$           -$                24,500.00$           

*Evaluation is exclusive of sales tax.

Lawmen's Shooters' Supply

Vero Beach, FL

San Diego Police 
Equipment Co.,Inc.

San Diego, CA
Advanced Tactical Supply LLC

Santa Maria, CA

Adamson Police Products

Hayward, CA

Botech Tactical

Los Angeles, CA

LC Action Police supply

San Jose, CA
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Bid #09-680-018 Ammunition
Evaluation*

Category VI:  Federal Ammunition

Description Quantity 
(Thousands) Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension

5.56mm 55 grain MCBT 
M193 Ball

100 -$             -$               -$        -$               -$          -$               -$        -$               353.66$    35,366.00$           -$           -$               

.223 Rem., 55 grain, FMJ 100 -$             -$               -$        -$               -$          -$               -$        -$               379.66$    37,966.00$           -$           -$               

Subtotal -$               -$               -$               -$               73,332.00$           -$               

Less 5% LVP
Less Terms Discount

Evaluation -$               -$               -$               -$               73,332.00$           -$               

*Evaluation is exclusive of sales tax.

Lawmen's Shooters' Supply

Vero Beach, FL

San Diego Police Equipment 
Co.,Inc.

San Diego, CA

Advanced Tactical Supply 
LLC

Santa Maria, CA

Adamson Police Products

Hayward, CA

Botech Tactical

Los Angeles, CA

LC Action Police supply

San Jose, CA
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