
Bid # 11-405-24 - Diesel Fuel
* Evaluation

Location/Category

Category I - Equip/Vehicle Tanks - (West 
Slope)  

DOT Placerville - Headington Rd 2.9125$            0.10 3.0125 2.9125$            0.15 3.0625             2.9125$            0.0525 2.9650         2.9125$            0.0452 2.9577        2.9125$            0.036 2.9485             
Winterization Additive 0.12 0.1200 0.025 0.0250             0.0164 0.0164         0.06 0.0600        0.01 0.0100             
Sub total 3.1325 3.0875             2.9814         3.0177        2.9585             
Local Vendor Preference 0.0000 0.0500 (0.1544)            0.0000 -              0.0000 -              0.0000 -                  
Terms Discount 0.0000 0.0050 (0.0154)            0.0000 -              0.0000 -              0.0000 -                  

Net Total 3.1325 2.9177$          2.9814$       3.0177$      2.9585$          

Category II - Equip/Vehicle Tanks - 
(South Shore Locations)

DOT Meyers - Shakori Road 2.9125$            0.10 3.0125 2.9125$            0.26 3.1725             2.9125$            0.1065 3.0190         2.9125$            0.0691 2.9816        2.9125$            0.0696 2.9821             
Winterization Additive 0.12 0.1200 0.025 0.0250             0.0164 0.0164         0.06 0.0600        0.01 0.0100             
Sub total 3.1325 3.1975             3.0354         3.0416        2.9921             
Local Vendor Preference 0.00 0.0000 0.0500 -0.1599 0.0000 -              0.0000 -              0.0000 -                  
Terms Discount 0.00 0.0000 0.0050 -0.0160 0.0000 -              0.0000 -              0.0000 -                  

Net Total 3.1325 3.0216$          3.0354$       3.0416$      2.9921$          

Category III - Equip/Vehicle Tanks - 
(West Shore Locations)

DOT Tahoma - Wilson Road 2.9125$            0.30 3.2125 2.9125$            0.38 3.2925             2.9125$            No Bid No Bid 2.9125$            0.189 3.1015        2.9125$            0.3 3.2125             
Winterization Additive 0.32 0.3200 0.025 0.0250             0.29 0.2900        0.01 0.0100             
Sub total 3.5325 3.3175             3.3915        3.2225             
Local Vendor Preference 0.00 0.0000 0.0500 -0.1659  0.0000 -              0.0000 -                  
Terms Discount 0.00 0.0000 0.0050 -0.0166  0.0000 -              0.0000 -                  

Net Total 3.5325 3.1350$          No Bid 3.3915$      3.2225$          
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Category IV - Generator Fuel Tanks 
(West Slope Locations)

2441 Headington Road 2.9125$            0.30 3.2125 2.9125$            0.35 3.2625             2.9125$            0.445 3.3575         2.9125$            0.3989 3.3114        2.9125$            No Bid No Bid
Winterization Additive (All locations) 0.32 0.3200 0.025 0.0250             0.02 0.0200         0.29 3.6014         

360 Fair Lane (Building B 0.30 3.2125 0.35 3.2625 0.445 3.36             0.3989 3.3114 No Bid No Bid
Winterization Additive (All locations) 0.32 0.3200 0.32 0.3200 0.02 0.02             0.29 3.6014  

300 Forni Road, (Main Jail) 0.30 3.2125 0.35 3.2625 0.445 3.36             0.3989 3.3114 No Bid No Bid
Winterization Additive (All locations) 0.32 0.3200 0.32 0.3200 0.02 0.02             0.29 3.6014  

300 Fair Lane (Sheriff's Dept) 0.30 3.2125 0.3500 3.2625 0.4450 3.3575         0.3989 3.3114        No Bid No Bid
Winterization Additive (All locations) 0.32 0.3200 0.0250 0.0250 0.0200          0.0200 0.2900         3.6014   

Sub total 14.1300 13.7400        13.5100       14.4056 No Bid 
Local Vendor Preference 0.00 0.0000 0.0500 -0.6870 0.0000 -              0.0000 -                 
Terms Discount 0.00 0.0000 0.0050 -0.0687 0.0000 -              0.0000 -                

Net Total 14.1300 12.9843 13.5100$     14.4056$    No Bid

Category V - Generator Fuel Tanks (East 
Slope Locations)

1121 Shakori Road 2.9125$            0.30 3.2125 2.9125$            0.5 3.4125             2.9125$            No Bid No Bid 2.9125$            0.5489 3.4614        2.9125$            0.3 3.2125             
Winterization Additive (All locations) 0.32 3.5325 0.025 0.0250             0.2900 3.7514        0.0100 0.0100             

1051 Al Tahoe Blvd. 0.30 3.2125 0.4 3.3125 No Bid No Bid 0.1689 3.0814 0.3000 3.2125
Winterization Additive (All locations) 0.32 3.5325 0.025 0.0250 0.2900 3.3714 0.0100 0.0100

1041 Al Tahoe Blvd 0.30 3.2125 0.45 3.3625 No Bid No Bid 2.9125 0.3000 3.2125
Winterization Additive (All locations) 0.32 3.5325 0.025 0.0250 0.2900 3.2025 0.0100 0.0100

 
1360 Johnson Blvd. 0.30 3.2125 0.5000 3.4125 No Bid No Bid 2.9125        0.3000 3.2125             
Winterization Additive (All locations) 0.32 3.5325 0.0250 0.0250 0.2900         3.2025 0.0100             0.0100 

. .
Sub totaal 14.1300 13.6000 No Bid  No Bid       13.5278           12.8900 
Local Vendor Preference 0.0000 0.0500 -0.6800  0.0000 -              0.0000 -                  
Terms Discount 0.0000 0.0050 -0.0680  0.0000 -              0.0000 -                  

Net Total 14.1300 12.8520$        No Bid 13.5278$    12.8900$        

* Evaluation is exclusive of sales tax
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