

## The County of El Dorado Chief Administrative Office

Procurement & Contracts Division Phone (530)621-5830

TO: ALL BIDDERS

RE: BID # 23-288-016 High Performance - Cold Patch Mix - West Slope

The apparent low qualified bidders for the subject bid are:

Category "A" – Vulcan Materials Company of Roseville, CA. Category "B" – Crafco Incorporated of Chandler, AZ. Category "B-1" - Crafco Incorporated of Chandler, AZ.

A spreadsheet is attached for your review.

This item is scheduled to be heard by the Board of Supervisors on Tuesday, 11/8/2022. Board of Supervisors Policy C-17, Section 5.6.5, contains the procedure for the protest process. Copies are available upon request.

Following Board of Supervisors approval, a purchase contract will be issued for the awarded period.

This notification is posted on the following websites:

https:pbsystem.planetbids.com/portal/48157/portal-home

https://www.edcgov.us/Government/Contracts/Pages/Bid-Results.aspx

All bids are on file in the Procurement & Contracts Office and are available to review by appointment between 8:00 a.m. – 12:00 p.m. and 1:00 p.m. – 4:00 p.m., Monday through Friday.

For questions, please contact Rick Blake, Sr. Buyer (530) 621-5873.

Thank you for your participation in the competitive bid process.

Think Wine (0ct 20, 2022 15:19 PDT)

**Purchasing Agent** 

## Bid Evaluation #23-288-016 High Performance Cold Patch Mix - West Slope

HAULING EXPENSE C	ALCULATIO	N:		1995 - 115					1				
Cost of Driver/Truck				\$50.00/ho					·				
Average Speed 30 miles per hour													
Rate to Haul \$50.00 / 30 mph = \$1.67/mile Average Truck Capacity 12 tons													
VENDOR	(hauling)	Miles 1-Way	x	Round Trip	x	Hauling Rate	=	Mileage Cost per Round Trip	x	Number of Trips (204 tons @ 12 tons / trip)	=	Total Hauling	Product Bld
Vulcan Materials Co. Roseville. CA ARO		43	X	2	х	\$1.67	=	\$143 62	X	17	+	\$2.441.54	Power Patch 457302 \$10 Environmental Fee / Load
Crafco inc. Chandler. AZ 2 Days ARO		453	X	2	X	\$1.67	=	\$1.513.02	x	17	+	\$25,721.34	Crafco, Inc.
Granite Construciton Co Sacramento, CA ARO	).	32	X	2	X	\$1.67	=	\$106.88	x	17	+	\$1,816.96	EZ Street Asphalt
Raynguard Protective M Sacramento, CA 5-7 Days ARO	laterials	36	X	2	x	\$1.67	E	\$120.24	X	17	+	\$2,044.08	EZ Street Asphatt

VENDOR (pro	oduct)	Cost per Ton	X	Tons	=	Bid Total -	Terms Discount	=	Product Subtotal Bulk Cold Patch Mix	٠	Hauling	=	Evaluated Total
Vulcan Materials Co Roseville, CA		\$135.00	x	204	-	\$27,540.00 -	\$0.00	-	\$27,540.00	+	\$2,611.54 (Trus * \$15/tru-Env Fee	<u>م</u>	\$30,151.54
Crafco Inc. Chandler, AZ		\$215.00	x	204	-	\$43,860.00 -	\$0.00	=	\$43,860.00	+	\$0 00	B	\$43,860.00
Granite Construction Co Sacramento, CA		\$175.00	x	204	=	\$35,700,00 -	\$0.00		\$35,700.00	+	\$1.816.96	-	\$37,516.96
Raynguard Protective Mater Sacramento, CA	riais	\$0.00	х	204	=	\$0.00 -	\$0.00	=	\$0.00	+	\$0.00	E	NO BID

VENDOR (product	) Cost per Bag	X	Number of Bags	=	Bid Total -	Terms Discount	=	Product total Bagged Cold Patch Mix	Notes
Vulcan Materials Co Roseville, CA	\$0.00	х	400	=	\$0.00 -	\$0.00	Ħ)	\$0.00	NO BID
Crafco Inc. Chandler, AZ	\$17.50	x	480	=	\$8,400.00 -	\$0.00	=	\$B,400.00	50# Bags = 480 Bags
Granite Construciton Co. Sacramento, CA	\$0.00	X	400	=	\$0 00 •	\$0.00	=	\$0.00	NO BID
Raynguard Protective Materials Sacramento, CA	\$26 00	Х	480	=	\$12,480.00 -	\$0.00	=	\$12.480.00	50# Bags = 480 Bags

## Category "B-1": Bag County Pick-Up from Vendors Location. (Based on 24,000 Pounds)

VENDOR (p	roduct)	Cost per Bag	x	Number of Bags	=	Bid Total -	Terms Discount	=	Product Subtotal Bagged Cold Patch Mix	+	Hauling per Trip	-	Evaluated Total
Vulcan Materials Co. Roseville, CA 40# Bags		\$17.00	х	600	=:	\$10,200,00 -	\$0.00	=)	\$10,200.00	+	\$143 62	-	\$10,343.62
Cratco Inc. Chandier, AZ 50# Bags		\$15.50	х	480	5	\$7,440.00 -	\$0.00	=	\$7,440.00	+	\$1.513 02	=	\$8,953.02
Granite Construction Co. Sacramento, CA 60# Bags		\$0.00	X	400	-	\$0.00 -	\$0.00	n	\$0.00	+	\$106.88	=	NO BID
Raynguard Protective Mat Sacramento, CA 50# Bags	eriais	\$24.00	X	480	=	\$11,520.00 -	\$0.00	=	\$11,520.00	+	\$120 24	=	\$11,640.24

1993 B 2 of 2