RESOLUTION NO. 008-2023
OF THE BOARD OF SUPERVISORS OF THE COUNTY OF EL DORADO

{REPEALING RESOLUTION NO. 036-2020)

WHEREAS, the California Code of Regulations, Title 24, Part 9, the California Fire Code, is updated by the
State every three years; and

WHEREAS, the 2022 California Fire Code became effective on January 1, 2023; and,

WHEREAS, California Health and Safety Code Sections 17958, 17958.5, 17958.7 and 18941.5 permits a
county to make such local amendments and modifications as the county determines are reasonably
necessary because of local climatic, geological or topographical conditions; and,

WHEREAS, the California Code of regulations, Health and Safety Code, Division 12, Part 2, Chapter 1,
Article 12, Section 13146, assigns responsibility for enforcement of safety regulations to the local level
and grants authority to delegate enforcement to the chief building official, or his or her authorized
representative, or the chief of the fire protection district, or his or her representative; and,

WHEREAS, the County of £l Dorado desires to delegate enforcement of the Fire Code to the chief of the
fire authority, or the chief’s authorized representative; and,

WHEREAS, the fire protection district and County have agreed to develop, implement and maintain a
memorandum of understanding that describes the roles and responsibilities pertaining to the inspection
of certain building standards found in the Fire Code; and,

WHEREAS, on October 31, 2022, The Board of Directors of the Diamond Springs-Ei Dorado Fire Protection
District adopted Ordinance No. 2022-01, which adopted the 2022 California Fire Code with amendments
the District deemed necessary to deal with local climate, geological or topographical conditions.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that the Board of Supervisors of the County of El Dorado ratifies
Ordinance No. 2022-01 of the Diamond Springs-El Dorado Fire Protection District and delegates the
enforcement of the ordinance to the Diamond Springs-El Dorado Fire Protection District Chief, or his or
her representative.

These changes include amendments and additions to the California Fire Code in the following sections:

101.1, 105.5, 105.5.55, 105.6, 105.6.25, 105.6.26, 107.5, 107.5.1, 107.7, 1115, 112.4, 112.4.2,
113.4, 202, 302.1, 307.4.4, 401.2.1, 503.2.1, 503.2.5, 503.2.6, 503.3.1, 503.3.2, 503.3.3, 503.6,
505.1, 507.5.1, 509.3, 510.4.2.3,903.2, 903.2.1.1, 903.2.1.2, 903.2.1.3, 903.2.1.4, 903.2.3, 903.2 4,
503.2.7, 903.2.7.2, 903.2.8.5, 903.2.9, 903.2.10, 903.2.10.1, 903.2.22, 903.2.23, 903.5, 907.2,

23-0015D 1 of 53



907.2.1.4, 907.2.2.3, 907.2.3.11, 907.2.4.1, 907.2.5.2, 907.2.6.6, 907.2.7.2, 907.2.8.4, 907.2.9.4,
907.2.10.1, 907.2.30, 907.6.5, 507.6.2.1, 907.9, 1203.1.3, 3311.3, 3313.1, 5001.7, 5601.2,
5704.2.9.6.1, 5706.2.4.4, 5806.2, 6104.2, Chapter 80 NFPA 1-22 Section 22.3, Chapter 80 NFPA 1-
22 Section 22.10, Chapter 80 NFPA 13D-22: Sections 4.6, 5.1.1.2, 7.6, 11.2.1.1, Appendix B: Table
B105.1(1), Appendix B: Table B105.2, Appendix D Sections D103.1 through D103.3, Appendix D
103.5, Appendix D 103.6.1, Appendix D103.6.2, Appendix D104.4

Diamond Springs-El Dorado Fire Protection District adopts the 2022 California Fire Code, Title 24, Part 9,
in_its entirety, including Appendices, incorporating those sections of the International Fire Code, 2021
edition not adopted by the state, with the exclusions listed below:

103, 309, 3115, 311.6, 318, 403.3, 403.5, 403.8, 403.10, 403.11, 404, 406, 903.3.1.2, 904.1.1,
1103.1, 1103.3-1103.4, 1103.6, 1105, Chapter 26, D104.2 (exception only}, D106.1 (exception only),
D107.1 (Exceptions only), Appendix A, Appendix G, Appendix J, Appendix K, Appendix L, Appendix
M, Appendix N, Appendix O.

Appendices not adopted can be used for reference in enforcing other sections of the 2022 California Fire
Code.

PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of Supervisors of the County of El Dorado at a regular meeting of
said BOARD, held the 3™ day of lanuary, 2023, by the following vote of said Board

Ayes: Thomas, Hidahl, Turnboo, Parlin, Laine
Attest: Noes: None
Kim Dawson Absent: None
Clerk of the Board of Supervisors

By: ,44_%& MM@&'—
DeputyClerk Chair, Bbard of Supervisors

Wendy Thomas

23-0015 D 2 of 53



o

WORD PR,

S Diamond Springs - El Dorado Fire Protection District
501 Pleasant Valley Road, Diamond Springs, CA 95619
Office (530) 626-3190 4 Fax (530) 626-3188
www.diamondfire.org

November 21, 2022

Don Ashton, Chief Administrative Officer
El Dorado County Board of Supervisors
330 Fair Lane

Placerviile CA 95667

Subject: Resolution Ratifying Ordinance No 2022.01 of the Diamond Springs-El Dorado
Fire Protection District, which Adopits the 2022 California Fire Code with
Amendments related to local climatic, geographic, and topographic conditions.

Dear Mr, Ashton:

The Diamond Springs-El Dorado Fire Protection District (DSEDFPD} is requesting the Board
of Supervisors (BOS) ratify its Ordinance No. 2022.01, which adopts the 2622 California Fire
Code as amended due 1o specific local climatic, geographic, and topographic conditions.
California Health and Safety Code Section 13869.7 requires the legislative body of the city or
county where the ordinance will apply to ratify, modify, or deny the adopted ordinance. The
BOS must also delegate enforcement of the ordinance to either the Fire District {or its
representative) or the Chief Building Official.

Therefore, we request the Board of Supervisors ratify Ordinance No. 2022.01 with
amendments to the 2022 Califoria Fire Code, and delegate the enforcement of that Ordinance

to the Diamond Springs-El Dorado Fire Protection District Chief. A proposed BOS resolution
is enclosed for your review and use on this topic.

This resolution has no direct fiscal impact to the County.
Sincerel
A S

Leah Yaws
Fire Marshal

Attachments:

1. Diamond Springs-El Dorado Fire Protection District Ordinance No. 2022.01
2. Diamond Springs-El Dorado Fire Protection District Finding of Facts Resolution No, 2022.09

23-0015D 3 of 53



Attachment No. 1

Diamond Springs El Dorado Fire Protection District

Ordinance No. 2022-01

23-0015 D 4 of 53



DIAMOND SPRINGS / E| DORADO FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT
ORDINANCE NO. 2022-01

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS OF THE DIAMOND
SPRINGS / EL DORADO FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT AS FOLLOWS:

An ordinance of the Diamond Springs / El Dorado Fire Protection District {DSEDFPD}
adopting the 2022 Edition of the California Fire Code, incorporating the 2021 Edition of the
International Fire Code, regulating and governing the safeguarding of life and property from fire
and explosion hazards arising from the storage, handling and use of hazardeus substances,
materials and devices, and from conditions hazardous to life or property in the occupancy of
buildings and premises in the DSEDFPD; providing for the issuance of permits and coilection of
fees therefor; Repealing Ordinance No. 2019-01 of the DSEDFPD and all other ordinances and
parts of the ordinances in conflict therewith.

Be it ORDAINED by the Board of Directors of the DSEDFPD, also known as the

Diamand Springs / El Dorado Fire Protection District:

Section 1: FINDINGS OF FACTS

Section 2: ADOPTION OF CODE WITH EXCLUSIONS
Section 3: LOCAL AMENDMENTS

Section 4: CONFLICT

Section 5: SEVERABILITY

Section 6: EFFECTIVE DATE AND PUBLICATION

SECTION 1: FINDINGS OF FACTS
The DSEDFPD makes certain changes (listed below) to the California Fire Code, 2022

Edition, pursuant to Health & Safety Code Sections 13869.7, 17958.5, 17958.7 and 18941.5
during this code adoption process. Such changes are necessary because of local climatic,
geological andfor topographical conditions. The DSEDFFD has adopted, pursuant to Section
18941.5 of the California Health & Safely Code, the findings of facts relative to these conditions
by Resolution #2022-09 of the DSEDFPD dated October 11, 2022.

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 4

23-0015 D 5 of 53



SECTION 2: ADOPTION OF CODE WITH EXCLUSIONS

The DSEDFPD adopts the 2022 California Fire Code, Title 24, Part 9, in its entirety,
including Appendices, incorporating those sections of the International Fire Code, 2021 edition
not adopted by the state, with the exclusions listed below:

Exclusions: 103, 309, 311.5, 311.6, 318, 403.3, 403.5, 403.8, 403.10, 403.11, 404, 406,
903.3.1.2, 904.1.1, 1103.1, 1103,3-1103.4, 1103.6, 1105, Chapter 26, D104.2 (Exception only),
D106.1 (Exception only), D107.1 {(Exceptions only), Appendix A, Appendix G, Appendix J,
Appendix K, Appendix L, Appendix M, Appendix N, Appendix O,

Appendices not adopted can be used for reference in enforcing other sections of the 2022

California Fire Code.

SECTION 3: AMENDMENTS TO THE 2022 CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE
The following Sections are hereby amended or added:

Chapter 1
SECTION 101.1 *TITLE" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 101.1 TITLE. These regulations shall be known as the Fire Code of ECFPD, hereinafter
referred to as “this code”.

SECTION 105.5 "REQUIRED OPERATIONAL PERMITS” IS AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 105.5 Required operational permits. The fire code official is authorized to issue
operational permits for the operations set forth in Sections 105.5.2 through 105.5.525.

SECTION 105.5.55 “AUTOMOBILE WRECKING YARDS" IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 105.5.55 Automobile wrecking yards. An operational permit is required for the
operation of automobile wrecking yards.

SECTION 105.6 "REQUIRED CONSTRUCTION PERMITS” IS AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 105.6 required construction permits. The fire code official is authorized to issue
censtruction permits for work as set forth in sections 105.6.1 through 105.6.246.

SECTION 105.6.25 "AUTOMOBILE WRECKING YARDS" IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 105.6.25 Automobile wrecking yards. Construction permits are requirad for the
installation of or modification to automobile wrecking yards.

QOrdinance 2022-01 Page 2

23-0015 D 6 of 53



SECTION 105.6.26 “TRAFFIC CALMING DEVICES” IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

105.6.26 Traffic calming devicas. Construction permits are required for the installation or
modification of traffic calming devices.

SECTION 107.5 "PERMIT, PLAN REVIEW AND INSPECTION FEES" SHALL BE ADDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 107.5 Permit. A scheduie of fees adopted by the district board of directors for plan
review, inspections and the issuance of permits by the district may be found in the most current
district fee schedule (Health & Safely Code 17951).

SECTION 107.5.1 “COST RECOVERY FEES” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 107.5.1 Cost Recovery Fees. Fire service fees may be charged to any person, fimm,
corporation or business that through negligence, violation of the law, or as a result of
carelessness, is responsible for the cause of the district to respond to the scene of an incident.
A district board may charge a fee ta cover the cost of any service which the district provides
or the cost of enforcing any regulation for which the fee is charged (Heaith & Safely Code
13918). The fee shail not exceed the actual cost of suppressing the fire and/or responding to

the scene of an incident.
SECTION 107.7 "ADMINISTRATIVE COSTS" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Saction 107.7 Administrative Costs. When a test or inspection is scheduled, and the
contractor fails to perform to the satisfaction of the authonly having jurisdiction (AHJ}, the AHUY
may bill the contractor for actual time spent traveling to and from the test/inspection focation
and the time spent at the test/inspection site as well as administrative costs.

SECTION 111.5 "APPEAL PROCEDURES AND TIMELINES" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 111.5 Appeal Procedures and Timeiines. Any person or entity who believes they
may be adversely affected by an order, decision, or determination made by the fire code official
through a written notice may appeal this matter within 15 calendar days of the postmark on the
notice. All such appeals shali be filed in writing with the Secretary of the Governing Board for
the district. A timely appeal shall stay further action by the fire code official until the matter is
determined by the Appeal Board as ouflined in Section 108.2, unfess the issue poses an
imminent fire or life safety hazard to members of the public. The fira code official shall notify
the appellant by certified mail of the date and time of such hearing. The hearing shall be
scheduled to take place no sooner than 20 calendar days from the date shown on the certified
mail. The appellant shall have the right to appear in person or by agent at the hearing and
present oral, written and/or photographic evidence to the Appeal Board.

SECTION 112.4 "VIOLATION PENALTIES" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 112.4 Violation Penalties. Persons who shall viclate a provision of this code or shall
fail to comply with any of the requirements thereof or who shall erect, install, alter, repair or do
work in violation of the approved construction documents or diractive of the fire code official,
or of a permit or certificate used under provisions af this code, shall be guilty of 2 misdemeanor

Crdinance 2022-01 Page 3

23-0015D 7 of 53



or infraction, at the discretion of the prosecuting atforney or agency, punishable by a fine not
more than $700.00 for a first viofation; A fine not exceeding $500.00 for a second violation of
the same provision within one year; A fine not exceeding $1600.00 for each additional violation
of the same provision within one year, or by imprisonment not exceeding 780 days, or both
such fine and imprisonment. Each day that a violation continues after due notice has been
served shall be deemed a separate offense. (Heaith & Safety Code Sections 13145 and

17395).

SECTION 112.4.2 “CITATIONS" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 112.4.2 Citations. The Fire Chief or his/her duly authorized representative, may
issue citations for infractions or misdemeanor violations of this code pursuant fo Section 13871
of the Health & Safety Code of the State of California and Chapler 5¢ (commencing with
Section 853.6) of Title 3 of Part 2 of the Penal Code of the State of California.

SECTION 113.4 *FAILURE TO COMPLY" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 113.4 Faiture to Comply. Any person who shall continue any work after having been
served with a stop work order, except such wark as that person is directed to perform to remove

a violation or unsafe condition, shall be punishable by a fine or impnsonment or both as
described in Section 112 4 (Health & Safety Code Sections 13145 and 17985,

Chapter 2

SECTION 202 "CAMPFIRE" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

CAMPFIRE. A fire which is used for cooking, personal warmth, lighting, or aesthetic purposes.
SECTION 202 “DISTRICT" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

DISTRICT. The district and all other areas within the exterior boundaries thereof now or
hereafter establishbed.

SECTION 202 “DRIVEWAY" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:!

DRIVEWAY. A vehicular access that serves up fo two (2) parcets with no more than two (2}
residential units and any number of non-commercial or industrial buildings on each parcel.

SECTION 202 "EXECUTIVE BODY" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:
EXECUTIVE BODY. The Board of Directors of the Dislrict.
SECTION 202 "FIRE CHIEF" BHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

FIRE CHIEF. The Chief Executive Fire Officer of the Fire department/district serving the
jurisdiction or a duly authorized representative.

SECTION 202 “FIRE HAZARD" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Ordinance 2022-0! Page 4

23-0015 D 8 of 53



FIRE HAZARD. Any condition, arrangement, or act which will increase, or may cause an
increase of the hazard or menace of fire to a greater than customarily recogrized as normal
by-persons in the public service of preventing, suppressing or extingtiishing fire; or which may
obstruct, delay, or hinder, or may become the cause of obstruction, delay or hinderance lo the
prevention, suppression, or extinguishment of fire.

SECTION 202 “OPEN BURNING" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

OPEN BURNING. The burning of materials wherein products of combustion are emitted directly
into the ambient air without passing through a stack or chimney from an enclosed chamber. Open
burning does not inciude road flares, smudge-pots and similar devices associated with safety or
occupational uses typically considered open flames- For the purpose of this definition, a chamber
shall be regarded as enclosed when, during the time combustion occurs, only apertures, ducts,
stacks, flues ar chimneys necessary to provide combustion air and permit the escape of exhaust

gas are gpen.

Open burning shall also include campfires, bonfires, portable outdoor fireplaces, ceremonial
fires, and recreational fire as defined in the Fire Code.

Exception:

1. UL or ASM! listed LPG or natural gas cutdoor flame devices, such as gas BBQ's or gas
fire pits that comply with the Fire Code.

2. For one-or two-family dwellings, fixed or portable outdoor flame devices that meet the
following:

a. Devices shall comply with the Fire Code.
b. Devices shall be used per manufacturer's specifications.
¢. Minimum 10-foot ciearance from device lo all flammable malerial and vegetation.
d.

No burning shall be conducted during high or extreme fire weather conditions (e.g.,
National Weather Service Red Flag Wamings).

3. Campfires on private lands. Where required by the fire code official, a permit shall be
issued by the fire code official.

4. Ceremonial and/or religious burning with the foliowing safety measures:
a. Maximum 4-fool x 4-foot burn area.
b. Minimum 10-foof clearance from edge of bum area to all flammable material and
vegetation.
An approved watsr supply is located within 500-feet of the bum area.
The burn area is located no less than 30-feet from adjoining property lines.
An aduit is present with a shove! until the fire is extinguished.

No burning shall be conducted during high or extreme fire weather conditions (e.g.,
National Weather Service Red Flag Wamings).

SR L = N 24

SECTION 202 “TRAINED CROWD MANAGER™ SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 5

23-0015D 9 of 53



TRAINED CROWD MANAGER. Standby personnel, usually a security guard or usher
personnel, who are lrained in the proper procedure to exit people from a tent or other place of
public assemblage in an orderly and calm fashion in the event of an emergency

Chapter 3

SECTION 202.1 “DEFINITIONS” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:
3D PRINTER.

ADDITIVE MANUFACTURING.
BONFIRE.

CAMPFIRE.

HI-BOY.

HIGH-VOLTAGE TRANSMISSION LINE.
OPEN BURNING.

PORTABLE OUTDOOR FIREPLACE.
POWERED INDUSTRIAL TRUCK.
RECREATIONAL FIRE.

SKY LATTERN.

SECTION 307.4.4 “OPEN BURNING RESTRICTIONS" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 307.4.4 Open Burning Restrictions. Open burning on alf lands within the jurisdiction of
the Diamond Springs / £&f Dorado Fire Protection District (DSEDFPD), including the Local
Response Area (LRA), is prohibited when the California Depariment of Foreslry and Fire
Protection (Cal Fire) issues a burm suspension in the State Responsibility Area (SRA). This
prohibition shaif be made effective 24-hours following its commencement in the SRA.

Open burning i5 also prohibited on all fands within the furisdiction of DSEDFPD at any time the
fire code official that atmospheric conditions or other local circumstances make such fires
hazardous, including factors such as high winds, fow fue! moisture, fire weather, the issuance of
red flag warnings, severe threat of wildiand fire, or present risk of destruction by wildfire to life,

wildfife, properly, or nalural resources.

Chapter 4
SECTION 401.2.1 “PRE-FIRE PLANS" IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 401.2.1 Pre-fire plans. Where required by the fire code official, a pre-fire plan shall
be provided and approved by the fire code official for alf new commercial structures.

Chapter §
SECTION 503.2.1 “DIMENSIONS™ SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 503.2.1 Dimensions. Fire apparatus access roads shall have an unobstructed width

of not less than 20 feet (6096 mm), exclusive of shoulders, as measured from face of curb fo
face of curb, except for approved security gates in accordance with Section 503.€, and an

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 6

23-0015 D 10 of 53



unobstructed vertical clearance of not less than 15 feet. Driveways shail have an unobstructed
width of not less than 12 feet wids.

SECTION 503.2.5 “DEAD ENDS" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 503.2.5 Dead Ends, Dead-end fire apparatus access roads and driveways in excess
of 150 feet (45,720 mm) in length shall be provided with an approved area for furning around

fire apparatus.

SECTION 503.2.6 “BRIDGES AND ELEVATED SURFACES" SHALL BE AMENDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 503.2.6 Bridges and Efevated Surfaces. Where a bridge or an elevated surface is
part of a fire apparatus access road, the bridge shall be constructed and maintained in
accordance with AASHTO HB-17, the current Ei Dorado County Transportation Divisfon Bridge
Standard or Appendix D of the current Califomia Fire Code, whichever is more restrictive.
Bridges and elevated surfaces shall be designed for a live icad sufficient to carry the imposed
loads of fire apparatus. Vehicle load limits shall be posted at both entrances to bridges when
required by the fire code official. Where elevated surfaces designed for emergency vehicle use
are adjacent to surfaces that are net designed for such use, approved barriers, approved signs
or both shall be installed and maintained where required by the fire code official.

SECTION 503.3.1 "NO PARKING IN FIRE LANES" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Saction 503.3.1 No Parking In Fire Lanes. No person shall stop, park, or leave standing any
vehicle, whether attended or unattended, except when necessary fo avoid confiict with other
traffic or in compliance with the directions of the Fire Chief, or his/her duly authonzed
reprasentative, Peace Officer or official traffic control device along the edge of any highway,
at any curb, or in any location in a publicly or privately owned or operated off-street parking
facility, designated as a fire lane by the district with jurisdiction over the area in which the place
is located. The designation shall be indicated (1) by a sign posted immediately adjacent fo,
and visible from, the designated pface clearly stating in letters not less than one inch in height
that the place is a fire lane, (2) by outlining or painting the place in red and, in contrasting color,
marking the place with the words “FIRE LANE", which are clearly visible from a vehicle, or (3)
by a red curb or red paint on the edge of the roadway upon which is clearly marked the words

“FIRE LANE™.

SECTION 503.3.2 “NO PARKING IN FRONT OF HYDRANTS" SHALL BE ADDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 503.3.2 No Parking in Front of Hydrants. No person shall stop, park, or leave
standing any vehicle within 15 feet of a fire hydrant except as follows: (a) If the vehicle is
attended by a licensed driver who is seated in the front seat and who can immediately move
such vehicle in case of necessily, (b} If the vehicie is owned or operated by a fire department

and is clearly marked as a fire department vehicle.

SECTION 503.3.3 “FIRE LANES BASED ON ROAD WIDTH" SHALL BE ADDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 7

23-0015 D 11 of 53



Sectfan 503.3.3 Fire Lanes Based on Road Width. Fire lanes shall be based on road width
as required in Appendix D as amended by the district.

SECTION 503.6 “SECURITY GATES" IS AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 503.6 Security Gates. The installation of security gates across a fire apparatus
access road shall be approved by the fire code official and shall comply with the District gate
standard. Where security gates are installed, they shall have an approved means of
emergency operation. The security gates and the emergency operation shall be maintained
operational at all times. Electric gate operators, where provided, shall be listed in accordance
with UL 325. Gates intended for automatic operation shall be designed, constructed, and
instalied to comply with the requirements of ASTM F2200.

SECTION 505.1 "ADDRESS IDENTIFICATION” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 505.1 Address Identification. Addresses for new and existing buildings shall camply
with the District address standard as approved by the fire code official. The address
identification shall be legibie and placed in a position that is visible from the street or road fronting
the property. Address identification characters shall contrast with their background. Address
numbers shall be Arabic numbers or alphabetical letters. Numbers shall not be spelled out. Each
character shall be not less than 4 inches (102 mm) high with a minimum stroke width of '/z inch
(12.7 mm). Where required by the fire code official, address identification shall be provided in
additional approved locations to facilitate emergency response. access is by means of a private
road and the building cannot be viewed from the public way, a monument, pole or other sign or
means shall be used to identify the structure. Address identification shall be maintained.

SECTION 507.5.1 "WHERE REQUIRED" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 507.5.1 Where Required. Where a portion of the facility or tuilding hereafter
constructed or moved into or within the jurisdiction is more than 150 feet from a hydrant on a fire
apparatus access road, as measured by an approved route around the exterior of the facility or
building, on-site fire hydrants and mains capable of supplying the required fire flow shall be
provided where required by the fire code official.

Exceptions:
1. For Group R-3 and Group U occupancies, the distance requirement shall be 600 feet
{183 m).

SECTION 509.3 “FIRE CONTROL ROOM" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 509.3 Fire Control Room. Fire sprinkier risers, fire alarm conftrol panels, solar
photovoitaic power system rapid shutoff switches, and other fire detection, suppression or
similar control elements shall be located inside a single fire control room for the building. The
fire control room shall have minimum dimensions of five feet by seven feet in size with a total
usable area of not less than 35 square feel. The room shal! be located within the building on
an outside wall at a location approved by the Fire Code Official and shall be accessible from
the exterior. An exterior access daor with a clear width of not less than 32 inches and height
of not less than 8G inches shall be provided for access into the room. A durable sign shall be
affixed to the exterior of the door with the words “FIRE CONTROL ROOM" in letters not less

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 8

23-0015 D 12 of 53



than 4 inches in height. A key box complying with Section 506 shall be instalied on the exterior
side of the fire control room door opening.

The room must be capable of maintaining a minimum temperature of 40 degrees Fahrenheit.
A clearance of 12 inches shall be provided from the fire sprinkler nisers to any adjacent walis.
This room can be a shared with other building utilities or fira protection equipment that is not
incompatible. An approved cabinet or container shall be provided to store record plans of the
fire sprinkler system and other fire protection equipment. This room shall not be used for any

other storage.
Exceptlon: One-and two-family dwellings, manufactured homes or similar uses defined
as either a Group R-3, R3.1, or R-4 occupancy.

SECTION 510.4.2.3 “STANDBY POWER" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 5104.2.3 Standby power. In-building, two-way emergency responder
communication radio coverage systems shall be provided with dedicated standby batteries or
provided with 2-hour standby batteries and connected to the facllity generator power system
in accordance with Section 1203. The standby power supply shall be capable of operating the
in-building, two-way emergency responder communication coverage system at 100-percent

system capacity for a duration of not tess than 72 hours,

Chapter 9
SECTION 903.2 “WHERE REQUIRED" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 803.2 Whers Required. Approved automatic sprinkler systems in new buildings and
structures when constructed or relocated within the jurisdiction shall be provided in the
locations described in Sections 903.2.1 through 903.2.12 and Sections 903.2.14 through

903.2.23.
Exception: Agricultural buildings not under a special use permit used for cornmercial
PUIDOSES.

SECTION 803.2.1.1 "GROUP A-1" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 903.2.1.1 Group A. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout stories
containing Group A-1 occupancies and throughout all stories from the Group A-1 pecupancy fo
and including the levels of exit discharge serving that occupancy where one of the following

conditions exists:
1. The fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet.
2. The fire area has an occupant load of 300 or more.

3. The fire area is located on a floor other than a level of exit discharge serving such
occupancies.

4. The fire area contains a multi-theater complex
SECTION 903.2.1.2 "GROUP A-2" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 903.2.1.2 Group A-2, An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout
stories containing Group A-2 occupancies and throughout all stories from the Group A-2

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 9

23-0015 D 13 of 63



occupancy to and including the levels of exit discharge serving that occupancy where one of the
following conditions exists;
1. The fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet;
2. The fire area has an occupant load of 100 or more.
3. The fire area is located on a floor other than a level of exit discharge serving such
occupancies.

4. The structure exceeds 3,600 square feet, contains more than one fire area containing a
Group A-2 occupancy, and is separated into two or more buildings by fire walls of less than
4-hour fire-resistance rating without openings.

SECTION 803.2.1.3 "GROUP A-3" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 903.2.1.3 Group A-3. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout
stories containing Group A-3 occupancies and throughout all stories from the Group A-3
occupancy to and including the levels of exit discharge serving that occupancy where one of the

following conditions exists:
1. The fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet.
2. The fire area has an occupant load of 300 or more.
3. The fire area is located on a floor other than a Jevel of exit discharge serving such
occupancies.

4. The structure exceeds 3,600 square feet, contains more than one fire area containing
exhibition and display rooms, and is separated inlo two or more buildings by fire walls of
less than 4-hour fire-resistance rating without openings.

SECTION 903.2.1.4 “GROUP A-4" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 903.2.1.4 Group A-4. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout
stories containing Group A-4 occupancies and throughout all stories from the Group A4
occupancy {o and including the levels of exit discharge serving that occupancy where one of the

following conditions exists:
1. The fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet.
2. The fire area has an occupant load of 300 or more.

3. The fire area is located on a floor other than a level of exit discharge serving such
occupancies,

SECTION €03.2.3 “GROUP E" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 903.2.3 Group E. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided for Group E
occupancies as follows:
1. Throughout all Group E fire areas greater than 3,600 square feet in area.
2. The Group E fire area is located on 2 floor ather than a level of exit discharge serving such
occupancies.

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 10

23-0015D 14 of 53



Exception: In buildings where every classroom has not fewer than one exterior exit
door at ground level, an automatic sprinkler system is not required in any
area befow the lowest level of exit discharge serving that area.

3. The Group E fire area has an occupant load of 300 or more.

4. In rooms or areas with special hazards such as laboratories, vocational shops and other
such areas where hazardous materials in quantities not exceeding the maximum allowable

guantity are used or stored.

5, Throughout any Group E structure greater than 3,600 square feet in area, which contains
more than one fire area, and which is separated into two or more buildings by fire walis of

less than 4-hour fire resistance rating without openings.
6. For public school state funded construction projects see Section 803.2.18.
7. For public school campuses, Kindergarten through 12" grade, see Section 903.2.20

SECTION 903.2.4 "GROUP F-1" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 903.2.4 Group F-1. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout all
buildings containing a Group F-1 accupancy where one of the following conditions exists:

1. A Group F-1 fire area exceeds 3,600 square fzet,
2. A Group F-1 fise area is located more than three stories above grade plane.

3. The combined area of all Group F-1 fire areas on all floors, including any mezzanines,
exceeds 3,600 square feet.

SECTION 903.2.7 "GROUP M" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 903.2.7 Group M. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout buiidings
containing a Group M occupancy where one of the following cenditions exists:
1. A Group M fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet,
2. A Group M fire area is located more than three stories above grade plane.
3. The combined area of ail Group M fire areas on all floors, including any mezzanines,
exceeds 3,600 squars feet.

5. The structure exceeds 3,600 square feet, contains more than one fire area containing a
Group M occupancy, and is separated into two or more buildings by fire walls of less than

4-hour fire resistance rating without openings.

SECTION 903.2.7.2 "GROUP M UPHOLSTERED FURNITURE OR MATTRESSES” SHALL
BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 803.2.7.2 Group M Upholstered Furniture or Mattresses. An automatic sprinkler
system shall be provided throughout a Group M fire area where the area used for the display
and sale of upholsiered furniture or mattresses exceeds 3,600 square feet.

SECTION 903.2.8.5 “MANUFACTURED HOMES” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 11

23-0015 D 15 of &3



Section 903.2.5.2 Manufactured Homes. An automatic fire sprinklar system shall be required
in afl new manufactured homes and mulli-family manufactured homes intended for use as a
one-and two-family dwelling. The design and installation of such systems shalf be in
accordance with California Code of Regulations, Title 25, §4300.

Exceptions:

!. Manufactured homes located within an existing mobile home park complying with
Cailifornia Health and Safety Code, Division 13, Part 2.1 or 2.3.

2. Manufactured homes that do not exceed 1,200 square feet in size and serve as an
accessory dwelling unit, as defined in Government Code Section 658502; when the
existing pnmary residence on the property Iis not required to comply with California
Residential Code Section R313.2.

3. Manufactured homes that do not exceed 320 square feet in size.
SECTION 903.2.9 "GROUP S-1" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 903.2.9 Group S-1. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout ail
buildings containing a Group S-1 occupancy where one of the following conditions exists:

1. A Group S-1 fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet.

2. A Group S-1 fire area is located more than three stories abave grade plane.

3. The combined area of all Group S-1 fire areas on all floors, inciuding any mezzanines,
exceeds 3,600 square feet.

4. A Group S-1 fire area used for the storage of commercial motor vehicles where the fire
area exceeds 3,600 square feet.

SECTION 803.2.10 “GROUP S-2" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 903.2.10 Group S$-2, An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout
buildings classified as parking garages where any of the foilowing conditions exist:

1. Where the fire area of the enclosed parking garage, in accordance with Section 406.6 of
the Cafifornia Building Code, exceeds 3,600 square feet.

2. Where the enclosed parking garage, in accordance with Section 406.6 of the California
Building Code, is located beneath other groups.

Excaption; Enclosed parking garages located beneath Group R-3 occupancies.

3. Where the fire area of the open parking garage, in accordance with Section 406.5 of the
California Building Code, exceeds 3,600 square feet.

SECTION 903.2.10.1 "COMMERCIAL PARKING GARAGES" SHALL BE AMENDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Sectlon 903.2.10.1 Commerclal Parking Garages. An automatic sprinkler system shall be
provided throughout buildings used for sterage of commercia! motor vehicles where the fire area

exceeds 3,600 square feet.

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 12

23-0015 D 16 of 53



SECTION 903.2.22 “GROUP 8" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 903.2.22 Group B. An automaltic sprinkier system shall be provided throughout all
buildings containing Group B occupancies where the fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet.

SECTION 203.2.23 “GROUP F-2" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 903.2.23 Group F-2. An aulomalic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout all
buildings contsining Group F-2 occupancias where the fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet.

SECTION 203.6 “WHERE REQUIRED [N EXISTING BUILDINGS AND STRUCTURES" IS
AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 903.6 Where Required In Existing Buildings and Structures. An automatic
sprinkler system shall be provided in existing buildings and structures where required in
Chapter 11 and as follows:
1. When there Is a change in occupancy classification that results in an increased life safety
or fire risk, as determined by the fire code official, and the structure exceeds 3,600 square
feet, an automatic fire sprinkler system shall be installed throughout the building.

2. In existing buildings 3,600 square feet or greater, other than one and two-family dwelling
units, and agricultural buildings not under special use permit for commercial purposes,
where the floor area of the building or structure is increased, such building or structure

shall be made to conform to Section 903.2.
Exception: When the building increase is less than 500 square feet.

3. In existing buildings 3,600 squars fee! or less, other than one-and two-family dwelling
units, and agriculturaf buildings not under special use permit for commercial purposes,
where the fioor area of the building or structure is increased o a lotal square footage
over 3,600 square feet, such building or structure shall be made to conform to Section
903.2.

Exception: When the building increase is less than 500 square feel.

SECTION 907.2. "“WHERE REQUIRED = NEW BUILDINGS AND STRUCTURES" SHALL BE
AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Sectlon 907.2. Where Required — New Bulildings and Structures. An approved fire alarm
system installed in accordance with the provisions of this code and NFPA 72 shall be provided
in new buildings and structures in accordance with Sections 807.2.1 through 807.2.30 and
provide occupant notification in accordance with Section 807.5, unless other requirements are

provided by another section of this code.

Not fewer than one manuail fire alarm box shall be provided in an approved location to initiate
a fire alarm signal for fire alamm systems employing automatic fire detectors or waterflow
detection devices. Where other sections of this code allow elimination of fire alarm boxes due
to sprinklers or automatic fire alarm systems, a single fire alarm box shail be installed at a

location approved by the enforcing agency.
Exceptions;

Ordinance 2022-1 Page 13

23-0015 D 17 of 63



1. The manual fire alarm box is not required for fire alarm conirol units systems
dedicated to elevator recall control, supervisory service and fire sprinkler
monitoring.

2. The manual fire alarm box is not required for Group R-2 occupancias unless
required by the fire code official to provide a means for fire watch personnel to
initiate an alarm during a sprinkler system, impairment event. Where provided, the
manual fire alarm box shall not be located in an area that is open to the public.

3. The manual fire¢ alarm box is not required to be installed when approved by the fire
code official.

4. A fire alamm system is not required in one and two-family dwellings, agriculfural
buildings, and other occupancies classified as Group U not under special use
permit and/or not used for commercial purposes {e.g. retail saies, food service,
and/or special events).

5. Buildings with a floor area less than 500 square feet may be exempl, as determined
by the fire code official based on building construcfion matserial and fealures,
location, occupancy type, and distance lo exposures.

SECTION 907.2.1.4 "GROUP A UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET" SHALL BE ADDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 907.2.1.4 Group A Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shall
be installed in all group A buildings with a floor area less than 3,600 square feel,

SECTION 907.2.2.3 “GROUP B UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET” SHALL BE ADDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 907.2,.2.3 Group B Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shall
be installed in all group B buildings with a floor area ess than 3,600 square feet.

SECTION 807.2.3.11 “GROUP E UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET" SHALL BE ADDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 907.2.3.11 Group E Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shall
be installed in all group E buildings with a floor area less than 3,600 square feet.

SECTION 807.2.4.1 “GROUP F UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET" SHALL BE ADDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 907.2.4.1 Group F Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shall
be installed in alf group F buildings with a floor area fess than 3,600 square feet.

SECTION 907.2.5.2 "GROUP H UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET" SHALL BE ADDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 907.2.5.2 Group H Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shall
be installed in ail group H buildings with a floor area less than 3,600 square feel.

Ordinance 2022-0) Page 14

23-0015 D 18 of 53



SECTION 907.2.6.6 "GROUP | UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET" SHALL BE ADDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 907.2.5.68 Group | Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shall be
installed in all group | buildings with a floor area less than 3,600 square feet.

SECTION 907.2.7.2 “GROUP M UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET" SHALL BE ADDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 907.2.7.2 Group M Under 3,600 Square Feeat, An approved fire alarm system shalf
be instalted in all group M buildings with a fioor area less than 3,600 square feetl.

SECTION 907.2.8.4 "GROUP R-1 UNDER 3,800 SQUARE FEET" SHALL BE ADDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 907.2.8.4 Group R-1 Under 3,600 Square Feet, An approved fire alarm system shall
be instalied in all group R-1 buildings with a floor area less than 3,600 square feet.

SECTION 907.2.9.4 “GROUP R-2, R-2.1 R-2.2 UNDER 3,800 SQUARE FEET" SHALL BE
ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 907.2.9.4 Group R-2, R-2.1, R-2.2 Under 3,600 Squara Feef. An approved fire alann
system shall be installed in all group R-2, R-2.1, R-2.2 buildings with a floor area less than

3,600 square foet.

SECTION 807.2.10.1 “GROUP § UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET" SHALL BE ADDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 907.2.10.1 Group S Under 3,600 Square Feetl, An approved fire alarm system shall
be installed in all group S buildings with a floor area less than 3,600 square feel,

907.2.30 “TYPE | HOOD INSTALLATIONS” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

907.2.30 “Type | Hood instaliations. The requirement of installation, or replacement, of a
Type | Hood System shall require a fire alarm/sprinkler monitoring system to be installed, or
for the hood system o be connscled to an existing fire alarm/sprinkler monitoring system for

that building.
807.56.5 "MONITORING" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

§07.6.5 Monitoring. Fire alarm systems required by this chapter or by the California Building
Code shall be monitored by an approved, UL certified, Type A Full Service central, proprietary
or remole station service, which gives audible and visual signals at a constantly attended

location. Alf sprinklered buildings shall be monitored.

Exceptions:
/. One- and two-family dwsllings (R-3 Occupancies and other occupancies classified
as "

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 15

23-0015 D 19 of 53



2. Agricultural buildings not under special use permit and/or not used for commercial
purposes (e.q., retails sales, food service, and/or special events).

SECTION 807.6.2.1 "SECONDARY POWER SUPPLY" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

SECTION 907.6.2.1 SECONDARY POWER SUPPLY. Where required by the fire code official,
in accordance with NEPA 72, the secondary power supply providing a minimum 24-hour power
capacity under quiescent load (system operating in & non-alarm condition) shall be amended

to a minimum 72-hour power capacity.

Exception: The existonce of an emergency back-up power supply that meets or exceed
the requirements of Califormia Fire Code Chapter 12.

SECTICN 907.9 “WHERE REQURIED IN EXISTING BUILDINGS® SHALL BE AMENDED AS
FOLLOWS:

SECTION 907.9 Where Required. An approved fire alarm system shall be provided in existing
buildings and structures where required in Chapter 11 and in existing buildings with a floor
area less than 3,600 square feet without an approved automatic sprinkler system, other than
one- or two-family dwelling units, agricultura! building not under special use permit for
commercial purposes where a fire alarm detection system does not exist and the fioor area of

the building or structure is increased
Exception: When the buiiding increase is less than 500 square feel.

Chapter 12
SECTION 1203.1.3 “INSTALLATION" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 1203.1.3 Installation. Emergency power systems and standby power systems shall
be installed in accordance with the California Building Code, the California Electrical Code,
NFPA 110 and NFPA 111. All buildings, other than one- and two-family dweliing units, and
agricuitural buildings not used for commercial purposes, with standby power, shall have a
shunt trip device that disconnects all power saurces to the building, approved by the fire code
official. Existing instaflations shall be maintained in accordance with the original approval.

Chapter 33
SECTION 3311.2 “PREMISE IDENTIFICATION” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 3311.3 Premise Identification. Prior to and duning construction, an approved
address sign shali be provided at each fire and emergency vehicle access road entry into the

project.

SECTION 2313.1 “WHEN REQUIRED” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:
Section 3313.1 When Required. An approved water supply for fire protection, either

temporary or permanent, shalt be instalfed and maintained in continuous operation as soon as
combustible building materials arrive on site, the commencement of vertical combustible

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 16

23-0015 D 20 of 53



construction and on installation of a standpipe system in buildings under construction, in
accordance with Sections 3313.2 through 3313.5.
Exception: The fire code official is authorized to reduce the fire-flow requirements for
isolated buildings or a group of buildings in rural areas or small communities where the
development of full fire-flow requirements is impractical.

Chapter 50
SECTION 5001.7 “LIABILITY FOR DAMAGES"” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 5001.7 Liabiiity for Damages. Any damages or cost resulting from the negligencs,
violation of the law, caroless handling, spill or discharge of any hazardous materials shall
constitute debt against any such person, firm or corporation causing such spilf or dischargs.
This debt is collectible by the Fire Chief, or histher duly authorized representative, in the same
manner as in the case of an obligation undsr contract, expressed or implied.

Chapter 56
SECTION 5601.2 "PERMIT REQUIRED" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 5601.2 Permit Required. Permits shall be required as set forth in Section 105.5 and
regulated in accordance with this section. Where fireworks permits are required, they shall be
issued by the Fire Chief, or hisfher duly authorized representative, and the El Dorado County

Board of Supervisors.

Chapter 57

SECTION 5704.2.96.1 “LOCATIONS WHERE ABOVE-GROUND TANKS ARE
PROHIBITED" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

SECTION 5704.2.9.6.1 Locations Where Above-Ground Tanks are Prohibited. Storage of
Class | and Class |l flammable liquids in above-ground tanks outside of buildings is prohibited
within the limits established by law as the limits of districts in which such storage is prohibited.
Storage of Class | and Class If lammable liquids in above-ground tanks outside of buildings is

prohibited unless approved by the fire code official.

SECTION 5706.2.4.4 "LOCATIONS WHERE ABOVE-GROUND TANKS ARE PROHIBITED"
SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

SECTION 5706.2.4.4 Locations Where Above-Ground Tanks are Prohibited. The storage
of Ciass | and Class ([ liquids in above-ground tanks is prohibited within the limits established
by law as the limits of districts in which such storage is prohibited. Storage of Class | and Class
It liquids in above-ground tanks is prohibited unless approved by the fire code official.

Chapter 58

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 17

23-0015 D 21 of 53



SECTION 5806.2 "LIMITATIONS" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

SECTION 5806.2 Limitations. Storage of flammable cryogenic fluids in stalionary containers
outside of buildings is prohibited within the limits established by faw as the limits of districts in
which such storage is prohibited. Storage of flammable cryogenic fluids in stationary containers
outside of buildings is prohibited unless approved by the fire code official.

Chapter 61

SECTION 6104.2 "MAXIMUM CAPACITY WITHIN ESTABLISHED LIMITS" SHALL BE
AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

SECTION 6104.2 Maximum Capacity within Established Limits. Within the limits
established by law restricting the storage of liquefied petroleum gas for the protection of heavily
populated or congested areas, the aggregate capacity of any one installation shall not exceed
a water capacity of 2,000 gallons. The storage of liquefied petroleumn gas in excess of an
aggregate of 2,000-galion water capacity when located at least one-half (1/2) mile from
property zoned or designated for residential use and at least one-half (1/2) mile from existing
residential development with a densily greater than one (1) dwelling unit per acre and &t least
one-half (1/2) mile from any hotel or motel is allowed when approved by the fire code official,
and a specialfconditional use permit is issued by the County of El Dorado.

Dispensing within established limits. Within the limits established by law restricting the
dispensing of liquefied petroleum gas for the protection of heavily populated or rongested
areas, the aggregale capacity of any one installation shall nof exceed a water capacity of 2,000
galions. The dispensing of liquefied petroleum gas in excess of an aggregate of 2,000-galion
water capacity when located at least one-haif (1/2) mile from property zoned or designa fed for
residential use and at least one-haif (1/2) mile from any hotel or motel is allowed when
approved by the fire code official and a special/conditional use permit is issued by the County

of Ef Dorado.

Chapter 80

SECTION 80, NFPA 1-22, CHAPTER 22 "AUTOMOTIVE WRECKING YARDS" IS ADOPTED,
AMENDED SECTIONS AS FOLLOWS:

Revise Section 22.3 as follows:

22.3 Fire department access roads shall be in accordance with the California Fire Cade,
Section 503 and Appendix D.

Add new Section 22,10 as follows:

22.10 Stored vehicles, boats, recreational vehicles, parts, and equipment shall not be stored
within 30 feet of adjacent property lines.

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 18

23-0015 D 22 of 63



SECTION 80, NFPA, 13D-22 —~ “STANDARD FOR THE INSTALLATION OF SPRINKLER
SYSTEMS IN ONE-AND TWO FAMILY DWELLINGS AND MANUFACTURED HOMES" IS
AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 903.3.1.3, 803.3.5.1 .1

NFPA 13D, Amended Sections as follows:

Add new Section 4.6 as follows:

4.6 Residential fire sprinkfer systems instalied in all new one-and two-family dwellings shall utilize
a "Passive Furge” system design unless otherwise approved by the fire code official.

Exception: Manufactured home installed, tested and approved by the California
Department of Housing and Community Development.

Revise Section 5.1.1.2 as follows:

5.1.1.2 A supply of at least one of each type and temperature sprinkier used within the premises
shall be maintained on the property at an approved location. Spare sprinklers shall be kept in a

mounted and accessible cabinet.

Revise Saction 7.8 as follows:

7.6 A Iocal audio/visual device activated upon water flow shall be provided on all fire sprinkler
systems in homes at an approved location on the exterior of the dwelling.

Revise Section 11.2.1.1 as follows:

11.2.1.1 Where a fire depariment pumper connection is not provided, the system shall be
hydrostatically tested at a minimum pressure of 150 pounds per squars inch gauge for no less
than a 30-minute duration without evidence of leakage. Such test shall be withessed by the fire

code official.
Appendix B - Fire Flow Requirements for Bulldings

TABLE B105.1(1) "REQUIRED FIRE FLOW FOR ONE- AND TWO-FAMILY DWELLINGS,
GROUP R-3, AND R-4 BUILDINGS AND TOWNHOUSES" SHALL BE AMENDEDR AS

FOLLOWS:

TABLE B1056.1(1) REQUIRED FIRE FLOW FOR ONE- AND TWO-FAMILY DWELLINGS,
GROUP R-3, AND R-4 BUILDINGS AND TOWNHOUSES

FIRE-FLOW AUTOMATIC . MINIMUM FIRE- | FLOW DURATION
CALCULATION SPRINKLER SYSTEM FLOW (hours)
AREA {Design Standard) (gallons per
(square foet) minute)
0-3600 No automatic sprinkler | 1,000 1
system ;
Ordinance 2022-01 Pagz 19

23-0015D 23 of 53



3,601 andgreater | No automatic sprinkler | Value in Table | Duration in Table
system B105.1(2) B105.1(2) at the
required fire-flow

rate

MAJOR SUBDIVISIONS {5 PARCELS OR GREATER}

0~ 3,600 Section 903,3.1.3 of the | 1,000 1
CA Fire Code or Section
3133 of the CA
Residential Code

3,801 and greater | Section 903.3.1.3 of the |12 valve of
CA Fire Code or Section | Table B105.1(2) | 2

3133 of the CA |{(min 1000
Residential Code GPM)

QTHER RESIDENTIAL DEVELOPMENT

0 - 3,600 Section 903.3.1.3 of the | 500 1

CA Fire Code or Section
3133 of the CA
Residential Code

3,601 and greater | Section 903.3.1.3 of the | 1/2 value of Table | 1
| CA Fire Code or Section | B105.1{2) (min.
3133 of the CA |750GPM)
Residential Code

TABLE B105.2 "REQUIRED FIRE FLOW FOR BUILDINGS OTHER THAN ONE- AND
TWO-FAMILY DWELLINGS, GROUP R-3, AND R-4 BUILDINGS AND
TOWNHOUSES® SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

TABLE B105.2 REQUIRED FIRE FLOW FOR BUILDINGS OTHER THAN ONE-
AND TWO-FAMILY DWELLINGS, GROUP R-3, AND R-4 BUILDINGS AND

TOWNHOUSES
AUTOMATIC MINIMUM FIRE- FLOW DURATION
SPRINKLER SYSTEM FLOW {hours}
{Design Standard) {gallons per minute)

No automatic sprinkler | Value in Table Duration in Table B105.1¢2)
system B106.1(2)
Section 903.3.1.1 of the |25% of the value in | Durationin Table B105.1{2) at
CA Fire Code Table B105.1(2)® the reduced flow rate

b. The reduced fire flow shall not be less than 1,500 gpm

Crdinance 2022-01 Page 20

23-0015 D 24 of 53



Appendix D - Fire Apparatus Access Roads
SECTION D103.1 “ACCESS ROAD WIDTH WITH A HYDRANT" SHALL BE AMENDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section D103.1 Access Road Width with a Hydrant. Where a fire hydrant is located on a
fire apparatus access road, the minimum road width shall be 26 feet (7925 mm), exclusive of

shoulders (see Figure D103.1).
Exception: Dnveways

SECTION D103.2 "GRADE" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

SECTION D103.2 Grade. Fire apparatus access roads and driveways shall not exceed 15.9%
in grade unless approved by the fire code official or by the £/ Dorade County amended
California Public Resource Cods Title 14 / Design and Improvement Standards Manual.

SECTION D103.3 "TURNING RADIUS" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

SECTION D163.3 Turning Radius. The minimum turning radius shall be determined by the
fire code official; and shall not include curb and gutter.

SECTION D103.5 "FIRE APPARATUS ACCESS ROAD GATES" SHALL BE AMENDED AS
FOLLOWS:

SECTION D103.5 Fire Apparatus Access Road Gates. Gates securing the fire apparatus
access roads shall comply with all of the following criteria:

1. Where a single gate is provided, the gate width shall be not less than 20 feet (6096 mm).
Where a fire apparatus road consists of a divided roadway, the gate widih shall ke not less
than 15 feet (3658 mm).

2. Gates shall be of the horizontal swing, horizontal stide, vertical lift or vertical pivot type.

3. Construction of gates shall be of materials that allow manual operation by one person.

4. Gate components shall be maintained in an operative condition at all times and replaced
or repaired when defective,

5. Eiectric gates shall be equipped with a means of opening the gate by fire depariment
personnel for emergency access. Emergency opening devices shall be approved by the

fire code official.
6. Methods of locking shall be submitted for approval by the fire code official.
7. Electric gate operators, where provided, shall be listed in accordance with UL 325.

8. Gates intended for automatic operation shall be designed, constructed and installed to
comply with the requirements of ASTM F2200.

SECTION D103.6.1 “ROADS 20 TO 29 FEET IN WIDTH" SHALL BE AMENDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 21

23-0015 D 25 of 53



SECTION D103.6.1 Roads 20 to 29 feet in width. Fire lane signs as specified in Section
D103.6 shall be posted on both side of fire apparatus access roads that are 20 to 29 feet wide
{6096 to 8534.4 mm).

SECTION D103.6.2 “ROADS MORE THAN 29 FEET IN WIDTH" SHALL BE AMENDED AS
FOLLOWS:

SECTION D103.6.2 Roads more than 29 feet in Width. Fire lane signs as specified in Section
D103.6 shall be posted on one side of fire apparatus access roads more than 29 feet wide
(8534.4 mm) and less than 36 feet wide (710972.8 mm).

SECTION D104.4 “"CIRCUMFERENTIAL FIRE APPARATUS ACCESS ROADS” SHALL BE
ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

SECTION D104.4 Circumferantial Fire Apparatus Access Roads. When required by the
fire code official, a fire apparatus access road shall be consiructed to encompass the entirety
of a strucfure and shall provide a continuous means of emergency vehicle access.

SECTION 4; CONFLICT
That Ordinance No. 2019-01 of the DSEDFPD, and alf other ordinances or parts of ordinances

herewith are hereby repealed.

SECTION 5: SEVERABILITY
If any Ordinance, article, subsection or subdivision thereof, provision, sentence, clause or

phrase of this code, or any application thereof, is for any reason held to be invalid by a court
of competent jurisdiction, such decision shall not affect the remaining provisions of this code,
which can be given effect without the invalid portions and, therefore, such invalid portions are
declared to be severable., The DSEDFPD hereby declares that it would have enacted this
Ordinance and each of its articles, sections, subsections, or subdivisions thereof, provisions,
sentences, clauses or phrases lrrespective of the fact that one or more of them is declared

invalid.

SECTION 6: EFFECTIVE DATE AND PUBLICATION

This Ordinance shall take effect thirty {(30) days after its adoption. The DSEDFPD Board
Secretary is directed to publish this ordinance in a newspaper of general circulation in the
District. In lieu of publication of the full text of the ordinance, a summary of the ordinance may
be published by the by the Board Secretary within fifteen (15) days after its passage and a

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 22

23-0015 D 26 of 53



certified copy shall be posted in the office of the DSEDFPD pursuant to Government Code
Section 36933(c) (1).

The above Ordinance was introduced at a meeting of the Board of Directors of the DSEDFPD
on October 11, 2022, and it was then read for the first time. A public hearing was set for the
Ordinance to be read for the second time on October 31, 2022, and approved by the following

vole:

PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of Directors of the DSEDFPD this, 31* day of October,
2022.

AYES: 2
NOES: O
ABSENT: 2
ABSTAIN: O

£s

Gary ?épar. B/ﬁ'gctor

ATTEST;

-

Lori Tuthill, Board Secretary

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 23

23-0015 D 27 of 53



EDHCWD, DSP, ECF, CPCSD, PFPO, RFPD

101.1 Amend with the name of the junisdiction Locally adopted and amended Adminstrative noed
w84 i Adtombie Wecking |\ u adoored andamended  |Adminisiraive need due o adilln of sectin 105.5.55.
Allows the fire cods offictal b anforca the fire code (specific
& ” in fire sccess, vegetefion claarances, hazardous materials,
105556 ﬂ"’"f"“""’f’,}fﬁ":ﬁm“wm Locally createdand adopled.[efc.) within automabike wrecing yan operstions, This was
omobila Wracking ; a demorstratad need experisncad within tha Dismond
Springs Fire Dupartment.
Add section i requice constiucton parmil for | Adminisiralive need due to adtition of saciion 105.6 26 and
10538 Autorobie Wrackng Yards, Locally crested and 8dooted |40 6 ¢
Allows the ire code offidal (o selkete this fins code (spesific
Add section to require construttion pemnil for to fire secess, vegetation cemrances, hazardous maleials,
Ll Autorobie Wrecking Yards. Locally croatad and adopted |\ ool onsirustad aner modified auiomobile
wratking yard operations.
Allows the Bre code afficial io review and epproved Iraffic
: - y ralming davices price tu gtallation. Fire Code curtenily
104.6.26 s "“““""“‘““’f"‘“‘“’?"“ g focally crauled snd sdopled permits Hha firs coxde official 'o rgutabs traffic caliming
atafation o fafic cakmin dedces devices, However, a permit fsat curmently raquirad prior to
fnstaltation cauaing undue hardship to
Adopling this secion ke aliow for Ie cosation sad suancs
of foes. achual Section 1056 i
1075 Section Addad. Prawously sechon106.5 Locly dopied ndamended (77 wmw:;:- Mhmm”"‘"“'
Coda 17451
10761 [sachon added. Prswousy secian 1066 1 ocaly s andadigied o e e s T S coel
1077 Saction added, Prevscusly section 1067 Locaity regied nd adopted mmmm;wwmwmmmm
Section 111.5.0f Chapler 1 of the Fire Gode of the Cistnct i
added to read ds-follows:
141 5 Appeal Procaduras and Timetnas Tha intont of s
provision & to darilfy the procedures and mvelines for a0
1His Secton adde] Frewsousiy section 109 4 Locally adoptad s amended  [inchvidusl ov sntity t B an agpes] i the Board of Appesis
regarding ar orclar. diciiaom, te detviaiont by the Fig
Code Offical Basad on the Coimty of E1 Dorsti’s
Vegetshon Mansgement Ordinance Board of Appeats”
|tmeiine
P Comiived Allows the Fra Code Official {2 eniorts the Fie Gode that
mnmmpamﬂm Mmrg’m protects 1 1nd property. Foes have been updeled
124 by the SEM. It s batter ief a locallies (o det Localty adosied snd amended. | malch the fses and penathies #3 deamad scpropriats by the
he : for B i District Ateenary's Office Tha chianga i Bre languegs In
st s include tha fami infractiony.
142 4.2 Citntions 15 sdded fo road s folows. 1124.2
Citabons
The Fire Chist or hisher duly authorized repesentativs(sl
fasue citabions Tor infradtions of ml
T QST e rons vt
Health and Sefsly Sode of th Siate of Califomss and
Chapter 5c {commancng with suciion 853 6) of Tide 3 of
Part 2 of 4 Pacal Code of the Slatsaf Cakiomis.
Previousty gecbon 112.4. Complati tha saction by
fling In the biank porbons Staf wase nct campletsd . LAl wolations of B code have heen oonsolidated under
1134 the SFM Bix batter i lo localities i Locally adopied e soenied S 112 & o inciude he sies for
determine the fesa/penattiss {or thar respective
arpas

23-0015 D 28 of 53




(Added definiions for Campfire, Diiveway. Dixricl,
{Execulive Body, Fie Chuel, Firs Hizard, Open Buming, and

02 N Added definificns fo= clarifty Loveally crasfac ared adophed Traned Crowd Manager Defintion of open buming shall
not inciude resdental LPG, naturel gas fusied, or wood
Jbuming appliances st caremonial buming.
021 N Added deliniton of campfire to Sechion Locally created and adopled Added defirition for dlarity.
T R T SR o910 et s o
W74 Y 3 Lpcuy craaind and adcpiad have writisr moey ingant fulse pesteiniy 1o open fires
jmﬂmﬁwm within grass, brush, and fres coverad amay.
" Provides the creaion of a floor plan for the purpasa of
Adced seclion lo require pre-fir plana for new |
40121 N Sl meBbed EtIoi. Localy created arid adopled mmmmaauﬁWbyememmmpmse
Fire apparetus am baconming langer and teflor. A verlical
cearanca of 15 Tasl provides prooer cieerance for
apparaius t pass ender withcef damaging appersitus
components: It also elows en extanded fima fame bokre
having [ racu the proedt: of the wagetation. Addtionsl
50321 ] CM%I’ n:;:::dm!oﬁmmm Locaity sdopted st smendad IMNW daarances acts as an increospd Duffer
for o aprond of firs A mmd width of 20 feet exclosive of
shouidars, g8 messured face of cb (o face of iy [s
neaded. These struciines con ha difficult to nevigle with
fire apparatus and should not b counted i e totel
divable road sitace.
[Acdud o spectfic sacion for R3's whera 1 allows the F"‘“Pln'“m';mm?m
80326 N mmmm'umsmwmm i - Jod fre vehich uwﬁuml E'_p 5
maich ax they requice limarounde for fire apparaius s il agross. s o
accass roacs and drivewsys ':'" - “m “th'miiﬂ'
| Allows codes 8nd standsaids ke Bridges and Elsvated
Changed ther ssction for Bridges and Elevated Surfaces of El Doregio County and Aspendix D of the
faces i slabe and maich £1 Dorado County i currant Firs Coda, whichever s mora raainelive, 1o by
326 % | Transpodation Division v addition to AASHTO HB- Localy edopted and congistent throughout county sgencies end ig allowsd &5 i
17 (minimum CFC requires} allemate maans & mathod thet s not lees rastriclive than
LhF‘tsm
Previously saction $03.4.2, Added saction reganding This section dearly defines the "No Parkung in Fire Larine™
0311 . no packing o fios lenas. 1 Localy created wid écdoplesd rules and (s consistent with tha Cakiomis Yahicle Code
. This saction daady dafinea he "No Parking it fant of fie
Previously section 50.3.4.3. Added saction raganding . :
503,32 B e s ford cl | Locatyonsated ard adopted 'mu Tules and i contsot with the Caiflues Vehice
. is saction clearty daftnes Celtfomlp Fire Coda Appemdix D
Praviously secfion 503 4 &, Addad seetion regarding
50433 N 8 Ko Eiacd 57 e it Localiy crasted and sdopiad wmummmwmmmm
mmmaa m':‘;dm |ASows fire disincls the suthonty o approve ales on
: ATefgency accoss roedways basad on the Datnef's gate standand, proniding
546 N consistancy firough all roadway gstes w El Dorado Loralfy created and sdoptad Ihe best pessiie emergoncy sccess to mainian fast
County, rafernng 1o the gats standards adopted by resprone fies.
the FPO's
Added saction pedawing to the visual addressing of Allows fe dastricts the anthoniy 10 appiove addossaing
Aoat N ladings Locnlty sdoptnd sndamended | 1 the Distocts addrassing senciseis
Commarcial proparbes ura raquwes] to mstall Fydranty af
QR L ety Mancoec it thie 300 fook intarvais, s they shoukd neser b cutaed of 150
ST ey N placement of hydrants and ther relstonship tn Lucally sdoplad snd smendad oot rom sy grver hyckant ut atytime thaf he dislance
g inbatwoon}

23-0015 D 29 of 53




Added verbiage to bang all of the necesssy firs
Jcontrols for & budding to ane location

Locally crested and adopted

Busidings are getting eoce sastie ivibe cordy i moe
common to have rew buikings with solac erays that
continue to generats powes gven whast B biridings

ol utlifles have been shutoff. Wien Shore ts an
lomergency. it /& wital fhal we have moud stcess io o of e
controls in-one locaion for public evacuation and Erefighter
satety e ¥ he fire danger presant i El Dorado County
throughout mcet of tHie year, this changs i spiropriale and
advisable

0423

Emergency Responder Radio System Secondary
Power Supply Modfication

Locally adoplad and 2manted

Amend 16 72 hour capacty far back-up power due 1o
weaather and PGAE safety related power outages,

32

|Adds 8 requirgment for spsinkior system instaliation
in new bulldings and Mructures 3,600 square fosl o
gmmum

Locaily adopled and smesded

Adminisirative need due i addiion of section 903.2.22 and
9032.23

321t

Previously secion 933,21 Ados o caquremont for
system matsistion m new Group &

ings and structures 3,600 sauece fgel or

grmater withn e distnct

Locally adoRed and srnsnded

Dua 13 fhe topographe, climatic, and geographie condilions
of El Dorado County and ther contributing fackors: To our
incraesad rasponsa lnss, along with the fact et fres
doubla In e each end svery minuls, wa requird spnniders
10 be installad in stnuctums once ey each 3,500 squars
st In seze 23 thoy raiate bo e bafavior end rata of
spread.

903212

Previously secton 303.2.1 Asds & requirement for
system insiniation in naw Group A-1
buligings and structures 3,600 sauare fest oc
raslar wiihin the district

Locally adopted and amended

Due {1 the {cpographic, dimatic, and grographle condiiens:
of £l Dorado County and their contibuting fioes o our
ncreased nesponas fimes, slorg wit the fec that fires
double e siza sack and every minuls, we tequins Sprinklan
fo b ingtaliod in sfructiras onsa they resch 3,600 squate
foot in 9120 &% thoy rolsts to fea Bekavior snd Arls of

spread.

L sk B

Previously section 803.2 1 Adds & requirement for
spnkler system mstallation i e Group £-2
bulidings and struciures 3,600 squisre feaf or
greater within the distvcl

Locally sdopled and amanced

Due o the topographs, dimatic, end geographit condibins
of E} Derado County end thar contribsting facions o our
increased response timas, alpng vath the fact et fires
double in e sach At svery mitLle, W nakiEs spankiens
o benstallnd in structures onoa they rssch 3,500 squane
feol in 5za a3 thay relate to e behavior and rats of
spread

Ynz14

Prawousy secton B03.2.1 Addy o requirsnset i
apeinkier syatem nsialation i new Sroup A-3
brdings and struciumes 3500 scquare fsot or
igreator within e districk

Locally sdopled and amended

Dus Io the topographic, climatia, and geographic conditions
of £ Dorado County and ther coabribisting fectors 1o our
increaded rasponda trias, ol wilk e Bt fiat firos
double In 520 aach Bnd avary minile, wo nezurs Sprinkiors
1o be estalfed in slructures once Uiy mech 5600 squams
foel in ez us Hiay roketa o find bebawor and rete of

spread

903.23

Priviously sackon 503.2.3 Adda & quirement for
sponider system misteRefion in tew Group €
buildings and siructures 3,600 square faet or
IMMhmm

Locofly edopted acd smended

Due io the togograpnic. dimatic, 3o geograptic: sontitions
of £l Dorade County end [heir oritribuling fseties lo our
increased response tmes, slong witht By bk thel finey
double in aze aach st avery minle, v raouie spnkiss
1o be kistafed in sfructures oncs thay reach 1800 squme

foel i sizst u Sy ook fo Bre hehmvor snd rats of
spread

K324

Adds a rsduirarment fie spsakior aystemn natallation
lin new Group F usikings and siruck it 5,800
Wmnuwgmwlmmdm

Locally adoptad enat smendad

Dua i the lopographic, cimalic. and geogmaphic sonditions
of E1 Dorado County and the ooatributing faciors io oor
incrensed meponss Bmas, along wify the fack iat fres.
double (n 2o eacls sl avsty mincte, we asgins sponiden
1o b inetallad I structures oncs ey reach 1600 squas
feet in oire a3 ey rolade & Rex behevior and mte of

sproad

3zl

Adds & tecearsmmat & spinkier systom insteliation
in new Group M buildings and siuctures 3.600
squive leet or graater within Sr disingt

Lotally sdopted and amenided

Due In fiua topograpine, climatic, and gaograpiio conditions
of Bf Dorda County snd thsk eonirbuting lactors io our
Incraased response fmee, long with the fact that fices
double i aizs sach ard every minale, we recrine spankiens
1o be Ingisiled s struciimes once thay reach 1600 soare
feel in aize 83 they relals to lew behavior and rate of
spreed

23-0015 D 30 of 53



wWizr2

Previously saction $03.2.7. Adda o requirentent for
spankler sysiem sisfafiaticn w new Group Mwit
Uipholstered Fumture or Matinsteses bikdings and
Istruchutes 3600 aquire foet or grester within the
jdistnct

Localty adopted snd amandsd

Due ko the topographic. climatic, s gecgraphiis condRions
of El Dorado County esd thelr conliiburting felors i our
increased responss: imas, sk witl the fact that fires
double in 520 aach and every e, we nIEUS yprinklens

be instalied in struciures once Biey raach 3500 squar
feed in sizs us oy mlate to fee batvicr and rate of

soread

Wrzas

M

| Praviously section 03 %62 This sactioe was
croatad o incude maeuTachyad medential single
memrmmwmmm.

Losaty adogted and smandmi

Menufactured Homes — The intant of this code section i to
ensure that manufactured homes ihat sofve as & ons of two-
tamily dwailings ara conststent with tve provisions found i
CRC Section 313 pertaining to bust dwefiinga of & similer
nature  Manufectured homes piaced In tha wikiland-urban
interface have 8 haightaned risk of :sped Srs consumpiion
dua to s fight-weight austons of ther consiruction. The
rapid firs spvead throughout Biess siutires prasents &
significant nsk 1o their occupants. Residenbal sprinkler
systams have baen ncorportied tdacraase this nisk
successiully in many Calforma communities

pad

Prevousty secton BIL2.§. Adds & requirermant for
speinkier systam natallation i new Grovp $
Buildings and stroctures 3,600 squave feel of
grestor wilhn the dstnct

Locally sdogted and smanted

Due & i tepographic, ckmatic, and geogrephic condltions
of EI Dorade Condy and thir coniributing factors & eur
gmmmmmmmmﬁm
double & st i and wvery minute, we require sprinkiery
10 b engtalisd n swuchures oncs they reach 3,600 square
fsat i sz as thay relate & fre bebvicr and cate of
sproad

Wiz

Previcusly secton 303.2 Adds a requirement for
||mmxmmnmmnmawps-2
ibuidings and struchunes 3,800 sousrs fast or
igreate: wilhin the deinct

Loxally sdoplad srd smanded

D $o the sopngrashic, chmalic. and geographst corditions
of &) Dorada County and thar conlibiuimg fecions jo our
increased responsa Umes, along with He facl that fres
double xr wize sach And every mitute, we requics sprinkians
10 b istaed in stnctunes once they reach 3,600 square
faet i sz s fhey relate tofra behawor and rsts of

spread

8032101

Previously saciion 803.2 50 Adat & requirsment for
sprnkler system nstadlatios: in rew Commaimasf
Pavking Garage bulidings and sieuctures 3,800
square font or grester wilhtin the: distzict

Lacally adopled and amended

Due fo the lopogrephic. chmalic, and geographis condibens
of E1 Do County and their coniributing factons i our
incronsod response times, sk wilh By fact thait firee
double in 3zeeach and avery miute, we recuirs Sprinkias
10 be instalisd in siruciures tros they teach 3,600 squats
feet In sze a2 ey reiete bo fire behavior and rits of
spread

a2z

Praviously cocion 503,27 Adds 8 mauirement
sprinkler system instafation in sew Group B
buildings end sructures 3,600 sauiscs fest o
greater within [ha distnol

Localy sdupted and amended

Dua o the topogragitic. cimatic, and geographic condihons
of El Dorada Cotmty srid Bweir contributing factons 1 our
increased responss tmes, glong with th fact tht fires
doubla m size saci snd every minule. we reguire spenkiers
o be instalied i straciures once thwy rsch 3600 nquane
ot Wy aize as they relaie 1o fire behavior and rats of
sproad

Praviousty section 303.2. Adds & requrement for
sprinkier sytem mstallation m new Group F-2
buidings and structures 3 BOC square feet or
greater withn the distnct

Locaily adoptod and amundad

Dua to he lopographic, timabic, and geograghic conditons
of El Dewnckr Catinty and this contributing facton fo oor
increased responag tmas, elong with e fad hat s
doublo in sze each and every minkie, we raqur sprnkies

be iruatallad i struckiws crcs they mach 3,600 aqans
foet i iz s Hisy raliste b s bahanior and iste of
spread

Praviously soclion 80328 Adds & mguerenent o
install aprinkders for exsting buidings that undema
a changs i tse of drester fiszant o i INCTOSSE
siza greater Bian 500 aquars feel and the resulting
squars feet s groster ther 3.600 square feat
Previeusly sppled 1o addion of mare than 30% o
1,000 squsre ‘eel

Locally eesatad and adepiad

Due to the topcgraphic, cimatic, rnd geogragitic cancitions
of Bl Dorado County s thiow contibuting faclors o our
incroased responss imes, siag sih the fact that fires
double in size each and arvery minuta, e rsuIng sprinklers

be Inalalied in shruciires once thay mach 3,600 squars
foet i aize 25 My i (o fies buhion and cate of
spread

23-0015D 31 of 53



5072

installation in new Suikings and structures 3,600
square lewel of |ass within the disinct

Locally adopled and sewnded

Adminisirative nead due # sddition of secion §03.2.30.

Previously section 307 2. Addad ccoupant
protection for fire alamms in Group A buddings wifh a
Tloor aves lass har 3600, excopt RI, &G buildings

Locay created and adopled

Provides proper amanysncy: aolification for actupances hat
aliow gublic san and ansures Firs Department ristification m

watd
i inot used for commercial purposes, s buildings
# ficor aeas of less than 500 squace faat az O avmnd of . cx ik
approvad by the o cods offioal
Previously section ST 28, Added occupant
prolection for fire stamns i Croug B benldings with & B ik

w223 floor aroa less han 3,000, mxcopt R3. AG buddings | | i andadonted |alow publicuse snd eosuras Fi Dmc:mﬂhﬂ:::
not used for commercial puiposss, &1 buikdings e ;us;‘ ens‘;\:m o
with 2 figor ares of legs than 500 squars et 25 ittt el
appeoved by B Rra coda offorgt
Praviously section 507.28, Addad ocougant
protection Ko fes slanms i Grots E bulkdngs vith 2 :

e floce area loss fan 3,600, except K3, &G tuldings o o AR W e e m“"“”;‘“m”m”‘”

i ok used fos commanial purposss, and tuldings Locally HICOl mmﬁ:rmﬁ:: smires Fine Cepartini ork Mt
it oy arwe of feex than 50 squsne st s 8 Dol m e o ks
approved by Bhe fe coda offical
Prevously sechon 50724, Added cocugmnt
protection for e slams: in Groug F buldngs wilh & o

WT21 Toor e (ess s 3,800, sxcept R3, AG buitings o P "m':d' e '":ﬂ’t '”“m"p. M” -
ot used for eommestcan! purpamss, end buddings ECRI Cond Rt M [+ W;"';: S FAN oot i
with & floor srea of less ac 500 squane Teet as s L Ll
approved by the e code officsl
Proviously secions 907,25 Added accupant
profechon for fre alamms o Group H viltngs with

R 2 foor ez less han 3,600, wroapt R3, AG ; :mmmm;“;w“;ﬂm“m“

: Enifdings nof uset for commercial purposes, and Baioly assind e Aot e p“m“s;. :::':‘ #8 OATIERG SIS
buddings with a floor area of tess fan 500 square NS C1 8 B0 o
ot 58 anproved by S fire cose officini
Preacusly sechon 907 2o Added occupant
profection for fire alarms it Group | bukiings wath 5

e Ao ared less o 3,600, owowpt K3, AGbuidg | | st b s Wi e
ol e for comensnsal gesposes, ard buidings acally created and xdoptad m“:':w;@; :v::ru i Deparimant nofifcation n
Wwith & floor ares ef less Buan SO0 s fusk 29 okt ol iy
approved by ibs fire coda sfficial
Praviously sechon 907 2a Added ocoupant
protaction for fire alamms in Group M buldings with ;

e  foor ates s than 3,600, axcept R3, AG = L‘”‘“W’“‘*”"“;;m”m”w“
buldings nal used Tor cormercisl pumoses, snd QM cramet et ackptes ““:L‘;n SpEime s kROt St
buldings with & foor acna of lesy dian 500 saquars U Al Ao
foal a8 approved By B frs code officist
Pravously section 507 20. Addad oeoupant
rotection for fre wisms ut Group 7-1 buddings ;
wih & foor ares less than 5,600, evapt B3, AG PO e By ORAGON SRR Bt

WrikA Locally craated and adopted aliow public uee and engurns Fie Depadment notification n

[bulldings not used for commeecial purposes, and
buidings with & Soor s of laas than 500 souace
lmswmmmmmm

tha event of a s oF Smicks:

23-0015 D 32 of 53




Praviously sechion 907.2a. Added cocupant
for fre slarms in Group R-2, R-2.1, end R

2 buliiigs with 8 foor area less thae 3,600,

Provides proper emagency noification for accupancies that

907284 excopt RY, AG buidings not used for commercial Locatly crasied and adopiad llow public e S etsures Fire Departmant nobfication n
and buldings with & floor ares of less avent of a fire or smoke
‘m“m-mhnmm
Prviously sachon 307 2a. Addad oocupant
for fre darms In Group 5 buldings with a fifcation for bocupancies tat
9072164 foor aromloss hon 3600, except RS, AGbudings | |y e and adopted  |afow pubic s and ensires Fi Deparimant notfication
used for commarcial purposes, and buikdings i ovent i 8 Ko & ik
& fioor ares of less then 500 square feet a5 ]
by the ra code officel
P«mmm%ﬂ?‘:;w "ﬁ’;’:"‘ Prevides proper smstysndy noliication for occupancies that
907 2.30 m’ e h‘mh'”mmmmm Locally crested and sxopled lmma:$H'WMn
instalied or repiaced
Provides proper responise and maintensnce Srunner servce”
of firs alarm systems. NFPA 72 specifles required response
times for firs alarm trouble and supenisory signals to
ansure systems rsmain opeeafionst. A Type A UL isted
%0765 Requres e slrh syslors 0 bomontared DY UL | | ocaty crestod snd adopisd [cenvl sation meels s NFPA requked fra o response
ypo A cankal sinton. ensung an operational fira alam system at sl imes.
ULType A listing raqures central stations to pirovida thie
“runner service” of conirack with anciher entity ta provide
|thus servica o oblain e sting.
Prmary Secondary Alsm Power Supply Amand 1072 hour capactty for bad-up powst dus io
el Modfcation Locaty cranlod el adopiod | e and PGAE safely relelod power Oulages
Praviously secion 3072 Addad ocoapant
for anisting buildings without automabe Prowdes proper smemency nolificaion for secupancies thal
0T & spankier systems bo mstil 2 fine erm o they add Locally created and adopted allow pubic use and ensures Fire Daparment nolification in
more than 30% or 1,000 squars feet to the the svant of n fire of smoke
structure, whichever s less
This saction sdds 2 Shunt Tip powar shul off devices fo
120013 hsnmlwwnmmu Locally adoptad and amended  |ensura amergency powsr shut off during the use of back-ap
power supplies.
Prawously secon 1310 Adcress requinsments for Adcreasing lor construdtion sfies 8 important fo assst
a3 i i Locally created and adopled respcnding smerpency crews.
Previousy saction 3312 ¢ Waler suppies ol Water must ba o sife pocx i conBusible matoral Being
[ixt construction skes witk combustible matsrins cnaie|  LOCHY #doptad and amendad  verbiel conmtnuchon Commancing.
Hazzrdous matenels ralaled inidents are costly fo mitigate.
fe W“Mm:mmwlﬁﬂgml S i H e lncadent is caused by neghgence du ko & business
R S foe mwm-egmmmﬂhgmmkh
ot Laglrenbip b Alowes agancies hat rmed 1o Know ehout exploswves 8nd
56012 jves. and by the Firs Chif and the Bowsd of Locally adopied and amenced frmworks to approve tham and have a dear undersianding
5 or f b of tha applications ot kow they will be used
Esiablished fnils as requwed by the Fire Code for Clasa |
Hammable sud Clats 1 combusiible lgud siorsge in sbove
ST4.286.1 mils as sel forth m the Fie Code Lecally adopled and amended ek, Roquioes AN sopvoved i 5
Special/Condibonal Use Permt from the County
Estabiished bmits as requirsd by tie Fire Code for Class |
Yammabia and Clasx i combustible fqud specisl
5708.24.4 Esiablished imils as 56t fxth n the Fiee Gode Locally adoptad and amended ¥ above-ground tanks, Requires AHJ approvel
1 Special’Conditional Use Permif fom the Cournty

23-0015 D 33 of 53



Adminesirative nead o add Distnc! name. Extsbiiahed limits

s raquined oy the Fire Code Officel for Flammebis
(Adminustrative addtion of District risme.,
5606.2 Eatablished Neits a5 sef forth i thaFies Coda Locatly adopiad and smended.  [Cryogenic fluds s siationaty coniainers. Ragquees AHJ
appeoval and & SpeciskCondtionat Lisa Permit frran e
County
Eslablishes distances betwee LPG slomge and
cispensaries that ane diectly raintad b sty for rosisantial
: developments and high-density hotelx, mobels, spartments,
a104.2 mfmm Loy adogted and smanded  [otc. whee & pelagse by lesk o sxpkosion of LP-Ges woukd
| nave & high probetity of kijury, istalation, o demih.
Requires AHJ spproval snd a SpecslTondiional Use
Parmi from the County
Digmanllod and stored vshicies sressnt sigalficant fire loads
(batteries Mammabla and combusiible liqulds, uphoistery.
. i .} arte riak b vegetation and adjacent propesdies, This
th!arsgéNFFA‘ 1- l'l;m-m!es ﬁmli@wmmmbm«ﬂm Lecally —— reul 405 e i
Autorols Whecking G vegelation in Butomobile wreeking yard oparations I 8id in
firaiightiong operations and reduction of firs sxension (o
adjacent properies and/or opsn lands.
Amended to include on-3its senider feads and wiench o
|site for smwment reginy, the melusion of 8 locel wator flow
alarm f cronte an sudible sla Ko the flow of water In the
NFPA 130-16 of Chapter 80 of the Fire Code of the event of waler schivation in 3 vacant sinecture, aed
Chapter 53, NFRA, Diatrict has besn amended 1o updabe Vanioun 3 st hydrostatic lesting mquiemants o assum proper 130
13016 provisions parseing b Bia festalistion of sonnkler Lo S e sprkler sysbam inslallafion dacraasing the nak of waler
systoms in one ged two-Iaméy deeilings damage from pipe fslure. Passivg purge requiremants
wears 850 mdded b snsune water orculstion through s
systam, recucng wagnant water and backfiow concams
(EID sncoumges thig typa of systam).
Allows us to match whisf deveicopars and resigents am used
; 10 in regarcs to GPM fiee flow requirsments that have fesn
; Changed 500 GPM to 1.000 GPH in maxr :
m?ﬂgﬂ subdivissons below 5000 font slsvaiion, 18 maleh Locedly adoptad and amended :‘:::“l -m;?ammam
] fire flow precadents used i EDC for veary o Sy e :
house fo hiowss, homa to vegwtation, addfor vegetatrion
to house sriion
Ax . Table Established a minimum requirament of 1,500 GPM, Allows us tu mpich whal deveicpens and resdents are ysad
“pwa'tm below 000 fock elevation. for all commarcial Locally adopted sad sanded 10 irs rixynrda b GBS Bre flow requaramants ot Nave beer
progacts used for over a decade in EDC.
: It 15 unreasonabla to require & Meidanlis drivawsy 1o
Agperiin O E103 1 Added an sxception for ressdandial dnvesmys Locaity adaplod and amended 226 oot wide spacs for acoast io & hydhant
Tithe 4 racuires s 10 ooy accest up 1o 16% diveways,
’ ’ Amendad to meet Sinte 1sw of grades no grater any exceptions would requive approval by fhe AHU B our EF
Appenie il 1032 e 16% withar Wikbond Urb Irtertacs Locally sdopled and anended |1y rus County Title 14 adoplon we allow graetor than 16%
grade with AF appoovsl snd barrd surtscs.
20 foot s widthie shall st ingluds curbs snd gutiens dug
Appende U DI 3 Added text 10 include curtsa and guiters Locally adbptisd s airieided o potenal sccese ssiee and boming rads concems.
P Whare fira spnaraius S0y 1oads consat of & divitlod
Appendie D D105 ;“?ﬂ"“'"’""“‘”" mmmmmw Localy ssiopied 6nd amonded. | roadway tha gate width sha nol be less han 14 feet duety
PE apparsue fuming redius
[No parking or: oads allowad oo roathwitys loss Bian 23 Feel
y in wicth abowe 5000 foat  Loser tha 5000 Ket thia doss
Appancix B 010361 Rond widths 20 to 24 font Localty pdopted and amendad ot apply. This secton i adoptad 55 & stacda iy e Fes

Code Appendix [ section 103.6 1 for s other elevations.

23-0015 D 34 of 53



on one Side orly on rads from 28 foet i 35 feet
Thiss In not vequired less San 5000 feet of
Appendhx D D10262 m:‘"“"""“""“"""“” Lacally adopted snd amended * Lowse than 5000 fet hi doee not egply. The
18 adoplad 88 & Stants in v Fles Code Appendix 0
103.6.2 for ¥t nthwe slevadong.
recquiret by fhe firs ook officisl, 5 s sppearshos
X ) | Added to requrs croumifsrantal fire appantug roud shall be constructed io encompass the sntire
ki BCOBSS 108dS EE L e and shall provids 8 coniuious maans of
vehicle sccags.
Adopted with no Amendments
101.1 trough 1016 wwlllbsthhmem Locafy wiogied dmissiratn clarty
102.1 through 102 12 Relerences, subyects not requlsted by the Gode Loally adonied | Adminstrative clarity
:ﬁ.:ﬁﬁm | Abity to enforca the code Loy accpted Admnstrative clanty
:g:;;:w Time limitaton of application Locally adapted | Adminvstrative canty
106 1 through 106 4 ’m&‘xﬂ“m“m"‘ Lacally adopted F e schedulos for patls
107 1 heough 107 & oy st prtets i Leocaly adopted inspection authonty
Mamtenance of safeguards, testing and eparedion of
108 1 yough 103.6 m:“ﬁm HMN; e Locally adoplad lsquipment. re-axspecon and fesfing, recordkasping,
supanvision, mndenng equipmient mopacable, overcrowding,
| Adoptod this section for adminisirabve dasily and
113 [#s 314 o satey inspactons Liscatly adopiad Stop work grder
od this saclion for sdmmstrative tiatly anc
1141 through 114.7 #d it safely inspecs Locally sdopted Unsafe struciures or equipment
Agphall knfffes coriian Highly flammebls scbstances and
require stnngant eaRYLANS. Managing ignition scurces
301 1 through X08.5 | Adopted this secion for fira and i safely Looadty edopied through resporshbila application. of stendeeds will reduce the
number of fres in various saftings (Clmatic, geciogical,
and lopographica)
General piparpiitanty reiabing W amoking Vacan! premises
condition and sately requinerignts, abandoned premises,
10 1 theough 3914 Adopted thes sacion for s and e ety Localty sdoplecs ‘“"“I”'_@M“’"W-W.Wf“
removet of hazamdous matenals (Clmatic, gedlogrcal and
topographical)
% . y General rctirements for roads, funnels, and tndges.
5231 Adopled this seclion for fire nd Iife sefaty Locally adopted {Climasic, geclogica, and topographicall
Provides evacuaton dills for hazandous and nshtatlonal
4036 through 40376 Adopled I section fr firg and [¥e safsly Locally adopled gecupancies (occupancies with ncreased pefantial for lfe
iosa)
y Provdes on diitis
463 9 through 403 9.4 Adopted this secton forfre and ife safety Locaity adopted baso: oy ionss “mﬁgf’s
405 1 Brough 405.10 A dopted ths section fox ira and e sataly Locally sdoptiet ““"”’mwm {Clmete.
Adopted this section for administrative ofality and ; A permit is required for emergency responder radio systaTs
5103 fire and li‘e safaly inspections Epolls aleac (Chmatic, geological, and fopographical)
Adopted this section for adminiskative dlarly and Decorative vegetation poses art rcraase in azard,
fA06.1 thrmgh B05.4 Ilirund {ife salely inspectons Lecally adopted flammabilty and increased ris«.
Wall covenngs 1 group E occupancies (Schoois) sels
Adopted this gaction for adminisiraive cliity snd maximym amount of fammabie wal coverings in
(807 1 eough 807 5.5 Ihsulﬁanfwmmm Locally adoptad oducatonal facioes (Cmatic, gelogical, and
{topographical)

23-0015 D 35 of 53




| Adopted this section for atiinistiativa ety s

Combustibie fumishing pose a sighificant Tammabiity and

808 1 through BOB.S ire and lfa saoly lnspactions Locally adopied mfmadlrra sar'ely haxeed in institutionsl and coflags domm
S . Provides clarity on accoptancs (esBing of dutomatic fre
a044.1 Adopted s soier o ecmiisialive charty end Locally adopted extinguishing systems. {CHatic, qeciogica, and
firo and e sakely inspeciions topographica)
1101.1 through 1102.1 i‘;"‘:"::d“’:im':’ BRRARN 1 Locaily adopted [Adminisiralive ity
Responder radio covarsge it axialing bulldings.
Al besidings will be required to allow emergancy responders
to recarve and lransme! eengrgency rdio raffic 1o and from
nach offier 8ndf the emargenay dispetch center. Tima
. : Iramas can be developed to come into comtpliance s the
Adopted this secton  sxisting buikings k the phasing in of & Systim over & gerod of Sme, defemined by
e JRSNEECE SRS Snf o S Locim sckcpted the o code offical, s sccaptatle Tha ratcosie bohnd s
posconies soction @ Hat o almast af emegency reeponder wiury of
fatality nodents communicalion & a ley stas. This
siustion can be comacied with the addifion of adio
quipment 10 boost i snal i areas that do notheve
strong signel (Thimabie, geclogical. snd topographical
Requires instaltabion of fire sprnkler syatems In axisting
3 Adopled this sectian for Lhe salaty of tha publie, Locally 8¢ secupancies with high Iife safefy risk arid i confomance
e firafghters. and other emangency respondars withe previous Unifony Fire Codes. (Climatie, geological, and
topographical)
7 - Requirzs Instalation of carbon monexide alaamsin
Adopted this soction for the: safefy of e publlc, . it Wit [ saffety sk {CEmat
e firefightets, and other emerency regpenders Loy Mo :::Jt::o:: p:'['ul;“m’ el s
" Provides & minimum leved of sa’ety with regavd lo egrass
R Sicuh Adapled this section for the safaty of the publc Locally ndopled trom eusting busitings housing occupancies with a high Ife
1104.25 firafighters, and oifiar smergansy responders salaty sk, {Climalc. geological, and topographical)
3 Prawides a minkmum foval of safety a e storage yards
1106 1 through Adcpted rru:s_ec&m for ihe asfaty of the public, Locally adopled with high levels of flaenmalls rubber matensl (Climatic,
1106 1.2 firafghters. aad other emergency fasponders geclogical, and topographical
Appendix D D10% 1 Adopled this section for the safily of e puliic, Locally General requinsmients for ke Apiarsius access roaia
Iheough E1104 1 firafighters. and other ame:gency respondion: e including loads (Cmatis, gackgical, and inpographical)
Appendix D' D134.2 Adapiad thes sacton ke e safely of the publls, fontod Commercial srd ndusinial development e apperatus
|(excluding exception) frefighlers, and slher amamency Mspondac Eouslty accass roads (Climatiz, geolngics, and fopogeicslh
Appencix D" D104 3 (Adopted this saction for The safely of the public, Losally adopisd Commearcial snd'indusinal davelopment fre apcanis
theough D054 firefighters, and other amergency fespomiens access roads (Climebic, gealagicst. and logographicall
Appendix O £H0E 1 Adopted this sacton for v safety of fis public, Fire |ppmamumru_muwmmfmi_mﬁ
{sreluding exceplion) refightsrs, and olber amergency FeSONAS Laclf opins davelopments (Chmelic, geclogical, and toparaptical].
Appendix D: D108.2 Adopted His section for e salisty of the publie, Locat Fire apparalus aocees roady for mulliple-tamiy ressdontial
through B106.3 firefighters, and otfer amangmney mspondas e devalopments [Climale, gadlogiesl, and topographica).
One- or twordwalling resdentinl developments shadl ba
Appendix O: D107 1 Adopted this seckon for the sefety of the public, Locally adopted nvbudmm\-mwospmmqwnm
(oxcluding axcopiions) |Srefighters, and other srargrcy mEDONGS mmmmmm dus {0 topogmaphic, geographes and
Cne- or two-dwadling ressedential devalopmients shall ba
Appendix [ B107.2 |Adcpted Ihis sachon for the safsty of the public, Loeally adogted squippad throughout will hwosperate and sppeeved re
through D108 ¢ frafighlers. gnd offer smBrgency rispandere Spparalus BCCass ronds Sm i Lopographit, geograghic and

cimatic conditions

Grey cefie are previously amendad, adopted, or changed code sections that are being adopted agairt in this code cycle.

23-0015 D 36 of 53



White cells are newly amended, adopted, or changed code sections that differ from previcus code adoptions.

23-0015 D 37 of 53




Attachment No. 2

Diamond Springs-El Dorado Fire Protection District

Public Hearing Notices

23-0015 D 38 of 53



(20155 C.C.R.)

Proof of Publication of
NOTICE OF INTENT

STATE OF CALIFORNIA
County of El Dorado

1 am a citizen of the United States and & resident
of the County aforesaid; I'm over the age of
eighteen years, and not a party to or interested in
the sbove-entitled matter. 1am principal clerk of
the printer at the Mountain Democrat, 2889 Ray
Lawyer Drive, a newspaper of general circulation,
printed and published Monday, Wednesday,

and Friday, in the City of Placerville,

County of El Dorado, and which newspaper has
been adjudged a newspaper of general circula-
tion by the Superior Court to the County of El
Dorado, State of Califomia, under the date of
March 7, 1952, Case Number 7258; that the
notice, of which the znnexed is a printed copy
(set in1 type no smaller than non-gareil), has been
published in each regular and entire issue of said
newspaper and not in any supplement thereof on
the following dates, to-with:

9/19, 10/5

ALL IN THE YEAR 2022
I certify (or declare) under penalty of perjury that
the foregoing is true and correct.

Dated at Placerville, California, this 5 day
of OCTOBER, 2022

BlAdsin @alu <
Signature

PUBLIC NOTICE

Nobica of Intent 1o Adapk e
2023 Caiflorns Fre Coce

23-0015 D 39 of 53



PROOF¥ OF PUBLICATION
(20155 C.CP)

Proof of Publication of
NOTICE OF INTENT

STATE OF CALIFORNIA
County of El Dorado

I am a citizen of the United States and a resident
of the County aforesaid; F'm over the age of
eighteen years, and not a party to or interested in
the above-entitled matter. I am principal clerk of
the printer at the Mountain Democrat, 2889 Ray
Lawvyer Drive, a newspaper of general circulation,
printed and published Monday, Wednesday,

and Priday, in the City of Placerville,

County of El Dorado, and which newspaper has
been zdjudged a newspaper of general circula-
tion by the Superior Court to the County of El
Dorado, State of California, under the date of
March 7, 1952, Case Number 7258, that the
notice, of which the anaexed is a printed copy
(s#t in type no smaller than non-pareil), has been
published in each regular and ertire issue of said
newspaper and not in any supplement thereof on
the following dates, to-with:

10/21,10/28

ALL IN THE YEAR 2022
I certify (or declare) under penalty of perjury that
the foregoing is true and correct

Dated at Placerville, California, this 28% day
of DCTOBER, 2022

- MAMsv Radus

Signature

NOTICE OF INTENT TO
ADOPT THE 2022
CALIFORNIA FIRE GODE

district shati hold its sscand pubilic
hearing at 1000 AM. on m
October 31, 2022 at 507 Plassant
Valley Road, Diamond Springs.
CA, mgwdng the adoption of s
2022 California Fire Code permignt
| o Hoalth and Sefety Code Section
lgeﬁﬂdmgnéhmm
ey saconday
code sections m&“.'é’m onted
by refarsnce, are on fis with
Sncrelary of the Dimrct and
apan 1o public Inspaction, Adoption
| of the 2022 Calfornia Fire Code wil
| enabie all Distncl porsonnet 1o lolkonw
rmwldvmwﬂwmxmugm
regard o the health snd safsty of

£F

g

the public ant Y oz
ey T
l 1o, 102 oM

23-0015 D 40 of 53



Attachment No. 3

Diamond Springs-El Dorado Fire Protection District

Resolution No. 2022-09

23-0015 D 41 of 53



RESOLUTION No. 2022-09

A RESOLUTION OF THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS OF THE DIAMOND SPRINGS-EL
DORADO FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT
ADOPTING FINDINGS SUPPORTING AMENDMENTS TO THE
CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE

A resalution for the Diamond Springs-El Dorado Fire Protection District setting forth findings with
respect to local conditions within the Fire District which make cerlain modifications and changes to the
California Fire Code reasonably necessary for preserving fire and life safety in the Diamond Springs-El

Dorado Fire Protection District.

The Governing Board of the Diamond Springs-El Dorado Fire Protection District finds and resoives as
follows:

WHEREAS, Health & Safety Code Section 17958.5 permits a Fire Protection District to adopt an
ordinance which changes or modifies the State Housing regulations adopted pursuant to Health & Safety
Code Section 17922 upon determination that such changes or modifications are necessary due to local
conditions that pertain regulations governing conditions hazardous to life, property and the environment
from fire, explosion, hazardous materials and hazardous uses; and

WHEREAS, Health & Safety Code Section 17958.7 requires that a District’s Board of Directors
making any changes or modifications pursuant to Health & Safety Code Section 17958.5 shall make
express finding that such changes or modifications are needed; and shall file a copy of such changes or
modifications with the Department of Housing and Community Development.

WHEREAS, the unique local climatic, geological, and topographical conditions existing within
the boundaries of the District make it reasonably necessary for the District to impose more stringent
requirements than set forth in the California Fire Code and pursuant to California Health and Safety Code
sections 13869.7 and 17958.7, the District desires to make express findings to that effect.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVYED that the Board of Directors of the Diamond Springs-
El Dorado Fire Protection District, after having duly noticed and held public hearings, hereby adopts the
following findings concerning current unique local conditions that together make each modification to
the California Fire Code, reasonably necessary to provide adequate and effective protection of life,
property and the environment more specifically set forth as follows:

23-0015 D 42 of 53



FINDINGS OF FACT
FOR CHANGES OR MODIFICATIONS TO THE STATE BUILDING STANDARDS
CODE (TITLE 24 PART 9) BECAUSE OF LOCAL CONDITIONS

General.
After due consideration, the Board of Directors of the Diamond Springs-El Dorado Fire Protection

District, hereby finds that due to local climatic, geologic and topographic conditions, as stated within
this document, there is a need to provide the modifications and changes contained in the adoptive
Ordinance of the California Fire Code. Such changes are deemed to be reasonably necessary to provide

adequate and effective protection of life, property, and the environment.

The Diamond Springs-El Dorado Fire Protection District provides fire protection, emergency medical
services, and specialized rescue services to approximately fifteen thousand five hundred people in a 65.5
square mile area. The District is located on the western slope of El Dorado County. The topography of
the District ranges from rolling hills of grass and oak woodland in the west and oak-timber in the steep
drainages of the east portion. The weather conditions vary from freezing temperatures with occasional
snow in winter, to summer temperatures that regularly exceed 100 degrees.

The District can be divided into three distinct areas: The core area encompasses Diamond Springs, El
Dorado, and the Missouri Flat Road corridor. The core area is more urban and contains most of the
District’s existing commercial development and potential for major commercial development. The
north and south ereas typically contain small subdivisions and isolated residential developments. These
areas are characteristic of the suburban or ranch environment. The north and south areas become very
isolated and more rural as one moves further away from the core of the District.

The Diamond Springs-El Dorado Fire Protection District is an “all-risk” apency. The District
participates in a sophisticated automatic aid program and is dispatched through agreement by the
California Department of Forestry and Fire Protection (Cal-Fire), at Camino. The resources of the
District will respond to, and deal with, any type of emergency. The term “Fire Protection” in this
document is broad and includes responses 1o fires, smoke and odor investigations, alarms, public assist
calls, hazardous materials incidents, medical aid, and specialized rescues.

The District has established one, full-time, staffed fire station and four satellite fire stations to provide
emergency services to the community. Fire Station 49 is located in the unincorporated town of
Diamond Springs, at 501 Pleasani Valley Rd. Fire Station 46 is located in the unincorporated town of El
Dorado, at 6170 Pleasant Valley Road. Fire Station 48 is located at 3840 Missouri Flat Road,
Placerville, just north of Highway 50. Fire Station 44 is located in the Logtown arca at 6109 Quartz
Drive, El Dorado. Fire Station 47 is located iz the Sleepy Hollow Subdivision, at 2312 Oakvale Drive,
Shingle Springs. The District has 1] full-time, career personnel, along with two administrative positions,

and two administrative support positions.

Climatic.
The Diamond Springs-El Dorado Fire Protection District is located within a foothill region. The District

is subject to four seasons, with an annual average snowfall in the winter months of 2 inches, in addition
to an average rainfall of 45 inches per year. These adverse weather conditions create severe hazardous
.

23-0015D 43 of 53



road conditions and flooding as well as rock slide hazards along the main access roads within, as well as
into, the District from the surrounding areas. Due to periods of rainfall, along with repeated road
closures, the ability of the Fire Protection District to provide immediate emergency response is often
delayed. These same adverse climatic conditions often result in a large number of vehicuiar accidents
that place extreme restraints on the availability of emergency response to perform emergency rescue,
first aid, hazardous materials control, and fire- fighting. The climatic conditions often result in a
substantial or tofa] lack of ability of the Fire Protection District to respond immediately to other types of
emergency situations thai occur. Examples of these emergency situations include structure fires,
wildland and forest fires, flooding, hazardous materials incidents, emergency medical calls, vehicle
accidents, and vertical rescues. The mutual aid agreements established with adjoining fire agencies
might not be possible due Lo adverse climatic conditions, restricting or totally blocking aceess into the

District.

Summary:
These local climatic conditions affect the acceleration, intensity, and size of fires in the Fire District,

Times of little or no rainfall, low humidity, and high temperatures create extremely hazardous
conditions, particularly as they relate to the wildland-urban interface. Winds experienced in this area can
have a significant impact upon structure fires, especially in buildings in close proximity lo one another,
and to wildlands commonly found in the Diamond Springs-El Derado Fire Protection District.
Structures built within the Diamond Springs-El Dorade Fire Protection District must be built with these

variables in mind.

Geological. The Diamond Springs-El Dorado Fire Protection District is located within moderate
activity seismic Zone Three. The seismic, geological conditions present a potential for multiple fires,
major breakage of water mains, multiple electrical power failures, multiple collapsed structures and a
large number of calls for emergency medical aid, all of which may occur simultaneously during a
seismic event. The water district has numerous water-pumping systems used for fire suppression water
delivery, as well as water storage tanks providing water system pressure. Most of the pumping systems
are dependent on electrical power for operation. Such electrica]l power may not be available during a
seismic event, Water storage tanks used for the storage of required fire suppression water may also
collapse in such an event forcing the additional need to transport water via additional picces of fire
apparatus which will place a significant restraint on the ability of the District to provide the required

emergency services.

Summary:
Local geographic and geological features and processes exist within the boundaries of the district that

may hamper the ability of the Diamond Springs-E! Dotado Fire Protection District to perform ifs swomn
duties. Fire following an earthquake has the potential of causing greatet Joss of life and damage than the

earthquake itself.

Topographical. The District is primarily composed of areas that are considered by the State to be high
fire hazard severity zones. Much of the District is located within foothill terrain, covered with highly
combustible vegetation, including the presence of many coniferous forested areas. The elevation within
the District ranges from at 1,000 feet to over 2,100 feet at the highest point. Slope within the District

-3

23-0015D 44 of 53



E.

rangﬁﬁ-omﬁdegr&sto%dm.?hcsuucumuﬁthinﬂmmoffooﬁﬁllshminhaveveryﬁmimd
fire access, due to narrow roadways with steep grades and poor road surface conditions. The presence of
many existing structures within the high fire hazard severity zone areas provides for a very high
potential of a structure fire spreading into a wildland or forest fire condition as well as the potential for a
wildland or forest fire spreading to structures.

Summary:

The alignment of canyons, valleys, and slopes into inhabited areas, combined with the variable nature of
ﬂletmain,yicldpotentialforincwasedﬁmrisk.Musts&udum,bothrasidanﬁalmdmmmemial,mm
or are surrounded by areas that contain significant grass, brush, mixed oak woodland, and mixed conifer
fuel load. Due to drought conditions, beetle infestations, and lack of vegetation management, much of
the area is populated with either dead or dylug trees, contributing to extreme fire danger.

Conclusion:

Local climatic, geographic, and topographic conditions described above increase ihe frequency,
intensity, and size of fires involving buildings in the Fire District. Further, these conditions impact
potential damage to structures from an earthquake and subsequent fire. Therefore, it is reasonably
necessary that the California Fire Code be modified to mitigate the effects of the above conditions.
California Health & Safety Code Section 17958.7 requires that modifications to the Fire Code be
expressly marked and identified as to which each finding refers to which Code modification. The

attached Appendix A provides this connection.

INTRODUCED at a regular meeting of the Board of Directors of the Diamond Springs/El
Dorado Fire Protection District on October 11, 2022.

PASSED AND ADOPTED at a regular meeting of the Board of Directors of the Diamond
Springs-El Dorado Fire Protection District on October 11", 2022 by the following roll call vote:

AYES: Y
NOES: O
ABSENT: 1.
ABSTAIN: O

ATTEST: BY:

1 » M/
ngumm Board Secretary Ratosoofict, Pdident

23-0015 D 45 of 53



SECTION 1: FINDINGS OF FACTS

in connection with the amendments enacted by Section 2 and 3 relating to the California
Fire Code and its appendix, 2022 edition, the Diamond Springs / E! Dorado Fire Protection
District (DSEDFPD) makes the following findings pursuant to Health and Safety Code
Section 17958.5, 17958.7 and 18941.5. The changes are reasonably necessary because
of local climatic, topographical, or geclogicat conditions.

DSEDFPD hereby adopts pursuant to Section 1884 1.5 of the California Health and
Safety Code, the following findings of fact:

(a) Under this adopting ordinance, specific amendments have been
established which are of a more restrictive nature than those adopted by the State of
Califomia {State Buildings Standards Code, State Housing & Community Development
Codes) commonly referred to as Title 24 & Title 25 of the California Code of Regufations.
These amendments to the California Fire Code 2022 edition, have been recognized by
the ECFPD to address the fire problems, concerns, and future direction by which ECFPD
can establish and maintain an environment which will afford a level of fire and life safety

to all who live and work within its boundary.

(b) The International Code Council has assumed responsibility for the
Intemational Fire Code and International Fire Code Standards. The international Code
Councif provided a means for participation by all code enforcement officials from
throughout the country as well as industry representatives, consultants, and other private
parties with an interest in the International Fire Code.

(¢}  The international Fire Code, being the 2021 edition thereof, published by
the International Code Council is a nationally recognized compilation of proposed rules,
regulations, and standards of said Association.

(d)  Said International Fire Code has been printed and published as a Code in
book form within the meaning of Section 50022.1 of the Government Code of the State

of Caiifornia.

(e)  Under the provisions of Section 18941.5 of the Health and Safety Code,

local amendments are based on climatic, topographical, and geological conditions. The
findings of fact contained herein address each of these situations and present the local
situation, which either singularly or in combination, caused the amendments to be

adopted.

23-0015 D 46 of 53



2022 CFC FINDINGS

LOCAL CONDITIONS

A. These amendments are justified based on a local climatic condition. DSEDFPD is
subject to precipitation, relative humidity, temperature extremes, and high velocity

winds.

1. Precipitation & relative humidity
a. Conditions
Precipitation. Average annual precipitation ranges from approximately
45 inches per year in rain and 2 inches of snow annually.
Approximately 88% of the average rainfall occurs during the months of
November through April and 12% from May through October. This area
has experienced major droughts in the last two decades: 1986 -1881,
1998 — 2003, 2007 - 2009, 2011 - 2015, and 2019. It is possible that
more droughts will occur in the future based on the weather cycle

pattern.

Relative Humidity. During the summer months (May through
September), the daily humidity ranges around 20% and occasionally
drops to the low teens.

2. Temperature
a. Conditions
Temperatures. During the summer months {(May through
September), the daily temperatures commonly exceed 90 degrees
Fahrenheit, with temperatures having been recorded as high as
115 degrees Fahrenheit.

a. Conditions

Winds. The summer prevailing winds are out of the south and
southwest. However, north winds occur during the spring {April and
May), the fall (September and October), and occasionally during
the summer months {June, July, and August). Velocities are in the
range of five to fifteen miles per hour, gusting to 30 miles per hour
during the summer months.

SUMMARY

These local climatic conditions affect the acceleration, intensity, and size of fire in
the community. Times of little or no rainfall and elevated temperatures create
extremely hazardous conditions, particularly as they relate to residential roof fires
and wildfire conflagrations. The climatic conditions are one of the greatest impacts
to fire behavior and other major emergency events due to their uncontrollabie

nature,

FPage 2019

23-0015 D 47 of 53



2022 CFC FINDINGS

B. These amendments are justified on the basis of a local geologic and topographic
conditions. DSEDFPD is subject fo varied terrain, slopes, increased vegetation,
varied surface features, hazardous building operations, and terrain risk factors.

1. Geological location
a. Conditions

Geological Location. Diamond Springs El Dorado Fire Protection
District is located in the foothilis of the Sierras at an altitude range of
approximately 1000 feet to 2100 feet above sea ievel.

2. Size and population
a. Conditions

Size and Population. The DSEDFPD encompasses
approximately 15,530 residents in 65.5 square miles.

3. Seismic Location
a. Conditions

Seismic Location. The nearest identified fault zone is the Bear
Mountain Fault, northwest of Diamond Springs. This fault zone
splits into multiple branches which transect the area between
Folsom and Shingle Springs. The closest branch passes through
the western edge of Browns Ravine. The next nearest extension of
this fault system is located immediately at the north end of £l Dorado
County and extends from the southeast arm of Folsom Lake, north
to the City of Auburn. No recent geologic activity has been observed
along this fault. However, studies of the east branch of the fault
zone, conducted by Woodward-Clyde Associates for the Auburn
Dam, and by Tierra Engineering Consultants near Folsom Lake,
indicate that the fault may be reactivating based on recent tectonic
trends and should be considered potentially active.

4. Topography
a. Conditions

Topography. The topography of the DSEDFPD varies from level 0%
slope to terrain with over a 90% slope. The valley floor is relativety
flat with gentle slopes and consists of grassland and trees. The east
and west sides of the valley floor increase to approximately 40%
slopes and consist of trees, brush, and grass-covered range land.
The slope in all cardinal directions within DSEDFPD is significant.
Hitly terrain throughout the area provides gullies or areas referred to
as “chimneys” which accelerate the spread of fire in addition to
dense, mature forest land.

Paged of B

23-0015 D 48 of 53



2022 CFC FINDINGS

5. Roads and streets

a. Conditicns
Roads and Streets. DSEDFPD has seen a moderate degree of
urban and commercial development within the last 15 years. With
this development comes the increase of vehicular traffic and
congestion which can have a direct effect on the response time of
emergency apparatus. Many pre-existing roadways and streets do
not conform to current standards and are narrow and winding in
design, thus creating an increase in response time by DSEDFFD

apparatus,

6. Building Clearances

a. Conditions
Building Clearances. As residential development continues to
occur in the DSEDFPD, the clearance between homes has
decreased which increases the abllity of fire to spread from one
home to another by both radiation and convection heat. Combined
with the wild land urban interface (WUI) and lack of resources for
defensible space, risk to life, property and environment is inherently
increased.

SUMMARY

The above geological and topographical conditions increase the magnitude,
exposure, accessibility problems and fire hazards that DSEDFPD is responsible to
mitigate. Fire following an earthquake has the potential of causing greater loss of
life and damage to property than the earthquake itself,
Other variables may iend to increase the situation:

1. The damage that may c¢ccur to the water system,

2. The extent of isolation due to roadway damage, overpass collapse and

debris blocking the roadway.

Paged of 3

23-0015 D 49 of 53



2022 CFC FINDINGS

2002 CFC Coda Tite Adoplted| Amended | Added Finding
Section
101.1 General X Administrative
102.6 - 102.12 Agplicabllity X Administrative
104.1 Duties and Powers X Administrative
104.5— 104.4 Duties and Powers X Administrative
104.6 Official Records X Administrative
104.8- 104.8.2 Approvad Materials X Administrative
104.9 Madifications X Administrative
104.11 — 104.12.3 Fire Envesﬁga_ﬂan X Administrative
105.2.3 Time af Application X Administrative
105.3.2 Extensions X Administrative
105.5 Operational Permits Adminisirative
105.5.65 Automobile X Administrafive
Wrecking Yards
1056 Censiruction X Administrative
Perrmits
105.6.25 Autornobile X Administrative
Whracking Yards
105.6.9 Fual Cell X Administrative
106.6.12 Hazardous Materials X Administrative
105.17 Plant Exiraction X Administrative
105.18 Privats Fire X Administrative
Hydrants
105.19 Smoke Control X Adminisirative
105.8.21 Special Event X Administrative
Structure
106.6.22 Spraying or Dippin X Administrative
105.8.23 Standpipe Systems X Administrative
105.6.24 Tents X Adminigirative
108,1~ 106.4 Construction X Administrative
Documents
107.1 Fees X Administrativa
107.5 Retat_gd Fees X Administrative
107.5.1 Cost Recovery X Administrative
107.6 Refunds X Administrative
1677 Administrative X Administrative
Costs
Section 108 Inspections X Administrative
Saction 103 Maintanance X Adrinistrative
1115 Appeals X Administrative
1124 Violation Penalties X Administrative
11241 Abatement of X Administrative
Viglations
112.4.2 GCitations X Administrative
Section 113 _Stop Work Order Adninistrative
143.4 Failure to Comply X Administrative
Fage 8 of 9

23-0015 D 50 of 53




2022 CFC FINDINGS

2022 CFC Cede Titia Adopted| Amended | Added Finding
Section
|
Section 114 Unsafa Strugtures X Administrative
202 Definitions X Administrative
Secfion 302 Definitions Administrative
Section 303 Asphalt Kettles Al A2, A3, B1, B2 B3. B4, BS B6
302.1 Definitions X Administrative .
Section 304 Combustible Waste] X Al. A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6 |
Section 305 lgnition Sources X A1, A2, A3 B, B2. B3. B4, BS, B6 |
Section 306 Muotion Picture b4 B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
Section 307 Open Burning X A1, A2, A3 B1, B2 B3 B4, B5 BS
307.4.4 Cpen Burning X A1, A2, A3, B1, 82 B3 B4 BS5 ES
Section 308 QOpen Flames X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, BS, B&
Section 309 Powered Industrial X A1, A2, A3 B1,B2. B3.B4,B5,B6
Teucks
Section 310 Smoking X Al, A2, A3 B1, BZ. B3. B4, B, B6
Seclion 311 Vacan{ Premises X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2, B), B4, B5, B6
Saction 320 30 Printing X B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
Section 321 Artificial Vegetation X A1, A2 A3 Bi, B2 B3.B4,B5, B6
403.2 - 403.2 4 Group A X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2, B3. B4, B5, B6
4036-403614 Group E_ X A1, A2, A3, B1,B2. B3.B4, B5, B8
403.9- 403934 Group R X Al, A2, A3, B1, B2 B3. B4, B5, B6
503.2.1 Dimensions X AT, A2, A3, B1, B2 B3. 84, B5, B6
503.2.5 Dead Ends X A1, A2, A3 B1,B2. B3 B4, B5,.B6
50326 Bridges X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, BE
503.3.1 No Pakrg&gs - Fire X A1, A2, A3 B1, B2, B3. B4, BS, B6
50332 Nu Parking — Fire X A1, A2 A3 B1,B2 B3 B4,B5 86
Hydrants
50333 Fire Lane Width X A1, A2 A3 B1, B2 B3.B4 BS, 86
50386 Security Gates X At AZ A3 B1, B2 B3. B4, BS, B6
505.1 Address X A1, A2, A3, B1. B2 B3 B4, B5 BS
507.8.1 Where Required ~ 4 At A2 A3 B1,B2 B3 B4, B85, BB
Fire Hydrants
500.3 Fire Contral Rooms X B1, B2, B3. B4, BS, B6
807.5.2 Group £ X B1, B2 B3. B4. B5, B6
503.2 Where Required - X A1, A2, A3, B1,B2 B3.B4, BS, B6
Fire Sprinkiers
9032114 Group A X A1, A2, A3 B1 B2 B3 B4,B5, BE
903.21.2 Group A-2 X A1, A2, A3, Bi, B2 B3 B4, BS BS
903.2.1.3 Groups A-3 X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2 B3. B4, B5, B&
803.2.1.4 Group A4 X A1, A2 A3 B1, BZ B3a B4, B5, B6
603.2.3 Group E X A1, A2, A3, Bt, B2 B3, B4, BS, B6
603.24 Group F-1 X A1, A2, A3, B1,B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
890327 Group M X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2 B3 B4, BS, B6

Page 7 of 9

23-0015 D 51 of 53



2022 CFC FINDINGS

2022 CFC Code Titla Adopted| Amended | Added | Defated Finding
Secticn
903.27.2 Group M - X A1, A2, A3, B1,B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
Matiresses
903.2.8.5 Manufactured X A1, A2, A3 B1, B2 B3 B4 B5 B6
Homes
803.28 Group 81 X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, BS, B6
803.2. 10 Group 8-2 X Al A2, A3, B1, B2, B3. B4, B5, B6
903.2.10.1 Parking Garages X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2 B3.B4,B5 B6
903.2.22 Group B X Al, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, BS, 86
o03.2.23 Group F-2 X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, BS, B6
803.6 Where Required — X A1, A2, A3, B, B2 B3.B4,B5 B6
Fire Sprinklers
907.2 VWhere Required — X At A2, A3 B1,B2.B3. B4, B5, B6
Fire Alarm Systems
907.214 Group A X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2.B3. B4, B5, BE
907.2.2.3 @mup B X A1, A2, A3, B1,B2. B3. B4, BS, B6
807.2.3.11 @map_s X A1, A2 A3 B1 B2 B3 B4, B5 B6
907.2.4.1 Group F-1 X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2 B3. B4, BS, B6
907,252 Sroup H X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3, B4, BS, B6
907266 Group | X A1, A2 A3, B1, B2 B3l B4, 85 Bg
807.2.7.2 Group M X Al A2 A3 B1i, B2 B3. B4, B5 B6
807.2.84 Group R-1 X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
907.294 Group ;;‘Z.ZRQA ; X Af, A2 A3, B1, B2 B3. B4, B5, 86
907.2.10.1 Group S X Al A2 A3 81, B2 B3 B4 B5 B6
a07.2.30 Type | Hoods X 841, B2 B3 B4, B5, B6
907.6.5 Monitoring X B1, B2. B3 B4, B5, B6
907.6.2.1 Seccrédary!l’mr X A1, A2 A3 Bt1,B2 B3 B4, B5 B6
Uppiy
8079 Where Required — X Al 82 A3 B1, B2 B3 B4, B5 86
Fire Alarm
Section 1101 General b4 A1, AZ A3, B1, B2 B3.B4, BS, BS
Section 1102 Definitions X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
11032 Responder X A1, A2 A3, B1, B2, B3 B4, BS, BS
Communication
11035~ 110358 Sprinkler Systems X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, BS, B&
1103.7 ~ Fire Alarm Systems X Al, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, BS, B6
1103.7.9.10
1103.8 - 1103.8.5.3 Smoke Alarms X Al, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
1103.89 - 1103.8.1 Carbon Monoxide X Al A2, A3, Bi, B2 B3, B4, BS, B6
Alarms
Section 1104 Egrass X B1, B2. B3. B4, B5 BS
Section 1106 Culdoor Cperations X A1, A2, A3, B1,B2. B3, B4, BS, BS
1203.1.3 [nstaliation X A1, A2 A3, B1, B2 B3 B4, BS, B6
313 Address X A1, A2 A3, B1, B2 B3. B4, BS, 86
33131 When Required — X Al A2, A3, B, B2, B3. B4, B85, B8
Water Supply

Faga 8 of §

23-0015 D 52 of 53




2022 CFC FINDINGS

2022 CFC Code Title Adoptad| Amended | Added Finding
Section
8001.7 Liability for X Administrative
Damages
5601.2 Permit Required X Administrative
5704.2.96.1 Locations — Above X A1, A2, A3 B1, B2. B3, B4, BS, 86
Ground Tanks
5706.2.4.4 Locations - Above X A1, AZ A3 B1,B2 B3 B4, BS, B6
Ground Tanks
5808.2 Limitations X A1, A2 A3, Bi, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
6104.2 Maximum Capacity X A1, A2, A3, B1,B2. B3, B4, BS, B6
Chapter 80 Referencad X A1, A2 A3, B1, B2. B3 B4, BS, B6
Standards
Appendix B Fire Flow - X A1, A2 A3 B1,B82 B3 B4, BS B6
Table B105.1 (1) Residential
Appendix B Fire Flow - X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3, B4, BS, B6
Table B105.2 Commercial
Appendix D Fire Apparaius X A1 A2 A3 B1,B2 B3 B4, BS, B8
Access Roads
Appendix D, Access Road Width X Al A2, A3, B1,82. B3. B4, BS, B8
D103.1
Appendix D, Grade X A1, AZ, A3, B1,B2. B3. B4, B5,B6
D103.2
Appendix D, Turning Radius X A1, A2, A3, Bi, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
D103.3
Appendix D, Gates X A1 A2, A3 B1,B2. B3.B4,B5, B8
D103.5
Appendix D, Fire Lane Marking X A1,A2, A3 B1,B82. B3.B4,B5,B6
D103.6.1
Appendix D, Fire Lane Marking X Al A2 A3 B1,B2 B3.B4 BS5,B6
D103.6.2
Appendix D, Circumferential Fire X A1,A2 A3, B1,B2 B3.B4,BS5 B8
D104.4 Access

Page 9ol 9

23-0015 D 53 of 53






