
RESOLUTION NO. 008-2023 

OF THE BOARD OF SUPERVISORS OF THE COUNTY OF EL DORADO 

(REPEALING RESOLUTION NO. 036-2020) 

WHEREAS, the California Code of Regulations, Title 24, Part 9, the California Fire Code, is updated by the 

State every three years; and 

WHEREAS, the 2022 California Fire Code became effective on January 1, 2023; and, 

WHEREAS, California Health and Safety Code Sections 17958, 179S8.5, 17958.7 and 18941.5 permits a 

county to make such local amendments and modifications as the county determines are reasonably 

necessary because of local climatic, geological or topographical conditions; and, 

WHEREAS, the California Code of regulations, Health and Safety Code, Division 12, Part 2, Chapter 1, 

Article 12, Section 13146, assigns responsibility for enforcement of safety regulations to the local level 

and grants authority to delegate enforcement to the chief building official, or his or her authorized 
representative, or the chief of the fire protection district, or his or her representative; and, 

WHEREAS, the County of El Dorado desires to delegate enforcement of the Fire Code to the chief of the 

fire authority, or the chief's authorized representative; and, 

WHEREAS, the fire protection district and County have agreed to develop, implement and maintain a 

memorandum of understanding that describes the roles and responsibilities pertaining to the inspection 

of certain building standards found in the Fire Code; and, 

WHEREAS, on October 31, 2022, The Board of Directors of the Diamond Springs-El Dorado Fire Protection 

District adopted Ordinance No. 2022-01, which adopted the 2022 California Fire Code with amendments 

the District deemed necessary to deal with local climate, geological or topographical conditions. 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that the Board of Supervisors of the County of El Dorado ratifies 

Ordinance No. 2022-01 of the Diamond Springs-El Dorado Fire Protection District and delegates the 

enforcement of the ordinance to the Diamond Springs-El Dorado Fire Protection District Chief, or his or 

her representative. 

These changes include amendments and additions to the California Fire Code in the following sections: 

101.1, 105.5, 105.5.55, 105.6, 105.6.25, 105.6.26, 107.5, 107.5.1, 107.7, 111.5, 112.4, 112.4.2, 

113.4, 202, 302.1, 307.4.4, 401.2.1, 503.2.1, 503.2.5, 503.2.6, 503.3.1, 503.3.2, 503.3.3, 503.6, 

505.1, 507.5.1, 509.3, 510.4.2.3, 903.2, 903.2.1.1, 903.2.1.2, 903.2.1.3, 903.2.1.4, 903.2.3, 903.2.4, 
903.2.7, 903.2.7.2, 903.2.8.5, 903.2.9, 903.2.10, 903.2.10.1, 903.2.22, 903.2.23, 903.6, 907.2, 

23-0015 D 1 of 53 



907.2.1.4, 907.2.2.3, 907.2.3.11, 907.2.4.1, 907.2.5.2, 907.2.6.6, 907.2.7.2, 907.2.8.4, 907.2.9.4, 

907.2.10.1, 907.2.30, 907.6.5, 907.6.2.1, 907.9, 1203.1.3, 3311.3, 3313.1, 5001.7, 5601.2, 

5704.2.9.6.1, 5706.2.4.4, 5806.2, 6104.2, Chapter 80 NFPA 1-22 Section 22.3, Chapter 80 NFPA 1-
22 Section 22.10, Chapter 80 NFPA 13D-22: Sections 4.6, 5.1.1.2, 7.6, 11.2.1.1, Appendix B: Table 

BlOS.1(1), Appendix B: Table Bl0S.2, Appendix D Sections D103.1 through D103.3, Appendix D 

103.5, Appendix D 103.6.1, Appendix D103.6.2, Appendix D104.4 

Diamond Springs-El Dorado Fire Protection District adopts the 2022 California Fire Code, Title 24, Part 9, 

in its entirety, including Appendices, incorporating those sections of the International Fire Code, 2021 

edition not adopted by the state, with the exclusions listed below: 

103, 309, 311.5, 311.6, 318, 403.3, 403.5, 403.8, 403.10, 403.11, 404, 406, 903.3.1.2, 904.1.1, 
1103.1, 1103.3-1103.4, 1103.6, 1105, Chapter 26, D104.2 (exception only), D106.1 (exception only), 

D107.1 (Exceptions only), Appendix A, Appendix G, Appendix J, Appendix K, Appendix L, Appendix 

M, Appendix N, Appendix 0. 

Appendices not adopted can be used for reference in enforcing other sections of the 2022 California Fire 

Code. 

PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of Supervisors of the County of El Dorado at a regular meeting of 
said BOARD, held the 3rd day of January, 2023, by the following vote of said Board 

Attest: 
Kim Dawson 
Clerk of the Board of Supervisors 

•v ~ ,~-

Ayes: Thomas, Hidahl, Turnboo, Parlin, Laine 
Noes: None 
Absent: None 

a}~ rlPs~~ 
Wendy Thomas 

23-0015 D 2 of 53 



Diamond Springs - El Dorado Fire Protection District 
501 Pleasant Valley Road, Diamond Springs, CA 95619 

Office (530) 626-3190 ♦ Fa."< (S30) 626-3188 
www.diamondfire.org 

November 21, 2022 

Don Ashton, Chief Administrative Officer 
El Dorado CoWlty Board of Supervisors 
330 Fair Lane 
Placerville CA 95667 

Subject: ResoJution Ratifying Ordinance No 2022.01 ofthe Diamond Springs-El Dorado 
Fire Protection District, which Adopts the 1021 California Fire Code with 
Amendments related to local climatic. geographic, and topographic conditions. 

Dear Mr. Ashton: 

The Diamond Springs-El Dorado Fire Protection District (DSEDFPD) is requesting the Board 
of Supervisors (BOS) ratify its Ordinance No. 2022.01, which adopts the 2022 California Fire 
Code as amended due lo specific local climatic, geographic, and topographic conditions. 
California Health and Safety Code Section 13869.7 requires the legislative body of the city or 
cowity where the ordinance will apply to ratify, modify, or deny the adopted ordinance. The 
BOS must also delegate enforcement of the ordinance to either the Fire District (or its 
representative} or the Chief Building Official. 

Therefore, we request the Board of Supervisors ratify Ordinance No. 2022.0 I with 
amendments to the 2022 California Fire Code, and delegate the enforcement of that Ordinance 
to the Diamond Springs-El Dorado Fire Protection District Chief. A proposed BOS resolution 
is enclosed for your review and use on this topic. 

This resolution has no direct fiscal impact to the County. 

~rL,.JG-
Leah Yaws O ~ 
Fire Marshal 

Attachments; 

I. Diamond Springs-El Dorado Fire Protection District Ordinance No. 2022.0 l 
2. Diamond Springs-El Dorado Fire Protection District Finding of Facts Resolution No. 2022.09 

23-0015 D 3 of 53 



Attachment No. 1 

Diamond Springs El Dorado Fire Protection District 

Ordinance No. 2022-01 

23-0015 D 4 of 53 



DIAMOND SPRINGS/ El DORADO FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT 

ORDINANCE NO. 2022-01 

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS OF THE DIAMOND 

SPRINGS/ EL DORADO FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT AS FOLLOWS: 

An ordinance of the Diamond Springs / El Dorado Fire Protection District (DSEDFPD) 

adopting the 2022 Edition of the California Fire Code, incorporating the 2021 Edition of the 

lntemational Fire Code, regulating and governing the safeguarding of life and property from fire 

and explosion hazards arising from the storage, handling and use of hazardous substances, 

materials and devices, and from conditions hazardous to life or property in the occupancy of 

buildings and premises in the DSEDFPD; providing for the issuance of permits and collection of 

fees therefor; Repealing Ordinance No. 2019-01 of the DSEDFPD and all other ordinances and 

parts of the ordinances in conflict therewith. 

Be it ORDAINED by the Board of Directors of the DSEOFPD, also known as the 

Diamond Springs/ El Dorado Fire Protection District: 

Section 1: FINDINGS OF FACTS 

Section 2: ADOPTION OF CODE WITH EXCLUSIONS 

Section 3: LOCAL AMENDMENTS 

Section 4: CONFLICT 

Section 5: SEVERABILITY 

Section 6: EFFECTIVE DATE AND PUBLICATION 

SECTION 1: FINDINGS OF FACTS 

The DSEDFPD makes certain changes (listed below) to the California Fire Code, 2022 

Edition, pursuant to Health & Safety Code Sections 13869.7, 17958.S, 17958.7 and 18941.S 

during this code adoption process. Such changes are necessary because of local climatic, 

geological and/or topographical conditions. The OSEOFPD has adopted, pursuant to Section 

18941.5 of the California Health & Safety Code, the findings offacts relative to these conditions 

by Resolution #2022-09 of the DSEDFPO dated October 11, 2022. 

Ordin:ulce 2022-01 Page 1 

23-0015 D 5 of 53 



SECTION 2: ADOPTION OF CODE WITH EXCLUSIONS 

The DSEDFPD adopts the 2022 Cafffomia Fire Code, Title 24, Part 9, In Its entirety. 

including Appendices, incorporating those sections of the International Fire Code, 2021 edition 

not adopted by the state, with the exclusions listed below: 

Exclusions: 103, 309, 311.5, 311.6, 318,403.3, 403.5, 403.8, 403.10, 403.11, 404,406, 

903.3.1.2, 904.1.1, 1103.1, 1103.3-1103.4, 1103.6, 1105, Chapter 26, 0104.2 (Exception only), 

D106.1 (Exception only), 0107.1 (Exceptions only), Appendix A, Appendix G, Appendix J , 

Appendix K, Appendix L, Appendix M, Appendix N, Appendix 0. 

Appendices not adopted can be used for reference in enforcing other sections of the 2022 

Cafitomia Fire Code. 

SECTION 3: AMENDMENTS TO THE 2022 CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE 

The following Sections are hereby amended or added: 

Chapter 1 

SECTION 101.1 "TITLE" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 101.1 TITLE. These regulations shall be known as the Fire Code of ECFPD, hereinafter 
referred to as "this code". 

SECTION 105.5 "REQUIRED OPERATIONAL PERMITS" JS AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 105.5 Required operational permits. The fire code official is authorized to issue 
operational permits for the operations set forth in Sections 105.5.2 through 105.5.525. 

SECTION 105.5.55 "AUTOMOBILE WRECKING YARDS" IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 105.5.55 Automobile wrecking yards. An operational pennit is required for the 
operation of automobile wrecking yards. 

SECTION 105.6 "RE.QUIRED CONSTRUCTION PERMITS" IS AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 105,6 required construction permits. The fire code official is authorized to issue 
construction permits for work as set forth in sections 105.6.1 through 105.6.246. 

SECTION 105.6.25 "AUTOMOBILE WRECKING YARDS" IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 105.6.25 Automobile wrecking yards. Construction pennits are required for the 
installation of or modification to automobile wrecking yards. 

Ordinance 2022-0 I Page2 

23-0015 D 6 of 53 



SECTION 105.6.26 "TRAFFIC CALM(NG DEVICES» IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

105.6.26 Traffic ca/ming devices. Construction permits are required for the installation or 
modification of traffic calming devices. 

SECTION 107.5 "PERMIT, PLAN REVIEW AND INSPECTION FEES" SHALL BE ADDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section 107.5 Permit. A schedule of fees adopted by the district board of directors for plan 
review, inspections and the issuance of permits by the district may be found in the most cu"ent 
district fee schedule (Health & Safety Code 17951). 

SECTION 107.5.1 ~cosT RECOVERY FEES" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 107.5, 1 Cost Recovery Fees. Fire service fees may be charged to any person, firm, 
corporation or business that through negligence, violation of the law, or ss a result of 
carelessness, is responsible for the cause of the district to respond to the scene of an incident. 
A district board may charge a fee to cover the cost of any service which the district provides 
or the cost of enforcing any regulation far which the fee is charged (Health & Safety Code 
13916). The fee shall not exceed the actual cost of suppressing the fire and/or responding to 
the scene of an incident. 

SECTION 107.7 "ADMINISTRATIVE COSTS" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 107.7 Administrative Costs. When a test or inspection is scheduled, and the 
contractor fails to perform to the satisfaction of the authority having jurisdiction (AHJ), the AHJ 
may bill the contractor for actual time spent traveling to and from the test/inspection location 
and the time spent at the test/inspection site as well as administrative costs. 

SECTION 111.5 "APPEAL PROCEDURES AND TIME LINES" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 111.5 Appeal Procedures and T/melines. Any person or entity who believes they 
may be adversely affected by an order, decision, or determination made by the fire code official 
through a written notice may appeal this matter within 15 calendar days of the postmark on the 
notice. All such appeals shall be filed in writing with the Secretary of the Governing Board for 
the district. A timely appeal shall stay further action by the fire code official until the matter is 
determined by the Appeal Board as outlined in Section 109.2, unless the issue poses an 
imminent fire or life safety hazard to members of the public. The fire code official shall notify 
the appellant by certified mail of the date and time of such hearing. The heanng shalf be 
scheduled to take place no sooner than 20 calendar days from the date shown on the certified 
mail. The appellant shall have the right to appear in person or by agent at the hearing and 
present oral, written and/or photograph;c evidence to the Appear Board. 

SECTION 112.4 "VIOLATION PENALTIES" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 112.4 Violation Penalties. F>ersons who shall violate a provision of this code or shall 
fail to comply with any of the requirements thereof or who shall erect, install, alter, repair or do 
work in violation of the approved construction documents or directive of the fire code official, 
or of a permit or certificate used under provisions of this code, shall be guilty of a misdemeanor 

Ordinance 2022-01 Page3 

23-0015 D 7 of 53 



or infraction, at the discretion of the prosecuting attorney or agency, punishable by a fine not 
more than $100.00 for a first violation; A fine not exceeding $500.00 for a second violation of 
the same provis;on within one year; A fine not exceeding $1000. 00 for each additional violation 
of the same provision within one year, or by imprisonment not exceeding 180 days, or both 
such fine and imprisonment. Each day that a violation continues after due notice has been 
served shall be deemed a separate offense. (Health & Safety Code Secrions 13145 and 
17995). 

SECTION 112.4.2 "CITATIONS" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 112.4.2 Citations. The Fire Ch;et, or his/her duly authorized representative, may 
;ssue citations for infractions or misdemeanor violations of this code pursuant to Section t 3871 
of the Health & Safety Code of the State of California and Chapter 5c (commencing with 
Section 853. 6) of Title 3 of Part 2 of the Penal Code of the State of Califomia. 

SECTION 113.4 "F Al LURE TO COMPLY" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

SectJon 113.4 Failure to Comply. Any person who shall continue any work after having been 
served with a stop work order, except such work as that person is directed to perform to remove 
a violation or unsafe condition, shall be punishable by a fine or imprisonment or both as 
described in Section 112.4 (Health & Safety Code Sections 13145 and 17995). 

Chapter 2 

SECTION 202 "CAMPFIRE" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

CAMPFIRE. A fire which is used for cooking, personal warmth, lighting, or aesthetic purposes. 

SECTION 202 "DISTRICT" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

DISTRICT. The district and all other areas within the exterior boundaries thereof now or 
hereafter established. 

SECTION 202 "DRIVEWAY" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

DRIVEWAY. A vehicular access that serves up to two (2) parcels with no more than two (2) 
residential units and any number of non-commercial or industrial buildings on each parcel. 

SECTION 202 "EXECUTIVE BODY" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

EXECUTIVE BODY. The Board of Directors of the Distnct. 

SECTION 202 "FIRE CHIEF" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

FIRE CHIEF. The Chief Executive Fire Officer of the Fire department/district serving the 
jurisdiction or a duly authorized representative. 

SECTION 202 "FIRE HAZARD" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Ordinance 2022..01 Page4 

23-0015 D 8 of 53 



FIRE HAZARD. Any condition, arrangement, or act which will increase, or may cause an 
increase of, the hazard or menace of fire to a greater than customarily recognized a.s normal 
by-persons in the public service of preventing, suppressing or extinguishing fire; or which may 
obstruct, delay, or hinder, or may become the cause of obstruction, delay or hinderance to the 
prevention, suppression, or extinguishment of fire. 

SECTION 202 "OPEN BURNING" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

OPEN BURNING. The burning of materials wherein products of combustion are emitted directly 
into the ambient air without passing through a stack or chimney from an enclosed chamber. Open 
burning does not Include road flares, smudge-pots and similar devices associated wilh safety or 
occupational uses typically considered open flames.,. For the purpose of this definition, a chamber 
shall be regarded as enclosed when, during the time combustion occurs, only apertures, ducts, 
stacks, flues or chimneys necessary to provide combustion air and permit the escape of exhaust 
gas are open. 

Open burning shall also include campfires, bonfires, portable outdoor fireplaces, ceremonial 
fires, and recreational fire as defined in the Fire Code. 

Exception: 

1. UL or ASMI listed LPG or natural gas outdoor flame devices, such as gas BBQ's or gas 
fire pits that comply with the Fire Code. 

2. For one-or two-family dwellings, fixed or portable outdoor flame devices that meet the 
following: 

a. Devices shall comply with the Fire Code. 

b. Devices shall be used per manufacturer's specifications. 

c. Minimum 10-foot clearance from device to all flammabfe material and vegetation. 

d. No burning shall be conducted during high or extreme fire weather conditions (e.g., 
National Weather Service Red Flag Wamings). 

3. Campfires on private lands. ~ere required by the fire code official, a permit shall be 
issued by the fire code official. 

4. Ceremonial and/or religious burning with the following safety measures; 

a. Maximum 4.foot x 4Mfoot bum area. 

b. Minimum 10-foot clearance from edge of bum area to all flammable material and 
vegetation. 

c. An approved water supply is located within 500-feet of the bum area. 

d. The bum area is located no less than 30-feet from adjoining property lines. 

e. An adult is present with a shovel until the fire is extinguished. 

f. No burning shall be conducted during high or extreme fire weather conditions (e.g., 
National Weather Se,vice Red Flag Warnings). 

SECTION 202 "TRAINED CROWD MANAGER" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Ordinance 2022--01 Page 5 

23-0015 D 9 of 53 



TRAINED CROWD MANAGER. Standby personnel, usually a security guard or usher 
personnel, who are trained in the proper procedure to exit people from a tent or other place of 
public assemblage in an orderly and calm fashion in the event of an emergency 

Chapter 3 

SECTION 302.1 "DEFINITIONS" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 
3D PRINTER. 
ADDITIVE MANUFACTURING. 
BONFIRE. 
CAMPFl~E. 
HI..SOY. 
HIGH.VOLTAGE TRANSMISSION LINE. 
OPEN BURNING. 
PORTABLE OUTDOOR FIREPLACE. 
POWERED INDUSTRIAL TRUCK. 
RECREATIONAL FIRE. 
SKY LA TTERN. 

SECTION 307.4.4 "OPEN BURNING RESTRICTIONS• SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 301.4.4 Open Burning Restrictions. Open burning on all lands within the jurisdiction of 
the Diamond Springs I El Dorado Fire Protection District (DSEDFPD), including the Local 
Response Area (LRA), is prohibited when the Califomia Department of Forestry and Fire 
Protection (Cal Fire) issues a bum suspension in the State Responsiblfity Area (SRA). This 
prohibition shall be made effective 24-hours following its commencement in the SRA. 

Open burning is a/so prohibited on a/I lands within the jurisdiction of DSEDFPD at any time the 
fire code official that atmospheric conditions or other Jocaf circumstances make such fires 
hazardous, including factors such as high winds, low fuel moisture, fire weather, the issuance of 
red flag warnings, severe threat of wildland fire, or present risk of destruction by wildfire to life, 
wildlife, property, or natural resources. 

Chapter4 

SECTION 401.2.1 "PRE-FIRE PLANS" IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 401.2.1 Pre-fire plans. Where required by the fire code official. a pre-fire plan shall 
be provided and approved by the fire code official for all new commercial structures. 

Chapter 5 

SECTION 503.2.1 "DIMENSIONS• SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 503.2.1 Dimensions. Fire apparatus access roads shall have an unobstructed width 
of not fess than 20 feet (6096 mm), exclusive of shoulders, as measured from face of curb to 
face of curb, except for approved security gates in accordance with Section 503.6, and an 

Ordinance 2022-01 Page6 

23-0015 D 10 of 53 



unobstructed vertical clearance of not less than 15 feet. Driveways shall have an unobstructed 
width of not less than 12 feet wide. 

SECTION 503.2.5 "DEAD ENDS" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 503.2.5 Dead Ends, Oead•end fire apparatus access roads and driveways in excess 
of 150 feet {45,720 mm) In length shall be provided with an approved area for turning around 
fire apparatus. 

SECTION 503.2.6 "BRIDGES AND ELEVATED SURFACES" SHALL BE AMENDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section 503.2.6 Bridges and Elevated Surfaces. Where a bridge or an elevated surface is 
part of a fire apparatus access road, the bridge shall be constructed and maintained in 
accordance with AASHTO HB-17, the current El Dorado County Transportation Division Bridge 
Standard or Appendix D of the currant California Fire Code, whichever is more restrictive. 
Bridges and elevated surfaces shall be designed for a live load sufficient to carry the imposed 
loads of fire apparatus. Vehicle load limits shall be posted at both entrances 10 bridges when 
required by the fire code official. Where elevated surfaces designed for emergency vehicle use 
are adjacent to surfaces that are not designed for such use, approved barriers, approved signs 
or both shall be installed and maintained where required by the fire code official. 

SECTION 503.3.1 "NO PARKING IN FIRE LANES" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 503.3. 1 No Parking In Fire Lanes. No person shall stop, park, or leave standing any 
vehicle, whether attended or unattended, except when necessary to avoid conflict w;th other 
traffic or in compliance with the directions of the Fire Chief, or his/her duly authorized 
representative, Peace Offlcer or official trcJffic control device along the edge of any highway, 
at any curb, or in any location in a publicly or privately owned or operated off-street parking 
facility, designated as a fire lam, by the district with jurisdiction over the area in which the place 
fs located. The designation shall be indicated (1) by a sign posted immediately adjacent to, 
and visible from, the designated place clearly stating in letters not less than one inch in height 
that the place is a fire lane, (2) by outlining or painting the place in red and, in contrasting color, 
marking the place with the words "FIRE LANE~ which are clearly visible from a vehicle, or (3) 
by a red curb or red paint on the edge of the roadway upon which is clearly marked the words 
"FIRE LANE". 

SECTION 503.3.2 "NO PARKING IN FRONT OF HYDRANTS" SHALL BE ADDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section 503.3.2 No Parking In Front of Hydrants. No person shall stop, park, or leave 
standing any vehicle within 15 feet of a fire hydrant except as follows: (a) If the vehicle is 
attended by a licensed driver who is seated in the front seat and who can immediately move 
such vehicle in case of necessity, (b) If the vehicle is owned or operated by a fire department 
and is clearly marked as a fire department vehicle. 

SECTION 503.3.3 "FIRE LANES BASED ON ROAD WIDTH" SHALL BE ADDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Ordinance 2022-01 Page7 

23-0015 D 11 of 53 



Section 503.3.3 Fire Lane$ Ba$ed on Road Width. Fire lanes shall be based on road width 
as required in Appendix D as amended by the district. 

SECTION 503.6 "SECURITY GATES" IS AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 503,6 Security Gates. The lns1allation of security gates across a fire apparatus 
access road shall be approved by the fire code official and shall comply with the District gate 
standard. Where security gates are installed, they shall have an approved means of 
emergency operation. The security gates and the emergency operation shall be maintained 
operational at all times. Electric gate operators, where provided, shall be listed in accordance 
with UL 325. Gates intended for automatic operation shall be designed, constructed, and 
installed to comply with the requirements of ASTM F2200. 

SECTION 505.1 "ADDRESS IDENTIFICATION" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 505.1 Addre$S Identification. Addresses for new and existing buildings shall comply 
with the District address standard as approved by the fire code official. The address 
identification shall be legible and placed In a position that is visible from the street or road fronting 
the property. Address identification characters shall contrast with their background. Address 
numbers shall be Arabic numbers or alphabetical letters. Numbers shall not be spelled out. Each 
character shall be not less than 4 inches (102 mm) high with a minimum stroke width of½ inch 
(12.7 mm). W'lere required by the fire code official, address identificatiOn shall be provided in 
additional approved locations to facilitate emergency response. access i$ by means of a private 
road and the building cannot be viewed from the public way, a monument, pole or other sign or 
means shall be used to identify the structure. Address identification shall be maintained. 

SECTION 507.5.1 "WHERE REQUIRED" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 507.5.1 Where Required. Where a portion of the facility or building hereafter 
constructed or moved into or within the jurisdiction is more than 150 feet from a hydrant on a fire 
apparatus access road, as measured by an approved route around the exterior of the facility or 
building, on-site fire hydranis and mains capable of supplying the required fire flow shall be 
provided where required by the fire code official. 

Exceptions: 

1. For Group R-3 and Group U occupancies, the distance requirement shall be 600 feet 
(183 m). 

SECTION 509.3 •FIRE CONTROL ROOM" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 509.3 Fire Control Room. Fire sprinkler risers, fire alarm control panels, solar 
photovoltaic power system ,ap;d shutoff switches, and other fire detection, suppression or 
similar control elements shall be located inside a single fire control room for the building. The 
fire control room shall have m;nimum dimensions of five feet by seven feet in size with a total 
usable area of not Jess than 35 square feet. The room shall be located within the building on 
an outside waft at a location approved by the Fire Code Official and shall be accessible from 
the exterior. An exterior access door with a clear width of not less than 32 inches and height 
of not less than 80 inches shall be provided for access into the room. A durable sign shall be 
affixed to the exterior of the door with the words •FIRE CONTROL ROOM" in letters not less 

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 8 

23-0015 D 12 of 53 



than 4 inches in height. A key box complying with Section 506 shall be installed on the exterior 
side of the fire control room door opening. 

The room must be capable of maintaining a minimum temperature of 40 degrees Fahrenheit. 
A clearance of 12 inches shall be provided from the fire spn"nkler nsers to any adjacent walls. 
This room can be a shared with other building utilities or fir9 protection equipment that is not 
incompatible. An approved cabinet or container shall be provided to store record plans of the 
fire spn"nkler system and other fire protection equipment. This room shall not be used for any 
other storage. 

Exception: One-and two-family dwellings, manufactured homes or similar uses defined 
as either a Group R-3, R3. 1, or R-4 occupancy. 

SECTION 510.4.2.3 "STANDBY POWER" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 510.4.2.3 Standby power. In-building, two-way emergency responder 
communication radio coverage systems shall be provided with dedicated standby batteries or 
provided with 2-hour standby batteries and connected to the facility generator power system 
in accordance with Section 1203. The standby power supply shall be capable of operating the 
in-building. two-way emergency responder communication coverage system at 100-percent 
system capacity for a duration of not less than 72 hours. 

Chapter 9 

SECTION 903.2 "WHERE REQUIRED" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 903.2 Where Required. Approved automatic sprinkler systems in new buildings and 
structures when constructed or relocated within the jurisdiction shall be provided in the 
locations described in Sections 903.2.1 through 903.2.12 and Sections 903.2.14 through 
903.2.23. 

Exception: Agricultural buildings not under a special use permit used for commercial 
purposes. 

SECTION 903.2.1.1 "GROUP A-1 " SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 903,2.1, 1 Group A. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout stories 
containing Group A-1 occupancies and throughout all stories from the Group A-1 occupancy to 
and including the levels of exit discharge serving that occupancy where one of the following 
conditions exists: 

1. The fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

2. The fire area has an occupant load of 300 or more. 

3. The fire area is located on a floor other than a level of exit discharge serving such 
occupancies. 

4. The fire area contains a multi-theater complex 

SECTION 903.2.1.2 "GROUP A-2" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 903.2.1.2 Group A-2. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout 
stories containing Group A-2 occupancies and throughout all stories from the Group A-2 

Ordinance 2022-01 Page9 

23-0015 D 13 of 53 



occupancy to and including the levels of exit discharge serving that occupancy where one of the 
following conditions exists: 

1. The fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet; 

2. The fire area has an occupant load of 100 or more. 

3. The fire area is located on a floor other than a level of exit discharge serving such 
occupancies. 

4. The structure exceeds 3,600 square feet, contains more than one fire area containing a 
Group A-2 occupancy, and is separated into two or more buildings by fire walls of less than 
4-hour fire-resistance rating without openings. 

SECTION 903.2.1.3 "GROUP A-3" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 903.2.1.3 Group A-3. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout 
stories containing Group A-3 occupancies and throughout all stories from the Group A-3 
occupancy to and including the levels of exit discharge serving that occupancy where one of the 
following conditions exists: 

1. The fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

2. The fire area has an occupant load of 300 or more. 

3. The fire area is located on a floor other than a level of exit discharge serving such 
occupancies. 

4. The structure exceeds 3,600 square feet. contains more than one fire area containing 
exhibition and display rooms, and is separated into two or more buildings by fire walls of 
less than 4-hour fire-resistance rating without openings. 

SECTION 903.2.1.4 "GROUP A-4" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Sectfon 903.2.1.4 Group A-4. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout 
stories containing Group A-4 occupancies and throughout all stories from the Group A-4 
occupancy to and including the levels of exit discharge serving that occupancy where one of the 
following conditions exists: 

1. The fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

2. The fire area has an occupant load of 300 or more. 

3. The fire area Is located on a floor other than a level of exit discharge serving such 
occupancies. 

SECTION 903.2.3 "GROUP E" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 903.2.3 Group E. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided for Group E 
occupancies as follows: 

1. Throughout all Group E fire areas greater than 3,600 square feet in area. 

2. The Group E fire area is located on a floor other than a level of exit discharge serving such 
occupancies. 

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 10 

23-0015 D 14 of 53 



Exception: In buildings where every classroom has not fewer than one exterior exit 
door at ground level, an automatic sprinkler system is not required in any 
area below the lowest level of exit discharge serving that area. 

3. The Group E fire area has an occupant load of 300 or more. 

4. In rooms or areas with special hazards such as laboratories, vocational shops and other 
such areas where hazardous materials in quantities not exceeding the maximum allowable 
quantity are used or stored. 

5. Throughout any Group E structure greater than 3,600 square feet in area, which contains 
more than one fire area, and which is separated into two or more buildings by fire walls of 
less than 4-hour fire resistance rating without openings. 

6. For public school state funded constn.iction projects see Section 903.2.19. 

7. For public school campuses, Kindergarten through 12111 grade, see Section 903.2.20 

SECTION 903.2.4 "GROUP F-1• SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 903.2.4 Group F-1. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout all 
buildings containing a Group F-1 occupancy where one of the following conditions exists: 

1. A Group F-1 fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

2. A Group F-1 fire area is located more than three stories above grade plane. 

3. The combined area of all Group F-1 fire areas on all floors, including any mezzanines, 
exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

SECTION 903.2.7 "GROUP M. SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 903.2,7 Group M. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout buildings 
containing a Group M occupancy where one of the following conditions exists: 

1. A Group M fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

2. A Group M fire area is located more than three stories above grade plane. 

3. The combined area of all Group M fire areas on all floors, including any mezzanines, 
exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

5. The structure exceeds 3,600 square feet, contains more than one fire area containing a 
Group M occupancy, and is separated into two or more buildings by fire walls of less than 
4-hour tire resistance rating without openings. 

SECTION 903.2.7.2 "GROUP M UPHOLSTERED FURNITURE OR MATTRESSES" SHALL 
BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 903.2.7.2 Group M Upholstered Furniture or Mattresses. An automatic sprinkler 
system shall be provided throughout a Group M fire area where the area used for the display 
and sale of upholstered furniture or mattresses exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

SECTION 903.2.8.5 "MANUFACTURED HOMES" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Ordinance 2022-0 I Page 11 

23-0015 D 15 of 53 



Section 903. 2.6.2 Manufactured Homes. An automatic fire sprinkler system shall be required 
in all new manufactured homes and multi-family manufactured homes intended for use as a 
one-and two-family dwelling. The design and installation of such systems shall be in 
accordance with California Code of Regulations, Title 25. §4300. 

Exceptions: 

J. Manufactured homes located within an existing mobile home park complying with 
California Health and Safety Code, Division 13, Part 2.1 or 2.3. 

2. Manufactured homes that do not exceed 1,200 square feet in size and serve as an 
accessory dwelling unit, as defined in Government Code Section 658502; when the 
existing primary residence on the property is not required to ccmply with California 
Residential Code Section R313.2. 

3. Manufactured homes that do not exceed 320 square feet in size. 

SECTION 903.2.9 "GROUP S-1" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 903.2.9 Group S-1. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout all 
buildings containing a Group S-1 occupancy where one of the following conditions exists: 

1. A Group s.1 fire area exceeds 31600 square feet. 

2. A Group S-1 fire area is located more than three stories above grade plane. 

3. The combined area of all Group S-1 fire areas on all floors, including any mezzanines, 
exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

4. A Group S-1 fire area used for the storage of commercial motor vehicles where the fire 
area exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

SECTION 903.2.10 "GROUP S-2" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 903.2.10 Group S-2. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout 
buildings classified as parking garages where any of the following conditions exist: 

1. Where the fire area of the enclosed parking garage, in accordance with Section 406.6 of 
the California Building Code, exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

2. Where the enclosed parking garage, in accordance with Section 406.6 of the California 
Bulk:Jing Code, is located beneath other groups. 

Ex.caption: Enclosed parking garages located beneath Group R-3 occupancies. 

3. Where the fire area of the open parking garage, in accordance with Section 406.5 of the 
California Building Code, exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

SECTION 903.2.10.1 "COMMERCIAL PARKING GARAGES" SHALL BE AMENDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section 903.2.10.1 Commercial Parking Garages. An automatic sprinkler system shall be 
provided throughout buildings used for storage of commercial motor vehicles where the fire area 
exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 12 

23-0015 D 16 of 53 



SECTION 903.2.22 "GROUP B" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 903.2.22 Group B. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout all 
buildings containing Group B occupancies where the fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

SECTION 903.2.23 dGROUP F-2" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 903.2.23 Group F-2. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout all 
buildings containing Group F-2 occupancies where the fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

SECTION 903.6 "WHERE REQUIRED IN EXISTING BUILDINGS AND STRUCTURES" IS 
AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 903.6 Where Required In Existing Buildings and Structures. An automatic 
sprinkler system shall be provided in existing buildings and structures where required In 
Chapter 11 and as follows: 

1. When there ls a change in occupancy classification that results in an increased life safety 
or fire risk, as determined by the fire code official, and the structure exceeds 3,600 square 
feet, an automatic fire sprinkler system shall be installed throughout the building. 

2. In existing buildings 3,600 square feet or greater, other than one and two-family dwelling 
units. and agricultural buildings not under special use permit for commercial purposes, 
where the floor area of the building or structure is increased, such building or structure 
shall be made to conform to Sect;on 903.2. 

Exception: 1/Vhen the bu;Jding increase is less than 500 square feet. 

3. In existing buildings 3,600 square feet or less. other than one-and two-family dwelling 
units, and agricultural buildings not under special use permit for commercial purposes. 
where the floor area of the building or structure is increased to a total square footage 
over 3,600 square feet, such building or structure shall be made to conform to Section 
903.2. 

Exception: L'Vhen the building increase is less than 500 square feet. 

SECTION 907.2. "WHERE REQUIRED - NEW BUILDINGS AND STRUCTURES" SHALL BE 
AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 907.2. Where Required - New Buildings and Structures. An approved fire alarm 
system installed in accordance with the provisions of this code and NFPA 72 shall be provided 
in new buildings and structures in accordance with Sections 907.2.1 through 907 .2.30 and 
provide occupant notification in accordance with Section 907.5, unless other requirements are 
provided by another section of this code. 

Not fewer than one manual fire alarm box shall be provided in an approved location to initiate 
a fire alarm signal for fire alarm systems employing automatic fire detectors or waterflow 
detection devices. Where other sections of this code allow elimination of fire alarm boxes due 
to sprinklers or automatic fire alarm systems, a single fire alarm box shall be installed at a 
location approved by the enforcing agency. 

Exceptions: 

Ordinance 2022.01 Page 13 

23-0015 D 17 of 53 



1. The manual fire alarm box is not required for fire alarm control units systems 
dedicated to elevator recall control, supervisory service and fire sprinkler 
monitoring. 

2. The manual flre alarm box is not required for Group R-2 occupancies unless 
required by the fire code official to provide a means for fire watch personnel to 
initia1e an alarm during a sprinkler system, impairment event. Where provided, the 
manual fire alarm box shall not be located in an area that is open to the public. 

3. The manual fire alarm box is not required to be instafled when approved by the fire 
code official. 

4. A fire alarm system is not required in one and two-family dwellings, agricultural 
buildings, and other occupancies classified as Group U not under special use 
permit and/or not used for commercial purposes (e.g. retail sales, food service, 
and/or special events). 

5. Buildings with a floor area less than 500 square feet may be exempt, as determined 
by the fire code official based on bu;/ding construction material and features. 
location, occupancy type, and d;stance to exposures. 

SECTION 907.2.1.4 "GROUP A UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET• SHALL BE ADDEO AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section 907.2.1.4 Group A Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shall 
be installed in all group A buildings with a floor area less than 3, 60<J square feet. 

SECTION 907.2.2.3 "GROUP B UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET" SHALL BE ADDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section 907.2.2.3 Group B Under 3,600 Square Feet An approved fire alarm system shall 
be installed in all group B buildings with a Door area less than 3,600 square feet. 

SECTION 907.2.3.11 "GROUP E UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET" SHALL BE ADDEO AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section 907,2.3.11 Group E Under 3,600 Square Feet An approved fire alarm system shall 
be installed in all group E buildings with a floor area less than 3,600 square feet. 

SECTION 907.2.4.1 MGROUP F UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET" SHALL BE ADDEO AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section 907.2.4.1 Group F Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shall 
be installed in all group F buildings with e floor area fess than 3, 600 square feet. 

SECTION 907.2.5.2 "GROUP H UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET" SHALL BE ADDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section 907.2.5.2 Group H Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shall 
be installed in all group H buildings with a Door area less than 3,600 square feet. 

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 14 

23-0015 D 18 of 53 



SECTION 907.2.6.6 "GROUP I UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET" SHALL BE ADDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section 901.2.6.6 Group I Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shall be 
installed in all group I buildings with a floor area fess than 3,600 square feet. 

SECTION 907.2.7.2 "GROUP M UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET" SHALL ae ADDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section 901.2.7.2 Group M Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shall 
be installed ;n all group M buildings with a floor area less than 3, 600 square feet. 

SECTION 907.2.8.4 "GROUP R-1 UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET" SHALL BE ADDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section 907.2.8.4 Group R·1 Under 3,600 Square Feet An approved fire alarm system shall 
be installed in all group R-1 buildings with a floor area less than 3, 600 square feet. 

SECTION 907.2.9.4 ~GROUP R-2, R-2.1 R-2.2 UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET" SHALL BE 
ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 901.2.9.4 Group R-2, R-2.1, R-2.2 Under3,60() Squara Feet. An approved fire alann 
system shall be installed in all group R-2. R-2.1, R-2.2 buildings with a floor area Jess than 
3,600 square feet. 

SECTION 907.2.10.1 ~GROUPS UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET' SHALL BE ADDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section 907.2.10.1 Group S Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shall 
be installed in all group S buildings with a floor area less than 3,600 square feet. 

907.2.30 ''TYPE I HOOD INSTALLATIONSff SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

907.2.30 "Type I Hood Installations. The requirament of installation, or replacement, of a 
Type I Hood System shall require a fire alarm/sprinkler monitoring system to be installed, or 
for the hood system to be connected to an existing fire a/arm/sprinkler monitoring system for 
that building. 

907.6.5 "MONITORING" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

907.6.5 Monitoring. Fire alarm systems required by this chapter or by the Caltfornia Building 
Code shall be monitored by an approved, UL certified, Type A Full Service central, proprietary 
or remote station service, which gives audible and visual signals at a constantly attended 
location. All sprinklered buildings shall be monitored. 

Exceptions: 

J. One- and two-family dwellings (R-3 Occupancies and other occupancies cfassified 
as •uu,_ 

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 15 

23-0015 D 19 of 53 



2. Agricultural buildings not under special use permit and/or not used for commercial 
purposes (e.g., retails sales, food service, and/or special events). 

SECTION 907.6.2.1 "SECONDARY POWER SUPPLY'' SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

SECTION 907.6.2.1 SECONDARY POWER SUPPLY. When;i required by the fire code official, 
in accordance with NFPA 72, the secondary power supply providing a minimum 24-hour power 
capacity under quiescent load (system operating in a non-alarm condition) shall be amended 
to a minimum 72-hour power capacity. 

Exception: The existence of an emergency back-up power supply that meets or exceed 
the requirements of California Fire Code Chapter 12. 

SECTION 907.9 "WHERE REQURIED IN EXISTING BUILDJNGS" SHALL BE AMENDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

SECTION 907.9 Where Required. An approved fire alarm system shall be provided in existing 
buildings and structures where required in Chapter 11 and in existing bu;fdings with a floor 
area less than 3,600 square feet without an approved automatic spnnkler system, other than 
one- or two-family dwelfjng units, agricultural building not under special use perm;t for 
commercial purposes where a fire alarm detection system does not exist and the floor area of 
the building or structure is increased 

Exception: When the building increase is less than 500 square feet. 

Chapter 12 

SECTION 1203.1.3 "INSTALLATION" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 1203.1.3 tnstanation. Emergency power systems and standby power systems shall 
be installed in accordance with the California Building Code, the California Electrical Code, 
NFPA 110 and NFPA 111. Alf buildings, other than one- and two-family dwelling units, and 
agricultural buildings not used for commercial purposes, with standby power, shall have a 
shunt trip device that disconnects all power sources to the building, approved by the fire code 
official. Existing installations shall be maintained in accordance with the original approval. 

Chapter33 

SECTION 3311 .3 "PREMISE IDENTIFICATION" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 3311.3 Premise Identification. Prior to and during construction, an approved 
address sign shall be provided at each fire and emergency vehicle access road entry into the 
project. 

SECTION 3313. 1 "WHEN REQUIRED'' SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 3313,1 When Required. An approved water supply for fire protection, either 
temporary or permanent, shalt be installed and maintained in continuous operation as soon as 
combustibre building materials arrive on site, the commencement of vertical combustible 

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 16 

23-0015 D 20 of 53 



construction and on installation of a standpipe system in buildings under construction, In 
accordance with Sections 3313.2 through 3313.5. 

Exception; The fire code official is authorized to reduce the fire-flow requirements for 
isolated buildings or a group of buildings in rural areas or small communities where the 
development of full fire-flow requirements is impractical. 

Chapter50 

SECTION 5001.7 "LIABILITY FOR DAMAGES~ SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 5001.7 Liability for Damages. Any damages or cost resulting from the negligence. 
violation of the law, careless handling, spill or discharge of any hazardous materials shall 
constitute debt against any such person, firm or corporation causing such spill or discharge. 
This debt Is collectible by the Fire Chief. or his/her duly authorized representative, in the same 
manner as in the case of an obligation under contra cf, expressed or implied. 

Chapter56 

SECTION 5601.2 "PERMIT REQUIRED" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLO\1'/S: 

Section 5601.2 Permit Required. Permits shall be required as set forth in Section 105.5 and 
regulated in accordance with this section. Where fireworks permits are required, they shall be 
issued by the Fire Chief, or his/her duly authorized representative, and the El Dorado County 
Board of SupeNisors. 

Chapter 57 

SECTION 5704.2.9.6.1 "LOCATIONS WHERE ABOVE-GROUND TANKS ARE 
PROHIBITED" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS; 

SECTION 5704.2.9.6.1 Locations Where Above-Ground Tanks are Prohibited. Storage of 
Class I and Class II flammable liquids in above.ground tanks outside of buildings is prohibited 
within the limits established by law as the limits of districts in which such storage is prohibited. 
Storage of Class I and Class II flammable liquids in above-ground tanks outside of buildings is 
prohibited unless approved by the fire code official. 

SECTION 5706.2.4.4 "LOCATIONS WHERE ABOVE-GROUND TANKS ARE PROHIBITED" 
SHALL se AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

SECTION 5706.2.4.4 Locations Where Above-Ground Tanks are Prohibited. The storage 
of Class I and Class II liquids in above•ground tanks is prohibited within the Hmits established 
by law as the limits of districts in which such storage is prohibited. Storage of Class I and Class 
II liquids in above-ground tanks is prohibited unless approved by the fire code official. 

Chapter 58 

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 17 

23-0015 D 21 of 53 



SECTION 5806.2 "LIMITATIONS" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

SECTION 5806.2 Limitations. Storage of flammable cryogenic fluids in stationary containers 
outside of buildings is prohibited within the limits established by raw as the limits of districts in 
which such storage is prohibited. Storage of flammable cryogenic fluids in stationary containers 
outside of buildings is prohibited unless approved by the fire code officia'-

Chapter 61 

SECTION 6104.2 "MAXIMUM CAPACITY WITHIN ESTABLISHED LIMITS" SHALL BE 
AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

SECTION 6104.2 Maximum Capaci1y within Established Limits. Within the limits 
established by law restricting the storage of liquefied petroleum gas for the protection of heavily 
populated or congested areas, the aggregate capacity of any one installation shall not exceed 
a water capacity of 2,000 gallons. The storage of liquefied petroleum gas in excess of an 
aggregate of 2,000-gallon water capacity when located at least one•half (112) mile from 
property zoned or designated for resident;a/ use and at least one•half (112) mile from existing 
residential development with a density greater than one (1) dwelling unit per acre and at least 
one-half (112) mile from any hotel or motel is allowed when approved by the fire code official, 
and a special/conditional use permit is issued by the County of El Dorado. 

Dispensing within established limits. Within the limits established by law restricting the 
dispensing of liquefied petroleum gas for the protection of heavily populated or congested 
areas, the aggregate capacity of any one installation shall not exceed a water capacity of 2,000 
gallons. The dispensing of liquefied petroleum gas in excess of an aggregate of 2, OOO•gallon 
water capacity when located at least one-half (112) mile from properly zoned or designated for 
residential use and at least one-half (112) mile from any hotel or motel is allowed when 
approved by the fire code official and a special/conditional use permit is issued by the County 
of El Dorado. 

Chapter 80 

SECTION 80, NFPA 1-22, CHAPTER 22 "AUTOMOTIVE WRECKING YARDS" IS ADOPTED, 
AMENDED SECTIONS AS FOLLOWS: 

Revise Section 22.3 as follows: 

22.3 Fire department access roads shall be in accordance with the California Fire Code, 
Section 503 and Appendix D. 

Add new Section 22.1 O as follows: 

22.10 Stored vehicles, boats, recreational vehicles, parts, and equipment shall not be stored 
within 30 feet of adjacent property lines. 

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 18 

23-0015 D 22 of 53 



SECTION 80, NFPA, 130-22- "STANDARD FOR THE INSTALLATION OF SPRINKLER 
SYSTEMS IN ONE-ANO TWO FAMILY DWELLINGS AND MANUFACTURED HOMES" IS 
AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 903.3.1.3, 903.3.5.1 .1 

NFPA 13D, Amended Sections as follows: 

Add new Section 4.6 as follows: 

4.6 Residential fire sprinkler systems installed in afl new one-and two-family dwellings shall utilize 
a "Passive Purge" system design unless otherwise approved by the fire code official. 

Exception: Manufactured home installed, tested and approved by the California 
Department of Housing and Community Development. 

Revise Section 5.1.1.2 as follows: 

5.1.1.2 A supply of at least one of each type and temperature sprinkler used within the premises 
shall be maintained on the property at an approved location. Spare sprinklers shall be kept in a 
mounte<J and accessible cabinet. 

Revise Section 7.6 as follows: 

7.6 A local audio/visual device activated upon water flow shall be provided on all fire sprinkler 
systems in homes at an approved location on the exterior of the dwefling. 

Revise Section 11.2.1.1 as follows: 

11.2.1.1 Where a fire department pumper connection Is not provided, the system shall be 
hydrostatically tested at a minimum pressure of 150 pounds pr:,r square inch gauge for no less 
than a 30-minute duration without evidence of feakage. Such test sha(I be witnessed by the fire 
code official. 

Appendix B - Fire Flow Requirements for Buildings 

TABLE 8105.1(1) "REQUIRED FIRE FLOW FOR ONE- ANO TWO•FAMILY DWELLINGS, 
GROUP R-3, AND R-4 BUILDINGS AND TOWNHOUSES" SHALL BE AMENDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

TABLE B105.1 (1) REQUIRED FIRE FLOW FOR ONE• ANO TWO•FAMJL Y DWELLINGS, 
GROUP R-3, AND R-4 BUILDINGS ANO TOWNHOUSES 

FIRE-FLOW AUTOMATIC MIN.MUM FIRE• FLOW DURATION 

CALCULATION SPRINKLER SYSTEM FLOW (hours) 
AREA (Design Standard) (gallons per 

(square feet) minute) 

0-3.600 No automatic sprinkler 1,000 1 
system 

Ordinance 2022--01 Page 19 

23-0015 D 23 of 53 



3,601 and greater No automatic sprtnfder Value In Table Duration In Table 
system 8105.1(2) B105.1(2) at the 

required fire-flow 
rate 

MAJOR SUBDIVISIONS (5 PARCELS OR GREATER} 

0-3,600 Section 903.3.1.3 of the 1,000 1 
CA Fire Code or Section 
313.3 of the CA 
Resident/al Code 

3,601 and greater Section 903.3.1.3 of the 112 value of 
CA Fire Code or Section Table B105.1(2) 2 
313.3 of the CA (min. 100() 

Residential Code GPM) 

OTHER RESIDENTIAL DEVELOPMENT 

0-3,600 Section 903.3.1.3 of the 500 1 
CA Fire Code or Section 

313.3 of the CA 
Residential Code 

3,601 and greater Section 903.3.1.3 of the 1/2 value of Table 1 
CA Fire Code or Section B105.1(2) (min. 

313.3 of the CA 750 GPM) 

Residential Code 

TABLE 0105.2 "REQUIRED FIRE FLOW FOR BUILDINGS OTHER THAN ONE•AND 
TWO-FAMILY DWELLINGS, GROUP R-3, ANO R-4 BUILDINGS AND 
TOWNHOUSES" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

TABLE 8105.2 REQUIRED FIRE FLOW FOR BUILDINGS OTHER THAN ONE• 
AND TWO.fAMILY DWELLINGS, GROUP R-3, AND R-4 BUILDINGS AND 

TOWNHOUSES 

AUTOMATIC MINIMUM FIRE- FLOW DURATION 
SPRINKLER SYSTEM FLOW (hours) 

(Design Standard) {gallons per minute) 

No automatic sprinkler Value in Table Duration in Table B105.1(2) 

system 8105.1(2) 

Section 903.3.1.1 of the 25% of the value In Duration in Table B105.1(2) at 
CA Fire Code Table B105.1(2) 'ti the reduced flow rate 

b. The reduced fire flow shall not be less than 1,500 gpm 

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 20 

23-0015 D 24 of 53 



Appendix O - Fire Apparatus Access Roads 

SECTION 0103.1 "ACCESS ROAD WIDTH WITH A HYDRANT" SHALL BE AMENDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section D103.1 Access Road Width wrth a Hydrant. Where a fire hydrant is located on a 
fire apparatus access road, the minimum road width shall be 26 feet (7925 mm), exclusive of 
shoulders (see Figure 0103.1). 

Exception: Driveways 

SECTION 0103.2 uGRAOE" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

SECTION 0103.2 Grade. Fire apparatus access roads and driveways shall not exceed 15. 9% 
in grade unless approved by the fire code official or by the £1 Dorado County amended 
California Public Resource Code Title 14 I Design and Improvement Standards Manual. 

SECTION 0103.3 "TURNING RADIUS• SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

SECTION 0103.3 Turning Radius. The minimum turning radius shall be determined by the 
fire code official; and shall not include curb and gutter. 

SECTION D103.S ~FIRE APPARATUS ACCESS ROAD GATES" SHALL BE AMENDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

SECTION 0103.5 Fire Apparatus Access Road Gates. Gates securing the fire apparatus 
access roads shall comply with all of the following criteria: 

1. Where a single gate is provided, the gate width shall be not less than 20 feet (6096 mm). 
Where a fire apparatus road consists of a divided roadway, the gate width shall be not less 
than 15 feet (3858 mm}. 

2. Gates shall be of the horizontal swing, horizontal slide, vertical lift or vertical pivot type. 

3. Construction of gates shall be of materials that allow manual operation by one person. 

4 . Gate components shall be maintained in an operative condition at all times and replaced 
or repaired when defective. 

5. Electric gates shall be equipped with a means of opening the gate by fire department 
personnel for emergency access. Emergency opening devices shall be approved by the 
fire code official. 

6. Methods of locking shall be submitted for approval by the fire code official. 

7. Electric gate operators, where provided, shall be listed in accordance with UL 325. 

8. Gates intended for automatic operation shall be designed, constructed and installed to 
comply with the requirements of ASTM F2200. 

SECTION D 103.6.1 "ROADS 20 TO 29 FEET IN WIDTH" SHALL BE AMENDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 21 

23-0015 D 25 of 53 



SECTION 0103.6.1 Roads 20 to 29 feet In width. Fire lane signs as specified in Section 
D103.6 shall be posted on both side of fire apparatus access roads that are 20 to 29 feet wide 
{6096 to 8534.4 mm), 

SECTION 0103.6.2 "ROADS MORE THAN 29 FEET IN WIDTH" SHALL BE AMENDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

SECTION D103.6.2 Roads more than 29 feet In Width. Fire lane signs as specified in Section 
0103.6 shall be posted on one side of fire apparatus access roads more than 29 feet wide 
(8534.4 mm) and less than 36 feet wide (10972.8 mm). 

SECTION 0104.4 "CIRCUMFERENTIAL FIRE APPARATUS ACCESS ROADS" SHALL BE 
ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

SECTION D104.4 C/rcumferentlaf Fire Apparatus Access Roads. When required by the 
fire code official, a fire apparatus access road shall be constructed to encompass the entirety 
of a structure and shall provide a continuous means of emergency vehicle access. 

SECTION 4; CONFLICT 

That Ordinance No. 2019·01 of the DSEDFPD, and all other ordinances or parts of ordinances 

herewith are hereby repealed. 

SECTION S: SEVERABILITY 

If any Ordinance, article, subsection or subdivision thereof, provision, sentence, clause or 

phrase of this code, or any application thereof, is for any reason held to be invalid by a court 

of competent iurisdiction, such decision shall not affect the remaining provisions of this code, 

which can be given effect without the invalid portions and, therefore, such invalid portions are 

declared to be severable. The DSEDFPO hereby declares that it would have enacted this 

Ordinance and each of its articles, sections, subsections, or subdivisions thereof, provisions, 

sentences, clauses or phrases Irrespective of the fact that one or more of them is declared 

invalid. 

SECTION 6: EFFECTIVE DATE AND PUBLICATION 

This Ordinance shall take effect thirty (30) days after its adoption. The DSEDFPO Board 

Secretary is directed to publish this ordinance in a newspaper of general circulatlon in the 

District. In lieu of publication of the full text of lhe ordinance, a summary of the ordinance may 

be published by the by the Board Secretary within fifteen (15) days after its passage and a 

Ordinance 2022-01 Page22 

23-0015 D 26 of 53 



certified copy shall be posted in the office of the DSEDFPO pursuant to Government Code 

Section 36933(c) (1). 

The above Ordinance was Introduced at a meeting of the Board of Directors of the DSEDFPD 

on October 11, 2022, and it was then read for the first time. A public hearing was set for the 

Ordinance to be read for the second time on October 31, 2022, and approved by the following 

vote: 

PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of Directors of the DSEDF PO this, 31 et day of October. 

2022. 

AYES: ~ 

NOES: 0 
ABSENT: Z. 
ABSTAIN:O 

Ga£,.~ 
I 

ATTEST: 

Lori Tuthill, Board Secretary 

Ordinance 2022..0l Page23 

23-0015 D 27 of 53 



£DHCWD, DSP. ECF, CKSD, PFPD lt'PD 

~u<'COdf't! 
S1:r,1fic1rt Lee 11, J<.lophd, S►~, J1:>p1ci 

(tl:tn)~" 
Wh,t 1, t~• C~,oge' 

flr••1•nd,•f' 
Why I~ T~<1e J LocJI Charge' 

Mlllld9"' ... ..,,.of lll a,d-.ldld ~ .. 
,ou fl 

AmenCI !II indudl ldlilion ol Au!llntoble \Vnd:1'41 Lor.ally adopted and amended Aoln<t1Slt!livt need CiJI IO addillon of SK11an 105.5.S5. 
Yard operlticllal perri 

AAoN, Ille llrt eocle olrc!ll to 1nlarce lhe ftle code (specif,: 

IOU.$S y Add !ec:,cn to tequire apnlional f181111t ror Locally Cf9111ed and edapled 
!o rn--. vegelriorl ~ hlZ'Blllol6N!lri«1, 

Aulamollile Wr9di13 Y1nls. 
&) llliflll uam.-ie wiedung ya'd ~ This was 
• detnDIIS!tl!ad neeel experl6nQ!d wltllln ttt, lliamllnd 
Sp,ings FnOepartment 

,as.a N 
Add~ ll!l~re awl11Jc!'<lf1 pa,nll for l.ocl/lyC19111ecf lm1adOP\ed 

Actninlstratlwi need dut toaddil!oo of ilGCllon 10!.6 26aad 

Aub-loblle Wrtctng Yards. 105.6.26. 

Allcws lltabt:Odeotl'il:iallo1111cm!thllhcode [~ 

10$.US 
Add !den ID~construelion pe,mil lot y Llll:ally~ and adoplDU 10 - -· -.egefalon cli!llrenc:8s, ~8ZSrdOU$malllrials, 
All'U'laboe Wrlldlng YIIRls. e1e.) "'1:lwl •ttwtr ~and.'«lftOCilied 1ulomoblla 

wrdng YillO operalio!IL. 

Allows the Ifft cede <ltlldal to NNIW Ind IIJlPIOVtld lrlffic 

105.6.26 N 
Ada sedicll to !81f.111t0QIIIIIIICQOII pa,mi! ro, Ille Locellylfflled and lldop!td 

c.a'mr,g de.as i,riar ta inSle11811on. FIia Code Cllllndt 

tnstalla!ICn oflraffic:calming dllllices 
pennll$ 111• fira eode offiasl 10 regulale trall'tc ~ 
de\'h:es. ~. I pennil lfll't Cll"""°Y recJA!Ald prior to 
fnafallllliorl c:M1n!J unduo oerdshlp ta 

~MMdlcl! ID.,_ilrfllr:nmanand-

10H N Seclall Added. Plwoully MCOon106..9 ~edq,ledltldsnended 
offlel11tcowaredllllC011S.Sedlarl 10S.Sdtlftlltlperma. 
pt.l dlec:kl. llld~•.._,itHeallh&Selely 
Coclt 17951 

107 S..I N Sedlall lllded. Prll',10Ullytlldial 10661 l.GCllf"aelled..O~ 
S«:lcn 107 51 CollRec:awyl'.- To - 1heOOltlD 
lhef"no.n:t. 

1017 y Sedlail addld. ~llldal 106.7 t.OC811Vc,9111dnl .... 
Seclon I~ 7 To - ti• ICNII emad 1-.odeblo 
!alltd~ bycc,,ran 

Stdlco 11 t 6of Clllplll' 1 d lh6Flnr Codi ol lhtOislnc:I 11 
added~ rwd •fcllcMI: 

1115 y Sdon ldtlilll'. fllwluiy 1tldicrt 109 I l.oalCy edop19CS ll'ld emlllded 

t11 5 ~ P~ and TtmMIIII Thi intsntol B1i1 
ll"J"lllOII la ID danly Iha~ and.,__ !or en 
nMdual ortndtylllllai .,.,_la..,_ bnl dAAm1 
~ -lll'dlf . ...,_, crdlllnrdllli -1118 F"d 
Ccdeotlall_81Ndon tl!t~Gf8Dnb't 
'11glllllcln ~ Clnit!nt lloll'll ti ApfleH' 
lmelllll 

Pl'wrcllliy Jdoll "°" ~fletclClioltby 
/iblt IN Fra Codi Olfdll IDIIIIGIWl\et=ffCodelllll 

1124 ft 
r.,g,n lhebllllll partio!ltlNtftllltlDCllmp(eCM 

~ ~ andllMllde6 
plCIICII 111111114 property. F• '1M be\W1 ~ ID 

byflle SFM. ltls baKII' leftlll lallellad«IIIMI 
mlldllhe lletaod perillllel•dMmlllfCIPfGllrilllbytlte 

ltle fetp/penlitie9 larMI' ~ -
Dlltnd Atll!i1lll(a Olllce Tll■--il lllellflgllllg91& 
mude lheflna inhctica 

112 U Clllca • lldded ti raal • ~ 112 U 
c.-ons 
~ Fq Chia! arllillltr~aullorlzld ,...UIIYl(t~ 

112.4.2 N 5ecoonllldld ,,.._,..,sedlorlf1U lacalVCIIMld end~ 
.,.,, _ Ci!811or11farll1hella9«~ 
"'019'cm aflllsClldtt~IOSdalt l3171 rlh 
Healll nl S.W,tode oltlllSladc.ll'lmlalllll 
Clwip!W Sc(~ wlllllllltbffle)ollllle3al 
PIii 2 of Ille Ptnll ~dllllS-ol Ca11rt1nU 

PrMully INCeclll 112.4 Cortplaj lhll91dCIII bV 

t13.4 
lllilQ i,, N ~par11cnsMwin ncta:1111piiQd iAa IIIClllllansoflWloodtllM blen tDldclllldllldlf 

N ~ Ille SfM Iii bar 1111 lo IOc:11110, ~-----dllwnwwtie~for-~ 
Sedlcll 1124toincildlllllllel1lllillflr llCUIIDM-

--

23-0015 D 28 of 53 



Addld.,.._ lar C..- l'/IINat. Cllltd. 
i&lanllodr,FNClwl. FhliGMd.~lhnilg.llld 

211:1 N M:tld ..... b'dlrily ~ Cllllld.nl lliOcllld T,.. CnllG UnQ,w DllndlDndcpe,, bilmilg M 
IICll..,.,_....I.PG.11111111 .. ~ "'waod 
~~ra~tumg. 

302.1 N Added det.nil,an ol campftre to Sectiolt Localy Cllllled and actipled Adrled dwnion lot darlty. 

Addld •tdelonfllr-.ilMlqlllilcllcns. Dueto .. hllll!Wifll,oerlllttllllllll SDnloCQrir 
~ .. '( 

l.lllQlllll8..., tom mmphloapanlllrn,ato loclitrft.i.dnaplld -...Y apedapa11tunag IN'-llllllllll1110N111d19'NM11pe,lllifqto~• 

~ 
,..., ... _....,,,.., ... _.. .... 

401.2.1 fj 
Adced lecfion 10 requn pni-llrt plsnafornew l.ocaly cnated 111d adcplelf 

Pio.ides ~a911Qn d aftaorpiitforthe puipasa of 

andor modlffl!d c:onatrudicn. 
eni.gency p!annMlg to beltlllad by emeigency respcnse 
petSClllUlt 

F-. •~n bel:a:nnf lllglrandllllal. r.Wldclt 
dtnncld15flttpi""1IIIIIIIIOlrQlaarll1Clb 
lppllallll ~paa ....... clnaglng ... tus 
Clffll)Qnlllll ft ..... llflndld ...... beln 

SD3.2.I N 
Cllanged w,1a1i CIWlll0II I01S l'el(andraed I.Gl:lllf ldariC8d anclanw,ldeit 

Mfflll kl!a:»lliepr,larJllle~Adlllc,iel 

~to201'el 
t'11111'1fllt~:,n~--1111AG-.dllltllr 
ifw.,_epteadolQ A••dllal20fmltll:Miftld 
nudn. •11Nt1111dtaal!JllblofacedGUlltf1 
needed. 11-IIIIICIIINscan bl~ tonr.,gllle llilh 
t'n ~ llldllhouldnotbllDllllld111llelOIII 
Cffilbll lOlld .. lfa. 

!Added ■..,-tflcsaclloll fcrR3'1wllllel.ic-""' 
IF've tlll)IIIU ~-bunrig IIWldwhal 

50.US N Fn Codlltnd 'Ala 14 Fire Saf9 ~ to Ldy ..... 11111 am.ndlll 
lffllAllpl llthldt• ft Qtl 1111-af 111 l!NIV91Cl' 1111s 

mlllal •tiey,....lllnllQlfldefarhappntus 
lt,ctJldel In WIii.di& a VIII III cMlan Vllldef. 1'11:Mda 

aa:allOIIClartd~ 
lbaall-u~~adrll!Dm 
ll'CUld lcrllpliMlllll11dlwwlysgrw!el' 1:18111!0' 

IAbn ClldellNI lllnlldsb'Bndfetenda..d 
Cl\-,ged 1111.:tion b-~ trd E/Mlld Surlaca d El DorlldoCelrityand~ Ddlll 

50325 N 
~ lollD rd mtlcfl B Ooiadoea.,ty LCIClllytdcplednamendlld 

CIIIS1I Flr11Codl. "41~ •fflO'I ~. ID be 

T~ OIV!Slm II adcf1iM to MSHTO tB- t:1111!Stlnt Virw.1houl Oll.'llly ~ 111d II eluw'6 a 1111 
17 (rnini'num CfC Alqlllltd) 1111!111119 fflNIII & ftleflod lllll II nct lell MllriclM f!III 

"-fnCodll 

50U1 N 
PNmu,jy Mdlan50U2. AddedMdlcnMQIIAlng 

l.d)'CIU!ldandliCIGDlld 
Th, Ntb deMfr de&lel lllt'NoPtlb,g III F'n fal•" 

no~ 111kalalm NM 111d If oonslslll1 _, flt Cafilmil Vthldl Codi 

9J3J.2 N 
~ ledlan503.U AOded NCtion,eg■idng ~Clllledandadqlled 

Th11Hdlcn ~ ddtal11 'NoPd!g ln l'Ql1tdffrll 

no PlfUlg 11mntclllydnr11:s 
t-r,,:n,u• 11M tlld•CCM111111tftCl1!1eClllbnt VtllllOt 
Code 

SOU.3 N 
PINOUSiy -6cl1503 .f 4. AddadMCtion~ ~ClllllllCl illlf adaplad 

This S1C11ar1 c.1y..,.cearomr, AttCodeAiiPe-dllO 

h.,_ llllldOl\1111dMCIIII 
11 1ltlffll'WUtlfn)a:jlane_.end lhllN'lellllcilltot'n --PrMllllly tlll:tiGnmUQllllldllldat)plild Mo,nqcimdl ... dlcltyl01pptM9'iN IIII 

503.6 lo ll1ll1IMI ~ICCllll and 
503.6 N CllMilbllcyllVCl.9!81~511111111 El Oarldc> Lcally~ and~ 

IOldwlyl 1111114 an 11e Dlllllda.-IIMdlrd, l)l!MlfnQ 

Cmlly, ~ tott. gltll '1111dllds a:l0pld lly 
... bllf ~ lfflll9ency ICOINlo mainlai! r. 

dltFPO'a 
,.... ...... 

SOSt N 
Added Ne11011 perflll'lillgtol!Nl111IIIIII ~ O! 

l.or:dy llllllPllldllllllnllnded Abl fredlllidf fie llllllwdylOapptM~ 

~ baMdan .. c.d'•~---
M:ledmcn ~tlllldlrdlardllf 

ecmm.a.pn,pe,11es nraqui111110ll!llllhydlnat 

Wf!.1 N ~d~llldlher,.,._.ID l.oailyedaptedl!ld....,.. 
300 irol--lllutlltiiylllauldt1MflleNllilllal150 

k:anmerall ~ 
!INl iom llll)'!lflllllhyihni II ~(half._._ 
~) 

23-0015 D 29 of 53 



-

~ ngellngmantimbllin .. OOlliff lllll'AOle 
amnon IDIIIW -kildlngtdltdlrll!IYII llllt 
---ID~powll'Mll.,_1111~ 

~ W111i1191 IDbnnQ II Cl4lh•~h 
gnral ._., llr,te IN! dlutcif. 'Milrt IM• Ill 

sou 't l.0cllyalllal lllldeclopled ~ . itl&VCIIM wehMIIIClld-lolld ... 
~ I fw I lluilding ID CM l0cllioll cantrm in eneloc:ebl larpublc~llld ~ • 

..., CIU910llleftMcllti99~111EIDarado~ 
~ --ollltyear,W.ctwce•W.-11111 
ICMullle. 

EmOQ1111tY Rasponder R<}dio SY$tom Sec:orid1rt L.ocaKr adcptecl and amenlfed 
Amel)d 10 72 lwf capecty fill Wcl<-llp power due ID 

5f0.U.l y 
Pwer Supply Mocitcaticn t0ealhel ar.d PG&E s,fecy "1a!od I/ONf1 Meges. 

~•~b'eplilllder~N1111111icn 
l.oclmy adl)lllld and lllllll!dld 

Mninimill'e need u lo ldl:Nl<II, o1 sec!ion 903.2.22 n 
903.2 N "',_buldlrlgt lllCl~3-.600 IQ&lall leel or 9032.23 gwt.- ...,11 .. dimc:I 

Dul IOIII ~ drllllC. ,nd~IC CXlll6tJcr4 

~DUiiy IIICIIOll903.2.1 ,._,~tu d EIOarldoCcut, 11111 -~ Wis IIIO!lr 
~ l9'IICllltlt~lllangWllll!l,elaclNthe 

903.2.1 I N 
~ .,-n Nllilallao Ill l!HGlcupA L«aily lldoplld and amencltd dOI.Cie In IIZ8 eac!, 11111.-Y nndt. Ml llqUll ll)Mfdell 
bllclng1 1111 llllldufN 3JOO lll(llnfeel or 10 bllilttllledinsbudui1ol ancelherl.:IIU001q11n 
grll!W ... hltktact IINII In llZ/0 as tley refllt lo IINt llnMc:f 111G no of 

lllfMd. 

Oue tollle~dlma1lc. llldgq'-,t,k;Cllldlcnl 

~tediorl 903.2.1 Addl 1~t to.' 
ol 8 Oaedo Caun1v and lhlllr ~ lllclol9 to C.,t 

AlaeasedratpOnHlirnef.ffldllhtlidMh 
903.212 N 

·spmtJer rtl1lffl ilslallllllon lll llllW Gtcup A-1 
LOCllf •dc!lledend1111111ded do.ble lllm•llldMIYl!irw.•t..-,~ 

~ ,nd~3,6001qutn1feelor lobenllftdlnllrUClllrmcricelltynlld!UOOICIIIIII 
~ • thin lie d:sl!lcl feellll-■ t,ey,..telDhbellfflorandllle rJ 

splllld. 

Dua IOlhe ~ Qll1&tic;. and~Clatldlllaw 

Pl8YIOUSly seclol 903.21 ~ • nic,.,nmant fir 
o1 El DlltadoCounly llld O.contr1buttig fla0II lo «r 
.naa«l 1111V11tlmlS. acngl1lldl lfiefecllhel • 

903.2.f 3 N 
~ 1yatem ........ in ,-GraupM IJat( edal)flld Ind lfflll'd«l ~ • •-" 111d -,lliln. • rectinlPd!Wa ~ andtfniclllrea 3,600 8qllflfee(or :0 tlentaladh~191CIIICllhyl98dl 3,800 ~ 
g reetor wdlwl .,, ctillnd """II'" IS lhef reiale fl> nllell-end 1$al 

tprNd 

llue 10 tJ,e I/Jpog!ll)llc. ~ lfld91(9ljt!C condlims 

~ysect011 903.2.I Mdlt~filr 
ol 8 Oaado Cowlty and !t,., ainlrbld!IQ ladirl lO °"' 
--,ed lellP(IIIMr;i-.tlOllfllill'lli.Oldlhethl 

903214 N 
llpllfttlerl)'ltllll 11811111affor1 11 IWW Gmup A-3 

Locllly aoopt., and -ctecl ~ 11 S1Z8 MCtl ln(J fNf/'/ IIIIIIIAII. •11CJ1ra,illillldn 
bwldlngslllll illllruclllM UCO lqWIRI r.lrJt to bewuled111~ aa lla,llldl 3.6001q11a11 
g,81t8rdll'l fledislllct 1111•"-•lllettllllWlahbellMll'alldrated .-

Out~ 1N1 ~pogap!IIC. dimalc. 111d !ll(V1$11111 aondilloit 

f'rNol.lly moit 90U.l Adlea191p-,t b 
of El Octado Colt!ty end hit COlll!lluUftg fldatl lO our 
inalUldr"f)Ol'!Mllllll. lllallgwlOll\lftll:tlllitftm 

~ -U " 
,imldet tylttll! llllillllllllln i1 .. Gloup£ 

Localytdopledillldemanded dolille III sau:h lffliMlymnm. nrequn spnnt:W. 
buildings and IIIUdLIM 3,600 ~• leetor to be inlllfld lrl RUCblsonc:e thtr rMi:11 l.600 aqun 
greur \li!llln lhldillnd IMl lnlizl•f181',.,_lolillllMh-andhlt&cl 

fl)l9ld 

°"' 101111 ~io. .._ andfq11pl1itlcondlllcna 
cl El Dorlldo County lllll ff1eor~ fBdlx1 lo our 

Addl1...-irlPffllltetly!IRMlllbcn inc;,WMdl"l)llllleltnes,aJonoWilll .. factllll• 
!JO!.U N •~ MW GIQJP F IIIMIQll111d--.nr3,tnl LocalJyldopled lrldatnerlded dociJII In IIZll llldtllllllewiy._, MtflMPIII aprinklln 

~ feel or 9rwllt wllhin Ille tlaict !ll belMllllld lnlN:llraonc:ehly._,3.&001q11n 
leal in llirll • ._1111.flll'ab11NM01..Sllltot .. 
[Ml ID the~ cllmelil:. and aeaa,al)lllccadioall 
cl 8~Coun!randlllllir~ ladln lllour 

~ lllqlhllll'lt 11:tll)ffnlifers,ltemllllldalion na-.dllll)CIWflfflN, .... lnefa::l .. !ltell 
9012.7 H ;o new Gloup M buildlngt 111d "11CSUIIS l&OO LOt.aftV ld0pfllll and illlllltdlld dolAlllinlliZeNCltandfMIYlllilw, .. IIIJftspmlla 

sqlWe lNI 01,... lli!N111111tcMICS IO btlnlllllledlfsbucUesllllltiMVMdl3.60Gtqu(t& 
iN111m• lllfrei8lofllbehM:lrllldllllllf 
IIJl9 

23-0015 D 30 of 53 



Due ID N 10pag:'11111c. cllnlk RI~.,.._ 
~ Ndioll!IOU7.Alllaa~lfar of El Dlndoc-it,aMrc:anlleUlllgflcllll IIIN 
...-.-n111111111an11,-~Mwllll --.ed~--.llqlllll-lllflctlhat• 

90U1.2 M I.JphrMlnd Fllll'Aft « ---•~ 111d LGClllyadaptldflldlfflllllded doub:e11-Ndlllld-,l'IIILil.•1111JR....._. 
~3.SX>9q1111111iet« ... .,n, 1111 tobenlllldlnlhellnlClll:ll llleylllC:f!3.800 .... 
dlllld llll lll11Ze•~Nllllllr>le~111d•ot .. 

IWl,facindH«nM-n.._o1 .. coc1tlldloll•m 
-,,.1n,l~holnlll!IIII IIIMIM1onerl• 
i.nly dllltngf n001W11ftlllll ......... blldln 
CRC Sedloo 31l pnnng lo bllllfdwelnp c!f llll'llillr 

~ ldcll90) 2.U.111isldllftWII 
nalUre Menufllc:luled l'lchl Iliad In ... -~ 
ll'illnOI hM1hliOftllNdriD'dl1iPlfhcanlll'llplicn 

!1)32,t! N: C,--,lalldllda~191111111111111ngl. ~ildaOflldllldlmdlldld cbllD llaf,gllf-niglll_ol._.Cl:IIIIINdlOII. '1111 
~ R-iln c,e llUl'enllll..-plllgllffl. rap!df'n ljlfflldllraug110Ull•IIM:IIQlp1N1111Sa 

SigMC1n1 ,.ii 10 tt. ~ Relldeneli ap,1Mlel 
sy,llllnl "-INlln ilmpGQllld ~ lhil nlk 
suaawty., mmyCailcnlaarnmlifldlel 

Out IIJtflllpOpli,c. dlfflalicl. llldOeoiJ'llllhiC CIOIIIIIICRI 

Pr.-.-.1yaDC11 90:U.tAddta~tror 
ol El Dcnoo COlll(y llld-etWilrlbuting fadln IDQII' 
IIICJ-..d NlpQI'• ffmet.llCIIQ'llill1 htfllctlllltlr• 

90).2.8 H spdlltf« 1,slli'llllllllllellon ll!a~S l,oc:aly llllOptldllld ll'l!lllded ~ -liZllt'Dtllllll-'!l\'lllfnit. ... .-tipWIM 
lluti"9'and~Uao...-1ae1or to 1Jelllltde01tsnc!ll!MGIICI llll'f111ad! 3,&00 lqU8f'6 
gfUll,r•thn lhedlbld MIIIII SIZIIS l'ley .... llln..,_nlllfeof 

aprad 

Due lo the lllp!lp)l,IG. ~ 111d geographic cond'Jtiant 

Previoully IICtol\ 903.2. Adds • niquuament for 
ol a Otftdo t:Mty andllllrCIIIICnauing fldlnlOCllr 
wiaeased fllPOl'll .._, llli'!lwilll Ill llcl Mliw 

903.210 N 
apllnldet sylttlll nllalnoll 11 11N (in)up S-2 I.Q:at; ldclpl9clend111Vl11dld cblble rr-•ldl llld-,mlnule. •1'4a'•Sf!Mkl«I 
bu.ldl'lgt ~ IIIUdunll 3.800 ..... feet« to be111SfJledilAVCIIQSaall19yl'NCil3,6CO~n 
JMIIW1ttwlf1111M1d '1!11 Ill NS• ~lelale lol ,a behawo andl9bt cl 

ll)lud 

lluebtlle~ .._n9'0!'lpHccondltitM 

~ ldon 903.2 \0 Addia~ b 
~ El D:ndo Coll!ty and llllir CO!llibutillm fecb1I to our 
n;r-«1rapon11...,_ 4111111!11111!11ll.-_,M1blN 

90U101 N 
spmi<lt, sysliltn l'llllllafdll In-~ t.ac:aly lldopllld ,nd llffl8lldlld OcX.t>ltlnmeeachandmirymlllUt.. N~lprinim 
Pa,tJng Gwago, tdllngund l1ftdns 3.f® 1o bl ir111.111c1 In lllOfttm:Btllf-=11 UOO-illfl 
S41119Ml!l ot .... wlilltiftlllltitlli:ld IMlln-•1llt'l'CllllelOhllellMlt S!drDol 

tp..O 

[M to 1111 ~ dhllk, llld ~IC cordloll 

Pnrllouldysdort 903.%.7 Addi• '9QUil9nent t,r 
ol B Dorado~ and M eondli-.i ltdln la our 
incrNNdrlll)Olllell:ia. alonOwldllltt flr:l tlllttlrall 

9(13.2.22 N 
spnnkllr ,,._ mlallaon,. _Groupe 

Laclllly adclpl9d llrldMMl!ded dol.tlle 111iz&l8dlaid.,..,mna.•1'111ft ..... 
~aidlllndJnls3,600-■-IWI ar to be 11\lllhd it llll\ldinsCDll llllf llldl UDO ..... 
g,11191 Wlilln Ill dlillJlcl INC111iaatl!ey,._1Glb1Mh1111crllldnd 

ap9ld 

Dul to Ill•~ dilnllic. ,nd ~ c:ondiLlollt 

~ .-903.1 Addia~ b 
d El 00nldo0xinl\' 111111 lllllr~ lmort to our 
~ '81p01Nllma, ebtQllillll facfMln5 

!IQU.23 N 
tpllliderl'jltlrl!IIDJlllcnlll,_Groupf.2 LOClllr__.nninded ~llltit199CIN...,lllllllllt,1NIIICJllll~ln 
buktngs ,nd ~3 6001q11aallll« to be inllllled fl llluillnl(IICI lllty'IN:ll llOO .... 
greeter w,IJw, ""dmnc:t lell fn Sia Iii lllty'relbl0 .. ~and1'lllll« 

spr8lld_ 

P'l'IIOlllly Ndliilt 903.Za Addu raqunment ID 0Jt IO 11,e KIIIQIJ'IPI\C. climatic. 111d 9IIO!Jlflhle condllcr.U 
n11111 lprilllflnfar .... bulellgl11111LlllfMr9P al 8 Dorado Coooly llldhtr0011bMngflda1 locu 

1 !i:ha1Qlllll•olW..-huanfor•~• m...i..,-.~abig..,tllel'lldlllll .... 

903.t y srza gr.- IIWln 5GO IQIIIII llll llldW.18111llk151 I.Dceiy Cl1llbd and ld0pted daubl9 ..... eec:11 ntewery lllnlltl, .. ,.. __, 

aq-.inlell•; .... -.uoo..,....w to bl mllllad ilt ~once~ ,.+i UOO 1q11n 

PINaull)' appltd IO~ almcnllwl JQ'l'to, 111111 Ill tllt a they 11111111:J h bllfNMar 111111'11111 al 

1.000..-ni.t sp'lld 

23-0015 D 31 of 53 



907 2 N 
Addt 1 ~ lilrbMlll "8111'ffl 
......_. in-~ mld1fruc:flnt3,600 I.Ctlllly ldcc,lld 111d nendlllf ~ n.-d u IO llddlon ofactloll 903.2.30. 
aquaalNIIYieMllltwlll'ltlfllid 

"--'Y Ncllan 907 .211. Mdld CCICUpllll 
pro1ac11011 lot h-11 Gloup A bulidngs Mfl I Prowldll p,oper~noaflcallcltlar~ IIIII 

907.2.fit ff 1o1Y --•uoo. ~ RJ • .a~ LcX:llyCllltlJd and~ IIIOl, JNIIICIIIIII 11111...,,. FQ Otpelfl!lclnllld.fficaOon in 
nctUHd lar annrdlf fUP0III, 111d bullllngs Ille Mr4 ol I h c, IN!!OQ. 
lwll•br-of ... 1!'11115'11~--
~ bJ--hcodeiddel 

~ lldfarl9'J7.21. Add'4a:Qq)lll 
pRlledio, fa llre...,.ilth4' BbWdll,JtWilh• P!ovd!s ptaper~nGflllcaflcrtfor~ lllll 

g()7.2.Z.3 N 
toor- 1eu11wtUIJO • ._R3. N;;widitgt localfCl'Uladand~ IIOlll l,dllc1.t1e llld..,.Fiie-Depafrnenl noOllcltlcift 11 
nct 1118d fer ~ '1IMJXINI, andbllilllngl ai...-o1 ah or tmelkt 
1'!111toa-oti.hll50Qtllllft•• 
~ ll111e irecodeaffiaal 

~MCIIOll !)07.21.Added~ 
p,olec:tcn bb&111tll!CffQIIPcbuiktllgsWIOl1 ~ ~ ~ nd!fiCIIJOII kit ocaipancl9 M 

9072.3.11 N 
,oor ..-ee lees 11,n 3,S,O, tml!)tR3. AGbuldings ta:ally Cllill!ldand lda!lled ,;o. Ml'IC 1J1e and...,. Fe~ noti1lcdal n 
nO( uffd lill' Qlll'IIIWII plQON5, and l'JUJldlnga it,e !Mint d ■ h or 11noke 
..., 1t1ocrncdfllttNP SOO,qunltllt111 
aw,CMld by l1CI h codeoftblll 

"-ouily 511Ct<ln 907.2a. Adcl8doc:cupe,11 
p<Dleeton l'crfile 11811115 n Grw, r lluldllg, • • P«Mdlc proper ~d-b'~lha 

907241 N 
IICOf .,._ iat llMI 3,SOO, 111:QlPl RJ, Af:il>ullllr!Qt 

IJlClll)o crealedlilld -.,ied ,,_~<UN and_,,. FnOeo,rlrnant natillc:a1lan 11 
nd used l'crCCIIIIIIIICNII flllrpme,, and bui1lqs Ille Mini at• llrur 91110kt ""'a tocr 61111 ol Jm 1!11111500 equnfteta 
•lllXlWld by lht h code offiQII 

PnMow/'r lllCton 907.2ll AddedOCCIIPIIII 
p!'(lleCIH1t b'huma11(hipHllUtdlnglYfllh P!OO!Clel ~ """91"'Yn<illblStlrl b'~ t..i 

9012.5.2 "' 
abr.-lffltllllll.600, elQllltR.3.At:. l.a;ailycmale:I madapled 1111ow pu!l6c: use«adensut1111 F°d~ft06ficall0n ll 
Dulldlnp Id 18 for Cllllllllllltl' 1Ul)01118, r.d 111e.....,,1 o1a n ..-.,.. 
butings wilh I Goar arae dw 11111 500 ,iqun 
le« B 11;,l)RMldbyllll h c:cdlolllcillf 

~'yaecton907 2a Added-.pant 
pn,ledl0n far h brnl 1n Glwp I buidilQIWlllllf PIIMdell)ICOS ll1ltlgllllCY~ottlieilCIQl'l!cr~!ht 

907266 N 
IIOQ' ns 18111ha13.600, elllllPI 1113.. AGlluiltln;s ltJQll!y Qellkl(f encl ldopled allow ~ u,o 111d fl!lllle$ F1!8 Oepar!l'rlenl ncxib!Jon 111 
no1 IIAd tor 1.:01m111C1111 jlllJlCIII. llld llufdhJS Ille - ol 1 !re orsmolro 
wt.II a !'Joel' are1 d"81 llllltellll 9qllalll"'4! 1$ 

app,Clled by hhc:odelllloal 

PrtY!Wly _, 907 2a Addtd oo:iupall 
l)llllea,onforh~III Glolu, MbUldlngs'Mt"I Pro,,da ~~ nctific:allcl! kw OCll:Ul)IIIIQN It'll 

907.212 N 
a fclarll!lll iaa bl 3.600. •Ollli R3, '-G ld\' ~ llldlldcpled 1110w pub'clltllendnurMflmOlpnneni~III 
bu1ctnQs no1 llllld b'Cllfmlllltlll putpaaee. and 1111_..da l!laarlffllh 
bulangt#ltlt loar .. dleNflMSOOl4Jft 
felt 11 ~by 1114th a.Ill !6:ill 

~ Sll:ialllll7ZIMdld~ 
~ lcrhlllatm&lll~R-t ~ PJUVJdes proper~~ fDr~II-• 

N 
Wllll 111oar 11111 lasl lhan 3,800, IIIClll)lR3. AG ldlt cruW 11\dadapted abr piQllc:UMlffdlnlUlll!'RDepellmenlnallbtllrl Ill 907U4 buldinQs t1C11 uted b CIOllll!lllall lllJIIIQla. nl hlevwll.dal!illf-
~.cha Illar .. film.lhlll 600 ~ 
feel•~ b'fllWhcodlto!floai 

23-0015 D 32 of 53 



1'1--,tllb 907.21. Adlllll _. 
pd9dollcrh.._. fnG!oupM,R-2.1,alll R 
2.2 ....._1111111 • 11wr-• •uoa. PIIMIIII ...-IIOllllllftCrnollfclllonlar__.M 

907.2.U N .:ieptR3. AGlluliflva lllltUlldllr_,_. l.aaltt~--- lbpulllll•n--Fb~ldblcll ln 
p,pmN. 111d llulldh8I..,. - -al• ile _,.al•._ or_.. 
lt,en 500 ...-INI •IIIPIDllldbf ,_ fnCOCII ... 
f'IMg'y ... 907..21. AddedllCIQ.llmt 
prcill(.anb' .. umalllGAll,pSllllllfnotWlll1 

Plaollda p1111p1r~rlGliblianlaroa:i...-M 
90TZ.1U N •■-•-...3.000, llceptRa,AGbuUr'Js l.ocillVOlllllld llld lmlllld ... pdlllcU1ell'ld-..Fa~ ndcaol ln 

nd Ulld lDI 0lllffllWII P1,111CN1. 111d lluldngt tietwllolt b orllldl. 'llllll • br••crlltalllll 5001qU11W INla 
IIAllQlld bfhh c:ode._, 

"'--Ylldo1901.ll. ~«aiplllt 
Pl!Mcltl picpw~IIClllic:alloll lar ~ llllt 

907130 N p!011C1an lcr T)fl8 1 Hood .... lflll I..GClllf tNNdllld._, lllclilll!dc-and-..FW~~,, CIOllll8CWd lD a!IIOllltndhlllrm .-i..._, 111a-4alt b tri1111M llllllf«l orlllpllcld 

PnJ.idn p,q,er- re,p(IIININI~ "nmtr-• 
ol h lflml l)'l!emS. NFPA 72 spdes l9ql,_red rOSF st 
times rot A111 en tiollble 111d supeM,o,y signllis 10 

RtcJJres •,e Mm S)ISklmt lo tie moritill'td by VL nure l)'S!lfflS remain ClpMIIJ0/1111. ,. T~ A UL.isllld 
907.SS .., l.ocaJlycmlld trid adoplld anrll ~ r.wm .. NFPA.edh lllrffl ~ •~T~Acennfstalfoll. W11M9 en opnimal fo<e a1enn sy,tlffl al II limas. 

Ul 'flMI A llllng requ m cenhl stations topilMde 11111 
·- I.--' or CCIIIP cl wi1h MOthtrentityla pco\ldt 
11\s- lDobllllflt~ 

IQ76.2.1 N Prrnrry ~ Minn p- si.w, L0Clltfa-.dnadolll8d MIIIICI to 72 ~car,eaty fo--~ poirerdue lo 
Mociflc:lbt WMllw tnd PG&E uflly r-.ied powllOU!lgei 

P-,.iy MCtQrl 901.2bMdld~ 
PIOltdian larllitllllg tdlngl dlCU IUllffllllC PIIMdllPRID«IIWglAC)'IICllilc:llalb'~ M 

9079 N IP'ri.llr l'/lltllll• Ill 11\11111 a fllul11111 lllltY add 1.0Clltf cr-.d and lifallCed 110W p&do1Nand-FQ~nol.'atol 11 
,_...,301'orl.000eqllll'l!wl!Olllt !ht _,."ti .. Qt lfflClt ~-~--

Thi& NClll!nldfs1So\r.!T1ppo11111lllllallc1M:alo 
1203 l 3 N Shllll 1r1P 1>CM11 uflly de>1cea lay ldop(lld 111d lmlll'ldld - • fl"QalCY.,-~~~~~•dbd.~ 

powereull!lfa 

33t1.l N ~adon3310 Ader-.----• 
l.ocaly Cl'Nllld tnd --

~lcrCQ'IRlldlcn-•,q,o't,nltu-1 ... 1111)011dng1r.1~--

33111 N ~y llldlon3S1tf w • ..-. 
r.«aly ldoplad-.1~ W.. lful be111 • pnar»«Jl'laldbltftllllaiallllillg -·~llllllrilaOIHl.e ADrld " Wltal conebUlflan ~ 

Airy dlml!l• • COlll flon ~ « IIIIINII HmldllulllllnllNlllleetilladlllflnallrlO~ IIII. 
If Ole ~cdlltfl CIIUNdbynaglgntdutlD I bllllnlN &0017 V plCll0N M~•llla:daut---lladn l.ocliJraealed llldadojuel proc.orprldiclllellUI IXlllwlblpalledonlotlle 

w1-1CIIII~,_ 
11"'9n .... 

Added llflly l)l'IMdlClnllOl,,....IIMIO ll9UIC! ,,_.,. ... ...,1Dtiw.-..-anc1 
66012 M fby bodl 1119FnCWnfSlllill!ll ~10r 

Loclly~aldlll'M'!d9d r-.or1i:a lo1PPMt11ernn i.eaaes~ 
~ aid'rlleFnQllfllldllllllaul~ otllllPllbllOnlotllcMl - .. be_.., 
~lat~ 

Eillllllallld Ids ...... by Ille f"n Codi lcr ClttN I 

5704.2.9&.I N Etlllb\stl«lwrill• •ladll 111!1FRO:lda ux:eltylllCiplldn!_.., ltmrnlbll lldCIIN •~IC(lldt1019~--
9'Qftl llnb.~AKl~81d• 
~ UH l'wnnt tn:r, h Colny 

Elltllltlledllllb•...-, .. t.FnCodllarO.. t 

5711U.U .. ,_ 
lmb• llllblll n llltfiftCode Loclly__,Md.-lded 

tllNNlllenO..IICIIIMIIIIIIIIIIIQICIIIPIOII 
c,plfllfcr,l11 ~ Iris. ~AKI 1PP1M1 
n • ~ U.. PnitmlleCouite, 

23-0015 D 33 of 53 



M,;i .... ntallDedd Diltld-Eldilbllltedlinls 

.-i,ir10111r1ctMlll8. N rlQlililllbylhefbClldtOffall•RMl1lllllt 
5806.2 k 1111!111 aJ11btn lna.fhCadll l.llclllJ ldaplld ancl lffllllded Ct,.,.cb11111flllonlMy---.--AHJ ---•~l.1111 l'tnllttam• Cariy 

EIIIIIIIIIN.._llllliWILPG._.111!1 
cfilC,nnl l!WftdltNy.,...,._,.,, __ 

~ W.forl.PG---~ 
dMt.4)1,•a•l'llll~lmll...,!!plllblrlts. 

emu H Loally ldqllld.., ll1llllded ._.,_, IININIIJlllkll'llllllablollP-GIIMlllld ,_ar,.._ID......,ifMlclimaltl 
hM1 hlg~p,allllillydfnjqry, ilNllllol\ or--. 
~ AHJ lq)l0Vll llllll1~UII 
Plnnll lnm ... County 

Oismalltled and starod 'lllhldlls ~ Signlllc:ant fre md$ 
(t,etll!rias llemmabla 111d Cllmbusllbll llqulds, Ujlhclsi.y. 

Cfl11111«80. NFPA. 1- Pmidos ~re-lllld deaflnce to ptllllllltylne, I &) and ri1klo111Qecaicn andlldjl09ntptcpe11ies, This 
N .LactllyCIUledat.lladaplad rwq~lramlllll prlWi4'I ·• aced and c:ldrlllOJ lo 22 for ~I,~ Yo. wiiN!lrxl in automOllile ~~ yera aplltlltians 1o llitt 1n 

~ opnttans and lDICtion o(flre eilBnlion to 
adjaca,l properties ,md/r, OP4111Md~. 

Nr.lndlc!IOlldude OIHi!fll,'mldW,-,.nlwttnehCII-
SIii far~ .... !Mllllilllial'ldlloGII !Iller llc,w 
A111 lo~111Mllltllltb'llwtllwd..,ln Int 

.. PA 131). tfi of Clllpts-80 of V. m Codi Qt Ille -Jd ..... lCIIVIIIOll111a--iRIICbn,Md 
Chl!lleraG,NFPA. V 

OillliGl,_IMIIIIM'CldldlDupc!Quaioul 
lllCdyldoplednllllded 

~ ldig~IO-,i-epq,er130 
130-18 pr-.~111--illlllllmlol....., ,p,mter f)1111ffl inuWan~llefflkd...., 

,.,_,.. kl 01111 tlldtwo-fanilydWdlgl .,.llom pllJlflla. PlllillPll,vt,..,..... 
... uoacldld lDtNU118• • ofl:IAMl0n l!lrough 111 
~ . rtCM1ng---andb9dCSOWcanaml 
(EID ~ 111111)'1111 d ilylllmi 

'bis us blllwllwllll~n ~ ft ullld 

cn.,g«I 500 GPM to 1,000 GPM ii lnfF 
IOWl ,tgtre11 IDGP',I ntow NqU,,..,...llllf~MI 

.. B·T• N Sl.l:>dMSIOnt bllalfl 5a1Gfml IIIMllon. la maid! Localy ldQPltd r,a aRMrl!Md 
IIMdb'Ollll'tdladl lnEtlC.Aisofl"7,'ldtl•~ 

BfOS.1(1) 1re 1ow ~ used ., eoc lcrl,'111111 IMI ol lWUCie-- forlrellabln9 PIIP0Mllll'1e~ 
olhwHlah~•. hllllltDV11g9111110n.Ulllbr111191falliell 
tohouat ignlb 

Appenck8 Tlblll 
~ a mWnlJm 11q11111!111i GI 1.SOO GPM. "'lo,,s IIIIOIIIN:IIM!el~ and~ .. UNlf 

N btlaw !OOOtoctelMtian. b' IIOIJIVNl'dll l.oclly ldcpc.cf-4~11d to In llgllldl la GPM hftolr JIIIIUIISllll1IM IIMbam 
810S.Z p,qects UMdforCMrl ~ IIEOc. 

.-.0-010.11 • Addtlf Ill ~b'l8cllnall dn--,S l.ocllyl((opledanddlllldlld 
tt 11 ~., reqvn 1 !llietdll GMWl'lti 
ocnllrUct 12lbll w!de ~ ftrlCCeNIOlllydrant. 

r111e~..-@10an1,1Ct:11P1~11tlft~. 

... 0'0103.2 N Amer.did ID 1118111 si..11111 of pdel no 918111:er LOCICy adOpled nf 8lllCll'ldolt anyaapliontlMll.fdl9Clll"tppNbJtlwtAHJ llNB 
thar1161'wlllwt\lMll!dtMllll lre"'- OnlrlOMl!y Tille 141Cio!11kr! wtlb ,_..1119116'1, 

gladt llllhAtlJW!Wlilllldllsdu'lllcl. 

~O:IJU0.3 N 4dclld l4111110lndlicleclllblllldgulllll UIC1lllrdlOllldnnindlld' ZO!ool•llilllfllllllltlllllnllldtQlllllllllt .... dut 
lopalrilllCll:8N _,.llld\WIIIIIIIIMCICIIICilffll. 

~ miMIIUIII M•p1aw1,n--, v.ti.lh lA)nhr1--.ctlldtoonasaf1\twdeO 
~00103.5 N LQCllllyldllpldOIIIIClll1llllldecl roedwly !l!e9alllldtlnlnol beleNtwli 15ftltpe:, 

anfnippllllllll0lell n:iads ~Ulingnidlus 

Noparblg 11tadllllOlflldm11>11MWtllN11181128 F• 

~ 0-010161 ff Rmhodll• 201D 29 !eel l.«aly--andM'iended 
lnwdh lbow 5000W l.onrlhln 6C001Ntllllla. 
lllltlSIPY ThiaNCicllellllPlld•lllllndll'ltieFlit 
Codt~ONC111111 tDU 1 f!rllolller..._ 

23-0015 D 34 of 53 



IPNl9011- l!Cllttftfan111Gtfnllll2&111tlllJ&INI 

~..,.mcntwl291INllll.t,_llen36 
--, lbll llnotNCpllC!lllt"-15000fNl« 

~D'Ot113.U N ~-- Llallyadapladnl ...... ~ i.--lllrl 5000 faelllli&dDIIIIMJIIIIJlfr. Tiie 
lld>ft11adajllld• ll--1tfllFW OadilAppa,dlD 
Sedlol 103 6 2 lor Ill lllfs llMIJans. 

~lo,.,..~ Int lpJMIUI 
Vt1Mn .-111111 h oCldeaddal. 1"8appllllal 

~O·OfOU ti LIICllly INllledllld ldopted - llllld alllllbtconmxlldlo~htnln -~ IWttl!tllldthallptO,tlle•~-rl 
~ ..illda--

Adopted with no Amendments 
101.1 tv'Clqt 101.5 H 

Ai¥ed lo ..-rial!-,., ... le\'Rlilfll'eM lQcallrlllapled MM._claltt 
wldly 

1C21 dw.qi 102 1:i N ~ -...n111~tir•Code t.ocat,adalnd MmbllraM d81iy 

1CA 1111'0Ujl N ~lo~llleoode I.ally~ Mlw\lC!lffl clriy 
IG4.1U 
1051~ 

N 1Ta1mato1 cr1~011 l.OClllly lldql!ICI dllll'f ,csu• 
106 t flloullh 106 • N 

~ fQeeclollb~clslylllll I.OCllly edDplld FN ~ for.,.._ 
lrtnlliltulely,nspee5o,-. 

107 1h'cugh1078 N 
~lllil teeioftb aitlillllllnllM~ n 

I.al& --
lnlpdco IUll!cnty 

b lllel llllillyapec:ions 

~ lllll IMdloii b'dlllildlNflwl ally end 
MlnWIIIIC8af-.llds. ~ tlld~ o( 

~ .1-.,109-6 N t,.ocalyllQl(ad ~ pmri l9-llli!plCloll and fd'9. _.111111119, 
fir9nlhulaly napdons ~twld9mg.....,..,,.,..,~ . 

113 N 
~ed 11111 MCII/JI\ lor !Jdrnlnisilbvt dlrily Ol1d 
l'n Ind Ille lllaly lllpecllcins Lllcallr~ ~..atCllflr 

I t4. I hough 114.7 N 
Ai¥1C1 fds IIClfcl; b-D!lnllrllivt dllnty aid Locallp adapl-.d Unule IWttne «.-a:.-nent 
tnm .. metr nspedk,11 

~ klldlelClOllllll hl;ill'ftoftllllllllllml!lna!S-.d 
requ,r1 atmQ1r11 u llguna Managing igrm, IIQJICN 

~ 1111Ssedcl' fllr ln#ldllltlltaly 301 t llllougtl309.5 N l.ocal'f~ llwwiJh ~l!)pbBal olmndlrd& III IUlatfl■ 
!U111lerol ... ~Vllblllallil,gS ~~. 
-.d~) 

Gsterlll~!lllilrt111l1mofoll,J Vanlo,8lllilll!I 
anWan andsele(Y~lllelldGl!edpiemi.w. 

310 1 lllrallgll 311 4 H ~ tfQ sec:t0n b'hllidlllllllllllY Locat(ldilplld 
llN!ll~~VICIIII~ NQlrily, ftrt 
proldcll, n ...-ion NlfflOl9I d C0ff'Qlllillel, 

!lfflOYII af hmrdcul '".,. (Clm,tc;, 99CllogQI. and 
IDpOgl lpl1cllJ 

323. t N Adq,led lhls J«!iOII lcr fl!I! 11\cl life se/lly locally adopted 
Genni requi/fflllfflls b reeds, tunnels, end bndgl!I. 
(~. gocloglal!, _,d IOpognp/''CII). 

~ IVIOia:,on drill.s fiw bmnlells an4 ,NlitwJ()l!81 

•OJ.6 lhrough 4037 6 N Adq,led tni, 1d0n IOr fire and li!e safetf locallyadopled =ptneias (~ v.i~ n:ieJsed po!vntiol b' lfe 
loss) 

4CJ 9 !hloullh .a3 94 I( Adapted llu , tdlan fol h lllld life safr:ly Loeellradopled 
Prowles evaa,a:ion dlll1s lcrhotll/mlllel OCICU~ 

(~s with incte6d pctentill fDr life m). 

406 1t1rougM05. I 0 N Adop'Ad 11111 IIClllll far h and 111 aafaly IJ:allr ldqltlCI 
cn,eiger,cy plMn,ng and IIClllll~ !Cim& 
g90laglcal, and lcpogr~~ 

510.l H 
Adcip:ed llus sedlon for actnini$1/11tiw cltrily and ~ll¥adcpted 

A pent11111 ~ •ed for eme<guncy responder rad'o syst!IT$ 

lire and li.'e ufelynspactions (ClimaCic. sllO!oglaf. and topographieal~ 

606.1 Ulrough 806.4 N Adopted !his s.ction for edmlr.slnlllw. da~ty a!ld 1.0ca11Y adoplld 
Oeantive yc,gtlaion poses an fntrllase ffl hlUld, 

Rrt111d lilt sar«y inspecfcos ~ and ~,creesed ti$<, 

WII ~ 11 Jllllt4I E 0CQ1P1n091 (Scliooll) 1111 a 

807 1 lll!Ough 807 5.6 H 
Adco'.ed 11& IICliotlfOI ectm1n1m1t11ed!Wflyn l.ocat/adoiDd 

ll1IJlfflC,ll1 anoin aftlamlli,le wal CIMIMgl in 

Ira 111dla~ nll)ICIIOl1I dlclta\ll ~ (Clhelle. gealDglCII. end 
topcgrlC)IICII) 

23-0015 D 35 of 53 



A~ed lhia leQCll tb!'mtni1trallvaclarlly and 
Com11us111> • ~ pose • ~ ff,mmai.Jily lllld 

808 1 through BOU N 
'Q and Ila ,alElly inspacfons Lacally aclopltd lnUee5ed i ll u'ely h_.i in lnsikU!lonal ftldcc41egt ddm 

type occupanaes. 

Adapled 11'.JS sediGI! 1a lldminisnli'ie cl!,ity ano Providos dny on 11:e1plancl l9itirt of •ut£rull~ In 
904.4. I tl 1roand llfe ulely fnsp«::lions 

Loc:aily adqlted e1t,ngu!sl1ing systems. (CtimaUr.; p,logli::al, 111d 
lopographal} 

I 101. 1 llu'oug'l I 102.1 N 
~ this section fer llltnonisno.. dsil)' and l~yadopttd AdmlnimllVt dlrify 
tile and lfe »lelY IIISPecfcns 

~Reipandlrraclo-.ift~llu11$,gs. 
'I ~ .. bl .._.111aic,,.~11111)(Mft 
Iv-and i,....i ~=, rldolll/kloMld from 
8ICII clller 111d ... llfflll9llllll' cl&pllldt Clllllr. Time 

Mopledll1• teefcrl111 Q(,ng bcildlngslortlle 
1ra1Wa11 l»dMlllpld ID-llltl~nfll 

11032 V All(yr,f~,ndoe..,.llffl8llll"ICY t.ocaiYillla!Hd 
pllas,lg 11d1 IWl(llffiOWJ'IINllocfl:Jlme. ~ b'( 

_..__ Iha Sri codl ohllf, IS IICl',llptallle 111a ~ behilll ha 
Neller ialllll llll llmclllll411111Vlllerl"IICIW~lll'.f!lf 
fllllly l'ldd9lls CllffllMIClllon ••kllf- 11,1, 
.._canblcmaedwilfllllelddltimlofllllb 
eq.ipnltlll loboalt .. llQNl 11 ... fl• dol\OI:~ 
Stn:ilg llgnlll (Clirrlelc. geclaglall. and ltipogllphlcll) 

Requires iMtalllltion ~ ft,-spdnk!i!r 111stems Ill eusling 

1103.S V 
Adopled this sec:lion fer Ille salllly ol lhe pc,bllc, l.ocel1yadaptlld 

occupc,des with llilfl life safely risk and ftl ccnfonnanca 
ru,f<;hltra and adlet eme,gei,ey ~rs w.llt invious Unftronn Rte Cede!. (CJlmlflc; i(!dclglcal. lfld 

:opcsrapl'icai) 

Adopled this IIIC60II fct !he safety d !he publlc. 
Requi111s lmtdetion ol <:e/bQn rnon01Clde lllam,, 111 

1103.9 N LOC8Uy adopted 0C01pancin wilh ~ ~fa safety dllll (Cimlltie. geaicgJl;al, 
fir~h:81. and OCher emergency ~rs and lc!>09111!lhlQII), 

1104 1 thcough Aoopled lhis s«t,()(1 for the 111'1y ot 11111 Pllbllc; 
Pl!Mdes I "'inirmlm lllvel al sa'aty Wl1h ,egaid to egru• 

N LOC81ly tdopled lforn a,osting buddings hcuaiog OtalPltlr:ies will, a high Ille 
1104 25 flflligh!e!S, and othllf l!ffll!IQ«U:y taponde(S safely rtdt. {Cllmalle. geolcil,lical an(l tGp(lg,aphi,:al), 

110611t~h Ad0pled tlu secGool lorlhaiafetyolt11epi111Gc, 
l'fovldesl nli\knUm fM ofsalelyal!ireSU199yinls 

1106 1.2 
N firolgh:crs atld lllhet lffllflll"C1 INpClldel5 

Locally adopted "'11h l,J¢ 19vel$ of111ffwnMllt l\lbber1'111114nal (Cllma\ic, 
g101ogrcal, ana'IDl)clg~ 

Apper,61 0- C>10f 1 N Mopled Iha lldiol1 lilr lM saflllyof 1118~ 
lclclllradllpled 

Gtn«ll ~fo'aappniUSIICCINlroad4 
~ough Dfl141 firef~ and ollMt erne,genC'I ~ ndudltiG !olds (CllmallG.~. al'llflDpcXJlal>hk:111► 

APPlfldbO OIOU N 
Ad(!pllld'-Ndiarl lotlhlts8'1tyollflel)I&, 

~lldaONCI 
Coim,ertllll lrldNlftill ~ ..... ll)Pll1lus 

(udud.ng ~I ~ andolfler8fMIUIJIICYIIIPOl'ldn -, lllldl (Clmltic, gealoglcll. 1111-..a& 

Applr.lb I>' 0104 3 N Adoplld Ila llldiMforOIII 11ft(y ol lrlp.elic. liail't adq,lld 
Canm11011 111d~dMloplnenth~ 

1111caqi 0t06.4 .....,.,,ltld .. ~ reepoll(flil8 ac:ca.acll(alnlllbo. .... and~ 

~diO: n1C111 N 
Adcpd illt adonb llltnfllyofflepJJlic. Ld1adt.¢ed Fn •~-• l'Oldllletll11Afil)l..-,mlilla11111 

(81ldudklg lillllflbon) ~ . llldOlller-s,eni:y ~ ~ (Clrnak,g~.11111~ 

~0:0106.2 N AdDp-aj Illa HCICn fat Ille afetJ al thtpillic:. ldyldopled 
Fn llll)l,-alUl -roedl lotl!Ulp..,.,radantill 

Ml,gh0106.3 ·~"dlltf~fllllllllCI• CIMlapmlnll (Clirnek ~. lllrf lapogUlllllCS). 

ar.. at-.....l9lden'lilli!Mlop,nenlstllellbe 
~0:0107 1 N 

Adopl,ld lhtllldlOltbtlie...-.YoltllpubBc, l.ocaly adopled 
~~llltl,IIWDtl)lllltllld,lppl'Mclh 

(ndudlng im:eofinl 
'"""'""· ,nd .......... IIIIJl)ftdlrl 

lll\)IIIIUl-roedsdueto~gq,IIIIWCll'CI 
clr!lllle00ftdltitn 

an. .. IWl>dl,lllng 1911denCill dMlapmenll lbrll 111 
~ D·Dtll7.2 N 

Adopted ._Mcbon flltlfMtulaty a111,epiM. t.cclllylld!lpt9! ~~·---••tlJPIGNdllre 
l1wough O 108 I ~ anddl'rll'~~ IA)lflll.1..,. rOlldisUla~c, gqr,plle..S 

dllnlllc C0lldilDfls 

Grey ctlls ae previously amended, adopted, °' changed code sections lhat n being adopted ag.in In lhJS code cycle. 

23-0015 D 36 of 53 



While cells are newly amended, adopted, or changed code sections that differ from prevfous code adoptions. 

23-0015 D 37 of 53 



Attachment No. 2 

Diamond Springs-El Dorado Fire Protection District 

Public Hearing Notices 

23-0015 D 38 of 53 



:.flf{ountatn{lllemocrat 
PROOF OF PUBLICATION 

(2015.S C.c.P.} 

Proof of Publication of 
NOTICE OF INTENT 

ST ATE OF CALIFORNIA 
County of El Dorado 

1 am a citizen of the United States and a resident 
of the County aforesaid; I'm over the age of 
eighteen years, and not a party to or interested in 
the above-entitled matter. I am principal clerk of 
the printer at the Mountain Democrat, 2889 Ray 
Lawyer Drive, a newspaper of general circulation, 
printed and published Monday. Wednesday, 
and Friday, in the City of PlacerviUe, 
County of El Dorado, and which newspaper has 
been adjudged a newspaper of general circula­
tion by the Superior Court to the County of El 
Dorado, State of Cali fomfa, under the date of 
March 7, 1952, Case Number7258; that the 
notice, of which the annexed is a printed copy 
(set in type no smaller than non-pareil). has been 
published in each regular and. entire issue of said 
newspaper and not in any supplemei1t thereof on 
the foUowing dates, to•with: 

9/t9, 10/5 

ALL IN THE YEAR 2022 
I certify (or declare) under penalty of perjury that 
the foregoing is true and correct. 

Dated at Placerville, California. this 511t. day 
of OCTOBER, 2022 

bcUl ~ e~w. c 
Signature 

Nobee ol lnlerW 10 Adopl die 
2022C'Alllolllllfll9Codt 

Nob Ill hlnll1t ~ l:O Ille 
il!lllllklllol tllllilulalll~B 
Clncb Fhl ~ £lllllnci Ill 
adopt the~ Call(cmeFtltQclcflr. 
Tlia dlltll(ltnll tdd ... Ir..« putlllc 
haR'llf Ii! 2:QO P.M. on October t1, 
202211tll01 ~VA"'VAoad. 
0le!nclnd $pmgs. CA, ~ lie 
lldq)ClOn o! the :?OZ!~ Fll9 
Coot pursua,,I lo Heaftll and Saflly 
Codi Sect1an 138611. C()j)IM of N 
cade ~,....,..to .,,cl my 
~codetdelf<xa!ldllfflldb, 
ldopled bynol..,..,.,. on •...a, 
h~c4N~91dn 
Ol)en!Oi,ubllcinapec1iol,.i\dOpllOI> 
al the 2022 c.,rta,na Ari Codi wll 
~-Oistlfelpencn,allo fellow 
one Ml of nA• and~ IMIII 
n,gwd lo ii,. ,..'Ill and uf.iy olttM 
pUt,ile md IN O:stricl'• ,...w 
~ 
Sf\ 9, 1 a,-, 111178 

23-0015 D 39 of 53 



;§lflountatnl)l3emotrat 
PROOF OF PUBLICATION 

(2015.5 C.CP,) 

Proof or Publication of 
NOTICE OF INTENT 

STATE OF CALIFORNIA 
County of El Dorado 

I am a citizen of the United States and a resident 
of the County aforesaid; I'm over the age of 
eighteen years. and not a party to or interested in 
the above-entitled matter. I am principal clerk of 
the printer at the Mountain Democrat, 2889 Ray 
Lawyer Drive, a newspaper of general circulation, 
printed and published Monday. Wednesday, 
and Friday, in the City of Placerville, 
County of Et Dorado. and which newspaper has 
been adjudged a newspaper of general circula­
tion by the Superior Court to the County ofEl 
Dorado, State of California, under the date of 
March 7, 1952, Case Number 7258; that the 
notice, of which the .atlne.'W:1 is a printed copy 
{set m type no s.rnaner than non~parei!)_. has been 
publisl:red in each regular and entire issue of said 
newspaper and not in any supplement thereof on 
the following dates, to-with: 

10121, 10/28 

ALL IN THEYEAR.2022 
l certify (or declare) under penalty of perjury that 
the foregoing is true and correct 

Dated at Plac:erville, California, this 28th day 
of OCTOBER, 1012 

bLJ.t.'¥,11 R~.s 
Signature 

•mnct or IIH[NT Tl) 
_,,,(If T ltil: :,; 

CAI IFUR',IA FIPC C0uE 

23-0015 D 40 of 53 



Attachment No. 3 

Diamond Springs-El Dorado Fire Protection District 

Resolution No. 2022-09 

23-0015 D 41 of 53 



RESOLUTION No. 2022-09 

A RESOLUTION OF THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS OF THE DIAMOND SPRINGS-EL 
DORADO FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT 

ADOPTING FINDINGS SUPPORTING AMENDMENTS TO THE 
CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE 

A resolution for the Diamond Springs-El Dorado Fire Protection District setting forth findings with 
respect to local conditions within the Fire District which make certain modifications and changes to the 
California Fire Code reasonabJy necessary for preserving fire and life safety in the Diamond Springs-El 
Dorado Fire Protection District. 

The Governing Board of the Diamond Springs-El Dorado Fire Protection District finds and resolves as 
follows: 

WHEREAS, Health & Safety Code Section 17958.5 permits a Fire Protection District to adopt an 
ordinance which changes or modifies the State Housing regulations adopted pursuant to Health & Safety 
Code Section 17922 upon detemrination that such changes or modifications are necessary due to local 
conditions that pertain regulations governing conditions hazardous to life, property and the environment 
from fire, explosion. hazardous materials and hazardous uses; and 

WHEREAS, Health & Safety Code Section 179S8. 7 requires that a District's Board of Directors 
making any changes or modifications pursuant to Health &. Safety Code Section 17958.5 shall make 
express finding that such changes or modifications are needed; and shall file a copy of such changes or 
modifications with the Department of Housing and Community Development. 

WHEREAS, the unique local climatic, geological, and topographical conditions existing within 
the boundaries of the District make it reasonably necessary for the District to impose more stringent 
requirements than set forth in the California Fire Code and pursuant to California Health and Safety Code 
sections 13869.7 and 17958.7, the District desires to make express findings to that effect. 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that the Board of Directors of the Diamond Springs­
El Dorado Fire Protection District, after having duly noticed and held public hearings, hereby adopts the 
following findings concerning current unique local conditions that together make each modification to 
the California Fire Code, reasonably necessary to provide adequate and effective protection of life, 
property and the environment more specifically set forth as follows: 

- t -

23-0015 D 42 of 53 



FINDINGS OF FACT 
FOR CHANGES OR MODIFICATfONS TO THE STATE BUILDING STANDARDS 

CODE (flTLE 24 PART 9) BECAUSE OF LOCAL CONDITIONS 

A. General. 
After due consideration, the Board of Directors of the Dlamond Springs-El Dorado Fire Protection 
District, hereby finds that due to local climatic, geologic and topographic conditions, as stated within 
this document, there is a need to provide the modifications and changes contained in the adoptive 
Ordinance of the California Fire Code. Such changes are deemed to be reasonably necessary lo provide 
adequate and effective protection of life, property, and the environment. 

The Diamond Springs-El Dorado Fire Protection District provides fire protection, emergency medical 
services, and specialized rescue services to approximately fifteen thousand five hundred people in a 65.5 
square mile area. The District is located on the western slope of El Dorado County. The topography of 
the District ranges from rolling hills of grass and oak woodland in the west and oak-timber in the steep 
drainages of the east portion. The weather conditions vary from freezing temperatures with occasional 
snow in winter, to summer temperatures that regularly exceed 100 degrees. 

The District can be divided into three distinct areas: The core area encompasses Diamond Springs, El 
Dorado, and the Missouri Flat Road corridor. The core area is more urban and contains most of the 
District's existing commercial development and potential for major commercial development. The 
north and south areas typically contain small subdivisions and isolated residential developments. These 
areas are characteristic of the suburban or ranch environment. The north and south areas become very 
isolated and more rural as one moves further away from the core of the District. 

The Diamond Springs-El Dorado Fire Protection District is an "all-risk" agency. The District 
participates in a sophisticated automatic aid program and is dispatched through agreement by the 
California Department of Forestcy and Fire Protection (Cal-Fire), at Camino. The resources of the 
District will respond to, and deal with. any type of emergency. The term .. Fire Protection" in this 
document is broad and includes responses to fires, smoke and odor investigations, alanns, public assist 
calJs, hazardous materials incidents, medical aid, and specialized rescues. 

The District ha:s estabhshed one, full-time, staffed fire station and four satellite fire stations to provide 
emergency services to the community. Fire Station 49 is located in the unincorporated town of 
Diamond Springs, at SOI Pleasant Valley Rd. Fire Station 46 is located in the unincorporated town of El 
Dorado, at 6170 Pleasant Valley Road. Fire Station 48 is located at 3840 Missouri Flat Road, 
Placerville, just north of Highway 50. Fire Station 44 is located in the Logtown area at 6109 Quartz 
Drive, El Dorado. Fire Station 47 is located in the Sleepy Hollow Subdivision, at 2312 Oakvale Drive, 
Shingle Springs. The District has 11 full-time, career personnel, along with two administrative positions, 
and two adminjstrative support positions. 

B. Cllmalit. 
The Diamond Springs-El Dorado Fire Protection District is located within a foothill region. The District 
is subject to four seasons, with an annual average snowfall in the winter months of 2 inches, in addition 
to an average rainfall of 45 inches per year. These adverse weather conditions create severe hazardous 

. 2. 

23-0015 D 43 of 53 



road conditions and flooding as well as rock slide hazards along the main access roads within, as weU as 
into, the District from the sunounding areas. Due to periods of rainfall, along with repeated road 
closures, the ability of the Fire Protection District to provide immediate emergency response is often 
delayed. These same adverse climatic conditions often result in a large number of vehicular accidents 
rha1 place extreme restraints on the availability of emergency response to perform emergency rescue. 
first aid, hazardous materials control, and fire- fighting. The climatic conditions often result in a 
substantial or total lack of ability of the Fire Protection District to respond immediately to other types of 
emergency situations that occur. Examples of these emergency situations include structure fires, 
wildland and forest fires, flooding, hazardous materials incidents, emergency medical calls, vehicle 
accidents, and vertical rescues. The mutual aid agreements established with adjoining fire agencies 
might not be possible due to adverse climatic conditions, restricting or totally blocking access into the 
District. 

Summary: 
These local climatic conditions affect the acceleration, intensity, and size of fires in the Fire District. 
Times of little or no rainfall, low humidity, and high temperatures create extremely hazardous 
conditions, particularly as they relate to the wildland-urban interface. Winds experienced in this area can 
have a significant impact upon structure fires, especially in buildings in close proximity to one another, 
and to wildlands commonly found in the Diamond Springs-El Dorado Fire Protection District. 
Structures built within the Diamond Springs-El Dorado Fire Protection District must be built with these 

variables in mind. 

C. Geological. The Diamond Springs-El Dorado Fire Protection District is located within moderate 
activity seismic Zone Three. The seismic, geological conditions present a potential for multiple fires, 
major breakage of water mains, multiple electrical power failures, multiple collapsed structures and a 
large number of calls for emergency medical aid, all of which may occur simultaneously during a 
seismic event. The water district has numerous water-pumping systems used for fire suppression water 
delivery, as well as water storage tanks providing water system pressure. Most of the pumping systems 
are dependent on electrical power for operation. Such electrical power may not be available during a 
seismic event. Water storage tanks used for the storage of required fire suppression water may also 
collapse in such an event forcing the additional need to transport water via additional pieces of fire 
apparatus which will place a significant restraint on the ability of the District to provide the required 

emergency services. 

Summary: 
Local geographic and geological features and processes exist within the boundaries of the district that 
may hamper the ability of the Diamond Springs-El Dorado Fire Protection District to perform its swom 
duties. Fire following an earthquake has the potential of causing greater loss of life and damage than the 

earthquake itself. 

D. Topographical. The District is primarily composed of areas that are considered by the State to be high 
fire hazard severity zones. Much of the District is located within foothill terrain, covered with highly 
combustible vegetation, including the presence of many coniferous forested areas. The elevation within 
the District ranges from at 1,000 feet to over 2,100 feet at the highest point. Slope within the District 

-3-

23-0015 D 44 of 53 



r8Dps from O degrees to 90 degrees. The structures within the areas of foothills amain have very limited 
file access, due to narrow roadways with steep grades and poor road surface conditions. Tho presence of 
many existing stzuctures within the high fire hazard severity ZGDe areas provides for a Wif1 high 
pocentia1 of a structure tire spieading into a wildland or forest fire condition as well as the poteat1al for a 
wildland or forest fire spreading to~-

Sammuy: 
The alipment of canyon,, valleys. and slopes into inhabihld meas, eombincd with the variable natun, of 
the tma.in. yicJd polential for increased fire risk. Most structures, both residential and commercial, are in 
or are surrounded by areas thai contain significant grass, brush, mixed oak woodland, and mixed conifer 
fuel load. Due to drought conditions, beetle infestations, and lack of vegetation management, much of 
the area is populated with either dead or dying trees. contributing to extreme fire danger. 

E. Co■cl•sion: 
Local climatic. geographic, and topograpbie conditions descn'bod above increase the frequency. 
intensity, and size of fires involving buildings in the Fite District. Further, these conditions impact 
potential damage to structures from an earthquake and subsequent fire. Therefore, it is reasonably 
necessary that the California Fire Code be DIOdified to mitigate the effects of the above conditions. 
California Health & Safety Code Section l79S8.7 requires that modifications to the Fire Code be 
expressly marked and identified as to which taeh findu:ig refers to whieh Code modification. The 
attached Appendix A provides this connection. 

INTRODUCED at a regular meeting of the Board of Directors of the Diamond SpriDgs/El 
Dorado F'ue Protection District on October 11th, 2022. 

PASSED AND ADOPTED at a regular meeting of the Board of Directors of tlie Diamond 
Springs-El Dorado Fire Protection District on October 11111• 2022 by the foUowing roll call vote: 

AYES: 4-
NOES: 0 

ABSENT: 1_ 

ABSTAIN: 0 

ATTEST: 

~ -~ . !A.Lt ~ 
~\lthill, Board Secretmy 

23-0015 D 45 of 53 



SECTION 1: FINDINGS OF FACTS 

In connection with the amendments enacted by Section 2 and 3 relating to the California 
Fire Code and its appendix, 2022 edition, the Diamond Springs/ El Dorado Fire Protection 
District (DSEDFPO) makes the following finding& pursuant to Health and Safety Code 
Section 17958.5, 17958.7 and 18941.5. The changes are reasonably necessary because 
of local climatic, topographical, or geological conditions. 

DSEDFPO hereby adopts pursuant to Section 18941. 5 of the California Health and 
Safety Code, the following findings of fact: 

(a) Under this adopting ordinance, specific amendments have been 
established which are of a more restrictive nature than those adopted by the State of 
California {State Buildings Standards Code, State Housing & Community Development 
Codes) commonly referred to as Title 24 & Title 25 of the California Code of Regulations. 
These amendments to the California Fire Code 2022 edition, have been recognized by 
the ECFPD to address the fire problems, concerns, and fu1ure direction by which ECFPD 
can establish and maintain an environment which will afford a level of fire and life safety 
to all who live and work within its boundary. 

(b) The International Code Council has assumed responsibility for the 
lntemational Fire Code and International Fire Code Standards. The International Code 
Council provided a means for participation by all code enforcement officials from 
throughout the country as well as Industry representatives, consultants, and other private 
parties with an interest in the International Fire Code. 

(c) The International Fire Code, being the 2021 edition thereof, published by 
the International Code Council is a nationally recogni;zed compilation of proposed rules, 
regulations, and standards of said Association. 

(d) Said International Fire Code has been printed and published as a Code in 
book form within the meaning of Section 50022.1 of the Government Code of the State 
of California. 

(e) Under the provisions of Section 18941.5 of the Health and Safety Code, 
local amendments are based on climatic, topographical, and geological conditions. The 
findings of fact contained herein address each of these situations and present the local 
situation, which either singularly or in combination, caused the amendments to be 

adopted. 

23-0015 D 46 of 53 



2022 CFC FINDINGS 

LOCAL CONDITIONS 

A. These amendments are justified based on a local climatic condition. DSEDFPO is 
subject to precipitation, relative humidity, temperature extremes, and high velocity 
winds. 

1. Precipitation & relative humidity 

a. Conditions 

Precipitation. Average annual precipitation ranges from approximately 
45 inches per year in rain and 2 inches of snow annually. 
Approximately 88% of the average rainfall occurs during the months of 
November through April and 12% from May through October. This area 
has experienced major droughts in the last two decades: 1986 -1991, 
1998 - 2003, 2007 - 2009, 2011 - 2015, and 2019. It is possible that 
more droughts will occur in the future based on the weather cycle 
pattern. 

Relative Humidity. During the summer months (May through 
September), the daily humidity ranges around 20%, and occasionally 
drops to the low teens. 

2. Temperature 

a. Conditions 

Temperatures. During the summer months (May through 
September), 1he daily temperatures commonly exceed 90 degrees 
Fahrenheit, with temperatures having been recorded as high as 
115 degrees Fahrenheit. 

3. Winds 

SUMMARY 

a. Conditions 

Winds. The summer prevailing winds are out of the south and 
southwest. However, north winds occur during the spring (April and 
May}, the fall (September and October), and occasionally during 
the summer months (June, July, and August). Velocities are in the 
range of five to fifteen miles per hour, gusting to 30 miles per hour 
during the summer months. 

These local climatic conditions affect the acceleration, Jntansity, and size of fire in 
the community. Times of little or no rainfall and elevated temperatures create 
extremely hazardous conditions, particularly as they relate to residential roof fires 
and wildfire conflagrations. The climatic conditions are one of the greatest impacts 
to fire behavior and other major emergency events due to their uncontrollable 
nature. 

23-0015 D 47 of 53 



2022 CFC FINDINGS 

8. These amendments are justified on the basis of a local geologic and topographic 
conditions. DSEDFPD is subject to varied terrain, slopes, increased vegetation, 
varied surface features, hazardous building operations, and terrain risk factors. 

1. Geol29ical location 

a. Conditions 

Geologlcal Location. Diamond Springs El Dorado Fire Protection 
District is located in the foothills of the Sierras at an altitude range of 
approximately 1000 feet to 2 ~ 00 feet above sea level. 

2. Size and population 

a. Conditions 

Size and Population. The DSEDFPD encompasses 
approximately 15,530 residents in 65.5 square miles. 

3. Seismic Location 

a. Conditions 

Seismic Location. The nearest identified fault zone is the Bear 
Mountain Fault, northwest of Diamond Springs. This fault zone 
splits into multiple branches which transect the area between 
Folsom and Shingle Springs. The closest branch passes through 
the western edge of Browns Ravine. The next nearest extension of 
this fault system is located immediately at the north end of El Dorado 
County and extends from the southeast arm of Folsom Lake, north 
to the City of Auburn. No recent geologic activity has been observed 
along this fault. However, studies of the east branch of the fault 
zone, conducted by Woodward-Clyde Associates for the Auburn 
Dam, and by Tierra Engineering Consultants near Folsom Lake, 
indicate that the fault may be reactivating based on recent tectonic 
trends and should be considered potentially active. 

4. Topograehy 

a. Conditions 

Topography. The topography of the OSEOFPO varies from level 0% 
slope to terrain with over a 90% slope. The valley floor is relatively 
flat with gentle slopes and consists of grassland and trees. The east 
and west sides of the valley floor increase to approximately 40% 
slopes and consist of trees, brush, and grass-covered range land. 
The slope in all cardinal directions within DSEDFPD is significant. 
Hilly terrain throughout the area provides gullies or areas referred to 
as "chimneys" which accelerate the spread of fire in addition to 
dense, mature forest land. 

Page 3 of 9 

23-0015 D 48 of 53 



2022 CFC FINDINGS 

5. Roads and streets 

a. Conditions 

Roads and Streets. DSEDFPD has seen a moderate degree of 
urban and commercial development within the last 15 years. With 
this development comes the increase of vehicular traffic and 
congestion which can have a direct effect on the response time of 
emergency apparatus. Many pre-existing roadways and streets do 
not conform to current standards and are narrow and winding in 
design, thus creating an increase in response time by DSEDFPD 
apparatus. 

6. Building Clearances 

a. Conditions 

SUMMARY 

Building Clearances. As residential development continues to 
occur in the DSEDFPD, the clearance between homes has 
decreased which increases the ability of fire to spread from one 
home to another by both radiation and convection heat. Combined 
with the wild land urban interface (WUI) and lack of resources for 
defensible space, rlsk to life, property and environment is Inherently 
increased. 

The above geological and topographical conditions increase the magnitude, 
exposure, accessibility problems and fire hazards that DSEDFPD is responsible to 
mitigate. Fire following an earthquake has the potential of causing greater loss of 
life and damage to property than the earthquake itself. 
Other variables may tend to increase the situation: 

1. The damage that may occur to the water system. 
2. The extent of isolation due to roadway damage, overpass collapse and 

debris blocking the roadway. 

Page• of 9 

23-0015 D 49 of 53 



2022 CFC FINOfNGS 

20Zl_lEfi..,.Code T& Adopt,d Am•nded Added Deleled Rndln(1 

101.1 General X Administrative 

102.6- 102.12 Applicabilitv X Administrative 

104.1 Duties and Powers X Administrative 

104.3- 104.4 Duties and Power& X Administrative 

104.6 Official Records X Administrative 

104.8-104.8.2 Aooroved Materials X Administrative 

104.9 Modifications X Admlniatratlve 

104.11 - 104.12.3 Flrelnveatiaatlon X Administrative 

105.2.3 Time of AppficatlOn X Administrative 

105.3.2 Extensions X Administrative 

105.5 Operational Permits Administrative 

105.5.55 Automobile X Administrative 
Wreckina Yards 

105.6 Construction X Administrative 
Permits 

105.6.25 Automobile X Administrative 
Wrecklnn Yards 

105.6.9 Fuel Cell X Administrative 

105.6.12 !Hazardous Materials X Administrative 

105.17 Plant Extraction X Administrative 

105.18 Private Fire X Administrative 
Hvdranls 

105.19 Smoke Control X Administrative 

105.6.21 S~ialEvent 
Structure 

X Administrative 

105.6.22 Soravino or Olcalna X Administrative 

105.6.23 Standpipe Svstems X Administrative 

105.6.24 Tents X AdmlnlstratlVe 

106.1-106.4 COns1ructi0n X Administrative 
Docurnen1s 

107.1 Fees X Administrative 

107.5 Related Fees X AdmlnlstratlVt 

107.5.1 Cost Recovery X Administrative 

107.6 Refunds X Administrative 

107.7 Administratl\le X Administrative 
Costs 

Sactron 108 lnscections X Admfnistrative 

Section 109 Maintenance X Administrative 

111.5 Appeals X Administretlve 

112.4 Violation Penaltles X Administrative 

112.4.1 Abatement of 
Violations 

X AdminiltratiVe 

112.4.2 Cffatfons X Administnaflve 

section 113 Stop Work Order Adrrinfstrative 

113.4 Faflure to Comply X Administrative 

Pagel oft 

23-0015 D 50 of 53 



2022 CFC FINDINGS 

2022 CFC Code T& Adopted MMrtdsd Add9d Delel8d I Finding 
$et;tlOn 

Section 114 Unsafe Seructures X Administrafive 

202 Definitions X Administrative 

Seetion 302 DefinitiOns Administrative 

Sec:tlon 303 Asphalt Kettles A1, A2.A3, B1, B2.B3.84,BS,B6 

302.1 Definitions X Administrative 

Section 304 Combustible waste X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. 83. 84. 85, 86 

Section 305 Ignition Sources X A1 ,A2,A3, B1 , B2.83.B4.B5,B6 
Sedion308 Motion Picture X 81, B2. B3. 84, B5, B6 

Section 307 Open Burning X A1, A2, A3, B1.B2. 83.84, B5, 86 

307.4.4 Open Bumlng X A1 , A2,A3, B1.82.B3.84, B5,B6 

Section 308 Open Flames X A1. A2., A3, 81, 82. 83. 84, B5, B6 

Section 309 Powered Industrial X A1, A2., A3, 81, 82. 83. 84, 851 86 
Trucks 

Seetion 310 Smoking X A1, A2, A3,81, B2.B3.84,B5, 86 

SediOn 311 Vacant Premises X A1, A2,A3, 81, 82.B3.84, B5, 86 

Section 320 30 Printing X 81. 82. B3. 84, 85, 86 

Section 321 Artificial Vegetation X A1, A2., A3,B1,B2.B3.B4, B5,B6 

403.2 - 403.2.4 Group A X A1 , A2, A3, B1 , B2.B3. 84, 85, 86 

403.6 - 403.6.1.4 GrcupF X A1 , A2.A3,B1, B2. B3. 84, 85, 86 

403.9 - 403.9.3.4 Group R X A1,A2,A3, B1,B2. B3. B4, B5, 86 

503.2.1 Dimensions X A1, A2.A3, B1, 82.B3. B4,B5,B6 

503.2.5 Dead Ends X A1 , A2,A3, 81 , B2.83. 84, B5. B6 

503.2.6 Bridges X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. 84, 85, B6 

503.3.1 No Parking - Fire X A1,A2,A3,B1,B2. B3. B4,B5,B6 
Lanes 

503.3.2 No Parking - Fire X A1,A2, A3,B1,B2. B3. B4,85,B6 
Hydrants 

503.3.3 Fire Lane 'Mdth X A1,A2,A3, B1, B2. B3.84, 85, B6 

503.6 Security Gates X A1, A2. A3, B1. 82. 83. 84. B5, 86 

505.1 Address X A1,A2,A3, B1. 82. B3. 94, 85, 86 

507.5.1 VVhere Required- ){ A1,A2. A3, B1,B2 B3. B4, 85, 86 
Fire Hvdranls 

509.3 Fire Control Rooms X B1, B2.B3.84,B5, 86 

807.5.2 Groupe X 81, B2.B3.B4, 85, B6 

903.2 VVhere Required -
Fire Snrtnk.lers 

X A1, A2,A3, B1,82 B3. 84, 85,86 

903.2.1.1 GroupA X A1 , A2, A3, B1,B2.83.B4, B5, 86 

903.2.1.2 GroupA-2 X A 1, A2. Pw, B1, B2. B3. 84, B5, 86 

903.2.1.3 GroupA-3 r A1 , A2,A3,B1, B2. 83. 84, B5, B6 

903.2.1.4 GroupM X A1,A2,Pw, B1,82. S3. 84, B5, B6 

903.2.3 GroupE X A1 , A2, A3,81. B2. B3. B4, 85,B6 

903.2.4 Group F-1 X A1, A2., A3, B1, B2. 83. B4. 85, B6 

903.2.7 Group M X A1 , A2., A3, 81, B2. 83. 84,85, B6 

Page7 oft 

23-0015 D 51 of 53 



2022 CFC FfNOrNGS 

2022CFCCode Title Adopted 
Section 

Amended AdtkJd Deleted Rnding 

903.2.7.2 GroupM- X A1,A2,A3,B1,B2.B3.B4,B5,B6 
Mattresses 

903.2.8.5 Manufactured X A1 ,A2,A3,B1,82.83.84,B5,B6 
Homes 

903.2.9 GmupS-1 X A1 , A2,A3, B1 , B2. 83. B4, 85, 86 
903.2.10 GroupS.2 X A1,A2,A3,B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6 

903.2..10.1 Parking Garages X A1, A2.A3, Bf, 82. B3.B4, B5, B6 
903.2.22 Group B X A1 , A2,A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, 85, B6 
903.2.23 GroupF-2 X A1,A2,A3, B1 , B2. B3. B4, B5,B6 

903.6 \I\Jhere Required - X A1,A2,A3,B1,B2.83. B4,85, 86 
Fire S0rinkfers 

907.2 \Nhere Requirsd -
Fire Alarm Svstems 

)( A1,A2, A3,B1 , B2.B3. B4,B5,B6 

907.2.1.4 Group A X A1.A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4,85, B6 
907.2.2.3 Group B X A1,A2.A3, 81, B2. B3. B4,B5, B6 

907.2.3.11 Groupe X A1, A2, AJ, 81. B2. 83. 84, B5, 86 
907.2.4.1 Group F-1 X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2.B3.B4.B5, B6 
907.2.5.2 GroupH X A1 , A2,A3. 81, B2. 83. 84, 85, 86 
907.2.6.6 Group I X A1, A2, AJ, 81, B2. B3. B4, 85, 86 
907.2.7.2 GroupM X A1 , A2, A3,B1 , B2. B3. B4, 85, B6 
907.2.8.4 Group R-1 X A1 , A2. A.3, B1 , 82. 83. B4, 85, 86 
907.2.9.4 Group R-2. R-2.1, 

R-2.2 
X A1, A2, A3, B1, 82. 83. 84, 85, B6 

907.2.10.1 Groups X A1 ,A2, A3,81,82. B3.B4, B5, 86 
907.2.30 Type I Hoods X 91. 82.83. 84, 85, 86 
907.6.5 Monitoring X B1,B2. B3 84,B5, B6 

907.6.2.1 Secondary Power X. A1,A2, A3,B1,B2. B3.84, 85, 86 
Suruilv 

907.9 Where Required - X A1 , A2,A3, 81, B2. S3, B4. B5, BS 
Fire Alarm 

Section 1101 General X A1 ,A2, A3, 81 , B2.B3.84. B5,86 
Sectlon 1102 Definitions X A1,A2,A3, 81,82. B3. B4, B5, 86 

1103.2 Responder X. A1,A2,A3, B1,B2, 83.B4,85,B6 
Communieation 

1103.5-1103.5.5 Sprinkler Systems X A1 , A2, A3, B1, B2. 83. 84, 85, B6 
1103.7- Fire Alann Systems X A1 ,A2, A3, 81, 82. B3. B4, 85, B6 

1103.7.9.10 
1103.8 - 1103.8.5.3 Smoke Alarms X A1 , A2, AJ. 81.B2.83. B4, B5, B6 
1103.9-1103.9.1 carbon MonoxJQe X A1, A2,A3.B1,B2.B3.B4,85, B6 

Alarms 
Section 1104 Egress X 81, 82.83.84, B5, B6 
Section 1106 Outdoor Operations X A1 , A2, A3, B1,B2. B3. 84 85, 86 

1203.1.3 Installation X A1, A2, A3, B1, 82. 83. 84. 85, 86 
3311.3 Address X Af.A2,A3, B1. B2. B3. 84,B5, B6 
3313.1 When Required - X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. 84, 95, B8 

Water Sumilv 

Page8of9 

23-0015 D 52 of 53 



2022 CFC FINDINGS 

2022CFC CodfJ Tille Adopted Am#lllded Added Deleted Finding 
Section 

5001.7 
-

Liability for X Administrative 
Oamaaes 

5601.2. Permit Required X Administrative 
5704.2.9.6.1 Locations - Above X A1,A2, A3, B1, B2. 83. B4, 85,B6 

Ground Tanks 
S706.2.4.4 Locations - Above X A1 , A2, A3, 81. B2. 83. 84, 85, 86 

Ground Tanks 
5806.2 Limitations X A1 , A2, A3, 81, B2. B3. 84.B5, B6 
6104.2 Maximum Capacity X A1. A2. A3, B1, 82. B3. 84, BS, 86 

Chapter 80 Referenced 
Standards 

X A1,A2, A3, B1,B2.B3.84,BS,86 

Appendix B Fire Flow- X A1, A2. A3. s1,a2. e3. B4, es.ea 
Table 8105.1 (1) Residential 

Appendi)( 8 Flre Flow . X A1,A2, A3, B1, 82.B3.B4,B5,B6 
Table 8105.2 Commercial 

Appendix 0 F!re Apparatus X A1, KJ., A3, B1, 82 B3. 84, 85, 86 
Access Roads 

Appendix D, Access Road Width X A1, A2, A3, 81,82.83. 84, BS, 86 
D103.1 

Appendix D, Grade X A1 , A2, A3,B1 ,82. B3. B4. 85,86 
0103.2 

Appendix o, Turning Radius X A1,A2, A3,B1,B2. B3. 84,B5, B6 
0103.3 

Appendix D, Gates X A1 , A2, A3,81,82. B3. B4, B5,B6 
0103.5 

Appendix 0, Fire Lane Marking X A1,A2, A3, B1,B2. 83.B4,B5, 86 
0103.6.1 

Appendix D, Fire Lane Marking X A1,A2, A3,B1, 82. B3. B4, 85, 86 
D103.6.2 

Appendix 0, Circumferential Fire X A1,A2, A3, 81,B2. B3. 84, B5,B6 
0104.4 Access 

Page9ot9 

23-0015 D 53 of 53 




