RESOLUTION NO. 009-2023
OF THE BOARD OF SUPERVISORS OF THE COUNTY OF EL DORADO

(REPEALING RESOLUTION NO. 037-2020)

WHEREAS, the Caiifornia Code of Regulations, Title 24, Part 9, the California Fire Code, is updated by the
State every three years; and

WHEREAS, the 2022 California Fire Code became effective on January 1, 2023; and,

WHEREAS, California Health and Safety Code Sections 17958, 17958.5, 17958.7 and 18941.5 permits a
county to make such local amendments and modifications as the county determines are reasonably
necessary because of local climatic, geological or topographical conditions; and,

WHEREAS, the California Code of regulations, Health and Safety Code, Division 12, Part 2, Chapter 1,
Article 12, Section 13146, assigns responsibility for enforcement of safety regulations to the local level
and grants authority to delegate enforcement to the chief building official, or his or her authorized
representative, or the chief of the fire protection district, or his or her representative; and,

WHEREAS, the County of El Dorado desires to delegate enforcement of the Fire Code to the chief of the
fire authority, or the chief's authorized representative; and,

WHEREAS, the fire protection district and County have agreed to develop, implement and maintain a
memorandum of understanding that describes the roles and responsibilities pertaining to the inspection
of certain building standards found in the Fire Code; and,

WHEREAS, on October 20, 2022, The Board of Directors of the El Dorado County Fire Protection District
adopted Ordinance No. 2022-02, which adopted the 2022 California Fire Code with amendments the
District deemed necessary to deal with local climate, geological or topographical conditions.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that the Board of Supervisors of the County of El Dorado ratifies
Ordinance No. 2022-02 of the El Dorado County Fire Protection District and delegates the enforcement of
the ordinance to the El Dorado County Fire Protection District Chief, or his or her representative.

These changes include amendments and additions to the California Fire Code in the following sections:

101.1, 105.5, 105.5.55, 105.6, 105.6.25, 105.6.26, 107.5, 107.5.1, 107.7, 111.5, 112.4, 112.4.2,
113.4, 202, 302.1, 307.4.4, 401.2.1, 503.2.1, 503.2.5, 503.2.6, 503.3.1, 503.3.2, 503.3.3, 503.6,
505.1, 507.5.1, 509.3, 510.4.2.3, 903.2, 903.2.1.1, 903.2.1.2, 903.2.1.3,903.2.1.4, 903.2.3, 903.2.4,
903.2.7, 903.2.7.2, 903.2.8.5, 903.2.9, 503.2.10, 903.2.10.1, 903.2.22, 903.2.23, 903.6, 907.2,
907.2.1.4, 907.2.2.3, 907.2.3.11, 907.24.1, 907.2.5.2, 507.2.6.6, 907.2.7.2, 507.2.3.4, 907.2.9.4,

23-0015 E 1 0of 43



907.2.10.1, 907.2.30, 907.6.5, 907.6.2.1, 907.9, 1203.1.3, 3311.3, 3313.1, 5001.7, 5601.2,
5704.2.9.6.1, 5706.2.4.4, 5806.2, 6104.2, Chapter 80 NFPA 1-22 Section 22.3, Chapter 80 NFPA 1-
22 Section 22.10, Chapter 80 NFPA 13D-22: Sections 4.6, 5.1.1.2, 7.6, 11.2.1.1, Appendix B: Table
B10S.1(1}, Appendix B: Table B105.2, Appendix D Sections D103.1 through D103.3, Appendix D
103.5, Appendix D 103.6.1, Appendix D103.6.2, Appendix D104.4

El Dorado County Fire Protection District adopts the 2022 California Fire Code, Title 24, Part 9, in its
entirety, including Appendices, incorporating those sections of the International Fire Code, 2021 edition
not adopted by the state, with the exclusions listed below:

103, 309, 311.5, 311.6, 318, 403.3, 403.5, 403.8, 403.10, 403.11, 404, 406, 903.3.1.2, 904.1.1,
1103.1, 1103.3-1103.4, 1103.6, 1105, Chapter 26, D104.2 {exception only), D106.1 (exception only),
D107.1 (Exceptions only), Appendix A, Appendix G, Appendix J, Appendix K, Appendix L, Appendix
M, Appendix N, Appendix O.

Appendices not adopted can be used for reference in enforcing other sections of the 2022 California Fire
Code.

PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of Supervisors of the County of El Dorado at a regular meeting of
said BOARD, held the 3 day of January, 2023, by the following vote of said Board

Ayes: Thomas, Hidahl, Turnboo, Parlin, Laine
Attest: Noes: None
Kim Dawson Absent: None

Clerk of the Board of Supervisors

By: 2 —Zendy Tpndf—

Deputy Cl Chair, Bohrd of Supervisors
Wendy Thomas

23-0015E 2 of 43



“We are dedicated to providing a professional and
courteous service to our citizens and communitics with

Pride, Trust & Integrity.”

November 23, 2022

Don Ashton, Chief Administeative Officer
El1 Dorado County Board of Supervisors
330 Fair Lane

Placerville, CA 95667

Subject: Reselution Ratifying Ordinance No. 2022-02 of the El Dorado County Fire
Protection District, which adopts the 2022 California Fire Code with
amendments related to local climatic, geographic and topographic conditions.

Dear Mr. Ashion:

The El Dorade County Fire Protection District {(ECF) is requesting the Board of Supervisors
(BOS) ratify its Ordinance No. 2022-02, which adopts the 2022 California Fire Code as amended
due to specific local climatic, geographic and topographic conditions. California Health and
Safety Code Section 13869.7 requires the legislative body of the city or county where the
ordinance will apply to ratify, modify or deny the adopted ordinance. The BOS must also
delegate enforcement of the ordinance to either the Fire District (or its representative} or the

Chief Building Official.

Therefore, we request the County Board of Supervisors ratify Ordinance No. 2022-02 with
amendments to the 2022 California Fire Code, and delepate the enforcement of that Ordinance to
the El Dorado County Fire Protection District Chief. A proposed BOS resolution is enclosed for

your review and use on this topic.

This resolution has no direct fiscal impact to the County.

Sincerely,

Braden Stirling
Fire Marshal

ATTACHMENTS:
1. El Dorado County Fire Protection District Ordinance No. 2022-02

2. El Dorado County Fire Protection District Finding of Fact Resolution No, 2022-08

Ef Dorade County Fire Protection District « 404¢ Carson Road / PO Box 807 « Caming, CA 95709
530-644-9630 = 530-644-9636 (fax)

23-0015 E 3 of 43



Attachment No. 1

El Dorado County Fire Protection District

Ordinance No. 2022-02

23-0015 E 4 of 43



EL DORAPO COUNTY FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT
ORDINANCE NO. 2022-02

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS COF THE EL DORADO
COUNTY FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT AS FOLLOWS:

An ordinance of the El Dorado County Fire Protection District (ECFPD) adopting the 2022
Edition of the California Fire Code, incorporating the 2021 Edition of the Infernational Fire Code,
regulating and governing the safeguarding of life and property from fire and explosion hazards
arising from the storage, handling and use of hazardous substances, materials and devices, and
from conditions hazardous to life or property in the occupancy of buildings and premises in the
ECFPD; providing for the issuance of permits and collection of fees therefor; Repealing Ordinance
No. 2019-02 of the ECFPD and all other ordinances and parts of the ordinances in confiict

therewith.
Be it ORDAINED by the Board of Directors of the ECFPD, also known as the El Dorado

County Fire Protection District:

Section 1: FINDINGS OF FACTS
Section 2;: ADOPTION OF CODE WITH EXCLUSIONS

Section 3: LOCAL AMENDMENTS

Section 4: CONFLICT

Section 5: SEVERABILITY

Section 6: EFFECTIVE DATE AND PUBLICATION

SECTION 1: FINDINGS OF FACTS
The ECFPD makes certain changes (listed below) to the California Fire Code, 2022

Edition, pursuant to Health & Safety Code Sections 13869.7, 17958.5, 17958.7 and 18941.5
during this code adoption process. Such changes are necessary because of local climatic,
geological and/or topographical conditions. The ECFPD has adopted, pursuant to Section
18941.5 of the California Health & Safety Code, the findings of facts relative to these conditions
by Resolution #2022-08 of the ECFPD dated October 20, 2022.

Page 1

Ordinance 2022-02
23-0015E 50f43



SECTION 2: ADOPTION OF CODE WITH EXCLUSIONS
The ECFPD adopts the 2022 California Fire Code, Title 24, Part 9, in_its_entirety,

including Appendices, incorporating those sections of the infernational Fire Code, 2021 edition

not adopted by the state, with the exclusions listed below:

Exclusions: 103, 309, 311.5, 311.6, 318, 403.3, 403.5, 403.8, 403.10, 403.11, 404, 400,
803.3.1.2, 904.1.1, 1103.1, 1103.3-1103.4, 1103.6, 1105, Chapter 26, D104.2 (Exception only),
D106.1 (Exception only), D107.1 (Exceptions only), Appendix A, Appendix G, Appendix J,

Appendix K, Appendix L, Appendix M, Appendix N, Appendix O.
Appendices not adopted can be used for reference in enforcing other sections of the 2022

California Fire Code.

SECTION 3: AMENDMENTS TO THE 2022 CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE
The following Sections are hereby amended or added:

Chapter 1
SECTION 101.1 “TITLE" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 101.1 TITLE. These regulations shall be known as the Fire Code of ECFFD, hereinafter
referred to as “this code”.

SECTION 105.5 “REQUIRED OPERATIONAL PERMITS” S AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 105.5 Required operational permits. The fire code official is authorized to issue
operational permits for the operations set forth in Sections 105.5.2 through 105.5.525.

SECTION 105.5.55 “AUTOMOBILE WRECKING YARDS’ IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 105.5.55 Automobile wrecking yards. An operational permit is required for the
operation of automobile wrecking yards.

SECTION 105.6 “REQUIRED CONSTRUCTION PERMITS" IS AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 105.6 required construction permits. The fire code official is authorized fo issue
construction permits for work as set forth in sections 105.6.1 through 105.6.246,

SECTION 105.6.25 “AUTOMOBILE WRECKING YARDS" IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 105.6.25 Automobile wrecking yards. Construction permits are required for the
installation of or modification to automobile wrecking yards.

Page 2

Ordinance 2022-02
23-0015 E6 of 43



SECTION 105.6.26 “TRAFFIC CALMING DEVICES” IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

105.6.26 Traffic calming devices. Construction permits are required for the installation or
modification of traffic calming devices.

SECTION 107.5 “PERMIT, PLAN REVIEW AND INSPECTION FEES” SHALL BE ADDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 107.5 Permit. A schedule of fees adopted by the district board of directors for plan
review, inspections and the issuance of parmits by the districf may be found in the most current

district fee schedufe (Health & Safety Code 17951).
SECTION 107.5.1 “COST RECOVERY FEES” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 107.5.1 Cost Recovery Fees. Fire service fees may be charged to any person, firm,
corporation or busingss that through negligence, violation of the law, or as a resuft of
carelessness, is responsible for the cause of the district fo respond to the scene of an incident.
A district board may charge a fee to cover the cost of any setvice which the district provides
or the cost of enforcing any reguiation for which the fee is charged (Health & Safely Code
13916). The fee shall not exceed the actual cost of suppressing the fire and/or responding to

the scene of an incident.
SECTION 107.7 “ADMINISTRATIVE COSTS” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 107.7 Administrative Costs. When a fest or inspection is scheduled, and the
contractor fails to perform to the satisfaction of the authority having junisdiction (AHJ), the AHJ
may bill the contractor for actual time spent traveling to and from the test/inspection location
and the time spent at the test/inspection site as well as administrative costs.

SECTION 111.5 “APPEAL PROCEDURES AND TIMELINES” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 111.5 Appeal Procedures and Timelines. Any person or entity who befieves they
may be adversely affected by an order, decision, or determination made by the fire code official
through a written notice may appeal this matter within 15 calendar days of the postmark on the
notice. All such appeals shall be filed in writing with the Secretary of the Goveming Board for
the district. A timely appeat shalf stay further action by the fire code official untif the matter is
determined by the Appeal Board as ouilined in Section 109.2, unless the issue poses an
imminent fire or iife safsty hazard to members of the public. The fire code official shall notify
the appelfant by certified mail of the date and time of such hearing. The hearing shall be
scheduled fo take place no sooner than 20 calendar days from the dafe shown on the cerlified
mail. The appellant shall have the right fo appear in person or by agent at the hearing and
present oral, writlen and/or photographic evidence fo the Appeai Board.

SECTION 112.4 “VIOLATION PENALTIES” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 112.4 Violation Penalties. Persons who shall violate a provision of this code or shall
fail to comply with any of the requirements thereof ar who shall erect, install, alter, repair or do
work in violation of the approved construction documents or directive of the fire code official,
or of a permit of certificate used under provisions of this code, shall be guilty of a misdemearior

Page 3

Ordinance 2022-02
23-0015 E 7 of 43



or infraction, af the discretion of the prosecuting attorey or agency, punishable by a fine not
more than $7100.00 for a first violation; A fine not exceeding $500.00 for a second violation of
the same provision within one year; A fine not exceeding $1000.00 for each additionaf violation
of the same provision within one year, or by imprisonment not exceeding 180 days, or both
such fine and imprisonment. Each day that a violation continues after due notice has been
served shall be deemed a separate offense. (Health & Safety Code Sections 13145 and

17995).

SECTION 112.4.2 “CITATIONS” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:
Section 112.4.2 Citations. The Fire Chief, or his/her duly authorized representative, may
issue citations for infractions or misdemeanor violations of this code pursuant lo Section 13871

of the Health & Safety Code of the State of California and Chapter 5c (commencing with
Section 853.6) of Title 3 of Part 2 of the Penal Code of the State of Califomia.

SECTION 113.4 “*FAILURE TO COMPLY” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:
Section 113.4 Failure to Comply. Any person who shall continue any work after having been

served with a stop work order, except such work as that person is directed to perform to remove
a violation or unsafe condition, shall be punishable by a fine or imprisonment or both as

described in Section 112.4 (Health & Safety Code Sections 13145 and 179995).

Chapter 2
SECTION 202 “CAMPFIRE" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

CAMPFIRE. A fire which is used for cooking, personal warmth, lighting, or aesthelic purposes.

SECTION 202 “DISTRICT” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

DISTRICT. The disirict and all other arcas within the exterior boundaries thereof now or
hereafier established.

SECTION 202 “DRIVEWAY” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

DRIVEWAY. A vehicutar access that serves up to two (2) parcels with no more than two (2)
residential units and any number of non-commercial or industrial buildings on each parcel.

SECTION 202 “EXECUTIVE BODY” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

EXECUTIVE BODY. The Board of Directors of the Dislrict.
SECTION 202 “FIRE CHIEF® SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

FIRE CHIEF. The Chief Executive Fire Officer of the Fire department/district serving the
junsdiction or a duly authotized representative.

SECTION 202 “FIRE HAZARD” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Ordinance 2032-02 Page 4
23-0015E 8 of 43



FIRE HAZARD. Any condition, arrangement, or act which will increase, or may cause an
increase of, the hazard or menace of fire to a greater than customanily recognized as normaf
by-persons in the public service of preventing, suppressing or extinguishing fire; or which may
obstruct, delay, or hinder, or may become the cause of obstruction, defay or hinderance fo the

prevention, suppression, or extinguishment of fire.
SECTION 202 “OPEN BURNING” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

OPEN BURNING. The buming of materials wherein products of combustion are emitted directly
into the ambient air without passing through a stack or chimney from an enclosed chamber. Open
burning does not include road flares, smudge-pots and similar devices associated with safety or
occupational uses typically considered open flames- For the purpose of this definition, 2 chamber
shall be regarded as enclosed when, during the time combustion occurs, only apertures, ducts,
stacks, flues or chimneys necessary to provide combustion air and permit the escape of exhaust

gas are open.

Open burning shall aiso include campfires, bonfires, portable outdoor fireplaces, ceremonial
fires, and recreational fire as defined in the Fire Code.

Exception:
1. UL or ASMI fisted LPG or natural gas outdoor flame devices, such as gas BBQ's or gas
fire pits that comply with the Fire Code.
2. Far one-or two-family dwellings, fixed or portable outdoor flame devices that meet the
following:
a. Devices shall comply with the Fire Code.
. Devices shalt be used per manufacturer’s specifications.
Minimum 10-foot clearance from device fo all lammable material and vegetation.
No buirning shall be conducted during high or extreme fire weather conditions (e.g.,
Nationatl Weather Service Red Flag Wamnings).
3. Campfires on private lands. Where required by the fire code official, a peimit shall be
issued by the fire code official.
4. Ceremonial and/for religious buming with the following safely measures:

b
c.
d.

a. Maximum 4-foot x 4-foot bum area.
b. Minimum 10-foot clearance from edge of burn area fo all flammable material and

vegetation.
An approved water supply is located within 500-feet of the bum area.

The bum area is located no less than 30-feet from adjoining propenrly fines.
An adult is present with a shovel until the fire is extinguished.

No burning shalt be conducted duting high or extreme fire weather conditions {e.g.,
National Weather Service Red Flag Wamings).

En I - B

SECTION 202 “TRAINED CROWD MANAGER" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Page 5

Ordinance 2022-02
23-0015 E 9 0of 43



TRAINED CROWD MANAGER. Standby personnel, usually a security guard or usher
personnel, who are trained in the proper procedure to exit people from a tent or other place of

public assemblage in an ordery and calm fashion in the event of an emergency

Chapter 3

SECTION 302.1 "DEFINITIONS” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:
3D PRINTER.

ADDITIVE MANUFACTURING.

BONFIRE.

CAMPFIRE.

HI-BOY.
HIGH-VOLTAGE TRANSMISSION LINE.

OPEN BURNING.

PORTABLE QUTDOOR FIREPLAGE.
POWERED INDUSTRIAL TRUCK.
RECREATIONAL FIRE.

SKY LATTERN.

SECTION 307.4.4 “OPEN BURNING RESTRICTIONS" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 307.4.4 Open Burning Restrictions. Open buming on aff lands within the jurisdiction of
the El Dorado County Fire Protection District (ECFPD), inciuding the Local Response Area (LRA),
is prohibited when the California Department of Forestry and Fire Protection (Cal Fire) issues a
bumn suspension in the Stafe Responsibility Area (SRA). This prohibition shall be made effective

24-hours following its commencement in the SRA.

Open bumning is aiso prohibited on all lands within the jurisdiction of ECFPD at any time the fire
code official that atmosphetic conditions or other focal circumstances make stch fires hazardous,
including factors such as high winds, low fuel moisture, fire weather, the issuance of red flag
warmings, severe threat of witdfand fire, or present risk of destruction by wildfire to life, wildiife,

property, or natural resources.

Chapter 4
SECTION 401.2.1 “PRE-FIRE PLANS" IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 401.2.1 Pre-fire plans. Where required by the fire code official, a pre-fire pian shalf
be provided and approved by the fire code official for aif new commercial structures.

Chapter 5
SECTION 503.2.1 "DIMENSIONS” SHALL. BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 503.2.1 Dimensions. Fire apparatus access roads shall have an unobstructed width
of not less than 20 feet (6096 mm), exclusive of shoulders, as measured from face of curb fo

face of curb, except for approved security gates in accordance with Section 503.6, and an

PageB

Ordinance 2022-02
23-0015 E 10 of 43



unobstructed vertical clearance of not less than 15 feet. Driveways shall have an unobsiructed
width of nof less than 12 feet wide.

SECTION 503.2.5 “DEAD ENDS"” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Sectien 503.2.5 Dead Ends. Dead-end fire apparatus access roads and driveways in excess
of 160 feet (45,720 mm) in length shall be provided with an approved area for turning around

fire apparatus.

SECTION 503.2.6 "“BRIDGES AND ELEVATED SURFACES” SHALL BE AMENDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 503.2.6 Bridges and Elevated Surfaces. Where a bridge or an elevated surface is
part of a fire apparatus access road, the bridge shall be constructed and maintained in
accordance with AASHTO HB-17, the current El Dorado County Transporiation Division Bridge
Standard or Appendix D of the current California Fire Code, whichever is more restnclive.
Bridges and elevated surfaces shall be designed for a live load sufficient to carry the imposed
loads of fire apparatus. Vehicle load limits shall be posted at both enfrances to bridges when
required by the fire code official, Where elevated surfaces designed for emergency vehicle use
are adjacent to surfaces that are not designed for such use, approved barriers, approved signs
or both shall be installed and maintained where required by the fire code officlal.

SECTION 503.3.1 "NO PARKING IN FIRE LANES” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 503.3.1 No Parking In Fire Lanes. No person shall stop, park, or leave standing any
vehicle, whether atfended or unatfended, except when nocessary {c avoid confiict with other
traffic or in compliance with the directions of the Fire Chief, or his/her duly authorized
representative, Peace Officer or official traffic confrof device afong the edge of any highway,
at any curb, or in any location int a publicly or privately owned or operated off-streef parking
facility, designated as a fire fane by the disirict with jurisdiction over the area in which the place
is located. The designalion shall be indicated (1) by a sign posted immediately adjacent fo,
and visible from, the designated place clearly stating in letfers not less than one inch in height
that the place is a fire lane, (2} by outlining or painting the place in red and, in contrasting color,
marking the place with the words “FIRE LANE”, which are clearly visible from a vehicle, or (3)
by a red curb or red paint on the edge of the roadway upon which is clearly marked the words

FIRE LANE’.

SECTION 503.3.2 “NO PARKING IN FRONT OF HYDRANTS" SHALL BE ADDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 503.3.2 No Parking in Front of Hydrants. No person shall stop, park, or leave
standing any vehicle within 15 feet of a fire hydrant except as follows: (a} If the vehicle is
aftended by a licensed driver who is seated in the front seaf and who can immediately move
such vehicle in case of necessity, (b) If the vehicle is owned or operaled by a fire department

and is clearfy marked as a fire depariment vehicle.
SECTION 503.3.3 "FIRE LANES BASED ON ROAD WIDTH" SHALL BE ADDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Page 7

Ordinance 2022-02
23-0015 E 11 0of 43



Section 503.3.3 Fire Lanes Based on Road Width. Fire lanes shalf be based on road width
as required in Appendix D as amended by the district.

SECTION 503.6 "SECURITY GATES" IS AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 503.6 Security Gates. The installation of security gates across a fire apparatus
access road shall be approved by the fire code official and shall comply with the District gate
sfandard. Where security gates are installed, they shall have an approved means of
emergency operation. The security gates and the emergency operation shall be maintained
operational at all times. Electric gate operators, where provided, shall be listed in accordance
with UL 325. Gates intended for auiomatic operation shall be deSIgned constructed, and

installed to comply with the requirements of ASTM F2200.
SECTION 505.1 "ADDRESS IDENTIFICATION” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 505.1 Address Identification. Addresses for new and existing buiidings shall comply
with the District address standard as approved by the fire code official. The address
identification shall be legible and placed in a position that is visible from the street or road fronting
the property. Address Identification characters shall contrast with their background. Address
numbers shall be Arabic nhumbers or alphabetical letters. Numbers shall not be spelled out. Each
character shall be not less than 4 inches (102 mm) high with a minimum stroke width of /2 inch
(12.7 mm). Where required by the fire code official, address identification shall be provided in
additional approved locations to facilitate emergency response. access is by means of a private
road and the building cannot be viewed from the public way, a monument, pole or other sign or
means shall be used to identify the structure. Address identification shall be maintained.

SECTION 507.5.1 “WHERE REQUIRED” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 507.5.1 Where Required. Where a portion of the faciiity or building hereafter
constructed or moved into or within the jurisdiction is more than 150 feet from a hydrant on a fire
apparatus access road, as measured by an approved route around the exterior of the facility or
building, on-site fire hydrants and mains capable of supplying the required fire flow shall be

provided where required by the fire code official.

Exceptions:
1. For Group R-3 and Group U occupancies, the distance requirement shail be 600 feet

(183 m).
SECTION 509.3 “FIRE CONTROL ROOM® SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 509.3 Fire Control Room. Fire sprnkfer nisers, fire alarm conirol panels, solar
pholovoltaic power system rapid shutoff switches, and other fire defection, suppression or
sirifar control elements shali be located inside a single fire control room for the building. The
fire controf room shafl have minimum dimensions of five feet by seven feet in size with a total
usable area of not Jess than 35 square feet. The room shalf be located within the building on
an outside wall af a location approved by the Fire Code Official and shall be accessible from
the exterior. An exterior access door with a clear width of not less than 32 inches and height
of not less than 80 inches shall be provided for access info the room. A durable sign shaif be
affixed to the exterior of the door with the words “FIRE CONTROL ROOM’ in letters not fess

Ordinance 2022-02 Pags 8
23-0015 E 12 of 43



than 4 inches in height. A key box complying with Section 506 shall be instafled on the exterior
side of the fire controf room door opening.

The room must be capable of maintaining a minimum temperature of 40 degrees Fahrenheil.
A ciearance of 12 inches shall be provided from the fire sprinkier risers fo any adjacent walls.
This room can be a shared with other building utifities or fire profection equipment that is not
incompatible. An approved cabinet or container shall be provided to store record pians of the
fire sprninkler system and other fire protection equipment. This room shalf not be used for any

other storage.
Exception: One-and two-family dwellings, manufactured homes or similar uses defined
as either a Group R-3, R3.1, or R-4 occupancy.

SECTION 510.4.2.3 “STANDBY POWER" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 510.4.2.3 Standby power. In-building, two-way emergency responder
communication radio coverage systems shall be provided with dedicated standby batteries or
provided with 2-hour standby batteries and connected to the facilify generator power system

in accordance with Section 1203. The standby power supply shall be capable of operafing the
in-building, two-way emergency responder communication coverage system at 100-percent

system capacity for a duration of not less than 72 hours,

Chapter 9
SECTION 903.2 “WHERE REQUIRED” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 903.2 Where Required. Approved automatic sprinkler systems /n new buildings and
structures when constructed or relocated within the junsdiction shalf be provided in the
focations described in Sections 903.2.1 through 903.2.12 and Sections 903.2.14 through

903.2.23.
Exception: Agricuffural buildings nof under a special use permit used for commercial

purposes.
SECTION 9803.2.1.1 “GROUP A-1" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 903.2.1.1 Group A. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout stories
containing Group A-1 occupancies and throughout all stories from the Group A-1 occupancy to
and including the levels of exit discharge serving that occupancy where one of the following

conditions exists:
1. The fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet.
2. The fire area has an occupant load of 300 or more.
3. The fire area is located on 2 floor other than a leve! of exit discharge serving such
occupancies.
4. The fire area contains a multi-theater complex

SECTION 903.2.1.2 "GROUP A-2" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 903.2.1.2 Group A-2. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout
stories containing Group A-2 occupancies and throughout all stories from the Group A-2

Ordinance 202242 Page Q@

23-0015 E 13 of 43



occupancy to and including the levels of exit discharge serving that occupancy where one of the
following conditions exists:
1. The fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet;
2. The fire area has an occupant load of 100 or more.
3. The fire area is located on a floor other than a level of exit discharge serving such
occupancies.

4. The structure exceeds 3,600 square feet, contains more than one fire area containing a
Group A-2 occupancy, and is separated into two or more buildings by fire walls of less than

4-hour fire-resistance rating without openings.

SECTION 903.2.1.3 “GROUP A-3" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 903.2.1.3 Group A-3. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout
stories containing Group A-3 occupancies and throughout all stories from the Group A-3
occupancy to and including the levels of exit discharge serving that occupancy where one of the

following conditions exists:
1. The fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet.
2. The fire area has an occupant load of 300 or more.
3. The fire area is located on a floor other than a level of exit discharge setving such

occupancies.

4. The structure exceeds 3,600 square feet, contains more than one fire area containing
exhibition and display rooms, and is separated into two or more buildings by fire walls of

less than 4-hour fire-resistance rating without openings.
SECTION 903.2.1.4 “GROUP A-4" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 903.2.1.4 Group A-4. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout
stories containing Group A-4 occupancies and throughout all stories from the Group A-4
occupancy to and including the levels of exit discharge serving that occupancy where one of the

following conditions exists:
1. The fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet.
2. The fire area has an occupant load of 300 or more.
3. The fire area is located on a floor other than a leve! of exit discharge serving such
occuparncies.

SECTION 903.2.3 “GROUP E” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 903.2.3 Group E. An automatic sprinkier system shall be provided for Group E
occupancies as follows:
1. Throughout all Group E fire areas greater than 3,600 square feet in area,
2. The Group E fire area is located on a floor other than a level of exit discharge serving such
occupancies.

Page 10

Ordinance 2022-02
23-0015 E 14 of 43



Exception: In buildings where every classroom has not fewer than one exterior exit
door at ground level, an automatic sprinkler system is not required in any
area below the lowest level of exit discharge serving that area.

3. The Group E fire area has an occupant load of 300 or more.

4. In rooms or areas with special hazards such as laborafories, vocational shops and other
such areas where hazardous materials in quantities not exceeding the maximum allowable

quantity are used or stored.

5. Throughout any Group E structure greater than 3,600 square feet in area, which contains
more than one fire area, and which is separated into two or more buildings by fire walls of

less than 4-hour fire resistance rating without openings.
6. For public school state funded construction projects see Section 903.2.19.
7. For public school campuses, Kindergarten through 12" grade, see Section 903.2.20

SECTION 903.2.4 "GROUP F-1" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 903.2.4 Group F-1. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout all
buildings containing a Group F-1 occupancy where one of the following conditions exists:
1. A Group F-1 fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet.
2. A Group F-1 fire area Is located more than three stories above grade plane.
3. The combined area of all Group F-1 fire areas on alf floors, including any mezzanines,
exceeds 3,600 square feet.

SECTION 903.2.7 “GROUP M” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 803.2.7 Group M. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout buildings
containing a Group M occupancy where one of the following conditions exists:

1. A Group M fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet,

2. A Group M fire area is located more than three stoties above grade plane.

3. The combined area of all Group M fire areas on ali floors, including any mezzanines,

exceeds 3,600 square feet.

5. The structure exceeds 3,600 square feet, contains more than one fire area containing a
Group M occupancy, and is separated into two or more buildings by fire wails of less than

4-hour fire resistance rating without openings.
SECTION 903.2.7.2 “GROUP M UPHOLSTERED FURNITURE OR MATTRESSES" SHALL
BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 903.2.7.2 Group M Upholstered Furniture or Mattresses. An automatic sprinkler
system shall be provided throughout a Group M fire area where the area used for the display
and sale of upholstered furniture or matiresses exceeds 3,600 square feet.

SECTION 903.2 8.5 “MANUFACTURED HOMES" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Page 11

Ordinance 2022-02
23-0015 E 15 0f 43



Section 903.2.5.2 Manufactured Homes. An automatic fire sprinkler system shail be required
in all new manufactured homes and multi-family manufactured homes intended for use as a
one-and lwo-family dwelling. The design and installation of such systems shalf be in

accordance with California Code of Regulations, Title 25, §4300.

Exceptions:
1. Manufactured homes Ilocated within an existing mobile home park complying with
California Health and Safety Cods, Division 13, Part 2.1 or 2.3.

2. Manufactured homes that do not exceed 1,200 square feet in size and serve as an
accessory dwelling unit, as defined in Government Code Section 658502; when the
existing primary residence on the propeity is not required to comply with Califomnia
Residential Code Section R313.2.

3. Manufactured homes that do not exceed 320 square feet in size.
SECTION 803.2.2 “GROUP 8-1" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 903.2.9 Group S-1. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout ali
buildings containing a Group S-1 occupancy where one of the following conditions exists:

1. A Group S-1 fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet.

2. A Group S-1 fire area is located more than three stories above grade plane.

3. The combined area of all Group S-1 fire areas on all floors, including any mezzanines,
exceeds 3,600 square feet.

4. A Group S-1 fire area used for the storage of commercial motor vehicles where the fire
area exceeds 3,600 square feet.

SECTION 803.2.10 “GROUP 8-2" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 803.2,10 Group S-2. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout
buildings classified as parking garages where any of the following conditions exist:

1. Where the fire area of the enclosed parking garage, in accordance with Section 406.6 of
the California Building Code, exceeds 3,600 square feet.

2. Where the enclosed parking garage, in accordance with Section 406.6 of the California
Building Code, is located beneath other groups.
Exception: Enclosed parking garages located beneath Group R-3 occupancies.

3. Where the fire area of the open parking garage, in accordance with Section 406.5 of the
California Building Code, exceeds 3,600 square feet.

SECTION $03.2.10.1 "COMMERCIAL PARKING GARAGES" SHALL BE AMENDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 903.2.10.1 Commercial Parking Garages. An automatic sprinkler system shall be
provided throughout buildings used for storage of commercial motor vehicles where the fire area
exceeds 3,600 square feet.

Page 12

Ordinance 202202
23-0015 E 16 of 43



SECTION 903.2.22 “GROUP B” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 903.2.22 Group B. An aufomatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout alf
buildings containing Group B occupancies where the fire area exceeds 3,600 square feel.

SECTION 903.2.23 “GROUP F-2" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 903.2.23 Group F-2. An automatic sprinkler system shail be provided throughout alf
buiidings containing Group F-2 occupancies where the fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet.

SECTION 903.6 “WHERE REQUIRED IN EXISTING BUILDINGS AND STRUCTURES" IS

AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 903.6 Where Required In Existing Buildings and Structures. An automatic
sprinkler system shali be provided in existing buildings and structures where required in
Chapter 11 and as folfows:

1. When there is & change in occupancy classification that results in an increased life safety
or fire risk, as determined by the fire code official, and the structure exceeds 3,600 square
feet, an automatic fire sprinkier system shall be installed throughout the building.

2. Inexisting buildings 3,600 square feef or greater, other than one and two-family dwelling
units, and agricultural buildings not under special use permit for commercial purposes,
where the floor area of the building or structure is increased, such building or structure

shall be made to conform to Section 903.2.
Exception: When the building increase is less than 500 square feet.

3. in existing buildings 3,600 square feet or less, other than one-and two-family dwelling
units, and agricuttural buildings not under special use permit for commercial purposes,
where the floor area of the building or structure is increased to a folal square footage
over 3,600 square feet, such building or structure shall be made to conform to Section
8903.2.

Exception: When the building increase is less than 500 square feet.

SECTION 907.2. "“WHERE REQUIRED — NEW BUILDINGS AND STRUCTURES® SHALL BE
AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 907.2. Where Required — New Buildings and Structures. An approved fire alarm
system installed in accordance with the provisions of this code and NFPA 72 shall be provided
in new buildings and structures in accordance with Sections 907.2.1 through 907.2.30 and
provide occupant notification in accordance with Section 907.5, unless other requirements are

provided by another section of this code.

Not fewer than one manual fire alarm box shall be provided in an approved location to initiate
a fire alarm signal for fire alarm systems employing automatic fire detectors or waterflow
detection devices. Where other sections of this code allow elimination of fire alarm boxes due
to sprinklers or automatic fire alarm systems, a single fire alarm box shall be installed at a

location approved by the enforcing agency.
Exceptions:

Page 13

Ordinance 2022-02
23-0015 E 17 of 43



1. The manual fire alarm box is not required for fire alarm control units systems
dedicated to elevaior recall control, supervisory service and fire sprinkler
monitoring.

2. The manual fire alarm box is not required for Group R-2 cccupancies unless
required by the fire code official to provide a means for fire waich personnel to
initiate an alarm during a sprinkler system, impairment event. Where provided, the
manual fire alarm box shall not be located in an area that is open to the public.

3. The manual fire alarm box is not required te be installed when approved by the fire

code official.

4. A fire alarm system is not required in one and two-family dwelfings, agricuttural
buildings, and other occupancies classified as Group U not under special use
permit and/or not used for commercial purposes (e.g. retail sales, food service,

andfor special events).

5. Buildings with a floor area less than 500 square feet may be exempt, as defermined
by the fire code official based on building construction malerial and features,
focafion, occupancy type, and distance {o exposures.

SECTION 9807.2.1.4 “GROUP A UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET” SHALL BE ADDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 907.2.1.4 Group A Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire aiarm system shalf
be installed in all group A buildings with a floor area fess than 3,600 square feel.

SECTION 907.2.2.3 “GROUP B UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET" SHALL BE ADDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 907.2.2.3 Group B Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shall
be installed in all group B buildings with a ficor area less than 3,600 square feet.

SECTION 907.2.3.11 “GROUP E UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET” SHALL BE ADDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 907.2.3.11 Group E Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shalf
be installed in all group E buildings with a floor area less than 3,600 sguare feel.

SECTION 907.2.4.1 "GROUP F UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET" SHALL BE ADDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section §07.2.4.1 Group F Under 3,600 Square Feel. An approved fire alarm system shall
be instalfed in alf group F buildings with a floor area less than 3,600 square feel.

SECTION 907.2.5.2 “GROUP H UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET" SHALL BE ADDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 907.2.5.2 Group H Under 3,600 Square Feel. An approved fire alarm system shall
be instafled in afl group H buildings with a fioor area less than 3,600 square feet.

Paca 14

Ordinance 202202
23-0015E 18 of 43



SECTION §07.2.6.6 “GROUP | UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET" SHALL BE ADDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 907.2.6.6 Group | Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shall be
instalfed in all group I buildings with a floor area less than 3,600 square feet.

SECTION 807.2.7.2 "GROUP M UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET” SHALL BE ADDED AS
FOLLOWS;

Section 907.2.7.2 Group M Under 3,600 Square Feel. An approved fire alarm system shall
be installed in all group M buildings with a floor area less than 3,600 square fest.

SECTION 807.2.8.4 “GROUP R-1 UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET” SHALL BE ADDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 907.2.8.4 Group R-1 Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shall
be installed in all group R-1 buildings with a floor area less than 3,600 square feet.
SECTION 807.2.9.4 “GROUP R-2, R-2.1, R-2.2 UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET" SHALL BE
ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 907.2.9.4 Group R-2, R-2.1, R-2.2 Under 3,600 Square Feel. An approved fire alarm
system shall be instaifed in all group R-2, R-2.1, R-2.2 buildings with a floor area less than

3,600 square feel.
SECTION 807.2.10.1 “GROUP S UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET” SHALL BE ADDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 807.2.10.1 Group S Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shall
be instalied in all group S buildings with a floor area less than 3,600 square feel.

807.2.30 “TYPE | HOOD INSTALLATIONS” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

907.2.30 “Type ! Hood Installations. The requirement of instalfation, or replacement, of a
Type I Hood System shall require a fire alarm/sprinkler monitoring system to be installed, or
for the hood system fo be connected to an existing fire alarm/sprinkler monitoring System for

that building.
807.6.5 “MONITORING" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

907.6.5 Monitoring. Fire alarm systems required by this chapter or by the California Building
Code shall be monitored by an approved, UL certified, Type A Fulf Service central, proprietary
or remote station service, which gives audible and visual signals at a constantly aftended

focation. Alf sprinklered buildings shail be monitored.
Excepftions:
1. One- and two-family dwellings (R-3 Occupancies and other occupancies classified
as “tr).

Ordinance 2022402 Page 15
23-0015 E 19 of 43



2. Agricuitural buildings not under special use permit and/or not used for commercial
purposes (e.g., relaifs sales, food service, and/or special evenis).

SECTION 807.6.2.1 "SECONDARY POWER SUPPLY” SHALL BE ADDED AS FCLLOWS:

SECTION %907.6.2.1 SECONDARY POWER SUPPLY. Where required by the fire code official,
in accordance with NFPA 72, the secondary power supply providing a minimum 24-hour power
capacily under guiescent load (system operating in a non-alarm condition} shafl be amended

to a minimum 72-hour power capacity.
Exception: The existence of an emergency back-up power supply that meets orexceed
the requirements of California Fire Code Chapter 12.

SECTION 807.9 “"WHERE REQURIED IN EXISTING BUILDINGS” SHALL BE AMENDED AS
FOLLOWS:

SECTION 907.9 Where Required. An approved fire alarm system shall be provided in existing
buildings and structures where required in Chapter 11 and in existing buildings with a floor
area less than 3,600 square feet without an approved automatic sprinkler system, other than

one- or two-family dwelling units, agricultural building not under special use permit for
commercial purposes where a fire afarm deteciion sysfem does not exist and the floor area of

the building or structure is increased
Exception: When the building inicrease is less than 500 square feel.

Chapter 12
SECTION 1203.1.3 “INSTALLATION" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 1203.1.3 Installation. Emergency power systems and standby power systems shall
be installed in accordance with the California Building Code, the California Electrical Code,
NFPA 110 and NFPA 111. All buildings, other than one- and fwo-family dwelling units, and
agncultural buildings not used for commercial purposes, with standby power, shall have a
shunt tnp device thaf disconnects alf power sources to the building, approved by the fire code
official. Existing instaflations shalf be maintained in accordance with the original approval.

Chapter 33

SECTION 3311.3 “PREMISE IDENTIFICATION" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:
Section 3311.3 Premise Identification. Prior to and during construction, an approved
address sign shall be provided at each fire and emergency vehicle access road entry into the
proaiect.

SECTION 3313.1 “WHEN REQUIRED” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 3313.1 When Required. An approved water supply for fire protection, either

tempoerary or permanent, shall be installed and maintained in continuous operation as seon as
combustible building materials arrive on site, the commencement of vertical combustible

Pagz 168

Ordinance 2022-02
23-0015 E 20 of 43



construction and on installation of a2 standpipe system in buildings under construction, in
accordance with Sections 3313.2 through 3313.5.
Exception: The fire code official is authorized to reduce the fire-flow requirements for
isolated buildings or a group of buildings in rural areas or small communities where the
development of full fire-flow requirements is impractical.

Chapter 50
SECTION 5001.7 “LIABILITY FOR DAMAGES” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 5001.7 Liability for Damages. Any damages or cost resuifing from the negligence,
violation of the law, careless handling, spill or discharge of any hazardous materials shall
constitute debt against any such person, firm or corporation causing such spill or discharge.
This debt is collectible by the Fire Chief, or his/her duly authotized representative, in the same
manner as in the case of an obligation under coniract, expressed or implied.

Chapter 56
SECTION 5601.2 “PERMIT REQUIRED” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 5601.2 Permit Required. Permits shall be required as set forth in Section 105.5 and
regulated in accordance with this section. Where fireworks permils are required, they shall be
issued by the Fire Chief, or his/her duly authorized representative, and the E! Dorado County

Board of Supervisors.

Chapter 57

SECTION 5704.2.96.1 “LOCATIONS WHERE ABOVE-GROUND TANKS ARE
PROHIBITED” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

SECTION 5704.2.9.6.1 Locations Where Above-Ground Tanks are Prohlbited. Storage of
Class | and Class Il flammable liquids in above-ground tanks outside of buildings is prohibited
within the limits established by law as the limits of districts in which such storage is prohibited.
Storage of Class i and Class I lammable liquids in above-ground tanks outside of buildings is

prohibited unfess approved by the fire code official.

SECTI{ON 5706.2.4.4 “LOCATIONS WHERE ABOVE-GROUND TANKS ARE PROHIBITED”
SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

SECTION 5706.2.4.4 Locations Where Above-Ground Tanks are Prohibited. The storage
of Class | and Class It fiquids in above-ground tanks is prohibited within the limits established
by law as the limits of districts in which such storage is prohibited. Sforage of Class ! and Class
If iquids in above-ground tanks is prohibited unless approved by the fire code official.

Chapter 58
Pace 17

Ordinance 202202
23-0015 E 21 of 43



SECTION 5806.2 “LIMITATIONS” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

SECTION 5806.2 Limitations. Storage of flammable cryogenic fluids in stationary containers
outside of buildings is prohibited within the limits established by law as the limits of districts in
which such storage is prohibited. Sforage of flammable cryogenic fluids in stationary containers
outside of buildings is prohibited unfess approved by the fire code official.

Chapter 61

SECTION 61042 “MAXIMUM CAPACITY WITHIN ESTABLISHED LIMITS" SHALL BE
AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:
SECTION 6104.2 Maximum Capacity within Established Limits. Within the limits

established by law restricting the storage of liquefied petroleum gas for the protection of heavily
populated or congested areas, the aggregate capacity of any one installation shall not exceed
a water capacity of 2,000 gallons. The storage of liquefied petroleum gas in excess of an
aggregate of 2,000-gallon water capacily when located at least one-half (1/2) mile from
property zoned or designated for residential use and af least one-half (1/2) mile from existing
residential development with a density greater than one (1) dwelling unif per acre and at least
one-half {1/2) mile from any hotel or mofef is allowed when approved by the fire code official,

and a specialfconditional use permit is issued by the County of E! Dorado.

Dispensing within established fimits. Within the limits established by law restricling the
dispensing of liquefied pefroleum gas for the protection of heavily populated or congesied
areas, the aggregate capacily of any one installation shall not exceed a water capacily of 2,000
gafions. The dispensing of liquefied petrofeum gas in excess of an aggregate of 2,000-gaflon
water capacity when located at least one-half (1/2) mile from property zoned or designated for
residential use and at least one-half (1/2) mile from any hotel or moltel is allowed when
approved by the fire code official and a specialfconditionat use permit is issued by the County

of Ef Dorado.

Chapter 80

SECTION 80, NFPA 1-22, CHAPTER 22 “AUTOMOTIVE WRECKING YARDS” IS ADCPTED,
AMENDED SECTIONS AS FOLLOWS:

Revise Section 22.3 as follows:

22.3 Fire department access roads shafl be in accordance with the Californta Fire Code,
Section 503 and Appendix D.

Add new Section 22.10 as follows:

22.10 Stored vehicies, boats, recreational vehicles, parts, and equipment shall not be stored
within 30 feet of adjacent propenrty lines. '

Ordinance 2022-02 Pue18
23-0016 E 22 0of 43



SECTION 80, NFPA, 13D-22 — “STANDARD FOR THE INSTALLATION OF SPRINKLER
SYSTEMS IN ONE-AND TWO FAMILY DWELLINGS AND MANUFACTURED HOMES”" IS

AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 903.3.1.3, 903.3.5.1.1
NFPA 13D, Amended Sections as follows:

Add new Section 4.6 as follows:

4.6 Residential fire sprinkler systems installed in all new one-and two-family dwellings shall ulilize
a “Passive FPurge” system design unless otherwise approved by the fire code official.

Exception: Manufactured home _installed, tested and approved by the California
Department of Housing and Community Development.

Revise Section 5.1.1.2 as follows:

56.1.1.2 A supply of at least one of each type and femperature sprinkler used within the premises
shall be maintained on the property at an approved location. Spare sprinklers shall be kept in a

mounted and accessible cabinet,

Revise Section 7.6 as follows:

7.6 A local audioNisual device activated upon waler flow shall be provided on aff fire sprinkler
systems in homes at an approved location on the exterior of the dwelling.

Revise Section 11.2.1.1 as follows:

11.2.1.1 Where a fire department pumper connection is not provided, the system shall be
hydrostatically tested at a minimum pressure of 150 pounds per square inch gauge for no less
than a 30-minute duration without evidence of feakage. Such test shalf be witnessed by the fire

code official,
Appendix B - Fire Flow Requirements for Buildings

TABLE B105.1(1) "REQUIRED FIRE FLOW FOR ONE- AND TWO-FAMILY DWELLINGS,
GROUP R-3, AND R-4 BUILDINGS AND TOWNHOUSES" SHALL BE AMENDED AS

FOLLOWS:

TABLE B105.1(1) REQUIRED FIRE FLOW FOR ONE- AND TWO-FAMILY DWELLINGS,
GROUP R-3, AND R4 BUILDINGS AND TOWNHOUSES

FIRE-FLOW AUTOMATIC MINIMUM FIRE- | FLOW DURATION
CALCULATION SPRINKLER SYSTEM FLOW (hours)
AREA {Design Standard}) (gallons per
{square feet) minute)
0 - 3,600 Ne automatic sprinkler | 1,000 1
system

Ordinance 2027-07 Pave 10
23-0015 E 23 of 43



3,601 and greater | No automatic sprinkler | Value in Table {Duration in Table
system B105.1(2) B105.1{2) at the
required  fire-flow

| rate

MAJOR SUBDIVISIONS (5 PARCELS OR GREATER)
0-3,600 Secticn 903.3.1.3 of the | 1,000 1
CA Fire Code or Section
3133 of the CA
Residential Code

3,601 and greater | Section 903.3.1.3 of the [1/2 wvalue of
CA Fire Code or Section | Table B105.1(2} |2

313.3 of the CA |(min. 1000
Residential Code GFM)

OTHER RESIDENTIAL DEVELOPMENT

0-3,600 Section 903.3.1.3 of the | 500 1

CA Fire Code or Section
3133 of the CA
Residential Code
3,601 and greater | Section 903.3.1.3 of the | 1/2valueofTable | 1
CA Fire Code or Section | B105.1(2) {min.
3133 of the CA |750GFPM)

Residential Code

TABLE B105.2 “REQUIRED FIRE FLOW FOR BUILDINGS OTHER THAN ONE- AND
TWO-FAMILY DWELLINGS, GROUP R-3, AND R-4 BUILDINGS AND
TOWNHOUSES” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

TABLE B105.2 REQUIRED FIRE FLOW FOR BUILDINGS OTHER THAN ONE-
AND TWO-FAMILY DWELLINGS, GROUP R-3, AND R-4 BUILDINGS AND

TOWNHOUSES
AUTOMATIC MINIMUM FIRE- FLOW DURATION
SPRINKLER SYSTEM FLOW (hours)
(Design Standard) (gallons per minute)

No automatic sprinkler | Value in Table Duration in Table B105.1(2}
system B8105.1(2)
Section 903.3.1.1 of the |25% of the value in | Durationin Table B105.1(2) at
CA Fire Code Table B105.1{2) ¥ the reduced flow rate

b. The reduced fire flow shall not be less than 1,500 gpm

Ordinance 202202 Paga 20
23-0015 E 24 of 43



Appendix D — Fire Apparatus Access Roads
SECTION D103.1 "ACCESS ROAD WIDTH WITH A HYDRANT” SHALL BE AMENDED AS

FOLLOWS:
Section D103.1 Access Road Width with a Hydrant. Whers a fire hydrant is located on a
fire apparatus access road, the minimum road width shall be 26 feet (7925 mm}, exclusive of
shoulders (see Figure D103.1}.

Exception: Driveways

SECTION D103.2 “GRADE” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

SECTION D103.2 Grade. Fire apparatus access roads and driveways shall not exceed 15.9%
In grade unless approved by the fire code official or by the El Dorado Counly amended
Calffornia Public Resource Code Title 14 / Design and Improvement Standards Manual.

SECTION D103.3 “TURNING RADIUS™ SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

SECTION D103.3 Turning Radius. The minimum turning radius shall be determined by the
fire code official; and shall not include curb and gutter.

SECTION D103.5 ‘FIRE APPARATUS ACCESS ROAD GATES” SHALL BE AMENDED AS
FOLLOWS:

SECTION D103.5 Fire Apparatus Access Road Gates. Gates securing the fire apparaius
access roads shall comply with all of the following criteria:

1. Where a single gate is provided, the gate width shall be not less than 20 feet (6096 mm).
Where a fire apparatus road consists of a divided roadway, the gate width shall be not less

than 15 feet (3658 mm).
. Gates shall be of the horizontal swing, horizontal slide, vertical lift or vertical pivot type.
3. Construction of gates shall be of materials that afiow manual operation by one person.
4. Gate compenents shall be maintained in an operative condition at all times and replaced
or repaired when defective.

5. Electric gates shall be equipped with a means of opening the gate by fire depariment
personnel for emergency access. Emergency opening devices shall be approved by the

fire code official.
8. Methods of locking shall be submitted for approval by the fire code official.

7. Electric gate operators, where provided, shall be listed in accordance with UL 325.

8. Gates intended for automatic operation shall be designed, constructed and installed to
comply with the requirements of ASTM F2200.

SECTION D103.6.1 "ROADS 20 TG 29 FEET IN WIDTH” SHALL BE AMENDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Page 21

Ordinance 2022-02
23-0015 E 25 of 43



SECTION D103.6.1 Roads 20 to 29 feet in width. Fire lane signs as specified in Section
D103.6 shall be posted on both side of fire apparatus access roads that are 20 to 29 feet wide

(6096 to 8534.4 mm).

SECTION D103.6.2 "ROADS MORE THAN 29 FEET IN WIDTH" SHALL BE AMENDED AS
FOLLOWS:

SECTION D103.6.2 Roads more than 29 feetin Width. Fire lane signs as specified in Section
D103.6 shall be posted on one side of fire apparatus access roads more than 29 feet wide

(8534.4 mm) and less than 36 feet wide (10972.8 mm).

SECTION D104.4 “CIRCUMFERENTIAL FIRE APPARATUS ACCESS ROADS” SHALL BE
ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

SECTION D104.4 Circumferential Fire Apparatus Access Roads. When required by the
fire code official, a fire apparatus access road shall be constructed to encompass the entirely
of a sfructure and shall provide a confinuous means of emergency vehicle access.

SECTION 4: CONFLICT
That Ordinance No. 2019-01 of the ECFPD, and all other ordinances or parts of ordinances

herewith are hereby repealed.

SECTION 5: SEVERABILITY
If any Ordinance, article, subsection or subdivision thereof, provision, sentence, dause or

phrase of this code, or any application thereof, is for any reason held to be invalid by a court
of competent jurisdiction, such decision shall not affect the remaining provisions of this code,
which can be given effect without the invalid portions and, therefore, such invalid portiens are
declared to be severable. The ECFPD hereby declares that it would have enacted this
Ordinance and each of its articles, sections, subsections, or subdivisions thereof, provisions,
sentences, clauses or phrases irrespective of the fact that one or more of them is declared

invalid.

SECTION 6; EFFECTIVE DATE AND PUBLICATION

This Ordinance shall take effect thity (30} days afier its adoption.
Secretary is directed to publish this ardinance in a newspaper of general circulation in the
District. In lieu of publication of the full text of the ordinance, a summary of the ordinance may
be published by the by the Board Secretary within fifteen (15} days after its passage and a

The ECFPD Board

Ordinance 2022-02 Pace 22
23-0015 E 26 of 43



certified copy shall be posted in the office of the ECFPD pursuant to Government Code Section
36933(c) (1).
The above Ordinance was introduced at a meeting of the Board of Directors of the ECFPD on

September 30, 2022, and it was then read for the first time. A public hearing was set for the
Ordinance to be read for the second time on October 20, 2022 and approved by the following

vote:

PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of Directors of the ECFPD this,.\;i ¢y day of

Ci’\ e e, 2022

AYES: ey b (e 1900, é—_" 14 i‘.":_’,f o ey
NOES: —

ABSENT: ial0w 43 18K Ty Qo mmmcon
ABSTAIN: —

T

N\
At G&LLK,MJ

B

i 7
Chris Swarbrick, Board Chair

) ATFET: |
A .

R
5

v
Kathiegn Freeman, Board Secretary

Ordinance 202202 Page 23
23-0015 E 27 of 43



EDMCWOD, DSP, ECF, CPCSD, PFPD, RFPD

Localy 3dopted avd amended

Adminisirative need

1011 |Amend with the name of the junsdction
1055 Amend o Incuce aadiion of Adomobile WRekG | ) ooy orcpted and amended | Adrin'stative need dus fo adion of secton 105555,
Yard operational permit
Allows tha firs code offiazl o eniome e firs eode {specric
A , . o fire acoess, vegetation clearances, hazardous materialg,
105 5.55 m:‘ﬁﬁ :’h?mr:‘q;:e;:::mnd el Locaky created and acopled \el: . withn awtomobuie wrecking yard operations. This was
e 2 demonshated nesd exporienced witin the Diemand
Springs Fire Department
Adt secton to require constmolion permit for Agministrafive need dua to addition of section 105.6.25 and
a8 Aytomobile Wrecking Yards, Aosaly/maat ik dipted 105.6.26
' Aliows the fire code official to enforce the fire code (specific
Add section {0 require consfruction permit for 1o fire access, vegalalion tleatances, hazardous maesials,
L Agtomoble Wrecking Yards. Localiereak and adopied el ) witin newly constnacied andfor modified automobile
wreching yand operations..
Allows the fire code official to review and approved traffic
5 : caiming davices pror to inslallation, Fis Code unienTy
H556.26 '::Lmlﬁmzﬁ:ﬁuﬂ& pemTHTorne Locally created and adopted permits the fira cade offidial o requiale Iratllc cafming
g devices. However, a permit isn't currently naquired prior o
insialation causing undue hardship f
Adopleng this seclion to sliow for the crezhon 2nd issuance
: ; jof fees to oover aciual costs. Seciion K56 defines parmits,
107.5 Section Added Previously section 106.6. Locally adapled and amended plan chacks, and inspectins & aliowed in Hoalth & Safety
Code 17951,
10754 Section added Presiously section 1066.1 Locally crocied o adopted. |- 1o o1 Cost Recovery Fees: Ta eover the vost fe
tha Fire Drstrict
5 5 Section 107.7 To recover fhe aclual coshs of avoidable
1wy Sechon added. Previously section 108 7 Locaity craated and adopted bl Intonclions by conracht
Section 111.5 of Chapter 1 of the Fia Code of the District is
addad to read as fallows:
111.5 Appeal Frocedures and Timelings' The intent of this
pravisian s 1o clarify the procedurss anctimelines for an
115 Secton added Previously section 109.4 Locally adapted ard zmended individal or entily o flle an appeal fo ine Board of Appeals
reganding an aider, decision, ov delarmmnation by the Fire
Code Offical Based on the Caunly of B Dorpdn's
Vegaiation Management Ordinance Board of Appeals'
nmeling.
Previousty section 1404, Complsted he seclicn by Aliows ﬂ};ﬁeﬁf:d Code Ofﬁc::ai 19:nfnm;l£1e Firg ‘(;:de that
filing in the blank sortions that were not complsled o propelty.‘ eAlils updated ln
1124 . Locally adapted and amanded maich the fees and penalies s deemed appropriats by the
Ly the SFM Ltis betier lett o locallies to datermimne A
o fossioenatios for Lielr = Cistngt Atomey's Office The change tothe language to
s FEIBHES Rl aES include the tem infractions.
112.4.2 Citatons 16 acded to read as follows: 1124,2
Citaions
The Fire Chief or hisher duly aulhorized moreseniative(s).
< may Issua citatlons far miractfons or misdemeancr
1242 Sechion aided, Previoutsy sectian 110.4. Locally created and adopted voianons of fis code pursuant & Section 13871 of the
Health and Salety Code af ihe Stale of Caifomia and
Chapter Sc {commencing witfh section 853.6) of Ttle 3 of
Part 2 of Ine Penal Code of the Staie of Calfomia,
Prevgusly section 1124, Completed the section by
ng in the bienk partions $hat were not completed Jans of f ;
1134 oy the SFM, 15 betlerleft 1o locailes to Localy adopied znd amended ;::fj:‘&; i E::":en ﬁﬁﬁvﬁm"“
|determine the fessipenstiies for their respective Yo
areas

23-0015 E 28 of 43



Adkded definitions for, Campiire. Driveway, District
Executve Body, Fire Chief, Fire Hazard Opeh Buining, and
piv] Addad dalnilions for Garity Locally created and adopfed Trainad Crowd Manager. Definttion of open busising shal
not inciude residantial LPG, natural 4as filsled, or wood
burning appkances o ceremenia’ Buming,
3021 Added definition of campiire to Section Locally created and adopied Addad definition for clarity.
‘m“ﬁdi?;fﬁﬁ‘m mgrmmhn:;in ; Due 1o the high fire danger that exdsts i El Dorads Cousey
2744 2’"9“’9" = oqurzﬂ:mm?ﬂ g Locaty created and adapled we have weiien more stringent ruies pedarting 1n.open fies
lreqm "’“sm‘ SCope ythin grass, brush, and lreg coveesd aras
Provides the trezbos of a floar plan for hepurposa of
401.2.1 W“"?’""’ reunralpre-ﬁ'e pans fornew Locally created and adopled lemengency planning o be ullizad by emergency msponse
andar modified constriction. Al
Fire apparatus are becoming larger and islier. A werlical
lclearance of 15 fet provides proper dearance for
apparalus 1o pass under without damaging apparalys
compenents. it also allows an exiended e frame before
having fo recot the onwlit of the vegetason. Additinal
5324 g;g::m‘“’ke""f FRzmmcsin 1o Locally adopted and amended  [height for vegetation clearances acks as & creased buffor
for the spread of fire. A road widih of 20 feef exeusive of
shoulders, as measured face of ot fo Jace of turb is
neaded. Thess stuclures can be difeull o navigate with
e apparatus and should nol be counted i the lotal
drivable road surface.
; . Fre appacatus reruire awas for tuming amund when
o Wm::mm ir"l;:ffgf‘”s’:f ""‘”F L‘“’w"“ e multple vehisies ars on e scene of anemergency. Ths
50325 A1 e 1 His o i tons Locafly adoplad ang amended  |mcluces fre vehicdes s well a5 civlan vehicles. Provides
Sy by i e corndé o o MY batter access R Ingressiegress Additaaaly, 2dds lm
mENH around for apparatus in driveways grealrthan 15T,
| Allgws codes and slandards for Bridges and Elevated
i()a‘mrrgec!if‘resec!icnrlf|:|i'BrldgesandEleqtalfed Surfaces of E! Dorado County and Appandix D of the
Susfaces 1o state and match E1 Dorado County lcutrent Fire Code, whichewer is more resticlive, to be
SEY  rransperiation Drviion in adklicn [0 AASHTO . | Localy adonted andamended |t throughout counly aganties andis aiowed 26 an
17 {minfraum CFC required) aitemate means & method that Is nof less festriciive than
the Fire Coda.
Proviously section 503.4.2. Added section ragarding This section clearly defines the “No Parking in Fire Lanes™
i o parking in e lanes Locafyeated and adopled |, 1+ ic comsistent with the Calfomla Vehicie Cad.
3 | This sextion clearly defines the “No Parking in fronl of fire
Peeviously section 5034 3. Added section iegarding g i ] ;
503.32 im arking in frnt of hyskants Locally craaiad and adopted g::us ruies and is consistent with the California Vehicle
. This seclion clearly defines California Fre Code Appeadix D
Prevously section 5034 4. Added section regarding . o 1o f
503.33 e iarios b on road width Locally created and adopled :i!:mfefence for road lane width and {keir selaficn to fire
5&3! 'e“st"wﬂm' mw S035.3. c‘m’:;d”"“w Allows firs distocis the auhon'y o approve gakes on
i wercy basad on tfie Distict's gate stindaid,
5035 nsistency though o madway gates k ElDorado | Lacally Created and adopled “mmm e e
County, mfering fo the gate Siandards adapled by L scoonss e
the FPO's |
|Ackled section pertainin to the visial addeegaing of Allows fire districls the autharity 10 approve addregsing
5061 Ibutdings Locally adapted and amended  { o o the Pistiofs addiessing standants,
" |Commercial giopertios are. requined fo nstall hydranis at
K Kedtve Ssndn o (300 foot inmjervals, thus ey shouk never se oulsida of 150
H lacerment of hydrants and thetr relatonship (o Localty adopled and amiended o) ¢ any grven hydkant al anyime {lak the cistanca
commercial bullings - )

23-0015 E 29 of 43



5093

|Adced verblage ¥ bring all of the necessary fire
controls for a bullding ko one location

Locally created and adopted

Buildings are getting more sizeble m ha county, His mone
to have new budings with sobrr arays that
cantinue k0 ganerate power ever wheh the bubdings
peneral uikGes have been shut off. When fhereis.an

gency, if & vilal that we have rapid access 0 ak of (e
feontiois in one tocation Tor pubkic evacuafion and firefighfer
afaly Due to the fire danger present in Bl Dorado County
throughout most of the year. this change: 18 apprgviate and
atvisatie

5104.2.3

Emengency Responder Radie Systam Secendary
Power Supply Modification

Loaally adopted and amended

|Amend to 72 hour capacity for back-up power dus lo
Iweathar and PGEE safely mlaled power culagis.

o032

Adds a requirement for sprinier system instalalion
in new bulidings and struciures 3,600 square feet or
reater withia the district

Locatly adopled and amnended

Adminsirative need dus to addition of seclion 903.2.22 and
903223

9m.2i

Previcusly section 903.21. Adds & mequiramant far
sprinkler system inslaliation in new Group A
bufdings and straciures 3,600 square fcef or
graater within the dlstrict

Locally adopred and amended

Oue B the topograpitic, glimatic, and gesgraphic condions
of Bl Dorado County and their contituting fackors fo our
increased sesponse Limas, along with the fact that fires
double In iz gach and evary minute, we equie sprikders
i be instaded w shuctures oroe ey reach 3,600 square
feel in size a5 they relate (o fire behavior and rate of

spread.

903212

Prvicusly sechon 5032.1. Adds a requirement for
sprinkler system installation in new Group A-1
bulldings and slructures 3,600 square feel or
greater within the distdcl

Locally adopted and amended

Due to the fopographic, glimatic, and gaaglaphic condiong
of Bl Dorado County and their coniibuting Belors o ooe
nereasad response times, atong with the fact that flres
ldauble m 5ize each and avery minule, we require sprinkiers.
o be Installed in siuciures ancs they reach 3,600 square
ffast In izb 85 they relate 1o fire behasior and rate of

spread

03213

Praviously section 903.2.1. Adds a requirement for
sprinider system installaffon i new Soup A2
bulldings and sftuctures 3800 squara fegl or
greater within the distict

Localy adopied and amended

Due o he pographic, climalic. and geographic condiions
fof B Dorado County 2nd their contribubing faotors ki eur
increased response times, along with the Gt thal fres
double i gz &ach and every minute, we require spinkiens
1 ba installed in structures once ey reach 3,600 stuare
feet m 51z0 a3 hey refate Lo fire behavior and rate of

spread.

803214

Previously section 903.2.1. Adds a requirement for
serinidar systemn instalation in new Graup A-3
bulldings and siruciures 3 800 square Test or
reater within the district

Locally adopled and amended

Due ko the topograghic, dimalic, and geographic conditions
of E Dorado Counky and thefrcontriuling factors o our
increasad respoase Bmas, slong with the bet thal fres
doubke in size #ach and every minule, we raquise sprinklers
i be nstalied in structures once thay reach 3,600 square
fect in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of

spread

Previously section 903.2.3 Adds 2 requirement or
sprnkier svstem installation in new Group E
buildings and siruciures 3,600 aquan feed or
Pwa?« within the district

Locally adopied and amended

Dug o the tepagraphic, cllmatic, and geographic conditions
of E{ Dorada County and their coninbuting factars to cur
incraased response times, dong with the fard that fires

uble in size each and every minule, we require Sprinkiers
10 be instaled in struclores once they reach 3,600 square
in $izz as they retate to fire behaiorand rate of

:'.pruad

80324

IAdds 2 requirement for sprinkler system installation
n new Group F bulldings and strucures 3,600
square feel ar greater sthin the district

Localy adagied and smanded

Due to the topographic, dimatic, and geographic: condiions
B Dorade County and their contributing faclors to our
increased response limes, along with the kct that fires
uble i 8ize gach and every minute, wesequire sprinkiers
2 be Installad in stnsclures ance they reach 3,600 square
foet in size 23 they rotate to fire behavior and rate of

spread.

Adds 2 requirement for sprinker system inslatialion
in e Group M bulldings and structures 3,600
squans feal or greater within Ihe district

Lacally adopted and amended

Due tg the topographic, climalic, and gepyaphic conditions
jof £ Dorado County and their confributing factors te cur
increased response fimes. aking with the fact thet firsy
double in $ize each and every minute. we fequire sprinkiers
10 be installed i1 struciures onos they reach 3,600 square
teet in size a5 they relata 10 fire behaviof and rage of
spread

23-0015 E 30 of 43




903.27.2

Prerviously saction 803.2 7 Adds a requsroment for
sprinkdisr systam insiadiation m tew Group M with
Eiphoisterst Furnitive or Matresses buildings and
structures 3,600 square feet or greater withia the
it

Locally adopied and amencded

Due to fhe topagraphe, climatic, and geographic condifions
of £l Daraga County and their contabuting faclars o our
increased response times, along with the fact that fires
ble in size each and every mmuls, we require sprinklers
i be installed 1 stnactures onoe they reach 3,600 squane
in 518 a3 they refale 1 fire beiovior and rage of
sumad.

Praviously seciion 903 2.8.2. This section was
Lw 10 Include manufsciured residential single
family R-3 in the residential sprinkder program

Locally adopted and amended

Manubactured Hofhes — The Retedt of this code seclion is to
ensue that manufactured homes that sere as 8 gner two-
family cwelings are cunsistent with the provisians found i
CRC. Saction 313 pentaining k built dwelings of a similar
nature. Manutcirad homes placad in e wikiland-yrhan
interface have & hexghtened risk af mpd e consunption
ta the light-weight nafure of their construction. The
rapid fire spsad threughout these Siuclures piesants 2
sigrificantrick § Ihalr gocupants. Residential spdnkler
Sysberms have boon inttporated o dacraase this rick
successfully & many Califemia comimunities.

Previously section 903.2.9. Adds 2 requirement for
spindles system ingtaliation In neve Croup
buildings and structures 3,500 sare feal or

ater within the district

Locally adopted and amended

Lug io e Tepographic, climatic, and geographic condiions
of £F Daraco County andg heir contributing factors to our
increased response times, akng with the fact that fres
ble in slza each and every minute, we /quire sprinklers
be Installed in stnichuras once they reach 3,600 squars
feel In size as they sedale to firg hehaviar gad rata of
spraad

203210

Previously section 903.2. Adds a sequirement for
sprinkler system instaliation in new Group 5-2
puiidings and structures 3,600 square feet ar
faroater wathin the district

Localy agopied and amended

Due ¥ the Fapographic, dimatic, and geographic condifions
I E1 Dorado County aad their conbituting factors to owr
increased response imes, along with e f31 that fires
doubla in $lza each and every minute, we equire sprinklers
to be mstalled in struchures once they reach 3,800 squere
Heat in gize as they refate to i behawior and rate of

sonear],

e —

9032101

Previously section 803.2.10. Adds a sequirement for
sprinkiar system ingtaliation in new Commertial
Parkng Garage buildings and struclyres 3,600
square feet or greates within the disticl

Locally atiopted and amended

Do ke I topographic, climatic. and gaographic conditions
of Bl Dorade Couniy and their conkibuting Bctors to sur
increased respanse times. along with the fact that fms
double I siza each and exgry minule, we require sprinkiers
o be installed in sniclures erce they mach 3,600 square
feel in gize as they relate to fire Dehavior and rate of
praad,

e ——

Provigusly section 903.2 7. Ackis a requirement for
sprnkler system instailation in new Group B
butdings and slructures 3,600 square feet or
greaier within the dsfict

Locally sdaded and amenced

Eus o the topographis, climatic, g geographic conditions
of El Datada County and fheir contributing factors & our
increased responsa times, alang with the fact that firss

uble in size each and every minute, we require spankiers
be instalied in ghuciures cnoe they reach 3,800 square
aet in size a3 they jelate to fire behavior and rate of

spread

R R S

Previcusty section 903.2. Adds a requirement for
sprinkder system installztion in new Group F-2
hulidings and siructures 3,600 square foet or
greater within e district

Locally adopted and amended

[Dug fo the topographic, dlimatic, and geagraphic conditons
f H Dorado County and their contributing fackars fbowr

incraased response fimes, along with the facl that fires

e &1 size e3ch and every minuie, we requim sprinklers

fo be instaled in starciures onoe they reach 3,800 sauare

feet in size as they relate o fire behavior and raie of

sproait.

FEEIEH

9035

Praviusly section 903.2a. Adds 8 requirament
wmstal sprnklers for existing buitdings that widero
a change In use of reater hazard or an increase in
size greater than 500 square feet and the resulling
square feet is greatar than 3,600 square fest.
Previously aopfied to addilion of more than 30% or
1.000 squars feel.

Locatly created ard adoplad

Due 10 the topographic, clmatic, and geoqraphis condilfons
El Doraco Caunty and their contributing factors ta our
increased response times, 2long with the fact that firs
doubie in slze each and every e, we require sprinkizrs
ko be inslalled n structures ance they reach 3,600 squars
feal ins size as Hey refate to fire beftavior and rate of
spread.

e ere—

23-0015 E 31 of 43



Adds 3 mquimmen for e alimm systeim
installation in new hulldings and siractures 3,600
square feat or less within the district

Lorally adonted and amended

|Adminisirative need gua tor acdition of seclion 903.2.30

WrZ14

|Previcusiy seclion 207 23, Added occupant
iprotection for fire alaims in Group A Iwikiings with 2

oor arsa legs than 3,600, except R3, AG buildrgs
ot used for commenrcial purposes, and bofdings
with 2 00 anga of less than 500 square fast 23
approved by Lhe fire code ofiicial

Loxally eeated and adopted

Provides propes emergency aotificalion ior aocupancies that
allow public use and ensures Fire Depariment nofification in
event of 3 fira or smoke.

907223

Previously section 507 2a. Added ocoupant
peotection for fire alarmg in Gmup B buildings with 2
Moor area less than 3600, excent R3, AG bufidings
ot wsed kor commiersial purposes, and bulidings
with 2 floor amea of lesy than 500 squars leel as
acproved biyihe fir code ofiicial

Locally created and adopted

Provides proper emangency notification for occupances fhat
low public use and ensures Fire Dapartment notification in
e event of a fire or ginoke.

072311

Previously sechion 907,23, Added pecupant
protaction for fire afams in Growp E bukaings with 2
tioor 2rea (253 than 3,500, excapl R3, AG buidings
et ised for cammancial purpeess, and buildngs
with a Boor arga of less than 500 square feet as
approved by e fire code ofiloial

Localy crealed and adopted

Provides proper ememency notification for oocupancies that
afow public use and ensures Fire Deparimant notificaton in
jthe avanl of a fire or smule.

907.24.1

Previgusly seclion 907 23 Added occupant
prolection for Bee alarms in Group F buildings with a
floor area less than 3,500, except R3, AG buildings
not used for commercal purposes. and bulldings

a floor area of kess than 500 square foel a5
approved by the fire code official

Locally created and adepied

Provides proper emergency nofification for oocupancles that
aflow public wse ant ensunss Fire Depariment natificalion in
Jthe evenl of & fira or smoke

907.25.2

Previously section 507 2a. Added aecupant

protection for fire alarms in Group H buikdiags with

a floor area less than 3,600, excepl R3, AG

builkdings not ysad for commercial purposas, and

bulldings with a floar area of less than 500 square
et a5 approved by the fre code official

Locally created and atpted

Provides proper emergency nollficalion fur cocupancies that
aliow putlic use and ansares Fire Deparment notifeaion fa
the event of 4 fire or smoke

Hr.288

Previously section 807 2a. Addad gocupant
pratection for fire alarms m Group | Duildings with
|fioor area less than 3,600, except R3, AG tiddings
Inot used for commerciad purpases, and buidings
wilh 2 floor area of less ihan 500 square feet a8
approvad by the fire code ofiiclal

Locally created and adopled

Provides proper emegenty nolification for occupancies that
aliow public uge and ensures Fire Depariment notificabon in
the event of 2 fine o smoke,

Q7272

Previously section 907 2a. Added oocupani
protection for fie atarms In Growp M bulldings with
|2 fioor zrea fess than 3,600, except R3 AG
buiidngs nof used for commerial purposes., dnd
buldings with 2 floor areaof less than 500 square:
eretas approved by the fire code offidal

Locally created and adopied

|Provides proper emesgency notificaion for occupancies that
3fow public use and ensuret Fire Depariment nolification in
the gvent of a fie o smoke.

HT284

Praviously seclion 507.2a. Added oacupant
potecton for fire alanms in Group R-1 buildings
with & floor area less than 3,600, except R3, AG
buridings not used for commercizl puposes, And

lidings wath a ficor ared of less than 500 square
feat a8 approved by the fire code official

Localy eredist and adopied

Provides proper emeigency nolificalion for occupancies that
sliow public use and ensuras Fire Departmant nolification in
the event of 2 fire o smoke

23-0015 E 32 of 43



Previovsly secilon 30728 Added cocupant
petection for fire 2lamis in Group R-2. R2.1, and R
2 Dulidings wilh 2 floor area fess than 3,600,

Provides praper smengency notification for occupanties (hat

907,294 except R3, AG buikdings not used for commamial Loca¥y created and adopted aliow public use and ensures Fire Depanmant notiication in
nunposes, and buddings with 4 Soor anea of less event of a fire or smoke
than 500 square feet as approved by the fire code
Previausly section 907 22, Addad otcupant
m&ﬁg :';";&;" sl %Mém;’“h £ Provides proger emargency nofilication fof sotupancies Hhal
0072101 Sla oA, "F | tocallycestedand adopled  Jaow pubiic use 2ng ensures Fire Depariment noffication in
ot used for commercial purposes, and busdings oA
nith a floor area of less than 500 square foat as J
approved by the fire code afficial
Eimikion s & T- g 910;?!:6 e : [Provides proper emergency nofification or oocupancies that
072N g LR : il Lacally treated ant adopied afow public usa and ensures Fire Degartinent nofification In
necied lo a moniored fire alam syslem when B b s i s <
stalled or replaced ¥
Provides pioper response and malatenance "runner service”
o fir alarm systems, NFPA 72 spedilies required response
times ko 5 alaim rouble and supenisary signals to
4 ensure syslams remain operational. A Type A UL Hsted
80765 m"f" ﬁ’:a&";' g bemoniored by UL | |ty creaed and adopted. |centalstalion mests the NFPA required fre alam response
ype o0: snsunng an operslional fire alanm syslem at i imes.
ULType A listing requires central stations 1o provkig this
‘amner senvice® or contrac, with another enlily 1 provide
this sernce 1o obian the Bsting.
Pamary Secongary Alaen Power Supply Amend & T2 hour capacity for back-up power due io
e Modiicaiion Locallycrealed and adopled  fior 2o PGAE salety elajed power utages
Previowsiy serlion 907.2b. Added aczupant
pratechon forxisting bulidinas without aulematic Provides proper émergancy aofification for oouupancies that
9079 sprinkles systems to install a fre alanm if they add Localy ereatad and aifoped low putlic vsa and ensures Flre Deparyment nofificatitn in
more than 30% or 1,000 square feet b the the avent of a fire of smoke
struciure. whichavar & less
‘his seclion addg a Shum Trip powar shyt off devices o
120313 Shunt frip power safely devices Locally adapted and amended lensure emergency power shuf off during the use of back-up
| power supplies.
Previoushy section 3310, Address raquiednants far | Aadressing for construction sites IS important to assist
w2 consiuckien elas Lacally crested and adopied responding emergency cTews.
Previousy section 3312.1. Waler supplies at |Water mustbe on site prior to combustible materisl being
Ao consiruetion sioe win combustible marerias ongie| Loy adopled andamended L - ertical ponsiruction commending
) Hazardous maierials related incidents ke costly 1o mitigate.
o any a_iama'g;s - cnsts:um “W'ﬁ‘“!;':g'“?", (| Localycesedandodapeg |1 e PORnkis causad by neiigonce deio @ business
i :m - o G rete process of practios the aciual cost wil be passed on (o the
cause 3 cost recovery negigent partics
‘mmsgkgp‘“;?;"nﬂ@gt pong iss‘:'; [Aliows agencies hat need & know aboul explosives snd
5601.2 o ki #1d =S Eapaiag Locally adopéed and amended fireworks for aporove thern and have a dear undersianding
|axploshies, and by the Firg Chief and the Boand of of he applications of how ey wil be used
Supenvisors for Hreworis ;
Established limits as requined by the Flre Code for Class |
' flammable and Class Il combustible liquid storage in above-
5704.298.1 Estabisked limils a5 set forih n the Fire Code Locally adopled and amended Lmnd {anKs, Requires AH) appmal ng 2
SpedialiConditional Use Pemit fom the County.
(Eslablshed limits as mquired by the Fira Code for Class |
fammable and Class |l comixesiivl lndd special
5706.24.4 EslabEshed limits as set forth: in the Fire Code Logally adepted and amendad  perations in above-groend tanks, Reuies AH apsroval

land a SpeciaCondtional Use Permil from the County

23-0015 E 33 of 43




Administralive: addion of Distngt name,

% need to add Distic agme Established lnils
las requied by the Fire Code 1Dffiaal for Flammable

5806.2 Locaky adopled and amended  [Cryogenle fuids In slationary confamers, Requires AHJ
Ftablished s 25 sal forthin the Fre Code: aoproval 20d 8 SpecialiCendisanal Use Pamnit from the
County
Estatishes distances between LPG giorage and
spensaries that are directly related to safety for ressdentia]
. X developments and high-density hotels, matbls, aparments,
B102 B ﬁ"’."a;:"n'g‘smf"’ LPG dorag ana snesh | Localyaoopledand amended. [fc whersa efease by eakor explsinof LP-Gas would
i & high probabllity of injury, inhala¥or, or death
ires AHJ approval and a SpedialiGondtional Use
Parmit from the County.
Drsmantied and atored vahicles present significant fin loads
(batteries, flammabie and combrstible lquids, upholstery.
2 . etc.) and rfish 1o vegetation and adfacent aroperties. This
Q'W%NF PA1 e udl:n\:rbeiemw ms“"d 3;'2"” Loropedy s | | calycreated andadopted  frequirement provides fire atcess and deerance to
"9 4 vegetation In automoblie wrecking yard eperations (0 akd in
firafighting operations and reduciion of fire extension to
adjacent properties andfor opan lands.
| Amended ta include or-site sprnkier heads and weenth on-
<ia lor emergent repalrs, the inclusion of 2 local weals fiow
alamm to create an audible alert for e fow of water i the
{MERA, 13016 of Chapter 80 of the Fing Coge of the levent of water actvabon in & vacant sireclure, and
Chapler 80, NEPA, Distict hae been amended to update varlows iﬁrpdmstarc festng requirements 10 assere proper 130
13D.16 rovisions pertaining o the Instabaion of spemiier | LOCERY dopled and amenced ooy o e Installation decrezting i risk of watet
systems In one and twa-family dwellings idamage from ppe [ailure  Passive purge requiremants
were i a0ded 1o enslie walar circutzion through he
system, seducing stagnant water and backfiow corcants
|EI0 encourages this type of system)
Allows us to mafcht whal developers and residents are used
T G MO Mt ko sk e i e
B105.1(%} e DLl Localy ot level of availabie waler fr freBghiing pugoses in the event
frecRis bzl of hawsa 1 housa, hoise ko vegelation, o vegetation
1o house Igaition.
dix B: Tabla Estabiished a minlmum requérement of 4,500 GPM, Allgws 1S to match what developers and residenis are used
’“Bm&z below 5000 foot elevation, for all commernial Locally adopted and amended  fio in regards to GPM fire flow sequirsments that have begn
picjects used for gver 2 decade in EDC
: . rorpon ey Lrtrsunramabletomqme  resfdential divewsy o
Appendix D D103 1 Added an exception for residential driveways Locaily adopted and amended onsinict 2 26 oot wide spacs for access 1 a hydart,
Tive 14 raquires us to pniy aceapt up to 16% driveways,
: Amended to meel State Jaw of geades no greater any exceptions would require approval by he AHJ. In our E
i d e [t i kg e e Localy adapted ad amended o o) County Tite 14 adaplion we aliw greater than 16%
lorade with AHJ approvel and hard) surfce.
§ ; 20 fool road widths shall not inchede cuds and gutters due
Appendix 0: D103 3 Ackded text 10 inclwde oabs and gutlers Locally adopted and amended. | oo S e e
2 Where fire apparatus access roads endst of a divided
Appendix [ DI035 oLk e eeistaled | oty adopted andamended  froadway the gate width shal ot be Jass than 15 feet dus to
it pparabus lapparatus Juming radius.
No parking on roads allkowed on roadways l2ss than 28 Feet
i wictih above 5000 leet. Lowes than 5600 feet this does
Appendtx O: CID3E.T Rnad widths 20 to 29 feal Locally adopled and amendad ot 2pply. This seclion s adopied 26 il stnds i the Fire

Code Appendx D seclin 1063.6.1 lor 2k ather elevelions.

23-0015 E 34 of 43




0 gng site anly o mads from 28 feet 1o 36 keet
Bowed. This is not required less than 5000 keet af
Appencix 0 D10362 m’““’mm‘fﬂ"”m"‘a“zgmmmmaﬁ Locally cdoptad and amedeaod 1 Lawar than S000 Roet he cocs not apgly The
is 2dopted as 1 stands In the Fire fade Appendix [
Sechon 103.6.2 for all ofher elevations.
When required by the fine code afficial, a fre apparalys
Added fo mquire cecumierential fire apparatus road shall be condtruciad to ancompass the enfire
Appendix D: D104.4 actess roads Ly gt and s gt = re and ghal provide a conlinuous means of
emergancy vehile aocess.
Adopted with no Amendments
101 1 through 1015 e "”ﬂ 10 SSlatica Soope, UL BUON SR e Locally adopted Admasative clary
1021 through 40212 Refarences, subjects not requiatad by ha Code Locally adopted |Adminisirative clardy
:g':z";"““’ Abiity to enforce the cods Localy adapted | Administrative tlary
:gg;;’”‘“’" Time imitation of apicalion Eocally adopted  Admimistraive clarly
Adopted this sedtion for adminisiralive clarty and
106 1 through 106 4 |e and e safety nspech Locally adopter Fea schedules fior permits
Adopled this sechon for agminfstrative clarity and
107 1 threugh 107.6 fie anc lfe salely Inspections Locally adopled Inspaction authority
’ . Mamtsnance of safequards, tesfing andoperalion of
108.1 through 1085 : ﬁ“iﬁ‘smﬁ' 'L Localy adapted enl, re-inspection and testing, recartkeeping,
A 3 supandsion, rendering squipmenl inoperatis, overcrowdng,
Adopted this sechon kor admimstrative carity and
13 e and i 5af R Eocally adopled St0p work arder
Adopted Ihis seclion for adminisirative ofanty and
114 1 through 1147 e 2 e asloty s = Localty atopted Unsafe siruciuses ar equipment.
Asphalt ketlies contam fughty fliammable srbstances ard
require stringent safeguants. Managing ignition seunces
3011 through 308.5 [Adopied this section Tor fira aad fife safety Locally adopiad ihmugh respansibie appicatian of slatdands wilt reduce the
inumber of fires in various seitings. (Chmatic, geofogical,
and lopographical].
[General requiraments relafing 10 smokdag, Vacant prémises
L:;nmﬁm andl sakety requirements, abandonad premises.
310.1 Mrough 3114 dopted this seciion for e and e safety Locally aopied _ “‘W@;ﬁ;ﬁ%ﬁ?ﬂ?”“’f e
iremoval of hagardots malerats. (Chimalk, gaclogical, and
pographical).
2021 Adepted ihis secilon for fre and I safedy Losally adopied %m”g'gzaﬁémg‘"ﬂm bridges.
Frowdes avacuation drlls for hazardous and instiufioral
403 6 through 40376 Adopled this section for fire and lile saiety Locally adopted occupancies {oecupancles with increased pofential Rl
loss).
403.9 through 40394 Adopted his section for fire and e safety Losally adogted 'fm”;;ﬁ:m::ﬁ’pmmm‘&m
405.1 through 405 10 A dogfed ths sechon for fre and I saety Locally afopted iy it 'Pmn@ Keaging {Cimstc,
103 Adopted this section for administrative clarity and Locaty adapted A permit is required for emergency sesponder radio systems
fire and fife safely nspections (Climatic, geological, and topographical}.
Adopled this section for administrative clarity and Decoralive vegetation poses an increase im hazard,
808.1 roach 8054 fire and life safety inspections Lacally adopted {fammability and increased nsk.
Wall coverings in group E ocaupanties {Schogls) safs a
iAdopted this section for administralve clarily and magmum amount of Rammable wall coverngs 1n
PR 7o eo 2nd i safety inspections hocaty gefopt=d ectcational fackibes (Cimatc. gevogica, ard
opographical)

23-0015 E 35 0f 43




Adopted fis section for admiristrative ¢ty and

Combustible fumishing pose a significant fammability and

608.1 throuch 804 .5 i 3 Locally adugled lincreased life safety hazard in institufionf and coliege domn
fire and lifie safely ingpections ype cocupancies.
5 . e e Provides ¢larfty on acceptance festing of auiomatic fes
904.4.1 . Wan:""‘r'f;r ;“"m‘ g af"“mj‘"‘““""‘ e Localy adopled extinguishing systems (Cimatic, gecloged, and
topegraphical)
Adopted this seclion for adminfstralive clarity angd . ;
1101, 1 through 1102.1 e v Rl ol st Locally adopted Administralive clarity
Emergancy Responder radi coverage I 2uiisting huidings.
A1 bulldings wil be required to llow emesgency responders.
receive and transmit emergency radio rafilc o and from
ach other and the ememency dispatch center. Tume
Adopted this section in existing buiddings for the lranescan be devaloped to come i compiance and the
11032 safely of Geafighters ud tfer emergency Locally agopted PO sy Been o s Ceurilh LY
s £ fire coce afficial Is acceptable. The rfonale banind his
section i thal on almast all emergency rasponder injury or
fatality incidenis commenftation is a kay issug. This
silyalion ¢an ba comagied with e addition of radio
laquipment to boast the signal n ateas thet do nod have
3irong signal (Climatic, geological, #ad pographical).
Raquiras instalfation of fire sprnkier systams in exsting
1015 Adopted this seclion for the safety of the public, Locall loccupancies wiih high Ble sajety risk and b confarmance
: firalightars, and ofher emergency responders y adopted lwith previus Unifom Fife Codes. (Climatic, geatogical, and
[topagraphical}.
s ; Requires installstion of cabon monoxde darns in
Adopted this sectian for the safaty of the public, i Sl
1103.9 frofighiers, and oifer emergency responders Locally adapted ocoupancies with !n'jl life satety isk. {Climatic, gagicgical,
and lopograghical).

1104.1 through LAdopted this saction for the safely of the public, P'o'-'ide._s 2 minim:s_m L ofsareiy S mgand ioes!'ess‘
10425 etoiters. and oher e = Locally adopled from eisting bufdings housing cocupancies with 2 high life
; Wy emergedcy respond < afety risk {Cimatic, geological, and topographical),

_ : Provides a minimum Jevel of safety at fire storage yards
::gg'; yren :;’:‘*‘::'mf’"eg:'”m' i "’“r':“' Locaily adopted it high levels o lammable rubber mareral (CRmatkc,
2 9 i STERNCY, igealogical, and lopographical).
Appendix 0, D161 1 Adopted this section for the safety of the public, Loeal Ganeral requirements for fire apparatus acoess roads
throegh 0104, hrefighters, and ofher emergency responclers fadpid including loads {Climatic, geoloareal, and opographical).
Appendix [ D104.2 Adopted this gaction for the safety of the public, Localy Commercial and indugirial development fire apparaius
“emludng axception) firefighters, and oiher amergency respondars Bl acoess ads (Climatle, geokgical, and topographical).
Appencix O D104.3 Adopted ihis secyion for the safety of the puble, Locally adopted ICommercial and idusirial development fre apparatus
thraugh D164 irebghters, and offer emergency responders ! acoass mads (Climatic, gaciogical, and lopographica).
[Appendix D: G166 1 Adopted this section for the safety of e public, Encaly adopfad Fire apparalus access roads for multipie-famlly regidential
|(aneludng gxcaplion) frefighters, and aftier emergency responders ! developments {Climatic, geclogical, and lapographical).
ix D; D106.2 Adopted this saclion for the safaty of the pubkic, 3 ety sy e apparatus access roads. for multiple-amily residential
through D106.3 firefighters, and other amargency respondars cevelopments (Clinmasic, geological, and bpagraphical).
One- or two-dwelling msidential developments shall be
| Appendia D: D07, 1 Adopted His seciion for the safety of the pubiic, ty ickapled loquipped throughout with v sperale and approved fire
[esciuding sxceptions) firefighters. and other emerpency responders b apparatus acoess roads due Io topographic, geonraghic and
cimatic conditions
One- or two-awelling residential developments shak be
Appendix : D107.2 |Adopled this section for the sataty of the public, Locaty adopted lequipped throughout wilh two sperate and approved fire
Thmgﬂ D108.1 firefighters, and other ememency responders |anparatus access roads due I lopographic, geographic and
cimabe conditions

Grey cells are previously amended, adopted, or changed tode sections that are being adopted apain in this code cycle.

23-0015 E 36 of 43



Mountain{Q) Bemocrat

PROOF OF PUBLICATION
(2015.5 C.C.P.)

Proof of Publication of
NOTICE OF INTENT

STATE OF CALTFORNIA
County of El Dorado

T am a citizen of the United States and a resident
of the County aforesaid; I'm over the age of
eighteen years, and not a party to or interested in
the above-entitled matter I am principal clerk of
the printer at the Mountain Democrat, 2889 Ray
Lawyer Drive, a newspaper of general circulation,
printed and published Monday, Wednesday,

and Friday, in the City of Placerville,

County of El Dorado, and which newspaper has
been adjudged a newspaper of general circula-
tion by the Superior Court to the County of El
Diorado, State of California, under the date of
March 7, 1932, Case Number 7258 that the
notice, of which the annexed is a printed copy
(set in type no smaller than non-pareil), has been
published in sach regular and entire issue of said
newspaper and not in any supplement thereof on
the following dates, to-with:

9/16

ALY IN THE YEAR 2022
I centify (or declare) under penalty of perjury that
the foregoing is true and correct,

Dated at Placerville, California, this 16™ day
of SEPTEMBER, 2612

Signature

| Notiog I3 hereby gven of e
intantion of the Bl Domoo County
Firs Protecticn Disirct tc adopt a
Fire Code Ordinance. The Uistrict
shall hold #ts first pubic Pawrng = !
pom, on Septembar 30 2000 2 O3

| of Placsrslie Towr Hal, 549 My 52
“mcordie, CA B5567 momrdng iha
adoption of i Fig Cose Oedieance
pursusd o Health and Safety Code
Sentions 15880 ancd 13865 7. Cogeae
of the code seciion relerad
and any secondary code sootions

| ntferrad to, adoptad by reference,

| are on fils with the Sacretary of
| the Disinet and are apen ko public
| inspection. Adoption of the Fire Gode

Orcinance will egopt ihe Caifornia
Fim Code 83 curently publisheo
In Title 24, Part 9. of the Califomia
Code of Regulations. goveming
firr pravention and buliding
standards relsied to fie ard pankc
sofely with some gmencments, In

| some instences the El Dorado

| County Fim Protection Districts
proposed Fire Code Orchinarce
prosoges Muilkding stardams more
strinaert B those  minimum
Dulcing staraiartie o rex! he

! Diate Fen Menhe v conigbey

£ the Ot s
€13 10873

23-0015 E 37 of 43



fHlountain{l)

PROOF OF PUBLICATION
(2015.5 C.C.P.)

Proof of Publication of
NOTICE OF INTENT

STATE OF CALIFORNIA
County of El Dorado

I am a citizen of the Upited States and a resident
of the County aforesaid; I'm over the age of
eighteen years, and not a party to or interested in
the above-entitled matter. I am principal clerk of
the printer at the Mountain Democrat, 2889 Ray
Lawyer Drive, a newspaper of general circulation,
printed and published Maonday, Wednesday,

and Friday, in the City of Placerville,

County of El Dorado, and which newspaper has
been adjudged a newspaper of general circula-
tion by the Superior Court to the County of El
Dorado, State of California, under the date of
March 7, 1952, Case Nurmber 7258, that the
notice, of which the annexed is a printed copy
{set in type no smaller than non-pareil), has been
published in each regular and entire issue of said
newspaper and not in any supplement thereof on
the following dates, to-with:

10/10

ALL IN THE YEAR 2022
I certify {or declare) under penalty of perjury that
the foregoing is true and comect.

Dated at Placerville, California, this 10" day
of OCTOBER, 2022

Signature

Notics s hersby glven of the
interion of the El Darado County
Gire Protection Distritt to adopt o
Flre Cogle Crdingnes. The Distrct
shall hold its sscong pubie hearey
at 1:00 P on Ostocer 20, 2029
Gt City of Fiaceraile Town Hal Sad
Main St Placerville, CA 95867,
racarding the adoption of the
Fira Uode Ondinance pursuant to
Haalth and Safely Code Sectons
1386% and 13869.7. Gaples of the
sodn smEvies parsd W end ey
d MnsaE alerr=d
10, adopied by reference, e O°
fie with the Secretary of the District
and ara open lo pubiic i-:spacm
Adoptcn of The Fire C008 (ronencd
will adopt! e Callormia Fre Code

Nt cuvanty pubhahed 0 Tioe 24

Pat B, of e Celtoris Cods
| of Regulstions, gowarning fim
pravention and bulihng EAndaTa

raisted to fire and panic safaty
with some amendments, in some
instannas the El Deraco Courty Fire
| Frotection District’s proposed Fire
Code Ordinance propGses building
| stantidards move stringen! Mar
I thoss mivimum bulcdng Flanceece
adopted by the Stats Fire Marshal
gnd contgined v the Calformia
Bulldirg Stendards Code.
15,1,;,“9 10972

23-0015 E 38 of 43



Attachment No. 2

El Dorado County Fire Protection District

Resolution No. 2022-08

23-0015 E 39 of 43



EL DORADC COUNTY FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT
RESOLUTION 2022-08

ARESOLUTION OF THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS OF THE EL DORADO COUNTY FIRE
PROTECTION DISTRICT
ADOPTING FINDINGS SUPPORTING AMENDMENTS TO THE
CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE

A resolution for the El Dorado County Fire Protection District setting forth findings with respect to local
conditions within the Fire District which make certain modifications and changes to the California Fire
Code reasonably necessary for preserving fire and life safety in the E] Dorade County Fire Protection

District.

The Goveming Beard of the El Dorado County Fire Protection District finds and resolves as follows:

WHEREAS, Health & Safety Code Section 17958.5 pemmits a Fire Protection District to adopt an
ordinance which changes or medifies the State Housing regulations adopted pursuant to Health & Safety
Code Section 17922 upon determination that such changes or modifications are necessary due to local
conditions that pertain regulations governing conditions hazardous to life, property and the environment

from fire, explosion, hazardous materials and hazardous uses; and

WHEREAS, Health & Safety Code Section 17958, 7 requires that a District’s Board of Divectors
making any changes or modifications pursuant to Health & Safety Code Section 17958.5 shall make
express finding that such changes or modifications are needed; and shall file a copy of such changes or
medifications with the Department of Housing and Comrmunity Develepment.

WHEREAS, the unique local climatic, geological, and topographical conditions existing within
the boundaries of the District make it reasonably necessary for the District to impose more stringent
requirements than set forth in the California Fire Code and pursuant to California Heaith and Safety Code
sections 13869.7 and 17958.7, the District desires to make express findings to that effect.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that the Board of Directors of the El Dorado County
Fire Protection District, after having duly noticed and held public hearings, hereby adopts the following
findings conceming current unique local conditions that together make each modification to the
California Fire Code, reasonably necessary to provide adequate and effective protection of life, property

and the environment more specifically set forth as follows:

23-0015 E 40 of 43



FINDINGS OF FACT
FOR CHANGES OR MODIFICATIONS TO THE STATE BUILDING STANDARDS
CODE (TITLE 24PART 9) BECAUSE OF LOCAL CONDITIONS

A. General,
After due consideration, the Beard of Directors of the El Dorado County Fire Protection District, hereby

finds that due to local climatic, geologic and topographic conditions, as stated within this document,
there is a need to provide the modifications and changes contained in the adoptive Ordinance of the
California Fire Code. Such changes are deemed to be reasonably necessary to provide adequate and

effective protection of life, properiy and the environment.

The El Dorado County Fire Protection District provides fire protection, emergency medical services and
specialized rescue services to approximately seventy-four thousand people in a 281 square mile area.
The District is located on the westem slope of EI Dorado County. The topography of the District ranges
from rolling hills of grass and oak woodland in the west and oak-timber in the steep drainages of the east
portion. The weather conditions vary from freezing temperatures with occasional snow in winter, to

summer temperatures that regularly exceed 100 degrees.

The District is divided into five distinet areas: Gold Hill, City of Placerville, Pleasant Valley, Pollock
Pines/Strawberry, and Shingle Springs. Most of the commercial and industrial areas are located along
the corridor of Highway 50 and mere rural communities with home sites on larger parcels along the

outet areas of the district

The El Dorado County Fire Protection District is an *ali-risk™ agency in which the District participates
in 2 sophisticated automatic aid program with other agencies within the county. The resources of the
District will respond fo, and deal with, any type of emergency. The term “Fire Protection” in this
document is broad and includes zesponses to fires, smoke and odor investigations, alarms, public assist
calls, hazardous materials incidents, medical aid, fire investigations and specialized rescues.

The District has five; full-time, staffed fire stations which provide emergency services to the
community. PFire Station 17 is located in the unincorporated town of Pollock Pines at 6430 Pony
Express Trail. Fire Station 19 is located in the unincorporated area of Placerville known as Pleasant
Valley at 4429 Pleasant Valley Road. Fire Station 25 is located in the City of Placerville at 3034
Sacramento Street. Fire Station 28 is located in the unincorporated town of Shingle Springs at 3860
Ponderosa Road. Fire Station 72 is located in the unincorporated town of Cool at 7200 Saint Florin
Court. The District has 72 full-time, career personnel, along with three support staff positions.

B. Climatic.
The El Dorado County Fire Protection District is located within a foothill region. The District is subject

to four seasons, with an annual average snow falf in the winter months of 2 inches, in addition to an
average rainfall of 45 inches per year. These adverse weather conditions create severe hazardous road
conditions and flooding as well as rock slide hazards along the main access roads within, as well as into,
the District from the surrounding areas. Due to periods of rainfall, along with repeated road closures,
the ability of the Fire Protection District to provide immediate emergency response is often delayed.
These same adverse climatic conditiors often result in a large numbes of vehicular accidents that place
extreme restraints on the availability of emergency response to perform emergency rescue, first aid,
hazardous rmaterials control and fire- fighting. The climatic conditions often result in a substantial or
total lack of ability of the Fire Protection District to respond immediately to other types of cmergency
situations that occur, Examples of these emergency situations include structure fires, wildland and
forest fires, flooding, hazardous materials incidents, emcrgency medical calls, vchicle accidents and

-2

23-0015 E 41 of 43



vertical rescues. The mutual 2id agreements estabiished with adjoining fire agencies might not be
possible due to adverse climatic conditions, restricting or totally blocking access into the District.

Summary:
These local climatic conditions affect the acceleration, intensity, and size of fites in the Fire District.

Times of little or no rainfall, low humidity and high temperatures create extremely hazardous conditions,
particularly as they relate to the wildland - urban interface. Winds experienced in this area can have a
significant impact upon structure fires, especially in buildings in close proximity to one another, and to
wildlands commonly found in the E Dorado County Fire Protection District. Structures buiit within the
£l Dorado County Fire Protection District must be built with these variables in mind.

Geological, The El Dorade County Fire Protection District is located within moderate activity seismic
Zone Three. The seismic, geological conditions present a potential for multiple fires, major breakage of
water mains, rmultiple electrical power failures, multiple collzpsed structures and a large number of calls
for emergency medical aid, ali of which may occur simultaneously during a seismic event. The water
district has numerous water-pumping systcns used for five suppression water delivery, as well as water
storage tanks providing water system pressure. Most of the pumping systems are dependent on
electrical power for operation. Such electrical power may not be available during a seismic event.
Water storage tanks used for the storage of required fire suppression water may alsc collapse in such an
event forcing the additional need to transport water via additional pieces of fire apparatus which will
place a significant restraint on the ability of the District to provide the required emergency services.

Summary:
Local geographic and geological features and processes exist within the boundaries of the district that

may hamper the ability of the £l Dorado County Fire Protection District to perfosm its sworn duties. Fire
following an earthquake has the potential of causing greater loss of life and damage than the earthquake

ftself.

Topographical. The District is primarily composed of arezs that are considered by the State to be high
fire hazard severity zones with areas of very high severity zones. Much of the District is {ocated within
foothill terrain, covered with highly combustible vegetation, including the presence of many coniferous
forested areas. The elevation within the District ranges from at 1,400 feet to over 6,000 feet at the
highest point. Slope within the District ranges from 0 degrees to 90 degrees. The structures within the
areas of foothills terrain have very limited fire access, due to narrow roadways with steep grades and
poor road surface conditions. The District is accessible only from the outside by one State Highway and
one U.S. Highway. The [ighway 50 corridor goes directly through the El Dorado County Fire District
and at times may be closed by snow or mudslides. This can make access to many paits of the El Dorado
County Fire District difficult. The presence of many existing structures within the high fire hazard
severity zone areas provides for a very high potential of a structure fire spreading into a wildland or
forest fire condition as well as the potential for a wildland or forest fire spreading to structures,

Summary:
The alignment of canyons, valleys and slopes into inhabited areas, combined with the variable nature of

the terrain, yield a potential for increased fire risk. Most structures, both residential and commercial, are
in, or are surrounded by areas that contain a significant grass, brush, mrxed oak woodland, and mixed
conifer fuel load. Due to drought conditions, beetle infestations, and lack of vegetation management,
much of the area is populated with either dead or dying trees, contributing to ap extreme fire danger.

23-0015 E 42 of 43



Conclusion:
1.ocal climatic, geographic and topographic conditions described above increase the frequency, intensity,

and size of fires involving buildings in the Fire District. Further, these conditions impact potential
damage to structures from an earthquake and subsequent fire. Therefore, it is reasonably necessary that
the California Fire Code be modified to mitigate the effects of the above conditions.

California Health & Safety Code Section 17958.7 requires that modifications to the Fire Code be
expressly marked and identified as to which each finding refers 10 which Code modification. The

attached Appendix A provides this connection.
INTRODUCED at a regular meeting of the Board of Directors of the El Dorado County Five Protection
District on September #5ih, 2022.

PASSED AND ADOPTED at a regular meeting of the Board of Directors of the El Dorado County Fire
Protection District on September3fth, 2682, by the following roll call vote:

ol Gind-
1 K@-‘nu'\,’\iljﬂ ..-\ S ’

AYES:
NOES:
ABSENT: «. ¢

ABSTAIN:

ATTEST:

1
t

il -_f' \, : .

A

Kathleen Frecman, Board Secretary Chefs Swarbrick, Board Chair

23-0015 E 43 of 43





