
RESOLUTION NO. 009-2023 

OF THE BOARD OF SUPERVISORS OF THE COUNTY OF EL DORADO 

(REPEALING RESOLUTION NO. 037-2020) 

WHEREAS, the California Code of Regulations, Title 24, Part 9, the California Fire Code, is updated by the 

State every three years; and 

WHEREAS, the 2022 California Fire Code became effective on January 1, 2023; and, 

WHEREAS, California Health and Safety Code Sections 17958, 17958.5, 17958.7 and 18941.5 permits a 

county to make such local amendments and modifications as the county determines are reasonably 

necessary because of local climatic, geological or topographical conditions; and, 

WHEREAS, the California Code of regulations, Health and Safety Code, Division 12, Part 2, Chapter 1, 

Article 12, Section 13146, assigns responsibility for enforcement of safety regulations to the local level 

and grants authority to delegate enforcement to the chief building official, or his or her authorized 

representative, or the chief of the fire protection district, or his or her representative; and, 

WHEREAS, the County of El Dorado desires to delegate enforcement of the Fire Code to the chief of the 

fire authority, or the chief's authorized representative; and, 

WHEREAS, the fire protection district and County have agreed to develop, implement and maintain a 
memorandum of understanding that describes the roles and responsibilities pertaining to the inspection 

of certain building standards found in the Fire Code; and, 

WHEREAS, on October 20, 2022, The Board of Directors of the El Dorado County Fire Protection District 

adopted Ordinance No. 2022-02, which adopted the 2022 California Fire Code with amendments the 

District deemed necessary to deal with local climate, geological or topographical conditions. 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that the Board of Supervisors of the County of El Dorado ratifies 

Ordinance No. 2022-02 of the El Dorado County Fire Protection District and delegates the enforcement of 

the ordinance to the El Dorado County Fire Protection District Chief, or his or her representative. 

These changes include amendments and additions to the California Fire Code in the following sections: 

101.1, 105.5, 105.5.55, 105.6, 105.6.25, 105.6.26, 107.5, 107.5.1, 107.7, 111.5, 112.4, 112.4.2, 
113.4, 202, 302.1, 307.4.4, 401.2.1, 503.2.1, 503.2.5, 503.2.6, 503.3.1, 503.3.2, 503.3.3, 503.6, 

505.1, 507.5.1, 509.3, 510.4.2.3, 903.2, 903.2.1.1, 903.2.1.2, 903.2.1.3, 903.2.1.4, 903.2.3, 903.2.4, 

903.2.7, 903.2.7.2, 903.2.8.5, 903.2.9, 903.2.10, 903.2.10.1, 903.2.22, 903.2.23, 903.6, 907.2, 

907.2.1.4, 907.2.2.3, 907.2.3.11, 907.2.4.1, 907.2.5.2, 907.2.6.6, 907.2.7.2, 907.2.8.4, 907.2.9.4, 

23-0015 E 1 of 43 



907.2.10.1, 907.2.30, 907.6.5, 907.6.2.1, 907.9, 1203.1.3, 3311.3, 3313.1, 5001.7, 5601.2, 

5704.2.9.6.1, 5706.2.4.4, 5806.2, 6104.2, Chapter 80 NFPA 1-22 Section 22.3, Chapter 80 NFPA 1-
22 Section 22.10, Chapter 80 NFPA 13D-22: Sections 4.6, 5.1.1.2, 7.6, 11.2.1.1, Appendix B: Table 

B105.1(1}, Appendix B: Table B105.2, Appendix D Sections 0103.1 through D103.3, Appendix D 

103.5, Appendix D 103.6.1, Appendix D103.6.2, Appendix D104.4 

El Dorado County Fire Protection District adopts the 2022 California Fire Code, Title 24, Part 9, in its 

entirety, including Appendices, incorporating those sections of the International Fire Code, 2021 edition 

not adopted by the state, with the exclusions listed below: 

103, 309, 311.5, 311.6, 318, 403.3, 403.5, 403.8, 403.10, 403.11, 404, 406, 903.3.1.2, 904.1.1, 

1103.1, 1103.3-1103.4, 1103.6, 1105, Chapter 26, D104.2 (exception only), D106.1 (exception only), 

D107.1 (Exceptions only), Appendix A, Appendix G, Appendix J, Appendix K, Appendix L, Appendix 

M, Appendix N, Appendix 0. 

Appendices not adopted can be used for reference in enforcing other sections of the 2022 California Fire 

Code. 

PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of Supervisors of the County of El Dorado at a regular meeting of 
said BOARD, held the 3rd day of January, 2023, by the following vote of said Board 

Attest: 
Kim Dawson 
Clerk of the Board of Supervisors 

By ~ ~ -. ~ putyO 

Ayes: Thomas, Hidahl, Turnboo, Parlin, Laine 

Noes: None 
Absent: None 

-U)~~~~ 
Wendy Thomas 

23-0015 E 2 of 43 



'?ll'e are deazcatdto ..JIYPVilf1nt1 a _prefe.rJ"i.onaf and' 
cuurtetJIIS service to our citizens and'comm1111ltfes -witli 

2'rfde, rnut & Integrity. ,, 

FIRE 

November 23, 2022 

Don Ashton, Chief Administrative Officer 
El Dorado County Board of Supervisors 
330 Fair Lane 
Placerville, CA 95667 

Subject: Resolution Ratifying Ordinance No. 2022-02 of the El Dorado County Fire 
Protection District, which adopts the 2022 California Fire Code with 
amendments related to local climatic, geographic and topographic conditions. 

Dear Mr. Ashton: 

The El Dorado County Fire Protection District (ECF) is requesting the Board of Supervisors 
(BOS) ratify its Ordinance No. 2022-02, which adopts the 2022 California Fire Code as amended 
due to specific local climatic, geographic and topographic conditions. California Health and 
Safety Code Section 13869.7 requires the legislative body of the city or county where the 
ordinance will apply to ratify, modify or deny the adopted ordinance. The BOS must also 
delegate enforcement of the ordinance to either the Fire District (or its representative) or the 
Chief Building Otlicial. 

Therefore, we request the County Board of Supervisors ratify Ordinance No. 2022-02 with 
amendments to the 2022 California Fire Code, and delegate the enforcement of that Ordinance to 
the El Dorado County Fire Protection District Chief. A proposed BOS resolution is enclosed for 
your review and use on this topic. 

This resolution has no direct fiscal impact to the County. 

Sincerely, 

Braden Stirling 
Fire Marshal 

ATTACHMENTS: 
1. El Dorado County Fire Protection District Ordinance No. 2022..02 
2. El Dorado County Fire Protection District Finding of Fact Resolution No. 2022-08 

El Dorado County Fire Protection District • 4040 Carson Road I PO Box 807 • Camino, CA 95709 
53o-644-9630 • 53()-.644'9636 (fax) 

23-0015 E 3 of 43 



Attachment No. 1 

El Dorado County Fire Protection District 

Ordinance No. 2022-02 

23-0015 E 4 of 43 



EL DORADO COUNTY FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT 

ORDINANCE NO. 2022-02 

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS OF THE EL DORADO 

COUNTY FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT AS FOLLOWS: 

An ordinance of the El Dorado County Fire Protection District (ECFPD) adopting the 2022 

Edition of the California Fire Code, incorporating the 2021 Edition of the lntemational Fire Code, 

regulating and governing the safeguarding of life and property from fire and explosion hazards 

arising from the storage, handling and use of hazardous substances, materials and devices, and 

from conditions hazardous to life or property in the occupancy of buildings and premises in the 

ECFPD; providing for the issuance of permits and collection of fees therefor; Repealing Ordinance 

No. 2019-02 of the ECFPD and all other ordinances and parts of the ordinances in conflict 

therewith. 

Be it ORDAINED by the Board of Directors of the ECFPD, also known as the El Dorado 

County Fire Protection District: 

Section 1: FINDINGS OF FACTS 

Section 2: ADOPTION OF CODE WITH EXCLUSIONS 

Section 3: LOCAL AMENDMENTS 

Section 4: CONFLICT 

Section 5: SEVERABILITY 

Section 6: EFFECTIVE DATE AND PUBLICATION 

SECTION 1: FINDINGS OF FACTS 

The ECFPD makes certain changes (listed below) to the California Fire Code, 2022 

Edition, pursuant to Health & Safety Code Sections 13869.7, 17958.5, 17958. 7 and 18941.5 

during this code adoption process. Such changes are necessary because of local climatic, 

geological and/or topographical conditions. The ECFPD has adopted, pursuant to Section 

18941.5 of the Ca!ifom;a Health & Safety Code, the findings of facts relative to these conditions 

by Resolution #2022-08 of the ECF PD dated October 20, 2022. 

Ordinance 2022-02 Page 1 

23-0015 E 5 of 43 



SECTION 2: ADOPTION OF CODE WITH EXCLUSIONS 

The ECFPD adopts the 2022 California Fire Code, Title 24, Part 9, in its entirety. 

including Appendices, incorporating those sections of the lntemational Fire Code, 2021 edition 

not adopted by the state, with the exclusions listed below: 

Exclusions: 103,309,311.5, 311.6, 318,403.3, 403.5, 403.8, 403.10, 403.11, 404,406, 

903.3.1.2, 904.1.1, 1103.1, 1103.3-1103.4, 1103.6, '1105, Chapter 26, D104.2 (Exception only), 

0106.1 (Exception only), 0107.1 (Exceptions only), Appendix A. Appendix G, Appendix J, 

Appendix K, Appendix L, Appendix M, Appendix N, Appendix 0. 

Appendices not adopted can be used for reference in enforcing other sections of the 2022 

California Fire Code. 

SECTION 3: AMENDMENTS TO THE 2022 CAUFORNIA FIRE CODE 

The following Sections are hereby amended or added: 

Chapter 1 

SECTION 101.1 "TITLE" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 101.1 TITLE. These regutations shall be known as the Fire Code of ECFPD, hereinafter 
referred to as "this code''. 

SECTION 105.5 "REQUIRED OPERATIONAL PERMITS" fSAMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 105.5 Required operational permits. The fire code official is authorized to issue 
operational permits for the operations set forth in Sections 105.5.2 through 105.5.5i5. 

SECTION 105.5.55 "AUTOMOBILE WRECKING YARDS" IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 105.5.55 Automobile wrecking yards. An operational permit is required for the 
operation of automobile wrecking yards. 

SECTION 105.6 "REQUIRED CONSTRUCTION PERMITS" IS AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 105.6 required construction permits. The fire code official is authorized to issue 
construction permits for work as set forth in sections 105.6.1 through 105.6.246. 

SECTION 105.6.25 °AUTOMOBILE WRECKING YARDS" IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 105.6.25 Automobile wrecking yards. Construction permits are required for the 
installation of or modification to automobile wrecking yards. 

Ordinance 2022-02 Page2 

23-0015 E 6 of 43 



SECTION 105.6.26 "TRAFFIC CALMING DEVICES~ IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

105.6.26 Traffic calming devices. Construction permits are required for the installation or 
modification of traffic calming devices. 

SECTION 107.5 "PERMIT, PLAN REVIEW ANO INSPECTION FEES~ SHALL BE ADDEO AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section 107.5 Pennit. A schedule of fees adopted by the district board of directors for plan 
review, inspections and the issuance of permits by the district may be found in the most current 
district fee schedule (Health & Safety Code 17951). 

SECTION 107.5.1 "COST RECOVERY FEESn SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 107.5.1 Cost Recovery Fees. Fire service fees may be charged to any person, firm, 
corporation or business that through negligence, violation of the law, or as a result of 
carelessness, is responsible for the cause of the district to respond to the scene of an incident. 
A district board may charge a fee to cover the cost of any service which the district provides 
or the cost of enforcing any regulation for which the fee is charged (Health & Safety Code 
13916). The fee shall not exceed the actual cost of suppressing the fire and/or responding to 
the scene of an incident. 

SECTION 107.7 "ADMINISTRATIVE COSTS" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 107.7 Administrative Costs. When a test or inspection is scheduled, and the 
contractor fails to perform to the satisfaction of the authority having jurisdiction (AHJ), the A HJ 
may bill the contractor for actual time spent traveling to and from the test/inspection location 
and the time spent at the test/inspection site as well as admin;strative costs. 

SECTION 111.5 "APPEAL PROCEDURES AND TIMELINES" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 111.5 Appeal Procedures and Time/Ines. Any person or entity who believes they 
may be adversely affected by an order, decision, or determination made by the fire code official 
through a written notice may appeal this matter within 15 calendar days of the postmark on the 
notice. All such appeals shall be filed in writing with the Secretary of the Governing Board for 
the district. A Nmely appeal shall stay further action by the fire code official until the matter is 
determined by the Appeal Board as outlined in Section 109.2, unless the issue poses an 
imminent fire or Nfe safety hazard to members of the public. The fire code official shall notify 
the appellant by certified mail of the date and time of such hearing. The hearing shall be 
scheduled to take place no sooner than 20 calendar days from the date shown on the certified 
mail. The appellant shall have the right to appear in person or by agent at the hearing and 
present oral, written and/or photographic evidence to the Appeal Board. 

SECTION 112.4 'VIOLATION PENAL TIES" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 112.4 Violation Penalties. Persons who shall violate a provision of this code or shall 
fail to comply with any of the requirements thereof or who shall erect, install, alter, repair or do 
work in violation of the approved construction documents or directive of the fire code official, 
or of a permit or certificate used under provisions of this code, shall be guilty of a misdemeanor 

Ordinance 2022~2 Page 3 

23-0015 E 7 of 43 



or infraction, at the discretion of the prosecuting attorney or agency, punishable by a fine not 
more than $100.00 for a first violation; A fine not exceeding $500.00 for a second violation of 
the same provision within one year; A fine not exceeding $1000. 00 for each additional violation 
of the same provision within one year, or by imprisonment not exceeding 180 days, or both 
such fine and imprisonment. Each day that a violation continues after due notice has been 
served shall be deemed a separate offense. (Health & Safety Code Sections 13145 and 
17995). 

SECTION 112.4.2 aCITATIONS" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 112.4.2 Citations. The Fire Chief, or his/her duly authorized representative, may 
issue citations for infractions or misdemeanor violations of this code pursuant to Section 13871 
of the Health & Safety Code of the State of California and Chapter 5c (commencing with 
Section 853.6) of Title 3 of Part 2 of the Penal Code of the State of California. 

SECTION 113.4 "FAILURE TO COMPLY" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 113.4 FaHure to Comply. Any person who shaU continue any work after having been 
served with a stop work order, except such work as that person is directed to perform to remove 
a violation or unsafe condition, shall be punishable by a fine or imprisonment or both as 
described in Section 112.4 (Health & Safety Code Sections 13145 and 17995). 

Chapter 2 

SECTION 202 "CAMPFIRE" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

CAMPFIRE. A fire which is used for cooking, personal warmth, lighting, or aesthetic purposes. 

SECTION 202 ''DISTRICT" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

DISTRICT. The district and all other areas within the exterior boundaries thereof now or 
hereafter established. 

SECTION 202 "DRIVEWAY' SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

DRIVEWAY. A veh;cufar access that serves up to two (2) parcels with no more than two (2) 
residential units and any number of non-commercial or industrial buildings on each parcel. 

SECTION 202 "EXECUTIVE BODY" SHALL BE ADDEO AS FOLLOWS: 

EXECUTIVE BODY. The Board of Directors of the Distn·ct. 

SECTION 202 "FIRE CHIEF~ SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

FIRE CHIEF. The Chief Executive Fire Officer of the Fire department/district serving the 
jun·sdiction or a duly authorized representative. 

SECTION 202 "FIRE HAZARD" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Ordinance 2022-02 Page4 

23-0015 E 8 of 43 



FIRE HAZARD. Any condition, arrangement, or act which will increase, or may cause an 
increase of, the hazard or menace of fire to a greater than customarily recognized as normal 
by-persons in the public service of preventing, suppressing or extinguishing fire; or which may 
obstruct, delay, or hinder, or may become the cause of obstruction, delay or hinderanoe to the 
prevention, suppression, or extinguishment of fire. 

SECTION 202 "OPEN BURNING" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

OPEN BURNING. The burning of materials wherein products of combustion are emitted directly 
into the ambient air without passing through a stack or chimney from an enclosed chamber. Open 
burning does not include road flares, smudge-pots and similar devices associated with safety or 
occupational uses typically considered open flames.,. For the purpose of this definition, a chamber 
shall be regarded as enclosed when, during the time combustion occurs, only apertures, ducts, 
stacks, flues or chimneys necessary to provide combustion air and permit the escape of exhaust 
gas are open. 

Open burning shall also include campfires, bonfires, portable outdoor fireplaces, ceremonial 
fires, and recreational fire as defined in the Fire Code. 

Exception: 

1. UL or ASMI listed LPG or natural gas outdoor flame devices, such as gas BBQ's or gas 
fire pits that comply with the Fire Code. 

2. For one-or two-family dwemngs, fixed or portable outdoor flame devices that meet the 
following: 

a. Devices shall comply with the Fire Code. 

b. Devices shall be used per manufacturer's specifications. 

c. Minimum 10-foot clearance from device to all flammable material and vegetation. 

d. No burning shafl be conducted during high or extreme fire weather conditions (e.g., 
National Weather Service Red Flag Warnings). 

3. Campfires on private lands. Where required by the fire code official, a pe'nnit shall be 
issued by the fire code official. 

4. Ceremonial and/or religious burning with the following safety measures: 

a. Maximum 4-foot x 4-foot bum area. 

b. Minimum 10-foot clearance from edge of bum area to all flammable material and 
vegetation. 

c. An approved water supply is located within 500-feet of the bum area. 

d. The bum area is located no less than 30-feet from adjoining property lines. 

e. An adult is present with a shovel until the fire is extinguished. 

f. No burning shall be conducted during high or extreme fire weather conditions (e.g., 
National Weather Service Red Flag Warnings). 

SECTION 202 "TRAINED CROWD MANAGER" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Ordinance 2022-02 Page5 

23-0015 E 9 of 43 



TRAINED CROWD MANAGER. Standby personnel, usually a secun'fy guard or usher 
personnel, who are trained in the proper procedure to exit people from a tent or other place of 
public assemblage in an orderly and calm fashion in the event of an emergency 

Chapter 3 

SECTION 302.1 "DEFINITIONS" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 
3D PRINTER. 
ADDrTIVE MANUFACTURING. 
BONFIRE. 
CAMPFIRE. 
HI-BOY. 
HJGH-VOL TAGE TRANSMISSION LINE. 
OPEN BURNfNG. 
PORTABLE OUTDOOR FIREPLACE. 
POWERED INDUSTRIAL TRUCK. 
RECREATIONAL FIRE. 
SKY LA TTERN. 

SECTION 307.4.4 "OPEN BURNING RESTRICTIONS" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 307.4.4 Open Burning Restrictions. Open burning on a/I lands within the jurisdiction of 
the El Dorado County Fire Protection District (ECFPD), including the Local Response Ares (LRA), 
is prohibited when the California Department of Forestry and Fire Protection (Cal Fire) issues a 
bum suspension in the State Responsibility Area (SRA). This prohibition shall be made effective 
24-hours following its commencement in the SRA. 

Open burning is also prohibited on a/I lands within the jurisdiction of ECFPD at any time the fire 
code official that atmospheric conditions or other local circumstances make such fires hazardous, 
including factors such as high winds, low fuel moisture, fire weather, the issuance of red flag 
warnings, severe threat of wild/and fire, or present risk of destruction by wildfire to life, wildlife, 
property, or natural resources. 

Chapter 4 

SECTION 401.2.1 "PRE-FrRE PLANS" IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 401.2.1 Pre.fire plans. Where required by the fire code official, a pre-fire plan shall 
be provided and approved by the fire code official for all new commerciaf structures. 

Chapter 5 

SECTION 503.2.1 "DIMENSIONS" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 503.2.1 Dimensions. Fire apparatus access roads shall have an unobstructed width 
of not Jess than 20 feet (6096 mm), exclusive of shoulders, as measured from face of curb to 
face of curb, except for approved security gates in accordance with Section 503.6, and an 

Ordinance 2022-02 Page6 

23-0015 E 10 of 43 



unobstructed vertical clearance of not less than 15 feet. Driveways shall have an unobstructed 
width of not less than 12 feet wide. 

SECTION 503.2.5 "DEAD ENDS" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 503.2.5 Dead Ends. Dead~end fire apparatus access roads and driveways in excess 
of 150 feet (45,720 mm) in length shall be provided with an approved area for turning around 
fire apparatus. 

SECTION 503.2.6 "BRIDGES AND ELEVATED SURFACESw SHALL BE AMENDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section 503.2.6 Bridges and Elevated Surfaces. Where a bridge or an elevated surface rs 
part of a fire apparatus access road, the bridge shall be constructed and maintained in 
accordance with AASHTO HB-17, the current El Dorado County Transportation Division Bridge 
Standard or Appendix D of the current Cafifornfri Fire Code, whichever is more restrictive. 
Bridges and elevated surfaces shall be designed for a live load sufficient to carry the imposed 
loads of fire apparatus. Vehicle load limits shall be posted at both entrances to bridges when 
required by the fire code official. Where elevated surfaces designed for emergency vehicle use 
are adjacent to surfaces that are not designed for such use, approved barriers, approved signs 
or both shall be installed and maintained where required by the fire code official. 

SECTION 503.3.1 "NO PARKING IN FIRE LANES" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 503.3.1 No Parking In Fire lanes. No person shall stop, park, or leave standing any 
vehicle, whether attended or unattended, except when necessary to avoid conflict with other 
traffic or in compliance with the directions of the Fire Chief, or his/her duly authorized 
representative, Peace Officer or official traffic control device along the edge of any highway, 
at any curb, or in any location in a publicly or privately owned or operated off-street parking 
facility, designated as a fire lane by the district with jurisdiction over the area in whfoh the place 
is located. The designation shall be indicated (1) by a sign posted immediately adjacent to, 
and visible from, the designated place clearly stating in letters not less than one inch in height 
that the place is a fire lane, (2) by outlining or painting the place in red and, in contrasting color, 
marking the place with the words "FIRE LANE', which are clearly visible from a vehicle, or (3) 
by a red curb or red paint on the edge of the roadway upon which is clearly marked the words 
"FIRE LANE'. 

SECTION 503.3.2 "NO PARKING IN FRONT OF HYDRANTS" SHALL BE ADDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section 503.3.2 No Parking in Front of Hydrants. No person shall stop, park, or leave 
standing any vehicle within 15 feet of a fire hydrant except as follows: (a) If the vehicle is 
attended by a licensed dn"ver who is seated in the front seat and who can immediately move 
such vehicle in case of necessity, (b) If the vehicle is owned or operated by a fire deparlment 
and is clearly marked as a fire department vehicle. 

SECTION 503.3.3 "FIRE LANES BASED ON ROAD WIDTH" SHALL BE ADDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Ordinance 2022-02 Page7 

23-0015 E 11 of 43 



Section 503.3.3 Fire Lanes Based on Road Width. Fire lanes shall be based on road width 
as required in Appendix Das amended by the district. 

SECTION 503.6 "SECURITY GATES" IS AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 503.6 Security Gates. The installation of security gates across a fire apparatus 
access road shall be approved by the fire code official and shall comply with the District gate 
standard. Where security gates are installed, they shall have an approved means of 
emergency operation. The security gates and the emergency operation shall be maintained 
operational at all times. Electric gate operators, where provided, shall be listed in accordance 
with UL 325. Gates intended for automatic operation shall be designed, constructed, and 
installed to comply with the requirements of ASTM F2200. 

SECTION 505.1 "ADDRESS IDENTIFICATION" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 505.1 Address Identification. Addresses for new and existing buildings shall comply 
with the District address standard as approved by the fire code official. The address 
identification shall be legible and placed in a position that is visible from the street or road fronting 
the property. Address identification characters shall contrast with their background. Address 
numbers shall be Arabic numbers or alphabetical letters. Numbers shall not be spelled out. Each 
character shall be not less than 4 inches (102 mm) high with a minimum stroke width of½ inch 
(12.7 mm). Where required by the fire code official, address identification shall be provided in 
additional approved locations to facilitate emergency response. access is by means of a private 
road and the building cannot be viewed from the public way, a monument, pole or other sign or 
means shall be used to identify the structure. Address identification shall be maintained. 

SECTION 507.5.1 "WHERE REQUIRED" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 507.5.1 Where Required. Where a portion of the facility or building hereafter 
constructed or moved into or withfn the jurisdiction is more than 150 feet from a hydrant on a fire 
apparatus access road, as measured by an approved route around the exterior of the facility or 
building, on-site fire hydrants and mains capable of supplying the required fire flow shall be 
provided where required by the fire code officrat 

Exceptions: 

1. For Group R-3 and Group U occupancies, the distance requirement shall be 600 feet 
(183 m). 

SECTION 509.3 "FIRE CONTROL ROOM" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 509.3 Fire Control Room. Fire spn"nk/er risers, fire alarm control panels, solar 
photovoltaic power system rapid shutoff switches, and other fire detection, suppression or 
siml'lar control elements shall be located inside a single fire control room for the building. The 
fire control room shall have minimum dimensions of five feet by seven feet in size with a total 
usable area of not less than 35 square feet. The room shall be located within the building on 
an outside wall at a location approved by the Fire Code Official and shall be accessible from 
the exterior. An exterior access door with a clear width of not less than 32 inches and height 
of not fess than 80 inches shall be provided for access into the room. A durable sign shall be 
affixed to the exterior of the door with the words "FIRE CONTROL ROOM" in letters not less 

Ordinance 2022-02 Page8 

23-0015 E 12 of 43 



than 4 inches in height. A key box complying with Section 506 shall be instafled on the exterior 
side of the fire control room door opening. 

The room must be capable of maintaining a minimum temperature of 40 degrees Fahrenheit. 
A clearance of 12 inches shall be provided from the fire sprinkler risers to any adjacent walls. 
Th;s room can be a shared with other building utilities or fire protection equipment that is not 
incompatible. An approved cabinet or container shall be provided to store record plans of the 
fire sprinkler system and other fire protection equipment. This room shall not be used for any 
other storage. 

Exception: One.and two-family dwellings, manufactured homes or similar uses defined 
as either a Group R-3, R3.1, or R-4 occupancy. 

SECTION 510.4.2.3 "STANDBY POWER" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 510.4.2.3 Standby power. In-building, two-way emergency responder 
communication radio coverage systems shall be provided with dedicated standby batteries or 
provided with 2-hour standby batteries and connected to the facility generator power system 
in accordance with Section 1203. The standby power supply shall be capable of operating the 
in-building, two-way emergency responder communication coverage system at 100-percent 
system capacity for a duration of not less than 72 hours. 

Chapter9 

SECTION 903.2 "WHERE REQUIRED" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 903.2 Where Required. Approved automatic sprinkler systems in new buildings and 
structures when constructed or relocated within the jurisdiction shall be provided in the 
locations described in Sections 903.2.1 through 903.2.12 and Sections 903.2.14 through 
903.2.23. 

Exception: Agricultural bui/d;ngs not under a special use permit used for commercial 
purposes. 

SECTION 903.2.1.1 "GROUPA-1" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 903.2.1.1 Group A. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout stories 
containing Group A-1 occupancies and throughout all stories from the Group A-1 occupancy to 
and includrng the levels of exit discharge serving that occupancy where one of the following 
conditions exists: 

1. The fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

2. The fire area has an occupant load of 300 or more. 

3. The fire area is located on a floor other than a level of exit discharge serving such 
occupancies. 

4. The fire area contains a multi-theater complex 

SECTION 903.2.1.2 "GROUP A-2" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 903.2.1.2 Group A-2. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout 
stories containing Group A-2 occupancies and throughout all stories from the Group A-2 

Ordinance 2022--02 Page 9 

23-0015 E 13 of 43 



occupancy to and including the levels of exit discharge serving that occupancy where one of the 
following conditions exists: 

1. The fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet; 

2. The fire area has an occupant load of 100 or more. 

3. The fire area is located on a floor other than a level of exit discharge serving such 
occupancies. 

4. The structure exceeds 3,600 square feet, contains more than one fire area containing a 
Group A-2 occupancy, and is separated into two or more buildings by fire walls of less than 
4-hour fire-resistance rating without openings. 

SECTION 903.2.1.3 "GROUP A-3ff SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 903.2.1.3 Group A-3. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout 
stories containing Group A-3 occupancies and throughout all stories from the Group A-3 
occupancy to and including the levels of exit discharge serving that occupancy where one of the 
following conditions exists: 

1. The fire area exceeds 3, 600 square feet. 

2. The fire area has an occupant load of 300 or more. 

3. The fire area is located on a floor other than a level of exit discharge seiving such 
occupancies. 

4. The structure exceeds 3,600 square feet, contains more than one fire area containing 
exhibition and display rooms, and is separated into two or more buildings by fire walls of 
Jess than 4•hour fire-resistance rating without openings. 

SECTION 903.2.1.4 "GROUP A-4" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 903.2.1.4 Group A-4. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout 
stories containing Group A-4 occupancies and throughout all stories from the Group A-4 
occupancy to and including the levels of exit discharge serving that occupancy where one of the 
following conditions exists: 

1. The fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

2. The fire area has an occupant load of 300 or more. 

3. The fire area is located on a floor other than a level of exit discharge serving such 
occupancies. 

SECTION 903.2.3 "GROUPE" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 903.2.3 Group E. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided for Group E 
occupancies as follows: 

1. Throughout au Group E tire areas greater than 3,600 square feet in area. 

2. The Group E fire area is located on a floor other than a level of exit discharge seiving such 
occupancies. 

Ordinance 2022-02 P82e 10 

23-0015 E 14 of 43 



Exception: In buildings where every cfassroom has not fewer than one exterior exit 
door at ground level, an automatic sprinkler system is not required in any 
area below the lowest revel of exit discharge serving that area. 

3. The Group E fire area has an occupant load of 300 or more. 

4. In rooms or areas with special hazards such as laboratories, vocational shops and other 
such areas where hazardous materials in quantities not exceeding the maximum allowable 
quantity are used or stored. 

5. Throughout any Group E structure greater than 3,600 square feet in area, which contains 
more than one fire area, and which is separated into two or more buildings by fire walls of 
less than 4-hour fire resis~nce rating without openings. 

6. For public school state funded construction project$ see Section 903.2.19. 

7. For public school campuses, Kindergarten through 12th grade, see Section 903.2.20 

SECTION 903.2.4 "GROUP F-1" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 903.2.4 Group F~1. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout all 
buildings containing a Group F-1 occupancy where one of the following conditions exists: 

1. A Group F-1 fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

2. A Group F-1 fire area is located more than three stories above grade plane. 

3. The combined area of all Group F-1 fire areas on arr floors, including any mezzanines, 
exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

SECTION 903.2.7 "GROUP M" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 903.2.7 Group M. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout buildings 
containing a Group M occupancy where one of the following conditions exists: 

1. A Group M fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

2. A Group M fire area is located more than three stories above grade plane. 

3. The combined area of all Group M fire areas on all floors, including any mezzanines, 
exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

5. The structure exceeds 3,600 square feet, contains more than one fire area containing a 
Group M occupancy, and is separated into two or more buildings by fire walls of less than 
4-hour fire resistance rating without openings. 

SECTION 903.2.7.2 "GROUP M UPHOLSTERED FURNITURE OR MATTRESSES" SHALL 
BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 903.2.7.2 Group M Upholstered Furniture or Mattresses. An automatic sprinkler 
system ~hall be provided throughout a Group M fire area where the area used for the display 
and sale of upholstered furniture or mattresses exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

SECTION 903.2.8.5 "MANUFACTURED HOMES" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Ordinance 2022-02 Page 11 

23-0015 E 15 of 43 



Section 903.2.5.2 Manufactured Homes. An automatic fire sprinkler system shall be required 
in all new manufactured homes and multi-family manufactured homes intended for use as a 
one-and two-family dwelling. The design and installation of such systems shaft be in 
accordance with California Code of Regulations, Title 25, §4300. 

Exceptions: 

1. Manufactured homes located within an existing mobile home park complying with 
California Health and Safety Code, Division 13, Part 2.1 or 2.3. 

2. Manufactured homes that do not exceed 1,200 square feet ;n size and serve as an 
accessory dwelling unit, as defined in Government Code Section 658502; when the 
existing primary residence on the property is not required to comply with ~alifomia 
Residential Code Section R313.2. 

3. Manufactured homes that do not exceed 320 square feet in size. 

SECTION 903.2.9 "GROUP S-1" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 903.2.9 Group S-1. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout all 
buildings containing a Group S-1 occupancy where one of the following conditions exists: 

1. A Group S-1 fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

2. A Group S-1 fire area is located more than three stories above grade plane. 

3. The combined area of all Group S..;1 fire areas on all floors, including any me2:zanines, 
exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

4. A Group S-1 fire area used for the storage of commercial motor vehicles where the fire 
area exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

SECTION 903.2.10 "GROUP S-2" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 903.2.10 Group S-2. An automatic sprinkler system sharl be provided throughout 
buildings classified as parking garages where any of the following conditions exist 

1. Where the fire area of the enclosed parking garage, in accordance with Section 406.6 of 
the California Building Code, exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

2. Where the enclosed parking garage, in accordance with Section 406.6 of the California 
Building Code, is located beneath other groups. 

Exception: Enclosed parking garages located beneath Group R-3 occupancies. 

3. Where the fire area of the open parking garage, in accordance with Section 406.5 of the 
California Building Code, exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

SECTION 903.2.10.1 "COMMERCIAL PARKING GARAGES" SHALL BE AMENDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section 903.2.10.1 Commercial Parking Garages. An automatic sprinkler system shall be 
provided throughout buildings used for storage of commercial motor vehicles where the fire area 
exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

Ordinance 2022--02 Pne12 

23-0015 E 16 of 43 



SECTION 903.2.22 "GROUP B" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 903.2.22 Group B. An automatic spnnkler system shall be provided throughout all 
bu;/dings containing Group B occupancies where the fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet 

SECTION 903.2.23 "GROUP F-2" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 903.2.23 Group F-2. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout all 
buildings containing Group F-2 occupancies where the fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet 

SECTION 903.6 "WHERE REQUIRED IN EXISTING BUILDINGS AND STRUCTURES" IS 
AMENDED AS FOLLOWS; 

Section 903.6 Where Required Jn Existing Buildings and Structures. An automatic 
sprinkler system shall be provided in existing buildings and structures where required in 
Chapter 11 and as follows: 

1. When there is a change in occupancy classification that results in an increased life safety 
or fire risk, as determined by the fire code official, and the structure exceeds 3,600 square 
feet, an automatic fire sprinkler system shall be installed throughout the building. 

2. In existing buildings 3,600 square feet or greater, other than one and two-family dwelling 
units, and agricultural buildings not under special use permit for commercial purposes, 
where the floor area of the building or structure is increased, such building or structure 
shall be made to conform to Section 903.2. 

Exception: When the building increase is less than 500 square feet. 

3. In existing buildings 3,600 square feet or less, other than one-and two-family dwelling 
units, and agricultural buildings not under special use permit for commercial purposes, 
where the floor area of the building or structure is increased to a total square footage 
over 3,600 square feet, such building or structure shall be made to conform to Section 
903.2. 

Exception: When the building increase is less than 500 square feet. 

SECTION 907.2. "WHERE REQUIRED - NEW BUILDINGS AND STRUCTURES" SHALL BE 
AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 907.2. Where Required - New Buildings and Structures. An approved fire alarm 
system installed in accordance with the provisions of this code and NFPA 72 shall be provided 
in new buildings and structures in accordance with Sections 907.2.1 through 907.2.30 and 
provide occupant notification in accordance with Section 907.5, unless other requirements are 
provided by another section of this code. 

Not fewer than one manual fire alarm box shall be provided in an approved location to initiate 
a fire alarm signal for fire alarm systems employing automatic fire detectors or waterflow 
detection devices. Where other sections of thfs code allow elimination of fire alarm boxes due 
to sprinklers or automatic fire alarm systems, a single fire alarm box shall be installed at a 
location approved by the enforcing agency. 

Exceptions: 

Ordinance 2022-02 Page 13 

23-0015 E 17 of 43 



1. The manual fire alarm box is not required for fire alarm control units systems 
dedicated to elevator recall control, supervisory service and fire sprinkler 
monitoring. 

2. The manual fire alarm box is not required for Group R-2 occupancies unless 
required by the fire code official to provide a means for fire watch personnel to 
initiate an alarm during a sprinkler system, impairment event. Where provided, the 
manual fire alarm box shall not be located in an area that is open to the public. 

3. The manual fire alarm box is not required to be installed when approved by the fire 
code official. 

4. A fire alarm system is not required in one and two-family dwellings, agricultural 
buildings, and other occupancies classified as Group U not under special use 
pennit and/or not used for commercial purposes (e.g. retail sales, food service, 
and/or special events). 

5. Buildings with a floor area less than 500 square feet may be exempt, as determined 
by the fire code official based on buUding construction material and features, 
location, occupancy type, and distance to exposures. 

SECTION 907.2.1.4 KGROUP A UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET" SHALL BE ADDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section 907.2.1.4 Group A Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shall 
be installed in all group A buildings with a floor area less than 3,600 square feet. 

SECTION 907.2.2.3 "GROUP B UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET' SHALL BE ADDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section 907.2.2.3 Group B Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shall 
be installed in all group B buildings with a floor area less than 3,600 square feet. 

SECTION 907.2.3.11 "GROUP E UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET' SHALL BE ADDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section 907.2.3.11 Group E Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shall 
be installed in all group E buildings with a floor area fess than 3,600 square feet. 

SECTION 907.2.4.1 "GROUP F UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET" SHALL BE ADDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section 907.2.4.1 Group F Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shall 
be installed in all group F buildings with a floor area less than 3,600 square feet. 

SECTION 907.2.5.2 "GROUP H UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET' SHALL BE ADDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section 907.2.5.2 Group H Under 3,600 Square Feet An approved fire alarm system shall 
be installed in all group H buildings with a floor area less than 3,600 square feet. 

Ordinance 2022-02 Pm14 

23-0015 E 18 of 43 



SECTION 907.2.6.6 "GROUP I UNDER 3,500 SQUARE FEET" SHALL BE ADDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section 907.2.6.6 Group I Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shall be 
installed in all group I buildings with a floor area less than 3,600 square feet. 

SECTION 907.2.7.2 "GROUP M UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET' SHALL BE ADDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section 907.2.7.2 Group M Under 3,600 Square Feet An approved fire alarm system shall 
be installed in all group M buildings with a floor area less than 3,600 square feet. 

SECTION 907.2.8.4 "GROUP R-1 UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET' SHALL BE ADDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section 907.2.8.4 Group R-1 Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shall 
be installed in all group R-1 buildings with a floor area less than 3,600 square feet. 

SECTION 907.2.9.4 •GROUP R-2, R-2.1, R-2.2 UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET" SHALL BE 
ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 907.2.9.4 Group R-2, R-2.1, R-2.2 Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm 
system shall be installed in all group R-2, R-2.1, R-2.2 buifding:S with a floor area less than 
3, 600 square feet. 

SECTION 907.2.10.1 "GROUP S UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET" SHALL BE ADDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section 907.2.10.1 Group S Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shall 
be installed in all group S buildings with a floor area less than 3,600 square feet. 

907.2.30 "TYPE I HOOD INSTALLATIONS" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

907.2.30 1'Type I Hood Installations. The requirement of installation, or replacement, of a 
Type I Hood System shall require a fire alarm/sprinkler monitoring system to be installed, or 
for the hood system to be connected to an existing fire alarm/sprinkler monitoring system for 
that building. 

907.6.5 "MON1TORING" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

907.6.5 Monitoring. Fire alarm systems required by this chapter or by the California Building 
Code shall be monitored by an approved, UL certified, Type A Full Service central, proprietary 
or remote station service, which gives audible and visual signals at a constantly attended 
location. Alf sprinklered buildings shall be monitored. 

Exceptions: 

1. One- and two-family dwellings (R-3 Occupancies and other occupancies classified 
as "U'J. 

Or<fina11ce 2022-02 

23-0015 E 19 of 43 



2. Agricultural buildings not under special use permit and/or not used for commercial 
purposes (e.g., retails sales, food seNice, and/or special events). 

SECTION 907.6.2.1 "SECONDARY POWER SUPPLY" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

SECTION 907.6.2.1 SECONDARY POWER SUPPLY. Where required by the fire code official, 
in accordance with NFPA 72, the secondary power supply providing a minimum 24-hour power 
capacity under quiescent load (system operating in a non-a/am, condition) shall be amended 
to a minimum 72-hour power capacity. 

Exception: The existence of an emergency back-up power supply that meets or exceed 
the requirements of California Fire Code Chapter 12. 

SECTION 907.9 "WHERE REQURIED IN EXISTING BUILDINGS" SHALL BE AMENDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

SECTION 907.9 Where Required. An approved fire alarm system shall be provided in existing 
buildings and structures where required in Chapter 11 and in existing buildings with a floor 
area less than 3,600 square feet without an approved automatic sprinkler system, other than 
one- or two-family dwelling units, agricultural bui/d;ng not under special use permit for 
commercial purposes where a fire alarm detection system does not exist and the floor area of 
the building or structure is increased 

Exception: When the building increase is Jess than 500 square feet. 

Chapter 12 

SECTION 1203.1.3 "INSTALLATIOW SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 1203.1.3 lnstanation. Emergency power systems and standby power systems shalr 
be installed in accordance with the California Building Code, the California Electrical Code, 
NFPA 11 O and NFPA 111. All buildings, other than one- and two-family dwelling units, and 
agricultural buildings not used for commercial purposes, with standby power, shall have a 
shunt tnp device that disconnects all power sources to the building, approved by the fire code 
official. Existing installations shall be maintained in accordance with the original approval. 

Chapter33 

SECTION 3311.3 "PREMISE !DENTIFICATJON" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 3311.3 Premise Identification. Prior to and during construction, an approved 
address sign shall be provided at each fire and emergency vehicle access road entry into the 
project. 

SECTION 3313.1 "WHEN REQUIRED;' SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 3313.1 When Required. An approved water supply for fire protection, either 
temporary or permanent, shall be installed and maintained in continuous operation as soon as 
combustible building materials arrive on site, the commencement of vertical combustible 

Ordinance 2022-02 Pa2e 16 

23-0015 E 20 of 43 



construction and on installation of a standpipe system in buildings under construction, in 
accordance with Sections 3313.2 through 3313.5. 

Exception: The fire code official is authorized to reduce the fire-flow requirements for 
isolated buildings or a group of buildings in rural areas or small communities where the 
development of full fire-flow requirements is impractical. 

Chapter 50 

SECTION 5001.7 "LIABILITY FOR DAMAGES" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 5001. 7 Liability for Damages. Any damages or cost resulting from the negligence, 
violation of the Jaw, careless handling, spill or discharge of any hazardous materials shall 
constitute debt against any such person, firm or corporation causing such spill or discharge. 
This debt is collectible by the Fire Chief, or his/her duly authorized representative, in the same 
manner as in the case of an obligation under contract, expressed or implied. 

Chapter 56 

SECTION 5601.2 ~PERMIT REQUIRED" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 5601.2 Permit Required. Permits shall be required as set forth in Section 105.5 and 
regulated in accordance with this section. Where fireworks permits are required, they shall be 
issued by the Fire Chief, or his/her duly authorized representative, and the El Dorado County 
Board of Supervisors. 

Chapter 57 

SECTION 5704.2.9.6.1 MLOCATIONS WHERE ABOVE-GROUND TANKS ARE 
PROHIBITED" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

SECTION 5704.2.9.6.1 Locations Where Above-Ground Tanks are Prohibited. Storage of 
Class I and Class JI flammable liquids in above-ground tanks outside of buHdings is prohibited 
within the limits established by law as the limits of districts in which such storage is prohlbited. 
Storage of Class I and Class II flammable liquids in above-ground tanks outside of buildings is 
prohibited unless approved by the fire code offteial. 

SECTION 5706.2.4.4 "LOCATIONS WHERE ABOVE-GROUND TANKS ARE PROHIBITED" 
SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

SECTION 5706.2.4.4 Locations Where Above-Ground Tanks are Prohibited. The storage 
of Class rand Class II liquids in above-ground tanks is prohibited within the limits established 
by law as the limits of districts in which such storage is prohibited. Storage of Class J and Class 
/I liquids in above-ground tanks is prohibited unless approved by the fire code official. 

Chapter 58 

Ordinance 2022..()2 Pa~e 17 

23-0015 E 21 of 43 



SECTION 5806.2 "LIMITATIONS~ SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

SECTION 5806.2 Limitations. Storage of flammable cryogenic fluids in stationary containers 
outside of buildings is prohibited within the limits established by law as the limits of districts in 
which such storage is prohibited. Storage of flammable cryogenic fluids in stationary containers 
outside of buildings is prohibited unless approved by the fire code official. 

Chapter 61 

SECTION 6104.2 "MAXIMUM CAPACITY WITHIN ESTABLISHED LIMITS" SHALL BE 
AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

SECTION 6104.2 Maximum Capacity within Established Limits. Within the rimits 
established by law restricting the storage of liquefied petroleum gas for the protection of heavily 
populated or congested areas, the aggregate capacity of any one installation shall not exceed 
a water capacity of 2,000 gallons. The storage of liquefied petroleum gas in excess of an 
aggregEJte of 2,000-gallon water capacity when located at least one-half (112) mile from 
property zoned or designated for residential use and at least one-half (112) mile from existing 
residential development with a density greater than one (1) dwelling unit per acre and at least 
one-half (112) mile from any hotel or motel is 81/owed when approved by the fire code official, 
and a special/conditional use permit is issued by the County of El Dorado. 

Dispensing within established limits. Within the limits estabNshed by Jaw restricting the 
dispensing of liquefied petroleum gas for the protection of heavily populated or congested 
areas, the aggregate capacity of any one installation shall not exceed a water capacity of 2,000 
gallons. The dispensing of liquefied petroleum gas in excess of an aggregate of 2,000.gallon 
water capacity when located at least one-half (1/2) mile from property zoned or designated for 
residential use and at least one-half (112) mile from any hotel or motel is allowed when 
approved by the fire code official and a special/conditional use permit is issued by the County 
of El Dorado. 

Chapter80 

SECTION 80, NFPA 1-22, CHAPTER 22 "AUTOMOTIVE WRECKING YARDS" IS ADOPTED, 
AMENDED SECTIONS AS FOLLOWS: 

Revise Section 22.3 as follows: 

22.3 Fire department access roads shall be in accordance with the Californra Fire Code, 
Section 503 and Appendix D. 

Add new Section 22.1 o as follows: 

22.10 Stored vehicles, boats, recreational vehicles. parts, and equipment shall not be stored 
within 30 feet of adjacent property lines. · 

Ordinance 2022-o2 Pa11e 18 

23-0015 E 22 of 43 



SECTION 80, NFPA, 130-22 - "STANDARD FOR THE INSTALLATION OF SPRINKLER 
SYSTEMS IN ONE-AND TWO FAMIL y DWELLINGS AND MANUFACTURED HOMES" rs 
AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 903.3.1.3, 903.3.5.1.1 

NFPA 13D, Arnended Sections as follows~ 

Add new Section 4.6 as follows: 

4.6 Res;dential fire sprinkler systems installed in all new one-and two-family dwellings shall utilize 
a "Passive Purge" system des;gn unless otherwise approved by the fire code official. 

Exception: Manufactured home. installed, tested r;1nd approved by the California 
Department of Housing and Community Development. 

Revise Section 5.1.1.2 as folrows: 

5.1.1.2 A supply of at least one of each type and temperature sprinkler used within the premises 
shell be maintained on the property at an approved location. Spare sprinklers shall be kept in a 
mounted and accessible cabinet. 

Revise Section 7.6 as follows: 

7.6 A local audioMsual device activated upon water flow shall be provided on all fire sprinkler 
systems in homes at an approved location on the exterior of the dwefling. 

Revise Section 11.2.1.1 as fottows: 

11.2.1.1 Where a fire department pumper connection is not provided, the system shall be 
hydros1atically tested at a minimum pressure of 150 pounds per square inch gauge for no less 
than a 30-minute duration without evidence of leakage. Such test shall be witnessed by the fire 
code official. 

Appendix B - Fire Flow Requirements for Buildings 

TABLE B105.1(1) "REQUIRED FIRE FLOW FOR ONE- AND TWO-FAMILY DWELLINGS, 
GROUP R-3, AND R-4 BUILDINGS AND TOWNHOUSES" SHALL BE AMENDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

TABLE B105.1 (1) REQUIRED FIRE FLOW FOR ONE- AND TWO-FAMILY DWELLINGS, 
GROUP R-3, AND R-4 BUILDINGS AND TOWNHOUSES 

FIRE-FLOW AUTOMATIC MINIMUM FIRE- FLOW DURATION 

CALCULATION SPRINKLER SYSTEM FLOW (hours) 

AREA (Design Standard) (gallons per 

(square feet) minute) 

0-3,600 No automatic sprinkler 1,000 1 

system 

Ortiin;inr.,. ?O?.?..fl? Pave 1~ 

23-0015 E 23 of 43 



3,601 and greater No automatic sprinkler Value in Table Duration in Table 

system B105.1(2) B105.1(2) at the 

required fire.flow 

rate 

MAJOR SUBDIVISIONS (5 PARCELS OR GREATER) 

0-3,600 Section 903.3.1.3 of the 1,000 1 
CA Fire Code or Section 

313.3 of the CA 
Residential Code 

3,601 and greater Section 903.3.1.3 of the 1/2 value of 
CA Fire Code or Section Table B105.1(2) 2 
313.3 of the CA (min. 1000 
Residential Code GPM) 

OTHER RESIDENTIAL DEVELOPMENT 

0-3,600 Section 903.3.1.3 of the 500 1 
CA Fire Code or Section 
313.3 of the CA 
Residential Code 

3,601 and greater Section 903.3.1.3 of the 1/2 value of Table 1 

CA Fire Code or Section 8105.1(2) (min. 

313.3 of the CA 750GPM) 
Residential Code 

TABLE B105.2 "REQUIRED FIRE FLOW FOR BUILDINGS OTHER THAN ONE- AND 
TWO-FAMILY DWELLINGS, GROUP R-3, AND R-4 BUILDINGS AND 
TOWNHOUSES" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

TABLE B105.2 REQUIRED FIRE FLOW FOR BUILDINGS OTHER THAN ONE­
AND TWO-FAMILY DWELLINGS, GROUP R-3, AND R-4 BUILDINGS AND 

TOWNHOUSES 

AUTOMATIC MINIMUM FIRE- FLOW DURATION 

SPRINKLER SYSTEM FLOW (hours) 

(Design Standard) (gallons per minute) 

No automatic sprinkler Value in Table Duration in Table B105.1(2) 
system 8105.1(2) 

Section 903.3.1.1 of the 25% of the value in Duration in Table B 105.1{2) at 

CA Fire Code Table B105.1(2)b the reduced flow rate 

b. The reduced fire flow shall not be fess than 1,500 gpm 

Ordinance 2022-02 Paee20 

23-0015 E 24 of 43 



Appendix D - Fire Apparatus Access Roads 

SECTION D103.1 "ACCESS ROAD WIDTH WITH A HYDRANT" SHALL BE AMENDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section D103.1 Access Road Width with a Hydrant. Where a fire hydrant is located on a 
fire apparatus access road, the minimum road width shall be 26 feet (7925 mm), exclusive of 
shoulders (see Figure D103.1}. 

Excepllon:Driveways 
. . 

SECTION D103.2 ~GRADE" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

SECTION 0103.2 Grade. Fire apparatus access roads and driveways shall not exceed 15.9% 
in grade unless approved by the fire code official or by the El Dorado County amended 
California Public Resource Code Title 14 I Design and Improvement Standards Manual. 

SECTION 0103.3 "TURNING RADIUS" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

SECTION D103.3 Turning Radius. The minimum turning radius shall be determined by the 
fire code officiar; and shall not include curb and gutter. 

SECTION 0103.5 °FIRE APPARATUS ACCESS ROAD GATES" SHALL BE AMENDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

SECTION 0103.5 Fire Apparatus Access Road Gates. Gates securing the fire apparatus 
access roads shall comply with all of the following criteria: 

1. Where a singre gate is provided, the gate width shall be not less than 20 feet (6096 mm). 
Where a fire apparatus road consists of a divided roadway, the gate width shall be not less 
than 15 feet (3658 mm). 

2. Gates shall be of the horizontal swing, horizontar slide, vertical lift or vertical pivot type. 

3. Construction of gates shall be of materials that allow manual operation by one person. 

4. Gate components shall be maintained in an operative condition at an times and replaced 
or repaired when defective. 

5. Electric gates shall be equipped with a means of opening the gate by fire department 
personnel for emergency access. Emergency opening devices shall be approved by the 
fire code official. 

6. Methods of locking shall be submitted for approval by the fire code official. 

7. Electric gate operators, where provided, shall be listed in accordance with UL 325. 

8. Gates intended for automatic operation shall be designed, constructed and installed to 
comply with the requirements of ASTM F2200. 

SECTION D103.6.1 "ROADS 20 TO 29 FEET IN WIDTH" SHALL BE AMENDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Ordinance 2022-02 Pa2e 21 

23-0015 E 25 of 43 



SECTION D103.6.1 Roads 20 to 29 feet in width. Fire lane signs as specified in Section 
0103.6 shall be posted on both side of fire apparatus access roads that are 20 to 29 feet wide 
(6096 to 8534.4 mm). 

SECTION 0103.6.2 "ROADS MORE THAN 29 FEET IN WIDTH" SHALL BE AMENDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

SECTION D103.6.2 Roads more than 29 feet in Width. Fire lane signs as specified in Section 
D103.6 shall be posted on one side of fire apparatus access roads more than 29 feet wide 
(8534.4 mm) and less than 36 feet wide (10972.8 mm). 

SECTION D104.4 "CIRCUMFERENTIAL FIRE APPARATUS ACCESS ROADS" SHALL BE 
ADDEO AS FOLLOWS: 

SECTION D104.4 Circumferential Fire Apparatus Access Roads. fNhen required by the 
fire code official, a fire apparatus access road shall be constructed to encompass the entirety 
of a structure and shall provide a continuous means of emergency vehicle access. 

SECTION 4: CONFLICT 

That Ordinance No. 2019-01 of the ECFPD, and all other ordinances or parts of ordinances 

herewith are hereby repealed. 

SECTION 5: SEVERABIUTY 

If any Ordinance, article, subsection or subdivision thereof, provision, sentence, clause or 

phrase of this code, or any application thereof, is for any reason herd to be invalid by a court 

of competent jurisdiction, such decision shall not affect the remaining provisions of this code, 

which can be given effect without the invalid portions and, therefore, such fnvalid portfoos are 

declared to be severable. The ECFPD hereby declares that it would have enacted this 

Ordinance and each of its articles, sections, subsections, or subdivisions thereof, provisions, 

sentences, clauses or phrases irrespective of the fact that one or more of them is declared 

invalid. 

SECTION 6: EFFECTIVE DATE AND PUBLICATION 

This Ordinance shall take effect thirty (30) days after its adoption. The ECFPD Board 

Secretary is directed to publish this ordjnance in a newspaper of general circulation in the 

District. In lieu of publication of the full text of the ordinance, a summary of the ordinance may 

be published by the by the Board Secretary within fifteen (15} days after its passage and a 

Ordinance 2022--02 Paee 22 

23-0015 E 26 of 43 



certified copy shall be posted in the office of the ECFPD pursuant to Government Code Section 

36933(c) (1). 

The above Ordinance was introduced at a meeting of the Board of Directors of the ECFPD on 

September 30, 2022, and it was then read for the first time. A public hearing was set for the 

Ordinance to be read for the second time on October 20, 2022 and approved by the following 

vote: 

PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of Directors of the ECFPD this,";) (_'. day of 

()\ -tfi} 7 P .;,··-·, 2022. 

NOES: --

ABSTAIN: -· 

~ J -,-;.t.-, 1·,J 

Chris Swarbrick'. Board Chair 

Ordinance 2022--02 Page23 

23-0015 E 27 of 43 



EDl!CWD DSP, ECr. Ci'CSD, PFPO, RFPD 

F,r: Co.dt:: 
Sqn hcJnt 

\11';.•t ts ~-:c Ch,,ngc" 
LO<Jlly JX'!):•j: S•'-4 J:kott'<I / 

chJngc> J.m,sdcd 
\'I .. ; I~ '"'hNC a _c:i C,:.~c" 

11)1 1 N AnMd Wit/I Iha nane ol the Jur,utlon t=r~ 3dcD!oo and a,iilJOded lm:irGZ. .... need 

105.5 II Amend to Include ad<lilioo of A.ulorooble Wrecking 
locally adOpled :.Kl amerded Mnnstra1111e need due lo addi!Jon of setllOn 105.5.55. 

Y~opeta!ioNI pe1mil 

AJoo,,s the fire OOde olfioa1 lO enloo:e Vie Are code ($ll6Clflc 

105 5.55 y Adil seaion to require operational permil lor 
LocaJy C!9a!ed and adopted 

'a fire access, wgetatron clearanr.es, llazardaus matsrlals, 

)\t.~O'tl® le Wl9Cl<ing Yar>:!s. 
etc.}, wi!hn automOCIJe wr8Cli.'1~ yard operations. Th!S was 
• demcnslraled need experleoced \0/ilhin the Diamond 
Sl)!inir, fue Department 

105.6 N 
Ad:l secoon to requie constmct,on permit for Locaf)' crealed 811d adopted 

Admlnisll'3JV\! need due to attdtk>n of sectkm 100.6.25 aid 
.\IIIOmobi:e Wreoing Yards. 105.6.26 

~rows the r.e oode ollia'al to enforce the tie code (sptd'ic 
Md - to requ·re conShU:tion penntt rt>r 105.6.25 y 
IAuto"'oble Wred<ing Yards. 

Locally created and act:,p,:ed 
t~ fll1 ¥.CeSS, ,iegelaOor, etearnnces, hazardous msfefials, 
ex.) 'MM tle'llly oonSITIJCled .andlo! modWted automobile 
M'e.$.i>g ya/ll operatiollS .. 

A!low$ tli& Bre coire oflicial 10 review ard appn;,ve,:J 113ffic 

105.6.26 N 
,',dd seclror1 to require construction permit for the 

Localy created and adopted 
cam.no cr&ii(es prior to 1nstalab011. Fire Cede rurrenffy 

nstallation of traffic calming devices 
perm Is tile fire oode ollldal ID rEgUlale traffic calming 
118\i.z. tto-M:wr, a permit isni curMII{ reQu1r~ prior to 
lr1S1ab•01 causing unt!I>! hardship lo 

Adapirg ttus sd011 IO slow l'or11!e creaiion and wance 

107.5 N Section Added ~sly sectoo106.6. I.Q(;a,ly adopted and amended 
at fees IOaiYer iit111al cos1s. Section 1il5.5defines perrniu, 
Ji1n Checb. and 11\spedions as altowed in Heallh &Sil/ely 
Code1~1. 

107,5.1 N SeCl01 ilddeG Pr!'i~y.ea,on I06.ll.l 1.ocan, etea!ed eod adoplBII 
Sec'.San 107 5.1 Cost Rsoow11y Fees:To-rllle(l!Stb 
;t,, FweO!s'Tici 

107.7 y Secbor1 ad:led. Ptevioosly SSC!lon 106 7 Locally mated ~I!~ 
So!dol 107.7 To Jl!(l),er the ac1uat COIis cf a'IQidalle 
'a.JOO inspectors by co,!r.lctllrs. 

Seciill!l 111.li or Chaptsr 1 or Ille Flm Code of lhe llslrict Is 
ad<P.d 1D rud as lalows· 
111.li Appeal F'roce<tJres and Tlmeli•~· The 1n~of 1111$ 
prov,s on ,s loclalify the pll'CeduOJS anllllmellnes for an 

111.$ y ~ n added Previously section 109.4 LOcaly adal)led and amended ncfvi1Jal or entily IO Ille an aweal 10 11,e Board ot Appeas 
,eg.w'ng ir1 otder,decislOII. Oldetl!tmination by!lle F~e 
C.CCle 011::a Based on the CoonlyofB OQnldQ'S 

V~a:ioo Manegeinent Ordn..ioe bd of Appeals' 
•ime:,ne. 

P,e,i,Jus.'y $e<ll00 110.4, ComJ]let8d !he sediOil ill' 
AlloY,s !he Fiie Codi! Official to enloroe lhe Finl Cooe lhat 

112.4 N 
bl1119 in tile blank portions that were not completed Locallfadojted and amended 

;itO:eas lie ard property. Fees ha.e ~ updalEd to 

l:t( die $FM It II better I~ ID local~ todelemiine 
m alch Ille fees and penaJtiilS as deened aiiproprlate by the 

lhe reetlpenalties for their respecllve areas Distria Aa:.noy'$ Offlce Thecllangero!he lang~age to 
lrd!lde lhe ltlrTn in lracticns. 

ll2A.2 Crtalllfls,u ddedlo A!ad as fo!Ql,E: 1124,2 
Clti!l'.ons 
Tile Are Cllfef l)(hiS.lher duty au~ reprasenla!hoe{s). 

112,42 1'I Sedllfl added, ~'10Ulsy sec11on t 10.4. l-0calty crealed and adopted 
m.Tf Issue dlatlons 1br riflaclioos or misdeneaior 
v.o!a?JOll, of thi& code lkJl'Sllant 10 Sedi:rJ 13871 of lb$ 

,leallh ~nd Safety Codeof lhe state of Clll1!omia and 
Cll.lir.nr 5c {Ollllmencil9 with sedlocl 853.6) of TIie 3 of 
P~ 2 of the Penal Code of !ht- State of Caiiamia. 

Pte'l!Ouslf &edm 112.4. Completed the leclian by 

1114 
II ng ii 1/lt blenv l)CJrti-Oll$ lllaf ,;we ~ comJ]letGCI M vio~t:c,115 of the code hiM:! been OOAIOlidaled under 

N ~!!'e SFM, ft lsbefferfe1ftolocallliesto Looaly adoped and amended 
detenune Ille !~Hies fllrlllelr lllSj)8dJVe 

Secfon 112.4 !o include !he penal des ftlr vlolatioos. -
23-0015 E 28 of 43 



~ed aetnitw n. campfire. Dive-,. Dtslricl. 
~ Body. Fie Chief, Fi111 ttazao. Open Bunwig, al>d 

202 N Added lf8iiW!Jon& ror <lari!y LDcallv aead and ad0pl.ed Traned CIIMd Manager llelnnion olopeo buPWlg wC 
lnOI ~ ,esade,lllal I.PG. n~ural gas flleled. or wood 
~ alll)iaices norQ!ll!fllOrul' ~-

302.1 N Mled deWiln ofcampfilefo Secricn Locally~ illld adollled ,t,Dded dc~n:lbl ror darily. 

Addtd a seQion bl open blmng mstrtctions. t\ie 10 lie~ fRclqtr 1181 eids!S 111 El DoradoCot.llly 

3074.4 y Language darilied liom campfl,e ID cpen bllming ID l.oo!8y creeled and adol)ted 
l!llQOOIClilS$ 11A scope of opin ll!ming 

1M h.M: wnllen 1110~ ~rules J)M8iling lo open flret 

lllqlll'lllllen!S, 
l,oit!iing,ass, 1)ru811, anCIMQ),oJlllO.!la 

401.2.1 H 
Added .sedlon to !i<!Ulra pre-ire pl.,,s for ne,. l.ooillytrwtedanda<t,pted 

Pr<Mdes Ille eremno/ a floor plan far~ pi,po,se ol 

andor modifledcons!ruclion. 
i-mel!l8"CY planning lei be ulll:!.ed by emergency respcme 
per,mnel. 

1-re ~ are beco:lllflQ ..-ind t,llilr. A vri:81 
~ of 15 feel pmde9 JlfflPIII dearalK:e fDr 
llll)MalUs 10 PIGli underwilhoul~ apparaltos 
lcanponen!s. a also allows an l!Xlende61itl8 fra111e beb~ 

503.2.1 N 
Cllangechertlcal r:le.ifllnces ID 15feet tlld roaa It i\ing D recllllhe g,ll'!!lloflhe ,ege1af0ft. AdtJlfQNI 

"4dlh$1P 20 feet 
i-ity adol)ted and iwnerded ~hi fllr wigelalicx! cfear.r1ces ac!s asan «rea.td bu1l1lr 

ror Ille l!Rad cf fi.1! A niad width ol 20 feel exc!usiY& al 
shooklels, as ._iedfaceof ClllblO laleclcurbis 
j/Wldl!<l Tlla!:e 5111ldurescan IJedlflcl/Nb n~llilh 
lt,t ~Ills Md sllculd IIOt btCOll!ledtl the Iola 
~ road •Uffaa:. 

Added atpecific sedilln fllr Rl's "'ere tt alk>wS Ille 
lfre ll!¥';irn,s llql1le aieas bl IIJmillg JJWnd when 

5032.5 N 
Fll8 Oxla ard fllle 14 Fire Safe Re9Jla!)Jns to 

~ adopllld ..S alllencled 
'1Ul!C)fe whdes a.-e en l/leseentolar lllllelgenCy. Tll~ 

lnall:h as Jle1 ieq,n 1Umaoond$ ror ire appall!M 
r.mas Ire l/ehicles as 11el as dvfllan vdlides. Pnwlde$ 

acwss road& and driveways 
i,.,ier access 1or rng"eSSfe9VSS Alkl~v. 8<IIIS lVln 
¥OOnd for ~ in ~ geallllrlh.n 150'. 

NrMCIOOfS andsta1dads lilrBltdgasud ElaYated 
Cllanged Ile secllon 1i1r Bridges and Eleved Sum:es cf El Dorado Counfy811dAjlpbfx D ol!he 

503.2.6 N 
$Jrfacles ID~ and IPaldl El Dora,)) C.Ovnty lncaly adopted and amended 

~ fn Code. whi:ll!Mr is IDfl re.wtfl,e, (0 be 
TranSjl(lrlalm DMsion in addillon lo AASHTO HB- ~-lll~COUllly ~ andiS alO'M!d as an 
17 (mWmum CFC ,equlred) .fttrnite muns & melhad that Is nol less 19Striche lhan 

the Fire Ccda. 

503.3.1 Joi 
PtlMllUSly section 503.4.2. Added sedion mgiltdlng LocalyCJmld 811d ajOplaa 

fllis sectirJn deady defll1es lhe "No Parl:ii'lil 11 FiRl lanes" 

no ~g Inn Janell l1lll!s ands c:onsis1ent witll the Caijfofllla Vehlde Cr.Ide. 

503.3.2 N 
101l!Vb111ly SedlOII 503.4 3. Added Sl!Clioo l?glldilg 

ITh;s sedian dealy deliH!s !lie 'Ho Par14"Q in lrtlrlt of fire 

IIHl parlring in front of hy«anl$ 
Lccally Cl'lllllld Md aelol)led lt~is· 111teund is C00SISflll11 f<ilh Ille California Vehlcfe 

Code 

503.3.3 N 
l're¥!ously S8lilaa 503.4.4. Added seaion regardqi Localy~andad01)1ed 

This seciion clearlydefillBS Calltimill FbCod.l AcJpeA1b 0 

fll8 la'le$ baSeCI 011 roe!! '4iid1h 
as Ille ~noe lot~ !ant '1lld1II andtbei"Rllm! to fin? 
t.ries. 

PrMuslv ser.'lico 503.5.3. Cteal8d a11I adopted IAl!ows &e 4-sllds the M1cnry 10 ~ gaCes on 
503.6 to lllillltaill emergency access and 

503.6 N lccnsislerctlllllllJOll ~ ~galas IA El Dotado LaeallycieateO and 8CIO~ 
~ based en f1e llls1llcl's !Jail! $Mi!RI. jllOVldl,O 

County. merring IO the gall! standards adapted ~ 
lltie llestposs,bleeme,.erq, 11001!UIOIM1llaln t.151 

fleFPO's 
i-se~ 

505.1 N 
Adjed $OClbl pertamgto Ille 'll&ual aa:n.in.i °' Locally aclapilld and a111ended 

1At1ows 11.-e clslnds lhe aulhalil)' IO~ addrm,lng 
bufdngs !based on lhe llillrict's addlesslng &ta~. 

Adia::t more c:msel'lali.e standard tir 1he 
lcommeroa ~ are recilired lO illltafl h)dranir at 

507.S.1 N placement of hydrants aw:! Mr reklfonihlp 10 Locally aclojled and a11'1c!rded 
13ll lual inteMlls, lhusllley shllllld newrbeovtsideof 150 

lcolnmllfl:ial blJiiings 
leel fmm any giwn nydranl al ~Yfl111t Oiall the dislarlce 
·nbet_,). 

23-0015 E 29 of 43 



~10in95 are ~ moie si.zable m Ille c:wnty, n ,s more 
""""'1DI ro have new lllildlngs will satar a,rays lllat 
lcontnua ro genem, Jl()IW!j'eveo iollen re buldings 

509.3 y Added "8ltllage fa bli~ all of the necessary fire 
(lelltfal ali6es ha'ie been shlll off. Wllai lllere is an 

ccnt:o~ br a bull:ing r, on& laeallon 
Locafy«nB!ed and adople(I emergency, I ,:; •Ual lllal ~ llaYe rapid aca!SS i> al of Ille 

CXlll:n:ors ,n one ICcaticrt fcrpubl'cewa,alion and liefd)ter 
si/8b' Due to 1lie fire (laBg9t piesent iR 8 Ooralb County 
lllrllll!lhout most ol'the 'fe0J', llis di~ 1uppmprlae and 
~ 

510.4.2.3 y EineJDency Responder Rado Syslelll S8cctldary 
~If~ and 1111!811del3 

iAmend lo n hour capaciy fo< bac:IHJp power due ID 
Ptlwer S:¢, ModbSon ~erandPG&Eutel)relaledcew«cu~. 

9032 
,'ajs a ~lmnenl fer spMlder S)'Stem inwalal Mninisir.Mi'..a need dut to 3liitol Qf ,et1;,n 003.2.22 and 

H in new blitd'.ngs aid structures 3,600 square lttt or Locally ado,Pled alld ainer)jed 
9taaler wilhwi Ille d'-51rlcl 

903.2.Zl 

Due fa dletc,p,grap,k:. dimallc. and gecgraplllccolldlllons 

Pr!Mlusly sedion 9032 1. ldd3 a niqui111m8flt for 
al B Oolado Counry and 1hel1 oontril:utilg facb's to our 

903.2.1.1 N 
W.nlder system 111.tal3'.10n In r.ew Group A Ulealy .mpled and amended 

itlaeased O.Spon$8 lineS, along wifll Ille fad lhal fife& 

ludings and swttures 3,600 square leet or 
double In size each ;ricf every mln1J111,.,,., ""1ire 51)riftlders 

!Jllaler wlli!o Ille dlsb!CI 
to tit inslafelf II Slruclures once ffley ll!aClt 3,600 squn 
feel it sil<! as Uiey relate to fire befl/11/i,Jf .illd rate of 

. spread. 

l}Je to Iha tq:ograplic, dimatic, and geag131)hic oon<i!MS 

PtevoJsty sec;oon !m.2.1. Mis a n,qureme,,lfcr of 8 Oof!do COllnly and their conbibulalg ladors 1D oor 

903.2.1.2 N 
sp,'nkler system inslallalion in new Groop A-1 

ncreased rasponse ttnes, along .vi1h the ~ lh;it N 

buJl!lll!ls 3tld &troctures 3,600 S41uare reet or 
Locally aa~ and amended ldo~ 11 size each and --, mmle, ,_, require spmlders 

~ w'lhin the dist/Id 
:o be instaled n srru<:1ures once lhey rtadl 3,600 $<111iN! 
1111 m size as that relate to ft19 tleh.i>ior illld tale of 
.p,ead 

CM m lhe iopog,ii:noc. Clinalic. and 900(13llhlc ccrolions 

Pre,nous.y s.!Cllan !nl.2.1. Adds a iaqulrwnent lor 
lof 8 Ocracb Co~nty and It& aintdiuUog fac1or.; to our 

9':ru.1.3 N 
5')1in~e,sySlem instllllalioo u, newGtoopA-2 

~ resp::n.a t""es. akln11 with the fael that fr!S 

blJldngs and stnxtures 3.600 SQ<late le8! (}( 
Locally adop!ed im am811ded dellie in size mi and eve,y minu~ • .., requite s¢nkfers 

g.'11,l'.eJ ..r.nln tt,e oi.lrict 
10 be installed In slrUetJJrfi Qllal u,ey "8di 3,600 ~are 
loot II s,zeas 1/iey n:fa!e l9 ftll! llelliMO!aidrateof 
spead. 

1M la the ro~ie, dimalie. and geoga~lc coo:lltions 

Preoously 5ectiorl 903.21. Adds a cequlremeol re, 
of B Dor.ldD Coonly ana th&'rcontrllu~og facloli t, our 

903.2.1.4 N 
sprirrklersystem instalatioo in newGroupA-3 

Locally ad'.l!1ed and amended 
~ respo.'ISC bme$, af!Mlg with the lac! th;li ffr~ 

buUdilgs end structures 3,600 square feel or 
double In sizeeadi ;,nd eve,y minule, "'~~ sprinklers 

lgieater \Mlhln th~ dislrlcl 
to be instaJ81l in~ once lflll)I read! 3.600 sct/319 
feel 11 size as lhey relate 10 fre beha'llor and rate or 
:l)retla 

Due to the ~gJ3!)hlc. dlma(lc. and ge(Vaphic 00ndi1Jons 

Pre\Wsly sedlon ml.3 Adds a requiremem for 
ol El Dorado Cooney arid their a:,ntnhlllog facto rs to our 

903.23 N 
spMbersysteminstallalion in new Groupe 

naa.md response trm, alollll with Ille lac! 1nat fires 

bullcf~ :ma sll'lldull!s 3.600 ~Ml lee! ot 
Loc:aly adopted and amellded fdoui.i in m each and ,:,,e,y minute,"" teqtnre SPJir,iters 

',J'l!3'E~"M"'1 the dlslJj;t 
t:o be lnslallld 11 srnx:tures ona! they r$1C113,600 square 
~ in Size a& they mlat& to fire beha-.i:Jr and rale of 
spread 

l)i,: to Ille lopograpfic, d imatic, and ge)!Pphil: conditiOns 
ol 8 Dorado County and lllelr ,::,:,nOlbutlngfactors lo our 

M:ls a requirement for spinl:/er sysiem lnslalla1!on inc:reJ5ed respcr,se ltnes, alorg with Ille lact lha1 fires 
9012.4 N C1 '- Q-Q14> F buildings ;,nd Sln.w;tUl\!8 3,600 ~Y ~ am smllnlled doultt II Sim each anll every mlnut&. '.Ml r«1uil! 51)rirtlers 

squaie feel or i,ealef 'MIiion 1he lislrict to Ill! Installed ii sllUclllres OOal they 18111113,600 S(J/319 

feet In SiZe as 1hey llllal&1D fire bell.Morand ra1e of 
~ -
Ou<! lo Ille lDpograJK, cllmalic, 811d ~pnlC colldilions 
fol 9 Oo1'do Coull!)' a/Ill lheirCClllllllulingladors lo our 

Adds a reciu1tetnolllt iOr sprtnkler syslem inslallallon n:reased ri,sponse ti'nes. alOng wifh the fatt that fires 
QXJ.2.7 N in new Group t.1 tuiC1119s and SlrTJC!Ures 3.600 tocallr ~ aid amended d()Vlje in SiZeeaclla/lll Mryminute. MllllQU~ sprll1(.lers 

$qUIIIB fealorgi981etMtllin Ille dl6!JiE:t Ill Ile inslafled ii struClllrl!S OOOI! 1hey l8adl 3,600 S(JJ319 

lee! 111 stm as they relate lo ffre beba,tir DI r.re of 
spead 

23-0015 E 30 of 43 



Oue lo lhe~, dinatic. alll;e<VWphic eo<dlions 
Pleviausly SilClbi1 ll03.2 7 ldds a mqun,112111 for of 1:1 Ooi..dO Cclunl)I afld their ccnltlluting lactari b illll' 
sprirlclersystem Ull!ll1lallall IIMWGroupM wllh increased response umes, atcng ,r,1111 die facl lhat Ins 

9)3.2.7.2 H Upholslm Fumltll/8 ot Mehrehes buikingund uxaly adol)ted ane1 ameroea ~Ille in sim eacll and e.ery m11111le, ..e ~nre Sl)rinklel$ 
$lrUdln'e$ 3,600 5quaie feet or 9reaterwilhin the ID be inSlaled it SllUClures once Ibey teach 3,600 ~are 
dis1rid feel in 611B as lhey reraie 1o Ive lleltmlr aoo rail of 

S/ll'll3d. 

Manule:lured Honw:s - Tit& inlelll of llli$ code aedicl1 ii to 
ensure lllal manafadurad homes 11iat sene as a one or lwo-
family dwelings are oonsislenl ~ the pm;Sions fo!r.d in 
CRC Section 313 pe11aning kl IXilt dwel~ of a similar 
natur.. Ma11ub:tured h-placed ln1he ~~ortball !'reviOusly section 903..2.8.2.Thls setlion was 

LJ>Cally ad-OplecJ .wiamended itterlaee havta he~lelled riSkof rapidfi!!<:1J11Swnpllon 903.28.5 N aeal!!d IO lncJUde mar.iflldwed A!Sidenfial sni1e !due to the listJl-""'V'f nslull! oflhei"~ion. The ta,,ily R-3 in the reSidential Sjlin!<ler ?"OQram 
<ai)id ffre spiead throughout these SU1idln$ p,eseo!s a 
sl!,lllbntrisk ti thelrQCCUpents. Res~ s,:,,IIU!er 
S)'!llems h.M Ileen ineorporabld 111 dee1eaSa ffliS risl( 

succ;essfull~ ii many Gaifomia QXllllunities. 

OuE! lo the toix9apllic, cilnallc, a11d geographic condtioJl$ 

Previously section 903.2.9. Adds a lllQUiremenl for 
ol e ())~ Coun(y end fheil'CQ11I/O!l~ng fllclols to our 
illeleased ~se times, along~ lltefal Iha! Ii'&$ 

003.2.9 N 
sf)IIRlrJer sys1Bnl instalalictl in new~ S 

LOGafy adopred aid amended doullle In llim eadl and every minute, 'M! iequi'e Sl)lillldeti buildings and structures 3,800 squn feet Ot 
to be J11$1jfJed In $11Uclurea once they !WI 3,600 sqll3tll greater within the 6s1riel 
feet In sim as !hey relale to ffre behavior and rat& of 
sp-aao 

Due 1o lhe lop0!Ja!ilk:, dlrnatic, and geogr.iplll; (OrdtiOns 

f'leloioosly sectiOn 903.2. Adds a requirement br ors~ CO~ll!V8"dtlleirconl!il)ijljlgtaaorstoovr 
irlma$8d response omes, a.'oog v.ilh lhe fact that fires 

903210 N sprinkleaysteminslallaoon in """'GJillipS-2 
lJlcally 811oped and amended ibJIH in sla each and •'NY minute, we ,equirn spin kier$ buildings and sitlldtlres 3,600 square feel or 10 be Installed In struc:fles a,ce llley ~ 3,600 squere 

l9r&.1iet -.slhi'J tfte dls1rk:I 
lee! in $1ze as Ille) t81ate 10 ira beha>iar au tale Qf 
spread. 

Due 10 IJl8 top)graphlC, dlmatlc. and geograph;c c:oocftiolls 
of 8 llllraoo Qiunty and their rontnl>ulhg ~ to our f'rerously secllon 803.210. Adel$ a iequire1111111t for 
im:.19ased response times. along llilh tile /act lhal flies 

903.2.10.1 H si;rinkler$1'$~111 ilslallation in newCommeltfaJ 
Locally adol)tedand amencl9d double ltl size eacl1 and e,eiy minlll9. we re(Jllre sprilll<181'$ Parkmg 13.-age Wldlngs and slrucl\1183 3,600 o be ilstaled in structures ooce they l&leh 3,600 square 

squ.i,e feel or graate< wilbll Ille diStlicl 
feet in size as t!ley nilati? to fire bellawlr and rate of 
~pread. 

Ou& 10 tlle to,Jograplic, dfmalic. and ~IC oincitiollS 
ol El Dorado County and their contri~ facfofs lo our Prelliously sedi0fl 903.2 7. Adds a requirement rcr 
increased reiponse lines. along .,;111 the fact tll.lt fies 

9032.22 H 
Sjlflnldersyslem lnstallaiion In new Group B 

tocaly ~ed and amended looutje ii Size each and Mry minut&, ~ requi'e •JO!klers buiGings an<! slruaures 3,600 5quare feet or 
ltobei~eclin ilrueluresonoo they reach 3,&00square ~within ihedstrict 
feel in Sile cl$ th~ relate to fire bell~ an:! rate of 
spe,d. 

DJe to 1h& toriollnt~. dinlatie, and ~le condlloos 

Previo!JS!y sectlc)jt 9fl3J. Meis a requirement h ~f B Dorado County illd lhelr ccn~ibuti,g fnlrs fD o• 
ineleased '8Sj)Of'lse limes, atong 'M'th lhefact that ffru 

903.2.23 N spiiWer~tem inSQllalion in new~ F-2 
I..Dcally lllfDIJled and amerded ldcdie a, ~ e;,ct, and evay rninu!e, we reqiire sprinklers 

buildings .-ridelri.lC:tW86 3.600 SQUare leel!II' 
to be lns1aled lrt ~res onoe they ,each 3,600 $C!Uile greaier willlil Ille dislr'd 
feet in si,e as tlley relale lo fire belia>ior arc! rate of 
sp9ild. 

Pnlvio<lsiy sectiOr1 90l2a. Adds a requirement t> Due IO Ille IOpographic, Mali¢, and geogl'ijllljc oollllltiells 
inSta1 S!)liokteis fo, «listiog tlulldings thaJ undel!IO of B Oonldo Coun(y alld their confributnJ fadors ta oor 
a change In ~seof greater llaz.lrdor an increase in ;,creasec1 feSllOOse times, along -.wlh the fad 111a1 fires 

903.6 V slm gieater than 500 ~arn feet and !he resulltng ur.ally aaated al1d iidol)le9 dooble in s!zeeadl and eve,y milule, ~ '"'l'fie s¢nlders 
square feet is ~er th;ri 3,600 S(luall! feet. tDIM!J insfailed ,n S1ructurascnoe they reach3.600QJaN 
Plevi:lusly al¥(ed to addldon of rr101e lllan 30% 01 feet ill size as ~ iefale to fire bellavtor ill1d rate of 
IOOl SQ!in le«. simif. 

23-0015 E 31 of 43 



ldls1 ---1JrJlallallllsyslBIII 
907.2 N 11S111111on fn-~-lfnldl,s3.600 lor.tly ado!Jed and amended Admlnisln!NI nttd o.t to .icldlicll of sedion 903.2.~ 

~M lee! Of lKS 10i1hin lhe dlsmcl 

PIVVIOUSI)' 9eCl0i'I 907 .2a. AddeCf oa:uplJII 
pntedlon ilt fireal.Vms In Group A 11Ullcing$ '"1tlt a 

~ prlll)e"e<neigency •ollblontroacupi,,des lliat 
9'J7.214 N 

~oor n.1 less than 3.ErlO. eatePt R3, AG hrilclt'(jf 
la(,ity,;,aaladand DJ2ed alow pimlk: use and enS1Jres till! 0epll1rllent noli1blfan in 

llOI used for mtM!ettial purposes, and lx!ildlngs lfleMni olafin,or$1110ke. 
\Ollh a !loo( naof iess 1\811500 8QU.-e fael ~ 
,wro\'9CI tr/ I.he leoodeGlrJCial 

PlfflllA!y ~ 907 2a. Added O<:QJl)llll 
~.00 fer £le ■ill!'IIS in Group B buitdngs IMlh a Pl0\lkles p,ope, ~ nod1lcatiOn tlr cccupande$ lha! 

!m'.2.2.3 N loo< na less lhan 3,000, ~ R3, AGlluild~ locally au:e.:1 ard adootad 3llow publc use .Yid enGUres Fire DepartJnent notifiC811on in 
not vs.cl 601 COrt'lnieteial l)Urposes, and btiding. i',he l!Yl!Jll al a fia or Sll!Oke. 
w1h a ffoor area of 11!38 than 500 t®el'II loiel as 
aw,"O'ltd bl' Ille Ira code olfclal 

l'!ev,ous~f secton 907.2a. Added ~ 
prllledbt ~ffre alalms in ~14' E o.t~ Wl1I a 

Pro>ldu vopei emergency notificatio• for OQCUpmcies that 
907.2.3.11 N 

m 81'811868 llla'I 3,600, emipl R3. AG buidiigs 
Locallytnaled•11I~ alowputilc use and ensures Fire llep.nlelll ~ In 

not useii filr CCll!lltrc:ial .DIIJ)O.W$, •nd bulf:lngs l1l1e e,enJ cf a llre or stnokB. 
W:11 a lcor area of JeS& lliai 500 square feet as 
approved ti/ !he IIR! Clldt oflciel 

f'rtv.<luslySBCIIOtl9072a M!I/JO~ 
I/J")ledlln fer h allms 11 Group F bulcings ld1I • Prow!es prniier emergel'IC'( noffi:alloa !er ~des 11181 

907.2.4.1 N 
roor area Im llian 3.600. aiaipt R3, N3 bulldir,gs 

ID:alyll'BU! alld adoJ)led lalow pql)IIC use afMI ens!Jll!IS Fite Depanment notiicalion in 
not used for ccrrmea;ial purposes. .rJd bi6llngs iltl8Mn1 ofe~o,smo1oe 
'M:11 a loor a,aa of less lllan 500 SQU8le leetas 
~ t,y lilt Cle code official 

PIMlu!:ly sedlon 907.2a. AddedOCClf)3nt 
p.'Olecoon bt Ire alarms in Group H 1:1!.oldiqgs !Mlh p~ ~r emt,-gency nol"tica!iool«ocaJpanaes tltal 

907.2.5.2 N 
,1 tw area less t11a, 3,600, ei:a,pt R3, AG 

locally ctealed and adOjJa,d ~ p,b4c use at>d enaum Fite Oetlemenl notificallon • 
buJdlngs nclvsedftr(IO!'llmerciat ~. and :tie event of a fire er smol<e 
builJngs !loir. a floor area of tess than 500 square 
~ as IPPf0\llld bv Ille lire <;1x1e official 

Prevb1Aly,ec;tion 90728. Ade191%0(l(:Up&Rt 
J)l01edion forlinlalannsmGioop I bcildlng5 llith .i f'ltMde!. proper emeiger.:y nolifil:allOo !or (XQJpancies th.I 

907.2.6.6 H 
t.oor irei less lha1 3,600, ~ R3. AGlllildirQS l.oc:allyaead .Jld~ allow publ1c use and enSUIK Fre Oepam,en1 notikabon in 
not used far rom~ pu1110ses. c11d bllldings the fM!l,t of a fire er s111oke • 
..-lh a llor a~a of18"5 lllall 500 SQuaie feel as 
SWo.t!d by thefl<e cmonlcial 

Prewius!y sectloll 907,2a. Added ~I ~le,,~'"' aJanns 111 ~ M bulldngs with ~es p~ llffll!lgetq nolificalioo u«cupancieS that 
N a floor an!a less lha'1 3,800, 8'lllllll R3 AG l.ocalyaealBd and adoplsd alow p,!ic ur;e .m ensurse FIIB 0ep6lhenl OOlilicalion in ~7.2.12 buidngs not usedftr0ll1lll1M:ial pmposes, and I/le -.i cf a IQ er smcka. 

bulding,-; ,.:1, a floar area cl less tllai !iOO S(Jlar& 

feel as ilW0"8d Dyllle fill eod80flldal 

Prevrusly sedion 907.2a. Added ~I 
pco:ecton lor flle~s in GroupR-1 tiuikljogs Proides proper eme,gency nctme:alDl l:r()CC!Jiiar,cies lhat 

907.284 N 
r,,t:t, a loo( e a It!&! 1han 3,600. e.cept R3, AG 

l.ncalt aealad and adolW alow pubie 116& and tnSUrM F"-e Depanmen1 oolilica!lon In 
~<fngs not ,.:ec, lorOOfllmeldal ~-and the !!\Ult of a iiR: orsmol1l 
:butld.ngs -'1 a toor area of less than 500 square 
leet as aj)j)l'Owd byUle lreaxlll official 

23-0015 E 32 of 43 



P~ iW.'IJon 907.2a Added occupant 
~ brfire alamls In Gro1.11 R-2. R-2.1. anel R 
2 . .2 Wldl~ Wllh a floor area ress lhan 3.iKJO. ~ PRIP8f llOleovencY notibliOn A,OCQJparideS that 

907.2.ll.4 N feir.ept R3. AG balk!ngs not ueeo t>r oomf!IM:i3r ux:alyanll!d and aaop(ad aJOW pul)Wc: use illd ensures Firw Dep.111ment AOOlcafoo in 

~ses. and luldingS llilfl a l'ioor area of less rJiee-ellt riafraorsmo~ 
laia, !lOO square feel as appro>td i,y the lite coda 

~ 

Piemudy sedloll 90728. ~ oea,pa111 
l)l0IJlcll0II lot fire elarlns ,n Gr~up s bulldl1!1J M!h a 

~ l"lfAII tmllllJGll'YnairlCSlion tll'occupenaes 111a1 
907.2101 N 

floor area less than 3.lKJO, $llCePl FU, AG bu,J-
t;r;ll~~Md~ arow p.a.: * and ensuJes F"R oe,ia,tlnerll ncifJcam 1r1 

IIOI usi!d lct'allllmeldal pwposes. llld IM!dlngs lhe a,,anf of a ffre or snioke. 
"""a loor area of less 1h00 500 rq,ae reet as 
approved~ the JIii (:(XI$ aflml 

PN!llioi,sty sectiOn ~7.2d. Adcled oa:11Jl31lt !Prllllldes prnpe, emeigency ncllfleation tr ocrupanda thal 
9072.30 N 

imec,on br Type 1 Hood S]IS1llms le be 
locallvr:re.iecland ~ 131ow pltQc use and ensures Frt& OeJalp1en1 r!Olifgjm In 

[O>nl!eded ID a monitol8d fin! alalTII system \fflen :hie ..eil ol a fill! or s11cl<e 
inSlaled or 111plaa!d 

Pr0'-ldll$ proper ~1x,r,se il1d malntenan::i: ' runner W!'<ice. 
of ~re alarm S)'S(ems, N FPA 72 specilies req.,ffll respaise 
tmts lor h alarm IJOUble and ~ signals to 

~ire5 fire alann ~ems to be monitored by UL 
en~ !ySIO.ms 111:nain ope<abonal. A Type A 1/L !Isled 

907.6.5 y Localy aeated aoo adopred a111tral stajoo meal$ Ills NFPA reqtJired fn abrm ~se 
lis1ed Type A r;enqal station. 

en!Unrg an ~tiooal ftr~ 118/111 sysleni at ill Hmes. 
UL Type A listing requires c:enlral stali0ns to provide this 
'runner selVice" or a)lllracl wilh anotheretilily to l)rO'llde 
!h,s sernce lo ootan !he isbn,;i. 

907.6.21 N 
Primary Seoondaly Alarm Po-$Uj)ply 

!Jaly created and adopted 
IATlend 10 72 hour capx,ly b' back111f po,,er we to 

Modification IWU'.her and PG&E salely 111laled ~ OlJta9e" 

PJeViouslo/ seclion 'X1f .2b. Added ocx:upant 
proledlon for exls1lng l;ddlngs tll1lloul aitcmalic Fl1wides P'0j)el e,,etgency IIOlificaoo1 lilroa;upandeS Ola! 

907.9 N sprinlder syslemt to iMtal a ie ilann If tl!ey add Localyc,981ad and ,d'opllld ~'1N p& 11S8 and !IIISlll8S Filll Dep:Qnet)t flOllfi:lltiOn 111 

J1101e lhan 30% or 1,000 ~w fwt la tl1a tile _,, of a iie or sniol<e 
swcon. wllidlel$' iS Jess 

Thi$ sectoo e<lds a 51111111 Till i-ar ihut off de-icas 10 
1203.LJ N Shunl •ip powtr sarett dolViCaS Lllealy adopted and i!fflended ensuie emergency power si.it oll' durilg lhe use of ~-up 

r-supp!es. 

3311.3 N 
Preonoust,.5edion 3310. Alldiess 111qurements br 

Locally C188led at>d adopted 
M21esSu,g lorCll'1Sln1:fnlfl sitcs IS \ITClCllalll tO assis! 

ccrtSIJvetiO~ &ilas ~ lng emergency mwo;. 

3313.1 N 
Previousysection 3312.1. WalersupplleS al 

Localy adopted and .-nended 
'Natsr mua tie er, site prior IO combustible mateflal being 

(IQll$trudJOII snee 1"1111 combustible m&'erials on-ste stored or YBnicaJ ccnslruction axrunermg. 
~ 

Ptiy damages or <OJfS flllrn negligent or 111lawfll 
H~s m.Jle~s refilt!ld lnel0efll$ aie costly ID 11itlgate. 
f fie inc:ldenl is calJS8cl ~ negl,gence itJe 10 a bllsinesli 

5001.7 y plllClices !hat cause a haz.woos mJtertatt ladderll l..ocallr cieated and eoo!Qd 
PfOCHS or pracflce the ackial aist wll be passed on to 1he f.11 Ca!.1$& a cost ll!Clllll!!y lee neg!Qetll pDJS. 

~ sa!ety p,oteciJOn "'111 permjls being ~ >I.tows agencies Illa! need lo know al>Oul eJ!lloslves 8rd 
5601.2 N 

by bolh 1he Fire Chief and 9ltrills Clripamenl br 
1..oca11y aooii«i aoo .-nded ~ loa?PM lhern lr!d ha\'!! adearuncleRlanding 

expl0Slwl$. and by the Fire Chief lllld tbs Board of of IN lll)l)i~ of hoWtlleywlll Ile IISBII. 
~lmlf-1<5 

Esta!>islled limds as ieqim ~ Ille All! Cede br Class I 

5704.2.9.6.1 N Eslabisbed Wm!ls as set lbrlh In 111e Re C«le locally acqited a,d a11ended 
rammable aod Cla&G II combusdble llquil Sbnge in ~ 
11,tiund tanks. ~ires AHJ appm,;al ffll a 
S~nai'.iooal USII Pemltt ~ (lie County. 

Esliblcwd Ii.if ts as 111qund by die Fffe Code farOass I 

5706.24.4 N E$lallished llmlls<1$selfcrlh In 1118 F',e CIXle Locally edo~ and a111ended 
iammaC!eano aass Ho,mlmlible lquidspeclal 
opera:lons i1 .txM:.ga.nd mfls. ~,-AHJ lllllJIM!I 
~ a SoeaaL'CondHional Use Penn1l m the CoollY 

23-0015 E 33 of 43 



i,.a,,,_..... .. need IOadd Oistncl,,_ EslabllShedl~ 

5800.2 N 
Adl'llilliSllab~ adcSliDn fl Oisl1ict a..ne. 

las ~ by lhe Are COde IJffiCl2I lorFenrnable 

EslMlshld ftmllli as sQI forlll In Ille ~e Code 
ux:allyadopledaidamendeel Oyoge,l.'t lu~ 111 StalioftatY llOlltantYS Raquies AKI 

aiiproval alld a St:Jed~iliOnal Use Yerm~ l!Om 1he 
ICounly 

Ew1C1hlie&d1Stanc8Cblllween LPG 11:lrageand 
ittSlleflsarfes that ;ire dlllldly related 10 Mly fr:, ~ii 

6104.2 N 
Established lmilS for LPG SIOt'a!l9 .ind disoenSirci 

~ pments and h~-d!Jnsity holels, inotelS, aJ)aflmef\ls, 

near or~ to teside~tial dewlopmenl 
!Jaly adopled and amended ~ where a release by leak ar eicplosiln of LP.Gas r«Jutl 

have t ti,jl probability d it;JIY, iflllalafoo, or deall, 

Req.Jires AHJ ippRl¥lll and a St,eciaWCci!ldtlJnal use 
Pem:• to11 lhe Ccunty. 

O.Srn~tlad a~ stored l'lllllde$ ,,,_n sgnlficanl fire b«ls 
(battea,s, ftamm.ible .ind com111SHble I quids, Vphoi$1ery. 

CllapWOO,NFPA, 1-
N 

Provides fire acaiss and desranoe 10 prcl)erly lil'les 
let) and liSk IO Yeget.ation and a,:facenl pro,,erties. lllis 

22 fol AUtOlll<ll>tle Wrecking Yarns. 
localy aeared and adopted ~ lrernenl provides fiff! access aid deerance to ,.a,on In .iu1amoblle wrecl<mg yaldqierafions IO aid 1n 

sefl;lh!ing operafons ard re:lud.klll of M! extension to 
ad'jaCrllt propenies and/er open lands. 

IA.11enaed to incluoe 0IHile 1pdnlder tiec alld "ltlndl oo• 
Sf.e for emeigant repalB, Ille induslotl of a loca 1llallil' flew 
a!atm l!> aeaw an audtte alert to, 'JIil llowaf water ii Ille 

NFPA 130-16 of Chapter 80 of Ole f'"' COOe ol lhe lr,ent of wil!tt aclNnln In a ,ar;anl smi!n,, and 
Chapter 00. NFPA, y OiSlnel ha& bee!> a11ended ii update varlllus hyo:llllSt.Jte IHIJl9 ~Dt5 to m~rv p,o~ 130 

130-16 ~sions pell3inlng IO Ille installalion oi Sl)linlder 
l.0cary adol)te6 and amended tspnnWer iY$1em lnstalalon decleaSin~ IR ~~ of waler 

s1'$18111S in one el'l(I two-f#lllly dlliolhngs ~ tom ppe rai'ure Passwe 11111!11! AlqlliremelllS 
119!'9 8\!o aa<!ed IO 8115URI water~ lhnlugh Ille 
S)'llem. ll!ducing SlalJ1an1 YID and back1lcw ooncen1S 
[E10 "'1«)11'.lllis~ofi)'S'lm) 

A!IOwS 11$ IO lllaldl ..tla! dMlopal'l nl residents aie used 

~B:Tallle 
Changed 500 GPM IO 1,000 GPM In .,,iOr ti il n,gads ID GPM R low llqllinimenrs Iha! hM been 

B105.1(1! 
N 1$UbdlWIOn$ belllW 5000 fOOt elevlllion. to match Loc:ally ~ and amended 

uHd forooar .i ~ IA EDC AIIOl)IOOicles a 11\ininum 

fire low precedents uaed in EOC l:lr yeas 
level ol ava:tallie water fer liefiglrong pu1poses IA Ille event 

IOI nouse IO hcuse. h0i94! lg ~IIOn, acW« vegellmll1 
to hOtlse igllillOn. 

Ai!Pencbc B: Tallie 
Eslablshed a mfnlmlffll ll!IJll~nt of 1.500 GPM, AIOwS U$ to 11~ IMlat deY!llopelS and msiden1S aie used 

B105.2 
Ill below5000tlottleva!ien, br all _,..al LDcalfy adcpled and ameaded :o in ~s ID GPM Ire tow~ that ha'<&~ 

!)ICjl!cts ilMCl lor Ol'l!I' a decade in EDC 

ApjJendixO: D1031 N Added an 9Jllel)lion t,r iesilel!lial lfrtveways ~ly ;adojli!d and amended 
llS Ullll!IISOllalllelo ,equne aresdeooald•~to 

loonslrUCt a 26 bot 6lCle spa ftt «x:IISS to a h)lllllll. 

TIISe 14 reqiitesus toonlyaa:eptuplo16% dn'fl!wa,s, 
Allenllid to mtel State law al~ no grealer 

AppellCh D: D103.2 N Locafy adoPled and a111ended 
anyQ:eplions Miuld ~ app,ovalbyte~ . In our 8 

11111116% 'MlhiT WUand Urban lnterfam Dor.JOO Counly TIie 14 adoption 11111 ah !18311)' 111¥1 IS,. 
g/Jde.,..., Al1J al)pCOV81aid !lad w~ 

A!lllendbl 0: 01033 N AdoeO CM to ioelude ClldJ$ -.d gullets Locallyadofmd andamendld 
20 rooc loao' ..idl1s shal oot mm wbs and gotteis aue 
IO poten•ial aixess i$SU8S and !Urning ra6Js Wllll!DIS. 

ARJendbt I> 0103.5 N 
Requies ll!intmum 15-ft Md& gale$~ ils1alled 

Whe:t frt ~r.i~s amiss roads oonsiStola cfvlded 

QR 118 8fll)IW'alllS ai:cesit08ds 
Locllly adopled aid a111ended roadway lhe p, widllt Shall net b& Im l!I~ 15 feet Clre 10 

appa-M turning radius. 

ND parking on roads allowed on roadWi\'I less tllaP 28 ~ 

Pflpeoobl D: 0103.6.1 H Road willths 20 kl 29 feel Lo::ally~edalld9mencled 
'" -.id1ll aboM SlClO 1eet Lowe,t/lal m feel th1sdles 
Incl awy. Ths ssdlon Is aoopted as Q atmt in 1he Fn 
!Code Apjlell(fx o '8dion 103.6.1 b'aldllar eievauo,is, 

23-0015 E 34 of 43 



P.iwig an ON Side only an IOad$ IICffl 21l leet IQ 36 leel 

Roads wfd1ll1 ntore than 29 feet but less lhan 36 
ail:JMd. This is not raquin!d less than 5000 teer of 

Appendll<O• Of03 62 N fttt,nw'dltl 
Localy pdoJ)llfd ;1111 ameOllllld eleviton i..Ola 11\aA 5000 feel 1118 does ROI W, Thi 

sedlan is adopted as ii stands In 1he F"IIII Cade Appendix D 
Se:ll0n 103.6.2 lcr all ollier ele\'atiOIIS. 

Wtra requfled by lhe fealdeolliclal,aim alll)ara8JS 

,\Openclix0:0104.4 N 
Added ID mq,ie QIW'lllem,ffal h appara_,s 

L.ocaly created and adcpted 
~ road Shall be ~to~hrire 

access roads micture and ahal pro\'lde a conllnL<IIJS means al 
emeige,,cJ~e-. 

Adopted with no Amendments 
1011 ttmJgh 101.!> N 

M)JUd Ill eslallll$h SCDjle, 11$trt, ~ ty n:t 
Locally~ All1111lSlrlr.i-.edarity 

vaiily 

102. f 111111,q, 102.12 N Rllerances, subjeds not MgUlal8d IJy Ille Code Loealy adopted AO'nins1r.w,,e e1ar1ty 

104 1 through 
N Atii:y 10 enloo:e Iha aoi l.ccaly adopted l/\lt!IWsu1r.e darily 

101.12.3 

105 f fl,oogh 
N nme imilalmof a~ Locally a:lo!Xed Mlninisltall\le dallly 

105.624 

1061 ltvough 100 4 N 
AdalJ(ed lhis sedioo for ad11inislr.l!iVe Clarl!Y alld 

Loc:alj,adoplell IFte sche!:b'as tr permit$ 
flre anti life safely 1e1Sl)e(:fi()llt 

1071 through 107.6 N 
Ad,ped Ills m,on for admnislraJive daily and 

~yadojted lnspec!loo aJ1 tl0ri!y 
tie and L~ safely lnspecfons 

Alleip!Bd this sedicn ror Drinls1rallve ct;idly and 
t.latnlnnce of salegu81111. tesiing andefe181icr1 ot 

1M.1 lhro,q, 109.6 N ~ ad~ed ~ent 111-inspeCtion alld l~llQ. raaimeplog, 
file and lie ml)' Inspections 

g,JMIS,an. ltlldering eciiiJlllenl ~ -0'fWIJYldng, 

113 N 
Ados,~ 1111$ &aaion br admimsllahe datily 1111d 

I.Ocally~ 5.'tlp WOfkO«let 
fire .-,d Iii!~ inspedlons 

114 11hrough 114 7 N Adoped lhb sectiGn for mlnislraliWe tlalily alld 
l.ocalyadQllled llr,wft $""1:luies or equlp,nent 

~ and Lie safely mspea,cns 

Asl)llal1 ke11les aintarn highly lam11able substances and 
requtt slringent saguanls. Ma~ng ignlion SOIJlleS 

J01.11trough 308.5 N Adapl?d !his iedlan f<lrffnt aAd Nie aalely Localy a1011Ced ll\OX19h iesJ)QIISb'e IIPf)kat1ol'I rl 91e<1cr.ds wm cedtlce Ille 
numbe< ol l ms i:I various $ellilgS. [Cim!Jll;, geclogieal. 
aid lopographa~. 

Gener~ 11QU!remen1S "1iitrg IG smoking. V&cMI inanees 
ccoo1ijan aAd safely 111quillllll8llts, allan:b1ed pre111lses, 

310.1111,oug, 311.4 N Ad?IX~ !his S>lG!Jon far 1ire Md 1"8 sate(J Locally a:lo!Xed tenant q,aces, sa~aiding •3C311 ~. sewrlfy, rte 
pl0l8<:llan. flrt se~tlon rerno.al of comtlustiCles, 
removal of hmldolls materials. (Clllll~ ~I, 811<1 
wpog~. 

323.1 N Ml,ced Ins sedion forfire a11d life s2fely Locally aoo,;Jled 
GellM!I ~ui'emenlS forroail. lullnels,and bridges. 
(Cllmalfc. geob1c:il. and tapagra~. 

F'rovide$ e.acuaL'on Ids to,- hazardous and instihl~ 

403.6 lhrough 403. 7.6 N Moped this sedicn ftlJ h and life safety 4>;,alt)'idoped 00C11pancles (occupa~ willl lnaezadi:cten~al for f ie 
'o:s). 

403.9 avcugh 403.9.4 N Adoplod lflis secffon klr file and life safely lllcally adoped 
iProvHes e-,acua!ion drill; klr hc(eVmotei accupa,dei; 
(oocu1Btcies ,.;lh ina,,ased poteallaf ror Ire loss~ 

'05.1 lll!Njl COS.10 H ~ Olis sedJcri for~ alld life safety Locally adoped 
Ernerg,w.yptannlllg andl1COfd keel)ing(Cimatlc, 
- . and tcpagral)h'cal). 

510.3 N 
Adopted this section for minis~ danly aJ1d Localyado~ 

A P8ffM is r?q111rall lcr eme,gency lllSPOJliler r.1dk> systems 
£te and life safely insp!dicns (Clima!ic, ~i:af, and topograpik3). 

806 1 Ill~ 806.4 N 
~ed ~ ,ec:ticn for 3dni!lstratr,e d.dy at,d 

Locally aitiiied Decorati.e l'8!)8Catlan POS8$ a11 lncr9ase n t=w. 
It& alld kle s:,fety inspecoons ~ammab"lty Mid it~ nsk. 

w;11 coverings ID 9roup E ocwpancies {Schools) ma 

807.f1110ugll&17.5.6 N 
AdoPleCI lhl$ sedlon for adlnlnimlN& Clarity and Localy adopted 

ma.amum amount ot &amm.lllle wal co..mgs ,n 
~ am tie safety lnl;pedJcns ecin:alonal facllles (Clmafc. geologbL and 

topagr.~ 

23-0015 E 35 of 43 



AdOpll!d !tis sedioo fol adminl51ralwe cl;,ltv lWlCl 
Combu.!ible Asmishng l)O$e a signilil:anl flamlatilit)' and 

808.1 bough 800.5 K l.Qcally~ ~11,ead life safety huaid in insbtulilna !rid OOl!ege donn 
~ and life salily inspedlofts 

fype OCCIJJ)a,'ldes. 

Ad:lpted INs sediOll for adminisrrative clalty arod 
Pn>-,llles darf1Yon accepl.n:e resting of .utcmatlc l"8 004.~., N 

h and 11re sare1y mspeclions Localy~ ecn(JJ!shlng systems (Cliniltic, p!alop, and 
IDl)Ographca') 

1tOI, I lhroiq, 1102.1 N 
Adopled !his sedion ror atnillstalfw darily a1111 

Locally adopted .-'dn.nistraive Clarity 
f,e and file s.i!ly ~~ 

Erae<gency Rctpotder radio~ In dsling bu>ldllgs. 
Al bUltfngswU be requhldlo alkJIN~epondeii 
lie, n,cei.e Im lnfflmil e111ergerq 131fi0 IRIIIC D ald from 
leach alher and the emelllfll(:Vdlspalehariler. Time 

Ad:lpted lhis secfon in eJdJ1ing oui'~s iJr ,ne ~ oen be devaloQed lO C0111e fnlO Qllllpliarlce and tJ>e 

1103.2 y ~ ol &t~lefs Md olher emi!lljency lot8Nyadopled l]llaSilg In ol a sysl'ml °""' a period of ine. delennltm by 

tesponders 
Ille~ COl!toll'r;ial, Is ;aa:apl.ll:)le. The raUanale blhild 111,s 
sectior1 iSllat en a'most aleniergenc,1911X)11(1e( ~or 
la1aily incldenl5 a,11mim:alion is a key iSsue. TIiis 
SilualiOO gin be a,necled wiVr the a<ilition of rtdo 
~ nt lOtJoosl ~ ~ rn~Vrlldo nOC~M 
ming signal (Clinatic, gecloglcal, 811<1 IIJP)g.lal)IIQ~. 

Requires in'1alaoofl of lire sprinkler ,ystems in eJO.lfing 

1103.5 y M>pted !his section for lbe safety or lhe pu!)jr., 
Locally.»lj:ted 

'lli1ll high Ble '3Ely risk .vie! In oonlonnaooe 
lira6g!ijers, and other emergeocy respoode!s ,.;,n previous Uniromi Fiie Cclcres. (Climil'ic, geolc',lical, arod 

lop:)graphcal). 

~ !llis sedion for the safelY of 1he public, 
R&iiu·~ lnstallstion 01 catlotl mcno,!lde alamts in 

1103.9 N l.lx31y JDlllled O(Xl1Jm0es w:111 hi1' ~ safely risk. (Omalic, geologlc31. ftef,ghlin, lrld oltier emeigency n,sponde,, 
and oep,J!J111itlcaJ). 

1104.1 lltrough ~ed this se:tion for 1he safet, of 111& put.ilie, 
~ a m~lmum I~ of saf8Cy'llllh ll!\lan110~ 

N LDcafy adople,:I &om &JdSWIQ buJdings nousinS, oa:upancies wi1h a ~lgb lile 
1104.25 Sre~h:m, and olher emeigency resf)OOde11> isarery risk. (c.!matic, geologi:al, ar11 l\l~raiihbl]. 

1106. I lhraugh Adopted 1his section for Ille safely or the pulic, Prowtes a mnmum ~ of sa~ty at lie Slorage yarm 
N Locally811(,p.ecl w.lh h,;t 19-iets of mmalje nitt>er N fflal (Clrnalic. 1106.1.2 fsef,gtrters, and olher eme,gency responders 

~.andto~. 

Appendix D. D10t 1 
N 

AOJIJ(ed IN$ ,ea10n for 1118 safety of re publt 
LCCal~adll!Xed 

GeneriJI requirements tor [ re ai,para!US = roads 
ltlrcugh 0104. 1 t;refi~eis. and oCIIBr emellJSl1CVrespcnders ilndudi,">,1 load$ (Oimalc.~IO!JCal, in!t,pOgraitllcal). 

Appenll~ D: 0104.2 
H 

AOojMd (Iii$ ~ fotlhe safely of llH, pubic, 
l.oc;ilyadol)IIKI 

Comrnel031 and indusmal ~ioplnent ire appa,a~ 
(exdu(tng e,iception) h:-efg!ICM, and oiler emergency respo~ - JOa<Js (Olrrla11c.~. n~im;a). 

Aw,w0-0104.3 
N 

Adopted lhls seclfoo fllrlhe safetyof 1118 pubic, 
t.ocailr adefl(lld 

Colllmeraal and '"duSiial development Ire ~ m 
mn,~[)1015.4 freighters, and olher e111ergency respcndf!IS - mads (Ctns:lt. geological, and topq,aphlcal). 

~D:01061 
N 

,\Q)lf.ed !his~ ~ Ill& safety ot Ille pu!)jie, 
La:aly adopled 

Fite 3").nluS 31Ca!SS ~ ilrmullijll&lanlly~ 
{eirdudng flC8!llietl) ireSgh'J!IS, ard olher emeigellCV rfSll(lltdeB ~ts (Clmlllic. geological, and llpog~. 

Ajlpendl,c D; D106.2 
N AOo~ tiis secllo~ b'Ule saf«yof lhel)ltic, 

Lacally ~ed 
Fn &pparalUS - rocMIS Ibo' mult~yll!Sidential 

ihl'Cllgh 0106.3 ~leis, and ollter emergenct IISl)Dndlra "4wtlop-nents {Cll111aic, geo!Qgbl, ~~l-

Oie- Cf ll!olH!we:lno IISidenl!al developllenls tltall be 
APf)elldix 0: 0107.1 

N 
~ Ibis~ forlhe$8(etyofllie public, 

Loca1y adopled 
~ -pped lh~llliffl tMsperaleaad'ill)lllllVedG18 

(elliCfudlng uoepllonsl ( ~ . llltf olher ffllelll9IIC\I J'8Sl)Ctlder$ ~:us access roads due IO fDpograpl'.i;. gecg,el)lliG alld 
ctmatic oond lions 

One- r,,: ~ :Ing resldernlal develol)ll,entt Shal be 
Appell®. D: 0107.2 

N ~ ltlis sedioo ltif Ille safefyollhe llUblic. l.ocafy adOl)led 
iequ~ lhmugl!Gut willt "'° siieraie and appro'lld b 

~rougft D108. I firejJh:ers, andolher~nq,oodeq liP~ access IOads cile lO lllpogr_, ; eog31lhc and 
dima!!CcondCW 

Grey eels are previously ~nded, adcpled, er changed code sections that are being adopled again in this eode cycle. 

23-0015 E 36 of 43 



;fflountain(i)i!letttotrat 
PROOF OF PUBLICATION 

(l01S.5 C.CP.) 

Proof of Publication of 
NOTICE OF lNTENT 

STAIB OF CALIFORNIA 
County of El Dorado 

I am a citizen of the United States and a resident 
of the County aforesaid; I'm over the age of 
eighteen years, and not a party to or interested in 
the above-entitled matter I am principal clerk of 
the printer at the Mountain Democrat, 2889 Ray 
Lawyer Drive, a newspaper of general circulation, 
printed and published Monday, Wednesday, 
and Friday, in the City of Placerville, 
County of El Dorado, and which newspaper has 
been adjudged a newspaper of general circuJa. 
tion by the Superior Court to the County ofEI 
Dorado, State of California, under the date of 
March 7, 1952, Case Number 7258; that the 
notice, of which the annexed is a printed copy 
(set in type no smaller than non-pareil), has been 
published in each regular and entire issue of said 
newspaper and not in any supplement thereof on 
the following dates, to-with: 

9/16 

ALL IN THE YEAR 2022 
I certify (or declare) under penalty of perjury that 
the foregoing is true and correct. 

Dated at Placerville, California, this 1~ day 
of SEPTEMBER, 2011 

Signature 

r.:,,,., 
ell ._.....,. 

~41-fh-~ ·-•-,,_~,u; ... -4 N • ._ ,-::...., 
and :any NOOida,y code sootianB 
r6181'19C1 to. tdo~ b1 ~ence, 
""' on Illa with the Secret,11y of 
the D.slltCI end ...._ o~ IX> publlc 
inllpecllan. Adopt10n of the Fire Code 
Orol,Sl\ee 'llill lloopt lhe ~ 
Fl,. Coo. 84 c-ly pubUsllecl 
In ntte :4. Part 9. of the Celifornla 
Code of ~egulatlons, gowmlr,g 
fire pre•~lcn and bulldin~ 
st~r.dan:19 -Gd ta fin, at'd penic: 
lffllty with some arMIIC'menlo. In 
some insfanc,joa tft• El Do,-do 
County F"n ~ Dlltliet._ 
Jll0PONd ..... Cvcl9 ~ 
p,oposea Wlaln; .....,_ -
strtnoent ~ ltiose l'lllnlmulll 

l • 

I. IC', 'l'l<t • -~ -;,,w 

23-0015 E 37 of 43 



Jl{ountat11"1)men1ocrat 
PROOF OF PUBLICATION 

(l0t5,5 C.C.P.} 

Proof of Publication or 
NOTICE OF INTENT 

STATE OF CALIFORNIA 
County of El Dorado 

I am a citizen of the United States and a resident 
of the County aforesaid; rm over the age of 
eighteen years, and not a party to or interested in 
the above-entitled matter. I am principal cfork of 
the printer at the Mountain Democrat, 2889 Ray 
Lawyer Drive, a newspaper of general circulation, 
printed and published Monday, Wednesday, 
and Friday, in the City of Placerville, 
County of El Dorado, and which newspaper has 
been adjudged a newspaper of general circula­
tion by the Superior Court to the County of El 
Dorado, State of California, under the date of 
March 7, 1952, Case Number 7258, that the 
notice, of which the annexed is a printed copy 
(set in type no smaller than non-pareil), has been 
published in each r~rular and entire issue of said 
newspaper and not in any supplement thereof on 
the following dates, to-with: 

10/10 

ALL IN TIIE YEAR 2022 
I certify (or declare) under penalty of perjury that 
the foregoing is true and correct. 

Dated at 'Placerville, California, this 101
" day 

of OCTOBER, 2022 

Signature 

•• ) ' t ,,, f I "'~ 'I A.. ,A .,,~ A 

! 11\' , .. < ldl ,•..A', I 

Notic,; Is lleNb'/ glll')n of thP 
1n"'1tf 0P of lhe er Oo""1<> County 
Fire Proletflon Cli$lrict to adopt a 
Fire COde Or.llnano!t. The OistrlCI 
,htlll hokl 
at 1:00 P.U ., • '- 21:tt.; 
ijf City of ~ -
Main SL Pl(ICat'lili., CA 95o6, , 
Ng&Rjl"fl 111e adoption or the 
fire Coe,. On:linence p,n,.rant to 
H..akh and Saltly Cod, $ectlcn• 
13889 and 131169.7. c.,p~ or r,,, 
"'.,h-•- ~ "3,lD ,_, ., - .., 
II). ... - -lie wftlt lhe S.ClfflllY DI Ille ~ 

and - IIPlfl ~ puCJc ~ 
Fft....:<l!Hll'...,,,,. 

--~-~FnCodlt 
- ~ t' T • ' Paot •- "' (lcJd,o 
a( Pegu • ""' 

Nlated to ftre and panic .. .., 
with ,orr.a amendment:.. :n "'°""' 
~thee 0o<8do County,.,. 
PN1teC11c11 DIIJbid'I ~ Fn 
CodeOrdr..nc:ep(apo,NSbuidng 
• ~Clardl ...... ..,,,,, ._~ ... ~ 
~b)'lheSln FnM!nhol 
and C0111ainec1 Ill 11w Cllllb'IM 
Buldlng Stsndaids Cod&. 
10/10 10912 

23-0015 E 38 of 43 



Attachment No. 2 

El Dorado County Fire Protection District 

Resolution No. 2022-08 

23-0015 E 39 of 43 



EL DORADO COUNT\' FIRE PROTECTION DISTRfCT 

RESOLUTION 2022-08 

A RESOLUTION OF THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS OF TIIE EL DORADO COUNTI' FIRE 
PROTECTION DISTRICT 

ADOPTING FINDINGS SUPPORTING AMENDMENTS TO THE 
CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE 

A resolution for the El Dorado County Fire Protection District setting forth findings with respect to local 
conditions within the Fire District which make certain modifications and changes to the California Fire 
Code reasonably necessary for preserving fire and life safety in the El Dorado County Fire Protection 

District. 

The Governing Board of the El Dorado County Fire Protection District finds and resolves as follows: 

WHEREAS, Health & Safoty Code Section 17958.5 pennits a Fire Protection Districtto ,1dopt an 
ordinance which changes or modifies the State Housing regulations adopted pursuant to Health & Safety 
Code Section 17922 upon detennination that such changes or modifications are necessary due to local 
conditions that pertain regulations governing conditions hazardous to life, property and the environment 
from fire, explosion, hazardous materials and hazardous uses; and 

WHEREAS, Health & Safety Code Section 17958. 7 requires that a District's Board of Directors 
making any changes or modifications pursuant to Health & Safety Code Section 17958.5 shalI make 
express finding that such changes or modifications are needed; and shall file a copy of such changes or 
modifications with the Department of Housing and Community Development. 

WHEREAS, the unique local climatic, geological, and topographical conditions existing within 
the boundaries of the District make it reasonably necessary for the District to impose more stri11gent 
requirements than set forth in the California Fire Code and pursuant to California Health and Safety Code 
sections 13869.7 and I 7958.7, the District desires to make express findings to that effect. 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that the Board of Directors of the El Dorado County 
Fire Protection District, after having duly noticed and held public hearings, hereby adopts the following 
findings concerning current unique local conditions that together make each modification to the 
California Fire Code, reasonably necessary to provide adequate and effective protection of life, property 
.-ind the environment more specifically set forth as follows: 

- 1 -

23-0015 E 40 of 43 



FINDINGS OF FACT 
FOR CHANGES OR MODIFICATIONS TO THE STATE BUlLDING STANDARDS 

CODE (TITLE 24PART 9) BECAUSE OF LOCAL CONDITIONS 

A. Generar. 
After due consideration, the Board of Directors of the El Dorado County Fire Protection District, hereby 
finds that due to local climatic, geologic and topographic conditions, as stated within this document, 
there is a need to provide the modifications and changes contained in the adoptive Ordinance of the 
California Fire Code. Such changes are deemed to be reasonably necessary to provide adequate and 
effective protection of life, property and the environment. 

The El Dorado County Fire Protection District provides fire protection, emergency medical services and 
speciaJized rescue services to approximately seventy-four thousand people in a 281 square mile area. 
The District is located on the western slope ofE! Dorado County. The topography of the District ranges 
from rolling hills of grass and oak woodland in the west and oak-timber in the steep drainages of the east 
portion. The weather conditions vary from freezing temperatures with occasional snow in winter, to 
summer temperatures that regularly exceed I 00 degrees. 

The District is divided into five distinct areas: Gold Hill, City of Placerville, Pleasant Valley, Pollock 
Pines/Strawberry, and Shingle Springs. Most of the commercial and industrial areas are located along 
the corridor of Highway 50 and more rural communities with home sites on larger parcels along the 
oater areas of the district 

The El Dorado County Fire Protection District is an "all-risk" agency in which the District participates 
in a sophisticated automatic aid program with other agencies within the county. The resources of the 
District will respond to, and deal with, any type of emergency. The term "Fire Protection" in this 
document is broad and includes responses to fires, smoke and odor investigations, alanns, public assist 
calls, hazardous materials incidents, medical aid, fire investigations and specialized rescues. 

The District has five; full-time, staffed fire stations which provide emergency services to the 
community. Fire Station 17 is located in the unincorporated town of Pollock Pines at 6430 Pony 
Express Trail. Fire Station 19 is located in the unincorporated area of Placerville known as Pleasant 
Valley at 4429 Pleasant Valley Road. Fire Station 25 is located in the City of Placerville at 3034 
Sacramento Street. Fire Station 28 is located in t11e unincorporated town of Shingle Springs at 3860 
Ponderosa Road. Fire Station 72 is located in the unincorporated town of Cool at 7200 Saint Florin 
Court. The District has 72 full-time, career personnel, along with three support staff positions. 

B. Climatic. 
The El Dorado County Fire Protection District is located within a foothill region. The District is subject 
to four seasons, with an annual average snow falI in the winter months of 2 inches, i11 addition to an 
average rainfall of 45 inches per year. These adverse weather conditions create severe hazardous road 
conditions and tlooding as well as rock slide haz;ards along the main access roads within, as well as into, 
the District from the surrounding areas. Due to periods of rainfall, along with repeated road closures, 
the ability of the Fire Protection Disttict to provide immediate emergency response is often delayed. 
These same adverse climatic conditions often result in a large number of vehicular accidents that place 
extreme restraints on the availability of emergency response to perform emergency rescue, first aid, 
hazardous materials control and fire- fighting. The climatic conditions often result in a substantial or 
total lack of ability of the Fire Protection District to respond immediately to other types of emergency 
situations that occur. Examples of these emergency situations include structure fires, wildland and 
forest fires, flooding, hazardous materials incidents, emergency medical calls, vehicle accidents and 

-2-

23-0015 E 41 of 43 



vertical rescues. The mutual aid agreements established with adjofoing tire agencies might not be 
possible due to adverse c limatk cond1tions, restricting or totally blocking access into the DistricL 

Summary: 
These local climatic conditions affect the acceleration, intensity, and size of faes in the Fire District. 
Ti1I1es of little or no rainfall, low humidity and high temperatures create extremely hazardous conditions, 
particularly as they relate to the wildland - urban interface. Winds experienced in this area can have a 
significant impact upon structure fires, especially in buildings in close proximity to one another, and to 
wildJands commonly found in the El Dorado County Fire Protection District. Structures built within the 
El Dorado County Fire Protectron District must be built with these variables in min<l. 

C. Geological. The El Dorado County Fire Protection District is located within moderate activity seismic 
Zone Three. The seismic, geological conditions present a potential for multiple fires, major breakage of 
water mains, multiple electrical power failures, multiple collapsed structures and a large number of calls 
for emergency medical aid, all of which may occur simultaneously during a seismic event. The water 
district has numerous water-pumping systems used for fire suppression water delivery, as well as water 
storage tanks providing water system pressure. Most of the pumping systems are dependent on 
electrical power for operation. Such electrical power may not be available during a seismic event. 
Water storage tanks used for the storage ofre-quired fire suppression water may also collapse in such an 
event forcing the additional need to transport water via additional pieces of fo-e apparatus which will 
pface a significant restraint on the ability of the District to provide the required emergency services. 

Summary: 
Local geographic and geological features and processes exist within the boundaries of the district that 
may hamper the ability of the El Dorado County Fire Protection District to perfo1m its sworn duties. Fire 
following an earthquake has the potential of causing greater loss of life and damage than the earthquake 
itself. 

D. Topographical The District is primarily composed of areas that are considered by the State to be high 
fire haz.ard severity zones with areas of very high severity zones. Much of the District is located within 
foothill terrain, covered with highly combustible vegetation, including the presence of many coniferous 
forested areas. The elevation within the District ranges from at 1,400 feet to over 6,000 feet at the 
highest point. Slope within the District ranges from 0 degrees to 90 degrees. The structures within the 
areas of foothills terrain have very limited fire access, due to narrow roadways with steep grades and 
poor road surface conditions. The District is accessible only from the outside by one State Highway and 
one U.S. Highway. The Highway 50 corridor goes directly through the El Dorado County Fire District 
and at times may be closed by snow or mudslides. This can make access to many pa1ts of rhe El Dorado 
County Fire District difficult. The presence of many existing structures wrthin the high fire hazard 
severity .zone areas provides for a very high potential of a structure fire spreading into a v-ildland or 
forest fire condition as well as the potential for a wildland or forest fire spreading to structures, 

Summary: 
The alignment of canyons, vaUeys and slopes into inhabited areas, combined with the variable nature of 
the terrain, yield a potential for increased fire risk.. Most structures, both residential and commercial, are 
in, or are surrounded by areas that contain a significant grass, brush, mixed oak woodland, and mixed 
conifer fuel load. Due to drought conditions, beetle infestations, and lack of vegetation management, 
much of the area is populated with either dead or dying trees, contributing to an e>..trerne fire danger. 

- 3 -

23-0015 E 42 of 43 



E. Conclusion: 
Local climatic, geographic and topographic conditions described above increase the frequency, intensity, 
end size of fires involving buildings in the Fire District. Further, these conditions iinpact potential 
damage to structures from an earthquake and subsequent tire. Therefore, it is reasonably necessary that 
the Califomia Fire Code be modified to mitigate the effects of the above conditions. 
California Health & Safety Code Section 17958.7 requires that modifications to the Fire Code be 
expressly marked and identified as to which each finding refers to which Code modification. The 
attached Appendix A provides this connection. 

mTRODUCED at a regular meeting of the Board of Directors of the El Dorado County Fite Protection 
District on September:3.Dth, 2022. 

PASSED AND ADOPTED at a regular meeting of the Board of Directors of the El Dorado County Fire 
Protectio11 District on September3t'h, lCll2, by the following roll call vote: 

~~~ . . 
A YES: ... I l C I< ' ' ,., ..,,..., ...... :\ • • ; - • 

... , ,,, .. ~·t~ 

NOES: · 

ABSENT: '- ' 

ABSTAIN: 

ATI'EST: 

, I 

Ki1tl11..:e11 Freeman, Board Secretary 

-4-

23-0015 E 43 of 43 




