RESOLUTION NO. 010-2023
OF THE BOARD OF SUPERVISORS OF THE COUNTY OF EL DORADO

{REPEALING RESCLUTION NO. 038-2020}

WHEREAS, the California Code of Regulations, Title 24, Part 9, the California Fire Code, is updated by the
State every three years; and

WHEREAS, the 2022 California Fire Code became effective on January 1, 2023; and,

WHEREAS, California Health and Safety Code Sections 17958, 17958.5, 17958.7 and 18941.5 permits a
county to make such [ocal amendments and modifications as the county determines are reasonably
necessary because of local climatic, geological or topographical conditions; and,

WHEREAS, the California Code of regulations, Health and Safety Code, Division 12, Part 2, Chapter 1,
Article 12, Section 13146, assigns responsibility for enforcement of safety regulations to the local level
and grants authority to delegate enforcement to the chief building official, or his or her authorized
representative, or the chief of the fire protection district, or his or her representative; and,

WHEREAS, the County of El Dorado desires to delegate enforcement of the Fire Code to the chief of the
fire authority, or the chief's authorized representative; and,

WHEREAS, the fire protection district and County have agreed to develop, implement and maintain a
memorandum of understanding that describes the roles and responsibilities pertaining to the inspection
of certain building standards found in the Fire Code; and,

WHEREAS, on October 20, 2022, The Board of Directors of the El Dorado Hills County Water District
adopted Ordinance No. 2022-01, which adopted the 2022 California Fire Code with amendments the
District deemed necessary to deal with local climate, geological or topegraphical conditions.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that the Board of Supervisors of the County of El Dorado ratifies
Ordinance No. 2022-01 of the El Dorado Hills County Water District and delegates the enforcement of the
ordinance to the El Dorado Hills County Water District Chief, or his or her representative.

These changes include amendments and additions to the California Fire Code in the following sections:

101.1, 105.5, 105.5.55, 105.6, 105.6.25, 105.6.26, 107.5, 107.5.1, 107.7, 111.5, 112.4, 112.4.2,
113.4, 202, 302.1, 307.4.4, 401.2.1, 503.2.1, 503.2.5, 503.2.6, 503.3.1, 503.3.2, 503.3.3, 503.5,
505.1, 507.5.1, 509.3, 510.4.2.3,903.2, 903.2.1.1, 903.2.1.2, 903.2.1.3, 903.2.1.4, 903.2.3, 903.2.4,
203.2.7, 903.2.7.2, 903.2.8.5, 903.2.9, 903.2.10, 903.2.10.1, 903.2.22, 903.2.23, 903.6, 907.2,
907.2.1.4, 907.2.2.3, 907.2.3.11, 907.2.4.1, $07.2.5.2, 907.2.6.6, 907.2.7.2, 907.2.8.4, 907.2.9.4,

23-0015 F 1 0of 43



907.2.10.1, 907.2.30, 907.6.5, 907.6.2.1, 9079, 1203.1.3, 3311.3, 3313.1, 5001.7, 5601.2,
5704.2.9.6.1, 5706.2.4.4, 5806.2, 6104.2, Chapter 80 NFPA 1-22 Section 22.3, Chapter 80 NFPA 1-
22 Section 22.10, Chapter 80 NFPA 13D-22: Sections 4.6, 5.1.1.2, 7.5, 11.2.1.1, Appendix B: Table
B105.1(1}), Appendix B: Table B105.2, Appendix D Sections D103.1 through D103.3, Appendix D
103.5, Appendix D 103.6.1, Appendix D103.6.2, Appendix D104.4

El Dorado Hills County Water District adopts the 2022 California Fire Code, Title 24, Part 9, in its entirety,
including Appendices, incorporating those sections of the International Fire Code, 2021 edition not
adopted by the state, with the exclusions listed below:

103, 309, 311.5, 311.6, 318, 403.3, 403.5, 403.8, 403.10, 403.11, 404, 406, 903.3.1.2, 904.1.1,
1103.1, 1103.3-1103.4, 1103.6, 1105, Chapter 26, D104.2 (exception only), D106.1 (exception only},
D107.1 (Exceptions only), Appendix A, Appendix G, Appendix J, Appendix K, Appendix L, Appendix
M, Appendix N, Appendix O.

Appendices not adopted can be used for reference in enforcing other sections of the 2022 California Fire
Code.

PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of Supervisors of the County of El Dorado at a regular meeting of
said BOARD, held the 3™ day of January, 2023, by the following vote of said Board

Ayes: Thomas, Hidahl, Turnboo, Parlin, Laine
Attest: Moes: None
Kim Dawson Absent: None

Clerk of the Board of Supervisors

By: ‘Wm%(// W)MW

Deputy £lerk Chair, Board of Supervisors
Wendy Thomas

23-0015 F 2 of 43



y

¥ S, EL DORADO HILLS
SO FIRE DEPARTMENT

-
EST. 1963\ “Serving the Communities of Ef Dorado Hills, Rescue and Latrobe”

November 30, 2022

Don Ashton, Chief Administrative QOfficer
El Dorado County Board of Supervisors
330 Fair Lane

Placerville, CA 95667

Subject: Resolution Ratifying Ordinance No. 2022-01 of the El Doradoe Hills County Water
District, which adopts the 2022 California Fire Code with amendments related to
local climatic, geographic and topographic conditions.

Dear Mr. Ashton:

The El Dorado Hills County Water District (EDHCWD) is requesting the Board of Supervisors (BOS)
ratify its Ordinance No. 2022-01, which adopts the 2022 California Fire Code as amended due to specific
local climatic, geographic and topographic conditions. California Health and Safety Code Section 13869.7
requires the legislative body of the city or county where the ordinance will apply o ratify, modify or deny
the adopted ordinance. The BOS must also delegate enforcement of the ordinance to either the Fire District

(or its representative) or the Chief Building Official.

Therefore, we request the County Board of Supervisors ratify Ordinance No. 2022-01 with amendments
to the 2022 California Fire Code, and delegate the enforcement of that Ordinance to the EDHCWD Fire
Chief. A proposed BOS resolution is enclosed for your review and use on this topic.

This resolution has no direct fiscal impact to the County.

Sincerely,

Jn.\, \ L

Chrishana Fields
Fire Marshal

ATTACHMENTS:

1. EDHCWD Ordinance and Finding of Fact No. 2022-01

1050 Wilson Boulevard y  El Dorade Hills, California 95762 ¢ Telephone (916) 933-6623 , Fax (916) 933-5983 . www.edhfire.com

23-0015F 3 of 43



EL DORADO HILLS COUNTY WATER DISTRICT
EL DORADO HILLS FIRE BEPARTMENT
CRDINANCE NO. 2022-01

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS OF THE EL DORADO
HILLS COUNTY WATER DISTRICT AS FOLLOWS:

An ordinance of the El Dorado Hills County ¥Water District (EDHCWD} adopting the 2022
Edition of the Calffornia Fire Code, incorporating the 2021 Edition of the Infernational Fire Code,
regulating and governing the safeguarding of life and property from fire and explesion hazards
arising from the storage, handling and use of hazardous substances, materials and devices, and
from conditions hazardous to life or property in the eccupancy of buildings and premises in the
EDHCWD; providing for the issuance of permits and collection of fees therefor; Repealing
Ordinance No. 2019-01 of the EDHCWD and all other ordinances and parts of the ordinances in

conflict therewith.
Be it ORDAINED by the Board of Directors of the EDHCWD, also known as the El

Dorado Hills Fire Department:

Section 1: FINDINGS OF FACTS

Section 2: ADOPTION OF CODE WITH EXCLUSIONS
Section 3: LOCAL AMENDMENTS

Section 4: CONFLICT

Sectionb: SEVERABILITY

Section 6: EFFECTIVE DATE AND PUBLICATION

SECTION 1: FINDINGS OF FACTS
The EDHCWD makes certain changes (listed below) to the California Fire Code, 2022

Edition, pursuant fo Heafth & Safety Code Sections 13869.7, 17958.5, 17958.7 and 18941.5
during this code adoption process. Such changes are necessary because of local climatic,
geological and/or topographical conditions. The EDHCWD has adopted, pursuant to Secfion
18941.5 of the California Heaith & Safefy Code, the findings of facts relative to these conditions
by Resolution #2019-1C of the EDHCWD dated September 19, 2019.

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 1

23-0015F 4 of 43



SECTION 2: ADOPTION OF CODE WITH EXCLUSIONS
The EDHCWD adopts the 2022 California Fire Code, Title 24, Part 9, jn_its entirety,
including Appendices, incorporating those sections of the International Fire Code, 2021 edition

not adopted by the state, with the exclusions listed below:

Exclusions: 103, 309, 311.5, 311.6, 318, 403.3, 403.5, 403.8, 403.10, 403.11, 404, 408,
903.3.1.2, 804.1.1, 1103.1, 1103.3-1103.4, 1103.86, 1105, Chapter 26, D104.2 (Exception only),
D106.1 {Exception only), D107.1 (Exceptions only), Appendix A, Appendix G, Appendix J,
Appendix K, Appendix L, Appendix M, Appendix N, Appendix O.

Appendices not adopted can be used for reference in enforcing other sections of the 2022

California Fire Code.

SECTION 3: AMENDMENTS TO THE 2022 CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE
The following Sections are hereby amended or added:

Chapter 1
SECTICON 101.1 “TITLE” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 101.1 TITLE. These regulations shall be known as the Fire Code of EDHCWD,
hereinafter referred to as “this code”.

SECTION 105.5 “REQUIRED OPERATIONAL PERMITS" iS AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 105.5 Required operational permits. The fire code official is authorized to issue
operational permits for the operations set forth in Sections 105.5.2 through 105,5.525.

SECTION 105.5.55 “AUTOMOBILE WRECKING YARDS" IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 105.5.55 Automobile wrecking yards. An operational permit is required for the
operation of automobile wrecking yards.

SECTION 105.6 “REQUIRED CONSTRUCTION PERMITS” IS AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 105.6 required construction permits. The fire code official is authorized to issue
construction permits for work as set forth in sections 105.6.1 through 105.6.2486.

SECTION 105.6.25 "AUTOMOBILE WRECKING YARDS" IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 105.8.25 Automobile wrecking yards. Construction permits are required for the
instaifation of or modification to automobile wrecking yards.

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 2

23-0015 F 5 0f 43



SECTION 105.6.26 “TRAFFIC CALMING DEVICES” IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

105.6.26 Traffic calming devices. Construction permits are required for the installafion or
madification of iraffic calming devices.

SECTION 107.5 “PERMIT, PLAN REVIEW AND INSPECTION FEES” SHALL BE ADDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 107.5 Permit, A schedufe of fees adopted by the district board of directors for plan
review, inspections and the issuance of permits by the district may be found in the most current
district fee schedule (Health & Safely Code 17851).

SECTION 107.5.1 “COST RECOVERY FEES” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 107.5.1 Cost Recovery Fees. Fire service fees may be charged to any person, firm,
corporation or business that through negligence, violation of the lfaw, or as a result of
carelessness, is responsible for the cause of the district to respond fo the scene of an incident.
A district board may charge a fee fo cover the cost of any setvice which the district provides
or the cost of enforcing any regulation for which the fee is charged {(Health & Safety Code
13916). The fee shall not exceed the actual cost of suppressing the fire and/or responding fo

the scene of an incident.

SECTION 107.7 “ADMINISTRATIVE COSTS” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 107.7 Administrative Costs. When a test or inspection is scheduled, and the
contractor fails to perform to the satisfaction of the authorily having jurisdiction (AHJ), the AHJ
may bill the contractor for actual time spent traveling to and from the testinspection location
and the time spent at the test/inspection site as weil as adminisirafive costs.

SECTION 111.5 “APPEAL PROCEDURES AND TIMELINES” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 111.5 Appeaf Procedures and Timelines. Any person or entity who believes they
may be adversely affected by an order, decision, or determination made by the fire code official
through a written notice may appeal this matter within 15 calendar days of the postmark on the
notice. All such appeals shall be filed in writing with the Secretary of the Governing Board for
the district. A timely appeal shali stay further action by the fire code official until the matter is
determined by the Appeal Board as oullined in Section 109.2, unless the issue poses an
imminent fire or lite safely hazard to members of the public. The fire code official shall notify
the appellant by certified mait of the date and time of such hearing. The hearing shall be
scheduled to take place no sooner than 20 calendar days from the date shown on the cerlified
maii. The appeilant shalf have the right to appear in person or by ageni at the heanng and
present oral, wrtten and/or phofographic evidence fo the Appeal Board.

SECTION 112.4 “VIOLATION PENALTIES” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 112.4 Violation Penalties. Persons who shall violate a provision of this code or shall
fail to comply with any of the requirements thereof or who shall erect, install, alter, repair or do
work in violation of the approved construction documents or directive of the fire code official,

Ordipance 2022-01 Page 3

23-0015 F 6 of 43



or of a permit or certificate used under provisions of this code, shall be guilty of a misdemeanor
or infraction, at the discretion of the prosecuting aftomey or agency, punishable by a fine not
more than $100.00 for a first violation; A fine not exceeding $500.00 for a second violation of
the same provision within one year; A fine not exceeding $1000.00 for each additional violation
of the sarne provision within one year, or by imprisonment not exceeding 780 days, or both
such fine and imprisonment. Each day that a violation continues after due notice has been
served shall be deemed a separate offense. (Health & Safety Code Sections 13145 and

17G695).

SECTION 112.4.2 “CITATIONS” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 112.4.2 Citations. The Fire Chief, or hisfher duly authonzed representalive, may
issue citations for infractions or misdemeanor violations of this code pursuant to Section 13871
of the Health & Safety Code of the Stale of Cafifomia and Chapter 5¢ (commencing with
Section 853.6} of Title 3 of Part 2 of the Penal Code of the State of California.

SECTION 113.4 "FAILURE TO COMPLY” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 113.4 Failure to Comply. Any person who shall continue any work after having been
served with a stop work order, except such work as that person is directed to perform to remove

a violation or unsafe condition, shall be punishable by a fine or imprisonment or both as
described in Section 112.4 (Health & Safety Code Sections 13145 and 17985).

Chapter 2

SECTICN 202 “CAMPFIRE” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

CAMPFIRE. A fire which is used for cooking, personal warmth, lighting, or aesthetic purposes.
SECTION 202 “DISTRICT” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

DISTRICT. The district and all other areas within the exienior boundaries thereof now or
hereaffer established.

SECTION 202 "DRIVEWAY” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

DRIVEWAY. A vehicular access that serves up fo iwo (2} parcels with no more than two (2}
residential units and any number of non-commercial or industrial buildings on each parcel.

SECTION 202 “EXECUTIVE BODY” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:
EXECUTIVE BODY. The Board of Directors of the District.
SECTION 202 “FIRE CHIEF” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

FIRE CHIEF. The Chief Executive Fire Officer of the Fire department/district serving the
jurisdiction or a duly authonzed representalive.

SECTION 202 “FIRE HAZARD” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:
Ordinance 2022-01 Page 4

23-0015 F 7 of 43



FIRE HAZARD. Any condition, arrangement, or act which will increase, or may cause an
increase of the hazard or menace of fire fo a greater than customarily recognized as normal
by-persons in the public service of preventing, suppressing or extinguishing fire; or which may
obstruct, delay, or hinder, or may become the cause of obstruction, defay or hinderance lo ihe
prevention, suppression, or extinguishment of fire.

SECTION 202 "OPEN BURNING” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

OPEN BURNING. The buming of materials wherein products of combustion are emitted directly
into the ambient air without passing through a stack or chimney from an enclosed chamber. Open
burning does not include road flares, smudge-pots and similar devices associated with safety or
occupational uses typically considered open flames. For the purpose of this definition, a chamber
shall be regarded as enclosed when, during the time combustion occurs, only apertures, ducts,
stacks, flues or chimneys necessary to provide combustion air and permit the escape of exhaust

gas are open.

Open burning shall also include campfires, bonfires, porfable outdoor fireplaces, ceremonial
fires, and recreational fire as defined in the Fire Code.

Exception:

1. UL or ASMI listed L PG or natural gas oufdoor flame devices, such as gas BBQ's or gas
fire pits that comply with the Fire Code.

2. For one-or two-family dwellings, fixed or portable outdoor flame devices that meet the
following:

a. Devices shall comply with the Fire Code,
b. Devices shalt be used per manufacturer's specifications.
c. Minimum 10-foot clearance from device fo all flammable material and vegetation,

d. No burning shail be conducted during high or extreme fire weather conditions (e.g.,
National Weather Service Red Flag Warnings).

3. Campfires on private lands. Where required by the fire code official, a permit shaii be
issued by the fire code official,

4. Ceremonial and/or religious burning with the following safety measures:
a. Maximum 4-foot x 4-foot burn area.
b. Minimum 10-foot clearance from edge of burn area fo alf flammable material and
vegefation.
An approved water supply is located within 500-feet of the burn area.
The burn area is located no less than 30-feet from adjoining property lines.
An adult {s present with a shove! until the fire is extinguished,

No burning shall be conducted during high or extreme fire weather conditions (e.g.,
National Weather Service Red Flag Warnings).

I

SECTION 202 “TRAINED CROWD MANAGER" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 5

23-0015F 8 0of 43



TRAINED CROWD MANAGER. Standby personnel, usually a security guard or usher
personnel, who are trained in the proper procedure fo exit people from a tent or other place of
public assemblage in an ordery and calm fashion in the event of an emergency

Chapter 3

SECTION 302.1 “DEFINITIONS” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:
3D PRINTER.

ADDITIVE MANUFACTURING.
BONFIRE.

CAMPFIRE.

Hi-BOY.

HIGH-VOLTAGE TRANSMISSION LINE.
OPEN BURNING.

PORTABLE OUTDOOR FIREPLACE.
POWERED INDUSTRIAL TRUCK.
RECREATIONAL FIRE.

SKY LATTERN.

SECTION 307.4.4 “OPEN BURNING RESTRICTIONS™ SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 307.4.4 Open Burning Restrictions. Open burning on aff lands within the jurisdiction of
the Ei Dorado Hills Fire Department (EDHFD), including the Local Responise Area (LRA), is
prohibited when the California Department of Forestry and Fire Protection (Cal Fire) issues a burn
suspension in the State Responsibility Area (SRA). This prohibition shall be made effective 24-

hours following its commencement in the SRA.

Open burning is also prohibited on alf lands within the jurisdiction of EDHIFD at any time the fire
code official determines that atmospheric conditions or other local circumstances make such fires
hazardous, including factors such as high winds, low fuel moisture, fire weather, the issuance of
red flag warnings, severe thireat of wildiand fire, or present risk of destruction by wildfire to life,
wildlife, property, or natural resources.

Chapter 4
SECTION 401.2.1 “PRE-FIRE PLANS" IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 401.2.1 Pre-fire plans. Where required by the fire code official, a pre-fire plan shall
be provided and approved by the fire code official for all new commercial strucfures.

Chapter 5
SECTION 503.2.1 “DIMENSIONS” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 503.2.1 Dimensions. Fire apparatus access roads shall have an unobstructed width
of not less than 20 feet (6096 mm), exclusive of shoulders, as measured from face of curb o
face of curb, except for approved security gates in accordance with Section 503.6, and an

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 6

23-0015 F 9 of 43



unobstructed vertical clearance of not less than 15 feef. Driveways shall have an unobstructed
width of not fess than 12 feef wide.

SECTION 503.2.5 “DEAD ENDS” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 503.2.5 Dead Ends. Dead-end fire apparatus access roads and driveways In excess
of 150 feet (45,720 mm) in length shall be provided with an approved area for turning around

fire apparatus.

SECTION 503.2.6 “BRIDGES AND ELEVATED SURFACES” SHALL BE AMENDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 503.2.6 Bridges and Elevated Surfaces. Where a bridge or an elevated surface is
part of a fire apparatus access road, the bridge shall be constructed and maintained in
accordance with AASHTO HB-17, the currenf Ef Dorado County Transportation Division Bridge
Standard or Appendix D of the current California Fire Code, whichever is more restrictive.
Bridges and elevated surfaces shall be designed for a live load sufficient to carry the imposed
loads of fire apparatus. Vehicle load limits shall be posied at both entrances to bridges when
required by the fire code official. Where elevated surfaces designed for emergency vehicle use
are adjacent to surfaces that are not designed for such use, approved barriers, approved signs
or both shall be installed and maintained where required by the fire code official.

SECTION 503.3.1 “NO PARKING IN FIRE LANES” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 503.3.1 No Parking In Fire Lanes. No person shalf stop, park, or leave standing any
vehicle, whether aftended or unattended, excepf when necessary fo avoid conflict with other
traffic or in compliance with the directions of the Fire Chief, or his/her duly authorized
representative, Peace Officer or official traffic conirof device along the edge of any highway,
af any curb, or in any location in a publicly or privately owned or operated off-sireet parking
facility, designated as a fire lane by the district with jurisdiction over the area in which the place
is located. The designation shafl be indicated (1) by a sign posted immediately adfacent to,
and visibie from, the designated piace clearly stafing in lefters not less than one inch in height
that the place is a fire 1ane, {2) by outlining or painting the place in red and, in contrasting color,
marking the place with the words “FIRE LANE”, which are clearly visible from a vehicle, or (3)
by a red curb or red paint on the edge of the roadway upon which is clearfy marked the words

“FIRE LANE".

SECTION 503.3.2 “NO PARKING IN FRONT OF HYDRANTS™ SHALL BE ADDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 503.3.2 No Parking in Front of Hydrants. No person shail sfop, park, or leave
standing any vehicle within 15 feet of a fire hydrant except as follows: {a) If the vehicle is
aftended by a licensed driver who is seated in the front seat and who can immediately move
such vehicle in case of necessily, (b) If the vehicle is owned or operated by a fire department

and is clearly marked as a fire department vehicle.

SECTION 503.3.3 “FIRE LANES BASED ON ROAD WIDTH” SHALL BE ADDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 7

23-0015 F 10 of 43



Section 503.3.3 Fire Lanes Based on Road Width. Fire lanes shalf be based on road width
as reqiired in Appendix D as amended by the District.

SECTION 503.6 “SECURITY GATES” IS AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 503.6 Security Gates. The installation of security gates across a fire apparatus
access road shall be approved by the fire code official and shalf comply with the District gate
standard. Where security gates are installed, they shall have an approved means of
emergency operation, The security gates and the emergency operation shall be maintained
operational at all times. Electric gate operators, where provided, shall be listed in accordance
with UL 325. Gates intended for automatic operation shall be designed, constructed, and
installed to comply with the requirements of ASTM F2200.

SECTION 505.1 “ADDRESS IDENTIFICATION" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 505.1 Address Identification. Addresses for new and existing buildings shalf comply
with the District address sfandard as approved by the fire code official. The address
identification shall be legible and placed in a position that is visible from the street or road fronting
the property. Address identification characters shall contrast with their background. Address
numbers shall be Arabic numbers or alphabetical letters, Numbers shall not be spelled out. Each
character shall be not less than 4 inches (102 mm) high with a minimum stroke width of '/2 inch
(12.7 mm). Where required by the fire code official, address identification shall be provided in
additional approved locations to facilitale emergency response. access is by means of a private
road and the building cannot be viewed from the public way, a monument, pole or other sign or
means shall be used fo identify the structure. Address identification shall be maintained.

SECTION 507.5.1 “WHERE REQUIRED" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 507.5.1 Where Required. Where a portion of the facility or building hereafter
constructed or moved into or within the jurisdiction is more than 150 feet from a hydrant on a fire
apparatus access road, as measured by an approved route around the exterior of the facility or
building, on-site fire hydrants and mains capable of supplying the required fire flow shall be
provided where required by the fire code official.

Exceptions:
1. For Group R-3 and Group U occupancies, the distance requirement shall be 600 feet
{183 m).

SECTION 509.3 “FIRE CONTROL ROOM” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 509.3 Fire Control Room. Fire sprinkler risers, fire alarm confrol panels, solar
photovoitaic power sysfem rapid shutoff swilches, and other fire detection, suppression or
simifar confrof elements shalf be located inside a single fire controf room for the building. The
fire control room shall have minimum dimensions of five feet by seven feet in size with a fotal
usable area of not less than 35 square feet, The room shall be focated within the building on
an outside wall af a location approved by the Fire Code Official and shall be accessible from
the exterior. An exterior access door with a clear width of not less than 32 inches and height
of not less than 80 inches shall be provided for access info the rocom. A durable sign shail be
affixed to the exterior of the door with the words ‘FIRE CONTROL ROOM’ in letters not fess

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 8

23-0015F 11 of 43



than 4 inches in height. A key box complying with Section 506 shall be instalfed on the exterior
side of the fire control room door opening.

The room must be capable of maintaining a minimum femperature of 40 degrees Fahrenhelit.
A clearance of 12 inches shall be provided from the fire sprinkier risers fo any adjacent walls.
This room can be a shared with other building dutilities or fire protection equipment that is not
incompatible. An approved cabinet or cantainer shall be provided to store record plans of the
fire sprinkler system and other fire protection equipment. This room shall not be used for any

other storage.
Exception: One-and two-family dwellings, manufacfured homes or similar uses defined
as either a Group R-3, R3.1, or R-4 occupancy.

SECTION 516.4.2.3 “STANDBY POWER" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 510.4.2.3 Standby power. In-building, two-way emergency responder
communication radio coverage systems shall be provided with dedicated standby batteries or
provided with 2-hour standby batteries and connected to the facility generator power system
in accordance with Section 1203. The standby power supply shall be capable of operating the
in-building, two-way emergency responder communication coverage system at 100-percent

system capacity for a duration of not less than 72 hours.

Chapter 9
SECTION 863.2 “WHERE REQUIRED" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 903.2 Where Required. Approved automatic sprinkler systems in new buildings and
structures when constructed or relocated within the jurisdiction shalf be provided in the
{focations described in Sections 903.2.1 through 903.2.12 and Sections 903.2.14 through

903.2.23.
Exception: Agricuftural buildings not under a special use permit used for commercial
PUposes.

SECTION 803.2,1.1 “GROUP A-1” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 903.2.1.1 Group A. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout stories
containing Group A-1 occupancies and throughout all stories from the Group A-1 occupancy to
and including the levels of exit discharge serving that occupancy where one of the following

conditions exists:
1. The fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet.
2. The fire area has an occupant load of 300 or more.

3. The fire area is located on a ficor other than a level of exit discharge serving such
occupancies.

4. The fire area contains a multi-theater complex
SECTION 803.2.1.2 “GROUP A-2" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 903.2.1.2 Group A-2. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout
stories containing Group A-2 occupancies and throughout all stories from the Group A-2

Ordinanee 2022-0] Pagc 9

23-0015F 12 of 43



occupancy to and including the levels of exit discharge serving that occupancy where one of the
following conditions exists:

1. The fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet;
2. The fire area has an occupant load of 160 or more.

3. The fire area is located on a floor other than a level of exit discharge serving such
ocoupancies.

4. The structure exceeds 3,600 square feet, contains more than one fire area containing a
Group A-2 occupancy, and is separated into fwo or more buildings by fire walls of less than
4-hour fire-resistance rating without openings.

SECTION 903.2.1.3 “GRCUP A-3" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 903.2.1.3 Group A-3. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout
stories containing Group A-2 occupancies and throughout all stories from the Group A-3
occupancy to and including the levels of exit discharge serving that occupancy where one of the
following conditions exists:

1. The fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet.
2. The fire area has an occupant load of 300 or more.

3. The fire area is located on a floor other than a level of exit discharge serving such
occupancies.

4. The structure exceeds 3,600 square feet, contains more than one fire area confaining
exhibition and display rooms, and is separated into two or more buildings by fire walls of
less than 4-hour fire-resistance rating without openings.

SECTION 903.2.1.4 “GROUP A-4" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 903.2.1.4 Group A-4. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout
stories containing Group A-4 occupancies and throughout all stories from the Group A4
occupancy to and including the levels of exit discharge serving that occupancy where one of the
following conditions exists:

1. The fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet.
2. The fire area has an occupant load of 300 or more.

3. The fire area is located on a floor other than a level of exit discharge serving such
occupancies.

SECTION 902.2.3 “GROUP E” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 903.2.3 Group E. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided for Group E
cceupancies as follows:

1. Throughout all Group E fire areas greater than 3,600 square feet in area.

2. The Group E fire area is located on a floor other than a level of exit discharge serving such
occupancies,

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 10

23-0015 F 13 of 43



Exception: In buildings where every classroom has not fewer than one exterior exit
door at ground level, an automatic sprinkler system is not required in any
area below the lowest level of exit discharge serving that area.

3. The Group E fire area has an oceupant load of 300 or more.

4. In rooms or areas with special hazards such as laboratories, vocational shops and other
such areas where hazardous materials in quantities not exceeding the maximum atlowable
quantity are used or stored.

5. Throughout any Group E structure greater than 3,600 square feet in area, which contains
more than one fire area, and which is separated into two or more buildings by fire walls of
less than 4-hour fire resistance rating without openings.

6. For public school state funded construction projects see Section 803.2.19.
7. For public school campuses, Kindergarten through 12" grade, see Section 903.2.20

SECTICN 903.2.4 “GROUP F-1" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 903.2.4 Group F-1. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout all
buildings containing a Group F-1 occupancy where one of the following conditions exists:

1. A Group F-1 fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet,
2. A Group F-1 fire area is located more than three stories above grade plane.

3. The combined area of all Group F-1 fire areas on all floors, including any mezzanines,
exceeds 3,600 square feet.

SECTION 803.2.7 “GROUP M” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 903.2.7 Group M. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout buildings
containing a Group M occupancy where one of the following conditions exists:

1. A Group M fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet.
2. A Group M fire area is located more than three stories above grade plane.

3. The combined area of all Group M fire areas on all floors, including any mezzanines,
exceeds 3,600 square feet.

5. The structure exceeds 3,600 square feet, contains more than one fire arsa containing a
Group M occupancy, and is separated into two or more buildings by fire walls of less than
4-hour fire resistance rating without openings.

SECTION 903.2.7.2 “GROUP M UPHGLSTERED FURNITURE OR MATTRESSES” SHALL
BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 903.2.7.2 Group M Upholstered Furniture or Mattresses. An automatic sprinkler
system shall be provided throughout a Group M fire area where the area used for the display
and sale of upholstered furniture or mattresses exceeds 3,600 square feet.

SECTION 903.2.8.5 “MANUFACTURED HOMES” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 11

23-0015F 14 of 43



Section 903.2.8.5 Manufactured Homes. An automatic fire sprinkler system shail be required
in all new manufaciured homes and multi-family manufactured homes infended for use as a
one-and two-family dwelling. The design and installation of such systems shall be in
accordance with California Code of Regulations, Title 25, §4300.

Exceptions:

1. Manufactured homes located within an existing mobile home park complying with
California Health and Safety Code, Division 13, Part 2.1 or 2.3.

2. Manufactured homes that do not exceed 1,200 square feet in size and serve as an
accessory dwelling unit, as defined in Government Code Section 658502, when the
existing primary residence on the properiy is not required to comply with California
Residential Code Secficn R313.2.

3. Manufactured homes that do not exceed 320 square feet in size.
SECTION 903.2.9 “GRCUP $-1" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 903.2.9 Group S-1. An autcmatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout all
buildings containing a Group S-1 occupancy where one of the following conditions exists:

1. A Group S-1 fire area excesds 3,600 square feet.
2. A Group S-1fire area is located more than three stories above grade plane.

3. The combined area of all Group S-1 fire areas on all floors, including any mezzanines,
exceeds 3,600 sguare feet.

4. A Group S-1 fire area used for the storage of commercial motor vehicles where the fire
area exceeds 3,600 square feet.

SECTION 903.2.10 "GROUP S-2” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 903.2.10 Group $-2. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout
buildings classified as parking garages where any of the foliowing conditions exist:

1. Where the fire area of the enclosed parking garage, in accordance with Section 406.6 of
the California Building Code, exceeds 3,600 square feet.

2. Where the enclosed parking garage, in accordance with Section 406.6 of the California
Building Code, is located beneath other groups.

Exception: Enclosed parking garages located beneath Group R-3 occupancies.

3. Where the fire area of the open parking garage, in accordance with Section 406.5 of the
California Building Code, exceeds 3,600 square feet.

SECTION 903.2.10.1 “COMMERCIAL PARKING GARAGES” SHALL BE AMENDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 903.2.10.1 Commercial Parking Garages. An automatic sprinkler system shall be
provided throughout buildings used for storage of commercial motor vehicles where the fire area

exceeds 3,600 square feet,

Ordinance 202201 Page 12

23-0015 F 15 of 43



SECTION 903.2.22 “GROUP B" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 903.2.22 Group B. An automatic sprinkier system shall be provided throughout all
buildings confaining Group B occupancies where the fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet.

SECTION 903.2.23 "GROUP F-2" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 903.2.23 Group F-2. An aufomatic sprinkler systemn sheall be provided throughout all
buildings containing Group F-2 occupancies where the fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet,

SECTION 903.6 “WHERE REQUIRED IN EXISTING BUILDINGS AND STRUCTURES” IS
AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 903.6 Where Required In Existing Buildings and Structures. An automatic
sprinkler system shall be provided in existing buildings and structures where required in
Chapter 11 and as folows:
1. When there is a chanige in occupancy classification that results in an increased life safety
or fire risk, as determined by the fire code official, and the structure exceeds 3,600 square
feet, an automatic fire sprinkler system shall be installed throughout the building.

2. Inexisting buildings 3,600 square feet or greater, other than one and two-family dwelling
units, and agricultural buildings not under special use permit for commercial purposes,
where the floor area of the building or structure is increased, such building or structure

shall be made to conform to Section 903.2,
Exception: When the building increase is less than 500 square feet.

3. In existing buildings 3,600 square feet or less, other than one-and two-family dwelling
units, and agricultural buildings not under special use permit for commercial purposes,
where the floor area of the building or structure is increased fo a fofal square foofage
over 3,600 square feet, such building or structure shafl be made fo conform fo Section

903.2.
Exception. When the building increase is fess than 500 square feet.

SECTION 907.2. “WHERE REQUIRED — NEW BUILDINGS AND STRUCTURES” SHALL BE
AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 907.2. Where Required — New Buildings and Structures. An approved fire alarm
system installed in accordance with the provisions of this code and NFPA 72 shal! be provided
in new buildings and structures in accordance with Sections 807.2.1 through 907.2.2830 and
provide occupant notification in accordance with Section 907.5, unless other requirements are

provided by ancther section of this code.

Mot fewer than one manual fire alarm box shall be pravided in an approved location fo initiate
a fire alarm signal for fire alarm systems employing automatic fire detectors or waterflow
detection devices. Where other sections of this code allow elimination of fire alarm boxes due
to sprinkiers or automatic fire alarm systems, a single fire alarm box shall be installed at a

location approved by the enforcing agency.
Exceptions:

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 13

23-0015 F 16 of 43



1. The manual fire alarm box is not required for fire alarm control units systems
dedicated to elevator recall control, supervisory service and fire sprinkler
manitoring.

2. The manual fire alarm box is not required for Group R-2 occupancies unless
required by the fire code official to provide a means for fire watch personnel te
initiate an alarm during a sprinkler system, impairment event. Where provided, the
manual fire alarm box shall not be located in an area that is open to the public.

3. The manual! fire alarm box is not required to be installed when approved by the fire
code official.

4, A fire alarm system is nof required in one and two-family dwellings, agricultural
buildings, and other occupancies classified as Group U not under special use
permit and/or not used for commercial purposes (e.g. refail sales, food service,
and/or special gvents).

5. Buildings with a floor area less than 500 square feet may be exempt, as determined
by the fire code official based on building construction material and features,
location, occupancy fype, and distance fo exposures,

SECTION $07.2.1.4 “GROUP A UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET” SHALL BE ADDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 907.2.1.4 Group A Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shalf
be installed in all group A buiidings with a floor area Jess than 3,600 square feel.

SECTION 907.2.2.3 “GROUP B UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET" SHALL BE ADDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 907.2.2.3 Group B Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shalf
be installed in ail group B buildings with a floor area less than 3,600 square feel.

SECTION 907.2.3.11 “GROUP E UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET" SHALL BE ADDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 907.2.3.11 Group E Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shail
be instafled in all group £ bulldings with a fioor area less than 3,600 square feet.

SECTION 807.2.4.1 “GROUP F UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET" SHALL BE ADDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 907.2.4.1 Group F Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shall
be installed in ail group F buildings with a floor area less than 3,600 square feet.

SECTION 907.2.5.2 “GROUP H UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET” SHALL BE ADDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 907.2.5.2 Group H Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shall
be instaffed in alt group H buildings with a floor area less than 3,600 square feef.

Qrdinance 20221 Page 14

23-0015 F 17 of 43



SECTION 907.2.6.6 “GRQUP | UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET” SHALL BE ADDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 907.2.6.6 Group | Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shall be
installed in alt group | buildings with a floor area less than 3,600 square feet.

SECTION 907.2.7.2 “GROUP M UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET” SHALL BE ADDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 907.2.7.2 Group M Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shal!
be instafled in aif group M buildings with a floor area less than 3,600 square feel.

SECTION 907.2.8.4 “GROUP R-1 UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET” SHALL BE ADDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 907.2.8.4 Group R-1 Under 3,600 Square Feet, An approved fire alarm system shall
be instailed in alf group R-1 buildings with a floor area less than 3,600 square feet.

SECTION 907.2.9.4 “GROUP R-2, R-2,1, R-2.2 UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET” SHALL BE
ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 907.2.9.4 Group R-2, R-2.1, R-2.2 Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm
system shall be instalfed in all group R-2, R-2.1, R-2.2 buildings with a floor area less than

3,600 square feet.

SECTION 807.2.10.1 "GROUP S UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET" SHALL BE ADDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 907.2.10.1 Group S Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shall
be installed in all group S buildings with a floor area less than 3,600 square feet.

907.2.30 “TYPE | HOOD INSTALLATIONS” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

907.2.30 “Type I Hood Installations. The requirement of installation, or replacement, of a
Type | Hood System shall require a fire alarm/sprinkier, monitoring system fo be instailed, or
for the hood system to be connected fo an exisfing fire alarm/sprinkler monitoring system for

thaf btitding.
907.8.5 “MONITORING" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

907.6.5 Monitoring. Fire alarm systerms required by this chapter or by the California Building
Code shall be monitored by an approved, UL certified, Type A Full Service centrai, proprietary
or remofte station service, which gives audible and visual signals at a consfantly altended
location. All sprinklered buildings shall be monitored.

Exceptions:
1. One- and two-family dwellings (R-3 Qccupancies and other occupancies classified
as ‘).
Ordinance 2022-01 Page 15

23-0015F 18 of 43



2. Agriculfural buildings not under special use permit and/or not used for commercial
purposes (e.q., retails sales, food service, and/or special events).

SECTION 807.6.2.1 “SECONDARY POWER SUPPLY” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

SECTION 907.6.2.1 SECONDARY POWER SUPPLY. Where required by the fire code official,
in accordance with NFPA 72, the secondary power supply providing a minimum 24-hour power
capacily under quiescent load (system operating in a non-alarm condition} shall be amended

fo a minimum 72-hour power capacity.

Exception: The existence of an emergency back-up power supply that meefs or exceed
the requirements of California Fire Code Chapter 12.

SECTION 907.9 “WHERE REQURIED IN EXISTING BUILDINGS” SHALL BE AMENDED AS
FOLLOWS:

SECTION 807.2 Where Required. An approved fire alarm system shall be provided in existing
buildings and structures where required in Chapter 11 and in existing buildings with a fioor
area less than 3,600 square feet without an approved automatic sprinkier system, ottier than
one- or two-famify dwelling units, agricultural building not under special use permit for
commercial purposes where a fire alarm detection system does not exist and the floor area of

the building or structure is increased
Exception: When the building increase is Jess than 500 square feel.

Chapter 12
SECTION 1203.1.3 “INSTALLATION" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 1203.1.3 Installation. Emergency power systems and standby power systems shall
be installed in accordance with the California Building Code, the Califormia Electrical Code,
NFPA 110 and NFPA 111. Aff buildings, other than one- and fwo-family dwelfing units, and
agricuitural buildings not used for commercial purposes, with sfandby power, shall have a
shunt trip device that disconnects all power sources fo the building, approved by the fire code
cificial. Existing instaflations shall be maintained it accordance with the original approval.

Chapter 33
SECTION 3311.3 “PREMISE IDENTIFICATION” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 3311.3 Premise identification. Prior fo and during construction, an approved
address sign shall be provided at each fire and emergency vehicle access road entry info the

project.
SECTION 3313.1 “WHEN REQUIRED” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:
Section 3313.1 When Required. An approved water supply for fire protection, either

temporary or permanent, shall be instafled and maintained in continuous operation as soon as
combustible building materials arrive on site, the commencement of vertical combustible

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 16

23-0015F 19 of 43



construction and on installation of a standpipe system in buildings under construction, in
accordance with Sections 3313.2 threugh 3313.5.
Exception: The fire code official is authorized fo reduce the fire-flow requirements for
isolated buildings or a2 group of buildings in rural areas or small communities where the
development of full fire-flow requirements is impractical.

Chapter 50
SECTION 5001.7 “LIABILITY FOR DAMAGES” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 5001.7 Liability for Damages. Any damages or cost resulting from the negligence,
violation of the law, careless handiing, spill or discharge of any hazardous materials shal
constitufe debf against any such person, firm or corporation causing such spill or discharge.
This debt is collectible by the Fire Chief, or hisfher duly authorized representative, in the same
manner as in the case of an obligation under conlract, expressed or implied.

Chapter 56
SECTION 5601.2 “PERMIT REQUIRED” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 5601.2 Permit Required. Permits shall be required as set forth in Section 105.5 and
regulated in accordance with this section. Where fireworks permits are required, they shail be
issued by the Fire Chief, or his/her duly authotized representative, and the E! Dorado County

Board of Supervisors.

Chapter 57

SECTION 5704.2.9.6.1 “LOCATIONS WHERE ABOVE-GROUND TANKS ARE
PROHIBITED” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

SECTION 5704.2.9.6.1 Locations Where Above-Ground Tanks are Prohibited. Storage of
Class | and Class Il flammable liquids in above-ground tanks outside of buildings is prohibited
within the limits established by law as the limits of districts in which such storage is prohibited.
Storage of Class | and Class If flammable liquids in above-ground tanks outside of buildings is
prohibited unless approved by the fire code officlal.

SECTION 5706.2.4.4 “LOCATIONS WHERE ABOVE-GROUND TANKS ARE PROHIBITED”
SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

SECTION 5706.2.4.4 Locations Where Above-Ground Tanks are Prohibited. The storage
of Class | and Class !l liguids in above-ground tanks is prohibited within the limifs established
by law as the limits of districts in which such storage is prohibited. Storage of Class | and Class
! liquids in above-ground tanks fs prohibited unless approved by the fire code official,

Chapter 58

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 17

23-0015F 20 of 43



SECTION 5806.2 “LIMITATIONS” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

SECTION 5806.2 Limitations. Storage of flammable cryogenic fluids in stationary containers
outside of buildings is prohibited within the limits established by law as the limits of districts in
which such storage is prohibited. Storage of flammable cryogenic fuids in stationary containers
oufside of buifdings is prohibited unfess approved by the fire code official.

Chapter 61

SECTION 6104.2 “MAXIMUM CAPACITY WITHIN ESTABLISHED LIMITS" SHALL BE
AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

SECTION 6104.2 Maximum Capacity within Established Limits. Within the limits
established by law restricting the storage of liquefied petroleum gas for the protection of heavily
populated or congested areas, the aggregate capacity of any one installation shall not exceed
a water capacity of 2,000 gallons. The storage of liquefied pefroieum gas in excess of an
aggregate of 2,000-gallon water capacity when localed at feast one-haif (1/2) miie from
property zoned or designated for residential use and at least one-half (1/2) mife from existing
residential development with a density grealer than one (1) dwelfing unit per acre and at least
one-haif {1/2) mile from any hotel or motel is allowed when approved by the fire code official,
and a special/conditional use permit is issued by the County of £l Dorado.

Dispensing within established limits. Within the limits established by law restricting the
dispensing of liquefied petroleurn gas for the protection of heavily populated or congested
areas, the aggregate capacity of any one instalfation shall nof exceed a water capacity of 2,000
gallons. The dispensing of liquefied petroleum gas in excess of an aggregate of 2,000-gallon
water capacity when located at least one-half (1/2) mile from property zoned or desighated for
residential use and at Jeast one-half (1/2) mile from any hotel or motel is alfowed when
approved by the fire code official and a special/conditional use permit is issued by the County
of £Ef Dorado.

Chapter 80

SECTION 80, NFPA 1-22, CHAPTER 22 “AUTOMOTIVE WRECKING YARDS" 1S ADOPTED,
AMENDED SECTIONS AS FOLLOWS:

Revise Section 22,3 as follows:

22.3 Fire department access roads shall be in accordance with the California Fire Code,
Section 503 and Appendix D.

Add new Section 22.10 as follows:

22.10 Stored vehicles, boats, recreational vehicles, parts, and equipment shall not be stored
within 30 feet of adjacent property lines.

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 18

23-0015 F 21 of 43



SECTION 80, NFPA, 13D-22 — "STANDARD FOR THE INSTALLATION OF SPRINKLER
SYSTEMS IN ONE-AND TWO FAMILY DWELLINGS AND MANUFACTURED HOMES” IS
AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 803.3.1.3, 803.3.5.1.1

NFPA 13D, Amended Sections as follows:

Add new Section 4.6 as follows:

4.6 Residential fire sprinkler systems instalied in all new one-and fwo-famify dwellings shall utifize
& “Passive Purge” system design unless otherwise approved by the fire code official.

Exception: Manufactured home installed, fested and approved by the California
Department of Housing and Community Development.

Revise Section 5.1.1.2 as follows:

5.1.1.2 A supply of at least one of each type and temperature sprinkier used within the premises
shall be maintained on the propeity af an approved location, Spare sprinklers shall be kept in &
mounted and accessible cabinet.

Revise Section 7.6 as follows:

7.8 A local audio/visual device activated upon water flow shall be provided on aff fire sprinkier
systems in homes at an approved lacation on the exterior of the dwelling.

Revise Section 11.2.1.1 as follows:

11.2.1.1 Where a fire department pumper connection is not provided, the system shall be
hydrostatically tested at a minimum pressure of 150 pounds per square inch gauge for no less
than a 30-minute duration without evidence of feakage. Such test shall be witnessed by the fire

code official.
Appendix B - Fire Flow Requirements for Buildings

TABLE B105.1(1) "REQUIRED FIRE FLOW FOR ONE- AND TWO-FAMILY DWELLINGS,
GROUP R-3, AND R-4 BUILDINGS AND TOWNHOUSES®™ SHALL BE AMENDED AS

FOLLOWS:

TABLE B105.1{1) REQUIRED FIRE FLOW FOR ONE- AND TWO-FAMILY DWELLINGS,
GROUP R-3, AND R-4 BUILDINGS AND TOWNHOUSES

FIRE-FLOW AUTOMATIC MINIMUM FIRE- | FLOW DURATION
CALCULATION SPRINKLER SYSTEM FLOW (hours)
AREA {Design Standard) {gallons per
{square feet) minute)
0 -3.800 No¢ automatic sprinkler | 1,000 1

system

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 19

23-0015 F 22 of 43



3,601 and greater | No automatic sprinkler | Value in Table | Duration in Table
system 8105.1(2) B105.1(2) at the
required  fire-flow
rate
MAJOR SUBDIVISIONS (6§ PARCELS OR GREATER}
0-3,600 Section 903.3.1.3 of the | 1,000 1
CA Fire Code or Section
3133 of the CA
Residential Code
3,601 and greater | Section 903.3.1.3 of the | 1/2 value of
CA Fire Code or Section | Table B105.1(2) : 2
3133 of the CA |(min 1000
Residential Code GPM)
OTHER RESIDENTIAL DEVELOPMENT
0 - 3,600 [ Section 903.3.1.3 of the | 500 1
CA Fire Code or Section
3133 of the CA
Residential Code
3,601 and greater | Section 903.3.1.3 of the | 1/2Zvalueof Table | 1
CA Fire Code or Section ! B105.1(2) (min.
313.3 of the CA |750GPM)
Residential Code

TABLE B105.2 “REQUIREDE FIRE FLOW FOR BUILDINGS OTHER THAN ONE- AND

TWO-FAMILY DWELLINGS,

TOWNHOUSES" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

GROUP R-3, AND R-4 BUILDINGS AND

TABLE B105.2 REQUIRED FIRE FLOW FOR BUILDINGS OTHER THAN ONE-
AND TWO-FAMILY DWELLINGS, GROUP R-3, AND R-4 BUILDINGS AND

TOWNHOUSES
AUTOMATIC MINIMUM FIRE- FLOW DURATION
SPRINKLER SYSTEM FLOW (hours)

{gallons per minute)
Value in Table

(Design Standard)
No automatic sprinkler

Duration in Table B105.1(2)

system B105.1(2) I
Section 803.3.1.1 of the |25% of the value in | Durationin Table B105.1(2)at
CA Fire Code Table B105.1(2) the reduced flow rate

b. The reduced fire flow shall not be less than 1,500 gpm

Ordinanee 2022-01 Page 20

23-0015 F 23 of 43



Appendix D - Fire Apparatus Access Roads

SECTION D103.1 “ACCESS ROAD WIDTH WITH A HYDRANT" SHALL BE AMENDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section D103.1 Access Road Width with a Hydrant. Where a fire hydrant is located on a
fire apparatus access road, the minimum road width shall be 26 feet (7925 mmy), exclusive of

shoulders (see Figure D103.1).
Exception: Driveways

SECTION D103.2 “GRADE” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

SECTION D103.2 Grade. Fire apparatus access roads and driveways shall not exceed 15.9%
in grade unless approved by the fire code official or by the Ef Dorade County amended
California Public Resource Code Titfe 14 / Design and Improvement Standards Manual.

SECTION D103.3 “TURNING RADIUS® SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

SECTION B103.3 Turning Radius. The minimum turning radius shall be determined by the
fire code official; and shail not include curb and gutter.

SECTION D103.5 "FIRE APPARATUS ACCESS ROAD GATES" SHALL BE AMENDED AS
FOLLOWS:

SECTION D103.5 Fire Apparatus Access Road Gates. Gates securing the fire apparatus
access roads shall comply with all of the following criteria:

1. Where a single gate is provided, the gate width shall be not less than 20 feet (6096 mm).
Where a fire apparatus road consists of a divided roadway, the gate width shall be not less
than 15 feet (3658 mm).

2. Gates shall be of the horizontal swing, horizontal slide, vertical lift or vertical pivot type.
3. Construction of gates shafl be of materials that allow manual operation by one persan.

4. Gate compenents shall be maintained in an operative condition at all times and replaced
or repaired when defective.

5. Electric gates shall be equipped with a means of opening the gate by fire depariment
personnel for emergency access. Emergency opening devices shall be approved by the

fire code official.

6. Methods of locking shall be submitted for approval by the fire code official.

7. Electric gate operators, where provided, shall be listed in accordance with UL 325.

8. Gates intended for automatic operation shall be designed, constructed and installed to
comply with the requirements of ASTM F2200.

SECTION D103.6.1 “ROADS 20 TO 29 FEET IN WIDTH” SHALL BE AMENDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Ordinance 2022.01 Page 21

23-0015 F 24 of 43



SECTION D193.6.1 Roads 20 to 29 feet in width. Fire lane signs as specified in Section
D103.6 shall be posted on both side of fire apparatus access roads that are 20 to 29 feet wide

(6096 to 8534.4 mm).

SECTION D103.6.2 “ROADS MORE THAN 28 FEET IN WIDTH® SHALL BE AMENDED AS
FOLLOWS:

SECTION D1903.6.2 Roads more than 28 feet in Width. Fire lane signs as specified in Section
[0103.8 shall be posted on one side of fire apparatus access roads more than 29 feet wide
(8534.4 mm) and less than 36 feet wide (10972.8 mm).

SECTION D104.4 “CIRCUMFERENTIAL FIRE APPARATUS ACCESS ROADS™ SHALL BE
ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

SECTION D104.4 Circumferential Fire Apparatus Access Roads. When required by the
fire code official, a fire apparatus access road shall be constructed to encompass the entirety
of a structure and shall provide a continuous means of emergency vehicle access.

SECTION 4: CONFLICT
That Ordinance No. 2019-01 of the EDHCWD, and all other ordinances or parts of ordinances

herewith are hereby repealed.

SECTION 5: SEVERABILITY

If any Ordinance, article, subsection or subdivision thereof, provision, sentence, clause or
phrase of ihis code, or any application thereof, is for any reason held to be invalid by a court
of competent jurisdiction, such decision shall not affect the remaining provisions of this code,
which can be given effect without the invalid portions and, therefore, such invalid portions are
declared fo be severable. The EDHCWD hereby declares that it would have enacted this
Ordinance and each of its arficles, sections, subsections, or subdivisions thereof, provisions,
sentences, clauses or phrases irrespective of the fact that ene or more of them is declared

invalid,

SECTION 6: EFFECTIVE DATE AND PUBLICATION

This Ordinance shall take effect thirty (30) days after its adoption. The EDHCWD Board
Secretary is directed to publish this ordinance in a newspaper of general circulation in the
District. In lieu of publication of the full text of the ordinance, a summary of the ordinance may
be published by the by the Board Secretary within fifteen {15) days after its passage and a

Ordinance 2022-G1 Page 22

23-0015 F 25 of 43



certified copy shall be posted in the office of the EDHCWD pursuant o Government Code

Section 36933(c} (1}.

The above Ordinance was introduced at a meeting of the Board of Directors of the EDHCWD
on September 15, 2022, and it was then read for the first time. A public hearing was set for
the Ordinance to be read for the second time on October 20, 2022 and approved by the

following vote:

PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of Directors of the EDHCWD this, aflﬁ‘day of

Ockeoeg 2022

AYES: 5
NOES: O
ABSENT: O
ABSTAIN: O

A Mt

Bobbi Bennett, Board President

ATTEST:

OXGund e BA s ool

Jessica Braddock, Board Secretary

Ordinance 2022-01

Page 23

23-0015 F 26 of 43



FINDINGS OF FACTS
FOR CHANGES OR MODIFICATIONS TO THE CALIFORNIA CODE OF
REGULATIONS, TITLE 24, PART 9

In connection with the amendments enacted by Section 2 and 3 relating to the California
Fire Code and its appendix, 2022 edition, the El Dorado Hills County Water EDHCWD
(EDHCWD) makes the following findings pursuant to Health and Safety Code Section
17958.5, 17958.7 and 18941.5. The changes are reasonably necessary because of local
climatic, topographical or geological conditions.

EDHCW®D hereby adopts pursuant to Section 18941.5 of the California Health and
Safety Code, the following findings of fact:

{a) Under this adopting ordinance, specific amendments have been
established which are of a more restrictive nature than those adopted by the State of
California (State Buildings Standards Code, State Housing & Community Development
Codes) commonly referred to as Title 24 & Title 25 of the California Code of Regulations.
These amendments to the California Fire Code 2022 edition, have been recognized by
the EDHCWD to address the fire problems, concerns and future direction by which
EDHCWD can establish and maintain an environment which will afford a level of fire and
life safety to all who live and work within its boundary.

() The International Code Council has assumed responsibility for the
International Fire Code and International Fire Code Standards. The International Code
Council provided a means for participation by all code enforcement officials from
throughout the country as well as industry representatives, consultants, and other private
parties with an interest in the International Fire Code.

(¢)  The International Fire Code, being the 2021 edition thereof, published by
the International Code Council is a nationally recognized compilation of proposed rules,
regulations and standards of said Council.

(d)  Said International Fire Code has been printed and published as a Code in
book form within the meaning of Section 50022.1 of the Government Code of the State

of California.

{e)  Under the provisions of Section 18941.5 of the Health and Safety Code,
local amendments are based on climatic, topographical and geologicai conditions. The
findings of fact contained herein address each of these situations and present the local
situation, which either singularly or in combination, caused the aforementioned
amendments to be adopted.

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 24

23-0015 F 27 of 43



LOCAL CONDITIONS

A. These amendments are justified on the basis of a local climatic condition.
EDHCWD is subject to precipitation, relative humidity, temperature extremes, and
high velocity winds.

1. Precipitation & relative humidity
a. Conditions

Precipitation. Average annual precipitation ranges from approximately
25 to 32 inches per year. Approximately 88% of the average rainfall
occurs during the months of November through Aptil and 12% from May
through October. This area has experienced major droughts in the last
two decades: 1986 -1991, 1998 — 2003, 2007 - 2009, and 2011 - 2015.
It is possible that more droughts will occur in the future based on the
weather cycle pattern.

Relative Humidity. During the summer months (May through
September), the daily humidity generally ranges around 20% and
occasionally drops to the low teens.

2. Temperature
a. Conditions
Temperatures. During the summer months (May through
September), the daily temperatures commonly exceed 90 degrees
Fahrenheit, with temperatures having been recorded as high as
115 degrees.

@
=
=]
o
o

Conditions

Winds. The summer prevailing winds are out of the south and
southwest. However, north winds occur during the spring (April
and May), the fall (September and October), and occasionally
during the summer months (June, July and August). Velocities are
generally in the range of five to fifteen miles per hour, gusting to 30
miles per hour during the summer months.

o

SUMMARY

These local climatic conditions affect the acceleration, intensity and size of fire in
the community. Times of little or no rainfall and high temperatures create
extremely hazardous conditions, particularly as they relate to residential roof fires
and wildfire conflagrations. The climatic conditions are one of the greatest impacts
to fire behavior and other major emergency events due to their uncontrollable

nature.

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 25

23-0015 F 28 of 43



B. These amendments are justified on the basis of a local geologic and topographic
conditions. EDHCWD is subject to varied terrain, slopes, increased vegetation,
varied surface features, hazardous building operations, and terrain risk factors.

1. Geological location

a. Conditions

Geological Location. El Dorado Hills is located in the foothills of the
Sierra at an altitude range of approximately 650 feet to 1,500 feet above
sea level.

2. 8ize and population

a. Conditions

Size and Population. The EDHCWD encompasses approximately
seventy to eighty (70-80) square miles and has a current population
of approximately 50,000 residents.

3. Seismic Location
a. Conditions

Seismic Location. The nearest identified fault zone running
through the EDHCWD is the Bear Mountain Fault. This fault zone
is split into several branches which transect the area between
Folsom and Shingle Springs. The closest branch passes through
the middle of the EDHCWD along the western edge of Browns
Ravine. The next nearest extension of this fault system is located
immediately at the north end of the EDHCWD, and extends from the
southeast arm of Folsom Lake, north to the City of Auburn. No
recent geologic activity has been observed along this fauit.
However, studies of the east branch of the fault zone, conducted by
Woodward-Clyde Associates for the Auburn Dam, and by Tierra
Engineering Consultants near Folsom Lake, indicate that the fault
may be reactivating based on recent tectonic trends and should be
considered potentially active.

4. Topography
a. Conditions

Topography. The topography of the EDHCWD varies from level 0%
slope to terrain with over a 40% slope. The valley floor is relatively
flat with gentle slopes and consists of grassland and trees. The east
and west sides of the valley floor increase to approximately 40%
siopes and consist of trees, brush and grass-covered range land.
The greatest degree of slope occurs in the northern end of the
EDHCWD and extends northeast from there. Hilly terrain throughout
the area provides gullies or areas referred to as "chimneys” which
accelerate the spread of fire.

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 26

23-0015 F 29 of 43



5. Roads and streets

a. Conditions

Roads and Streets. The EDHCWD has seen an accelerated degree
of urban and commercial development within the last 15 years. With
this development comes the increase of vehicular traffic and
congestion which can have a direct effect on the response time of
emergency apparatus.

6. Building Clearances
a. Conditions

Building Clearances. As residential development continues to
occur in the EDHCWD, the clearance between homes has
decreased which increases the ability of fire to spread from one
home to another by both radiation and convection heat.

SUMMARY

The above geological and topographical conditions increase the magnitude,
exposure, accessibility problems and fire hazards that the EDHCWD must handle.
Fire following an earthquake has the potential of causing greater loss of life and

damage to property than the earthquake itself.
Other variables may tend to increase the situation:

1. The damage that may occur to the water system, and;
2. The extent of isolation due to roadway damage, overpass collapse and
debris blocking the roadway.

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 27

23-0015 F 30 of 43



2022 CFC Code Title Adopted| Amended | Added | Delefed Finding
Section
101.1 General X Administrative
102.6 - 102.12 Applicability X Administrative
104.1 Duties and Powers X Administrative
104.3— 104.4 Duties and Powers X Administrative
104.6 Official Records X Administrative
104.8— 104.8.2 Approved Materials X Administrative
104.9 Modifications X Administrative
104.11— 104.12.3 Fire Investigation X Administrative
105.2.3 Time of Application X Administrative
105.3.2 Extensions X Administrative
105.5 Operational Permits Administrative
105.5.55 Automobile X Administrative
Wrecking Yards
105.6 Construction X Administrative
Permits
105.6.25 Automobile X Administrative
Wirecking Yards
105.6.9 Fuel Cell X Administrative
105.6.12 [Hazardous Materials X Administrative
105.17 Plant Extraction X Administrative
105.18 Private Fire X Administrative
Hydrants
105.19 Smoke Control X Administrative
105.6.21 Special Event X Administrative
Structure
105.6.22 Spraying or Dipping X Administrative
105.6.23 Standpipe Systems X Administrative
106.6.24 Tents X Administrative
106.1~ 106.4 Construction X Administrative
Documents
107.1 Fees X Administrative
107.5 Related Fees X Administrative
107.5.1 Cost Recovery X Administrative
107.6 Refunds X Administrative
107.7 Administrative X Administrative
Costs
Section 108 Inspections X Administrative
Section 109 Maintenance X Administrative
111.5 Appeals X Administrative
112.4 Violation Penalties X Administrative
112.4.1 Abatement of X Administrative
Violations
112.4.2 Citations X Administrative
Section 113 Stop Work Order Administrative
113.4 Failure to Comply X Administrative
Ordinance 2022-01 Page 28

23-0015 F 31 of 43




2022 CFC Code Title Adopted| Amended | Added | Deleted Finding
Section
Section 114 Unsafe Structures X Administrative
202 Definitions X Administrative
Section 302 Definitions Administrative
Section 303 Asphalt Kettles Al, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
302.1 Definitions X Administrative
Section 304 Combustible Waste X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
Section 305 Ignition Sources X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2, B3. B4, B5, B
Section 306 Motion Picture X B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
Secfion 307 Open Burning X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
30744 Open Burning X A1, A2 A3, B1, B2 B3. B4, B5, B6
Section 308 Open Flames X A1, A2 A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
Section 309 Power_?d Irll(dustrial X A1, A2 A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
rucks
Section 310 Smoking X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
Section 311 Vacant Premises X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
Section 320 3D Printing X B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
Section 321 Artificial Vegetation X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2 B3. B4, B5, B6
403.2 - 403.2.4 Grom X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
4036 —-4036.1.4 Group F X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2, B3. B4, B5, B6
403.9-4039.34 Group R X A1, A2, A3, Bi, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
503.2.1 Dimensions X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
503.2.5 Dead Ends X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
503.2.6 Bridges X A1, A2 A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
503.3.1 No Parking — Fire X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
Lanes
503.3.2 No Parking — Fire X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
Hydrants
503.3.3 Fire Lane Width X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, BS, B6&
503.6 Security Gates X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2, B3. B4, B5, B6
505.1 Address X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
507.5.1 Where Required — X A1, A2, A3 B1,B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
Fire Hydrants
500.3 Fire Control Rooms X B1, B2. B3, B4, B5, B6
807.5.2 Group E X B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
903.2 Where Required — X A1, A2 A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, BS, B&
Fire Sprinklers
903.2.1.1 Group A X A1, A2 A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
803.2.1.2 Group A-2 X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
903.21.3 Group A-3 X A1, A2, A3 B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
903.2.1.4 Group A-4 X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, BS, B6
903.2.3 Group E X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2, B3. B4, B5, B6
903.2.4 Group F-1 X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
903.2.7 Group M X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6

Ordinance 2022-01

Page 29

23-0015 F 32 of 43




2022 CFC Code Title Adopted| Amended | Added | Deleted Finding
Section
903.2.7.2 Group M - X A1, A2 A3 B1, B2 B3. B4, B5, B6
Mattresses
903.2.8.5 Manufactured X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
Homes
903.2.9 Group S-1 X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
903.2.10 Group S-2 X A1, A2 A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
903.2.10.1 Parking Garages X A1, A2 A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
903.2.22 Group B X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
903.2.23 Group F-2 X A1, A2 A3 B1, B2 B3. B4, B5, B6
803.6 Where Required — X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B&
Fire Sprinklers
907.2 Where Required - X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
Fire Alarm Systems
907214 Group A X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
907.2.2.3 Group B X A1, A2 A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, BS
907.2.3.11 Group E X A1, A2 A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
907.2.4.1 Group F-1 X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
907.2.5.2 Group H X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
907.2.6.6 Group | X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
907.2.7.2 Group M X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
907.2.8.4 Group R-1 X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
907.2.9.4 GroupRR-zz,zR-zj, X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B8
907.2.10.1 Group S X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
907.2.30 Type | Hoods X B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
g07.86.5 Monitoring X B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
907.6.2.1 Secondary Power X A1, A2 A3, B1, BZ. B3. B4, BS, B6
Supply
907.9 Where Required ~ X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
Fire Alarm
Section 1101 General X A1, A2 A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, BS
Section 1102 Definitions X A1 A2 A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B&
1103.2 Responder X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
Communication
1103.5-1103.5.5 Sprinkler Systems X Ai, A2, A3, B1, B2, B3. B4, BS, B6
1103.7 — Fire Alarm Systems X A1, A2 A3, B1, B2 B3. B4, B5, B&
1103.7.9.10
1103.8 —1103.8.5.3 Smoke Alarms X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
1103.9-1103.9.1 Carbon Monoxide X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
Alarms
Section 1104 Egress X B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
Section 1106 Outdoor Operations X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
1203.1.3 Installation X A1, A2 A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, BS, B8
3311.3 Address X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
3313.1 When Required — X Al A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
Water Supply
Ordinance 2022-01 Page 30

23-0015 F 33 of 43




2022 CFC Code Title Adopted| Amended | Added | Deleted Finding
Section
5001.7 Liability for X Administrative
Damages
5601.2 Permit Required X Administrative
5704.2.9.6.1 Locations — Above X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
Ground Tanks
5706.2.4.4 Locations — Above X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B§
Ground Tanks
5806.2 Limitations X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
6104.2 Maximum Capacity X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
Chapter 80 Referenced X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
Standards
Appendix B Fire Flow - X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
Table B105.1 (1) Residential
Appendix B Fire Flow - X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
Table B105.2 Commercial
Appendix D Fire Apparatus X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2 B3. B4, B5, B6
Access Roads
Appendix D, Access Road Width X A1, A2 A3 B1, B2 B3.B4,B5,BS
D103.1
Appendix D, Grade X A1, A2 A3 B1, B2 B3. B4, B5,B6
DN103.2
Appendix D, Turmning Radius X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, BS, B6
D103.3
Appendix D, Gates X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
D103.5
Appendix D, Fire Lane Marking X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, BS, B6
D103.6.1
Appendix D, Fire Lane Marking X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
D103.6.2
Appendix D, Circumferential Fire X A1, A2 A3, B1, B2 B3. B4, B5, B8
D104.4 Access

Ordinance 2022-01

Page 31

23-0015 F 34 of 43




D) Democrat

PROOF OF PUBL[CATION
(20155 C.C.P.)

STATE OF CALIFORNIA
County of El Dorado

1 am a citizen of the United States and a resident
of the County aforesaid; I'm over the age of
eighteen years, and not a party to or interested in
the above-entitled matter. 1 am principal clerk of
the printer at the Mountain Democrat, 2889 Ray
Lawyer Drive, 2 newspaper of general circulation,
printed and published Monday, Wednesday,

and Friday, in the City of Placerville,

County of El Dorado, and which newspaper has
been adjudged a newspaper of general circula-
tion by the Superior Court to the County of El
Dorado, State of California, under the date of
March 7, 1952, Case Number 7258; that the
notice, of which the annexed is a printed copy
{(set in type no smaller than non-pareil), has been
published in each regular and entire issue of said
newspaper and not in any supplement thereof on
the following dates, to-wit:

9/28, 10/3
All in the year 2022,

I certify (or declare) nnder penalty of perjury that
the foregoing is true and correct.

Dated at Placerville, California, this 3™ day
of OCTOBER, 2022

DS Rodias
Signature

Proof of Publication of

NOTICE OF PUBLIC HEARING

PUBLIC HEARING NCTICE

Notioe of intent ¢ adopt the
1 2022 CoRfornia Flre Coda

p.m. @t the B Dorado Hills Fire
partment, 1080 Wikson Boutavard,
Dorado Hills, Calfornia, to adopt

Brdinance 2022-01, adopting the
2022 Califormia Fire Gode with local

amerdments.

Adoption of Orﬁlrlancu 2022-01

Wwouki be puvsuant fo

HaaRh & Bafety Coda Ssction mee
o 18868.7, wiich allow the District
adopt moditications or Mss

o the Califurnia Fim Code

mone atringent than the huidmg
standards adopted by the Stats
Fre Marshal and contained in the
California Buliding Standarts Code.
Capies of the proposed Ordinancs,

sode section referred to and any
smndarycndesecﬂcm refzmred
o, adopted referenica, am on
file with ths Sacratary of
the District and am open jo public

District pamonnal to follow ane set

of rules and regulations with: ragard

to the heatth and salety of the public

and the District’s response thereto,
Board Presidunt

Bobd Bennet!, Board

1 Dorado Hiks County Watar District
BY: .essica Braddock, Boad
Becretary )
BATED: Saptamber 22, 2022
/28, 1073 10920

23-0015 F 35 of 43



EDHCWD, DSP, ECF, CPCSD, PFPD, RFPD

101.1 Amend with the name of the jurisdiction Locally adopted and amended Administrative nead
1055 ::ET;:“S:;E;H‘::O" BEAIERTRE g Locally adopted 2nd amended Administrative need due to addition of section 105.5.85.
Allows the fire code official o enforce the fire code (specific
Add section to raquire operational permit for 1o fire acoess, vegetation clearances, hazardous materials,
105.5.55 Aulomobile Wrerﬁin Y::!s P Locally created and adopted elc.). within automobile wrecking yand cperations. This was
. g TS a demonstrated nised experiencad within the Dramond
Springs Fire Department
Add section to require construction permit for Administrative need due to addition of section 105.6.25 and
1056 [utomobile Wrecking Yards. Localycraated ad atiogted.  Lioggag
Allows the fire code official to enforce the fire code (specific
|Add section to require construction pesmit for to fira access, vegedation claarances, hazardeus materials,
Wi Automobile Wrecking Yards. Locally created and adopied [\ 1 within newly constucted andior modified automobile
wrecking yard operations..
Allows the fire code official to review and approved traffic
1 7 i ; calming devices prior to instaliation. Fire Code cumently
105.6.26 az;;::gg’;n’:g;':ﬁﬁ'::ﬂ?m e Locally created and adopted | permis the fire code official fo requlate traffic calming
9 devices. However, a permit isn't cumently required prior to
installation causing undue hardship 1o
Adopting this section to allow for the creation and issuance
; ;. . of fees to cover actual costs, Section 105.6 defines pemmils,
107.5 Section Added. Previousty section106.5. Locally adopted and amended plan checks, and inspections as allowed i Health &Safsty
Code 17951,
1075.1 Section added. Previously section 106.6.1 Lacally created and adopted iﬁﬁz TD?;EC’L GO0 PRSIy F: L0 mcEr Mo
: " Section 107.7 To recover the actual costs of avoidable
1077 Section added. Previausly section 106.7 Locaily created and adopted failed inspections by contraciors,
Section 111.5 of Chapter 1 of the Fire Code of the District is
added io read as follows:
111.5 Appeal Procedures and Timelings: The intent of this
provision s fo cfarify the procedures and timelines for an
ins Section added. Previously section 109.4 Localiy adopied and amended individual crentity fo filz an appeal to the Board of Appeals
regarding an order, degision, or determiration by the Fire
Code Official. Based on the County of El Dorade's
\/egetation Management Ordinance Board of Appeals’
timeline.
Allows the Fire Code Official to enforce the Fire Code that
Previously section 110.4, Completed the section by
filling in the blank portions that were aot completed ek M and property: F el best uPdaie,d b
1124 ; & : Loczlly adopted and amended maich the fees and penalties as deemed appropriate by the
by the SFM. It is better left to localities to datermine
ihe fees r;alties For i FOSFREES arass District Attorney's Office. The change to the fanguage to
eesipe pc include the term infractions.
112.4.2 Citetions is added o read as follows: 112.4.2
Citations
The Fire Chief or hisiner duly authorized representative(s),
2 ; . may issue citations for infractions or misdemeanaor violations
11242 Section added. Previoulsy section 110.4. Lecally created and adopted of this code pursuant o Section 13871 of the Health and
Safety Code of the State of Califormia and Chapler 5¢
[commenicing with section 853.6) of Title 3 of Part 2 of the
Penal Code of the State of California,
Previously section 112.4, Completed the section by
filling in the blank portions that were not completed . .
: 7 All vilations of the code have besn consolidated under
Ll gz,em:nﬁ::fr“e';ﬁg;ﬁ:;‘;;ﬁ:;ﬁ;:&m Locally adopied and amended | ion 112.4 o incluce the penalties for viotaions.
areas
Added definitions for. Campfire, Driveway, District,
Executive Body, Fire Chief, Fire Hazard, Open Buming, and
202 Added definitions for clarity Logally created and adopted Treined Crowd Manager. Definition of spen buming shall
not include residential LPG, natural gas fueled, cr woed
buming appliances nor ceremonial buming.
302.1 Added definition of campfire to Section Locally created and adopted Added definition for clarity
'::d"" 5 if::;‘;g;;m::‘"}’"rg i’:f”fm;}.n " Duse 1o the high fire danger that exists in Bl Dorado County
30744 enoon?;agss al Isco e 2 Ibumin bl "9 Locally created and adopted we have wiitten more stringent rules pertaining to open fires
e rel:ne ol Bl ofe 4 within grass, brush, and tree covered areas.
. . Provides the creation of a floor plan for the purpase of
40.21 ::3:? mwsecmifm';‘;r::'i‘:::ﬁgfﬁm pansornew Locally created and adopled  |emergency planning to be utilized by emergency response

personnel

23-0015 F 36 of 43



50321

Changed vertical clearances to 15 feet and road
widths o 20 feet

Locally adopted and amended

Fire apparatus are becoming larger and taller, A werfical
clearance of 15 feet provides proper dlearance for
apparatus 1o pass under withiout damaging apparatus
components. it also allows. an extended fims frame before
having to recut the growth of the vegatation. Additional
{height far vegetation clearances acts as an increased buffer
for the spread of fire. A road width of 20 feet exclusive of
shoulders, as measured face of curb lo face of curbis
Ineeded. These structures an be difficult to navigate with
fire apparatus and should not be counted in the lotal
drivable road surface.

503.2.5

Added a specific section for R3's where it allows the
Fire Code and Title 14 Fire Safe Reguiations 1o
malch as they require tumarounds for fire apparatus
access roads and diveways

Locally adopted and amended

Fire apparatus require areas for turning asound when
multipie vehicles are on the scene of an emergency. This
includes fira vehicles as well as civilian vehicles. Provides
better access for ingress/egress. Additionally, adds tur
around for apparatus in driveways greater than 150,

503.28

Changed the section for Bridges and Elevated
Surfaces fo state and match E! Dorado County
Transportation Division in addition to AASHTO HB-
17 {minimum CFC required)

Locally adopted and amended

Allows codes and standards for Bridges and Elevaled
Surfaces of Bl Dorado County and Appendbx D of the
current Fire Sode, whichever is more restrictive, to be
consistent throughout county agencies and is allowed as an
altemate means & method that is not less restrictive than
the Fire Code.

Previously section 5)3.4.2. Added section regarding
no parking in fire lanes

Locally created and acopted

This section clearly defines the "No Parking in Fire Lanes™
rules and is consistent wilh the Caiifornia Vehicle Code.

Previously section 503.4.3. Added section regarding
no paridng in front of hydrants

lLocally created and adopted

This section clearly defines the "No Parking in front of fire
|hydrants® rules and is consistent with the California Yehicle
Cade

Previously section 503.4.4. Added secfion regarding
fire lanes based on road width

Locally created and adopled

This section clearly defines California Fire Code Appendix D
as the reference for road lane width and their relation to fire
lanes.

503.6

Previously section 503.5.3. Created and adopted
5036 to maintain emergency acoess and
consistency through all oadway gates in El Dorado
County, referring fo the gate standards adopted by
the FPO's

Locally created and adopted

Allows fire districts the authonily io approve gates on
ruadways based on the District's gate standard, providing
the best possible emergency access o maintzin fast
response times.

Added section pertaining to the visual addressing of
buildings

Locally adopted and amended

Allows fire districts the autharity to approve addressing
based on the Distric’s addressing standards.

507.5.1

Added mare congervative standard for the
placement of hydrants and their relationship to
commercial buildings

Locally adopted and amended

Commercial properties are required 1¢ install hydrants at
300 foot intervals, thus they should never be outside of 150
feet from any given hydrant at anytime (half the distance
inbetween),

Added verbiage to bring all of the necessary fire
controls for a building to one location

Locally created and adopted

Buildings are getting more sizable in B county. liis more
common to have new buikdings with solar amays that
continue o generate power even when the buildings
general utllities have been shut ofl. When there is arn
emergency, it is vital that we have rapid access fo all of the
controls in one location for public evaguation and firefighter
safely. Dir to the fire danger present in Bl Dorado County
throughout most of the year, this change is appropriate and
advisable.

510.4.2.3

Emergency Responder Radio System Secondzry
Power Supply Modification

Locally adopted and amended

Amend to 72 hour capacity for back-up power due to
weather and PGAE safely related power outages.

903.2

Adds a requirement for sprinkler system Installation
in new buildings and structures 3,600 square feef or
reater within the district

Locally adopled apd mended

Administrative need due fo addition of sectien 903.2.22 and
903.2.23.

903.2.1.1

Previously section 903.2.1. Adds a requirement for
sprinkler system installation in new Group A
buildings and structures 3,600 square feetor
greater within the district

Locally adapted and amended

Due to the topographic, dimatic, and geographic conditions
of El Dorado Ceunty and their contributing factors to our
increased response times, along with the fact that fires
double in size each and evary minute, we require sprinklers
10 be instalied in structures once they reach 3,600 square
feet in size as they relate o fire behaviot and rate of spread.

903.2.1.2

Previousfy section 803.2.1. Adds a requirement for
sprinkler system installadon in new Group A-1
buildings and structures 3,600 square feet or
greater within the district

Locally adopted and amended

Due lo the topographic, climatic, and geographic condiions
of El Dorade County and their conlribufing factors to our
increased response times, along with the fact that fires
double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers
10 be installed in struckires once they reach 3,600 square
lleat in size as they relale 1o fire behavior and rate of spread.

23-0015 F 37 of 43



903.2.1.3

Previously seclion 903.2.1. Adds a requirement for
sprinkler system installation in new Group A-2
buildings and structures 3,600 square Teet or
greater within the district

Locally adopted and amended

Due to the fopographic, climatic, and geographic corlifions
of EI Dorado County and their confributing factors to our
increased response times, along with the fact that firss
double irf size each and every minufe, we require sprinklers
o be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square
feet in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of spread.

803214

Previously section 903.2.1. Adds a requiremant for
sprinkler system installation in new Group A-3
buikiings and structures 3,600 square feet or
greater within the district

Locally adopled and amended

Due to the topographic, dimatic, and gecgraphic conditions
of EI Dorado County and their confributing factors to our
increased response times, along with the fact that fires
doubla in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers
to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square
feet in size as they relte to fin befavior and rate of spread.

%0323

Previously saction 903.2.3. Adds a requirement for
sprnkler system installation in new Group E
buildings and structures 3,600 square feetor
greater within the district

Locally adopted and amended

Due to the lopographic, climatic, and geographic conditions
of El Dorado County ani their coedribiging factors to our
increased response times, along with the fact tha fires
double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers
10 be instafled in struciures once they reach 3,600 square
feet in size 23 they relale to fire behavior and rate of spread.

903.24

Adds a requirement for sprinkler system installation
in new Group F buildings and structures 3600
square feet or greater within the disirct

Locally adopted and amendaed

Due 1o the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions

of EI Dorado County and their contributing factors o our
increased raspanse times, along with the fact that fires
double In size each and every minale, we require sprinklers
1o be installed in struciumes onca fhey reach 3,600 square
feel in size as they relate fo fire behavior and tate of spraad.

90327

Adds a requiremnent for sprinkler system installation
in new Group M bulidings and structures 3,600
square feet or greater within the district

Locally adopted and amended

Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions
of El Dorade County and their contributing factors to our
increased response times, along with the fact that fires
double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers
10 be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square
feet in size as they relate {o fire behavior and rate of spread

903272

Previously section 903.2.7. Adds a reqiirement for
sprinkler system installation in new Group M wilh
Upholstered Fumniture or Mattresses uildings and
structures 3,600 square feet or greater within the
district

Locally adopted and amended

Due to the fopographic, climatic, and geographic conditions
of El Dorado County and their contributing factors fo our
increased response fimes, along with the fact that fires
double in size aach and every minule, we requite sprinklers
to be installed in struttures once they reach 3,600 square
feet in size as they relate fo fire behavior and rate of spread.

903285

Previously section 903.2.8.2.This section was
created fo includa manufactured resideniial single
family R-3 In the residential sprikler program.

Locally adopted and amended

Manufactured Homes ~ The intent of this code section is to
ensura that manufactured homes that serve as a one or two-
family dweltings are consistent with the provisions Tound in
CRC Section 313 pertaining to built dwellings of a similar
nature. Mantdactured homes placed in the wildland-urban
inferiace have a heighiened risk of rapid fire consumption
due to the Jight-weight nature. of their construction. The
rapid fire spread throughout these structures presents a
significant risk to their occupants. Residential sprinkler
systems have been incorporated to decrease iis risk
successfully in many California communities.

€328

Previously section %03.2.9. Adds a requirement for
sprnkler system installation in new Group 8§
buiidings and struckures 3,600 square feetor
greater within the district

Localy adopted and amended

Due to the fopographic, dimatic, and geographic conditions
of El Dorado Ceunty and iheir contributing factors o our
increased response times, along with the fack that fires
double in size each and gvery minute, we require sprinkiers
to be instaled in structures once they reach 3,600 square
feet in size as ihey relate fo fire behavior and rate of spread,

503.2.10

Previously saction 803.2, Adds a requirement for
sprinkler system installation in new Group §-2
buildings and structures 3,600 square feet or
greater within the district

Locally adopled and amended

Due to the tepographic, slimatic, and geographic conditions
of El Dorada Counly and their contributing faciors to our

increased response times, along with the Tact hat fires
double in size each and every minute, we require spinklers
to be installed in sinsctures once they reach 3,600 square
feel in sizg as they relate to fire behavior and rate of spread

23-0015 F 38 of 43



Previously section 903.2.10. Adds a requirement for
sprinkler system installation in new Commercial

Due to the fopographic, glimatic, and gecgraphic conditions
of El Dorade County and their conlributing factors to our
increased response times, along with the fact that fires

bl Parking Garage buildings and structuras 3,600 LOcHRy sopted s aimarkind double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklems
square feet or greater within the district 1o be Installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square
feel in size as they relate to fire behavior and sate of spread.
Due to the fopagraphic, dimatic, and geographic condifions
Previously section 903.2.7. Adds a requirement for of El Dorado County and their contributing factors 1o our
sprinkler systam installation in new Group B increased response times, slong with fhe fact that fires
ks buildings and structures 3,600 square feet or B AR T doubla in size each and every minute, we require spriniders
greater within the disirict to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square
feet in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of spread.
Due to the topographic, dimatic, and geographic conditions
Previously section 903.2, Atids 2 requirement for of El Dorade County and their conlributing factors to our
sprinkler system installation in new Group F-2 increased response times, along with the fact that fires
Bl buildings ary:: structures 3,600 square feet or Lsat, dopkesan e cad double In size each and every minuts, we require sprinklers
greater within the district to be instailed in stucturas once they reach 3,600 square
feet in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of spread.
Praviously secton 9032, Adds a equdrmment 1o Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions
I <py) Woh R G- A Dt of EI Dorado County and their contrbuing faclors fo our
R Tk g increased mspanse times, along with the fact that fires
8036 size gfeater'man 500 square feef and the resulting Locally created and adooted double in size each and every mifule, we require sprirkiers
.Sq”a.m Y g'r:: ler;:?.a'?mﬁ Eee;o% to be installed in sirustures once they reach 3,600 square
ES SO0 () b B TO U 0 (et n size 25 they rolate to firs behavior and rate of spread.
1,000 square feet.
Adds a requirement for fire alamm system installation
907.2 in new bulldings and struciures 3,600 square feet or Lacally adopted and amended Administrative need due to addition of section 903.2.30.
less within the district
Previously section 907.2a. Added occupant
|protection for fire alarms in Group A buildings with a Provides proper em ifcation foroccupandies that
907.2.1.4 fooriamma sz $an 3 500, wceps 2, As butdngs Locally reated and adopled  |alow public use and ensures Fire Department nafification in
not used for commercial purposes, and buildings oD i s
with a floor area of less than 500 square feet as 4
approved by the fire code official
Previously section 907.2a. Added occupant
pro‘ection for fire dlanms in Group B Mihm§w a Provides proer emergency Rotficasion for occupandies that
907.223 wiidaberdin by 3600 s .bu."dmgs Locally created and adopled allow public use and ensures Fire Depariment notification in
PO S8R0 o coiTunar # puiposes, B holdlics the event of a fire or smoke.
with a floor area of less than 500 square feot as i
approved by the fire code official
Previously section 907.2a. Added occupant
protection fos fire alarms in Group E buildinggwith a Provides proper emergency notfication for occupancios that
07,2311 SR Jess tha: 3,50, 1o R0, S DURIOK Locally created and adogted  [allow public use and ensures Fire Department notification in
not used for commercial purposes, and buildings e vt ot ol ks
with a floor area of less than 500 square feet as ‘
approved by the fire code official
Previously section 907.2a. Added ocsupant
protection for fire alam in Group F buildings with 2 Proviles praper emergency nofiication or cccupancies that
907.241 floor area less than 5,600, except R3, AG buldings |\ cocted and adopted  [alow public use and ensures Firs Depariment notfication in
not used for commercial purposes, and bildings: T e
with a floor area of less than 500 square feet as i
approved by the fire code official
Previously section 807.2a. Added ocoupant
protection for ire alams in Group H buming§ “.m 4 Provides proper emergency notification for occupancies that
907252 floor area less than 3,600, except R3, AG buldings | ) oy roated and avosted |allow public use and ensures Fire Depariment notfication in
not used for commercial purposes, and bulldings e vl it ate i
with a floor area of less than 500 square feet as ;
approved by the firg cods official
Previously section 907.2a. Added occupant
protection for fire alarms in Group | buildings with a Provides proper ermergenicy noffication for ocoupancles that
97288 ot et BRI 3600 Shap sy Mipaine Locally created and edopied allow public use and ensures Elve Department notification in
not used for commercial purposes, and butldings i e e
with a floor area of less than 500 square feet as -
approved by the fire code official
Previously secion $07.2a. Added occupant
protection for fire alanms in Group M buildings with Provides proper ncy nolification for occupandies that
907272 f e ks Uian oM susp i 0 Locally crasled and adopled [low public use and ensures Fire Depariment notfication in

buiidings rot used for commercial purposes, and
buildings with a floor area of less than 500 square
feet as approved by the fire code official

the event of a fire or smaoke.

23-0015 F 39 of 43



Previously section 907.2a. Added occupant
protection for fire alamns in Group B-1 buildings with
a floor area tess fhan 3,600, except R3, AG

Provides proper emergency nofification for octupancies that

907284 buidings not used far commieeetal purpases, and Locally created and adopted &‘elll?« ptbhcof:sg ;:Z: ;n:u;:s Fire Department nofification in
buildings with a fioor area of less than 500 square 3
feat as approved by the fire code official
Previously section 907.2a. Added occupant
protection for fire alarms in Group R-2, R-2.1, and R:
2.2 buildings with a floar area less than 3,800, Provides proper emergency notification for cocupancies that
907.2.94 except R3, AG buildings not used for commarcial Locally created and adopled allow public use and ensures Fire Department notification in
purposes, and buildings with a floor area of less the event of a fire or smoke.
than 500 square feet as approved by the fire code
official
Previously section 907.2a. Added occupant
mpan amchna E;ﬁ:ﬁ'g&"g:g gsbl:g"g{];fm : Provides proper emergency notification for occupancies that
907.2.10.1 e ) AS DUINGS | ) elly created and adopted  [allow public use and ensures Fire Depariment notffication in
not used for commercial purposes, and buildings e it ot afie o crhe
with a floor area of less than 500 square faet a5 y
approved by the fire code official
Previously section %07.2d. Added 5 == 3
p:ecb‘m forT ypeior-k?:d sﬁkmiczl:“ Provides proper emergency notification for cccupancies that
907.2.30 : Locally ereated and adopted allow public use and ensures Fire Departiment notification in
connected 1o a monitored fire alarm system when A
installed or replaced i
Provides proper respanse and maintenance "runner service”
of fire alarm systems. NFPA 72 specifies required response
times for fire alarm trouble and supesvisory signals fo
; ; ensure systems remain operational. A Type A UL listed
907.6.5 Ifi?;g:%es ﬁr: a;:::_a?ﬁ;':: o be monitored by UL Locally created and adopted central station meets the NFPA required fire alarm response
yoe i ensuring an operational fire alarm system at all imes.
ULType A listing requires central stations to provide this
“runnier service™ ar contract with another entity to provide
this service to obtain the listing.
Primary Secondary Alarm Power Supply \Amend to 72 hour capacity for back-up power i to
e Modication Locally created and adopled | e and PGAE safety related power outages.
Previously section 907.2b. Added occupant
protection for existing buldings without automatic Provides proper ememency nolification for ccoupancias that
8079 sprinkler systems to ingtall a fire alarm if they add |ocafly created and adopied allow public use and ensures Fire Depariment nofification in
more than 30% or 1,000 square feet to the the event of a fire of smoke,
structure, whichever is less
This section adds a Shunt Trip power shut off devices to
1203.4.3 Shunt trip power safaly devices Locally adopted and amended ensure emergency power shut off during the use of back-up
power suppiles.
Previously section 3310. Address requirements for Addressing for construgtion sites is Important to assist
3311.3 i fon sltes Locally created and adopted ing emergency crews.
Previousy section 3312.1, Water supplies at Water must be en site otior o combustible materiat being
pa construction sifes with combustible materials on-site Sy SRS stored o verticat constiction commencing,
Any :}amages or casts from negligent or unlawfl ?Eﬁ:ﬁ:&ﬁﬁaf negll‘ge::zr:ect‘:iy B migse.
5001.7 pmmll s sse tr;a;o c;u:::;azzflemous materials incident Locally created and adopted or pracice the achusi cost wil be on o the
1y fee |negligent parties.
mbv e Allows ageriies hal need 10 know about explosives and
5601.2 . Y Locally adopted and amended  [fireworks to approve them and have a clear understanding
explosives, and by the Fire Chief and the Boand of of e appications f how they wil be used
Supenvisors for fireworks i :
Established limits as required by the Fire Code for Class |
o flammable and Class 1| combustible liquid storage in above-
5704.296.1 Established limits as se forth in the Fire Code Locally adopted and amended gound tanks. Requires Al approval and
Special/Conditional Use Permit from the County.
Established limits as required by the Fire Code for Class |
} 7. ) flammable and Class Il combustible liquid special
5706.2.4.4 Established limits as set forth in the Fire Code Locally adopted and amended operations In above-graund fenks. Requires AHJ approval
and a SpecialiConditional Use Permit fiom the County.
Administrative need 1o add District name. Established limits
AP ’ ! " as required by the Fire Code Official for Flammable
5606.2 Administrative addiion of Distit name. Established) ) ., oioteq and amended  |Cryogeric fids in stationary containers. Requires AHJ

limits as set forth in the Fire Code

approval and a SpecialfConditional Use Permit from the
County.

23-0015 F 40 of 43



6104.2

Established limits for LPG storage and dispensing

near o adjacent o residential development Locally adopled and amendled

Establishes distances between LPG storage and
dispensarfes that are directly related to safety for reskiential
developments and high-density hotels, motels, apariments,
elc. where a release by lealt or explosion of LP-Gas would
have a high probability of injury, inhalation, or death,
Requires AHJ approval and a SpecialiConditional Use
Permit from the County.

Chepier 80, NFPA, 1-
2

Provides fire access and dlearance to property lines

for Automobile Wrecking Yards. Lacally created and adopted

Dismantied and stored vehicles present significant fire lpads
(batteries, flammable and combustible liquids, upholstery.
elc.) and risk & vegetation and adjacent properties. This
requirement provides fire access and clearance to
vegetation in auformobile wrecking yard operations to aid in
firefighting operations and reduction of fire extension o
adjacent properties and/or open lands.

NFPA 130-16 of Chapter 80 of ie Fire Code of the
District has been amended to update vatious

Amended to include on-site sprinkler heads and wrench on-
site for emergant repairs, the inclusion of a local water flow
alarm to create an audible afert for the flow of water in the
event of water activation in a vacant struciure, and
hydrostatic testing requirements to assure proper 130

projects

Chapter 80, NFPA,
13D-16 provisions. pertaining to the installation of sprinkier R B sprinkler system installation decreasing the risk of water
systems in one and two-family dwelings damage from pipe failire. Passive purge requirements
were also added fo ensure water circulation through e
system, reducing stagnant water and backflow concems
(EID encourages this type of system).
Allows us fo match what devalopers and residents are used
s 10 in regards fo GPM fire flow requiremens ihat have been
> Changed 500 GPM 1o 1,000 GPM in major 5 :
Ame‘m'dos‘* ?’ s subdfeisions below 5000 foot elevation, fo malch Locally dopteet and amended | (L84 f0r st & dacad in EDC s prowides & imum
101} fice flow b5 used in EDC for years level of available water for firefighting purposes in &he event
L of house to house, hoise o vegetation, adnor vegetatrion fo
house ignition.
Appendix B: Table Established a minimum requirement of 1,500 GPM, Allows us to maich what developers and residents are used
8106 2 below 5000 foot elevation, for all commeitial | ocaly adopted and amended to in regards to GPM fire flow requirements that have been
' used for over a decade in EDC.

Appendix D: 01031

Added an excepiion for residential driveways Locally adopled and amended

It is unreasonabks to require a residential diveway to
construct a 26 foot wida space for access 1o a hydrant.

Amended to meet State law of grades no greater

Title 14 requires us to orly accept up to 16% drivaways, any
exceptions would require approval by the AR, I our E1

fire and life safety inspections

Ll ihan16% within Wikdiand Urban Interface. Locally adopled and amended  p ) County Title 14 adoption we allow grealer than 16%
Prade with AHJ approval and hand surface.
g . 20 foot road widths shall not include curbs and gutiers due
Appendix D: D103.3 Added text fo include curbs and gutters Locally adopted and amended o potential dccess ssues and tumig radius concems,
: o : : Where fire apparatus access roads consist of a divided
ApbendixD: DI93.5 f:g‘r;m m‘“‘"’”“;ﬁ:iﬁsgms where installed | | o ofly adopted and amended  |roadway ée gate width shall not be fess than 15 feet due fo
peaE: apparatus tuming radivs.
No parking on roads allowed on roadways less than 28 Feet
- y in width above 5000 Jeet. Lower than 5000 feet this does
Appendix D: Di03.6.1 Road widths 20 fo 20feet Locally adopted and amended ot apply. This sectionis adopted as it stands it o Fire
Code Appendix D section 103.6.1 for ali other elevations.
Parking on one side only on roads from 28 feet 1o 36 feet
3 allowed. Thig iz nist required less than 5000 feet of
Appendix D: D103.6.2 xﬁﬁﬁgs e ian 25 feat bl lnes han 26 Locally adopted and amended  |elevation, Lower than 5000 feet this does ot apply. The
4 section is adopted s it stands in the Fire Code Appendix D
Section 103.6.2 for all ather elevations.
Lthn required by the fire code official, a fire apparatus
: Added to reqrire circumerential fire apparatus. i access road shall be canstructed 10 encompass the entire
Fipciet Bt 8 access roads ] e structure and shall provide a continucus means of
emergency vehicle access.
Adopted with no Amendments
1014 through 1015 f:;‘:;d A Asiatieh SCone Lt Suvenily S Localy adopted Adminiswaive clarity
102.1 through 102.12 References, subjects not regulated by the Code Locally adopled Administrative clarity
}ﬁ':z";‘”““ Abilty to enforcs the code Locally adopted Administrative clarity
g'g g:"“‘-‘" Time limitation of application Locally adopted Administrative clarity
[Ropled tis section for administrabve clanty and -
106.1 through 106.4 e s o el o Locally adopied Fee schedutes for permiis
1071 through 1075 Adopted this section for administrative clanity and v adopied I ; fori

23-0015 F 41 of 43




Adopted this section for administrative clarity and

Maintenance of safequards, testing and operation of

108.1 through 109.8 ; . h Locally adopted lequipment, re-inspection and testing, recordkeeping,
fiee; 200 e sty Inapectans supervision, rendering equipment inoperable, overcrowding,
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and
113 fite and e Safely inspections Locally adopted Stop work order.
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and ;
114.% through 114.7 ive and e safoly Inspections Locaily adopted Unsafe structures or equipment.
Asphalt kettles contain highly flammable substances and
require stringent safequards. Managing ignition seurces
301.1 through 308.5 Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally adopied through responsible application of standards will reduce the
number of fires in various settings. {Climatic, geclogical,
and topographical).
General fequirements relatiag to smoking. Vacant premises
condition and safety requiremnents, abandoned premises,
’ : - tenant spaces, safeguarding vacant premises, secusity, fire
310.1 through 311.4 Adapted this section for fire and life safety Locally adopted protection, fire Separation, removal of combusibles,
removal of hazardous materials. (Climatic, geclogical, and
topographical).
] . . General requiremenis for roads, tunnels, and bridges.
323.1 Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally adopted (Climatic, geological, and topographical.
Provides evacuation drifls for hazardous and institutional
403.6 through 403.7.6 Adopied this section for fire and life safety Locally adopted occupancies (occupancies with increased potential for e
loss).
. | . Provides evacuation drills for hotel/metel occupancies
403.9 through 403.9.4 Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally adopted Isocimanpiss Wil inciessd patenial for e oss)
. | i Emergency planning and record keeping {Climatic,
405.1 through 405.10 Adopted this section for fire and lite safety Lecally adopted leogical, and topographical)
510.3 Adopted this section for administrative clarity and Locally adopied A permit is required for emergency responder radio systems
§ fire and life safety inspections ey (Climatic, geological, and topographical.
[Adopted this section for administralive clanty and Decoragve vegetation pases an increase in hazard,
AR g0 fire and life safety inspections Localy atioptac flammability and increased risk.
Wall coverings in group E occupancies {Schools) sels a
Adopted this section for administralive claity and maximum amaount of flammable wall coverings in
Rl S fie and Ife safety inspections Locally adopted educational faciites (Climatic, gectogical, and
topographical).
: S i ; Combustible fumnishing pose a significant flammiabifity and
808.1 through 808 5 Qfﬁlﬁ'z:gﬁgsmﬂ"'mm carty e Locally adopted increasett e safety hazard in insiitutional and coflege dorm
fyDe OCCUpancies.
; : Timns o : Provides clasity on acceptance festing of automatic fire
504.4.1 Qr‘l"grmm :f:ct‘y"i’:;;;%':;"'s“am Sty and Logally adopted extinguishing systems. (Climatic, geclogical, and
topographical).
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and o ;
1401.1 through 1102.1 ire and life saety inspections Locally adopted Administrative clarity
Emergency Responder radio coverage in existing buildings.
| All buildings will ke required to allow emargency responders
to receive and transmit emergency radio ttaffic to and from
aach other and the emergency dispatch center. Time
. . Y frames can be devefoped to come into compliance and the
11032 Adf:pte:f 2::5%2::: :z?]ﬂer;ge?nlgm:gs e Locally adopted plifiing ln of, 3 sysimin over aperod bt e, dalprmingd Dy
- f:s “'n s g "gency iacop the fire code official, is acceptable. The rationale befind this
ol secticn is that on almost all emergency resporder injury or
fatality incidents communication i$ a key issue. This
sitwation can be comected with the addition of radio
equipment to boost the signal in areas that do not hrave
strong signal {Climatic, geclogical, and topographical).
Requires installation of fire sprinkler systems in existing
11035 Adopted this section for the safety of the public, Locally adopted occupancies with high life safety risk and in conformance
’ firefighters, and other emergency responders ¥ adop with previous Uniform Fire Codes. (Climatic, geological, and
topographical).
; . ; Requires instailation of carbon manoxide alams in
11039 giet ihis octon for e eqfhty of ol bike, Locally adopted ceupancles with high e safety risk. (Climatic, geological,
firefighters, and other emergency responders :
and topographical).
; : , Provides a minimum leval of safety with regard to egress
}}3'125‘“"’”9“ 2{2‘;"‘:&2‘2 ndse"o"fh';:‘;;";e Zfe‘yr:: "‘idp;‘:"” Locally adopled from existing buildings housing occupancies with a high fife
: ki IGRnCy Teste safely ik, (Climatio, geological, and fopographica).
; . " Provides a minimuen level of safety at tire storage yards with
1 1321 g‘m“g" ﬁgpm:‘zzdﬁg;": Zfe“’r:f ‘h;f::w’ Locally adopted high lgvels of flammable rubber material. {Climatc,
it ghess, Tgency respo geolpgical, and topographical).
Appendix D: D104.1 Adopted this section for fhe safety of the public, Locally adopied General requirements for fire apparatus acoess roads
through D104.1 firefighiers, and other emeqgency responders ¥ 0P including loads (Climaic, geclogical, and tepographical).

23-0015 F 42 of 43



Appendix D: D104.2 " Adopted this section for the safety of the public, Locally adopled Commercial and industrial development fire apparatus
(exciuding exception) firefighters, and other emergency responders access roads ic, , and topographical).
Appendix D: D104.3 N [Adopted this section for the safety of the public, Commercial and industrial development fire apparatus
rough D105.4 firefighters, and other emergency responders e access roads (Climatic, geological, and topographical).
Appendix D: D106.1 u |Adopted this section for the safaty of the public, Eocally sopted Fire apparatus access roads for multiple-family residential
(exciuding excepiion} firefighters, and other emergency responders developments (Climatic, geological, and topographical).
Appendix D: D106.2 N this sectlon for the safety of the public, Locally adopted Fire apparatus access roads for multiple-famity residential
through D106.3 hers, and otfier emengency responders Idenelupmms (Climatic, geclogical, and topographical).
One- or two-dwelling residential developments shall be
Appendix D: DH07.1 N Adopted this section for the safety of the public, Locally adopfed equipped throughout with two spermte and appeoved fins
(excluding exceptions) |firefighters, and other emergency responders apparatus access mads due i topographic, geographic and
climatic conditions.
One- or wo-dwelling residential developments shall be
Appendix D: D107.2 N Adopted this section for the safety of the public, Localy adopted equipped throughout wih two sperate and approved fire
through D108.1 firefighters, and other emergency responders apparatys access roads due fo topographic, gesgraphic and
climatic conditions.

Grey cells are previously amended, adopted, or changed code sections that are being adopled again in this code cycle.

White cells are newly amended, adopted, or changed code sections that differ from previous code adoptions.

23-0015 F 43 of 43






