
RESOLUTION NO. 012-2023 

OF THE BOARD OF SUPERVISORS OF THE COUNTY OF EL DORADO 

(REPEALING RESOLUTION NO. 045-2020) 

WHEREAS, the California Code of Regulations, Title 24, Part 9, the California Fire Code, is updated by the 

State every three years; and 

WHEREAS, the 2022 California Fire Code became effective on January 1, 2023; and, 

WHEREAS, California Health and Safety Code Sections 17958, 17958.5, 17958.7 and 18941.5 permits a 

county to make such local amendments and modifications as the county determines are reasonably 

necessary because of local climatic, geological or topographical conditions; and, 

WHEREAS, the California Code of regulations, Health and Safety Code, Division 12, Part 2, Chapter 1, 

Article 12, Section 13146, assigns responsibility for enforcement of safety regulations to the local level 

and grants authority to delegate enforcement to the chief building official, or his or her authorized 

representative, or the chief of the fire protection district, or his or her representative; and, 

WHEREAS, the County of El Dorado desires to delegate enforcement of the Fire Code to the chief of the 

fire authority, or the chief's authorized representative; and, 

WHEREAS, the fire protection district and County have agreed to develop, implement and maintain a 
memorandum of understanding that describes the roles and responsibilities pertaining to the inspection 

of certain building standards found in the Fire Code; and, 

WHEREAS, on October 27, 2022, The Board of Directors of the Rescue Fire Protection District adopted 

Ordinance No. 2022-01, which adopted the 2022 California Fire Code with amendments the District 

deemed necessary to deal with local climate, geological or topographical conditions. 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that the Board of Supervisors of the County of El Dorado ratifies 

Ordinance No. 2022-01 of the Rescue Fire Protection District and delegates the enforcement of the 

ordinance to the Rescue Fire Protection District Chief, or his or her representative. 

These changes include amendments and additions to the California Fire Code in the following sections: 

101.1, 105.5, 105.5.55, 105.6, 105.6.25, 105.6.26, 107.5, 107.5.1, 107.7, 111.5, 112.4, 112.4.2, 

113.4, 202, 302.1, 307.4.4, 401.2.1, 503.2.1, 503.2.5, 503.2.6, 503.3.1, 503.3.2, 503.3.3, 503.6, 

505.1, 507.5.1, 509.3, 510.4.2.3, 903.2, 903.2.1.1, 903.2.1.2, 903.2.1.3, 903.2.1.4, 903.2.3, 903.2.4, 
903.2.7, 903.2.7.2, 903.2.8.S, 903.2.9, 903.2.10, 903.2.10.1, 903.2.22, 903.2.23, 903.6, 907.2, 

907.2.1.4, 907.2.2.3, 907.2.3.11, 907.2.4.1, 907.2.5.2, 907.2.6.6, 907.2.7.2, 907.2.8.4, 907.2.9.4, 

23-0015 H 1 of 46 



907.2.10.1, 907.2.30, 907.6.5, 907.6.2.1, 907.9, 1203.1.3, 3311.3, 3313.1, 5001.7, 5601.2, 

5704.2.9.6.1, 5706.2.4.4, 5806.2, 6104.2, Chapter 80 NFPA 1-22 Section 22.3, Chapter 80 NFPA 1-
22 Section 22.10, Chapter 80 NFPA 13D-22: Sections 4.6, 5.1.1.2, 7.6, 11.2.1.1, Appendix B: Table 

B105.1(1), Appendix B: Table B105.2, Appendix D Sections D103.1 through D103.3, Appendix D 

103.S, Appendix D 103.6.1, Appendix D103.6.2, Appendix D104.4 

Rescue Fire Protection District adopts the 2022 California Fire Code, Title 24, Part 9, in its entirety, 

including Appendices, incorporating those sections of the International Fire Code, 2021 edition not 

adopted by the state, with the exclusions listed below: 

103, 309, 311.S, 311.6, 318, 403.3, 403.S, 403.8, 403.10, 403.11, 404, 406, 903.3.1.2, 904.1.1, 
1103.1, 1103.3-1103.4, 1103.6, 1105, Chapter 26, D104.2 (exception only), 0106.1 (exception only), 

D107.l (Exceptions only), Appendix A, Appendix G, Appendix J, Appendix K, Appendix L, Appendix 

M, Appendix N, Appendix 0. 

Appendices not adopted can be used for reference in enforcing other sections of the 2022 California Fire 

Code. 

PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of Supervisors of the County of El Dorado at a regular meeting of 
said BOARD, held the 3rd day of January, 2023, by the following vote of said Board 

Attest: 
Kim Dawson 
Clerk of the Board of Supervisors 

By:~~ -o~puerk 

Ayes: Thomas, Hidahl, Turnboo, Parlin, Laine 
Noes: None 
Absent: None 

~~ 712@~ 
Chalr:a;d of Supervisors 

Wendy Thomas 

23-0015 H 2 of 46 



c:, 

Rescue Fire Protection District 
• P.O. Box 201 Rescue, CA 95672 • Phone: (530) 677-1868 • 

Fax: (530) 677-9609 
www.rescuefiredepartment.org 

November 21, 2022 

Don Ashton, Chief Administrative Officer 
El Dorado County Board of Supervisors 
330 Fair Lane 
Placerville, CA 95667 

Subject: Resolution Ratifying Ordinance No. 2022-01 of the Rescue Fire 
Protection District, which adopts the 2022 California Fire 
Code with amendments related to local climatic, geographic 
and topographic conditions. 

Dear Mr. Ashton: 

The Rescue Fire Protection District is requesting the Board of Supervisors (BOS) 
ratify its Ordinance No. 2022-01, which adopts the 2022 California Fire Code as 
amended due to specific local climatic, geographic and topographic conditions. 
California Health and Safety Code Section 13869.7 requires the legislative body of 
the city or county where the ordinance will apply to ratify, modify or deny the 
adopted ordinance. The BOS must also delegate enforcement of the ordinance to 
either the Fire District ( or its representative) or the Chief Building Official. 

Therefore, we request the County Board of Supervisors ratify Ordinance No. 2022-
01 with amendments to the 2022 California Fire Code, and delegate the 
enforcement of that Ordinance to the Rescue Fire Protection District Fire Chief. A 
proposed BOS resolution is enclosed for your review and use on this topic. 

This resolution has no direct fiscal impact to the County. 

Sincerely, ·~ Or ~ 
Bryan Ransdell, -------------
Fire Chief 

ATTACHMENTS: 
1. RFPD Resolution and Ordinance 2022-01 

23-0015 H 3 of 46 



RESCUE FIRE DEPARTMENT 

ORDINANCE NO. 2022.01 

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS OF THE RESCUE FIRE 

DEPARTMENT AS FOLLOWS: 

AIi ordinance of the Rescue Fire Protection District (RFPD) adopting the 2022 Edition of 

the California Fire Code, incorporating the 2021 Edition of the International Fire Code, regulating 

and governing the safeguarding of life and property from fire and explosion hazards arising from 

the storage, handling and use of hazardous substances, materials and devices, and from 

conditions hazardous to life or property in the occupancy of buildings and premises in the Rescue 

Fire Department; providing for the issuance of permits and collection of fees therefor; Repealing 

Ordinance No. 2019-01 of the RFPO and all other ordinances and parts of the ordinances in 

conflict therewith. 

Be it ORDAINED by the Board of Directors of the RFPO: 

Section 1: FINDINGS OF FACTS 

Section 2: ADOPTION OF CODE WITH EXCLUSIONS 

Section 3: LOCAL AMENDMENTS 

Section 4: CONFLICT 

Section5: SEVERABILITY 

Section 6: EFFECTIVE DATE AND PUBLICATION 

SECTION 1: FINDINGS OF FACTS 

The Rescue Fire Department makes certain changes (listed below) to the California Fire 

Code, 2022 Edition, pursuant to Health & Safety Code Sections 13869. 7, 17958.5, 17958. 7 

and 18941.5 during this code adoption process. Such changes are necessary because of local 

climatic, geological and/or topographical conditions. The RFPD has adopted, pursuant to 

Section 18941.5 of the California Health & Safety Code, the findings of facts relative to these 

conditions by Resolution #2022-10 of the RFPO dated October 12, 2022. 

SECTION 2: ADOPTION OF CODE WITH EXCLUSIONS 

Cndinance 2022-01 Page 1 

23-0015 H 4 of 46 



The RFPD adopts the 2022 California t=ire Code, Title 24. Part 9, in its entirety. including 

Appendices, incorporating those sections of the International t=ire Code, 2021 edition not adopted 

by the state. with the exclusions listed below: 

Exclusions: 103. 309, 311.5. 311.6, 318,403.3, 403.5, 403.8, 403.10, 403.11, 404,406, 

903.3.1.2, 904.1.1, 1103.1, 1103.3-1103.4, 1103.6, 1105, Chapter 26, D104.2 (Exception only), 

D106.1 (Exception only), 0107.1 (Exceptions only). Appendix A, Appendix G, Appendix J, 

Appendix K. Appendix L, Appendix M, Appendix N, Appendix 0. 

Appendices not adopted can be used for reference in enforcing other sections of the 2022 

California Fire Code. 

SECTION 3: AMENDMENTS TO THE 2022 CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE 

The following Sections are hereby amended or added: 

Chapter 1 

SECTION 101.1 "TITLE" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 101 .1 TITLE. These regulations shall be known as the Fire Code of RFPD, hereinafter 
referred to as "this code". 

SECTION 105.5 "REQUIRED OPERATIONAL PERMITS" IS AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 105.5 Required operational permits. The fire code official is authorized to issue 
operational permits for the operations set forth in Sections 105.5.2 through 105.5.5a5. 

SECTION 105.5,55 "AUTOMOBILE WRECKING YARDS" IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 105.5.55 Automoblle wrecking yards. An operational permit is required for the 
operation of automobile wrecking yards. 

SECTION 105.6 "REQUIRED CONSTRUCTION PERMITS" IS AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 105.6 required construction permits. The fire code official is authorized to issue 
construction permits tor work as set forth In sections 105.6. 1 through 105.6.246. 

SECTION 105.6.25 "AUTOMOBILE WRECKING YARDS" IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 105.6.25 AutomobiJe wrecking yards. Construcbon permits are required for the 
installation of or modification to automobile wrecl<ing yards. 

SECTION 105.6.26 ~TRAFFIC CALMING DEVICES" IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 2 

23-0015 H 5 of 46 



105.6.26 Traffic calming devices. Construction permits are required for the installation or 
modification of traffic calming devices. 

SECTION 107.5 "PERMIT, PLAN REVIEW AND INSPECTION FEES• SHALL BE ADDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section 107.5 Permit. A schedule of fees adopted by the distn·ct board of directors for plan 
review, inspections and the issuance of permits by the district may be found ;n the most current 
district fee schedule (Health & Safety Code 17951). 

SECTION 107.5.1 "COST RECOVERY FEES" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 107.5. 1 Cost Recovery Fees. Fire service fees may be charged to any person, nrm, 
corporation or business that through negligence, violation of the law, or as a result of 
carelessness, is respons;bJe for the cause of the district to respond to the scene of an incident. 
A district board may charge a fee to cover the cost of any service which the district provides 
or the cost of enforcing any regulation for which the fee is charged (Health & Safety Code 
13916). The fee shall not exceed the actual cost of suppressing the fire and/or responding to 
the scene of an incident. 

SECTION 107.7 •ADMINISTRATIVE COSTS• SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 107. 7 Admlnistra'tive Costs. When a test or inspection is scheduled, and the 
contractor fails to perform to the satisfaction of the authority having jurisdiction (AHJ), the AHJ 
may bill the contractor for actual time spent traveling to and from the test/inspection location 
and the time spent at the test/inspection site as well as administrative costs. 

SECTION 111.5 ~APPEAL PROCEDURES AND TIMELINES" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 111.5 Appeal Procedures and Timelines. Any person or entity who believes they 
may be adversely affected by an order, decision, or determination made by the fire code official 
through a written notice may appeal this matter within 15 calendar days of the postmark on the 
notice. All such appeals shall be fifed in writing with the Secretary of the Governing Board for 
the district. A timely appeal shall stay furlher action by the fire code official until the matter is 
determined by the Appeal Board as outlined in Section 109.2, unless the issue poses an 
imminent fire or life safety hazard to members of the public. The fire code official shall notify 
the appellant by certified mail of the date and time of such hearing. The hearing shall be 
scheduled to take place no sooner than 20 calendar days from the date shown on the certified 
mail. The appellant shall have the right to appear in person or by agent at the hearing and 
present oral, written and/or photographic evidence to the Appeal Board. 

SECTION 112.4 KVIOLA TION PENAL TIES" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 112.4 Violation Penalties. Persons who shall violate a provision of this code or shall 
fail to comply with any of the requirements thereof or who shall erect, install, alter, repair or do 
work in violation of the approved construction documents or directive of the fire code official, 
or of a permit or certificate used under provisions of this code, shall be guilty of a misdemeanor 
or infraction, at the discretion of the prosecuting attomey or agency, punishable by a fine not 
more than $100.00 for a first violation; A fine not exceeding $500.00 for a second violation of 

Ordinance 2022-01 Page3 

23-0015 H 6 of 46 



the same provision within one year; A fine not exceeding $1000.00 for each additional violation 
of the same provision within one year, or by imprisonment not exceeding 180 days, or both 
such fine and imprisonment. Each day that a violation continues after due notice has been 
served shall be deemed a separate offense. (Health & Safety Code Sections 13145 and 
17995). 

SECTION 112.4.2 uclTATIONS" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 112.4.2 Citations. The Fire Chief. or his/her duly authorized representative, may 
issue citations for infractions or misdemeanor violations of this code pursuant to Section 13871 
of the Health & Safety Code of the State of California and Chapter 5c (commencing with 
Section 853. 6) of Title 3 of Part 2 of the Penal Code of the State of California. 

SECTION 113.4 "FAILURE TO COMPL r SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 113.4 Failure to Comply. Any person who shall continue any work after having been 
served with a stop work order, except such work as that person is directed to perform to remove 
a violation or unsafe condition, shall be punishable by a fine or imprisonment or both as 
described in Section 112.4 (Health & Safety Code Sections 13145and 17995). 

Chapter2 

SECTION 202 "CAM?FIRE" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

CAMPFIRE. A fire which is used for cooking, personal warmth, lighting, or aesthetic purposes. 

SECTION 202 "DISTRICT" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS; 

DISTRJCT. The district and all other areas within the exterior boundaries thereof now or 
hereafter established. 

SECTION 202 "DRIVEWAY" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

DRJVEWA Y. A vehicular access that seNes up to two (2) parcels with no more than two (2) 
residential units and any number of non-commercial or industrial buildings on each parcel. 

SECTION 202 "EXECUTIVE BODr SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

EXECUTIVE BODY. The Board of Directors of the District. 

SECTION 202 "FIRE CHIEF~ SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

FIRE CHIEF. The Chief Executive Fire Officer of the Fire departmentldistn·ct serving the 
jurisdiction or a duly authorized representative. 

SECTION 202 "FIRE HAZARD" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

FIRE HAZARD. Any condition, arrangement, or act which will increase, or may cause an 
increase of, the hazard or menace of fire to a greater than customarily recognized as normal 

Ordinance 2022-01 Page4 

23-0015 H 7 of 46 



by-persons in the public service of preventing, suppressing or extinguishing fire; or which may 
obstruct, delay, or hinder, or may become the cause of obstruction, delay or hinderance to the 
prevention, suppression, or extinguishment of fire. 

SECTION 202 "OPEN BURNING" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

OPEN BURNING. The burning of materials wherein products of combustion are emitted directly 
into the ambient air without passing through a stack or chimney from an enclosed chamber. Open 
burning does not include road flares, smudge-pots and simllar devices associated with safety or 
occupational uses typically considered open flames. For the purpose of this definition, a chamber 
shall be regarded as enclosed when, during the time combustion occurs, only apertures, ducts, 
stacks, flues or chimneys necessary to provide combustion air and permit the escape of exhaust 
gas are open. 

Open burning shall also include campfires, bonfires, portable outdoor fireplaces, ceremonial 
fires, and recreational fire as defined in the Fire Code. 

Exception: 

1. UL or ASMI listed LPG or natural gas outdoor flame devices, such as gas BBQ's or gas 
fire pits that comp/y with the Fire Gode. 

2. For one-or two-family dwellings, fixed or portable outdoor flame devices that meet the 
following: 

a. Devices shall comply with the Fire Code. 

b. Devices shall be used per manufacturer's specillcauons. 

c. Minimum 10-foot clearance from device to all flammable material and vegetation. 

d. No burning shall be conducted during high or extreme fire weather conditions (e.g., 
National Weather Service Red Flag Warnings). 

3. Campfires on private lands. Where required by the fire code official, a permit shall be 
issued by the fire code official. 

4. Ceremonial and/or religious burning with the following safety measures: 

a. Maximum 4-foot x 4-foot bum area. 

b. Minimum 10-foot clearance from edge of burn area to all flammable material and 
vegetation. 

c. An approved water supply is located within 500-feet of the bum area. 

d. The bum area is located no less than 30-teet from adjoining property lines. 

e. An adult is present with a shovel until the fire is extinguished. 

f. No burning shall be conducted dunng high or extreme fire weather conditions (e.g., 
National Weather Service Red Flag Warnings). 

SECTION 202 "TRAINED CROWD MANAGER• SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Ordinance 2022-01 Pages 

23-0015 H 8 of 46 



TRAINED CROWD MANAGER. Standby personnel, usually a security guard or usher 
personnel, who are trained in the proper procedure to exit people from a tent or other place of 
public assemblage in an orderly and calm fashion in the event of an emBrgency 

Chapter 3 

SECTION 302.1 •oEFINITIONS" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 
3D PRINTER. 
ADDITIVE MANUFACTURJNG. 
BONFIRE. 
CAMPRRE. 
HI-SOY. 
HIGH-VOLTAGE TRANSMISSION LINE. 
OPEN BURNING. 
PORTABLE OUTDOOR FIREPLACE. 
POWERED INDUSTRIAL TRUCK. 
RECREATIONAL FIRE. 
SKY LA TTERN. 

SECTION 307.4.4 "OPEN BURNING RESTRICTIONS" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 307.4.4 Open Burning Restrictions. Open burning on all lands within the jurisdiction of 
the Rescue Fire Department including the Local Response Area (LRA), is prohibited when the 
California Department of Forestry and Fire Protection (Cal Fire) issues a bum suspension in the 
state ResponsiMity Aroa (SRA). This prohibition shall be made effective 24-hours following its 
commencement in the SRA. 

Open burning is also p,oh;bited on all lands within the jurisdiction of Rescue Fire Department at 
any time the fire code official that atmospheric conditions or other local circumstances make such 
fires hazardous, including factors such as high winds, low fuel moisture, fire weather, the issuance 
of red nag warnings, severe threat of wild/and fire, or present risk of destruction by wildfire to fife, 
wildlife, property, or natural resources. 

Chapter4 

SECTION 401.2.1 "PRE-FIRE P~NS" IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 401.2.1 Pre-fire plans. Where required by the fire code official, a pre-fire plan shall 
be provided and approved by the fire code official for all new commercial structures. 

Chapter 5 

SECTION 503.2.1 "DIMENSIONS" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 503.2.1 Dimensions. Fire apparatus access roads shall have an unobstructed width 
of not less than 20 feet (6096 mm), exclusive of shoulders, as measured from face of curb to 
face of curb, except for approved security gates in accordance with Section 503.6, and an 

Ordinance 2022-01 Pages 

23-0015 H 9 of 46 



unobstructed vertical clearance of not less than 15 feet. Driveways shall have an unobstructed 
width of not less than 12 feet wide. 

SECTION 503.2.5 uDEAD ENDS" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 503.2.5 Dead Ends. Dead-end fire apparatus access roads and driveways in excess 
of 150 feet (45,720 mm) in length shall be provided with an approved area for turning around 
fire apparatus. 

SECTION 503.2.6 •BRIDGES AND ELEVATED SURFACES• SHALL BE AMENDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section 503.2.6 Bridges and Elevated Surfaces. Where a bridge or an elevated surface is 
part of a fire apparatus access road, the bridge shall be constructed and maintained in 
accordance with AASHTO HB-17, the cuffent £1 Dorado County Transpo,tation Division Bridge 
Standard or Appendix D of the current California Fire Code, whichever is more restrictive. 
Bridges and elevated surfaces shall be designed for a live load sufficient to carry the imposed 
loads of fire apparatus. Vehicle load limits shall be posted at both entrances to bridges when 
required by the fire code official. Where elevated surfaces designed for emergency vehicle use 
are adjacent to surfaces that are not designed for such use, approved barriers, approved signs 
or both shall be installed and maintained where required by the fire code official. 

SECTION 503.3.1 "NO PARKING IN FIRE LANES" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 503.3.1 No Parking In Fire Lanes. No person shall stop, park, or leave standing any 
vehicle, whether attended or unattended, except when necessary to avoid conflict w;th other 
traffic or in compliance with the directions of the Fire Chief, or his/her duly authorized 
representative, Peace Off,cer or official traffic control device along the edge of any highway, 
at any curb, or in any location in a publicly or privately owned or operated off-street parking 
facility, designated as a fire lane by the district with jurisdiction over the area in which the place 
is located. The designation shall be indicated (1) by a sign posted immediately adjacent to, 
and visible from, the designated place clearly stating in letters not less than one inch in height 
that the place is s fire lane, (2) by outlining or painting the place in red and, in contrasting color, 
marking the place with the words "FIRE LANE", which are clearly visible from a vehicle, or (3) 
by a red curb or red paint on the edge of the roadway upon which is clearly marked the words 
"FIRE LANE". 

SECTION 503.3.2 "NO PARKING IN FRONT OF HYDRANTSu SHALL BE ADDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section 503.3.2 No Parking In Front of Hydrants. No person shall stop, park, or leave 
standing any vehicle within 15 feet of a fire hydrant except as follows: ( a) If the vehicle is 
attended bys licensed driver who ;s seated 1'n the front seat and who can immediately move 
such vehicle in case of necessity, (b) If the vehicle is owned or operated by a fire department 
and is clearly marked as a fire department vehicle. 

SECTION 503.3.3 "FIRE LANES BASED ON ROAD WIDTH" SHALL BE ADDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Ordinance 2022-01 Page7 

23-0015 H 10 of 46 



Section 503.3.3 Fire Lanes Based on Road Width. Fire lanes shall be based on road width 
as required in Appendix D as amended by the District. 

SECTION 503.6 •sECURJTY GATES" IS AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 503.6 Security Gates. The Installation of security gates across a fire apparatus 
access road shall be approved by the fire code official and shall comply with the District gate 
standard. Where security gates are installed, they shall have an approved means of 
emergency operation. The security gates and the emergency operation shall be maintained 
operational at all times. Electric gate operators, where provided, shall be listed in accordance 
with UL 325. Gates intended for automatic operation shall be designed, constructed, and 
installed to comply with the requirements of ASTM F2200. 

SECTION 505.1 aADDRESS IDENTIFICATION° SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 505.1 Address fdentlfictnion. Addn?sses for new and existing buildings shall comply 
with the District address standard as approved by the fire code official. The address 
identification shall be legible and placed in a position that is visible from the street or road fronting 
the property. Address identification characters shall contrast with their background. Address 
numbers shall be Arabic numbers or alphabetical letters. Numbers shall not be spelled out. Each 
character shall be not less than 4 inches (102 mm) high with a minimum stroke width of½ inch 
(12.7 mm). Where required by the fire code official, address identification shall be provided in 
additional approved locations to facilitate emergency response. access is by means of a private 
roa,d and the building cannot be viewed from the public way, a monument, pole or other sign or 
means shall be used to identify the structure. Address identification shall be maintained. 

SECTION 507.5.1 "WHERE REQUIRED" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 507.5.1 Where Required. Where a portion of the facility or building hereafter 
constructed or moved into or within the jurisdiction is more than 150 feet from a hydrant on a fire 
apparatus access road, as measured by an approved route around the exterior of the facility or 
building, on-site fire hydrants and mains capable of supplying the required fire flow shall be 
provided where required by the fire code official. 

Exceptions: 

1. For Group R-3 and Group U occupancies, the distance requirement shall be 600 feet 
(183 m). 

SECTION 509.3 "FIRE CONTROL ROOM" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 509.3 Fire Control Room. Fire sprinkler risers, fire alarm control panels, solar 
photovoltaic power system rapid shutoff switches, and other fire detection, suppression or 
similar control elements shall be located inside a single fire control room for the bu;/ding. The 
fire control room shall have minimum dimensions of five feet by seven feet in size with a total 
usable area of not less than 35 square feet. The room shall be located within the building on 
an outside wall at a location approved by the Fire Code Official and shall be accessible from 
the exterior. An exterior access door with a clear width of not less than 32 inches and height 
of not fess than 80 inches shall be provided for access into the room. A durable sign shall be 
affixed to the exterior of the door with the wards "FIRE CONTROL ROOM" in letters not less 

Ordinance 2022-0 l Page a 

23-0015 H 11 of 46 



than 4 inches in height. A key box complying with Section 506 shall be installed on the exterior 
side of the fire control room door opening. 

The room must be capable of maintain;ng a minimum temperature of 40 degrees Fahrenhe;t. 
A clearance of 12 inches shall be provided from the fire sprinkler risers to any adjacent walls. 
This room can be a shared with other building utilities or fire protection equipment that is not 
incompatible. An approved cabinet or container shafl be provided to store record plans of the 
'fire sprinkler system and other fire protection equipment. This room shall not be used for any 
other storage. 

Exception: One-and two-family dwellings, manufactured homes or similar uses defined 
as either a Group R-3, R3. 1, or R-4 occupancy. 

SECTION 510.4.2.3 "STANDBY POWER" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS; 

Section 510.4.2.3 Standby power. In-building, two-way emergency responder 
communication radio coverage systems shall be provided with dedicated standby batteries or 
provided with 2-hour standby batteries and connected to the facility generator power system 
in accordance with Section 1203. The standby power supply shall be capable of operating the 
in-building, two-way emergency responder communication coverage system at 100-percent 
system capacity for a duration of not less than 72 hours. 

Chapter 9 

SECTION 903.2 "WHERE REQUIRED~ SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 903.2 Where Required. Approved automatic sprinkler systems in new buildings and 
structures when constructed or relocated within the jurisdict;on shall be provided in the 
locations described in Sections 903.2.1 through 903.2.12 and Sections 903.2.14 through 
903.2.23. 

Exception: Agricultural buildings not under a special use permit used for commercial 
purposes. 

SECTION 903.2.1.1 "GROUPA-1" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 903.2.1.1 Group A . An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout stories 
containing Group A-1 occupancies and throughout all stories from the Group A-1 occupancy to 
and including the levels of exit discharge serving that occupancy where one of the following 
conditions exists: 

1. The fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

2. The fire area has an occupant load of 300 or more. 

3. The fire area is located on a floor other than a level of exit discharge serving such 
occupancies. 

4. The fire area contains a multi-theater complex 

SECTION 903.2.1.2 "GROUP A-2~ SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 903.2.1.2 Group A-2. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout 
stories containing Group A-2 occupancies and throughout all stories from the Group A-2 

Ordinance 2022-01 Page9 

23-0015 H 12 of 46 



occupancy to and including the levels of exit discharge serving that occupancy where one of the 
following conditions exists: 

1. The fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet; 

2. The fire area has an occupant load of 100 or more. 

3. The fire area is located on a floor other than a level of exit discharge serving such 
occupancies. 

4. The structure exceeds 3,600 square feet, contains more than one fire area containing a 
Group A-2 occupancy, and is separated into two or more buildings by fire walls of less than 
4-hour fire-resistance rating without openings. 

SECTION 903.2.1.3 "GROUP A-3w SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 903.2.1.3 Group A-3. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout 
stories containing Group A-3 occupancies and throughout all stories from the Group A-3 
occupancy to and including the levels of exit discharge serving that occupancy where one of the 
following conditions exists: 

1. The fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

2. The fire area has an occupant load of 300 or more. 

3. The fire area is located on a floor other than a level of exit discharge serving such 
occupancies. 

4. The structure exceeds 3,600 square feet, contains more than one fire area containing 
exhibition and display rooms, and is separated into two or more buildings by fire walls of 
less than 4-hour fire-resistance rating without openings. 

SECTION 903.2.1.4 "GROUP A4• SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 903.2.1.4 Group A4. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout 
stories containing Group A-4 occupancies and throughout all stories from the Group A-4 
occupancy to and including the levels of exit discharge serving that occupancy where one of the 
following conditions exists: 

1. The fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

2. The fire area has an occupant load of 300 or more. 

3. The fire area is located on a floor other than a level of exit discharge serving such 
occupancies. 

SECTION 903.2.3 "GROUP E" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 903.2.3 Group E. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided for Group E 
occupancies as follows: 

1. Throughout all Group E fire areas greater than 3,600 square feet in area. 

2. The Group E fire area is located on a floor other than a level of exit discharge serving such 
occupancies. 

Ordinance 2022-0 I Page 10 

23-0015 H 13 of 46 



Exception: In buildings where every classroom has not fewer than one exterior exit 
door at ground level, an automatic sprinkler system is not required in any 
area below the lowest level of exit discharge serving that area. 

3. The Group E fire area has an occupant load of 300 or more. 

4. In rooms or areas with special hazards such as laboratories, vocational shops and other 
such areas where hazardous materials in quantities not exceeding the maximum allowable 
quantity are used or stored. 

5. Throughout any Group E structure greater than 3,600 square feet in area, which contains 
more than one fire area, and which is separated into two or more buildings by fire walls of 
less than 4-hour fire resistance rating without openings. 

6. For public school state funded construction projects see Section 903.2.19. 

7. For public school campuses, Kindergarten through 12th grade, see Section 903.2.20 

SECTION 903.2.4 ~GROUP F~1• SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 903.2.4 Group F-1. An automatic sprinkler system shall be _provided throughout all 
buildings containing a Group F-1 occupancy where one of the following conditions exists: 

1. A Group F-1 fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

2. A Group F-1 fire area is located more than three stories above grade plane. 

3. The combined area of all Group F-1 fire areas on all floors, including any mezzanines, 
exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

SECTION 903.2.7 ''GROUP M" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 903.2.7 Group M. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout buildings 
containing a Group M occupancy where one of the following conditions exists: 

1. A Group M fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

2. A Group M fire area is located more than three stories above grade plane. 

3. The combined area of all Group M fire areas on all floors, including any mezzanines, 
exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

5. The structure exceeds 3,600 square feet, contains more than one fire area containing a 
Group M occupancy, and is separated into two or more buildings by fire walls of less than 
4-hour fire resistance rating without openings. 

SECTION 903.2.7.2 •GROUP M UPHOLSTERED FURNITURE OR MATTRESSESR SHALL 
BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 903.2.7.2 Group M Upholstered Furniture or Mattresses. An automatic sprinkler 
system shall be provided throughout a Group M fire area where the area used for the display 
and sale of upholstered furniture or mattresses exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

SECTION 903.2.8.5 ~MANUFACTURED HOMES" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 11 

23-0015 H 14 of 46 



Section 903.2.B.5 Manufactured Homes. An automatic fire sprinkler system shall be required 
in all new manufactured homes and multi-family manufactured homes intended for use as a 
one-and two-family dwelling. The design and installation of such systems shall be in 
accordance with California Code of Regulations, Title 25, §4300. 

Exceptions: 

1. Manufactured homes located Within an existing mobile home park complying with 
California Health and Safety Code, Division 13, Part 2.1 or 2.3. 

2. Manufactured homes that do not exceed 1,200 square feet in size and serve as an 
accessory dwelling unit, as defined in Government Code Section 658502; when the 
existing primary residence on the properly is not required to comply with California 
Residential Code Section R313.2. 

3. Manufactured homes that do not exceed 320 square feet in size. 

SECTION 903.2.9 "GROUP S-1• SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 903.2.9 Group S-1. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout all 
buildings containing a Group S-1 occupancy where one of the following conditions exists: 

1. A Group S-1 fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

2. A Group S-1 fire area is located more than three stories above grade plane. 

3. The combined area of all Group 5-1 fire areas on all floors, including any mezzanines, 
exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

4. A Group S-1 fire area used for the storage of commercial motor vehicles where the fire 
area exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

SECTION 903.2.10 °GROUP S-2" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 903.2.10 Group S-2. Ari automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout 
buildings classified as parking garages where any of the following conditions exist: 

1. Where the fire area of the enclosed parking garage, in accordance with Section 406.6 of 
the California Building Code, exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

2. Where the enclosed parking garage, in accordance with Section 406.6 of the California 
Building Code, is located beneath other groups. 

Exception: Enclosed parking garages located beneath Group R-3 occupancies. 

3. Where the fire area of the open parking garage, in accordance with Section 406.5 of the 
California Building Code, exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

SECTION 903.2.10.1 aCOMMERCIAL PARKING GARAGES" SHALL BE AMENDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section 903.2.10.1 Commercial Parking Garages. An automatic sprinkler system shall be 
provided throughout buildings used for storage of commercial motor vehicles where the fire area 
exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 12 

23-0015 H 15 of 46 



SECTION 903.2.22 "GROUP B" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 903.2.22 Group B. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout all 
buildings containing Group B occupancies where the fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

SECTION 903.2.23 "GROUP F-2" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 903.2.23 Group F-2. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout all 
buildings containing Group F-2 occupancies where the fire area exceeds 3,600 squaf9 feet. 

SECTION 903.6 "WHERE REQUIRED IN EXISTING BUILDINGS AND STRUCTURES" IS 
AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 903.6 Where Required In Existing Buildings and Structures. An automatic 
sprinkler system shall be provided in existing buildings and structures where required in 
Chapter 11 and as follows: 

1. When there is a change in occupancy classification that results in an increased life safety 
or fire risk, as determined by the fire code official, and the structure exceeds 3,600 square 
feet, an automatic fire sprinkler system shall be installed throughout the building. 

2. Jn existing buildings 3,600 square feet or greater, other than one and two-family dwelling 
units, and agricultural buildings not under special use permit for commercial purposes, 
where the floor area of the building or structure is increased, such building or structure 
shall be made to conform to Section 903.2. 

Exception: When the building increase is less than 500 square feet. 

3. In existing buildings 3,600 square feet or less, other than one-and two-family dwelling 
units, and agricultural buildings not under special use permit for commercial purposes, 
where the ffoor area of the building or structure is increased to a total square footage 
over 3,600 square feet, such building or structure shall be made to conform to Section 
903.2. 

Exception: When the building increase is less than 500 square feet. 

SECTION 907.2. "WHERE REQUIRED-NEW BUILDINGS ANO STRUCTURES" SHALL BE 
AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 907.2. Where Required - New Buildings and Structures. An approved fire alarm 
system installed in accordance with the provisions of this code and NFPA 72 shall be provided 
in new buildings and structures in accordance with Sections 907.2.1 through 907.2.30 and 
provide occupant notification in accordance with Section 907.5, unless other requirements are 
provided by another section of this code. 

Not fewer than one manual fire alann box shall be provided in an approved location to initiate 
a fire alarm signal for fire alarm systems employing automatic fire detectors or waterflow 
detection devices. Where other sections of this code allow elimination of fire alarm boxes due 
to sprinklers or automatic tire alarm systems, a single fire alarm box shall be installed at a 
location approved by the enforcing agency. 

Exceptions: 

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 13 

23-0015 H 16 of 46 



1. The manual fire alarm box Is not required for fire alarm control units systems 
dedicated to elevator recall control, supervisory service and fire sprinkler 
monitoring. 

2. The manual fire alarm box is not required for Group R-2 occupancies unless 
required by the fire code official to provide a means for fire watch personnel to 
initiate an alarm during a sprinkler system, impairment event. Where provided, the 
manual fire alarm box shall not be located in an area that is open to the public. 

3. The manual fire alami box is not required to be installed when approved by the fire 
code official. 

4. A fire alarm system is not required in one and two-family dwellings, agricultural 
buildings, and other occupancies classified as Group U not under special use 
permit and/or not used for commercial purposes (e.g. retail sales, food service, 
and/or special events). 

5. Buildings with a floor area less than 500 square feet may be exempt, as determined 
by the fire code official based on bu;lding construction material and features, 
location, occupancy type, and distance to exposures. 

SECTION 907.2.1.4 ~GROUP A UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEEr SHALL BE ADDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section 907.2.1.4 Group A Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shall 
be installed in all group A buildings with a floor area less than 3,600 square feet. 

SECTION 907.2.2.3 "GROUP B UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET" SHALL BE ADDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section 907.2.2.3 Group B Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shall 
be installed in all group B buildings with a floor area less than 3,600 square feet. 

SECTION 907.2.3.11 "GROUP E UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET" SHALL BE ADDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section 907.2.3.11 Group E Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shall 
be installed in all group E buildings with a floor area less than 3,600 square feet. 

SECTION 907.2.4.1 "GROUP F UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET" SHALL BE ADDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section 907.2.4.1 Group F Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shall 
be installed in all group F buildings with a floor area less than 3,600 square feet. 

SECTION 907.2.5.2 •GROUP H UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET" SHALL BE ADDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section 907.2.5.2 Group H Under 3,600 Square Feet An approved fire alarm system shall 
be installed in all group H bu;tdings with a floor area less than 3,600 square feet. 

Ordinance 2022-0 I Page 14 

23-0015 H 17 of 46 



SECTION 907.2.6.6 "GROUP I UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET" SHALL BE ADDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section 901.2.6.6 Group I Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shall be 
installed in all group I buildings with a floor area less than 3,600 square feet. 

SECTION 907.2.7.2 "GROUP M UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET" SHALL BE ADDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section 901.2.7.2 Group M Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shall 
be installed in all group M buildings with a floor area less than 3,600 square feet. 

SECTION 907.2.8.4 "GROUP R-1 UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET• SHALL BE ADDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section 907.2.8.4 Group R-1 Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shall 
be installed in all group R-1 buildings with a floor area less than 3,600 square feet. 

SECTION 907.2.9.4 "GROUP R-2, R-2.1, R-2.2 UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET" SHALL BE 
ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 907.2.9.4 Group R-2, R-2.1, R-2.2 Under 3,600 Square Feet An approved fire alarm 
system shall be installed in all group R-2, R-2.1, R-2.2 buildings with a floor area less than 
3,600 square feet. 

SECTION 907.2.10.1 uGROUP SUNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET" SHALL BE ADDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section 907.2.10.1 Group S Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shall 
be installed in all group S buildings with a floor area less than 3,600 square feet. 

907.2.30 "TYPE I HOOD INSTALLATIONS" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

907.2.30 "Type I Hood lnstallaUons. The requirement of installation, or replacement, of a 
Type I Hood System shall require a fire a/arm/sprinkler monitoring system to be installed, or 
for the hood system to be connected to an existing fire alarm/sprinkler monitoring system for 
that building. 

907 .6.5 "MONITORING" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOUOWS: 

907.6.5 Monitoring. Fire alarm systems required by this chapter or by the California Building 
Code shall be monitored by an approved, UL certified, Type A Full Servir:e central, proprietary 
or remote station service, which gives audible and visual signals at a constantly attended 
location. All sprinklered buildings shall be monitored. 

Exceptions: 
I . One- and two-family dwellings (R-3 Occupancies and other occupancies classified 

as "U"). 

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 15 

23-0015 H 18 of 46 



2. Agricultural buildings not under special use permit and/or not used for commercial 
purposes (e.g., retails sales, food service, and/Or special events). 

SECTION 907.6.2.1 "SECONDARY POWER SUPPLY" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

SECTION 907.6.2.1 SECONDARY POWER SUPPLY. Where required by the fire code official, 
in accordance with NFPA 72, the secondary power supply providing a minimum 24-hour power 
capac,1y under quiescent load (system operating in a non-alarm condition) shafl be amended 
to a minimum 72-hour power capacity. 

Exception.· The existence of an emergency back-up power supply that meets or exceed 
the requirements of California Fire Code Chapter 12. 

SECTION 907.9 "WHERE REQURIED IN EXISTING BUILDINGS" SHALL BE AMENDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

SECTION 907 .9 Where Required. An approved fire alarm system shall be provided in existing 
buildings and structures where required in Chapter 11 and in existing buildings with a floor 
area less than 3,600 square feet without an approved automatic sprinkler system, other than 
one- or two-family dwelling units, agricultural building not under special use perm;t for 
commercial purposes where a fire alarm detection system does not exist and the floor area of 
the building or structure is increased 

Exception: When the building increase is Jess than 5()() square feet. 

Chapter 12 

SECTION 1203.1.3 BINSTALLATION" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 1203.1.3 Installation. Emergency power systems and standby power systems shall 
be installed in accordance with the California Building Code, the California Electrical Code, 
NFPA 11 O and NFPA 111. All buildings, other than one- and two-family dwelling units, and 
agricultural buildings not used for commercial purposes, with standby power, shall have a 
shunt trip device that disconnects all power sources to the building, approved by the fire code 
official. Existing installations shall be maintained in accordance with the original approval. 

Chapter 33 

SECTION 3311.3 "PREMISE IDENTIFICATION" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 3311.3 Premise Identification. Prior to and during construction, an approved 
address sign shall be provided at each fire and emergency vehicle access road entry into the 
project. 

SECTION 3313.1 "WHEN REQUIRED" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 3313.1 When Required. An approved water supply for fire protection, either 
temporary or permanent, shall be installed and maintained in continuous operation as soon as 

, combustible building materials arrive on site, the commencement of vertical combustible 

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 16 

23-0015 H 19 of 46 



construction and on installation of a standpipe system in buildings under construction, in 
accordance with Sections 3313.2 through 3313.5. 

Exception: The fire code official is authorized to reduce the fire-flow requirements for 
isolated buildings or a group of buildings in rural areas or small communities where the 
development of full fire-flow requirements is impractical. 

Chapter 50 

SECTION 5001.7 uLIABILITY FOR DAMAGES" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 5001. 7 Liability for Damages. Any damages or cost resulting from the negligence, 
violation of the Jaw, careless handling, spill or discharge of any hazardous materials shall 
constitute debt against any such person, firm or corporation causing such spill or discharge. 
This debt is colfectible by the Fire Chief, or his/her duly authorized 18presentative, in the same 
manner as in the case of an obligation under contract, expressed or ;mplied. 

Chapter56 

SECTION 5601.2 "PERMIT REQUIRED" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 5601.2 Permit Required. Permits shall be required as set forth in Section 105.5 and 
regulated in accordance with this section. Where fireworks permits are required, they shall be 
issued by the Fire Chief, or hisnterduly authorized representative, and the El Dorado County 
Board of Supervisors. 

Chapter57 

SECTION 5704.2.9.6.1 "LOCATIONS WHERE ABOVE-GROUND TANKS ARE 
PROHIBITED" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

SECTION 5704.2.9.6.1 Locations Where Above-Ground Tanks are Prohibited. Storage of 
Class I and Class II flammable liquids in above-ground tanks outside of buildings is prohibited 
within the limits established by law as the limits of districts in which such storage is prohibited. 
Storage of Class I and Class II flammable liqu;ds in above-ground tanks outside of buildings is 
prohibited unless approved by the fire code official. 

SECTION 5706.2.4.4 "LOCATIONS WHERE ABOVE-GROUND TANKS ARE PROHIBITED" 
SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

SECTION 5706.2.4.4 Locations Where Above-Ground Tanks are Prohibited. The storage 
of Class I and Class II liquids In above-ground tanks is prohibited within the limits established 
by law as the limits of districts in which such storage Is prohibited. Storage of Class I and Class 
JI liquids in above--ground tanks is prohibited unless approved by the fire code official. 

Chapter 58 

Ordi11ance 2022-01 Page 17 

23-0015 H 20 of 46 



SECTION 5806.2 °LIMITATIONS" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

SECTION 5806.2 Limitations. Storage of flammable cryogenic fluids in stationaiy containers 
outside of buildings is prohibited within the limits established by law as the limits of districts in 
which such storage is prohibited. Storage of flammable cryogen;c fluids in stationary containers 
outside of buildings is prohibited unless approved by the fire code official. 

Chapter 61 

SECTION 6104.2 •MAXIMUM CAPACITY WITHIN ESTABLISHED LIMITS" SHALL BE 
AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

SECTION 6104.2 Maximum Capacity within Established Limit&. Within the limits 
established by law restricting the storage of liquefied petroleum gas for the protection of heavily 
populated or congested areas, the aggregate capacity of any one installation shall not exceed 
a water capacity of 2,000 gallons. The storage of liquefied petroleum gas in excess of an 
aggregate of 2, ODO-gallon water capacity when located at least one-half (112) mile from 
property zoned or designated for residential use and at feast one-half (112) mile from existing 
residential development with a density greater than one (1) dwelling unit per acre and at least 
one-half (112) mile from any hotel or motel is allowed when approved by the fire code official, 
and a speciaVconditional use permit is issued by the County of El Dorado. 

Dispensing within established limits. Within the limits established by law restricting the 
dispensing of liquefied petroleum gas for the protection of heavily populated or congested 
areas, the aggregate capacity of any one installation shall not exceed a water capacity of 2, 000 
gallons. The dispensing of liquefied petroleum gas in excess of an aggregate of 2, 000-gallon 
water capacity when located at least one-half (112) mile from property zoned or designated for 
residential use and at least one-half (112) mile from any hotel or motel is allowed when 
approved by the fire code off,cial and a speciaVconditional use permit is issued by the County 
of El Dorado. 

Chapter 80 

SECTION 80, NFPA 1-22, CHAPTER 22 "AUTOMOTIVE WRECKING YARDS'' IS ADOPTED, 
AMENDED SECTIONS AS FOLLOWS: 

Revise Section 22.3 as follows: 

22.3 Fire department access roads shall be in accordance with the California Fire Code, 
Section 503 and Appendix D. 

Add new Section 22.10 as follows: 

22.10 Stored vehicles, boats, recreational vehicles, parts, and equipment shall not be stored 
within 30 feet of adjacent property lines. 

Ordinance 2022-0 l Page 18 

23-0015 H 21 of 46 



SECTION 80, NFPA, 13D-22-"STANDARD FOR THE INSTALLATION OF SPRINKLER 
SYSTEMS IN ONE-AND TWO FAMILY DWELLINGS AND MANUFACTURED HOMES" IS 
AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 903.3.1.3, 903.3.5.1 .1 

NFPA 13D, Amended Sections as follows: 

Add new Section 4.6 as follows: 

4.6 Residential fire sprinkler systems installed in all new one-and two-family dwellings shall utilize 
a "Passive Purge• system design unless otherw;se approved by the fire code official. 

Exception: Manufactured home installed, tested and approved by the California 
Department of Housing and Community Development. 

Revise Section 5.1.1.2 as foHows: 

5.1.1.2 A supply of at least one of each type and temperature sprinkler used within the premises 
shall be ma;ntained on the property at an approved location. Spare sprinklers shall be kept in a 
mounted and accessible cabinet. 

Revise Section 7.6 as follows: 

7.6 A local audio/visual device activated upon water flow shall be provided on all fire sprinkler 
systems in homes at an approved location on the exterior of the dwelling. 

Revise Section 11.2.1.1 as follows: 

11.2.1.1 Where a fire department pumper connection is not provided, the system shall be 
hydros1atlcally tested at a minimum pressure of 150 pounds per square inch gauge for no less 
than a 30-minute duration without evidence of leakage. Such test shall be witnessed by the fire 
code official. 

Appendix B - Fire Flow Requirements for Buildings 

TABLE B105.1(1) "REQUIRED FIRE FLOW FOR ONE- AND TWO-FAMILY DWELLINGS, 
GROUP R-3, AND R-4 BUILDINGS AND TOWNHOUSES. SHALL BE: AMENDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

TABLE B105.1 (1) REQUIRED FIRE FLOW FOR ONE- AND TWO-FAMILY DWELLINGS, 
GROUP R-3, AND R-4 BUILDINGS AND TOWNHOUSES 

FIRE-FLOW AUTOMATIC MINIMUM FIRE- FLOW DURATION 

CALCULATION SPRINKLER SYSTEM FLOW (hours) 

AREA (Design Standard) (gallons per 

(square feet) minute) 

0-3,600 No automatic sprinkler 1,000 1 
system 

Ordinan'1e 2022-0 I Page 19 

23-0015 H 22 of 46 



3,601 and greater No automatic sprinkler Value in Table Duration in Table 

system 8105.1 (2) B105.1(2) at the 
required tire-flow 
rate 

MAJOR SUBDJVJS/ONS (5 PARCELS OR GREATER) 

0-3,600 Section 903.3.1.3 of the 1,000 1 

CA Fire Code or Section 

313.3 of the CA 

Residential Code 

3,601 and greater Section 903.3.1.3 of the 1/2 value of 

CA Fire Code or Section Table 8105.1(2} 2 
313.3 of the CA (min. 1000 
Residential Code GPM) 

OTHER RESIDENTfAL DEVELOPMENT 

0-3,600 Section 903.3.1.3 of the 500 1 
CA Fire Code or Section 

313.3 of the CA 
Residential Code 

3,601 and greater Section 903.3.1.3 of the 1/2value of Table 1 
CA Fire Code or Section 8105.1(2) (min. 

313.3 of the CA 750GPM) 
Residential Code 

TABLE B 105.2 "REQUIRED FIRE FLOW FOR BUILDINGS OTHER THAN ONE-AND 
TWO-FAMILY DWELLINGS, GROUP R-3, AND R-4 BUILDINGS AND 
TOWNHOUSES" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

TABLE B105.2 REQUIRED FIRE FLOW FOR BUILDINGS OTHER THAN ONE­
AND TWO-FAMILY DWELLINGS, GROUP R-3, AND R-4 BUILDINGS AND 

TOWNHOUSES 

AUTOMATIC MINIMUM FIRE- FLOW DURATION 

SPRINKLER SYSTEM FLOW (hours) 
(Design Standard) (gallons per minute) 

No automatic sprinkler Value in Table Duration in Table B 105. 1 (2) 

system B105.1(2) 

Section 903.3. 1.1 of the 25% of the value in Duration in Table B105.1 (2) at 

CA Fire Code Table 8105.1(2) b the reduced flow rate 

b. The reduced fire flow shall not be less than 1,500 gpm 

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 20 

23-0015 H 23 of 46 



Appendix D - Fire Apparatus Access Roads 

SECTION D103.1 "ACCESS ROAD WIDTH WITH A HYDRANT' SHALL BE AMENDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section D103.1 Access Road Width with a Hydrant. Where a fire hydrant is located on a 
fire apparatus access road, the minimum road width shall be 26 feet (7925 mm), exclusive of 
shoulders (see Figure D103.1). 

Exr:eption: Driveways 

SECTION 0103.2 "GRADE" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

SECTION 0103.2 Grade. Fire apparatus access roads and driveways shall not exceed 15.9% 
in grade unless approved by the fire code official or by the El Dorado County amended 
Califomia Public Resource Code Titfe 14 I Design and Improvement Standards Manual. 

SECTION D103.3 "TURNING RADIUS'' SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

SECTION 0103.3 Turning Radius. The minimum turning radius shall be determined by the 
fire code official; and shalf not include curb and gutter. 

SECTION D103.5 "FIRE APPARATUS ACCESS ROAD GATES~ SHALL BE AMENDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

SECTION 0103.5 Fire Apparatus Access Road Gates. Gates securing the fire apparatus 
access roads shall comply with all of the following criteria: 

1. Where a single gate is provided, the gate width shall be not less than 20 feet (6096 mm). 
Where a fire apparatus road consists of a divided roadway, the gate width shall be not less 
than 15 feet (3658 mm). 

2. Gates shall be of the horizontal swing, horizontal slide, vertical lift or vertical pivot type. 

3. Construction of gates shall be of materials that allow manual operation by one person. 

4. Gate components shall be maintained in an operative condition at all times and replaced 
or repaired when defective. 

5. Electric gates shall be equipped with a means of opening the gate by fire department 
personnel for emergency access. Emergency opening devices shall be approved by the 
fire code official. 

6. Methods of locking shall be submitted for approval by the fire code official. 

7. Electric gate operators, where provided, shall be listed in accordance with UL 325. 

8. Gates intended for automatic operation shall be designed, constructed and installed to 
comply with the requirements of ASTM F2200. 

SECTION D103.6.1 nROADS 20 TO 29 FEET IN WIDTH" SHALL BE AMENDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 21 

23-0015 H 24 of 46 



SECTION D103.6.1 Roads 20 to 29 feet in width. Fire lane signs as specified in Section 
0103.6 shall be posted on both side of fire apparatus access roads that are 20 to 29 feet wide 
(6096 to 8534.4 mm). 

SECTION 0103.6.2 "ROADS MORE THAN 29 FEET IN WIDTH" SHALL BE AMENDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

SECTION D103.6.2 Roads more than 29 feet In Width. Fire lane signs as specified in Section 
D103.6 shall be posted on one side of fire apparatus access roads more than 29 feet wide 
(8534.4 mm) and less than 36 feet wide (10972.8 mm). 

SECTION D104.4 "CIRCUMFERENTIAL FIRE APPARATUS ACCESS ROADS" SHALL BE 
ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

SECTION D104.4 Circumferential Fire Apparatus Access Roads. When required by the 
fire code official, a fire apparatus access road shall be constructed to encompass the entirety 
of a structure and shall provide a continuous means of emergency vehicle access. 

SECTION 4: CONFLICT 

That Ordinance No. 2019-01 of the RFPO, and all other ordinances or parts of ordinances 

herewith are hereby repealed. 

SECTION 5: SEVERABIUTY 

If any Ordinance, article, subsection or subdivision thereof, provision, sentence, clause or 

phrase of this code, or any application thereof, is for any reason held to be invalid by a court 

of competent jurisdiction, such decision shall not affect the remaining provisions of this code, 

which can be given effect Without the invalid portions and, therefore, such invalid portions are 

declared to be severable. The RFPD hereby declares that it would have enacted this Ordinance 

and each of its articles, sections, subsections, or subdivlsfons thereof, provisions, sentences, 

clauses or phrases irrespective of the fact that one or more of them is declared invalid. 

SECTION 6: EFFECTIVE DATE AND PUBLICATION 

This Ordinance shall take effect thirty (30) days after its adoption. RFPD Board Secretary is 

directed to publish this ordinance in a newspaper of general circulation in the District. In lieu 

of publication of the full text of the ordinance, a summary of the ordinance may be published 

by the by the Board Secretary within fifteen (15) days after Its passage and a certified copy 

shall be posted in the office of the RFPD pursuant to Government Code Section 36933(c) (1). 

Ordinance 2022-01 Page22 

23-0015 H 25 of 46 



The above Ordinance was introduced at a meeting of the Board of Directors of the RFPD on 

September 14, 2022, and Jt was then read for the first time. A public hearing was set for the 

Ordinance to be read for the second time on October 12, 2022 and approved by the following 

vote: 

PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of Directors of the Rescue Fire Department this, 

2J day of Qc.Jo:e&'2; 2022. 

AYES:.-6 

NOES: 

ABSENT: 

ABSTAIN: 

XXXX, Board President 

ATTEST: 

/fl-fi--v----= 
Aja Mercado, Board Secretary 

Ordinance 2022-01 Page23 

23-0015 H 26 of 46 



The above Ordinance was introduced at a meeting of the Board of Directors of the RFPD on 

September 14, 2022, and it was then read for the first time. A public hearing was set for the 

Ordinance to be read for the second time on October 12, 2022 and approved by the following 

vote: 

PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of Directors of the Rescue Fire Department this, 

23 day of OCJO'i3-€:~ 2022. 

AYES:.-6 

NOES: 

ABSENT: 

ABSTAIN: 

XXXX, Board President 

ATTEST: 

/fl+~ 
Aja Mercado, Board Secretary 

Ordinance 2022·01 Page 23 

23-0015 H 27 of 46 



SECTION 2: FINDINGS OF FACTS 

In connection with the amendments enacted by Section 2 and 3 relating to the California 
Fire Code and its appendix, 2022 edition, the Rescue Fire Protection District (RFPD) 
makes the following findings pursuant to Health and Safety Code Section 17958.5, 
17958.7 and 18941.5. The changes are reasonably necessary because of local climatic, 
topographical or geological conditions. 

RFPD hereby adopts pursuant to Section 18941.5 of the California Health and 
Safety Code, the following findings of fact: 

(a) Under this adopting ordinance, specific amendments have been 
established which are of a more restrictive nature than those adopted by the State of 
California (State Buildings Standards Code, State Housing & Community Development 
Codes) commonly referred to as Title 24 & Title 25 of the California Code of Regulations. 
These amendments to the California Fire Code 2022 edition, have been recognized by 
the RFPD to address the fire problems, concerns and future direction by which RFPD can 
establish and maintain an environment which will afford a level of fire and life safety to all 
who live and work within its boundary. 

(b) The International Code Council has assumed responsibility for the 
International Fire Code and International Fire Code Standards. The International Code 
Council provided a means for participation by all code enforcement officials from 
throughout the country as well as industry representatives, consultants, and other private 
parties with an interest in the International Fire Code. 

(c) The International Fire Code, being the 2021 edition thereof, published by 
the International Code Council is a nationally recognized compilation of proposed rules, 
regulations and standards of said Association. 

(d) Said International Fire Code has been printed and published as a Code in 
book form within the meaning of Section 50022.1 of the Government Code of the State 
of California. 

(e) Under the provisions of Section 18941.5 of the Health and Safety Code, 
local amendments are based on climatic, topographical and geological conditions. The 
findings of fact contained herein address each of these situations and present the local 
situation, which either singularly or in combination, caused the aforementioned 
amendments to be adopted. 

23-0015 H 28 of 46 



2022 CFC FINDINGS 

LOCAL CONDITIONS 

A. These amendments are justified on the basis of a local climatic condition. RFPD is 
subject to precipitation, relative humidity, temperature extremes, and high velocity 
winds. 

1. Precipitation & relative humidity 

a. Conditions 

Precipitation. Average annual precipitation ranges from approximately 
25 to 32 inches per year. Approximately 88% of the average rainfall 
occurs during the months of November through April and 12% from May 
through October. This area has experienced major droughts in the last 
two decades: 1986 -1991, 1998 - 2003, 2007 - 2009, and 2011 - 2015. 
It is possible that more droughts will occur in the future based on the 
weather cycle pattern. 

Relative Humidity. During the summer months (May through 
September), the daily humidity generally ranges around 20% and 
occasionally drops to the low teens. 

2. Temperature 

a. Conditions 

Temperatures. During the summer months (May through 
September), the daily temperatures commonly exceed 90 degrees 
Fahrenheit, with temperatures having been recorded as high as 
115 degrees. 

3. Winds 

SUMMARY 

a. Conditions 

Winds. The summer prevailing winds are out of the south and 
southwest. However, north winds occur during the spring (April 
and May), the fall (September and October), and occasionally 
during the summer months (June, July and August). Velocities are 
generally in the range of five to fifteen miles per hour, gusting to 30 
miles per hour during the summer months. 

These local climatic conditions affect the acceleration, intensity and size of fire in 
the community. Times of little or no rainfall and high temperatures create 
extremely hazardous conditions, particularly as they relate to residential roof fires 
and wildfire conflagrations. The climatic conditions are one of the greatest impacts 
to fire behavior and other major emergency events due to their uncontrollable 
nature. 

Page2of8 

23-0015 H 29 of 46 



2022 CFC FINDINGS 

B. These amendments are justified on the basis of a local geologic and topographic 
conditions. RFPD is subject to varied terrain, slopes, increased vegetation, varied 
surface features, hazardous building operations, and terrain risk factors. 

1. Geological location 

a. Conditions 

Geological Location. Rescue is located in the foothills of the Sierra at 
an altitude range of approximately 650 feet to 1,500 feet above sea 
level. 

2. Size and population 

a. Conditions 

Size and Population. The Rf PD encompasses approximately 
twenty to thirty (20-30) square miles and has a current population 
of approximately 6,500 residents. 

3. Seismic Location 

a. Conditions 

Seismic Location. The nearest identified fault zone running 
through the District is the Bear Mountain Fault. This fault zone is 
split into several branches which transect the area between Folsom 
and Shingle Springs. The closest branch passes through the middle 
of the District along the western edge of Browns Ravine. The next 
nearest extension of this fault system is located immediately at the 
north end of the District, and extends from the southeast arm of 
Folsom Lake, north to the City of Auburn. No recent geologic activity 
has been observed along this fault. However, studies of the east 
branch of the fault zone, conducted by Woodward-Clyde Associates 
for the Auburn Dam, and by Tierra Engineering Consultants near 
Folsom Lake, indicate that the fault may be reactivating based on 
recent tectonic trends and should be considered potentially active. 

4. Topography 

a. Conditions 

Topography. The topography of the District varies from level 0% 
slope to terrain with over a 40% slope. The valley floor is relatively 
flat with gentle slopes and consists of grassland and trees. The east 
and west sides of the valley floor increase to approximately 40% 
slopes and consist of trees, brush and grass-covered range land. 
The greatest degree of slope occurs in the northern end of the District 
and extends northeast from there. Hilly terrain throughout the area 
provides gullies or areas referred to as "chimneys" which accelerate 
the spread of fire. 

Page 3 of 8 

23-0015 H 30 of 46 



2022 CFC FINDINGS 

5. Roads and streets 

a. Conditions 

Roads and Streets. The District has seen an accelerated degree of 
urban and commercial development within the last 15 years. With 
this development comes the increase of vehicular traffic and 
congestion which can have a direct effect on the response time of 
emergency apparatus. 

6. Building Clearances 

a. Conditions 

SUMMARY 

Building Clearances. As residential development continues to 
occur in the District, the clearance between homes has decreased 
which increases the ability of fire to spread from one home to another 
by both radiation and convection heat. 

The above geological and topographical conditions increase the magnitude, 
exposure, accessibility problems and fire hazards that the Department must 
handle. Fire following an earthquake has the potential of causing greater loss of 
life and damage to property than the earthquake itself. 
Other variables may tend to increase the situation: 

1. The damage that may occur to the water system, and; 
2. The extent of isolation due to roadway damage, overpass collapse and 

debris blocking the roadway. 

Page 4of8 

23-0015 H 31 of 46 



2022 CFC FINDINGS 

2022 CFC Code Ttfle Adopted 
Section 

Amended Added Deleted Finding 

101.1 General X Administrative 

102.6- 102.12 Applicability X Administrative 

104.1 Duties and Powers X Administrative 

104.3 - 104.4 Duties and Powers X Administrative 

104.6 Official Records X Administrative 

104.8 - 104.8.2 Approved Materials X Administrative 

104.9 Modifications X Administrative 

104.11- 104.12.3 Fire Investigation X Administrative 

105.2.3 Time of Application X Administrative 

105.3.2 Extensions X Administrative 

105.5 Operational Permits Administrative 

105.5.55 Automobile X Administrative 
Wrecking Yards 

105.6 Construction X Administrative 
Permits 

105.6.25 Automobile X Administrative 
Wrecking Yards 

105.6.9 Fuel Cell X Administrative 

105.6.12 Hazardous Materials X Administrative 

105.17 Plant Extraction X Administrative 

105.18 Private Fire X Administrative 
Hydrants 

105.19 Smoke Control X Administrative 

105.6.21 Special Event X Administrative 
Structure 

105.6.22 Spraying or Dipping X Administrative 

105.6.23 Standpipe Systems X Administrative 

105.6.24 Tents X Administrative 

106.1- 106.4 Construction X Administrative 
Documents 

107.1 Fees X Administrative 

107.5 Related Fees X Administrative 

107.5.1 Cost Recovery X Administrative 

107.6 Refunds X Administrative 

107.7 Administrative X Administrative 
Costs 

Section 108 Inspections X Administrative 

Section 109 Maintenance X Administrative 

111.5 Appeals X Administrative 

112.4 Violation Penalties X Administrative 

112.4. 1 Abatement of X Administrative 
Violations 

112.4.2 Citations X Administrative 

Section 113 Stop Work Order Administrative 

113.4 Failure to Comply X l Administrative 

Page5of8 

23-0015 H 32 of 46 



2022 CFC FINDINGS 

2022 CFC Code 
Section 

Td/e Adopted Amended Added Deleted Finding 

Section 114 Unsafe Structures X Administrative 
202 Definitions X Administrative 

Section 302 Definitions Administrative 
Section 303 Asphalt Kettles A1 , A2, A3,B1 , B2.B3.B4, B5, B6 

302.1 Definitions X Administrative 
Section 304 Combustible Waste X A1,A2,A3, B1,B2.B3.B4, B5,B6 
Section 305 Ignition Sources X A1 ,A2, A3, B1 , B2.B3.B4,B5, B6 
Section 306 Motion Picture X B1, B2. B3. 84, B5, 86 
Section 307 Open Burning X A1,A2,A3,81,B2.B3.B4, B5, B6 

307.4.4 Open Burning X A1 . A2, A3, B1,B2.B3.B4,B5,B6 
Section 308 Open Flames X A1 , A2, A3, B1 , B2. B3. B4, B5, B6 
Section 309 Powered Industrial X A1,A2,A3,B1, B2.B3. B4, B5,B6 

Trucks 
Section 310 Smoking X A1 , A2,A3,B1,82.83.B4,B5, B6 
Section 311 Vacant Premises X A1 , A2, A3, B1 , B2. B3. B4, B5, B6 
Section 320 3D Printing X B1, B2. B3. B4, 85, B6 
Section 321 Artificial Vegetation X A1,A2, A3,B1,B2.B3.84,B5,B6 

403.2 - 403.2.4 Group A X A1 , A2, A3,B1, 82. B3.84,B5, B6 
403.6 - 403.6.1 .4 Group F X A1,A2,A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, 86 
403.9 - 403.9.3.4 Group R X A1,A2,A3,81,82.BaB4,85, B6 

503.2.1 Dimensions X A1 , A2, A3, B1, B2.B3. B4, B5, 86 
503.2.5 Dead Ends X A1, A2,A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, 86 

503.2.6 Bridges X A1,A2,A3,B1,B2.B3.84,B5, 86 

503.3.1 No Parking - Fire X A1 , A2, A3, B1,B2. B3. B4, B5,B6 
Lanes 

503.3.2 No Parking - Fire X A1 , A2, A3, B1 , 82. B3.B4, B5, B6 
Hydrants 

503.3.3 Fire Lane Width X A1,A2,A3, B1, B2.B3.B4,85, B6 
503.6 Security Gates X A1,A2,A3,B1, B2. B3.B4, B5, 86 
505.1 Address X A1 , A2,A3. B1 ,B2.B3. B4, B5, B6 

507.5.1 Where Required - X A1,A2, A3,B1,B2.B3. B4, B5, B6 
Fire Hydrants 

509.3 Fire Control Rooms X 81, 82. 83.B4, B5,86 
807.5.2 Group E X B1,B2. B3. 84, B5, 86 
903.2 Where Required - X A1 , A2, A3,B1,82. B3.B4,85,B6 

Fire Sprinklers 
903.2.1.1 Group A X A1 , A2, A3, B1 , B2. B3. B4, 85, B6 
903.2.1.2 GroupA-2 X A1,A2, A3,B1 ,B2. B3. B4, 85, B6 
903.2.1.3 Group A-3 X A1,A2,A3.B1,B2.B3.B4,85,B6 
903.2.1.4 GroupA-4 X A1 , A2, A3, B1 , B2.B3. B4, 85, B6 
903.2.3 Group E X A1 , A2, A3,81,82. B3. B4, 85, B6 
903.2.4 Group F-1 X A1,A2,A3,B1,B2.B3. B4,85,B6 
903.2.7 Group M X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2.B3. B4,85,86 

Page 6 of 8 

23-0015 H 33 of 46 



2022 CFC FINDINGS 

2022 CFC Code Title Adopted 
Section 

Amended Added Deleted Finding 

903.2.7.2 Group M- X A1,A2,A3,B1,B2.B3.B4,B5,B6 
Mattresses 

903.2.8.5 Manufactured X A1,A2, A3, B1, B2. 83. B4,85,B6 
Homes 

903.2.9 Group S-1 X A1 , A2, A3,B1 , B2. B3. B4, B5, B6 
903.2.10 Group S-2 X A1,A2, A3, B1, B2.B3. B4, B5, B6 

903.2.10.1 Parking Garages X A1,A2,A3,81,82.B3.B4,B5,86 
903.2.22 Group B X A1, A2, A3, B1,B2. B3. 84, B5, B6 
903.2.23 Group F-2 X A1 , A2,A3, B1, B2. B3. 84, B5, B6 

903.6 Where Required - X A1,A2,A3,B1,B2.B3. 84, B5, B6 
Fire Sprinklers 

907.2 Where Required - X A1,A2,A3,81,82.B3.B4,B5,B6 
Fire Alarm Systems 

907.2.1.4 Group A X A1, A2, A3, B1 , B2. 83.B4,B5, B6 
907.2.2.3 Group B X A1 , A2, A3, 81, 82. B3.B4, 85, 86 

907.2.3.11 Group E X A1 ,A2,A3,B1,82. 83. 84,B5,B6 
907.2.4.1 Group F-1 X A1 , A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6 
907.2.5.2 Group H X A1 , A2, A3, B1 ,B2. B3. B4, B5, 86 
907.2.6.6 Group I X A1,A2,A3,B1,B2.B3.84,B5,B6 
907.2.7.2 Group M X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, 85, B6 
907.2.8.4 Group R-1 X A1 , A2, A3,B1,B2.B3. B4,B5, B6 
907.2.9.4 Group R-2, R-2.1, X A1,A2,A3,81,82.83. 84, 85,B6 

R-2.2 
907.2.10.1 Group S X A1 , A2, A3,B1 , B2.B3. 84, 85, B6 
907.2.30 Type I Hoods X B1,B2. 83. 84, B5,B6 
907.6.5 Monitoring X 81,82. B3.B4, B5,B6 

907.6.2.1 Secondary Power X A1,A2,A3, 81,B2.B3.B4,85,86 
Supply 

907.9 Where Required - X A1 , A2, A3, B1 , 82. B3. 84, B5,B6 
Fire Alarm 

Section 11 O 1 General X A1,A2, A3, 81,B2. 83. B4, B5,B6 
Section 1102 Definitions X A1,A2,A3, 81 , 82.83.B4,B5, B6 

1103.2 Responder X A1 , A2, A3, B1,B2. B3. B4, B5,B6 
Communication 

1103.5-1103.5.5 Spnnkler Systems X A1 , A2, A3, B1 , B2. B3. B4, B5,B6 
1103.7 - Fire Alarm Systems X A1,A2,A3,B1,B2.83.B4,B5,B6 

1103.7.9.10 
11 03.8 - 1103.8.5.3 Smoke Alarms X A1,A2,A3, B1 , B2. B3. B4, B5,86 
1103.9 - 11 03.9.1 Carbon Monoxide X A1 , A2, A3, B1 , B2. B3. B4, B5,86 

Alarms 
Section 11 04 Egress X B1 , B2. B3. B4, B5,B6 
Section 1106 Outdoor Operations X A1 , A2,A3,B1,82.83. B4, B5,B6 

1203.1.3 Installation X 
,, A1,A2,A3,B1,B2.B3. 84,B5,86 

3311.3 Address X I! A1 , A2, A3,B1, B2. 83. B4,B5, B6 
3313.1 When Required - X 1, A1, A2, A3, B1 , B2.B3. B4, B5, B6 

Water Supply 

Page 7 of 8 

23-0015 H 34 of 46 



2022 CFC FINDINGS 

2022 CFC Code Td/e Adopted Amended Added Deleted Finding 
Section 

5001.7 Liability for X Administrative 
Damages 

5601 .2 Permit Required X Administrative 

5704.2.9,6.1 Locations - Above X A1,A2, A3, B1 , B2. B3. B4, B5, B6 
Ground Tanks 

5706.2.4.4 Locations - Above X A1, A2, A3,81, 82. 83. B4, 85, B6 
Ground Tanks 

5806.2 Limitations X A1,A2,A3,B1,82.B3.B4,B5, B6 

6104.2 Maximum Capacity X A1,A2, A3, B1,B2.83.B4,85,86 

Chapter 80 Referenced X A1 , A2, A3, B1,82.83. B4, 85, B6 
Standards 

Appendix B Fire Flow - X A1,A2, A3, B1, 82. 83. B4, 85, B6 
Table B105.1 (1) Residential 

Appendix B Fire Flow - X A1,A2,A3, B1, 82. B3. B4,B5,B6 
Table B105.2 Commercial 

Appendix D Fire Apparatus 
Access Roads 

X A1 , A2, A3, 81, 82. 83. B4, B5, B6 

Appendix D, Access Road Width X A1,A2,A3,81, B2.B3.84,85,86 
D103.1 

Appendix D, Grade X A1 , A2, A3, B1 , 82. B3.B4,B5, B6 
D103.2 

Appendix D, Turning Radius X A1 , A2, A3,81, 82. 83.B4, B5, B6 
D103.3 

Appendix D, Gates X A1,A2,A3,B1,82.B3.B4,B5,B6 
D103.5 

Appendix D, Fire Lane Marking X A1 , A2, A3, B1,82. 83. B4, B5, B6 
D103.6.1 

Appendix D, Fire Lane Marking X A1,A2, A3, 81,B2.B3.B4, B5, B6 
D103.6.2 

Appendix D, Circumferential Fire X A1 , A2, A3, B1 , B2. B3. B4, B5, B6 
D104.4 Access 

Page8 of8 

23-0015 H 35 of 46 



EDHCWD, DSP, ECF, CPCSD, PFPD, RFPD 

F,re Code~ 
S,gmficant 

Whal Is lhe Change? 
Locally adopted / SFM adopted / 

change? Amended 
Why Is There a Local Change' 

101.1 N Amend with the name of the jurisdiction L.cx:ally adopted and amended Administrative need 

105.5 N 
Amend to indude addition of Automobile Wrecking Locally adopted and amended Administrative need due to oodition of section 105.5.55. 
Yafd operational pennit 

Alows the fire code official to enforoe the fire code (specific 

105.5.55 y Add section to require operational permit for 
Locally created and a1opted 

co fire access, vegetation clearances, hazardous materials, 

Automobile Wrecking Yards. 
e!C.). within automobHe wrecking yard operations. Tois was 
a demonstrated need experienced within the Diamond 
Springs Fire Department 

105.6 N 
Add section to require construction pennit for 

Locally created and adopted 
Adninistrative need due to oodition ol section 105.6.25 and 

Automobile Wrecking Yards. 105.6.26. 

Allows the fire code official to enforce the fire code (specific 
Add section to require construction pennit for 

105.6.25 y Locally created and adopted 
to fire access, vegetation clearances, hazardous materials, 

AUIOmObtle Wrecking Yards. e!C.) within newly constructed and/or modified automobile 
wrecking yard operations .. 

Alows the fire code official lo review and approved traffic 

105.6.26 N 
Add section to require construction pennit for the Locally created and a:lopted 

calming devices prior to insia,1ation. Fire Code currently 

installation of traffic calming devk:es 
permits the fire code official lo regulate traffic calming 
devices. However, a permit isn't cunrently required prior to 
installation causing undue hardship to 

Adopting this section to allow for the creation and issuance 

107.5 N Section Added. Previously section106.6. Locally adopted and amended 
of fees to cover actual costs. Section 105.6 defines permits, 
plan checks, and inspections as allowed in Health &Safety 
Code 17951. 

107.5.1 N Secoon ooded. Previously section 106.6.1 Locally created and adopted 
Section 107.5.1 Cost Recovery Fees: To recove, the cost to 
lhe Fire Disbict. 

107.7 y Section added. P1eviously section 106.7 Locally created and adopted 
Section 107.7 To recover the actual oostsof avoldab!e 
failed inspections by contractors. 

Section 111.5 of Chapter 1 of the Fire Code of the District is 
added to read as follows: 
111.5 Appeal Procedures and Timelines: The intent of this 
provision is to clarify the procedures and timelines for an 

111.5 y Section added. Previously section 109.4 Locally adopted and amended individual or entity Ill file an appeal to the Board of Appeals 
1e93rding an order, decision, or determination by the fire 
Code Official. Based on the County of El Dorado's 
Vegetation Management Ordinance Board of Appeals' 
timeflne. 

Previously section 110.4. Completed the section by 
ANows the Fire Code Official to enforce the Fire Code that 

112.4 N 
filfing in the blank portions that were not completed Locally adopted and amended 

p!lltects life and property. Fees have been updated to 

by the SFM. It is better left to localities to determine 
match the lees and penalties as deemed appropriate by the 

the fees/penalties for their respective areas 
District Attorney's Office. The change to the fanguage to 
include the term infractions. 

112.4.2 Citations is added lo read as follows: 112.4.2 
Citations 
Toe Fire Chief or his/her duly authorized representative(s), 

112.4.2 N Section added. Previoulsy section 110.4. Locally created and adopted 
may issue citations for infractions or misdemeanor 
violations of this code pursuant to Section 13871 of the 
Health and Safety Code of the State of California and 
Chapte, 5c (commencing with section 853.6) of Title 3 of 
Part 2 of the Penal Code of the State of California. 

Previously section 112.4. Completed the section by 

113.4 
filling in the blank portions that were not completed All violations of the code have been consolidated under 

N by the SFM. It is better left lo localities to Locally adopted and amended 
determine the fess/penalties for their respective 

Section 11 2.4 to include the penalties for violations. 

areas 

23-0015 H 36 of 46 



Added definilbns for. C&ffll)ire. DliYeway, District, 
~ llody, Fre Chief, Fie Hazlwd, Open Btlning, and 

202 N Added definbs forofalily Localy created and ~ Trained Crowd Manager. Definilion of open txlming shllll 
not Include resldnal LPG, natural gas fueled. or wood 
bllnilv.i applianoes nor ceremonial burning. 

302.1 N Added deflllition of campfire to Section LDCa.,y created and adopted Added definition for claily. 

Added a sedion for open burning resbiclions. 

W.4.4 y Language mffied froo1 camptiie to open blmng to 
Localy created rd adopted 

Due 10 lhe high file danger that exists in 8 Dorado County 

enoompass ful SQlf)e of open booing 
we have Writteo 1110111 stringent rules per1aining to open fies 

requirements. 
wilhin grass, brush, and tree OOYel8d areas. 

401.2.1 N 
Added section to require pre-fire plans for new 

Locally created and adopted 
Pro'lides the creation of a ftool' plan for !he pulJ)Ose of 

andor modified conslruclion. 
emetgency planning to be utilized by emergency response 
petSOMel. 

Fire apparatus are becoming larger and taller. A verlcal 
clearance 0115 leet prooddes proper clearance for 
aJll)aralUS 10 pass 1Jlderwf111out dafmOng apparatus 
components. It also allows iwi extended time frame before 

503.2.1 N 
Clanged Yellical clearaooes ID 15 feet and road l.ocaly adopted and 1111ended 

having to reart the growth of U1e wgelatlon Addioonal 

widlhs to 20 feet 
height for vegetation clearances acts as an incl1lased buffer 
for the spread of fire. A road v,,ida, ol 20 feet exclusive of 
shouk!ers, as measured f1!ce of c:uJb to faced. curb is 
neeced. These structures can be diflicoll to navigate with 
fire apparatus and shouk! not be counted in the total 
drivallie road surface. 

Added a specifc section for R3's when! it albws lhe 
F'ire apparatus require areas for turning alOllnd YAlen 

503.2.5 N 
Fve Code and TIiie 14 Fire Safe Regulations to 

Localy adopted rd anended 
multiple whicles are on the scene of an emergency. This 

mat:h as lhey require lumalounds for f.re appaatus 
includes fire vehicles as well as dYlial1 whicles. Prov& 

access roads and driveways 
better access for ingress/egress. Additionally, adds tum 
aroood for apparatus In drr;eways greater a,an 150'. 

Alows codes and standards for Bridges and Elevated 
Chaiged the section for Bridges and Elevated Sllfaces of 8 Dorado COunty and Appendix O of the 

503.2.6 N 
Surfaces 10 state and malc:h 8 Dorado County l.ecally adopted and amended 

c:urrenl Fire Code, whicheve( is l1lO!& reSlriclive, to be 
T ranspooalion Division in addilion to MSHTO HS. oonsistent throughout county agencies and is Mlowed as an 
17 (minimum CFC required) ali!mate ITMxllS & method ttlat is not less resllictive lhan 

the Fre Code. 

503.3.1 N 
Previously section 503,4.2. Added section reganling Locafy created and adopted 

This sedion cleaty defines the "No Palldng In Finl Lanes" 
no par1\lng in fire lane$ rules and is consislelt with lhe califomia Vehicf& Code. 

503.3.2 N 
Previoosly section 503.4.3. Added section regarding 

Localy crea1ed and adopted 
This section clearly defines the 'No Par1dng in front of fire 

no pning in front of h)'drants 
h)'drants· ruJes and ls oonslstent with the Callomia Vehicle 
Code. 

503.3.3 N 
Pre"-ously secron 503.4.4. Addad aec11on regaroing 

Localyaasted S!ld adopted 
This section cleaty def:nes California F'ire Code Appencix D 

fire lanes based on road widlh 
as Ille re1enmce for road Jana widlh and their relation to file 
lanes. 

PreW>USly section 503.5.3. Created and adopted Alows lire districts the authority to approve gales on 
503 6 to maintain emeigency access and 

503.6 N oonsistency through al ioadway gates in El Dorado Locally created and adopted 
roadways bad on lhe Oislricts gate standard, p!O',iding 

Couniy, refllrring to the gate standanls adopted Ill 
the best possable emergency acx;ess to maintain fast 

lheFPO's 
response times. 

505.1 N 
Added section pertaining to the visual addressing ol 

Locally adopted and amerdec! 
Allows fire dislricls the ~ lo apjlll)\'e addressing 

buildings based oo lhe District's add•ng standa«ls. 

Added more conservatiwl slandard for the 
Commercial propertiesare required to inslall hydrants at 

507.5.1 N placement of h)'drants and their relationship to Locally adopted and amended 
300 loot intervals. thus they shouk! never be outside ol 150 

commercial buik!'ngs 
feel from any given h)'drant at anytime (half the distance 
inbetween). 

23-0015 H 37 of 46 



Blikf,ngs are gelling mo,e sizable in the county. II is more 
oonvnon to haw new buildings wMlt soi. arrays that 
oontinue ID generate powere-;en when the buti1gs 

Added vert>ia<Je to bring all of the necessary fire 
general ulilities have been sh~ off. When there is an 

509.3 y locally aeated and adopled emecgency, it is vila1 that we trave rapid access to all of the 
oontrols for a building lo ooe localian oonlrOls In one localian for pullllc evacuation and 11refighler 

safety. Due 10 the !Ire danger present In 8 Dorado County 
throughout rnos1 of the year, 1his change is appropriate and 
advlsable. 

Emergency Responder Radio System Seocndary l.Dcally adopled and amended 
Amend to 72 hour capacity for back-up power due 10 

510.4.2.3 y 
Power Supply Modification weather and PG&E safety related power outages. 

Adds a requirement for sprinkler system installation 
l~y adopled and amended 

Administra,ve need due 10 addition of section 903.2.22 and 
903.2 N 111 new bu<ldings and structures 3,600 square feet or 903 2.23. 

greater within the d'ISlrict 

Due I:> the topographic. cfimatic. and geographic conditions 
of 8 Dorado County and their oontribuliog faclors to our 

Previously section 903.2.1. Adds a !llqllirement for increased response times, along wi1h the fact that fires 

903.2.1.1 N 
sprinkler system installation in new Group A Localy adopled and amended double In size each and every mnite. we require sprinklers 
buildings and strucrures 3,600 square feet or to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square 
grea'.er widlin the cislrict teeI in size as 1hey relle to tire behavK>r and rate of 

spread. 

Dile I:> the topographic, dimatic. and geographk: conditions 
of 8 Dorado COunty and their contributing fado,s to our 

Preoously sectlof1 903.2.1. Adds a requiremenl for increased response 6mes, along with the fact that fires 

903.2.1.2 N 
sprinkler system installation in new Group A-1 Locally adopled and amended double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers 
btaldings and siuclureS 3,600 square feet or to be installed in swctures once Ibey reach 3,600 square 
grea'.er within the district feet in size as they relate IO fire behavior and rate of 

spread, 

Due ID the 111pographlc, dimatic. and geog,aphic rondioons 
of 8 Dorado Coooty and their oontributing facilrs ID our 

Previlusly section 903.2.1. Adds a requirementfor increased response times, along witt1 the fact that fues 

903.2.1.3 N 
sprin/(ler system installalion in new Group A-2 Localy adopled and amended double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers 
buildngs and structures 3,600 square feet or to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square 
grea:er within the district feet in size as they relate 10 fire behavior and rate of 

spread. 

Due ID the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions 
of 8 Dorado Count, and !heir contributing facto,s Ill our 

Previously section 903.2.1 . Adds a requirement for inaeased response times, along with the fact that fires 

903.2.1.4 N 
sp,W<ler system instalatlon in new Group A-3 Locally adopled and amended double in size each and every mioote. we require sprinklers 
buldings and structures 3,600 square feet or 10 be installed in structures once Oley reach 3,600 square 
greater within the district feet in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of 

spread. 

Dile to the topog1aphic, climatic, and gqraphic conditions 
of 8 Dorado County and their oontributing faclors to our 

Previously section 903.2.3. Adds a requirement for inaeased "5l)Of'S8 limes, along with the factthatllres 

903.2.3 N 
spnnkler system instadation in new Group E Localy adopted and amended double In size each and every minute, we require sprinklers 
buldings and Slrucl\Jres 3,600 square feet or to be ins!atled in structures once !hey reach 3,600 square 
grea'.er wilhll the d'IS!ricl feet in size as 1hey relate to fire behavior and rate of 

spread. 

Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditlollS 
of El Dorado County and their contributing faclOrs 1D our 

Adds a requirement for sprinkler system instaltation ina&aS!ld iesponse times, ~ with the fact that fires 

90U4 N in new Gmup F buildings and svuchlles 3,600 Localy adopted and amended double in size each and eve,y minute, we require sprinklers 
square feet orgle<ilerwilhin the district ID be installed in structures once !hey reach 3,600 square 

feet in size as they relale to fue behavior and rate of 
spread. 

Due to the topographic, dimatlc, and geographk: condilions 
of El Dorado County and their contributing factors to our 

Adds a requirement for sprinkler system install.non inaeased response times, ~ wi1h the fact that rres 
903.2.7 N in new Group M buildings and slruclures 3,600 Loc:aly adopted and amended double in size each and 1/!-/ery minute, we require sprinklers 

square feet or greater within the district 10 be installed in structurvs once they reach 3,600 square 
feet in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of 
spread. 

23-0015 H 38 of 46 



Due to lhe lopographic. dinatic, and geogra~ oonditions 
Previously sedion 903.2.7. Adds a requlremenl for of El Dorado COUnly and their oonllibuling faclDrs to our 
Sf)rinklef S)'Slem installa1ion in 118:W Group M lllitll increased response times, a1o11Q with 1he fact lhat fire$ 

9ll3.U.l! N Upholstered Fumlt\ml Of Mattresses buildings and Localy adopted and amended double in size each and~ minute, we iequlre sprlnkfem 
swctures 3,600 square feet or greater within die to be instaled in structures once llley reach 3,600 squa,e 
dlsrd feet in size as they relate to fi1& behaYlo/ and rate of 

spread. 

Manufaclured Homes-The Intent of this code section is to 
ensure that manufactured homes !hat serie as a: one or two 
family dwell'ngs are C00$1stenl wllh the p,ovisiOns found In 
CRC Section 313 pertaining to built dweUings Qf a similar 

Previously section 903 2.8.2. This section was 
nature. Manufactured homes placed in the wildlan<l-urban 

903.2.8.5 N created to include manuf;r;lu$d residential single IJlcally adopted and amended 
interface ha-,e a heightened risk of rapid fire consumption 
due to 1he light-weight natura of lheir oonslruciion. The 

family R-3 in IM! residential sprinkler program. rapid fire spread throughout these swctures presents a 
sigm1Ca11t risk to their occupants. Residential sprinkler 
systems haw been Incorporated to decrease this risk 
successfu,ty in many Caliiomia communities. 

Due to the IPpogrepiil:, dlmatit, and geographic QlOdilloos 

Pre'oiously section 903.2.9. Adds a requirement for 
of El OQrado county and their contributing factors to our 
inaeased response times, along with the fact that fires 

903.2.9 N 
sprinkler system illstallafioo in new Group S locally adopted and amended double in size each and every minute. we require sprinkler.; 
buildings and strucb.ites 3,600 square feet or 

to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square 
greater Within the d"IStriet feet in size as they relale to fiie behavior and ra4e of 

spread. 

Due ID the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions 

Pre'oiously secoon 903.2. Adds a requirement for 
of El Dorado County and their oonlltbuting factors lo our 
increased response times, ~ with 1he fact that fires 

903.2.10 N 
sprinkler system installation in new Group S-2 Locally adopted and amended double in siZe each and every minute, we require sprinklers 
builongs and structures 3,600 square feet or to be installed in structures once fhey reach 3,600 square 
grea:er ..,,th.n the distrid feet in size as lley relate to fire behavior and rate of 

spread. 

Due to the IOpographic, climatic, and geographic conditions 

Pra'llously B(k)n 9@.2.1 O. Adds a requirement for 
of El OQrado County and theiroontributing factors to OLK 
inaeased response times. aking with lhe fact that fires 

903.2.10.1 N 
sprinkler system Installation in new Commerdal locally adop(ed and amended double in siZe each af1d every minute, we require spriokleli 
Pa,1ting Garage buildings and struclures 3,600 to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square 
square feet orgreaterwithin Iha district feet in size as fhey relate la fire behavior and rate of 

spread. 

Due to the topographic, clirnaoo. and geographk: cond~ioris 

Previously sec1ion 903.2.7. Adds a requirement for 
of El Dorado County and theircontnbufing factors to our 
inaeased response times, along with the fact that fires 

903.2.22 N 
sprinkler system instalatton in new Group B lo;ally adojlled and amended double in size each and every minute, we ~ire sprinkler.; 
buildings and structures 3.600 square feet or 10 be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square 
greater within the dis1rict feet in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of 

spread. 

Due to the topographic, climaoo, and geographic conditions 

Previously sec1ion 903.2. Adds a requ~ for 
of El Dorado COllnl)' and lheir contrtbuting factors to our 
inaeased response times, along wi1h the fact that fires 

903.2.23 N 
spnnkler system installation in new Group F-2 Looatly adopted and amended double in size each and ewry minute, we require sprinkler.; 
buildings and srnx:tures 3,600 square feet or to be installed in sl!Uctures onc::e they rea:h 3,600 square 
g realer within the cflSlrict feet in size as Ibey relate to fire behavior and rate of 

spread 

Prel'i:>usly section 903.28. Adds a requirement to Due 10 the topographic, dinatic. and geographic oonditions 
Install sprinkler.; fomlsting buildings that undergo of El Dorado County and their oontnbuting factors to our 
a change in use of greater hazard or an i~ase in roeased response times, along with Ille fact that fires 

903.6 y size grea-.er than 500 square feet and the resulting locally crea'.ed and adopted double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers 
square feet is greater than 3,600 square feet. to be instaled in sbuclures once they reach 3,600 square 
Pre'oiously applied ID addition of more than 30% or feet in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of 
1,000 square feet spread. 

23-0015 H 39 of 46 



Adds a requiromeot for lie alarm s)'Sleln 
907.2 N Installation in ,_ buildings and structures 3,600 L.o:aly adopCed and amended ~ris1ratll'e need due lo addi1ion of seclion 903.2.30. 

square feet or less wilhil the diStricl 

Ple'liously section 907.:za. Added occupant 
protection tor lie alarms in Group A buildings with a Provides proper emeigency notificadon for occupancies that 

907.2.1.4 N 
floor area less than 3,600, except R3, AG buildings Locally aeated and aclopled allow public uS& and ensuies Fre Oepartmel'lt notification in 
not used for oommercial purposes, and buidingS the event of a fire or smoke. 
wfth a ffoor area of less tlal 500 squani feet as 
approved by Ille fire code official 

Previ:>usly section 907.2a. Added oa:upant 
proledion for fire alanns in Group B buidfngs with a Provides proper emergency notificatiotl for occupancies that 

907.2.23 N 
floor area less than 3,600, except R3, AG buidings L.ocaly aealed and adopted alow public use and ensures F1111 Department noliticalion in 
no1 used for commetcial l)IIIJJSeS, and buildings the event of a fire or smoke. 
with a floor area of less lhan 500 square feet as 
approved by the fre code official 

Previously section 907.2a. Added occupant 
prolection for fiie alarms in Group E buildings with a Provides proper emeigency nolificalion for oocupaooes that 

907.2.3.11 N 
floor iJea less than 3,600, eig;ept R3, AG buildings l.ocaly aeated and adopted allow public use and ensures Rre Department nolificabon in 
not used for commen:ial JUl)OS8S, and buildings the event of a fire or smoke. 
w,th a floor area of less than 500 square feel as 
approved by the fire code official 

Prel'loosly section 907.2a. Added occupant 
protection for fire alarms in Group F blildngs with a Provides proper emergency nollficalion for occupancies lhal 

907.2.4.1 N 
floor area less Dian 3,600, el<cep( R3, AG buidings Localy created and adopted a:Jow public use and ensures Fire Oepa1ment notifieallon In 
not used for corrvnercial purposes, and buikf'J19S the event of a fire or smoke. 
with a floor area of less than 500 square feet as 
approved by the fire code official 

Pre1iously section 907.2a. Added ocwpant 
proledlon for fire alarms in Group H bulldings with Provides proper erne,gency nolifocallon for occupancies that 

907.2.5.2 N 
a floor area less than 3,600, except R3. AG Locally created and adopted allow public use and ensures Fire Deparlment not.flcatJon in 
buildings not used for commen:ial purposes, and lhe eve11t of a fire or smoke. 
build.igs With a floor area of less 1han 500 square 
feet as approved by the fire code official 

Pre'lioustf sectioo 907.2a. Added occupant 
proledloo forfiie alarms in Group I IMldi:lgs with a Provides proper emergency nolillcation foroocupandes that 

907.2.6.6 N 
floo< area less IM1 3,600, except R3, AG buildings Localy Cll!atsd and adopted allow pubr,c use and ensures Fwe Department notification in 
no1 used for' commercial flUIPOses, and buildings the event of a fire or smoke. 
l\ith a ffOOr area ol less than 500 square feet as 
approved by the filll COCle offidal 

Prel'loosly section 907.2a. Added occupant 
proledion for fire afanns in Group M buildings with Prowles proper emergency notification for occupancies that 

907.2.7.2 N 
a !Joor area less thlrl 3,600, except R3, AG 

Locally created and adopted allow llllblic use and ensuies Fiie Department nolifocation In 
~ not usec1 tor a)lllllleraal purposes, and the event of a file or smoke. 
buikf"ings with a floor area of less than 500 square 
feet as approved by Ille fit& em, Dffillial 

Pre-<iol!Sly sectbn 907.2a. Added occupant 
protection for fire alam,s in Group R-1 buildings Provides proper emergency notmcation for oocupancie$ that 

907.2.8.4 N 
with a floor area less than 3,600, except R3, AG 

l.ocafly aealad and adolied allow public use and 1111sures Fue Department notification in 
buidings not used for commercial purposes, and the event of a fire orsmofle. 
buidings with a floor area of less than 500 square 
feet as approved by the fire oode official 

23-0015 H 40 of 46 



Previously secllon 907.2a. Added occupant 
proledion for fire alarms in Group R-2. R-2.1, and R 
2.2 ~ with a floor.sea less than 3,600, Provides poper emeigency nolfficalion for oocupandes !hat 

!117.2.9.4 N excepl R3, AG buildings not used for ,;ommerclal Locally crealed and adop(ed alow public use and ensures Fire Deparlment ll01fficalion in 
ptXPOSes, and blildings with a floor area of less the event of a fire or smoke. 
lhan 500 squaie feet as applQV8d by the llm code 
otrlCial 

Pmiously sediol1907.2a. Added OCQJ!)3l1I 
pn:1~ for fire alarms In Group $ btildings with a Provides proper emergency notificalion for occupancies that 

907.2.10.1 N 
floor aru less than 3,600, except R3, AG buildr,gs 

Localy created and adopled allow pubic use and ensures Fire Department notification in 
not used for convnercial p(llp08eS. and buildings the event ol a fire or smoke. 
IMth a floor 8IBa of less thal 500 square feel as 
appro~ 17/ the fie code official 

Previously section 907 .2d. Added occupant Provides proper eme,gency notification for occupancies that 
907.2.30 N 

proledlon for Type 1 Hood s~ms to be Locally created and adopted albw pubic use and ellSIIRlS Fire Depa1ment notification in 
c:onnected tit a monilomd fire alarm system when the event of a fire or smoke. 
insta'1ed oneplaced 

Provides proper response and maintenance 'runner service" 
of fire alarm systems. NFPA 72 specifies required response 
limes for fire alarm trouble and supervisory signals to 

Requires fire alarm systems to be monitored by Ul 
ensure systems remain operational. A Type A Ullisted 

907.6.5 y Locally created and adopted central station meelS the NFPA required fire alarm response 
listed Type A central station. ensoong an operational fire alarm system at all times. 

ULType A lis~ng requires central stations to provide this 
·runner service" or e-0ntract with another entity to provide 
this service to obtain the listing. 

907.6.2.1 N 
Primary Seoondary Alilllll Power Supply 

locaiy created and adopted 
Amend to 72 hour capacity for back-up power due to 

Modficaboo wealher and PG&E sa'ety related power outages. 

Pre-.iously section 907.2b. Added occupant 
protediofl for existing buildings without automatic Provides proper emergency n~fication for ocx:upoocies that 

907.9 N spnnkler systems to install a fire alarm tt they add Locally created and adopted allow ~ use and ensures Are Department ooofication in 
more than 30% or 1,000 squam feet to the the event of a fire or smoke. 
struct\re, v.tlichever Is less 

This section adds a Shunt Trip power shut di devices to 
1203.1.3 N Shunt trip power safely devices Locally adopted and amended ensure emergency power shut off during the use of back-up 

power supplies. 

3311.3 N 
Previously section 3310. Address requiremenlS for 

Locally created and adopted 
Addressing forconstru~on sites Is lmpollanl to assist 

c:o~sites respond'ng emergency crew... 

3313.1 N 
Prevbusy seclion 3312.1. Water supplies at Locally adopled and amended 

Water must be on site prior to combustible material being 
c:onstruction sites with combustible matericljs on-site stored or vertical oonslrUclion commencing. 

Any damages or coslS from negligent or unlawful 
Hazaldous materials related incidents are costly to mitigate. 
If the incident is caused by negligence due to a business 

5001.7 y practX:es that cause a hazardous materials incident Locally auted and adopted 
process or practice the actual oost till be passed on to the .. iu cause a oost Je<:Overy tee negligent parties. 

Added safety protection YAth permits being issued Alows agencies that need to io-about explosives and 
5601.2 N 

by bolll the Fire Chief and Sheltffs Department for Locally adopted and amended fireworl<s to approve them and hlM a clear understancing 
elCl)losiWs. and by 1he Fire Chief and the Board of of Ille Jlppliallions of how they YAM be used. 
Supervisors for fll8'Mllts 

Established tinils as required by 1he Fw Code for Class I 

5704.2.9.6.1 N Establislled limits as set fonh in the F'ire Code Locally adop(ed and amended 
flarrmable and Class II c:ombostible liquid storage in above-
ground tanks. Requires AHJ approval and a 
SpeciaL'Coodilional lls'4 Permit from the County. 

Eslab&shed limits as ,equired by the Fire Code for Class I 

5706.2.4.4 N Establlshed ~mils as set forth in the Fire Code Locally adopted and amended 
flammable and Class II combuslible liqJlid special 
operations in above-g,ound tanks. Requires AHJ approval 
and a Special/Concitiooal Use Permit fnln lhe County. 

23-0015 H 41 of 46 



AdministratNe neall 11> add ~ name. Established limits 

5806.2 N 
Adnmistrative adcition of District name. 

as required by the FIi\! Code Official for Flammable 

Estallfished limits as Slit forth in the Fire Code 
Locally adopted and amended Cl)'ogenic tluk!s In statioray containefs. Requires AHJ 

approval and a Special/Con<itional Ulle l'ermit frol!I the 
Co111ty, 

Establishes distances between LPG storage and 
dispensaries that n direcay retaled lo safety fer residential 

6104.2 N 
Established wts fol LPG storage and dispensing Localy adopled and amended 

de,elopments and high-density hotels, molels, aplllmenls, 

near°' adjacent to resfdentlal develol)iTlent 
ek:. where a release by leak or explosion of LP-Gas would 
have a high probabiHly of injury, inhalation. Of death. 
Requ'.res AHJ lpllRlVal and a Special/Condifloal lJ$9 
Permit from the CWlty. 

Dismantled and stored vehicles present signifJCant fire loads 
(batteries. nammable and combustible liqufds, upholstery. 

Chapter 80, NFPA, 1-
N 

Provides fire access and clearance to property lines 
er:.) and risk to vegetation and adjacent propelfies. This 

22 for Automobile Wrecking Yards. 
Locany created and adopted reqoiremenl provides fire access and clearance to 

vegetation in automobile wrecking yard operations to aid in 
firefighting operations and reducoon of fire extension to 
~nt properties and/or open lands. 

Amended to include on-site sprinkler heads and wiench on-
site for emergent repairs, the inclusion of a local water ffow 
alann to create an audible alert fol the fkrN of water in the 

NFPA 130-16 of Chapter 80 of the Fore Code of !he eYentofwater activatioo in a vacant structure, and 
Chap1er 80, NFPA, y Ois1rict has been amended lo update vMOUS hydlOSlatic testing requirements to asswe proper 130 

130-16 pn)Visions pertaining to !he installation ol sprinkler 
Localy adopled and amended sprinlcler system installation decreasing the risk of water 

systems in one and two-family dwelliogs damage from pipe failure. Passive pu1ge requirements 
were also added to ensure wa1sr ciroulation through the 
system, reducing stagnant waler and bilCkftow concerns 
(EID encourages this type of system). 

Alows us to match what developers and residents are used 

Appendix B: Table 
Changed 500 GPM to 1,000 GPM in major 

to in regams to GPM fire flow requirements that have been 

B105.1(1) 
N subcf.visions below 5000 foot elevation, to match Locally adopted and ;mended 

used feroyer a decade In El)(;. Also plll'lides a minimum 

fre flow precedents used in EOC for years 
level of available water for firef,ght.ng pu,poses in the event 
of house to house, holse to vegelation, adn/or vegetatrion 
to house ignition. 

Appendix B: Table 
Estabished a mininum requirement of 1,500 GPM, Alov.-s us to ma:ch what developers and residents are used 

B105.2 
N below 5000 foot elevation, for all oommelcial LocaUy adopted and amended to In regards to GPM fire flow requirements that have been 

projects used for over a decade in EOC. 

Appendix 0: 0103.1 N Added an excel)tion for resfdentlal dnveways t.o,;a!y adopted and amended 
It is ullr$8$0nable to require a residential driveway to 
construct a 26 foot wfde space for access to a hydrant. 

rrt1e 14 ~ us to only accept up to 1'6% driveways, 
Amended to meet State law of grade$ no greater 

Appendix 0: 0103.2 N Locally adopled and amended 
any excep(ions would require aPIJIOval by the AHJ. In our El 

than16% v.ithin Wddland Urban lnteJface. Dorado Coooty TIiie 14 adoption we alow greater than 16% 
grade with AHJ approval and hard surface. 

Appendix D: 0103.3 N Added text to include cums and gutters L.ooally adopted and amended 
20 foot road widths shall not indude rurbs and gutters due 
to polential access issues and turning radius concerns. 

Appendix 0: 0103.5 N 
Requires minimum 15-ft wide gates v.'heo! installed 

Where fre apparatus access roads consist of a divided 

on fire apparabJs access rooos 
Locally adopted and amended roa,t,,ay !he gate widlh shall not be Jess than 15 feet due to 

a~tus turning radius. 

No parking on roads allowed on roadways less than 28 Feet 

Appendix O: 0103.6.1 N Road wxlths 20 to 29 feet L.ooally adopted and amended 
in width above 5000 feel Lower than 5000 feet this does 
nol apply. This section is adopted as tt stands in the Fire 
Code Appendix O section 103.6.1 for all other elevations. 

23-0015 H 42 of 46 



Plrklng on one side ooly on roads from 28 feet lo 36 feet 

Roads widlhs rrlOlll lhan 29 feet llut less lllal 36 
alowed. This is not requifed fess than 5000 feet ol 

Appendix D: 0103.6 2 N 
feet in width 

Localy adoplad and amended elevation. Lower than 5QOO feet thiS does not apjliy. Toe 
section is adopted as ltSlands in Ille Fie Code Appendix 0 
Section 103.6.2 for al olller eleYations, 

When ll!QUired by the fire oode ~ . a fire apparatus 

Appendix 0: 0104.4 N 
Added 10 require cin:umferentlal lite apparatus 

Localy ciealed and adopted 
access road shal be oonstrucled to encompass the enbre 

access roads structure and shall provide a oonlinuous means of 
emergency vehide access. 

Adopted with no Amendments 
101.1 through 101.5 N 

Adopted to esla05sh scope. intent severab1ity and Localy adopted Administrative clanty 
varidity 

102.1 Ulrough 102.12 N Relerences, subjeds not regulated by the Code Localy adopted AdministratiVe clarity 

104.1 through N Abil ty to enfon:e lhe oode locally adopted Actninistrative clarity 
104.12.3 

105.1 through 
N Time fimllalion of application Localy adopted Aan'.nistratiYe clarity 

105.6.24 

11)).1 lhrough 100.4 N 
Adopted this section for adllillstrabve clalfty and l.ccally adopted Fee schedules for pennits 
fire and Gfe sa'ety inspections 

107,1 thlough 107.6 N 
Adopted !his section for administrative darity and 

Locally adopted lnspectJon authority 
fire and life safety inspections 

Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 
MainteM'ICI! of sareguanls. lllsling and operation of 

100.1 through 109.6 N Localy adopled ~!pmen~ re-inspection and testing, recoolkeeping. 
fire and li!e sa!ety inspections supervision, rendering equipment lnoperallle, oven:rowding, 

113 N 
Adopted this section for admlnistrative clarity and Lllcally ooopted S.,p wori( Older. 
fire and ,1e safety inspections 

114.1 1hrough 114.7 N 
Adopted this section for admin-straDve danty and locally adopted Unsafe structures or eqlipment. 
lite and ~e ~ety inspections 

Asphalt kettles contain highly fl.rnmable substmees and 
require stringent sa!eguartfs. Malailing ignition SOllteS 

301 . 1 through 300.5 N Adopted this section for fire and lfe sa!ety Locally adopled through respon&ible application of standanls will reduce the 
nll!lber of fires in various settings. (Climatic, geotogic.al, 
and topographical). 

General requirements relating 10 smol<ing. 'laeant premises 
oondition and sa!ety requirements, abandoned premises, 

310.1 ttwough 311.4 II Adopted this seclion for ire and ife safely Locally adopted 
tenant spaces, safeguanfing vacant premises, security, fire 
proledJOn, fire sep8falion, mmoval or combustibles, 
removal of hazaidous materials. (Climatic, geological, and 
ropographical). 

323.1 N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally adopted 
General requirements for roads, tunnels, and bridges. 
(Cfimatic, geological, and topograpllica). 

Provides ev1K.Ualion drills for hazardous and institutional 
403.6 through 403.7.6 N Adopted this section for fire and ltte safety Locally adopted occupancies (occupancies with increased potential for lffe 

loss). 

403.9 through 403.9.4 N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally adopted 
Provides evacuation drills for hoteYmotel occupancies 
(occupancies with increased potential for ltte loss). 

405.1 through 405.10 N Adopted lhis section tor fire and life safety LocaNyadojxed 
Emergency planning and record keeping (Climatic, 
geological, and lllpographical). 

510.3 N 
Adopted this section for administrabve clarity and Locally adopted 

A permit is required for emergency responder radio systems 
fife and ltte safety inspections (Climatic, geological, and topographical). 

800.1 tlvl>ugh 806.4 N 
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and Locally adopted 

Decorative vegetation poses an increase in hazard, 
fire and lffe safety inspections llammallilty and increased risk. 

Wall coverings in group E oa:upardes (Schools) sets a 

807.1 thl0ugh 807.5.6 N 
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and l.ocalyadopted 

ma,wnum amount of 1lammabte wal coverings in 
fire and lie safely inspections educatonal facilities (Climatic, geologjcal, and 

t!lpog~. 

23-0015 H 43 of 46 



Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 
Combustible furnishing pose a significant flammability and 

808.1 through 808.5 N 
fire and life safety inspections 

Locally adopted increased lffe safety hazard in institutional and college donn 
type occupancies. 

Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 
Provides clarity on acceptance testing of automatic fire 

904.4.1 N fire and life safety Inspections 
Locally adopted extinguishing systems. (Climatic, geological, and 

topographical). 

1101.1 through 1102.1 N 
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 

Locally adopted Adminisllative clarity 
fire and me safety inspections 

Emergency Respcnder radio coverage in existing buildings. 
AH buildings will be required to allow emergency responders 
to receive and transmit emergency radio traffic to and from 
each other and the emergency dispatdl center. Time 

Adopted this sectton in existing buildings for the 
frames can be developed to come into compliance and the 

1103.2 y safety of firefighters and other emergency Locally adopted 
phasing in of a system over a period of lime, determined by 

responders 
the fire code official, is acceptable. The rationale behind this 
section is that on almost all eme111ency responder injury or 
fatality incidents communication is a key issue. This 
situation can be corrected with the addition of radio 
equipment to boost the signal in areas that do not have 
strong signal {Climatic. geological, and topcgraphical). 

Requires installation of fire spookier systems in existing 

1103.5 y Adopted this section for the safety of the public, 
Locally adopted 

occupancies with high life safety risk and in conformance 
firefighters, and other eme111ency responde/S with previous Uniform Fire Codes. (Climatic, geological, and 

topographical). 

Adopted this section for the safety of the public, 
Requires installation of carbon monoicide alarms in 

1103.9 N 
firefighters, and other emergency responders 

Locally adopted occupancies with high life safety risk. (Climatic, geological, 
alld topographical). 

1104.1 through Adopted this section for the safety of the public, 
Provides a minimum lever of safety with reganl to egress 

1104.25 
N 

firefighter.;, and other eme1gency respcnders 
Locally adopted from existing buildings housing occupancies with a high tile 

safety risk. (Climatic, geological, and topographical). 

1106.1 through Adopted this section for the safety of the public, 
Provides a minimum level of safety at tire storage yards 

1106.1.2 
N 

firefighters, and other eme111ency responders 
Locally adopted with high levels of flammable rubber material. (Climatic, 

geological, and topographical). 

Appendix D: D101.1 
N 

Adopted this section for the safety of the public, 
Locally adopted 

General requirements for fire apparatus access roads 
through D104.1 firefighters, and other emergency responders including loads (Climatic, geological, and topcgraphical). 

Appendix D: D104.2 
N 

Adopted this section for the safety of the public, 
Locally adopted 

Commercial and industrial development fire apparatus 
(excluding exception) firefighters, and other emergency responders access roads (Climatic, geological, and topcgraphical}. 

Appendix D: D104.3 
N 

Adopted this section for the safely of the public, 
Locally adopted 

Commercial and industrial development fira apparatus 
through D105.4 firefighters, and other emergency responders access roads (Climatic, geological, and topographical). 

Appendix D: D106.1 
N 

Adopted this section for the safety of the public, 
Locally adopted 

Fire apparatus access roads for multiple-family residential 
(excluding exception) firefighters, and other emergency respcndets developments (Climatic, geological, and topographical). 

Appendix D: D106.2 
N 

Adopted this section for the safety of the public, 
Locally adopted 

Fire apparatus access roads for multiple-family residential 
through D106.3 firelighters, and other emergency responders developments (Climatic, geological, and topographical). 

One- or two-dwelling residential developments shalt be 
Appendix D: D107.1 

N 
Adopted this section for the safety of the public, 

Locally adopted 
equipped throughout with two sperate and approved fire 

(excluding exceptions) firefighters, and other emergency responders apparatus access roads due to topographic, geographic and 
Climatic conditions. 

One- or two-dwelling residential developments shall be 
Appendix D: Dt07.2 

N 
Adopted this section for the safety of the public, 

Locally adopted 
equipped throughout with two sperate and approved fire 

through D108.1 firefighters, and other emergency responders apparatus access roads due to topographic, geographic and 
dimatic conditions. 

Grey cells are previously amended, adopted, or changed code sections that are being adopted again in this code cycle. 

23-0015 H 44 of 46 



White cells are newly amended, adopted, or changed code sections that differ from previous code adoptions. 

23-0015 H 45 of 46 



Approva/~n·. "eel virJ. 
Signature Date: 
Description L Code: ., 2 -w~~ --~ 

BILL TO 
RESCUE FIRE PROTECTION 

DISTRICT 
P.O. BOX201 
RESCUE, CA 95672 

1.0.# 
10996 

MD PUBLIC NOTICE 

MOUNTAIN DEMOCRAT INC 
2889 RAY LAWYER DRIVE P.O. BOX 1088 
PLACERVILLE, CA 95667 US 
(530)344-5086 
legals@mtdernocrat.net 

INVOICE 10996 

_..,,. ~;,{. ..... ~::. -~ .,, .,.., 4•1, ·"' ,_:c. ~:· :'lri ~ ·.z _:...... -rr: :~ ..: ~-. 
DUE E>Aifaia{l-9/2~~ .... ' . .-. >. 1 '',\!. ·1.1- "..:-: ,,,_:,;.-:.; 
•.;:•-:r:: .. ....,, .. '-!'..,'1.•..r:-••::"A;'..,- •w: r

0

-... _,,'.--.•.~:-~:..- .. ,.!;,::i:: . ..,,.:. 

4 26.00 104.00 
PUBLIC NOTICE OF INTENT, NOTICE OF INTENT TO ADOPT 
THE 2022 CALIFORNIA FIRE Cc;>J)E, PUB DATES 1=0/..:..17-'-'-1""'01..:..19"--/2=2a-. _______________ _ 
MD PUBLIC NOTICE 
BOLD TEXT 

PLEASE INCLUDE YOUR INVOICE NUMBER WITH YOUR 
REMITTANCE 
.. ALL PAYMENTS ARE DUE IN FULL UPON RECEIPT OF 

INVOICE•• 

10 0.30 3.00 

PAYMENT 60.00 

I'.":. f. J,o ~ $47.0Q 

m:..""i.•w~"."":-:---,-?J--.:,. r::i'\ ~! r '-. • •• ~~?1,Q., 

NG'/ O 8 . !. 

Sy: -~~~~..:;~ ..... . , .• 

MOUNTAIN DEMOCRAT INC 2889 RAY LAWYER DRIVE P.O. BOX 108B PLACERVILLE, CA 95667 (530) 344-5D86 legals@rnldemct;raLnel 

23-0015 H 46 of 46 


