RESOLUTION NO. 012-2023
OF THE BOARD OF SUPERVISORS OF THE COUNTY OF EL DORADO

{REPEALING RESOLUTION NO. 045-2020)

WHEREAS, the California Code of Regulations, Title 24, Part 9, the California Fire Code, is updated by the
State every three years; and

WHEREAS, the 2022 California Fire Code became effective on January 1, 2023; and,

WHEREAS, California Health and Safety Code Sections 17958, 17958.5, 17958.7 and 18941.5 permits a
county to make such local amendments and modifications as the county determines are reasonably
necessary because of local climatic, geological or topographical conditions; and,

WHEREAS, the California Code of regulations, Health and Safety Code, Division 12, Part 2, Chapter 1,
Article 12, Section 13146, assigns responsibility for enforcement of safety regulations to the local level
and grants authority to delegate enforcement to the chief building official, or his or her authorized
representative, or the chief of the fire protection district, or his or her representative; and,

WHEREAS, the County of El Dorado desires to delegate enforcement of the Fire Code to the chief of the
fire authority, or the chief’s authorized representative; and,

WHEREAS, the fire protection district and County have agreed to develop, implement and maintain a
memorandum of understanding that describes the roles and responsibilities pertaining to the inspection
of certain building standards found in the Fire Code; and,

WHEREAS, on October 27, 2022, The Board of Directors of the Rescue Fire Protection District adopted
Ordinance No. 2022-01, which adopted the 2022 California Fire Code with amendments the District
deemed necessary to deal with local climate, geological or topographical conditions,

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that the Board of Supervisors of the County of El Dorado ratifies
Ordinance No. 2022-01 of the Rescue Fire Protection District and delegates the enforcement of the
ordinance to the Rescue Fire Protection District Chief, or his or her representative.

These changes include amendments and additions to the California Fire Code in the following sections:

101.1, 105.5, 105.5.55, 105.6, 105.6.25, 105.6.26, 107.5, 107.5.1, 107.7, 1115, 112.4, 112.4.2,
113.4, 202, 302.1, 307.4.4, 401.2.1, 503.2.1, 503.2.5, 503.2.6, 503.3.1, 503.3.2, 503.3.3, 503.5,
505.1, 507.5.1, 509.3, 510.4.2.3, 903.2, 903.2.1.1, 903.2.1.2, 803.2.1.3,903.2.1.4, 903.2.3, 903.2.4,
903.2.7, 903.2.7.2, 903.2.8.5, 903.2.9, 903.2.10, 903.2.10.1, 903.2.22, 903.2.23, 203.6, 907.2,
907.2.1.4, 907.2.2.3, 907.2.3.11, 907.2.4.1, 907.2.5.2, 907.2.6.6, 907.2.7.2, 907.2.8.4, 907.2.9.4,

23-0015 H 1 of 46



907.2.10.1, 907.2.30, 907.6.5, 907.6.2.1, 907.9, 1203.1.3, 3311.3, 3313.1, 5001.7, 5601.2,
5704.2.9.6.1, 5706.2.4.4, 5806.2, 6104.2, Chapter 80 NFPA 1-22 Section 22.3, Chapter 80 NFPA 1-
22 Section 22.10, Chapter 80 NFPA 13D-22; Sections 4.6, 5.1.1.2, 7.6, 11.2.1.1, Appendix B: Table
B105.1(1}, Appendix B: Table B105.2, Appendix D Sections D103.1 through D103.3, Appendix D
103.5, Appendix D 103.6.1, Appendix D103.6.2, Appendix D104.4

Rescue Fire Protection District adopts the 2022 California Fire Code, Title 24, Part 9, in its entirety,
including Appendices, incorporating those sections of the International Fire Code, 2021 edition not

adopted by the state, with the exclusions listed below:

103, 309, 311.5, 311.6, 318, 403.3, 403.5, 403.8, 403.10, 403.11, 404, 406, 903.3.1.2, 904.1.1,
1103.1,1103.3-1103.4, 1103.6, 1105, Chapter 26, D104.2 {exception only), D106.1 {exception only),
D107.1 (Exceptions only}, Appendix A, Appendix G, Appendix J, Appendix K, Appendix L, Appendix
M, Appendix N, Appendix O.

Appendices not adopted can be used for reference in enforcing other sections of the 2022 California Fire
Code.

PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of Supervisors of the County of El Dorado at a regular meeting of
said BOARD, held the 3" day of January, 2023, by the following vote of said Board

Ayes: Thomas, Hidahl, Turnboo, Parlin, Laine
Attest: Noes: None
Kim Dawson Absent: None

Clerk of the Board of Supervisors

sv:'%f@%é"—*b /2 20y 2/ 7,11
Depu erk Chair, Bohrd of Supervisors

Wendy Thomas

23-0015H 2 of 46



Rescue Fire Protection District

o P.0O. Box 201 Rescue, CA 95672 « Phone: (530) 677-1868 «
Fax: (530) 677-9609
www.rescuefiredepartment.org

November 21, 2022

Don Ashton, Chief Administrative Officer
El Dorade County Board of Supervisors
330 Fair Lane

Placerville, CA 95667

Subject: Resolution Ratifying Ordinance No. 2022-01 of the Rescue Fire
Protection District, which adopts the 2022 California Fire
Code with amendments related to local climatic, geographic
and topographic conditions.

Dear Mr. Ashton:

The Rescue Fire Protection District is requesting the Board of Supervisors (BOS)
ratify its Ordinance No. 2022-01, which adopts the 2022 California Fire Code as
amended due to specific local climatic, geographic and topographic conditions.
California Health and Safety Code Section 13869.7 requires the legislative body of
the city or county where the ordinance will apply to ratify, modify or deny the
adopted ordinance. The BOS must also delegate enforcement of the ordinance to
either the Fire District (or its representative) or the Chief Building Official.

Therefore, we request the County Board of Supervisors ratify Ordinance No. 2022-
01 with amendments to the 2022 California Fire Code, and delegate the
enforcement of that Ordinance to the Rescue Fire Protection District Fire Chief. A
proposed BOS resolution is enclosed for your review and use on this topic.

This resolution has no direct fiscal impact to the County.

Sincerely,

Bryan Ransdell,

Fire Chief

ATTACHMENTS:
1. RFPD Resolution and Ordinance 2022-01

23-0015 H 3 of 46



RESCUE FIRE DEPARTMENT
ORDINANCE NO. 2022-01

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS OF THE RESCUE FIRE
DEPARTMENT AS FOLLOWS:

An ordinance of the Rescue Fire Protection District (RFPD) adopting the 2022 Edition of
the California Fire Code, incorporating the 2021 Edition of the International Fire Code, regulating
and goveming the safeguarding of life and property from fire and explosion hazards arising from
the storage, handling and use of hazardous substances, materials and devices, and from
conditions hazardous to life or property in the occupancy of buildings and premises in the Rescue
Fire Department; providing for the issuance of pemits and collection of fees therefor; Repealing
Ordinance No. 2019-01 of the RFPD and all other ordinances and parts of the ordinances in

conflict therewith,
Be it ORDAINED by the Board of Directors of the RFPD:

Section 1: FINDINGS OF FACTS
Section 2: ADQPTION OF CODE WITH EXCLUSIONS

Section 3. LOCAL AMENDMENTS
Section 4. CONFLICT
Section5: SEVERABILITY

Section 6: EFFECTIVE DATE AND PUBLICATION

SECTION 1: FINDINGS OF FACTS

The Rescue Fire Department makes certain changes (listed below) {o the California Fire
Code, 2022 Edition, pursuant to Health & Safety Code Sections 13869.7, 179568.5, 17958.7
and 78941.5 during this code adoption process. Such changes are necessary because of local
climatic, geological and/or topographical conditions. The RFPD has adopted, pursuant to
Section 18941.5 of the California Health & Safety Code, the findings of facts relative to these
conditions by Resolution #2022-10 of the RFPD dated October 12, 2022.

SECTION 2: ADOPTION OF CODE WITH EXCLUSIONS

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 1

23-0015 H 4 of 46



The RFPD adopts the 2022 California Fire Code, Tille 24, Part 9, in it entirety, including
Appendices, Incorporating those sections of the infernationaf Fire Code, 2021 edition not adopted

by the state, with the exclusions fisted below:

Exclusions: 103, 309, 311.5, 311.6, 318, 403.3, 403.5, 403.8, 403.10, 403.11, 404, 406,
903.3.1.2, 904.1.1, 1103.1, 1103.3-1103.4, 1103.8, 1105, Chapter 26, D104.2 (Exception only),
D106.1 (Exception only), D107.1 (Exceptions only), Appendix A, Appendix G, Appendix J,

Appendix K, Appendix L, Appendix M, Appendix N, Appendix O.
Appendices not adopted can be used for reference in enforcing other sections of the 2022

California Fire Code.

SECTION 3: AMENDMENTS TO THE 2022 CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE

The following Sections are hereby amended or added:

Chapter 1
SECTION 101.1 “TITLE” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 101.1 TITLE, These regulations shall be known as the Fire Code of RFPD, hereinafter
referred 1o as “this code™.

SECTION 105.5 “REQUIRED OPERATIONAL PERMITS" IS AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 105.5 Required operational permits. The fire code official is authorized to issue
operational permits for the operations set forth in Sections 105.5.2 through 105.5.525.

SECTION 105.5.55 "AUTOMOBILE WRECKING YARDS" |S ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 105.5.55 Automobile wrecking yards. An operational permit is required for the
operalion of automobile wrecking yards.

SECTION 105.6 “REQUIRED CONSTRUCTION PERMITS” IS AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 105.6 required construction permits. The fire code official is authorized to issue
construction permits for work as set forth In sections 105.6.1 through 105.6.246.

SECTION 105.6.25 “AUTOMOBILE WRECKING YARDS" IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 105.6.25 Automobile wrecking yards. Construction permils are required for the
installation of or modificalion to automobile wrecking yards.
SECTION 105.6.26 “TRAFFIC CALMING DEVICES” IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Ordinance 2022-0t Page 2

23-0015 H 5 of 46



105.6.28 Traffic calming devices. Construction permits are required for the installation or
modification of traffic calming devices.

SECTION 107.5 "PERMIT, PLAN REVIEW AND INSPECTION FEES® SHALL BE ADDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 107.5 Permit. A schedule of fees adopted by the distnct board of directors for plan
review, inspections and the issuance of permits by the district may be found in the most current
district fee schedule (Heaith & Safeiy Code 17951).

SECTION 107.5.1 “COST RECOVERY FEES” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 107.5.1 Cost Recovery Fees. Fire service fees may be charged to any person, firm,
corporation or business that through negligence, violation of the law, or as a resuif of
carelessness, is responsible for the cause of the district {o respond to the scene of an incident.
A district board may charge a fee o cover the cost of any service which the district provides
or the cost of enforcing any regulation for which the fee is charged (Health & Safety Code
13918). The fee shall not exceed the actual cost of suppressing the fire and/or responding to

the scene of an incident.
SECTION 107.7 “ADMINISTRATIVE COSTS” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 107.7 Administrative Costs. When a lest or inspection is scheduled, and the
contractor fails to perform to the satisfaction of the authority having jurisdiction (AHJ), the AHJ
may bill the contractor for actual time spent iraveling to and from the fest/inspection location
and the time spent at the test/inspection site as welf as administrative costs.

SECTION 111.5 “APPEAL PROCEDURES AND TIMELINES® SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 111.5 Appeal Procedures and Timelines. Any person or entity who believes they
may be adversely affected by an arder, decision, or determination made by the fire code official
through a written notice may appeal this matter within 15 calendar days of the postmark on the
notice. All such appeals sheall be filed jn writing with the Secretary of the Governing Board for
the district. A timely appeal shalf stay further action by the fire code official until the matter is
determined by the Appeal Board as outlined in Section 109.2, unless the issue poses an
imminent fire or life safety hazard to members of the public. The fire code official shalf nolify
the appellant by certified mail of the date and time of such hearing. The hearing shall be
scheduled to take place no sooner than 20 calendar days from the date shown on the ceriified
mail. The appeliant shait have the right to appear in person or by agent at the hearing and
present oral, written and/or photographic evidence to the Appeal Board.

SECTION 112.4 “VIOLATION PENALTIES" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 112.4 Violation Penaltles. Persons who shall violate a provision of this code or shail
fail to comply with any of the requirements therecof or who shall erect, install, alter, repair or do
work in violation of the approved construction documents or directive of the fire code official,
or of a permit or certificate used under provisions of this code, shall be guilty of a misdemeanor
or infraction, at the discretion of the prosecuting attommey or agency, punishable by a fine not
more than $700.00 for a first violation; A fine not exceeding $500.00 for a second violation of

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 3

23-0015 H 6 of 46



the same provision within one year; A fine not exceeding $1000.00 for each additional viofation
of the same provision within one year, or by imprisonment not exceeding 780 days, or both
such fine and imprisonment. Each day that a viotation confinues after due notice has been
served shall be deemed a separate offense. (Health & Safely Code Seclions 13145 and

17995).

SECTION 112.4.2 “CITATIONS” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 112.4.2 Citations. The Fire Chief, or histher duly authorized representative, may
issue citations for infractions or misdemeanor violations of this code pursuant to Section 13871
of the Health & Safefy Code of the State of California and Chapter 5¢ (commencing with
Secfion 853.6) of Title 3 of Part 2 of the Penal Code of the State of Califomia.

SECTION 113.4 "FAILURE TO COMPLY" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 113.4 Failure to Comply. Any person who shall continue any work after having been
served with a stop work order, except such work as that person is directed to perform to remove

a viglation or unsafe condition, shall be pynishable by a fine or imprisonment or both as
described in Section 112.4 {Health & Safety Code Seclions 13145 and 17935).

Chapter 2

SECTION 202 “CAMPFIRE” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

CAMPFIRE. A fire which is used for cooking, personal warmth, lighting, or aesthetic purposes.
SECTION 202 “DISTRICT" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

DISTRICT. The district and all other areas within the exterior boundaries thereof now or
hereafter established.

SECTION 202 “DRIVEWAY" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

DRIVEWAY. A vehiculer access that serves up to two (2] parcefs with no more than two {2)
residential units and any number of non-commercial or industnal buildings on each parcel.

SECTION 202 “EXECUTIVE BODY" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:
EXECUTIVE BODY. The Board of Directors of the District,
SECTION 202 “FIRE CHIEF” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

FIRE CHIEF. The Chief Executive Fire Officer of the Fire department/district serving the
Jurisdiction or a duly authorized representative.

SECTION 202 “FIRE HAZARD" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

FIRE HAZARD. Any condition, arrangement, or act which will increase, or may cause an
increase of, the hazard or menace of fire 10 a greater than customarily recognized as normaj

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 4

23-0015 H7 of 46



by-persons in the public service of preventing, suppressing or extinguishing fire; or which may
obstruct, delay, or hinder, or may become the cause of obstruction, delay or hinderance to the
prevention, suppression, or extinguishment of fire.

SECTION 202 “OPEN BURNING" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

OPEN BURNING. The burning of materials wherein products of combustion are emitted directly
into the ambient air without passing through a stack or chimney from an enclosed chamber. Open
burning does not include road flares, smudge-pots and simllar devices associated with safety or
occupational uses typically considered open flames. For the purpose of this definition, a chamber
shall be regarded as enclosed when, during the time combustion occurs, only apertures, ducts,
stacks, flues or chimneys necessary to provide combustion air and permit the escape of exhaust

gas are open.

Open burning shaft also include campfires, bonfires, portable outdoor firepiaces, ceremonial
fires, and recreational fire as defined in the Fire Code.

Exceplion:

1. UL or ASM! listed L PG or natural gas outdoor flame devices, such as gas BBQ’s or gas
fire pits that comply with the Fire Code.

2. For one-or two-family dwellings, fixed or pertable outdoor flame devices that meet the
following:
a. Devices shall comply with the Fire Code.
b. Devices shall be used per manufacturer's specifications,
¢. Minimurn 10-foot clearance from device to all fammable material and vegefation.

d No burning shall be conducted during high or extreme fire weather conditions (e.g.,
National Weather Service Red Flag Wamings).

3. Campfires on privafe lands. Where required by the fire code official, a permit shall be
issued by the fire code official.

4. Ceremonial and/or religious buming with the following safely measures:
a. Maximum 4-foot x 4-foof bum area.

b. Minimum 10-foot clearance from edge of burn area to all flammable material and
vegefation.

An approved waler supply is located within 500-feet of the burn area.
The bum area is located no less than 30-feet from adjoining property lines.
An adult is present with a shove! until the fire is extinguished.

No burning shail be conducted during high or extreme fire weather conditions (e.g.,
National Weather Service Red Flag Wamings}.

- e Ao

SECTION 202 *‘TRAINED CROWD MANAGER" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 5

23-0015 H 8 of 46



TRAINED CROWD MANAGER. Standby personnel, ustalfly a secunty guard or usher
personnel, who are trained in the proper procedure to exit people from a tent or other place of
public assemblage in an orderfy and calm fashion in the event of an emergency

Chapter 3

SECTION 302.1 “DEFINITIONS" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:
3D PRINTER.

ADDITIVE MANUFACTURING.

BONFIRE.

CAMPFIRE.

HI-BOY.

HIGH-VOLTAGE TRANSMISSION LINE.
OPEN BURNING.

PORTABLE QUTDOOR FIREPLACE.
POWERED INDUSTRIAL TRUCK.
RECREATIONAL FIRE.

SKY LATTERN.

SECTION 307.4.4 “OPEN BURNING RESTRICTIONS” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 307.4.4 Open Burning Restrictions. Open burning on all iands within the jurisdiction of
the Rescue Fire Department, including the Local Response Area (LRA), is prohibited when the
California Department of Forestry and Fire Protection (Cal Fire) issues a burn suspension in the
State Responsibility Area {SRA). This prohihition shaif be made effactive 24-hours following its

commencement in the SRA.

Open burning is also prohibited on ali lands within the jurisdiction of Rescue Fire Department at
any time the fire code official that atmospheric conditions or other local ¢circumstances make stich
fires hazardous, including factors such as high winds, low fuel moisture, fire weather, the issuance
of red flag warnings, severe threat of wildiand fire, or present risk of destruction by wifdfire to life,

wildiife, properly, or natural resources.

Chapter 4
SECTION 401.2.1 “PRE-FIRE PLANS" IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 401.2.1 Pre-fire plans. Where required by the fire code official, a pre-fire plan shall
be provided and approved by the fire code official for all new commerciat structures.

Chapter &5
SECTION 503.2.1 “DIMENSIONS” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 503.2.1 Dimensions. Fire apparatus access roads shall have an unobstructed width

of not less than 20 feet {6096 mm), exclusive of shoulders, as measured from face of curb to
face of curh, except far approved security gates in accordance with Seclion 503.6, ard an

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 6

23-0015H 9 of 46



unabstructed vertical clearance of not less than 75 fest. Driveways shall have an unabstructed
width of not less than 12 feetf wide.

SECTION 503.2.5 “DEAD ENDS" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 503.2.5 Dead Ends. Dead-end fire apparatus access roads and dnveways in excess
of 150 feet (45,720 mm) in fength shall be provided with an approved area for turning around

fire apparatus.

SECTION 503.2.6 “BRIDGES AND ELEVATED SURFACES” SHALL BE AMENDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 503.2.6 Bridges and Elevated Surfaces. Where a bridge or an elevated surface is
part of a fire apparatus access road, the bridge shall be constructed and maintained in
accordance with AASHTO HB-17, the current Ef Dorado County Transportation Division Bridge
Standard or Appendix D of the current California Fire Code, whichever is more restrictive.
Bridges and elevated surfaces shall be designed for a live load sufficient to carry the imposed
ioads of fire apparatus. Vehicle load limits shall be posted at both entrances to bridges when
required by the fire code official. Where elevated surfaces designed for emergency vehicle use
are adjacent to surfaces that are not designed for such use, approved barriers, approved signs
or both shall be installed and maintained where required by the fire ccde official.

SECTION 503.3.1 “NO PARKING IN FIRE LANES" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 503.3.1 No Parking In Fire Lanes. No person shall stop, park, or leave standing any
vehicle, whether sttended or unattended, except when necessary to avoid conilict with other
traffic or in compliance with the directions of the Fire Chief, or histher duly authorized
representative, Peace Officer or official traffic control device along the edge of any highway,
at any curb, or in any location in a publicly or privalely owned or operated off-street parking
facility, designated as a fire iane by the district with jurisdiction over the area in which the place
is located. The designation shall be indicated (1) by a sign posted immediately adjacent to,
and visible from, the designated place clearly stating in lefters not less than one inch in height
that the place is a fire lane, (2) by outlining or painting the place in red and, in contrasting color,
marking the place with the words “FIRE LANE", which are clearly visible from a vehicle, or (3)
by a red curb orred paint on the edge of the roadway upon which is clearly marked the words

‘FIRE LANE™.

SECTION 503.3.2 “NO PARKING IN FRONT OF HYDRANTS" SHALL BE ADDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 503.3.2 No Parking in Front of Hydrants. No person shall stop, park, or leave
standing any vehicle within 15 feet of a fire hydrant except as follows: (a) If the vehicle is
attended by a licensed driver who is seated in the front seat and who can immedialely move
such vehicle in case of netessily, (b) If the vehicle is owned or operated by a fire depariment
and Js clearly marked as a fire department vehicle.

SECTION 503.3.3 “‘FIRE LANES BASED ON ROAD WIDTH" SHALL BE ADDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 7

23-0015 H 10 of 46



Section 503.3.3 Fire Lanes Based on Road Width. Fire janes shall be based on road width
as required in Appendix D as amonded by the District.

SECTION 503.6 “SECURITY GATES" IS AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 503.6 Security Gates. The Installation of security gates across a fire apparatus
access road shall be approved by the fire code official and shalf comply with the District gate
standard. Where security gates are installed, they shall have an approved means of
emergency operation. The security gates and the emergency operation shall be maintained
operational at ail times, Electric gate operators, where provided, shall be listed in accordance
with UL 325. Gates intended for automatic operation shall be designed. constructed, and
installed to comply with the requirerments of ASTM F2200.

SECTION 505.1 “ADDRESS IDENTIFICATION” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 505.1 Address Identification. Addresses for new and existing buildings shall comply
with the Districi address standard as approved by fthe fire code official. The address
identification shall be fegible and placed in a position that is visible from the street or road fronting
the property. Address identification characters shall contrast with their background. Address
numbers shall be Arabic numbers or alphabetical letters. Numbers shall not be spelled out. Each
character shall be not less than 4 inches {102 mm) high with a minimum stroke width of */2 inch
(12.7 mm). Where required by the fire code official, address identification shall be provided in
additional approved locations to facifitate emergency response. access is by means of a private
road and the building cannot be viewed from the public way, a monument, pole or other sign or
means shall be used te identify the structure. Address identification shall be maintained.

SECTION 507.5.1 “"WHERE REQUIRED" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 507.5.1 Where Required. Where a porddion of the facifity or building hereafter
constructed or moved into or within the jurisdiction is more than 150 feet from a hydrant on a fire
apparatus access road, as measured by an approved route around the exterior of the facility or
building, on-site fire hydrants and mains capable of supplying the required fire flow shall be
provided where required by the fire code official.

Exceptions:
1. For Group R-3 and Group U occupancies, the distance requirement shall be 600 feet
(183 m).

SECTION 509.3 “FIRE CONTROL ROOM™ SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 509.3 Fire Control Room. Fire sprinkler nsers, fire alarm conirol panels, solar
photovoitaic power system rapid shutoff switches, and other fire detection, suppression or
simifar controi elements shall be Jocated inside a single fire confrof room for the buriding. The
fire controi room shali have minimum dimensions of five feet by seven feet in size with a fotal
usable area of nof less than 35 square feel. The room shali be located within the building on
an outside wall at a location approved by the Fire Code Official and shall be accessible from
the exterior. An extenior access door with a clear width of not less than 32 inches and height
of not less than 80 inches shall be pravided for access into the room. A durable sign shail be
affixed to the exterior of the door with the words “FIRE CONTROL ROOM" in letters not less

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 8

23-0015H 11 of 46



than 4 inches in height. A key box complying with Section 506 shall be instalied on the exterior
side of the fire conftrol room door opening.

The room must be capable of maintaining a minimum femperature of 40 degrees Fahrenheil.
A clearance of 12 inches shall be provided from the fire sprinkler risers to any adjacent walls.
This room can be a shared with other building utilities or fire protection equipment that is not
incompatible. An approved cabinet or container shall be provided to store record plans of the
fire sprinkler system and other fire protection equipment. This room shall not be used for any

other storage.
Exception: One-and two-family dwellings, manufactured homes or similar uses defined
as either a Group R-3, R3.1, or R-4 occupancy.

SECTION 510.4.2.3 “STANDBY POWER" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 510.4.2.3 Standby power. In-building, fwo-way emergency responder
communication radio coverage systems shall be provided with dedicated standby batteries or
provided with 2-hour standby batteries and connected to the facility generator power system
in accordance with Section 1203. The standby power supply shall be capable of operating the
in-building, two-way emergency responder communication coverage system at 100-percent
system capacity for a duration of not less than 72 hours.

Chapter 9
SECTION 903.2 “WHERE REQUIRED" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 903.2 Where Required. Approved automatic sprinkler systems in new buildings and
structures when construcfed or relocated within the jurisdiction shail be provided in the
locations described in Sections 903.2.1 through 903.2.12 and Sections 903.2.14 through

903.2.23.
Exception: Agricultural buildings not under a special use permit used for commercial
purposes.

SECTION $03.2.1.1 “GROUP A-1" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 903.2.1.1 Group A. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout stories
containing Group A-1 occupancies and throughout all stories from the Group A-1 cccupancy to
and including the levels of exit discharge serving that occupancy where one of the following

conditions exists:
1. The fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet.
2. The fire area has an occupant lead of 300 or more.

3. The fire area is located on a floor other than a level of exit discharge serving such
occupancies.

4. The fire area contains a multi-theater complex
SECTION 903.2.1.2 “CROUP A-2" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 903.2.1.2 Group A-2. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout
storles containing Group A-2 occupancies and throughout all stories from the Group A-2

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 9

23-0015 H 12 of 46



occupancy to and including the jevels of exit discharge serving that occupancy where one of the
following conditions exists:
1. The fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet;
2. The fire area has an occupant load of 100 or more.
3. The fire area is located on a floor other than a level of exit discharge serving such
occupancies.

4. The structure exceeds 3,600 square feet, contains more than one fire area containing a
Group A-2 occupancy, and is separated into two or mare buildings by fire walls of less than
4-hour fire-resistance rating without openings.

SECTION 803.2.1.3 "GROUP A-3" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 903.2.1.3 Group A-3. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout
stories containing Group A-3 occupancies and throughout all stories from the Group A-3
occupancy to and including the levels of exit discharge serving that occupancy where one of the
following conditions exists.

1. The fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet.
2, The fire area has an occupant load of 300 or more.

3. The fire area is located on a floor cther than a Jevel of exit discharge serving such
occupancies.

4. The structure exceeds 3,600 square feet, contains more than one fire area containing
exhibition and display rooms, and is separated into two or more buildings by fire walls of
less than 4-hour fire-resistance rating without openings.

SECTION 903.2.1.4 “GROUP A-4" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 903.2.1.4 Group A-4. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout
stories containing Group A4 occupancies and throughout all stories from the Group A-4
occupancy to and including the levels of exit discharge serving that occupancy where one of the
following conditions exists:

1. The fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet.
2. The fire area has an occupant load of 300 or more.

3. The fire area is located on a floor other than a level of exit discharge serving such
occupancies.,

SECTION 803.2.3“GROUP E" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 903.2.3 Group E. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided for Group E
cccupancies as follows:

1. Throughout all Group E fire areas greater than 3 600 square feet in area,

2. The Group E fire area is located on a floor other than a level of exit discharge serving such
cccupancies,

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 10

23-0015 H 13 of 46



Exception: In buildings where every classroom has not fewer than one exterior exit
door at ground level, an automatic sprinkler system is not required in any
area below the lowest level of exit discharge serving that area.

3. The Group E fire area has an occupant load of 300 or more.

4. In rooms or areas with special hazards such as laboratories, vocational shops and other
such areas where hazardous rnaterials in quantities not exceeding the maximum zllowable
quantily are used or stored,

5. Throughout any Group E structure greater than 3,800 square feet in area, which contains
more than ene fire area, and which is separated into twg or more buildings by fire walls of
less than 4-hour fire resistance rating without openings.

6. For public school state funded construction projects see Section 803.2.19.
7. For public school campuses, Kindergarten through 12 grade, see Section 903.2.20

SECTION 903.2.4 “GROUP F-1" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:
Section 903.2.4 Group F-1. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout all
buildings containing a Group F-1 occupancy where one of the following conditions exists:

1. A Group F-1 fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet.

2. A Group F-1 fire area is located more than three stories above grade plane.

3. The combined area of afl Group F-1 fire areas on all floors, including any mezzanines,
exceeds 3600 square feet.

SECTION 903.2.7 “"GROUP M” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 903.2.7 Group M. An automatie sprinkler system shall be provided throughout buildings
containing a Group M occupancy where one of the following canditions exists:

1. A Group M fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet.
2. A Group M fire area is located more than three stories above grade plane.

3. The combined area of all Group M fire areas on all floors, including any mezzanines,
exceeds 3,600 square feet.

5. The structure exceeds 3,600 square feet, contains more than one fire area containing a
Group M occupancy, and is separated into two or more buildings by fire wails of less than
4-hour fire resistance rating without openings.

SECTION 903.2.7.2 "GROUP M UPHOLSTERED FURNITURE OR MATTRESSES” SHALL
BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 903.2.7.2 Group M Upholstered Furniture or Mattresses. An autematic sprinkler
system shali be provided throughout a Group M fire area where the area used for the display
and sale of upholstered fumiture or matiresses exceeds 3,600 square feet.

SECTION 903.2.8.5 “MANUFACTURED HOMES” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 11

23-0015 H 14 of 46



Section 903.2.8.5 Manufactured Homes. An aufomatic fire sprinkler system shall be required
in all new manufactured homes and multi-family manufactured homes intended for use as a
one-and two-family dwelling. The design and installation of such systems shall be in
accordance wilth Caiifornia Code of Reguiations, Title 25, §4300.

Exceptions:

1. Manufactured homes located within an existing mobile home park complying with
California Health and Safety Code, Division 13, Part 2.1 or 2.3.

2. Manufactured homes that do not exceed 1,200 square feet in size and serve as an
accessory dwelfing unil, as defined in Government Code Section 658502; when the
existing primary residence on the property is not required to comply with Cakifornia
Residenfial Code Section R213.2.

3. Manufactured homes that do not exceed 320 square feet in size.
SECTION $03.2.9 “GROUP 8-1" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 903.2.9 Group S-1. An automaltic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout all
buildings containing a Group S-1 occupancy where one of the following conditions exists:

1. A Group S-1 fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet.
2. A Group S-1 fire area is located more than three stories above grade plane.

3. The combined area of all Group S-1 fire areas on all floors, including any mezzanines,
exceeds 3 600 square feet.

4. A Group S-1 fire area used for the storage of commercial motor vehicles where the fire
area exceeds 3,600 square feet,

SECTION 903.2.10 “GRCUP S-2" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 903.2.10 Group $-2. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout
buildings classified as parking garages where any of the following conditions exist:

1. Where the fire area of the enclosed parking garage, in accordance with Section 406.6 of
the California Building Code, exceeds 3,600 square feet.

2. Where the enclosed parking garage, in accordance with Section 406.6 of the California
Building Code, is located beneath other groups.

Exception: Enclosed parking garages located beneath Group R-3 occupancies.

3. Where the fire area of the open parking garage, in accordance with Section 406.5 of the
California Building Code, exceeds 3,600 square feet.

SECTION 903.2.10.1 “COMMERCIAL PARKING GARAGES" SHALL BE AMENDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 903.2.10.1 Commercial Parking Garages. An automatic sprinkler system shall be
provided throughout buildings used for storage of commercial motor vehicles where the fire area

exceeds 3,600 square feet.

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 12

23-0015 H 15 of 46



SECTION 903.2.22 “GROUP B” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 903.2.22 Group B. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout alf
buitdings containing Group B occupancies where ihe fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet.

SECTION 903.2.23 “GROUP F-2" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 903.2.23 Group F-2. An aulomatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout all
buildings containing Group F-2 occupancies where the fire area excesds 3,600 square feet,

SECTION 903.6 “WHERE REQUIRED IN EXISTING BUILDINGS AND STRUCTURES® IS
AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 903.6 Where Required In Existing Buildings and Structures. An automatic
sprinkler system shall be provided in existing buildings and structures where required in

Chapter 11 and as follows:
1. When there is a change in occupancy classification that results in an increased life safety
or fire risk, as determined by the fire code official, and the structure exceeds 3,600 square
feet, an automatic fire sprinkler system shall be installed throughout the building.

2. Inexisting buildings 3,600 square feet or greater, other than one and two-family dwelling
units, and agriculural buildings not under special use permit for commercial purposes,
where the floor area of the building or structure Is increased, such building or structure
shall be made o conform o Section 803.2.

Exception: When the building increase is less than 500 sguare feet.

3. In existing buildings 3,600 square feet or less, other than one-and two-family dwelling
units, and agricultural buildings not under special use permit for commercial purposes,
where the floor area of the building or structure is increased fo a fotal square foofage
over 3,600 square feel, such building or structure shail be made to conform to Section
903.2

Exception: When the building increase is less than 500 square feel.

SECTION 907.2. "WHERE REQUIRED - NEW BUILDINGS AND STRUCTURES” SHALL BE
AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 907.2. Where Required — New Buildings and Structures, An approved fire alarm
system installed in accordance with the provisions of this code and NFPA 72 shall be provided
in new buildings and structures in accordance with Sections 907.2.1 through 907.2.30 and
provide occupant notification in accordance with Section 807.5, unless other requirements are
provided by another section of this code.

Not fewer than one manual fire alamm box shall be provided in an approved location to initiate
a fire alarm signal for fire alam systems employing automatic fire detectors or waterflow
detection devices. Where other sections of this code allow elimination of fire alarm boxes due
to sprinklers or automatic fire alarm systems, a single fire alarm box shall be installed at a
location approved by the enforcing agency.

Exceptions:

Ordinance 202201 Page 13

23-0015 H 16 of 46



1. The manual fire alarm box Is not required for fire alarm control units systems
dedicated to elevator recall control, supervisory service and fire sprinkler
monitoring.

2. The manual fire alarm box is not required for Group R-2 occupancies unless
required by the fire code official to provide a means for fire watch persannel to
initiate an alarm during a sprinkler system, impairment event. Where provided, the
manual fire alarm box shall not be located in an area that is open to the public.

3. The manual fire alarm box is not required to be installed when approved by the fire
code official.

4. A fire alarm system is not required in one and two-family dwellings, agricultural
buifdings, and other occupancies classified as Group U not under special use
permit and/or not used for commercial purposes (e.g. retail sales, food service,
and/or special events).

5. Buildings with a fioor araa less than 500 square feet may be exempt, as determined
by the fire code official based on building construction matenal and features,

location, cccupancy fype, and distance fo exposures.
SECTION 207.2.1.4 "GROUP A UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET" SHALL BE ADDED A3
FOLLOWS:

Section 907.2.1.4 Group A Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shalf
be installed in all group A buildings with a floor area less than 3,600 square feet.

SECTION 807.2.2.3 “GROUP B UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET" SHALL BE ADDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 907.2.2.3 Group B Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shall
be installed in al group B buildings with a fiocr area less than 3,600 square feet.

SECTION 907.2.3.11 “GROUP E UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET" SHALL BE ADDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 907.2.3.11 Group E Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shall
be instalfed in alf group E buiidings with a floor area less than 3,600 square feet.

SECTION 907.2.4.1 "GROUP F UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET™ SHALL BE ADDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 907.2.4.1 Group F Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shall
be installed in afi group F buildings with a floor area less than 3,600 square feet.

SECTION ©07.2.5.2 “GROUP H UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET" SHALL BE ADDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 907.2.5.2 Group H Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shalf
be instailed in all group H buildings with a floor area less than 3,600 square feet.

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 14

23-0015H 17 of 46



SECTION 907.2.6.6 "“GROUP | UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET" SHALL BE ADDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 907.2.6.6 Group 1 Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alann system shall be
installed in ail group | buildings with a floor area less than 3,600 square feet.

SECTION 907.2.7.2 “GROUP M UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET” SHALL BE ADDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section §07.2.7.2 Group M Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shail
be installed in all group M buildings with a floor area less than 3,600 square feet.

SECTION 807.2.8.4 “GROUP R-1 UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET" SHALL BE ADDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 907.2.8.4 Group R-1 Under 2,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shall
be installed in ail group R-1 buildings with a floor area less than 3,600 square feet.

SECTION 9807.2.9.4 “GROUP R-2, R-2.1, R-2.2 UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET" SHALL BE
ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 907.2.8.4 Group R-2, R-2,1, R-2.2 Under 3,600 Square Feet. An appraved fire alarm
systern shall be instalied in all group R-2, R-2.1, R-2.2 buildings with a floor area less than

3,600 square feet.

SECTION 907.2.10.1 “GROUP & UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET” SHALL BE ADDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 907.2.10.1 Group S Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm sysfem shall
be installed in all group 8 buildings with a floor area less than 3,600 sgquare feel.

907.2.30 “TYPE | HOOD INSTALLATIONS” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

$07.2.30 “Type | Hood Installations. The roquirement of installation, or replacement, of a
Type | Hood System shail require a fire alarm/sprinkler monitoring system to be installed, or
for the hood system to be connected to an existing fire alarm/sprinkler monitonng system for

that building.
907.6.5 “MONITORING” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

907.6.5 Monitoring. Fire alarm systems required by this chapter or by the California Building
Code shall be monitored by an approved, UL certified, Type A Full Service central, proprietary
or remote station service, which gives audible and visual signals at a constantly attended
location. All sprinklered buildings shall be monitored.

Exceptions:
1. One- and two-family dwelfings (R-3 Cccupancies and other occupancies classified
as “U7).
Ordinance 2022-01 Page 15

23-0015H 18 of 46



2. Agricuttural buildings not under special use permit and/or not used for commercial
purposes (e.g., retails sales, food service, and/or special events).

SECTION 907.6.2.1 “SECONDARY POWER SUPPLY" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

SECTION 907.6.2.1 SECONDARY POWER SUPPLY. Where required by the fire code official,
in accordance with NFPA 72, the secondary power supply providing a minimum 24-hour power
capacily under quiescent load (system operating in a non-alarm condition) shall be amended

to a minimum 72-hour power capacity.

Exception: The existence of an emergency back-up power supply that meets or exceed
the requirements of Califomia Fire Code Chapter 12.

SECTION 907.9 “WHERE REQURIED IN EXISTING BUILDINGS” SHALL BE AMENDED AS
FOLLOWS:

SECTION 907.9 Where Required. An approved fire alarm system shall be provided in existing
buildings and structures where required in Chapter 11 and in existing buildings with a floor
area fess than 3,600 square feet without an approved aufomalic sprinkler system, other than
one- or two-family dwelling units, agriculfural building not under special use permit for
commercial purposes where a fire alarm detection system does not exist and the floor area of

the building or structure is increased
Excaption: When the building increase is less than 500 square feef.

Chapter 12
SECTION 1203.1.3 “INSTALLATION" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 1203.1.3 Installation. Emergency power systems and standby power systems shail
be installed in accordance with the California Building Code, the California Electrical Code,
NFPA 110 and NFPA 111. Al buildings, other than one- and two-family dwelling units, and
agriculiural buildings nof used for commercial purposes, with standby power, shall have a
shunt tip device that disconnects all power sources to the building, approved by the fire code
official. Existing installations shall be maintfained in accordance with the onginal approval.

Chapter 33
SECTION 3311.3 “PREMISE |IDENTIFICATION” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 3311.3 Premise Identification. Prior to and during construction, an approved
address sign shail be provided at each fire and emergency vehicle access road entry info the

project.
SECTION 3313.1 “WHEN REQUIRED” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:
Section 3313.1 When Required. An approved water supply for fireé protection, either

temporary or permanend, shall be instalfed and maintained in continuous cperafion as soon as
combustible building materials arrive on site, the commencement of vertical combustible

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 16

23-0015 H 19 of 46



construction and on installation of a standpipe system in buildings under construction, in
accordance with Sections 3313.2 through 3313.5.
Exception: The fire code official is authorized to reduce the fire-flow requirements for
isolated buildings or a group of buildings in rural areas or small communities where the
development of full fire-flow requirements is impractical.

Chapter 50
SECTION 5001.7 “LIABILITY FOR DAMAGES” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 5001.7 Liability for Damages. Any damages or cost resulfing from the negligence,
violation of the law, careless handfing, spill or discharge of any hazardous matedals shall
constitute debt against any such person, firm or corporation causing such spili or discharge.
This debt is coliectible by the Fire Chief, or his/her duly authorized representative, in the same
manner as in the case of an obfigation under conlract, expressed or implied.

Chapter 56
SECTICON 5601.2 “PERMIT REQUIRED” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 5601.2 Permit Required. Permits shall be required as set forth in Section 105.5 and
regulated in accordance with this section. Where fireworks permits are required, they shall be
issuad by the Fire Chief, or hismer duly authorized representative, and the El Dorado County

Board of Supervisors.

Chapter 57

SECTION 5704.298.1 “LOCATIONS WHERE ABOVE-GROUND TANKS ARE
PROHIBITED” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

SECTION 5704.2.9.6.1 Locations Where Above-Ground Tanks are Prohibited. Storage of
Class | and Class Il flammable liquids in above-ground tanks outside of buildings is prohibited
within the limits established by law as the limits of disiricts in which such storage is prohibited.
Storage of Class | and Class fi lammable liquids in above-ground tanks outside of buildings is
prohibited unless approved by the fire code official.

SECTION 5706.2.4.4 "LOCATIONS WHERE ABOVE-GROUND TANKS ARE PROHIBITED”
SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

SECTION 5706.2.4.4 Locations Where Above-Ground Tanks are Prohibited. The storage
of Class | and Class Il liquids in above-ground tanks is prohibited within the limits established
by law as the limits of districts in which such storage is prohibited. Storage of Class | and Class
Il fiquids in above-ground tanks is prohibited unless approved by the fire code official.

Chapter 58

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 17

23-0015 H 20 of 46



SECTICON 5806.2 “LIMITATIONS” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

SECTION 58086.2 Limitations. Storage of flammable cryogenic fluids in stationary containers
outside of buildings is prohibited within the limits established by law as the limits of districts in
which such storage is prohibited. Sforage of fammable cryogenic fluids in stationary containers
outside of buildings is prohibited unless approved by the fire code official.

Chapter &1

SECTION 6104.2 “MAXIMUM CAPACITY WITHIN ESTABLISHED LIMITS® SHALL BE
AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

SECTION 6104.2 Maximum Capacity within Established Limits. Within the limits
established by law restricting the storage of liquefied petroleum gas for the protection of heavily
populated or congested areas, the aggregate capacity of any one installation shail not exceed
a water capacity of 2,000 gallons. The storage of liquefied petroleum gas in excess of an
aggregate of 2,000-gallon water capacily when located at least one-haif (1/2} mile from
properly zoned or designated for residential use and at least one-half (1/2) mile from exisling
residential development with a density greater than one (1) dweiling unit per acre and at least
one-haif (1/2) mile from any hotel or motel is allowed when approved by the fire code official,
and a special/conditional use permif is issued by the Counly of Ef Dorado.

Dispensing within established limits. Within the limits established by law restricting the
dispensing of liquefied pelroleum gas for the proiection of heavily populated or congested
areas, the aggregate capacity of any one installation shall nof exceed a waler capacity of 2,000
gallons. The dispensing of liquefied peiroleum gas in excess of an aggregate of 2,000-gallon
wafer capacity when Jocated at least one-half (1/2) mile from property zoned or designated for
residential use and at least one-half (1/2) mile from any hotel or motel is alfowed when
approved by the fire code official and a specialiconditional use parmit is issued by the Caunty

of El Dorado.

Chapter 80

SECTION 80, NFPA 1-22, CHAPTER 22 “AUTOMOTIVE WRECKING YARDS' IS ADOPTED,
AMENDED SECTIONS AS FOLLOWS:

Revise Section 22.3 as follows:

22.3 Fire department access roads shall be in accordance with the California Fire Code,
Section 503 and Appendix D.

Add new Section 22.10 as follows:

22.10 Stored vehicles, boats, recreational vehicles, parts, and equipment shall not be stored
within 30 feet of adjacent property lines.

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 18

23-0015 H 21 of 46



SECTION 80, NFPA, 13D-22 — “STANDARD FOR THE INSTALLATION OF SPRINKLER
SYSTEMS IN ONE-AND TWO FAMILY DWELLINGS AND MANUFACTURED HOMES” |8
AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 903.3.1.3, 903.3.5.1.1

NFPA 13D, Amended Sections as follows:

Add new Section 4.6 as follows:
4.6 Residential fire sprinkier systems installed in all new one-and two-family dwellings shall utilize
a “Passive Purge” system design uniess otherwise approved by the fire code official.

Exception: Manufactured home instalied, fested and approved by the California
Department of Housing and Community Devefopment.

Revise Section 5.1.1.2 as follows:

5.1.1.2 A supply of at least one of each type and temperature sprinkler used within the premises
shall be maintained on the property af an approved location. Spare sprinklers shall be kept in a

mounfed and accessibie cabinoef.

Revise Section 7.6 as follows:

7.6 A local audio/visual device activated upon water flow shali be provided on all fire sprinkier
sysfems in homes at an approved location on the exterior of the dwelling.

Revise Section 11.2.1.1 as follows:

11.2.1.1 Where a fire department pumper connection is not provided, the system shall be
hydrostatically tested at a minimum pressure of 150 pounds per square inch gauge for no less
than a 30-minute duration without evidence of leakage. Such test shall be witnessed by the fire

code official.
Appendix B - Fire Flow Requirements for Buildings

TABLE B105.1(1) “REQUIRED FIRE FLOW FOR ONE- AND TWO-FAMILY DWELLINGS,
GROUP R-3, AND R-4 BUILDINGS AND TOWNHOUSES" SHALL BE AMENDED AS

FOLLOWS:

TABLE B105.1(1) REQUIRED FIRE FLOW FOR ONE- AND TWO-FAMILY DWELLINGS,
GROUP R-3, AND R-4 BUILDINGS AND TOWNHOUSES

FIRE-FLOW AUTOMATIC MINIMUM FIRE- | FLOW DURATICN
CALCULATION SPRINKLER SYSTEM FLOW (hours)
AREA (Design Standard) {gallons per
(square feet) minute)
0-3,600 No automatic sprinkler | 1,000 1
system
Ordinance 2022-61 Page 19

23-0015 H 22 of 46



3,801 andgreater | No automatic sprinkler | Value in Table [Duration in Table

system B105.1{2) B105.1(2) at the
required fire-flow
rate

MAJOR SUBDIVISIONS (5 PARCELS OR GREATER)

0 - 3,600 Section 9803.3.1.3 of the | 1,000 1
CA Fire Code or Section
3133 of the CA
Residential Code

3,601 and greater | Section 903.3.1.3 of the |1/2 wvalue of
CA Fire Code or Section | Table B105.1(2} | >

3133 of the CA |(min. 1000
Residential Code GPM)

OTHER RESIDENTIAL DEVELOPMENT

0-3,600 Section 903.3.1.3 of the | 500 7

CA Fire Code or Section
3133 of the CA
Residential Cade

3,601 and greater | Section 903.3.1.3 of the | 1/2value of Table | 1
CA Fire Code or Section | B105.1(2) (min.
3133 of the CA | 750 GPM)
Residential Code

TABLE B105.2 “REQUIRED FIRE FLOW FOR BUILDINGS OTHER THAN ONE- AND
TWO-FAMILY DWELLINGS, GROUP R-3, AND R-4 BUILDINGS AND
TOWNHOUSES” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

TABLE B105.2 REQUIRED FIRE FLOW FOR BUILDINGS OTHER THAN ONE-
AND TWO-FAMILY DWELLINGS, GROUP R-3, AND R-4 BUILDINGS AND

TOWNHOUSES
AUTOMATIC MINIMUM FIRE- FLOW DURATION
SPRINKLER SYSTEM FLOW {hours}
{Design Standard) {gallons per minute)

No automatic sprinkler |Value in Table Duration in Table B105.1(2)
system B105.1(2)
Section 903.3.1.1 of the | 25% of the value in | Durationin Table B105.1(2) at
CA Fire Code Table B105.1(2)° the reduced flow rate

b. The reduced fire flow shall not be less than 1,500 gpm

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 20

23-0015 H 23 of 46



Appendix D - Fire Apparatus Access Roads

SECTION D103.1 “ACCESS ROAD WIDTH WITH A HYDRANT" SHALL BE AMENDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section D103.1 Access Road Width with a Hydrant. Where a fire hydrant is located on a
fire apparatus access road, the minimum road width shall be 28 feet (7925 mm), exclusive of

shoulders (see Figure D103.1).
Exception: Driveways

SECTION D103.2 “GRADE" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

SECTION D103.2 Grade. Fire apparatus access roads and driveways shall not exceed 15.9%
in grade unless approved by the fire code official or by the El Dorado County amended
California Public Resource Code Tifle 14 / Design and Improvement Standards Manual.

SECTION D103.3 “TURNING RADIUS” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

SECTION D103.3 Turning Radius. The minimum turning radius shall be determined by the
fire code official; and shail not inciude curh and gutter.

SECTION D103.5 “FIRE APPARATUS ACCESS ROAD GATES” SHALL BE AMENDED AS
FOLLOWS:

SECTION D103.5 Fire Apparatus Access Rocad Gates. Gales securing the fire apparatus
access roads shall comply with all of the following criteria:

1. Where a single gate is provided, the gate width shall be not less than 20 feet (6096 mm).
Whiere a fire apparatus road consists of a divided roadway, the gale widih shall be not less

than 135 feet (3658 mm).
2. Gates shall be of the horizontal swing, horizontal slide, vertical [ift or vertical pivot type.
3. Construction of gates shall be of materials that allow manual operation by one person.

4. Gate components shall be maintained in an operative condition at all times and replaced
or repaired when defective.

5. Electric gates shall be equipped with a means of opening the gale by fire department
personnel for emergency access. Emergency opening devices shail be approved by the
fire code official.

6. Methods of locking shall be submitted for approval by the fire code official.
7. Electric gate operators, where provided, shall be listed in accordance with UL 323.

8. Gates intended for automatic operation shall be designed, constructed and installed to
comply with the requirements of ASTM F2200.

SECTION D103.6.1 "ROADS 20 TO 29 FEET IN WIDTH" SHALL BE AMENDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Qrdinance 2022-01 Page 21

23-0015 H 24 of 46



SECTION D103.6.1 Roads 20 to 29 feet in width. Fire lane signs as specified in Saction
D103.6 shall be posted on both side of fire apparatus access roads that are 20 to 29 feet wide

(6096 to 8534.4 mm).

SECTION D103.6.2 “ROADS MORE THAN 29 FEET IN WIDTH" SHALL BE AMENDED AS
FOLLOWS:

SECTION D103.56.2 Roads more than 29 feet in Width. Fire lane signs as specified in Section
D103.6 shall be posted on one side of fire apparatus access roads more than 29 feet wide
(8534.4 mm) and less than 36 feet wide (70972.8 mm).

SECTION D104.4 “CIRCUMFERENTIAL FIRE APPARATUS ACCESS ROADS” SHALL BE
ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

SECTION D104.4 Circumferential Fire Apparatus Access Roads. When required by the
fire code official, a fire apparatus access road shafl be constructed fo encompass the entirely
of a structure and shall provide a continuous means of emergency vehicle access.

SECTION 4: CONFLICT
That Ordinance No. 2018-01 of the RFFD, and all other ordinances or parts of ordinances

herewith are hereby repealed.

SECTION 5: SEVERABILITY
If any Ordinance, article, subsection or subdivision thereof, provision, sentence, clause or

phrase of this code, or any application thereof, is for any reason held to be invalid by a court
of competent jurisdiction, such decision shall not affect the remaining provisions of this code,
which can be given effect without the invalid portions and, therefore, such invalid portions are
declared to be severable. The RFPD hereby dec¢lares that it would have enacled this Ordinance
and each of its articles, sections, subsections, or subdivisions thereof, provisions, sentences,
clauses or phrases irrespective of the fact that one or more of them is declared invalid.

SECTION 6: EFFECTIVE DATE AND PUBLICAT{ON

This Ordinance shall take effect thirty (30) days after its adoption. RFPD Board Secretary is
directed to publish this ordinance in a newspaper of general circulation in the Bistrict. In lieu
of publication of the full text of the ordinance, a summary of the ordinance may be published
by the by the Board Secretary within fifteen (15) days after its passage and a certified copy
shall be posted in the office of the RFPD pursuant to Governmeni Code Section 36933(c) (1},

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 22

23-0015 H 25 of 46



The above Ordinance was introduced at a meeting of the Board of Directors of the RFPD on
Sepiember 14, 2022, and it was then read for the first time. A publiic hearing was set for the
Qrdinance to be read for the second time on October 12, 2022 and approved by the following

vote:

PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of Directors of the Rescue Fire Department this,

23 day ot OCTOEENL 2022.

AYES: 5
NOES:

ABSENT:
ABSTAIN:

e

XXXX, Board President

ATTEST:

Mg~

Aja Mercado, Board Secretary

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 23

23-0015 H 26 of 46



The above Ordinance was introduced at a meeting of the Board of Directors of the RFPD on
Saptember 14, 2022, and it was then read for the first time. A public hearing was set for the
Ordinance to be read for the second time on October 12, 2022 and approved by the following

vote:

PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of Directors of the Rescue Fire Department this,

27 day of OCTORELE 2022,

AYES: 6
NOES:

ABSENT:
ABSTAIN:

e~

200X, Board President

ATTEST:

Agpg~—

Aja Mercado, Board Secretary

Ordinance 2022.01

Page 23

23-0015 H 27 of 46



SECTION 2: FINDINGS OF FACTS

In connection with the amendments enacted by Section 2 and 3 relating to the California
Fire Code and its appendix, 2022 edition, the Rescue Fire Protection District (RFPD)
makes the following findings pursuant to Heaith and Safety Code Section 17958.5,
17958.7 and 18941.5. The changes are reasonably necessary because of local climatic,
topographical or geological conditions.

RFPD hereby adopts pursuant to Section 18941.5 of the California Health and
Safety Code, the following findings of fact:

(a) Under this adopting ordinance, specific amendments have been
established which are of a more restrictive nature than those adopted by the State of
California (State Buildings Standards Code, State Housing & Community Development
Codes) commonly referred to as Title 24 & Title 25 of the California Code of Regulations.
These amendments to the California Fire Code 2022 edition, have been recognized by
the RFPD to address the fire problems, concerns and future direction by which RFPD can
establish and maintain an environment which will afford a level of fire and life safety to all
who live and work within its boundary.

(b) The International Code Council has assumed responsibility for the
International Fire Code and International Fire Code Standards. The International Code
Council provided a means for participation by all code enforcement officials from
throughout the country as well as industry representatives, consuitants, and other private
parties with an interest in the International Fire Code.

(¢}  The International Fire Code, being the 2021 edition thereof, published by
the International Code Council is a nationally recognized compilation of proposed rules,
regulations and standards of said Association.

(d)  Said International Fire Code has been printed and published as a Code in
book form within the meaning of Section 50022.1 of the Government Code of the State

of California.

(e)  Under the provisions of Section 18941.5 of the Health and Safety Code,
local amendments are based on climatic, topographical and geological conditions. The
findings of fact contained herein address each of these sifuations and present the local
situation, which either singularly or in combination, caused the aforementioned
amendments to be adopted.

23-0015 H 28 of 46



2022 CFC FINDINGS

LOCAL CONDITIONS

A. These amendments are justified on the basis of a local climatic condition. RFPD is
subject to precipitation, relative humidity, temperature extremes, and high velocity

winds.
1. Precipitation & relative humidity
a. Conditions

Precipitation. Average annual precipitation ranges from approximately
25 to 32 inches per year. Approximately 88% of the average rainfall
occurs during the months of November through April and 12% from May
through October. This area has experienced major droughts in the last
two decades; 1986 -1991, 1998 — 2003, 2007 - 2009, and 2011 - 2015.
It is possible that more droughts will occur in the future based on the

weather cycle pattern.

Relative Humidity. During the summer months (May through
September), the daily humidity generally ranges around 20% and
occasionally drops to the low teens.

2. Temperature
a. Conditions

Temperatures. During the summer months (May through
September), the daily temperatures commonly exceed 90 degrees
Fahrenheit, with temperatures having been recorded as high as

115 degrees.

3. Winds
a. Conditions

Winds. The summer prevailing winds are out of the south and
southwest. However, north winds occur during the spring (April
and May), the fall (September and October), and occasionally
during the summer months (June, July and August). Velocities are
generally in the range of five to fifteen miles per hour, gusting to 30
miles per hour during the summer months.

SUMMARY

These local climatic conditions affect the acceleration, intensity and size of fire in
the community. Times of little or no rainfall and high temperatures create
extremely hazardous conditions, particularly as they relate to residential roof fires
and wildfire conflagrations. The climatic conditions are one of the greatest impacts
to fire behavior and other major emergency events due to their unconirollable

nature.

Page20of 8

23-0015 H 29 of 46



2022 CFC FINDINGS

B. These amendments are justified on the basis of a local geologic and topographic
conditions. RFPD is subject to varied terrain, slopes, increased vegetation, varied
surface features, hazardous building operations, and terrain risk factors.

1. Geological location
a. Conditions

Geological Location. Rescue is located in the foothills of the Sierra at
an altitude range of approximately 650 feet to 1,500 feet above sea
level.

2. Size and population
a. Conditions

Size and Population. The RFPD encompasses approximately
twenty to thirty (20-30) square miles and has a current population
of approximately 6,500 residents.

3. Seismic Location
a. Conditions

Seismic Location. The nearest identified fault zone running
through the District is the Bear Mountain Fault. This fault zone is
split into several branches which transect the area between Folsom
and Shingle Springs. The closest branch passes through the middle
of the District along the western edge of Browns Ravine. The next
nearest extension of this fault system is located immediately at the
north end of the District, and extends from the southeast arm of
Folsom Lake, north to the City of Auburn. No recent geologic activity
has been observed along this fault. However, studies of the east
branch of the fault zone, conducted by Woodward-Clyde Associates
for the Auburn Dam, and by Tierra Engineering Consultants near
Folsom Lake, indicate that the fault may be reactivating based on
recent tectonic trends and should be considered potentially active.

4. Topography
a. Conditions

Topography. The topography of the District varies from level 0%
slope to terrain with over a 40% slope. The valley floor is relatively
flat with gentle slopes and consists of grassland and trees. The east
and west sides of the valley floor increase to approximately 40%
slopes and consist of trees, brush and grass-covered range land.
The greatest degree of slope occurs in the northern end of the District
and extends northeast from there. Hilly terrain throughout the area
provides gullies or areas referred to as “chimneys” which accelerate
the spread of fire.

Page 3of 8

23-0015 H 30 of 46



2022 CFC FINDINGS

5. Roads and streets
a. Conditions

Roads and Streets. The District has seen an accelerated degree of
urban and commercial development within the last 15 years. With
this development comes the increase of vehicular traffic and
congestion which can have a direct effect on the response time of
emergency apparatus.

6. Building Clearances
a. Conditions

Building Clearances. As residential development continues to
occur in the District, the clearance between homes has decreased
which increases the ability of fire to spread from one home to another
by both radiation and convection heat.

SUMMARY

The above geological and topographical conditions increase the magnitude,
exposure, accessibility problems and fire hazards that the Department must
handle. Fire following an earthquake has the potential of causing greater loss of
life and damage to property than the earthquake itself.

Other variables may tend to increase the situation:

1. The damage that may occur to the water system, and;
2. The extent of isolation due to roadway damage, overpass collapse and

debris blocking the roadway.

Page 4 of 8

23-0015 H 31 of 46



2022 CFC FINDINGS

2022 CFC Code Title Adopted| Amended | Added | Deleted Finding
Section
101.1 General X Administrative
102.6-102.12 Applicability X Administrative
104.1 Duties and Powers X Administrative
104.3—104.4 Duties and Powers X Administrative
104.6 Cfficial Records X Administrative
104.8—104.8.2 Approved Materials X Administrative
104.9 Modifications X Administrative
104.11—104.12.3 Fire Investigation X Administrative
105.2.3 Time of Application X Administrative
105.3.2 Extensions X Administrative
105.5 Operational Permits Administrative
105.5.55 Automobile X Administrative
Wrecking Yards
105.6 Construction X Administrative
Permits
105.6.25 Automobile X Administrative
Wrecking Yards
105.6.9 Fuel Cell X Adminisirative
105.6.12 Hazardous Materials X Administrative
105.17 Plant Extraction X Administrative
105.18 Private Fire X Administrative
Hydrants
105.19 Smoke Control X Administrative
105.6.21 Special Event X Administrative
Structure
105.6.22 Spraying or Dipping X Administrative
105.6.23 Standpipe Systems X Administrative
105.6.24 Tents X Administrative
106.1— 106.4 Construction X Administrative
Documents
107.1 Fees X Administrative
107.5 Related Fees X Administrative
107.5.1 Cost Recovery X Administrative
107.6 Refunds X Administrative
107.7 Administrative X Administrative
Costs
Section 108 Inspections X Administrative
Section 109 Maintenance X Administrative
111.5 Appeals X Administrative
112.4 Violation Penalties X Administrative
112.4.1 Abatement of X Administrative
Violations
112.4.2 Citations X Administrative
Section 113 Stop Work Order Administrative
113.4 Failure to Comply X Administrative

Page Sof 8

23-0015 H 32 of 46




2022 CFC FINDINGS

2022 CFC Code Title Adopted| Amended | Added | Deleted Finding
Section
Section 114 Unsafe Structures X Administrative
202 Definitions X Administrative
Section 302 Definitions Administrative
Section 303 Asphalt Kettles A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
302.1 Definitions X Administrative
Section 304 Combustible Waste X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2 B3. B4, B5, B6
Section 305 Ignition Sources X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B8
Section 306 Motion Picture X B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
Section 307 Open Burning X A1, A2, A3, B1, BZ. B3. B4, B5, B6
307.44 Open Bumning X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
Section 308 Open Flames X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
Section 309 PWer;.*d Ir;(dustrial X A1l A2 A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
rucks
Section 310 Smoking A A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
Section 311 Vacant Premises X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
Section 320 3D Printing X B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
Section 321 Artificial Vegetation X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2, B3. B4, B5, B6
403.2 -403.2.4 Group A X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
403.6 - 403.6.1.4 Group F X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2, B3. B4, B5, B6
403.9-403.9.34 Group R % A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
503.2.1 Dimensions X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
503.2.5 Dead Ends X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
503.2.6 Bridges X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, BS, B6
503.3.1 No Parking — Fire X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
Lanes
503.3.2 No Parking — Fire X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
Hydrants
503.3.3 Fire Lane Width X A1, A2 A3 B1, B2. B3. B4, BE, B6
5036 Security Gates X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
505.1 Address X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
507.5.1 Where Required — X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
Fire Hydrants
509.3 Fire Control Rooms X B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
807.5.2 Group E X B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
903.2 Where Required — X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, BS
Fire Sprinklers
903.21.1 Group A X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
903.2.1.2 Group A-2 X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
903.2.1.3 Group A-3 X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2, B3. B4, B5, B6
903.2.1.4 Group A-4 X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
903.2.3 Group E X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
903.2.4 Group F-1 X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
903.2.7 Group M X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B, BS

Page 60of 8

23-0015 H 33 of 46




2022 CFC FINDINGS

2022 CFC Code Title Adopted| Amended | Added | Deleted Finding
Section
903.2,7.2 Group M - X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, BS
Mattresses
903.2.8.5 Manufactured X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
Homes
903.2.9 Group S-1 X A1, A2 A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, BS, B6
803.2.10 Group S-2 X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
903.2.10.1 Parking Garages X A1, A2 A3 B1, B2 B3. B4, B5, B6
903.2.22 Group B X A1, A2 A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
803.2.23 Group F-2 X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
903.6 Where Required — X A1l A2 A3, B1,B2. B3.B4, B5, B6
Fire Sprinklers
907.2 Where Required — X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
Fire Alarm Systems
907.2.1.4 Group A X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
907.2.2.3 Group B X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
907.2.3.11 Group E X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2 B3. B4, BS, B
907.2.4.1 Group F-1 X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
907.2.5.2 Group H X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, BS, BS
907.2.6.6 Group | X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
907.2.7.2 Group M X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
907.2.84 Group R-1 X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
907.2.9.4 Groupl_?-zzéR-zj, X A1, A2 A3 B1, B2.B3. B4, B5, B8
907.2.10.1 Group S X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
907.2.30 Type | Hoods X B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
807.6.5 Monitoring X B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
907.6.2.1 Secondary Power X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
Supply
907.9 Where Required — X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
Fire Alarm
Section 1101 General X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
Section 1102 Definitions X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B&
1103.2 Responder X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
Communication
1103.5-1103.5.5 Sprinkler Systems X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
1103.7 — Fire Alarm Systems X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B&
1103.7.9.10
1103.8 -1103.8.5.3 Smoke Alarms X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
1103.9 -1103.9.1 Carbon Monoxide X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
Alarms
Section 1104 Egress X B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
Section 1106 Qutdoor Operations X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5,B6
1203.1.3 Installation X A1, A2, A3 B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, BS
33113 Address X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, Eg, B6
3313.1 When Required — X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2, B3. B4, B5, B6
Water Supply

Page 7of 8

23-0015 H 34 of 46




2022 CFC FINDINGS

2022 CFC Code Title Adopted| Amended | Added | Deleted Finding
Section
5001.7 Liability for X Administrative
Damages
5601.2 Permit Required X Administrative
5704.2.9.6.1 Locations — Above X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
Ground Tanks
5706.2.4.4 Locations — Above X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
Ground Tanks
5806.2 Limitations X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2 B3. B4, B5, B6
6104.2 Maximum Capacity X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
Chapter 80 Referenced X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
Standards ) -
Appendix B Fire Flow - X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
Table B105.1 (1) Residential
Appendix B Fire Flow - X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
Table B105.2 Commercial
Appendix D Fire Apparatus X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, BS5, B6
Access Roads
Appendix D, Access Road Width X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, BG
D103.1
Appendix D, Grade X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
D103.2
Appendix D, Turning Radius X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
D103.3
Appendix D, Gates X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5,B5
D103.5
Appendix D, Fire Lane Marking X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
D103.6.1
Appendix D, Fire Lane Marking X A1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3, B4, B5, BS
D103.6.2
Appendix D, Circumferential Fire X A1, A2 A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
D104.4 Access
Page 8 of 8

23-0015 H 35 of 46



EDHCWD, DSP, ECF, CPCSD, PFPD, RFPD

Fire Code # S;i:‘:;:;“ What Is the Change? Locally adozt:: ;dsei!M adopted | Why Is There a Local Change?
Amend with the name of the jurisdiction Locally adopled and amended Administrative need
1055 M ?'Z:n:pt;:‘ui:::r:niﬁon op ARl Wrecking Locally adopted and amended Administrative need due to addition of section 105.5.55.
Alows the fire code official to enforce the fire code (specific
; 3 3 . 1o fire access, vegelation clearances, hazardous materials,
105.5.55 Y 23;%?;‘@:‘};:’6\?&3“"” gt Locally created and adopted  |etc). within automabile wrecking yard operations. This was
! 9 g a demonstrated need experienced within the Diamond
Springs Fire Departrmant.
Add section 1o require construction permit for Administrative need due to addition of section 105.6.25 and
135 N |automonile Wresiing Yards. Losayprestedand o] Bipegop,
Alows the fire code official to enforce the fire code (specific
Add section to require construction permit for to fire access, vegetation clearances, hazardous materials,
L L4 Automobile Wrecking Yards. becali o and oo efc.) within newly constructed and/or modified automobile
wrecking yard operations..
Allows the fire code official to review and approved traffic
; x : ; calming devices prior to installation, Fire Code cumently
1056.26 N :g?;:f;inoﬁ:;::ﬁn: ir:‘strzglg;:emzi Torife Localiy created and adopted permits the fire code official to regulate traffic calming
gy = g devices. However, & permit fsn't cumently required prior fo
installation causing undue hardship fo
Adopting this section to allow for the creation and issuance
. . of fees to cover actual costs. Section 105.8 defines permits,
107.5 N Section Added. Previously section106.6. Locally adepted and amended olan checks, and inspections as allowed n Health &S ety
Code 17951,
1075.1 N |Secton added. Previously section 108.6.1 T o .
the Fire District.
; ; Section 107.7 To recover the actual costs of avoidable
107.7 Y Section added. Previously section 106.7 Locaily created and adopted falled inspectians by conractors.
Section 111.5 of Chapter 1 of the Fire Code of the Districtis
added to read as follaws:
111.5 Appeal Procedures and Timelines: The intent of this
provision is fo clarify the procedures and timelines for an
1115 Y Section added. Previously section 108.4 Locally adopted and amended individual or entity to file an appeal 1o the Board of Appeals
regarding an order, decision, or determination by the Fire
Code Official. Based on the County of Bl Dorado’s
\Vegetation Management Ordinance Soard of Appeals”
timeline
! ) Abows the Fire Cede Official to enforce the Fire Code that
Previously section 110.4. Completed the section by >
filling in the blank portions that were not completed protacts Me drd property. F i iog! updatgd t
1124 N by the SEM. It is befier left to localities fo determin Locally adepted and amended malch the fees and penalties as deemed apprepriate by the
B e e Ry TG BN ; At ATTGH S Dnfl This B O g Be0
P pec inciude the term infractions.
112.4.2 Citations is added to read as foilows: 112.4.2
Citations
The Fire Chied or hisiher duly autherized representative(s),
. : may issue citations for infractions or misdemeancr
11242 N Section added. Previoulsy section 110.4, Locally created and adopted violations of tis code pursuant o Section 13871 of the
Health and Safety Code of the State of Califomia and
Chapter 5¢ (commencing with section 853.6) of Title 3 of
Part 2 of the Penal Code of the State of Califomia,
Previously section 112.4. Completed the section by
filling in the blank pertions that weze not complated — .
1134 N [bythe SEM. Itis betier left o localities to ciliadandanedeq T Aokborklaf S e e bsor EvRblated Uiy
determine the fessipenalties for their respective Section 112.4 to include the penalties for violations.
arees

23-0015 H 36 of 46




Added definitions for. Gampfire, Driveway, District,
Executive Body, Fire Chief, Fire Hazard, Open Buming. and
Trained Crowd Manager. Definiion of open buming stz

202 Added definitions for clarify Lasally created and adopted
ot fclude reskiential LPG, natural gas fusled, or woad
burning appliances nor ceremonial buming.
302.1 Added definition of campfire to Section Locally created and adopled Added definition for clarity.
‘”’""";m.ﬁ‘ hﬁ;ﬁg“gm'““m’“mé‘;m . Due to the high fire danger that exsts in £1 Dorado County
0744 | ull sc008 of open buri Locally created and adopted we have written more siringent rules pertaining to epen fires
b pa.glope na within grass, hnush, and tree covered areas.
requirements.
H 2 Provides the creation of a floor plan for the puipose of
Added saction to require pre-fire plans for new s, =
401.2.1 andor modified construction. Locally created and adopied emergi':y planning fo be utilized by emergency response
Fire apparatus are becoming larger and talfer. A vatiical
clearance of 15 feei provides proper clearance for
apparatus to pass under without damaging apparatus
components. [t also alows an extended time frame before
; Ihaving 1o recut the growth of the vegetation. Additional
503.2.1 i:amsgmadgmfxl chimnces L MetLare fod Locefly adopted and amended height for vegetation clearances acts as an increased buffer
for the spread of fire. A road width of 20 feet exclusive of
shoulders, as measured face of curb o face of curb is
needed. These structures can be difficult to navigate with
|fire apparatus and should nef be counted in the total
drivable road surface,
: : o Fire apparatus require areas for uming around when
;ﬂ?ﬂ:ﬁﬁm& 10 Figf‘ﬁz::: R‘”:;J;goa;f;s e multiple vehicies are on the scene of an amergency. This
503.2.5 , Locally adopled and amended includes fire vehicles as well as civitian vehicles. Provides
WA s ey [bouins MiiTsaiods 101 M oSN better accass for ingrassfegress. Addifionally, adds fum
(U SR around for apparatus in driveways greater than 150,
Allows codes and standands for Bridgas and Elevaled
Changed the section for Bridges and Elevated Surfaces of E! Dorado County and Appendix D of the
Surfaces to state and maich El Dorado County cumrent Fire Code, whichever is more restrictive, to be
ke Transportaton Division in addlion to AASHTO Hp- | Localy adopted and amended | ic.o1+ throughout county agencies and s allowed a6 an
17 (minimum CFC required) altemate means & method that fs not less resirictive than
the Fire Gode.
Previously section 503.4.2. Added section regarding This section clearty defines the "Mo Parking in Fire Lanes”
HHal o parking in fire lanes Locally created and adopted | ¢ ot consistant with the Califomia Vehicle Code.
. . . . This section clearly defines the "No Parking in front of fire
Previously section 503.4.3, Added ssction regarding 8} y ik
503.3.2 o pirking in front of Aydrans Locally creafed and adopled giznts 1ules and Is consistent with the California Vehicle
: : ; This section clearly defines California Fire Code Appendix D
50333 Previously section 503,44, Added secion 1808909 | g crester ar aopted. [ the reference for road lane widih and their relation to s
fire lanes based on road wiifh i
;;‘?ﬁg;f::eﬁ'ia' Cr:;ﬂia{::domed Alows fice disiricts e authorily to approve gates on
: oy ; roadiays based on the District’s gale standard, provkding
5036 consistency through all roadway gates in Ei Dorado Locally created and adopted e et DiEl A e T i Bk
County, referring to the gate standards adopted by e et
the FPO's bt
Added section pertaining to the visual stkdrossing of Aliows fire districts the authority to approve addressing
#hi buidings Locally adopted and amendetd |y o the Disirict's addressing siardasds.
! Commercial properties ar keguired to install hydrants at
ey tre e s““?’a"" f(.’r the' 300 foot intervals, thus they should never be outside of 150
507.5.1 placement of hydrants and their relationship to Locally adogled and amended feet from any given hydrant af anytime (half the distanca

commercial buildings

inbetween).

23-0015 H 37 of 46




Added verbiage to bring all of the necessary fire
controls for a building ko one location

Locally created and adopted

Buildings are getting more sizable in Ehe county. [tis more
common ta have new buildings with solar arrays that
continue o generate gowereven when the buildings
general ulilities have been shut off. When there is an

lemergency, it is vital that we have rapid access o 2ll of the

controls in one focation for public evacuation and firefighter
safety, Dua to the firs danger present in Et Dorado County
throughout most of the year, this change is appropriate and
advisable.

5104.2.3

Emergency Responder Radio System Secondary
Power Supply Modification

Locally adopéed and amended

Amend to 72 hour capacity for back-up power due 10
wealher and PG&E safety related power outages.

9032

Adds a requirement for sprinkler system installation
in new buildings and skructures 3,600 square feel or
greater within the district

Logally adopted and amended

Administrative need due %o addition of section 903.2.22 and
903.2.23.

803211

Previously section 903,21, Adds a requirement for
sprinkler system installation in niew Group A
buidings and structures 3,600 square feetor
greater within the district

Locally adopted and amended

Due 1o the topographic, diimatic, and geographic conditions
of El Dorado County and their contributing factors fo our
increased response times, along with the fact that fires
double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklars
1o be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square
feet in size as they relate o fiee behavior ard rate of

spread.

903212

Praviously section 903.2.1, Adds a requirement for
sprinkler system installation in new Group A-1
buildings and struciures 3,500 square feet or
greater within the districi

Locally adopted and amended

Due fo the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions
of El Dorado County and their contribaing factors fo our
increased response Simes, long with the fact that fires
double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers
to be installed in struchures once they reach 3,600 square
feet in size as they relate o fire behavior and rate of
spread.

$3.213

Previously section 903.2.1. Adds a requirement for
sprinkler systern installation in new Group A-2
buildings and stnactures 3,600 square feet or
greater within the district

Locally adepied and amended

Due fo the topographic, climatic, and geographic canditions
of El Dorado County and their contribuging faciors to our
increased response times, along with the fact that fires
double in size each and every minute, we requing sprinklers
10 be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square
feet in size as they relate o fire behavior and rate of
spread,

903214

Previously saction 803.2.1. Adds a requirement for
sprinkler system instalation in new Group A-3
buiidings and siuctures 3,600 square feet or
greater within the district

Logally adopted and amended

Due to the topagraphic, climatic, and gecgraphic conditions
of El Dorado Gounfy and feir contibiting factors ta our
increased responss times, along with the fact that fires
double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers
to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square
feet in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of
spread.

903.2.3

Previously section 803.2.3. Adds a requirement for
sprinkler system installation in new Group E
bulldings and structures 3,600 square feat or
greater within the district

L.ocally adopted and amended

Due to the topographic, dlimatic, and gaographic conditions
of El Dorado Coundy and their contributing factors fo our
increased response times, along with the fact that fires
double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers
to be installed in struciures once they reach 3,600 squars
fagt in size as they relate to fire behaviar and rate of
spread.

9324

Adds a requirement for sprinkler system installation
in new Group F buildings and stuctores 3,600
square feet or greatar within the district

Lieally adopted and amended

Due to the topographic, ciimatic, and gangraphic conditions
of El Dorado County and their contributing factors to our
increased response times, along with the fact that fires
double In skze each and every minuls, we require sprnklers
1o be instafled in struckures once they reach 3,600 square
feet in size 25 thay relate to fire behavior and rate of
spread,

Adds a requirement for sprinkler system installation
in new Group M buildings and structures 3,600

|square feet or greater within the districk

Locally adopled and amended

Due to the topographic, elimatic, and geographic canditions
of Ef Dorado County and their contributing facters fo our
increased response times, along with the fact that fires
double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers
1o be instalied in structures once they reach 3,600 square
foal in size a5 hey relate to fire behavior and rmte of

spread,

23-0015 H 38 of 46




05272

Previously section 903.2.7. Adds a requirement for
sprinkler system installation in new Group M with
Uphalstered Fumiture or Maftresses buildings and
structures 3,600 square feet or greater within the
district

Locally adopted and amended

{double in size each and evisry mirufe, we require Sprinkiers

Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions
of Ef Dorac County and their contriberting factors to our
increased response times, along with the fact that fires

to be insialledt in structures once they reach 3,600 square
feet in size as they relate to fins behavior and rate of
spread.

903285

Previously section 803.2.8.2.This section was
|created to include manufactured nesidential single
family R-3 in the residential sprintder program.

lLocafly adopted and amended

Manufactured Homes —~ The intent of this code section is fo
ensure that manufactured homes that serve as a one or two-
family dwellings are consistent with the provisions found In
CRC Section 313 pertaining ip built dwellings of a similar
nature. Manufackured homes placed in #he wikliand-utban
interface have a heightened risk of rapid fire consurmption
due to the fight-weight nature of their construction. The
rapid fire spread throughout these struciures presents a
significant fisk to their occupants. Rasidential sprirklar
syslems have beet incorparated 1o decrease this risk
successfully in many Califomia communities.

90329

Previously section 903.2.9. Adds a requirement for
sprinkler system installation in new Group $
buildings and structures 3,600 square feet or
greater within the district

Locally adopled and amerided

Due to the topographie, elimati, and geographic conditions
of El Dorado County and their contributing factors fo our
incraased response timas, along with the fact that fires
double in size each and every minute, we reguire sprinklers
to be installed in siructures once they reach 3,600 square
feet in size as they relate fo fire behavior and rate of

sproad.

903.2.10

Previously section 903.2. Adds a reguitsrnant for
|sprinkler system instaliation in new Group 5-2
buildings and structures 3,600 square feet or
greater within the distict

Locatly adopted and amended

Due to the jopographic, climatic, and geographic conditions
of El Dorado Coundy and their conributing factors o our
increased response times, along with the fact that fires
double in size each and every minite, we require sprinklers
to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square
feet in size as they relale fo fire behavior and rate of
spread.

903.2.10.1

Previously sestion 803.2.10. Adds a requirerneant for
sprinkler system installation in new Commercial
Parking Garage buikdings and sfructures 3,600
square feef or greater within the district

Locally adopted and amended

Due to the topographic, dlimatic, and geographic conditions
of El Dorado County and their contributing factors o our
increased response limes, alorg with the fact that fires
double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers
10 be installed in sfructures once they reach 3,600 square
feet in size as they rlate fa fire behavior and rate of
spread.

903.222

Previously section 903.2.7. Adds 2 requirement for
sprinkler system installation i new Group B
buifdings and strisctures 3,500 square et or
greater within the diskrict

Locally adopted and amerided

Due to the topagraphic, ciimatic, and geographic conditions
of El Dorado County and their condibuting factors to our
increased response times, along with the fack that fires
double in size each and every minete, we reguire sprinklers
1o be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square
feet in size as they refate to fire behavior and rate of
spread

Previeusly section 903.2. Adds a requirement for
sprinkler system installation in new Group F-2
buildings ard structures 3,600 square feet or
greater within the district

Locally adopbed and amended

Due fo the tepographic, climalic, and geographic conditions
of El Dorado Gounty and their coniributing factors to our
increased response times, along with the fact that fires
double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers
10 be installed in stnictures once they reach 3,600 square
feet in size as they ralate to fire behavior and rate of

spread,

Previously secfion 503,23, Adds a requirement fo
install sprinklers for existing buikdings that undergo
a ghange in use of greater harard or an increasy in
size greater than 500 square: feet and the resulting
square feet is greater than 3,600 square feet.
Previously applied to addition of more than 30% or
1,000 square feet.

Locally created and adopled

Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic condikons
of EI Darado Gounty and fheir contributing factors to our
Increased response times, along with the fact thaf fires.
double in size each and every minute, wé requing sprinklers
fo be installed in struciures ance they reach 3,600 square
feel in size a5 they relale fo fire behavior and raie of
spread.

23-0015 H 39 of 46



Adds a requirement for fire alarm systein

907.2 Instaltation in new buildings and structures 3,600 Locally adopted and amended Administrative need due to addition of section 503.2.30.

|square faef or less within the district

Praviously section 907.2a. Added occupant

protection for fire alarms in Group A Min@m a Provides proper emergency nalification for occupancies that
907.2.1.4 PPt o0 ool S S Tl 2 P“.Mm Locally created and adopied allow public usa and nsures Fire Department nofification in

not used for cammercial purposes, and buikdings R e

with a floor area of less than 500 square fest as

approved by the fire code oficial

Previously section 997.2a. Added ocoupant

protection for fire alanms in Group B buildingsl witha Provides praper emergancy notificalion for cocupancies that
907223 floor area less than 3,600, except R3, AG bulldings | - . coried and adogled | allow public use and ensures Fire Departrent noffication in

Bk ol for Commerl purponss, M iolngs the event of 2 fire or smoke

with a fioor area of less than 500 square feat as 4

approved by the fire code official

Previously section 907.2a, Added ocoupant

gm?:emgsﬁg a‘%”;&" Group IESNAISIEI:M: Provides proper emergency nolification for nccupancies that
9072311 ook afea s e 3,500, snegt o, Az g Localy created and adopted |alow public use and ensures Fire Department nofification in

not used for commercial purposes, and buildings B ot T e

with a floor area of less than 500 square feet as ’

approved by the fis code official

Previously section 907.2a. Added cccupant

pRoRCton for fre el buifding§ w.rith . Provides proper emergency nolification for cocupancies that
907241 floor area less than 3,600, except R3, AG buidings | -\ oy ocie and adapted  |allow public use and ensures Fire Deparment notiication in

not used for commercial purposes, and buildings e il Bt o caeka

with a floor area of less than 500 square feet as 4

approved by the fire code official

Previously section 507.2a. Added oocupant

protection for fire alams in Group H bulldings with Provides proper emergency notiicaion for scoupandies that
w7252 A ToopamE s than s B S R Locally created and adopted | alow public use and ensures Fire Department noffication in

buildings not used for commercial purposes, and o BuRhl 2 A ORI

buildings with a floor area of less than 500 square 4

feet as approved by the fire code official

Previously section 807.2a. Added octapant

::;Bdmy ﬁtr: :\Izﬂg&;n qu: :%gm féﬂgb;gm 3 Provides proper emergency nofification for cosupanties that
907.266 area ess than 3,600, except RS, A bUldings | ) ooy crestad and adopted. | aliow public use and ensures Fire Departmant notification in

not used for comamencial purposes, and buildings e oot o i o ke

with & fioor area of tess than 500 square feat as ]

approved by the fire cote official

Previously saction 907.2a. Added occupant

protection for fire alamms in Group M buiklings with Provides proper oy notifcation for oocupancies that
997.21.2 . B,W o o5 1 3,600 ext.:ept RJ, 4G Locaily created and adopted akow public use and ensures Fire Department notification in

buildings not used for commercial purposes, and U e e B

buikdings with a floor area of less than 500 square .

feet as approved by e fire cods official

Previously section 907.2a. Added occupant

pf%tectlﬂ?o:or ﬂfe: a{m::ifﬁrg;p I::e bugmg; Provides proper emergency notification for ocoupancies that
907.284 e e g Locally created and adopled | allow public use and ansures Fire Depariment notfication in

hididings not used for commeicial purposes, and
buildings with a floor area of less than 500 square

Ifeetas approved by the fire code officiat

the event of a fire o smoke.

23-0015 H 40 of 46



IPrem'ousiy sestion 907.2a. Added occupant
protection for fire alarms in Group R-2, R-21, and R
2.2 buildings with a floor area less than 3,600,

Provides proper emergency notification fer occupancies that

907.2.94 except R3, AG buildings not used for commercial Locally created and adopted allow public use amd ensures Fire Deparfment naffication in
purposes, and bulidings with a floor area of less the event of a fire or smoke,
than 500 square feet as approvad by the fire tode
official
Previously section 907,22, Added occupant
m‘emcnu"rggaﬁ%";g ;’ab";g'as e Provides proper emergency notification jor ocoupancies that
207.2.10.1 i S g Logally created and adopted allow public use and ensures Firs Department notification in
el o Ll o the event of a fire or smake.
with a floor area of less than 500 square feet as :
approved by the fire code official
Pm;;t::hrfso‘ec_rhon ?ﬁ?ﬁﬁg"t Provides proper emergency notification for occupancies that
907.2.30 2 we. Locally creaied and adopted  [allow public use and ensures Fire Department nofication in
connected fu & montlored fire alamm system when W36 sueri of 2 e e erate
installed or replaced i
Provides proper response and maiatenance "runner service”
of fire alarm systems. NFPA 72 specifies required response
times for fire alam trouble and supervisory signals to
’ ; ensure systems remain operational. A Type A UL listed
907.65 ESoiuiows Aoy el 5yshenms i b moninre oy UL Locally croated and adopted  |central station meets the NFPA required fre atarm response
listed Type A central station. X o
ensuring an operational fire alarm system at all times.
ULType A listing requires central stations to provide this
“runner service” or contract with another entity to provide
this sarvice i oblain the fisting.
Primary Secondary Alarm Power Supply Amend to 72 howr capacity for back-up power due fo
Gl Modfication Locally created and sdopted | e and PGAE safety related power outages.
Previously section 907.2b. Added cccupant
protection for existing buildings without automatic Provides proper emergency notification for occupancles that
907.9 sprinkler systems to install a fire alarm if they add Locaily created and adopied allow public use and ensures Fire Department notification in
more than 30% or 1,000 squars feet fo the the event of a fire or smoke.
structure, whichever is less
This section adds a Shunt Trip power shut off devices fo
1203.13 Shunt trip power safety devices Locally adopted and amended ensure emergency power shut off during the use of back-up
pewer supplies.
Previously section 3310, Address requirements for Addressing for construction sites is imponiant to assist
aitic construction sites L2c8h oata S acopeed responding emergency crews.
Previousy section 331 2.1, Water supplies at Water must be on site prior to combustible material being
e construction sites with combustible materials on-site g R T stored or vertical construction cammencing.
iy Gamages o costs fomnegigent o unlae s oo BN o e Al &
5001.7 pr_act»oes that cause a hazardous materials incident Locally created and adepled pocass o pracics the actual cast wilbe passed on o the
will cause a cost recovery fee i i
negligent parties.
Sﬁs::l;iimcmmm md‘”"“gmbe / l‘lm|§ 'ssem"ewd Allows agencies that need to know about explosives and
5601.2 y =T = 3 P Locally adopled and amended fireworks to approve them and have a clear understanding
expiosives, and by the Fire Chief and the Boand of of the applications of how they will be yeed.
Supervisors for fireworks ¥
Established limits as required by the Fire Cogde for Class |
e . ‘ flammable and Class il combustible liquid storage in above-
5704.296.1 Established limits as set forth in the Fire Code Locally adopted and amended | ground {anks, Requires AHJ approval and a
Special/Conditional Lise Permit from the County.
Established limils as required by the Fire Code for Class |
. flammable and Class I combustible liquid special
5706.24.4 Established limits as set forth in the Fire Code Locally adopted and amended operations in 200ve-grouned tanks, Requres AHJ Spproval

and a SpecialiConditional Use Permit from the County.

23-0015 H 41 of 46




Administrative addition of District name.
Established limits as sgt fortft i the Fire Code

Locally adopted and amended

Administrative need t add District name. Established fimits
as required by the Fire Code Official for Flammable
Cryogenic fluids in stationary containers. Requires AHJ
approval and a SpecialiConditional ijse Pemit from the
County.

6104.2

Established limits for LPG storage and dispensing
near or adjacent to residential development

Locally adopled and amended

Establishes distances between LPG storage and
dispensaries that are directly related to safaty for residential
developments and high-density hotels, motels, apartments,
alc. where a release by leak or explosion of LP-Gas would
have a high probability of injury, inhalation, or death.
Requires AHJ approval and a SpecialfConditional Use
Permit from the County.

Chapter 80, NFPA, 1-
22

Provides fire access and clearance to property lines
for Automobile Wracking Yards.

Lacalty created and adopted

Dismantled and stored vehicles present significant fire loads
(batteries, flammable and combustible liquids, uphalstery.
etc.) and risk to vegetation and adjacent properties. This
requirement provides fire access and clearance to
vegetation i automobile wresking yard operations to aid in
firafighting eperations and reduction of fire extensicn to
adjacent properties andfor open lands.

Chapter 80, NFPA,
130-16

NFPA 13D-16 of Chapter 80 of the Fire Code of the
District has been amended fo update various
provisions pertaining to the installation of sprinkler
syslems In one and twe-family dwellings

Locally adopted and amended

Amended to include on-ite sprinkler heads and wrench on-
site for amergent repairs, the inclusion of a local watet flow
alarm to creale an audible alert for the flow of water in the
event of water activation in a vacant structure, and
hydrostatic testing requirements 1o assure proper 130
sprinkler system installaion decreasing the risk of water
damage from pipe fallure, Passive purge requiremants
were also added to ensure water circulation through the
system, reducing stagnant water and backflow concems
(EID encourages this type of system).

Appendix B: Table
B105.1(1}

Changed 500 GPM to 1,800 GPM in major
subdivisions below 5000 foot elevation, to maich
fire flow precedents used in EDC for years

Locally adopted and amended

Allows us to mafch what developers and residents are used
10 in regards to GPM fire flow requirements that have been
used forover & decade In EDC. Also provides & iminimium:
level of available water for firefighting purposes in the event
of house {6 house, foise to vegetation, adnfor vegefatrion
to house ignition.

Appendix B: Table
Bt05.2

Established a minimuin requirement of 1,500 GPM,
below 5000 fool elevation, for all cammergial
projects

Locally adonted and amended

Aliows us 1o match what developers and residents are used
to In regards to GPM fire flow requiremants that have beer
used for over a decade in EDC.

Apperidix £: D103.1

Added an axception for residential driveways

Locally adopled and amanded

It is unreasonable to require a residentiaf driveway to
construct a 26 foot wide space for access 1o a hydrant,

Appendix £ D103.2

|

Amended fo meet State law of grades no greater
than16% within Wildland Urban Interface.

Locally adopied and amended

Title 14 requires us fo only accept up fo 18% driveways,
any exceptions would require approval by the AHJ. n our Bl
Dorado County Title 14 adoplion we allow greater then 16%
grade with AHJ approval and hard surface.

Appendix D: D193.3

Added text to include curbs and gufters

Locally adopted and amended

20 foot road widths shall not include curbs and guliers dus
1o potential access issues and fuming radius concems.

Appendix O: D103.5

Requires minimum 15-ft wide gates where installed
on fire apparatus access roads

Locally adopted and amended

\Where fire apparatus access roads consist of a divided
roadway the gate width shail not be Jess than 15 feet due o
apparatus tuming radius.

Appendix D: D103.6.1

Road widths 20 to 29 feet

Lexally adopted ard amended

No parking on roads allowed on roadways less than 28 Feet
in width above 5000 feet. Lower than 5000 fest this dees
not apply. This section is adopted as it stands in the Fire
Code Appendix D seclion 103.6.1 for all other efevations.

23-0015 H 42 of 46




Paking on one side only on roads from 28 feet to 36 fest
: allowed. This is not required less than 5000 feet of
Appendix [ 10362 g gl s ol Locally adapted and amended  |elevation. Lower fan 5000 feet this coes not aply. The
section is adopted as (Fsiands In the Fire Coge Appendix D
Section 103.6.2 for &l other elevations.
When required by the fire code official, a fire apparatus
& re Added 1o require circumferential fire apparatus access road shall be constructed to encompass the entire
AR e access roads R il W ded structure and shall provide & continuous means of
emergency vehicle access,
Adopted with no Amendments
101.1 through 101.5 :amm’ GEBREch ops: Minck domecatity 20 Locally adopfer Admiristrative carty
1021 through 10212 References, subjects not regulated by the Code Locally adapted Administrative clasity
:ﬁ‘g";"”"" Abilty to enforce the code Localty adopled Administrative clarity
:gg'é i Time fimitation of application Locally adopted Administrative clarity
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and -
106.1 through 106.4 ire and I safety inspections Locally adopled Fee schedules for pemits
Adopted this section for administrative clarity anxd 4 .
107.1 through 107.6 500 and s s2fety Inspections Locafly adopied Inspection autherity
: o . Maintenance of safeguarts, iesking and operation of
108.1 Urough 1096 m;{:‘ mmw"in';"' a.d':l_“‘mm i Locally adopled equipment, re-inspection and tesiing, recordkeeping,
supenvision, rendering equipment inoperable, overcrowding,
Adopted this section for administrative ciarity and
13 fire and ife safety inspections Lecally adopted Stop work order,
Adopled this section for administraive clanity and -
1141 through 114.7 e 2nd W sality inspections Locally adopted Unsafe structures or equipment,
Asphall ketiles contain highly flammable substances and
require stringent safeguards. Managing igniion sources
301.1 through 308.5 Adopted this section for fire and fife safety Locally adopted through responsible application of standards will reduce the
number of fires in various settings. {Climatic, geological,
and topographical).
Generai teguirements relating to smoking. Vacant premiseés
condition and safety requirements, abandoned premises,
4 : : tanant spaces, safequarding vacant premises, sectrity, fire
310.1 through 31%.4 Adopted this secton for fire and life safety Leeally adopted orotection, fre separation, eemoval of combustibies,
removal of hazamdous materials. (Climatic, geological, and
topographical).
T ; ; Geneyal requirements for roads, tunnels, and bridges
3231 Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally adopted (Climatic, geological, and topographical).
Provides evacuation drills for hazardous and institutional
403.5 through 403.7.6 Adopted this section for fire and life safedy Locally adopted ccoupancies (occupancies with increased potential for life
loss).
s 2 . Provides evacuation drils for hotelmotel ccoupanties
403.9 through 403.9.4 Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally adopted (ocoupancies with increased potential for ffe loss).
o " g Emergency planning and record keeping (Climatic,
405.1 through 405.10 Adopled this section for fire and Iife safety Locally acopted Seolaical) el ek lica!
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and A permit is required for emergency responder radlo systems
s fira and life safety inspections LRk Rt {Climatic, geclogical, and topographical).
Adaopted this section for administrative clarity and Decorative vegetation poses an increase in hazard,
L Mg 2 fire and life safety inspections L ocay; R flammability and increased risk.
Walk coverings in group E accupancies {Schoals) sets a
Adopted this secfion for administrative clarity and maximum amount of flammable wall coverings in
A3 R AH A fire and e safety Inspections S op educational facillfes {Climatic, geological, and
topographical).

23-0015H 43 of 46



B08.1 through 808.5

Adopted this section for administrative clarity and
fire and life safely inspections

Locally adopted

Combustible fumishing pose a significant flammability and
increased Efe safety hazard in institutional and college domm
type occupancies.

904.4.1

Adopted this section for administrative clarity and
fire and life safely inspections

Locally adopted

Provides clarity on acceptance testing of automatic fire
extinguishing systems. (Climatic, geological, and
topographical).

1101.1 through 11921

|Adapted this section for administrafive ctarity and
fire and fife safety inspections

Locally adopted

Adminisirative clarity

1103.2

Adopled this section in existing buifdings for the
safety of firefighters and other amergancy
responders

Lecaly adopted

Emergency Responder radic coverage in existing buildings.
Al buildings will be required to allow emergency respanders
to receive and fransmit emergency radic traffic to and from
each other and the emergency dispatch centar, Time
frames can be developed to come into compliance and the
phasiag in of a system over a pesiod of time, determined by
the fire code official, is acceptable. The rationale benind this
section fs that on almast all emergency responder irjury or
tatality incidents communication is a key Issus. This
situation can be comected with the addition of radie
equipment 1o boost the signal in areas that do ot have
strong signal (Climatic, geological, and topographical).

11035

Adopted this section for the safety of the public,
firefighters, and other emergency respanders

Locally adopted

Requires installation of fire sprinkler systems in existing
ocoupancies with high fife safety risk and in confarmance
with previous Uniform Fire Codes. (Climatic, geological, and
tapographical).

11039

Adopted this section for he safety of the public,
firefighters, and other emergency responders

Lacally adopted

Requires installaion of carbon monoxide alarms in
occupancies with high ife safaty risk, (Climatic, geological,
and topographical).

1104.1 through
1104.25

Adopted this section for the safely of the public,
|firefighters, and other emergency responders

Locally adopted

Provides a minimum level of safefy with regard ¢ egress
from existing buildings housing cccupancies with a high life
safety risk. (Climatic, geological, and topographicat).

1106.1 through
1106.1.2

Adopted this section for the safety of the public,
firefighters, and other emergency responders

Locally adopted

Provides a minimum level of safety af tire storage yards
with high levels of flammable nubber material, (Climatic,

geological, and topographical).

Appendix D: D101.1
through D104.1

Adopted this section for the safety of the public,
firefighters, and other emergency responders

Locally adopted

General requirements for fire apparatus access roads
including loads {Climatic, geclogical, and topographica),

Appendix D: D104.2
(excluding exception)

Adepted this section for the safely of the public,
firafighters, and other emergency responders

Locally adopted

Commercial and industrial development fire apparatus
access roads {Climatic, geolegical, and topographical).

Appendix 0: D104.3
through D105.4

Adopted this section for the safety of the public,
firefighters, and other emergency responders

Locally adapted

Commersial and industrial davelopmant fire apparatus
aceess roads (Climatic, geclogical, and fopographical),

Appendix D: D106,
(exciuding exception)

Adaptad this section for the safety of the public,
firefighters, and other emergenty respanders

Locally adopted

Fire apparatus access roads for multiple-family residential
developments (Clmatic, geological, and topographical).

Appendix D 0106.2
through D106.3

Adopied this section for the safety of the public,
firefighters, and other emergency responders

Lacally adopted

Fire apparatus access roads for multiple-family residential
developmenis {Climatic, geclogical, and topographical).

Appendix D: D107.1
(excluding exceptions)

Adapted this section for the safety of the public,
ifirefighters, and other emergency responders

Locally adopted

Cne- or two-dwelling residential developmenis shall be
equipped throughout with two sperate and approved fire
apparatus accass mads dus to lopographic, geographic and
climatic conditions.

Appendix D: D107.2
through D108.1

Adopted this section for the safety of the public,
firefighters, and other emergency responders

Locally adepted

One- ar two-dweliing residential devefopments shall be
equipped thmoughout with two sperate and approved fire
apparatus access roads dug i topographic, geographic and
climatic conditions.

Grey cells are previously amended, adopted, or changed code sections that are being adopted again in this code cycle.

23-0015 H 44 of 46



White cells are newly amended, adopted, or changed code sections that differ from previous code adoptions.

23-0015 H 45 of 46




b, (530)344-5086
o T ¥ legais@mtdemocrat.net

BILL TO INVOICE 10996

. o MOUNTAIN DEMOCRAT INC
Signan.s g Date 2889 RAY LAWYER DRIVE P.O. BOX 1088
Doscrptioy C Couc: > PLACERVILLE, CA 95667 US

RESCUE FIRE PROTECTION
DISTRICT

P.0. BOX 201
RESCUE, CA 95672

4 26.00 104.00

MD FUBLIC NOTICE
PUBLIC NOTICE OF INTENT, NOTIGE OF INTENT TGO ADOPT
THE 2022 CALIFORANIA FIRE CODE, PUB DATES 10/17, 1041922
MD PUBLIC NOTICE 10 0.30 3.00
BOLD TEXT
50.00

PLEASE INCLUDE YOUR INVOICE NUMBER WITH YOUR PAYMENT

REMITTANCE
*“ALL PAYMENTS ARE DUE IN FULL UPON RECEIPT OF

INVOICE™

MOUNTAIN DEMOCTRAT ING 2889 RAY LAWYER DRIVE P.O. BOX 1088 PLACERVILLE, CA 95867 (§30) 344-5086 iegals@midemograt.net

23-0015 H 46 of 46



