BID EVALUATION #23-485-060

3 Days ARO

JANITORIAL SUPPLIES
UNITS OF MEASURE CONVERTED INTO SMALLER CJUANTITIES IN
ORDER TO EVALUATE DIFFERENT CASE/CONTAINER SI7ES
P {A) Fastenal Company {C) AkaOne Inc, (D) Walker's Offlce Supply (E) West Coast Janitorfal (F) Brady iFs
Category 1 - Ianitorial Chemicals £l Dorado Hilis, CA Roseullle, CA Rocklin, CA Placervlle, CA Modesto, CA
Estimated  Unit of Extended Extended Extended Extended Extended
Bid Item #| Description Quantity Measure Unit Price Price Notes Unit Price Price Notes Unit Price Price Notes Unift Price Price Notes Unlt Price Price Notes
7 , 7.50z btl,
Liquid Hand Scap - Antimicrobial 1;:;::' 162;:::: u :;:::tl' 181?:3:' 1;;52
1 v(:;r;r; :l;r;zr-”e) 50 ot 2850 Cuncas 50.1794 $690,74 $3.05/battle 50,2944 £1,133,34 £4.71/hottle $0.3484 $1,341.51 £3.92/hottle $0.2591 5297.50 $2.85/hottle 40,4600 $1,771.00 $3.45/bottie
; i $0.1794/0z $0.2944/0z $0.3484/0z $0.2581/0z $0.460/0z
g Powder i niar with 210z can, 21oz can, 210z can, 21cz can, 21oz can,
2 i engmea:h i 150 Cans 5116 $174.00 24/case $1.20 $195,00 24fcase 5221 $331,50 24fcase $1.45 $219.00 24fcase 5120 $180.00 24fcase
£ .0552/oz .0619/0z .1052/0z 0695/0z .0571/oz
Bathroom/Shower Cleaner - Non
3 Ack, Dedorizes=1kart 3 Quarts $3.50 $14.00 12/case $3.64 $14.56 12/case $3.19 512.76 12/case %294 511.76 12/ease $3.52 $14.08 13/case
F Shower Cleaner -
a  |oRRnEANCWRLTaaner . 12 Quarts $430 $5160 | 12Qps. foase $5.55 $e6gp | 2oorcan $4.34 t49.68 12/case 139 sa06s | 12/case $2.77 $33.24 | 12fease
Quart 12 cans /case
Glass & Surface Cleaner - Liquid -
LI R 100 Gallons $5.25 $525.00 4fcase sa.42 $842,00 2fcase $13.28 $1,328.00 12/case $4.91 $491.00 dfcase $4.10 $410.00 4fcase
- i =
& Zz:‘:l‘“'""g Seap-HandUgud =Ll oy | roamene $6:30 $189.00 4fcase 720 $216.00 afcase $13.57 $407.10 Afcase §7.15 21450 4fcass 677 $20310 |  4fosse
icidal Cle is
g |SSimERgiCaner/ Didntedtantifor | g ) e, $7.40 $740.00 4fcase $11.38 $1,138.00 4fease %088 $1,088.00 4fcase $10.06 $1,006.00 4fease $10.50 $1,050.00 fcase
Walls & Fleors - 1 Gallon
290z can, 200z can, 200z b, 200z btl, 190z b},
Foaming Cleaner and Dislafectant / 12/case 12/case 12/case 12 /case 12/case
8 - 6000 . 5524 . 856 . 3,184.00 0.1595 582, 1810 , 896,
Rl et bt 208, G 1 Cunces $0,1595 $2,552.00 $2.15/Can $0,1785 $2,856,00 e i $0.1950 $ ¢a.98/can 50.158 $2,552.00 P $0.18 $2,896.00 pestyich
R - — .1585/oz 1785/0z .1990/0z .1595/o2 -1810/az
1, X . .
Nen Foaming Cleaner / Disinfectant, 212‘;:::: 21?:;::: 21:’:::5; 21(;;:5: 1?;:;:'
ls: Staph, 3 L IV, X X . 158, ;i 431 X 3 2 ,145.
9 .i:rr::?:?s apl Str:: or:e:ens HIV 6000 | Ounces $0.1575 $945.00 $3.15/can 50.1930 $1,158.00 ¢3.84/Can $0.2385 $1,431.00 $4.77/Can $0.1645 $997,00 43.29/Car 50,1909 $1,145.40 e
< .1575/0z .1930/0z .2385/0z .1645/0z .190%/0z
Cleaner Disinfectart, Deodorizer, 6x1/2
10 Pine Scent, Liguid {Like Pinesol) - 1 8 Gallans 5$11.60 492.80 | Gallons/Case 59.54 $76.32 4fcase $10.89 §87.12 Afcase £8.85 $70.80 4fcase $4.93 535,92 4/case
Gallon $5.80/half gal.
Urinal Sei Block -
1 D:::n reen w/ Deodorant Block -1 Dozen $17.50 $262.50 12/case $11.90 $176.50 12fease $17.95 526925 | 12/case 41620 $243.00|  12/case $10.60 $139.00|  12feace
T ;
12 Di’;e:f’::’_ ?’G":;:‘":' Huid,for 80 Gallons $10.34 $827.20 4fcase $3.55 $764.00 afcase $10.85 $868.80 4fcase 51073 $658.40 4fcase $12.90 $1,032.00 4fcase
iqui i % Alcohol
13 k‘:::‘i:::d:g:l'ﬁ;“ 0% Akohe 20 Gallans $17.00 $340.00 4fcase $19.60 $392.00 6/case $15.86 $317.30 4fease $19.95 $399.00 &/case $15.99 $319.50 afcase
i Akcohol, 7 ted, 1 o )
14 'é:;’;:"" e IRt a0 Gallons $20.00 $800.00 Afcase $25.98 $1,039.20 4fcase $26.34 $1,063.60 afcase $19.95 $798.00 afcase $22.00 $920.90 Afcase
T T,
15 ::;:n ap for Dispenser, Liguid - 11 op0 | Gotions $6.90 $5795.00 Ajcase $5.59 $4,695.60 afcase $5.83 $4,897.20 dfcase $5.35 $4,494.00 4fcase $7.10 $5,964.00 afcase
Bleach, Germicidal, 5.25% Sedium
16 |HyporChiorite, Liguid (Clorgx) - 1 208 Gallons $4.00 $2,200.00 &fcase $3.80 $1,140,00 6/case 54.18 $1,230,00 6/case 5395 $1,185.00 6fcase 3364 $1,092.00 /case
Gallen
T 4t 4018/Box 18 LB/Pail 40 LB/Bucket 25 LB/Box 25 L8/Box
17 " mﬁa o a: (m'st / ounij ) 50 Pounds $0.9150 54575 ($36.60/Box $1.3056 $65.28 523.50/Pait $0.6735 533,68 $26.94/bag £0.7520 $37.60 618 80/box $1.1160 4555.80 |  $27.90/box
B P $0.915/pound) $1.3056/Pound) $0.670/pound $0.752/pound $1.116/pound
s .
18 2;‘]’;} Ariace:Cleaner-Liguld-; 20 Gallons $7.40 $148.00 afcase $28.10 $562.00 3fcase $9.56 $191.20 4fease $5.83 $116.50 4fcase $6.10 $122.00 4fcase
sh, Wax, n ip. i
g |FoorPolsh.Wax hitslase; Nor Slig 70 Gallons $16.00 $1,120.00 aease $2066 $1,445.20 4fcase $17.16 $1,201.20 4fcase $16.43 $1150.00 | 2Eelon pal @ $16.57 41,159.90 4fcase
16% Soligs 582.15
Ice & Snow Melt, Chemnical 50 LB Bag 5018 Bag 5018 Bag SOLB Bag 50LB Bag
g e 60  |Bags/ Pails $10.25 $615.00 S35/ $15.20 $912.00 < 304/18 $16.56 559160 % 20505 $10.95 $657.00 SoTuglin. $7.99 $479.40 Sitae
200z can, 200z can, 100z can, 13.80z can, 160z biti,
Air Freshener Deodorizer-Aarasal 12/case 12/case 12/case 12/case 12/case
21 2161 0.7 $379.08 ; ; . L5876 . 5 193 ;
(2002/can- 108 Cans] 0 Qunces $0.1755 $379.08 $3.52/Can $0.2050 5442 .80 $a.10/Can $0.7350 $1,587.60 §7.35/can $0.1703 5367.93 $2.35/can 50.1928 $418.50 $2.10fcan
$0.1755/0z $0.205/0z $0.7350/0z £0.1703/0z $0.1938/0z
I 8 , 1 i ]
st and Santzer, 5% 80% it pri o5 o e i
22 |Alcohol, P - : 008 . A ; 191, ; i .7549 811,
(;:; Bzz ; ::113 :Mattl::: st 2400 Ounces $0.42 $1,008.00 43.36/BoMle $0.1719 $412.50 62.75/Batle 50.4963 $1,191.00 $3.97/bottle 50.3563 $855.00 $2.85/bottle 8.7 $1,811.68 $10.21/battle
50.42/02 $0.1719/0z $0.4963/0z 50.2563/0z $0.754%/0z
Sub totals $18,515.67 $19,745.90 $23,095.00 $17,751.77 $21,276.82
Prompt Payment Discount 0% $0,00 2% a% $0.80 5% 0% 50.00
Local Vender Preferchee (5%) 0% $0.00 0% $0.00 % $0.80 5% 0% 5000
Category Total $18,515,67 $19,350.98 $23,095.00 $15,976.59 $21,276.82
TERMS Net 45 Days 2%/ 25 Days Netds Days Siio S?J;Zg:;:smm Net 45 Days
DELIVERY ARO 3-5 Days ARQ 5 Days ARO 5-7 Business Days ARO . 2 Days ARD
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UNITS OF MEASURE CONVERTED INTO SMALLER QUANTITIES IN ORDER TO

EVALUATE DIFFERENT CASE/CONTAINER SIZES

BID EVALUATION #19-485-055

JANITORIAL SUPPLIES

— . (A) Fastenal Company {C) Alta One Inc. (D) Walker's Office Supply (E} West Coast Janitorial (F) Brady IFS
Category Il - Janitorial Utensils El Dorado Hllis, CA Roseville, CA Rocklin, CA Placerville, CA Modesto, CA
Estimated Extended Extended Extended Extended Extended
Bid Iltem # Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Price Price Notes Unit Price Price Notes Unit Price Price Notes Unit Price Price Notes Unit Price Price Notes
Plastic Spray Bottle, 28/400 Neck,
23 32 Ounce, HD Chemical Resistant 75 Bottles $0.99 $74.25 Each $50.95 $71.25 24/case 50,61 $45.75 24/case $0.77 $57.75 | 134/case $0.75 $56.25 96/case
1 Bottle
Trigger for Plastic Spray Bottle,
24 28/400 Closurel, 9" Long Tube - 1 75 Triggers 51.00 $75.00 1 each 51.24 $93.00 24/case $2.30 $172.50 100/case $1.69 $126.75 200/case $0.79 $59.25 200/case
Trigger
Brush, Toilet Bowl, Plastic Bristles, 4
25 1/2" Head, 21" Overall Length - 1 24 Each $1.70 $40.80 12/case $4.00 $96.00 12/case $3.61 $86.64 12/case 52.50 $60.00 12/case $1.86 $44.64 12/case
Each
, Toil , Acid Resistant,
g | o FoletBosd, Acid Resistan 12 Each $0.75 $9.00| 12fcase $1.20 $14.40 |  12/case $1.71 $2052 | 25/case $1.05 $12.60 | 144/case $0.89 $10.68 | 100/case
12" Handle - 1 Each
Stainl , Round Ball
27 Exsatesineuhbes Rojd Bal 20 Dozen $4.70 $94.00 {6 dozen / box 45.95 $119.00 | 12 dozen /box $6.46 $129.20 |  12/box $6.94 $138.80 | 6 dozen / box $5.80 $116.00 | 6 dozen / box
{Scotch Brite} - 1 Dozen
Scrubbing Sponge, Light Duty, 1 Side 5/box
28 Sponge, 1 Side Scrub Backing - 70 Boxes $16.00 $1,120.00 20/box $15.10 $1,057.00 20/hox $17.20 51,204.00 20/box $16.94 $1,185.80 20/box $23.20 $1,624.00 $5.80/box
20/Box '
) 15/box 15/box 192/box 20/box 20/box
Scouring Pad, H Duty, 6x9 (3M) -
2 | /BDXE ad, Heavy, Duly. 6x9, [3M] 200 Each $0.4667 $93.34 | $7.00/box $0.5347 $106.93 |  $8.02/box $0.3241 $64.81 | $62.22/box $0.5280 $105.60 | $10.56/box $0.2850 $57.00 | $5.707box
$0.4667 each $0.5347 each $0.3241/pad 50,5280 each $0.285 each
15/box 15/box 15/box 15/box 10/box
Steel Pads - H t
30 C[::n:':”'lss";sx adsHaavy Duty 250 Each $0.2933 $73.33 | $4.40/box $0.3113 $77.83 | $4.67/box $0.3533 $88.33 | $5.30/box $0.4073 $101.83 | $6.11/box $0.4400 $110.00 | $4.40/box
L $0.2933 each 50.3113 each $0.3533 each $0.4073 each $0.44 each
Pl L Toll ial, Wood
31 unger, Tolet, Industrial, Woo 10 Each $5.10 $51.00 | 1each $3.54 $35.40 1each $3.68 $36.80 |  6/case $4.75 $47.50 |  1each $3.90 $39.00 | 1each
Handle, 20" Length - 1 Each
SuB Totals $1,630.72 $1,670.82 $1,84856 $1,836.63 $2,116.82
Prompt Payment Discount 0% $0.00 2% }3.4.2 0% $0.00 5% 1) 0% $0.00
Local Vendor Preference (5%) 0% 50.00 0% $0.00 0% $0.00 5% 0% $0.00
Category Total $1,630,72 $1,637.40 $1,848 56 $1,652.97 $2,116.82
TERMS Net 45 Days 2% / 25 Days Net 45 Days 5% / 20 Days Net 45 Days
5% Local Vendor Discount
DELIVERY ARO 3-5 Days ARO 5 Days ARO 5-7 Business Days ARO 3 Days ARO 2 Days ARO
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UNITS OF MEASURE CONVERTED INTO SMALLER QUANTITIES IN ORDER TO
EVALUATE DIFFERENT CASE/CONTAINER SIZES

BID EVALUATION #19-485-055

JANITORIAL SUPPLIES

Category Il - Janitorial Floor Care Products

{A) Fastenal Company

(C) AltaOne Inc.

(D) walker's Office Supply

(E) West Coast janitorial

(F) BradyIFs

El Dorado Hills, CA Roseville, CA Rocklin, CA Placerville, CA Modesto, CA
i Estimated
Bid Item # Description Quantity | Unit of Measure Unit Price  |Extended Price Notes Unit Price  |Extended Price| MNotes Unit Price  |Extended Price Notes Unit Price  |Extended Price Notes Unit Price  |Extended Price Notes
Floor Machine Stripper Pad, Black, 5/case 5/case 5/case S/case 5/case
32 8 C 25.00 200.00 20.26 162.08 1996 159.68 28.35 226.80 16.00 128.00
20" (like 3M 7200N) - 1 Case A58 3 $ $5 each 02 s $4,052 each ? $ $3.99 each $ 3 $5.67 each $ $ $3.20 each
Floor Machine Polishing Pad, White, 5/case S/case 5/case S/case 5/case
33 6 Case 25.00 150.00 20.26 121.56 1996 119.76 28.35 170.10 16.00 96.00
20" {like 3M 4100N} - 1 Case s s $5 each 3 > $4.052 each s $ $3.99 each ; $ $5.67 each 3 s $3.20 each
Broom, Yellow Metal Cap, Upright,
34 55" Length, Plastic/Nylon Bristles- 1 3 Each $8.00 $24.00 1 each $11.50 $34.50 12/case $6.62 519.86 1each $8.50 $2550 12/case $5.76 $17.28 12/case
Each
Mop bucket with Ringer /
35 Downpress, Combo Pack, 35 quart 2 Each $60.00 $120.00 1 set 579.89 $159.78 1 set 58922 §178.44 1set $85.38 $170.76 1set $79.90 $159.80 1set
for 16-240z Mop - 1 Set
Mop Head, Wet, Medium, 4 Ply
c tt n
36 otton/Rayon/Polyester Biend, 5 25 Each $3.50 58750 |  12/case $8.68 $217.00 | 12/case $8.69 $217.25 | 12/case $4.50 $112.50 | 12/case $4.50 $11250 | 12/case
Headband, Twisted Loop - 1
Each
Mop Head, Wet, Large, 4 Ply
"
I Lemine e il el ol 80 Each $3.70 $29600 |  12/case $13.99 $1,119.20 |  12/case $12.28 $982.40 |  12/case $4.70 $376.00 |  12/case $5.90 $47200 |  12/case
Headband, Twisted Loop - 1
Each
Ci trated 5 gailon pail @
Floor Stripper, Non-Butyl, Low Oder, 10;1::;;_ 7 5 gallon pail @ g$53 93 5t ¢
38 Medium Duty, Rinse Free - 5 Gallon 70 Gailons $9.25 $647.50 4/case $7.89 $552.22 | . - $21.53 $1,507.10 & £ $10.78 $754.60 ) 515.42 $1,079.40 4/case
Pail/1 Galion Mixed Gallons 5107.64 1/Gal @
{$213/Gal) $11/Gal.
Sub-Totals $1,525.00 $2,366.34 $3,184.49 51,836.26 $2,064.98
Prompt Payment Discount 0% $0.00 2% 0% $0.00 5% 91.8 0% $0.00
Locat Vendor Preference {5%) 0% $0.00 0% 50.00 0% $0.00 5% 0% $0.00
Category Total $1,525.00 $2,319.02 $3,184.49 $1,652.63 $2,064.98
20D
TERMS Net 45 Days 2% / 25 Days Net 45 Days & LO:IG Jen do:;:smunt Net 45 Days
DEUVERY ARO 3-5 Days ARO S Days ARO 5-7 Business Days ARO 3 Days ARO 2 Days ARO
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UNITS OF MEASURE CONVERTED INTO SMAILLER QUANTITIES IN ORDER TO
EVALUATE DIFFERENT CASE/CONTAINER SIZES

BID EVALUATION #19-485-055
JANITORIAL SUPPLIES

s C) Alta One Inc. {D) Walker's Office Supply (E) West Coast Janitorial {F} Brady IF§
-Ja {A) Fastenal Company {
Category IV nitorial Paper Products El Dorado Hills, CA Roseville, CA Rockdin, CA Placerville, CA Modesto, CA
Estimated Extended Extended Extended Extended Extended
Bid Item # Description Quantity | Unit of Measure Unit Price Price Notes Unit Price Price Notes Unit Price Price Notes Unit Price Price Notes Unlt Price Price Notes
Tampon - Tampax Gentle Glide for 500/case 500/case 500/case 500/case 500/case
39 25 Cases 83.00 2,075.00 83.99 2,099.75 95.00 2,375.00 61.50 1,537.50 81.00 2,025.00
Vending, 1 Case 3 > $0.166 each $ ? $0.1679 each ? $ $0.19 each 5 $ 50.1230 each $ 3 $0.162 each
Sanitary Napkins, Maxi-Pad #4 or #8 250/case 250/case 250/case 250/case 250/case
40 70 C 40.00 2,800.00 57.40 4,018.00 52.88 3,701.60 51.68 3,617.60 44.90 3,143.00
for Vending - 1 Case ARSE 3 3 $0.16 each $ h $0.2296 each 3 $ $0.21 each » $ $0.2067 each $ 3 $0.1796 each
Panty Liners, Dailies Thin, Regular
41 Size #PCG-10796, 6/120 - 40 Cases $56.00 $2,240.00 0.0778 each 453,90 $2,156.00 0.0748 each $56.24 $2,249.60 0.28 each $45.25 $1,810.00 $0.0628 each $45,90 $1,836.00 06375 each
720 Pads/Case
Facial Tissue, Flat Box, White, 2-Ply, 30/case 30/case 30/case 30/case 30/case
42 140 Cases 20.00 2,800.00 A0 3,136.00 22.27 3,117. 23.90 3,346.00 15.44 2,161.60
100 Sheets/Box - 1 Case ase ’ » $0.667 each 22 $ $0.7466 each > i $ $ $0.7967 each $ 5 $0.5146 each
I 80 rolis/case 96 volls/case 96 rolls/case 96 rolls/case 96 rolls/case
Toilet Tissue, 2 Ply, 500 Sheets / Roll p
43 {1000 Cases x 96 Rolls/Case) 96000 flolls $0.6000 $57,600.00 $48.00/case $0.4735 $45,460.00 £45.46/case 50.5144 $49,380.00 549,38 /case 504218 $40,420.00 $40.49/case 50,4156 $39,900.00 $39.90/case
$0.60 roll $0.4735 roll $0.5144 roll 50.4218 roll $0.4156 roll
Paper Towel, Single Fold, Natural 250 sheets/pack 250 sheets/pack 250 sheets/pack 250 sheets/pack ' asa‘éhez_tsfpaék
44 Brown - 240000 Sheets $0.0060 $1,440.00 | 16 packs/case $0.0060 $1,440.00 | 16 packs/case $0.0064 $1,536.00 | 16 packs/case $0.0063 $1,500.00 | 16 packs/case $0.0051 $1,227.54 | 12 packs/case
250 Sheets/pk, 16 pks/Case $24.00/Case $24.00/Case 425.67/Case $25.00/Case 52050[&!&
Paper Towel Roll, Natural Brown, 7- 12/case @
45 25 £ 31.50 787.50 6, 25,20 630.00 6 26.74 668.50 6, . 667.25 6 19.95 498.75 o
7/8" Wide x 800" Long - 1 Case ases $ $ fcase $ 5 fease 5 $ fcase $26.69 5 fcase $ 3 $39.90/case
Paper Towel, Multi-Fold, Bleached or 250 sheets/pack 250 sheets/pack 250 sheets/pack 250 sheets/pack 334 sheets/pack
46 Natural - 250 Sheets/Pk, 5600000 Sheets $0.0066 536,680.00 | 16 packs/case $0.0053 $29,400.00 | 16 packs/case $0.0060 $33,404.00 | 16 packs/case $0.0053 $29,526.00 | 16 packs/case $0.0047 $26,546.91 12 packsfcase
16 pks/Case $26.20/Case $21.00/case $23.86/Case $21.09/Case $19.00/Case
200 sheets k ts, k
o e o e CErT
47 200 Sheets/Roll-12 Rolls/C - 100 240000 Sheets 0,0079 1,896.00 0.0103 2,473.60 0.0071 1,698.53 0.0060 1,444.80 0.0112 2,688.00
siases} Eeki/o il oas 3 $ $19.00/case 5 3 $24,75/case 3 s 3 3 $24.08fcase $ » $26.90/case
$1.5833/pack $1.546/pack $1.204/pack $2.24/pack
Paper Towel, Kitchen Style, 85 sheets/roll 160 sheets/roll 85 sheets/roll 85 sheets/roll
perforated Roll - 30 rolis/case 80 rolisfcase 30 rolls/case 30 rollsfease
48 102000 Sheets 00,0127 $1,299.96 $0.0025 254,17 0.0131 1,333.65 0.0118 1,200,00 0,0106 1,079.52
{85 Sheets/Rol-12 Rolls/Case - 60 s $32.50/case 3 $31.90/case $ ? $ s $30.00/case 3 $ $26.99/case
Cases) 51.0833/roll $0.3987/roll $1.00/roll 50.8996/roll
: s 250 sheets/pack 250 sheets/pack 250 sheets/pack 250 sheets/pack 250 sheets/pack
Toilet Seat Cover, Paper, Single
49 90 Cases $31.50 $2,835.00 | 20 packs/case $34.69 $3,122.10 | 20 packs/case $30.49 $2,744.10 | 20 packs/case $33.75 $3,037.50 | 20 packs/case 526.80 $2,412.00 | 20 packs/case
Sheet, 1/2 Fold - 1 Case
50.0063/sheet $0.00693/sheet $0.0061/sheet $0.0068/sheat 50,0054/sheet
Hand Sanitizer Sheet Wipes 6" x 6" or 100 wipes/can 100 wipes/can
so  [|LarEen ) 60000 Wipes $0.0496 $2,977.78 $0.0656 $3036.00 | 12cans/case 50.1035 $6,210.00 $0.0620 $3,720.00 40,0842 $5,052,00 | 12cansfcase
{50 wipes/Canister 56.56/can $8.42/can
1200 Canisters) 50.0656/wipe 50.070/wipe
Hard Surface Disinfecting Wipes, 6" x 160 wipes/can 130 wipes/can 80 wipes/can
6" or Larger, White, . 6 cans/case 12 cansfcase 12 cans/case
51 130000 Wipes 0.0516 6,703.00 0,1182 15,366.00 0.0459 5,967.00 0.0552 7,176.00 0.0624 8,108.75
{130 wipes/Canister P 3 3 $8,25/can $ 3 $ g s $ $7.12/can 3 $ $4,99/can
1000 Canisters) $0.0516/wipe 50.0552/wipe $0.0624/wipe
Sub-Totals $122,139.24 $113,491.62 $114,385.78 $99,072.65 $96,679.07
Prompt Payment Discount 0% $0.00 2% {52,269.83 0% $0.00 5% {54,953.63) 0% 50.00
Local Vendor Preference (5%) 0% $0.00 0% $0.00 0% 50.00 5% (54,953.63 0% 50.00
Category Total $122,139.24 $111,221.79 $114,385.78 $89,165.39 $96,679,07
5 0D
TERMS Net 45 Days 2% / 25 Days Net 45 Days o an:' J:l do:;?munt Net 45 Days
DELIVERY ARO 3.5 Days ARO 5 Days ARO 5-7 Business Days ARD 2 Days ARO

3 Days ARO
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UNITS OF MEASURE CONVERTED INTO SMALLER QUANTITIES IN ORDER TO
EVALUATE DIFFERENT CASE/CONTAINER SIZES

BID EVALUATION #19-485-055
JANITORIAL SUPPLIES

s . A} Fastenal Compan {C) Alta One inc. {D) Walker's Office Supply (E} West Coast Janitorial (F} Brady IFS
Category V - Janitorial Trash Liners ( ,)5| Dorado Hills, ?j\ Y Roseville, CA Rocklin, CA Placerville, CA Modesto, CA
Estimated
Bid item # BEREtipaian Quantity | Unit of Measure Unit Price  |Extended Price Notes UnitPrice |Extended Price Notes Unit Price  |Extended Price Notes UnitPrice  |Extended Price Notes Unit Price  |Extended Price Notes
Can Liner, .80 Mil., 24"x23" for 7-10 500/case 500/case 500/case 500/case 500/case
52 Gallon Can, Black - 1 32500 Each $0.0390 $1,267.50 | $19.50/case $0.0430 $1,397.50 | $21.50/case $0.0748 $2,430.35 | $37.39/case $0.0425 $1,381.90 | $21.26/case $0.0280 $900.35 [ $13.99/case
Case of 500 Liners (65 Cases) $0.039 each $0.043 cach $0.0748 each $0.0425 each $0.028 each
Can Liner, 1 Mil., 24"x32" for 12-16 500/case 1000/case 150/case 500/case 500/case
53 Gallon Can, Black - 1 30000 Each $0.0670 $2,010.00 | $33.50/case $0.0375 $1,125.00 | $37.50/case $0.1344 $4,032.00 | $20.16/case $0.0714 $2,141.40 | $35.69/case $0.0785 $2,355.00 | $39.25/case
Case of 500 Liners (60 Cases) $0.067 each $0.0375 each $0.1344 each $0.0714 each $0.0785 each
Can Liner,1.0 Mil., 30"x36" for 20-30 250/case 250/case 100/case 250/case 250/case
54  |Gallon Can, Black - 15000 Each $0.0896 $1,344.00 | $22.40/case $0.0780 $1,170.00 | $19.50/case $0.2219 $3,32850 | $22.19/case $0.0961 $1,441.20 | $24.02/case $0.0947 $1,420.20 | $23.67/case
1 Case of 250 Liners {60 Cases) 50.0896 each $0.078 each $0.2219 each $0.0961 each $0.0947 each
Can Liner, 2 Mii., 40"x46" for 40-45 100/case 100/case 100/case 100/case 100/case
55 Gallen Can, Heavy Duty, Black - 50000 Each $0.2800 $14,000.00 | $28.00/case 50,3350 $16,750.00 [ $33.50/case $0.3950 $19,750.00 | $39.50/case $0.2699 $13,495.00 | $26.99/case $0.3272 $16,360.00 | $32.72/case
1 Case of 100 Liners {500 Cases) $0.28 each $0.335 each $0.395 each $0.2699 each $0.3272 each
Can Liner, 1 Mil. 33"x39" for 33 150/case 100/case 100/case 250/case 250/case
56 Gallor Can, Black - 3750 Each 50,1520 $570.00 | $22.80/case 50,2350 $881.25 | $23.50/case $0.1693 $634.88 | $16.93/case $0.1166 $437,40 | $29.16/case $0.1160 $435.00 [ $29.00/case
1 Case of 250 Liners {15 Cases) $0.152 each $0.235 each $0.1693 each $0.1166 each $0.116 each
Can Liner, 1.5 mil., 40"x46" for 44 100/case 100/case 200/case 100/case 200/case
57 Gallen Can, Clear, Heavy Duty - 6000 Each $0.2100 $1,260.00 | $21.00/case $0.3350 $2,010.00 | $33.50/case $0.1480 S888.00 | $29.60/case $0.2605 $1,563.00 | $26.05/case 40.2245 $1,347.00 | $44.90/case
1 Case of 100 Liners (60 Cases) $0.21 each $0.335 each 50.148 each $0.2605 each $0.2245 each
Sub-Total $20,451.50 $23,333.75 $31,063.73 $20,459.90 $22,826.55
Prompt Payment Discount 0% $0.00 2% 166.68) 0% $0.00 5% (51,023.00 0% $0.00
Local Vendor Preference (5%) 0% $0.00 0% $0.00 0% 50.00 5% {51,023.00) 0% $0.00
Category Total $20,451.,50 $22,867.08 $31,063.73 $18,413.91 $22,826.55
TERMS Net 45 Days 2% { 25 Days Net 45 Days 5% Locsa,lévlef:lc?:;?scount Net 45 Days
DELIVERY ARO 3-5 Days ARO 5 Days ARO 5-7 Business Days ARO 3 Days ARO 2 Days ARO
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EACH ITEM AWARDED BY VENDOR

BID EVALUATION #19-485-055
JANITORIAL SUPPLIES

. i < {A) Fastenal Compan {C) Alta One Inc. {D) Walker's Office Supply [E} West Coast Janitorial {F} Brady IFS
Catagory Vi Miscelkineous "o Exception” ltems El Dorado Hills, o Roseville, CA Rocklin, CA Placerville, CA Modesto, CA
) Estimated Extended Extended Extended Extended Extended
Bid Item # Déscription Quantity | Unit of Measure Unit Price Price Notes Unit Price Price Notes Unit Price Price Notes Unit Price Price Notes Unit Price Price Notes
Floor Polish - Wax; Heavy-Duty,
58 Johnson Vectra Only - 5 Pails $135.00 $675.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $127.83 $639.15 $111.46 $557.30 | Bid $111.46/Pail $106.90 $534.50
5 Gallon Pail
gy |TolletTissue-1Ply; 1,000 140 Case $45.00 $6,860.00 50.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $43.88 $6,142.50 | Bid 48.75/Case 45590 $7,826.00
Sheets/Roll - 96 Rolls/Case
Discontinued -
Toilet Tissue - 2 Ply "Wheat Straw Alt. Brand Bid
60 Fiber" 506 Sheets/Roll - 1 Case $59.00 $59.00 | Bid $59.00/case $0.00 50.00 NO BID $80.52 $80.52 | 500 sheets/roll 50.00 $0.00 NO BID $59.00 $59.00 | 473 Sheets/Roll
80 Rolls/Case - 1 Case 500 sheets/roll
80 rolls/case
61 ;‘:ija ‘;‘i"f‘;"ﬂ;z‘S nAbe 50 Boxes $30.00 £1,500.00 $31.85 $1,502.50 | Bid $32.50/Box $32.05 $1,602.50 $28,56 $1,427.85 | Bid $31.72/Box $31.99 $1,509.50
62 z:z:'s'/':::e"'a"d Sanftizes H000 0, 35 Each $95.63 $3,347.05 $109.45 $3,830.62 | Bid $111.68/case $105.98 $3,709.30 $83.25 $2,913.75 | Bid $92.50/Each $95.90 $3,356.50
63 Purell NXT Hand Sanitizer Dispensers 5 Each $0.00 $0.00 Provided at No $0.00 $0.00 Provided at No $0.00 $0.00 Provided at No $0.00 40,00 Provided at No $0.00 $0.00 Provided at No
Each Charge Charge Charge Charge Charge
Discentinued -
Lquid Soap for Dispenser - Hand Alt. Brand Bid Product
64 Soap, w/Pink & Klean Cleanser, 800 125 Case $43.00 $5,375.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 50.00 NO BID 54141 $5,176.13 | Bid $46.01/Case $59.90 $7.487.50 | Discontinued
ML Bag, 12 Bagsfcase Sub: Sky #7015 Sub: #9106.12
(Fits Dispenser)
g |BamtkSoagtisgensenlorabi0saap 15 Each $0.0000 g || TeeEs RN $0.0000 $0.00 NO BID $0.0000 $0.00 NO BID $0.0000 $0.00 | ProvidedatNo $0.0000 Goupy | Frowizisdato
#9128-12 - 1 Each Charge Charge Charge
Purell Sanitizing Hand Wipes,  6-
66 3/4" x 6", 270 wipes /canister, 6 S Cases $71.00 $355.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $81.84 $409.20 584.37 $421.83 | Bid $93.74/Case 574,33 $371.65
canister/case - 1 case
Sub-Total $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0,00
Prompt Payment Discount Applied to Each Line 5% 50.00 2% $0.00 0% $0.00 5% $0.00 0% $0.00
Local Vendor Preference {5%) - Applied to £ach Line 5% $0.00 0% $0.00 0% $0.00 5% $0.00 0% $0.00
Category Total by Items 50.00 $0.00 $0.00 50,00 50.00
TERMS Net 45 Days 2% f 2% Days (Applied to each item} Net 45 Days 5% L::' ‘({i: dllarvl;l(s::ii::i::ii :c:om:;:lll - Net 45 Days
DELIVERY ARO 3-5 Days AROQ 5 Days ARQ 5-7 Businass Days ARO 3 Days ARO 2 Days ARO
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BID EVALUATION #19-485-055
JANITORIAL SUPPLIES

} Y . (A) Fastenal Company (C) Alta One Inc. (D} Walker's Office Supply (E) West Coast Janitorial (F) Brady IFs
Category VII - Shank-Free Correctional Tools El Dorado Hills, CA Roseville, CA Rocklin, CA Placerville, CA Modesto, CA
o Estimated
Bid ltem # Descriphan Quantity | Unit of Measure Unit Price  |Extended Price Unit Price |Extended Price Unit Price  |Extended Price Unit Price | Extended Price Unit Price |Extended Price
Shank-Free O Dust -
67 e A ER R R 24 Each $9.89 $237.36 $9.80 $235.20 $11.38 $273.12 $10.83 $259.92 $13.36 $320.64
Briarwood
-F 0 E S
gg [PHaIk-EEERIAE-ESY Sweep 24 Each $14.40 $345.60 $14.00 $336.00 $15.95 $382.80 $15.47 $371.28 $19.11 $458.64
Broom - Briarwood
Shank-Free Orange Floor Scrubbi
69 FREAlE= RO SRR 24 Each $26.80 $643.20 $26.20 $628.80 $28.87 $692.88 $28.89 $693.36 $35.66 $855.84
Brush - Briarwood
- O Hand-Held
gg  [PUank-EreeOange Handte 7 Each $8.88 $319.68 $8.60 $309.60 $9.91 $356.76 $9.59 $345.24 $11.80 $424.80
Scrubbing Brush - Briarwood
S - 0 5"x36" Plasti
71 tan-DRE0TNEES k36" Flastic 12 Each $20.60 $247.20 $20.15 $241.80 $22.83 $273.96 $22.20 $266.40 $27.80 $333.60
Dust Mop Frame - Briarwood
Shank-F O Plastic Hand
72 aniebreaOrange vlastic Handle 36 Each $21.60 $777.60 $20.99 $755.64 $24.53 $883.08 $24.15 $869.40 $27.80 $1,000.80
w/Short Tip - Briarwood
Shank-Free "Quick-Bite" Wet Mop
73 Holder w/Plastic Flexible Handle - 24 Each $28.50 $684.00 §27.80 $667.20 5$34.08 5817.92 $31.85 $764.40 $37.90 $909.60
Briarwood
Shank-F Black Fiberglass Handl
74 ank-rree ack riberglass Handle 12 Each $16.60 $199.20 $16.10 $193.20 $19.26 $231.12 $18.52 $222.24 $22.05 $264.60
w/Long Tip - Briarwood
k-Free Small Threaded Wall
gy [PoAnkFresSmal Treaded Wa 12 Each $8.80 $105.60 $8.60 $103.20 $9.82 $117.84 $9.49 $113.88 $11.71 $140.52
Washing Brush - Briarwood
Sub-Total $3,559.44 $3,470.64 $4,029.48 $3,906.12 54,709.04
Prompt Payment Discount Applied to Each Line 5% $0.00 2% ) 0% $0.00 5% $195.31 0% 50.00
Local Vendor Preference (5%) - Applied to Each Line 5% 50.00 0% $0.00 0% $0.00 5% (5195.3 0% 50.00
Category Total by items $3,559.44 $3,401.23 54,029.48 $3,515.51 $4,709.04
5 20 Da
TERMS Net 45 Days 2% / 25 Days Net 45 Days B !_oc:lé\{en dor l‘;?scount Net 45 Days
DELIVERY AROQ 3-5 Days ARO 5 Days ARO 5-7 Business Days ARO 2 Days ARO
3 Days ARO
* Evaluation is Exclusive of Sales Tax 0 20.66 0 0 0
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BID EVALUATION #19-485-055
JANITORIAL SUPPLIES

summary of All Ca tegories (AI)EI I;astenal C-ompany () Alta.One Inc. (D) Walker's .Office Supply (E) West Co?st Janitorial {F} Brady IFS
orado Hills, CA Roseville, CA Rocklin, CA Placerville, CA Modesto, CA
Category Description Category Total Category Total Category Total Category Total Category Total
Category [ lanitorial Chemicals $18,515.67 $19,350.98 $23,095.00 $15,976.59 $21,276.82
Category I\ Utensils $1,630.72 $1,637.40 $1,848.56 $1,652.97 $2,116.82
Category |l Floor Care Products $1,525.00 $2,319.02 $3,184.49 $1,652.63 $2,064.98
Category IV Paper Products $122,139.24 $111,221.79 $114,385.78 $89,165.39 $96,679.07
Category V Trash Liners $20,451.50 $22,867.08 $31,063.73 $18,413.91 $22,826.55
Category VI Miscellaneous "No Exception” ftems 50.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Category VIl Shank-Free Correctional Tools 53,559.44 $3,401.23 $4,029.48 $3,515.51 $4,709.04
Grand Total $167,821.57 $160,797.49 $177,607.02 $130,377.00 $149,673.28
TERMS Net 45 Days 2%/ 25 Days Net 45 Days 5;502 ‘2: ::;s Net 45 Days
DELIVERY ARO 3-5 Days ARO 5 Days ARO 5-7 Business Days ARO Local Vendor Preference 2 Days ARO
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