
 

 

 

 

RESOLUTION NO. XXXX‐2023 

OF THE BOARD OF SUPERVISORS OF THE COUNTY OF EL DORADO 

(REPEALING RESOLUTION NO. 043‐2020) 

 

WHEREAS, the California Code of Regulations, Title 24, Part 9, the California Fire Code, is updated by the 

State every three years; and  

WHEREAS, the 2022 California Fire Code became effective on January 1, 2023; and, 

WHEREAS, California Health and Safety Code Sections 17958, 17958.5, 17958.7 and 18941.5 permits a 

county  to make  such  local  amendments  and modifications  as  the  county  determines  are  reasonably 

necessary because of local climatic, geological or topographical conditions; and,   

WHEREAS,  the California Code of  regulations, Health and Safety Code, Division 12, Part 2, Chapter 1, 

Article 12, Section 13146, assigns responsibility for enforcement of safety regulations to the  local  level 

and  grants  authority  to  delegate  enforcement  to  the  chief  building  official,  or  his  or  her  authorized 

representative, or the chief of the fire protection district, or his or her representative; and,  

WHEREAS, the County of El Dorado desires to delegate enforcement of the Fire Code to the chief of the 

fire authority, or the chief’s authorized representative; and,  

 WHEREAS, the  fire protection district and County have agreed to develop,  implement and maintain a 

memorandum of understanding that describes the roles and responsibilities pertaining to the inspection 

of certain building standards found in the Fire Code; and,  

WHEREAS, on January 26, 2023, The Board of Directors of the Mosquito Fire Protection District adopted 

Ordinance No. 22‐09, which adopted the 2022 California Fire Code with amendments the District deemed 

necessary to deal with local climate, geological or topographical conditions.  

NOW, THEREFORE, BE  IT RESOLVED, that the Board of Supervisors of the County of El Dorado ratifies 

Ordinance No.  22‐09  of  the Mosquito  Fire  Protection District  and  delegates  the  enforcement  of  the 

ordinance to the Mosquito Fire District Chief, or his or her representative.  

These changes include amendments and additions to the California Fire Code in the following sections:  

101.1,  105.5,  105.5.55,  105.6,  105.6.25,  105.6.26,  107.5,  107.5.1,  107.7,  111.5,  112.4,  112.4.2, 

113.4,  202,  302.1,  307.4.4,  401.2.1,  503.2.1,  503.2.5,  503.2.6,  503.3.1,  503.3.2,  503.3.3,  503.6, 

505.1, 507.5.1, 509.3, 510.4.2.3, 903.2, 903.2.1.1, 903.2.1.2, 903.2.1.3, 903.2.1.4, 903.2.3, 903.2.4, 

903.2.7,  903.2.7.2,  903.2.8.5,  903.2.9,  903.2.10,  903.2.10.1,  903.2.22,  903.2.23,  903.6,  907.2, 

907.2.1.4, 907.2.2.3, 907.2.3.11, 907.2.4.1, 907.2.5.2, 907.2.6.6, 907.2.7.2, 907.2.8.4, 907.2.9.4, 

23-1589 G 1 of 55



907.2.10.1,  907.2.30,  907.6.5,  907.6.2.1,  907.9,  1203.1.3,  3311.3,  3313.1,  50001.7,  5601.2, 

5704.2.9.6.1, 5706.2.4.4, 5806.2, 6104.2, Chapter 80 NFPA 1‐22 Section 22.3, Chapter 80 NFPA 1‐

22 Section 22.10, Chapter 80 NFPA 13D‐22: Sections 4.6, 5.1.1.2, 7.6, 11.2.1.1, Appendix B: Table 

B105.1(1), Appendix B: Table B105.2, Appendix D Sections D103.1  through D103.3, Appendix D 

103.5, Appendix D 103.6.1, Appendix D103.6.2, Appendix D104.4 

The Mosquito Fire District adopts the 2022 California Fire Code, Title 24, Part 9, in its entirety, including 

Appendices, incorporating those sections of the International Fire Code, 2021 edition not adopted by the 

state, with the exclusions listed below: 

103,  309,  311.5,  311.6,  318,  403.3,  403.5,  403.8,  403.10,  403.11,  404,  406,  903.3.1.2,  904.1.1, 

1103.1, 1103.3‐1103.4, 1103.6, 1105, Chapter 26, D104.2 (exception only), D106.1 (exception only), 

D107.1 (exception only), Appendix A, Appendix G, Appendix J, Appendix K, Appendix L, Appendix 

M, Appendix N, Appendix O.   

Appendices not adopted can be used for reference in enforcing other sections of the 2022 California Fire 

Code.  

 

PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of Supervisors of the County of El Dorado at a regular meeting of said 
BOARD, held the _____ day of _________________, 20___, by the following vote of said Board 
 
              Ayes: 
Attest:              Noes: 
Kim Dawson            Absent: 
Clerk of the Board of Supervisors 
 
By: ________________________________    _____________________________________ 
    Deputy Clerk            ,Chair, Board of Supervisors 
 

 

23-1589 G 2 of 55



February 14, 2023 

MOSQUITO FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT 
8801 ROCK CREEK ROAD 
PLACERVILLE, CA 95667 

(530) 626-9017 
Fax (530) 626-3240 

Don Ashton, Chief Administrative Officer 
El Dorado County Board of Supervisors 
330 Fair Lane 
Placerville, CA 95667 

Subject: Resolution Ratifying Ordinance #22-09 of the Mosquito Fire Protection District, which 
adopts the 2022 California Fire Code with amendments related to local climatic, geographic and 
topographic conditions. 

Dear Mr. Ashton, 

The Mosquito Fire Protection District (MFPD) is requesting the Board of Supervisors (BOS) ratify its 
Ordinance #22-09, which adopts the 2022 California Fire Code as amended due to specific local climatic, 
geographic and topographic conditions. California Health and Safety Code Section 13869.7 requires the 
legislative body of the city or county where the ordinance will apply to ratify, modify or deny the 
adopted ordinance. The BOS must also delegate enforcement of the ordinance to either the Fire District 
(or its representative) or the Chief Building Official. 

Therefore, we request the County Board of Supervisors ratify Ordinance #22-09 with amendments to 
the 2022 California Fire Code, and delegate the enforcement of that Ordinance to the MFPD Fire Chief. 

This ordinance and resolution has no direct fiscal impact to the County. 

ATTACHEMENTS: 
MFPD Ordinance #22-09 
MFPD Resolution #22-10 

23-1589 G 3 of 55



MOSQUITO FIRE PROTECTION 

DISTRICT ORDINANCE NO. 2022-09 · 

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS OF THE MOSQUITO FIRE 

PROTECTION DISTRICT AS FOLLOWS: 

An ordinance of the Mosquito Fire Protection District (MFPD) adopting the 2022 Edition of 

the California Fire Code, incorporating the 2021 Edition of the International Fire Code, regulating 

and governing the safeguarding of life and property from fire and explosion hazards arising from 

the storage, handling and use of hazardous substances, materials, and devices, and from 

conditions hazardous to life or property in the occupancy of buildings and premises in the MFPD; 

providing for the issuance of permits and collection of fees therefor; Repealing Ordinance No. 

2019-01 of the MFPD and all other ordinances and parts of the ordinances in conflict therewith. 

Be it ORDAINED by the Board of Directors of the MFPD, also known as the MOSQUITO 

FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT: 

Section 1 :, FINDINGS OF FACTS 

Section 2: .ADOPTION OF CODE WITH EXCLUSIONS 

Section 3: LOCAL AMENDMENTS 

Section 4: CONFLICT 

Section5: . SEVERABIUTY 

Section 6: EFFECTIVE DATE AND PUBLICATION 

SECTION 1: FINDINGS OF FACTS. 

The MFPD makes certain changes (listed below) to the California Fire Code, 2022 

Edition, pursuant to Health & Safety Code Sections 13869.7, 17958.5, 17958.7, and 18941.5 

during this code adoption process. Such changes are necessary because of local climatic, 

geological, and/or topographical conditions. The MFPD has adopted, pursuant to Section 

18941.5 of the California Health & Safety Code, the findings of facts relative to these conditions 

by Resolution #2019-06 of the MFPD dated November 14, 2019. 

SECTION 2: ADOPTION OF CODE WITH EXCLUSIONS 

Ordinance 2022-09 Page 1 

23-1589 G 4 of 55



The MFPD adopts the 2022 California Fire Code, Title 24, Part 9,. in its entirety, including 

Appendices, incorporating those sections of the International Fire Code, 2021 edition not adopted 

by the state, with the exclusions listed below: 

Exclusions: 103,309,311.5, 311.6, 318, 403.3, 403.5, 403.8, 403.10, 403.11, 404, 406, 

903.3.1.2, 904.1.1, 1103.1, 1103.3-1103.4, 1103.6, 1105, Chapter 26, 0104.2 (Exception only), 

0106.1 (Exception only), 0107.1 (Exceptions only), Appendix A, Appendix G, Appendix J, 

Appendix K, Appendix L, Appendix M, Appendix N, Appendix 0. 

Appendices not adopted can be used for reference in enforcing other sections of the 2022 

California Fire Code. 

SECTION 3: AMENDMENTS TO THE 2022 CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE 

The following Sections are hereby amended or added: 

Chapter 1 

SECTION 101.1 "TITLE" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 101.1 TITLE. These regulations shall be known as the Fire Code of MFPD, hereinafter 
referred to as "this code." 

SECTION 105.5 "REQUIRED OPERATIONAL PERMITS" IS AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 105.5 Required operational permits. The fire code official is authorized to issue 
operational permits for the operations set forth in Sections 105.5.2 through 105.5.525. 

SECTION 105.5.55 "AUTOMOBILE WRECKING YARDS" IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 105.5.55 Automobile wrecking yards. An operational permit is required for the 
operation of automobile wrecking yards. 

SECTION 105.6 "REQUIRED CONSTRUCTION PERMITS" IS AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 105.6 required construction permits. The fire code official is authorized to issue 
construction permits for work as set forth in sections 105.6.1 through 105.6.246. 

SECTION 105.6.25 "AUTOMOBILE WRECKING YARDS" IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 105.6.25 Automobile wrecking yards. Construction permits are required for the 
installation of or modification to automobile wrecking yards. 

SECTION 105.6.26 "TRAFFIC CALMING DEVICES" IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Ordinance 2022-09 Page2 

23-1589 G 5 of 55



105.6.26 Traffic calming devices. Construction permits are required for the installation or 
modification of traffic calming devices. 

SECTION 107.5 "PERMIT, PLAN REVIEW AND INSPECTION FEES" SHALL BE ADDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section 107.5 Permit. A schedule of fees adopted by the district board of directors for plan 
review, inspections and the Issuance of permits by the District may be found in the most current 
district fee schedule (Health & Safety Code 17951 ). 

SECTION 107.5.1 "COST RECOVERY FEES" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 107.5.1 Cost Recovery Fees. Fire service fees may be charged to any person, firm, 
corporation, or business that through negligence, violation of the law, or as a result of 
carelessness, is responsible for the cause of the District to respond to the scene of an incident. 
A district board may charge a fee to cover the cost of any service which the District provides 
or the cost of enforcing any regulation for which the fee is charged (Health & Safety Code 
13916). The fee shall not exceed the actual cost of suppressing the fire and/or responding to 
the scene of an incident. 

SECTION 107.7 "ADMINISTRATIVE COSTS" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 107.7 Administrative Costs. When a test or inspection is scheduled, and the 
contractor fails to perform to the satisfaction of the authority having jurisdiction (AHJ), the AHJ 
may bill the contractor for actual time spent traveling to and from the test/Inspection location 
and the time spent at the test/inspection site as well as administrative costs. 

SECTION 111.5 "APPEAL PROCEDURES AND TIMELINES" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 111.5 Appeal Procedures and Timelines. Any person or entity who believes they 
may be adversely affected by an order, decision, or determination made by the fire code official 
through a written notice may appeal this matter within 15 calendar days of the postmark on the 
notice. All such appeals shall be fifed in writing with the Secretary of the Governing Board for 
the District. A timely appeal shall stay further action by the fire code official until the matter is 
determined by the Appeal Board as outlined in Section 109.2 unless the issue poses an 
imminent fire or life safety hazard to members of the public. The fire code official shall notify 
the appellant by certified mail of the date and time of such hearing. The hearing shall be 
scheduled to take place no sooner than 20 calendar days from the date shown on the certified 
mail. The appellant shall have the right to appear in person or by agent at the hearing and 
present oral, written, and/or photographic evidence to the Appeal Board. 

SECTION 112.4 "VIOLATION PENALTIES" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 112.4 Violation Penalties. Persons who shall violate a provision of this code or shall 
fail to comply with any of the requirements thereof or who shall erect, install, alter, repair, or 
do work in violation of the approved construction documents or directive of the fire code official, 
or of a permit or certificate used under provisions of this code, shall be guilty of a misdemeanor 
or infraction, at the discretion of the prosecuting attorney or agency, punishable by a fine not 
more than $100.00 for a first violation; A fine not exceeding $500.00 for a second violation of 

Ordinance 2022-09 Page3 

23-1589 G 6 of 55



the same provision within one year; A fine not exceeding $1000. 00 for each additional violation 
of the same provision within one year, or by imprisonment not exceeding 180 days, or both 
such fine and imprisonment. Each day that a violation continues after due notice has been 
served shall be deemed a separate offense. (Health & Safety Code Sections 13145 and 
17995). 

SECTION 112.4.2 "CITATIONS" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 112.4.2 Citations. The Fire Chief, or his/her duly authorized representative, may 
issue citations for infractions or misdemeanor violations of this code pursuant to Section 13871 
of the Health & Safety Code of the State of California and Chapter 5c (commencing with 
Section 853. 6) of Title 3 of Part 2 of the Penal Code of the State of California. 

SECTION 113.4 "FAILURE TO COMPLY" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 113.4 Failure to Comply. Any person who shall continue any work after having been 
served with a stop work order, except such work as that person is directed to perform to remove 
a violation or unsafe condition, shall be punishable by a fine or imprisonment or both as 
described in Section 112.4 (Health 8, Safety Code Sections 13145 and 17995). 

Chapter 2 

SECTION 202 "CAMPFIRE" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

CAMPFIRE. A fire which is used for cooking, personal warmth, lighting, or aesthetic purposes. 

SECTION 202 "DISTRICT" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

DISTRICT. The District and all other areas within the exterior boundaries thereof now or 
hereafter established. 

SECTION 202 "DRIVEWAY" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

DRIVEWAY. A vehicular access that serves up to two (2) parcels with no more than two (2) 
residential units and any number of non-commercial or industrial buildings on each parcel. 

SECTION 202 "EXECUTIVE BODY" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

EXECUTIVE BODY. The Board of Directors of the District. 

SECTION 202 "FIRE CHIEF" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

FIRE CHIEF. The Chief Executive Fire Officer of the Fire department/district serving the 
jurisdiction or a duly authorized representative. 

SECTION 202 "FIRE HAZARD" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

F!RE HAZA.RD. Any condition, arrangement, or act which will increase, or may cause an 
increase of, the hazard or menace of fire to a greater than customarily recognized as normal 

Ordinance 2022-09 Page4 

23-1589 G 7 of 55



by-persons in the public service of preventing, suppressing, or extinguishing fire; or which may 
obstruct, delay, or hinder, or may become the cause of obstruction, delay or hinderance to the 
prevention, suppression, or extinguishment of fire. 

SECTION 202 "OPEN BURNING" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

OPEN BURNING. The burning of materials wherein products of combustion are emitted 
directly into the ambient air without passing through a staclc or chimney from an enclosed 
chamber. Open burning does not include road flares, smudge-pots, and similar devices 
associated with safety or occupational uses typically considered open flamei::, recreatieflaHifS&; 
0F-~se-eJ:-j3Bftaele-BtttE!ee~laces. For tl1e purpose of this definition, a chamber shall be 
regarded as enclosed when, during the time combustion occurs, only apertures, ducts, stacks, 
flues, or chimneys necessary to pmvide combustion air and permit the escape of exhaust gas 
are open. 

Open burning shall also include campfires, bonfires, portable outdoor fireplaces, ceremonial 
fires, and recreational fire as defined in the Fire Code. 

Exception: 

1. UL or ASMI listed LPG or natural gas outdoor flame devices, such as gas BBQ's or gas 
fire pits that comply with the Rre Code. 

2. Campfires on private lands. Where required by the fire code official, a permit is shall 
be issued by the fire code official. 

3. Ceremonial and/or religious burning with the following safety measures: 

a. Maximum 4-foot x 4-foot burn area. 

b. Minimum 10-foot clearance from edge of burn area to all flammable material and 
vegetation. 

c. An approved water supply is located within 500-feet of the burn area. 

d. The burn area is located no less than 30-feet from adjoining property lines. 

e. An adult is present with a shovel until the fire is extinguished. 

f. No burning shall be conducted during high or extreme fire weather conditions (e.g., 
National Weather Service Red Flag Warnings). 

SECTION 202 "TRAINED CROWD MANAGER" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

TRAINED CROWD MANAGER. Standby personnel, usually a security guard or usher 
personnel, who are trained in the proper procedure to exit people from a tent or other place of 
public assemblage in an orderly and calm fashion in the event of an emergency 

Chapter 3 

SECTION 302.1 "DEFINITIONS" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 
3D PRINTER. 
ADDITIVE MANUFACTURING. 

Ordinance 2022-09 Page 5 

23-1589 G 8 of 55



BONFIRE. 
CAMPFIRE. 
HI-BOY. 
HIGH-VOLTAGE TRANSMISSION LINE. 
OPEN BURNING. 
PORTABLE OUTDOOR FIREPLACE. 
POWERED INDUSTRIAL TRUCK. 
RECREATIONAL FIRE. 
SKY LANTERN. 

SECTION 307.4.4 "OPEN BURNING RESTRICTIONS" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 307.4.4 Open Burning Restrictions. Open burning on all lands within the 
jurisdiction of the MOSQUITO FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT (MFPD), including the Local 
Response Area (LRA), is prohibited when the California Department of Forestry and Fire 
Protection (Cal Fire) issues a burn suspension in the State Responsibility Area (SRA). This 
prohibition shall be made effective 24-hours following its commencement in the SRA. 

Open burning is also prohibited on al/ lands within the jurisdiction of MFPD at any time the fire 
code official that atmospheric conditions or other local circumstances make such fires hazardous, 
including factors such as high winds, low fuel moisture, fire weather, the issuance of red flag 
warnings, the severe threat of wild/and fire, or present risk of destruction by wildfire to life, wildlife, 
property, or natural resources. 

Chapter4 

SECTION 401.2.1 "PRE-FIRE PLANS" IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 401.2.1 Pre-fire plans. Where required by the fire code official, a pre-fire plan shaf/ 
be provided and approved by the fire code official for all new commercial structures. 

Chapter5 

SECTION 503.2.1 "DIMENSIONS" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 503.2.1 Dimensions. Fire apparatus access roads shall have an unobstructed width 
of not less than 20 feet (6096 mm), exclusive of shoulders, as measured from face of curb to 
face of curb, except for approved security gates in accordance with Section 503.6, and an 
unobstructed vertical clearance of not less than 15 feet. Driveways shall have an unobstructed 
width of not Jess than 12 feet wide. 

SECTION 503.2.5 "DEAD ENDS" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 503.2.5 Dead Ends. Dead-end fire apparatus access roads and driveways in excess 
of 150 feet {45,720 mm) In length shall be provided with an approved area for turning around 
fire apparatus. 

SECTION 503.2.6 "BRIDGES AND ELEVATED SURFACES" SHALL BE AMENDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Ordinance 2022-0 9 Page 6 

23-1589 G 9 of 55



Section 503.2.6 Bridges and Elevated S1.11iaces. Where a bridge or an elevated sU1face is 
part of a fire apparatus access road, the bridge shall be constructed and maintained in 
accordance with AASHTO HB-17, the current El Dorado County Transportation Division Bridge 
Standard or Appendix D of the current California Fire Code, whichever is more restrictive. 
Bridges and elevated surfaces shall be designed for a live load sufficient to carry the imposed 
loads of fire apparatus. Vehicle load limits shall be posted at both entrances to bridges when 
required by the fire code official. Where elevated surfaces designed for emergency vehicle 
use are adjacent to surfaces that are not designed for such use, approved barriers, approved 
signs or both shall be installed and maintained where required by the fire code official. 

SECTION 503.3.1 "NO PARKING IN FIRE LANES" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 503.3.1 No Parking In Fire Lanes. No person shall stop, park, or leave standing any 
vehicle, whether attended or unattended, except when necessary to avoid conflict with other 
traffic or in compliance with the directions of the Fire Chief, or his/her duly authorized 
representative, Peace Officer, or official traffic control device along the edge of any highway, 
at any curb, or in any location in a publicly or privately owned or operated off-street parking 
facility, designated as a fire Jane by the District with jurisdiction over the area in which the place 
is located. The designation shall be indicated (1) by a sign posted immediately adjacent to, 
and visible from, the designated place clearly stating in letters not Jess than one inch in height 
thatthe place is a fire lane, (2) by outlining or painting the place in red and, in contrasting color, 
marking the place with the words "FIRE LANE," which are clearly visible from a vehicle, or (3) 
by a red curb or red paint on the edge of the roadway upon which is clearly marked the words 
"FIRE LANE." 

SECTION 503.3.2 "NO PARKING IN FRONT OF HYDRANTS" SHALL BE ADDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section 503.3.2 No Parking in Front of Hydrants. No person shall stop, park, or leave 
standing any vehicle within 15 feet of a fire hydrant except as follows: (a) If the vehicle is 
attended by a licensed driver who is seated in the front seat and who can immediately move 
such vehicle in case of necessity, (b) If the vehicle is owned or operated by a fire department 
and is clearly marked as a fire department vehicle. 

SECTION 503.3.3 "FIRE LANES BASED ON ROAD WIDTH" SHALL BE ADDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section 503.3.3 Fire Lanes Based on Road Width. Fire lanes shall be based on road width 
as required in Appendix D as amended by the District. 

SECTION 503.6 "SECURITY GATES" IS AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 503.6 Security Gates. The installation of security gates across a fire apparatus 
access road shall be approved by the fire code official and shall comply with the District gate 
standard. Where security gates are installed, they shall have an approved means of 
emergency operation. The security gates and the emergency operation shall be maintained 
operational at all times. Electric gate operators, where provided, shall be listed in accordance 
with UL 325. Gates intended for automatic operation shall be designed, constructed, and 
installed to comply with the requirements of ASTM F2200. 

Ordinance 2022-09 Page 7 

23-1589 G 10 of 55



SECTION 505.1 "ADDRESS IDENTIFICATION" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 505.1 Address Identification. Addresses for new and existing buildings shall comply 
with the District address standard as approved by the fire code official. The address 
identification shall be legible and placed in a position that is visible from the street or road fronting 
the property. Address identification characters shall contrast with their background. Address 
numbers shall be Arabic numbers or alphabetical letters. Numbers shall not be spelled out. Each 
character shall be not less than 4 inches (102 mm) high with a minimum strol(e width of½ inch 
(12.7 mm). Where required by the fire code official, address identification shall be provided in 
additional approved locations to facilitate emergency response. access is by means of a private 
road and the building cannot be viewed from the public way, a monument, pole or other sign or 
means shall be used to identify the structure. Address identification shall be maintained. 

SECTION 507.5.1 "WHERE REQUIRED" SHALL. BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 507 .5.1 Where Required. Where a portion of the facility or building hereafter 
constructed or moved into or within the jurisdiction is more than 150 feet from a hydrant on a fire 
apparatus access road, as measured by an approved route around the exterior of the facility or 
building, on-site fire hydrants and mains capable of supplying the required fire flow shall be 
provided where required by the fire code official. 

Exceptions: 

1. For Group R-3 and Group U occupancies, the distance requirement shall be 600 feet 
(183 m). 

SECTION 509.3 "FIRE CONTROL ROOM" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 509.3 Fire Control Room. Fire sprinkler risers, fire alarm control panels, solar 
photovoltaic power system rapid shutoff switches, and other fire detection, suppression, or 
similar control elements shall be located inside a single fire control room for the building. The 
fire control room shall have minimum dimensions of five feet by seven feet in size with a total 
usable area of not Jess than 35 square feet. The room shall be located within the building on 
an outside waif at a location approved by the Fire Code Official and shall be accessible from 
the exterior An el<terior Access door with a cleAr width of notless than 32 inches and height 
of not less than 80 inches shall be provided for access into the room. A durable sign shall be 
affixed to the exterior of the door with the words "FIRE CONTROL ROOM" in letters not less 
than 4 inches in height. A key box complying with Section 506 shall be installed on the exterior 
side of the fire control room door opening. 

The room must be capable of maintaining a minimum temperature of 40 degrees Fahrenheit. 
A clearance of 12 inches shall be provided from the fire sprinkler risers to any adjacent walls. 
This room can be a shared with other building utilities or fire protection equipment that is not 
incompatible. An approved cabinet or container shalf be provided to store record plans of the 
fire sprinkler system and other fire protection equipment. This room shall not be used for any 
other storage. 

Exception: One-and two-family dwellings, manufactured homes, or similar uses 
defined as either a Group R-3, R3. 1, or R-4 occupancy. 

SECTION 510.4.2.3 "STANDBY POWER" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Ordinance 2022-09 Pages 

23-1589 G 11 of 55



Section 510.4.2.3 Standby power. In-building, two-way emergency responder 
communication radio coverage systems shall be provided with dedicated standby batteries or 
provided with 2-hour standby batteries and connected to the facility generator power system 
in accordance with Section 1203. The standby power supply shall be capable of operating the 
in-building, two-way emergency responder communication coverage system at 100-percent 
system capacity for a duration of not less than 72 hours. 

Chapter9 

SECTION 903.2 "WHERE REQUIRED" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 903.2 Where Required. Approved automatic sprinkler systems in new buildings and 
structures, when constructed or relocated within the jurisdiction, shall be provided in the 
locations described in Sections 903.2.1 through 903 .2.12 and Sections 903.2.14 through 
903.2.23. 

Exception: Agricultural buildings not under a special use permit used for commercial 
purposes. 

SECTION 903.2.1.1 "GROUP A-1" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 903.2.1.1 Group A. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout stories 
containing Group A-1 occupancies and throughout all stories from the Group A-1 occupancy to 
and including the levels of exit discharge serving that occupancy where one of the following 
conditions exists: 

1. The fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

2. The fire area has an occupant load of 300 or more. 

3. The fire area Is located on a floor other than a level of exit discharge serving such 
occupancies. 

4. The fire area contains a multi-theater complex 

SECTION 903.2.1.2 "GROUP A-2" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 903.2.1.2 Group A-2. An automatic sprinl<ler system shall be provided throughout 
stories containing Group A-2 occupancies and throughout all stories from the Group A-2 
occupancy to and including the levels of exit discharge serving that occupancy where one of the 
following conditions exists: 

1. The fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet; 

2. The fire area has an occupant load of 100 or more. 

3. The fire area is located on a floor other than a level of exit discharge serving such 
occupancies. 

4. The structure exceeds 3,600 square feet, contains more than one fire area containing a 
Group A-2 occupancy, and is separated into two or more buildings by fire walls of less than 
4-hour fire-resistance rating without openings. 

SECTION 903.2.1.3 "GROUP A-3" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Ordinance 2022·09 Page9 

23-1589 G 12 of 55



Section 903.2.1.3 Group A-3. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout 
stories containing Group A-3 occupancies and throughout all stories from the Group A-3 
occupancy to and including the levels of exit discharge se1ving that occupancy where one of the 
following conditions exists: 

1. The fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

2. The fire area has an occupant load of 300 or more. 

3. The fire area is located on a floor other than a level of exit discharge serving such 
occupancies. 

4. The structure exceeds 3,600 square feet, contains more than one fire area containing 
exhibition and display rooms, and is separated into two or more buildings by fire walls of 
less than 4-hour fire-resistance rating without openings. 

SECTION 903.2.1.4 "GROUP A-4" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 903.2.1.4 Group A-4. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout 
stories containing Group A-4 occupancies and throughout all stories from the Group A-4 
occupancy to and including the levels of exit discharge serving that occupancy where one of the 
following conditions exists: 

1. The fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

2. The fire area has an occupant load of 300 or more. 

3. The fire area is located on a floor other than a level of exit discharge serving such 
occupancies. 

SECTION 903.2.3 "GROUP E" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 903.2.3 Group E. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided for Group E 
occupancies as follows: 

1. Throughout all Group E fire areas greater than 3,600 square feet in area. 

2. The Group E fire area is located on a floor other than a level of exit discharge serving such 
occupancies. 

Exception: In buildings where every classroom has not fewer than one exterior exit 
door at ground level, an automatic sprinkler system is not required in any 
area below the lowest level of exit discharge serving that area. 

3. The Group E fire area has an occupant load of 300 or more. 

4. In rooms or areas with special hazards such as laboratories, vocational shops and other 
such areas where hazardous materials in quantities not exceeding the maximum allowable 
quantity are used or stored. 

5. Throughout any Group E structure greater than 3,600 square feet in area, which contains 
more than one fire area, and which is separated Into two or more buildings by fire walls of 
less than 4-hour fire resistance rating without openings. 

6. For public school, and state-funded construction projects see Section 903.2.19. 

7. For public school campuses, Kindergarten through 12Ih grade, see Section 903.2.20 

Ordinance 2022-09 Page 10 

23-1589 G 13 of 55



SECTION 903.2.4 "GROUP F-1" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 903.2.4 Group F-1. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout all 
buildings containing a Group F-1 occupancy where one of the following conditions exists: 

1. A Group F-1 fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

2. A Group F-1 fire area is located more than three stories above grade plane. 

3. The combined area of all Group F-1 fire areas on all floors, including any mezzanines, 
exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

SECTION 903.2.7 "GROUP M" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 903.2.7 Group M. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout buildings 
containing a Group M occupancy where one of the following conditions exists: 

1. A Group M fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

2. A Group M fire area is located more than three stories above grade plane. 

3. The combined area of all Group M fire areas on all floors, including any mezzanines, 
exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

5. The structure exceeds 3,600 square feet, contains more than one fire area containing a 
Group M occupancy, and is separated into two or more buildings by fire walls of less than 
4-hour fire-resistance rating without openings. 

SECTION 903.2.7.2 "GROUP M UPHOLSTERED FURNITURE OR MATTRESSES" SHALL 
BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 903.2.7.2 Group M Upholstered Furniture or Mattresses. An automatic sprinkler 
system shall be provided throughout a Group M fire area where the area used for the display 
and sale of upholstered furniture or mattresses exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

SECTION 903.2.8.5 "MANUFACTURED HOMES" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 903.2.8.5 Manufactured Homes. An automatic fire sprinkler system shall be required 
in all new manufactured homes and multi-family manufactured homes intended for use as a 
one-and two-family dwelling. The design and installation of such systems shall be in 
accordance with California Code of Regulations, Title 25, §4300. 

Exceptions: 

I. Manufactured homes located within an ·existing mobile home park complying with 
California I-lea/th and Safety Code, Division 13, Part 2. 1 or 2. 3. 

2. Manufactured homes that do not exceed 1,200 square feet in size and serve as an 
accessory dwelling unit, as defined in Government Code Section 658502; when the 
existing primary residence on the property is not required to comply with California 
Residential Code Section R313.2. 

3. Manufactured homes that do not exceed 320 square feet in size. 

SECTION 903.2.9 "GROUP S-1" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Ordinance 2022-0 I Page 11 

23-1589 G 14 of 55



Section 903.2.9 Group S-1. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout all 
buildings containing a Group S-1 occupancy where one of the following conditions exists: 

1. A Group S-1 fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

2. A Group S-1 fire area is located more than three stories above grade plane. 

3. The combined area of all Group S-1 fire areas on all floors, including any mezzanines, 
exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

4. A Group S-1 fire area used for the storage of commercial motor vehicles where the fire 
area exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

SECTION 903.2.10 "GROUP S-2" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 903.2.10 Group S-2. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout 
buildings classified as parking garages where any of the following conditions exist: 

1. Where the fire area of the enclosed parking garage, in accordance with Section 406.6 of 
the California Building Code, exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

2. Where the enclosed parking garage, in accordance with Section 4C6.6 of the California 
Building Code, is located beneath other groups. 

Exception: Enclosed parking garages located beneath Group R-3 occupancies. 

3. Where the fire area of the open parl<ing garage, in accordance with Section 406.5 of the 
California Building Code, exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

SECTION 903.2.10.1 "COMMERCIAL PARKING GARAGES" SHALL BE AMENDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section 903.2.10.1 Commercial Parking Garages. An automatic sprinkler system shall be 
provided throughout buildings used for storage of commercial motor vehicles where the fire area 
exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

SECTION 903.2.22 "GROUP B" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 903.2.22 Group B. An automatic sprinkler system shall be prcvided throughout all 
buildings containing Group B occupancies where the fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

SECTION 903.2.23 "GROUP F-2" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 903.2.23 Group F-2. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout all 
buildings containing Group F-2 occupancies where the fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

SECTION 903.6 "WHERE REQUIRED IN EXISTING BUILDINGS AND STRUCTURES" IS 
AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 903.6 Where Required In Eidsting Buildings and Structures. An automatic 
sprinkler system shall be provided in existing buildings and structures where required in 
Chapter 11 and as follows: 

Ordinance 2022-09 Page 12 

23-1589 G 15 of 55



1. When there is a change in occupancy classification that results in an increased life safety 
or fire risk, as determined by the fire code official, and the structure exceeds 3,600 square 
feet, an automatic fire sprinkler system shall be installed throughout the building. 

2. In existing buildings 3,600 square feet or greater, other than one ana' two-family dwelling 
units, and agricultural buildings not under special use permit for commercial purposes, 
where the floor area of the building or structure is increased, such building or structure 
shall be made to conform to Section 903.2. 

Exception: When the building increase ls less than 500 square feet. 

3. In existing buildings 3,600 square feet or less, other than one-and two-family dwelling 
units, and agricultural buildings not under special use permit for commercial purposes, 
where the floor area of the building or structure is Increased to a t-::ital square footage 
over 3,600 square feet, such building or structure shall be made to conform to Section 
903.2. 

Exception: When the building increase is less than 500 square feet. 

SECTION 907.2. "WHERE REQUIRED- NEW BUILDINGS AND STRUCTURES" SHALL BE 
AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 907.2. Where Required - New Buildings and Structures. An approved fire alarm 
system installed in accordance with the provisions of this code and NFPA 72 shall be provided 
in new buildings and structures in accordance with Sections 907.2.1 through 907.2.~30 and 
provide occupant notification in accordance with Section 907.5, unless other requirements are 
provided by another section of this code. 

Not fewer than one manual fire alarm box shall be provided in an approved location to initiate 
a fire alarm signal for fire alarm systems employing automatic fire detectors or waterflow 
detection devices. Where other sections of this code allow the elimination of fire alarm boxes 
due to sprinklers or automatic fire alarm systems, a single fire alarm box shall be installed at a 
location approved by the enforcing agency. 

Exceptions: 

1. The manual fire alarm box is not required for fire alarm central units systems 
dedicated to elevator recall control, supervisory service and fire sprinkler 
monitoring. 

2. The manual fire alarm box is not required for Group R-2 occupancies unless 
required by the fire code official to provide a means for fire watch personnel to 
initiate an alarm during a sprinkler system, impairment event. Where provided, the 
manual fire alarm box shall not be located in an area that is open to the public. 

3. The manual fire alarm box is not required to be installed when approved by the fire 
code official. 

4. A fire alarm sys/em is not required in one and two-family dwellings, agricultural 
buildings, and other occupancies classified as Group U not under special use 
permit and/or not used for commercial purposes (e.g. retail sales, food service, 
and/or special events). 

Ordinance 2022-09 Page 13 

23-1589 G 16 of 55



5. Buildings with a floor area less than 500 square feet may be exempt, as determined 
by the fire code official based on building construction material and features, 
location, occupancy type, and distance to exposures. 

SECTION 907.2.1.4 "GROUP A UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET" SHALL BE ADDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section 907.2.1.4 Group A Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shall 
be installed in all group A buildings with a floor area less than 3,600 square feet. 

SECTION 907.2.2.3 "GROUP B UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET" SHA_L BE ADDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section 907.2.2.3 Group B Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shall 
be installed in all group B buildings with a floor area Jess than 3,600 square feet. 

SECTION 907.2.3.11 "GROUPE UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET" SHALL BE ADDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section 907.2.3.11 Group E Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shall 
be installed in all group E buildings with a floor area less than 3,600 square feet. 

SECTION 907.2.4.1 "GROUP F UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET" SHALL BE ADDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section 907.2.4.1 Group F Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shall 
be installed in all group F buildings with a floor area fess than 3,600 square feet. 

SECTION 907.2.5.2 "GROUP H UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET" SHALL BE ADDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section 907.2.5.2 Group H Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shall 
be installed in all group I-/ buildings with a floor area less than 3,600 square feet. 

SECTION 907.2.6.6 "GROUP I UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET" SHALL BE ADDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section 907.2.6.6 Group I Under 3,600 Squarn Feet. An approved fire alarm system shall 
be installed in a// group I buildings with a floor area less tl1an 3,600 square feet. 

SECTION 907.2.7.2 "GROUP M UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET" SHALL BE ADDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section 907.2.7.2 Group M Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shall 
be installed in all group M buildings with a floor area less than 3,600 square feet. 

SECTION 907.2.8.4 "GROUP R-1 UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET" SHALL BE ADDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Ordinance 2022-09 Page 14 

23-1589 G 17 of 55



Section 907.2.8.4 Group R-1 Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shall 
be installed in all group R-1 buildings with a floor area less than 3,600 square feet. 

SECTION 907.2.9.4 "GROUP R-2, R-2.1, R-2.2 UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET" SHALL BE 
ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 907.2.9.4 Group R-2, R-2.1, R-2.2 Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm 
system shall be installed in all group R-2, R-2. 1, R-2.2 buildings with a floor area less than 
3,600 square feet. 

SECTION 907.2.10.1 "GROUPS UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET" SHALL BE ADDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section 907.2.10.1 Group S Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shall 
be installed in all group S buildings with a floor area Jess than 3,600 square feet, 

907.2.30 "TYPE I HOOD INSTALLATIONS" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

907.2.30 "Type I Hood Installations. The requirement of installation, or replacement, of a 
Type I Hood System shall require a fire a/arm/sprinkler monitoring system to be installed, or 
for the hood system to be connected to an existing fire a/arm/sprinkler monitoring system for 
that building. 

907.6.5 "MONITORING" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

907.6.5 Monitoring, Fire alarm systems required by this chapter or by the California Building 
Code shall be monitored by an approved, UL certified, Type A Full Service central, proprietary 
or remote station service, which gives audible and visual signals at a constantly attended 
location. All sprinklered buildings shall be monitored. 

Exceptions: 

1. One- and two-family dwellings (R-3 Occupancies and other occupancies classified 
as «LJ'?. 

2. Agricultural buildings not under special use permit and/or not used for commercial 
purposes (e.g., retails safes, food se1v/ce, and/or special events). 

SECTION 907.6.2.1 "SECONDARY POWER SUPPLY" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

SECTION 907.6.2.1 SECONDARY POWER SUPPLY. Where required by the fire code 
official, in accordance with NFPA 72, the secondary power supply providing a minimum 24-
hour power capacity under quiescent load (system operating in a non-alarm condition) shall 
be amended to a minimum 72-hour power capacity. 

Exception: The existence of an emergency back-up power supply that meets or exceed 
the requirements of California Fire Code Chapter 12. 

SECTION 907.9 "WHERE REQURIED IN EXISTING BUILDINGS" SHALL BE AMENDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Ordinance 2022-09 Page 15 

23-1589 G 18 of 55



SECTION 907.9 Where Required. An approved fire alarm system shall be provided in existing 
buildings and structures where required in Chapter 11 and in existing buildings with a floor 
area less than 3,600 square feet without an approved automatic sprinkler system, other than 
one- or two-family dwelling units, agricultural building not under special use permit for 
commercial purposes where a fire alarm detection system does not exist and the floor area of 
the building or structure is increased 

Exception: When the building increase is less than 500 square feet. 

Chapter 12 

SECTION 1203.1.3 "INSTALLATION" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 1203.1.3 Installation. Emergency power systems and standby power systems shall 
be installed in accordance with the California Building Code, the California Electrical Code, 
NFPA 110 and NFPA 111. All buildings, other than one- and two-family dwe/1/ng units, and 
agricultural buildings not used for commercial purposes, with standby power, shall have a 
shunt trip device that disconnects all power sources to the building, approved by the fire code 
official. Existing installations shall be maintained in accordance with the original approval. 

Chapter33 

SECTION 3311.3 "PREMISE IDENTIFICATION" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 3311.3 Premise Identification. Prior to and during construction, an approved 
address sign shall be provided at each fire and emergency vehicle access road entry into the 
project. 

SECTION 3313.1 "WHEN REQUIRED" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 3313.1 When Required. An approved water supply for fire protection, either 
temporary or permanent, shall be shall be installed and maintained in continuous operation as 
soon as combustible building materials arrive on site, the commencement of vertical 
combustible construction and on installation of a standpipe system in buildings under 
construction, in accordance with Sections 3313.2 through 3313.5. 

Exception: The fire code official is authorized to reduce the fire-flow requirements for 
isolated buildings or a group of buildings in rural areas or small communities where the 
development of full fire-flow requirements is impractical. 

Chapter 50 

SECTION 5001.7 "LIABILITY FOR DAMAGES" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 5001.7 Liability for Damages. Any damages or cost resulting from the negligence, 
violation of the law, careless handling, spill or discharge of any hazardous materials shall 
constitute debt against any such person, firm or corporation causing such spill or discharge. 
This debt is collectible by the Fire Chief, or his/her duly authorized representative, in the same 
manner as in the case of an obligation under contract, expressed or implied. 

Ordinance 2022-09 Page 16 

23-1589 G 19 of 55



Chapter 56 

SECTION 5601.2 "PERMIT REQUIRED" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 5601.2 Permit Req'uired. Permits shall be required as set forth in Section 105.5 and 
regulated in accordance with this section. Where fireworks permits are required, they shall be 
issued by the Fire Chief, or his/her duly authorized representative, and the El Dorado County 
Board of Supervisors. 

Chapter 57 

SECTION 5704.2.9.6.1 "LOCATIONS WHERE ABOVE-GROUND TANKS ARE 
PROHIBITED" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

SECTION 5704.2.9.6.1 Locations Where Above-Ground Tanks are Prohibited. Storage of 
Class I and Class II flammable liquids in above-ground tanks outside of buildings is prohibited 
within the limits estabfished by law as the limits of districts in which such storage is prohibited. 
Storage of Class I and Class If flammable liquids in above-ground tanks outside of buildings is 
prohibited unless approved by the fire code official. 

SECTION 5706.2.4.4 "LOCATIONS WHERE ABOVE-GROUND TANKS ARE PROHIBITED" 
SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

SECTION 5706.2.4.4 Locations Where Above-Ground Tanks are Prohibited. The storage 
of Class I and Class II liquids in above-ground tanl,s is prohibited within the limits established 
by law as the limits of districts in which such storage is prohibited. Storage of Class I and Class 
II liquids in above-ground tanks is prohibited unless approved by the fire code official. 

Chapter 58 

SECTION 5806.2 "LIMITATIONS" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

SECTION 5806.2 Limitations. Storage of flammable cryogenic fluids in stationary containers 
outside of buildings is prohibited within the limits established by law as the limits of districts in 
which such storage is prohibited. Storage of flammable cryogenic fluids in stationary containers 
outside of buildings is prohibited unless approved by the fire code official. 

Chapter 61 

SECTION 6104.2 "MAXIMUM CAPACITY WITHIN ESTABLISHED LIMITS" SHALL BE 
AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

SECTION 6104.2 Maximum Capacity within Established Limits. Within the limits 
established by law restricting the storage of liquefied petroleum gas for the protection of heavily 

Ordinance 2022-09 Page 17 

23-1589 G 20 of 55



populated or congested areas, the aggregate capacity of any one installation shall not exceed 
a water capacity of 2,000 gallons. The storage of liquefied petroleum gas in excess of an 
aggregate of 2,000-gallon water capacity when located at least one-half (1/2) mile from 
property zoned or designated for residential use and at least one-half (112) mile from existing 
residential development with a density greater than one (1) dwelling unit per acre and at least 
one-half (112) mile from any hotel or motel is allowed when approved by the fire code official, 
and a special/conditional use permit is issued by the County of El Dorado. 

Dispensing within established limits. Within the limits established by law restricting the 
dispensing of liquefied petroleum gas for the protection of heavily populated or congested 
areas, the aggregate capacity of any one installation shall not exceed a water capacity of 2,000 
gallons. The dispensing of liquefied petroleum gas in excess of an aggregate of 2,000-gallon 
water capacity when located at least one-half (112) mile from property zoned or designated for 
residential use and at least one-half (1/2) mile from any hotel or motel is allowed when 
approved by the fire code official and a special/conditional use permit is issued by the County 
of El Dorado. 

Chapter 80 

SECTION 80, NFPA 1-22, CHAPTER 22 "AUTOMOTIVE WRECKING YARDS" IS ADOPTED, 
AMENDED SECTIONS AS FOLLOWS: 

Revise Section 22.3 as follows: 

22.3 Fire department access roads shall be in accordance with the California Fire Code, 
Section 503 and Appendix D. 

Add new Section 22.10 as follows: 

22.10 Stored vehicles, boats, recreational vehicles, parts, and equipment shall not be stored 
within 30 feet of adjacent property lines. 

SECTION 80, NFPA, 13D-22 - "STANDARD FOR THE INSTALLATION OF SPRINKLER 
SYSTEMS IN ONE-AND TWO FAMILY DWELLINGS AND MANUFACTURED HOMES" IS 
AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 903.3.1.3, 903.3.5.1.1 

NFPA 13D, Amended Sections as follows: 

Acid new Section 4.6 as follows: 

4.6 Residential fire sprinkler systems installed in all new one-and two-family dwellings shall utilize 
a "Passive Purge" system design unless otherwise approved by the fire code official. 

Exception: Manufactured home installed, tested and approved by the California 
Department of Housing and Community Development. 

Revise Section 5.1.12 as follows: 

Ordinance 2022-0 9 Page 18 

23-1589 G 21 of 55



5.1.1.2 A supply of at least one of each type and temperature sprinkler used within the premises 
shall be maintained on the prope1ty at an approved location. Spare sprinklers shall be kept in a 
mounted and accessible cabinet. 

Revise Section 7.6 as follows: 

7 .6 A local audio/visual device activated upon water flow shall be provided on all fire sprinkler 
systems in homes at an approved location on the exterior of the dwelling. 

Revise Section 11.2.1.1 as follows: 

11.2.1.1 Where a fire department pumper connection is not provided, the system shall be 
hydrostatically tested at a minimum pressure of 150 pounds per square inch gauge for no less 
than a 30-minute duration without evidence of leakage. Such test shall be witnessed by the fire 
code official. 

Appendix B - Fire Flow Requirements for Buildings 

TABLE B105.1(1) "REQUIRED FIRE FLOW FOR ONE- AND TWO-FAMILY DWELLINGS, 
GROUP R-3, AND R-4 BUILDINGS AND TOWNHOUSES" SHALL BE AMENDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

TABLE B105.1(1) REQUIRED FIRE FLOW FOR ONE• AND TWO-FAMILY DWELLINGS, 
GROUP R-3, AND R-4 BUILDINGS AND TOWNHOUSES 

(PLEASE NOTE THAT TABLE B105.1 (11 INCLUDES A SEPARATE SECTION FOR SPRINKLERED RESIDENCES WITH LESSER FIRE 
FLOW REQUIREMENTS NOT MENTIONED IN THIS AMENDED SECTION! 

FIRE-FLOW AUTOMATIC MINIMUM FIRE- FLOW DURATION 
CALCULATION SPRINKLER SYSTEM FLOW (hours) 

AREA (Design Standard) (gallons per 
ls□uare feet\ minute} 

0- 3,600 No automatic sprinkler 1,000 1 
system 

3,601 and greater No automatic sprinkler Value in Table Duration in Table 
system B105. 1(2) B105.1(2) at the 

required fire-flow 
rate 

MAJOR SUBDIVISIONS (5 PARCELS OR GREATER) 

0-3,600 Section 903.3.1.3 of the 1,000 1 
CA Fire Code or Section 
313.3 of the CA 
Residential Code 

3,601 and greater Section 903.3.1.3 of the 1/2 value of 
CA Fire Code or Section Table 8105.1(2) 2 
313.3 of the CA (min. 1000 

Residential Code GPM) 

Ordinance 2022-091 Page 19 

23-1589 G 22 of 55



OTHER RESIDENTIAL DEVELOPMENT 

0 -3,600 Section 903.3.1.3 of the 500 1 
CA Fire Code or Section 
313.3 of the CA 
Residential Code 

3,601 and greater Section 903.3.1.3 of the 1/2 value of Table 'I 

CA Fire Code or Section B105.1 (2) (min. 
313.3 of the CA 750 GPM) 
Residential Code 

TABLE B105.2 "REQUIRED FIRE FLOW FOR BUILDINGS OTHER THAN ONE- AND 
TWO-FAMILY DWELLINGS, GROUP R-3, AND R-4 BUILDINGS AND 
TOWNHOUSES" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

TABLE B105.2 REQUIRED FIRE FLOW FOR BUILDINGS OTHER THAN ONE­
AND TWO-FAMILY DWELLINGS, GROUP R-3, AND R-4 BUILDINGS AND 

TOWNHOUSES 

AUTOMATIC MINIMUM FIRE· FLOW DURATION 
SPRINKLER SYSTEM FLOW (hours) 

(Design Standard) (gallons per minute) 

No automatic sprinkler Value in Table Duration in Table 8105.1(2) 
system B105.1 (2) 

Section 903.3.1.1 of the 25% of the value in Duration in Table 8105.1 (2) at 
CA Fire Code Table B105.1(2)b the reduced flow rate 

b. The reduced fire flow shall not be less than 1,500 GPM 

Appendix D - Fire Apparatus Access Roads 

SECTION 0103.1 "ACCESS ROAD WIDTH WITH A HYDRANT" SHALL BE AMENDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section D103.1 Access Road Width with a Hydrant. Where a fire hydrant is located on a 
fire apparatus access road, the minimum road width shall be 26 feet (7925 mm), exclusive of 
shoulders (see Figure 0103.1). 

Exception: Driveways 

SECTION D103.2 "GRADE" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

SECTION D103.2 Grade. Fire apparatus access roads and driveways shall not exceed 15.9% 
in grade unless approved by the fire code orticial or by the El Dorado County amended 
California Public Resource Code Title 14 I Design and Improvement Standards Manual. 

Ordinance 2022-09 Page 20 

23-1589 G 23 of 55



SECTION D103.3 "TURNING RADIUS" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

SECTION D103.3 Turning Radius. The minimum turning radius shall be determined by the 
fire code official; and shall not include curb and gutter. 

SECTION D103.5 "FIRE APPARATUS ACCESS ROAD GATES" SHALL BE AMENDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

SECTION 0103,5 Fire Apparatus Access Road Gates. Gates securing the fire apparatus 
access roads shall comply with all of the following criteria: 

1. Where a single gate is provided, the gate width shall be not less than 20 feet (6096 mm). 
Where a fire apparatus road consists of a divided roadway, the gate width shall be not less 
than 15 feet (3658 mm). 

2. Gates shall be of the horizontal swing, horizontal slide, vertical lift, or vertical pivot type. 

3. Construction of gates shall be of materials that allow manual operation by one person. 

4. Gate components shall be maintained in an operative condition at all times and replaced 
or repaired when defective. 

5. Electric gates shall be equipped with a means of opening the gate by fire department 
personnel for emergency access. Emergency opening devices shall be approved by the 
fire code official. 

6. Methods of locking shall be submitted for approval by the fire code official. 

7. Electric gate operators, where provided, shall be listed in accordance witl1 UL 325. 

8. Gates intended for automatic operation shall be designed, constructed, and installed to 
comply with the requirements of ASTM F2200. 

SECTION D103.6.1 "ROADS 20 TO 29 FEET IN WIDTH" SHALL BE AMENDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

SECTION 0103,6.1 Roads 20 to 29 feet in width. Fire lane signs, as specified in Section 
D 103.6 shall be posted on both sides of fire apparatus access roads that are 20 to 29 feet wide 
(6096 to 8534.4 mm). 

SECTION D103.6.2 "ROADS MORE THAN 29 FEET IN WIDTH" SHALL BE AMENDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

SECTION D103,6.2 Roads more than 29 feet in Width. Fire lane signs, as specified in 
Section D103.6, shall be posted on one side off1re apparatus access roads more than 29 feet 
wide (8534.4 mm) and less than 36 feet wide (10972.8 mm). 

SECTION D104.4 "CIRCUMFERENTIAL FIRE APPARATUS ACCESS ROADS" SHALL BE 
ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

SECTION D104.4 Circumferential Fire Apparatus Access Roads. When required by the 
fire code official, a fire apparatus access road shall be constructed to encompass the entirety 
of a structure and shall provide a continuous means of emergency vehicle access. 

Ordinance 2022-09 Page 21 

23-1589 G 24 of 55



SECTION 4: CONFLICT . 

That Ordinance No. 2019-09 of the MFPD and all other ordinances or parts of ordinances 

herewith are hereby repealed. 

SECTION 5: SEVERABILITY 

If any Ordinance, article, subsection or subdivision thereof, provision, sentence, clause, or 

phrase of this code, or any application thereof, is for any reason held to be invalid by a court of 

competent jurisdiction, such decision shall not affect the remaining provisions of this code, 

which can be given effect without the invalid portions and, therefore, such invalid portions are 

declared to be severable. The MFPD hereby declares that it would have enacted this Ordinance 

and each of its articles, sections, subsections, or subdivisions thereof, provisions, sentences, 

clauses, or phrases, irrespective of the fact that one or more of them is declared invalid. 

SECTION 6: EFFECTIVE DATE AND PUBLICATION 

This Ordinanc.e shall ts_ke effect thirty (30) days after its adoption. The MFPD Board Secretary 

is directed to publish this Ordinance in a newspaper of general circulation in the District. In lieu 

of publication of the full text of the Ordinance, a summary of the Ordinance may be published 

by the by the Board Secretary within fifteen (15) days after its passage and a certified copy 

shall be posted in the office of the MFPD pursuant to Government Code Section 36933(c) (1). 

The above Ordinance was introduced at a meeting of the Board of Directors of the Ml-PD on 

December 22, 2022, and it was then read for the first time. A public hearing was set for the 

Ordinance to be read for the second time on January 26, 2023, and approved by the following 

vote: 

Ordinance 2022-09 Page 22 

23-1589 G 25 of 55



PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of Directors of the MFPD this, 

Januaiy, 2023. 

AYES: 

NOES: 

ABSENT: 

ABSTAIN:_ 

, Board President 

ATTEST: 

-
Sharlyn Fields , Board Secretary 

Ordinance 2022-0 9 

26th day of 

Page 23 

23-1589 G 26 of 55



RESOLUTION 22-10 

A RESOLUTION OF THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS OF THE 
MOSQUITO FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT 

ADOPTING FINDINGS SUPPORTING AMENDMENTS TO 
THE CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE 

A resolution for the Mosquito Fire Protection District setting forth findings with respect to 
local conditions within the Fire District which make certain modifications and changes to 
the California Fire Code reasonably necessary for preserving fire and life safety in the 
Mosquito Fire Protection District 

The Governing Board of the Mosquito Fire Protection District finds and resolves as 
follows: 

WHEREAS, Health & Safety Code Section 17958.5 permits a Fire Protection 
District to adopt an ordinance which changes or modifies the State Housing regulations 
adopted pursuant to Health & Safety Code Section 17922 upon determination that such 
changes or modifications are necessary due to iocal conditions that pertain regulations 
governing conditions hazardous to life, property and the environment from fire, explosion, 
hazardous materials and hazardous uses; and 

WHEREAS, Health & Safety Code Section 17958.7 requires that a District's Board 
of Directors making any changes or modifications pursuant to Health & Safety Code 
Section 17958.5 shall make express finding that such changes or modifications are needed; 
and shall file a copy of such changes or modifications with the Department of Housing and 
Community Development. 

WHEREAS, the unique local climatic, geological, and topographical conditions 
existing within the boundaries of the District make it reasonably necessary for the District to 
impose more stringent requirements than set forth in the California Fire Code and pursuant 
to California Health and Safety Code sections 13869.7 and 17958.7, the District 
desires to make express findings to that effort 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that the Board of Directors of the 
Mosquito Fire Protection District, after having duly noticed and held public hearings, hereby 
adopts the following findings concerning current unique local conditions that 
together maim each modification to the California Fire Code, reasonably necessary to 
provide adequate and effective protection of life, property and the environment more 
specifically set forth as follows: 

-1-

23-1589 G 27 of 55



FINDINGS OF FACT 
FOR CHANGES OR MODIFICATIONS TO THE STATE BUILDING 

STANDARDS CODE (TITLE 24 PART 9) BECAUSE OF LOCAL 
CONDITIONS 

A. General. 

After due consideration, the Board of Directors of the Mosquito Fire Protection District, 
hereby finds that due to local climatic, geologic and topographic conditions, as stated within 
this document, there is a need to provide the modifications and change contained in the 
adoptive Ordinance of the California Fire Code. Such changes are deemed to be reasonably 
necessary to provide adequate and effective protection of life, property, and the 
environment. 

The Mosquito Fire Protection District provides fire protection, emergency medical 
services, and specialized rescue services to approximately 2,500 people in a 13 square mile 
area. The District is located on the Western slope of El Dorado County. The 
topography of the District ranges from rolling hills of grass, oak woodland, large 
quantities of brush, and steep drainages. The weather conditions vary from freezing 
temperatures with occasional snow in winter, to summer temperatures that regularly 
exceed 100 degrees. 

The Mosquito Fire Protection District is an "all-risk" agency. The District participates in a 
sophisticated mutual aid program and is dispatched through agreement by the California 
Department of Forestry and Fire Protection (Cal-Fire) at Camino. The resources of the 
District will respond to, and deal with, any type of emergency. The term "Fire 
Protection" in this document is broad and includes responses to fires, smoke, and odor 
investigations, alarms, public assist calls, hazardous materials incidents, medical aid, and 
specialized rescues. 

The District has one staffed fire station to provide emergency service to the community. Fire 
Station 75 is located at 8801 Rock Creek Road. The District has 2 full-time, career 
personnel, along with 1 part time management position, and these are supplemented with a 
volunteer Assistant Chief, Engine Company Officers and Firefighters. 

B. Climatic. 

The Mosquito Fire Protection District is located within a foothill region. The District is 
subject to four seasons, with an annual snowfall in the winter months of 2-4 inches, in 
addition to an average rainfall of 39 inches per year. These adverse weather conditions 
create severe hazardous road conditions and flooding as well as rockslide hazards along the 
main access roads within, as well as into, the District from the smTounding areas. Due to 
periods of rainfall, along with repeated road closures, the ability of the Fire Protection 

-2-

23-1589 G 28 of 55



District to provide immediate emergency response is often delayed. These same adverse 
climatic conditions often result in a large number of vehicular accidents that place 
extreme restraints on the availability of emergency response to perform emergency 
rescue, first aid, hazardous materials control, and firefighting. The climatic conditions 
often result in a substantial or total lack of ability of the Fire Protection District to 
respond immediately to other types of emergency situations that occur. Examples of these 
emergency situations include structure fires, wildland and forest fires, flooding, 
hazardous materials incidents, emergency medical calls, vehicle accidents, and vertical 
rescues. The mutual aid agreements established with adjoining fire agencies might not be 
possible due to adverse climatic conditions, restricting or totally blocking access into the 
District. 

Summary: 

These local climatic conditions affect the acceleration, intensity, and size of fires in the Fire 
District. Times of little or no rainfall, low humidity, and high temperatures create 
extremely hazardous conditions, particularly as they relate to the wildland-urban 
interface. Winds experienced in this area can have a significant impact upon structure fires, 
especially in buildings in close proximity to one another, and to wildlands 
commonly found in the Mosquito Fire Protection District. Structures built within the 
Mosquito Fire Protection District must be built with these variables in mind 

C. Geological. 

The Mosquito Fire Protection District is located within moderate seismic Zone Three. The 
seismic, geological conditions present a potential for multiple fires, major breakage of water 
mains, multiple electrical power failures, multiple collapsed structures and a large number 
of calls for emergency medical aid, all of which may occur simultaneously during a seismic 
event. The water district has numerous water-pumping systems used for fire suppression 
water delivery, as well as water storage tanks providing water system pressure. Most of the 
pumping systems are dependent on electrical power for operation. Such electrical power 
may not be available during a seismic event. Water storage tanks used for storage of 
required fire suppression water may also collapse in such an event forcing the additional 
need to transport water via additional pieces of fire apparatus which will place a significant 
restraint on the ability of the District to provide the required emergency services. 

Summary: 

Local geographic and geological features and processes exist within the boundaries of the 
Districts that may hamper the ability of the Mosquito Fire Protection District to perform its 
sworn duties. Fire following an earthquake has the potential of causing greater loss of life 
and damage than the earthqualce itself. 

-3-

23-1589 G 29 of 55



D. Topographical. 

The District is primarily composed of areas that are considered by the State to be high fire 
hazard severity zones. Much of the hill is located within foothill terrain, covered with highly 
combustible vegetation, including the presence of many coniferous forested areas. The 
elevation within the District ranges from approximately 800 feet to over 3200 feet at the 
highest point. Slope within the District ranges from 0 to 90 degrees. The structures within 
the areas of the foothill's terrain have very limited fire access, due to narrow 
roadways with steep grades and poor road surface conditions. The presences of many 
existing structures within the high fire severity zone areas provides for a very high 
potential of a structure fire spreading into a wildland or forest fire condition as well as the 
potential for a wildland or forest fire spreading to structures. 

Summary: 

The alignment of canyons, valleys, and slopes into inhabited areas, combined with the 
variable nature of the terrain, yield potential for increased fire risk. Most structures, both 
residential and commercial, are in or are surrounded by areas that contain significant grass, 
brush, mixed oak woodland, and mixed conifer fuel load. Due to drought 
conditions, beetle infestations, and lack of vegetation management, much of the area is 
populated with either dead or dying trees, contributing to extreme fire danger. 

E. Conclusion 

Local climatic, geographic, and topographic conditions described above increase the 
frequency, intensity, and size of fires involving buildings in the Fire District. Further, these 
conditions impact potential damage to structures from an earthquake and 
subsequent fire. Therefore, it is reasonably necessary that the California Fire Code be 
modified to mitigate the effects of the above conditions. California Health & Safety Code 
Section 17958.7 requires that modifications to the Fire Code be expressly marked and 
identified as to which each finding refers to which Code modification. The attached 
Appendix A provides this connection. 

-4-

23-1589 G 30 of 55



PASSED AND ADOPTED at a regular meeting of the Board of Directors of the 
Mosquito Fire Protection District on January 26, 2023 by the following roll call vote: 

AYES: 

NOES: 

ABSENT: 

ABSTAIN: 

ATTEST: BY: 

Sharlyn Fields, Board Clerk Don Stever, Board President 

-5-

23-1589 G 31 of 55



MOSQUITO FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT 

12 022 CFC Code Section Title Adopted Amended Added Deleted Finding I 
I 

01.1 ';cneral X \.dministrative I 
102.6- 102.12 t:,\pplicability X !Administrative ! 
104.1 )uties and X lriministrativc I 

I 
>owcrs I 

04.3-104.4 )uties and X !Administrative l 
1>owcrs I 

'04.6 )fficial Records X \dministrativc I 
04.8 - 104.8.2 !Approved X 1 ~dministrative 

~atcrials I 

04.9 Modifications X !Administrative 

04.11 - 104.12.3 fire X !Administrative I 
l!nvestigation ·1 I 

'05.2.3 tnmc of X IA cl min istrntivc 
~pplication I l 

'05.3.2 ~xtcnsions X I !Administrative I 

I I 

05.5 )pcrational !Administrative I 
'cnnits I 

05.5.55 li\utomobile ~ i\.dministrative 
I I !Wrecking Yards 

~os.6 t:onstruction X ljdministrative ' 'cnnits 

~05.6.25 ! \utomobile xi t\dministrativc 
!Wrecking Ynrds 

'05.6.9 ◄ucl Cell X \\dministrativc I 

05.6.12 -Jazardous X 

I 
1 \dmiuistrative I 

I Vlatcrials I 
105.17 !Plant Extraction X IAdministrnth·c 

05.18 1 'rivatc Fire X I !Administrative 
I lydrnnts ·1 

I 

'05.19 Smoke Control X l~\dministrntivc 
'• 

'05.6.21 >pccial Event X !Administrative 
,tructurc ·1 

05.6.22 ipraying or X !Administrative 
)ipping I 

'05.6.23 ;;tandpipc X !Administrative ' 

I 
I 

~ystcms I 

Resolution No: 2022-10 

23-1589 G 32 of 55



J\ilOSQUITO FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT 

12022 CFC Code Section Title Adopted Amended Added Deleted Finding 

105.6.24 tf cnts X Administrative 

106.1 - 106.4 Construction X Administrative 

Documents 

107.J Fees X Administrative 

107.5 Related Fees X Administrative i 

107.5.1 Cost Recovery X Administrative 

107.6 Refunds X Administrative 

107.7 Administrative X Administrative 

Costs I 
Sectio11 108 Inspections X Administrative 

Section 109 Maintenance X Administrative 

111.5 11-\ppeals )i jAdministrativc I 
112.4 Violation X Administrative 

I Penalties 

112.4.] Abatement of X Administrative 
I I 
Violations I 

I 

112.4.2 Citations X Administrative 

Section 113 Stop Work Administrative 
Order I 

113.4 Failure to X Administrative 

Comply 
I 
I 

Section 114 Unsafe X Administrative 
Structures 

' 
202 ll<•finitions X Administrative I 

I 

Section 302 Definitions Administrative I 

I 

Section 303 Asphalt Kettles !Al, A2, A3, Bl, B:?. B3. B4, BS, 
~6 I 

302.1 Definitions X )Administrative 

Section 304 Combustible X Al, A2, A3, Bl, 82. B3. 84, BS1 

Waste B6 

I 

Resolution No: 2022-10 

23-1589 G 33 of 55



MOSQUITO FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT 

2022 CFC Code Sectio11 Title Adopted Ameudetl Added Deleted Finding ! 
I 

Section 305 Ignition Sources X Al, A2, A3, Bl, B2. B3. 84, BS, 
B6 I 

Section 306 Motion Picture X Bl, B2. B3. B4, BS, B6 I 
Section 307 Open Buruing X Al, A2, A3, Bl, B2. B3. B4, BS,I 

I 

86 I 

307.4.4 Open Burning X Al, A2, A3, Bl, B2. B3. 84, BS,! 
86 

Section 308 Open Flames X Al, A2, A3, BI, B2. B3. B4, BS, 
86 

Section 309 Powered X Al, A2, A3, Bl, B2. B3. 84, BS, 
lndustri:tl B6 
frucks 

Section 310 Smoking X A 1, A2, A3, Bl, B2. B3. B4, BS, 
B6 

Section 31 I Vacant Premises X. Al, A2, A3, Bl, B2. B3. B4, BS, 
86 

Section 320 3D Printing X Bl, B2. B3. B4, BS, B6 
Section 321 Artificial X Al, A2, A3, Bl, B2. B3. B4, BS, 

Vegetation 86 
403.2 - 403.2.4 Group A X Al, A2, A3, Bl, B2. B3. B4, BS, 

86 
403.6 - 403.6.1.4 Group F "\,: Al, A2, A3, Bl, B2. B3. B4, BS, 

B6 
403.9 - 403.9.3.4 Group R X Al, A2, A3, BI, B2. B3. 84, BS, 

B6 
503.2.] Dimensions X Al, A2, A3, Bl, B2. B3. B4, BS, 

86 
503.2.5 Dead Ends X IAI, A2, A3, Bl, B2. B3. B4, BS, 

B6 
503.2.6 Bridges X Al, A2, A3, Bl, B2. B3. B4, BS

1 

B(, 
503.3.1 No Parking- ) rl,A2,A3,Bl,B2. B3. B4,B5, 

Fire l,:mes 86 
503.3.2 No Parking- X Al, A2, A3, Bl, B2. B3. B4, BS, 

Fire Hydrants 86 
- "" 

- ---, 

Resolution No: 2022- 10 

23-1589 G 34 of 55



MOSQUITO FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT 

2022 CFC Code Section Title Adopted Amended Added Deleted Fi11ding 

503.3.3 Fire Laue Width X Al, A2, A3, Bl, B2. B3. B4, BS, 
86 

503.6 Security Gates X A I, A2, A3, Bl, B2. B3. B4, BS, 
B6 

505.1 Address X A I, A2, A3, Bl, B2. B3. B4, BS, 
B6 

507.5.1 Where Required X Al, A2, A3, Bl, B2. B3. B4, BS, 
- Fire IJydrants 136 

509.3 Fire Control X Bl, B2. B3. 84, BS, B6 
Rooms 

807.5.2 Group~ X Bl, 82. B3. B4, BS, B6 

903.2 Where Required X rl, A2, A3, Bl, B2. B3. B4, BS, 
._ Fire Spriulclcrs 86 

903.2.1.1 Group A X Al, A2, A\ Bl, B2. B3. 84, BS, 
136 

903.2.1.2 Group A-2 X Al, A2, A3, Bl, B2. B3. B4, 85, 
86 

903.2.l.3 Group A-3 X A 1, A2, A3, Bl, B2. B3. B4, BS, 
B6 

903.2.1.4 Group A-4 X Al, A2, A3, Bl, B2. B3. B4, BS, 
86 

903.2.3 Group E X Al, A2, A3. Bl, B2. B3. B4, BS, 
86 

903.2.4 Group F-1 X A 1, A2, A3. Bl, B2. B3. 84, BS, 
B6 

903.2.7 Group M X Al, A2, A3, BI, B2. B3. B4, BS, 
B6 

903.2.7.2 Group M- X Al, A2, A3, Bl, 82. B3. B4, BS, 
Mattresses B6 

Resolution No: 2022-03 

23-1589 G 35 of 55



MOSQUITO FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT 

2022 CFC Code Section Title Adopted Ame11ded Added Deleted Finding I 
I 

903.2.8.5 Manufactured )I Al, A2, A3, Bl, B2, 

Homes ls3, B4, BS, B6 

903.2.9 Group S-1 X r1, A2, A3, 81, B2. B3. B4, BS, 
B6 

903.2.10 Group S-2 X Al, A2, A3, Bl, B2. B3. B4, BS, 
B6 

903.2.10.l Parking Garages X IA 1, A2, A3, Bl, B2. 83. B4, BS, 
B6 

903.2.22 Group B X Al, A2, A3, Bl, B2. 83. B4, BS, 
86 

903.2.23 Group F-2 X A 1, A2, A3, Bl, 82. 83. 84, BS, 

86 

903.6 Where Required X A1,A2,A3,BJ,B2. 83. 84,85, 
I I" S . 11 

I r ◄ i re pnn { ers !B6 
907.2 Where Rcc1uircd X Al, A2, A3, Bl, B2. B3. B4, BS, 

.... Vire Alarm B6 
Systems 

907.2.1.4 Group A X A 1, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5, 

186 
907.2.2.3 Group B X Al, A2, A3, Bl, B2. B3. B4, B51 

B6 

907.2.3.11 Group E X Al, A2, A3, Bl, B2. B3. 84, BS, 

86 
907.2.4.1 Group F-1 X A I, A2, :\3, Bl, B2. B3. 84, BS, 

jBCl 
907.2.5.2 Group H X Al, A2, A3, Bl, 82. B3. B4, BS, 

B6 

907.2.6.6 Group I )i Al, A2, A3, Bl, B2. B3. B4, BS, 
B6 

907.2.7.2 Group M ~ Al, A2, :\3, Bl, B2. B3. 84, 85, 

Jn6 
907.2.8.4 Group R-1 ) lAl, A2, A3, Bl, B2. B3. B4, 85, 

B6 

Resolution No: 2022-10 

23-1589 G 36 of 55



MOSQUITO FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT 
-· 

2022 CFC Code Sectio11 Title Adopted Amended Added Deleted Filldillg I 

907.2.9.4 Group R-2, R- )< Al, A2, A3, Bl, 82. B3. 84, BS, 
2.1, R-2.2 B6 

907.2.10.1 Group S X Al, A2, A3, Bl, 82. B3. B4, BS, 
B6 

907.2.30 Type I Hoods X Bl, B2. B3. B4, BS, B6 

907.6.5 Monitoring X Bl, B2. B3. B4, BS, B6 

907.6.2.l Secondary Power X Al,A2,A3,Bl,B2. B3. B4, 85, 

Supply 86 

907.9 Where Required X Al , A2, A3, Bl, B2. B3. B4, BS, 
..... Fire Alarm B6 

Section 1101 Gencrnl X Al , A2, A3, Bl, B2. B3. B4, BS, 
86 

Section 1102 Definitions X At, A2, A3, Bl, B2. B3. B4, BS, 
B6 

1103.2 Responder X Al, A2, A3, Bl, B2. B3. B4, BS, 
Communication B6 

1103.5 - 1103.5.5 Sprinkler X Al, A2, A3, Bl, B2. B3. B4, BS, 
Systems B6 

J 103.7 - 1103.7.9.10 Fire Alarm X AJ, A2, A3, Bl, B2. B3. B4, BS, 
Systems B6 

1103.8 - 1103.8.5.3 Smoke Alarms X AJ, A2, A3, Bl, B2. 83. B4, BS, 

JB6 
1103.9 - 1103.9.1 Carbon X A I, A2, A3, Bl, 82. B3. B4, BS, 

Monoxide B6 
Alarms 

Section l l 04 Egress X Bl, B2. B3. B4, BS, B6 

Section l I 06 Outdoor X !Al, A2, A3, Bl, B2. B3. B4, 85, 
Operations B6 

1203.1.3 Installation X A 1, A2, A3, BI, B2. B3. B4, BS, 
B6 

3311.3 Address X Al, A2, A3, BI, 82. B3. 84, BS, 

I B6 

3313.1 When Required - X Al, A2, A3, Bl, 82. B3. B4, BS, 
Water Supply B6 

Resolution No: 2022- 10 

23-1589 G 37 of 55



MOSQUITO FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT 

12022 CFC Code Sectioll Title Adopted Amended Added Deleted FindinJ! I 

5001.7 Liability for r Administrative 
Damages 

5601.2 Permit Required X Administrative - . 
5704.2.9.6.1 Locations - X Al, A2, A3, Bl, B2. B3. 84, 85, 

!Above Ground B6 
Tanks 

5706.2.4.4 Locations - X Al, A2, A3, Bl, B2. B3. B4, B5, 
!Above Ground 86 
Tanks 

. . 

5806.2 Limitations X Al, A2, A3, Bl, B2. B3. B4, B5, 
86 

6104.2 Maxinmm X ~I, A2, A3, Bl, B2. B3. 84, 85, 
Capacity 6 

Chapter 80 lcfcrcnced X rl, A2, A3, Bl, B2. B3. B-', B5, 
Standards B6 

Appendix B Fire Flow - X Al, A2, A3, Bl, B2. B3. B4, BS, 
!'able 8105.1 (1) Residential B6 
Appendix B Fire Flow - X Al, A2, A3, Bl, B2. B3. 8-', B5, 
Table B105.2 Commercial B6 
Appendix D Fire Apparatus X !AI, A2, A3, BJ, B2. 83. B4, BS, 

. 
(Access Roads IB6 

Appendix D, !Access Road X 1:~,A2,A3,Bl,B2. B3. B4,B5,1 
0103.1 !Width 

Appendix D, Grade X rl, A2, A3, Bl, 82. B3. B4, B5, 
D103.2 86 
Appendix D, I'uruing Radius X \A J, A2, A3, BI, B2. B3. B-', B5, 
D103.3 86 

Appendix D, ates X \Al, A.2, A3, Bl, B2. B3. B4, B5, 
D103.5 86 
Appendix D, IFirc Lane X Al, A2, A3, Bl, 82. B3. 84, B5, 
D103.6.1 (Marking 86 

Appendix D, Fire Lane X ~1, A2, A3, Bl, B2. B3. B4, B5, 
D103.6.2 M~rking 6 
Appendix D, Cir cu mforcntial X \Al, A2, A3, Bl, B2. B3. B-', B5, 
D104.4 Fire Access tl36 

Resolution No: 2022-10 

23-1589 G 38 of 55



EDHCWD, DSP, ECF, CPCSO, PFl'D, RFPD MFPD 

'SiQiitlleant "' '' ; I( ' ;, ' "f ~· Locally'adOP'ted iSFf;, .tdoplcd I ' 
,. 

Fire Coda# What Is the Change? Why Is There 3 Local Change? 
, change? ' \ ·" ,,. Amended 

101.1 N Amend v.ilh lhe name of the Jurisdiction Locally adopted and amended Admlnlslralive need 

105.5 N 
Amend lo Include addlOon of Automobile Wrecking 

Locally adopted and amended Administrative need due lo addiUon or section 105.5,55. 
Yard operational permit 

Allows the fire code official to enforce the fire code (specific 

Add seclion to require operational permit for lo fire access, vegetation clearances, hazardous materials, 
105,6.55 y 

Automobile Wrecking Yards. 
Locally l:fealed and ado pied elc.), within aulomobUe wrecking yard operations. This was 

a demons!rated need experienced wUhin the Diamond 
Sp1lngs Fire Department 

105.6 N 
Add section to require construc!ion permit for 

locally created and adopted 
Admlnislralive need due to addilion o( section 105,6.25 and 

Automobile Wrecking Yards. 105.626. 

Altows !he fire code ollicial ta enrorce the lire code (specific 

105.6.25 y Add seclion to require construction permit for 
Locallycrealed and adopted lo fire access, vegetation clearances, hazardous maletlafs, 

Automobile Wrecking Yards. etc.)within newly conslruded and/or modifiedaulamobile 
wtecklng yard opera1ions .• 

Allows Ille fire code o!ficial lo review Md approved traffic 

Add section lo requifeconslrucllon pennil for lhe carmino devices prior to insla!la\ion. Fire Code currenlly 
105.6.26 N 

inslallallon of lm!fic calming devices locally crea\ed and adopled pennlts the fire code official to regulate traffic. calming 
devices. However, a permit isn't curren\ly requlredplior lo 
installation causing undue hardsh'lp lo 

Adapting !his seclion lo allow for !he creation and Issuance 

107.5 N Section Added, Previaustysecl!on106,6. Locally adopted and amended 
of fees to cover actual cos1s. Seclion 105.6 defines pennlls, 
plan checks, and tnspecUans as allowed in Heallh &Safety 
Code 17951. 

107.5.1 N Section added, Previously section 106.6.1 Locally created and adopted 
Section 107.5.1 Cost Recovery Fees: To mcoverlhe cos! lo 
lhe Fire Dislrlct. 

107.7 y Section added. Previously section 106.7 locally created and adopted 
Section 107 .7 To recover the actual costs of avoidable 
failed inspecUons byconlraclors. 

Section 111.5of Chapter 1 of the Fire Cade of !he District is 
added lo read as follows: 
111.5 Appeal Procadures and Tfmelines: The lnlent of !his 
provision is to clarify lhe procedures and Umelines fer an 

111.5 y Section added. Previously seclion 109.4 Locally adopted and amended individual or entity to file an appeal to lhe Board of Appears 
regarding an order, decision. ordelermination by the Fire 
Code Official. Based on !he County of El Dorado's 
Vegetation Management Ordinance Board of Appeals' 
time!ine. 

ProViously section 110.4, Completed lhe secllon by 
Allows lhe Fire Code Official lo enforce the Fire Code Iha\ 
pro\ects life and property. Fees have been updated la 

112.4 N filllng In the blank portions lhal were no! campteted 
Locally adapted and amended malch the fees and penalties as deemed appropriate by the by !he SFM.11 is better left lofocaliUes to de!ermlne 

lhe fees/penames for their respective areas Dis!ricl A\lomey's Office. The change to \he language to 
include the lerm infractions. 

112.4.2 Citalions is added to read as fallows: 112.4.2 
Cilalions 
The Fire Chief or hlsfner duly authorized representalive(s), 

112.4.2 N Section added. Previaulsy section 110.4. Local]y created andadop{ed 
may issue cl!atlons far infractions or misdemeanor 
vlolallons of this code purauant lo SecUon 13871 of the 
Health and Safely Code oflhe State of California and 
Chapter 5c (commencing with section 853.6) ofTitle 3 of 
Part2 of the Pena! Code of lhe Stale ofCanromia. 

Previously secllon 112.4, Completed lheseclion by 
rn11ng in the blank porllons that were no! compleled All vlalaUons of the code have been consolidated under 

113.4 N by lhe SFM. ll is better len lo localilies to Locallyadopted and amended Section 112.4 to indude 1he penalUes for viola!ions. 
de\ermine lhefesslpenallies for lheirrospec!ive 
areas 

23-1589 G 39 of 55



Added definitions for. Campfire, Driveway, Dis Irie!, 
Execufive Body, Fire Chief, FiTe Hazard, Open Bum!ng, and 

202 N Added definitions for clarity Locally created and adopted Trained Crowd Manager. DeHnillon of open burning shall 
no! include resklenlfal LPG, natural gas fueled, or wood 
burning appliances nor ceremonlal burning. 

302.1 N Added definition of campfire 10 Sec Hon locally created and adopted Added definition for clarily. 

Added a section for open burning restrictions. Due to !he high fire danger lhal exists in El Dorado County 
307AA y Language clarified from campfire to open burning to 

Locally c,eated and adopted we have \Willen more stringent rules pertaining to open fires 
encompass full scope of open burning wilhin grass, brosh, and tree covered areas. 
requiremenls. 

Added secfion lo require pre-fire plans for new 
Provides the creation of a lloorpfan for !he puipose or 

401.2.1 N locally created and adopted emergency planning to be ulinzed by emergency response 
andor modified construction. personnel. 

Fire apparatus are becoming larger and laUer. A vertical 
clearance or 15 feet provides proper clearance for 
apparatus lo pass under without damaging apparatus 
components. II also allows an extended lime frame before 

Changed vertical clearances to 15 feet and road 
having 10 recul !he growth of !he vegetation. Addillonal 

5032.1 N Locally adopted and amended height forvcgelallon clearances acts as an increased buffer 
wid!hs to 20 feel fort he spread of foe. A road width of 20 reel excfusive of 

shoulders, as measured face of cu,b to face of curb Is 
needed. Thesestruclures can be difficull to navigate with 
lire apparalus alXI should not be counted in the lolal 
driv.ible re.id surface. 

Added a specific section for R3's where ll allows the 
Fire awaratus require areas for turning around when 

Fire Code and Tille 14 Fire Safe Regula lions {o 
mu\Up!e vehicles are on the scene of an emeigency, This 

5032.5 N malch as !hey require lumarounds for fire apparatus 
Locally adopted and amended Includes fire vehicles as well as civilian vehicles. Provides 

access roads and driveways 
beUer access for Ingress/egress. Add!Uona\ly, adds tum 
around forapparatus in driveways greaterlhan 150'. 

Allows codes and standards for Bridges and Elevated 
Changed lhe secllon for Bridges and Elevaled Surfaces of El Dorado County and Appendix D of lhe 

503.2.6 N Surfaces to sIaIe and match El Dorado County 
Locally adopted and amended 

current Fire Cade, whichever is more reslricHve, lo be 
Transportation Division In add~ion ta AASHTO HB- cansis!ent throughout county agencies and is alloWed as an 
17 (minimum CFC required} a1temaIe means & method that Is not lessreslriclive lhan 

the Flre Code, 

503,3.1 N 
Previously seclfon 503.4.2.Added section regarding 

Locally created and adopted 
This section c!earfy defines the "No Parking in Fire Lanes~ 

no parkfng In fire lanes rules and is consistenl with 1he California Vehlcle Code. 

Previously secl!on 503.4.3, Added seclion regarding This section cleartydefines lhe ~No Parking In rronl of fire 
503,3.2 N 

no parking in rronl of hydrants 
Locally created and adop!ed hydranIs· rules and is consis!enl wilh !he California Veh[cle 

Code. 

Previously secfion 503.4,4. Added seclion regarding 
This secHon c!eariy defines California Fire Code Appendix D 

503.3.3 N fire lanes based on road wid1h Locally ere a led and adopted as lhe reference for road lane w!dlh and lhe!r relation to fire 
lanes. 

Previously seclion 503,5.3. Created and adopted 
Altows fim districts the authority ta approve gates on 

503.6 lo mainlaln emergency access and 
503.6 N consistency through all roadway gales in El Dorado locally created and adapted 

roadways based on \he Dislricfs gate s!andard, providing 

County, referring lo the gale standardsadopled by the besl possible emergency access lo mainlafn fast 

the FPO's response limes. 

505.1 N Added section pe~alnlng lo the visual addressing of 
Locally adopted and amended 

Allows fire dislricls the authorily lo approve addressing 
buildings based on the Dlslrtcfs addressing standards. 

Added more conseivaliveslandard for lhe 
Commerc'1al properties are required lo lnslall hydrants at 

507,5.1 N placement of hydranls and I heir relaUonshlp lo Locally adopted and amended 
300 foot inlervals, thus they should never be oulslde of 150 
feet from any given hydrant al anyllme (half the dis!ance 

commemial buildings inbetween}. 

23-1589 G 40 of 55



Buildings are ge\fing more sizable in the county. !tis more 
common lo have new buildings with solar arrays that 
conHnue to generate power even tW'len !he buildings 

Added verbiage to bring all of lhe necessaryfire 
general utilities have been shul off, When there ls an 

5092 y locally created and ado pied emergency, it isvilal Iha! we have rapid access to all of the 
controls for a buildlng lo one locatron controls in one location for public evacuation and firefighter 

safety. Due to the Ore danger present in El Dorado County 
throughout most of the year, !his change is appropn'ate and 
advisable, 

510.4.22 y Emergency Responder Radio Sys I em Secondary Locally adopted and amended 
Amend lo 72 hour capacity for back.up power due to 

PowerSupply Modiflcallon weal her and PG&E safely related power outages. 

Adds a requirementforsprinklersyslem inslallalion Admintstrafive need due lo addition of section 903.2.22 and 
9032 N in nrm bulldings and slroclures 3,600 square feet or locally adopted and amended 903.2,23. 

grealerwilhln the district 

Due to lhe topographic, climaHc, and geographic conditions 

P,eviously seclion 903.2.1. Adds a requirement ror 
of El Dorado County and lheircontribuling faclars lo our 
increased respcnse limes, along with the fact that fires 

903.2.1.1 N 
sprinkler system !nslallaUon in new Group A locally adopled and amended double In size each and every minute, we require sprinkfers 
buildfngs and structures 3,600 square !eel or to be Installed in struc!uresonce they reach 3,600 square 
grealer within !he dislricl reet In size as lhey relate to fire behavior and rate of 

spread, 

oue lo !he topographic, dimalic, and geographic condifions 

Previouslysec!fon 903.2.f. Adds a requirement for 
of El Dorado County and !heir conltibuling factors ta our 

sprtnklersys!ern lnsla!lal!on in new GroupA-1 
increased response times, along with the fact that firos 

903.2.1.2 N 
buildings and structures 3,600 square feet or 

locally adopted and amended double in size each and every minute, we require splinkJers 
to be installed in structures once !hey reach 3,600 square grea!erwllhln lhedlslrict 
feel in size as they relale to fire behavior and rate of 
spread. 

oue lo !he toPographic, climaUc, and geographic conditions 

Previously section 903.2.1. Adds a requirement for of El Dorado County and their contcibuUng factors lo our 

sprinkler system installation In new Group A-2 Increased response times, along with the fact that fires 
903.2.1.3 N buildings and struclures 3,600 square feel or locally adapted and amended double in size each and every minute, we require sprfnklers 

greaterwilhin lhedistricl 
to be fnstalled in slruclures once they reach 3,600 square 
feet In size as they relale to fire behavior and rate of 
spread. 

Que to the !opographlc, climatic, and geographic condi!ions 

Previously section 903,2.1. Adds a requirement for of El Dorado County and !heir conlribuling factors to our 

sprinkler system inslallati<m in new Group A.!J increased respoose Umes,alongwilh the ractthat fires 
903,2,1.4 N 

buildings and struclures 3,600 square feet or 
locally adapled and amemfed doub[e in size each and every minute, we require sprinkle1s 

greaten•1~hin lhe dislricl lo be Installed In slructures once they reach 3,600 square 
feet in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of 
spread. 

Due to U1e topographic, cfimallc, and geographic conditions 

Pcevlously sedion 903.2.3. Adds a requirement for or El Dorado County aOO I heir conlribuling factors to our 

sprlnkter system ins\aValion in new Group E increased response limes, along with the facl that flres 
903.2.3 N 

bull dings and s!ruc!ures 3,600 square feel or 
locally ado pied and amended double In size each and eveiy minute, we require sprinklers 

greater within the d!slrict 10 beinslaUed inslructuresonce they reach 3,600 square 
feet In size as !hey relate to fire behavior and rate of 
spread, 

Due to !he topographic, climatic, and geographic condllions 
of El Dorado County and their conllibutlng factors lo our 

Adds a requirement for sprinkler system inslallalion Increased response times, a!ong wilh the fact that fires 
903.2.4 N in new Group F buildings and struclurea3,600 locally adopted and amended double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers 

square feel or greater w11hln !he dislric! to be inslalted In s!rucluresonce they reach 3.600square 
reel in slze as they relate to fire behavior and rale of 
spread, 

Due to the lopographic, climaUc, and geographic conditions 
of El Dorado Coonly and lheir con1ribu11ng faciors la our 

Adds a requirement for sprinkler system installation increased response times, along wllh lhe fact that fires 
903.2,7 N In new Group M buildings and structures 3,600 localy adopted and amended double In s·1ze each and every minute, we require sprinklers 

square feet or grea!erwllh!n lhe dislricl to be installed In sln,c\U(es once they reach 3,600 square 
feet in si1.e as they relate to fire behavior and rate of 
spread. 

23-1589 G 41 of 55



Due to the lopograph!c, cRmatic, and geographic condinons 
Previously secUon 903.2.7. Atkls a requirement for of El Dorado County and their conlributing factors to our 
sp,lnkler system inslal!alion In new Group M with increased response limes, along with the fact that fires 

903.2.7.2 N Upholstered Furniture or MaUresses buildings and locallyadopledand amended double in size each and every minute, we require spllnklers 
structures 3,600 square feel or greater wilhin lhe to be Installed in shuctures once lhey reach 3,600 square 
district feet ln s·1ze as they rel ale lo fie behaWor and rate of 

spread. 

Manufac!ured Homes- The intent of this code seclion Is to 
ensure 1hal manufactured homes that serve as a one or two 
family dwellings are consistent Wilh the provisions found In 
CRCSeclion 313 pellaining lo buill dwellings of a simHar 

Previously seclion 903.2.8.2.This section was 
nature. Manufactured homes placed in the wild/and-urban 
interface have a heightened risk of rapid lire consumplion 

903.2.B.5 N created to include manufactured reside nil al single locallyadopled and amended due (o the light-weight nature of their conslruciion. The 
faml!y R-3 in the residential sprinkler program. rapid ffre spread throughout these structures presents a 

significant risk tolhelroccupanls. Residential sprinkler 
systems have been incorporated lo decrease this risk 
successf uHy in many Calif omia communities, 

Due lo !he topographic. climalic, and geographic condiUons 

P1evlous!ysec\ipn 903.2,9.Adds a requirement for 
of El Dorado County and lheirconlribuling factors to our 

sprinkler system inslaHation in new Group S 
increased response limes, along with lhe fact that fires 

9032S N bu!ldings and structures 3,600 square feel or 
LocaUy adop!ed and amended doub!e in sJ2e each and every minute, we requirespl'inkleis 

greater within !he district 
to be installed in slructures once !hey reach 3,600 square 
feel In size as they ref ale to fire behavior and rate of 
spread. 

Oue to lhe topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions 

Previously sec lion 903.2. Adds a requlremenl for 
of El Dorado County and lhe!rcon!rlbulingfactors lo our 

sprinkler system inslaHaUon In new Group S-2 
·ncreased response limes, alongwilh the fact that fires 

903.2.10 N 
buildings andslrucluras 3,600 square fuel or 

Locally adopted and amended double In size each and every minule, we require sprinklers 

greater within me dislricl 
lo be Installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square 
feel in size as !hey relate to fire behavior and rate of 
sp1ead. 

Due to lhe topographic, climatic, and geographic condiUons 

Previously secHon 903.2.10. Adds a requirement for 
or El Dorado County and lhelrcontribuUngfaclois to our 

spdnkler sys!em ins1allalion in new Commercial 
increased response limes, alongwilh the fact that fires 

903.2.10.1 N 
Pamlng Garage buildings and slruclures 3,600 locally adopted and amended double in size each and eveiy minute, we require sprinklers 

square feet orgreaterwithki !he district 
to be insla!led In structures once they reach 3,600 square 
feet lo size as they relate to fire behavior and rale of 
spread. 

Due to !he lopographic, climaric, and geographic conditions 

Prevlous[ysccUon 903,2.7. Adds a requirement for of El Dorado County and theircon\ribuUng faclois to our 

sprinkler system inslallaUon In new Group B 
Increased response limes, alongwilh !he fact that fires 

903.2,22 N 
buildings and st,uctures 3,600 square feel or 

locally adopted and amended double in size each and ev8f}'minule, we require sprinklers 

grealerwil.hin lhe dis!ricl 
to be inslafled(nslrucluresonce they reach 3,600 square 
reet in size as they relate lo fire behavior and rate or 
spread. 

Due lo the topographic, clfmallc, and geographic conditions 

PreWClusly secUon 903,2. Adds a requirement for 
of El Dorado County and lheircoollibul'lng f actms to our 

sprinkler system inslal!alion in new Group F-2 
Increased response times, aloog with !he fact that fires 

903.2.23 N 
buildings and structures 31600 square feel or 

Localty adopted and amended double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers 

greater within the districl 
lo be Installed in structures once lhey reach 3,600 square 
feel in size as !hey relate lo fire behavior and rate or 
spread, 

Previously section 903.2a, Adds a requirement fo Due to the topographlc, ciimatiG, and geographic conditions 
Install sprink!e,s rorexisling buildings lhal undergo or El Dorado County and their conlribuling factors lo our 
a change In use of grea!er hazard or an increase in increased response limes,alongwith 1he fact lhal fires 

903.6 y size greaterlhan 500 square feet and the resulling locally created and adopted double in size each and every ml nute, we require sprinklers 
square feet Is greater than 3,600 square feet. to be lnstalled in s1ruc!ures once they reach 3,600 square 
Prevlous\y applied to addition of more than 30% or reel in size as they relate to fire behavlorandrateof 
1,000 square feel. spread. 

23-1589 G 42 of 55



Adds a requirement for firo alarm system 
907.2 N lns\a!lallon In new buildings and slruc!ures 3,600 Loe.illy adopled and amended Admlnis\rallve need due to addlfion of sec1ion 903.2,30. 

square feet or Jess within the dislrict 

Previously seelion 907.2a.Added occupant 
protection for fire alarms in Group A bulldings with a 

Provides proper emergency noUfical/on for occupancies that 
9072.1.4 N 

floor area ress than 3,600, excepl R3, AG buildlngs locally created and adopted 
no! used for commercial purposes, and buildings 

allow public use and ensures Fire Departmen\ notification in 

with a floor area of less than 500 square feel as 
the event of a fire or smoke. 

approved by the fire code official 

Pcevious(y secUon 907.2a. Added occupant 
protection ror fire alarms In Group B buildingswilh a 

Pcovides proper emergency noUficallon for occupancies Iha! 
907.2.2.3 N 

floor area less than 3,600, except R3, AG bul[dings 
Locally etealed and adopted not used for commercial purposes, and bu!ldings allow pubnc use and ensures Fire Oepartmentnollfrcalfon in 

with a ffoorarea of less than 500 square feet as 
the event of a fire or smoke. 

approved by the fire code official 

Previously section 907.2a. Added occupant 
prolecUon for fire alarms in Group E buildings w'1th a 

Provides proper emergency nolifrcalion foroC<Jupancies I hat 
907.2.3.11 N 

naora,ea less than 3,600, except R3, AG buildings 
locally created and adopted not used for commerdal purposes, and buildfngs allow pubric use and ensures Fire Department nolificatlon Jn 

with a floor area of Jess than 500 square feet as 
the event of a fire or smoke. 

approved by lhe fire code official 

Previously section 907,2a, Added ocx:upanl 
p-otec«on for fire alarms In Group F buildings with a 

Provides proper emergency noliRcalion for occupancies that 
907.2.4.1 N 

floor area less than 3,600, except R3, AG bu!ldings 
locally created and adopled 

not used for commerclaJ purposes, and buildings allow public use and ensures Fire Department notification in 

wi!h a floor area ofless than 500 square feel as the event of a fire or smoke, 

approved by the fire code official 

Previouslysedlon 907,2a,Alfded occupant 
prolecUon for fire alarms In Group H buildings wi!h Provides proper emergency noUlication for occupancies that 

907,2.5.2 N 
a floor area less than 3,600, except R3, AG Locally crealed a,d adopled 
buildings not used Cor commercial purposes, and alfaw public use and ensures Fire Oepa'lmenl no~ficafion ln 

buUdings with a floor area of less than 500 square 
the event of a fire or smoke. 

feel as approved by the fi1ecode offic!al 

Previously secllon 907.2a.Added occupant 
prolecUon for fire alarms ill Group I buildings with a 

Provides proper emergency notmcal!on for occUpancles that 
907.2.6,6 N floor area less than 3,600, except R3, AG bU"1ldlngs 

Locally created and adopted 
not used for commercial purposes, and buildings 

allow public use and ensures Fire Department no!ificalion in 

with a floor area of less than 500 square feel as lhe event of a fire Of' smoke. 

approved by the fire code official 

Previously section 907.2a, Added occupant 
prolec11on for llre ala1ms in Group M buiidings wilh 

Provides proper emergency nolificaUon for occupancies that 
907.2,7.2 N a Ooorarea less !han3,6001 except R3, AG locally created and adopted 

buitdings not used for commercial purposes, and 
allo\'I pub!Jc use and ensures Fite Department nolifical!on in 

bu'1!dlngs w"ilh a Ooarareaof less lhan 500 square 
the even! of a lire or smoke. 

feel as approved by lhe fire code official 

Previously secHon 907 ,2a. Added occupant 
prolecilon for fire alaims In G1oup R~1 buikflngs Provides proper emergency notification for occupancies that 

907.2M N wllh a floor area fesslhan 3,600,excepl R3, AG Locally created and adopted 
bulldings not used for commercial purposes, and 

allow pub Uc use and ensures Fire Department nolilicaUon in 

bu'lldlngs wilh a floor area of less lhan 500 square 
lheeventofa fireorsmoke. 

feet as approved by lhe fire code official 

23-1589 G 43 of 55



Previously sec!ion 907.2a. Added occupan1 
protecfion rorfire alarms in Group R~2, R~2.1, and R 
2.2 bU!tdfngs wi!h a floor area less than 3,600, Provides proper emergency no1ificalion (or occupancies that 

907.2,9.4 N except R3, AG buildings not used for commercial locally created and adopted allow public use and ensures Fire Oepat1ment nolifica!lon in 
purposes, and buifdings wllh a floor area of less lhe event of a fire or smoke, 
lll8n 500 square feel as approved by the lire code 
officlal 

PreViously section 907,2a.Added occupant 
proteclion for fire alarms In Group S buildings wilh a Provides proper emergency nolificalion for occupancies that 

907.2.10,1 N 
floor area tess than 3,600, except R3, AG buildings Locally created and adopted allow public use and ensures Fire ~eparlmenl notification In 
not used for commercial pl.Hposes, and buifdings 
with a fioor area of tess lhan 500 square feel as 

!he event of a lire or smoke, 

approved by the fire code official 

PmviousJy secUon 907 ,2d. Added occupant Provides proper emergency nolificalion for occupancies that 
907.2.30 N 

pro!ecUon for Type 1 Hood systems to be 
Locally c1eated and adopted aUow publfc useand ensures Fire Department notilica!ion in 

connected to a monitored fJraalarmsyslemwhen the even I of a fire or smoke. 
Installed or replaced 

Provides proper response and mainlenance "runner service" 
or frre alarm systems. NFPA 72 specifies required response 
times for fire ararm trouble and supervisory sfgnals lo 

Requires nre alarm systems to be monitored by UL 
ensure systems remain operational.A Type A UL nsled 

907.6.5 y Locally created and adopted central station me els the NFPA required lire alarm response 
Ii sled Type A central s!at!on. ensuring ao operational lire alarm system at all times. 

UL Type A listing requires central stations to provide lhis 
~runner service" or con1racl with anolher en lily lo provide 
thls service lo obtain lhe !isling. 

907.6.2.1 N PrimaiySeconda{}' Afarm Power Supply Locally crealed and ado pied Amend to 72 hour capacity for back-up power due lo 
ModiRcaUon wealher and PG&E safety related powerou!ages, 

Previouslysection 907 .2b. Added occupant 
protection for existing buildings without automatic Pro'-;ides proper emergency notiflcalion for occupancies lhal 

907.9 N sprinkler systems to /nstaH a fire alann if they add Locally created and adopted allow public use and ensures F1Ie Department notification in 
more than 30¾ or1,000 square feet lo the lhe evenlof a fire or smoke. 
slruclure, wh!cheverrs less 

This sec non adds a Shunl Trip powershul off devices to 
1203.f.3 N Shunt lrip power safely devices Locally adopted and amended ensure emergency powershul off during the use of back.up 

power supplies. 

33112 N 
Previously section 3310. Address requfrements for 

Locally created and adopted 
Addressing forcons!ruction siles is important to asslst 

conslruclion siles responding emergency crews. 

3313,f N 
Previousy secUon 3312.1. Walersupplles at 

Locally adopted and amended 
Walermusl be on sile prior lo combustible material being 

construction si!es wilh combuslible maferials on•slte stored orvertical construcUon commencing, 

Any damages orcosls from negligent or unlawful Hazardous materials re la led incidents are costly lo mitigate. 

5001.7 y praclicesthal cause a hazardous materials Incident locallycrealed and adopted If the incident is caused by negligence due lo a business 

will cause a cost recovery fee process or practice the actual cost will be passed on !o the 
negfigenl parties. 

Added safely protecl!on wilh pemi!!S being issued 
Allows agencies that need lo know about explosives and 

5601.2 N 
by both the Pire Chief and Sheriffs Department for 

locally adopted and amended lireworl!s to approve lhem and have a clear understanding 
explosives, and by lhe Fire Chief and !he Board or 
Supervisors for fireworks 

of the applicatrons of how they will be used. 

Established limils as required by the Flre Code for Class I 

5704.2.9.6,1 N EsJablished limits as set for1h in !he Fire Code Localy adop!ed and amended flammable and Class 11 combusGble fiquld storage In above• 
ground Ian ks. Requires AHJ approval and a 
SpeciaUCondiUooal Use Permit from the County. 

Eslabllshed limits as required by the Fire Code for Class I 

5706,2.4.4 N Eslab!lshed limils as sel for1h in the Fire Code Locaky adopted and amended 
nammable and Cf ass II combustible liquid special 
operations Jn above-ground tanks. Requires AHJ approval 
and a SpeclaVCondilional Use Pem1il from lhe County. 

23-1589 G 44 of 55



Administrative need lo add District name. EslabHshed limits 

Adminislra1iveaddilion or Dlslricl name. 
as required bylhe Fire Code Official for Flammable 

6806.2 N Eslablished llmlls as sel foilh In !he Fire Code 
locally adopted and amended Cryogenic fluids in staUonarycontalners. Requires AHJ 

approval and a SpecialfConditional Use Permit rrom lhe 
County. 

EslabUshes distances between LPG storage and 
dispensaries lhal are directly related to safety for residential 

Established limits for LPG storage anddlspensing 
developments and hlgh-densltyho!els,molels, apartments, 

61042 N Locally adopted and amended etc. where a release by leak or e,r;plosion of LP-Gas would 
near or adjacenl loresldenUa1 development have a hlgh probabiKty of i~ury, inhalafion, ordealh. 

RequiresAHJ approval and a Special/Condilional Use 
Pennll from lhe County. 

Dismantled and stored vehicles presentsignif!can! fre toads 
(baUeries, llammable and combusUble liquids, upholstery. 

ChaplerBO. NFPA, 1- Provides fire access and clea:ance to property lines 
etcJ and risk lo vege!alion and adjacent pIoperf1es. This 

N Locally created and adopted requirement provides fire access and dearance lo 
22 for Aulomobile Wreck1ng Yards. vegetation in automobile wrecking yard operations lo aid in 

firefigh1ing opera\lons and mduel!on of fire exlension to 

', adjacent properties andloropen lands. 

Amended lo include on-slle sprinkler heads and wrench on• 
sile for emergent repairs, the inclusion of a local water ffow 
alarm lo cceale an audible alert for the now of water in lhe 

NFPA 13D-16ofChapter60 of the Rre Code of lite event of water activation in a vacant slruciure, and 
ChaplerBO, NFPA, y District has been amended to update valious 

Locally adopted and amended 
hydrostatic testing requiremenls to assure proper 13D 

130-16 provisions pertaining lo the ins!a1/ation of sprinkfer sprinkler system installation decreasing the n'sk of water 
systems in one and two-fam!ly dwellJngs damage from pipe failure. Passivepurgerequiremenls 

were also added to ensure waler circufafion through lhe 
syslem, reducing stagnant water and backflow concerns 
(EID encourages !his type of system). 

AOows us to match what developers and residen!s are used 

Changed 500 GPM 101,000 GPM in major to In regards to GPM fire flow roquiremenls thal have been 
Appendix B; Table 

N subdivisions below 5000 root erevaf!on, lo match locally adopted and amended 
used for O\rer a decade in EOC. Also provides a minimum 

B105.1(1) level of available water for firefighting purposes in !he event 
frre llow precedenls used rl EDC for years of house lo house, hoise 10 ve9elalian, adnforvegelatrion 

to house ignilion, 

Appendix B: Table Established a minimum requirement of 1,500 GPM, Allows us lo malch what developers and residents are used 

B105.2 N below 5000 fool elevalion, fora!! commen::ial Lcca!!y adopted and amended (o in regards 10 GPM lire now requirements that have been 
projects used for over a decade In EDC. 

Appendix D: 0103.1 N Added an excepUon for restdenUal driveways Locaky adopted and amended 
fl is unreasonable to require a residen!lal driveway to 
construct a 26 root wide space for attcss toa hydrant, 

TIiie 14 requires us to only accept up to 16% driveways, 

Appendix D: 0103.2 N Amended lo meet Slate Jaw of grades no greater 
Lc-:ally adopted and amended 

any excep1ions would require approval by the AHJ. In our El 
than16% wllhln Wlldland lkban !n!erface. Dorado County Title 14 adoption we allow greater than 16% 

grade with AHJ approval and hard surface, 

Appendix 0: 0103.3 N Added lext to include curbs and gullers Locally adopted and amended 
20 foot road widlhs sha!I no! include curbs and guUers due 
to potenUal access issues and turning radius concerns. 

Requires minimum 15-fl wide gales where inslal!ed 
Where fire apparatus access roads consist of a divided 

Appendix D: D103~ N Lee.ally adopted and amended roadway lhegatewidlhsha!I nolbeless than 15 feel due to 
on fire apparatus access roads apparatus turning radius. 

No parking on roads allowed on roadways less than 28 Feel 

Append;, D: D103.6,1 N Road widths 20 to 29 feel Lccally adopled and amended 
in wldlh above 5000 feel, lower than 5000 feel lhls does 
nol apply. This section Is adop!ed as it stands in !he Fire 
Code Appendix D section 103.6.1 for all olherelevations. 

23-1589 G 45 of 55



Parking on one side only on roads from 28feet to361eel 

Roadswidlhs more lhan 29 feet bul less (han 36 
allowed. This is not required less than 5000 feet or 

Appendix D: D103.62 N Locally adopled and amended elevation, Lower than 5000 feet 1hls does not apply. The 
feel in wld1h section is adopted as it stands In the Fire Code Appendix D 

Sec11on 103.6.2 for all olhere!evalions, 

When required by the fire code official. a lire apparatus 

Appendix D: D104.4 N 
Added lo require circumferenUal fire apparalus Locally created and adopted 

access road shall be constructed lo encompass the entire 
access roads structure and shall providea continuous means of 

emergencyvehicle access. 

Adopted with no Amendments 
101.1 lhrough 101.5 N 

Adopted lo eslablish scape, intent, severability and 
loca!ly adopted Administrative clarity 

val!dity 

102.11hrough102.12 N References, subjecls not regufa!ed by the Code Locally adopted Administrafive clarity 

104.1 lhrough N Abilily lo enforce the code locally adopted Administrative crarily 104.12,3 

105.1 lhrough 
N Time llmilatlon of applle:aHon Locally adopted Aclminis!ralivedartty 

105.6.24 

106.1 lhrough 106.4 N 
Adop!ed !his seclion foradminlslralive clarity and locally adopled Fee schedules for pennils 
flie and life safety inspeciions 

107,1 lhrough 107,6 N 
Ado pied thls secUon roradministraUve clarity and 

Locally adopted lnspecfioo authotity 
llreand life safelyinspedions 

Adopted lhis section for adm!nfst<alive clarity and 
Maintenance of safeguards, tes1ing and operation of 

108.1 lhrough 109.6 N 
lire and life sarety rnspeclions 

Locally adopled equtpment. re-inspection and tesling, recordkeeping, 
supervision, rendering equ·1pmenl inoperable, overcrowding, 

113 N 
Adopled lhls seclion for administrative clalily and Locally adopted S!opwo,k order. 
fire and life saretyinspee/1ons 

114.1 lhrough 114.7 N 
Adopted this secllon for admlnlslrativa clarity and 

locally adopted Unsafe slructuresorequipment. 
fire and life safetyinspecl/ons 

Asphalt kelt!es contain highly Rammable subs lances and 
require stringent safeguards. Managlng !gnilfon sources 

301.1 lhrough 308.5 N Adopted !his seclion for fire and life safety Locally adopted lhmugh responsible application of s!andards will reduce 1he 
number of fires in various settings. (Climatic, geolog!cal, 
and topographical). 

General requirements rela1ing to smoking. Vacant premises 
condWon and safely requlremenls, abandoned premises, 

310.1 lhrough311.4 N Adopted lllrs sec:lion for fire and life safety Locally adopted tenant spaces, safeguarding vacant premises, security, fire 
protec:Uon, fire separalion. removal of combustibles, 
removal of hazardous ma!eriaJs. (Climal!c, geological, and 
lopograpl1l cal). 

323.1 N Adopted this secllon for fire and life safely Locally adopted 
General requiremenls for roads, lunne!s, and bridges. 
(CJJmaUc, georogical, and topographical). 

Provides evacuatlon<lrmsfor hazardous and inslitufional 
403.6 lhrough 403.7.6 N Adopted this secllon for fire and life safely Locally adopled occupancies {occupancies wi!h increased potential for lire 

loss). 

403,9 lhrough 403.9.4 N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally adopted 
Provides evacuation drills for hoteUmolel occupancies 
(occupancies with increased potential for life loss). 

405.1 lhrough 405. 10 N Adopted this section for fire and life safely Locally adopted 
Emergency planning and record keeping {Climatic, 
geologlcal, and topographical), 

510.3 N 
Adopled lhissection for adm!nlstralive clarily and Locally adopted 

A pennil is required for emergency responder radio systems 
fire and Ufe safety lnspectfons (Climatic, geological, and topographical}. 

806.1 lhrough 606A N 
Adopted !his seolion foradminislfalive clarity and Locally adopled 

Decorative vegela1ionposes an increase in hazard, 
fire and life safely Inspections ltammabllily and increased risk. 

Wall coverings in group E occupancies (Schools} sels a 

807,1 lhrough007.5.6 N Adopted lhis secllon ror admlnislraftve cfarl!y and LocaMy adopted 
maXimum amount of flammable wall coverings in 

Ure and me safety lnspeclions educalional facffif!es (Climatic, geological, and 
topographical). 

23-1589 G 46 of 55



Adopted !his seclion for adminls!ralive clarily and 
Combustible furnishlng pose a significant !Tarnmabitily and 

808.1 through 808.5 N Locally adopted Increased life safety hazard in ins!ilulional and college do1m 
fire and lire safely inspectioos type occupancies, 

Adopted \his secnon for adminis!ralive clarity and 
Provides clarity on acceplam:e le sling of automatic fire 

904.4.1 N Locally adopletl exlinguishing systems. (Cfrmafic, geological, and 
fire and Ufe safelylnspeclions topographical), 

1101.1 through 1102.1 N 
Adopted lh!s section for arfminisfrative clarity and Locally adopted Admfnisllalive darily 
fire and fife safety inspecnons 

Emergency Responder radio coverage in exisling buildings, 
A!I buildings will be required lo allow emergency responders 
lo receiVe and transmit emergency radio traffic to and from 
each o!her and the emergency dlspalch center. lime 

Adopted !his seclion in exisUng buifdlngs for the 
(ram es can be developed lo come into compllance and the 
phasing in or a syslem over a period of time, determined by 

1103.2 y safety of firefighters and olher emergency Locaffy adopted the fire code officlal, Is acceptable. The ralionale behind \his 
responders secllon is that on a!mosl all emergency responder injury or 

ra1ality incidents communlcalion ls a key Issue. This 
sUua!ion can be corrected wllh the addil!on or radio 
equipment to boost fhe signal in areas that do not have 
slrong signal (CUmatic, geolog!cal, and lo))O!lraph:cal). 

Requires insla!laUon of fire sprlnkler systems in exisling 

1103.5 y Adopted this section For lhe safe!yoFlhe publ!c, 
Local!y adopted 

occupancies wilh high nre safely risk and ln conformance 
rrrefrghlers, and other emergency responders with pcevious Unlform Fire Codes. (Cl~mallc, geological, and 

topographical). 

Adopted this section for lhe safety of lhe public, 
Requires insla!lalion of carbon monoxide alarms in 

1103.9 N lireRghters, and other emergency responders Locally adopted occupancies wilh high life safety risk. (Climalic,geological. 
and topographical). 

1104.1 through Adopted this section for lhe safely of Ille public, 
P,ov!des a minimum level of safely wilh regard to egress 

N Locally adopted from exls!ing buildings housing occupancies with a high life 
1104.25 firefighters, and other emergency responders safely risk, (Climalic, geologfcal, and topographical). 

1106.1 ihrough Ado pied !his section for lhe safety of lhe public, 
Provides a minimum revel or sarety at 1ire storage yards 

1106.1.2 N firefighters, and o1her emergency responde1s 
Locally adopted with high revels of nammable rubber maletia!. {Climalic, 

geological, and topographical). 

Appendix O: D101.1 
N 

Adopted this sec11on for lhe safety of lhe public, 
Locally adopted 

General regulremenls for fire apparalus access roads 
lhrough D104,1 firefighlars, and other emergency responders including loads (ClimaUc1 geological, and lopographlcal). 

Appendix o: 0104.2 
N 

Adopted this section for !he safely or 1he public, 
Locally aclopled 

Commercial and industrial development fire apparatus 
(excluding exception) firefigh!ers, anrf other emergency respondera access roads {Climatic, geologir.al, and topographical). 

Appendix 0: D104,3 
N 

Adopted this sec!ion for lhe safely of !he public, 
Locally adopted Commercial and industrial developmenl fire appara1us 

lhlough 0105.4 firefighfers, and other emergency responders access roads (Climatlc, geological, and topographical). 

Appendix D: D106.1 
N 

Adopted lhfssecl/on for the sarety of lhe pub!lc, 
locally adopted 

Fire apparatus access roarfs (or multiple-family residenllal 
(excluding exceplion} firefighters, and other emergency responders developments (Cllmalic, geological, and lopagraphical). 

Appendix O: 0106.2 
N 

Adopted lh!s sec11on for the safety or lhe public, 
Locally adopted 

Fire apparatus access roads for muUiple--fami!y residennar 
through 0105.3 firefighlers, and other emergency responders deve!opmenls (C!imalic,geo!oglcal, and topographical), 

One• or two-<lwelling res!denlial developmenlsshall be 
Appendix o: D107,1 

N 
Adopled !his seclion forlhe safely of lhe pullfic, LocaHy adopted 

equipped throughout wi(h twosperate and approved fire 
(excluding excepUons) 0retighlers, and other emergency responders apparatus access roads due lo topographic, geographic and 

climatic conditions, 

One~ortwo-<lwelffng residenlial devetopments shall be 
Append~ D: 0107.2 

N 
Adopted this section for the safely or U1e public, Locally adopted 

equipped throughout wilh two sperale and approved fire 
through D108.1 firefighters, and olheremergency responders appaiatus access roads due to topographic, geographic and 

climatic condillons. 

-

23-1589 G 47 of 55



PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of Directors of the MFPD this, 

J anuaiy, 2023. 

AYES: 4 S\t\Jtf-. I~ 0 V.v'\j i~\,\.\A._-1- J) li lN 
NOES:~ 

ABSENT: J v\ ~ ~ \~ 
ABSTAIN~ 

'--- 'r\_ ® resident 

ATTEST: 

-
Sharlyn Fields , Board Secretary 

Ordinance 2022-09 

26th day of 

Page 23 

23-1589 G 48 of 55



RESOLUTION 22-10 

A RESOLUTION OF THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS OF THE 
MOSQUITO FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT 

ADOPTING FINDINGS SUPPORTING AMENDMENTS TO 
THE CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE 

A resolution for the Mosquito Fire Protection District setting forth findings with respect to 
local conditions within the Fire District which make certain modifications and changes to 
the California Fire Code reasonably necessary for preserving fire and life safety in the 
Mosquito Fire Protection District 

The Governing Board of the Mosquito Fire Protection District finds and resolves as 
follows: 

WHEREAS, Health & Safety Code Section 17958.5 permits a Fire Protection 
District to adopt an ordinance which changes or modifies the State Housing regulations 
adopted 
pursuant to Health & Safety Code Section 17922 upon determination that such changes or 
modifications are necessary due to local conditions that pertain regulations governing 
conditions hazardous to life, property and the environment from fire, explosion, hazardous 
materials and hazardous uses; and 

WHEREAS, Health & Safety Code Section 17958.7 requires that a District's Board 
of Directors making any changes or modifications pursuant to Health & Safety Code 
Section 17958.5 shall make express finding that such changes or modifications are needed; 
and shall file a copy of such changes or modifications with the Department of Housing and 
Community Development. 

WHEREAS, the unique local climatic, geological, and topographical conditions 
existing within the boundaries of the District make it reasonably necessary for the District to 
impose more stringent requirements than set forth in the California Fire Code and pursuant 
to California Health and Safety Code sections 13869.7 and 17958.7, the District 
desires to make express findings to that effort 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that the Board of Directors of the 
Mosquito Fire Protection District, after having duly noticed and held public hearings, hereby 
adopts the following findings concerning current unique local conditions that 
together make each modification to the California Fire Code, reason ab! y necessary to 
provide adequate and effective protection of life, property and the environment more 
specifically set forth as follows: 

-1-

23-1589 G 49 of 55



FINDINGS OF FACT 
FOR CHANGES OR MODIFICATIONS TO THE STATE BUILDING 

STANDARDS CODE (TITLE 24 PART 9) BECAUSE OF LOCAL 
CONDITIONS 

A. General. 

After due consideration, the Board of Directors of the Mosquito Fire Protection District, 
hereby finds that due to local climatic, geologic and topographic conditions, as stated within 
this document, there is a need to provide the modifications and change contained in the 
adoptive Ordinance of the California Fire Code. Such changes are deemed to be reasonably 
necessary to provide adequate and effective protection of life, property, and the 
environment. 

The Mosquito Fire Protection District provides fire protection, emergency medical 
services, and specialized rescue services to approximately 2,500 people in a 13 square mile 
area. The District is located on the Western slope of El Dorado County. The 
topography of the District ranges from rolling hills of grass, oak woodland, large 
quantities of brush, and steep drainages. The weather conditions vary from freezing 
temperatures with occasional snow in winter, to summer temperatures that regularly 
exceed 100 degrees. 

The Mosquito Fire Protection District is an "all-risk" agency. The District participates in a 
sophisticated mutual aid program and is dispatched through agreement by the California 
Department of Forestry and Fire Protection (Cal-Fire) at Camino. The resources of the 
District will respond to, and deal with, any type of emergency. The term "Fire 
Protection" in this document is broad and includes responses to fires, smoke, and odor 
investigations, alarms, public assist calls, hazardous materials incidents, medical aid, and 
specialized rescues. 

The District has one staffed fire station to provide emergency service to the community. Fire • 
Station 75 is located at 8801 Rock Creek Road. The District has 2 full-time, career 
personnel, along with 1 part time management position, and these are supplemented with a 
volunteer Assistant Chief, Company Officers and Firefighters. 

B. Climatic. 

The Mosquito Fire Protection District is located within a foothill region. The District is 
subject to four seasons, with an annual snowfall in the winter months of 2-4 inches, in 
addition to an average rainfall of 39 inches per year. These adverse weather conditions 
create severe hazardous road conditions and flooding as well as rockslide hazards along the 
main access roads within, as well as into, the District from the surrounding areas. Due to 
periods of rainfall, along with repeated road closures, the ability of the Fire Protection 

-2-

23-1589 G 50 of 55



District to provide immediate emel'gency response is often delayed. These same adverse 
climatic conditions often result in a large number of vehicular accidents that place 
extreme restraints on the availability of emergency response to perform emergency 
rescue, first aid, hazardous materials control, and firefighting. The climatic conditions 
often result in a substantial or total lack of ability of the Fire Protection District to 
respond immediately to other types of emergency situations that occur. Examples of these 
emergency situations include structure fires, wildland and forest fires, flooding, 
hazardous materials incidents, emergency medical calls, vehicle accidents, and vertical 
rescues. The mutual aid agreements established with adjoining fire agencies might not be 
possible due to adverse climatic conditions, restricting or totally blocking access into the 
District. 

Summary: 

These local climatic conditions affect the acceleration, intensity, and size of fires in the Fire 
District. Times of little or no rainfall, low humidity, and high temperatures create 
extremely hazardous conditions, particularly as they relate to the wildland-urban 
interface. Winds experienced in this area can have a significant impact upon structure fires, 
especially in buildings in close proximity to one another, and to wildlands 
commonly found in the Mosquito Fire Protection District. Structures built within the 
Mosquito Fire Protection District must be built with these variables in mind 

C. Geological. 

The Mosquito Fire Protection District is located within moderate seismic Zone Three. The 
seismic, geological conditions present a potential for multiple fires, major breakage of water 
mains, multiple electrical power failures, multiple collapsed structures and a large number 
of calls for emergency medical aid, all of which may occur simultaneously during a seismic 
event. The water district has numerous water-pumping systems used for fire suppression 
water delivery, as well as water storage tanks providing water system pressure. Most of the 
pumping systems are dependent on elecu·ical power for operation. Such electrical power 
may not be available during a seismic event. Vv' ater storage tanks used for storage of 
required fire suppression water may also collapse in such an event forcing the additional 
need to transport water via additional pieces of fire apparatus which will place a significant 
restraint on the ability of the District to provide the required emergency services. 

Summary: 

Local geographic and geological features and processes exist within the boundaries of the 
Districts that may hamper the ability of the Mosquito Fire Protection District to perform its 
sworn duties. Fire following an earthquake has the potential of causing greater loss of life 
and damage than the earthquake itself. 

-3-

23-1589 G 51 of 55



D. Topographical. 

The District is primarily composed of areas that are considered by the State to be high fire 
hazard severity zones. Much of the hill is located within foothill terrain, covered with highly 
combustible vegetation, including the presence of many coniferous forested areas. The 
elevation within the District ranges from approximately 800 feet to over 2500 feet at the 
highest point. Slope within the District ranges from Oto 90 degrees. The structures within 
the areas of the foothill's terrain have very limited fire access, due to narrow 
roadways with steep grades and poor road surface conditions. The presences of many 
existing structures within the high fire severity zone areas provides for a very high 
potential of a structure fire spreading into a wildland or forest fire condition as well as the 
potential for a wildland or forest fire spreading to structures. 

Summary: 

The alignment of canyons, valleys, and slopes into inhabited areas, combined with the 
variable nature of the terrain, yield potential for increased fire risk. Most structures, both 
residential and commercial, are in or are surrounded by areas that contain significant grass, 
brush, mixed oak woodland, and mixed conifer fuel load. Due to drought 
conditions, beetle infestations, and lack of vegetation management, much of the area is 
populated with either dead or dying trees, contributing to extreme fire danger. 

E. Conclusion 

Local climatic, geographic, and topographic conditions described above increase the 
frequency, intensity, and size of fires involving buildings in the Fire District. Further, these 
conditions impact potential damage to structures from an earthquake and 
subsequent fire. Therefore, it is reasonably necessary that the California Fire Code be 
modified to mitigate the effects of the above conditions. California Health & Safety Code 
Section 17958.7 requires that modifications to the Fire Code be expressly marked and 
identified as to which each finding refers to which Code modification. The attached 
Appendix A provides this connection. 

-4-

23-1589 G 52 of 55



PASSED AND ADOPTED at a regular meeting of the Board of Directors of the 
Mosquito Fire Protection District on January 26, 2023 by the following roll call vote: 

AYES: 4 
NOES:~ 

ABSENT: I 

ATTEST: BY: 

Sharlyn Fields, Board Clerk 
~~£,~ 

D~ Board President 

-5-

23-1589 G 53 of 55



l 
l 
I 

;fffilountain~1leemotrat 
PROOF OF PUBLICATION 

(2015.5 C.C.P.) 

Proof of Publication of 
NOTICE OF INTENT 

STATE OF CALIFORNIA 
County of El Dorado 

I am a citizen of the United States and a resident 
of the County aforesaid; I'm over the age of 
eighteen years, and not a party to or interested in 
the above-entitled matter. I am principal clerk of 
the printer at the Mountain Democrat, 2889 Ray 
Lawyer Drive, a newspaper of general circulation, 
printed and published Monday, Wednesday, 
and Friday, in the City of Placerville, 
County of El Dorado, and which newspaper has 
been adjudged a newspaper of general circula­
tion by the Superior Court to the County of El 
Dorado, State of California, under the date of 
March 7, 1952, Case Number 7258; that the 
notice, of which the annexed is a printed copy 
(set in type no smaller than non-pareil), has been 
published in each regular and entire issue of said 
newspaper and not in any supplement thereof on 
the following dates, to-with: 

1/13 

ALL IN THE YEAR 2023. 

I certify (or declare) under penalty of perjury that 
the foregoing is true and correct. 

Dated at Placerville, California, this 13th day 
of JANUARY, 2023 

w.Lscv1 ~"'5 
Signature 

I 
:1· 

" \ SEC0No
11
NOTICE q ~Jv 

NOTICE OF INTENT TO ADOPT A 
: '" EIRE~COOE ORDINANCE cJ '-

: 1tr§t_Jci3ii_~~fubY _iv~fl"oft~eirit~ttott 
: ;,0(:,ihii'<\·,Mo~frldit03f:i'rit1·'.'~r0teCt10'n 
1ip1~mc_t: .'J6f;~Q,pt;f ~t:-f~!f~;;?R~~~ 

: i\..: .9~~-'.-'.(fh1};8,t~_tj9,t;jM,lJ:(QO_I~ 
: 1°lt nd._pUbllc:h_ear1ng!'at,7,:9op~ 
, r,P ::?~[i*.f:!2,~}µf~a;¥-~Yi!9_ 
\., , .1 ... ,, ., .. - •. t19i:rbQl~trj~\St_atf()1J}',7,'5, 
t~~9J/.;t,~o~~i,~1'8'Ei_~h~~i/, 8!~tjetyl_1,1~ 
~-G,fl,IJ(om_!~,;reg_~l'PJD9:~~e.1a~'!Pl!9rtt?i 
:.:1-~,e}fire;_'Cfl:d!:';;O~!Da~tj~LP.~~·u_~t 
to HE!alth and'Sa:faty CodfSe'ctlons 

\13869;".and-,,13869~7-,'..-_.Co_Pt_~Stdfitne 
-'.C6d8\Sectr0ril\i'eferfOd>tOtand/.'8i\"y 
:i<k:O_hd_ary~_008:S6Ct10rih:rnrermd'tC11 

'i;'.a'ctOPtecJ bYiT8rel'eric8;lai-iorifl1e'W1111 
. '\tH~";_?,fi~~a~iy:p*h~}PiiH,~-~ifg,:~ 
:;()pen to.public i_nsp8Cti()_n::1Acfopt1on 

Ot-ihB:_rlre coc1e:_brc11rtancB_W1iradOPt 
'·th'e_'.c;a"tir6rni8' Fir8-p?ct8\.aSiC~ri'eht!1 
publ!shed In irtle-24, Part 9,'of 1h~ 
ca11fOrn1a Code _of .. Reg·u1at1on/j.j 
goverblng /)fli\~?<Rt~"i~'~ion, . an~ 
bulldlnJ;J standSrds'ralated to tire rui_c:t 

, p~~,l,~,~~eJy,\~i,~:~!J1!fari}'8n'dmenl$1 
ln'?o.rna lnstan_C~s;_,tp a:_M()Squlto Fire 
erotec116_ri/Dlstrict•~:-;),~6Posed •\ Flfu 
d0Ct'_8>-9{d_1_11~811,cl~(_pfo_po'i:ia's• b'Llltdlrig 
St'arld!Jrc1s·:_-.:;n,b'r9·i3Sfring·&nt ;.,th'an 
t~ci~~t[l111ll_ffiUrn ib\iU~r~9t,st!ln~~s 

; i;t.~?P.t.~_:;py,-t_he1_,~,t_1lt~',f_J~·-Marsh~I 
'llhd1i': c,or_italne{:f ;.; int;\ t~_a.\_.- Ca_lf ~o'rrild 
aU1_fd1rlg :Standal"CffCCM6/ .: -._;, '-,.:-)~} 

r)?.l~ti:-::;.;: -,' '.':';;.s;:\:t;_'t:·:,_.r:;}1'.,l)\\~ 

23-1589 G 54 of 55



JJ(ountatn ~11Bemocrat 
PROOF OF PUBLICATION 

(2015.5 C.C.P.) 

Proof of Publication of 
NOTICE OF [NTENT 

STATE OF CALIFORNIA 
County ofEl Dorado 

I am a citizen of the United States and a resident 
of the County aforesaid; I'm over the age of 
eighteen years, and not a party to or interested in 
the above-entitled matter. I am principal clerk of 
the printer at the Mountain Democrat, 2889 Ray 
Lawyer Drive, a newspaper of general circulation, 
printed and published Monday, Wednesday, 
and Friday, in the City of Placerville, 
County of El Dorado, and which newspaper has 
been adjudged a newspaper of general circula­
tion by the Superior Court to the County of El 
Dorado, State of California, under the date of 
March 7, 1952, Case Number 7258; that the 
notice, of which the annexed is a printed copy 
(set in type no smaller than non-pareil), has been 
published in each regular and entire issue of said 
newspaper and not in any supplement thereof on 
the following dates, to-with: 

12/7 

ALL IN THE YEAR 2022 
I certify ( or declare) under penalty of perjury that 
the foregoing is true and correct. 

Dated at Placerville, California, this 7th day 
of DECEMBER, 2022 

/>1)1As.on P.'l,i.v.s 
Signature 

M#4'M§9it0iiM 'f lliJ 
First Notice 

Notice of Intent to Adopt a Fire 
Code Ordinance 

Notice is hereby given of the intention 
of the Mosquito Fire Protection 
District to adopt a Fire Code 
Ordimince, The District shall hold 
its first public he8ril1g at 7 P.M. 011 
ThLirsday December 22nd, 2022 at 
the Mosquito Fire Protection District 
Station 75, 8801 Rock Creek Ad of 
the Fire Code Ordinance pursuant 
to Health a·nd Safety Code Sections 
13869 and 13869.7. Copi0s of the 
code section referred to and any 
secondary code sections referred to,. 
adopted by reference, are on file with• 
the Secretary of the District and are:, 
open to public inspection. Adoption, 
of the Are Code Ordinance will adopt 
the California Fire Code as currently, 
published in ·Title 24, Part 9, of the, 
California Code of Regulations; 
governing fire prevention and 
building standards related to fire and, 
panic safety with some amendments.-· 
In some instances the Mosquito Are. 
Protection District's proposed Fire 
Code Ordinance proposes building' 
standards more stringent tha11 · 
those minimum building standards, 
adopted by the State Fire Marshal' 
and contained in the California 
Building Standards Code. 

I 12/7 11181 

23-1589 G 55 of 55


	Draft Reso - Mosquito.pdf
	Mosquito Package.pdf
	MQT Fire Code Letter for CAO.PDF
	MQT Ordinance 22-09 Fire Code.PDF
	MQT Resolution 22-10 MQT Fire Code.PDF
	MQT Fire Code Public Notices.PDF




