
RESOLUTION NO. XXXX-2023 

OF THE BOARD OF SUPERVISORS OF THE COUNTY OF EL DORADO 

(REPEALING RESOLUTION NO. 041-2020) 

WHEREAS, the California Code of Regulations, Title 24, Part 9, the California Fire Code, is updated by the 
State every three years; and  

WHEREAS, the 2022 California Fire Code became effective on January 1, 2023; and, 

WHEREAS, California Health and Safety Code Sections 17958, 17958.5, 17958.7 and 18941.5 permits a 
county to make such local amendments and modifications as the county determines are reasonably 
necessary because of local climatic, geological or topographical conditions; and,   

WHEREAS, the California Code of regulations, Health and Safety Code, Division 12, Part 2, Chapter 1, 
Article 12, Section 13146, assigns responsibility for enforcement of safety regulations to the local level 
and grants authority to delegate enforcement to the chief building official, or his or her authorized 
representative, or the chief of the fire protection district, or his or her representative; and,  

WHEREAS, the County of El Dorado desires to delegate enforcement of the Fire Code to the chief of the 
fire authority, or the chief’s authorized representative; and,  

 WHEREAS, the fire protection district and County have agreed to develop, implement and maintain a 
memorandum of understanding that describes the roles and responsibilities pertaining to the inspection 
of certain building standards found in the Fire Code; and,  

WHEREAS, on January 5, 2023, The Board of Directors of the Lake Valley Fire Protection District adopted 
Ordinance No. 2022-01, which adopted the 2022 California Fire Code with amendments the District 
deemed necessary to deal with local climate, geological or topographical conditions.  

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that the Board of Supervisors of the County of El Dorado ratifies 
Ordinance No. 2022-01 of the Lake Valley Fire Protection District and delegates the enforcement of the 
ordinance to the Lake Valley Fire District Chief, or his or her representative.  

These changes include amendments and additions to the California Fire Code in the following sections: 

101.1, 105.5, 105.5.55, 105.6, 105.6.25, 105.6.26, 107.5, 107.5.1, 107.7, 111.5, 112.4, 112.4.2, 
113.4, 202, 302.1, 307.4.4, 401.2.1, 503.2.1, 503.2.5, 503.2.6, 503.3.1, 503.3.2, 503.3.3, 503.6, 
505.1, 507.5.1, 509.3, 510.4.2.3, 903.2, 903.2.1.1, 903.2.1.2, 903.2.1.3, 903.2.1.4, 903.2.3, 903.2.4, 
903.2.7, 903.2.7.2, 903.2.8.5, 903.2.9, 903.2.10, 903.2.10.1, 903.2.22, 903.2.23, 903.6, 907.2, 
907.2.1.4, 907.2.2.3, 907.2.3.11, 907.2.4.1, 907.2.5.2, 907.2.6.6, 907.2.7.2, 907.2.8.4, 907.2.9.4, 

23-1589 C 1 of 67



907.2.10.1, 907.2.30, 907.6.5, 907.6.2.1, 907.9, 1203.1.3, 3311.3, 3313.1, 50001.7, 5601.2, 
5704.2.9.6.1, 5706.2.4.4, 5806.2, 6104.2, Chapter 80 NFPA 1-22 Section 22.3, Chapter 80 NFPA 1-
22 Section 22.10, Chapter 80 NFPA 13D-22: Sections 4.6, 5.1.1.2, 7.6, 11.2.1.1, Appendix B: Table 
B105.1(1), Appendix B: Table B105.2, Appendix D Sections D103.1 through D103.3, Appendix D 
103.5, Appendix D 103.6.1, Appendix D103.6.2, Appendix D104.4 

The Lake Valley Fire District adopts the 2022 California Fire Code, Title 24, Part 9, in its entirety, including 
Appendices, incorporating those sections of the International Fire Code, 2021 edition not adopted by the 
state, with the exclusions listed below: 

103, 309, 311.5, 311.6, 318, 403.3, 403.5, 403.8, 403.10, 403.11, 404, 406, 903.3.1.2, 904.1.1, 
1103.1, 1103.3-1103.4, 1103.6, 1105, Chapter 26, D104.2 (exception only), D106.1 (exception only), 
D107.1 (exception only), Appendix A, Appendix G, Appendix J, Appendix K, Appendix L, Appendix 
M, Appendix N, Appendix O.   

Appendices not adopted can be used for reference in enforcing other sections of the 2022 California Fire 
Code.  

 

PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of Supervisors of the County of El Dorado at a regular meeting of said 
BOARD, held the _____ day of _________________, 20___, by the following vote of said Board 
 
       Ayes: 
Attest:       Noes: 
Kim Dawson      Absent: 
Clerk of the Board of Supervisors 
 
By: ________________________________  _____________________________________ 
  Deputy Clerk      ,Chair, Board of Supervisors 
 

 

23-1589 C 2 of 67



LAKE VALLEY FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT . ; 
"Serving the Community Since 1947" 

Chad Stephen, Fire Chief 

13oard of Dir~ctor, 
John Rice 
13rian Hogan 
l.~ona Allen 
Ron Siuon 
Irene Kaelin 

January 5, 2022 

Don Ashton, Chief Administrative Officer 
El Dorado County Board of Supervisors 
330 Fair Lane 
Placerville, CA 95667 

Subject: Resolution Ratifying Ordinance No. 2022-01 of the Lake Valley 
Fire District, which adopts the 2022 California Fire Code with 
amendments related to local climatic, geographic and 
topographic conditions. 

Dear Mr. Ashton: 

The Lake Valley Fire Protection District (LVFPD) is requesting the Board of Supervisors (BOS) ratify its Ordinance No. 
2022-01, which adopts the 2022 California Fire Code as amended due to specific local climatic, geographic and 
topographic conditions. California Health and Safety Code Section 13869.7 require the legislative body of the city or 
county where the ordinance will apply to ratify, modify or deny the adopted ordinance. The BOS must also 
delegate enforcement of the ordinance to either the Fii'2 District (or its representative) or the Chief Building Official. 

Therefore, we request the County Board of Supervisors ratify Ordinance No. 2022-01 with amendments to the 2022 
California Fire Code, and delegate the enforcement of that Ordinance to the LVFPD Fire Chief. A proposed BOS 
resolution is enclosed for your review and use on this topic. 

This resolution has no direct fiscal impact to the County. 

Sincerely, 

Chad Stephen 
Fire Chief 

23-1589 C 3 of 67



LAKE VALLEY FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT 

ORDINANCE NO. 2022-01 

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS OF THE LAKE VALLEY FIRE 

PROTECTION DISTRICT AS FOLLOWS: 

An ordinance of the Lake Valley Fire Protection District (LVFPD) adopting the 2022 

Edition of the California Fire Code, incorporating the 2021 Edition of the International Fire Code, 

regulating and governing the safeguarding of life and property from fire and explosion hazards· 

arising from the storage, handling and use of hazardous substances, materials, and devices, 

and from conditions hazardous to life or property in the occupancy of buildings and premises in 

the LVFPD; providing for the issuance of permits and collection of fees therefor; Repealing 

Ordinance No. 2019-01 of the LVFPD and all other ordinances and parts of the ordinances in 

conflict therewith. 

Be it ORDAINED by the Board of Directors of the LVFPD, also known as the LAKE 

VALLEY FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT: 

Section 1: FINDINGS OF FACTS 

Section 2: ADOPTION OF CODE WITH EXCLUSIONS 

Section 3: LOCAL AMENDMENTS 

Section 4: CONFLICT 

Sections: SEVERABILITY 

Section 6: EFFECTIVE DATE AND PUBLICATION 

SECTION 1: FINDINGS OF FACTS 

The LVFPD makes certain changes (listed below) to the California Fire Code, 2022 

Edition, pursuant to Health & Safety Code Sections 13869.7, 17958.5, 17958. 7, and 18941.5 

during this code adoption process. Such changes are necessary because of local climatic, 

geological, and/or topographical conditions. The LVFPD has adopted, pursuant to Section 

18941. 5 of the California Health & Safety Code, the findings of facts relative to these conditions 

by Resolution #2019-01 of the LVFPD dated December 12, 2019. 

23-1589 C 4 of 67



SECTION 2: ADOPTION OF CODE WITH EXCLUSIONS 

The LVFPD adopts the 2022 California Fire Code, Title 24, Part 9, in its entirety, 

including Appendices, incorporating those sections of the International Fire Code, 2021 edition 

not adopted by the state, with the exclusions listed below: 

Exclusions: 103,309,311.5, 311.6, 318,403.3, 403.5, 403.8, 403.10, 403.11, 404,406, 

903.3.1.2, 904.1.1, 1103.1, 1103.3-1103.4, 1103.6, 1105, Chapter 26, 0104.2 (Exception only), 

D106.1 (Exception only), D107.1 (Exceptions only), Appendix A, Appendix G, Appendix J, 

Appendix K, Appendix L, Appendix M, Appendix N, Appendix 0. 

Appendices not adopted can be used for reference in enforcing other sections of the 2022 

California Fire Code. 

SECTION 3: AMENDMENTS TO THE 2022 CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE 

The following Sections are hereby amended or added: 

Chapter 1 

SECTION 101 .1 "TITLE" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 101.1 TITLE. These regulations shall be known as the Fire Code of LVFPD, 
hereinafter referred to as "this code." 

SECTION 105.5 "REQUIRED OPERATIONAL PERMITS" IS AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 105.5 Required operational permits. The fire code official is authorized to issue 
operational permits for the operations set forth in Sections 105.5.2 through 105.5.5~5. 

SECTION 105.5.55 "AUTOMOBILE WRECKING YARDS" IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 105.5.55 Automobile wrecking yards. 
operation of automobile wrecking yards. 

An operational permit is required for the 

SECTION 105.6 "REQUIRED CONSTRUCTION PERMITS" IS AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 105.6 required construction permits. The fire code official is authorized to issue 
construction permits for work as set forth in sections 105.6.1 through 105.6.246. 

SECTION 105.6.25 "AUTOMOBILE WRECKING YARDS" IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 105.6.25 Automobile wrecking yards. Construction permits are required for the 
installation of or modification of automobile wrecking yards. 

23-1589 C 5 of 67



SECTION 105.6.26 "TRAFFIC CALMING DEVICES" IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

105.6.26 Traffic calming devices. Construction permits are required for the installation or 
modification of traffic calming devices. 

SECTION 107.5 "PERMIT, PLAN REVIEW AND INSPECTION FEES" SHALL BE ADDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section 107.5 Permit. A schedule of fees adopted by the district board of directors for plan 
review, inspections, and the issuance of permits by the District may be found in the most current 
district fee schedule (Health & Safety Code 17951). 

SECTION 107.5.1 "COST RECOVERY FEES" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 107.5.1 Cost Recovery Fees. Fire service fees may be charged to any person, firm, 
corporation, or business that, through negligence, violation of the law, or as a result of 
carelessness, is responsible for the cause of the District to respond to the scene of an incident. 
A district board may charge a fee to cover the cost of any service which the District provides or 
the cost of enforcing any regulation for which the fee is charged (Health & Safety Code 13916). 
The fee shall not exceed the actual cost of suppressing the fire and/or responding to the scene 
of an incident. 

SECTION 107.7 "ADMINISTRATIVE COSTS" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 107.7 Administrative Costs. When a test or inspection is scheduled, and the 
contractor fails to perform to the satisfacUon of the authority having jurisdiction (AHJ), the AHJ 
may bill the contractor for actual time spent traveling to and from the test/inspection location 
and the time spent at the test/inspection site as well as administrative costs. 

SECTION 111.5 "APPEAL PROCEDURES AND TIMELINES" SHALL BE ADDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section 111.5 Appeal Procedures and Timelines. Any person or entity who believes they may 
be adversely affected by an order, decision, or determination made by the fire code official 
through a written notice may appeal this matter within 15 calendar days of the postmark on the 
notice. All such appeals shall be filed in writing with the Secretary of the Governing Board for the 
District. A timely appeal shall stay further action by the fire code official until the matter is 
determined by the Appeal Board as outlined in Section 109.2 unless the issue poses an 
imminent fire or life safety hazard to members of the public. The fire code official shall notify the 
appellant by certified mail of the date and time of such hearing. The hearing shall be scheduled 
to take place no sooner than 20 calendar days from the date shown on the certified mail. The 
appellant shall have the right to appear in person or by agent at the hearing and present oral, 
written, and/or photographic evidence to the Appeal Board. 

SECTION 112.4 "VIOLATION PENALTIES" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 112.4 Violation Penalties. Persons who shall violate a provision of this code or shall 
fail to comply with any of the requirements thereof or who shall erect, install, alter, repair, or do 
work in violation of the approved construction documents or directive of the fire code official, or 

23-1589 C 6 of 67



of a permit or certificate used under provisions of this code, shall be guilty of a misdemeanor or 
infraction, at the discretion of the prosecuting attorney or agency, punishable by a fine not more 
than $100.00 for a first violation; A fine not exceeding $500.00 for a second violation of the 
same provision within one year; A fine not exceeding $1000.00 for each additional violation of 
the same provision within one year, or by imprisonment not exceeding 180 days, or both such 
fine and imprisonment. Each day that a violation continues after due notice has been served 
shall be deemed a separate offense. (Health & Safety Code Sections 13145 and 17995). 

SECTION 112.4.2 "CITATIONS" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 112.4.2 Citations. The Fire Chief, or his/her duly authorized representative, may issue 
citations for infractions or misdemeanor violations of this code pursuant to Section 13871 of the 
Health & Safety Code of the State of California and Chapter 5c (commencing with Section 
853. 6) of Title 3 of Part 2 of the Penal Code of the State of California. 

SECTION 113.4 "FAILURE TO COMPLY" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 113.4 Failure to Comply. Any person who shall continue any work after having been 
served with a stop work order, except such work as that person is directed to perform to remove 
a violation or unsafe condition, shall be punishable by a fine or imprisonment or both as 
described in Section 112.4 (Health & Safety Code Sections 13145 and 17995). 

Chapter 2 

SECTION 202 "CAMPFIRE" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

CAMPFIRE. A fire that is used for cooking, personal warmth, lighting, or aesthetic purposes. 

SECTION 202 "DISTRICT" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

DISTRICT. The District and all other areas within the exterior boundaries thereof now or 
hereafter established. 

SECTION 202 "DRIVEWAY" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

DRIVEWAY. A vehicular access that serves up to two (2) parcels with no more than two (2) 
residential units and any number of non-commercial or industrial buildings on each parcel. 

SECTION 202 "EXECUTIVE BODY" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

EXECUTIVE BODY. The Board of Directors of the District. 

SECTION 202 "FIRE CHIEF" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

FIRE CHIEF. The Chief Executive Fire Officer of the Fire department/district serving the 
jurisdiction or a duly authorized representative. 

SECTION 202 "FIRE HAZARD" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

23-1589 C 7 of 67



FIRE HAZARD. Any condition, arrangement, or act which will increase, or may cause an 
increase of, the hazard or menace of fire to a greater than customarily recognized as normal 
by-persons in the public service of preventing, suppressing, or extinguishing fire; or which may 
obstruct, delay, or hinder, or may become the cause of obstruction, delay or hinderance to the 
prevention, suppression, or extinguishment of fire. 

SECTION 202 "OPEN BURNING" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

OPEN BURNING. The burning of materials wherein products of combustion are emitted directly 
into the ambient air without passing through a stack or chimney from an enclosed chamber. 
Open burning does not include road flares, smudge-pots and similar devices associated with 
safety or occupational uses typically considered open flames. For the purpose of this definition, 
a chamber shall be regarded as enclosed when, during the time combustion occurs, only 
apertures, ducts, stacks, flues or chimneys necessary to provide combustion air and permit the 
escape of exhaust gas are open. 

Open burning shall also include campfires, bonfires, portable outdoor fireplaces, ceremonial 
fires, and recreational fire as defined in the Fire Code. 

Exception: 

1. UL or ASMJ listed LPG or natural gas outdoor flame devices, such as gas BBQ's or 
gas fire pits that comply with the Fire Code. 

2. For one-or two-family dwellings, fixed or portable outdoor flame devices that meet the 
following: 

a. Devices shall comply with the Fire Code. 

b. Devices shall be used per the manufacturer's specifications. 

c. Minimum 10-foot clearance from device to all flammable material and vegetation. 

d. No burning shall be conducted during high or extreme fire weather conditions 
(e.g., National Weather Service Red Flag Warnings). 

3. Campfires on private lands. Where required by the fire code official, a permit shall be 
issued by the fire code official. 

4. Ceremonial and/or religious burning with the following safety measures: 

a. Maximum 4-foot x 4-foot bum area. 

b. Minimum 10-foot clearance from the edge of the burn area to all flammable 
material and vegetation. 

c. An approved water supply is located within 500 feet of the burn area. 

d. The burn area is located no less than 30 feet from adjoining property lines. 

e. An adult is present with a shovel until the fire is extinguished. 

f. No burn;ng shall be conducted during h;gh or extreme fire weather conditions 
(e.g., National Weather Se/Vice Red Flag Warnings). 

SECTION 202 "TRAINED CROWD MANAGER" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

23-1589 C 8 of 67



TRAINED CROWD MANAGER. Standby personnel, usually a security guard or usher 
personnel, who are trained in the proper procedure to exit people from a tent or other place of 
public assemblage in an orderly and calm fashion in the event of an emergency 

Chapter 3 

SECTION 302.1 "DEFINITIONS" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 
30 PRINTER. 
ADDITIVE MANUFACTURING. 
BONFIRE. 
CAMPFIRE. 
HI-BOY. 
HIGH-VOLTAGE TRANSMISSION LINE. 
OPEN BURNING. 
PORTABLE OUTDOOR FIREPLACE. 
POWERED INDUSTRIAL TRUCK. 
RECREATIONAL FIRE. 
SKY LANTERN. 

SECTION 307.4.4 "OPEN BURNING RESTRICTIONS" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 307.4.4 Open Burning Restrictions. Open burning on all lands within the jurisdiction 
of the LAKE VALLEYFIRE PROTECTION DfSTRfCT (LVFPD), including the Local Response 
Area (LRA), is prohibited when the California Department of Forestry and Fire Protection (Cal 
Fire) issues a burn suspension in the State Responsibility Area (SRA). This prohibition shall be 
made effective 24-hours following its commencement in the SRA. 

Open burning is also prohibited on all lands within the jurisdiction of LVFPD at any time the fire 
code official that atmospheric conditions or other local circumstances make such fires 
hazardous, including factors such as high winds, low fuel moisture, fire weather, the issuance of 
red flag warnings, the severe threat of wild/and fire, or present risk of destruction by wildfire to 
life, wildlife, property, or natural resources. 

Chapter 4 

SECTION 401.2.1 "PRE-FIRE PLANS" IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 401.2.1 Pre-fire plans. Where required by the fire code official, a pre-fire plan shall be 
provided and approved by the fire code official for all new commercial structures. 

Chapter 5 

SECTION 503.2.1 "DIMENSIONS" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 503.2.1 Dimensions. Fire apparatus access roads shall have an unobstructed width of 
not less than 20 feet (6096 mm), exclusive of shoulders, as measured from face of curb to face 
of curb, except for approved security gates in accordance with Section 503.6, and an 

23-1589 C 9 of 67



unobstructed vertical clearance of not less than 15 feet. Driveways shall have an unobstructed 
width of not less than 12 feet wide. 

SECTION 503.2.5 "DEAD ENDS" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 503.2.5 Dead Ends. Dead-end fire apparatus access roads and driveways in excess of 
150 feet (45,720 mm) in length shall be provided with an approved area for turning around fire 
apparatus. 

SECTION 503.2.6 "BRIDGES AND ELEVATED SURFACES" SHALL BE AMENDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section 503.2.6 Bridges and Elevated Surfaces. Where a bridge or an elevated surface is 
part of a fire apparatus access road, the bridge shall be constructed and maintained in 
accordance with AASHTO HB-17, the current El Dorado County Transportation Division Bridge 
Standard or Appendix D of the current California Fire Code, whichever is more restrictive. 
Bridges and elevated surfaces shall be designed for a live load sufficient to carry the imposed 
loads of fire apparatus. Vehicle load limits shall be posted at both entrances to bridges when 
required by the fire code official. Where elevated surfaces designed for emergency vehicle use 
are adjacent to surfaces that are not designed for such use, approved barriers, approved signs 
or both shall be installed and maintained where required by the fire code official. 

SECTION 503.3.1 "NO PARKING IN FIRE LANES" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 503.3.1 No Parking In Fire Lanes. No person shall stop, park, or leave standing any 
vehicle, whether attended or unattended, except when necessary to avoid conflict with other 
traffic or in compliance with the directions of the Fire Chief, or his/her duly authorized 
representative, Peace Officer, or official traffic control device along the edge of any highway, at 
any curb, or in any location in a publicly or privately owned or operated off-street parking facility, 
designated as a fire lane by the District with jurisdiction over the area in which the place is 
located. The designation shall be indicated (1) by a sign posted immediately adjacent to, and 
visible from, the designated place clearly stating in letters not less than one inch in height that 
the place is a fire lane, (2) by outlining or painting the place in red and, in contrasting color, 
marking the place with the words "FIRE LANE," which are clearly visible from a vehicle, or (3) 
by a red curb or red paint on the edge of the roadway upon which is clearly marked the words 
"FIRE LANE." 

SECTION 503.3.2 "NO PARKING IN FRONT OF HYDRANTS" SHALL BE ADDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section 503.3.2 No Parking in Front of Hydrants. No person shall stop, park, or leave 
standing any vehicle within 15 feet of a fire hydrant except as follows: (a) If the vehicle is 
attended by a licensed driver who is seated in the front seat and who can immediately move 
such vehicle in case of necessity, (b) If the vehicle is owned or operated by a fire department 
and is clearly marked as a fire department vehicle. 

SECTION 503.3.3 "FIRE LANES BASED ON ROAD WIDTH" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

23-1589 C 10 of 67



Section 503.3.3 Fire Lanes Based an Road Width. Fire Janes shall be based on road width as 
required in Appendix D as amended by the District. 

SECTION 503.6 "SECURITY GATES" IS AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 503.6 Security Gates. The installation of security gates across a fire apparatus access 
road shall be approved by the fire code official and shall comply with the District gate standard. 
Where security gates are installed, they shall have an approved means of emergency operation. 
The security gates and the emergency operation shall be maintained operational at all times. 
Electric gate operators, where provided, shall be listed in accordance with UL 325. Gates 
intended for automatic operation shall be designed, constructed, and installed to comply with 
the requirements of ASTM F2200. 

SECTION 505.1 "ADDRESS IDENTIFICATION" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS : 

Section 505.1 Address Identification. Addresses for new and existing buildings shall comply 
with the District address standard as approved by the fire code official. The address 
identification shall be legible and placed in a position that is visible from the street or road 
fronting the property. Address identification characters shall contrast with their background. 
Address numbers shall be Arabic numbers or alphabetical letters. Numbers shall not be spelled 
out. Each character shall be not less than 4 inches (102 mm) high with a minimum stroke width 
of 1

/ 2 inch (12. 7 mm). Where required by the fire code official, address identification shall be 
provided in additional approved locations to facilitate emergency response. access is by means 
of a private road and the building cannot be viewed from the public way, a monument, pole or 
other sign or means shall be used to identify the structure. Address identification shall be 
maintained. 

SECTION 507.5.1 "WHERE REQUIRED" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 507.5.1 Where Required. Where a portion of the facility or building hereafter 
constructed or moved into or within the jurisdiction is more than 150 feet from a hydrant on a fire 
apparatus access road, as measured by an approved route around the exterior of the facility or 
building, on-site fire hydrants and mains capable of supplying the required fire flow shall be 
provided where required by the fire code official. 

Exceptions: 

1. For Group R-3 and Group U occupancies, the distance requirement shall be 600 feet 
(183 m). 

SECTION 509.3 "FIRE CONTROL ROOM" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 509.3 Fire Control Room. Fire sprinkler risers, fire alarm control panels, solar 
photovoltaic power system rapid shutoff switches, and other fire detection, suppression, or 
similar control elements shall be located inside a single fire control room for the building. The 
fire control room shall have minimum dimensions of five feet by seven feet in size with a total 
usable area of not less than 35 square feet. The room shall be located within the building on an 
outside wall at a location approved by the Fire Code Official and shall be accessible from the 
exterior. An exterior access door with a clear width of not less than 32 inches and height of not 
less than 80 inches shall be provided for access into the room. A durable sign shall be affixed to 
the exterior of the door with the words "FIRE CONTROL ROOM" in letters not less than 4 

23-1589 C 11 of 67



inches in height. A key box complying with Section 506 shall be installed on the exterior side of 
the fire control room door opening. 

The room must be capable of maintaining a minimum temperature of 40 degrees Fahrenheit. A 
clearance of 12 inches shall be provided from the fire sprinkler risers to any adjacent walls. This 
room can be shared with other building utilities or fire protection equipment that is not 
incompatible. An approved cabinet or container shall be provided to store record plans of the 
fire sprinkler system and other fire protection equipment. This room shall not be used for any 
other storage. 

Exception: One-and two-family dwellings, manufactured homes, or similar uses defined 
as either a Group R-3, R3. 1, or R-4 occupancy. 

SECTION 510.4.2.3 "STANDBY POWER" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 510.4.2.3 Standby power. In-building, two-way emergency responder communication 
radio coverage systems shall be provided with dedicated standby batteries or provided with 
2-hour standby batteries and connected to the facility generator power system in accordance 
with Section 1203. The standby power supply shall be capable of operating the in-building, 
two-way emergency responder communication coverage system at 100-percent system 
capacity for a duration of not less than 72 hours. 

Chapter 9 

SECTION 903.2 "WHERE REQUIRED" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 903.2 Where Required. Approved automatic sprinkler systems in new buildings and 
structures, when constructed or relocated within the Jurisdiction, shall be provided in the 
locations described in Sections 903.2.1 through 903.2.12 and Sections 903.2.14 through 
903.2.23. 

Exception: Agricultural buildings not under a special use permit used for commercial 
purposes. 

SECTION 903.2.1 .1 "GROUPA-1" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 903.2.1.1 Group A. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout stories 
containing Group A-1 occupancies and throughout all stories from the Group A-1 occupancy to 
and including the levels of exit discharge serving that occupancy where one of the following 
conditions exists: 

1 . The fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

2. The fire area has an occupant load of 300 or more. 

3. The fire area is located on a floor other than a level of exit discharge serving such 
occupancies. 

4. The fire area contains a multi-theater complex 

SECTION 903.2.1.2 "GROUP A-2" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 903.2.1.2 Group A-2. An automatic sprin kier system shall be provided throughout 
stories containing Group A-2 occupancies and throughout all stories from the Group A-2 

23-1589 C 12 of 67



occupancy to and including the levels of exit discharge serving that occupancy where one of the 
following conditions exists: 

1. The fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet; 

2. The fire area has an occupant load of 100 or more. 

3. The fire area is located on a floor other than a level of exit discharge serving such 
occupancies. 

4. The structure exceeds 3,600 square feet, contains more than one fire area containing a 
Group A-2 occupancy, and is separated into two or more buildings by fire walls of less 
than 4-hour fire-resistance rating without openings. 

SECTION 903.2.1.3 "GROUP A-3" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 903.2.1.3 Group A-3. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout 
stories containing Group A-3 occupancies and throughout all stories from the Group A-3 
occupancy to and including the levels of exit discharge serving that occupancy where one of the 
following conditions exists: 

1. The fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

2. The fire area has an occupant load of 300 or more. 

3. The fire area is located on a floor other than a level of exit discharge serving such 
occupancies. 

4. The structure exceeds 3,600 square feet, contains more than one fire area containing 
exhibition and display rooms, and is separated into two or more buildings by fire walls of 
less than 4-hour fire-resistance rating without openings. 

SECTION 903.2.1.4 "GROUP A-4" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 903.2.1.4 Group A-4. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout 
stories containing Group A-4 occupancies and throughout all stories from the Group A-4 
occupancy to and including the levels of exit discharge serving that occupancy where one of the 
following conditions exists: 

1. The fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

2. The fire area has an occupant load of 300 or more. 

3. The fire area is located on a floor other than a level of exit discharge serving such 
occupancies. 

SECTION 903.2.3 "GROUPE" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 903.2.3 Group E. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided for Group E 
occupancies as follows: 

1. Throughout all Group E fire areas greater than 3,600 square feet in area. 

2. The Group E fire area is located on a floor other than a level of exit discharge serving 
such occupancies. 

23-1589 C 13 of 67



Exception: In buildings where every classroom has not fewer than one exterior exit 
door at ground level, an automatic sprinkler system is not required in any 
area below the lowest level of exit discharge serving that area. 

3. The Group E fire area has an occupant load of 300 or more. 

4. In rooms or areas with special hazards such as laboratories, vocational shops and other 
such areas where hazardous materials in quantities not exceeding the maximum 
allowable quantity are used or stored. 

5. Throughout any Group E structure greater than 3,600 square feet in area, which contains 
more than one fire area, and which is separated into two or more buildings by fire walls of 
less than 4-hour fire resistance rating without openings. 

6. For public school, and state-funded construction projects see Section 903.2.19. 

7. For public school campuses, Kindergarten through 12th grade, see Section 903.2.20 

SECTION 903.2.4 "GROUP F-1" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 903.2.4 Group F-1. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout all 
buildings containing a Group F-1 occupancy where one of the following conditions exists: 

1. A Group F-1 fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

2. A Group F-1 fire area is located more than three stories above grade plane. 

3. The combined area of all Group F-1 fire areas on all floors, including any mezzanines, 
exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

SECTION 903.2.7 "GROUP M" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 903.2.7 Group M. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout buildings 
containing a Group M occupancy where one of the following conditions exists: 

1 . A Group M fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

2. A Group M fire area is located more than three stories above grade plane. 

3. The combined area of all Group M fire areas on all floors, including any mezzanines, 
exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

5. The structure exceeds 3,600 square feet, contains more than one fire area containing a 
Group M occupancy, and is separated into two or more buildings by fire walls of less than 
4:..hour fire-resistance rating without openings. 

SECTION 903.2.7.2 "GROUP M UPHOLSTERED FURNITURE OR MATTRESSES" SHALL BE 
AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 903.2.7.2 Group M Upholstered Furniture or Mattresses. An automatic sprinkler 
system shall be provided throughout a Group M fire area where the area used for the display 
and sale of upholstered furniture or mattresses exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

SECTION 903.2.8.5 "MANUFACTURED HOMES" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

23-1589 C 14 of 67



Section 903.2.8.5 Manufactured Homes. An automatic fire sprinkler system shall be required 
in all new manufactured homes and multi-family manufactured homes intended for use as a 
one-and two-family dwelling. The design and installation of such systems shall be in accordance 
with California Code of Regulations, Title 25, §4300. 

Exceptions: 

1. Manufactured homes located within an existing mobile home park complying with 
California Health and Safety Code, Division 13, Part 2.1 or 2.3. 

2. Manufactured homes that do not exceed 1,200 square feet in size and serve as an 
accessory dwelling unit, as defined in Government Code Section 658502; when the 
existing primary residence on the property is not required to comply with California 
Residential Code Section R313.2. 

3. Manufactured homes that do not exceed 320 square feet in size. 

SECTION 903.2.9 "GROUP S-1" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 903.2.9 Group 5-1. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout all 
buildings containing a Group S-1 occupancy where one of the following conditions exists: 

1. A Group S-1 fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

2. A Group S-1 fire area is located more than three stories above grade plane. 

3. The combined area of all Group S-1 fire areas on all floors, including any mezzanines, 
exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

4. A Group S-1 fire area used for the storage of commercial motor vehicles where the fire 
area exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

SECTION 903.2.10 "GROUP S-2" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 903.2.10 Group S-2. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout 
buildings classified as parking garages where any of the following conditions exist: 

1. Where the fire area of the enclosed parking garage, in accordance with Section 406.6 of 
the California Building Code, exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

2. Where the enclosed parking garage, in accordance with Section 406.6 of the California 
Building Code, is located beneath other groups. 

Exception: Enclosed parking garages located beneath Group R-3 occupancies. 

3. Where the fire area of the open parking garage, in accordance with Section 406.5 of the 
California Building Code, exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

SECTION 903.2.10.1 "COMMERCIAL PARKING GARAGES" SHALL BE AMENDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section 903.2.10.1 Commercial Parking Garages. An automatic sprinkler system shall be 
provided throughout buildings used for storage of commercial motor vehicles where the fire 
area exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

23-1589 C 15 of 67



SECTION 903.2.22 "GROUP B" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 903.2.22 Group B. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout all 
buildings containing Group B occupancies where the fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

SECTION 903.2.23 "GROUP F-2" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 903.2.23 Group F-2. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout all 
buildings containing Group F-2 occupancies where the fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

SECTION 903.6 "WHERE REQUIRED IN EXISTING BUILDINGS AND STRUCTURES" IS 
AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 903.6 Where Required In Existing Buildings and Structures. An automatic sprinkler 
system shall be provided in existing buildings and structures where required in Chapter 11 and 
as follows: 

1. When there is a change in occupancy classification that results in an increased life safety 
or fire risk, as determined by the fire code official, and the structure exceeds 3,600 
square feet, an automatic fire sprinkler system shall be installed throughout the building. 

2. In existing buildings 3,600 square feet or greater, other than one and two-family dwelling 
units, and agricultural buildings not under special use permit for commercial purposes, 
where the floor area of the building or structure is increased, such building or structure 
shall be made to conform to Section 903.2. 

Exception: When the building increase is less than 500 square feet. 

3. In existing buildings 3,600 square feet or less, other than one-and two-family dwelling 
units, and agricultural buildings not under special use permit for commercial purposes, 
where the floor area of the building or structure is increased to a total square footage 
over 3,600 square feet, such building or structure shall be made to conform to Section 
903.2. 

Exception: When the building increase is less than 500 square feet. 

SECTION 907.2. "WHERE REQUIRED- NEW BUILDINGS AND STRUCTURES" SHALL BE 
AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 907.2. Where Required - New Buildings and Structures. An approved fire alarm 
system installed in accordance with the provisions of this code and NFPA 72 shall be provided 
in new buildings and structures in accordance with Sections 907.2.1 through 907.2.~30 and 
provide occupant notification in accordance with Section 907.5, unless other requirements are 
provided by another section of this code. 

Not fewer than one manual fire alarm box shall be provided in an approved location to initiate a 
fire alarm signal for fire alarm systems employing automatic fire detectors· or water flow 
detection devices. Where other sections of this code allow the elimination of fire alarm boxes 
due to sprinklers or automatic fire alarm systems, a single fire alarm box shall be installed at a 
location approved by the enforcing agency. 

Exceptions: 

23-1589 C 16 of 67



1. The manual fire alarm box is not required for fire alarm control units systems 
dedicated to elevator recall control, supervisory service and fire sprinkler 
monitoring. 

2. The manual fire alarm box is not required for Group R-2 occupancies unless 
required by the fire code official to provide a means for fire watch personnel to 
initiate an alarm during a sprinkler system impairment event. Where provided, the 
manual fire alarm box shall not be located in an area that is open to the public. 

3. The manual fire alarm box is not required to be installed when approved by the fire 
code official. 

4. A fire alarm system is not required in one and two-family dwellings, agricultural 
buildings, and other occupancies classified as Group U not under special use 
permit and/or not used for commercial purposes (e.g. retail sales, food service, 
and/or special events). 

5. Buildings with a floor area less than 500 square feet may be exempt, as determined 
by the fire code official based on building construction material and features, 
location, occupancy type, and distance to exposures. 

SECTION 907.2.1.4 "GROUP A UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET" SHALL BE ADDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section 907.2.1.4 Group A Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shall be 
installed in all group A buildings with a floor area less than 3,600 square feet. 

SECTION 907.2.2.3 "GROUP B UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET' SHALL BE ADDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section 907.2.2.3 Group B Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shall be 
installed in all group B buildings with a floor area less than 3,600 square feet. 

SECTION 907.2.3.11 "GROUPE UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET" SHALL BE ADDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section 907.2.3.11 Group E Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shall 
be installed in all group E buildings with a floor area less than 3,600 square feet. 

SECTION 907.2.4.1 "GROUP FUNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET" SHALL BE ADDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section 907.2.4.1 Group F Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shall be 
installed in all group F buildings with a floor area less than 3,600 square feet. 

SECTION 907.2.5.2 "GROUP H UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET" SHALL BE ADDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section 907.2.5.2 Group H Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shall be 
installed in all group H buildings with a floor area less than 3,600 square feet. 

23-1589 C 17 of 67



SECTION 907.2.6.6 "GROUP I UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET' SHALL BE ADDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section 907.2.6.6 Group I Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shall be 
installed in all group I buildings with a floor area less than 3,600 square feet. 

SECTION 907.2.7.2 "GROUP MUNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET" SHALL BE ADDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section 907.2. 7.2 Group M Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shall be 
installed in all group M buildings with a floor area less than 3,600 square feet. 

SECTION 907.2.8.4 "GROUP R-1 UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET" SHALL BE ADDEO AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section 907.2.8.4 Group R-1 Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shall 
be installed in all group R-1 buildings with a floor area less than 3,600 square feet. 

SECTION 907.2.9.4 "GROUP R-2, R-2.1, R-2.2 UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET' SHALL BE 
ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 907.2.9.4 Group R-2, R-2.1, R-2.2 Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm 
system shall be installed in all group R-2, R-2. 1, R-2.2 buildings with a floor area less than 
3,600 square feet. 

SECTION 907.2.10.1 "GROUPS UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET" SHALL BE ADDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section 907.2.10.1 Group S Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shall 
be installed in all group S buildings with a floor area less than 3,600 square feet. 

907.2.30 "TYPE I HOOD INSTALLATIONS" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

907.2.30 "Type I Hood Installations. The requirement of installation, or replacement, of a Type 
I Hood System shall require a fire alarm/sprinkler monitoring system to be installed, or for the 
hood system to be connected to an existing fire a/arm/sprinkler monitoring system for that 
building. 

907.6.5 "MONITORING" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

907.6.5 Monitoring. Fire alarm systems required by this chapter or by the California Building 
Code shall be monitored by an approved, UL certified, Type A Full SeNice central, proprietary 
or remote station seNice, which gives audible and visual signals at a constantly attended 
location. All sprinklered buildings shall be monitored. 

Exceptions: 

1. One- and two-family dwellings (R-3 Occupancies and other occupancies classified as 
"U'J. 

23-1589 C 18 of 67



2. Agricultural buildings not under special use permit and/or not used for commercial 
purposes (e.g., retails safes, food service, and/or special events). 

SECTION 907.6.2.1 "SECONDARY POWER SUPPLY" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

SECTION 907.6.2.1 SECONDARY POWER SUPPLY. Where required by the fire code official, 
in accordance with NFPA 72, the secondary power supply providing a minimum 24-hour power 
capacity under quiescent load (system operating in a non-alarm condition) shall be amended to 
a minimum 72-hour power capacity 

Exception: The existence of an emergency back-up power supply that meets or exceed 
the requirements of California Fire Code Chapter 12. 

SECTION 907.9 "WHERE REQUIRED IN EXISTING BUILDINGS" SHALL BE AMENDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

SECTION 907.9 Where Required. An approved fire alarm system shall be provided in existing 
buildings and structures where required in Chapter 11 and in existing buildings with a floor area 
less than 3,600 square feet without an approved automatic sprinkler system, other than one- or 
two-family dwelling units, agricultural building not under special use permit for commercial 
purposes where a fire alarm detection system does not exist and the floor area of the building or 
structure is increased 

Exception: When the building increase is less than 500 square feet. 

Chapter 12 

SECTION 1203.1.3 "INSTALLATION" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 1203.1.3 Installation. Emergency power systems and standby power systems shall be 
installed in accordance with the California Building Code, the California Electrical Code, NFPA 
110 and NFPA 111. All buildings, other than one- and two-family dwelling units, and agricultural 
buildings not used for commercial purposes, with standby power, shall have a shunt trip device 
that disconnects all power sources to the building, approved by the fire code official. Existing 
installations shall be maintained in accordance with the original approval. 

Chapter 33 

SECTION 3311.3 "PREMISE IDENTIFICATION" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 3311.3 Premise Identification. Prior to and during construction, an approved address 
sign shall be provided at each fire and emergency vehicle access road entry into the project. 

SECTION 3313.1 "WHEN REQUIRED" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 3313.1 When Required. An approved water supply for fire protection, either temporary 
or permanent, shall be installed and maintained in continuous operation as soon as combustible 
building materials arrive on site, the commencement of vertical combustible construction and on 
installation of a standpipe system in buildings under construction, in accordance with Sections 
3313.2 through 3313.5. 

23-1589 C 19 of 67



Exception: The fire code official is authorized to reduce the fire-flow requirements for 
isolated buildings or a group of buildings in rural areas or small communities where the 
development of full fire-flow requirements is impractical. 

Chapter 50 

SECTION 5001.7 "LIABILITY FOR DAMAGES" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 5001. 7 Liability for Damages. Any damages or cost resulting from the negligence, 
violation of the law, careless handling, spill or discharge of any hazardous materials shall 
consUtute debt against any such person, firm or corporation causing such spill or discharge. 
This debt is collectible by the Fire Chief, or his/her duly authorized representative, in the same 
manner as in the case of an obligation under contract, expressed or implied. 

Chapter 56 

SECTION 5601.2 'PERMIT REQUIRED" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 5601.2 Permit Required. Permits shall be required as set forth in Section 105.5 and 
regulated in accordance with this section. Where fireworks permits are required, they shall be 
issued by the Fire Chief, or his/her duly authorized representative, and the El Dorado County 
Board of Supervisors. 

Chapter 57 

SECTION 5704.2.9.6.1 "LOCATIONS WHERE ABOVE-GROUND TANKS ARE PROHIBITED" 
SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

SECTION 5704.2.9.6.1 Locations Where Above-Ground Tanks are Prohibited. Storage of 
Class I and Class II flammable liquids in above-ground tanks outside of buildings is prohibited 
within the limits established by law as the limits of districts in which such storage is prohibited. 
Storage of Class I and Class II flammable liquids in above-ground tanks outside of buildings is 
prohibited unless approved by the fire code official. 

SECTION 5706.2.4.4 "LOCATIONS WHERE ABOVE-GROUND TANKS ARE PROHIBITED" 
SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS : 

SECTION 5706.2.4.4 Locations Where Above-Ground Tanks are Prohibited. The storage of 
Class I and Class II liquids in above-ground tanks is prohibited within the limits established by 
law as the limits of districts in which such storage is prohibited. Storage of Class I and Class II 
liquids in above-ground tanks is prohibited unless approved by the fire code official. 

Chapter 58 

SECTION 5806.2 "LIMITATIONS" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

23-1589 C 20 of 67



SECTION 5806.2 Limitations. Storage of flammable cryogenic fluids in stationary containers 
outside of buildings is prohibited within the limits established by law as the limits of districts in 
which such storage is prohibited. Storage of flammable cryogenic fluids in stationary containers 
outside of buildings is prohibited unless approved by the fire code official. 

Chapter 61 

SECTION 6104.2 "MAXIMUM CAPACITY WITHIN ESTABLISHED LIMITS" SHALL BE 
AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

SECTION 6104.2 Maximum Capacity within Established Limits. Within the limits established 
by law restricting the storage of liquefied petroleum gas for the protection of heavily populated 
or congested areas, the aggregate capacity of any one installation shall not exceed a water 
capacity of 2,000 gallons. The storage of liquefied petroleum gas in excess of an aggregate of 
2,000-galfon water capacity when located at least one-half (1/2) mile from property zoned or 
designated for residential use and at feast one-half (1/2) mile from existing residential 
development with a density greater than one ( 1) dwelling unit per acre and at least one-half 
(1/2) mile from any hotel or motel is allowed when approved by the fire code official, and a 
special/conditional usepermit is issued by the County of El Dorado. 

Dispensing within established limits. Within the limits established by law restricting the 
dispensing of liquefied petroleum gas for the protection of heavily populated or congested 
areas, the aggregate capacity of any one installation shall not exceed a water capacity of 2,000 
gallons. The dispensing of liquefied petroleum gas in excess of an aggregate of 2,000-gallon 
water capacity when located at least one-half (1/2) mile from property zoned or designated for 
residential use and at least one-half (112) mile from any hotel or motel is allowed when 
approved by the fire code official and a special/conditional use permit is issued by the County of 
El Dorado. 

Section 6112 High Elevation Liquefied Petroleum Gas Installations (5,000 

foot elevations and above) shall be added as follows: 

Any new LPG installation shall comply with the following: 

1. A permit is required by this Code for individual LPG containers of 125 

gallons or greater. At the time of application by any person for a permit to 

install an LPG system as required by this Code, the applicant shall submit an 

LPG plot plan to the District for approval and shall contain the following: 

a. Stamp of approval of the prospective LPG supplier. 

b. Tank location showing distances to structure and edge to edge of 

pavement or other identifying mark. 

23-1589 C 21 of 67



c. Tank capacity in US gallons. 

d. Location of riser pipe at building. 

e. Property boundaries. 

f. An outline of all existing/proposed buildings on the lot and a depiction of the 

roof ridge line of any building to be supplied with LPG. 

2. Two stage regulator systems shall be installed on all LPG installations in 

accordance with manufacturer's instructions. All first stage regulators and 

connecting pigtails shall be installed under a protective valve cover on the 

tank. All regulators installed under th;s cover shall be listed and approved for 

this use and position of mounting. A connector providing flexibility shall be 

used to connect the first stage regulator to the main service valve on the tank. 

All copper pigtails shall be internally tinned and use only forged flare nuts. 

3. The riser from the yard piping shall be a minimum of Schedule 80 and shall be 

located not more than 3 inches horizontally from the walls of the tank, and 

swing joints will be used above and below tank level to provide for tank 

movement (street elbows shall not be used). An approved flexible alternative is 

preferred in lieu of rigid steel pipe for the tank riser. This shall include but not 

be limited to plastic (PE), copper tubing, stainless steel. ALL FLEXIBLE 

MATERIAL USED FOR THE TANK RISER SHALL BE SHEATHEO IN AN 

APPROVED STEEL COVER FOR PROTECTION. As swing joints are 

eliminated in an approved flexible alternative, sufficient slack must be 

maintained to allow for tank movement and/or expansion and contraction of the 

alternative material. All plastic pipe shall be buried at least 18" below finished 

grade. An electrically continuous corrosion resistant tracer wire (min. A WG 14) 

or tape shall be buried with the plastic pipe to facilitate locating. One end shall 

be brought above ground at the building wall or riser and the other end shall be 

23-1589 C 22 of 67



brought above ground at the tank. 

4. The second stage regulator and riser pipe shall be installed on the gable end 

of the building, as close as practical to the building wall, unless this is not 

feasible due to structural or topographical constraints. An approved gas shutoff 

valve rated for a minimum of 125 PSI shall be installed immediately prior to the 

second stage regulator. An approved gas shut off sign or other identifier shall 

be installed directly above the gas shut off valve, on the building in a visible 

location within three (3) feet of the eaves of the roof or roof line if no eaves are 

present. If the second stage regulator or a combination first/second stage 

regulator is used at the tank, then an approved gas shut off valve shall be 

located at the building. 

5. A protective cover shall be installed over the second stage regulator and meter 

(if installed) at the building. The minimum design for the protective cover shall 

be equal to, or greater than, the Building Design Load (determined by the 

building department), and shall be securely supported to the ground or 

diagonally to the building wall. When supported to the ground, the footing for 

the supports shall be found 6 inches below finished grade. Precast concrete 

piers may be used in lieu of poured footings, provided they are placed on 

stable soil. If second stage regulator/meter assemblies could be subject to 

vehicle damage, then a minimum of 3" steel crash posts filled with concrete 

shall be installed for protection. Crash posts shall have a minimum depth in the 

ground of 24", embedded in concrete. 

6. Observation and inspecUon, if any, by the District shall not constitute an 

approval of the work of installation of the aforementioned protective cover, nor 

shall it be deemed to create any liability or responsibility on the part of the 

District for the design or construction of the protective cover, nor to any third 

party or entity whatsoever. 

7. The riser pipes for the yard piping shall not be embedded in concrete, asphalt 

or other rigid substance. Such substance placed around a riser shall be held 

back at least 3 inches from all sides of the pipe. All exposed exterior gas piping 

23-1589 C 23 of 67



used for runs along walls or roofs shall be minimum schedule 80 steel pipe 

supported and secured by approved straps at intervals not to exceed four (4) 

feet. 

B. LPG tanks shall be permanently marked by a square or other approved equal 

stake of wood or other material with a minimum dimension of 2" X 2" or a 

cross sectional width of 21 nominal lumber. 

9. Such stakes shall be of sufficient height to rise above the anticipated snow 

depth, with the minimum height being 10 feet. The snow stakes shall be yellow 

in color and will be placed on the opposite side of the tank from the riser, and 

directly opposite the tank valves. The top twelve inches of the stake shall be 

painted orange. The side of the stake adjacent to the tank shall continue with 

the orange color a minimum of 18 inches from the top of the stake. 

I 0. Installation and maintenance of all tank stakes shall be the responsibility of 

the LPG supplier. No tank shall be filled or serviced unless staked as provided 

in this chapter. 

11. Any supplier supplying propane to a tank must affix a label or other means of 

identification to the inside of the tank valve protective cover. The label or other 

device must be waterproof and contain the supplier's name and emergency 

telephone number. 

12. All LPG tanks shall be placed on approved concrete supports. Acceptable tank 

supports shall include, but not be limited to: Precast reinforced concrete pads, 

reinforced concrete slab, or precast reinforced concrete saddles. Use of 

un-reinforced cinder building blocks is specifically prohibited. If saddles are 

used they shall contact a minimum of 110 degrees of the tank circumference. 

Asphalt impregnated felt of not less than 3/8" thickness shall be installed 

between the container and the concrete saddle. Support may be poured in 

place in lieu of prefabricated supports. If poured in place it shall be a minimum 

of 4 inches thick and reinforced with not less than WWF 6X12, W16 by W26 or 

4 #3 rebar in each direction. In areas where tanks may be subject to shifting 

snow, unstable ground or other hazardous conditions, the Fire Chief may 

23-1589 C 24 of 67



require additional tank support, securing or protection. 

Section 6113 Underground LPG Tanks Installations and Ownership shall be 

added as follows: 

6113.1 Permits and Plans. Permits shall be required, and plans shall be 

submitted for all underground tank installations as approved by the AHJ. 

6113.2 Underground LPG Tank Ownership. Underground LPG tanks shall be 

prohibited from being sold to end-users and shalt be retained by the LPG company 

under a lease-type system to ensure proper annual maintenance requirements are 

met and 

recorded. 

Section 6114 Natural Gas shall be added as follows: 

Existing natural gas installations shall comply with the following: 

1. The meter assembly shall be installed on the gable end of the building, as 

close as practical to the building wall, unless this is not feasible due to 

structural or topographical constraints. 

2. A protective cover, designed to be equal to or greater than the Building Design 

Load (determined by the building department), approved by the supplier, shall 

be installed over the meter assembly, securely supported to the ground or 

diagonally to the building wall. 

When supported to the ground, the footing for the supports shall be founded 

6 inches below finished grade. Pre-cast concrete piers may be used in lieu 

poured footings, provided they are placed on stable soil. 

23-1589 C 25 of 67



Section 6115 Violations shall be added as follows: 

6115. 1 Violations. It shall be unlawful for an LPG supplier to provide service to 

a LPG installation, which does not comply with the provisions in section 6112 or 

6113. 

6115.2 Failure to Provide Cover. Failure by the customer to provide a cover as 

required for a natural gas meter assembly is a violation of this code and will subject 

the customer to a one hundred dollar ($100.00) fine. 

Chapter 80 

SECTION 80, NFPA 1-22, CHAPTER 22 "AUTOMOTIVE WRECKING YARDS" IS ADOPTED, 
AMENDED SECTIONS AS FOLLOWS: 

Revise Section 22.3 as follows: 

22.3 Fire department access roads shall be in accordance with the California Fire Gode, Section 
503 and Appendix D. 

Add new Section 22.10 as follows: 

22.10 Stored vehicles, boats, recreational vehicles, parts, and equipment shall not be stored 
within 30 feet of adjacent property lines. 

SECTION 80, NFPA, 130-22- "STANDARD FOR THE INSTALLATION OF SPRINKLER 
SYSTEMS IN ONE-AND TWO FAMILY DWELLINGS AND MANUFACTURED HOMES" IS 
AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 903.3.1.3, 903.3.5.1.1 

23-1589 C 26 of 67



NFPA 130, Amended Sections as follows: 

Add new Section 4.6 as follows: 

4.6 Residential fire sprinkler systems installed in all new one-and two-family dwellings shall 
utilize a "Passive Purge" system design unless othe,wise approved by the fire code official. 

Exception: Manufactured home installed, tested and approved by the California 
Department of Housing and Community Development. 

Revise Section 5.1.1.2 as follows: 

5.1.1.2 A supply of at least one of each type and temperature sprinkler used within the premises 
shall be maintained on the property at an approved location. Spare sprinklers shall be kept in a 
mounted and accessible cabinet. 

Revise Section 7.6 as follows: 

7.6 A local audio/visual device activated upon water flow shall be provided on all fire sprinkler 
systems in homes at an approved location on the exterior of the dwelling. 

Revise Section 11.2.1.1 as follows: 

11.2.1.1 Where a fire department pumper connection is not provided, the system shall be 
hydrostatically tested at a minimum pressure of 150 pounds per square inch gauge for no less 
than a 30-minute duration without evidence of leakage. Such a test shall be witnessed by the 
fire code official. 

Appendix B - Fire Flow Requirements for Buildings 

TABLE B105.1(1) "REQUIRED FIRE FLOW FOR ONE- AND TWO-FAMILY DWELLINGS, 
GROUP R-3, AND R-4 BUILDINGS AND TOWNHOUSES" SHALL BE AMENDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

TABLE B105.1 (1) REQUIRED FIRE FLOW FOR ONE- AND TWO-FAMILY DWELLINGS, 
GROUP R-3, AND R-4 BUILDINGS AND TOWNHOUSES 

(PLEASE NOTE THAT TABLE B105.1(1/ INCLUDES A SEPARATE SECTION FOR SPRINKLERED RESIDENCES WITH LESSER 
ElB£ FLOW REQUIREMENTS NOT MENTIONED IN THIS AMENDED SECTION,! 

FIRE-FLOW AUTOMATIC MINIMUM FLOW DURATION 
CALCULATIO SPRINKLER SYSTEM FIRE-FLOW (hours) 

NAREA (Design Standard) (gallons per 
(square feet) minute) 

0- 3,600 No automatic 
system 

sprinkler 1,000 1 

3,601 and greater No automatic sprinkler Value in Table Duration in Table 
system B105.1 (2) B105.1(2) at the 

23-1589 C 27 of 67



required fire-flow 

rate 

MAJOR SUBDIVISIONS (5 PARCELS OR GREATER) 

0- 3,600 Section 903. 3 .1 . 3 of the CA 1,000 1 

Fire Code or Section 

313.3 of the CA 
Residential Code 

3,601 and greater Section 903.3.1.3 of the CA 1/2 value of 

Fire Code or Section Table 8105.1(2) 2 
313.3 of the CA (min. 1000 GPM) 

Residential Code 

OTHER RESIDENTIAL DEVELOPMENT 

0- 3,600 Section 903.3.1.3 of the CA 500 1 
Fire Code or Section 
313.3 of the CA 

Residential Code 

3,601 and greater Section 903.3.1.3 of the CA 1 /2 value of Table 1 
Fire Code or Section B105.1 (2) (min. 

313.3 of the CA 750 GPM) 

Residential Code 

TABLE B105.2 "REQUIRED FIRE FLOW FOR BUILDINGS OTHER THAN ONE- AND 
TWO-FAMILY DWELLINGS, GROUP R-3, AND R-4 BUILDINGS AND TOWNHOUSES" 
SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

TABLE 8105.2 REQUIRED FIRE FLOW FOR BUILDINGS OTHER THAN ONE- AND 
TWO-FAMILY DWELLINGS, GROUP R-3, AND R-4 BUILDINGS AND 
TOWNHOUSES 

AUTOMATIC MINIMUM FIRE-FLOW FLOW DURATION 

SPRINKLER SYSTEM (gallons per minute) (hours) 

(Design Standard) 
No automatic sprinkler Value in Table Duration in Table B 105.1 (2) 
system B105.1(2) 

Section 903. 3 .1. 1 of the 25% of the value in Duration in Table B105.1(2) at 
CA Fire Code Table B 105.1 (2) b the reduced flow rate 

b. The reduced fire flow shall not be less than 1,500 GPM 

Appendix D - Fire Apparatus Access Roads 

23-1589 C 28 of 67



SECTION 0103.1 "ACCESS ROAD WIDTH WITH A HYDRANT' SHALL BE AMENDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section D103.1 Access Road Width with a Hydrant. Where a fire hydrant is located on a fire 
apparatus access road, the minimum road width shall be 26 feet (7925 mm), exclusive of 
shoulders {see Figure 0103.1). 

Exception: Driveways 

SECTION 0103.2 "GRADE" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

SECTION D103.2 Grade. Fire apparatus access roads and driveways shall not exceed 15.9% 
in grade unless approved by the fire code official or by the El Dorado County amended 
California Public Resource Code Title 14 I Design and Improvement Standards Manual. 

SECTION D103.3 "TURNING RADIUS" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

SECTION 0103.3 Turning Radius. The minimum turning radius shall be determined by the fire 
code official; and shall not include curb and gutter. 

SECTION D103.5 "FIRE APPARATUS ACCESS ROAD GATES" SHALL BE AMENDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

SECTION D103.5 Fire Apparatus Access Road Gates. Gates securing the fire apparatus 
access roads shall comply with all of the following criteria: 

1. Where a single gate is provided, the gate width shall be not less than 20 feet (6096 mm). 
Where a fire apparatus road consists of a divided roadway, the gate width shall be not 
less than 15 feet (3658 mm). 

2. Gates shall be of the horizontal swing, horizontal slide, vertical lift, or vertical pivot type. 

3. Construction of gates shall be of materials that allow manual operation by one person. 

4. Gate components shall be maintained in an operative condition at all times and replaced 
or repaired when defective. 

5. Electric gates shall be equipped with a means of opening the gate by fire department 
personnel for emergency access. Emergency opening devices shall be approved by the 
fire code official. 

6. Methods of locking shall be submitted for approval by the fire code official. 

7. Electric gate operators, where provided, shall be listed in accordance with UL 325. 

8. Gates intended for automatic operation shall be designed, constructed, and installed to 
comply with the requirements of ASTM F2200. 

SECTION D103.6.1 "ROADS 20 TO 29 FEET IN WIDTH" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

SECTION 0103.6.1 Roads 20 to 29 feet in width. Fire lane signs, as specified in Section 
0103.6 shall be posted on both sides of fire apparatus access roads that are 20 to 29 feet wide 
(6096 to 8534.4 mm). 

23-1589 C 29 of 67



SECTION D103.6.2 "ROADS MORE THAN 29 FEET IN WIDTH" SHALL BE AMENDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

SECTION D103.6.2 Roads more than 29 feet in Width. Fire lane signs, as specified in 
Section D103.6, shall be posted on one side of fire apparatus access roads more than 29 feet 
wide (8534.4 mm) and less than 36 feet wide (10972.8 mm). 

SECTION D104.4 "CIRCUMFERENTIAL FIRE APPARATUS ACCESS ROADS" SHALL BE 
ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

SECTION D104.4 Circumferential Fire Apparatus Access Roads. When required by the fire 
code official, a fire apparatus access road shall be constructed to encompass the entirety of a 
structure and shall provide a continuous means of emergency vehicle access. 

SECTION 4: CONFLICT 

That Ordinance No. 2019-01 of the LVFPD and all other ordinances or parts of ordinances 

herewith are hereby repealed. 

SECTION 5: SEVERABILITY 

If any Ordinance, article, subsection or subdivision thereof, provision, sentence, clause, or 

phrase of this code, or any application thereof, is for any reason held to be invalid by a court of 

competent jurisdiction, such decision shall not affect the remaining provisions of this code, 

which can be given effect without the invalid portions and, therefore, such invalid portions are 

declared to be severable. The LVFPD hereby declares that it would have enacted this 

Ordinance and each of its articles, sections, subsections, or subdivisions thereof, provisions, 

sentences, clauses, or phrases, irrespective of the fact that one or more of them is declared 

invalid. 

SECTION 6: EFFECTIVE DATE AND PUBLICATION 

This Ordinance shall take effect thirty (30) days after its adoption. The LVFPD Board Secretary 

is directed to publish this Ordinance in a newspaper of general circulation in the District. In lieu 

of publication of the full text of the Ordinance, a summary of the Ordinance may be published by 

the by the Board Secretary within fifteen ( 15) days after its passage and a certified copy shall be 

posted in the office of the LVFPD pursuant to Government Code Section 36933(c) (1). 

23-1589 C 30 of 67



The above Ordinance will be introduced at a meeting of the Board of Directors of the LVFPD on 

December 8, 2022, and it will then be read for the first time. A public hearing will be set for the 

Ordinance to be read for the second time no earlier than 10 days after 1st reading, and 

approved by the following vote: 

.-
PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of Directors of the LVFPD on the ..:::, day of 

J'!'Y\V My , 2 0 2 3. 

AYES: 

NOES: 

ABSENT: 

ABSTAIN: 

J 

ATTEST: 

5 

0 

Irene Kaelin, Board Secretary 

23-1589 C 31 of 67



LAKE VALLEY FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT 

RESOLUTION NO: 2022-01 

A RESOLUTION OF THE BOARD OF DlRECTORS OF THE LAKE 
VALLEY FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT ADOPTING FINDINGS 

SUPPORTING AMENDMENTS TO THE CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE 

A resolution for the Lake Valley Fire Protection District setting forth findings with 

respect to local conditions within tJ1c Fire District which make certain modifications and 

changes to the California Fire Code reasonably necessary for preserving fire and life 

safety in the Lake Valley fire Protection District. 

The Governing Board of the Lake Valley Fire Protection Dist1ict finds and 

resolves as follows: 

WHEREAS, Health & Safety Code Section 17958.5 pennits a Fire Protection 

District lo adopt an ordinance which changes or modifies the State Housing regulations 

adopted pursuant to Health & Safety Code Section 17922 upon a detennination that such 

changes or modifications are necessary due to local conditions that pertain regulations 

governing conditions hazardous to life, property and the environment from fire, 

explosion, hazardous materials and hazardous uses; and 

WHEREAS, Health & Safely Code Section 17958.7 requires that a District's Board 

of Directors making any changes or modifications pursuant to Health & Safety Code Section 

17958.5 shall make an express finding that such changes or modifications arc needed; 

and shall file a copy of such changes or modifications with the Department of Housing 

and Comm1mity Development; and 

WHEREAS, the unique local climatic, geological, and topographical conditions 

existing within the boundaries of the District make it reasonably necessary for the 

District to impose more stringent requirements than set forth in the California Fire Code 

and pursuant to California Health and Safety Code sections 13869.7 and 17958.7, the 

District desires to make express findings to that effect; and 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that the Board of Directors of the 

Lake Valley Fire Protection District, after having duly noticed and held public hearings, 

hereby adopts the following findings concerning cunent unique local conditions that 

together make each modification to the California Fire Code, reasonably necessary to 

provide adequate and effective protection of life, property and the environment more 

specifically set forth a.<; follows: 

23-1589 C 32 of 67



SECTION 2: FINDINGS OF FACTS 

In connection with the amendments enacted by Section 2 and 3 relating to 
the California Fire Code and its appendix, 2022 edition, the LAKE VALLEY 
FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT (LVFPD) makes the following findings 
pursuant to Health and Safety Code Section 17958.5, 17958. 7, and 
18941.5. The changes are reasonably necessary because of local climatic, 
topographical, or geological conditions. 

LVFPD hereby adopts, pursuant to Section 18941.5 of the California 
Health and Safety Code, the following findings of fact: 

(a) Under this adopting ordinance, specific amendments have been 
established which are of a more restrictive nature than those adopted by the 
State of California (State Buildings Standards Code, State Housing & 
Community Development Codes), commonly referred to as Title 24 & Title 
25 of the California Code of Regulations. The LVFPD has recognized these 
amendments to the California Fire Code 2022 edition to address the fire 
problems, concerns, and future direction by which LVFPD can establish and 
maintain an environment that will afford a level of fire and life safety to all 
who live and work within its boundary. 

(b) The International Code Council has assumed responsibility for the 
International Fire Code and International Fire Code Standards. The 
International Code Council provided a means for participation by all code 
enforcement officials from throughout the country and industry 
representatives, consultants, and other private parties interested in the 
International Fire Code. 

(c) The International Fire Code, being the 2021 edition thereof, 
published by the International Code Council, is a nationally recognized 
compilation of proposed rules, regulations, and standards of said 
Association. 

(d) Said International Fire Code has been printed and published as a 
Code in book form within the meaning of Section 50022.1 of the 
Government Code of the State of California. 

(e) Under Section 18941.5 of the Health and Safety Code, local 
amendments are based on climatic, topographical, and geological 

conditions. The findings of fact herein address each of these situations and 
present the local situation, which, either singularly or in combination, 

caused the aforementioned amendments to be adopted. 

Page 1 of 1 O 

23-1589 C 33 of 67



2022 CFC FINDINGS 

LOCAL CONDITIONS 

A. These amendments are justified on the basis of a local climatic 
condition. LVFPD is subject to precipitation, relative humidity, 
temperature extremes, and high velocity winds. 

1. Precipitation & relative humidity 

a. Conditions 

Precipitation. Annual precipitation fluctuates greatly. 
Approximately 90 - 95 percent of the precipitation occurs 
during the months of November through April. and 5 - 10 
percent occurs· from May through October. This area has 
experienced major droughts in the recent past; one in 

1977 - 1978, one which started in 1989 and lasted into 1994, 
others from 1999-2004, and 2006-2009. Droughts continue to 
cycle to this day. Electrical storms are frequent and are usually 
accompanied by little rainfall, potentially creating numerous 
lightning caused fires. Snow storms, loss of access and 
avalanches are routine. Heavy winter snows are responsible 
for delays in response and access to buildings and patients at 
emergency scenes. Winter snow storms along with heavy tourist 
traffic routinely bring all community traffic to a standstill 
during weekends and holidays. 

Relative Humidity. During the months of June through 
September, the daily humidity ranges around 30 percent, and 
often drops to the low teens. Low relative humidity have 
allowed for greater spread of wildfires and caused structure 
fires to readily spread to the wildland interlace 

Temperatures. During the months of June through 
September, daily temperatures exceed 70 degrees to 90 

degrees Fahrenheit. Winter temperatures can drop 
to below O degrees Fahrenheit. The highest recorded 
temperature was 99 degrees Fahrenheit in 1988 with 

the lowest being negative 13 degrees Fahrenheit 
February of 2019. 

Page 2 of 10 

23-1589 C 34 of 67



Winds. Prevailing winds are out of the south and southwest. 

However, north and east winds occur during the spring (May 
through June), the fall (late September and October), and 
occasionally during the summer months. Wind velocities 

generally range from five to fifteen miles per hour, gusting to 
thirty miles per hour during the summer months 

SUMMARY 

These local climatic conditions affect the community's acceleration, 
intensity and size of a fire. Times of little or no rainfall and high 
temperatures create extremely hazardous conditions, mainly 
residential roof fires and wildfire conflagrations. The climatic 
conditions are one of the most significant impacts to fire behavior and 
other major emergency events due to their uncontrollable nature. 

B. These amendments are justified based on local geOlogic and 
topographic conditions. LVFPD is subject to terrain, slopes, increased 
vegetation, surface features, hazardous building operations, and 
terrain risk factors. 

1. Geological location 

a. Conditions 

Geological Location. The fire environment of a community is 
primarily a combination of two factors: the physical geographic 
characteristics of the area and the historic pattern of development. These 
two factors create a mixture of environments that ultimately determines 
the area's fire protection needs. 

The Lake Valley Fire Protection District provides fire prevention, fire 

protection, advanced emergency medical and rescue services for 

unincorporated El Dorado and Alpine County an,as within the Lake Tahoe 

Basin. 

The Lake Valley Fire Protection District serves 85 square miles via Station 
7, located at 2211 Keetak, Station 6, located at 1286 Golden Bear Trail. Station 5 

located at 1009 Boulder Mountain Court is staffed by Calfire via a lease 

agreement with the District. 

Page 3 of 10 

23-1589 C 35 of 67



The Lake Valley Fire Protection District service area includes: California State 

Highway 50 from Camp SacramentoT to the City of South Lake Tahoe 

boundary; California State Highway 89 South from Alpine County Willow 

Creek Road to California State Highway 50 in Meyers. 

Extending along California State Highway 89 North, the Fire District 

extends from the Northern boundary of the City of South Lake Tahoe (West 

Way) to Eagle Creek in Emerald Bay. 

The service area has a varied topography and vegetative cover. It has 

relatively flat areas along the shoreline of Lake Tahoe along Pope and 

Baldwin Reach areas (6225.feet at Lake level). Steep hills and mountain 

peaks over I 0,000 feet are part of the Tahoe Basin. The most prominent 
peak in the fire District is Mount Tallac at 9735. Vegetative cover 

ranges from stands of manzanita to dense frwests of fir and pine trees. 

The main commercial areas are in Meyers and Tahoe Paradise along the 

highway 50 corridor. Businesses as well as the California Agricultural 
Station, the Meyers Elementary School, two golf courses and the local 

Tahoe Paradise Park are in this area. 

Neighborhoods in the vicinity of Pioneer Trail include: Elks Club, Golden 

Bear, Cold Creek, High Meadow, Black Bart, Kokanee Trail, 

Montgomery Estates, Washoan. This corridor also includes the Sierra 

House School and the South Tahoe Public Utilities District work sites. 

The neighborhoods of North Upper Truckee, Echo View Estates, 

Mountain View Estates, and Tahoe Mountain were affected by the Angora 

Fire of 2006 with the loss of 254 homes. The area secs significant traffic delays 

due to tourist travel and is highly prone to heavy snows. 

The neighborhoods of South Upper Truckee and Christmas Valley off of 

both State Highway 50 at Echo Summit and State Highway 89 to Alpine 
County also suffer traffic delays from tourist travel and heavy snows. Echo 

Summit, via State Highway 50, is a funnel for traffic congestion and 

highly prone to winter avalanches. 

Page 4 of 10 

23-1589 C 36 of 67



The State Highway 89 corridor, north to Emerald Bay, is the most heavily 

traveled road in the Lake Tahoe Basin. Of the estimated 20 million 

tourists visiting the Tahoe Basin annually, roughly 4.9 million stop to take 

a picture of Emerald Bay. This busy highway runs through Camp 

Richardson Resort, Pope, Kiva and Baldwin Beaches and USFS historic 

sites. Traveling north the Mount Tallac trailhead, access to Fallen Leaf 

Lake, the Cascade Lake and residential area, the Spring Creek summer 
residential areas are passed along the way to Inspiration Point and 

Emerald Bay, Vikings Holm and the Eagle Falls Creek. The Fire District 

extends along State Highway 50, over Echo Summ\t on the west side of 

the Sierra crest to the Echo Snow Park- Adventure Mountain and Sierra at Tahoe Ski 

Resort. Additionally the District serves the hamlets of Little Norway, the 

Mount Ralston Subdivision, Echo Lakes, Philips, Sierra Pines, Bryan 

Creek, Tamarack Park, Sayles Canyon and Camp Sacramento. 

Due to the remoteness of the communities and recreational areas of 

Strawberry, Twin Bridges, HorscTail Falh, Lover's Leap and the 39 mile 
tract, Lake Valley Fire District personnel are called to serve these areas 

within the El Dorado County Fire Protection District. 

Seismic Location. 

The relatively young geological processes that created the Tahoe Basin are 

still active. The district's entire land surface is in the high-to-moderate seismic hazard 

zones. 

Size and Population. 

The District covers 85 square miles with a population of 13,000, swelling to 
over 100,000 during the summer months. The District has 3 fire stations; 
two staffed by 22 safety personnel and one (1) fire station via Cal fire 
contract. The District has four ( 4) Chief Officers, including the Fire Chief, 
one (l) Fire Prevention Technician, one (1) Mechanic/Fleet Manager and 
one (1) Administrative Manager. Overall, there 29 fire total District 
personnel. The District oversight is via the five (5) members of the Fire 
Board of Directors. 

Page 5 of 10 

23-1589 C 37 of 67



Roads and Streets. 

Many roads are sub-standard; narrow widths, on-street parking, less than 20 feet of 

unobstructed pavement and ingress and egress issues during peak population 

fluctuations. Some areas are served by single lane roads, severely restricting 

emergency vehicles. 

Topography. 

The topography of the District varies from near level to terrain in excess of a 40 

percent slope. As a rule of thumb, the rate of fire spread doubles as the slope 

percentage doubles, all other factors remaining the same. Most residential and 

commercial structures are in, or are surrounded by forested areas. Due to drought, 

beetle infestations, and heavy vegetation, many the area have dead or dying 

trees, contributing to fire danger. Elevation ranges from about 6200 feet at 

lake level to over 7200 feet on mountain pass roads with peaks exceeding 

9000 feet in elevation. 

Vegetation. 

Vegetation in the Fire District varies from sub-alpine forests of aspen and pine to pine 

and cedar forests, with substantial brush fields of manzanita, snow brush, and white thorn. 

Residential development in the Fire District is generally concentrated in heavily 

forested areas. This situation allows fire to travel easily from home to home, forest to 

home, or home to forest by radiation, convected heat and/or flying embers Often 

dwellings are completely surrounded by highly combustible vegetation, compounding 

the fire problem. 

SUMMARY 

The above climatic, geological, and topographical conditions increase 
the magnitude, exposure, accessibility problems, and fire hazard the 
District must handle. As an example, fire following an earthquake has 
the potential to cause greater loss of life and damage to property than 
an earthquake itself. Wildland fire has seen some significant changes 
in spread dynamics due to drought and fire history in the area. 

CONCLUSION 

Local climatic, geographic and topographic conditions described above increase the 

frequency, intensity, and size of fires involving buildings in the Fire District. Further, 

these conditions impact potential damage to structures from an earthquake and 

subsequent fire. Therefore, it is reasonably necessary that the California Fire Code be 

modified to mitigate the effects of the above conditions. Page 6 of 10 

23-1589 C 38 of 67



2022 CFC Code Sec:lion Title Adopted Amended Added Deleted Finding 

105.6.2-:/ Tents X Administrative 

1 06. 1-1 06. 4 Construction X 
Administrative 

Documents 

107.1 Fees X Administrative 

107.5 Related Fees Administrative 

107.5.1 Cost Recovery Administrative 

107.6 Refunds X Administrative 

107.7 Administrative 
Administrative 

Costs 

Section l 08 Inspections X Administrative 

Section 109 Maintenance X Administrative 

111.5 Appeals Administrative 

112.4 Violation X 

Penalties 
Administrative 

112.4. l A batcment of X 
Violations 

Administrative 

l 12.4.2 Citations Administrative 

Section 113 Stop Work 

Order 
Administrative 

113.4 Failure to X 

Comply 
Administrative 

Sec:tion 114 Unsafe X 
Structures 

Administrative 

202 Definitions X Administrative 

Section 302 Definitions Administrative 

Section 303 Asphalt Kettles IAI, A2, A3. 131, B2. 83. 84, BS 

1B6 

302. l Definitions X Administrative 

Section 304 Com bustiblc X Al, A2, A3, Bl, 82. 83. 84, BS 

Waste 86 

23-1589 C 39 of 67



2022 CFC Code Section Title Adopted Amended Added Deleted Finding 

Section 305 Ignition Sources X IA. I, A2, AJ, Bl, 82. 83. 84, BS 

136 

Section 306 Motion Picture X Bl, B2. B3. B4, BS, 86 

Section 307 Open Burning X Al, A2, AJ, Bl, B2. B3. 84, RS, 

86 

307.4.4 Open Burning 1\1, A2, A3, Bl, B2. B3. B4, BS, 

B6 

Section 308 Open Flames X Al, A2, A3, Bl, 82. 83. 84, BS, 

136 

Section 309 Powered X Al, A2, A3. Bl, 82. 83. 134, BS, 

Industrial R6 

Trucks 

Section 310 Smoking X Al, A2, A3, Bl, B2. TB. 84, BS, 

86 

Section 311 Vacant Premises X k'\ l, A2, A3, Bl, I32. B3. B4, BS, 

86 
Section 320 HD Printing X Bl, B2. 83. 84, BS, 86 

Section 321 Artificial X A I, A2, A3, Bl, B2. B3. B4, BS 

Vegetation 86 

t03.2 - 403.2.4 Group A X JAi, A2, A3, Bl, 82. 83. 84, BS, 

86 

403.6 - 403.6.1.4 Group F X Al, A2, A3, Bl, 82. 83. 84, BS. 

B6 

t03.9 - 403.9.3.4 Group R X Al, A2, A3, Bl, 82. 1:33. 84, BS 

B6 

503.2.1 Dimensions X !Al, A2, A3, Bl, 82. 83. 84, RS 

B6 

503.2.5 Dead Ends X !Al, A2, A3, Bl, B2. B3. B4, BS 

B6 

503.2.6 Bridges X Al, A2, A3, Bl, 82. B3. 134, BS 

86 

503.3. l No Parking- JAi, A2, A3, Bl, B2. 83. 84, 85 

Fire Lanes 86 

503.3.2 No Parking- Al, A2, A3, Bl, 82. B3. 84,BS 

Fire Hydrants 86 

23-1589 C 40 of 67



2022 CFC Code Section Title Adopted Amended Added Deleted Finding 

503.3.3 Fi re Lane Width IA l, A2, A3, Bl, B2. B3. 84, BS, 

86 

503.6 Security Gates X IA I, A2, A3, Bl, B2. 83. B4, BS, 

B6 

505.1 Address X Al, A2, A3, Bl. 82. B3. 84, BS 

B6 

507.5.1 Where Required X Al, A2, A3, 81, 132. 83. H4, BS, 

- Fire Hydrants 86 

509.3 Fire Control Bl, B2. B3. B4, BS, B6 

Rooms 

807.5.2 Group E X Bl, 82. 83. B4, BS, 86 

903.2 Where Required X Al, A2, A3, RI, 82. B3. 84, BS, 

Fire Sprinklers B6 

903.2.1. I Group A X JAi, A2, A3, Bl, 82. 83. B4, BS, 

[36 

903.2.1.2 Group A-2 X IA\, A2, A3, 81, 82. B3. B4, BS 

86 

903.2.1.3 Group A-3 X Al, A2, A3, RI, 82. BJ. B4, BS. 

B6 

903.2.1.4 Group A-4 X Al, A2, AJ, Bl, B2. 83. 84, BS 

B6 

903.2.3 Group E X Al, J\2, A3, Bl, B2. 83. 84, I3S 

B6 

903.2.4 Group F-1 X Al, A2, A3, Bl, B2. 133. B4, BS 

86 

903.2.7 Group M X JAi, A2, A3, Bl, B2. BJ. 84, RS 
[36 

903.2.7.2 Group M- X Al,A2, A3, Bl, B2. B3. B4, BS, 

Mattresses 86 
' 

23-1589 C 41 of 67



CFC Code Secriun Title Adoe1ed ,•!mended Added Deleted f'inding 

903.2.8.5 Manufactured IAL A2. A3. Bl. 82. 

Homes R3, B4, RS, 86 

903.2.9 Group S-1 X Al. A2, AJ, 81, 82. 83 84, BS. 

B6 

903.2.10 Group S-2 X Al, A2, J\3, BL 82. 83. 84, BS 

H6 

903.2.10.1 Parking Garages X IA!, A2, A3, BL 82. !33. R4, BS, 
B6 

22 Group B !Al. A2, A3, Bl, 82. 83. I34. BS: 

86 

903 .2.23 Group F-2 !Al, A2, A3, RI, 82. 83. 84, l-3S, 

86 

Where Required X JAL A2, J\3, Bl. 82. 83. B4.BS 

Fire Sprinklers 86 

907.2 Where Required X Al, J\2, A3. Bl, 82. BJ. B4, BS, 

Fire Alarm 86 
Systems 

907.2.1.4 Group A AL A2,A3, !31, 82. 83. 84. RS 

H6 

Group B AL A2, A3, 131, 132. B3. 84. BS 

H6 
II I 11 Group E Al, A2, A3, 131, 82. B3. 84.BS 

86 

- I Group P-1 JAi, A2, A3. Bl. 132. 83. 84. BS . 

JB6 

907.2.'i.2 Group I I IA]. l\2, A3. Bl, 82. 83. 134.BS , 

86 
907.2.6.6 Group I IAI, A2, A3, BL 82. 83 84. BS 

B6 

907.2.7.2 Group M IAI, A2, A3, Bl, B2. B3. B4.BS 

86 
.2.8.4 Group R-1 !Al, A2, /\3, 81, 82. 83. B4,BS . 

186 

23-1589 C 42 of 67



!2022 CRf Code Section Title Adopted Amended Added Deleted Finding 

907.2.9.4 Group R-2, R- 1/\l, /\2,J\3, BL B2. 83. 84, 85. 

2.1, R-2.2 IB6 

907.2.10.1 Group S IA!, A2, A3, Bl, 82. B3. B4, 85, 

86 

907.2.30 Type I I Ioods Bl, 82. B3. B4, B5, B6 

907.6.5 Monitoring X BL 82. 83. B4, 85, B6 

1907.6.2.1 Secondary Power Al, A2, A3, Bl, 82. B3. 84, BS 

i Supply 86 
1907.9 Where Required 
I 

X Al, A2, A3, Bl, B2. B3. B4, B5, 

. Fire Alarm B6 

Section I 1 0 I General X /\I, J\2, A3, BL B2. B3. B4, 85, 

86 

Section 1102 Definitions X l/\l,/\2,A3,BI, 82. 83. 84,85 

86 

! 1103.2 Responder X !Al, A2, A3, Bl, 82. 83. 84, B5, 

Communication B6 

1103.5- 1103.5.5 Sprinkler X Al, A2, A3, 81, B2. 83. B4, B5 

Systems 86 
1103.7 -1103.7.9.10 Fire Alarm X Al, A2, A3, BL H2. R3. R4, 85 

Systems B6 

1103.8 -1 l 03.8.5.3 Smoke Alarms X IAl,A2,A3,Bl, 82. R3. 84,BS 

B6 

1103.9 -1103.9.1 Carbon X Al, A2, A3, HI, 82. 83. 84, B5, 

Monoxide B6 

Alarms 

Section 1104 Egress X Bl, B2. B3. 84, 85, 86 

Section 1106 Outdoor X Al, A2, A3, Bl, B2. B3. 84, B5, 
Operations 136 

11203. 1.3 Installation X lAI. A2, /\3, Bl, B2. 83. B4, 85 

I 86 
33 I l.3 Address X IAl,A2,A3,Bl, 82. B3. 84,B5 

B6 

3313.1 When Rcq uired -

I 
X !Al, A2, A3, Bl, B2. B3. B4, 8 5 

Water Supply l B6 

23-1589 C 43 of 67



2022 CFC Code Section Title Adopted Amended Added Deleted Finding 

5001.7 Liability for 
Administrative 

Damages 

5601.2 Permit Required X Administrative 

5704.2.9.6.1 Locations- X Al, A2, A3, Bl, 82. 83. 84, BS 
!Above Ground [36 

Tanks 

5706.2.4.4 Locations - X Al, A2, A3. Bl, 82. B3. B4, 85, 

Above Ground 86 

Tanks 

5806.2 Limitations X Al, A2, A3. Bl, B2. B3. B4, BS, 

86 

6104.2 Maximum X Al, A2, A3, Bl, 82. B3. 84, B5, 

Capacity B6 

6112 High X 

Elevation-
Climatic, Administrative, 

LPG 
Geological 

6113.1 Permits X Climatic, Administrative, 
and Plans Geological 

6113.2 LPG- X Cl i 111 atic, Ad min istrati ve, 
Own Geological 

6 ! 14 Natural X Climatic, Administrative, 
Gas Geological 

6 I 15.1 Violations X Climatic, Administrative. 
Geological 

6115.2 Failure to X 

provide 
Climatic, Administrative, 

Geological 
cover 

Chapter 80 Referenced X IAI, A2, A3, Bl, B2. 83. 84, 85, 

Standards B6 

Appendix B Fire flow - X IAl,A2,A3, BL B2. B3. B4. 

Table Bl OS.I (1) Residential 85,86 

Appendix B Fire now - X Al, A2, A3, Bl, I32. B3. 84, I35, 

Table 8105.2 Commercial 86 

Appendix D Fire Apparatus X Al, A2, A3, Bl, B2. 83. 84, 85, 

Access Roads B6 
Appendix D, Access Road X Al, A2, /\3, Bl, B2. B3. B4, BS 

D103.1 Width 86 
Appendix D, Grade X Al, A2, A3, Bl, 82. 83. 84, BS 

D103.2 B6 

23-1589 C 44 of 67



Appendix D, Turning Radius X Al, A2, A3, Bl, B2. B3. 84, BS, 

1.)103.3 B6 

Appendix D, Gates X JAi, A2, A3, BL B2. B3. 84,135 

1)\03.5 86 

Appendix D, Fire Lane X IA\, A2, A3, Bl, 82. 83. B4, B5 

D\03.6.1 Marking B6 

Appendix D, fire Lane X !Al, A2, A3, Bl, 82. 83. 84, 85 

D l 03.6.2 Marking 136 

Appendix D. Circumferential X !AL A2, A3, Bl, 82. 83. 84, 

D104.4 Fire Access BS, 

B6 

23-1589 C 45 of 67



LAKE VALLEY FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT 

INTRODUCED at a regular meeting of the Board of Directors of the Lake 

Valley Fire Protection District on December 8, 2022. 

PASSED AND ADOPTED at a regular meeting of the Board of 

Directors of the Lake Valley Fire Protection District on January 5, 2023 by 

the following roll call vote: 

Aye: Nay: Abstain 

John 
dll_ Rice 

Brian 

JI)_ Hogan 

Leona 

d-1/_ Allen 

J1l 
Ron 

Sitton 

JrL 
Irene 

Kaelin 

VOTE ON PASSAGE: Aye _s- Nay ,12_ Abstain{,)__ Present Q 

John Rice, Hoard Chair 

Signature ~ 

I, Irene Kaelin, Secretary to tile Board, do hereby certif.v that the foregoing Resolutio11 
No. 2022-01 was voted upon and approved by" majority vote ,~f the Board, on the s" day 
of Janua,y 2023; and I further certijj, the compliance with tlte Cod?/ied Resolution and 
tlte Laws of the Board, 

Secretmy 

23-1589 C 46 of 67



Why Is There a Local Change? 

Amend with the name of the jurisdiction locally adopted and amended Administrative need 

105.5 N 
Amend to include addition of Automobile Wrecking locally adopted and amended Administrative need due to addition of seclioo 105.5.55. Yaro operational permit . 

Allows the fire wde official to enf'Orce the fire code ( specific 

105.5.55 y Add section to require operational permn for locally created and adopted 
to ~re access, vegetation clearances, hazardous materials, 

Auto mo bile Wrecking Yards. 
etc.). within automobile wrecking yard operations. This was 
a demonstrated need experienced within the Diamond 
Springs Fi re Department. 

105.6 N 
Add section to require conslruction permit for 

locally created and adopted 
Administrative need due lo addition of section 105.6.25 and 

Automobile Wrecking Yards. 105.6.26. 

Allows the fire code official to enforce the fire code (specific 
Add section to r~uire construction permit for 

105.6.25 y Locally created and adopted 
to fire access, vegetation clearances. hazaroous materials, 

Automobile Wrecking Yards. etc.) within newly constructed and/or modified automobile 
wrecking yard operations .. 

Allows the fire code official to review and approved traffic 

!05.6.26 N 
Add sec:tion to require constructioo perm it for the Locally created and adopted 

calming devices prior to installaMn. Fire Code currently 

installation of traffic calming devices 
permits the fire cede official lo regulate traffic calming 
devices. However, a pem1il isn't currently required prior to 
installation causing undue hardship to 

Adopting this section lo al!ow forlhe creation and issuance 

107.5 N Section Added. Previously sedion106.6. Locally adopted and amended 
of fees to cover actual costs. Section 105.6 defines pennits, 
plan checks, and inspections as allowed inH ea Ith &Safety 
Code 17951. 

107.S.1 N Section added. Previously section 106.6.1 locally created and adopted 
Section 107.5.1 Cost Recovery Fees: Toreooverthecostto 
the Fire District. 

107.7 y Section added. Previously section 106.7 Locally created and adopted 
Section 107,7 To rl;lcover the actual costs of avoidable 
failed inspections by contractors. 

Section 111.5 of Chapter 1 of the Fire Code of the District is 
added to read as follows: 
111.5 Appeal Procedures and Timelines: The intent of this 
provision is to clarify the procedures and timelines for an 

lll.5 y Secti011 added. Previously section 100.4 Locally adopted and amended individual or entity to file an appeal to the Board of Appeals 
regarding an order, decision, or determination by the Fire 
Code Official. Based on the County of El Dorado's 
Vegetation Management Ordinance Board of Appeals' 
timeline. 

Previously section 110.4. Completed the section by 
Allows the Fire Code Official to enforoe the Fire Cede that 

t 12.4 N 
filling in the blank IX)rtions that were not completed 

Locally adopted and amel'lded 
protects life and property. Fees have been updated to 

by the SFM. It is better left 1D localities ID determine 
match the fees and penalties as deemed appropriate by the 

the feesfpenallies for their respective areas 
District Attorney's Office. The change to the language to 
include the tern, infiactions. 

112.4.2 Citations is added to read as follows: 112.4.2 
Citations 
The Fire Chief or his/her duly authorized representative( s ), 

112.4.2 N Section added. Prel'ioulsy section 110.4. Locally created and adopted 
may issue citations for infractions or misdemeanor 
violations of this code pursuant to Section 13871 of the 
Health and Safety Code of the State of California and 
Chapter Sc (commencing with section 853.6) ofTlfle 3 of 
Part 2of the Penal Code of the State of California. 

Previously section 112.4. Completed the section by 

113.4 
filling in the blank portions that were not completed 

N bytheSFM. ltis better left to localities to Locally adopted and amerlded 
All violations of the code have been consolidated under 

detenmine the fess/penalties forthei r respective 
Section 112.4 to include the penalti&s for violations. 

areas 

23-1589 C 47 of 67



Added definitions for: Campfire, Driveway, District, 
Executive Body, Fire Chief, Fire Hazard, Open Burning, and 

202 N Added definitions for darity Locally created and adopted Trained Crowd Manager. Definition of open burning shall 
not include residential LPG, natural gas fueled, or wood 
burning appliances nor c:eremonial burning. 

302.l N Added definition of campfire to Section Locally created and adopled Added definition for ciarity. 

Added a section for open burning restrictions. Due to the high fire danger that exists in El Dorado County 
307.4.4 y Language clarified tiom campfire to open burning to Locally a-ealed and adopted 

encompass full scope of open burning 
we have written more stlingent rules pertaining to open fires 

requirements. 
within grass, brush, and tree covered areas. 

40L2.l N 
Added section lo require pre-lire plans for new locally created and adopted 

Provides the ere au on of a floor plan for the purpose of 

andor modified construction. 
emergency planning to be utilized by emergency response 
personnel. 

Fire apparatus are becoming larger and taller. A vertica I 
clearance of 15 feet provides proper clearance for 
apparatus to pass under without damaging apparatus 
components. It also allows an extended time frame before 

5032.l N 
Changed vertical clearances lo 15 feet and road 

having torecut the growth of the vegetation. Additional 

widths to 20feet 
Locally adopted and amended height for vegetation clearances acts as an increased buffer 

for the spread of fire. A road width of 20 feet exclusive of 
shoulders, as measured face of curb to face of curb is 
needed. These structures can be d ifficultto navigate with 
fire apparatus and should not be counted in the total 
drivable road surface. 

Added a specific section for R3's where itallows the 
Fire apparatus require areas for turning around when 

5032.S N 
Fire Code and Tille 14 Fire Safe Regulations to 

locally adopted and amended 
multiple vehicles are on the scene of an emergency. This 

match as Uley require turnarounds for fire apparatus 
includes fire vehicles as ~II as civilian vehicles. Provides 

access roads and driveways 
better access for ingress/egress. Addijionally, adds tum 
around for apparatus in driveways greater than 150'. 

Allows codes and standards lo r Bridges and Elevated 
Changed the section for Bridges and Elevated Surfaces of El Dorado County and Appendix D of the 

5032.6 N 
Surfaces to state and match EIDorado County 

Loe.illy adopted and amended 
current Fire Code, whichever is more res~ictive, to be 

Transportation Division in addition toMSHTO HB consistent throughout county agencies and is allowed as an 
17 (minimum CFC required) alternate means & method that is not less restrictive than 

the Fire Code. 

503.3.l N 
Previously section 503.4.2, Added section regarding 

Locally created and adopted 
This section clearly defines the "No Par1<ing in Fire Lanes" 

no parking in fire I anes rules and isconsistent with the California Vehicle Code. 

503.3.2 N 
Previously sec:lion 503.4.3. Added section regarding 

Locally created and adopted 
This section cleartydefines the 'No Parking infrontornre 

no parking in front of hydrants 
hydrants" rules and is consistent with the California Vehicle 
Code. 

503.3.3 N 
Previously section 503.4.4. Added section regarding 

Locally created and adopted 
This section clearly defines California Fire Code Appendix D 

fire lanes based on road width 
as the reference for road lane width and their relation to fire 
lanes. 

Previously section 503.5 .3. Created and adopted Allows fire districts the authority 10 approve gates on 
503.6 to maintain emergency access and 

503.6 N consistency through all roai:may gates in El Dorado Locally created and adopted 
roadways based on the Disbict's gate standard, providing 

County, referring to the gate standards adopted by 
the best possible emergency access to maintain fast 

theFPO's 
response times. 

505.1 N 
Added section pertaining lo the visual addressing o 

Locally adopted and amended 
Allows fire districts the authority to approve addll!ssing 

buildings based on the District's addressing standards. 

Added more conservative standard for the 
Commercial properties are required lo install hydrants at 

507.5.1 N placement of hydrants and their relaoonship to Locally adopted and <111ended 300 foot intervals, thus they should never be outside of 150 

commercial buildings 
feet from any given hydrant at anytime (half the distance 
inbetween ). 

23-1589 C 48 of 67



Buildings are getting more sizable in the county. It is more 
common to have new buildings with solar arrays that 
continue to generate pawllr even when the buildings 

Added verbiage to bring all of 1he necessary fire 
general utilities have been shut off. When there is an 

509.3 y Locally created and adopted emergency, it is vital that we have rapid access lo alt of 1he 
controls for a building to one location controls in one location for public evacuation and firefighter 

safety. Due to the fire danger present in El Dorado County 
throughout rr,;ist of the year, this change i.5 appropriate and 
advisable. 

Emergency Responder Radio System Seoondary Locally adopted and amended 
Amend to 72 hour capacity for bad<•UP power due to 

510.4.2.3 V Power Supply Modification weather and PG&E safety related power outages. 

Adds a requirement for sprinkler system installation 
Locally adopted and amended 

Administrative need due lo addition of section 903.2.22 and 
903.2 N in new buildings and structures 3,600 square feel or 903.2.23. 

greater within the distlicl 

Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions 

Previously section 903.2.1. Addsarequirement for 
of El Dorado County and their contributing factors. to our 
increased response times, along with the fact that fl res 

903.2. 1.1 N sprinkler system insta I lation in new Group A Locally adopted and amended double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers 
buildings and structures 3,600 square feet or to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square 
greater v.ithi n the distnct feet in size as they relate to fire behavio'r and rate of 

spread. 

Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions 

Previously section 903. 2.1. Adds a requirement for 
of El Dorado County and their contributing factors to our 
increased response times, along with the fact that fires 

903.2.1.2 N sprinkler system installation innew Group A 1 Locally adopted and amended double in siz.e each and every minute, we require sprinklers 
buildings and structures 3,600 square feet or to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square 
g realer within the district feet in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of 

spread. 

Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions 

Previously section 903.2.1. Adds arequirement for 
ot El Dorado County and their contributing factors to our 
iricrease<l response times, along with the fact that fires 

903.2.1.3 N 
sprinkler system installa1ion in new Group A-2 Locally adopted and amended double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers 
buildings and structures 3,600 square feet or to be installed in strucll.ires once they reach 3,600 square 
greaterwithin the district feet in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of 

spread. 

Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions 

Previously section 903.2.1. Adds a requirement for 
of El Dorado County and their contributing factors toour 
increased response times, along with the fact that fires 

903.2.1.4 N sprinkler system installation in new Group A-3 Locally adopted and amended double in size each and every minute, vve require sprinklers 
buildings and structures 3,600 square feet or to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square 
greater within the district feet in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of 

spread. 

Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions 

Previously section 903.2 ,3. Adds a requirement for 
of El Dorado County and their contributing factors to our 
increased response limes, along with the fact that fires 

903.2.3 N 
sprinkler system installation innew Group E 

Locally adopted and amended double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers 
buildings and structures 3,600 square feet or to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square 
greater within the district feet in size as they rel ate lo fire behavior and rate of 

spread. 

Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions 
of El Dorado County and their contributing factors to our 

Adds a requirement for sprinkler system installation increased response times, along with the fact that fires 
903.2.4 N in new Group Fbuildings and structures 3,600 Locally adopted and amended double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers 

square feet or greater within the district to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square 
feet in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of 
spread. 

Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions 
of El Dorado County and their oontribuHng factors to our 

Adds a requirement for sprinkler system installation increased response times, along with the fact that fires 
903.2.7 N in new Group M buildings and structures 3,600 Locally adopted and amended double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers 

square feet or greater within the district to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square 
feelinsize as they relate lo fire behavior and rate of 
spread. 

23-1589 C 49 of 67



Due lo 1he topographic, dirnatic, and geographic conditions 

Previously section 903.2.7. Adds a requirement for of El Dorado County and their contributing factors to our 
increased response ~ mes, along with the fact that fires sprinkler· system installation in new Group M with 

Locally adopted and amended double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers 903.2.7.2 N Upholstered FumibJre orMattresses buildings and 
to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square structures 3,600 square feel or greater within the 
feet in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of district 
spread. 

Manufactured Homes-The intent of this code section is to 
ensure that manufactured homes that seive as a one or tv.o-
family dwellings areconsisrent with the provisions found in 
CRC Section 313 pertaining to built dwellings of a similar 
nature. Manufactured homes placoo inthewildland .. urban 

Previously section 903.2.8.2.Thissection was 
Locally adopted and amended 

interface have a heightened risk of rapid fire oonsurnption 
903.2.8.5 N created to include manufactured residential single due to the I ight-weight nature of their construclion. The 

family R-3 in the residential sprinkler program. rapid fire spread throughout these structures presents a 
significant risk to their occupants. Residential sprinkler 
systems have been inoorporated to decrease this risk 
successfully in many California communites. 

Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions 
of El Dorado County and their contributing factors to our 

Previously secti90 903.2.9. Adds arequirement for increased response times, along with the fact that fires 
903.2.9 N 

sprinkler system installation in new Group S 
Locally adopted and amended double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers 

buildings and structures 3,600 square feet or to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square 
greater v.ithin the district feet in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of 

spread. 

Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic condijions 
of EI Dorado County and their contributing factors to our 

Previously section 903.2. Adds a requirement for 
increased response times, along with the fact that fires 

903.2.10 N sprinkler system installation in new Group S-2 
Locally adopted and amended double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers 

buildings and structures 3,600 square feet or to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square 
g realer within the district feet in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of 

spread. 

Due to the topographic, climatic, and geographic conditions 
of El Dorado County and their contributing factors to our 

Previously section 903.2.10. Adds a requirement for increased response times, along with the fact that fires 
903.2.10.1 N 

sprinkler system installation in new Commercial 
Locally adopted and amended double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers 

Parl<ing Garage buildings and structures 3,600 to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square 
square feet or greater within the district 

feet in slze as they relate to fire behavior and rate of 
spread. 

Due to the topographic. climatic, and geographie conditions 

Previously section 903.2. 7. Adds a requirement for of El Dorado County and their contributing facto rs to our 
increased response limes, along with the fact that fires 

903.2.22 N sprinkler system installation in new Group B 
Locally adopted and amended double in size each and everyminute, we require sprinklers buildings and structures 3,600 square feet or 

to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square g realer within the district 
feet in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of 
spread. 

Due to the topographic, dimatic, and geographic conditions 

Prelliously saction 903.2. Adds a requireroont for 
of El Dorado County and their contributing factors to our 
increased response times, along wah the fact that fires 

903.2.23 N sprinkler system installation innew Group F-2 
Locally adopted and amended double in siz.e each and every minute, we require sprinklers buildings and structures 3,600 square feet or 

to be installed in structures once they reach 3,600 square greater within the district 
feel in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of 
spread. 

Previously section 903.2a. Adds a requirement to Due to the tDpographic, cJirnatic, and geographic conditions 
install sprinklers for existing buildings that undergo of El Dorado County and their conbibuting factors to our 
a change in use of greater hazard or an increase in increased response times, along with the fact that fires 

903.6 y size greater than 500 square feet and the resulting Locally created and adopted double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers 
square feet is greater than 3,600 square feet. to be installed in stnuctures once they reach 3,600 square 
Previously applied to addition of more than 30% or feet in size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of 
1,000 square feet. spread. 

23-1589 C 50 of 67



Adds a requirement for fire alarm system 
907.2 N installation in new buildings and s11\lctures 3,600 locally adopted and amended Administrative need due to addition of section 903.2.30. 

~ 
... . .. 

Previously section 907. 2a. Added occupant 
protection for fire alarms in Group A buildings with a Provides proper emergency notification for occupancies that 
floor area less than 3,600, except R3, AG bui dings L 

11 
led d d ted 

907.2.1.4 N not used for commercial purposes. and buildings oca Y crea an a op 
allow public use and ensures Fire Department notification in 

wilh a floor area of less than 500 square feel as 
the event of a fire or smoke. 

approved by the fire code official 

Previously section 907.2a. Added occupant 
protecU an for fire alanns in Group B buildings with a Provides proper emergency notification for ocou pancies that 

907.2.2.3 N floor area less than 3,600, except R3, AG buildings 
Locally created and adopted !allow public use and ensures Fire Deparbnent notification in 

not used for commercial purposes, and buildings 
wilh a fi oor area of less th an 500 square feel as 

~he event of a fire or smoke. 

approved by the fire code official 

P raviously section 907 .2a. Added oocupanl 
protection for fire alarms in Group E buildings with a Provides proper emergency notification for occupancies th at 

N floor area less than 3,600, except R3, AG buildings 
907.2.3.11 not used for commercial purposes, and buildings 

Locally created and adopte<I allow public use and ensures Fire Department notification in 

with a floor area of less than 500 square feet as 
the event of a fire or smoke. 

approved by the fire code official 

Previously section 907.2a. Added occupant 
protection for fire alarms in Group F buildings with a 

Provides proper emergency notification for occupancies that 
fioor a ea less than 3,600, except R3, AG buildingN 

90TIA.1 not used for commercial purposes, and buildings Locally created and adopted allow public use arid ensures Fire Department notification in 

with a floor area of less than 50 0 square feel as the event of a fire or smoke. 

approved by the fire code official 

Previously secUon 907 .2a. Added occupant 
proteclion for fire alarms in Group H buildings with 

a fioor area less than 3,600, except R3, ARJ Provides proper emergency notification for occupancies that 
9072.5.2 buildings not used for commercial purposes, and Locally creatfld and adopted allow public use and ensures Fi re Department notification in 

buildings with a floor area of less than 500 square the event of a fire or smoke. 

feet as approved by the fire code official 

Previously section 907.2a. Added occupant 
protection for fire alarms in Group I buildings with a 

N floor area less than 3,600, except R3, AG buildings Provides proper emergency notification for occupancies that 
9072.6.6 not used for commercial purposes, and buildings Locally created and adopted allow public use and ensures Fire Department notification in 

with a floor area of less th an 500 square feet as theeventofafire or smoke. 

approved by the fire code official 

Previously section 907.2a. Added occupant 
protection for fire al arms in Group M buildings with 

a fioo area less than 3,600, except R3, A~ Provides proper emergency notification for occupancies that 
9fYl.2.71 buildings not used for commercial purposes, and Locally created and adopted allow public use and ensures Fire Department noUfication in 

buildings with a floor area of less lhan 500 square the event of a fire or smoke. 

feel as approved by the fire oode official 

Previously secfion 907.2a. Added occupant 
protec~on for fire alarms in Group R-1 buildings 

with a lloor area less than3,600, except R3, A~ Provides proper emergency notification for occupancies that 
907.2.8.4 buildings not used for oommert:ial purposes, and Locally created and adopted allow public use and ensures Fire Department notification in 

buildings with a floor area of less than 500 square theeventof a fire or smoke. 

feet as approved by the fire code official 

23-1589 C 51 of 67



Previously section 907 .2a. Added occupant 
protection for fire alarms in Group R-2, R-2.1, and R 
2.2 buildings with a floor area less than 3,600, Provides proper emergency nolification for occupancies that 

907.2.9.4 N except R3, AG buildings not used for commercial Locally 11eated and adopted allow public use and ensures Fire Department notification in 

purposes, and buildings with a floor area of less the event of afire orsmoke. 

than 500 square feet as approved by the fire code 
official 

Pre~iously section 907. 2a. Added occupant 
protection fur fire alanns in Group S buildings with a Provides proper emergency notification for occupancies that 

907.2.10.1 N 
floor area less than 3,600, except R3, AG buildings Locally created and adopted allow public use and ensures Fire Department notification in 
not used for commercial purposes. and buildings the event of a fire or smoke. 
with a floor area of less Iha n 500 square feet as 
approved by the fire code official 

Previously section 907 .2d. Added occupant Provides proper emergency notification for ocrupancies I hat 
907.2.30 N 

protection for Type 1 Hood systems to be Locally created and adopted allow public use and ensures Fire Department notification in 
connected toa monitored firealamt system when the event of afire or smoke. 
installed or replaced 

Provides proper response and maintenance 'runner service" 
of fire alarm systems. N FPA 72 specifies required response 
times for fire alann trouble and supeivisory signals to 

Requires fire alanm systems to be monitored by UL 
ensure systems remain operational. A Type AU Llisted 

907.6.5 y Locally 11eated and adopted central station meets the NFPA required fire alarm response 
listed Type A central station. ensuring an operational fire alanm system at all times. 

UL Type A listing requires central stations to provide this 
'runner seivice' or contract with another entity to provide 
this service to obtain the listing. 

907.6.2.1 N 
Primary Secondary Alam1 Po.rer Supply 

Locally created and adopted 
Amend to 72 hour capacity for back-up powerdue to 

Modification weather and PG&E safety related power outages. 

Previously section 907.2b. Added occupant 
protection forexisting buik!ings wilhout automatic Provides proper emergency notificalion for occupancies Iha I 

907.9 N sprinkler systems kl install a fl re alarm if they add Locally created and adopted allow public use and ensures Fire Department notification in 
more than 30% or 1,000 square feet to the the event of a fire or smoke. 
structure, whichever is less 

This section adds a Shunt Trip power shutoff devices to 
1203.1.3 N Shunt trip power safety devices Locally adoptec and amended ensure emergency power shut off du ring the use of back-up 

power supplies. 

3311.3 N 
Previously section 3310. Address requirements for 

Looilly created and adopted 
Addressing for construction sttes is important to assist 

construction sites responding emergency crews. 

3313.1 N 
Previousy section 3312. 1. Water supplies at 

Locally adopted and amended 
Water must be on site prior to combust ble material being 

construction snes with combustible materials on-de stored orverlical construction commencing. 

Any damages or costs from negligent or unlawful Hazardous materials related incidents are costly to mitigate. 

5001.7 y practices ihat cause a hazardous matelials incident Local~ creared and adopted 
If the incident is caused by negligence due to a business 

will cause a cost recovery fee 
process or practice the actual cost will be passed on to the 
neg Ii gent parties. 

Added safety protection with pem1its being issued 
Allows agencies that need to know about explosives and 

by both the Fire Chief and Sheriffs Department for 
5601.2 N 

explosives, and by the Fire Chief and 1he Board of 
locally adopted and amended fireworks to approve !hem and have a clear understanding 

Supervisors for fireworks of the applications of how they wil I be used. 

Established limits as require<! by the Fire CodeforClass 1 

5704.2.9.6.1 N Established lim"rts as set forth in the Fire Code Locally adopted and amended 
flammable and Class llcombustible I iquid storage in above• 
ground tanks. Requires AHJ approval and a 
SpeciaUConditional Use Permit from the County. 

Established limits as required by the Fire Code forClass 1 

5706.2.4.4 N Established limits as set for1h in the Fire Code Locally adopted and amended flammable and Class llcombustible liquid special 
operations in above-ground tanks. Requires AHJ approval 
and aSpeciaVCondilional Use Pemiit from the County. 

23-1589 C 52 of 67



Administrative need to add District name. Established limits 

Administrative addition ofOistrict name. 
as required by the Fire Code Official for Flammable 

5806.2 N 
Established Ii mits as set forth in the Fire Code 

Locally adopted and amended Cryogenic fluids in stationary containers. Requires AHJ 
approval and a Special/Conditional Use Pemnit from the 
County. 

Estaol ishes distances oetween LPG storage and 
dispensaJies Iha! are directly related to safety for residential 

Established limits for LPG storage and dispensing 
developments and high-density hotels, motels, apartments, 

6104.2 N Locally adopted and a mEnded etc. where a release by leak or explosion of LP--Gas would 
near or adjacent to residential development 

have a high prooability of injury, inhalation, or death. 
Requires AHJ approval and a Special/Conditional Use 
Permit from the County. 

In previous 2019 ordinance, High 

6112 y Elevation Liquefied Petroleum Gas Locally adopted and added Any new LPG installation requirements. Installations (5,000 foot elevations and 
above) 

6113.1 y Permits shall be required Locally adopted and added Plans shall be submitted for all underground 
tank installations as approved by AHJ. 

Underground LPG tanks shall be prohibited 
6113.2 y Lease/Ownership Locally adopted and added from being sold and retained by the the LPG 

company under a lease-type system. 

6114 y Natural Gas Locally adopted and added Natural Gas Installation requirements 

Unlawful for a supplier to provide service that 
611 5.1 y Violations Locally adopted and added does not comply with the provisions of 6112 or 

6113 

6115.2 y Meter protection Locally adopted and added Failure to provide a cover to the meter is a 
violation of this code 

23-1589 C 53 of 67



Dismantled and slored vehides present significant fire loads 
(batteries, flammable and combustible liquids, upholsteiy 

Chapter 80, NFPA. 1- Provides fire access and clearance to property lines 
etc.) and risk to vegetation and adjacent properties. This 

N Local:y created and adopted requirement provides fire access and dearance to 
22 for Automobile Wrecking Yards. 

vegetation in automobile wrecking yard operations to aid in 
firefighting operations and reduction of fire extension to 
adJacent properties and/or open lands. 

Amended to include on-site sprinkler heads and wrench on-
site for emergent repairs, the inclusion of a local walerfiow 
alann to create an audible alert for the ffow of water in the 

NFPA 13D-16 of ChapteroO of the Fire Code of the event of water activation in a vacant structure, and 
Chapter 80, NFPA, 

) District has been amended to update various 
Locally adopted and am ended 

hydrostatic testing requirements to assure proper 130 
130-16 provisions pertaining to the installation of sprinkler sprinkler system installation decreasing the risk of water 

systems in one and \w()-family dwellfngs damage from pipe failure. Passive purge requirements 
were also added to ensure water circulation through the 
system, reducing stagnant water and backfiow concerns 
(EID encourages this type of system) 

Allows us to match what developers and residents are used 

Changed 500 GPM to1,000 GPM in major toin regards to GPM fire flow requirements that have been 
Appendix B: Table 

N subdivisions below 5000 foot elevation, lo match Locally adopted and amended 
used for over a decade in EOG. Also provides a minimum 

8105.1(1) 
fire flow precedents used In E DC for years I eve I of ava i I able water for fire fighting purposes in the event 

of house to house, hoise to vegetation, adnfor vegetalrion 
to house ignition. 

Appendix B Table 
Established a minimum requirement of 1,500 GPM, Al!ows us to match what developers and residents are used 

8105,2 
N below 5000 foot elevation, for all commercial Locally adopted and amended to in regards to GPM fire flow requirements that have been 

projects used for over a decade in EDC. 

Appendix 0: D103 1 N Added an exception for residential dliveways Locally adopted and amended 
ltis unreasonable to require a residential driveway to 
construct a 26 foot wide space for access lo a hydrant. 

Tille 14 requires us to only accept upto 16% driveways, 

Appendix O: D103.2 N Amended to meet State law of grades no greater 
Locally adopted and amended 

any exceptions would require approval by theAHJ. In our El 
than16% within Wildland Urban Interface Dorado County Title 14adoption we allow greater than 16% 

grade with AHJ approval and hard surface. 

Appendix O 0103.3 N Added text to include curbs and gutters Locally adopted and amended 
20 foot road widths shall not include curbs and gutters due 
to potential access issues and turning radius concerns 

Requires minimum 1 &-fl wide gates where installed Where fire apparatus access roads consist of a divided 
Appendix D: D103.5 N Locally adopted and amended roadway the gale width shall not be less than t 5 feet due to 

on fire apparatus access roads 
apparatus tu ming radius. 

No parl<ing on roads allowed on roadways less than 28 Feet 

Appendix D: D103.6.1 N Road wid!lls 20 to 29 foot Locally adopted and amended 
in width above 5000 feel. Lower than 5000 feet this does 

not apply. This section is adopted as it stands in the Fire 
Code Appendix D section 103. 6.1 for all other elevations. 

23-1589 C 54 of 67



Parking on one side only on roads from 28 feet to36 feet 

Roads widths more than 29 feet but less than 36 
allowed. This is not required less than 5000 feet of 

Appendix D: D103.6.2 N 
feet in width 

Locally adopted and amended elevation. Lower than 5000 feelthis does not apply. The 
section is adopted as it stands in the Fire Code Appendix D 
Section 1 0 3. 6.2 lo r al I other elevations. 

Wien required by the fire code official, a fire apparatus 

Appendix D D104.4 N Added to require circumferentialfire apparatus 
Locally created and adopted 

access road shall be constructed to encompass the entire 
access roads structure and sh al I provide a continuous means of 

emergency vehicle access. 

Adopted with no Amendments 
101 1 lhrough 101.5 N 

Adopted to establish scope, intent, severabillty and 
Locally adopted Administrative clarity validity 

102.1 through 10212 N References, subjecls not regulated by the Code Loca I ly adopted Administrative ciarity 

1 04 .1 through 
N Ability to enforce tile code Loca I ly adopted Administrative clarity 104.12.3 

105.1 through N Time limitation of application Loca I ly adopted Administrative clarity 105.6.24 

106.1 through 106.4 N Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 
Loe a I ly adopted Fee schedules for pennits fire and life safety inspections 

107.1 through 107.6 N 
Adopted this section for administrative clarny and 

Loca I ly adopted Inspection authority fire and life safety inspections 

Adopted this section for administrative clarity and Maintenance of safeguards, testing and operation of 
1 08 .1 through 109. 6 N 

fire and life safety inspections 
Loca I ly adopted equipment, re-inspection and testing, recordkeeping, 

supervision, rendering equipment inoperable, overcrowding. 

113 N 
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 

Locally adopted Stop work order. fire and life safety inspections 

114.1 through 114.7 N 
Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 

Locally adopted Unsafe slrticiures or equipment. fire and life s.ifety inspections 

Asphalt kettles contain highly flammable substances and 
require stringent safeguards. Managing ignttion sources 

301.1 through 308.5 N Adopted this section for fire and life safety loca l!y adopted through responsible application of standards will reduce the 
number of fires in various settings. (Climatic geological, 
and topographical). 

General requirements relating to smoking. Vacant premises 
condition and safety requirements, abandoned premises, 

310.1 through 3114 N Adopted this section for fire and life safety locally adopted tenant spaces, safeguarding vacant premises, security, fire 
protection, fire separation, removal of combustibles, 
removal of hazardous materials. (Climatic, geological, and 
topographical). 

323.1 N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally adopted 
General requirements for roads, tunnels, and bridges. 
(Climatic, geological, and topographical). 

Provides evacuation drills for hacardous and institutional 
403.6 through 403.7.6 N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally adopted oocupancies {occupancies wilh increased potential for l~e 

loss). 

403. 9 th rough 403. 9. 4 N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally adopted 
Provides evacuation drills for hotel/motel occupancies 
(occupancies with increased potential for life loss) 

405.1 through 405.10 N Adopted this section for fire and life safety Locally adopted 
Emergency planning and record keeping {Climatic, 
geological, and topographical). 

510.3 N 
Adopted this section for administrative clar~y and 

Locally adopted A pen nit is required for emergency responder radio systems 
fire and life safety inspections (Climatic, geological. and topographical). 

806 .1 through 806.4 N 
Adop1ed this section for administrative clarity and 

Locally adopted 
Decorative vegetation poses an increase in hazard, 

fire and life safety inspections flammability and increased risk. 

Wall covefings in group E occupancies.(Schools) sets a 

807.1 through 007.5.6 N Adopted this section for adminis\ralive clarity and 
Locally adopted 

maximum amount of flammable wall coverings in 
fire and life safety inspections educational facilities (Climatic, geological, and 

topographical). 

23-1589 C 55 of 67



Adopte<I this section for administrative clarity and 
Combustible furnishing pose a significant flammability and 

808.1 through 808.S N Locally adopted increased life safety hazard in instMona I and college domi fire and life safety inspections 
type occupancies 

Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 
Provides clarity on acceptance testing of automatic fire 

904.4.1 N fire and life safety inspections Locally adopted extinguishing systems. (Climatic, geological, and 
topographical). 

1101. 1 through 1102. N Adopted this section for administrative clarity and 
Locally adopted Administrative clarity fire and life safety inspections 

Emergency Responder radio coverage in existing buildings. 
All buildings will be required lo allow emergency responders 
to receive and transmit emergency radio traffic to and from 
each other and the emergency dispatch center. Time 

Adopted this section in existing buildings for the frames can be developed to come into compliance and the 

1103.2 \' safety of fi refig hlers and other emergency Locally adopted phasing inof a system over a period of time, determined by 

responders the fire code official, is acceptable. The rationale behind this 
section is that on almost all emergency responder injury or 
fatality incidents communication is a key issue. This 
situation can be corrected with the addition of radio 
equipment to boost the signal in areas that do not have 
strong signal {Climatic, geological, and topographical). 

Requires installation of fire sprinkler systems in existing 

1103.5 y Adopted this section for the safety of the public, 
Locally adopted occupancies with high life safety risk and in conformance 

firefighters, and other emergency responders with previous Unfform Fire Codes. (Climatic, geological, and 
topographical). 

Adopted this section for the safety of the public, Requires installation of carbon monoxide alarms in 
1103.9 N 

firefighters, and other emergency responders Locally adopted occupancies with high lfe safety risk. (Climatic. geological, 
and topographical) 

1104.1 through Adopted this section for the safety of the public, Provides a minimum level of safety with regard to egress 

1104.25 N 
firefighters, and other emergency responders Locally adopted from existing buildings housing occupancies with a high life 

safety risk. (Climatic, geological, and topographical) 

1106.1 through Adopted this section for the safety of the public. Provides a minimum level of safety at tire storage yards 

1106.1.2 N 
firefighters, and other emergency responders Locally adopted with high levels of flammable l\lbber material. (Climatic, 

geological. and topographical). 

Appendix D: D101.1 
N 

Adopted this section for the safety of the public. 
Locally adopted 

General requirements for fire apparatus access roads 
thrcugh 0104.1 firefighters, and other emergency responders including loads (Climatic, geological, and topographical). 

Appendix D: D104.2 
N Adopted this section for the safety ofthepublic, 

Locally ad opted Commercial and industrial development fire apparatus 
(excluding exception) firefighters, and other emergency responders access roads (Climatic, geological, and topographical). 

Appendix D: D104.3 
N 

Adopted this section for the safety ol the public, 
Locally ad opted 

Commercial and industrial development fire apparatus 
through 0105.4 firefighters, and other emergency responders access roads (Climatic. geological, and topographical). 

Appendix D: D1 061 
N 

Adopted this section for the safely of the public, 
I ocal ly adopted Fire apparatus access reads for multiple-family residential 

(excluding exception) firefighters, and other emergency responders developments (Climatic, geological, and topographical). 

Appendix D: D106.2 
N Adopted this section for the safely of the public, 

locally adopted 
Fire apparatus access roads for multiple-family residential 

through D106.3 firefighters. and other emergency responders developments (Climatic, geological, and topographical). 

One- or two-dwelling residential developments shall be 
Appendix D: D107. 1 

N 
Adopted this section far the safety of the public, 

locally adopted equipped throughout with two sperate and approved fire 
{excluding exceptions ) firefighters and other emergency responders apparatus access roads due to topographic, geographic and 

climatic conditions, 

One-or two-dwelling residential developments shall be 
Appendix D D107.2 

N 
Adopted this section for the safety of the public, 

Locally adopted 
equipped throughout witll two sperate and approved fire 

through D108.1 firefighters, and other emergency responders apparatus access roads due to topographic, geographic and 
climatic conditions. 

Grey cells are previously amended, adopted, or changed code sections that are being adopted again inthis code cycle 

23-1589 C 56 of 67



White cells are newly amended, adopted, or changed code sections that differ from previous code adoptions. 

23-1589 C 57 of 67



Notice of Intent to Adopt the 2022 Fire Code Ordinance 

Notice is hereby given of the intention of the Lake Valley Fire Protection District to 
adopt a Fire Code Ordinance. The District shall hold its first pub! ic hearing at 17 :00 on 
Thursday December 8th, 2022 at the Lake Valley Fire Protection District Station 7,2211 
Keetak St, South Lake Tahoe, CA, regarding the adoption of the 2022 Fire· Code 
Ordinance pw-suant to Health and Safety Code Sections 13869 and 13869.7. Copies of 
the code section referred to and any secondary code sections referred to, adopted by 
reference, are on file with the Secretary of the District and are open to public inspection. 
Adoption of the Fire Code Ordinance will adopt the California Fire Code as currently 
published in Title 24, Part 9, of the California Code of Regulations, governing fire 
prevention and building standards related to fire and panic safety with some amendments. 
In some instances the Lake Valley Fire Protection District's proposed Fire Code 
Ordinance proposes building standards more stringent than those minimum building 
standards adopted by the State Fire Marshal and contained in the California Building 
Standards Code. 

23-1589 C 58 of 67



~Column 

OFFICIAL AD PROOF 

This is the proof of your ad scheduled to run in Tahoe Daily Tribune on the dates indicated below. If 

changes are needed, please contaci us prior to deadline at (530) 541-3880. 

Notice ID: 03ORKMkDbuaRVoYAoJrF I Proof Updated: Nov. 23, 2022 at 12:58pm PST 
Notice Name: 8CD06 Noiice of Intent Lake Valley Fire I Publisher ID: 251403 

This is not an invoice. Below is an estimated price, and it is 

subject to change. You will receive an invoice with the final 

price upon invoice creation by the publisher. 

FILER 

Chad Stephen 

stephen@Jakevalleyfire.org 

(530) 577-3737 

Columns Wide: 2 

1112512022: Other Notice 

12102/2022: Other Notice 

Affidavit flat c!1arge 

Internet Flat Fee Charge 

FILING FOR 

Tahoe Daily Tribune 

Ad Class: Legals 

Subtotal 

Tax% 

Total 

72.84 

72.84 

8.52 

44.50 

$198.70 

0.00 

$198,70 

See Proof on Next Page 

8CD06 Notice of Intent Lake Valley Fire ~ Page 1 of 2 

23-1589 C 59 of 67



FIRST NOTICE 
Notice ol Intent to Adc,p, tne 2022 Fire C<lde 

OrdiLWli:e 

Notre is hereby g1veL, o1 the inten1ion of· the t...r.ke 
Valley Fire Protection Disific, to adopt a Fire Code 
Ordinance. The District8hi!ll hold its first public he~ring 
ai 17:00 on Thursday. December 8th, 2022 atthi, Lake 
Valley :=ira Protection D;s!rict Sta~•.:,n 7. 2211 
Kt>fitak St. South Lake Tal1Ge, CA, ragarding the 
adoplion of the 2022 Fire Code. Ordinance pursuant 
to Health and Safe,ty Code Sec1ions 13B69 and 
13869-7. Copies at the code section referr,;,d· to and 
any secondary code rectio~ 1eterreci to. ado pied by 
rsfar&nca. are on· file wilh the Seerctmy ol 1ha District 
and are open to puolic irispection. Adopfion ot Uie Fire 
Code Ordinance will ndcptthe California Fire Code as 
currently pubrished in lifle 24, Part 9. of lhe California 
Code of Regulaticms. go;/erning lire prev6Iltion and 
bu ilcii ng siandards re lated to lire and panic sale,y 
wiM so,n;;, ruTWnciments. In some instances, the Lake 
Valley Fire Protection District'6 pr'lposed Fire Code 
Ordi nanoo prnpo sas b uildi n2 slanda!ds morn stringent 
u,a11 ll10M min,mum buila;ng standards adopted by 
the State Fir.:- Marshal <ind oom'1ined in the California 
Su:!ding Stnndar(ls Code.· 

Publ!shed: November 2S. Oecember 2. 2022 

8CD06 Notice oflntent Lake Valley Fire - Page 2 of 2 

23-1589 C 60 of 67



SECOND NOTICE 

Notice of Intent to Adopt the 2022 Fire Code O,·dinance 

Notice is hereby given of the intention of the Lake Valley Fire Protection District to adopt a Fire 

Code Ordinance. The District shall hold its second public hearing at 16:00 on Thursday January 
5th, 2023 at the Lake Valley Fire Protection District Station 7, 2211 Keetak St, South Lake 

Tahoe, CA, regarding the adoption of the 2022 Fire Code Ordinance pursuant to Health and 

Safety Code Sections 13869 and 13869.7. Copies of the code section referred to and any 

secondary code sections referred to adopted by reference, are on file with the Secretary of 

the District and are open to public inspection. Adoption of the Fire Code Ordinance will adopt 

the California Fire Code as currently published in Title 24, Part 9, of the California Code of 

Regulations, governing fire prevention and building standards related to fire and panic safety 

with some amendments. In some instances the Lake Valley Fire Protection District's proposed 

Fire Code Ordinance proposes building standards more stringent than those minimum building 

standards adopted by the State Fire Marshal and contained in the California Building Standards 

Code. 

23-1589 C 61 of 67



~Column 

OFFICIAL AD PROOF 
This is the proof of your ad scheduled to run in Tahoe Daily Tribune on the dates indicated below. If 

changes are needed, please contact us prior to deadline at (530) 541-3880. 

Notice ID: dTBabOtXuKeZh9t9kp8r I Proof Updated: Dec. 21, 2022 at 01:43pm PST 
Notice Name: 8CD06 Lake Valley Fire Protection District, 2 I Publisher ID: 255488 

This is not an invoice. Below is an estimated price, and it is 

subject to change. You will receive an invoice with the final 

price upon invoice creation by the publisher. 

f:ILER 

Chad Stephen 

stephen@lakevalleyfire.org 

(530) 577-3737 

Columns Wide: 2 

12/23/2022: Other Notice 

Affidavit flat charge 

Internet Flat Fee Charge 

Tahoe Daily Tribune 

Ad Class: Legals 

Subtotal 

Tax (0%) 

Total 

90.29 

4.00 

40.00 

$134.29 

$0.00 

$134.29 

See Proof on Next Page 

8CD06 Lake Valley Fire Protection District, 2 . Page 1 of 2 

23-1589 C 62 of 67



SECOND NOTICE 

Notlee of Intent to Adopt the 2022 Are Code 
Ordlnonce 

No~ce 1s hereby giwin of lM intention of the Lake 
Vall<Jy Fire Protection Disir ict to adopt a Fire 
Code Ordinanc,._ Th" District sh£all hc>ld ,ts second 
public hsaring at 16:00 Ol'I Tl1ursday, January 
5111, 2023 at ·the Lake Valley Fire Prarection District 
Station 7, 2211 Keerok St, Somh Lake 
Tahoe. CA, regarding \h., adoption of the 2022 fire 
Coos; Ordinurwe pursuant to Health aild 
Safety Code Sections_ 13869 and 13869.7. Copies 61 
,n;e code seciion referred to and_ any 
secondary rode sections referred ·to, ac!opted by 
ref,,..e.~ce. are on lite wilhthe Secretary of 
ihe Oistri ct and mo op Bil to public i rtSpeclion . Adopfo n 
of the Fire Code Ord1nonca will adopt 
me Cali1mnia Flrn Code as current!~ publ[&hi!d ir.Title 
24. PaJt 9, of the: California Codoe cl 
clegulalions, governing fir;:; preveniion and building 
standards 1elaled to fire 2nd l'anic safety 
wi~ some amendments. In some instances. ,;,a Lake 
Va:ley Fire Proiec~on Distlict's prop<.>Sed 
Fire Cod€> Ordinance oropooes building startdard~ 
more strins;ier,t than thosa minimum l>uilding 
standardG adopted by the State Fire Marshal and 
contained in the Caliiomin Building Standards 
Coc:e. 

PubliGhed, DEcembsr 23, 2022 

8CD06 Lake Valley Fire Protection District, 2 - Page 2 of 2 

23-1589 C 63 of 67



12128/22, 11 :15 AM 

11:14 

X Lake Valley Fire Pr ... 
o southtahoenow.com 

SouthTahoeN® Wcom 
.11tiur fJ"e Sr.,,p J,:,:1· J ... ak.(: n,-lwe 1~~1t,~ & 1;;:_~ 

t,r ·,.,.,i;: .. r,,, t~I \I": ~~~ , ,_.,,.y~ • ,,._,.,. , '-' '- (', rl• •'if'rl <;("--l(ll)' 'i -V.-• ~ 

httpsoutl1tahoenow.comstory11252022Iake-valley-fire-protection--district-adopt-new-fire-codefbclid=lwAR2IGV1 SsV4YUzRZvSFj.png 

.. 11? m 

□ 

-
-e<,.,. ,:.i, ..•. SNOW REMOVAL 

OPERATIONS IN EFFECT 
,, .. , 
~T~ 
• ~~ •HM!tlltfNii\iMi1IWHiMiHB >► 
lake Valley Fl•~ !>roteclion Olstrict to adop( new Fire Code 

VlQw view n~ms 
•~·it)r~~ t'-l:\I i-"-'t' :J)ill',,,,il-lt o,, r~: U, r:.'7(:;,/ ·ii 1 'l9)'1'1 

1'r'l;:lt1 I).,.,~ 
f.-.•...-1:\J~ ., il Ji..1\• 

L/.:ii-.1!: V',:.lie\' l="irl;' Pf'QtE.!t.t1i::.:1 Dist, ;,:.L (l.V~PD} h~s P0'5.tcd ~ not•, e 
o~ ir::!:~nl tc, ,:1d¢pt th~ 2022 fi;"C U:,t1~ O1d\rW0Ct:!: 

:_vi:p-o !.'{;ii ,•m:d tts fl--:st yui::lhc. ,-,t:a'"i119 ot S p.:T'. ~., tt-ir.ir~d.iv, 

Oe~mti-er- ~ <:"t :t Statlan 7 at n1J K?~tak St :.. .... n, '-1'e~tlrs 

T,'le i'•wa;ring Is b~lll!J ht~i.:.1 regarding t!le aao~tio:i of ti,{' .2(]."U; 

'C"tft! C1'!Je Di"'Oln~n<:E!' p1J;·o:.1.!tr~ t,:-. lCe,,]~h and ~,1fety Cr>df.! 
S0<'tt:J~.:; 131:16~ ):H~cl l 3~6~. 7. {:o.,IP.S ;jf th~ cmJc .<;~1ct•f1-rl 

,....fc-r'h'1 d to and ~tr.' iitc:"CrJ:ii!"'; ~u°"" ~~aioi·.s l'<':f~n.;~d 1<; 
;:\'ci,:,;::tecl t)y rt>~rer;,·i)-, .ir~ o~ file wiUi t~e Sc::rv:l~"/ -:;,r th~ 
Oii,,vlc.t ~:1tl -.1:e rpen to put.de ,1tc,pt?cho11. 

OPEN ENROLLMENT 
1 IP1St1,mm,nn1~r.ollmimtuNrt~ 

~ti ... t 1032-JiUWill:t 31, 20;,l 

141ltf"<M:SJl),60o,1'8i:i 

Ado~ti<1"\ or t.hP. ~'<¼ CuJ~ 
Qrrj<n~N wll! .)d,ap~- H,c 
Cafifom1a: 1-i"r~ C::-oJ'I!' i'IS O:::L,Jfroatlv 
p,1b-lis.,-,.e41 tr,. "ii tie. ::14, ~,.,. '.:!, of 
the. Ci! i ;frJr!":1.:'I- C~Oi\'" of 
~-e~1.ht:it::mS, Q\"!-\'t•rm~t; f!re1. 
prf.>~•~ttr.irl ~1\::t t111il~fr19 
s'r.~H1dai-d.s f(lll,t¢~ t,t- f.ti" ol'rtd 

pa11i, $..rJ.f~tv R;~:1 ~ 

91m~n:!m~:nC$ 
fr1 rome lnft.;Ulf.11!$, \l'V! l-r.:k~ o/c._1;::~'Y Fke Pt1;rn(t ~n Ol(J <.Ct 'S 

;.=:"'v~~¾.411::C Fin~ Cod~ C tdina1li:e prc"JpOSl:!!i. i i IJJtdm1j ~!a!'4.fun:!~ 
't"!~t-.:- lj.1N\~L'f"<t thlt:'C t h()~ • tr<"'.M1mulT. !:u1i.t1,.,g st~.ri®ffl•t tld,;:tp~~.:r 
!!-i t~ :i,t-,;:t f lfe ~;:._,,.~h-a1 ~ t1,d ,:-;Jnn, f\!-t1 ·1n tt; e- t.'~m·,m ·,-i. 
D iil-r.2~g $ t;.,ntl.1~1'.f!: i.oti ~,. 

r11e .. I(~ ... -C6d-E:: Crl'll-tr'l,.-\l"i((:- ! l~ t:i~ to1m<l ~~RE:.-1. 
o~,._,, .... ,, .. t-lJ"" .,,. 

(!;> 0 

n ... . 

A~ ~~~b~!~c:!':~~~m~ 

~ton 
s;-.,:1'.o!~: )i,!N:;0:1 

SRl 
~7;,- i-~> 

,D ,"--!t·"'d'f l~ i,,'1--~ 

••• 

https ://mail.google .cornlmail/u/0/#inbox/FMfcgzGrblbtWllb TkPRd Fvlxn VxCjnf g?projector=1 &messagePartld =O. 1 112 

23-1589 C 64 of 67



12128/22, 11: 15 AM 

11:15 

X < Lake Valley Fire Pr ... 
o southtahoenow.com 

~~ ~Ye'N1~ ~,.; t~T.tll; ~;J!J~t S51.:I t:~NL....- SCfl::ifL 

Lake Valley Fire Protection Dlsttl<:1 to oold second public 
hea,tng on new Fire CO<le 

View v:ffir, \~em s 

~hi:m1:tn>rt <',., ~V~j, t·l-'Jl/::W:;;:~ -~-S:Jp,ri 

:6VUIT1)1\fp 

i~i,s~•:,,:i,._.,!foo< 

li:1k~ Vi!lley fke PnJtection Oi5trict tl.VFPO) 15 1!lfor'mi119 tt\e 
P...itiHc they w\U be holdln~ a sctor1d public hearing, t,;! its 
1 nte ntior. le i'.dOpt: cl Fi~e Col1t' Orcti na r.a;:t. 

~e 01 !>tri c.t sha fl ho It ·1lS ~~C'tlnd pl! l:',li{.; Mai1ri g r:, !1 the itiJOpt1on 
of th~ £(122 Firt Code Ordinanc-t=1 ~t 4 p.m. 0;1 Thursd:;i",'r ,,;anvary 
5, ?.0;?.3, ~t th~ lVF~O Station 7, Vil Keetak St, Soutt, 1.ake 
Tahoe1 C~lif. 

t.ori,._-,, ~r cfle rode scctil)fl rtrJ;ffCd tc arid ,HW ~c~~nd.:ity ,;;:ode 
•1:t::i:.·1 ref-erred to, a<1opt~<! by rEf~ri:~C-f', jre on M~ with lh!.!. 
!."'1M :,ry at the O istdct anr:l ..,re o pell to J)u r.,tic In spec:t 1~ri. 
&o.: :-,1,:;r1 of ~h€! f-k~ Ccd.e Qrdiner.ce wi:i adopt the Cahforni.;11 
F".r,e C.::Je- .;is CLl:'fently puhh:i,he(l fn l•tle 241 Pait i;, of the 
t f;(i,un:~ Coo~ of R~gu!a\t1,;;n:;.. 90ve-i·rw19 ~r-e p,eventlor, and 

-.111J•n, lit3f'lt1.!-rll.s ,1;;>latccl to fir~ an,11 p21ii1c 5urery witt.. some 
l'f'r'.'l'\r1milnts. 

OPEN ENROLLMENT 

I
:.-:-,..; PtW1enc111 •nr<,1™,n .r.-sl~e11t• 

, ... ,....-.1.l42:l! ... fa:r.,U'M}'J.1,20~il 

,111Uju,U~~)'-"'M, 

{~cO',,~c» \ 1i J ~-0' ,,:,u ... 

?> 

l~ roi,w lllG?.)nci::<1, LVtPO's 
pr'(il'.)OSC'!l Fire Ccdil! OrtHr, 3f1 ce 
prop<.•'!>CS t11,.1f/C::•r.(J sumda,os 
mr...'-1(! ShimJent l,h~r, lhO:-it:: 
rr.1riimi:!"n bui!dltlg Sta!"lr.i)l'd.s 
i1dopt~e1 t!y r:nf Stot2 fire 
M~• ~11a{ ar,d -.u,Y.:ainii:d it' th~ 
t·.a :ir~ ... , 1,i~ Bui I (fol£ St and;;;; rd 5; 

Co~~ 
D "!'-''~ ::,;n,, ti w ♦ 

0 

httpsouthtahoenow.comstory122120221ake-valley-fire-protection-district-hold-seconct-public-hearing-new-fire·code.png 

.,ll? l!B 

□ 

[I 
• S.u,gka! SerVl«'I-

A1,rallablf!. Cl 051:'-io HOli'lle-

~ ton 
1,~ "' J' ~•~r,~•( 

Monthly Billi>lj; 
Coming, 2 02~ :~===-:u_ ... ,,- --· 

:~ . .-·1.¥~j 
l<'- ... 

I:. -~ 

~

HOWWlttW< 
• R~A<;H YOU tt< a 
IWJ EMERGf;NCYl 
Ul'lt>•ti VQV~ liM~E,~ • 

<'.':J:, 

ll ~.,.;.--~-.i,v-, 

~ ~~;;:~~~ ti.-mQ" 
li61D,tl,<fttjlt~~il/tlrCICIJ,f /,./tN'/ 
~',llij'fVIP_f-~-;;,J;"A t~~() lll!"I' 

••• 

https:1/mai I .geog le .com/mai l/u/0/#inbox/FMfcgzGrblbtvwb TsCdJfSLV Jghm SMQb?projector= 1 &messagePartld=O .1 112 

23-1589 C 65 of 67



12128/22, 11 :16 AM 

< 

NOTICE OF 
INTENT TO 
ADOPT THE 2022 
FIRE CODE 
ORDINANCE 
by Martin Goldberg I Nov 25, 2022 I News 

AA a !akevalleyfire.org 

' c!J [I] 

C 

Co 

Notice of Intent to Adopt the 2022 Fire Code Ordinance Lake Valley Fire.png 

hltps://rnail.google .comlmail/u/0/#inbox/FMfcgzGrblbtvwZsHwvxdwwCQhm kRRZC?projector.c1 &messagePartld-'O .1 1/2 

23-1589 C 66 of 67



12/28122, 11 :14 AM 

NOTICE OF 
INTENT TO 
ADOPT THE 2022 
FIRE CODE 
ORDINANCE 
SECOND NOTICE 
by Martin Goldberg i Dec 21, 2022 I News ! O 

comments 

• lakev<1lleyf1re .o rg 

Notice of Intent to Adopt the 2022 Fire Code Ordinance - Sec;ond Notice Lake Valley Fire.png 

https://mail.google.com/mai l/u/0/#inbox/FMfcgzGrbl btvwbCLdZN RNwHQ!VjxZT m?projector=1 &messagePartld=O .1 112 

23-1589 C 67 of 67


	Draft Reso - Lake Valley.pdf
	Lake Valley-2022 Fire Code Package.pdf



