RESOLUTION NO. 136-2023
OF THE BOARD OF SUPERVISORS OF THE COUNTY OF EL DORADO

{(REPEALING RESCLUTION NO. 043-2020)

WHEREAS, the California Code of Regulations, Title 24, Part 9, the California Fire Code, is updated by the
State every three years; and

WHEREAS, the 2022 California Fire Code became effective on January 1, 2023; and,

WHEREAS, California Health and Safety Code Sections 17958, 17958.5, 17958.7 and 18541.5 permits a
county to make such local amendments and modifications as the county determines are reasonably
necessary because of local climatic, geological or topographical conditions; and,

WHEREAS, the California Code of regulations, Health and Safety Code, Division 12, Part 2, Chapter 1,
Article 12, Section 13146, assigns responsibility for enforcement of safety regulations to the local level
and grants authority to delegate enforcement to the chief building official, or his or her authorized
representative, or the chief of the fire protection district, or his or her representative; and,

WHEREAS, the County of El Dorado desires to delegate enforcement of the Fire Code to the chief of the
fire authority, or the chief's authorized representative; and,

WHEREAS, the fire protection district and County have agreed to develop, implement and maintain a
memorandum of understanding that describes the roles and responsibilities pertaining to the inspection
of certain building standards found in the Fire Code; and,

WHEREAS, on January 26, 2023, The Board of Directors of the Mosquito Fire Protection District adopted
Ordinance No. 22-09, which adopted the 2022 California Fire Code with amendments the District deemed
necessary to deal with local climate, geological or topographical conditions.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that the Board of Supervisors of the County of El Dorado ratifies
Ordinance No. 22-09 of the Mosquito Fire Protection District and delegates the enforcement of the
ordinance to the Mosquito Fire District Chief, or his or her representative.

These changes include amendments and additions to the California Fire Code in the following sections:

101.1, 105.5, 105.5.55, 105.6, 105.6.25, 105.6.26, 107.5, 107.5.1, 107.7, 111.5, 112.4, 112.4.2,
113.4, 202, 302.1, 307.4.4, 401.2.1, 503.2.1, 503.2.5, 503.2.6, 503.3.1, 503.3.2, 503.3.3, 503.5,
505,1, 507.5.1, 509.3, 510.4.2.3,903.2, 903.2.1.1, 903.2.1.2, 903.2.1.3, 903.2.1.4, 903.2.3, 903.2.4,
503.2.7, 903.2.7.2, 903.2.8.5, 903.2.9, 903.2.10, 903.2.10.1, 903.2.22, 903.2.23, 903.6, 907.2,
907.2.1.4, 907.2.2.3, 907.2.3.11, 907.2.4.1, 907.2.5.2, 907.2.6.6, 907.2.7.2, 907.2.8.4, 907.2.9.4,

23-1589 G 1 0of 85



907.2.10.1, 907.2.30, 907.6.5, 907.6.2.1, 907.9, 1203.1.3, 33113, 3313.1, 50001.7, 5601.2,
5704.2.9.6.1, 5706.2.4.4, 5806.2, 6104.2, Chapter 80 NFPA 1-22 Section 22.3, Chapter 80 NFPA 1-
22 Section 22.10, Chapter 80 NFPA 13D-22: Sections 4.6, 5.1.1.2, 7.6, 11.2.1.1, Appendix B: Table
B105.1{1), Appendix B: Table 8105.2, Appendix D Sections D103.1 through D103.3, Appendix D
103.5, Appendix D 103.6.1, Appendix D103.6.2, Appendix D104.4

The Mosquito Fire District adopts the 2022 California Fire Code, Title 24, Part 9, in its entirety, including
Appendices, incorporating those sections of the international Fire Code, 2021 edition not adopted by the
state, with the exclusions listed below:

103, 309, 311.5, 311.6, 318, 403.3, 403.5, 403.8, 403.10, 403.11, 404, 406, 903.3.1.2, 904.1.1,
1103.1, 1103.3-1103.4, 1103.6, 1105, Chapter 26, D104.2 {exception only), D106.1 (exception only),
0107.1 {exception only), Appendix A, Appendix G, Appendix J, Appendix K, Appendix L, Appendix
M, Appendix N, Appendix O.

Appendices not adopted can be used for reference in enfarcing other sections of the 2022 California Fire
Code.

PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of Supervisors of the County of El Dorado at a regular meeting of
said BOARD, held the 12th day of September, 2023, by the following vote of said Board

Ayes: Thomas, Hidahl, Turnboa, Parlin, Laine
Attest: Noes: None
Kim Dawson Absent: None
Clerk of the Board of Supervisors

oy ,%éé'——* Zlitnaty THonas—
Deputy Cler,

Wendy Thomas ,éhair, Board of Supervisors

Kyle Kuperus

23-1589 G 2 of 55



MOSQUITO FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT
8801 ROCK CREEK ROAD
PLACERVILLE, CA 95667

(530) 626-9017
Fax (330) 626-3240

February 14, 2023

Don Ashton, Chief Administrative Officer
El Dorado County Board of Supervisors
330 Fair Lane

Placerville, CA 95667

Subject: Resolution Ratifying Ordinance #22-09 of the Mosquito Fire Protection District, which
adopts the 2022 California Fire Code with amendments related to local climatic, geographic and
topographic conditions.

Dear Mr. Ashton,

The Mosquito Fire Protection District (MFPD) is requesting the Board of Supervisors (BOS) ratify its
Ordinance #22-09, which adopts the 2022 Califarnia Fire Code as amended due to specific local climatic,
geographic and topographic conditions. California Health and Safety Code Section 13869.7 requires the
legislative body of the city or county where the ordinance will apply to ratify, modify or deny the
adopted ordinance. The BOS must also delegate enforcement of the ordinance to either the Fire District

{or its representative) or the Chief Building Official.

Therefore, we request the County Board of Supervisors ratify Ordinance #22-09 with amendments to
the 2022 California Fire Code, and delegate the enforcement of that Ordinance to the MFPD Fire Chief.

This ordinance and resolution has no direct fiscal impact to the County.

Respe I{L

Jack/Rosevear, Fire Chief
ATTACHEMENTS:

MFPD Ordinance #22-09
MFPD Resolution #22-10

23-1589 G 3 of 55



MOSQUITO FIRE PROTECTION
DISTRICT ORDINANCE NO. 2022-09

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS OF THE MOSQUITO FIRE
PROTECTION DISTRICT AS FOLLOWS:

An ordinance of the Mosquito Fire Protection District (MFPD) adopting the 2022 Edition of
the Calffornia Fire Code, incorporating the 2021 Edition of the Infernational Fire Code, reguiating
and governing the safeguarding of life and property from fire and explosion hazards arising from
the storage, handling and use of hazardous substances, matetials, and devices, and from
conditions hazardous 1o fife or properiy in the occupancy of buildings and premises in the MFPD;,
providing for the issuance of permits and collection of fees therefor; Repealing Ordinance No.
2019-01 of the MFPD and all other ordinances and paris of the ordinances in conflict therewith.

Be it ORDAINED by the Board of Directors of the MFPD, also known as the MOSQUITO
FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT: '

Section 1. FINDINGS OF FACTS

Section 2: ADOPTION OF CODE WITH EXCLUSIONS
Section 3: LOCAL AMENDMENTS

Section 4. CONFLICT

Section5: SEVERABILITY

Section 6; EFFECTIVE DATE AND PUBLICATION

SECTION 1: FINDINGS OF FACTS.

The MFPD makes certain changes (listed below) to the Cafffornia Fire Code, 2022
Edition, pursuant to Health & Safety Code Sections 13869.7, 17958.5, 17968.7, and 18941.5
during this code adoption process. Such changes are necessary because of local climatic,
geological, andfor topographical conditions. The MFPD has adopted, pursuant to Section
18941.5 of the California Health & Safety Code, the findings of facts relative to these conditions
by Resolution #2019-06 of the MFPD dated November 14, 2019.

SECTION 2: ADOPTION OF CODE WITH EXCLUSIONS

Ordinance 2022-09 Page 1

23-1589 G 4 of 55



The MFPD adopts the 2022 California Fire Code, Title 24, Part 9, in its entirety, including
Appendices, incarporating those sections of the International Fire Code, 2021 editionnot adopted
by the state, with the exclusions listed below:

Exclusions: 103, 309, 311.5, 311.8, 318, 403.3, 403.5, 403.8, 403.10, 403.11, 404, 406,
903.3.1.2, 904.1.1, 1103.1, 1103.3-1103.4, 1103.6, 1105, Chapter 26; D104.2 (Exception only),
D106.1 (Exception only), D107.1 {Exceptions only), Appendix A, Appendix G, Appendix J,
Appendix K, Appendix L, Appendix M, Appendix N, Appendix O.

Appendices not adopted can be used for reference in enforcing other sections of the 2022
Galifornia Fire Code.

SECTION 3: AMENDMENTS TO THE 2022 CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE
The following Sections are hershy amended or added:

Chapter 1
SECTION 101.1 "TITLE" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 101.1 TITLE. These regulafions shall be known as the Fire Code of MFPD, hereinaiter
referred to as “this cade.”

SECTION 105.5 "REQUIRED OPERATIONAL PERMITS" IS AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 105.5 Required operational permits. The fire code official is authorized to issue
operational permits for the operations set forth In Sections 105.5.2 through 105.5.525.

SECTION 105.5.55 "AUTOMOBILE WRECKING YARDS" 1S ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 105.5.55 Automobile wrecking yards. An operafional permit is required for the
operation of auiomobile wrecking yards.

SECTION 105.6 “REQUIRED CONSTRUCTION PERMITS" IS AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 105.6 required construction permits. The fire code official is authorized fo issue
construction permits foi wark as set forth in sections 105.6.1 through 105.6.246.

SECTION 105.6.25 "AUTOMOBILE WRECKING YARDS" IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Sectlon 105.6.25 Automobile wrecking yards. Consiruction permifs are required for the
instalfation of ar modification to automobile wrecking yards.

SECTION 105.6.26 “TRAFFIC CALMING DEVICES" IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Ordinance 2022-09 Page 2

23-1589 G 5 of 65



105.6.26 Traffic calming devices. Construction permits are required for the instalfation or
modification of traffic calming devices.

SECTION 107.5 “PERMIT, PLAN REVIEW AND INSPECTION FEES” SHALL BE ADDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 107.5 Permit. A schedule of fees adapted by the district board of directors for plan
review, inspections and the Issuance of permits by the District may be found in the most current
district fee schedule (Health & Safety Code 17951).

SECTION 107.5.1 "COST RECOVERY FEES" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 107.5.1 Cost Recovery Fees. Fire setvice fees may be charged to any person, firm,
corporation, or business that through negligence, violation of the law, or as a result of
carelessness, is responsible for the cause of the District fo respond to the scene of an incident.
A district board may charge a fee to cover the cost of any service which the District provides
or the cost of enforcing any regulation for which the fee is charged (Health & Safety Code
13916). The fee shall not exceed the actual cost of suppressing the fire and/or raspanding to
the scene of an incident.

SECTION 107.7 "ADMINISTRATIVE COSTS" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 107.7 Administrative Costs. When a test or inspection is scheduled, and the
contractor fails ta perform fo the safisfaction of the authority having jurisdiction (AtHJ), the AHJ
may bill the contractor for actual time spent traveling fo and from the test/inspection location
and the time spent at the test/inspection site as well as administrative costs.

SECTION 111.5 “APPEAL PROCEDURES AND TIMELINES" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 111.5 Appeal Procedures and Timelines. Any person or entity who beliaves they
may be adversely affected by an order, decision, or determination made by the fire code official
through a written notice may appeal this matter within 15 calendar days of the postmark on the
notice. All such appeals shall be filed in writing with the Secretary of the Governing Board for
the District. A timely appeal shall stay further action by the fire code official until the matter is
determined by the Appeal Board as outlined in Section 109.2 unless the issue poses an
imminent fire or life safety hazard to members of the public. The fire code officlal shalff notify
the appeflant by certified mail of the date and time of such hearing. The hearing shall be
scheduled to take place no sooner than 20 calendar days from the date shown on the certified
mail. The appeliant shall have the right to appear in person or by agent at the hearing and
present oral, written, and/or photographic evidence to the Appeal Board.

SECTION 112.4 “VIOLATION PENALTIES” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 112.4 Violation Penalties. Persons who shall violate a provision of this code or shall
fall to comply with any of the requirements thereof or who shall erect, install, alter, repair, or
do work in violation of the approved construction documents or directive of the fire code officlal,
or of a permit or certificate used under provisions of this code, shall be guilty of a misdemeanor
or infraction, at the discretion of the prosecuting atforney or agency, punishable by a fine not
more than $700.00 for a first violation; A fine not exceeding $500.00 for a second violation of

Ordinance 2022-09 Page 3

23-1589 G 6 of 55



the same provision within one year; A fine not exceeding $7000.00 for each additional violation
of the same provision within one year, or by imprisoninent not exceeding 780 days, or both
such fine and imprisonment. Each day that a violation continues after due notice has been
served shall be deemed a separate offense. (Health & Safety Code Sections 13145 and
17995),

SECTION 112.4.2 “"CITATIONS" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 112.4.2 Citations. The Fire Chief, or his/her duly authorized representative, may
issue citations for infractions or misdemeanar violations of this code pursuant to Section 13871
of the Healfth & Safety Code of the State of California and Chapter Sc {commencing with
Section 853.6) of Title 3 of Part 2 of the Penal Code of the State of California.

SECTION 113.4 "FAILURE TO COMPLY" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 113.4 Failurs to Comply. Any person who shall continue any work after having been
served with a stop work order, except such work as that person is directed to perform to remove
a violation or unsafe condition, shall be punishable by a fine or imprisonment or hoth as
described In Section 112.4 (Health & Safety Code Sections 13145 and 17995).

Chapfer 2

SECTION 202 "CAMPFIRE" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

CAMPFIRE. A fire which is used for caoking, personal watmth, lighting, or aesthelic purposes.
SECTION 202 "DISTRICT" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

DISTRICT. The District and all other areas within the exterior boundaries thereof now or
hereafter established,

SECTION 202 “DRIVEWAY" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

DRIVEWAY. A vehicular access that serves up fo two (2) parcels with no more than {wo (2)
residential units and any number of non-commercial or Indusirial buildings on each parcel.

SECTION 202 “EXECUTIVE BODY" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:
EXECUTIVE BODY. The Board of Directors of the District.
SECTION 202 “FIRE CHIEF" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:!

FIRE GHIEF. The Chief Executive Fire Officer of the Fire depattment/district serving the
[Jurisdiction or a duly authorized represeniative.

SECTION 202 "FIRE HAZARD" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

FIRE HAZARD. Any condition, arrangement, or act which will increase, or may cause an
increase of, the hazard or menace of fire to a greater than customarlly recognized as normal

Ordinance 2022-09 Page 4

23-1589 G 7 of 55



by-persons in the public service of preventing, suppressing, or extinguishing fire; or which may
obstruct, delay, or hinder, or may become the cause of obstruction, defay or hinderance to the
prevention, suppression, or extinguishment of fire.

SECTION 202 “OPEN BURNING" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

OPEN BURNING. The buming of materials wherein products of combustion are emitted
directly into the ambient air without passing through a stack or chimney from an enclosed
chamber. Open burning does not include road flares, smudge-pots, and similar devices
assoclated with safety or occupational uses typically considered open flames;-recreational-fires,
or-uso-of-pertable-outdoer fireplaces. For the purpose of this definition, a chamber shall be
regarded as enclosed when, during the time combustion occurs, only apertures, ducts, stacks,
flues, or chimneys necessary to provide combustion air and permit the escape of exhaust gas
are open.

Open burning shall also include campfires, bonfires, portable autdoor firepiaces, ceremonial
fires, and recreational fire as defined in the Fire Code.

Exception:

1. UL or ASMI listed LPG or natural gas outdoor flame devices, such as gas BBQ's or gas
fira pits that comply with the Fire Code.

2, Campfires on private lands. Where required by the fire code official, a permit is shall
be Issued by the fire code official.

3, Ceremonial andfor religious burning with the folfowing safely measures:
a. Maximum 4-foot x 4-foot burn area.

b. Minimum 10-feot clearance from edge of burn area to aif flammable material and
vegetation,

An approved water supply is located vzithin 600-feet of the burn area.
The burn area is located no less than 30-feet from adjoining property lines.
An adult is present with a shove! until the fire Is extinguished.

No burming shafl be conducted during high or extreme fire weather conditions {e.g.,
National Weather Service Red Flag Warnings).

e AP

SECTION 202 "TRAINED CROWD MANAGER" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS;
TRAINED CROWD MANAGER. Standby personnel, usually a securfty guard or usher

parsonnel, who are trained in the proper procedure to exit people from a tent or other place of
public assemblage in an orderly and calm fashion in the event of an emergency

Chaptar 3

SECTION 302.1 “DEFINITIONS" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:
3D PRINTER.
ADDITIVE MANUFACTURING.

Qrdinance 2022-09 Page 5

23-1589 G 8 of 55



BONFIRE.

CAMPFIRE,

HI-BOY.

HIGH-VYOLTAGE TRANSMISSION LINE,
OPEN BURNING.

PORTABLE OUTDOOR FIREPLACE.
POWERED INDUSTRIAL TRUCK.
RECREATIONAL FIRE.

SKY LANTERN.

SECTION 307.4.4 “OPEN BURNING RESTRICTIONS" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 307.4.4 Open Burning Restrictions., Open burming on all lands within the
Jurisdiction of the MOSQUITO FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT (MFPD), including the Local
Response Area (LRA}, Is prohibifed when the California Depariment of Forestry and Fire
Protection (Cal Fire) issues a burn suspension in the Stale Responsibility Area (SRA). This
prohibition shall be made effective 24-hours following its commencement in the SRA.

Open burning is also prohibited on alf tfands within the jurisdiction of MFPD at any time the fire
code official that atmospheric conditlons or other local circurnstances make such fires hazardous,

including factors such as high winds, low fuel mojsture, fire weather, the issuance of red flag
warnings, the severe threat of wildiand fire, or present risk of destruction by wildfire fo life, wildiife,

properly, or natural resources.

Chapter 4
SECTION 401.2.1 “PRE-FIRE PLANS” IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 401.2.1 Pre-fire pians. Where required by the fire code official, a pre-fire plan shall
be provided and approved by the fire code official for all new commercial structures.

Chapter §

SECTION 503.2.1 "DIMENSIONS” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 583.2.1 Dimensions. Fire apparatus access roads shall have an unobstructed width
of not less than 20 jeet (6096 mm), exclusive of shoulders, as measured from face of curb to
face of curb, except for approved security gates in accordance with Section 503.6, and an

uncbstructed veriical clearance of not less than 75 feet, Driveways shall have an unobstructed
width of not less than 12 feet wide.

SECTION 503.2.5 “DEAD ENDS” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 503.2.5 Dead Ends. Dead-end fire apparatus access roads and driveways in excess
of 150 feet (45,720 mm) In length shall be provided with an approved area for turning arotnd
fire apparatus,

SECTION 503.2.6 "BRIDGES AND ELEVATED SURFACES” SHALL BE AMENDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Ordinance 2022-09 Page 6

23-1589 G 9 of 55



Section 503.2.6 Bridges and Elevated Susfaces. Where a bridge or an elevated suiface is
part of & fire apparatus access road, the bridge shall be constructed and maintained in
accordance with AASHTO HB-17, the current £l Dorado County Transporiation Division Bridge
Standard or Appendix D of the current California Fire Code, whichever Is more resltrictive,
Bridges and elevated surfaces shall be designed for a live load sufficient to carry the imposed
loads of fire apparatus. Vehicle load limits shal be posted at both entrances to bridges when
required by the fire code official. Whete elevated surfaces designed for emergency vehicle
use are adjacent to surfaces that are not designed for such use, approved barriers, approved
signs or both shall be installed and maintained where required by the fire code official.

SECTION 503.3.1 “NO PARKING IN FIRE LANES" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 503.3.1 No Parking In Fire Lanes. No person shall stop, park, or leave standing any
vehicle, whether attended or unattended, except when necessary to avoid conflict with other
traffic or in compliance with the directions of the Fire Chief, or his/her duly authorized
representative, Peace Officer, or official traffic controf device along the edge of any highway,
al any curb, or in any location in a publicly or privately owned or operated off-street parking
facility, designated as a fire lane by the District with furisdiction over the area in which the place
is located, The designation shall be indicated {1) by a sign posted Immediately adjacent fo,
and visible from, the designated place clearly stating in letters not less than one inch in height
that the place is a fire lane, (2} by outlining ar painting the place in red and, in conirasting color,
marking the place with the words “FIRE LANE,” which are clearly visible from a vehicle, or (3)
by a red curb or red paint on the edge of the roadway upon which Is clearly marked the words
“FIRE LANE.”

SECTION 503.3.2 “NO PARKING IN FRONT OF HYDRANTS" SHALL BE ADDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 503.3.2 No Parking in Front of Hydrants. No person shail stop, park, or leave
standing any vehicle within 15 feet of a fire hydrant except as follows: (a) If the vehicle is
attended by a licensed driver whe is seated in the front seat and who can immediately move
such vehicle In case of necessity, (b) If the vehicle is owned or operated by a fire department
and is clearly marked as a fire department vehicle.

SECTION 503.3.3 "FIRE LANES BASED ON ROAD WIDTH" SHALL BE ADDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 503.3.3 Fire Lanes Based on Road Widih. Fire lanes shall be based on road width
as required in Appendix D as amended by the District.

SECTION 503.6 “SECURITY GATES" IS AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 503.6 Security Gates. The instaliafion of securlty gates across a fire apparatus
access road shall be approved by the fire code official and shall comply with the District gate
standard. Where security gates are installed, they shall have an approved means of
emergency operation. The security gates and the emergency operaflon shall be maintained
operational at all times. Electric gate operators, where provided, shall be listed in accordance
with UL 325. Gates intended for automatic operation shali be designed, construcied, and
installed to comply with the requirements of ASTM F2200.

Ordinance 2022-09 Page 7

23-1589 G 10 of 55




SECTION 505.1 "ADDRESS IDENTIFICATION” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 505.1 Address Identification. Addresses for new and existing buildings shall comply
with the District address standard as approved by the fire code officlal. The address
identification shall be legible and placed in a position that is visible from the strest or road fronting
the property, Address identification characters shall contrast with their background. Address
numbers shall be Arabic numbers or alphabetical letters. Numbers shall not be spelled out. Each
character shalt be nat less than 4 Inches {102 mm) high with a minimum stroke width of /z inch
(12,7 mm). Where required by the fire code official, address identification shall be provided in
additional approved locations to facilitate emergency response. access is by means of a private
road and the building cannot be viewed from the public way, a monument, pole or other sign or
means shall be used fo identify the structure. Address identification shall be maintained.

SECTION 507.5.1 "WHERE REQUIRED" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 507.5.1 Where Required. Where a portion of the facility or buliding hereafter
constructed or moved into or within the jurisdictlon is more than 150 feet from a hydvant on a fire
apparatus access road, as measured by an approved route around the exterior of the facility or
building, on-site fire hydrants and mains capable of supplying the required fire flow shall be
provided where required by the fire code official.

Exceptions:

1. For Group R-3 and Group U occupancies, the distance reguirement shall be 600 feet
{183 m).

SECTION 509.3 “FIRE CONTROL ROOM” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 509.3 Fire Control Room. Fire sprinkier risers, fire alarm control panels, solar
photovoltaic power system rapld shutoff switches, and other fire detection, suppression, or
similar contro} elements shall be located inside a single fire control room for the building. The
fire conirol room shall have minimum dimensions of five feet by seven feet in size with a total
usable area of not less than 35 squara feet. The room shall be located within the building on
an autside walfi at a jocation approved by the Fire Code Official and shalf be accessible from
the exterlor An exteriar access door with a clear width of not Jess than 32 inches and height
of not less than 80 inches shall be provided for access into the room. A durable sign shall be
affixed fo the exterior of the door with the words “FIRE CONTROL ROOM" in letters not Jess
than 4 inches in height. A key box complying with Section 5086 shall be installed on the exterior
side of the fire conlrof room door opening.

The room must be capable of malntaining a minimum temperature of 40 degrees Fahrenhef.
A clearance of 12 inches shall be provided from the fire sprinkler risers to any adjacent walls.
This room can be a shared with other building utifities or fire protection equipment that is not
incompatible. An approved cabinet or container shall be provided to store record plans of the
fire sprinkler system and other fire protection equipment. This room shail not be used for any
other storage.

Exception: One-and two-family dwellings, manufactured homes, or similar uses
defined as either a Group R-3, R3.1, or R-4 occupancy.

SECTION 510.4.2,3 “STANDBY POWER" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Ordinance 2022-09 Page 8

23-1589 G 11 of 55




Section 510.4.2.3 Standby power, In-building, fwo-way emergency responder
communication radio coverage systems shall be provided with dedicated standby batteries or
provided with 2-hour standby batterles and connected to the facility generator power system
in accordance with Section 1203, The standby power supply shall be capable of operating the
In-building, two-way emergency responder communication coverage system at 100-percent
system capacity for a duration of not iess than 72 hours.

Chapter 9
SECTION 903.2 "WHERE REQUIRED” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 903.2 Where Required. Approved automatic sprinkler systems in new buildings and
structures, when constructed or relocated within the jurisdiction, shall be provided in the

Jocations described in Sections 903.2,1 through 903.2.12 and Sections 903.2.14 through
903.2.23.

Exception: Agriculural buildings not under a special use permit used for commercial
purposes.

SECTION 903.2.1.1 "GROUP A-1" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 203.2.1.1 Group A. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout stories
containing Group A-1 accupancies and throughout afl starfes from the Group A-1 occupancy to

and including the levels of exit discharge serving that occupancy where one of the following
conditions exists:

1. The fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet,
2. The fire area has an occupant load of 300 or more.

3. The fire area Is located on a floor other than a level of exit discharge serving such
accupancies.

4, The fire area contains a multi-theater complex
SECTION 203.2.1.2 "GROUF A-2" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Saction 203.2.1.2 Group A-2. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout
stories containing Group A-2 occupancies and throughout all stories from the Group A-2

occupancy to and including the levels of exit discharge serving that occupancy where one of the
following conditions exists:

1. The fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet;
2. The fire area has an occupant load of 100 or more.

3. The fire area is located on a floor other than a level of exit discharge serving such
occupancies.

4. The structure exceeds 3,600 square feet, contains more than one fire area containing a
Group A-2 accupancy, and is separated Into two or more buildings by fire walls of less than
4-hour fire-resistance rating without openings.

SECTION 803.2.1.3"GROUP A-3" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Ordinance 2022-02 Page 9

23-1589 G 12 of 55



Section 903.2.1.3 Group A-3. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout
stories containing Group A-3 occupancies. and throughout all stories from the Group A-3

accupancy to and including the levels of exit discharge serving that occupancy where one of the
following conditions exists:

1. The fire area exceeds 3,600 square fest.
2. The fire area has an occupant load of 300 or more.

3. The fire area is located on a floor other than a level of exit discharge serving such
ococupancies,

4. The structure exceeds 3,600 square feet, contains more than ane fire area containing
exhibition and display rooms, and is separated into two or more buildings by fire walis of
less than 4-hour fire-resistance rating without openings.

SECTION 903.2.1.4 "GROUP A-4" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 903.2,1.4 Group A-4. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout
stories containing Group A-4 occupancies and throughout all stories from the Group A-4
ocoupancy to and including the levels of exit discharge serving that occupancy where one of the
foliowing conditions exists:

1. The fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet.,

2. The fire area has an occupant load of 300 or more.

3, The fire area is located on a floor other than a level of exit discharge serving such

occupancies.

SECTION 903.2,3 "GROUP E” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:
Section 903.2.3 Group E. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided for Group E
oceupancies as follows:

1. Throughout all Group E fire areas greater than 3,600 square feet in area.

2, The Group E fire area is located on a floor other than a level of exit discharge serving such
occupancies.

Exception: In bulldings where every classroom has not fewer than one extetior exit
door at ground level, an automatic sprinkler system is not required in any
area below the lowest level of exit discharge serving that area,

3. The Group E fire area has an occupant load of 300 or more.

4, In rooms or areas with special hazards such as laboratories, vocational shops and other
such areas where hazardous materials in quantities not exceeding the maximum allowable
duantity are used or stored.

5. Throughout any Group E structure greater than 3,600 square fest in area, which contains
more than one fire area, and which is separated Into twa ar more buildings by fire walls of
less than 4-hour fire resistance rating without openings.

8. For public school, and state-funded construction projects see Section 903.2.1 9.
7. For public school campuses, Kindergarten through 12 grade, see Section ©03.2.20

Ordinance 2022-09 Page 10

23-1589 G 13 of 55



SECTION 903.2.4 "GROUP F-1" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 203.2.4 Group F-1. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout all
bulldings containing a Group F~1 occupancy where one of the following conditions exists:

1. A Group F-~1 fire area.exceeds 3,600 square feet.

2. A Group F-1 fire area is located more than three sfories above grade piane.

3. The combined arsa of all Group F-1 fire areas on all floors, including any mezzanines,

exceeds 3,600 square feet.

SECTION 803.2.7 "GROUP M" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:
Section 903.2,7 Group M, An autornatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout buildings
containing a Group M occupancy where one of the following conditions exists:

1. A Group M fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet.

2. A Group M fire area is located mote than three stories above grade plane,

3. The combined area of &l Group M fire areas on all floors, including any mezzanines,
exceeds 3,600 souare feet.

5. The sfructure exceeds 3,600 square feet, contains more than one fire area containing a
Group M occupancy, and is separated into two or more buildings by fire walls of less than
4-hour fire-resistance rating without openings.

SECTION 903.2.7.2 "GROUP M UPHOLSTERED FURNITURE OR MATTRESSES" SHALL
BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS;

Section 803.2.7.2 Group M Upholstered Furniture or Matiresses. An automatic sprinkler
system shall be provided throughout a Group M fire area where the area used for the display
and sale of upholstered furniture or mattresses exceeds 3,600 square feet.

SECTION 903,2.8.5 "MANUFACTURED HOMES"” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 903.2.8.5 Manuractured Homes. An automatic fire sprinkler sysiem shall be required
in all new manufactured homes and multi-family manufactured homes infended for use as a
one-and two-family dwelling. The design and installation of such systems shall be In
accordance with California Code of Regulatfons, Title 25, §4300.

Exceptfions:

1, Manufactured homes located within an existing mobile fiome park complying with
California Health and Safety Code, Division 13, Pari 2,1 or 2.3.

2. Manufactured homes that do not exceed 1,200 square feet in size and serve as an
accessory dwelling unit, as defined in Government Code Section 658502; when the
existing primary residence on the property is not required fo comply with California
Residential Code Seclion R313.2.

3. Manufactured homes that do not exceed 320 square feet in size.

SECTION 903.2.9 “GROUP S-1" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Ordinance 2022-01 Page 11

23-1589 G 14 of 55



Section 803.2.9 Group $-1. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout all
buiidings containling a Group S-1 occupancy where one of the following conditions exists:

1. A Group S-1 fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet.

2. A Group S-1 fire area is located more than three storfes above grade plane.

3. The combined area of alt Group 8-1 fire areas on all floors, including any mezzanines,
exceeds 3,600 square fest.

4. A Group S-1 fire area used for the storage of commercial motor vehicles where the fire
area exceeds 3,600 square feet.

SECTION 903.2.10 “GROUP 82" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:
Section 203.2,10 Group S-2. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout
bufldings classified as parking garages where any of the following conditions exist:

1. Where the fire area of the enclosed parking garage, in accordance with Section 406.6 of
the California Building Code, exceeds 3,600 square feet.

2. Where the enclosed parking garage, in accardance with Section 406.6 of the California
Building Code, is located beneath other groups.

Exception: Enclosed parking garages located beneath Group R-3 occupancles.

3. Where the fire area of the open parking garage, In accordance with Section 406.5 of the
California Building Code, exceeds 3,600 square feet.

SECTION 903.2.10.1 "COMMERCIAL PARKING GARAGES" SHALL BE AMENDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 903.2.10,1 Commercial Parking Garages. An automatic sprinkler system shall be

provided throughout bulldings used for storage of commercial motor vehicles where the fire area
exceeds 3,600 square feet.

SECTION 903.2.22 "GROUP B" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 903.2.22 Group B. An automatic sprinkler system shalf be prcvided throughout aff
buildings containing Group B occupancies where the fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet,

SECTION 903.2.23 “GROUP F-2" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 993.2,23 Group 2. An automalic sprinkier sysfem shall be provided throughout aff
buildings containing Group F-2 occupancies where the fire area exceeds 3,600 square faet.

SECTION 903.6 “WHERE REQUIRED IN EXISTING BUILDINGS AND STRUCTURES” IS
AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 903.6 Where Reouired in Existing Buildings and Structures. An automatic
sprinkier system shall be provided in existing buildings and structures where required in
Chapter 11 and as follows:

Ordinance 2022-09 Page 12

23-1589 G 15 of 85



1. When there is a change in occupancy classification that results in an increased life safely
or fire risk, as determined by the fire code official, and the structure exceeds 3,600 square
feet, an automatic fire sprinkler system shall be instalfed throughout the building.

2, In existing buildings 3,600 square feet or grealer, other than one and two-family dwelling
units, and agricultural buildings nof under special use permit for commercial purposes,
where the floor area of the building or structure is increased, such building or structure
shalf be made to conform to Section 903.2.

Exception: When the building increase Is less than 500 square feal.

3. In existing buildings 3,600 square feet or less, other than one-and two-family dwelling
units, and agricultural buildings nof under special use permit for commercial purposes,
where the floor area of the bullding or structure is Increased to a tofal square footage
over 3,600 square feet, such building or structure shall be made to conform to Section
203.2.

Exception: When the building increase is less than 500 square feet.

SECTION 807.2. *WHERE REQUIRED — NEW BUILDINGS AND STRUCTURES" SHALL BE
AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 207.2. Where Required —~ New Buildings and Structures. An approved fire alarm
system instafted in accordance with the provisions of this code and NFPA 72 shall be provided
in new buildings and structures in accordance with Sections 8907.2.1 through 907.2.2830 and
provide occupant notification in accordance with Section 807.5, untess other requirements are
provided by another section of this code.

Not fewer than one manual fire alarm box shall be provided in an approved focation to initiate
a fire alarm signal for fire alarm systems employing automatic fire detectors or waterflow
detection devices, Where other sections of this ¢code allow the eltmination of fire alarm boxes
due to sprinklers or aufomatic fire alarm systems, a single fire alarm box shall be installed ata
location approved by the enforcing agency.

Exceptions:

1. The manual fire alarm box Is not required for fire alarm centrol units systems
dedicated to elevator recall control, supervisory service and fire sprinkier
monitoring.

2. The manual fire alarm box is not required for Group R-2 occupancies uniess
required by the fire code official to provide a means for fire watch personne! fo
initiate an alarm during a sprinkler system, impairment event. Where provided, the
manual fire alarm box shall not be located in an area that is open to the public.

3. The manual fire alarm box Is not required to be installed when approved by the fire
cade official.

4, A fire alarm system is not required in ane and two-family dwellings, agricultural
buildings, and other occupancies classified as Group U not under special use
permit and/or not used for commercial purposes (e.g. refail sales, food seivice,
anclfor special evenis).

Ordinance 2022-09 Page 13

23-1589 G 16 of 55



5. Buildings with a floor area less than 500 square feet may bé exempt, as defermined
by the fire code officlal based on building construction material and features,
Jocation, oceupancy fype, and distance fo exposures.

SECTION 907.2.1.4 “GROUP A UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET" SHALL BE ADDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 907.2,1.4 Group A Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shall
be instalfed in afl group A buildings with a floor area less than 3,600 square feet.

SECTION 907.2,2.3 *GROUP B UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET" SHA_L BE ADDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 907.2.2.3 Group B Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shaif
be installed in all group B buildings with a floor area less than 3,600 square fest.

SECTION 9207.2.3.11 “GROUP E UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET" SHALL BE ADDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 907.2.3.11 Group E Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shall
be installed in all group E buildings with a floor area less than 3,600 square feet.

SECTION 907.2.4.1 "GROUP F UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET" SHALL BT ADDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 907.2.4.1 Group F Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shall
be installed in alf group F buildings with a floor area less than 3,600 square feet.

SECTION 907.2.5.2 "GROUP H UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET" SHALL BE ADDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 907,2.5.2 Group H Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire afarm system shall
be Installed In all group H bulldings with a floor area less than 3,600 square feet.

SECTION 907.2.6.6 “GROUP | UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET" SHALL BE ADDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 907.2.6.6 Group | Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire atarm system shall
be installed in all group ! buildings with a floor area less than 3,600 square feet.

SECTION 907.2.7.2 "GROUP M UNDER 3,800 SQUARE FEET" SHALL BE ADDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 907.2.7.2 Group M Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved firs alarm system shall
be installed in alf group M buildings with a floor area less than 3,600 square feet.

SECTION 907.2.8.4 “GROUP R-1 UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET" SHALL BE ADDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Ordinanee 2022-09 Page 14

23-1589 G 17 of 55



Section 907.2.8.4 Group -1 Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shall
be installed in all group R~1 bulidings with a flocr area less than 3,600 square feet.

SECTION 807.2.9.4 "GROUP R-2, R-2.1, R2,2 UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET" SHALL BE
ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 907.2.9.4 Group R-2, R-2.1, R-2.2 Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm
system shall be Installed in alf group R-2, R-2.1, R-2.2 buildings with a floor area less than
3,600 square feet.

SECTION 907.2.10.1 "GROUP S UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET" SHALL BE ADDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 907.2.10.1 Group S Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shall
be installed in all group S buildings with a floor area less than 3,800 square feet.

907.2.30 "TYPE | HOOD INSTALLATIONS" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

907.2.30 “Type | Hood Instalfations. The requirement of installation, or replacement, of a
Type { Hood System shall require a fire alarm/sprinkler monitoring system to be instailed, or

for the hood system to be connected to an existing fire alarm/sprinkler monitoring system for
that building.

907.6.5 "MONITORING” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

807.6.5 Monitoring. Fire alarm systems required by this chapter or by the Califomia Buliding
Code shall be monitored by an approved, UL certified, Type A Full Service central, proprietary
or remote station service, which gives audlble and visual signals at a constantly attended
location. All sprinklfered buildings shall be monitored.

Excepiions:

1. One- and two-family dwellings (R-3 Occupancies and other occupancies classified
as “U”).

2. Agricultural bulldings not under special use permit andfor not used for commercial
purposes (e.g., refalls sales, food service, and/or special events).
SECTION 907.6.2.1 “SECONDARY POWER SUPPLY" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

SECTION 907.6.2.1 SECONDARY POWER SUPPLY, Where required by the fira code
official, in accordance with NFPA 72, the secondary power supply providing a minimum 24~
hour power capacily under quiescent load (system operating in a non-alarm condifion) shall
be amended to a minimum 72-hour power capacily.

Exception: The existence of an emergency hack-up power supply that meels or exceed
the requirements of California Fire Code Chapter 12.

SECTION 907.9 “WHERE REQURIED IN EXISTING BUILDINGS” SHALL BE AMENDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Ordinance 2022-09 Page 15

23-1589 G 18 of 55



SECTION 207.9 Where Required. An approved fire alarm system shall be provided in existing
buildings and structures where required In Chapter 11 and in existing buildings with a floor
area less than 3,600 square feat without an approved automatic sprinkler system, other than
one- or two-family dwelling units, agricultural bullding not under special use permit for
commercial purposes where a fire alarm detectlon system does not exist and the floor area of
the building or structure is increased

Exception: When the building increase js less than 500 square feet.

Chapter 12
SECTION 1203.1.3 “INSTALLATION" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 1203.1.3 Installation. Emergency power systems and standby power systems shall
be installed in accordance with the California Building Code, the California Electrical Code,
NFPA 110 and NFPA 111, All buildings, other than one- and two-family dwelling units, and
agricultural bulidings not used for commerclal purposes, with standby power, shall have a
shunt trip device that disconnects all power sources to the building, approved by the fire code
official. Existing installations shall be maintained in accordance with the original approval.

Chapter 33
SECTION 3311.3 “PREMISE IDENTIFICATION” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

" Section 3311.3 Premise Identification. Prior to and during construction, an approved
address sign shalf be provided at each fire and emergency vehicle access road entry into the
project.

SECTION 3313.1 “WHEN REQUIRED” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 3313.1 When Required. An approved water supply for fire protection, either
temporary or permanent, shall be shall be installed and maintained In continuous operation as
soon as combustible building materials arrive on site, the commencement of vertical
combustible construction and on installation of a standplpe system in buildings under
construction, in accordance with Sactions 3313.2 through 3313.5.

Exception: The fire code officlal Is authorized to reduce the fire-flow requirements for
isolated buildings or a group of buildings in rural areas or small communities where the
development of full fire-flow requirements is impractical.

Chapter 50
SECTION 5001.7 "LIABILITY FOR DAMAGES”® SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 5001.7 Liability for Damages. Any damages or cosf resufting from the negfigence,
violation of the law, carefess handling, spill or discharge of any hazardous malerials shall
constitute debt against any such person, firm or corporation causing such spill or discharge.
This debt is colfectible by the Fire Chief, or his/her duly authorized representative, in the same
mannet as in the case of an obligation under contract, expressed or Implied.

Ordinance 2022-09 Page 16

23-1589 G 19 of 55



Chapfter 56
SECTION 5601.2 “PERMIT REQUIRED" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 5601.2 Permit Required. Permits shall be required as set forth in Section 106.5 and
regulated in accordance with this section. Where fireworks permits are required, they shall be

issued by the Fire Chief. or histher duly authorized representative, and the El Dorado County
Board of Supervisors.

Chapter 57

SECTION 5704.2.9.6.1 "LOCATIONS WHERE ABOVE-GROUND TANKS ARE
PROHIBITED” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

SECTION 5704.2.9.6.1 Locations Where Ahove-Ground Tanks are Prohibited, Storage of
Class | and Class il flammable liquids in above-ground tanks outside of buildings is prohibited
within the limits established by law as the timits of districts in which such storage is prohibited.
Storage of Class | and Class i flammable liquids in above-ground tanks outside of buildings is
prohibfted unless approved by the fire code official.

SECTION 5706.2.4.4 "LOCATIONS WHERE ABOVE-GROUND TANKS ARE PROHIBITED"
SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

SECTION 5706.2.4.4 Locations Where Above-Ground Tanks are Prohibited. The storage
of Class | and Class 1l figuids in above-ground tanks Is prohibited within the limits established

by law as the limits of districts in which such storage is prohibited. Storage of Class | and Class
It liquids in above-ground tanks is prohibited uniess approved by the fire cade official,

Chapter 58

SECTION 5806.2 “LIMITATIONS" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

SECTION 5806.2 Limitations. Storage of flammable cryogenic fluids in stationary containers
outside of buildings Is prohibited withln the limits established by law as the fimiis of districts in

which such storage is prohibited. Storage of flammabie cryogenic fluids in stationary containers
outside of buildings is prohibited unless approved by the fire code official.

Chapter 61

SECTION 6104.2 "MAXIMUM CAPACITY WITHIN ESTABLISHED LIMITS" SHALL BE
AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

SECTION 6104.2 Maximum Capacity within Established Limits. Within the limits
established by law restricting the storage of liquefied petroleum gas for the protection of heavily

QOrdinance 202209 Page 17

23-1589 G 20 of 55



populated or congested areas, the aggregate capacity of any ane installation shall not exceed
a water capacity of 2,000 gallons, The storage of liquefied pelfroleum gas in excess of an
aggregate of 2,000-gallon water capacify when located at least one-half (1/2} mile from
property zoned or designated for residential use and at least one-half {1/2} mile from existing
residential development with a density greater than one (1) dwelling unit per acre and af Jeast
one-half (1/2) mile from any hotel or motel is aliowed when approved by the fire code official,
and a special/conditional use permit Is issued by the County of Ef Dorado.

Dispensing within established limits, Within the limits established by law restricting the
dispensing of liquefied petroleum gas for the profection of heavily populated or congested
areas, the aggregale capacity of any one installation shall notexceed a water capacity of 2,000
galions. The dispensing of liquefied petroleum gas in excess of an aggregate of 2,000-gallon
water capacity when located at least one-half (1/2) mife from property zoned or designated for
residential use and at least one-half (1/2} mille from any hotel or motel is allowed when
approved by the fire code official and a speclal/conditional use permit is issued by the County
of El Dorado.

Chapter 80

SECTION 80, NFPA 1-22, CHAPTER 22 "AUTOMOTIVE WRECKING YARDS" IS ADOPTED,
AMENDED SECTIONS AS FOLLOWS:

Revise Section 22.3 as follows:

22.3 Fire department access roads shall be in accordance with the California Fire Code,
Section 503 and Appendix D.

Add new Section 22.10 as follows:

22.10 Stored vehlicles, boats, recreational vehicles, parts, and squipment shall not be stored
within 30 feet of adjacent property lines.

SECTION 80, NFPA, 13D-22 — “STANDARD FOR THE INSTALLATION OF SPRINKLER
SYSTEMS IN ONE-AND TWO FAMILY DWELLINGS AND MANUFACTURED HOMES" IS
AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 803.3.1.3, 203.3.5.1.1

NEPA 130, Amended Sections as follows:

Add new Saction 4.6 as follows:

A% Residential fire sprinkler systems installed in all new one-and two-family dwellings shall utilize
a “Passive Purge” system design unless otherwise approved by the fire code official.

Exception: Manufactured home installed, tested and approved by the California
Department of Housing and Community Development.

Revisa Section 5.1.1.2 as follows:

Ordinance 2022-09 Page 18

23-1589 G 21 of 55



5.1.1.2 A supply of at fleast one of each type and temperature sprinkler used within the premises
shall be malntained on the property at an approved location. Spare sprinkiers shall be keptin a
mounted and accessible cabinet.

Revise Section 7.6 as follows:

7.6 A local audio/visual devige activated upon water flow shall be provided on all fire sprinkler
systems in homes af an approved location on the exterior of the dwelling.

Revise Section 11.2.1.1 as follows:

11.2.1.1 Where a fire depariment pumper connection is not provided, the system shall be
hydrostatically tested at a minfimum pressure of 150 pounds per square inch gauge for no less
than a 30-minute duration without evidence of leakage. Such test shall be witnessed by the fire
code official,

Appendix B ~ Fire Flow Requirements for Buildings

TABLE B105.1(1)} "REQUIRED FIRE FLOW FOR ONE- AND TWO-FAMILY DWELLINGS,
GROUP R-3, AND R-4 BUILDINGS AND TOWNHOUSES® SHALL BE AMENDED AS
FOLLOWS:

TABLE B105.1{1) REQUIRED FIRE FLOW FOR ONE- AND TWO-FAMILY DWELLINGS,

GROUP R-3, AND R-4 BUILDINGS AND TOWNHOUSES
BLEASE NOTE THAT TABLE B105.1(1) INCLUDES A SEPARATE SECTION FOR SPRINKLERED RESIDENCES WITH LESSER F)
FLOW REQUIREMENTS NOT MENTIONED (N THIS AMENDED SECTION)

FIRE-FLOW AUTOMATIC MINIMUM FIRE- | FLOWDURATION
CALCULATION SPRINKLER SYSTEM FLOW (hours)
AREA (Design Standard}) (gallons per
{square feet) minute)
0 - 3,600 No automatic sprinklert 1,600 1
system
3,601 and greater |No automatic sprinkler | Value In Table | Duratlon in Table
system B105.1(2) B105.1{(2) at the
required  fire-flaw
rale
MAJOR SUBDIVISIONS (5§ PARCELS OR GREATER)
0-3,600 Section 803.3.1.3 of the | 7,000 1
CA Flre Code or Section
3133 of the CA
Residential Code
3,601 and greater | Section 903.3.1.3 of the | 1/2 value of
CA Fire Code or Secfion |Table B108.1(2} |2
313.3 of the CA |(min. 1000
Residentiatl Code GPM)

Qrdinance 2022-091

Page 19

23-1589 G 22 of 55



OTHER RESIDENTIAL DEVELOPMENT

0 - 3,600 Section 903.3.1,3 of the | 500 1
CA Flre Code or Section
3133 of te CA
Residential Code

3,601 and greater | Section 903.3.1.3 of the | 1/2valueof Table | 1
CA Fire Code or Section | B105.1{2) (min.
313.3 of the CA |750GPM)

Residentiai Code

TABLE B105.2 "REQUIRED FIRE FLOW FOR BUILDINGS OTHER THAN ONE- AND
TWO-FAMILY DWELLINGS, GROUP R-3, AND R-4 BUILDINGS AND
TOWNHOUSES" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

TABLE B105.2 REQUIRED FIRE FLOW FOR BUILDINGS OTHER THAN ONE-
AND TWO-FAMILY DWELLINGS, GROUP R-3, AND R-4 BUILDINGS AND

TOWNHOUSES
AUTOMATIC MININUM FIRE- FLOW DURATION
SPRINKLER SYSTEM FLOW (hours)
(Design Standard} {(gallons per minute)

No automatic sprinkler | Value in Table Duration in Table B105.1(2)
system B105.1{2)
Section 803.3.1.1 of the |25% of the value in [ Duration in Table B105.1{2) at
CA Fire Code Table B105.1(2)b the reduced flow rate

b. The reduced fire flow shall not be less than 1,500 GPM

Appendix D - Five Apparatus Access Roads
SECTION D103.1 "ACCESS ROAD WIDTH WITH A HYDRANT” SHALL BE AMENDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section D103.1 Access Road Width with a Hydrant. Where a fire hydrant is located on a
fire apparatus access road, the minimum road width shall be 26 feet (7925 mm), exclusive of
shoulders {see Figure D103.1).

Exception: Driveways
SECTION D103.2 “GRADE" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

SECTION D193.2 Grade. Fire apparatus access roads and driveways shall not exceed 15.9%
in grade unless approved by the fire code offisial or by the £l Dorado County amendead
California Public Resource Code Title 147 Design and Improvement Standards Manual.

QOrdinance 2022-09 Page 20

23-1589 G 23 of 55



SECTION D103.3 "TURNING RADIUS" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

SECTION D103.3 Turning Radius. The minimum turning radius shail be determined by the
fire code official; and shall nof include curb and gutter.

SECTION D103.5 “FIRE APPARATUS ACCESS ROAD GATES" SHALL BE AMENDED AS
FOLLOWS:

SECTION D103,5 Fire Apparatus Access Road Gafes. Gates securing the fire apparatus
access roads shall comply with all of the following criteria:

1. Where a single gate is provided, the gate width shaft be not less than 20 feet (6096 mm).
Whete a fire apparatus road consists of a divided roadway, the gate width shali be not less
than 15 feet {3658 mm).

2, Gates shall be of the horizontal swing, horizontal slide, vertical lift, or vertical pivot type.
3, Consfruction of gates shall be of materials that allow manual operation by one person.

4, Gate components shall be maintained in an operative condition at alt times and replaced
or repaired when defective.

5. Electric gates shall be equipped with a2 means of opening the gate by fire depariment

personnel for emergency access. Emergency opening devices shall be apptoved by the
fire code official,

6. Methods of locking shall be submitted for approval by the flre code official.

7. Electric gate operators, where provided, shall be listed in accordance with UL 325,

8. Gatas intended for automatic operafion shall be designed, constructed, and Installed fo
comply with the requirements of ASTM F2200,

SECTION D103.6.1 “ROADS 20 TO 29 FEET iN WIDTH" SHALL BE AMENDED AS
FOLLOWS:

SECTION D103.6.1 Roads 20 to 29 feet in width. Fire lane signs, as specified in Section

D103.6 shall be posted on both sides of fire apparatus access roads that are 20 to 29 feet wide
(6096 to 8534.4 mm).

SECTION D102.6.2 "ROADS MORE THAN 29 FEET IN WIDTH" SHALL BE AMENDED AS
FOLLOWS:

SECTION D103.6.2 Roads more than 29 feet in Width. Fire lane signs, as specified in
Section D103.6, shall be posted on one side of fire apparatus access roads more than 29 feet
wide (8534.4 mm) and less than 36 feet wide (10972.8 mm).

SECTION D104.4 "CIRCUMFERENTIAL FIRE APPARATUS ACCESS ROADS" SHALL BE
ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

SECTION D104.4 Circumferential Fire Apparatus Access Roads. When required by the
fira code officlal, a fire apparaius access road shall be construcled to encompass the entirety
of a struciure and shall provide a continuous means of emergency vehicle access.

Ordinance 2022-09 Page 21

23-1589 G 24 of 55



SECTION 4: CONFLICT |
That Ordinance No, 2018-09 of the MFPD and all other ordinances or parts of ordinances
herewith are hereby repealed.

SECTION 5: SEVERABILITY

If any Ordinance, article, subssction or subdivision thereof, provision, sentence, ciause, or
phrase of this code, or any application thereof, is for any reason held to be invalld by a court of
competent jurisdiction, such decision shall not affect the remaining provisions of this code,
which can be given effect without the invalid portions and, therefore, such invalid portions are
declared to be severable. The MFPD hereby declares that it would have enacted this Ordinance
and each of its arlides, sections, subsections, or subdivisions thereof, provisions, sentences,
clauses, or phrases, irrespective of the fact that one or more of them is declared invalid.

SECTION 6: EFFECTIVE DATE AND PUBLICATION
This Ordinance shall iake effect thirty (30) days after its adoption. The MFPD Board Secretary
is directed o publish this Ordinance in a newspaper of generai circulation In the District. In lieu

of publication of the full text of the Ordinance, a summary of the Ordinance may be published
by the by the Board Secretary within fifteen (15) days after its passage and a certified copy
shall be posted in the office of the MFPD pursuant to Government Code Section 36933(c) (7)-

The above Ordinance was introducad at a meeting of the Board of Directors of the MEFED on
December 22, 2022, and it was then read for the first fime. A public hearing was set for the

Ordinance fo be read for the second time on January 26, 2023, and approved by the following

vote:

Ordinance 202209 Page 22

23-1589 G 25 of 55



PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of Directors of the MFPD this, 26th day of

January, 2023.

AYES:

NOES:
ABSENT:
ABSTAIN:,

, Board President

ATTEST:

Sharlyn Fields , Board Secretary

Ordinance 202209

Page 23

23-1589 G 26 of 55



RESOLUTION 22-10

A RESOLUTION OF THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS OF THE
MOSQUITO FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT
ADOPTING FINDINGS SUPPORTING AMENDMENTS TO
THE CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE

A resolution for the Mosquito Fire Protection District setting forth findings with respect to
local conditions within the Fire District which make certain modifications and changes to
the California Fire Code reasonably necessary for preserving fire and life safety in the
Mosquito Fire Protection District

The Governing Board of the Mosquito Fire Protection District finds and resolves as
follows:

WHEREAS, Health & Safety Code Section 17958.5 permits a Fire Protection
District to adopt an ordinance which changes or modifies the State Housing regulations
adopted pursuant to Health & Safety Code Section 17922 upon determination that such
changes or modifications are necessary due to iocal conditions that pertain regulations
governing conditions hazardous to life, property and the environment from fire, explosion,
hazardous materials and hazardous uses; and

WHEREAS, Health & Safety Code Section 17958.7 requires that a District’s Board
of Directors making any changes or modifications pursnant to Health & Safety Code
Section 17958.5 shall make express finding that such changes or medifications are needed;
and shall file a copy of such changes or modifications with the Department of Housing and
Community Development.

WHEREAS, the unique local climatic, geological, and topographical conditions
existing within the boundaries of the District make it reasonably necessary for the District to
impose more stiingent requirements than set forth in the California Fire Code and pursuant
to California Health and Safety Code sections 13869.7 and 17958.7, the District
desires to make express findings to that effort

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that the Board of Directors of the
Mosquito Fire Protection District, after having duly noticed and held public hearings, hereby
adopts the following findings concerning current unique local conditions that
together make each modification to the Californiz Fire Code, reasonably necessary {0
provide adequate and effective protection of life, property and the environment moge
specifically set forth as follows:

23-1589 G 27 of 55



FINDINGS OF FACT
FOR CHANGES OR MODIFICATIONS TO THE STATE BUILDING
STANDARDS CODE (TITLE 24 PART 9) BECAUSE OF LOCAL
CONDITIONS

A. General.

After due consideration, the Board of Directors of the Mosquito Fire Protection District,
hereby finds that due to local climatic, geojogic and topographic conditions, as stated within
this document, there is a need to provide the modifications and change contained in the
adoptive Ordinance of the California Fire Code. Such changes are deemed to be reasonably
necessary to provide adequate and effective protection of life, property, and the
environment.

The Mosquito Fire Protection District provides fire protection, emergency medical
services, and specialized rescue services to approximately 2,500 people in a 13 square mile
area. The District is located on the Western slope of El Dorado County. The

topography of the District ranges from rolling hills of grass, oak woodland, large
quantities of brash, and steep drainages. The weather conditions vary from freezing
temperatures with occasional snow in winter, to summer temperatures that regularly
exceed 100 degrees.

The Mosgquito Fire Protection District is an “ali-risk” agency. The District participates in a
sophisticated mutual aid program and is dispatched through agreement by the California
Department of Forestry and Fire Protection (Cal-Fire) at Camino. The resources of the
District will respond to, and deal with, any type of emergency. The term “Fire

Protection” in this document is broad and includes responses to fires, smoke, and odor
investigations, alarms, public assist calls, hazardous materials incidents, medical aid, and
specialized rescues.

The District has one staffed fire station 1o provide emergency service to the community, Fire
Station 75 is located at 8801 Rock Creek Road. The District has 2 full-time, career
personnel, along with 1 part time management position, and these are supplemented with a
volunteer Assistant Chief, Engine Company Officers and Firefighters.

B. Climatic.

The Mosquito Fire Protection District is located within a foothill region. The District is
subject to four seasons, with an annual snowfall in the winter months of 2-4 inches, in
addition to an average rainfall of 39 inches per year. These adverse weather conditions
create severe hazardous road conditions and flooding as well as rockslide hazards along the
main access roads within, as well as into, the District from the surrounding areas. Due to
periods of rainfall, along with repeated road closutes, the ability of the Fire Protection

23-1589 G 28 of 55



District to provide immediate emergency response is often delayed. These same adverse
climatic conditions often result in a large number of vehicular accidents that place
extreme restraints on the availability of emergency response to perform emergency
rescue, first aid, hazardous materials control, and firefighting. The climatic conditions
often resuit in a substantial or tota} lack of ability of the Fire Protection District to
respond immediately to other types of emergency situations that occur. Examples of these
emergency sitnations include structure fires, wildland and forest fires, flooding,
hazardous materials incidents, emergency medical calls, vehicle accidents, and vestical
rescues. The mutnal aid agreements established with adjoining fire agencies might not be
possible due to adverse climatic conditions, restricting or totally blocking access into the
District,

Summary:

These local climatic conditions affect the acceleration, intensity, and size of fires in the Fire |
District. Times of little or no rainfall, low humidity, and high temperatures create
extremely hazardous conditions, particularly as they relate to the wildland-urban

interface. Winds experienced in this area can have a sigaificant impact upon structure fires,
especially in buildings in close proximity to one another, and to wildlands

commonly found in the Mosquito Fire Protection District. Structures built within the
Mosquito Fire Protection District must be built with these variables in mind

C. Geological.

The Mosquito Fire Protection District is located within moderate seismic Zone Three, The
seismic, geological conditions present a potential for multiple fires, major breakage of wates
mains, multiple electrical power failures, multiple collapsed structures and & large number
of calls for emergency medical aid, all of which may occur simultaneously during a seismic
event, The water district has numerouns water-pumping systems used for fire suppression
water delivery, as well as water storage tanks providing water system pressure. Most of the
pumping systems ate dependent on electrical power for operation. Such electrical power
may not be available during a seismic event. Water storage tanks vsed for storage of
required fire suppression water may also collapse in such an event forcing the additional
need to transport water via additional pieces of fire apparatus which will place a significant
restraint on the ability of the District to provide the required emergency services.

Summary:

Local geographic and geological features and processes exist within the boundaries of the
Districts that may hamper the ability of the Mosquito Fire Protection District to perform its
sworn duties. Fire following an earthquake has the potential of causing greater loss of life
and damage than the earthquake itself,

23-1589 G 29 of 55



D. Tepographical.

The District is primarily composed of areas that are considered by the State to be high fire

hazard severity zones. Much of the hill is located within foothill terrain, covered with highly

combustible vegetation, including the presence of many coniferous forested areas. The
elevation within the District ranges from approximately 800 feet to over 3200 feet at the
highest point. Slope within the District ranges from 0 to 90 degrees. The structures within
the areas of the foothill’s terrain have very limited fire access, due to narrow

roadways with steep grades and poor road surface conditions. The presences of many
existing structures within the high fire severity zone areas provides for a very high
potential of a structure fire spreading into a wildland or forest fire condition as well as the
potential for a wildland or forest fire spreading to structures.

Summary:

The alignment of canyons, valleys, and slopes into inhabited areas, combined with the
variable nature of the terrain, yield potential for increased fire risk. Most structures, both
residential and commercial, are in or are surrounded by areas that contain significant grass,
brush, mixed oak woodland, and mixed conifer fuel load. Due to drought

conditions, beetle infestations, and lack of vegetation management, much of the area is
populated with either dead or dying trees, contributing to extreme fire danger.

E. Conclusion

Local climatic, geographic, and topographic conditions described above increase the
frequency, intensity, and size of fires involving buildings in the Fire District. Further, these
conditions impact potential damage to structures from an earthquake and

subsequent fire. Therefore, it is reasonably necessary that the California Fire Code be
modified to mitigate the effects of the above conditions. California Health & Safety Code
Section 17958.7 requires that modifications to the Fire Code be expressly marked and
identified as to which each finding refers to which Code modification. The attached
Appendix A provides this connection.

23-1589 G 30 of 55



PASSED AND ADOPTED at a regulac meeting of the Board of Directors of the
Mosquito Fire Protection District on January 26, 2023 by the following roll call vote:

AYES:
NOES:
ABSENT:

ABSTAIN:

ATTEST:

Sharlyn Fields, Board Clerk

BY:

Don Stever, Board President

23-1589 G 31 of 65



MOSQUITO FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT

[2022 CFC Code Section Title I,-]_r.!-rmrur[ Amended | Added Deleted Finding
§01.1 (seneral | e % 1L ',;\dminis_[;ative
f02.6- 192,12 '——_[.\pplunhlhh 7? o0 R |Administrative
4.1 By I)tmcx and 1 T _I;fﬂ111i||istrative
dowers 4 | e & e -
fO4.3 - 104.4 Duties and X ;‘\(il}lilli5l3'klli\'k‘*
owers 1
104.6 )ificial Records B 7 . S . T
04,8 ~ 104.8.2 A oy ed a TR s ARk M R :\dmnusimtwe B Sl o
l‘.l.‘llvi'i.:i:x [ i
/4.9 i"sls:(‘i.'ic-:ﬁions e t\lb—_m . f - ; dministrative
104.17 — 104.12.3 t"";u Y E T T [Admindswative T
|invceng1t10n ; ! |
105.2.3 E; ime of oA Y l T 7 |Administraive
IApplication ;
¥#5.3.2 Extensions 7ﬁl: U i o 1 » | Ifid:llinistrative
| (}5.5 Dperational | = & ! R V|77 IA(lmInistmti\'c 3 y
ermits | i j !
105.5.55 [Autemohile " Skaarl Tl 5 s . . L Ndministrative e
l;\‘\frecb;%ns: Yards ( |
105.6 Construction e i 3 w1 & I\qumu ative
Fermils
105.6.25 hatomobile <] ) i D %xd:mnlsu.mvc
Pvrecking “fnrds_- . 1 . R k e )
[05.6.9 FuelCal | X | | [dminisrative
[25.6.42 buzardous X \dmiuvistrative
Materials ‘
105.17 [Plant Extraction | X Adwinistrative
(05,18 Private Fire X " |Administrative
Ij-lvdr.um
fG5.19 _i'smﬂki, Control | X 4 E ™ .H{ ‘,..".ii.:!-ii‘ilisiE‘:‘lii\’i'
}05.6.21 Bpectal Event ey . &3 "~ |Administrative
ﬂrucmm
{05.6.22 Epraying or N s [Administrative
Pipping
105.6.23 B randpipe ' . I;Adminisn'ﬂtive
hystonts i | L

Resolution No: 2022-10

23-1589 G 32 of 35



MOSQUITO FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT

Resolution No: 2022-10

. B4, RS,

2022 CFC Code Section ¥irke Adopted | Amended | fdtf_ef__ Deleted Finding
1(5.6.24 [Tents X - s f_;,\aimiuistrative
106.1 - 106.4 Construction X K : \dminisirative
Dogumuents |
107.1 Fees X _ i il TN i.kdmiui::tmtiw of Rl
107.5 [Related Fees ) . ‘ __:.jﬂx;i_aﬁ;ifr:xtifg_ A
107.5.1 !Cest Recavery A \IﬁA |Administrative
107.6 Refunds X Aabministrative
107.7 Administrative X o ‘ oy ‘—:_H- T Administrative
usts | !
Section 108 Inspections =% ..t 1 |Administrative -
Section 109 Maintenance x| 1T T Naministrative
1115 A ppeals [ iwrin i THE t_ A ;,'-\dm—i:—nsi‘rntivc a
112.4 Viokation 5 I T Admintstrative
Fenaltics i | 1
17241 Albatement of | |- —"““ ﬂdlt:i:ﬁé%rhth&: =
Violations | {
11242 o 1 N famimswatve
Section [13 siop Work ' i e —iA”_ " |Administrative
Order \
1134 Fatlure to TR T T U [Administrative
Comply l
m____.]...__n_ -
Section 114 Tinsafe X l T T dwindstrative
Structures | 1
2032 Definitions | X L Administrative R
Section 302 Definitions A '|'w & Administrative
Scetion 303 Asphall ketties | " \ - T AL AZ 23,81, B B3 B4,
: | ol
302.1 Definitions TR % Administrative
Section 304 ombustible I 8 T ] o A5, A2, Aﬂ"x Bi, 52, B3
Wuste [ 1 ,'P-h
e . N G R

23-1589 G 33 of 55



MOSQUITO FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT

1

2022 CFC Code Section Tifff Adopted | Amended | Added | Deleted Finding
[Section 305 l[gnition Sourees | X T Al, A2, A3, Bl, B2. B3. B4, BS,
B6
Seetion 306 Motion Pictare X 51, B2, B3, B4 85, B6
Section 307 Open Burning b AT, A2, A, BL BZ, B3, B4, BS,
130
307.4.4 " |Open Burninge | v % \1LAZ, A3, B1, B2, B3, 14, B5,
1o
Scetion 30 Cipen Flamaoes ;: i N | 1“t\2; .%3, B1, B;‘;. B3, B4, B.SJ
Ili!’l '
Section 309 Powered X IA1.A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, B5,
Industrixl IBG
[ravks oe. i ;
Section 310 Smoking RN hi. A2, A3, BI, B2. B3, B4, B5.
'!’ah
Section 31) Vacaot Prenises i Rk D Al A2, A3, B, BZ. B3, B4, BS,
30
Section 320 BD Printing B g ~[BI, B2. B3. B4, B3, B6
Scetion 321 Artificial il T 1 At Az.A3,BI. B2 B3. B4, B,
YVevetation | 6
403.2 — 403.2.4 gy, 1 %1 k. Al A2,A3, B, B2. B3. B4, BS,
110
403.6 - 403.6.1.4  |Group ¥ N N IA1, A2, A3, BI, B2. B3. B4, B3,
{B6 '
4039 -403.9,.3.4 kkr(rh:oup R E3 = S ;'n . A2, Aa,iﬂlﬁlllw_ﬁtl@‘i
[B6 ;
503.2.1 Dimensions | T & | |AL A2, A3 Bl B2. B3. B4, BS|
5 36 |
503.2.5 Dead Ends s Y A1, A2, A3, B, B2. B3. B4, B3,
- Bﬁ .
503.2.6 Bridges X | 1 [s1.A2.A3.BL. B2 B2, B4, B,
Bo
503.3.1 [No Parking - i o [\1. A2, A3.BI, B2. B3. B4, B35,
Fire Fanes 136
503.3.2 No Parking & 1 i = .;\i;m!iZ, Ad, Bi,_ﬁz B3. B4, BS,
Itre Hydrants 16

Lesofution Na: 2022 1

23-1589 G 34 of 55




MOSQUITO FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT

2022 CFC Code Section Title Ndmped | Amended | Added | Deleted ml"indr'ng

503.3.3 IFire Lane Width ; M |71.AZ,A3,BI1.B2. B3. B4.B5)

o '

503.6 Security Gatas S X \11,A2, A3, B1, B2, B3. B4, B5)

In \

505.1 Address o i S AL, A2, A3, Bl, B2. B3, B4, B5,
_, 136

507.5.1 Where Required | | N | Al, A2, A3, 11, B2, B3. B4, B3,

- Fire {ydrants . | 1) :

5003 Yire Control A “jr N Bi, B2. B3, B4, BS, B0 |

IRooms i | '

[807.5.2 Groupl | X| | | |BL,B2 B3 B4,B5,B6 |

903.2 Where Required N Al, A2, A3, Bl B2. B3. B4, B5)

— Fire Sprinklers il"fa I:

903.2.1.1 GrowpA | | X | | |A1,42,A%, 51,82 B3 B4,BS)

130

903.2.1.2 Group A2 | M oue Al A2, A3, Bl, BZ. B3. B4, B35/

1§48 J

903.2.1.3 CGroup A-3 x| | Int A2 A% BI, B2 B3, B4 B5)
B6

003.2.1.4 Grovp A-4 g =T 3= Al A2, A3, Bl, B2, B3. B4, BS
- e B6

003.2.3 Group I X \\1,AZ, A3, Bi,B2. B3. B4, BS

P S SR P [B6 |

903,24 Group -1 X AL AZ, A3, BL B2, B3, B4, 35)
M e

903.2.7  [CrewpM X T T T T IAL AL, A3, B, B2 B3, By, BS)
iB6

03.2.7.2 |Group M- e TR T T T T i, A2, A3, BIL B2, B3, B4, 36,
lﬁi:lllt'ussus - - " " L_" ‘[Bé

Resolution No: 2022-03

23-1589 G 35 of 55



MOSQUITO FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT

2022 CFC Code Section Title Adopted | Amended | Added Deleted Finding

003.2.8.5 Mapufactured 3 A1, A2, A3, B, B2, ‘

Homes B33, B4, BS, B6 g

003.2.9 Group S-1 X T |AL AZ.A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, BS|

B6 ]

[903.2.10 Group -2 =N = | |  ALALALEL BI B EiBS

B6 ;

003.2.10.1 Parking Garages o \1.AZ, A3, Bl B2. B3. B4, BS/

B6 !

003.2.22 fGrowpns | | TN AL A2,A3, BI, B2. B3. B4, B5|

16 {

003.2.23 T lGroup ¥z [~ T x| [Al.A2,A3.Bl, B2 B3. B4, BS,
856

903.6 Where Required | | % | AT, A2, 43, B1, B2. B3. B4, BS,
Fire Sprinllers '_H:‘v

907.2 7 [Where Required 3 N 1| |AlAz A3, Bl,B2. B3. B4,BS,
- Fire Alarm B6

Systcims |

907.2.1.4 GrewpA | | T a  iiL, A2 A3, BLBZ B B4, BS
36

007.2.23 ey 7T AT T 1AL Az, A3, B1, B2. B3, B4, BS)
86

907.2.3.11 Group B o N 1AL A2, A3, B1, B2, B3, B4, BS,
36

907.2.4.1 T Group -1 ST TN LA A5 BT, BE BY BA, B8

< 0 R N N O |

907.2.5.2 Group U N 141, A2, A3, BL, B2. B3, B4, 85,
{H1

007.2.6.6 Group 1 T T T AL, Az, A3, BIL B2, B3, B4, BS,
B6

967.2.7.2 Group &L | S S ¥ V37 AZ A3, BI, B2 B3, 04, BS,
A

007284 leresprel [T T YT AL, A2, A3, BY, B2 B3, B4, BS,
B

Resolution No: 2022-10

23-1589 G 3

6 of 55




o

MOSQUITO FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT

Resolution Mot 2022-10

2022 CFC Code Section]  Title Adopted | Amended | Added | Deleted Finding 3
|
|

907.2.9.4 Growp R-2, R- Fr {1, AZ, A3,B1,B2. B3. B4, 85,

2,1, 1-2.2 . (W . ¥y i
507.2.10.1 Group S N S X AL, A2, A3, B, B2. B3. B4, B3,
6 |

907.2.30 Type | Hoods : R P21, B2. B3. B4, BS, B6 i

907.6.5 Monitoring 1 x| | PBLE B BiLB5BS |

907.6.2.1 Secondary Power — | X |Al,AZ A3 BI, B2, B3. B4, B5)

Supply ‘; i
907.9 Where Required o | AL A2, A3, BL, B2. B3. B4, B5|
- Fire Alarm ' 86 |
Seetion 1101 senerad X i TR R ASHSL, 32. B3. B4, BS,
i‘.-.h i
Section 1102 Definitions g = Iv "_ T [NI.AZ A3 BL, 2. BA. B4, 5
o | O ST W |
1103.2 Responder N ‘ ilzu,n.:,m B1,B2. B3. B4, B3,
Conmpunication . ) —— e i“(i IR ‘
11035 - 1103.5.5 Sprinkler X IA1, AZ, A3, BI, B2. B3, B4,h5.‘.
Systenms | 136 {
1103.7 - 1103.7.9.10  [Fire Alarm B = E A1, A2, A3, B1,B2. B3. B4, Bs)
Systems 130 '
1103.8 - 1103.853  |Smoke Alarms =Y. ! L A2, A3, B1, B2, B3. Bd, BS,
B6
1103.9-1103.9.1  |Carhon .\*'#‘”" | e AL, AZ, A3, BL, B2, B3, B4, B3
Monoxide Bo
A Tarms
Section 1104 gross o “r. .t - Bi.B2. B3, BA, BS, B6 |
Seetion 1106 Outdovr ¢ _‘" ] I\1 A2, A3, B1,B2. B3. B4, 85
’)it'_);fcyntium _ i 3. - 36

1203.1.3 Enstaliation -| ' % | AT, A2, AR B, BI. B3. 34

|26

13113 Address | r =1 LA 1. AZ, A3, BI, B2, B3. B4, BS,

ps_

31313.1 Whin Required - TR L T T T, A A3, B, B2 BA. B4, BS,

Water Supply 30 |

23-1589 G 37 of 55




MOSQUITO FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT

2022 CEC Code Section

Titie Adopted | Amended | Added | Deleted Finding
5001.7 E;iubility for Ix Administrative '
ANAZCS % N S r i |
5601.2 {Permit Requuu] iy S i __Administrative ]
5704.2.9.6.1 |Loeations — X I\1,A2, A3, BL, BZ. B3. B4, BS.
lAlmw. Ground |::L
' anks - p—, [
5706.2.4.4 Locations - X ]H, AZ, A3, BI, B2, B3. B4, B3,
Above Ground |
T auks N B .
B306.2 Limitations R ] ik :.\i A2 Ai,_Bl,f}Z, B3. B4, B3,
. Y " 86 |
6104.2 Maxinmm X Al, A2, A3, B}, B2, B3. B4, B5,|
€Capacity | 1: 16 '
Chapter §0 TReferenced x| T AT AZ AT BI. L B3, B, 55)
Standards | | Ii':h i
Appendix B Firc Flow - | Nl - " |AlL, A2, A3, B1, B2. B3. B4, BS,
I'able B105.1 (1) Residential 3 36
Appeadix B Fire Flow - | l = 1,42, 43, B1,B2. B3. B4, B3]
Table B105.2 Cotinmercial - T B 136 {
Appendix T Fire Apparatus X l"x?, AZ, A? B1, B2. B3. B4, B5,
|Access Roads e
Appendix D, (Access Boad LT #5 . Pl’ AZ,-}XS, B, B2. B3. B4, Bﬁ,‘
D103.1 [Width 826 ;
appendis D,  lGrade R e 1AL A2, A3, B, B2, B3. B4, BS,
3103.2 36
Appendix D, " Purning Radius "X [ [ iA1, A2,A3,B1,.B2 B3 Bd,B5)
D103.3 z6
Appendix D, TGates X Al,AZ,Al, Bl, B2. B3, B, B3,
103.5 WY
k.a\ppcmlix D, fFire Lane . -4 '—;("— T 3!_112 Ad, Bf,_BZ. FE; B—:ﬂ
D103.6.1 [Marking 36
IAppendix D, [hw Lane ) X 5«1.;\:, A3, Bl, B2 B3. B4, 8BS,
iﬁlﬂlﬁ.z Marking - 136
lAppum‘lix D, ‘(.‘ircumtcrcmini £ 1 iA1,A2,A3,Bl, B2, B3. B4, ES,
D 104.4 Fire Aveess {130

Rosolution No: 2022-10

23-1589 G 38

of 55




St

B s i i

.

B L

EDHCWD, DSP, ECF, CPCSD, FFFD, RFPD MFPD

d d

1011 Amend wilh the name of the jursdiction Locally adopted and amended Administzalive need
Amend 10 Inclucte addiion of Automobile Wreddng -
108.5 Yard operational pemil Locally adoptedand amended | Adminisilive need due ke addiion of section 105.5.55.
Allows the fire code official to enforss bhe fire code {apecilic
. " fo firg aceass, vegelalion clearances, hazardous malerials,
105,655 i R I opctptaml Locally cratted and adogled | ) wilin auomobe wrecking yard ogerations. This was
9 ' adamanstrated nead axpatienced vilhin the Dizmond
Spiings Fire Depariment,
Add section (0 require construction permyl for Adminisirative need due lo addilion of secion 105,6.25 and
1055 |Aulomobile Wrecking Yards. Localy created and adoplad |55 95
Allows the fire code official fo enforee (ha fire code (spadiic
Add seclion lo requite eonsiurction permil for {o fite acgess, vegatation clesrances, hazardous matedals,
eA<0 Aviomobile Wrecking Yards, Locallycreated andadapled | oy i naly consioucted andior madied autamabile
wrecking yard operalions..
 Allows he fire code official ta review and approved Inaific
. calming devices pror Lo Installafon. Fire Gode tureplly
106626 ﬁhﬁmﬁmﬁﬁ“‘“gm:‘m”“ e Lacaly cealed and adopled [ permits the e code offial o regulate traifc calng
g devices. Howaver, a permit st cuaenlly reguiced piar fo
installation causieg unchro hardship lo
Adopling this setlion fo atlow for the crealion and Issuance
- lof Tees to cover aclual costs. Section 105.5 deflines permils,
107.5 Setlion Auded. Previously seclion06.6. Lacaty adopied and amendud ian chiecks, and Inspeciions 25 aliowed in Healh &Salely
Code 17951,
107.54 Section added. Praviously seciion 106.8.1 Loty et s aigtay [ YOI Goc Fecovery et T tesgnor b oot
the Fire Dislrict,
; Settion 107.F Torecover the achml costs of avoidable
w2 ls;diun added. Praviousty sextion 106.7 Locally ereated and adopled failed inspectons by contraclors.
Section 111.5af Chaptec % of the Fira Code of the Dislicl s
added 1o fead as follows:
411.5 Appeal Procadures and Timelines: Theintent of Ihis
provision is lo clarffy e pagaedures and Fmedines foran
115 Seclion added. Previously section 100.4 Locally adopled andamendzd  [individual or enity to fife 2n appealtodhe Buand afAppesls
1egarding an order, dacision, ot detarminaiion by the Fire
Code Official. Based on the Gounly of i Dorado's
Vegelalion Management Ondinance Board of Appeals'
meline,
Previously secfion 110.4, Complvied the seclion by ‘;L‘f:;"‘l;;": f:"m;?g“f; ;Z f“’:f‘;ee"‘:m"m‘f":: fhes
1i24 fiing i the bianK portons Ihat were pol comgleted Locally adopted and amended malch the fees 2nd panalias as desmed appiopdale by he
by Uhe SFM. ILis ballsr R ioiucai_iﬁas lodelerming Disiot Aflomey's Ofice. The change to 1he langusge fo
Ihe [eesfpenaliies for Ihel respetiive arpas inchide thietartt infraclions.
112.4.2 Clisfions is added lo read as fallows: 112.4.2
Cilalions
The Fite Chiaf ar histher duly authofized represantative{s),
" x tmay fssue cllations fof infraclions or misdemeanor
1242 Seclion added. Previoulsy section 1104, Locally created and adopted vlolalons of this code pirsuant Lo Section 13874 of the
Hoalth and Sefely Code of he Blale of Caklomia.and
Chapler 5¢ (commencing wilh seclion 853.6) of Tille of
Pait 2 of the Penal Code of the State of Callamia,
Previously sectlon 1124, Completed Iheseclion by
filing in the blank porlions that were not compleled ”
1104 3 the BFM, s bellerlehto ncalies o il dipd i | [PNOMGAei e sote s ean omsifiiled inves

delertine the fessipanalites for thelr raspective

Section 112.4 1o inclrde The panallies for violations,

23-1589 G 39 of 55




e e A i OB . Mt e b SR i e

in o 3 et i bt

 Addad definitfons for: Campfire, Drivaway, Distrizt,
Execuiive Body, Fre Chief. Fite Hazard, Open Buming, and

202 N Added definitons for ctarily Lacally created and adopted Traked Crowd Manager. Definttion of apen buming shalt
nod inglude residentlal LPG, nalwral gas fueted, or wooed
buming appliances nor ¢2remenial buming.

3021 N | Addad definltion of campére to Seciion Locally crealed end adopted Added definition for cladly.
e B Sochen o e braton s Lo e bigh i danger that exisis in Bl Dorado Coury
Y b Language clified fum camplie 1o apen L Locally created and adopled 'wa have willlen mora sidngeni rules pariaining to open fres
emonmass B scope of opae buriing hin grass, brush, and tree covered areas,
jrenuiements.
Provides tha srealion ol a floot pfan for the. purpose of
Added seciion lo raquire pre-fire plans for new
40.21 N antior modifed constniction. Locally cragled and adoplad xﬂc&r planning lo he uized by amergency respanse
Fira apparalus are hecaming largerand lafler. A veriical
cleazance of 15 feal srovides proper ciearanes for
apparalus fo pass undar withaut damaging apparalus
comppients, jLalso allows an extended time rame befoce
having lo recut hagronth of the vegetation, Additlana)
60321 N %T:g?:;?::: slanamiee 1o fhfeet o e Latslly adopled and amanded  [kelght forvegelaFon clearances acls as an incrtased bufler
for We spraad of fire. A road width of 20 Jeel exclusive of
shouldars, 25 measured faca of cuiblo face of curb I
ngeded. Thesesimclures can be diicult o navigate with
fire apparalus and shouid not be counted tn Le tolal
diivable read suface,
Added 3 specilic seclion far R3's where Italows the iy ﬁhﬁ?ﬂgﬁssgnmgﬂmmm
50325 N mehg“::;"d m;:mfx:d?gﬁ:?:s ':m“s Lacaty adepled and amended neludas fire vehicles as well as civillan vehicles. Provides
cess mdiﬁ e o hetter access for lngressiegress. Addionally, adds tum
i around forapparatus in driveviays qrealer lhan 150,
Allows codes and statidards for Bridges and Elevaled
Chunged the sectionfor Bidges and Bevaled Swifacas of F Dorado County and Appendix Dof lhe
{Suifaces lo siate and match El Derado Gounly czmrent Fire Code, whichever {s mare reslricive, to be
SaEh i Transportation Divisionia addiion 1o AASHTD MB- Locally adopted and amended consistant thraughout county agencles and is alowed a5 an
77 (minimbm CFC raqulred) lermats means & melhad it is not lessrestiviive than
Ihe Fire Code,
Previowsly secfon 503.4.2, Added secflon ragarding This section clearfy defines the "No Pasklng in Fire Lanes”
kA N duoparktngin e lanes Locally crealed and adopted. |, jo a1 consistantvih the Calfomia Veie Code,
" " This secllun cleady defines the *No Parking in fronl of fire
Previously section §03.4.3, Added seclian regarding 7 : 2 .
50322 N noparking i font of bydranls Locally Greated and adopled léﬂ:ms rwles and is consistant with (he Calfomia Vehicle
’ " . Hits secilon vleanly defines Callfornia Fire Code Appendix D
Previously section 503.4.4. Added section ragarding|
603.3.3 N i lenes based ar road wAdIh Loezly created and adopled :;sn':: raferance for road lane widih and thelecelation o fre
Eiotol sl A3, st an Eccpged Altows fire gishicls (he aulhonfy to appiove gales on
503.8 lo maintain emergency access and e basad on e Eishicty ks sandm, oy
5036 N sistercy Usough o roadway gales!n Bl Dorado | Locally oreated and adapled 1hembesl g mgss ,omwn"fw g
Caunly, refeniag to the gele standards adopled by :ﬁm gency
the FPOS Rl
|Added section pettaining lo the vieval addressing of | Aflaws fire disircls the authadly to approve addressing
St N Bukings Locally adopted end amended {00 e Diskicps addressing standands.
Commearcial propaties are required Io inslall hydmnls at
Added more consepvaliveslandard for (he .
507.5.1 N placemant of bydsants and thelr relzlonshla ko Locallyadopled and amended 300 aotnlervats, s they should sever be outside af 150

commescial buiidings

fect from any given fiydrant al anylime (half Ihe distante
inhebseen).

23-1589 G 40 of 55



i o B 4 B TS S R

PO

S G S

£93

Added vatbiage b biing el of the necessaty five
canirols for a Wilding fo one location

Logally crealed and adopled

Bulidings ate getling mere sizable in he counly. iis more
commen Lo have new buildings with soler amays fral
ronfue to genermte powar even when fie buildings
genetal ulilides tave beea shulaff, When thetels an
emengency, it s vial iat we fiave rapid access lo afl of the
irtls In one location for putile evacualionand firefighter
safely, Due lo ihe fira danger presentin El Derade Counly
ibsoughoul mest of the vear, Ihis change Ts approprite and
dvisatile,

510,423

Emergenty Responder Rade Sysiem Secondary
Povrer Supply Modificallon

Locally adopted and amendad

Amend lo 72 hour capacity far back-up power due to
wealher and PGAE safely relalet pover oulages.

9032

Adds a requiremant forsprinkler syslem installalion
i new bujidings and struclures 3,600 square feat or
graater wiihin the distict

Locaflyadapted 2nd amended

Administralive need due lo addition of section 903.2.22 and
903.2.23.

903.2.14

|Praviously seciion $64.2.1. Adds a ragquirement for
spiittkler sysiem hnstallation in new Group A
buildings and stuclureg 3,600 squace (et or
greater wilkdn ihe disiict

Losslly adopled and amended

D 1o the wpographic, dimatic, and geogaphic condifors
of £1 Darado Counly and elr conlribuling factors lo our
increased respensa times, along with the fact that fires
double In size each and every mintte, we requie spinkiers
o be Installed in strucluies ance they reach 3,60 square
Tt i size a6 they relate to Fre behavior and @te of

spraad,

4r3.2.4.2

Previously section 903.2.1. Adds a requirement for
sminkler systern Instaltatlon in pew Group A1
bulldings and steictures 3,800 squae feet or
greater wihin Lhe district

Locally adopted and amended

Due fo the lopographi, limaliz, 2nd geographl: conditions
of B! Darado Counly and thelr contibuling Faglors 16 cur
increased rasponse imes, along lh the fact thal fros
double In size each and every miwle, we ragulie spinklers
to be installed in struclures once they reach 3,600 snuare
Toel in size as (hey relete 1o fire behavior and fata of
spread,

903253

Previousty section 903,2.1. Adds a requicement for

inklar systom insialiation n new Group A2
buildings and slwelvses 3,600 square felar
gieates vt the distict

Lecally adopled and amsnded

Dug o the topagrapkie, climallc, avd geographic conditions
of E1 Drocado County and thelr conldbuling factors lo our
cisased response limes, along with e lach thal fires
daible In size onch and every midute, we requira sprinkiers
o be Instaked in starclutes ance thay reach 3.600 sqrare
{eet In slze as they refate ta fite behaviorand rte of
spread,

03244

Praviously secilon 503.2.1. Adds a requirement for
spiinkler sysiem Installation in new Geoup A2
buiidings and sinctures 3,600 square faet of
geeatervrithin the distict

Lacaity adopled and amended

Tua {0 Lhe fopagraphie, elimallc, and geographk: condifons
of £l Barado County and [heir canlrbuting factoes to our
increased response fimes, glangwith the faeithat fires
double tn size each and evary minute, we require sprinklers
to be instailed Instuciures once they teath 3,600 squere
[eetin size as thay relale fo fite behavior and mle of
spread,

803.23

Previously setfon 903.2.3. Adds a requirement for
sprinkier syslom insiatation in new Group E
bulloings and structures 3,600 square feal oF
greater vilhin the dlsldgt

Lacally adopled and amendad

Due to tha topographic, cmalks, and geographic condilisns

of Et Dorado County and thefr confriuiing faclors o our
icmased responte Imes, afong will iha fac! hatilies
double [n size each and every minle, we require sprinklers
to beinstalledinshuciures once hey reach 3,600 square
foet in size as they rakale o fite behavior and rate of
spread,

903.24

Adds a raquirement for speinidar systam instalafion
in nev Group F insldings and stachses 3,600
sqpare festor greatar withla The disidct

Locatly adopted and amended

Bie to lhe lopographic, climatic, and geograpiic condlllons
of £ Dorado County and Mrelr contdbuting factors fo aur
inereased response {iwes, ajong with the fact thal fres
doubte i size each 2nd every minule, we require spfinkiars
to be inslalled In struclumsancs thay veach 3,500 aquare
festin size as they rlete Yo fire hehavior and ele of

pread,

03.27

Aokis a tequirement for spiinkler system inglatalian
In nEw Growp M buikdings and sluctures 3,600
surare feet o grealer viliin the disiicl

Locaty adogled end amended

Due o the fopographic, climatls, and geographic candifons
of El Dorade Counly and their sonldbuling faciors b our
increased response Himes, along with the faet that fres
double In size each and avery minute, we require spinklers
toba inslalled In siroclvas onca they reach 3,600 squate
fest i size as lhey refale 1o (e behavior and rale of
spread.

23-1589 G 41 of 65




Previously seclion 903,2.7. Adds a requirement for
sprwikler system instaiialion b new Group M with

Dus o he topagraphic, chmatic, and geographic condifions
f E1 0orado County 20d thelr contribiting factors o cur
increazad respoase limes, along with the facl that fires

903.27.2 N Upholstered Fumilure o Matlresses buildings and Locallyadopled and amended  {doublein $ze each and every minule, we requive sprnkless
siruclores 3.600 square feel or grezter within lhe 10 ba Inslalled in stsciures once Ihey seach 3,600 square
district feat in size as they relale fo fire behavior and rafe of

Manulaciured Homaes — The infent of this code seclinn{s fo
ansure thal manulaclured homes that serve s a one o o4
family dwellings are consistent wilh the provigions found i
. GRC Setlion 313 pedaining fo built dwellings of a similar
: . nalure. Manufactured homes placed hn the wildlard-uiben
Previourly secon 603.2.8.2.This secion s interface have a helghtened rish of apldfre consumpBon
903.2.0.5 N mgledln include manufaglured residential single Looally adopled and amendad 40e {0 10 lightweight nalure ofthelr canstiuclion, The
{amily R-3 In he tesidentiat sprinker progtam. rapid fire spread yavghout hes Stuciures presents a
significanl sk 1o thefroccupants. Residenilal
syslems have been incomorated fo dacrease thls risk
successfully Inmany Califamia communilles,
Due {othe loprgrplle, eﬂma_ue. and gecgraphic conditions
[Pieviouslyseclion 03.2.9, Adds a requiremenl for mﬁmﬁm mﬂ"?ﬁ mm“
0329 LI oo o s Localyadopted and amended |double in size each and every mintle, we fequite sgrnklers
m‘:fmmmiim' s 10 be nstelled i srushires once they deach 3300 square
feet kn size as Liey relale to fire behavior and rate of
spread.
Oue to 1he lopographic, cimalis, and gengraphic condilions
Previgusly seellan 903.2. Adds a requiremant foc wmtmﬁh:g::m““ﬁﬂ da n::‘:l !;;':su:
203.2.40 N b’f"z‘:‘r”"‘a’:f“ "“""';"gg““‘””’gﬁz Locally sdopled andamended  [doublen size eachand every minute, we fequlfe spriniders
mm‘ an: e"“d". ‘m‘.;' e o be Installed In sirictuses nce they reach 3,600 square
e feelin size a3 they relzte to ire hehavior 2nd rmle of
spread,
Due o the topographic, climatic, and geographic condiians
Previously sactlon §03.2.10, Addsa requiremen fo mﬂggmﬁgﬁ?ﬁ:&?ﬁ:ﬁ:ﬁ ‘M“ " ;"::'
agaz 104 N mg’"“m '"‘."““"“’;f: ;’“"‘mm";";;:[ Locall adopledand amended  {double it size each ard every minule, wé fequlie spraklers
mmm“':?""‘“'t m’“‘uww ' (o b inslalted In sfruckues once fhey resch 3,800 square
feet In size as they refate to firo behavior and rale of
spread.
Due tothe lopographic; cEmaiic, and geographic conditions
- Ef Dorado County and thelr canvibuliag faclors e our
:’;:’:;[r sﬂ?ﬁi{:‘u&?ﬂm m"&gmm fos ncreased respanse fimes, along with the fact that fires
903222 N bﬂ“ e a‘:mu b it re; A Locally adopladand amended  {double in size each and evesyminule, we requita sprioklers
gmﬂe? skl 9 Io ba instaltedn slructurez once they reach 3,600 square
feel in sizn as ey selate Io fire behavior ard rale of
spread.
Due to {he lopagraphic, eimalle, and geographic sondillans
; af El Dorado County and their conlibuting facltors to our
oy e st o

903223 B e e A0 r m‘:, o Lovalyadopled and amended  |double bn size each and every minule, we fequke sprinkders
. aia?fvithh el il l0 be Instalied in stnuglures onze they reach 3,800 square
g feelin size as they relate lo firebehavior and rale of
Pravicusly section 503.2a, Adds a requimeat o Due 1o he lopographic. dimatic, and geographic conditions
Instalf sprinkless foreaisling buidings Ihaf undergo of & Darado County and their cantribuling faclors fo our
a change in vse of grealer iizard or an increase in response imes, along with the facl thal fires

9036 Y stre grealer (han 500 square featand the rosulling Locally ¢reated and adapted idouble in size sath and evary minule, we require sprinklers

square faet s greater (fian 3,600 square feel,
Praviously appHied lo addltion of more than 30% of
1,000 square feel.

o beinstalled in sluctures orce they reach 3,600 sqpare
Teatin size as they relale lofire behaviar andrate of
spread.

23-1589 G 42 of 55




i Bifom i abet o £

o

Adds @ sequinament for fro 2iarm system

a07.2 nsiallation in now bulkings and sinclures 3,600 Locally adapted and amended  jAdminisirative noed dus to addition of seciion 903.2.30.
|snquare feat or Jess within the distrct
Praviously saclion 907.2a. Atded otcupanl
"M'm[m":h”l?:;u" Group .ﬁnbu:gmwima Provitles propaer emetgency nollfication for aecypancios that
w244 fioor drea less than 3800, excapAR3, AG balldings ) | o oo and adoplodd  fallow puiblc use and ensues Fite Depariment natfication in
vot used for commerdal purposes, and bulidings ihe eventol a firo of STIOKE.
with 2 flos area of tess than 500 square feel as
appoved by the fire cude officiat
|Peasinusly soction 907.2a, Added occipart
pnotechion for fice alamns in Group B buddingawith a :
907223 fioor arealess than 3,600, except R3, AG bulidings Loca Puovddas proper emefgency nolificaton for accupancies M
2.2, s v created and adopled alfove pubflc use and easures Fire Deparimeat notification in
notused for commercial putposes, and buitdings ho event of a ire opsmoka.
|witt & foararea of fess thart 600 euare featos
appioved by the (i code official
Previously section 907.22, Added eoovpant
};mwb:gg: ?“;‘Em ws&gﬁaﬁha Provitles proper emengency nalificalin for eaupancies Wat
807.23.11 oare 93,600, except R3, AG UGS |\ oo oot anc adoptes {Biow pulbks e and ensures Fie Depariment noiicalien In
notused for cammerclal purposes, and buildings lihe event of a fire o ot
wilh a floor area of jees (han 600 square féel a5 .
approved by the firo code official
Previously section 947,2a, Addéd actupant
protestion for fire afams [n Group F bulldings with 4 ;
foor area 1953 lhan 3,500, except R, AG bulldlags Prayidas proper emérgeacy noilication far uccupanciss that
07241 ol used for oommercia a0 b Lesally ereated and adopled aliow public use and ensures Firg Depariment nailication n
2B puposes, g ’lhe evenl of a T o smotie,
with a floorarea of [ess then 500 squarefeel a5
approved by the fira code officll
Previously section 907,23, Added otigant
peolacilon for fire alams bh Group Hbuldingswith ouides .
proper amergency nofification for ottupancies thal
507,252 2 Ui Area B8 Ui 807, w4 Localy ciealad andadopled  [allow public use arel ensutes Fire Ospariment notifealionin
budings not used for commerclal purpases, aod the even ol a freor smoke,
buidings with a floor area of less than 500 square
feet as approved by ihe fiie code official
Previously seclion 907.2a. Added oocupan
proleckon for fire elarms in Grup | buﬂdhps_wlh a Proviles poper emesgency nolificallon for Tos that
72468 area feas than 3‘.&%‘ exc2pL3, AG buikdings Locally crealed and adopted allow/ public Use &nd ensures Fire Deparimen! aolfisalionin
notused for commescial pupasas, and bulldings \he event af a fre of smoee.
wilh a foar area of less (han 600 squarofeel as
approved by the Nia code afficial
Praviously seciion 9072, Added vecupanl
puutedlon ﬁ:lrB fire ;larms li;'lcl(s«:u.u M mll:ggs wilh Pravides proper emergency naiifcalion or accupancies Ihat
§07.2.7.2 A 5001 G875 et 380, excent RS, Locally created and adopled allov public use and ensuras Flre Dapariment notificalion in
butdings nol used for commerclal purposes, and \he event of a e arEmake,
buiings with a floor area of 1ess than 580 square
fael as approved by the fire codfe offickat
Praviousiy secllon 907,23, Added occupanl
pratechion for fire afams it Group R-1 buikings Provides -
praper emergancy noliflcation fos occupencies that
q07.2.84 il a flocr oy fess that 3,500, @vcapl R, AG Localy cregted and adepled allow publle: use and easures Fire Depariment noffication in

buifdings wot sed for commercll purpases, and
buikiings vt & floor atea of tess than 500 square
fast as approved by the fire code official

e evenlof a fire or smoke,

23-1589 G 43 of 55




i e e e e e

e oms i s e e e

Praviougly secfion 907.2a. Added accupanl

protecion for Gre atamms in Group R2, R-2.1, and R

2.2 billiags with & fioor area fess than 3,500,

Provides propar emesnency noflfication foraccupanches thal

37294 N except R3, AG bulldings fot used for cammercial Loesly created and adoplad allaw public use and ensuses Fie Department notifiealian in
purposes, and uidings wilia Roor area af less the avenl of a fite or smoke.
firem SO0 squate fee) as approved by the fire cade
oificlal
Praviously sectien 407.2a. Added otcupant
mﬁggjﬁiﬂ&m 3&:‘; :;‘f;";ﬁ;i;: Provides praper amergency Roticalion for occupandies that
0er.2,101 N s for .‘ : > d bl Locally created and adopled aow piblic use and ensures Fite Department nolificallon ln
TORRRO(E) uposes, and DURUngs thoaventof s e arsmoke,
with 2 Roor ares of [ess [kan 500 square feel as
appraved by tha fire coda ofiicdal
mm?p?mﬁmmt Provides proper emergency nolifisalion for ogcupancies that
907,230 N ratind 1o 4 monkbred fenalaiin systan vhEn Logally cresled and adopied aliow publle bse and enswes Fire Deparimant nolificalion fn
Installed or rsplaced ¥ e evanl of a fire or smoke,
Provides properiesposse and mainlemanca "wenkr sewvke”
f firg alarm systems, NFPA 72 speclfies required response
times for fire alam lrauble and supenvisary signals lo
" ensure Systems remain operational. A Type A UL listed
o765 i o obo momfloed byUL { ¢ o cooaleqand adopted  |coniral stolion mesis the MFPA reguired fre-alamm response
e 2 g ar aperslional fire elatmt System at sl imes,
ULType A listing requiras ceniral stailans {0 pravide tis
‘wnner senvice” or condrac! with another entity fo provide
L5 senica ta abtain the listing,
Pdmary Seoondany Alorm Power Supply | Amend 1o 72 hour capacily for hack-up power due 10
s el N Noditeation Locallyorealed and adopled 1 oor 204 PGXE sately relaled pasvaroulages,
Praviously section 907.2b, Added occupant
protaction for exisling bulldisgs without automalio Provides ropa; emenyency aotificalion for occupancies that
gor8 N sorinkler syslems 1o jnslall d firs alaom i they add Locally wrealedarid adopled allow public use and ensives Flra Depanment notiflcaliondn
more thap 30% ar 1,000 souare feet to the Ihe evenlof a fira orsmoke,
structere, whicheveris less
IThIS seclion addsa Stunl Trp powes shuloff devices o
120313 N Shunt rip povrer safely devices Locally adopled and amendsd  fensure emergency powesshut offduring the use of back-up
powsr Supples.
Previously seclion 3310 Addiess requirements for | Adifrassing lor constittelion siles is iImporfent te assis
B3 N constmaction Sies Loraty crealed and adopled responding emecgancy crees.
Previousy section 2312, Waler supplies at ater must he on site;prior o comivisTile material being
A N conslruelion Siles wilh combustible maletials an-slle Yuraly adoptec s amfasd stored orvartical construclion commencing.
. tazardnus malenats related incidents any cosly o mltinale.
A s husi
0017 Y pmi?;;ﬁ:fggeﬂ:mrﬁ?;:m;mmm Lacally created and adopted I the ieldentis cuised by neglgence due loa
| will cause 2 cast recovary foe pratessor practice the aclual cost will be passed on fa the
negligent parlles,
| Auddad safaly praloction Wi persiis being issued
by btk the Fire Cilef and Sherlis Depariment for Alous aponcies Lk peed ko krow ahod, explosiies sud
§o0t.2 N Josi X Lecally adopted and smended | fireworks to apgrova themand kave a clear understanding
NS, 24 e Firs Colet e oy of of the appitcations of how ey il be used
Supenisars for frewoks :
Esjablished Fmits as required by the Fire Cade for Class !
(lammabla and Class Heombustibie lquid slorage In above-
5704,2.96.1 N Established imits as set {oh In the Fire Code Lacaty adopted ard amendad qround tanks, Requies AHJ approvatand a
SpecialiCondifional Use Pemmit from the Counly,
Established Wmits a3 taquited by the Fire Code for Class |
5706244 N |estabisned timits s selfoh inthe Fie Cade Localy sdoplad andamended [12F7Reabla and Class I combuaPbie lquld spocil

uperations in above-ground tanks. Requies AHJ apgigval
ni 2 SpeckiCondiional Use Pamil frott the County.

23-1589 G 44 of 55



e R S i 1

SRR S

s o e b B e e R

8006,2

Adminisliativeaddition ol Distdcl name.
Esiatiishad lmits 25 sel fudh in he Fira Code

Locally adopled and amended

| Adeintslrative need lo add Disict nemo, Eslablished fmils
5 sequirad by tha Flra Code Ofiic! for Flammable
antc fids in statlonary contaners. Requires AHJ
annroval and a SpeclalfCondiviona) Use Pesmit from the
County.

61042

Estgblisked limiis for LPG storage anddispensing
near or adjacent (o residential develgpment

Lacally adoplad and amended

Estabishes distances between LPG stomge and
spensarestfhat aredirechy related lo sataly for residential
mpments and Nigh-densiiyholets, motels, apasimets,
alc. whare 2 nlease by leak or explosion of LP-Gas veould
hava 2 high probataly of injury, inhatalion, or dealh.
Ruquites AHJ approval and a SpeclaliCondianat Yse
Pennil from the Conty.

Chaplat80, MFEA, 1-
22

Ocovides fre access and clearante to piopery fnes
for Aulamabile Wrecking Yards.

Lotally weated sad adopled

Dismantied 2nd slored vabicles praseat significant fire foads
(ballaries, llammabla and combushible liquids, upholstery.
el¢.) and sk lo vegetation and adjacent propesfes, This
|requirement provides fire access and dearnce fo
vagatation in aulprobile wheeking yard opesstions o ald in
fireflghting operallons ard reduction of fire extension o
adjacent proparties andfor open kands.

Chaples &0, NEPA,
13016

NFPA 130-16 ol Chapier B0 of the Fire Code of lhe
Disiriel has toon amended toypdale vaidous
provislans peraining lo the Instatlakion of sprnkler
5 in one and hea-fzmlly tweflings

Lagglly adopted and smended

Amanded lo indlude on-site sprinkler feads and wrench on-
sila for emergen rapalrs, the inclusion of o Jocal wallet flow
alam 1o create anaudiblo alert for the fowalwalerin the
event of waler activation it a vacant stuciu@, and
hydrostalic osting requirzments to assure propar 130
srlnkier system inslaltaton decreasing the dsk of water
tamage from pipefallure. Passive purge reqviemenls
wiare also added to ensure waler dircylation through the
systam, redycing stagaant waler and hackfiow concems
|EID encourages this type of system).

Appendix 3 Tablo
B105.1(1}

Changed 500 GPM lo 1,000 GPM in mafor
subdivisions batow 5000 foot elevalian, to match
fira Row precedents used in EDC for yaais

Locally adopled and amended

Allows ys lomaich what developers and tesidenls are used
t0 in regands lo GPM ke Row requirements (hal have been
used fof over a decade In EDC. Ako provides a minimum
tave] of available water for firafighting purposas [n the event
of ouse lo house, hoise to vegetalion, adn/ervegetatrion
to hovse ignition,

Appandix B: Table
Bl05.2

Estabilshed a minimum requirsmentof 1,500 GPM,
betow 5000 faal efavalion, for all commercial
prefects

Lceafly adopled and amended

Allews us 1o malch what developers and residents are used
toin regands lo GPM fire fow sequirements Nt have besa
uged for overa decade n ERC.

AppendixD: D103

Addad an exceplion for residential driveweys

Losaky adopted and amended

It is unreasanable o tequice a residentlal diveway lo
constucta 26 fool wics space for aceess toa hydeant,

Amended lo mest Stale law of grades no greater

Tille 14 requires us 1o only accept up fo 16% divaways,
any axcepiions would requite approval by the AR, In aur €L

AR O; 032 than16% vithin Witdland Wban intestace, Locally adopled and amecied Dorado County Thle 14 adaplion we aliowgraater ihaa 16%
{graxdde with AH appeaval and hard sudface,
2 20 fool soad wilths shall nol induda curbs and guilers dua
Appendix D: D103.3 | Addad text 1o intlude curks and gutlers Lacafly adopled and amended ‘lﬂ oozl gecoss feses 2nd Loming FAdlus Cancems.
: Whate fire apparatus access mads consist of a dividad
Appentin D; DI035 ;e#g?n:gmxgvﬁzmmnwmm Lecaliy adopledandamended  |soadway the gate widl sl nol e legs than 15 fegt due 1o
i [apnaratus huning s,
He parking on roads allowed oo roadways less than 28 Feot
Appandi D: 103.6.1 Ruatl widths 20 to 28 feel hnatyaoghudalonendid) (IS8 sbore SCID k. Louie ian WO AL i S

riat apply. This sectlon [s adoplad as it stands In the Fire
Gode Appendlx D section 193.6,1 for all other elevations.

23-1589 G 45 of 55



Patking on one side onlyon toads from 28 feet (o 36 Teel
. This is not ragured less than 5000 fast of
AppendixD: D1036.2 mfjmm then29 feetbutless han36 |\ oy dogied andamended  Jelevation. Lower then 5000 feet his does notapply. Th
is adopled 95 it s1ands Inthe Fire Code Appentix D
clion 103,8,2 for ¥ ofher elevalions.
n requited by the Tire code official, a fire apparaies
Added to requite circumferenllal fire apparalus arcass road shll be construcled to encompass the entite
A E Dyt aceessoats T and shaprovidea continuous mesns of
mesgencyvehicle accass,
Adopted with no Amendments
1014 thiough 1015 m”“““"“mmm“ Locsly adopted dministrative clary
102.1 through 102,12 Relerences, suljecls nal regufaled by the Code LoczRy adopled Adminiziealive clarity
1::'_@;“" Aty to enforce the code Localy adopled Admirstralive ciafly
:g';_::‘"g“ Time lisfalon of appliealion Lacaly adopted Adinisative tarly
ol =
1061 tousgh 1064 mnd |;;Bmms?wﬁswmmm Localy adopled e schedules for pemis
107.1 trough 102.8 ““ﬁg’;’;f,ﬂmm“‘“m claty ard Localy adopterd nspection authorly
A IMafntenance of salegwards, esing and operatian of
1031 thvough 1095 gg“g;%'g‘i;‘;‘::;’“g:;‘::‘“‘am Sy and Locsily adapled etulament, re-nspecion and testing, ecordaaping,
0 supenvision, rendering stuipment inoparable, avercrowding,
Adopted this seclion for administraliye cladly and
113 s avd e solely nspeciions Locafly adopled Ehpm order.
4.1 vough 147 e :;fz‘;;:y’?;s’;;fx"“""’ Sloeky and Locally adopted Unsale strutlures or equipment,
Asphalt kelles conlain highly fammable subslances and
iequire siingert safeguards. Managing ignition sources
304 through 308.8 Adopted this seclion for fire and lfe salety Localiy adoplad |mrough responsibte zppication of standards will mduce the
numberof fres [n various selfings. {Climallc, geological,
and topegraphicaf).
Gonharal requirements retaling to smoking. Vacant premises
condllion and salely requiiements, abandoned premises,
¥ 4 Adooted (enant spaces, sefeguarding vacan! premises, secwily, lire
iy wovphe 3t b ST ko o o et 1y Lacilty dopted proteciion, fire saparafion, removal of cambusibies,
removal of hazardous meterials. (Climatic, peologleal, and
lopogeaphical].
General requirements for roads, lunnels, and bridges.
323. ca
231 Adopled s section for fire and lile salely Locally adopted climstic, geological, and phical.
Provides evacuatian drills foe hazardous snd inslitpiional
1403.6 lhiough 403,78 Adopled this seciion for fire and ife salety Loeally adopted ecupancles {ocewpancies with increased palential for jife
L
e Providas evacuetion diills for haletimate! oocupancles
4039 through 403.9.4 Adopled this seclion fet fire and life safety Locally adopled Jlﬂmp ancies wilh increased polenfialfr e loss).
Fmﬁd Yough 405.10 \Adapled tis section for fire and life safely Localy adopled Em: fﬂﬂﬂ‘a ?ﬂm;mm keeping (Climalc,
103 This section &r administrative dlarily and Locally adooted A perail is required for emergency respander radio systems
fira and e safoly Inspeciions |{Climatic, geolagical, and fopographical),
Adopted this seckion for administralive clarity and Dacolsiive vegelalionposes anincrease In huzard,
m’} stk ot fire ans lifa salety Inspections Lessryadogie Nammabliity and lncreased risk.
Wall covarings In group E accupancies {Schoals) sets a
Adoplad this seclion ot administiative charity and maximm amount of flammable wall coverings in
lm" Twghr.28 fire and lile safely inspactions Localy adopted edweationa) fackifies (Climatic. geclogical, and
tapographical).

23-15689 G 46 of 55




: " Combushbie fumishing pose 2 significant femmabiily and
08,1 Ihiough 6085 [ Denecton fe SRS Ll Locally adopled llmeased fle safely hazard n insiuionsl and colege doun
ive and fife salely inspections ype otsupancies.
: Piovides claily on acteptance tesing of solamatic fio
Adopied s seclion for sdminisiafive ity and
004.4.% N Locatly adopled exiinguishing systems. (Climatie, gealogleal, and
fire and life safely Inspecticns opographical)
oLt hogn 1t0za] N [ uﬁ;ﬁﬁm&mmmm e Localy adopled drinistiaive claly
Emergency Respender radlo coverage in exsTing buildisgs,
A Buikdings il be required bo allow emargency respondels
to rocsive and tahsmil amergancy radio tralfic fo and fom
each ofar and the emerganoy dispalch cealer, Time
% iramtes can bo develnpad b comeinto compliance and the
Avdopied ihis seclionin existagbuiliings forthe ahasing ol % < 2
syatem overa period of lime, detenuined by
e X ﬂ“'gﬂ%‘;ﬂ“@mm s e i) Lucaly adapled the fre code aiftlal, Is acceptable. The miionate behind this
? secion is hat on aimost 28 emargency responder infury or
fatalityineidents communleation s a key Issue. Tiis
sliualion can be corestod with g addifion of radic
guipment fo boost fhe signatin areas that donol have
sirang signal {Climalic. geological, and tepographical).
Requires instaalian of s Spdnider systems in existing
(1035 ¥ [Adopled Uds section [o¥ the sefelyof the publie, Losgly adoptad pecipantios with high e saety rsk and In conformarnce
. Fnreﬁghlers. and other emaigency responders y wiith eaviows Unifarm Fire Codes, (Cimaile, geologieal, and
topographicall.
Requkes inslalation o eachon monoride alams in
Adopited this seclion for the safety of the publie, :
1103.9 N Locally adoplod occupancies with high e safely risk, {Climafis, gealogleal,
lrafigiiers, aitd othor emergancy taspondors and topographica).
i Provides a minkmum level of safely with regaid 1o eqress
14141 throwgh Ad thi It h g : = g 3
1:3445' g N we;‘:lﬂs:!slaa:ﬁ[;“a:r::am?n!:gr:; “:5’;2""' \ocaliy adepled lrom exisling budings hausieg ocvupancies with a High i
2 safaly ek, {Cimatic, geoiogcsh, and topographicaly,
Provides a rmimum [ovel of salely at e slorage yams
1106.1 ihrough Adoplad this seciion for the safetyof the pubfe,
N Lacatty adapled with hlgh levels of flammabie [ubbar maledal. {Ciimalks,
1106.1,2 iﬁteﬁghlecs. and olhes emaigency fesptidels geological, aad logographical,
Agpendix Dz D101.1 N Adopled this secion for Jhe safely of e pubic, Locally adogted Benaral requirements far fire apparalus access wads
thiough D104, firefighters, and olheremergancy responder yace inehuding (oads (Climalic, gectogical, and topographical),
Appendix 0: D104.2 N Adopled this section for the safely of tha publis, Loeally adapled Commergial and industrial develspmenl firo sppasalus
i(axdud{ng axceplion) fitafighlars. and other amergency tesponders P accass pads (Chimalle, geclogles), and topegraphical).
Appendix D: D104,3 N Adopled Ihls section for the saleiyol the public, Localy adopiad Cominercial and indusinal devetopment fize apparalus
lhzough D054 firetghters, and viler ememency respanders § adep ancess rads {Ciimatlc, geological, and topograptical).
Appandix D: D108.1 N Adaplad this saction for the safely of the pudfic, Locally adopted Fire apparalus acgess roads for muliple-family rasidentiat
(extiuding exception} fvafighlers, and other amergancy msponders ¥ devalopmants {Climetic, geologica, and fepographical).
Appandix Dz DT6.2 N Adoptad tis sectlon for he safely of e peblc, Localty sdopted Fite apparalus aoeess roads for mwallipie-famiy resideniial
Ihrough B406.3 firafighless, and tther enteigency responders Y developments {Climatic, gealogical, and lopographical).
Qnve- of Wio-dweling tesidential dovelopments shall be
Anpandix 0; D071 N Adapled his section for the saloly of the pulfic, Lacally adopted equipped thioughoul wilh bvo sperate and approved fie
{exciiding exceplions) firefightars, and other emetgency responders ! apparalus acgess mads due {n lapographic, geagraphic and
elimailc conditions,
Crie-or twi-dwalfing residentis! developmentls shall be
Rependlx B 0197.2 N Adopted this seclion for the safely of be publs, Locally adapled aquinped throughoutvith wo sperate and approved fire
thraugh D106,1 firefighlers, and olher emeigency responders G apparalus steass soads due o tepographis, gegraphic and
climatic condifons.

23-1589 G 47 of 53




PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of Directors of the MFPD this, 26th day of
January, 2023.

AYES: L{— S}mg“{w\ﬁ\@msfbl,&m
NoEs: S
ABSENT: | U\gcb\h

ABSTAIN:,

o o8
k\ . Board President

=

ATTEST:

e a1
i 1Y

Sharlyn Fields : Board Secratary

Ordinance 2022-09 Page 23

23-1589 G 48 of 55



RESOLUTION 22-10

A RESOLUTION OF THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS OF THE
MOSQUITO FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT
ADOPTING FINDINGS SUPPORTING AMENDMENTS TO
THE CALIFORNIA FIRE CCDE

A resolution for the Mosquito Fire Protection District setting forth findings with respect to
local conditions within the Fire District which make certain modifications and changes to
the California Fire Code reasonably necessary for preserving fire and life safety in the
Mosquito Fire Protection District

The Governing Board of the Mosquito Fire Protection District finds and resolves as
follows:

WHEREAS, Health & Safety Code Section 17958.5 permits a Fire Protection
District to adopt an ordinance which changes or modifies the State Housing regulations
adopted
pursuant to Health & Safety Code Section 17922 upon determination that such changes or
modifications are necessary due to local conditions that pertain regulations governing
conditions hazardous to life, property and the environment from fire, explosion, hazardous
materials and hazardous uses; and

WHEREAS, Health & Safety Code Section 17958.7 requires that a District’s Board
of Directors making any changes or modifications pursuant to Health & Safety Code
Section 17938.5 shall make express finding that such changes or modifications are needed;
and shall file a copy of such changes or modifications with the Department of Housing and
Community Development,

WHEREAS, the unique local climatic, geological, and topogyraphical conditions
existing within the boundaries of the District make it reasonably necessary for the District to
impose more stringent requirements than set forth in the California Fire Code and pursuant
to California Health and Safety Code sections 13869.7 and 17958.7, the District
desires to make express findings to that effort

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that the Board of Directors of the
Mosgquito Fire Protection District, after having duly noticed and held public hearings, hereby
adopts the following findings concerning current unique local conditions that
together make each modification to the California Fire Code, reasonably necessary to
provide adequate and effective protection of life, property and the environment more
specifically set forth as follows:

23-1589 G 49 of 55




FINDINGS OF FACT
FOR CHANGES OR MODIFICATIONS TO THE STATE BUILDING
STANDARDS CODE (TITLE 24 PART 9) BECAUSE OF LOCAL
CONDITIONS

A. General.

After due consideration, the Board of Directors of the Mosquito Fire Protection District,
hereby finds that due to [ocal climatie, geologic and topographic conditions, as stated within
this document, there is a need to provide the modifications and change contained in the
adoptive Ordinance of the California Fire Code. Such changes are deemed to be reasonably
necessary to provide adequate and effective protection of life, property, and the
environment.

The Mosquito Fire Protection District provides fire protection, emergency medical
services, and specialized rescue services to approximately 2,500 people in a 13 square mile
area. The District is located on the Western slope of EI Dorado County. The

topography of the District ranges from roliing hills of grass, oak woodland, large
quantities of brush, and steep drainages. The weather conditions vary from freezing
temperatures with occasional snow in winter, to summer temperatures that regularly
exceed 100 degrees.

The Mosquito Fire Protection District is an “ali-1isk™ agency. The District participates in a
sophisticated mutual aid program and is dispatched through agreement by the California
Department of Forestry and Fire Protection (Cal-Fire) at Camino. The resources of the
District will respond to, and deal with, any type of emergency. The term “Fire

Protection” in this document is broad and includes responses to fires, smoke, and odor
investigations, alarms, public assist calls, hazardous materials incidents, medical aid, and
specialized rescues.

The District has one staffed fire station to provide emergency service to the community. Fire  »
Station 75 is located at 8801 Rock Creek Road, The District has 2 full-time, career

personnel, along with 1 part time management position, and these are supplemented with a
volunteer Assistant Chief, Company Officers and Firefighters.

B. Climatic.

The Mosquito Fire Protection District is located within a foothill region. The District is
subject to four seasons, with an annual snowfall in the winter months of 2-4 inches, in
addition to an average rainfall of 39 inches per year. These adverse weather conditions
create severe hazardous road conditions and flooding as well as rockslide hazards along the
main access roads within, as well as into, the District from the surrounding areas. Due to
periods of rainfall, along with repeated road closures, the ability of the Fire Protection

L

23-1589 G 50 of 55




District to provide immediate emergency response is often delayed. These same adverse
climatic conditions often result in a {arge number of vehicular accidents that place
extreme restraints on the availability of emergency response to perform emergency
rescue, first aid, hazardous matesials control, and firefighting. The climatic conditions
often result in a substantial or total lack of ability of the Fire Protection District to
respond immediately to otber types of emergency situations that occur. Examples of these
emergency situations include structure fires, wildland and forest fires, flooding,
hazardous materials incidents, emergency medical calls, vehicle accidents, and vertical
rescues. The mutual aid agreements established with adjoining fire agencies might not be
possible due to adverse climatic conditions, restricting or totally blocking access into the
District.

Summary:

These local climatic conditions affect the acceleration, intensity, and size of fires in the Fire
District. Times of little or no rainfall, low humidity, and high temperatures create
extremely hazardous conditions, particularly as they relate to the wildland-urban

interface. Winds experienced in this area can have a significant impact upon structure fires,
especially in buildings in close proximity to one another, and to wildlands

commonly found in the Mosquito Fire Protection District. Structures built within the
Mosquito Fire Protection District must be built with these variables in mind

C. Geological.

The Mosquito Fire Protection District is located within moderate seismic Zone Three. The
seismic, geological conditions present a potential for multiple fires, major breakage of water
mains, multiple electrical power failures, multiple collapsed structures and a large number
of calls for emergency medical aid, all of which may occur simultaneously during a seismic
event. The water district has numerous water-pumping systems used for fire suppression
water delivery, as well as water storage tanks providing water system pressure. Most of the
pumping systems are dependent on electrical power for operation. Such electrical power
may not be available during a seismic event. Water storage tanks used for storage of
required fire suppression water may also collapse in such an event forcing the additional
need to transport water via additional pieces of fire apparatus which will place a significant
restraint on the ability of the District to provide the required emergency services.

Summary:

Local geographic and geological features and processes exist within the boundaries of the
Districts that may hamper the ability of the Mosquito Fire Protection District to perform its
sworn duties. Fire following an earthquake has the potential of causing greater [oss of life
and damage than the earthquake itself.

23-1589 G 51 of 55



D. Topographical.

The District is primarily composed of areas that are considered by the State to be high fire
hazard severity zones. Much of the hill is located within foothill terrain, covered with highly
combustible vegetation, including the presence of many coniferous forested areas. The
elevation within the District ranges from approximately 800 feet to over 2500 feet at the
highest point. Slope within the District ranges from 0 to 90 degrees. The structures within
the areas of the foothill’s terrain have very limited fire access, due to narrow

roadways with steep grades and poor road surface conditions. The presences of many
existing structures within the high fire severity zone areas provides for a very high

potential of a structure fire spreading into a wildland or forest fire condition as well as the
potential for a wildland or forest fire spreading to structures.

Summary:

The alignment of canyons, valleys, and slopes into inhabited areas, combined with the
variable nature of the terrain, yield potential for increased fire risk. Most structures, both
residential and commercial, are in or are surrounded by areas that contain significant grass,
brush, mixed oak woodland, and mixed conifer fuel load. Due to drought

conditions, beetle infestations, and lack of vegetation management, much of the area is
populated with either dead or dying trees, contributing to extreme fire danger.

E. Conclusion

Local climatic, geographic, and topographic conditions described above increase the
frequency, intensity, and size of fires involving buildings in the Fire District. Further, these
conditions impact potential damage to structures from an earthquake and

subsequent fire. Therefore, it is reasonably necessary that the California Fire Code be
modified to mitigate the effects of the above conditions. California Health & Safety Code
Section 17958.7 requires that modifications to the Fire Code be expressly marked and
identified as to which each finding refers to which Code modification. The attached
Appendix A provides this connection.

23-1589 G 52 of 55



PASSED AND ADOPTERP at a regular meeting of the Board of Directors of the
Mosquito Fire Protection District on January 26, 2023 by the following roll call vote:

AYES: L Steee ,qou\mj iH-c,ufd' i BIMO

NOES:

ATTEST: BY:

"”:};Z%’ o \ A /‘\'é‘—

\

Sharlyn Fields, Board Clerk Don Stever, Board President

23-1589 G 53 of 55



Mountain@)Bemorrat

PROOF OF PUBLICATION
(2015.5 C.C.IV)

Proof of Publication of

NOTICE OF INTENT

STATE OF CALIFORNIA
County of El Dorado

1 am a citizen of the United States and a resident
of the County aforesaid; I'm over the age of
eighteen years, and not a party to or interested in
the above-entitled matter. 1 am principal clerk of
the printer at the Mountain Democrat, 2885 Ray
Lawyers Drive, a newspaper of general circulation,
printed and published Monday, Wednesday,

and Friday, in the City of Placerville,

County of El Dorado, and which newspaper has
been adjudged a newspaper of general circula-
tion by the Superior Court to the County of El
Dorado, State of California, under the date of
March 7, 1952, Case Number 7258; that the
notice, of which the annexed is a printed copy
(set in type no smaller than non-pareil), has been
published in each regular and entire issue of said
newspaper and not in any supplement thereof on
the following dates, to~with:

1/13
ALL IN THE YEAR 2023.

I centify (or declare) under penalty of perjury that
the foregoing is true and correct.

Dated at Placerville, California, this 13™ day
of JANUARY, 2023

MALSCH Balws

s secnnd publo hanﬂdg at_?'Dme
Jion :im‘uary 26,2023 atthe. Mmqulm

L  SECOND NOTICE .
Il NOTICE OF INTENT TO ADOPT A
' FIRE'CODE ORDINANGCE

otection District” Station. 75
“Aock Creak Rd;.? Piﬂcmll!&
ca}ﬂomla regarding the'adoption’of
- the*Fire. Cods ,Ordinanca’ purauart
| to Health and ' Safety Codv Sncllum
'13869;and 13869.7,. Cagles of: \ht
‘cade’ seotion: .-e!ermd toiand ‘any
ao:ondnrycodc seatiois roferrod o,
ndepladbyroremnco ara onfile'with
‘he. Socretafy of tha!/ Dlxtm: and.are
Yopan o public inspection.’ “Adoption
of the Fire Code Ord) naﬂcnmﬂsdup{
‘fhe'California Fire Codo'as wmnw
publjshed In Title 24, Part 8, of tha
California Code _of Ragullt!ﬂni\
governing ..fire ptovantion and
bullding standards rélated to fire and
pani’ aafatvwmh somé amandments:
lnsome nstances; the Mosquite Fire
F’mlﬂntbn Dlstdsl's prupocad ‘Fire
Cuao Ordlmmce proposas biilding
.dundarﬂl: mare: ~stringént | .than
\‘hn:ua mln!mwn bulldlng sstandards
ad’upted (by Hhe: Slata Fire Marahdi
hl?" Caldonda

Signature

F;f,t.— CQ{,‘LO AT g&f_&

23-1589 G 54 of 65



Mountain@)Bemocrat

PROOF OF PUBLICATION
(2015.5 C.C.P.)

Proof of Publication of
NOTICE OF INTENT

STATE OF CALIFORNIA
County of El Dorado

I am a citizen of the United States and a resident
of the County aforesaid; I'm over the age of
eighteen years, and not a party to or interested in
the above-entitled matter. I am principal clerk of
the printer at the Mountain Democrat, 2889 Ray
Lawyer Drive, a newspaper of general circulation,
printed and published Monday, Wednesday,

and Friday, in the City of Placerville,

County of El Darado, and which newspaper has
been adjudged a newspaper of general civcula-
tion by the Superior Court to the County of El
Dorado, State of California, under the date of’
March 7, 1952, Casc Number 7258; that the
notice, of which the annexed is a printed copy
(set in type no smaller than non-pareil), has been
published in each regular and entire issue of said
newspaper and not in any supplement thereof on
the following dates, to-with:

12/7

ALL IN THE YEAR 2022
1 certify (or declare) under penalty of perjury that
the foregoing is true and correct.

Dated at Placerville, California, this 7" day
of DECEMBER, 2022

BUlason Radus
Signature

Flrst Notica 1
Notice of inient fo Adopt a Fire
Code Ordinance

1 Mofica is hereby givan of the intention
of the Mosquito Fire Prolection
District to adopt a Fire Code
Ordinance. The Digtdict shall hold
Its first public hesring at 7 B.M. o

l Thursgay December 22nd, 2022 at
| the Mosquite Fire Protaction District-
| Statlen 75, 8907 Reck Creak Hd of
the Fira Code Ordinance pursuant
to Health and Safsty Code Sections.
13869 and 13869.7. Copias of the
code section referred to and any
secondary code sectlons referred 1o,
adopted by reference, are on fife with:
the Sacratary of the District and are,
open to public (nspection. Adoption.
af the Fire Code Ortinance will adopt
tha California Fire Code as currently,
published in-Title 24, Part 9, of the.
Cajifornia Code of Regulations,
governing fire  prevention and
building standards refated to fire and:
panic salaty with some amendments.’
in sorna instances the Mosquito Fire.
Protection Disltict's propesed Fhe
] Coile Owdinance propeses buliding:
standards more stringeni than
thosae minimum buliding standards.
| adopled by the State Fira Marshal*
and contained in the California

| Bullding Standards Code, *
| 4277 11481

23-1589 G 55 of 55





