
RESOLUTION NO. 136-2023 

OF THE BOARD OF SUPERVISORS OF THE COUNTY OF EL DORADO 

(REPEALING RESOLUTION NO. 043-2020) 

WHEREAS, the California Code of Regulations, Title 24, Part 9, the California Fire Code, is updated by the 

State every three years; and 

WHEREAS, the 2022 California Fire Code became effective on January 1, 2023; and, 

WHEREAS, California Health and Safety Code Sections 17958, 17958.5, 17958.7 and 18941.5 permits a 

county to make such local amendments and modifications as the county determines are reasonably 

necessary because of local climatic, geological or topographical conditions; and, 

WHEREAS, the California Code of regulations, Health and Safety Code, Division 12, Part 2, Chapter 1, 

Article 12, Section 13146, assigns responsibility for enforcement of safety regulations to the local level 

and grants authority to delegate enforcement to the chief building official, or his or her authorized 

representative, or the chief of the fire protection district, or his or her representative; and, 

WHEREAS, the County of El Dorado desires to delegate enforcement of the Fire Code to the chief of the 

fire authority, or the chief's authorized representative; and, 

WHEREAS, the fire protection district and County have agreed to develop, implement and maintain a 

memorandum of understanding that describes the roles and responsibilities pertaining to the inspection 

of certain building standards found in the Fire Code; and, 

WHEREAS, on January 26, 2023, The Board of Directors of the Mosquito Fire Protection District adopted 

Ordinance No. 22-09, which adopted the 2022 California Fire Code with amendments the District deemed 

necessary to deal with local climate, geological or topographical conditions. 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that the Board of Supervisors of the County of El Dorado ratifies 

Ordinance No. 22-09 of the Mosquito Fire Protection District and delegates the enforcement of the 

ordinance to the Mosquito Fire District Chief, or his or her representative. 

These changes include amendments and additions to the California Fire Code in the following sections: 

101.1, 105.5, 105.5.55, 105.6, 105.6.25, 105.6.26, 107.5, 107.5.1, 107.7, 111.5, 112.4, 112.4.2, 
113.4, 202, 302.1, 307.4.4, 401.2.1, 503.2.1, 503.2.5, 503.2.6, 503.3.1, 503.3.2, 503.3.3, 503.6, 

505.1, 507.5.1, 509.3, 510.4.2.3, 903.2, 903.2.1.1, 903.2.1.2, 903.2.1.3, 903.2.1.4, 903.2.3, 903.2.4, 

903.2.7, 903.2.7.2, 903.2.8.5, 903.2.9, 903.2.10, 903.2.10.1, 903.2.22, 903.2.23, 903.6, 907.2, 

907.2.1.4, 907.2.2.3, 907.2.3.11, 907.2.4.1, 907.2.5.2, 907.2.6.6, 907.2.7.2, 907.2.8.4, 907.2.9.4, 

23-1589 G 1 of 55 



907.2.10.1, 907.2.30, 907.6.5, 907.6.2.1, 907.9, 1203.1.3, 3311.3, 3313.1, 50001.7, 5601.2, 

5704.2.9.6.1, 5706.2.4.4, 5806.2, 6104.2, Chapter 80 NFPA 1-22 Section 22.3, Chapter 80 NFPA 1-

22 Section 22.10, Chapter 80 NFPA 13D-22: Sections 4.6, 5.1.1.2, 7.6, 11.2.1.1, Appendix B: Table 

B105.1(1), Appendix B: Table Bl0S.2, Appendix D Sections D103.1 through D103.3, Appendix D 

103.5, Appendix D 103.6.1, Appendix D103.6.2, Appendix D104.4 

The Mosquito Fire District adopts the 2022 California Fire Code, Title 24, Part 9, in its entirety, including 

Appendices, incorporating those sections of the International Fire Code, 2021 edition not adopted by the 

state, with the exclusions listed below: 

103, 309, 311.5, 311.6, 318, 403.3, 403.5, 403.8, 403.10, 403.11, 404, 406, 903.3.1.2, 904.1.1, 
1103.1, 1103.3-1103.4, 1103.6, 1105, Chapter 26, D104.2 (exception only), D106.1 (exception only), 

D107.1 (exception only), Appendix A, Appendix G, Appendix J, Appendix K, Appendix L, Appendix 

M, Appendix N, Appendix 0. 

Appendices not adopted can be used for reference in enforcing other sections of the 2022 California Fire 

Code. 

PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of Supervisors of the County of El Dorado at a regular meeting of 
said BOARD, held the 12th day of September, 2023, by the following vote of said Board 

Attest: 
Kim Dawson 

:'."k~:~i~ 
Kye Kuperus 

Ayes: Thomas, Hidahl, Turnboo, Parlin, Laine 
Noes: None 
Absent: None 

23-1589 G 2 of 55 



MOSQUITO FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT 
8801 ROCK CREEK ROAD 
PLACERVILLE, CA 95667 

February 14, 2023 

Don Ashton, Chief Administrative Officer 
El Dorado County Board of Supervisors 
330 Fair Lane 
Placerville, CA 95667 

(530) 626-9017 
Fax (530) 626-3240 

Subject: Resolution Ratifying Ordinance #22·09 of the Mosquito Fire Protection District, which 
adopts the 2022 California Fire Code with amendments related to local climatic, geographic and 
topographic conditions. 

Dear Mr. Ashton, 

The Mosquito Fire Protection District {MFPD) is requesting the Board of Supervisors (BOS) ratify its 
Ordinance #22-09, which adopts the 2022 California Fire Code as amended due to specific local climatic, 
geographic and topographic conditions. California Health and Safety Code Section 13869.7 requires the 
legislative body of the city or county where the ordinance will apply to ratify, modify or deny the 
adopted ordina nee. The BOS must also delegate enforcement of the ordinance to either the Fire District 
(or its representative) or the Chief Building Official. 

Therefore, we request the County Board of Supervisors ratify Ordinance #22-09 with amendments to 
the 2022 California Fire Code, and delegate the enforcement of that Ordinance to the MFPD Fire Chief. 

This ordinance and resolution has no direct fiscal impact to the County. 

Respe IL 

osevear, Fire Chief 

ATTACHEMENTS: 
MFPD Ordinance #22-09 
MFPD Resolution #22-10 

23-1589 G 3 of 55 



MOSQUITO FIRE PROTECTION 

DISTRICT ORDrNANCE NO. 2022•09 • 

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS OF THE MOSQUITO FIRE 

PROTECTION DISTRICT AS FOLLOWS: 

An ordinance of the Mosquito Fire Protection District (MFPD) adopting the 2022 Edition of 

the Cal/fornla Fire Code, incorporating ttle 2021 Edition of the Jntemationaf Fire Code, regulating 

and governing the safeguarding of life and property from fire and explosion hazards arising from 

the storage, hand\ing and use of hazardous substances, materials, and devices, and from 

conditions hazardous to life or property in the occupancy of buifdings and premises in the MFPD; 

providing for the issuance of permits and collection of fees therefor; Repealing Ordinance No. 

2019-01 of the MFPD and all other ordinances and parts of the ordinances in conflict therewith. 

Be It ORDAINED by the Board of Directors of the MFPD, also known as the MOSQUITO 

FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT: 

Section 1 :,FINDINGS OF FACTS 

Section 2: .ADOPTION OF CODE WITH EXCLUSI.O~S 

Section 3: LOCAL AMENDMENTS 

Section 4:. CONFLICT 

Section5: SEVERABILITY 

Section 6; EFFECTIVE DATE AND PUBLICATION 

SECTION 1: FINDINGS OF FACTS. 

The MFPD makes certain changes (listed below) to the California Fire Code, 2022 

Edltion, pursuant to Health & Safety Code Sections 13869.7, 17958.6, 17958.7, and 18941.5 

during this code adoption process. Such changes are necessary because of local climatic, 

geological, and/or topographical conditions. The MFPD has adopted, pursuant to Section 

18941.5 of the Ca/ifom;a Health & Safety Code, the findings of facts relative to these conditions 

by Resolution #2019-06 of the MFPD dated November 14, 2019. 

SECTlON 2; ADOPTION OF CODE WITH EXCLUSIONS 

Ordinance 2022-09 Page1 

23-1589 G 4 of 55 



The MFPD adopts the 2022 California Fire Code, Title 24, Part 9"- in its entirety. including 

Appendices, incorporating those sections of the International Ffre Code, 2021 editionnotadoP1ed 

by the state, with the exclusions listed below: 

Exclusions: 103,309,311.5, 311.6, 318,403.3, 403.5, 403.B, 403.10, 403.11, 404,406, 

903.3. 1.2, 904, 1.1, 1103, 1, 1103.3-1103.4, 1103.6, 1105, Chapter 26: D104.2 (Exception only), 

D106.1 (Exception only), D107 .1 {Exceptions only), Appendix A, Appendix G, Appendix J, 

Appendix K, Appendix L, Appendix M, Appendix N, Appendix 0. 

Appendices not adopted can be used for reference in enforch,g other sections of the 2022 

Califomia Fire Code. 

SECTION 3: AMENDMENTS TO THE 2022 CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE 

The following Sections are hereby amended or added: 

Chapter1 

SECTION 101.1 "TITLE" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS; 

Sect[on 101,1 TITLE. These regulations shalt be known as the Fire Code of MFPD, hereinafter 
referred to as "this code." 

SECTION 105.5 nREQUIRED OPERATIONAL PERMITS" IS AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 105.5 Required operational permits. The fire code official is authorized to issue 
operational permits for the operations set forth In Sections 105.5.2 through 105.5.525. 

SECTION 105.5.55 "AUTOMOBILE WRECKING YARDS" IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 105.5,55 Automobile wrecking yards. An operational permit is required for the 
operation of automobile wrecking yards. 

SECTION 105.6 "REQUIRED CONSTRUCTION PERMITS" IS AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 105.6 required construction permits. The fire code official is authorized to issue 
construction permlts for wo1·k as set forth in sections 105.6.1 through 105.6.246. 

SECTION 105,6.25 "AUTOMOBILE WRECKING YARDS" IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 105.6.25 Automobile wrecking yards. Construction permits are required for the 
installation of or modification to automobile wrecking yards. 

SECTION 105.6.26 "TRAFFIC CALMING DEVICES" IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Ordinance 2022-09 Page2 

23-1589 G 5 of 55 



105.6.26 TrEJffic calming devices. Construction permits are required for the installation or 
modification of traffic calming devices. 

SECTION 107.5 ~PERMIT, F'LAN REVIEW AND INSPECTION FEES" SHALL BE ADDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section 107.5 Permit. A schedule of fees adopted by the distdct board of directors for plan 
reviewJ inspections and the Issuance of permffs by the District may be found in the most r;un-ent 
district fee sclledule (Health & Safety Code 17951). 

SECTION 107.5.1 "COST RECOVERY FEES" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 107.5.1 Cost Recovery Fees. Fire service fees may be charged to any person, firm, 
corporation, or business that through negligence, violation of the law, or as a result of 
carelessness, is responsible for the cause of the District to respond to the scene of an incident. 
A district board may charge a fee to cover the cost of any service which the District provides 
or the cost of enforcing any regulation for which the fee is charged (Health & Safety Code 
13916). The fee shall not exceed the actual cost of suppressing the fire and/or responding to 
the scene of an incident. 

SECTION 107.7 "ADMINISTRATIVE COSTS" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 107.7 Administrative Costs. When a test or inspection is scheduled, and the 
contractor falls to perform to the satisfaction of the authority having jurisdiction (AHJ), the AHJ 
may bill the contractor for actua( time spent traveling to and from the test/Inspection location 
and the time spent at the test/inspection sfte as well as administrative costs. 

SECTION 111.5 "APPEAL PROCEDURES AND TIMEUNES" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 111.5 Appeal Procedures and Timelines. Any person or entity who believes they 
may be adversely affected by an order, decision, or determination made by the fire code official 
through a written notice may appeal this matter within 15 calendar days of the postmark on the 
notice. All such appeals shall be filed In writing with the Secretary of the Governing Board for 
the o;strict. A timely appeal shall stay further action by the fire code official until the matter is 
determined by the Appeal Board as outlined in Section 109.2 unfess the issue poses an 
Imminent fire or life safety hazard to members of the public. The fire code official shall notify 
the appellant by certified mail of the date and time of such hearing. The hearing shall be 
scheduled to take place no sooner than 20 calendar days from the date shown on the certified 
mail. The appellant shall have the right to appear in person or by agent at the hearing and 
present oral, written, and/or photographic evidence to the Appeal Board. 

SECTION 112.4 "VIOLATION PENALTIES• SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Sectio11 112.4 Violation Penalties. Persons who shall violate a provision of this code or shall 
fail to comply with any of the requirements thereof or who shall erect, install, alter, repair, or 
do work In violation of the approved construction documents or directive of the fire code official, 
or of a permit or certificate used under provisions of this code, shall be guilty of a misdemeanor 
or infraction, at the discretion of the prosecuting attorney or agency, punishable by a fine not 
more than $100.00 for a first violation; A fine not exceeding $500.00 for a second violation of 

Ordinance 2022-09 Page3 

23-1589 G 6 of 55 



I • 

the same provision within one year; A fine not exceeding $1000.00 for each additional violation 
of the same provision within one year, or by imprisonment not exceeding 180 days, or both 
such fine and imprisonment. Each day that a vtolation continues after due notice has been 
served shall be deemed a separate offense. (Health & Safety Code Sections 13145 and 
17995). 

SECTfON 112,4.2 "CITATIONS" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 112.4.2 Citations. The Fire Chief, or his/her duly authorized representative, may 
issue citations for infractions or misdemeanor violations of this code pursuant to Section 13871 
of the Health & Safety Code of the State of Cafifomfa and Chapter 5c (commenc;ng with 
Sect/on 853. 6) of Title 3 of Part 2 of the Penal Code of the State of Callforn/a. 

SECTION 113.4 "FAILURE TO COMPL y• SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 113.4 Failure to Comply. Any person who shall continue any work after having been 
served with a stop work order, except such work as th at person is directed to perform to remove 
a violation or unsafe condition, shall be punishable by a fine or imprisonment or both as 
described In SectJon 112.4 (Health & Safety Code Sections 13145 and 17995). 

Chapter 2 

SECTION 202 ''CAMPFIRE" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

CAMPFIRE. A fire which is used for cooking, personal warmth, lighting, or aesthetic purposes. 

SECTION 202 "DISTRICT" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

DISTRICT. The Dist,;ct and all other areas within the exterior boundaries thereof now or 
hereafter established. 

SECTION 202 "DRIVEWAY" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

DRIVEWAY. A vehicular access that serves up to two (2) parcels with no more than two (2) 
residential units and any number of non-commercial or Industrial buildings on each parcel. 

SECTION 202 "EXECUTIVE BODY'' SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

EXECUTIVE BODY. The Board of Directors of the District. 

SECTION 202 "FIRE CHIEF" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

FIRE CHIEF. The Chief Executive Fire Officer of the Fire department/district serving the 
jurisdiction or a duly authorized representative. 

SECTION 202 "FIRE HAZARD" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

FIRE HAZARD. Any condition, arrangement, or act which will increase, or may cause an 
increase of, the hazard or menace of fire to a greater than customarily recognized as normal 

Ordinance 2022-09 Page4 

23-1589 G 7 of 55 



by-persons in the public service of preventing, suppressfng, or extinguishing fire; or which may 
obstruct, delay, or hinder, or may become the cause of obstruction, delay or hinderance to the 
prevention, suppression, or extingulshment of fire. 

SECTION 202 "OPEN BURNING" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

OPEN BURNING. The bumlng of materials wherein products of combustion are emitted 
directfy into the ambient air without passing through a stack or chimney from an enclosed 
chamber. Open burning does not include road flares, smudge-pots, and simtlar devices 
associated with safety or occupational uses typicaUy considered open flames, reoreatisRaHi~ 
8F use of ~--ootaoof=--:flreplases. For the purpose of this definition, a chamber shall be 
regarded as enclosed when, during the time combustion occurs, only apertures, ducts, stacl<s, 
flues, or chimneys necessary to provide combustion air and permit the escape of exhaust gas 
are open. 

Open burning shaJ/ a/so include campfires, bonfires, portable outdoor fireplaces, ceremonial 
fires, and recreational fire as defined In the Fire Code. 

Exception: 

1, UL or ASMI listed LPG or natural gas outdoor flame devices, such as gas BB Q's or gas 
fire pits that compfy with the Fire Code. 

2. campfires on private lands. Where required by the fire code official, a permit is shall 
be issued by the fire code official. 

3, Ceremonial and/or religious burning with the foltowfng safety measures: 

a. Maximum 4-foot x 4-foot burn area. 

b. Minimum 10,foot clearance from edge of burn area to all flammable material and 
vegetation. 

c. An approved water supply is located v1ithin 500-feet of the burn area. 

d. The bum area is located no less than 30-feet from adjoining property lines. 

e. An adult is present with a shovel until the fire is extinguished. 

f. No bummg shall be conducted during high or extreme fire weather conditions {e.g., 
National Weather Service Red Flag Warnings). 

SECTION 202 "TRAINED CROWD MANAGER" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

TRAINED CROWD MANAGER. Standby personnel, usually a security guard or usher 
personnel, who are trained in the proper procedure ta exit people from a tent or other place of 
public assemblage in an orderly and calm fashion ;n the event of an emergency 

Chapter 3 

SECTION 302.1 "DEFlNITIONS" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 
3D PRINTER. 
ADDITIVE MANUFACTURING. 

Ordinance 2022·09 Pages 

23-1589 G 8 of 55 



BONFIRE. 
CAMPFIRE. 
HI-BOY. 
HIGH-VOLTAGE TRANSMISSION LINE. 
OPEN BURNING. 
PORTABLE OUTDOOR FIREPLACE. 
POWERED INDUSTRIAL TRUCK. 
RECREATIONAL FIRE. 
SKY LANTERN. 

SECTJON 307.4.4 "OPEN BURNING RESTRICTIONS" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 307.4.4 Open Burning Restrictions. Open burning on all lands within the 
Jurisdiction of the MOSQUITO FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT (MFPD), Including the Local 
Response Area (LRA), Is prohibited when the California Department of Forestry and Fire 
Protection (Cal Fire) issues a burn suspension in the State Responsibility Area (SRA). This 
prohibition shall be made effective 24-hours following its commencement in the SRA. 

Open burning is also prohibited on all lands within the jurisdiction of MFPD at any time the fire 
code official that atmospheric conditions or other local circumstances make such fires hazardous, 
including factors such as high winds, low fuel moisture, fire weather, the issuance of red flag 
warnings, the severe threat of wild/and fire1 or present risk of destruction by wildfire to life, wildlife, 
property, or natural resources. 

Chapter 4 

SECTION 401.2.1 uPRE-FIRE PLANS" IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 401,2.1 Pre-fire plans. Where required by the fire code official, a pre-fire plan shall 
be provided and approved by the fire code official for all new commercial structures. 

Chapters 

SECTtON 503,2.1 "DIMENSIONS" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 503.2.1 Dimensions. Fire apparatus access roads shall have an unobstructed wtdth 
of not less than 20 feet (6096 mm), exclusive of shoulders, as measured from face of curb to 
face of curb, except for approved security gates in accordance with Section 503.6, and an 
unobstructed vertical clearance of not less than 15 feet. Driveways shall have an unobstructed 
w;dth of not Jess than 12 feet wide. 

SECTION 503.2.5 "DEAD ENDS" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 503.2.5 Dead Ends. Dead~end fire apparatus access roads and driveways In excess 
of 150 feet (45,720 mm) fn length shall be provided with an approved area for turning around 
fire apparatus. 

SECTION 503.2.6 "BRIDGES AND ELEVATED SURFACES'' SHALL BE AMENDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Ordinance 2022-0 9 Pages 

23-1589 G 9 of 55 



Section 503.2,6 Bridges and Elevated Surfaces. Where a bridge or an elevated swface is 
part of a fire apparatus access road, the bridge shall be constructed and maintained in 
accordance with AASHTO HB-17, the current El Dorado County Transportation DiVJsion Bridge 
Standard or Appendix D of the current California Fire Code, whichever ls more restrictive. 
Brfdges and elevated surfaces shall be designed for a live load sufficient to carry the imposed 
loads of fire apparatus, Vehicle load lim!ts shall be posted at both entrances to bridges when 
required by the fire code official. Where elevated surfaces designed for emergency vehicle 
use are adjacent to surfaces that are not designed for such use, approved barriers, approved 
signs or both shall be installed and maintained where required by the fire code official. 

SECTION 503.3, 1 "NO PARKING IN FIRE LANES" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 503.3,1 No Parking In Fire Lanes. No person shall stop, park, or leave standing any 
vehicle, whether attended or unattended, except when necessary to avoid conflict with other 
traffic or in compliance with the directions of the Fire Chief, or hiS/her duly authorized 
representative, Peace Officer, or official traffic control device along the edge of any highway, 
at any curb, or in any location In a publicly or privately owned or operated off-street parking 
facility, designated as a fire Jane by the District with Jurisdiction over the area In which the place 
is located. The designation shafl be indicated (1) by a sign posted immediately adjacent to, 
and visible from, the designated place clearly stating in letters not less than one Inch in height 
that the place is a fire lane, (2) by outlining orpainting the place in red and, in contrasting color, 
marking the place with the words UFIRE LANE," which are clearly visible from a vehicle, or (3) 
by a red curb or red paint on the edge of the roadway upon which is clearly marked the words 
"FIRE LANE. II 

SECTJON 503.3.2 "NO PARKING IN FRONT Of HYDRANTS" SHALL BE ADDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Sect;on 503,3.2 No Parking in Front of Hydrants. No person shall stop, park, or leave 
standing any vehicle within 15 feet of a flre hydrant except as follows: {a) If the vehicle is 
attended by a licensed driver who is seated fn the front seat and who can immediately move 
such vehicle In case of necessity, (b) ff the vehicle is owned or operated by a fire department 
and Is clearly marked as a tire department vehicle. 

SECTION 503.3.3 "FIRE LANES BASED ON ROAD WIDTH" SHALL BE ADDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section 503.3.3 Fire Lanes Based on Road Width. Fire lanes shall be based on road width 
as required in Appendix D as amended by the District. 

SECTION 503.6 "SECURITY GATES" IS AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 503.6 Security Gates. The installation of securlty gates across a fire apparatus 
access road shall be approved by the fire code official and shall comply with the District gate 
standard. Where security gates are installed, they shall have an approved means of 
emergency operation. The security gates and the emergency operation shall be maintained 
operational at all times. Electric gate operators, where provided, shall be listed in accordance 
with UL 325. Gates intended for automatic operation shall be designed, constructed, and 
installed to comply with the requirements of ASTM F2200, 

Ordinance 2022-09 Page 7 

23-1589 G 10 of 55 



SECTION 505.1 "ADDRESS IDENTIFICATION" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 505.1 Address Identification. Addresses for new and existing buildings shal( comply 
with the District address standard as approved by the fire code official. The address 
identification shall be legible and placed in a position that is visible from the street or road fronting 
the property. Address identification characters shall contrast with their background. Address 
numbers shall be Arabic numbers or alphabetical letters. Numbers shall not be spelled out. Each 
chatacter shall be not less than 4 Inches (102 mm) high with a minimum stroke width of½ Inch 
(12.7 mm}. Where required by the fire code official, address identification shall be provided in 
additional approved locations to facilitate emergency response. access is by means of a private 
road and the building cannot be viewed from the publlc way, a monument, pole or other sign or 
means shall be used to identify the structure. Address identification shall be maintained. 

SECTION 507.5.1 "WHERE REQUIRED'' SHALL. BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 507 .5.1 Where Required. Where a portion of the facility or building hereafter 
constructed or moved Into or Within the Jurisdiction ls more than 150 feet from a hydrant on a fire 
apparatus access road, as measured by an approved route around the exterior of the facility or 
building, on..site fire hydrants and mains capable of supplying the required fire flow shall be 
provided where required by the fire code offici{:11. 

Exceptions: 
1. For Group R-3 and Group U occupancies, the distance requirement shall be 600 feet 

(183 m). 

SECTION 509.3 "FIRE CONTROL ROOM'' SHALL BE ADDEO AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 509.3 Fire Control Room. Fire sprinl<Jer risers, fire alarm control panels, solar 
photovoltaic power system rapid shutoff switches, and other fire detection, suppression, or 
simFlar control elements shall be located inside a single fire control room for the building. The 
fire control room shall have minimum dimensions of five feet by seven feet In size with a total 
usable area of not Jess than 36 square feet. The room shall be located within the buf/ding on 
an outside wafl at a location approved by the Fire Code Official and shall be accessible from 
the ex.terlor An exterior i=ic:c:ess door with a clear width of not less than 32 inches and height 
of not less than 80 inches shall be provided for access into the room. A durable sign shall be 
affixed to the exterior of the door with the words "FIRE CONTROL ROOM" in letters not fess 
than 4 inches in height. A key box complying with Section 506 shall be installed on the exterior 
side of the fire control room door opening. 

The room must be capable of maintaining a minimum temperature of 40 degrees Fahrenheit. 
A clearance of 12 Inches shall be provided from the fire sprinkler risers to any adjacent walls. 
This room can be a shared with other building utilities or fire protection equipment that is not 
incompatible. An approved cabinet or container shall be provided to store record plans of the 
fire sprinkler system and other rire protection equipment. This room shall not be used for any 
other storage. 

Exception: One~and two-family dwellings, manufactured homes, or similar uses 
defined as either a Group R-3, R3. 1, or R~4 occupancy. 

SECTION 510.4.2.3 "STANDBY POWER" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Ordinai1ce 2022-09 Pages 

23-1589 G 11 of 55 



Section 510.4.2.3 Standby power. In-building, two-way emergency responder 
communication radlo coverage systems shall be provided with dedicated standby batteries or 
provided with 2-hour standby batteries and connected to the facility generator power system 
in accordance with Section 1203, The standby power supply shall be capable of operating the 
lo-building, two-way emergency responder communication coverage system at 100-percent 
system capacity for a duration of not less than 72 hours. 

Chapter9 

SECTION 903.2 "WHERE REQUIRED" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 903.2 Where Required. Approved automatic sprinkler systems in new buildings and 
structures, when constructed or relocated within the jurisdiction, shat/ be provided in the 
locations described in Sections 903.2.1 through 903.2.12 and Sections 903.2.14 through 
903.2.23. 

Exception: Agricultural buildings not under a special use permit used for commercial 
purposes. 

SECTION 903.2.1.1 "GROUPA-1" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 903,2.1, 1 Group A. An automatic sprinklersystem shall be provided throughout stories 
containing Group A-1 occupancies and throughout all stories from the Group A·1 occupancy to 
and including the levels of exit discharge serving that occupancy where one of the following 
conditions exists: 

1. The fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet 

2. The fire area has an occupant load of 300 or more. 

3. The fire area Is located on a floor other than a level of exit discharge serving such 
occupancies. 

4. The fire area contains a multi-theater complex 

SECTION 903.2.1.2 "GROUP A·2" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Sectlon 903.2.1.2 Group A-2. An automatic sprlnl<ler system shall be provided throughout 
stories containing Group A-2 occupancies and throughout all stones from the Group A-2 
occupancy to and including the levels of exit discharge serving that occupancy where one of the 
following conditions exists: 

1. The fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet; 

2. The fire area has an occupant load of 100 or more. 

3. The ffre area is located on a floor other than a level of exit discharge serving such 
occupancles. 

4. The structure exceeds 3,600 square feet, contains more than one fire area containing a 
Group A-2 occupancy, and ts separated into two or more buildings by fire walls of less than 
4-hour fire•resistance rating without openings. 

SECTtON 903.2.1.3 "GROUP f.,,-3" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Ol'dinance 2022-09 Page9 

23-1589 G 12 of 55 



Section 903.2.1.3 Group A-3. An automatic sprlnlder system shall be provided throughout 
stories containing Group A-3 occupancies. and throughout all stories from the Group A-3 
occupancy to and including the levels of exit discharge serving that occupancy where one of the 
following conditions exists: 

1. The fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet 

2. The fire area has an occupant load of 300 or more. 

3. The fire area is located on a floor other than a level of exit discharge serving such 
occupancies. 

4, The structure exceeds 3,600 square feet, contains more than one fire area containing 
exhibition and display rooms, and is separated into two or more buildings by fire waits of 
less than 4-hour fire-resistance rating without openings. 

SECTION 903.2.1.4 ''GROUP A-4" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 903,2.1.4 Group A•4. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout 
stories containing Group A-4 occupancies and throughout all stories from the Group A-4 
occupancy to and including the levels of exit discharge serving that occupancy where one of the 
following conditions exists: 

1. The fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

2. The fire area has an occupant load of 300 or more. 

3. The fire area ls located on a floor other than a level of exit discharge serving such 
occupancies. 

SECTION 903.2.3 "GROUP E" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 903.2.3 Group E. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided for Group E 
occupancies as follows: 

1. Throughout all Group E fire areas greater than 3,600 square feet in area. 

2. The Group E fire area Is located on a tloor other than a level of e.xlt discharge serving such 
occupancies. 

E,tception: In buildings where every classroom has not fewer than one exterior exit 
door at ground level, an automatic sprinlder system is not required in any 
area below the lowest level of exit discharge serving that area. 

3. The Group E fire area has an occupant load of 300 or more. 

4. In rooms or areas wlth special hazards such as laboratories, vocational shops and other 
such areas where hazardous materials in quantities not exceeding the maximum allowable 
quantity are used or stored. 

5. Throughout any Group E structure greater than 3,600 square feet in area, which contains 
more than one fire area, and which is separated Into two or more buildings by fire walls of 
less than 4-hour fire resistance rating without openings. 

6. For public school, and state-funded construction projects see Section 903.2.19. 

7. For public school campuses, Kindergarten through 12th grade, see Secttan 903.2.20 

Ordinance 2022-09 Page 10 

23-1589 G 13 of 55 



SECTION 903.2.4 "GROUP F-1" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 903.2.4 Group F-1. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout all 
buildings containing a Group F-1 occupancy where one of the following conditions exists: 

1. A Group F~1 fire area.exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

2. A Group F~1 fire area is located more than three stories above grade plane. 

3. The combined area of all Group F-1 fire areas on all floors, lncludlng any mezzanines, 
exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

SECTION 903.2.7 "GROUP M" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 903.2.7 Group M. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout buildings 
containing a Group M occupancy where one of the following conditions exists: 

1, A Group M fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

2. A Group M fire area is located more than three stories above grade plane. 

3. The combined area of all Group M fire areas on all floors, including any mezzanines, 
exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

5. The structure exceeds 3,600 square feet, contains rnore than one fire area containing a 
Group M occupancy, and is separated into two or more bulldings by fire walls of less than 
4-hour fire-resistance rating without openings, 

SECTION 903.2.7.2 "GROUP M UPHOLSTERED FURNITURE OR MATTRESSES" SHALL 
BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 903.2.7.2 Group M Upholstered Furniture or Mattresses. An automatic sprinkler 
system shall be provided throughout a Group M fire area where the area used for the dlsp\ay 
and sale of upholstered furniture or mattresses exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

SECTION 903.2.8.5 "MANUFACTURED HOMES" SHALL BE ADDEO AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 903.2.8.5 Manufactured Homes. An automatic fire sprinkler system sha/J be required 
in all new manufactured homes and multi-family manufactured homes intended for use as a 
one-and two-family dwelllng. The design and ;nstalf ation of such systems shall be In 
accordance with California Code of Regulations, Title 25, §4300, 

Exceptions: 

1. Manufactured homes located within an ·existing mobile home park complying with 
California I-lea/th and Safety Code, Division 13, Part 2.1 or 2.3. 

2. Manufactured homes that do not exceed 1,200 square feet in size and serve as an 
accessory dwelling unit, as defined in Government Code Section 658502; when the 
existing primary residence on the property is not requ;red to comply with Callfomia 
Residential Code Seotion R313.2. 

3. Manufactured homes that do not exceed 320 square feet in size. 

SECTION 903.2.9 ''GROUP S-1" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Ordi11ance 2022-01 Page 11 

23-1589 G 14 of 55 



Section 903.2,9 Group S-1. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout all 
buildings containing a Group S-1 occupancy where one of the following conditions exists: 

1. A Group S-1 fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

2. A Group S-1 fire area Is located more than three stories above grade plane. 

3. The combined area of all Group S-1 fire areas on all floors, Including any mezzanines, 
exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

4. A Group S-1 fire area used for the storage of commercial motor vehicles where the fire 
area exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

SECTION 903.2.10 "GROUP S-2" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 903.2.10 Group 5-2. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout 
buildings classified as parking garages where any of the following conditions exist: 

1. Where the fire area of the enclosed parking garage, in accordance with Section 406,6 of 
the California Building Code, exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

2. Where the enclosed parking garage, in accordance with Section 4C6.6 of the California 
Building Code, is located beneath other groups. 

Exception: Enclosed parking garages located beneath Group R-3 occupancies. 

3. Where the fire area of the open parking garage, In accordance with Section 406.5 of the 
California Building Code, exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

SECTION 903.2.10.1 "COMMERCIAL PARKING GARAGES" SHALL BE AMENDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section 903.2.10,1 Commercial Parking Garages. An automatic sprinkler system shall be 
provided throughout buildings used for storage of commercial motor vehicles where the fire area 
exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

SECTION 903.2.22 "GROUP B" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 9Q3.2.22 Group 13. An automatic sprinkler system shall be prcvided throughout all 
buildings containing Group B occupancies where the fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

SECTION 903.2.23 "GROUP F-2" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

' Section 903.2,23 Group F-2. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout all 
buildings containing Group F-2 occupancies where the fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

SECTION 903.6 "WHERE REQUIRED IN EXISTING BUILDINGS AND STRUCTURES" IS 
AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 903,6 Where Required In Existing Buildings and Structures. An automatic 
sprlnkler system shall be provided in existing buildings and structures where required in 
Chapter 11 and as follows: 

Oi:dinance 2022-09 Page 12 

23-1589 G 15 of 55 



1. When there is a change In occupancy classification that results in an increased life safety 
or fire risk, as determined by the fire code official, and the structure exceeds 3,600 square 
feet, an automatic fire sprinkler system shall be installed throughout the building. 

2, In existing buildings 3,600 square feet or greater, other than one and two~family dwelling 
units, and agricultural bufldings not under special use permit for commercial purposes, 
where the floor area of the bu;Jding or structure is increased, such building or structure 
shall be made to conform to Section 903,2. 

Exception: When the building increase 'ts less than 500 square feet. 

3. In existing buf/dlngs 3,600 square (-eet or less, other than one-and two-family dwe/Jing 
units, and agricultural buildings not under special use permit for commercial purposes, 
where the floor area of the bu/fding or structure is Increased to a bta/ square footage 
over 3,600 square feet, such building or structure shall be made to conform to Section 
903.2. 

Exception: When the building increase is less than 500 square feet. 

SECTION 907.2. "WHERE REQUIRED- NEW BUILDINGS AND STRUCTURES" SHALL BE 
AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 907,2. Where Required - New Buildings and Structures. An approved fire alarm 
system installed in accordance with the provisions of this code and NFPA 72 shall be provided 
in new buildings and structures in accordance with Sections 907.2.1 through 907 .2.~30 and 
provide occupant notification in accordance with Section 907.5, unless other requlrements are 
provided by another section of this code. 

Not fewer than one manual fire alarm box shall be p1·ovided In an approved location to initiate 
a fire alarm signal for fire alarm systems employing automatic fire detectors or waterflow 
detection devices. Where other sections of this code allow the elimination of fire alarm boxes 
due to sprinklers or automatic fire alarm systems, a single fire alarm box sflall be insta\led at a 
location approved by the enforcing agency. 

Exceptions: 

1. The manual fire alarm box Is not required for fire alarm ccntrol units systems 
dedicated to elevator recall control, supervisory service and fire sprinkler 
monitoring. 

2. The manual fire alann box is not required for Group R-2 occupancies unless 
required by the fire code official to provide a means for fire watch personnel to 
initiate an alarm during a sprinlder system, impairment event. Where provided, the 
manual ilre alarm box shall not be located in an area that is open to the public. 

3. The manual iire alarm box Is not required to be installed when approved by the fire 
code official. 

4. A fire alarm system is not required in one and two-family dwellings, agricultural 
buildings, and other occupancfes classified as Group U not under special use 
permit and/or not used f-or commercial purposes (e.g. retail sales, food service, 
and/or special events). 

Ordinance 2022-09 Page 13 

23-1589 G 16 of 55 



5. Buildings with a floor area less than 500 square feet may be exempt, as determined 
by the fire code official based on building construction material and features, 
location. occupancy type, and distance to exposures. 

SECTION 907.2.1.4 "GROUP A UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET'' SHALL BE ADDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section 907.2, 1.4 Group A Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shall 
be installed in all group A buildings with a floor area less than 3,600 square feet. 

SECTION 907.2.2.3 "GROUP B UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET" SHA-L BE ADDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section 907.2.2,3 Group B Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shall 
be ;nstal/ed in all group B buildings with a floor area less than 3,600 square feet. 

SECTION 907.2.3.11 "GROUP E UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET" SHALL BE ADDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section 907 .2.3.11 Group E Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shall 
be installed in all group E buildings with a floor area less than 3,600 square feet. 

SECTION 907.2.4.1 "GROUP F UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET" SHALL BE ADDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section 907.2.4.1 Group F Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approv0d firG alarm system shall 
be installed in all group F buildings with a floor area less than 3,600 square feet. 

SECTION 907.2.5.2 "GROUP H UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET" SHALL BE ADDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section 907.2.5.2 Group H Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shall 
be Installed In afl group H bulldings with a floor area less than 3,600 square feet. 

SECTION 907.2.6.6 "GROUP I UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEETtt SHALL BE ADDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section 907.2.6.6 Group I Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shall 
be installed in all group I buildings with a floor area less tl1an 3,600 square feet. 

SECTION 907.2. 7.2 "GROUP M UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET" SHALL BE ADDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section 907.2.7.2 Group M Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shall 
be fnstafled in alf group M buildings with a floor area Jess than 3,600 square feet. 

SECTION 907.2.8.4 "GROUP R-1 UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET" SHALL SE ADDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

01'dinauce 2022-09 Page 14 

23-1589 G 17 of 55 



Section 907.2.8.4 Group R-1 Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shall 
be installed in all group R-1 buildings with a floor area less than 3,600 square feet. 

SECTION 907.2,9.4 "GROUP R-2, R-2.1, R-2.2 UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET" SHALL BE 
ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 901.2.9.4 Group R-2, R-2.1. R-2.2 Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm 
system shall be Installed in all group R-2, R-2.1, R-2.2 buildings with a floor area fess than 
3,600 square feet. 

SECTfON 907.2.10, 1 "GROUP S UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET" SHALL BE ADDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section 907.2. 10.1 Group S Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shall 
be installed in all group S buildings with a floor area less than 3,600 square feet, 

907.2.30 "TYPE I HOOD INSTALLATIONS" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

907.2.30 "Type I Hood Installations. The requirement of installation, or replacement, of a 
Type f Hood System shall require a fire alarm/sprinkler monitoring system to be installed, or 
for the hood system to be connected to an existing fire alarm/sprinkler monitoring system for 
that building. 

907.6.5 "MONITORlNG" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

907.6.5 Monitoring. Fire alarm systems required by this chapter or by the Callfomia Bulkllng 
Code shall be monitored by an approved, UL certified, Type A Full Service central, proprietary 
or remote station service, which gives audible and visual signals at a constantly attended 
location. All sprinklered buildings shall be monffored. 

Exceptions; 

1. One- and two-famJ1y dwellings (R-3 Occupancies and other occupancies classified 
as "U'?, 

2. Agricultural bulldings not under special use permit and/or not used for commercial 
purposes (e.g., retells sales, food se1vice, and/or special events). 

SECTION 907.6.2.1 "SECONDARY POWER SUPPLY" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

SECTION 907.6.2.1 SECONDARY POWER SUPPLY. Where required by the fire code 
official, In accordance with NFPA 72, the secondary power supply providing a minimum 24~ 
hour power capacity under quiescent load (system operating in a non~alarm condition) shall 
be amended to a m;nimum 72-hour power capacity. 

Exception: The existence of an emergency back-up power supply that meets or exceed 
the requirements of California Fire Code Chapter 12. 

SECTION 907.9 "WHERE REQURIED IN EXISTING BUILDINGS" SHALL BE AMENDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Oi-dinance 2022-09 Page 15 

23-1589 G 18 of 55 



SECTION 907.9 Where Required. An approved fire alarm system shall be provided in existing 
buildings and structures where required In Chapter 11 and in existing buildings with a floor 
area less than 3,600 square feet without an approved automatic sprlnlcler system, other than 
one- or two-family dwe/llng units, agr/cu/tura/ building not under special use permit for 
commercial purposes where a fire alarm detection system does not exist and the floor area of 
the building or structure Is increased 

E}(ception: IM",en the building Increase is less than 500 square feet. 

Chapter 12 

SECTION 1203.1.3 "INSTALLATlON'' SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 1203.1.3 Installation. Emergency power systems and standby power systems shall 
be installed in accordance with the California Building Code, the California Electrical Code, 
NFPA 110 and NFF>A 111. Alf buildings, other than onew and two-family dwelling units, and 
agricultural buiJdings not used for commercial purposes, with standby power, shall have a 
shunt trip device that disconnects all power sources to the building, approved by the fire code 
official. Existing inslal/at/ons shall be maintained In accordance with the original approval. 

Chapter33 

SECTION 3311.3 "PREMISE IDENTIFICATION'' SHALL BE ADDEO AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 3311.3 Premise Identification. Prior to and during construction, an approved 
address sign shall be provided at each fire and emergency vehicle access road entry into the 
project. 

SECTION 3313.1 "WHEN REQUIRED" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 3313.1 When Required. An approved water supply for fire protection, either 
temporary or permanent, shall be shall be installed and maintained In continuous operation as 
soon as combustible building materials arrive on site, the commencement of vertical 
combustible construction and on installation of a standpipe system in buildings under 
construction, in accordance with Sections 3313.2 through 3313.5. 

Exception: The fire code official is authorized to reduce the fire-flow requirements for 
Isolated buildings or a group of buildings in rural areas or small communities where the 
development of full fire-flow requirements is impractical. 

Chapter SO 

SECTION 5001.7 "LIABILITY FOR DAMAGES" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 5001.7 Liability for Damages. Any damages or cost resulting from the negligence, 
violation of the law, careless handling, spill or discharge of any hazardous materials shall 
constitute debt aga;nst any such person, firm or corporation causing such spill or discharge. 
This debt is collectible by the Fire Chief, or his/her duly authorized representative, in the same 
manner as in the case of an obligation under contract, expressed or Implied. 

Ol'di11ance 2022-09 Page 16 

23-1589 G 19 of 55 



Chapter56 

SECTION 5601.2 "PERMIT REQUIRED" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 5601.2 Permit Req'ulred. Permits shall be required as set forth in Section 105.5 and 
regulated in accordance with this section. Where fireworl<s permits are required, they shall be 
Issued by the Fire Chief, or his/her duly authorized representative, and the El Dorado County 
Board of Supervisors. 

Chapter 57 

SECTION 5704.2.9.6.1 "LOCATIONS WHERE ABOVE-GROUND TANKS ARE 
PROHIBITED" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

SECTION 5704.2.9.6.1 Locations Where Above-Ground Tanks are Prohibited. Storage of 
Class I and Class II flammable liquids in above-ground tanks outside of bulldlngs is prohibited 
within the limits estabfished by law as the limits of districts in which such storage is prohibited. 
Storage of Class f and Class II flammable liquids in above~ground tanks outside of buildings is 
prohibfted unless approved by the fire code official. 

SECTION 5706.2.4.4 nLOCATIONS WHERE ABOVE-GROUND TANKS ARE PROHIBITED" 
SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

SECTION 5706.2.4.4 Locations Where Above-Ground Tanks are Prohibited. The storage 
of Class I and Class II liquids in above-ground tanl,s is prohibited within the limits established 
by law as the limits of districts in which such storage is prohibited. Storage of Class I and Class 
JI lfquids in above-ground tanks is prohibited unless approved by the fire code official. 

Chapter58 

SECTION 5806.2 "LIMITATIONS" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

SECTION 5806.2 Limitations. Storage of flammable cryogenic fluids in stationary containers 
outside of buildings Is prohibited within the limits established by \aw as the limits of districts in 
which such storage is prohibited. Storage of flammable cryogenic fluids in stationary containers 
outside of buildings is proMbited unless approved by the fire code official. 

Chapter61 

SECTION 6104.2 "MAXIMUM CAPACITY WITH\N ESTABLISHED LIMITS" SHALL BE 
AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

SECTION 6104.2 Maximum Capacity within Established Limits. Within the limits 
established by law restricting the storage of liquefied petroleum gas for the protection of heavily 

Ordinance 2022-09 Page 17 

23-1589 G 20 of 55 



populated or congested areas, the aggregate capacity of any one installation shall not exceed 
a water capacity of 2,000 gallons. The storage of liquefied petroleum gas in excess of an 
aggregate of 2,000-gallon water capacity when located at /east one-half (112) mile from 
property zoned or des;gnated for residential use and at least one-half (112) mile from existing 
resident/al development with a density greater than one (1) dwelling unit per acre and at /east 
one-half (112) mile from any hotel or motel Is allowed when approved by the fire code official, 
and a special/conditional use permit Is issued by the County of £I Dorado. 

Dispensing within established limits. Within the limits established by law restricting the 
dispensing of liquefied petroleum gas for the protection of heavily populated or congested 
areas, the aggregate capacity of any one installation shall not exceed a water capacity of 2,000 
gallons. The dispensing of liquefied petroleum gas in excess of an aggregate of 2,000•gallon 
water capacity when located at least one-half (112) mile from property zoned or designated for 
residential use and at least one-half (112) mile from any hotel or motel is allowed when 
approved by the fire code official and a specJal/conditional use permft is issued by the County 
of £1 Dorado. 

Chapter 80 

SECTION 80, NFPA 1-22, CHAPTER 22 "AUTOMOTIVE WRECKING YARDS" IS ADOPTED, 
AMENDED SECTIONS AS FOLLOWS: 

Revise Section 22.3 as follows: 

22.3 Fire department access roads shall be in accordance with the Ca~ifomia Fire Code, 
Section 503 and Appendix D. 

Add new Section 22.10 as follows: 

22.10 Stored vehicles, boats, recreational vehicles, parts, and equipment shall not be stored 
within 30 feet of adjacent property lines. 

SECTION 80, NFPA, 13D-22 - "STANDARD FOR THE INSTALLATION OF SPRINKLER 
SYSTEMS IN ONE-AND TWO FAMILY DWELLINGS AND MANUFACTURED HOMES" IS 
AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 903.3.1,3, 903.3.5.1.1 

NFPA 1301 Amended Sections as follows~ 

Add new Section 4,6 as follows: 

4.6 Residential Dre sprinkler systems installed in all new one~and two-family dwe({ings shall utlllze 
a "Passive Purge" system design unless o(herwise approved by the fire code official. 

Exception: Manufactured home installed, tested and approved by the Cafifornia 
Department of Housing and Community Development. 

Revise Sectlo11 5.1.1 .2 as follows: 

Ordinance 2022-09 Page 18 

23~1589 G 21 of 55 



5.1.1,2 A supply of at least one of each type and temperature sprinkler used witMn the premises 
shall be maintained on the prope1ty at an approved focation. Spare sprinklers shall be kept in a 
mounted and accessible cabinet. 

Revise Section 7.6 as follows: 

7 .6 A local audio/visual device activated upon water flow shall be provided on all fire sprinkler 
systems in homes at an approved location on the exterior of the dwelling. 

Revise Section 11.2.1.1 as follows: 

11.2.1.1 Where a fire department pumper connection is not provided, the system shall be 
hydrostatica\ly tested at a minimum pressure of 150 pounds per square inch gauge for no less 
than a 30-m;nute duration without evidence of leakage. Such test shall be witnessed by the fire 
code official. 

Appendix B - Fire Flow Requirements for Buildings 

TABLE B105.1(1) "REQUIRED FIRE FLOW FOR ONE- AND TWO-FAMILY DWELLINGS, 
GROUP R-3, AND R-4 BUILDINGS AND TOWNHOUSES" SHALL BE AMENDED AS 
FOLLOWS; 

TABLE B105.1(1) REQUlRED FlRE FLOW FOR ONE-ANO TWO-FAMlLY DWELLINGS, 
GROUP R-3, AND R-4 BUILDINGS AND TOWNHOUSES 

(PLEASE NOT/; THAT TABLE B105.1(1l lNCLUDl:S A SEPABATI: SECTION FOR SPRINKU:RED RI!SIDf:NCES WITH LESSER FIRE 
FLOW REQUIREMENTS NOT MENTIONl:D fN THIS AMENDED SECTIDNI 

FIRE-FLOW AUTOMATIC MINIMUM FIRE- FLOW DURATION 
CALCULATION SPRINKLER SYSTEM FLOW (hours) 

AREA (Design Standard) (gallons per 
(sauare feet) minute} 

0-3,600 No automatic sprinkler 1,000 1 
system 

3,601 and greater No automatic sprinkler Value in Table Duration in Table 

system 8105.1(2) 8105.1{2) at the 
required fire-flow 

rate 

MAJOR SUBDIVISIONS (5 PARCELS OR GREATER) 

0-3,600 Section 903.3.1.3 of the 1,000 1 

CA Fire Code or Section 
313.3 of the CA 
Residential Code 

3,601 and greater Section 903.3.1.3 of the 1/2 value of 

CA Fire Code or Section Table B105.1(2) 2 
313.3 of the CA (min. 1000 

Residential Code GPM) 

Ordinance 2022-0 91 Page 19 

23-1589 G 22 of 55 



OTHER RESIDENTIAL DEVELOPMENT 

0 -3,600 Section 903.3.1.3 of the 500 1 
CA Fire Code or Section 
313.3 of the CA 
Residential Code 

3,601 and greater Section 903.3.1.3 of the 1/2 value of Table ·1 

CA Fire Code or Section B105.1(2) (min. 
313.3 of the CA 750 GPM) 
Resident!al Code 

TABLE B105.2 nREQUIRED FIRE FLOW FOR BUILDINGS OTHER THAN ONE-AND 
TWO-FAMILY DWELLINGS, GROUP R-3, AND R-4 BUILDINGS AND 
TOWNHOUSES" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

TABLE B105.2 REQUIRED FIRE FLOW FOR BUILDINGS OTHER THAN ONE· 
AND TWO-FAMILY DWELLINGS, GROUP R-3, AND R-4 BUILDINGS AND 

TOWNHOUSES 

AUTOMATIC MINIMUM FIRE• FLOW DURATION 

SPRINKLER SYSTEM FLOW (hours) 

{Design Standard) (gallons per minute) 

No automatic sprinkler Value rn Table Duration in Table 8105.1{2) 
system B105.1(2) 

Section 903.3.1.1 of the 25% of the value in Duration in Table B105.1 (2) at 
CA Fire Code Table B105.1(2)b the reduced flow rate 

b. The reduced fire flow shall not be less than 1,500 GPM 

Appendix D - Fire Apparatus Access Roads 

SECTION D103.1 "ACCESS ROAD WIDTH WITH A HYDRANT" SHALL BE AMENDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section D103.1 Access Road Width with a Hydrant. Where a flre hydrant is located on a 
fire apparatus access road, the minimum road width shall be 26 feet (7925 mm), exclusive of 
shoulders (see Figure D103.1 ). 

Exception: Driveways 

SECTION D103.2 "GRADEn SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

SECTION 0103.2 Grade. Fire apparatus access roads and driveways shall not exceed 15.9% 
in grade unless approved by the fire code official or by the El Dorado County amended 
California Public Resource Code Title 14 I Design and Improvement Standards Manual. 

Ordinauce 2022~09 Page20 

23-1589 G 23 of 55 



SECTION D103.3 "TURNING RADIUS" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

SECTION D103.3 Turning Radius. The minimum turning radius shall be determined by the 
fire code official; and shall not include curb and gutter. 

SECTION D103.5 "FIRE APPARATUS ACCESS ROAD GATES" SHALL BE AMENDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

SECTION 0103,5 Fire Apparatus Access Road Gates. Gates securing the fire apparatus 
access roads shall comply with all of the following criteria: 

1. Where a single gate is provided, the gate width shall be not less than 20 feet (6096 mm). 
Where a fire apparatus road consists of a divided roadway, the gate width shall be not less 
than 15 feet (3658 mm). 

2. Gates shall be of the horizontal swing, horizontal slide, vertical lift, or vertical pivot type. 

3. Construction of gates shall be of materials that allow manual operation by one person. 

4, Gate components shall be maintained In an operative condition at all times and replaced 
or repaired when defective. 

5. Electric gates shall be equipped with a means of opening the gate by fire department 
personnel for emergency access. Emergency opening devices shall be approved by the 
fire code official. 

6. Methods of locking shall be submitted for approval by the fire code official. 

7. Electric gate operators, where provided, shall be listed in accordance with UL 325, 

8. Gates intended for automatic operation shall be designed, constructed. and Installed to 
comply with the requirements of ASTM F2200. 

SECTION D103.6.1 "ROADS 20 TO 29 FEET IN WIDTH" SHALL BE AMENDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

SECTION 0103,6.1 Roads 20 to 29 feet in width. Fire lane signs, as specified in Section 
D 103. 6 shall be posted on both sides of fire apparatus access roads that are 20 to 29 feet wide 
(6096 to 8534.4 mm). 

SECTION D103.6.2 "ROADS MORE THAN 29 FEET IN WIDTH" SHALL BE AMENDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

SECTION D103,6.2 Roads more than 29 feet in Width. Fire lane signs, as specified in 
Section D103.6, shall be posted on one side offire apparatus access roads more than 29 feet 
wide (8534.4 mm) and less than 36 feet wide (10972.8 mm). 

SECTION 0104.4 "CIRCUMFERENTIAL FIRE APPARATUS ACCESS ROADS" SHALL BE 
ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

SECTION D104.4 Circumferential Fire Apparatus Access Roads. When required by the 
fire code official, a fire apparatus access road shall be cons'tructed to encompass the entirety 
of a structure and shall provide a continuous means of emergency vehicle access. 

Ordinance 2022-09 Page21 

23-1589 G 24 of 55 



SECTION 4: CONFLICT 

That Ordinance No. 2019-09 of the MFPD and all other ordinances or parts of ordinances 

herewith are hereby repealed. 

SECT(ON 5: SEVERABILITY 

If any Ordinance, article, subsection or subdivision thereof, provision, sentence, clause, or 

phrase of this code, or any application thereof, Is for any reason held to be invalld by a court of 

competent jurisdiction, such decision shall not affect the remaining provisions of this code, 

which can be given effect without the invalid portions and, therefore, such invalid portions are 

declared to be severable. The MFPD hereby declares that it would have enacted this Ordinance 

and each of its articles, sections, subsections, or subdivisions thereof, provisions, sentences, 

clauses, or phrases, irrespective of the fact that one or more of them is declared invalid. 

SECT&ON 6: EFFECTIVE DATE AND PUBLICATION 

This Ordinancia ~hall. take effect thirty (30) days after its adoption. The MFPD Board Secretary 

is directed to publish this Ordinance ln a newspaper of general circulation In the District. In lieu 

of publication of the fun text of the Ordinance, a summary of the Ordinance may be published 

by the by the Board Secretary within fifteen (~ 5) days after its passage and a certified copy 

shall be posted in the office of the MFPD pursuant to Government Code Section 36933(c) (1). 

The above Ordtnance was introduced at a meeting ot the Board ot Directors of the MI--PD on 

December 22, 2022. and It was then read for the first time. A public hearing was set for the 

Ordinance to be read for the second time on January 26, 2023, and approved by the followlng 

vote: 

Ordi11ance 2022-09 Page 22 

23-1589 G 25 of 55 



PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of Directors of the MFPD this, 

January, 2023. 

AYES: 

NOES~ 

ABSENT: 

ABSTAIN:_ 

ATTEST: 

, Board President 

Sharlyn Fields , Board Secretary 

Ordinance 2022-09 

26th day of 

Page23 

23-1589 G 26 of 55 



RESOLUTION 22-10 

A RESOLUTION OF THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS OF THE 
MOSQUITO FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT 

ADOPTING FINDINGS SUPPORTING AMENDMENTS TO 
THE CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE 

A resolution for the Mosquito Fire Pl'Otection District setting forth findings with respect to 
local conditions within the Fire District which make certain modifications and changes to 
the Califomia Fire Code reasonably necessru')' for preserving fire and life safety in the 
Mosquito Fh'e Protection Distdct 

The Governing Board of the Mosquito Fire Protection District finds and resolves as 
follows: 

WHEREAS, Health & Safety Code Section 17958.5 permits a Fire Protection 
District to adopt an ordinance which changes or modifies the State Housing regulations 
adopted pursuant to Health & Safety Code Section 17922 upon determination that such 
changes or modifications are necessary due to local conditions that pertain regulations 
governing conditions hazardous to life, property and the environment from fire, explosion, 
hazardous materials and hazardous uses; and 

WHEREAS, Health & Safety Code Section 17958.7 requites that a District's Board 
of Directors making any changes or modifications pul'sttant to Health & Safety Code 
Section 17958.S shall make express finding that such changes or modifications are needed; 
and shall file a copy of such changes or modifications with the Department of Housing and 
Community Development. 

WHEREAS, the unique local cJimatic, geological, and topographical conditions 
existing within the boundaries of the District make it reasonably necessary for the District to 
impose more stringent requirements than set forth in the California Fire Code and pursuant 
to California Health and Safety Code sections 13869.7 and 17958.7, the District 
desires to make express findings to that effort 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that the Board of Directors of the 
Mosquito Fire Protection District, after having duly noticed and held public heatings, hereby 
adopts the following find1ngs concerning curl'ent unique local conditions that 
together make each modification to the California Fire Code, reasonably necessary to 
provide adequate and effective protection of life, propei.ty and the environment more 
specifically set fotth as follows: 

23-1589 G 27 of 55 



FINDINGS OF FACT 
FOR CHANGES OR MODIFICATIONS TO THE STATE BUILDING 

STANDARDS CODE (TITLE 24 PART 9) BECAUSE OF LOCAL 
CONDITIONS 

A. General. 

After due consideration, the Board of Directors of the Mosquito Fire Protection District, 
hereby finds that d1.,e to local climatic, geologic and topographic conditions, as stated within 
this document, there is a need to provide the modifications and change contained in the 
adoptive Ordinance of the California Fire Code. Sllch changes are deemed to be reasonably 
necessary to provide adequate and effective protection of life, property, and the 
environment. 

The Mosquito Fire Prntection District provides fire protection, emergency medical 
services, and specialized rescue services to approximately 2,500 people in a 13 square mile 
area. The District is located on the Western slope of El Dorado County. The 
topography of the District ranges from rolling hills of grass, oak woodland, large 
quantities ofbmsh, and steep drainages. The weather conditions vary from freezing 
temperatures with occasional snow in winter, to summer temperatures that regularly 
exceed 100 degrees. 

The Mosquito Fire Protection Distdct is an "all-1·isk" agency. The District participates in a 
sophisticated mutual aid program and is dispatched through agreement by the California 
Depaitment of Forestry and Fire Protection (Cal-Fire) at Camino. The resources of the 
District will respond to, and deal with, any type of emergency. The term "Fire 
Protection" in this document is broad and includes responses to fires, smoke, and odor 
investigations, alarms, public assist calls, hazardous materials incidents, medical aid, and 
specialized rescues. 

The District has one staffed fire station to provide emergency service to the community. Fire 
Station 75 is located at 8801 Rock Creek Road. The District has 2 full-time, career 
personnel, along with 1 part time management position, and these are supplemented with a 
volunteer Assistant Chief, Engine Company Officers and Firefighters. 

B. CJimatic. 

The Mosquito Fire Protection District is located within a foothill region. The District is 
subject to fotu· seasons, with an annual snowfall in the winter months of 2-4 inches, in 
addition to an average rainfall of 39 inches per year. These adverse weather conditions 
create severe hazardous road conditions and flooding as well as 1·ocks1ide hazards along the 
main access roads within, as well as into, the District from the surrounding areas. Due to 
periods of rainfall, along with repeated road closures, the ability of the Fire Protection 

-2-

23-1589 G 28 of 55 



District to pl'Ovide immediate emergency response is often delayed. These same adverse 
climatic conditions often 1·esult in a large numbel' of vehicular accidents that place 
extreme restraints on the availability of emergency response to perform emei.-gency 
1-escue, fil'St aid, hazardous materials conb-ol, and firefighting. The climatic conditions 
often result in a substantial or total lack of ability of the Fire Protection District to 
respond immediately to other tyPes of emergency situations that occur. Examples of these 
emergency situations include structure fires, wildland and forest fires, flooding, 
hazardous materials incidents, emergency medical calls, vehicle accidents, and vertical 
rescues. The mutual aid agreements established with adjoining fire agencies might not be 
possible due to adverse climatic conditions, restricting or totally blocking access into the 
District. 

Summary: 

These local climatic conditions affect the acceleration, intensity, and size of fires in the Fire 
District. Times of little or no rainfall, low humidity, and high temperatures create 
extremely hazardous conditions, particulady as they relate to the wildland-urban 
interface. Winds experienced in this area can have a significant impact upon structure fires, 
especially in buildings in close proximity to one another, and to wildla11ds 
commonly found in the Mosquito Fire Pl'Otection District. Structures built within the 
Mosquito Fire Protection District must be built with these variables in mind 

C. Geological. 

The Mosquito Fire Protection District is located within moderate seismic Zone Three. The 
seismic, geological conditions present a potential for multiple fires, major breakage of water 
mains, multiple electrical power failures, multiple collapsed structures and a large number 
of calls for emergency medical aid, all ofwhicb may occur simultaneously during a seismic 
event. The water district has numerous water-pumping systems used for fire suppression 
water delivery, as well as water storage tanks providing water system pressure. Most of the 
pumping systems are dependent on electdcal power for operation. Such. electrical power 
may not be available during a seismic event. Water storage tanks used for storage of 
1-equired fire suppression water may also collapse in such an event forcing the additional 
need to transport water via additional pieces of fire apparatus which will place a significant 
restraint on the ability of the District to provide the required emergency services. 

Summary: 

Local geographic and geological features and pl'Ocesses exist within the boundaries of the 
Districts that may hamper the ability of the Mosquito Fire Protection District to perform its 
sworn duties. Fi.re following an earthquake has the potential of causing gi-eater loss of life 
and damage than the earthquak~ itself. 

-3-

23-1589 G 29 of 55 



D. Topographical. 

The District is primarily composed of areas that are considered by the State to be high fire 
hazard severity zones. Mt1ch of the hill is located within foothill te1Tain, covered with highly 
combustible vegetation, including the presence of many coniferous forested areas. The 
elevation within the District ranges from approximately 800 feet to over 3200 feet at the 
highest point. Slope within the District ranges from Oto 90 degrees. The structures within 
the areas of the foothill's terrain have very limited fire access, due to narrow 
roadways with steep grades and pool' road smface conditions. The presences of many 
existing structures within the high fire severity zone areas pi-ovides for a very high 
potential of a structure fire spreading into a wildland or forest fire condition as well as the 
potential for a wildland or forest fire spreading to structul'es. 

Summary: 

The alignment of canyons, valleys, and slopes into inhabited areas, combined with the 
variable nature of the terrain, yield potential for increased fire risk. Most su-uctures, both 
residential and commercial, al.'e in or are surrounded by areas that contain significant grass. 
brush, mixed oak woodland, and mixed conifer fuel load. Due to drought 
conditions, beetle infestations, and lack of vegetation management, much of the area is 
populated with either dead or dying trees, contributing to extreme fire danger. 

E. Conclusion 

Local climatic, geographic, and topographic conditions described above increase the 
frequency, intensity, and size of fires involving bLliklings in the Fire District. Fu11her, these 
conditions impact potential damage to str\\ctures from an earthquake and 
subsequent fire. Therefore, it is reasonably necessary that the California Fire Code be 
modified to mitigate the effects of the above conditions. Califomia Health & Safety Code 
Section 17958.7 requires that modifications to the Fire Code be expressly marked and 
identified as to which each finding refers to which Code modification. The attached 
Appendix A provides this connection. 

-4-

23-1589 G 30 of 55 



PASSED AND ADOPTED at a regular meeting of the Board of Directors of the 
Mosquito Fire Protection District on January 26, 2023 by the following roll call vote: 

AYES: 

NOES: 

ABSENT: 

ABSTAIN: 

ATTEST: BY: 

Sharlyn Fields, Board Clerk Don Stever, Board President 

-5-

23-1589 G 31 of 55 



MOSQUITO FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT 

j2022 CFC Code Section Title Adopted Armmdetl Added D,!leted Fi,zding 

01.1 cncral X 
1l\dmi11is trativc 

02.6- 102.12 l-\pplicahility X l~\dministrative 

04.1 utics and \ !Administrative 

l·\.dminist:·ati\';-- - - -- - -

--1----~-!--'I_ ___ _ 

.\ - ~ - - _ _ l\dministrati\'c 

X . . . . ':--- -,t dministrative 

X I I l~ 1i_n_b-·ti-·:-1t_h_·c-----

04.3-104.4 

04.6 
04.8-104.8.2 

04.9 

fficial Records 

04.JJ - 104.12.3 l•irc ---1----x-1 - ,- - L•\dministrntivc 

!Investigation 
1------- ----t-------1 

~rinw oi' X 1 .. ____ I ____ ~ ·I' d 111inistr,1ti\•c 05.2.3 
!Applica tion 1----- ------i,......:..;:..__-----: ._ _ ____ ____ _ _ 
extensions ~ I_,_ I I ___ ~dministrativc 05.3.2 

05.5 
•crmits 
pcrutional H IAclministrnti\'c 

1---------~..------L • \ 11 f om oh i lc .\ \dmini~tra tive 

l\Vrcckinl! Yards 
1---------1---..;.___ _ ~----·----- --

1-o_s_._6---- ---1~::_.,~_::_·~:.:ction ___ J __ .. ___ L. _ _ ~ __ I _ ____ j ~(dmin.: rat_i:~- - -

05.5.55 

05.6.25 ! \utomobilc I j I XI ! \ d m i11 ist rniiw 

1--------- -~.Vrccldug Ynrcb_J~ ... _ __ L .. - ·· .. ____ _ !_._ ____ ________ _ 
l-o_s_._6._9 ____ ___ f!,_,_11!_·l_C_c_u __ ___ _ I_ __ - ~J__ I l ___ l\_c_h_11_i,_1i_, 1_r_a_ti_,c_· _____ _ 

05.6.12 laz1mlot1:. l X ~ \ ilmiuistrntive 
ntci-ials ~---- ---~~-- - --- -

05.17 l~'l:mt Ex.traction I X \_ _ _____ --··- - · ___ ;:\llmini~lrativc: 

05.JX '})ri.·ull' Vire I \'. l l1\<lminisn·nti\1c 

+------ - ----;ltly~l:imt~- ------- _ _ ··- __ . ····--· _ ... 1._ ________ _ _ _J _ _ __ _ ______ ____ _ 
05.19 'mokc Control ----- x_J_ - -- · - · l ___ _ I l,;\ dmh_,_h_t,_·n_t_h_·,· _ _ ____ _ 

05.6.21 'pedal Event X I t !Administrnth•c 

-1----------l-·-tr_u_c_n_u~c - - - - ---- --- -·- - - _______ _J ·- - ----
05.6.22 , 'prnying 01· XJ IAtlministrutivc 

ippiu~ 
05.6.23- - - - --!t-t.:mdpi1;-t,---1l··- - --:--x 1··· - · · ·- · ·1·· ..... !Aclmlnistrntivc 

,.._ _______ --1 ystcms _ _ . 

Resolution No: 2022-10 

23-1589 G 32 of 55 



MOSQUITO FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT 

2022 CFC Code Section Title ,.fi/apted Ame11decl Ad,tetl Deleted Fi11di1tg 
--i-- - ----------_;;;,_ _ __ _ 

105.6.24 fems X IAdministl'ath•c 

IConstrnctiou X \dministra riv1! 

Dm·m111:nts I 
1----------1.-.------1 --- --11------ -· ---:---- - ------ -------

1-1_0_7._.1 ______ --11-F_cc_·s_· - ----+---X-11---- - -+--- --+--- - '·-'d_,_11_i1_ii_~_tr_·:1_ti_v_t· _____ _ 

1-1_0_7_.s _______ -11-R_clntcd Fees _ _ _ __. _ ___ ::<, 1--- - - -~\dministr_a_ti_v_c ______ _ 
107.5.1 Cost Recovery X dmini:.t rativc 
1------- ----11------;_-+--- -·- - --t----l.,__---+----------- -
J0l.6 Refunds X Allministr..itivc ----~- ---+----+-------------
107.7 Administrative :,; Administrative 

I 06. l - W6.4 

!Costs 
1----- -----11----------1---~ -½-----4-----t----+------------
Sectio11 J(J8 lns1>cctions X Administrative 
1Sectio11 /09 Maintenance X ••• - -- ----~\dministrntiv_c _ _ _ _ _ _ 

1-l_l_l_.S _____ _ -.;1-,\""'p_p_1•_al_s _ _ __ 
4 
___ -+-----.....:.-----==-X...;1----rt\_d_1_11_i1_u_st_r_a _ti_vt_' _____ _ 

112.4 \'iol:1tim1 X ~\dmiuistrativc 

Penalties \ i---------i----.------------

1-

/_J_i_.4_. 1 _ _ ____ -4--,A_l_m_t~_~x_n_cn_t_· 0_1_·_ - -+--- -X-1-----1--
1
_. \ cl minisrrnti \'c 

Violations _ 

< '.i1ations ~ .\clminh1r:1ti\'c 112.4.2 - ---
Stop Work l Administn tivc 

Order 
1-1-1-3-.4 ______ _..;1-F-n_iI_u_rl! ~----· - - .. - ,.. X I _, ____ \·\dmiuist rnth•i~ 

Comply 

:::::::::::::::::""' __ 1-_-_~--...:_c..._.;.. ___ -_-_-_:_-I_,__· - ---· ~ - -- -·------ -='-- --1-------- - ----~---=_- __ -.... 

Sectio11 114 Unsafe X •'.dministrati"c 

Section ll.J 

Strncturcs ~--- - -----·-- - -------- · -
,_2_0_2 _ ______ -+-n_1•_fi_n_it_11_11_1s___ X - 1----1-----~· \_d_n_11_·n_is_·t_r :_1t_iv_c_' _____ _ 
Section 302 lkfinitiou~ _, ____ Administrntivc 

""s_c_c-ti-on-3-03 ____ __._A_1-_p_h_a_Jt-Kettlci:: l ·· · ·· ·· · - - · - -- ·--- - ~~!· A2. AJ. Bl , B:!. 83. B4, B5, 

Ddinitious 1- ·· • .. • -· • X ·-- i--··--- 'j,\dmini:-;iratiYc •• 

C'ombnsHhl~· f ~·' ~/·\.I. A2, A3, B-1-. 1-3--2.- 13-3-. -B-4-, -B-5. 

\vustc I ~6 

========-=--=--=-------. - -+--1- ------- --- - - - -- ,-- ----- -- -

-----+---!----+------------

302.l 
Section .304 

Resolution No: 2022-10 

23-1589 G 33 of 55 



MOSQUITO FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT 

2022 CFC Code Sectim, Title Adopted Amemle,I Adtled Deleted Findiu~ 

I.section 305 Ignition Sources X Al, A2, A~, Bl, B2. B3. 84, BS, 
86 

Section 30<, :\Jofioll rictun• X Bl , B2. ID. B-k BS, B6 
lsectioo 307 Open Buming 

1307.4.4 O pl'll Buroln:,: \ I. A2, AJ, Ul . 132. B3. B4, BS. 

1~(1 

Section 30~ IOprn Flames 

B<1 

--:\--1----...j,----1----i,.\ l. A2, A3, l3L 82. 83. H4, ;~s,1 

1----------+------- -1- - ---1~----;----;;--- I 
;>owcrcd X . \ 1. A2, /\3, Ill, 82. BJ. B-1. BS.' Section 309 
lnduso-i:tl 
I r11cks 

86 

1----------------1----t•- ---+----+----1--------- ------
Smokiug Section 310 A l, ,\2, AJ. Bl, P.2. B3. B4, U5., 

Bh 
1-------- -1--------+----1•- - ---i-----+----t-----------1 

:\1, A2, A3, Bl, B2. 83. B4t BS, Section 311 \'acant Premises X 

1----------·- - ---.--~ 
tm Printing Section 320 

Section 321 Artifida l 

V (•~t:ta t ion 

403.2 - 403.;?.4 

~03.6- 403.6.1.4 Group I•' 

.J03.'J - 403.'J.3.4 

503.2,6 

503.3.l No Parkin~ -
Fire 1,imc~ 

1503.3.2 

m, 
B l, B2. B3. 84, 85, B6 

\i°: A2, A.:1, Bl. 82. 8 3. B4, US 
86 

JH, 
- - -----.,----- -

Al, A2, A3, Bl, B2. B3. B4. BS 
Un 

No Pnrlting

l•'irc Hydrants 
----------------·-- - -=-1-------1- --i------------·-

23-1589 G 34 of 55 



MOSQUITO FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT 

2022 CFC Code Sectio11 Title . 1,wpt<!d Ametttfl!il Atl,leti Deleted Fiutli11g 

503.3-1 flrc Lane Width X ,\ i. Al , A3, Bl, B2. B3. B4. BS, 
Bo 

503.6 Security Gates X •. \ 1, A2, A3, Bl , B2. B3. B4, B5i 

Bn ::j 
SOS.I Addn:s~ X .\ I A2, A3, Bl, 82. fB . B.i. BS. 

B6 

507,5.1 Where Required s. Al , A2, A3, Bl, B2. B3. B4, BS, 

!- Flrc I lydnmts lH> 

509.3 liil'(' Control X ' H , U:?. B.3. B4, BS, B6 

Rooms 
-· ___ 1B1, 82. B3. B4, BS, B6 

- - -
807.5.2 G roup I( X ·-·-- - - - ·-
903.2 Where Req uired '.\ 

1

.\ 1, A2, A3, BL B2. 8 3. B-'. 85 

- fire Spri11Jdc1·s 1'(1 

~03.2.1.1 Group A X --

1

1.~1-:-A2, A3, Bl, IB. B3. 84, 85. 
t i{) 

- 1-· 
. ---· . ··-

l\ I, A2, A3. Bl , B2. B3. R4, B5 903.2. t .2 Group A-2 X 
H6 ----· - - - -·- - - -

903.2.l.3 IG r 1111p A-3 X 1
, l, A2, AJ, Bl, H2. B:t B4. B5 

. 1136 

903.2.l.4 Group A-4 ---·-·E·-- X - -· Al, A2, A3, Bl, B2. 83. 84, BS 
86 

·-- ~ , 

903.2.3 Group E X IA 1, A2, A3, Bl , 82. B3. B4, RS. 

ls6 
903.2.4 Group (q I I X - ------ ·1r:·•~~, AZ, A3, BI, 82. 83. B4, 115

1 903.2.7 
·--.. ---·-··--- -•--·-·---- --··1 .. -- - - .. - --- -- ----- A I, Al, A3, Bl, B2. B3. B-t, B5, 

Group !\-~-----=_J·- __ J=-_}_.. X __ B6 

!903.2.7.2 Group M • I X ____ ,.)AI . A2, A3, Bl,B2. HJ . 84,l>:•, 

~?Htll'C!'iSl!S ____ [B6 

Resolution No: 2022~03 

23-1589 G 35 of 55 



l 
11 

1 

1 

MOSQUITO FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT 

1022 CFC Cvdc.Sectio111 Title Adopted Amerulerl A dder/ Deleted Fimli11g 

903.2.8.5 1\1 :.mufaclurcd 
Homes 

903.2.9 Groul' S-1 

903.2.10 Group S-2 

-\ 1, A2, A3, Bl , B2, 
B3, 8 4, B5,H6 

X A 1, A2. AJ, HJ, n;?. B3. IU, BS 

I 

I 

ls6 
----:---x --- -- - --·1.,1, A2,.\J ,m.nz. BJ. B-l, 1~5, 

IB6 
,---------+------~---+------1-
903.2.10.1 P:1rldng Garages X l

1
.\ 1,A2, A3, Bl, 82. 8 3. B4, D5.I 
Bh 

CJ0J.2.22 (;rnup B - - • r 7--- ,--. -~ I~,~· A2, AJ, m, B2. B3. 84, BS, 

1--------1------ ,_ - :- - -• - ·f-- - . -------------- t=-- , t~: · A1, A3, m, B2. BJ. 84, HS. 903.2.23 

903.6 \\ here Rc<Juircd X !,\ 1, Al, A:i, Bl, rn. B3. H4, BS, 
I 

1--------~( _f_'i1_·c_s.;:.·p_r i11klcrs __ _ _ __ _ _ ___ !,_H_6 _____ _ " __ _ 
Where Required X Al , A2, A3, Bl, B2. B3. 84, BS, !)07.2 

907.2.l.4 

907.2.2-1 

907.2.3.U 

:/07.Z.4. r 

907.2.5.2 

907.2.6.6 

IJ<J 7.l. 7.Z 

907.2.8.4 

- Fire Ahlrm 
Systems 

Resolution No: 2022-10 

86 

23-1589 G 36 of 55 



MOSQUITO FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT 

2022 CFC Code Sectimt Title Adopted Ament/et! Added Deleted Fi11di1tg 

1----- ----1------ - -+-- - - - - •- l---4---!- --- - ---------{ 
< ;ro1111 R-2, R- ) !·\ 1, A2, AJ, 01. B2. BJ. 84, B:5 907.2.9.4 
2. 1. R-2.2 B6 

1--------..i------- 4-----4----l•---._---+-------- - - --I 
Croup S \ ,\ l, A2, A3, Bl, 82. B3. B4. 85, 907.2.JO.l 

Un 

907.2.30 Type I Hoods Bl. B2. fS3. 84, BS. Bo 
!---------+--'~ --- - - - - ----- - - - ---
907.6.5 Monitoring Bl, B2. B3. B4. 85, B6 
1------- ---1--- -____;,:,_ _ _ - --1----~----4------1.___: _ ____ ____; ___ --l 
907.6.2.l Sccondar)' Power l t\l , A2, A3, m. m. 83. B4, HS. 

Surply l'.!h 
1-9-07-.-9------+W--=-)1..:.c,...:·c- l-k-•q_u_il_·e-d~-----4------4----1·---!l,\

6

J, A2, A3, Bl, B2. 83. B4, BS 
- l•'irc Alarm jB 

t-S-c-ct-io_n_ll_O_l ___ -+(.- ;-l'l-l C_r_11I_____ - • • X -· --+--- - l\ 1. A2, A3, n"1, B2. B3. B4, B5,l 

lllh 
1---------1-------~·- - - - ------ ---1----!------ -------1 

I

. \ I. 1\2. A.J, Bl. B2. B:t 84, HS 

86 

'i 

xl 
\ 

\. 

Section 1102 X 

Rcspondc1· •• --X-.-i----~ - --+i- -- lAl, .t\2, A3, Bl, 82. 83. B4, 85, 

Conmnmication 86 
1----------1-- - ---·-- - --· - - - - - --':----i--- - -·-------

Sprinlclcr X ,\ t, AZ, A3, m , B2. B3. B4, .R5. 

1103.2 

1103.5 - 1103.S.5 
Systems B6 

1----------i...:;----- -4----ll--·- ·- c....•- - il- - - 1--- - ---- - ___ ...., 
Fire Alurm ~ IL\ L A2, A3, BI, B2. B3. 84. BS 
~ystcms m, 

1---------1....:----- -,---- · - ·- ----· -1--------------- -----1 
Smoke Alunus X j''!..l,A2, A3, lH, BZ. B3. 84, BS, 

1103.7- 1103.7.9. IO 

1103.8 - 1103.8.5.3 
jB6 

fl03.9- l 103JU 

Ruso\ulion No: 2022-10 

23-1589 G 37 of 55 



MOSQUITO FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT 
·-

12022 CFC Code Sectirm Title A tloJJtt1tl Amended Added Deleted Filldillf: 

5001.7 Lfobility for t r dministrativc 
Damages 

15601.2 Permit RcouirccJ X 1Admiuistr:ttivc 

5704.2. 9 .6.1 Locations- X A 1, A2, A3, B l, B2. 83. 84, 85 

!Above Gnmud r.(l 

franks 

15706.2.4.4 jLocation~ - X I·, i, A2, A3, Bl , R2. BJ. B..t, B3 
IAhovr Crrouml 

r() 
T:mks 

15806.2 
----- 1 f. \ l , A2, A3, BI, 132. B3. R4, RS Limitations .'\: 

W, 

610-U l\faximum X 

\

A I, A2, A3, Bl, B2. 8 3. 84, BS, 
C, ':tp;ld(\ :!h 

·-· --·-·· ·- ~ 

I" l -1 ;_, 1. A2.A\ B l. 1n.. BJ. n-t. ns. IChnptc1· 80 {cfo1•cnccd X 
Stundards ~',(, 

Appendix B Ffrc Flow - l -r X l l \Al, A2, A3, Bl, B2. B3. B4, 85, 
l'ablc BIOS.I (1) Residential 1H6 

-:-7- ··-- l .. ·- .F ... -
Appcndb: fl Fin.• f'low - X r \ 1, A2, ,\3, BJ, en. B3. o.i, o.=;, 

[ommcrcial _ l'ablc B 105.2 "$() 

\.ppcnclix D 7ii'rc Appai·utu:;: r ·--~--- i""-1, A2, A.3 , Bl, B2. BJ. B-l, B5, 

!Access Roads !Bb 

Appendix D, !Access Road 

1 
--1--- x -r-1 ---i~~!· A2, A3, Bl. B2. 133. B4, ns.

1 1>103.1 !Width 
•\ppcnrlix D, --- - r=;;·:tth· l f

. X 7 T l,\I,A2,A3,Bl, B2. B3. 84, BS,j 
0103.2 I l{(l 

·r ·---- ·- - ·· ·-- 1 - -1 - -

1---r---
1
~~~· A2. A3. Bl . 132. BJ. B-1, 8 5.

1 
Appendix D, ru,ning Radius X 
0103.3 

- • 1~;,t~ v ---

I I I I Appendix D, X lAl, AZ, AJ, Bl, B2. U3. B-4, BS, 

0103.5 I :M, 

!Fire Laue --- r 
- . - ----- - - -----~ -·-- --

A)JJ>cndix 0 1 X 
I

·,\ I, A2, .\ 3, Bl , B2. BJ, B..J, 85, 

D103.6.1 [Markin~ Bh 

~ 
- -·- ----·-1--[Appendix D, Fire Lane X 

\

·\l , A2, ,\3.Dl , DZ. 83. 8..J,B~~ 

ID103.6.2 Marking 136 

~ppcndix D, Circumlercntial I X r 7 \•' l, A2, AJ , Dl, B2. BJ. B-l, 8 5, 

D104.4 Fire Access :Bb 
- - ---

Resolution No: 2022- I (J 

23-1589 G 38 of 55 



tO>ICWO, DSP, U:F, CPCSD, PF~D. RfPO Mll'D 

S1gnd1c:int 
Wt-:u I,: lhc ChJnse? 

Loc~ll~ adopled I s=r., adop'cd' Wh"/ I~ There~ l~c:,I Ch:>ngc? 
' circ Ced~ P. 

chan:;~? A◄r.eedcd I 

101.1 N Amtnd v.illl lhe name of lhe )ulhd'.idlon lac,lly adoGled and ~mended Adn"'nlw.llile need 

106.5 N 
Amend to Include addlDon of Automobile Witcl:ing Localy adopted and amended AdrlmisltiltiYe flfed due lo addllon or secllon 105.5.". 
Yard aperafianal pt11111l 

Alto-I,~ Ille &It ~ de ot&tial ID enlortt l11t1ire code tspedlic 

lfldd s etllan 10 reiiu!le op era lional pennil /or 
ta fm access, ..egelalan de:nnces, hazarm&s 11\atarillls. 

IOS.6.55 y Lacally aeoled and adopted elc.), wiUlin aUlomabla wrecking ya/d oper.itiollL Thi$ was 
~ lornobile Wl'IC1cilg Yald5, a damonS1raled neadoxperienced Vlilhln Iha Diamond 

SpIln9s F,e Oeparunenl 

Add seclion 1011quile construc:Uon petmll lor t.oeaay c,eated and adopted 
Admlnls~afiill! need d'Je to addition Ill sacllon 105.6.25 and 

105.6 N Automobile WrttkfrG Yards. 105.6.28. 

Allows !he fite cad& offli:ial to enrarce Iha r.-e code (spaclfic 
Add ~,clion 10 require conslrvcllon permil for Lo,;;,U,aealed andadapled 

to lile~us, ~gti.UOn clBS12ncss, ha:iamaus materia!S,. 
105.6.25 y 

AUlomObile WA!Ckln9 Yan!S. elc.) wiU1in 1111,-ily ccnslruded and/or macli&eclaulo111<1bile 
1wedl'llg y«d cperalion~ 

Mowst1Ie rrre code olfil:ial to te\'lc\v and BPPIOY!ld lralfic 

Alld secllan 10 ~ltoco11Sltuclion ptcmil for !he 
c:m;ng de,,ces pdor lo lnMfon. F"n Code cunnny 

105.6.26 N LocaUy cIealed and adopted perrrJts 1M fire cede oll"IQ&l to regulate tra6I<; calming 
lnslallallon ol tmlrie calming dewcec de'lices. H<r.vGver, a permit Isn't cuaenUy reqwedpnor to 

kl::lilllatioo cau,~ unduo hardship to 

Ad09(1ng this seellon loaffov, ror llte c:n1alwm and rssuaQ.:e 

Localyadopled and amendsd 
ol r,es kl cov.racluah:osls. Seclion 105.S dafm•s p!111lU; , 

107.5 N Ser:lton Added. P1m0usiy sacllon106,6. plan checks, and lllSpedons as oUowed ln Hulll &Safety 
Code 17951. 

~lly created and adoi,led 
Stclion 107.S.1 Co'1 ReCllYelY Fees: Ta AIClll'erll!e cost to 

107.5.1 N Sedion added. Pro,iously sedion 106.6.1 lht Fire Oislrfcl. 

Locally e,jia\ed and adapled 
Setton 1ll7,7 To recoverlhe adual cDSIS ol ~• 

1!11,7 y Section add1d. P111\ioUll'f section 106.T Jailed inspeclOflS byconll:lciors. 

Sedlon 111.5ofChaptec1 oflhel'liaCods of lheDislriclls 
addtd lG~asfoUom: 
111.5 Appeal Pioailllres and Tfmefntes: Toe Intent or this 
provision is lo dslffy Ille procedun:s and limalines lo ran 

111.S y Secilon added. Previlusly sccllon 109.4 Locany adop(ed and arnendt<I indMdual or en~ ta fi'e an appeal lo Ole Saartl of Appeals 
1eganl'119 an order. decblon. or det1mnlnau1111 by llte Flra 
Code Olllcial. eased on the county ol El Dlxado's 
Vegetation M:inagemenl Omfnan1:e Boalllof APpeal$' 
limd ne. 

Allows lht F"IIV Code Olffclal lo enforce Ille Fire Code 1hal 
Provlous.r/ aec!I011110.4. C0111>loted the sedlon by pcoleWl "' and properly. Faes hiMI Ileen upda!l!d lo 

112.4 N 
11:lng lrl the bluk pof11ons lhal l'lete llOI c:ompfeted Localy adopted and amended malclt tie files and penalla$ as dnmed appl'Q9liall! tiy Ille 
l1i \he SFM.I1 Is 11111111 Ian \o\cca&tles lo deletrrine OISln'CI AUcmey's Office. The change lo Ille ranguag, lo 
lht £ee5/pena!Res far lhei rllSjlecti'le arDas incklde 111e lellll inl1 aclio ns. 

112.4.2 CilllDOIJ$ is added lo read as tllows: 112.4.2 
Cllalions 
The Fir a Chief or hlslhar cM/ 1KJ1horized reinsentalr,e(s), 

Seclionadded. Pmioulsy sedlan 110.4. LocallJ a1!81ed and adopted 
ffl•V l:.!ill<I cltat»ru. for in!r.id\olls 01 mllldemunor 

112.41 N vlolal:ons of lhls oade p!Qlantto Sedlan 13871 of Iha 
Heallh and Solely Code of Ille Slate or Callam la and 
Cl1apter 5c (commenclngwith sedlcin BS3.6)ofl1Ue3 al 
Pail2o!lh9 Pinal Codao!l\\e SaleotC.lill111i1. 

P~ously sec~ 112.4, C0111ple1ed llle~c:tion by 
fling In the blank po~lons lhlll weie nat "'1111,'(elc d 

Loeallyadaplad andamendad 
A1111olaltons cl the tacl11 Im• been consolidaltd under 

113.4 N ibY lhe SFM. 11 is better lea 10 localhfes lo Sedion 112.4 to llldttde the penalUes for vlalalons. 
de termlna the f est/penaDlas for l~lr roso ecllve 
areas 

23-1589 G 39 of 55 



Added deffnitlons ror. Carnpfira, Oll\/al'lay, Dlsfllct, 
Execuflve 8odr, Rio Ch!el, file Har.aid, Open B1111lng, and 

202 N Added dermili>ns rordan'ly Locally crealed and adopted 'fralned Ciowd Manager. Delin~Jon of open bumklg shall 
not indude mldenffal LPG, nahlral gaa 1illled, or wood 
bumfng applfances nor ceremonial buml119-

302.1 N Added definlUon of camol!le to secuon t.oc:alY M!Slacl and adooted Addlld defll\ltion !oi i:la!IN. 

Wlded a sectlClrl for open bumng resb1£11an,, uua 1411111 lligll rue-If Iha\ emll in a Doiado COU111)' 
WAA y Lallguage dalllled ftom camplie l&open buming to Lor.aly craaled and adgpled 

911COmj!B$S fiJII scope of open burning 
we ha~ wnllen more slrlngenl RJles pertaining to open !Ires 

1&quil-n1s. 
f..llhln grm, bnish, tod bee covered a,eas. 

◄01.2.1 N Added sdoa lo require pre-fire plan, larnew loc:ol(y Cl'l!lltd afl(f adop1ad 
Provldlls thecraalinn ol a floor plan far Ille J)Clrpo5e or 

andOr mcd!lled construclion, 
emaigency plannlng to II! ulilmd by am11111el\C'f response 
pe,sonneL 

Fire apparatu, are heCQmhigJarrierand taller. A wrllcal 
dearance or 15 feet JJ1DVides properc!earam:e lat 
apparatus to pass undar l'titllaU\ dam;~ ;ippar,itus 
compo•ents. II also allwtnn ulended flme frame be!cre 

503.2.1 N Changed ~111cal deara11C11s to 1Sleet tnd 10an l0e11llyadopled and amended 
ha'4Rg IOrewtlhe~rlh ollllevegelalion. Mdlllorm 

YAdths to 20 IHI 
height for'ICgelalao clearances acls as 11t1 inc:«eand butler 
twlhe 'fllllad offire, A ,oad widlh of 2.0 /eel emusl'III of 
sl!Oulders. as measu11d raca of ,;u1b to face cf wrb Is 
needed. Thases1cuclules canbedlriet1II tonavlgate with 
Ille apparalus and slioukf not be counled r,, Illa total 
ddvable IOild sulface. 

Added a specillc secliun ror R3's where II aaows lhe 
Fire awaralus raquUa areas for Jlmji\g around when 

503.2.5 N Fire Code and liQe i4 FIR!Sare F{egulallons '° Loca111 adopted and amellded 
~ 11eh1ctesara m the scene af an eme,vency. This 

milch as they c.qll!e lwnar<111nds lorflre apparatus 
ncludesfiravehidenswell ascmllan nhldes. P1011ides 

aci:ess ioad$and dllveways 
belier access lorlngresstegress. Addll Ol\l\ly, adds cum 
around !Dr apparatus in drlve'l/8)'5 grealerl~ 150'. 

Allows codes and slalldanls !Gr Bridgn and Elevated 
Cllanged llluatlioaforBlidgeund Elm!ed S\llface$ or a llOladO county and Appandbc D of Ille 

503.2.6 "' 
surtac;es to :.tale and ma1'/I El Dorado Col.nty i.Ql:ally a4o)lled and a1111~ad 

CUll'enl Frre CGde, whlcluwerls mora msbidivc, to be 
Tral'oSpllllall~n OM$1Dlll'I add11on lo MSttTO'HB- conslslent throughDlll c;oooly ag!!l!Clea and Is alloWed as an 
17 (mfllimum CFC raqulred) lattemat~ means & melhod Ula\ Is nal leSSics!llttro \ban 

lhe Are Coda. 

503,3.1 N 
Prelllously-llorl503,4.2.Added sedlOn reg~Rling ~lly created and adopted 

This seclioncleall'ydelines lhe'No Parking n Fire Lanes• 
no parf<!rt11111 fire lane, rules and is GCRSlstanlYAlh lhe ca11roml1 Velll~e Code. 

503.3.2 N 
Prelfo!lsly secUon 503A.3. Added section regarding Locally created and adqiled 

Tols.secUon cleadydellnes lhe 'No Parking In front orare 

no parking in flllnl ol llydranls 
h)dninls' n,fes and is I.OM(gleql with 11"1 Cal!Omia Vehlde 
CQde. 

603.3.3 N Pievlouslysecfion 503.4-<l,Added section regording LocaHy crealed and adopted 
lhls section ,:lea~ del!nes Calfomla F're Code Appendix P 

lire lanes based on road vtdth 
as Ille refecallOI fonoad lane v.fdlh and lhelrrela!lorl lo lite 
lanes. 

Previollsly seclloa 503.5.3. Ci,ialed BOIi ad<lpled Alrowt file disldcls !he aulliorily to appnm gates on 

603.6 
50S,8 to maintain amecgenc,acr:essand 

N iQ!ltsil~ney U\iough 311 roadway gales ln 1:1 Donido Locanyaea1ed and ado)l4ed 
1oaitttays based onlhe Olslrle1'8 gale $'1andallf. providing 

Counly, refelling to lhe gale standards adopled by 
the besc possible eme~ency access lo mainlafn fast 

\be l'PO's 
mpo!IS8 Rmes. 

50.9.t N 
Added secllon pertaining le> the visual addrassing or Locally adopJad and amended 

Al!Ows fte dlslricls lheaulhorily lo approve addressing 
oofdi'ngs based on lhe Dlsl~cfs acld.-S$1ng sland1rds. 

Added more co~rtaUve&J,ndaid for lhe 
Commercial propeJ!iasarerequlred lo Jnsran Jiydran!S al 

!i07,5.1 N placamenl or ~Qnls and llu!lr relaloashfp !o l.Dtally adopled ; 11d amel\111111 
300 loot inleM1111, Illus lhey sho(ild never be oullllde o£15Q 

oomme,dalbulkllligi: 
reel r1om any gfvenhydranl al anytime (lla'f lhe dlslance 
inbelween}. 

23-1589 G 40 of 55 



l 

l 
l 
I 

i 
i 

I 
l 
,\ 
j 
' I 
i 
I 

l 
l 
1 

l 

' i 
j 

i, 
: 
I 

l 
l , 

j 
I 

5093 

510.4.2.3 

903% 

903.2.1.1 

903.2.1.2 

903,2.1.3 

903,i.1.4 

903.2.3 

903.2A 

lm.2,1 

Added vaibfage lo bc!i¥J all ol lhe aewsaiyflle y 
conlNlla far a llulkllng (a OIH! IDQIUon 

Eme19enq' ~pornlal Radlo Sysl em s acandary 
V l'llv1er Supj)ly Mocllk:allon 

Adds a ,equl1amanlforspdnklersyslem inslalfaUon 
N In~ buildings and slruc:luleS 3,600 square feel or 

grqrerv.ilhln the dlslrli:t 

Piat.iousl'/ section 900..2.1. Adds a requlremanl lor 

N 
SJllinkl•r~ bstallollon in new Group A 
buildlngs andslrucblll9 3,600 squllll! teet or 
grearer wilhin lhe dislrk;l 

Ptfl'lloUSly seelfon 903.2. 1. Meis a raquirement fol 

N 
llfflll(tlenysl11111 llllla\laUon in new GroupM 
bUtl«ngs and slnldl.lres 3,600 ,qu,ue reel or 
g111aterwlthln Ille dlSlr!d 

Pliliousf)fsecillon 903.2.1.Adds a requfremtn! for 

"' 
:ipdnk!el system llls\aliail)ft In nl'II Group M 
bUillln_gs and Jtruelutes 3,600 square feet or 
gieall:1Will11nll1rtdllltrict 

Previously sacllao 903.2.1. Adds a R!Clulremrnl for 

N 
sprinkleray&1GIII fnSlallalioo in new Group A.;s 
bulldlngsand slrvclllru 3,600 ~uare tee! or 
~atwv1ilnin lhe lfislliel 

~ setlion 903.2.3.Adds a requirement ror 

N sprinklars)'Jlem lnslalelion In ow, Groupe 
bUlldklga and slMlures 3.Blll square feal or 
girta!er vilhin lhedW~ 

Adds a requirement rorsprink!Qrsys18111 inslallOlion 
N In nel'I Gl1lll\> F blAldlrlgs and druclu1e.s 3,600 

square feelorgiealtr\'/llhln lhediSlrlcl 

Allds a 1equl1B!llenl !or splin\ler system lnslllUalian 
N lo naw Group r,! blllldlngs and struc(ures 3.600 

Sqllil ro feel or g realer v.illllp Ille didri•I 

!IUAdlngs aregalting lPlll1! sllablein uiecaunty. It is ITIOle 
common to have new bllildil1gs WiUI solar amirs lllat 
continue to gentr11le po,om even 1men the buildings 
g1neral ulillllas half81iw\S!IUIGff, Wl\en \ha1alsan 

Loc:effy crealad and adopted eQUll'llllllcy, ii rsvffal lhal we ~e rajl!d IICC8$$ IO all of lht 
t.0111!ols In Olle location lo/ pubDc evacualloPand rde!igblar 
safety. Due to the life dangerptesenlln er Dorado Ca1m~ 
throughoul most of Ille year, lhls cltall!le Ts appl1lprla1e and 
lad\fsallle. 

loc:aly a,opted ancl amend ad 
Amend lo 72 hour capacily far badl-up paYllr due lo 
!'lealhei and PG&E saltly re\aled power DUlages. 

Loc:allyadoptedand amended 
Adnllnlstralmt 11111Nl due lo addition of section 903.'Z.22 and 
903.2.23. 

Due lo lhe \opogrepllie, ti,nak, and geogiaplllc candillcns 
cl El Ooracfo County and lhelrcanlriblllng faclocs lo our 
increased 185P(IIISB times. along with the lael ht firn 

loeallyadoplad and amended double In aim eadl lllld 11111Y mll\llte, we 1equtre spnn\t1rs 
lo be lnslllfled In s1ru,tures once Uley readl 3.&00 square 
ftet. ltulzt as t!loy relate lo ffre bohawor and rate al 
sp111ad, 

Qua lnthe topographic, climatic, aml ge09raph'k: c:ondilions 
of El Dorado Ceooly and lhefr canldbuting factois lo our 
increased nisponsetlmas, along 1'lllh the fact lbal &111S 

l.oclly adopled 811d amended doutfe ln sile eadl and every mnile, we !llllulle sp\inl<Jffl 
to be insl;llled !JI stnrdures once llley reach 3.600 square 
1<14l in Sitt as t111y relale 10 fir1 bthavlor and fate of 
splelld. 

Due lo thv tol)aQlf PhiC. ctiqlal!c, &Mgeogniphl~candllions 
ol El DClr'ada County and lhe?r Cllllldbullng ractrn to out 
mu.Std respotlSll linu,1, e1ong ~ lhe faclllurl ~ru 

~Uy adcpled and a"18nded double In sll'e aaeh and ewiry mlnuta, we re~llre spdnldeis 
IO be Instated in ~ruchlres cni:11 !hay ,~ath 3,600 squase 
feet In size a Uley relate to fir• beha.,.01"11M me or 
spread. 

Olla to Iha topograph~. eWmalk;, alld geographlc CQnd°,Wons 
or El Dorado C011nly and !heir oonlnbutin!I raam !O our 
ir.:reasoo tesp0R'leflrtes,alcln9wl\llllle fad.Iha\ r,m 

LOcaly adopled and amen~ed double In size escb and every mlnule, we require sprinklers 
lo t,e lnslal ed 1n ~rui;tu1as = they reach 3,600 square 
(e11U11 me as they relllle-lo lilt bel1111'1onnd ,ale of 
spre11d. 

Due lo U1e topographl,; o!imall;, and geographic: corditions 
Ii El !lorado Coan~ a[Yj !hair CG11frill!Un1 racfols lD OIi' 

illc11111sed respanse Umea, along wflh lh• fact lhaUlie, 
locallyadopled and amendod double In size each and eve,y IDIMJle, we R!C!Ufresprinkfers 

IO beinstalledin54ruc\llre1 ol\te \hey mad'l 3,600 square 
feet In srzeas lhey relate to fire behavior and rate ol 
Sfl(ead, 

Due to the topographic, cBm,fr:, and geographic oond!Uons 
o!EIOorado Counlyand their i:onMbuUog lacltn lo our 
Increased respQfle licpes, a»ng 1111h lhe fact lhal !lrvs 

l.ociAly adop\ed and amended doublt in site eaeh and evel)' minule, M require spliolclers 
lo be illslaITedl~StNCIUresance lh6Y [.ch 3.6001q11111 
fhlrn sl~e as they relele to fire behaviorand ialeor 
i5pread, 

Due to lhe topograpllic, ciirnaUc, and gaographlccondlUo,,. 
or El Dorado CoQlll.y and ttleir COlllribulll'Q !.din lo GUr 
lntmsed rosponsa Umes, storig wllll tie raot 1hatfl9S 

t.ocaty adap(ede!llf amenclt!I double In site eadl allll every mlnule, v,a re<p111 sprinklers 
lobe lnslalled In sltuclins one, they re11ch 3,600 so,uare 
feet lrl sil:e as they 111talatoffre bthallionnd rate or 
S{lle&d. 

23-1589 G 41 of 55 



Pmiously secllon 903.2.7.Adcln requirflllllll for 
Du8 lo9ie lapOQAl,Phil:, ellnl6c, and geoJ1111plilccondi1011s 

1\11 B Ooiado Ccnfttf am ltlelrc:onln!Mlllng faclm lo CM' 

9P1in klBr syaltra lrldala lloll In IIIYI GroUp M wllll I-ad respaase &mes, llang Will tile facl lhal mus 
90'-2.7.2 N ~,.._or,...._buldtlgs,lld lqyadapk,jarda.llllld ~inm1adlnM1Yminute,we~spcil!U 

sllvcUeS 3.600 square feelargrealen,it,h lbe IO be IMlaled in lfluCIU1115°"'9 Ibey ,eadl 3Ji00 squa,e 
dislricl leel 111 size at lhty relate kl In lllhmancl Ille <I 

epread. 

Manulaclured Homu-The ln!enl o(lhl& code kdi0n Is lo 
anaure tha! rurwlaclured homes lhatll!M! as acne r,,: two 
falRlly dwetings 119 CIOIISlslent Will lhe provisions laund kl 
CRC Seclioll 513 pedamg lo bill dweililgs rl a saniar 

Pl'eliwsly s.:lioll 903.2.8.'l.lllis sedion vm nnio:. Mamtllcluled homes placed ii Ille~ 

U03.2.B.5 N CNlaledlo incble manufactured resldenllal slngle locally adopled and amended lnCerfacc haw a heightened risk of l3pld Dre coa~fan 

falwtt M ln'iit1elldenllal spjiiOef pragram. 
we lo \hG ~-¥ftllghl na\Ule o!1helr eo11S1Rtt.Uon. 1be 
repld h Slftad luolgllaul llleN sfnldlNes ptHlllts a 
~nl dsk kl llloirCCDJpaAls. Residlntal lpilrtlw 
SJIIOIIS ftlWe beenlncalpolaled lo deaelse lhlsrililt 
succeufully In many Ca&romta cammvnllles, 

,_ 

ou, to tha lopoglllpWe. dlma6c:. and geoaraptilc ~ntfil!Qas 

Ple'tilHIIIJsecli9n IDU.9.Adds aieqllrameril ~r 
cl El [.lo,ado CoC111!yand lhelreontributire flclOQ lo our 

90S,2.9 N lpmllr~IIIRslalalon~MWGIO\ljl S 
IIIC/8/lsadlUll)0nS81ines.alocl!I 'Mlltlle faclllllfiM 

bllild1Rgund111licturaol 3,8001q11aie liel or Loc;,)1acqitod and U!l!illad dOVbls In size each and mrtr'llllllile. we ,equiresprinMe,s 

91111ttf w1Jlln Int di1b\~ 
lo be lns~led ii s1111r.l\ne$ om:alhey reach 3,800 sqwre 
rett In slu as lhey relale to Gre behaworand rate of 
~-

Oue10 lie lopOgtapllk; cllrnalc, andgeog11~CXIPlilrJllS 

Pll!viously seellan 903.2. Adds 1 1e1tulcement for of El Donado couniy and lhtfrconblhulillQ~\o a\l! 

903.2.fO N sl)o'IAlder~iaslalaUoahnewGloup~ 111-d respoase dines, alongwllh Ile fact that fies 

blllll"11111 ,ndsllw!IM 3,GOO~~ °' LoeaJy~d and IIJlfllded dlllllllelnliletllihandewiy~ wettqlille~ 

grn1erm11in the district o be nslaled tn Slrlldures oncelhey reac:113.600squait 
eel In ilnl H lhey rilale lo ft111 hehal'iarllld Aile o1 

spieed. 

Due Ill Ille ~c, clknalc, andg,I09/llllllict'Odo,is 

Pl8Vlausfy secllon 903.2.111. Addsa req1'remenl tor ofl:I Dorado Counly alld lhlllrcontnw~faclors to our 

903.2..t0.1 N sp,lnkler s)'Slem lnaf allalion In new Coninten:lal Increased response timu, alonQwilll lhe racuhat m 

~ Gage~ aill!SIIUCM!S3,600 
Loealy adopledand amended ~uble in sfu •ad! and every milllAo, we ,aqu~e spcic,klelS 

•qUr&feelargiealM'llilllrl ihedillnd lobe iDslakd Ill $WC!UleSCII\Ce they 111sdl 3,arosquaie 
'eetln lllie aslht)'ie!ale ID iro bthiNlor n •of 
\~ 

Dueloffte lopagraphli; cVmafc, and gec,gtaphlc00lldilion, 

Ptevlaus1Y1edlan 903.2.7, Adds a requielnetll for lot 8 Dotffo CoLWrtt andlh«CGntll>ullrtg fac:IOIS too..-

901.2.22 N sprlnlder system lllSlallallan Ill r..1/ Group B Loealy adopledand amended 
klcnased res,- lmff, along wllll Ille facUl!alfm 

blllclings and IUVC4Ul'8$ 3,600 SI\Ullli feel Gr dOCifllo in slzo each and IM!'fmlNIII, we raquk, s¢n\ltfS 

grealer\Wlin Ullt ~ lo be /nslalled ffl 11tuclucesonce they mch 3,600 squa,e 
l"eellnsit.enU...,~lolnbellN!lrarldlllltof 
lflC'i1I. 

Out lo 1he lopogill(lhic, clfmaUc, and geographic llllfldillans 

PMlollslyaedlan 903.2.>.ddsa requitemenl ((If ~I B Dcrado CoclnfV and ll111irtanllfbuHng factors lo our 

9012.23 N sprillkler ,,stem in1faGallcn in new Gn;,up F--2 
Localyaitopfed 111d -dad 

lnctessGd tespol!Wlrrres, alongwll lht ractllatrm 

buld1ngs and slJUclurea 3,600 SQ11a1efe1I or 
~Lilleln size PCl1 and evety mnne, we l'9qliu spi;uldm 

gAialenwthln the .incl lo lie JnstaUed in sl!llclUres ora they 1eedl 3,800 aqu11e 
feel ill size as Uleyrelale lo rrre~eha'lioi and rate or 
~ad. 

P1evicusly eee1ion 903.2a. Adds a requiivmenl ro Due to lhe lopog11phk:. dnlallc, and gcographiccondleions 
nslall Sj)linltlll1 lorblsllag Mfngs 111,1 unc1e1go 0£1'1 Dar3doCOUR\y ;ad llllir tonlriblill\9 laden ID OVI' 

a change lauseaf grenrbnnl oran flt-.e In IIM:a"eased iespome v111es.alona wilh 1he f acl 11111 Ires 
Q03.6 y $1zegrealer 111111500 square leetalld the rosullfn11 Locally Crteltd and adapttd ~ in mm and MfY 1111W, WI 11q.-es,lililels 

1qu;ire feetls greller than 3,500 lllUlle feet. lo be Installed in ll111ctures onc1 Ur1y re.lCll 3,600 squJII! 
Pre'llously alllJlfed to adlttlo11 ot IIIQle than so,,. 01 leel In s"tze as 111ey ll!lale lo fire beha,ior andrale or 
l,OOOsqua19feet. spread. 

23-1589 G 42 of 55 



907.2 N 
Md& a ~lrlmenl for Illa alam1 sySlem 
lnslallaUon In now bulldlngul!d slM:IUIH 3,600 t.oeally adopted and a1MDded Ml\lllrisViliwnoed due to alldlliort ol seclian 9rtf.2,30. 
squi!ID feet 1r 1Ns wllllln the dislrict 

Pll\lou1ly section 907.211.Added a«upanl 
protetllon lorllre alallllS III Grovp A buildingSll'llh a Pfllll!des ~ emel91nGY notliClliGII lcrocaipanclas Ur.II 

907.2.1.A N 
lloor area ress than 3,6D0, emp( R3, AG two~ Locally cica1ed end adopled no, used for commtrdal llUIJIOSus, and bulldi1115 

alow publlc use and ensure1 Fite Department naUr,c:aQon in 

will a llollr11111a anus \1,111 !illO squa11 lee\ as 
Ule 1Wenlo1a finl onmolce. 

applllWd by lh• fir~ code Gtllcill 

IPmiouslY IIIIClkln 907.2a. Added DCC141lnl 
P"lledion tbr ~ie a111nn, 1n Gtoup a bu~illgs Wlth a PrcMcles proper emergeney ncMilk:al on far oo:up,rdes Illa! 

907,2.2.3 N 
lloor1reale£s lhan 3,GOO,_..,pt R3, AG bulrdlngs l.ocaly "Nied alld adopted 
rtOlused larcommen:ial/lUIJlDS<>S. and bulldfngs 

alloY1 pullllc u~ and en5Ull!s Fire Oepartmenlno~caffon in 

wi111 a lloor area olles; lllan 500 ,~uatt reel as 
Iha ewntolar.reors~ 

approVed b)' !he nre code ollicial 

Previoosly '9i:IICll'I 907.2a. Addad OCCVj)&nl 
protei;lloo forf11e otalll\S in GwJp E bu'~dir,g1 WIina PIOVlrles proper emergeni;y oolificalion for oC<llJpancies lhat 

907.2.3.11 N 
Roo,a,u less !han 3,600. except R3, AG buikllngs 

l<1t1!1/ tlllaltd illld adllpled 
r,ot111ed for tomm&rclal pr,poses, end bUDdlng& 

allolY pubic use am ensures FIii! Oepa~ment nOllficatlon In 

Wlh a floor siea of lees lhan 600 squa,e feel as 
the ewnt ol at,,e«smolce. 

11Jll)IOVad bl' flle llro code ollidaf 

l'IIMOUS¥ mtliln 9D7.2a.Added oocupanl 
potecllon lafflre sfa1ms In Group F buildings v,tU, a Pm des proper OJneigency nolillcalloll roroccupane!as 11lat 

907.2,1.f N 
Roar an,a lass than 3,600, except R3, AG building. L®alfy created and adcplet 
!I'll used [(Ir QOnlll1erdal p11rposes. and bvWdilllf 

allowpublie usnml ensures Are Depanml!III ncitilicaf on In 

wilh a floorarea ortau than SOOsquare !eel as 
lhe event of a ffll! or smoke, 

Spl)IOV$d by lhe nee ~e olliclal 

Pmioll\ly sUlll)ll 907,2a.Ad'lled occupaol 
pclllacllon fa, fin, ala1111$ h Gioup H bulldlngs wilh P111uldes pnipereme,gency noUffi:alion for OCCUpSllOies thal 

907,2.5.2 N 
8 lloor 111!a lH8 lhan 3,600, el<C4!pl R3. AG Lccaly aealad and ac!Opled 
bUfdlnOs Ml used (01 commeccl.l puqiosea, aad 

allowpubtic use ¥¥1 ~ Rie Oepa!lmenl nolintallollin 

buldings Wl'lh a Uoor area of leSS than SOO square 
Ille event ol a 11reor smoke. 

fetlaUIJl)IO'itd by lbel!nlQlde official 

Pre11!011sry section S07.2a.Addacl OllCUI"'~\ 
proled!Gn for nra etanns Ill G111up I buildings wlh a 

901.2.6.6 "' 
liloonuea less than 3.GllO. ex~pt R3, AG buikflngs Locally cw.1led and allep(ed 

Provides properem119ericynollUcallon ror~es lhal 

ADI used for cc,mme~al IIWJXl'"'S. and bulldings 
aRO'll public use and ensures Fire Dtpartmelll nofflcallon in 

\\llh a tloarareaofle$S lhsn 500 squaro!eel .is 
Iba event or a rire01 smoke. 

approved br Ille Illa code official 

P(evioosly sedion 907..29, Addedoecupanl 
protection 101 fi111 ataims In Group M ~kl~gs Yiilh PIO'lldell plllll4felll!rgl!I\CV nolll\callon lotoi:r:upancies !flat 

9111.2.7.2 N a ftoor aiea ~ss lhan 3,\\00, e~l R3, ~ Locally cr4aled aod adopled 
bu!ldi~s nolund rorcumm~al purpo&es, af\41 

allcrrt publlC vse and ens1111s Fire Oeparlm1111l no~fica~ar1 in 

bll'dd1ngs With a noorare11 of Jess lhan 500 square 
lhee<ienlofarin!orsmotce. 

feel as approved by the fire code olliclal 

Pte'lriouslvse~llan 907.2",Added occupanl 
proledlcfl for lire alanns In Gloup R·1 bvileings Provides proper em"'l!lll\eir nQlil\calian lilf OQCupanc\ts \Ila\ 

907.U.4 M 
llllll a floor area reu lhan 3,000, elt.Qlpl R3. Kt locaKy created and alklplsd 
butld'n11s nol used lot conmerelal pl!IP05e5, and 

allow publlcuseand eosures Fi,e Depadment nofficatlcm .i 

bllildlngn~lh a m atell ol tessthan 600 squm 
the eventol a rire or smoke, 

feat as apprn\'ed by the ~e code ol!'icial 

23-1589 G 43 of 55 



; 
i 

l 
I 
I 

\ 
l 

9117.2,9.4 

907.2,10-f 

907.2.30 

901.6.5 

907.6.2.1 

907.9 

1203.1.3 

3311.1 

3313,1 

5001.7 

5801.2 

ffi4,2.9.6.1 

67ll6,2A.4 

N 

N 

N 

y 

N 

N 

N 

N 

N 

't 

N 

N 

N 

P .. l'louSly secllan 907.211.Add,d oCCIJpanl 
plllledicri !or rire al81111S in Or!IOP R-'2, R..:!.1, and R 
2.2 butkll~swilh a lloorarealess lhan 3,600, 
except R~. AG llllHdlngs ~ot used to, aimmercial 
pU1p11sas, and IM!dings wllh all0ora"3 of less 
lbim 500$1jUllr& ftel as appn,ved by Ille rire code 
olficlal 

~'AIIU$tJ1acllon ~G7.2a.Added occ.11paot 
~rolecllon rorfira alaims 111 Group s ~uRdJngs wllh a 
lloor-le$s Ulan 3,600, excapt R3, AG bulldilg.s 
110t\l$8d!or~I plllPOS1!S, a,,d buldin!IS 
v.ilh a ll01lr aie, ol less than SOO squa,e fael as 
appfOl/td by !he fire ccdo official 

Pre-.iOUSIJ seclkln 907.211. Added acc:ui>111t 
p!O!ecllon forT!'l)e 1 Hood sys!Gms 10 be 
t1rt11$d lo a monl!Ored r.11aalarmsyslemwt1en 
ln$lalleil or 111plaeed 

Re(IUires Pre alarm $)'5lell15 lo be mcnilorad by UL 
isled Type A cenlral 5laU011. 

PdmaiySeoondacy Afam, Power Suppt, 
Modlllcalbn 

P•~IysecllDn fl07.2b.Adde61l1X111)ant 
protection fllf exb[ng oolldiJlgs wilhoul alJlomaUo 
spdnklers~n to lns!al a nre slacm If lhey add 
n,o.,e lhan 3011- ur 1,000 SC\f'all! feello Ille 
slruelvre, wNi:lleYerls le&& 

Shllnl 1rip p01'1trsaftC, de~ices 

Prll'llouslysecUon3310. Addrl!$$ requhnenls (or 
C01151n/Clion sifM 

l'felriotlSY secOon 3312.1. Water supplies al 
ClOllllludlon sileswilh combustible mafe1ials o!Hlte 

Ally damages orc:.osts !Rim 112919elll or umlul 
pm:fiteSlhal cause a hazardous ma1erials Inc1denl 
llill cause a cosl cecoYel)I foe 

Added safety pm(edm ~h pemjls 'oelng issued 
bV bolh Iha Rte C!llef and Sherif(& DepartrneAI !Gr 
explosi,es, and by Ille FlttCliel and lhe Boefll or 
Supffiisois forr~ 

Eslabllshed llnu'luuelforth In !he F11e Coda 

Eslalll!Shed limlls as set lot1h rn lhe Fire Code 

Pra'l'!des pruper eme,glllll;t noftOmffoo for•ccupallllfes that 
1..cca.ly created and adopled allow public use and fll$U,es Fiie °"l)arlmenl noUlical!nn kl 

Illa event of a fire or slllolle, 

PIO'Ados proper emmaency 111Jli1icar111111or oocupancle• !hat 
Locally cceawd end adOplld allow publkniseand en1ures Rre ~partmanl noGfication In 

the event of a nre orsmoke. 

ldl aealld and adopled 
Provides pioperemergellC)' noliffcaU011 for o«upsncies lhal 
a11ow p11bl1c use and eMU1es Fire Dl!pa~ment nollfica!lon In 
U1e evanlof a lhe orsn10ke. 

Provides 11«1~errespoftse aod malrnenance "luoner se,,,lte" 
~I lite alarm $YS!ems. NFPA 72 &pecffies iequired response 
ti111s !Dr life alarm lmuble and supeM$OfY signal$ lo 
l!llSUl'e systems remain operational. A 'fype A UL !is\e\! 

lccally ,reated and adopted csnlralsli!lion meals Iha NFPA requin!d ffre alarm resp0111e 
ieMUmg a11oper.1iQl!alr,e alarm syswm al err limes. 
UL Type A Rslfna rfiN\uiras c1n11a1 srauons to plO'lide lhiS 
~(llnner sernce" or contract wilh anolharenlilyla provide 
In~ ,.,,,1co la obtaln Iha 11S11n9. 

tocal~etealed alld adopll!<i 
Amend lo 72 nour capadly for back,up power due lo 
wealher and PG&E safely relaled pawarourages. 

PIG'lldu p!Ojltl 1111eTgencyllOllfication loroccvpanc1as lhal 
localfV crealedand adopled alow P'Jblic un and e,isures Flre Ctp;i11111enl nolincation In 

Ille evenlofa flreonmoke. 

1111$ ~on adds a Shlllll Trip power shulolf devices lo 
Locally ado9ledand amanded enSU/e eme~ powershul off duling 1h11 use ol bacl,up 

power $UppS,s. 

Localy created and adoplod 
Addressing I« c1mslludi011 sites j,; lmp0rtanl to as=;lsl 
resPOnding emergsney crews. 

~ocally adopted and amend1d 
Walllrfl'IJsl be un slla prior lo combculbla matertal being 
sloled orvel1ical ~ruction cammen:tng. 

1-\aiardoUs malelials 1e\ated Incidents are cosily 1o mlUgale. 

Locally ctea led and adopted 
lf lhe lnckJ1nl is G'.IUSed by neglgeoce due to a~ 
J)IQC8.ls or pr,1cliee !he aclual cos! 1'111 be passed C111 to 1fle 
11.nl penles. 

Allows agendes !hat need to lnow ahooleiq,loM& and 
Locally adopted and amended fliQwark$ to awrove lhern and have a clear unders!andlng 

of !he apP\ltlallonsol holv tt,ey !Ml be USld. 

Est•bllshed imls as required by Iha Fl18 Code for Class I 

lQCaly adopled and amend ad 
llammabla and Class ft(lll(llll\JB.l!ble fkluldtlfflage In above• 
groimd tanks. Re!jUlles AHJapproyaland a 
Specllll/CaldiOollalUse Permit from lhe County. 

Es~Y111td limi!s as IIICl~~ad by \bl! Fire Code lorClass 1 

Lacaly 8dOpllld and amended 
Rammabla and crass Ii c:ombuslible liquid specie! 
operations 1n a!Jove,gro111d tanks. Requi'eS AHJ approv.il 
ind a ~Iliana! UsePennll from llle County. 

23-1589 G 44 of 55 



l 
I 

1 
l 
i 

1 
'i 

1 
I 

j 

l 

1 
j 
l 
i 
I 

6806.t 

6104.2 

ChaplerBO, !IFPA, t-
22 

Chapter 80, NFPA, 
130-16 

Appendix IJ: Tabla 
B105.1(1} 

~endl~B:Tabla 
8105.2 

t\ppendlX D: 1>103.1 

Appendix D: 01012 

AAJernllxD: D103.3 

19P1ndlll D; D103.S 

Appentix D: 0103.6, 1 

Adm!nlsltafiveaddlllon o1Dls1dcl naina. 
N Eslallllshad fmltus set fOllh I~ lht Are Cllde 

Eslsblisllfld Kmlls tor ll'G slolage anddlspensin9 
N near ar adjacent to 18$1denVal development 

Prooides G1e -atce55 and e!llaiance to prope~y lines 
N lar Aulomobia W1ec:l<lng Yards. 

', 

NFPA 130-16 olChapler BO of lhe Fire Code of Iha 

y Dislsld has buon amended to updale vadous 
plOllis/ans per!airu9 lo U,e JnSlellafon of sprinkler 
~sin one and two,rsm!ly dwellln/l& 

Changed 500 GPM lo 1,0110 GPM in major 
N $Ubdl'li$lons bew.v 5000 flllll elevaffcn, lo mati:h 

llra low precedents used h EOC ra- yaa111 

E:slallllShed a minimum "1julramenlal 1,500 GJ'/11, 
N bfiowSOOO(ool elavallon, rorall commerdal 

fl"llfeCI$ 

N Added 1111 excepdon for 1851denUal driveways 

N 
/\lllanded lo meat Slale law of Ql'ildes IVl gresler 
Ulan1S'k ,i1!111n WWdland Urban lme11aCa. 

N Added leJ<l lo tndlide cuibs and goners 

Rel!Uirel mlnl11'Jm 15-1\ lftlcle gaits Wheie in!otlUed N an &re apperalusaccesuoads 

N Road\'fflllhs 20 lo29 leet 

Admln!1llallue nelld lo acid OlslJlcl name. EsrabllshadUmll$ 
i,s 1equlrtd byth, Flra Code Olftelal for Aanlmalilc 

l~lly adopted and amended ~enlc ffuld& in slallONiyconbllne,s. Requires AHJ 
aP(lll)Vat and a Sl\!ClallCGndilloatl UH PePnlt kClffl Ille 
County. 

Estab»shes dilleiu:es between LPG s~ and 
llJspensal!l!$1hat aredfreclly relaled lo 11f11V ror remleflllal 
'1MIO!Mll•1'1s allll hlgh-dlllllllyholell,motels, ~pments, 

loc~y adophld and aflll!nded elC. whera a ll!!Nse by !eat« ei,p!ollon of IP-Gas woold 
b.Ne a high p,dlat;;lily ol iijuiy, lnh"360(1, or dealh. 
RequiresAHJ app,vyal and a SpeciaUCondlllaniil Use 
Pem,n ff11111 the County. 

Dl&mantled and st-i whlcle& p(es..,,signfficanl 1ile loads 
(ballariei;. llammsble and combu$Gtlle liqutds, upholstery. 
ele.) and dsklo\'89elaVon illld adjaurit propenles. lhls 

Locally ciealed 811d adopled requ&emetJt pRl\'ides nre acr;e,--,it clearance lo 
vegatanon in auton1obile wreeldng ya«! opera\lans 10 aid tn 
ftrefl,ghling operallons and reduCUon o( ffre Plenso'oo ID 
adj;ICtlll pn,porl!es andforopet1 Jaflds, 

Mrenillld lo indude on-slle spiinklerheads and W11nr;h Ofl-
&lie for eme19enl repalis, lhe induslal cl e Joeal wala! «ow 
al.a1111 lo aeate anaudiblo alertror lheffowolwaleril 11,e 
_,, of waler ach\oalfon in a wcant slnldull, and 

Lct1I~ adopted and amended 
hydro$1alic lntingmquilemenlS lo assul8 pn,per 13D 
Sllil'nlilor 'YSltm 11,slallaffon det:reas'l\9 lht lisk of water 
damage !Rim plpefallur&. Pas,lva purge11qlile1111Rls 
'118ft alllO added to BIISUl8 walll amilallon 11,rough lht 
$J$1BIP, redllC!fQ slagnanll'li'lter and backflOW concerns 
(EID encouragesV!ls l)p• Dfsyslem). 

A'loftl us tomalc'nvmat davetopersand msidenl& aieused 
to in regards lo GPM re How n,qulremenls lhal hal/4 bl!ln 
used tor over a decade In eoc. Also plD'lldNa minimum 

Locallf adopled and amunded Jovel or avaiable waler for nrer.ghUrg purpo5es Jn the tlllllll 
of house lo house. hoise to vejjlllalian. a~rvegllallion 
10 hovsv ignlNan, 

Nltt,rs us lo malch ,,ha! dewloj)l!lt and Ro$ldents are used 
Lccalty adopted and amllllded co in resards IO GPM lite flow 1eqllimmenls Ula! h.-,e beea 

used !or over a dec;ade In EOC. 

Loealy adopled and amended 
II is unll!asonobre 10 reqllire a 11sidenllal dJiweway lo 
construct a 26 fool wfd& space ror access ta a hydca~t. 

w.ally ildopted and amended 

fdl1 14 r11q11ires 11S lo only aCCQpl up to 16% dllvew:iys, 
any w:ep11ons would "'<tulre approval by the Al<J. In our El 
Oollldo CounlyTillB 14 adopUqi we aUo.vgreater ihan 16% 
pie lllilll AH./ a!ll)llNal ;ti! hall! aul\'ace. 

Locally adopled and amended 
20 foot niad 1\'idll\S shall nol induda curbs and gullel$ due 
to pcitenllal acceS!i l11$11n alld tlllOOQ mus ~rns. 

'Wlllli. fire 'll)lllra\115 a~n mils ton!isl of a dl'lidld 
Lccal[y adllllled and ameJ1ded roadway the gatellidlb shall nol be less lh1111 15 leet due lo 

appatalusluming radius. 

llo palfclng OP road$allowed on mdwayt le,s than 28 Feet 

Lccally adcpl~d and -nded 
in wld1h aho'ls ~ reet, Lowcrlhan 5000 Ital this daes 
not apply. This secUon laadopladas llsland1lnth, Fire 
Code A\lllendlX D stcUon 1oi..e.11or a&otlltf ete~ons. 

23-1589 G 45 of 55 



if'ai'liaQ OIi 1111t1 lidlOlllyan~ m 28 tm lo3&1eel 

Roadsw.ldlhs 11101e lhan 29 rat! but lass lllan 36 
allawed. 1l1ls is not raqlfred l1ss lhan SOO0 feet of 

Appcndbc 0: D103.8.2 N !eell11'1dlh \Dcally adople(I and 8ffllded llmlfon, LOW11r lhan 5000 feel 1111s does not apply. The 
ldonis adcplad • i lilandl lntelireCodeAppe111hD 
lsld0n103.0.2b"llolllfre1Mbl. 

'Mltll niqulrtd by Ile rre CD!e ofl'tdel. a Ille apparaa,s 

.Appen«ixD:DfOU N Added lo .. cill:umfalndallirt IIA)aBM< ~Cl9aledand~ iaa:etSroaJ 1h11 bel.'OtlS!ruc:lad lo~IS Ult di~ 
8CICIS$loa& ~andlllafpnwide• r.oitw1U011Snieantof 

leme1119~cynlll1:le-. 

Adopted with no Amendments 
101.1 lbrough 101.S " ~Dalallish1C1198,helll,--IIICS 

vaff(5ty ldyadcpled '1dmllfslliM claril)-

1 D2.1 fl 111ugh 1 D2.12 N IRll/flenceS. subJecfs not ,egulallld ti,, lhe Cod, Lqyado\lled Mmtnir.1tati'le d;iri\y 

fOt f llltau(lh II -lo enloiu lb code lOQ(IJadocJ4ed IMmrlfsllaM ~ UM.12.3 

106.1 hOugh N Time limBallon of applcatbn Locall'f adop\ed Admlnlslra\!Ve darily 1115.8.24 

106.1 IIIIOllflll 106A .. ~led!MHCfan/Q(admlnlllrakedarilyar,cl 
flrund~1u1felyinspedlons l~adojlled Fet sched!Qes for pelfflits 

107.I llrough 1D7.8 N Adopted Ibis Mellon for adminlslr.10118 clanly and l.acaly adop\alS lllll)l!i;lion au'lhOllly 11,uadfit tllt\yfllP'CliOns 

108,1 lhrough 11)g.6 Adopllld lhiuec11111 for ac!Qlklfsllalke clarity and ~811C8 ds.afegA,ds. teslllg alld~ ol 
N 

lltend 6ft ■afelylnapectlOns Loally adopted el!Ufpmenl, re411SJ)Bdi0n and latllll, 11c111dk1epi~. 
Wf)tl'lltion, iendemg tq\l\pmenl inopara'ole, oven:roil'dlng, 

t13 " 
Moplad lhlsseclonlol' ~M aad 

Locally ado!lled ~worlt oldl!1. flreaRd lluefetylllspecllons 

114.f lhlOllgh 114.1 N Adopted Ibis secllon for adll'lnlslrallvll da~ly &nd Locaty edopted \male slrutturas oreljllipinent. tlieandlksalelyiispldOns 

~ llrllles CO!Wn~llanwnableaubslincesaixl 

301.~ lt-,aug!l30$,S N Adopled lhi"s seclion far rfe •nd Ufa safety 
1aqu!re slril\!lllll s1leguards. M1111gi,g lgnil!On sou,m; 

Locaiy edopled lhn,ugll le$1)111\Slble apwcation of sta!ldards \~lll lllduce Ill• 
nurieroflnsrnnrlotJsseUings.(Cl!mde.~. 
ud~). 

Gonar.il requireme11s retsll1111 to smol:lng. Vacanlpllltnises 
candlfOl'I and aaretr ~•111ls, abandoned prwses, 

310, 1 lhrough 311.4 N Adopled thllsedcnf« ll!•arlila~ ~~ 
~~ stleguald'ng.,_.~ sea.ily, In 
l)l(lledcn. i't 11fll!raDrn.11mOWI orca~. 
removal orhazanlous mlll!rials. (Clmstlc, geologlcal,aM 
tapl)(,lraphlcal). 

32!,1 N Adapted Ns seclblforfirnndlCe safely localt, adop(ed Gnei.i reqweme,illl ~ mads. ""'1els, and bcldges, 
(Clllll atlc, 1111ologlcal, and lcpcgraplic:a~. 

f403.& flrouch403.7.8 N ~ lis sedmlorlft andli/e safely 
P!1l\lide$ evWlalloR drill$ fol ~~~ -amlnsh1-'ional 

locjly adopted locqpande5(occup811Cieswilh h:reawd potentlal forlte 
!toss). 

40Ullwugh 403.M N Adop4ed Dus sec[on rar ro end tile safety Locally adopltd Pro\fdas evacueUPn driDs lor holel'mo181 accupancles 
kar.t11panaas 'Mil incieaNd polrial lill' life loss). 

!405.1 \111oll!lh 405.10 N Adopted lhls s,c11a1 rar r«e and nr, safely loc:211y adOpled Enll!IIIIIIICY planring am reuJ!ll 1wtp119 (Clnlalc. 
IMll!amcal, an61DJ)llgral)hlca1). 

510.3 N ~lhissacllm lar~ darily and l.ocafyadop!ld Ape,mil Is raq11ffd bt-O~ respondtt rado syslelnS 
... •nd lfe $1(1\y npecfoas (Clmafc. galllagical, and lapogiapllicat, 

808.1 lhrough llil6.4 N -"lopted this section for adm!Alsllalive clarily and Locally adoplld Daco1811ve vegela1lo11posu an lnoeasa In h•zard, 
11,und &re safely rnspectioos ltammabllily aild lnaeased J!Sk. 

Wal CO\'lllngiln gnqr E ~(Schools) Ills a 

I007 .1111'1l11Ql'I !ll7.S.& H Adapll!d Ills •ecUonC1ir adnilMllalilie dad)' and l.ocaly adopted 111aM111113illGUlllolt'laRmabftWlll~sln 
tie and life surety lnspsdioos ed'JC.llional ldlies IClinnlliO. geo~I. end 

lllpographlcll~ 

23-1589 G 46 of 55 



Adopled 1111& seellon for ailnmllSkalll'e darily slld 
Combustible rwnislilllg p~se a sJan!llcanl lfammabl'IIIY and 

808, 1 lhrough 808.5 N Locally adOp!ed lncfealed Illa salety harw fl! lQslhuliOllal and colege dolfll 
r11t and ~le sa felV inspections l,P&OCC11pandes. 

Mop\ed lhlssaclkln for lllimlniidra11ve c:1a1ily and 
Pt!Mdes c'lilli\y on 11"8pl•ni:e lasllJ18 of 111.1lomauc&m 

904A.1 N Locally sdopled exlingulshlnfl systems. (Clltnalll:, geobg(o:al, end 
fll8 and Ille safely l111peclicms topogiaphlt,d), 

1101.\ lhnlugh 110t1 "' 
Mol)led \Iii seclhin 1or adlllilli51131ll'e claiily and LOCat/ adopled Ad'mlnlsllallve danly 
Iha and die safely lnsc,ecll«!s 

Einecgency Responder radio 00'1111198 Jn 1x1$11n9 bllildl,)gs, 
Al buildings 11111 ba required lo alloW emoigency responders 
to ree,iVaalld traasmllen,eigellC)/ 111d\G l!alfit lo and from 
each other and Iha amergenGY dlspalcll WIier, Time 

AdoJ)led lhls seclionrn eirisOng brrildl~s forlhe 
rrames can bo dmlupad b come inlo goj11pllan1111 and lhe 
pllasiRg In ofa system crma pe,iOd af 1ime,d111A11mined by 

1103,2 y safetyoff!Mtlgllleia aiv:I oUtet emelll'ncy localyad®led the &re code ofllclal, rucceptable. The r.ilioruilc hellind 11\is 
,e.spondets sadon is Iba! OJI almost aa em&l!lenc'/ Nspcnder !npiyor 

falal~im:idtnlscarm,vnl!',abon ls a kay IS$ue. TIiis 
sllUa~on can be=~ wllh 811 6ddi\l<)4\ <J radio 
equ~nt to hoost Ille slglllllln areas Iha\ donol hal/ll 
sirong signal (CDmuUi:. geologkal. and loJ)O!lraplieal). 

Re~ulres inslaVaUon ril 1118 $11dnklot ~ ill ftisl"ing 

1103.6 y AdoJ)led lhls seclloa for lho &alelyorthe public, U>C8Ky adopl.lld 
oc:cupancla; wllll hiJlh Die safely dsk and ln co,1/omlancu 

llrefighlers, and olher emergency responde1s w«h pce'/lalll Ulllfollll File Codas. [C!rna~c. geok>gica). and 
IDPlll!lllPhlcal), 

Adopted lhls section fo, lhesafely of lhe prbllc, 
Rtqu~es insfaffalion of cmion mcnoida atami, ill 

110a9 N Locally adoplad occupancies wilh hlg~ lfe sarely risk. (Cllm&flc, geoluglcal. 
ffraRgtlk!r,, and othor ,mergancy rospc,ndo1$ andtop~ 

1104.1 lhraugh Adopted 1111a sacl!oa for lbt $Biel)' ollhe public, 
l'loYldes a mrnr~m level or sarety,vih regard 10 egress 

N 1.ocally adapled from e:vslirlg buildings he using OGCUpanc:ies will! a lig h nre 
1104.ia lireli!}hltrs. and olbeomargancy respondeis safely li$ll, ICl\melic, geologll:a\, Ind topogmplllcal). 

t106.1 lhloll9h Adopted lhtuecvon for lhesaf atyof '1a l)llbtic, 
Pl!Mdes a mmmum IOYel or Slllety at 11/e siorage yards 

N la(allyadap~ Wl\h high IMS of flammable lllbbet ,naledal. (Clmalic, 
1108.1.2 rrel!Q~tela, aid olllllr emerg111cy respor,der& gealogir:a~ and lapogt11phlcal). 

Append',x D: 0101.1 N 
Adopled !his secllon fo, lhe safely of Ule pubic, lccaly adopled 

General requlremrnls IGrfile apparalus illXe$S roads 
lhiOUUlt D104,1 lliellghlats, and olheremeigel\ey respcndlll!I rncumg t0~(CllmaYc. 910lr,gical, ffll topcgrapblcal). 

Append!K D: Dt04.2. N 
AIIOf)led lhluadion for llia safety oil he pubilo, locally lldop(ed 

Commercial and i1duslrisl devefopmenlflre lljlplllhrs 
(exdudlng 8l(Ceproo) 111811ghlers. and other eme!IJOI\C'/ 1espondeis access roads {CfbnaU,;, geola:glcaJ. a~d topographical), 

1'11Pf/1dlX D: 0104,3 N 
Ado)lled lhluedlon rot the salelyollhe public, locally adopted 

Cll!l\fflerclal and induslrial dmlopment fire apparalu• 
llvaugll 0\05.4 fiiellghters, 111d olher BIIM!Jg61\cy Al&ponders access l!lads (Cliniallc, geo!Ogil:al 111\d l.al)ographlu.l). 

Appt1ndo'x D: D 106.1 N 
Adilptad 1h11 sedtoll fur the safe\), oflh• pul111c, locaWy adopted 

Fire apparaws a1:eess roads ror mul&ple-family midaallal 
~duding IIXCl!plion} rlNlfiQhlers, and olher eme,gency ,esponcJei, dwalopmonls (Cll!Tlllllc, geological, aid 1cpographlcaQ. 

Appendix D: D108.2 N Adopted rhls secllon for lhe salely ol lh• publlc, 1.wi,y adopted 
Fke apparalU$ aQCeSs (Olds !or twUiplHllllily 1esldenllal 

lhrough 0106.3 1181\gh(eis, and olber amergrncy responders ~p,ne,,ls {C~rnavc, geological, and lopoQrap~ll, 

Olla• or \'llo-dWl!llr,g re!liderrUal davelolllllenlsshall be 

~ndbl. O: D10T ,1 N Ado pied lllls ucilon fortlle stlo[yof Ille pulJI'~. Local:1 adopllli 
equJpped lhlr,ughoUlwi1h lwcspe(al!liM!dsPP!Qved ti(e 

{exeluding exceptions) Omtigh16rs, and o\l\lr ~es,cy 1esponder, ewaratus 8(:CQ6$ !llada due lo topographic, ge.igrapblc , nd 
cll111aue cor.dlliol't~. 

Olle-orlwlxh1>elil1g 11!$idenllil develapmOl!ls shaU be 

~D:0107,2 N Adopted l~ls secllun for lh& i efefy cl lhe public, ~oc:ally edcpled 
equipped ltroughwl Ynlh lwo •iale and appn,ved tire 

lh1ough D1011.1 llra1ighlers, and olherflllOlgeAcyrespollder.1 appararus aceessmdsduelol~ ge,ipphk:and 
dima&c~ons. 

-

23-1589 G 47 of 55 



PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of Directors of the MFPD this, 

January. 2023. 

ct V\_ , BearctPresident 

ATTEST: 

-
Sharlyn Fields , Board Secretary 

Ordinance 2022-09 

26th day of 

Page 23 

23-1589 G 48 of 55 



RESOLUTION 22-10 

A RESOLUTION OF THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS OF THE 
MOSQUITO FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT 

ADOPTING FINDINGS SUPPORTING AMENDMENTS TO 
THE CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE 

A resolution for the Mosquito Fire Protection District setting forth findings with respect to 
local conditions within the Fire District which make certain modifications and changes to 
the California Fire Code reasonably necessary for preserving fire and life safety in the 
Mosquito Fire Protection District 

The Governing Board of the Mosquito Fire Protection District finds and resolves as 
follows: 

WHEREAS, Health & Safety Code Section 17958.5 permits a Fire Protection 
District to adopt an ordinance which changes or modifies the State Housing regulations 
adopted 
pursuant to Health & Safety Code Section l 7922 upon determination that such changes or 
modifications are necessary due to local conditions that pertain regulations governing 
conditions hazardous to life, property and the envil'onment from fire, explosion, hazardous 
materials and hazardous uses; and 

WHEREAS, Health & Safety Code Section 17958.7 requires that a District's Board 
of Directors making any changes or modifications pursuant to Health & Safety Code 
Section 17958.5 shall make express finding that such changes or modifications are needed; 
and shall file a copy of such changes or modifications with the Department of Housing and 
Community Development. 

WHEREAS, the unique local climatic, geological, and topographical conditions 
existing within the boundaries of the District make it reasonably necessary for the District to 
impose more stringent requirements than set forth in the California Fire Code and pursuant 
to California Health and Safety Code sections 13869.7 and 17958.7, the District 
desires to make express findings to that effo1t 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that the Board of Directors of the 
Mosquito Fire Protection District, after having duly noticed and held public hearings, hereby 
adopts the foJ!owing findings concerning current unique local conditions that 
together make each modification to the California Fire Code, reasonably necessary to 
provide adequate and effective protection of life, property and the environment more 
specifically set forth as follows: 

-1-

23-1589 G 49 of 55 



FINDINGS OF FACT 
FOR CHANGES OR MODIFICATIONS TO THE STATE BUILDING 

STANDARDS CODE (TITLE 24 PART 9) BECAUSE OF LOCAL 
CONDITIONS 

A. General. 

After due consideration, the Board of Directors of the Mosquito Fire Protection District, 
hereby finds that due to local climatic, geologic and topographic conditions, as stated within 
this document, there is a need to provide the modifications and change contained in the 
adoptive Ordinance of the California Fire Code. Such changes axe deemed to be reasonably 
necessary to provide adequate and effective protection of life, property, and the 
environment. 

The Mosquito Fire Protection District provides fire protection, emergency medical 
services, and specialized rescue services to approximately 2,500 people in a 13 square rnil.e 
area. The District is located on the Western slope of El Dorado County. The 
topography of the District ranges from rolling hills of grass, oak woodland, large 
quantities of brush, and steep drainages. The weather conditions vary from freezing 
temperatures with occasional snow in winter, to summer temperatures that regularly 
exceed 100 degrees. 

Toe Mosquito Fire Pl'Otection District is an "all-risk" agency. The District participates in a 
sophisticated mutual aid program and is dispatched through agreement by the California 
Department of Forestry and Fire Protection (Cal-Fire) at Camino. The resources of the 
District will respond to, and deal with, any type of emergency. The term ''Fire 
Protection" in this document is broad and includes responses to fires, smoke, and odor 
investigations, alarms, public assist calls, hazardous materials incidents, medical aid, and 
specialized rescues. 

The District has one staffed fire station to provide emergency service to. the community. Fire • 
Station 75 is located at 8801 Rock Creek Road. The Dist.tict has 2 full-time, career 
personnel, along with l part time management position, and these are supplemented with a 
volunteer Assistant Chief, Company Officers and Firefighters. 

B. Climatic. 

The Mosquito Fire Protection District is located within a foothill region. The District is 
subject to four seasons, with an annual snowfall in the winter months of 2-4 inches, in 
addition to an average rainfall of 39 inches per year. These adverse weather conditions 
create severe hazardous road conditions and flooding as well as rockslide hazards along the 
main access roads within, as well as into, the District from the surrounding areas. Due to 
periods of rainfall, along with repeated road closures, the ability of the Fire Protection 

-2-

23-1589 G 50 of 55 



District to provide immediate emergency response is often delayed. These same adverse 
climatic conditions often result in a large number of vehicular accidents that place 
extreme restraints on the availability of emergency response to perform emergency 
rescue. first aid, hazardous materials control, and firefighting. The climatic conditions 
often result in a substantial or total lack of ability of the Fire Protection District to 
respond immediately to other types of emergency situations that occur. Examples of these 
emergency situations include structure fires, wildland and forest fires, flooding, 
hazardous materials incidents, emergency medical calls, vehicle accidents, and vertical 
rescues. The mutual aid agreements established with adjoining fire agencies might not be 
possible due to adverse climatic conditions, restlicting or totally blocking access into the 
District. 

Summary: 

These local climatic conditions affect the acceleration, intensity, and size of fires in the Fire 
District. Times of little or no rainfall, low humidity, and high temperatures create 
extremely hazardous conditions, particularly as they relate to the wildland-urban 
interface. Winds experienced in this area can have a significant impact upon structure fires, 
especially in buildings in close proximity to one another, and to wildlands 
commonly found in the Mosquito Fire Protection District. Su·uctures built within the 
Mosquito Fire Protection District must be built with these variables in mind 

C. Geological. 

The Mosquito Fire Protection District is located within moderate seismic Zone Three. The 
seismic, geological conditions present a potential for multiple fires, major breakage of water 
mains, multiple electrical power failures, multiple collapsed structures and a large number 
of calls for emergency medical aid, all of which may occur simultaneously during a seismic 
event. The water district has numerous water-pumping systems used for fire suppression 
water delivery, as well as water storage tanks providing water system pressure. Most of the 
pumping systems are dependent on electrical power for operation. Such electrical power 
may not be available during a seismic event. Water stm·age tanks used for storage of 
required fire suppression water may also collapse in such an event forcing the additional 
need to transport water via additional pi.eces of fh'e apparatus which will place a significant 
restraint on the ability of the Disttict to provide the required emergency services. 

Summary: 

Local geographic and geological features and processes exist within the boundaries of the 
Districts that may hamper the ability of the Mosquito Fire Protection District to perform its 
sworn duties. Fire following an earthquake has the potential of causing greater loss of life 
and damage than the earthquake itself. 

-3-

23-1589 G 51 of 55 



D. Topographical. 

The District is primarily composed of areas that are considered by the State to be high fire 
hazard severity zones. Much of the hill is located within foothiJl terrain, covered with highly 
combustible vegetation, including the presence of many coniferous forested areas. The 
elevation within the District ranges from approximately 800 feet to over 2500 feet at the 
highest point. Slope within the District ranges from O to 90 degrees. The structures within 
the areas of the foothill's tel'rain have very limited fire access, due to narrow 
roadways with steep grades and poor road surface conditions. The presences of many 
existing structures within the high fire severity zone areas provides for a very high 
potential of a structure fire spreading into a wiidland or forest fire condition as well as the 
potential for a wildland or forest fire spreading to structures. 

Summary: 

The alignment of canyons, valleys, and slopes into inhabited areas, combined with the 
variable nature of the terrain, yield potential for increased fire risk. Most structures, both 
residential and commercial, a.re in or are sun·ounded by areas that contain significant grass, 
brush, mixed oak woodland, and mixed conifer fuel load. Due to drought 
conditions, beetle infestations, and lack of vegetation management, much of the area is 
populated with either dead or dying trees, contributing to extreme fire danger. 

E. Conclusion 

Local climatic, geographic, and topographic conditions described above increase the 
frequency, intensity, and size of fires involving buildings in the Fire District. Further, these 
conditions impact potential damage to structures from an earthquake and 
subsequent fire. Therefore, it is reasonably necessary that the California Fire Code be 
modified to mitigate the effects of the above conditions. California Health & Safety Code 
Section 17958.7 requires that modifications to the Fire Code be expressly marked and 
identified as to which each finding refers to which Code modification. The attached 
Appendix A provides this connection. 

-4-

23-1589 G 52 of 55 



PASSED AND ADOPTED at a regular meeting of the Board of Directors of the 
Mosquito Fire Protection District on January 26, 2023 by the following roll call vote: 

ABSENT: I 

ATTEST: BY: 

Sharlyn Fields. Board Clerk 

-5-

23-1589 G 53 of 55 



;J$\ountainl)1!lemotrat 
PROOF OF PUBLICATION 

(2015.5 C.C.P,) 

Proof of Publication of 
NOTICE OF INTENT 

STATE OF CALIFORNIA 
County of El Dorado 

I am a citizen of the United States and a resident 
of the County aforesaid; rm over the age of 
eighteen years, and not a party to or interested in 
the above-entitled matter. I am principal clerk of 
the printer at the Mountain Democrat, 2889 Ray 
Lawyer Drive, a newspaper of general circulation, 
printed and published Monday, Wednesday, 
and Friday, in the City of Placerville, 
County of El Dorado, and which newspaper has 
been adjudged a newspaper of general c.ircula
tion by the Superior Court to the County of El 
Dorado, State of California, under the date of 
March 7, 1952, Case Number 7258; that the 
notice, of which the annexed is a printed copy 
(set in type no smaller than non-pareil), has been 
published in each regular and entire issue of said 
newspaper and not in any supplement thereof on 
the following dates, to-with: 

1/13 

ALL IN THE YEAR 2023. 

I certify ( or declare) under penalty of perjury that 
the foregoing is true and correct. 

Dated at Placerville, California, this 13th day 
of JANUARY, 2023 

MM,sC\lt {9tl.t.5 
Signature 

SECOND NOTICE 
noncE OF INTENT TO ADOPT ;, 

FIRE CODE Ol"OINMlCE 

23-1589 G 54 of 55 



Jm:ountatn{t1!ltmocrat 
PROOF OF PUBLICATION 

(2015.5 C.C.P.) 

Proof of Publication of 
NOTICE OF INTENT 

STATE OF CALIFORNIA 
County of El Dorado 

I am a citizen of the United States and a resident 
of the County aforesaid; I'm over the age of 
eighteen years, and not a party to or interested in 
the above-entitled matter. I am principal clerk of 
the printer at the Mountain Democrat, 2889 Ray 
Lawyer Drive, a newspaper of general circulation, 
printed and published Monday, Wednesday, 
and Friday, in the City of Placerville, 
County of El Dorado, and which newspaper has 
been adjudged a newspaper of general circula
tion by the Superior Court to the County of El 
Dorado, State of California, under the date of 
March 7, 1952, Case Number 7258; that the 
notice, of which the annexed is a printed copy 
(set in type no smaller than non-pareil), has been 
published in each regular and entire issue of said 
newspaper and not in any supplement thereof on 
the following dates, to-with: 

12/7 

ALL 1N THE YEAR 2022 
I certify (or declare) under penalty of perjury that 
the foregoing is true and correct. 

Dated at Placerville, California, this ih day 
of DECEMBER, 2022 

W,A.sCi'<\ Rni..1-tS 
Signature 

First Notice 
Notice of Intent to Adopt a Fire 

Code O!dinance 
Notice is hereby given ofU1e Intention 
of the Mosqulto F\1e Protection 
District to adopt a Fire Code 
Ortlhino,ce. The District shall hold 
Its first public heuring at 7 P.M. ori 
Thur.iday December• i2nd, 2022 al 
the Mosquito Fi"' ProNlctlon District· 
Station 75, 8801 Rock Cruek Rd of 
the Fina Code Ordinance pursuant 
to Health and Safety Code Sec•lfons 
13869 and 13869.7. Copies of th,o 
code section referred to and 11ny 
secondill'Y code sections 161erred to. 
adopted t,y reference, are on file with• 
the SGcretary of the DIStlict and Bf<!, 
open to pubffc Inspection, Adoption, 
al \he Fire Code Ordirance wm adopt 
Iha Califoml• Fire Code ao currunUy, 
publlshad In ·Title 24, Part 9, of Iha, 
California Code of Regulations; 
governing tire prevention and 
t>uildlng standards related to fire and, 
panic safety with some amendments;· 
tn sorM insta11ces the Mosquito fire. 
Protectloo Di5trict's proposed Fire 
Cotle Ordinance propo= buijdln!j 
standards more stringent than· 
those minimum building standards, 
adoplad by the Stste Fire Marshal' 
and contained in th& California 
Building Standard4 Code. 

112n 11101 

23-1589 G 55 of 55 




