
RESOLUTION NO. 134-2023 

OF THE BOARD OF SUPERVISORS OF THE COUNTY OF EL DORADO 

(REPEALING RESOLUTION NO. 041-2020) 

WHEREAS, the California Code of Regulations, Title 24, Part 9, the California Fire Code, is updated by the 

State every three years; and 

WHEREAS, the 2022 California Fire Code became effective on January 1, 2023; and, 

WHEREAS, California Health and Safety Code Sections 17958, 17958.5, 17958.7 and 18941.5 permits a 

county to make such local amendments and modifications as the county determines are reasonably 

necessary because of local climatic, geological or topographical conditions; and, 

WHEREAS, the California Code of regulations, Health and Safety Code, Division 12, Part 2, Chapter 1, 

Article 12, Section 13146, assigns responsibility for enforcement of safety regulations to the local level 
and grants authority to delegate enforcement to the chief building official, or his or her authorized 

representative, or the chief of the fire protection district, or his or her representative; and, 

WHEREAS, the County of El Dorado desires to delegate enforcement of the Fire Code to the chief of the 

fire authority, or the chief's authorized representative; and, 

WHEREAS, the fire protection district and County have agreed to develop, implement and maintain a 

memorandum of understanding that describes the roles and responsibilities pertaining to the inspection 

of certain building standards found in the Fire Code; and, 

WHEREAS, on January 5, 2023, The Board of Directors of the lake Valley Fire Protection District adopted 

Ordinance No. 2022-01, which adopted the 2022 California Fire Code with amendments the District 

deemed necessary to deal with local climate, geological or topographical conditions. 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that the Board of Supervisors of the County of El Dorado ratifies 

Ordinance No. 2022-01 of the Lake Valley Fire Protection District and delegates the enforcement of the 

ordinance to the Lake Valley Fire District Chief, or his or her representative. 

These changes include amendments and additions to the California Fire Code in the following sections: 

101.1, 105.5, 105.5.55, 105.6, 105.6.25, 105.6.26, 107.5, 107.5.1, 107.7, 111.5, 112.4, 112.4.2, 

113.4, 202, 302.1, 307.4.4, 401.2.1, 503.2.1, 503.2.5, 503.2.6, 503.3.1, 503.3.2, 503.3.3, 503.6, 

505.1, 507.5.1, 509.3, 510.4.2.3, 903.2, 903.2.1.1, 903.2.1.2, 903.2.1.3, 903.2.1.4, 903.2 .3, 903.2.4, 
903.2.7, 903 .2.7.2, 903.2.8.5, 903.2.9, 903.2.10, 903.2.10.1, 903.2.22, 903.2.23, 903.6, 907.2, 

907.2.1.4, 907.2.2.3, 907.2.3.11, 907.2.4.1, 907.2.5.2, 907.2.6.6, 907.2.7.2, 907.2.8.4, 907.2.9.4, 

23-1589 C 1 of 67 



907.2.10.1, 907.2.30, 907.6.5, 907.6.2.1, 907.9, 1203.1.3, 3311.3, 3313.1, 50001.7, 5601.2, 

5704.2.9.6.1, 5706.2.4.4, 5806.2, 6104.2, Chapter 80 NFPA 1-22 Section 22.3, Chapter 80 NFPA 1-

22 Section 22.10, Chapter 80 NFPA 13D-22: Sections 4.6, 5.1.1.2, 7.6, 11.2.1.1, Appendix B: Table 
B105.l(l), Appendix B: Table B105.2, Appendix D Sections D103.1 through D103.3, Appendix D 

103.5, Appendix D 103.6.1, Appendix D103.6.2, Appendix D104.4 

The Lake Valley Fire District adopts the 2022 California Fire Code, Title 24, Part 9, in its entirety, including 

Appendices, incorporating those sections of the International Fire Code, 2021 edition not adopted by the 

state, with the exclusions listed below: 

103, 309, 311.5, 311.6, 318, 403.3, 403.5, 403.8, 403.10, 403.11, 404, 406, 903.3.1.2, 904.1.1, 
1103.1, 1103.3-1103.4, 1103.6, 1105, Chapter 26, D104.2 (exception only), D106.1 (exception only), 

D107.1 (exception only), Appendix A, Appendix G, Appendix J, Appendix K, Appendix L, Appendix 

M, Appendix N, Appendix 0. 

Appendices not adopted can be used for reference in enforcing other sections of the 2022 California Fire 

Code. 

PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of Supervisors of the County of El Dorado at a regular meeting of said 
BOARD, held the 12th day of September, 2023 by the following vote of said Board 

Attest: 
Kim Dawson 
Clerk of the Board of Supervisors 

•v -71..~ 
Kyle Kuperus 

Ayes: Thomas, Hidahl, Turnboo, Parlin, Laine 
Noes: None 
Absent: None 

-w~~ 7bt1W~ 
Wendy Thomas,hair, Board of Supervisors 

23-1589 C 2 of 67 



LAKE VALLEY FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT 
,; 

"Serving the Community Since 1947" 
Chad Stephen, Fire Chief 

lluard of Directors 
John Rice 
Hrian Hogan 
Leona Allen 
Run SillOII 
Irene t-:acl111 

January S. 2022 

Don Ashton, Chief Administrative Officer 
El Dorado County Board of Supervisors 
330 Fair Lane 
Placerville, CA 95667 

Subject: Resolution Ratifying Ordinance No. 2022-01 of the Lake Valley 
Fire District, which adopts the 2022 California Fire Code with 
amendments related to local climatic, geographic and 
topographic conditions. 

Dear Mr. Ashton: 

The Lake Vc1lley Fire Protection District (LVFPD) is requesting the Board of Supervisors (BOS) ratify its Ordinance No. 
2022-01, which adopts the 2022 Cc1lifornia Fire Code as amended due to specific local c:limatic, geographic and 
topographic conditions. California Health and Safety Code Section 13869.7 require the legislative body of the city or 
county where the ordinance will apply to ratify, modify or deny the adopted ordinance. The BOS must also 
delegate enforcement of the ordinance to either the Fire District (or its representative) or the Chief Building Official. 

Therefore, we request the Coul"ty Board of Supervisors ratify Ordinance No. 2022-01 with amendments t□ the 2022 
California Fire Code, and delegate the enforcement of that Ordinance to the LVFPD Fire Chief. A proposed BOS 
resolution is enclosed for your review and use on this topic. 

This resolution has no direct fisca l impact to the County. 

Sincerely, 

Chad Stephen 
Fire Chief 

23-1589 C 3 of 67 



LAKE VALLEY FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT 

ORDINANCE NO. 2022-01 

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS OF THE LAKE VALLEY FIRE 

PROTECTION DISTRICT AS FOLLOWS: 

An ordinance of the Lake Valley Fire Protection District (LVFPD) adopting the 2022 

Edition of the California Fire Code, incorporating the 2021 Edition of the fntemational Fire Code, 

regulating and governing the safeguarding of life and property from fire and explosion hazardi 

arising from the storage, handling and use of hazardous substances, materials, and devices, 

and from conditions hazardous to life or property in the occupancy of buildings and premises in 

the LVFPD; providing for the issuance of permits and collection of fees therefor; Repealing 

Ordinance No. 2019-01 of the LVFPD and all other ordinances and parts of the ordinances in 

conflict therewith. 

Be it ORDAINED by the Board of Directors of the LVFPD, also known as the LAKE 

VALLEY FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT: 

Section 1: FINDINGS OF FACTS 

Section 2: ADOPTION OF CODE WITH EXCLUSIONS 

Section 3: LOCAL AMENDMENTS 

Section 4: CONFLICT 

Section5: SEVERABILIIY 

Section 6: EFFECTIVE DATE AND PUBLICATION 

SECTION 1: FINDINGS OF FACTS 

The LVFPD makes certain changes (listed below) to the California Fire Code, 2022 

Edition, pursuant to Health & Safety Code Sections 13869.7, 17958.5, 17958.7, and 18941.5 

during this code adoption process. Such changes are necessary because of local climatic, 

geological, and/or topographical conditions. The LVFPD has adopted, pursuant to Section 

18941.5 of the California Health & Safety Code, the findings of facts relative to these conditions 

by Resolution #2019-01 of the LVFPD dated December 12, 2019. 

23-1589 C 4 of 67 



SECTION 2: ADOPTION OF CODE WITH EXCLUSIONS 

The LVFPD adopts the 2022 California Fire Code, Title 24, Part 9, in its entjrety, 

including Appendices, incorporating those sections of the International Fire Code, 2021 edition 

not adopted by the state, with the exclusions listed below: 

Exclusions: 103, 309, 311.5, 311.6, 318, 403.3, 403.5, 403.8, 403.10, 403.11, 404, 406, 

903.3.1.2, 904.1.1, 1103.1, 1103.3-1103.4, 1103.6, 1105, Chapter 26, 0104.2 (Exception only), 

D106.1 (Exception only), D107.1 (Exceptions only), Appendix A, Appendix G, Appendix J, 

Appendix K, Appendix L, Appendix M, Appendix N, Appendix 0. 

Appendices not adopted can be used for reference in enforcing other sections of the 2022 

California Fire Code. 

SECTION 3: AMENDMENTS TO THE 2022 CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE 

The following Sections are hereby amended or added: 

Chapter 1 

SECTION 101.1 "TITLE" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 101.1 TITLE. These regulations shall be known as the Fire Code of LVFPD, 
hereinafter referred to as "this code." 

SECTION 105.5 ~REQUIRED OPERATIONAL PERMITS" IS AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 105.5 Required operational permits. The fire code official is authorized to issue 
operational permits for the operations set forth in Sections 105.5.2 through 105.5.5~5. 

SECTION 105.5.55 "AUTOMOBILE WRECKING YARDS" IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 105.5.55 Automobife wrecking yards. 
operation of automobile wrecking yards. 

An operational permit is required for the 

SECTION 105.6 "REQUIRED CONSTRUCTION PERMITS" IS AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 105.6 required construction permits. The fire code officiaf is authorized to issue 
construction permits for work as set forth in sections 105.6.1 through 105.6.246. 

SECTION 105.6.25 "AUTOMOBILE WRECKING YARDS" IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 105. 6.25 Automobile wrecking yards. Construction permits are required for the 
installation of or modification of automobile wrecking yards. 

23-1589 C 5 of 67 



SECTION 105.6.26 'TRAFFIC CALMING DEVICES" IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

105.6.26 Traffic calming devices. Construction permits are required for the installation or 
modification of traffic calming devices. 

SECTION 107.5 "PERMIT, PLAN REVIEW AND INSPECTION FEES" SHALL BE ADDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section 107.5 Permit. A schedule of fees adopted by the district board of directors for pfan 
review, inspections, and the issuance of permits by the District may be found in the most current 
district fee schedule (Health & Safety Code 17951). 

SECTION 107.5.1 "COST RECOVERY FEES" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 107.5.1 Cost Recovery Fees. Fire service fees may be charged to any person, firm, 
corporation, or business that, through negligence, violation of the Jaw, or as a result of 
carelessness, is responsible for the cause of the District to respond to the scene of an incident. 
A district board may charge a fee to cover the cost of any service which the District provides or 
the cost of enforcing any regulation for which the fee is charged (Health & Safety Code 13916). 
The fee shall not exceed the actual cost of suppressing the fire and/or responding to the scene 
of an incident. 

SECTION 107.7 ~ADMINISTRATIVE COSTS" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 107.7 Administrative Costs. When a test or inspection is scheduled, and the 
contractor fails to perform to the satisfaction of the authority having jurisdiction (AHJ), the AHJ 
may bill the contractor for actual time spent traveling to and from the test/inspection location 
and the time spent at the test/inspection site as well as administrative costs. 

SECTION 111.5 "APPEAL PROCEDURES AND TIMELINES" SHALL BEADDEDAS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section 111.5 Appeal Procedures and Time/Ines. Any person or entity who believes they may 
be adversely affected by an order, decision, or determination made by the fire code official 
through a written notice may appeal this matter within 15 calendar days of the postmark on the 
notice. All such appeals shall be filed in wn'ting with the Secretary of the Governing Board for the 
District. A timely appeal shall stay further action by the fire code official until the matter is 
determined by the Appeal Board as outlined in Section 109.2 unless the issue poses an 
imminent fire or life safety hazard to members of the public. The fire code official shall notify the 
appellant by certified mail of the date and time of such hearing. The hearing shall be scheduled 
to take place no sooner than 20 calendar days from the date shown on the certified mail. The 
appellant shall have the right to appear in person or by agent at the hearing and present oral, 
written, and/or photographic evidence to the Appeal Board. 

SECTION 112.4 "VIOLATION PENALTIES" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 112.4 Violation Penalties. Persons who shall violate a provision of this code or shall 
fail to comply with any of the requirements thereof or who shall erect, install, alter, repair, or do 
work in violation of the approved construction documents or directive of the fire code official, or 

23-1589 C 6 of 67 



of a permit or certificate used under provisions of this code, shall be guilty of a misdemeanor or 
infraction, at the discretion of the prosecuting attorney or agency, punishable by a fine not more 
than $100.00 for a first vioJat;on; A fine not exceeding $500.00 for a second violation of the 
same provision within one year; A fine not exceeding $1000.00 for each additional violation of 
the same provision within one year, or by imprisonment not exceeding 180 days, or both such 
fine and imprisonment. Each day that a violation continues after due notice has been served 
shall be deemed a separate offense. (Health & Safety Code Sections 13145 and 17995). 

SECTION 112.4.2 ~CITATIONS" SHALL BE ADDEO AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 112.4.2 Citations. The Fire Chief, or his/her duly authorized representative, may issue 
citations for infractions or misdemeanor violations of this code pursuant to Section 13871 of the 
Health & Safety Code of the State of California and Chapter 5c (commencing with Section 
853. 6) of Title 3 of Part 2 of the Penal Code of the State of California. 

SECTION 113.4 "FAILURE TO COMPLY" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 113.4 Failure to Comply. Any person who shall continue any work after having been 
served with a stop work order, except such work as that person is directed to perform to remove 
a violation or unsafe condition, shall be punishable by a fine or imprisonment or both as 
described in Section 112.4 (Health & Safety' Code Sections 13145 and 17995). 

Chapter 2 

SECTION 202 "CAMPFIRE" SHALL BE ADDEO AS FOLLOWS: 

CAMPFIRE. A fire that is used for cooking, personal warmth, lighting, or aesthetic purposes. 

SECTION 202 "DISTRICT" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

DISTRICT. The District and all other areas within the exterior boundaries thereof now or 
hereafter established. 

SECTION 202 "DRIVEWAY" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

DRIVEWAY. A vehicular access that serves up to two (2) parcels with no more than two (2) 
residential units and any number of non-commercial or industrial buildings on each parcel. 

SECTION 202 "EXECUTIVE BODY" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

EXECUTIVE BODY. The Board of Directors of the District. 

SECTION 202 "FIRE CHIEF" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

FIRE CHIEF. The Chief Executive Fire Officer of the Fire department/district serving the 
jurisdiction or a duly authorized representative. 

SECTION 202 "FIRE HAZARD" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

23-1589 C 7 of 67 



FIRE HAZARD. Any condition, arrangement, or act which will increase, or may cause an 
increase of, the hazard or menace of fire to a greater than customarily recognized as normal 
by-persons in the public service of preventing, suppressing, or extinguishing fire; or which may 
obstruct, delay, or hinder, or may become the cause of obstruction, defay or hinderance to the 
prevention, suppression, or extinguishment of fire. 

SECTION 202 "OPEN BURNING" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

OPEN BURNING. The burning of materials wherein products of combustion are emitted directly 
into the ambient air without passing through a stack or chimney from an enclosed chamber. 
Open burning does not include road flares, smudge-pots and similar devices associated with 
safety or occupational uses typically considered open flames. For the purpose of this definition, 
a chamber shall be regarded as enclosed when, during the time combustion occurs, only 
apertures, ducts, stacks, flues or chimneys necessary to provide combustion air and permit the 
escape of exhaust gas are open. 

Open burning shall also include campfires, bonfires, portable outdoor fireplaces, ceremonial 
fires, and recreational fire as defined in the Fire Code. 

Exception: 

1. UL or ASMJ listed LPG or natural gas outdoor flame devices, such as gas BBQ's or 
gas fire pits that comply with the Fire Code. 

2. For one-or two-family dwellings, fixed or portable outdoor flame devices that meet the 
foffowing: 

a. Devices shall comply with the Fire Code. 

b. Devices shall be used per the manufacturer's specifications. 

c. Minimum 10-foot clearance from device to all flammable maten'a/ and vegetation. 

d. No burning shall be conducted during high or extreme fire weather conditions 
(e.g., National Weather Service Red Flag Warnings). 

3. Campfires on private lands. Where required by the fire code official, a permit shall be 
issued by the fire code official. 

4. Ceremonial and/or religious burning with the following safety measures: 

a. Maximum 4-foot x 4--foot bum area. 

b. Minimum 10-foot clearance from the edge of the burn area to all flammable 
material and vegetation. 

c. An approved water supply is located within 500 feet of the burn area. 

d. The bum area is located no less than 30 feet from adjoining property lines. 

e. An adult is present with a shovel until the fire is extinguished. 

f. No burning shall be conducted during high or extreme fire weather conditions 
(e.g., National Weather Se,vice Red Flag Warnings). 

SECTION 202 "TRAINED CROWD MANAGER" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

23-1589 C 8 of 67 



TRAINED CROWD MANAGER. Standby personnel, usually a security guard or usher 
personnel, who are trained in the proper procedure to .exft people from a tent or other place of 
public assemblage in an orderly and calm fashion in the event of an emergency 

Chapter 3 

SECTION 302.1 "DEFINITIONS" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 
3D PRINTER. 
ADDITIVE MANUFACTURING. 
BONFIRE. 
CAMPFIRE. 
Ht-BOY. 
HIGH-VOLTAGE TRANSMISSION LINE. 
OPEN BURNING. 
PORTABLE OUTDOOR FIREPLACE. 
POWERED INDUSTRIAL TRUCK. 
RECREATIONAL FIRE. 
SKY LANTERN. 

SECTION 307.4.4 "OPEN BURNING RESTRICTIONS" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 307.4.4 Open Burning Restrictions. Open burning on all lands within the jurisdiction 
of the LAKE VALLEYF/RE PROTECTION DISTRICT (LVFPD), including the Local Response 
Area (LRA), is prohibited when the California Department of Forestry and Fire Protection (Cal 
Fire) issues a burn suspension in the State Responsibility Area (SRA). This prohibition shall be 
made effective 24-hours following its commencement in the SRA. 

Open burning is also prohibited on all lands within the jurisdiction of LVFPD at any time the fire 
code official that atmospheric conditions or other local circumstances make such fires 
hazardous, including factors such as high winds, low fuel moisture, fire weather, the issuance of 
red flag warnings, the severe threat of wild/and fire, or present risk of destruction by wildfire to 
life, wi1dlife, property, or natural resources. 

Chapter4 

SECTION 401.2.1 "PRE-FIRE PLANS" IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 401.2.1 Pre-fire plans. Where required by the fire code official, a pre-fire plan shall be 
provided and approved by the fire code official for all new commercial structures. 

Chapter 5 

SECTION 503.2.1 "DIMENSIONS" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section S03.2.1 Dimensions. Fire apparatus access roads shall have an unobstructed width of 
not less than 20 feet (6096 mm), exclusive of shoulders, as measured from face of curb to face 
of curb, except for approved security gates in accordance with Section 503.6, and an 

23-1589 C 9 of 67 



unobstructed vertical clearance of not less than 15 feet. Driveways shall have an unobstructed 
width of not less than 12 feet wide. 

SECTION 503.2.5 "DEAD ENDS" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 503.2.5 Dead Ends. Dead-end fire apparatus access roads and driveways in excess of 
150 feet (45,720 mm) in length shall be provided with an approved area for turning around fire 
apparatus. 

SECTION 503.2.6 "BRIDGES AND ELEVATED SURFACES" SHALL BE AMENDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section 503.2.6 Bridges and Elevated Surfaces. Where a bridge or an elevated surface is 
part of a fire apparatus access road. the bridge shall be constructed and maintained in 
accordance with AASHTO HB-17, the current El Dorado County Transportation Division Bridge 
Standard or Appendix D of the current California Fire Code, whichever is more restrictive. 
Bridges and elevated surfaces shall be designed for a live load sufficient to carry the imposed 
loads of fire apparatus. Vehicle load limits shall be posted at both entrances to bridges when 
required by the fire code official. Where elevated surfaces designed for emergency vehicle use 
are adjacent to surfaces that are not designed for such use, approved barriers, approved signs 
or both shall be installed and maintained where required by the fire code official. 

SECTION 503.3.1 "NO PARKING IN FIRE LANES" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 503.3.1 No Parking In Fire Lanes. No person shall stop, park, or leave standing any 
vehicle, whether attended or unattended, except when necessary to avoid conflict with other 
traffic or in compliance with the directions of the Fire Chief, or his/her duly authorized 
representative, Peace Officer, or official traffic control device along the edge of any highway, at 
any curb, or in any location in a publicly or privately owned or operated off-street parking facility, 
designated as a fire lane by the Distn"ct with jurisdiction over the area in which the place is 
located. The designation shall be indicated (1) by a sign posted immediately adjacent to, and 
visible from, the designated place clearly stating in letters not fess than one inch in height that 
the place is a fire lane, (2) by outlining or painting the place in red and, in contrasting color, 
marking the place with the words "FIRE LANE," which are clearly visible from a vehicle, or (3) 
by a red curb or red paint on the edge of the roadway upon which is clearly marked the words 
"FIRE LANE." 

SECTION 503.3.2 "NO PARKING IN FRONT OF HYDRANTS" SHALL BE ADDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section 503.3.2 No Parking in Front of Hydrants. No person shall stop, park, or leave 
standing any vehicle within 15 feet of a fire hydrant except as follows: (a) If the vehicle is 
attended by a licensed driver who is seated in the front seat and who can immediately move 
such vehicle in case of necessity, (b) If the vehicle is owned or operated by a fire department 
and is clearly marked as a fire department vehicle. 

SECTION 503.3.3 "FIRE LANES BASED ON ROAD WIDTH" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

23-1589 C 10 of 67 



Section 503.3.3 Fire Lanes Based on Road Width. Fire lanes shall be based on road width as 
required in Appendix D as amended by the District. 

SECTION 503.6 "SECURITY GATES" IS AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 503.6 Security Gates. The installation of security gates across a fire apparatus access 
road shall be approved by the fire code official and shall comply with the District gate standard. 
Where security gates are installed, they shall have an approved means of emergency operation. 
The security gates and the emergency operation shall be maintained operational at all times. 
Electric gate operators, where provided, shall be listed in accordance with UL 325. Gates 
intended for automatic operation shall be designed, constructed. and installed to comply with 
the requirements of ASTM F2200. 

SECTION 505.1 "ADDRESS IDENTIFICATION" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS : 

Section 505.1 Address Identification. Addresses for new and existing buildings shall comply 
with the District address standard as approved by the fire code official. The address 
identification shall be legible and placed in a position that is visible from the street or road 
fronting the property. Address identification characters shall contrast with their background. 
Address numbers shall be Arabic numbers or alphabetical letters. Numbers shall not be spelled 
out. Each character shall be not less than 4 inches (102 mm) high with a minimum stroke width 
of 1/ 2 inch (12.7 mm). Where required by the fire code official, address identification shall be 
provided in additional approved locations to facilitate emergency response. access is by means 
of a private road and the building cannot be viewed from the public way, a monument, pole or 
other sign or means shall be used to identify the structure. Address identification shall be 
maintained. 

SECTION 507.5.1 "WHERE REQUIRED" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 507.5.1 Where Required. Where a portion of the facility or building hereafter 
constructed or moved into or within the jurisdiction is more than 150 feet from a hydrant on a fire 
apparatus access road, as measured by an approved route around the exterior of the facility or 
building, on-site fire hydrants and mains capable of supplying the required fire flow shall be 
provided where required by the fire code official. 

Exceptions: 

1. For Group R-3 and Group U occupancies, the distance requirement shall be 600 feet 
(183 m}. 

SECTION 509.3 "FIRE CONTROL ROOM" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 509.3 Fire Control Room. Fire sprinkler risers, fire alarm control panels, solar 
photovoltaic power system rapid shutoff switches, and other fire detection, suppression, or 
similar control elements shall be located inside a single fire control room for the building. The 
fire control room shall have minimum dimensions of five feet by seven feet in size with a total 
usable area of not less than 35 square feet. The room shall be located within the building on an 
outs;de wall at a location approved by the Fire Code Official and shall be accessible from the 
exterior. An exterior access door with a clear width of not less than 32 inches and height of not 
less than BO inches shall be provided for access into the room. A durable sign shall be affixed to 
the exterior of the door with the words "FIRE CONTROL ROOM" in letters not Jess than 4 

23-1589 C 11 of 67 



inches in height. A key box complying with Section 506 shall be installed on the exterior side of 
the fire control room door opening. 

The room must be capable of maintaining a minimum temperature of 40 degrees Fahrenheit. A 
clearance of 12 inches shall be provided from the fire sprinkler risers to any adjacent walls. This 
room can be shared with other building utilities or fire protection equipment that is not 
incompatible. An approved cabinet or container shall be provided to store record plans of the 
fire sprinkler system and other fire protecfjon equipment. This room shall not be used for any 
other storage. 

Exception: One-and two-family dwellings, manufactured homes, or similar uses defined 
as either a Group R·3, R3. 1. or R·4 occupancy. 

SECTION 510.4.2.3 "STANDBY POWER" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 510.4.2.3 Standby power. In-building, two-way emergency responder communication 
radio coverage systems shall be provided with dedicated standby batteries or provided with 
2-hour standby batteries and connected to the facility generator power system in accordance 
with Section 1203. The standby power supply shall be capable of operating the in-building, 
two-way emergency responder communication coverage system at 100-percent system 
capacity for a duration of not less than 72 hours. 

Chapter 9 

SECTION 903.2 "WHERE REQUIRED" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 903.2 Where Required. Approved automatic sprinkler systems in new buildings and 
structures, when constructed or relocated within the jurisdiction, sha/f be provided in the 
locations described in Sections 903.2.1 through 903.2.12 and Sections 903.2.14 through 
903.2.23. 

Exception: Agricultural buildings not under a special use permit used for commercial 
purposes. 

SECTION 903.2.1.1 "GROUP A-1" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 903.2.1.1 Group A. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout stories 
containing Group A-1 occupancies and throughout all stories from the Group A-1 occupancy to 
and including the levels of exit discharge serving that occupancy where one of the following 
conditions exists: 

1. The fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

2. The fire area has an occupant load of 300 or more. 

3. The fire area is located on a floor other than a level of exit discharge serving such 
occupancies. 

4. The fire area contains a multi-theater complex 

SECTION 903.2.1.2 "GROUP A-2" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 903.2.1.2 Group A-2. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout 
stories containing Group A-2 occupancies and throughout all stories from the Group A-2 

23-1589 C 12 of 67 



occupancy to and including the levels of exit discharge serving that occupancy where one of the 
following conditions exists: 

1. The fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet; 

2. The fire area has an occupant load of 100 or more. 

3. The fire area is located on a floor other than a level of exit discharge serving such 
occupancies. 

4. The structure exceeds 3,600 square feet, contains more than one fire area containing a 
Group A-2 occupancy, and is separated into two or more buildings by fire walls of less 
than 4-hour fire-resistance rating without openings. 

SECTION 903.2.1.3 "GROUP A-3" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 903.2.1.3 Group A-3. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout 
stories containing Group A-3 occupancies and throughout all stories from the Group A-3 
occupancy to and including the levels of exit discharge serving that occupancy where one of the 
following conditions exists: 

1. The fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

2. The fire area has an occupant load of 300 or more. 

3. The fire area is located on a floor other than a level of exit discharge serving such 
occupancies. 

4. The structure exceeds 3,600 square feet, contains more than one fire area containing 
exhibition and display rooms, and is separated into two or more buildings by fire walls of 
less than 4-hour fire-resistance rating without openings. 

SECTION 903.2.1.4 "GROUP A-4" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 903.2.1.4 Group A-4. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout 
stories containing Group A-4 occupancies and throughout aH stories from the Group A-4 
occupancy to and including the levels of exit discharge serving that occupancy where one of the 
following conditions exists: 

1. The fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

2. The fire area has an occupant load of 300 or more. 

3. The fire area is located on a floor other than a level of exit discharge serving such 
occupancies. 

SECTION 903.2.3 "GROUPE" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 903.2.3 Group E. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided for Group E 
occupancies as follows: 

1. Throughout all Group E fire areas greater than 3,600 square feet in area. 

2. The Group E fire area is located on a floor other than a level of exit discharge serving 
such occupancies. 

23-1589 C 13 of 67 



Exception: In buildings where every classroom has not fewer than one exterior exit 
door at ground level. an automatic sprinkler system is not required in any 
area below the lowest level of exit discharge serving that area. 

3. The Group E fire area has an occupant load of 300 or more. 

4. In rooms or areas with special hazards such as laboratories, vocational shops and other 
such areas where hazardous materials in quantities not exceeding the maximum 
allowable quantity are used or stored. 

5. Throughout any Group E structure greater than 3,600 square feet in area, which contains 
more than one fire area, and which is separated into two or more buildings by fire walls of 
less than 4-hour fire resistance rating without openings. 

6. For public school, and state-funded construction projects see Section 903.2.19. 

7. For public school campuses, Kindergarten through 12th grade, see Section 903.2.20 

SECTION 903.2.4 "GROUP F-1" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 903.2.4 Group F-1. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout all 
buildings containing a Group F-1 occupancy where one of the following conditions exists: 

1. A Group F-1 fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

2. A Group F-1 fire area is located more than three stories above grade plane. 

3. The combined area of all Group F-1 fire areas on all floors, including any mezzanines, 
exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

SECTION 903.2.7 UGROUP M" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 903.2.7 Group M. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout buildings 
containing a Group M occupancy where one of the following conditions exists: 

1. A Group M fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

2. A Group M fire area is located more than three stories above grade plane. 

3. The combined area of all Group M fire areas on all floors, including any mezzanines, 
exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

5. The structure exceeds 3,600 square feet, contains more than one fire area containing a 
Group M occupancy, and is separated into two or more buildings by fire walls of less than 
4-hour fire-resistance rating without openings. 

SECTION 903.2.7.2 "GROUP M UPHOLSTERED FURNITURE OR MATTRESSES" SHALL BE 
AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 903.2.7.2 Group M Upholstered Furniture or Mattresses. An automatic sprinkler 
system shall be provided throughout a Group M fire area where the area used for the display 
and sale of upholstered furniture or mattresses exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

SECTION 903.2.8.5 "MANUFACTURED HOMES" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

23-1589 C 14 of 67 



Section 903.2.8.5 Manufactured Homes. An automatic fire spr;nk/er system shall be required 
in all new manufactured homes and multi-family manufactured homes intended for use as a 
one-and two-family dwelling. The design and installation of such systems shall be in accordance 
wfth California Code of Regulations, Title 25, §4300. 

Exceptions: 

1. Manufactured homes located within an existing mobile home park complying wffh 
California Health and Safety Code, Division 13, Part 2.1 or 2.3. 

2. Manufactured homes that do not exceed 1,200 square feet in size and serve as an 
accessory dwelling unit, as defined in Government Code Section 658502; when the 
existing primary residence on the property is not required to comply with California 
Residential Code Section R313.2. 

3. Manufactured homes that do not exceed 320 square feet in size. 

SECTION 903.2.9 "GROUP S-1~ SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 903.2.9 Group S-1. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout all 
buildings containing a Group S-1 occupancy where one of the following conditions exists: 

1. A Group S-1 fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

2. A Group S-1 fire area is located more than three stories above grade plane. 

3. The combined area of all Group S-1 fire areas on all floors, including any mezzanines, 
exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

4. A Group S-1 fire area used for the storage of commercial motor vehicles where the fire 
area exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

SECTION 903.2.10 "GROUP S-2" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 903.2.10 Group S-2. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout 
buildings classified as parking garages where any of the following conditions exist: 

1. Where the fire area of the enclosed parking garage, in accordance with Section 406.6 of 
the California Building Code, exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

2. Where the enclosed parking garage, in accordance with Section 406.6 of the California 
Building Code, is located beneath other groups. 

Exception: Enclosed parking garages located beneath Group R-3 occupancies. 

3. Where the fire area of the open parking garage, in accordance with Section 406.5 of the 
California Building Code, exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

SECTION 903.2.10.1 "COMMERCIAL PARKING GARAGES" SHALL BE AMENDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section 903.2.10.1 Commercial Parking Garages. An automatic sprinkler system shall be 
provided throughout buildings used for storage of commercial motor vehicles where the fire 
area exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

23-1589 C 15 of 67 



SECTION 903.2.22 "GROUP B" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 903.2.22 Group B. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout all 
buildings containing Group 8 occupancies where the fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

SECTION 903.2.23 "GROUP F-2" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 903.2.23 Group F-2. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout all 
buildings containing Group F-2 occupancies where the fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet. 

SECTION 903.6 "WHERE REQUIRED IN EXISTING BUILDINGS AND STRUCTURESn IS 
AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 903.6 Where Required In Existing Buildings and Structures. An automatic sprinkler 
system shall be provided in existing buildings and structures where required in Chapter 11 and 
as follows: 

1. When there is a change in occupancy classification that results in an increased life safety 
or fire risk, as determined by the fire code official, and the structure exceeds 3.600 
square feet, an automatic fire sprinkler system shall be installed throughout the building. 

2. In existing buildings 3,600 square feet or greater, other than one and two-family dwelling 
units, and agricultural buildings not under special use permit for commerdal purposes, 
where the floor area of the building or structure is increased, such building or structure 
shall be made to conform to Section 903.2. 

Exception: When the building increase is less than 500 square feet. 

3. In existing buildings 3,600 square feet or less, other than one-and two-family dwelling 
units, and agricultural buildings not under special use permit for commercial purposes, 
where the floor area of the building or structure is increased to a total square footage 
over 3,600 square feet, such building or structure shall be made to conform to Section 
903.2. 

Exception: When the building increase is less than 500 square feet. 

SECTION 907.2. "WHERE REQUIRED - NEW BUILDINGS AND STRUCTURES" SHALL BE 
AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 907.2. Where Required - New Buildings and Structures. An approved fire alarm 
system installed in accordance with the provisions of this code and NFPA 72 shall be provided 
in new buildings and structures in accordance with Sections 907.2.1 through 907.2.2930 and 
provide occupant notification in accordance with Section 907.5, unless other requirements are 
provided by another section of this code. 

Not fewer than one manual fire alarm box shall be provided in an approved location to initiate a 
fire alarm signal for fire alarm systems employing automatic fire detectors or water flow 
detection devices. Where other sections of this code allow the elimination of fire alarm boxes 
due to sprinklers or automatic fire alarm systems, a single fire alarm box shall be installed at a 
location approved by the enforcing agency. 

Exceptions: 

23-1589 C 16 of 67 



1. The manual fire alarm box is not required for fire alarm control units systems 
dedicated to elevator recall control, supervisory service and fire sprinkler 
monitoring. 

2. The manual fire alarm box is not required for Group R-2 occupancies unless 
required by the fire code official to provide a means for fire watch personnel to 
initiate an alarm during a sprinkler system impairment event. Where provided, the 
manual fire alarm box shall not be located in an area that is open to the publ ic. 

3. The manual fire alarm box is not required to be installed when approved by the fire 
code official. 

4. A fire alarm system is not required in one and two-family dwellings, agric:u/tural 
buildings, and other occupancies classified as Group U not under special use 
permit and/or not used for commercial purposes (e.g. retail safes, food service, 
and/or special events). 

5. Buildings with a floor area fess than 500 square feet may be exempt, as determined 
by the fire code official based on building construction material and features, 
location, occ:upancy type, and distance to exposures. 

SECTION 907.2.1.4 "GROUP A UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET' SHALL BE ADDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section 907.2.1.4 Group A Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shall be 
;nstafled in all group A buildings with a floor area less than 3,600 square feet. 

SECTION 907.2.2.3 "GROUP B UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET" SHALL BE ADDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section 907.2.2.3 Group B Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shall be 
installed in all group B buildings with a floor area less than 3,600 square feet. 

SECTION 907.2.3.11 "GROUPE UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET" SHALL BE ADDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section 907.2.3.11 Group E Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shall 
be installed in all group E buildings with a floor area less than 3,600 square feet. 

SECTION 907.2.4.1 "GROUP F UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET" SHALL BE ADDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section 907.2.4.1 Group F Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shall be 
installed in all group F buildings with a floor area less than 3,600 square feet. 

SECTION 907.2.5.2 "GROUP H UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET' SHALL BE ADDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section 907.2.5.2 Group H Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shall be 
installed in all group H buildings with a floor area Jess than 3,600 square feet. 

23-1589 C 17 of 67 



SECTION 907.2.6.6 ~GROUP I UNDER 3.600 SQUARE FEET" SHALL BE ADDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section 907.2.6.6 Group I Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shall be 
installed in all group I buildings with a floor area less than 3,600 square feet. 

SECTION 907.2.7.2 "GROUP MUNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET" SHALL BE ADDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section 907.2. 7.2 Group M Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shall be 
installed in all group M buildings with a floor area less than 3,600 square feet. 

SECTION 907.2.8.4 "GROUP R-1 UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEEr SHALL BE ADDEO AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section 907.2.8.4 Group R-1 Under 3,600 Square Feet An approved fire alarm system shall 
be installed in all group R-1 buildings with a floor area less than 3,600 square feet. 

SECTION 907.2.9.4 "GROUP R-2, R-2.1, R-2.2 UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET' SHALL BE 
ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 907.2.9.4 Group R-2, R-2.1, R-2.2 Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm 
system shall be installed in alt group R-2, R-2.1, R-2.2 buildings with a floor area less than 
3,600 square feet. 

SECTION 907.2.10.1 uGROUP S UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET' SHALL BE ADDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section 907.2.10.1 Group S Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shall 
be installed in all group S buildings with a floor area fess than 3,600 square feet. 

907.2.30 "TYPE I HOOD INSTALLATIONS" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

907.2.30 "Type I Hood Installations. The requirement of installation, or replacement, of a Type 
I Hood System shall require a fire alarm/sprinkler monitoring system to be installed, or for the 
hood system to be connected to an existing fire a/arm/sprinkler monitoring system for that 
building. 

907.6.5 "MONITORING" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

907.6.5 Monitoring, Fire alarm systems required by this chapter or by the California Building 
Code shall be monitored by an approved, UL certified, Type A Full Service central, proprietary 
or remote station service, which gives audible and visual signals at a constantly attended 
location. All sprinklered buildings shall be monitored. 

Exceptions: 

1. One- and two-family dwellings (R-3 Occupancies and other occupancies classified as 
'V"). 

23-1589 C 18 of 67 



2. Agricultural buildings not under special use permit and/or not used for commerci8I 
purposes (e.g., retails sales, food service, and/or special events). 

SECTION 907.6.2.1 "SECONDARY POWER SUPPLY" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

SECTION 907.6.2.1 SECONDARY POWER SUPPLY. Where required by the fire code official, 
in accordance with NFPA 72, the secondary power supply providing a minimum 24-hour power 
capacity under quiescent load (system operating in a non-alarm condition) shall be amended to 
a minimum 72-hour power capacity. 

Exception: The existence of an emergency back-up power supply that meets or exceed 
the requirements of California Fire Code Chapter 12. 

SECTION 907.9 "WHERE REQUIRED IN EXISTING BUILDINGS" SHALL BE AMENDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

SECTION 907.9 Where Required. An approved fire alarm system shall be provided in existing 
buildings and structures where required in Chapter 11 and in existing buildings with a floor area 
less than 3,600 square feet without an approved automatic sprinkler system, other than one- or 
two-family dwelling units, agricultural building not under special use permit for commercial 
purposes where a fire alarm detection system does not exist and the floor area of the building or 
structure is increased 

Exception: When the building increase is less than 500 square feet. 

Chapter 12 

SECTION 1203.1.3 "INSTALLATION" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 1203.1.3 Installation. Emergency power systems and standby power systems shall be 
installed in accordance with the California Building Code, the California Electrical Code, NFPA 
110 and NFPA i11. All buildings, other than one- and two-family dwelling units, and agricultural 
buildings not used for commercial purposes, with standby power, shall have a shunt trip device 
that disconnects all power sources to the building, approved by the fire code official. Existing 
installations shall be maintained in accordance with the original approval. 

' 

Chapter 33 

SECTION 3311.3 "PREMISE IDENTIFICATION" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 3311.3 Premise Identification. Pn·or to and during construction, an approved address 
sign shall be provided at each fire and emergency vehicle access road entry into the project. 

SECTION 3313.1 "WHEN REQUIRED" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 3313.1 When Required. An approved water supply for fire protection, either temporary 
or permanent, shall be installed and maintained in continuous operation as soon as combustible 
buHding materials arrive on site, the commencement of vertical combustible construction and on 
installation of a standpipe system in buildings under construction, in accordance with Sections 
3313.2 through 3313.5. 

23-1589 C 19 of 67 



Exception: The fire code official is authorized to reduce the fire-flow requirements for 
isolated buildings or a group of buildings in rural areas or small communities where the 
development of full fire-flow requirements is impractical. 

Chapter 50 

SECTION 5001.7 "LIABILITY FOR DAMAGES" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 5001.7 Liability for Damages. Any damages or cost resulting from the negligence, 
violation of the law, careless handling, spill or discharge of any hazardous materials shalf 
constitute debt against any such person, firm or corporation causing such spill or discharge. 
This debt is collectible by the Fire Chief, or his/her duly authorized representative, in the same 
manner as in the case of an obligation under contract, expressed or implied. 

Chapter 56 

SECTION 5601.2 "PERMIT REQUIRED" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 5601.2 Permit Required. Permits shall be required as set forth in Section 105.5 and 
regulated in accordance with this section. Where fireworks permffs are required, they shall be 
issued by the Fire Chief, or his/her duly authorized representative, and the El Dorado County 
Board of Supervisors. 

Chapter 57 

SECTION 5704.2.9.6.1 ~LOCATIONS WHERE ABOVE-GROUND TANKS ARE PROHIBITED" 
SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

SECTION 5704.2.9.6.1 Locations Where Above~Ground Tariks are Prohibited. Storage of 
Class I and Class II flammable liquids in above-ground tanks outside of buildings is prohibited 
within the limits established by law as the limits of districts in which such storage is prohibited. 
Storage of Class I and Class II flammable liquids in above-ground tanks outside of buildings is 
prohibited unless approved by the fire code official. 

SECTION 5706.2.4.4 "LOCATIONS WHERE ABOVE-GROUND TANKS ARE PROHIBITED" 
SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS : 

SECTION 5706.2.4.4 Locations Where Above-Ground Tanks are Prohibited. The storage of 
Class I and Class II liquids in above-ground tanks is prohibited within the limits established by 
law as the limits of districts in which such storage is prohibited. Storage of Class I and Class JI 
liquids in above-ground tanks is prohibited unless approved by the fire code official. 

Chapter 58 

SECTION 5806.2 "LIMITATIONS" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

23-1589 C 20 of 67 



SECTION 5806.2 Limitations. Storage of flammable cryogenic fluids in stationary containers 
outside of buildings is prohibited within the limits established by law as the limits of districts in 
which such storage is prohibited. Storage of flammable cryogenic fluids in stationary containers 
outside of buildings is prohibited unless approved by the fire code official. 

Chapter 61 

SECTION 6104.2 "MAXIMUM CAPACITY WITHIN ESTABLISHED LIMITS" SHALL BE 
AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

SECTION 6104.2 Maximum Capacity within Established Limits. Within the limits established 
by law restricting the storage of liquefied petroleum gas for the protection of heavily poputated 
or congested areas, the aggregate capacity of any one installation shall not exceed a water 
capacity of 2,000 gallons. The storage ofliquefied petroleum gas in excess of an aggregate of 
2,000-galfon water capacity when located at least one-half (1/2) mile from property zoned or 
designated for residential use and at least one-half (1/2) mile from existing residential 
development with a density greater than one (1) dwelling unit per acre and at least one-half 
(1/2) mile from any hotel or motel is allowed when approved by the fire code official, and a 
special/conditional use·permit is issued by the County of El Dorado. 

Dispensing within established limits. Within the limits established by law restricting the 
dispensing of liquefied petroleum gas for tne protection of heavily populated or congested 
areas, the aggregate capacity of any one installation shall not exceed a water capacity of 2,000 
gallons. The dispensing of liquefied petroleum gas in excess of an aggregate of 2,000-gallon 
water capacity when located at least one-half (112) mile from property zoned or designated for 
residential use and at least one-half (1/2) mile from any hotel or motel is allowed when 
approved by the fire code official and a special/conditional use permit is issued by the County of 
El Dorado. 

Section 6112 High Elevation Liquefied Petroleum Gas Installations (5,000 

foot elevations and above) shall be added as follows: 

Any new LPG installation shafl comply with the following: 

1. A permit is required by this Code for individual LPG containers of 125 

ga/Jons or greater. At the time of application by any person for a permit to 

install an LPG system as required by this Code, the applicant shall submit an 

LPG plot plan to the District for approval and shalt contain the following: 

a. Stamp of approval of the prospective LPG supplier. 

b. Tank location showing distances to structure and edge to edge of 

pavement or other identifying mark. 

23-1589 C 21 of 67 



c. Tank capacity in US gallons. 

d. Location of riser pipe at building. 

e. Property boundaries. 

f. An outline of all existing/proposed buildings on the lot and a depiction of the 

roof ridge line of any building to be supplied with LPG. 

2. Two stage regulator systems shall be installed on all LPG installations in 

accordance with manufacturer's instructions. Alf first stage regulators and 

connecting pigtails shall be installed under a protective valve cover on the 

tank. All regulators installed under this cover shall be listed and approved for 

this use and position of mounting. A connector providing flexibility shall be 

used to connect the first stage regulator to the main service valve on the tank. 

All copper pigtails shall be internally tinned and use only forged flare nuts. 

3. The riser from the yard piping shall be a minimum of Schedule 80 and sha/f be 

located not more than 3 inches horizontally from the walls of the tank, and 

swing joints will be used above and below tank level to provide for tank 

movement (street elbows shall not be used). An approved flexible alternative is 

preferred in Heu of rigid steel pipe for the tank riser. This shall include but not 

be limited to plastic (PE), copper tubing, stainless steel. ALL FLEXIBLE 

MATERIAL USED FOR THE TANK RISER SHALL BE SHEATHEO IN AN 

APPROVED STEEL COVER FOR PROTECTION. As swing joints are 

eliminated in an approved flexible alternative, sufficient slack must be 

maintained to a/law for tank movement and/or expansion and contraction of the 

alternative material. All plastic pipe shall be buried at least 18" below finished 

grade. An electrica/fy continuous corrosion resistant tracer wire (min. A WG 14) 

or tape shall be buried with the plastic pipe to facilitate locating. One end shall 

be brought above ground at the buUding wall or riser and the other end shall be 

23-1589 C 22 of 67 



brought above ground at the tank. 

4. The second stage regulator and riser pipe shall be instaJJed on the gable end 

of the bui/d;ng, as close as practical to the building wall, unless this is not 

feasible due to structural or topographical constraints. An approved gas shutoff 

valve rated for a minimum of 125 PSI shall be installed immediately prior to the 

second stage regulator. An approved gas shut off sign or other identifier shall 

be insta/Jed directly above the gas shut off valve, on the building in a visible 

location within three (3) feet of the eaves of the roof or roof line if no eaves are 

present. If the second stage regulator or a combination first/second stage 

regulator is used at the tank, then an approved gas shut off valve shall be 

located at the building. 

5. A protective cover shall be installed over the second stage regulator and meter 

(if installed) at the building. The minimum design for the protective cover shall 

be equal to, or greater than, the Building Design Load (determined by the 

building department), and shall be securely supported to the ground or 

diagonally to the building wall. When supported to the ground, the footing for 

the supports shall be found 6 inches below finished grade. Precast concrete 

piers may be used in lieu of poured footings, provided they are placed on 

stable soil. If second stage regulator/meter assemblies coufd be subject to 

vehicle damage, then a minimum of 3" steel crash posts filled with concrete 

shall be installed for protection. Crash posts shall have a minimum depth in the 

ground of 24", embedded in concrete. 

6. Observation and inspection, if any, by the District shall not constitute an 

approval of the work of installation of the aforementioned protective cover, nor 

shall it be deemed to create any liability or responsibility on the part of the 

District for the design or construction of the protective cover, nor to any third 

part,y or entity whatsoever. 

7. The riser pipes for the yard piping shall not be embedded in concrete, asphalt 

or other rigid substance. Such substance placed around a riser shall be held 

back at least 3 inches from all sides of the pipe. All exposed exterior gas piping 

23-1589 C 23 of 67 



used for runs along walls or roofs shall be minimum schedule 80 steel pipe 

supported and secured by approved straps at intervals not to exceed four (4) 

feet. 

a. LPG tanks shall be permanently marked by a square or other approved equal 

stake of wood or other material with a minimum dimension of 2" X 2" or a 

cross sectional width of 2i nominal lumber. 

9. Such stakes shall be of sufficient height to rise above the anticipated snow 

depth, with the minimum height being 10 feet. The snow stakes shall be yellow 

in color and will be placed on the opposite side of the tank from the riser, and 

directly opposite the tank valves. The top twelve inches of the stake shall be 

painted orange. The side of the stake adjacent to the tank shall continue with 

the orange color a minimum of 18 inches from the top of the stake, 

I 0. installation and maintenance of all tank stakes shall be the responsibility of 

the LPG supplier. No tank shall be filled or serviced unless staked as provided 

in this chapter. 

11. Any supplier supplying propane to a tank must affix a label or other means of 

identification to the inside of the tank valve protective cover. The label or other 

device must be waterproof and contain the supplier's name and emergency 

telephone number. 

12. Alf LPG tanks shall be placed on approved concrete supports. Acceptable tank 

supports shall include, but not be limited to: Precast reinforced concrete pads, 

reinforced concrete slab, or precast reinforced concrete saddles. Use of 

un-reinforced cinder building blocks is specifically prohibited. If saddles are 

used they shall contact a minimum of 110 degrees of the tank circumference. 

Asphalt impregnated felt of not less than 3/8" thickness shall be installed 

between the container and the concrete saddle. Support may be poured in 

place in lieu of prefabricated supports. If poured in place it shall be a minimum 

of 4 inches thick and reinforced with not fess than WWF 6X12, W16 by W26 or 

4 #3 rebar in each direction. In areas where tanks may be subject to shifting 

snow, unstable ground or other hazardous conditions, the Fire Chief may 

23-1589 C 24 of 67 



require additional tank support, securing or protection. 

Section 6113 Underground LPG Tanks Installations and Ownership shall be 

added as fof/ows: 

6113.1 Permits and Plans. Permits shall be required, and plans shall be 

submitted for all underground tank installations as approved by the AHJ. 

6113.2 Underground LPG Tank Ownership. Underground LPG tanks shall be 

prohibited from being sold to end-users and shall be retained by the LPG company 

under a lease-type system to ensure proper annual maintenance requirements are 

met and 

recorded. 

Section 6114 Natural Gas shall be added as follows: 

Existing natural gas installations shall comply with the following: 

1. The meter assembly shall be installed on the gable end of the building, as 

close as practical to the building wall, unless this is not feasible due to 

structural or topographical constraints. 

2. A protective cover, designed to be equal to or greater than the Building Design 

Load (determined by the building department), approved by the supplier, shall 

be installed over the meter assembly, secure/ y supported to the ground or 

diagonally to the building wall. 

When supported to the ground, the footing for the supports shall be founded 

6 inches below finished grade. Pre-cast concrete piers may be used in lieu 

poured footings, provided they are placed on stable soil. 

23-1589 C 25 of 67 



Section 6115 Violations shall be added as follows: 

6115,1 Violations, It shall be unlawful for an LPG supplier to provide service to 

a LPG installation, which does not comply with the provisions in section 6112 or 

6113. 

6115.2 Failure to Provide Cover. Failure by the customer to provide a cover as 

required for a natural gas meter assembly is a violation of this code and will subject 

the customer to a one hundred dollar ($100.00) fine. 

Chapter80 

SECTION 80, NFPA 1-22, CHAPTER 22 "AUTOMOTIVE WRECKING YARDS" IS ADOPTED, 
AMENDED SECTIONS AS FOLLOWS: 

Revise Section 22.3 as follows: 

22.3 Fire department access roads shall be in accordance with the California Fire Code, Section 
503 and Appendix D. 

Add new Section 22.10 as follows: 

22.10 Stored vehicles, boats, recreational vehicles. parts, and equipment shall not be stored 
within 30 feet of adjacent property lines. 

SECTION 80, NFPA, 13D-22- "STANDARD FOR THE INSTALLATION OF SPRINKLER 
SYSTEMS IN ONE-ANO TWO FAMILY-DWELLINGS AND MANUFACTURED HOMES" IS 
AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 903.3.1.3, 903.3.5.1.1 

23-1589 C 26 of 67 



NFPA 13D, Amended Sections as follows: 

Add new Section 4.6 as follows: 

4.6 Residential fire sprinkler systems installed in all new one-and two-family dwellings shall 
utilize a "Passive Purge" system design unless otherwise approved by the fire code official. 

Exception: Manufactured home installed, tested and approved by the California 
Department of Housing and Community Development. 

Revise Section 5.1.1.2 as follows: 

5.1.1.2 A supply of at least one of each type and temperature sprinkler used within the premises 
shall be maintained on the property at an approved location. Spare sprinklers shall be kept in a 
mounted and accessible cabinet. 

Revise Section 7.6 as follows: 

7.6 A local audio/visual device activated upon water flow shall be provided on all fire sprinkler 
systems in homes at an approved location on the exterior of the dwelling. 

Revise Section 11.2.1.1 as follows: 

11.2.1.1 Where a fire department pumper connection is not provided, the system shall be 
hydrostatically tested at a minimum pressure of 150 pounds per square inch gauge for no Jess 
than a 30-minute duration without evidence of leakage. Such a test shall be witnessed by the 
fire code official. 

Appendix B - Fire Flow Requirements for Buildings 

TABLE B105.1(1) "REQUIRED FIRE FLOW FOR ONE- AND TWO-FAMILY DWELLINGS, 
GROUP R-3, AND R-4 BUILDINGS AND TOWNHOUSES" SHALL BE AMENDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

TABLE B105.1 (1) REQUIRED FIRE FLOW FOR ONE-AND TWO-FAMILY DWELLINGS, 
GROUP R-3, AND R-4 BUILDINGS AND TOWNHOUSES 

£PLEA SE NOTE THAT TABLE B 105 1(1) INCLUDE$ A SEPARATE $ECTIQN EQR SPRINKLfREQ RESIDENCES WITH LESSER 
EJBE. FLOW RE.OUIRfMeNTS NOT MENTIONED IN TfflS AMENDED SECTIQNI 

FIRE-FLOW AUTOMATIC MINIMUM FLOW DURATION 
CALCULATIO SPRINKLER SYSTEM FIRE-FLOW (hours) 

NAREA (Design Standard) (gallons per 
(square feet) minute) 

0 -3,600 No automatic 
system 

sprinkler 1,000 1 

3,601 and greater No automatic sprinkler Value in Table Duration in Table 
system B105.1(2) B105.1(2) at the 

23-1589 C 27 of 67 



required fire-flow 
rate 

MAJOR SUBDIVISIONS (5 PARCELS OR GREATER) 

0-3,600 Section 903.3.1.3 of the CA 1,000 1 
Fire Code or Section 
313.3 of the CA 
Residential Code 

3,601 and greater Section 903.3.1.3 of the CA 1/2 value of 
Fire Code or Section Table B105.1(2) 2 
313.3 of the CA (min. 1000 GPM) 
Residential Code 

OTHER RESIDENT/AL DEVELOPMENT 

0- 3,600 Section 903.3.1.3 of the CA 500 1 
Fire Code or Section 
313.3 of the CA 
Residential Code 

3,601 and greater Section 903.3.1.3 of the CA 1/2 value of Table 1 
Fire Code or Section 8105.1(2) {min. 
313.3 of the CA 750 GPM) 
Residential Code 

TABLE B105.2 "REQUIRED FIRE FLOW FOR BUILDINGS OTHER THAN ONE- AND 
TWO-FAMILY DWELLINGS, GROUP R-3, AND R-4 BUILDINGS AND TOWNHOUSES" 
SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

TABLE 8105.2 REQUIRED FIRE FLOW FOR BUILDINGS OTHER THAN ONE-AND 
TWO-FAMILY DWELLINGS, GROUP R·3, AND R-4 BUILDINGS AND 
TOWNHOUSES 

AUTOMATIC MINIMUM FIRE-FLOW FLOW DURATION 
SPRINKLER SYSTEM (gallons per minute) (hours) 

(Design Standard) 
No automatic sprinkler Value in Table Duration in Table B105.1 (2) 
system B105.1(2) 

Section 903. 3 .1. 1 of the 25% of the value in Duration in Table B105.1 (2) at 
CA Fire Code Table B 105.1 (2) b the reduced flow rate 

b. The reduced fire flow shall not be less than 1,500 GPM 

Appendix D - Fire Apparatus Access Roads 

23-1589 C 28 of 67 



SECTION D103.1 "ACCESS ROAD WIDTH WITH A HYDRANT" SHALL BE AMENDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Section D103.1 Access Road Width with a Hydrant. Where a fire hydrant is located on a fire 
apparatus access road, the minimum road width shall be 26 feet (7925 mm), exclusive of 
shoulders {see Figure D103.1). 

Exception: Driveways 

SECTION D103.2 "GRADE" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

SECTION D103.2 Grade. Fire apparatus access roads and driveways shall not exceed 15.9% 
in grade unless approved by the fire code official or by the El Dorado County amended 
California Public Resource Code Title 14 I Design and Improvement Standards Manual. 

SECTION 0103.3 "TURNING RADIUS" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

SECTION D103.3 Turning Radius. The minimum turning radius shall be determined by the fire 
code official; and shall not include curb and gutter. 

SECTION D103.5 "FIRE APPARATUS ACCESS ROAD GATES" SHALL BE AMENDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

SECTION D103.5 Fire Apparatus Access Road Gates. Gates securing the fire apparatus 
access roads shall comply with all of the following criteria: 

1. Where a single gate is provided, the gate width shall be not less than 20 feet (6096 mm). 
Where a fire apparatus road consists of a divided roadway, the gate width shall be not 
less than 15 feet {3658 mm). 

2. Gates shall be of the horizontal swing, horizontal slide, vertical lift, or vertical pivot type. 

3. Construction of gates shall be of materials that allow manual operation by one person. 

4. Gate components shall be maintained in an operative condition at all times and replaced 
or repaired when defective. 

5. Electric gates shall be equipped with a means of opening the gate by fire department 
personnel for emergency access. Emergency opening devices shall be approved by the 
fire code official. 

6. Methods of locking shall be submitted for approval by the fire code official. 

7. Electric gate operators, where provided, shall be listed in accordance with UL 325. 

8. Gates intended for automatic operation shall be designed, constructed, and installed to 
comply with the requirements of ASTM F2200. 

SECTION D103.6.1 ~ROADS 20 TO 29 FEET IN WIDTH" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 

SECTION 0103.6.1 Roads 20 to 29 feet in width. Fire tane signs, as specified in Section 
0103.6 shall be posted on both sides of fire apparatus access roads that are 20 to 29 feet wide 
(6096 to 8534.4 mm). 

23-1589 C 29 of 67 



SECTION D103.6.2 uROADS MORE THAN 29 FEET IN WIDTH" SHALL BE AMENDED AS 
FOLLOWS: 

SECTION D103.6.2 Roads more than 29 feet in Width. Fire lane signs, as specified in 
Section D103.6, shall be posted on one side of fire apparatus access roads more than 29 feet 
wide (8534.4 mm) and less than 36 feet wide (10972.B mm). 

SECTION D104.4 "CIRCUMFERENTIAL FIRE APPARATUS ACCESS ROADS" SHALL BE 
ADDED AS FOLLOWS: 

SECTION D104.4 Circumferential Fire Apparatus Access Roads. When required by the fire 
code official, a fire apparatus access road shall be constructed to encompass the entirety of a 
structure and shall provide a continuous means of emergency vehicle access. 

SECTION 4: CONFLICT 

That Ordinance No. 2019-01 of the LVFPD and all other ordinances or parts of ordinances 

herewith are hereby repealed. 

SECTION 5: SEVERABILITY 

If any Ordinance, article, subsection or subdivision thereof, provision, sentence, clause, or 

phrase of this code, or any application thereof, is for any reason held to be invalid by a court of 

competent jurisdiction, such decision shall not affect the remaining provisions of this code, 

which can be given effect without the invalid portions and, therefore, such invalid portions are 

declared to be severable. The LVFPD hereby declares that it would have enacted this 

Ordinance and each of its articles, sections, subsections, or subdivisions thereof, provisions, 

sentences, clauses, or phrases, irrespective of the fact that one or more of them is declared 

invalid. 

SECTION 6: EFFECTIVE DATE AND PUBLICATION 

This Ordinance shall take effect thirty {30) days after its adoption. The LVFPD Board Secretary 

is directed to publish this Ordinance in a newspaper of general circulation in the District. In lieu 

of publication of the full text of the Ordinance, a summary of the Ordinance may be published by 

the by the Board Secretary within fifteen (15) days after its passage and a certified copy shall be 

posted in the office of the LVFPD pursuant to Government Code Section 36933(c) (1). 

23-1589 C 30 of 67 



The above Ordinance will be introduced at a meeting of the Board of Directors of the LVFPD on 

December 8, 2022, and it will then be read for the first time. A public hearing will be set for the 

Ordinance to be read for the second time no earlier than 10 days after 1st reading, and 

approved by the following vote: 

.... 
PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of Directors of the LVFPD on the v day of 

Jll''(\,\h-,.y,.._t , 2023. 

AYES: 

NOES: 

5 

0 
ABSENT: 0 
ABSTAIN: t) 

J 

ATTEST: 

Irene Kaelin, Board Secretary 

23-1589 C 31 of 67 



LAKE VALLEY FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT 

RESOLUTION NO: 2022~01 

A RESOLUTION OF THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS OF THE LAKE 
VALLEY FIRE PROTECTIO~ DISTRJCT ADOPTING FINDL~GS 

SUPPORTING AMENDMENTS TO THE CAUFORNIA FIRE CODE 

A resolution for the Lake Valley Fire Protection District setting forth findings with 
respect to local conditions within the Fire District which make ce1tain modifications and 
changes to the California Fire Code reasonably necessary for preserving fire and life 
safety in the Lake Valley Fire Protection District 

The Governing Board of the Lake Valley FiTe Protection District finds and 
resolves as follows: 

WHEREAS, Health & Safety Code Section 17958.5 permits a Fire Protection 

District to adopt an ordinance which changes or modifies lhe State Housing regulations 

adopted pursuant to Health & Safety Code Section 17922 upon a determination that ~'Uch 
changes or modifications are necessary due to local conditions that pertain regulations 
governing conditions 11azardous to life, property and the environment from fire, 
explosion, hazardous material~ and hazardous uses; and 

\VJJEREAS, Health & Safety Code Section 17958.7 requires that a District'i; Board 
of Directors making any changes or modifications pursuant to Health & Safety Code Section 
17958.5 shall make an express finding that such changes or modifications arc needed; 
and shall file a copy of such changes or modifications with the Department of Housing 
and Community Development; and 

WHEREAS, the unique local climatic, geological, and topographical conditions 
existing within the boundaries of the District make it reasonably necessary for the 
District to impose more stringent requirements than set forth in the California Fire Code 
and pursuant to Califomia Health and Safety Code sections 13869.7 and 17958.7, the 

District desires to make express findings to that effect; and 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that the Board of Directors of the 
Lake Valley Fire Protection District, after having duly noticed and held public hearings, 
herehy adopts the following findings concerning current unique local conditions that 

together make eacb modification to the California Fire Code. reasonably necessary to 
provide adequate and effective protection of Hfe. property and the environment more 
specifically set forth a.-; follows: 

23-1589 C 32 of 67 



SECTION 2: FINDINGS OF FACTS 

In connection with the amendments enacted by Section 2 and 3 relating to 
the California Fire Code and its appendix, 2022 edition, the LAKE VALLEY 
FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT (LVFPD) makes the following findings 
pursuant to Health and Safety Code Section 17958.5, 17958.7, and 
18941.5. The changes are reasonably necessary because of local climatic, 
topographical, or geological conditions. 

LVFPD hereby adopts, pursuant to Section 18941.5 of the California 
Health and Safety Code, the following findings of fact 

(a) Under this adopting ordinance, specific amendments have been 
established which are of a more restrictive nature than those adopted by the 
State of California (State Buildings Standards Code, State Housing & 
Community Development Codes), commonly referred to as Title 24 & Title 
25 of the California Code of Regulations. The LVFPD has recognized these 
amendments to the California Fire Code 2022 edition to address the fire 
problems, concerns, and future direction by which LVFPD can establish and 
maintain an environment that will afford a level of fire and life safety to all 
who live and work within its boundary. 

(b) The International Code Council has assumed responsibility for the 
International Fire Code and International Fire Code Standards. The 
International Code Council provided a means for participation by all code 
enforcement officials from throughout the country and industry 
representatives, consultants, and other private parties interested in the 
International Fire Code. 

(c) The International Fire Code, being the 2021 edition thereof, 
published by the International Code Council, is a nationally recognized 
compilation of proposed rules, regulations, and standards of said 
Association. 

(d) Said International Fire Code has been printed and published as a 
Code in book form within the meaning of Section 50022.1 of the 
Government Code of the State of California. 

(e) Under Section 18941.5 of the Health and Safety Code, local 
amendments are based on climatic, topographical, and geological 

conditions. The findings of fact herein address each of these situations and 
present the local situation, which, either singularly or in combination, 

caused the aforementioned amendments to be adopted. 

Page 1 of 10 

23-1589 C 33 of 67 



2022 CFC FINDINGS 

LOCAL CONDITIONS 

A. These amendments are justified on the basis of a local climatic 
condition. LVFPD is subject to precipitation, relative humidity. 
temperature extremes, and high velocity winds. 

1. Precipitation & relative humidity 

a. Conditions 

Precipitation. Annual precipitation fluctuates greatly. 
Approximately 90 - 95 percent of the precipitation occurs 
during the months of November through April, and 5 - 10 
percent occurs from May through October. This area has 
experienced major droughts in the recent past; one in 
1977 - 1978, one which started in I 989 and lasted into l 994, 
others from 1999-2004, and 2006-200':i. Droughts continue to 

cycle to this day. Electrical storms are frequent and are usually 
accompanied by little rainfall, potentially creating numerous 
lightning caused fires. Snow storms, loss of access and 
avalanches are routine. Heavy winter snows are responsible 
for delays in response and access to buildings and patients at 
emergency scenes. Winter snow storms along with heavy tourist 
traffic routinely bring all community traffic lo a standstill 
during weekends and holidays. 

Relative Humidity. During the months of June through 
September, the daily humidity ranges around 30 percent, and 
often drops to the low teens. Low rclati ve humidity have 
allowed for greater !.pread of wildfires and caused structure 
fires to readily spread to the wildland interface 

Temperatures. During the months of June through 
September, daily temperatures exceed 70 degrees to 90 
degrees Fahrenheit. Winter temperatures can drop 
to below O degrees Fahrenheit. The highest recorded 
temperature was 99 degrees Fahrenheit in 1988 with 
the lowest being negative 13 degrees Fahrenheit 
February of 2019. 

Page 2 of 10 

23-1589 C 34 of 67 



Winds. Prevailing winds are out or the south and southwest. 
However, north and east winds occur during the spring (May 
through June), the fall (late September and October), and 
occasionally during the summer months. Wind velocities 
generally range from five to fifteen miles per hour, gusting to 
thirty miles per hour during the summer months 

SUMMARY 

These local climatic conditions affect the community's acceleration, 
intensity and size of a fire. Times of little or no rainfall and high 
temperatures create extremely hazardous conditions, mainly 
residential roof fires and wildfire conflagrations. The climatic 
conditions are one of the most significant impacts to fire behavior and 
other major emergency events due to their uncontrollable nature. 

B. These amendments are justified based on local geologic and 
topographic conditions. LVFPD is subject to terrain, slopes, increased 
vegetation, surface features, hazardous building operations, and 
terrain risk factors. 

1. Geological location 

a. Conditions 

Geological Location. The fire environment of a community is 
primarily a combination of two factors: the physical geographic 
characteristics of the area and the historic pattern of development. These 
two factors create a mixture of environments that ultimately determines 
the area's frre protection needs. 

The Lake Valley Fire Protection District provides fire prevention, fire 
protection, advanced emergency medical and rescue services for 

unincorporated El Dorado and Alpine County an:a, within the Lake Tahoe 

Basin. 

The Lake Valley Fire Protection District serves 85 square miles via Station 
7, located at 2211 Keetak, Station 6, located at 1286 Golden Bear Trail. Station 5 

located at 1009 Boulder Mountain Court is staffed by Calfire via a lease 

agreement with the District. 

Page 3 of 10 

23-1589 C 35 of 67 



The Lake Valley Fire Protection District service area includes: California State 

Highway 50 from Camp SacramentoT to the City of South Lake Tahoe 

boundary; California State Highway 89 South from Alpine County Willow 
Creek Road to California State Highway 50 in Meyers. 

Extending along California State Highway 89 North, che Fire District 
extends from the Northern boundary of the City of South Lake Tahoe (West 

Way) to Eagle Creek in Emerald Bay. 

The service area has a varied topography and vegetative cover. It has 
relatively flat areas along the shoreline of Lake Tahoe along Pope and 
Baldwin Reach areas (6225.feet at Like level). Steep hills and mountain 

peaks over I 0,000 feet are part of the Tahoe Basin- The most prominent 

peak in the fire District is Mount Tai lac at 9735. Vegetative cover 
ranges from stands of manzanita to dense forests of fir and pine trees. 

The main commerciai areas are in Meyers and Tahoe Paradise along the 
highway 50 corridor. Businesses as well as the California Agricultural 
Station, the Meyers Elementary School, two golf courses and the local 

Tahoe Parndise Park are in this area. 

Neighborhoods in the vicinity of Pioneer Trail include: Elks Club, Golden 
Bear, Cold Creek, High Meadow, Black Bart, Kokanee Trail, 

Montgomery Estates, Washoan. This conidor also includes the Sierra 

House School and the South Tahoe Public Utilities District work sites. 

The neighborhoods of North Upper Truckee, Echo View Estates, 
Mountain View Estates, and Tahoe Mountain were affected by the Angora 

Fire of 2006 with the loss of 254 homes. The area secs significant traffic delays 
due to tourist travel and is highly prone to heavy snows. 

The neighborhoods of South Upper Truckee and Christmas Valley off of 
both State Highway 50 at Echo Summit and State Highway 89 to Alpine 
County also suffer IJaffic delays from tourist travel and heavy snows. Echo 
Summit, via State Highway 50, is a funnel for traffic congestion and 
highly prone to winter avalanches. 

Page 4 of 10 

23-1589 C 36 of 67 



The State Highway 89 corridor, north to Emerald Bay, is the most heavily 

traveled road in the Lake Tahoe Basin. Of the estimated 20 million 
tourists visiting the Tahoe Basin. annually, roughly 4.9 million stop to take 

a picture of Emerald Bay. This busy highway runs through Camp 
Richardson Resort, Pope, Kiva and Baldwin Beaches and USFS historic 
sites. Traveling north the Mount Tallac trailhead, access to Fallen Leaf 
Lake, the Cascade Lake and residential area, the Spring Creek summer 
residential areas are passed along the way to Inspiration Point and 
Emerald Bay, Vikings Holm and the Eagle falls Creek, The Fire District 

extends along State Highway 50, over Echo Summit on the west side of 

the Sierr.i crest to the Echo Snow Purl<- Adventure Mountain and Siena at Tahoe Ski 

Resort. Additionally the District serves the hamlets of Little Norway, the 

Mount Ralston Subdivision, Echo Lakes, Philips, Sierra Pines, Bryan 

Creek, Tamarack Park, Sayles Canyon and Camp Sacramento. 

Due to the remoteness of the communities and recreational areas of 

Strawberry, Twin Bridges, HorscTail Falls, Lover's Leap and the 39 mile 
tract, Lake Valley fire District personnel are called to serve these areas 

within the El Dorado County Fire Protection District. 

Seismic Location. 

The relatively young geological processes that created the Tahoe Basin are 
still active. The district's entire land surface is in the high-to-moderate seismic hazard 

zones. 

Size and Population. 

The District covers 85 square miles with a population of I 3,000, swelling to 
over 100,000 during the summer months. The District has 3 fire stations; 
two staffed by 22 safety personnel and one (1) fire station via Cal fire 
contract. The District has four ( 4) Chief Officers, including the Fire Chief, 
one (l) Fire Prevention Technician, one (1) MechaniciFlcct Manager and 
one { t) Administrative Manager. Overall, there 29 foe total District 
personnel. The District oversight is via the five (5) members of the Fire 
Board of Directors. 

Page 5 of 10 

23-1589 C 37 of 67 



Roads and Streets. 

Many roads are sub-standard; narrow widths, on-street parking, less than 20 feet of 

unobstructed pavement and ingress and egress issues during peak population 

fluctuations. Some areas are served by single lane roads, severely restricting 

emergency vehicles. 

Topography. 

The topography of the District varies from near level to terrain in excess of a 40 

percent slope. As a rule of thumb, the rate of fire spread doubles as the slope 
percentage doubles, all other factors remaining the same. Most residential and 
commercial structures are in, or are surrounded by forested areas. Due to drought, 

beetle infostations, and heavy vegetation, many the area have dead or dying 

trees, contributing to fire danger. Elevation ranges from about 6200 feet at 

lake level to over 7200 feet on mountain pass roads with peaks exceeding 

9000 feet in elevation. 

Vegetation. 

Vegetation in the Fire District v21ries from sub-alpine forests of aspen and pine to pine 
and cedar forests, with substantial brush fields of manzanita, snow brush, and white thorn. 

Residential development in the Fire District is generally concentrated in heavily 
forested areas. This situation allows fire to travel easily from home to home, forest to 
home, or home to forest by radiation, convected heat and/or flying embers Often 
dwellings are completely surrounded by highly combustible vegetation, compounding 

the fire problem. 

SUMMARY 

The above climatic, geological, and topographical conditions increase 
the magnitude, exposure, accessibility problems, and fire hazard the 
District must handle. As an example, fire following an earthquake has 
the potential to cause greater loss of life and damage to property than 
an earthquake itself. Wildland fire has seen some significant changes 
in spread dynamics due to drought and fire history in the area. 

CONCLUSION 

Local climatic, geographic and topographic conditions described above increase the 
frequency, intensity, and size of fires involving buildings in the Fire District. Further, 

these conditions impact potential damage to structures from an earthquake and 
subsequent fire. Therefore, it is reasonably necessary that the California Fire Code be 

modified to mitigate the effects of the above condilions. Page 6 of 10 

23-1589 C 38 of 67 



2022 CFC Code Section Title Adopted Amended Added Deleted Finding 

105.6.2-1 Tents X Administrative 

106.1-106.4 Construction X Administrative 
Documents 

!U7.l Fees X Administrative 

107.5 Related Fees Administrative 

107.5.1 Cost Recovery Administrative 

JV7.6 Refunds X Administrative 

107.7 Administrative Administrative 
CQS1S 

Section ](JR Inspections X Administrative 

IS,;clion 109 Maintenance X Administrative 

111.5 Appeals Administrative 

I I 12.4 Violation X Administrative 
I Penalties 
1

112.4.1 A batcment of X Administrative 
Violations 

l 12.4.2 Citations Administrative 

Section 113 Stop Work Adm in istrati vc 
Order 

113.4 Failure to X 
Administrati"e 

Comply 

Ser.:tivn JJ.I Unsafe X Administrative 
Structures 

202 Ddinitions X Administrative 

Section 302 Definitions Administrative 

Section 303 Asphalt Kettles IAI, A2. A3. I3I, B2. B3. 134, BS 

186 

302. l Ddinitions X Administrative 

Section 304 Combustible X Al, A2, A3, Bl, 82. 83. B4, BS 

Waste B6 

23-1589 C 39 of 67 



2022 CFC Code Section Tule Adopted Amended Added Deleted Finding 

Section 305 Ignition Sources X \I, A2, A3, Bl, 82. 83. 84, BS 

136 

Section 306 Motion Picture X hi, B2. B3. B4. BS, B6 

Seclion 307 Open Burning X .\I, A2, A3, 131, 82. B3. 84, BS, 

86 

307.4.4 Open Burning \I, A2, A3. Bl, 82. B3. 84, BS. 
B6 

Section 308 Open rl,tmes X -\I, A2,A3, Bl, B2. B3. B4, BS, 

B6 

Section 309 Powered X Al, A2, A3, Bl, B2. 83. B4, IlS, 

Industrial 1~6 

Trucks 

Section 310 Smoking X :\l, A2, A3, Bl , B2. R3.114, BS, 

86 

Section 311 Vacant Premises X v\l, A2, A3, Ill, 132. 133. 134, RS, 

H6 
Section 320 BO Printing X Bl, 82. 83. 84, BS, B6 

Section 321 Artificial X Al, A2, A3. Bl, B2. B3. B4, BS 

Vegetation 86 

t03.2 - 403.2.4 Group A X IA!, A2, A3, DI, B2. 03. B4, R5, 

B6 

403.6 - 403.6.1.4 Group F X Al, A2, A3, Bl, B2. 83. B4, J3S 

B6 

t03.9 - 403.9.3.4 Group R X Al, A2, A3, Bl, 82. 133. 8 4, HS 
86 

503.2.1 Dimensions X [Al, A2, A3, Bl, B2. rn. 84, IlS 

86 

503.2.5 Dead Ends X !Al, A2, A3, 131, B2. B3. B4, BS. 

B6 

503.2.6 Bridges X Al, A2. A3. 81, 02. 83. B4, BS 1 

86 

503.3. l No Parking- I Al, A2, A3, Bl, B2. 83. 84, 85. 

Fire Lanes 86 

503.3.2 No Parking- Al. A2,A3, Bl, 82. 83. 84,BS 

Fire Hydrants B6 

23-1589 C 40 of 67 



2022 CFC Code Section Title Adopted Amended Added Deleted Fin.ding 

503.3.3 Fire Lane Width 0\I , A2. AJ. Bl, B2. 83. B4, BS, 

B6 

503.6 Security Gates X ·\I. A2. A3, Bl, B2. 83. B4, BS. 

186 

505.1 Address X IAI, 1\2, A3. Bl. 82. 83. B4, BS 
86 

507.5. l Where Required X Al, A2. A3, 81, 82. B3. 84. HS, 

- Fire Hydrants 136 

509.3 Fire Control Bl, 82. 83. 84, BS, 86 

Rooms 

807.5.2 Group E X Bl, 82. 83. B4, BS, 86 

903.2 Where Required X Al, A2, A3, RI, 82. B3. 84, BS, 

rire Sprinklers 86 

903.2.1.1 Group A X IAI, A2, A3, Bl, B2. B3. B4. BS, 

86 

903.2.1.2 Group A-2 X IAI, A2, A3, Bl, B2. 83. B4, BS 

B6 

903.2.1.3 Group A-3 X Al, A2, A3, RI, 82. B3. 84. BS 

86 

903.2. l.4 Group A-4 X Al, A2, AJ, Bl, B2. 83. 84, BS 

B6 

903.2.3 Group E X A 1. J\2, /\3, Bl, 82. 83. 84. BS 
B6 

903.2.4 Group F-1 X Al, A2, A3, Bl, 82. 133. 134, BS. 
86 

903.2.7 Group M X !Al, A2, A3, Bl, 82. 83. 134. BS. 

86 

903.2.7.2 Group M- X Al, A2. t\3, Bl, B2. 83. B4, as, 
Mattresses 86 

23-1589 C 41 of 67 



('/if' Code Secriun Title Adopted .--lmend1:d Added Deleted f'indinK 

9U3.2.8.5 Manufactured IAI, A2. A3. HI, H2. 

Homes 83, A4. RS, H6 

903.2.9 Group S- l X Al. A2, AJ. HI, 82. 83 84,BS, 

86 

903.2.10 Group S-2 X AL A2, 1\3, HI. 132. 1:33. IH. l:3S 
86 

903.2.10.1 Parking Garages X IALA2. A3, 111. B2. 113. 84, BS, 

86 

22 Group B 1/\I. A2. A3. IJl. 132. 133. 134. BS: 

1:36 

9(l.1.2.~3 Group F-2 IAI. A2. A3, Bl, Il2. 83. 84, BS, 

B6 

¼'here Required X !At A2. A3. BL 132. 83. 84. BS 

Fire Sprinklers B6 

907.2 \'.'here Required X /\I, t\2. AJ. 131, 132. 133. 114. 13S, 

Fire Alarm B6 

Systems 

l)07.~. I .4 Group A Al. A2. A3. l3I. 82. 133. IJ4. RS 

H6 

Group 13 Al. A2, A3, 131, I32. 113. I34, I3S 

H6 

11 Group E Al , A2, A3, Al, 132. 1:33 s-i. s5r 
B6 

l Group F-1 IAI, A2, A3. Ill, 132. BJ. 114. IJS 

11:36 

907.2."i.2 Group 11 !Al. ,\2, f\3. BJ, [32. 83. f34. BS , 

86 

907.2.6.6 Group I IAI, A2. A3. Bl. £32. [33 0 4, BS 

86 

907.2.7.2 Group M 

I 
IAI, A2. 1\3. Bl. 82. B3. B4.13S 

116 

.2.8.4 Group R-1 
I 

IAI, A2. /\3. Bl. 82. 133. 84. BS. 

186 

23-1589 C 42 of 67 



!20.?1 CRI' Code S'ection J'itle Adopted Amended Added Deleted Finding I 

907.2.9.4 Group R-2, R- 11\l , /\2,/\3, Bl, 82. 83. 84, 85. 

2.1. R-2.2 )I36 

907.2.10.1 Group S I Al, A2, A3. Bl, B2. B3. 84. 85, 

86 

907.2.30 Type I I Ioods Bl, 82. B3. 84, 85, B6 

907.6.5 Monitoring X BL 82. 133. 04, 135, 136 

1907.6.2.1 Secondary Power Al.A2, A3, Bl, B2. B3. 84, 05 

I Supply 86 

j907_9 l\\'hcrc Required X Al. A2. A3, 131, B2. 83. B4, B5, 
I 

FtreAlarm 86 

Section 1101 General X Al, /\2, A3. Bl. 82. en. B4, 135, 

86 

Section I l 02 Definitions X 1/\ I, /\2, A3, Bl, 82. !33. 134, B5 

86 

11103.2 Responder X JAi, A2, A3, Bl, 82. B3. B4, B5. 
i Commun icatinn B6 

I 103.5- 1103.5.5 Sprinkler X Al, A2, A3, Bl, 132. 03. 84, 85 

Systems 86 

1103.7 -I 103.7.9.10 Fire Alarm X Al, A2, A3, BL 82. 83. R4, R5 

Systems 86 

1103.8 - I !03.&.5.3 Smoke Alarms X IA!, A2, A3. Bl, 132. 83. 84, BS 

B6 

1103.9 -1103.9.1 Carbon X Al, A2. Al Bl, 82. 83. 8 4, 85, 

Monoxide 86 

Alarms 

Section 1104 Egress X Bl, B2. 83. 84, 8 5, 86 

Section 11 06 Outdoor X Al, A2, AJ, Bl, 8 2. 8 3. 84, 1:35, 

Operations 86 
I 

11203.1.3 Installation X lAI. A2, A3, Bl, 82. BJ . B4, 135 

I 86 

33 l l.3 Address 

I 
X IALA2,A3,Bl, 82. 83 . B4,B5 

86 

3313.1 When Required - X IA!, A2, A3, Bl, B2. B3 . B4, 8 )1 

Water Supply I B6 

23-1589 C 43 of 67 



2022 CFC Code Section Title Adomed Amended Added Deleted Finding 

5001.7 Liability for Administrative 
Damages 

5601.2 Permit Required X Adm inistrari vc 

5704.2.9.6.1 Locations- X Al, A2, A3, Bl, R2. 03. 84, B5 

!Above Ground 136 

Tanks 

5706.2.4.4 Locations - X Al, A2, A3. Bl, 82. 83. 84, 85, 

Above Ground 86 

Tanks 

5~06.2 Limitations X Al, A2, A3. Bl, 82. 83. 84, B5. 

B6 

6104.2 Maximum X Al, A2, AJ, 81, 82. B3. 84, B5, 

Capacity B6 

6112 High X 

Elevation-
Climatic, Administrative, 

LPG 
Geological 

6 l 13. 1 Permits X Climatic, Ad ministrativc, 

and Plans Geological 

6l 13.2 LPG- X Climatic, Administrative, 

Own Geological 

6114 Natural X Climatic, Administrative, 

Gas Geological 

6115.1 Violations X Climatic, Administrative. 
Geological 

6115.2 Failure to X 

provide 
Climatic, Administrative, 

Geological 
cover 

Chapter 80 Referenced X I A I, A2, A3. Bl, B2. 83. B4, B5, 

Standards 186 

Appendix B Fire flow - X IAI, A2. A3, Rl. A2. 83. B4. 

Table 8105. ! (I) Residential B5,B6 

Appendix B Fire now - X Al, A2, A3, Bl, 82. B3. 84, 135, 

Table 8105.2 Comme rcial 86 

Appendix D Fire Apparatus X Al, A2, A3, Bl, B2. B3. B4, 85, 

Access Roads B6 

Appendix D. t\ccess Road X Al, A2. t\3, Bl, 82. 83. 84. B5 

0103.1 Width B6 

Appendix D. Grade X Al, A2 , A3, Bl, H2. BJ. B4. BS 

D103.2 B6 

23-1589 C 44 of 67 



Appendix D, Turning Radius X AL A2, A3. Bl, B2. B3. 134, 135, 

f.)103.3 B6 

Appendix D, Gates X IAl,A2,A3.AL B2. 83. 84,135. 

1)103.5 136 

Appendix D, Fire Lane X IA\, A2, A3, Bl, 132. 133. 134, B5. 

0103.6.1 Marking 86 

/\.ppendix D. rirc Lane X JAi, A2, A3, 131, 82. 83. 134.135 

Dl03.6.2 :vtarking 06 

Append ix D. Circumferential X IAI. A2, A3, 131, 132. 133. 134, 

D104.4 Fire Access BS, 

B6 I 

23-1589 C 45 of 67 



LAKE VALLEY FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT 

INTRODUCED at a regular meeting of the Board of Directors of the Lake 

Valley Fire Protection District on December 8. '.!02:2. 

PASSED AND ADOPTED ata regular meeting 0fthe 80ard of 

Directors of the Lake Valley Fire Protection District on January 5, 2023 by 

th~ fol!..>wing roll call vote: 

Aye: Nay: Abstain 

John 
~ Rice 

Brian 

cfl2_ Ilagan 

Leona 

.JI/. Allen 
--

Ron 
J-1l_ Sitton 

Irene 
/Tl Kaelin 

VOTE ON PASSAGE: Aye .S- Nay,0_ AbstainQ_ Pr~s~nt C) 

John Rice, Board Chair - ~i-1-i ~ -l/'--._- -
(.} Signature 

I, Irene Kaeli11_. Secretar:i1 to the Board, do hereby certif.v that tl,e fimtgoi11g Resol11tion 
No. 2021-01 was vote,/ upon and approved by " majority vote tifthe BC1ard, on tl,e 5"1 day 
o.f Ja,11,ary 2023; and If urtller certljj1 the compliance with the Codified Resolution and 
tlte LaH,s of 11,e Board, 

Secrelury 

23-1589 C 46 of 67 



Admhm!M ~ 

105.S N 
Amend IOiamadciton o( Actori0tlie ~ locat, ad:JplBd andirnended Alt!inislrllMI need due to Bdlllon d &&da, 105.5.55. 
Yard~blaipe!llll 

Abls te «re aide ofciaJ menb'ce tllerre code (specific 

lOS.S.SS y MJsediol!IONC1ftopnbW P8ftrillot IDfreacx:esa, vegelllbl ~ he281110usllllllertlls, 

AIJComobi!e Wreddng Vaid& 
Jocaly~andlllilpled 8':.~ 'Mhll amrcbl! ~ yardopemton., ThisMS 

a demcnslnffd need aperienc:ed wflin the Oiamcnd 
Spmgs Fire Deparlment 

105.6 N 
Adil secllon to llqlin! aw\W\IQQII permit IClr bcally CINIBd and adopled 

AdniislralM)need <bl badilicin <Jf seelicri 105.6.25 and 
Aalomoble \\'recmg Yards. IOS.6.16. 

"""'5 lheboode officialt>81lhce 11-ehaJde(spdc 
Add seclioo to ~uie =~ucllon permit for L05.6.2S y LocaPy cnale<j and adopled 

lofreacces,, o;egetala'I c:learn8$. hazaldous llliJlllrials. 
Automobile Wrecking Yards. r.c.) v.ithil newly conWUcted and'or rmdltiad auttKnOblle 

Wfedcslg yard opeooons .. 

/\lows the Ire oode official 1D ieview and appmwd traific 

IOM.26 N Add aedm lO 1equre ocns!ruc:tlm pn,11 fgr lhe Lacatly 01llllect and aclq,Ed 
calm!~ dMles crtor kl lnstalalbn. File Coda Clll'l!fflly 

installation of traffic calmilg devices permb the nre mde o111aa11o ~ nfficcalmilg 
d~ ~r, a plllTllit isn'tcimnt, requred prior 10 
lnslallatlon causing undue hardship to 

Adapting fhlssecion 1oaaowbfle creallon andissllance 

107.S N SediDn Added. Pl'evioosiy sedlon1~6. Localy aiopted and aiiencled 
ofiies tocowr actual costs. Sedlon 105.6 defiles permits, 
plan checb, am insl)ecllons as alboed lnHtalh &Safety 
Code 17951. 

107.S.I N Sec-.l<Jl added. Fmlously sedion 106.6.1 Localtv owled and~ Sedlon 107.5.1 Cosl~ Foos Ton>COYel'lheDJStt> 
the Fire Dlolrk;t. 

107.7 y Sec:itn added. Pl'~sly sedlon 106.7 Locally cued and adopted Sec:tiOll107.7To111GCM11t.e81.UiOOS1SofMidet)le 
'ailed ~ bycoroadOrs. 

Sec;Uor, 111.5 of ~ r 1 of lhel'ire Code of the Oimct is 
8dded1o readas folkM-s: 
111.5 Aripea! Procedures and Tllll8liies: The l1M1ntof !his 
prc-,isioll iSto clarify lhe procedU'es and Umelines for an 

111.5 y Settoo added. Prev!wsty sea!a1 100.4 Locally adoiiled and 8lllll1doo '.ndMdulJ orenlity to/le 111-welll lOllle brdot Appeals 
regald'. !¥J an order, decision, or ~nation by tte Flll'J 
Code O'ficial. Based on the county of El Dorado's 
Vege:alon Msiagemenl Q,d~ Boaldof Aj)peels' 
ttne..ne. 

~, sedan 110.4. ~ the sedi!lt t:y MsNs lhe Fire COde otidal torillce lhefi11 COde tst 

112.4 N liing in lhe blank poltlons that were not a,mp eted 
Locally adopted ~d .nended 

protects life and pr()pelly. Fees 11M been updaled to 

t,,. fie SAA. ll Is belier left ti bc:aliWes ID dt:rrrrine rre\ch iie fMs andpanalties aadeemed alll),opriate bylhe 

lhc l'eesfpenafties lilrt,eir mspeclNe are&<. 
O's7ic:I Al!aney's Office. The d'iao{le to the language 10 
nclude the term i!t'ac:tons. 

112.4.2 ~lsadded tonia.:1asfolkJws; 112.4.2 
Citm1s 
The F'ire Chief or his/her du>, autlorized rep~ntawe(s}, 

112.4.2 N SedirJrl added. Pmowsy $lailll 110.4, LocalycremdandadJpi,d may lsslleaialions for Wracliorls or misdemeanor 
violations ofttllsc:odepursuarttoSedlon 13871 of the 
He-a~ and safety Qlde of the Stale <tcatlforria llrd 
Cha))!er 5c (aimmencing with eectfon 853.8) of TIiie 3 of 
Part2of1hePenal Code of the Stats ofcaifomla. 

PIMusly Mdfon 112.4. Coml)lewd thosedlon by 

113.4 
ftlllng illlhe ~ portions lhal-noli:ampleted 

,. 'lalllo,\'; cl te code haw been anddaal inler N bytheSFM. ltiaben«lel\toloc;alitiwto Localy adopled and~ 
detennine lhe feesi'penaltle4 ror thelr111epective Sedion 112.410includa1he penaNies fa-violations. -

23-1589 C 47 of 67 



hided definilions for. Campfifl. Drtveway, D.lsbtci, 

202 N Added def'lllm lor d8rty 
i&eo.M llody,Fllt Clll9f, Fin, Hmld, Open Burnilg. aid 

L«.aly Cl"8led and adoptid !Trained Crowd Manager. Deftrl1IOl1 or open blmng shill 
not include mden!lal LPG, naural gas fueled, er wood 
bUmlng appllm:es nor ceremonial b,.ring. 

302.l N Added delinillon cl r.-,r,,e lo Setton Localli~dinladop!.ed !Added defnilion u darlv. 

Added asecllon for open burning r8Slrictlons. Due 1o the i.gti rll11 daAger that exlsisln El Dorado Col1iy 
307.4.4 y Lquagedried iom ~ toopan tuning h loailly aeaflld and adgpl9d 

-pass full soopeof open burning 
wellMWlilerlrme~rules~ilcpen• 

requirements. 
wltllln grass, brush, and lnle ~ areaa. 

4012.1 N Addedsec1ion loll!qUff pe-h plans fo<nN lccat,,cnalidand~ 
Prowles theCl831iOO of a floor plan for the purpose a 

andor modified con"1uc1ion. 
emergency plamlng ilbe ~ byemsgency tespOf1lMI 

per$01\nel. 

Fire apparatus are ber»rl1ng latger and IDier. A ffllical 
clearance of 15 feet jlO\'ldes r,roper clearance f0r 
appanws 10 pass 111der without damaging apparabJS 
CIJn1lOl19lllll. lalso aloWs an 8Xilnded trme nme ~ 

5032.l N Changed wrbl denncee lo 15 feet and road 1.Jxally adopied and amendec 
hawlg brecut Ille Qll7,YII, of Ille vegel8llon. Acldlianal 

widths to 20feet 
tielg1t li>rwgetation clearances ads asan ilcraased bulfer 
for the spread orrwe. A road wJclli1 or20 faet ll'lCiusive of 
shrude,s, as measired lace of M IDfae&ofa.b Is 
needed. These $11\JdJ.re& can be diftWttonavigatle witi 
lire apparatus and should not be comled In Ille IO!lll 
drivable rood Sl.lface. 

Addeda$peCilceectiorlfarR3'~'M1818ilal>ws~ Are apparatus require areas fer lllming 811l11nd when 

5032.S N 
Fire Code and Title 14 F"ireSafe Regulalklns to 

lacat,- adopted and ane,lded 
~vehicles are on tie:iceneofan~. iNs 

match as t,evreq.in IIJmarounds i:Jrh appn1us lrocludes ffre whldes 11 Ml ascivlll;n ve!ti,s. Provides 

aocess roads 1111d driveway,i 
bel!l!i accesa for I~&. Addlionaly, ldls tum 
afQtl1d for~ inm-~~eatertt,an 150'. 

Allows axles and slandanls fer Bridps and Ele\laled 
Chqed the section for Bridges and EJevaled ~ofElOoradoCmny andAppendlx Doftll& 

S03.2.6 N 
Sooaces to state and match EJDorado Colrty 

LccaRy aGopted i111d amended 
current F;re Code. whlchever is more restlict!Ye, to be 

Transpo~Dlvisioo in addition tDMSHTO HB consi&ler( lhro!JQhool coumy agerr:a,s and Is allowl!d as an 
17 (ninlmlll\ CFC reqLired) alternate means & method that is not less restrldt;e Ulan 

the Fie Code. 

503.3.l N Pre11ously stdlan503.4l, Added sec!ion reg;lrding Locaiy crealed and ild<lpled Tllis sectlcn clearly defines lhe ''No Partinlj In Fire Lanes' 
no partdrci in ftre lanes rues and is c:onslstant 1111h lheCaWcnia Vehicle Code. 

503.3.2 N Pre-.iou$ly seclion 503.4.:1. Added seC\ion regerding 
Locally amted and ad~d 

Th~seclton deerty deftnes the 'No Parking In n1111tof fire 

no para,g lnf!Olt d!Tydrants nydr.lnls' nNS and ls constslentwilh the~lomla Ve~lde 
Code. 

503.3.3 N 
P~'liously seaion 503.4.4. Added section r1ganl~ 

Locally created ard adol)'ed 
Thi$ section de6tty defillescatlfomla Finl COIie Appel1dX D 

fir&lanes based on road width as the refnnce for road lane width and tl\elr re~ to ftre 
laries. 

Previously tec:ti~ 503.5.3. <naled and ad• 
AIM ffredistricl$ the aulhmy ID approve gates ~n 

S03,6 
503.6 tomainlaln emergenay access and 

N COl18lalencyllrotighalroact,,iaygi!te6~EIDonido t.ocalJy Clllli8d and idopild ~ based on the Disrds 9ffle saiderd, pmviding 

Colrty, lftrring )I) Ile gale standard& adq)ted by the bellpoa&illle -iier,cy access t>malnlaln fasl 

ttieFPO's response times. 

SOS.I N Addedsecton pe!taimg lo the vlsual addles5iV 0 
l.cc&lly a<lop!8d and .mended Alol4&ecistri:lsi1183111hority.,~adchsslag 

buildings based on the District's ac!dresi'lg standar~ 

Added moce C00$8Mllive slarldatd for lhe COmmerr.ia1 ~ arereqwad lolnstall hydram at 

S07.S.1 N plac:arnent af lt;dr.m1 and their relatilaship ti Locally adopled and 1111frlded 300f00tlnteMlls, thus lhey 5holld newrbeou\5ideof150 

cammercial blildings \llelfrnm any given h)'drant atanytlme (half the distance 
ri>etween). 

23-1589 C 48 of 67 



Buldings an: gat1ing 1110111 saable In lhe county. II is more 
cmnmon t, have new buldilgs *"' sola"aniys thlt 
ccnlirllle ID generate power even when tie buikiigs 

Added 1'8111iagt ., ~ all of tie R8C89&IHY t'r9 
general utlHles havebeim shutoff. 'M18ll there isan 

.509.3 y l.oca~ Clealed and adotJled emergency, lls..«al t,atwellMrapid access loallof Ille 
conllllls b-a bulcfrw loOlle locallon c:oniol!;itoneb:allcll bp&8Yal:ll8tionandhfigllllr 

se/81:f. Due to the Ire dangeqrnml In El Oonido Counly 
thrwgl'(iut most of the )'f!llr. this chMge lsappropllatll and 
advlsable. 

Eme,yency Resp011der Radio System Setondary Looally adopted artd amended 
Amend 10 72 hour aipltlly for badt•UP pCMar due IO 

510.4.2.3 y 
Power SUDDlll Mo<ification weaOlerandPG&E aalllty related oo,ver ~-

Adds al'e(lllirlllllntb-$11riilder system lmlallaton 
~y adopted and am«ided 

Adrmlstali,,e need u le adcllllon ol sedlon 903.2.22 .nl 
903.2 N In new buldlngs and structuies 3,600 squi,re ffflor 903.2.23. 

~ter ~ thll dislrid 

Dile !DilcrJpograplllc. dmm;, 8Cld ~ ~ 

PlMXBly ll8dlllll 9C0.2.1. Addsa19e1ulrem&III far 
ofEIDoradoCounty and lheirconbiluing fadora IOour 
increased response fmes, along w•h 1he fact flat fires 

903.2.1.1 N 51lrinkler ,ystem ilstalaliot1 in new Group A 
Localtadcpledaldanended cWa in slzaeach 8NI 81181Ymi11.w, we requiuplnldeis 

buldngs and strucues 3,600 square feet or to be iistaled in slna/M once lley reach 3,600 square 
greaerv.4thin fie disb1cl feet in size a& they relate to fire behaviOr end raoo of 

spreed. 

Due ID the lilpogra~c. dlmallc, and geographic conaltiol'$ 

P/9\Aously sec:1on1n12.1. Mlsa~ a of El Dorado Counly and their COl\lribi.41ng factors to our 
~ R!$pOll$t jmos, along will the fact that Efes 

903.2.1.2 N sprinkler system lnslallallcn in new Gfoup A 1 L.ocaly adq)ted -,o llllt1llded doimlelnslzlleach nlMf'/ milv.m, we~m sprinklers blJRcf,ngs and stnicturaa 3,800 squarv 1-1 or to beins1alled In slruduras once they reach 3,eoo square 
grealerwithin the dislricl feet in lllze as they retele kl r.-e bel1avtor and rabl oc 

spreed. 

ClJe ID fie~ cimat1c, andgeognplic~ 

PnMMtj &edlon 0032.1. >dds amquilmellt b' 
ol BOorado Cou,ty a,d their oonfriboblg facCon; !0011" 
incmsed response imes, along w1th the fact that ffres 

9032.1.3 N 
sprinkler ~emilstal1alioo inJeN Groop A·2 Lccally dlpb!d and amended dooble in size each lllldeveryminu!e, WII requln, !ip(ini:lel's 
bulldir,gs andstlllclures 3,600 sqwe feet or 

tD be insialled inm.a,res onco they~ 3.600 ~ Ql9iller v.itlln Che district 
feet in size as theofrelaletofire behalllor and rate of 
spread. 

Due tDfttt,pographie, diTial1c. and geOCJ1!IPlk: ccnditiolls 

Pravbusly secUon 903.2.1. Adds a 18(1111r8rrent b' cJEIDaado COtrtf and tietr (tl11lribua,g iadols lllwr 
increased re9POl\88 times, alo~g "'1th lhe fact thatfLCeS 

903.21.4 N spdnkler syslam lnslallallon In,-Group A-3 Localy adopted Md im!nda:I double 1n stzaeadt and fNfllY mnullt. \118 req.Jile ~ buidir9S and elrud1re9 3,600 square feet or lobe iJ\9lalled In mictlJeSoncetheyreacb 3,600 ,qun greaterv.ithin t1ecfstrlct feelinsizz,astheyrelatetoijAJbehaviorand rate at 
spread. 

Due ID lhe lopographic. cllm8ic, and ~ccnditio,,s 

Previously SECtion 003.2.3. Adds a requ.""1enl fU of El Dorado County and their co"'1butlng factors to our 
increa!led ruspcnse limes, alo~ wi1h lhe fact that fires 

903.2.3 N 
sprnler system in!!al!alicln fnnew Group E 

~ adopl!d Md amended <ioulM in$iu!aachandfMl'(mirue, M~~ buklngs and struellres 3,600 square feet °' to be illSl;l,'led in Slf\lCffl:$ one& they reach 3,800 SCJllR grealerwithln Uledislllct feet In size as they relate lo fire behavior and ~ of 
spread. 

Ouet>lhc~phk:, climati:, aid geagraphic amclti!ns 
of El Don!do Coooty arid their contribulng factors ID our 

Addsanqnmentb-sprt,lderl'J1(2!nlnllalilllotl Increased response 1lmel, alorG will Ile at that flree 
903.2.4 N ii JeNGroup Fbu1dngs and structures 3,600 localyadop(ecjandalrel1dld doUllein$Zteach andfMft~ IAenl!Jd s,rrilelS 

square Ivel er 9reaterwllhln lhedistri.'l ta be installed In s\'Ut:111es once lhey reach 3,600 SQU!n 
reet In size as they relat9 Ill fire behavior and rate of 
spread. 

Dua tD lhe ll)p:1graplll;. clinlltic, 111d gecgraph',c conditions 
of El Do,acb Counly and lheir ~ factors lo cu 

Addsa ~nt ~sprirlker S)1llem lnstaHation incieased respan&e limes, along will lie fact that fires 
903.2.7 N In new Group M blli!dings and slrudures 3,mo IJx:ally ~ and anserded do,Jile In size each and &WI) mJ\Ule, we ~uire $1lrinklers 

square feet or "ealel wi111in the dl&tricl tobeins!alled in 5iuctUnls oo:e Vl8'{ -=ti 3,000 SQ1m1 
feelnsize as they retata lo Ire behavior and rate of 
spread. 

23-1589 C 49 of 67 



Due b hi 1Dll0Qra~, dlmalc, and geogtaphlc aindilloos 

Pre\Wlly secioil 9032.7. Addsan,qulrammt lbr ofB Dorado COi.inly and ttlet contribwng factJ's !Dour 
n::reased response times, along Wllh Ille fact lhat fm sprinkler svsmm 1nstallaU0n in new Grcup M with 

LDc:ally adopted end amemed double In sim eadl and every mini.lie, we requlra sp!Yllders 
903.2.7.2 N Upholstered Fumlllire lll'Mattressas buikft9; ;sid 

to be Ins~ in slruclures once they ieach 3,600 square mictures 3,600 squan1 feel er 1J9ffir within Iha 
feet in size as 1hey relate to Dre behavior and rate of dlsllict 
spread. 

Manufactured Home&-The int.entofttiscode section Is to 
ensure lhat11B1ufactul8CI homes lhat serve as a (Ile or IV«>-
family dwalfings are consiSlent wllh lhe p~lons bJnd in 
CRC section 313 permlnlng la b~Uwellings cf a smilar 
na1!Jre. Manufacturad homff placed In !he wlldland.urtlllll 

Previously sedlon 903.2.8.2.Thissection vm 
Locally adopted 111d aml!/lded 

interface 118118 a heightened rlsk of rapid lire oonsumption 
!!03.2.8.S N treated to include manufactured residenflal sil~ duelothel~-weigtnlllinof!heircormuctkln. The 

family R-3 in the reeidemial sprinkler program. rapid fire spmd lhroughout the98 sfn.l:lules pres~nts a 
significant risk to their OCCIJllar&. Resldentlal spnnldet 
syslems nave been 100lll'Jl0rall!d to decrease !his ri&k 
sua:essfuly inrnany Callcrnla communltles. 

DY& ID the IOpogr.iphlc. diimllc, and geagraphk: aindltions 
of El Dorado County and their contrlbullng fadora to our 

Pn!11illlllly seciiOO 003.2.8. Adds Sf!q\.lnnlenl fer rncreased response limes, along wffh the fact that fires 

903.2.9 N 
sprinkler system installation in new Group S Locally adoJ)led and amended double In size each am eveiy mlniu, we require sprinklers 
buldlngs andslruclures 3.600 squan: feet or lo be installed in slNcb.lres on<:e hy reach 3,600 SIJ!are 
g-ea1er v.itllln u,e dlsbict feet in size as they relate to fire behavior and ra1e cf 

spniad. 

Cue le lhc tllpograpriic, cliriw:, and geogrsphic oondlion! 
cf El O()rado County and 1helrcor1ributin~ factas 1D cur 

PIIMllllly """"°'1 BQJ.2. Adds e,~uqment .il<' inaeased response fimes, alongwiththefacl. lhatfires 

903.2.10 N 
sprinl<ter system Installation In new Gmup S--2 ux;ally adopted 111d amendlld double ln8Ze earJland owry mini.Ce, we require si-1nkln 
boidings and swctures 3.600 SQuaie l'eet or 10 be ~led In $Wctlre$ OIIC8 they reach 3,600 squaie 
grealer within the district feet in size as they relate lo fire behavror and rate of 

spread. 

Cue 1011ie 1Dpo!Jiphic, clima1ic, aoo geographic oond'rtions 
of El Dorado County and tt,elr conlrlbutlng faders ID our 

Previously 2dl:ln ~32.10. Adds a ~oirer1llnt ~r k1aeased response time&, alongwlh lhefactthatfires 

901.2.10.1 N 
sprinkler syshlm installallon inneNCommercial Local~ adop!ed a,d amended double in size each and eveiy milulll, we require sprinklers 
P1l!klng Garage bulldlngs alld slruc11J1811 3,600 to be insfall!d lnstnJcblll!s once lhey reach3,600 ,quare 
square flletorgreaterwithin tl'Mldlslrld feet In size as lheyrelate to fire behavior all!! rate of 

spread. 

Due ID tie ID!10graphic. dim.le. and geographic; condlllons 

PnMoosly section 003.2. 7. Ad:ls a ruqtiremenl lbr 
ofEID0r.1do Co\l'lty and lhelrconllibuting factors to our 
inaeesed response limes, along with lhe fact that fires 

903.2.22 N 
sprinkler system lnsfallaUon In new Group B LDcaDy adopted and arnerided double in size each arid ew11ymioo1n, 'Ml requi1<1 sprinklers 
bull<lngs and suu:tures 3,600 square ilet or 10 be installed in SfrtJCtures once they reach 3.000 squere 
grealerwllhin the dlstrlct feetin Sile as theyraiate ID Hre bellavior and rate of 

spread. 

Due to the 1opograi:filc, dlma!lc, and geographic con~lions 

Prellioost-, section 003.2. Mls a requlnmnt for 
of El Dorado County and lheiroonlrhiting factors to ou-
it1a-eased respllllse Hmes, along with lhe fact that tires 

903.2.23 N 
sprinkler system Installation in new Group F-2 Locally adopkld and amended dooble in size eachandeverynmute, weraqme aprinkleis 
buDdlngsand st!udures 3,600 SGU!lr& feet or tobe ilstalled In sfruclla'es once they reach 3,600 square 
greeter within lhed~nct feel in size as they telate lo ffreb&havior and rate ct 

spread. 

Previously wcflon 903.28. Adds a requiem1mt t> Due t> the lllfJ<)graptic, climallc, and geographi; conditions 
lnsta11 s!Xlnk!el1; fa 8ldsling biildings llat.indargo of El Do"'do County arid llieir ccnlribl.ing faclMI lo our 
a d1ange in use of graatsr llaza!d or an inciease in inaeaS!id response Umes. along with the fad thal. fires 

903.6 y size gn,aler than 500 square feet and the resulHng Locally created and adopbld doubll n sllll eedl and Mry minute, ~ req.ire 8pllniools 
square feel la gieater than 3,600 square feet to be inslalled in struclures once 11\e'f readl 3,600 SQIIIIAI 
PIIMCUSlo/ ~ied kl adtlloll cimore than 30% or feetinsileasthey relate to fire behavior and ralecf 
1,000 square feet. spread. 

23-1589 C 50 of 67 



907.2 N ilSl.dalion in .-bu~ and slruciuree 3.800 locally adllpied and amended ~ minisntive need Ille ti) addition al sedion 903.2.30. 
Adds a 111~1n1ment ta-ire aarm s)'llem I 

'------ -+-- - - ~-,..~Cll'l1166"J1llliAlhe~ 

Pl'evioosly sedJcn 907.2a. Added ooouP11nL I b 
907.:?.l.4 N 

907.2.2.3 N 

llO'l .2.3. II N 

prlllfflon forftre alarms In Gr1111p A bulditiga wilh a 
floor area less than 3,600 eJtc:.apt R3 AG bul~lngs O'lidas p111per emeigency notification far ~andes !hat 
ncl used fur commen.ial ~oses. 111d buildings I Lacalt; c'88ted and adopl!d . pllbllc UN and ensures Are Department notifica'ion in 
dh a ffoor ina of less than 500 s~ feela, ~ 111.,avantofa flra or11T1ok11. I 
app!IMld fl!, the ire code dlidal _ 

PAMousl)' 9ef.licn '!JJ7 2a. Added occupant 
pro~ticn lbrfire alanns in Group B buldinga w!lh a !f>lol,ldes proper emergency notfflcatlon ror oc:ru.......,es lhat 
floor aiea!ess than 3,600, e11ceptR3, AG bui!clngs ,-•-
nol used ror commeltial purposell. end buldlrgs Loealy enaalad aid adop1ed illllow pubOc use and eMUrt$ Fire Deparllnent nollllcadcn In 

w!Ul afloorareadless lhan 500 S(Jlare feel as r e"91lt of a lira or smoke. 
apprMld by the fl~ cod~ offtdal 

Pl'lllllously secllcn '!JJ7.2a. Added OeQ.Jpant 

pl'01ectlt11 for fire alllllllS In Gro141 E buidings IMth a 
loor area Jeq 11an 3.600, i::rcepl FU, N3 buildin~s 
not used b' canmert:ial p1.rp09es, and bui!drg5 
Willi a floor areei cf 1811 than 500 squani feet es 
approved by the flrecode crtlcl91 

Locally creeled arid adopltid 
Prol,4de5 pmper emeraeru:11 na11lcatlon for ca:ul)clrlcies that 
low pubic use and lllllUfllS F1111 Depa!lment no .. celon 111 r event of a fire or smcka. 

l-----+----1--------- + ----- ---'~ I 
I 
I 

9072.◄.l 

907.2.S.2 

907.26.6 

9fll.2.11 

907.2.8.4 

Pre-.iousty seeton 907 .2a. Added o0Cl4)811l 
PIOte<;Ugn forfi111 alam1& In Gioui>Fbuild,nga wlh a 

floor a/l!a less !han 3,600, 11JtCept R3, AG blJldlngN 

I not used for com 111en:ial l)lll)llSeS, Bild 'oulldings 

I 
w,lhaftoora~a ollesa lhan500square IM!as 
approved by the fire cOde offidal 

PITiiously secllcn 007.2a. Added oa:upanl 
protedlon forflte alarms In Group H buildings Mlh I 

a fioor a.-ea Jess lhan 3,000, eue¢ R3, ARI 
buildings not used forcommerdal llll'P098S, and 
buildings will• noor 8te6 clle5' lhan 500 S(luare 

N 

feel u approved by 11\e In cO<le ol!lclal I 
P1¥110llSI!/ sacuon 907.2a. Added oc:aipant 
p~n lllrlia elalm6 In Gr,:i14> I buildlngi wil!I a 
floor area lesa 1han 3,600, except R3, N3 llliildngs 
not ued rorccmmen:lal PVIPOses, aod bulldlngs 
..,.;th a floor area ofleea 111an 500 square feet a, 

appl'O\led by lhef.-e code official 

praledian fer fire alarms in Group M bulkjings •1111 
Pre.iously ~ 907 ..2a. Added occupara I 

e floo enia Jass lhan 3,600, except R3, A~ , 
buildings not uted forcommmclal pu,poses, and I 
buijdlngg wiUu ffoorllf1la ofl051 lhan 500,quare 
feel 1upprcwd by Ille fire code officlal I 
Pre\'10uslysectlcn907.2a.Added0rnJPllnt 
protection for fire alarms in Gro14> R-1 builclngs 

wilt, 11 ~a less lhan3,6CO, !IX.eept R3. ~ 
bolkJilgs not used foroommen:1111 purpaina, 111d 
buid!ngs wilh aflocr a"'a cf less than 500 square 
feet as approved by lhe fire cede cfflcial 

Lacally crealed andadapled 

1.0,;ally crealed and adopilld 

Lacally aealBd and adcpled 

Locally cr.ated and adoir.ed 

l.ncally crealed aid adopted 

Prowles proper emergl!ncy rdficaion for ct.alJ)llndes that 
ttm, ?Utilk: .:;e and ensures Fn Depemie11t nolfflcation in 
the event cf a fire or smoke. 

I 

Prcvde, proper eme,gency nOtiicrion ill' oc,;upaictes that 
i/a;; public use and en:stn! Fire Depanment notlkat!cn in 1 
Ille event of afireorsmoke. 

Pra,Ades p10per emergency no!rficatian for occupancies !hat 

1
alaw p,mtic use and en:11Jres Fire Department notification In 
lhe event of a f,reor smoke . 

1----.. --.. , ...... ---~-"--"-' 
the eventolalire or smoke. 

Plovdes proper eme~cy notiicai on fa- occq1111Kies that 
al!Qw public use and en,sins Fi11 Oepar1melil nollllcl6in i'1 
the event of a fire or smoka. 

23-1589 C 51 of 67 

I 
I 



Previooaly sedi:m 907 la. Added occupant 
pmlilclor1 lorfire a"1ms in Goop R-2, R~ 1, andR 
2.2bulldings wlthafloorarealess Oian 3,&:lO, PrtMdes proper emergn:y nollflcatlon for occup111aes Ulal 

907.2-9.4 N except R3, AG oo•dlngs riot U6llld br canmeroial Locally CJea!ed a11d adopled albw publil: uS& end ensures Fre Department notilicalicm in 

purpoaea. and l)ulldlngs ~ 1 ffoor na of less the event of afire or smoke. 

flan 500 squal8 feelasapprow,d tl'f Vle fire coda 
ofrldal 

Previously section 907 .2a. Added oeeupn 
prolec1im furfnalams in GroupSllUlldlngs wilha ~ proper emBrgency nQtilicatlon fer ocwpaJlcies th.at 

9(>7.2.10.l N 
ftoor anla less ttian 3,600, except R3, AG buildings locally (teated and ad- alow jll.l:)llc U9II Slid &nSUl9S Fire Oep81!r!M!nl nalfication to 
not used forCIJffllTleccial putp068S. and bu~dings the event of a fire er smoke. 
wilh a lloor area ofless than 500 square feet as 
approved by 1he fint code official 

Prel/lousfy secfon 907 ld. Added OCC\JPllrtl Pl!Mdee proper «nergency nolification r-or OCQlllancies !hill 

907.2.30 N 
proteciion for '1'ypc 1 Hood sysrems to be l.ocaly ~ 111\d adopled 811cw JM)lc use aid en&IRS Firll Otipam,ent nolification In 
comecied to a monitored firealann sys!lmwhen the event cf a fire or smoke. 
installed or replaced 

Provides proper resp011Se andmalntena11ce 'runner se,vice' 
ri Ire alann s¢ems. NFPA 72 specifies 11!!J1111d resjlC)nse 
times for fire aliil!ll L'wble and SIJl)IIIV!scry slgrials t> 

~~Ires fire alann systems ID be moni10red by UL 
ensure SyslllmS 111mafn operalional. A Type A Ullsted 

907.6.5 y 
listed Type A central StallOll, 

locally created and adopted amtral s!aion meelS lhe NFPA n,qufnld ~ alalffl re51JOnse 
ensuring an operational fireslarm syslBrn at all llmas. 
UL T~e A listing requiies oenlnll slaflons II> provide 1N~ 
·rurmr se!Vice" or ainlracl with anolher erdy lo ~rol'ide 
this service 10 obtain 1he II sting. 

<J0?.6.2! N 
Primary Secaidery Alarm Pwer Supply Locally a1'8ll!d ard adcp!Ed 

Amend Ill 72 nourcapacity for back-up power due ID 

ModWicat!on weather ood PG&E safely rela1ed power OIJlages. 

Pra~y seclial 907.2b. Addeel ~~nt 
IX'()teclon lbrexislir,;i bu"1irg.s wlholJI Ulllllltic !'f!Mdes proper IIIT1111'J!nc)' nolmc.1licn fill' Occuplllclee tha 

907.9 N 15priridersystemi !Dlnmil a fire $!arm ff lhey add Locally cree.llld andadopted all11N public US& and era.res Fiie Deparinmt notiffcajon iri 
more than 30% ar 1,000 square ll!et to !he lheeventof1:1fir&QtsmQke. 
structure, whichever is less 

This sectlon adds a Shunt Trip power shutoff devices to 

1203.1.3 N Shunt ttip power s:tefy devices Locally alcpted and an-ended ensure emefllency powerslnrt off wring U,e ~of back-up 
power supplies. 

33 LU N 
Previously section 3310. Address requirements for locally 1mted Md adopfed 

Addressing fori;onstruction siles isimpOflanl toassist 
construction sites responding emerge~y crews. 

3313.l N 
Prevlousy sacllon 33121. Wal'er supplles et Lor.ally adopted and clf!landed 

Water must be on site p~or1o o:mi11Jstil:liu matel'lal being 
1,01\Siruclion site!! with oombustible material$ on-llile stored orverlcel co1151rucucn wmmencing. 

Any damages er~ rrom negligent or unlawfti 
Hazaroous ma!llrtals re!aild incidents are costty tomitigale. 

5001.7 y practices fiat cau&e a hal.aldous materfals h::idri Localt,' creeled and ado;,led 
If the rodent is caused by negligence due to a business 

will cause a cost rewvery fee 
process Orllfactlce tile actual c:osl wll be Pf!$ed en ID the 
negligent parties. 

Added safetJ protedbn with pormil! being issued AIIC1NS ~ es that need to know about explosives and 
by bo1ll the Fire Cllief 111d Sheriffs Depertment lilr 

5601.2 N explollMIS, ard by ttie Fhl Chief and Ile Boan! cf 
1.1,cally a<lop1ed and amendeli firewoiis 10 apJ)llll,ie !hem zrd haYe a clear und8"lll.llndlng 

Supervisors lorfnM«ks 
of the applications of how they will boused, 

Estailllshed Umb as lellUwd by theFlie Code tc.,Claaa t 

5104.2.9.6.1 N Estalll.shed lrrits as lie! 1i:111'1 In h FlrBCode LoG.By adopted and anended 
flammable and Class llcom!luslible liqlid Slerage in abcNe-
ground lanks. Requllll$ AHJ approval and a 
SpeciaUConditional Use Perml from 1he C0Ullly. 

Established lmits aslll(lulred bytheFirllCo:le ftlrClass t 

5706.2.4.4 N EstabDshed Dmil6 as set for1h i1 the Fire Cede locally ado!il!d and amended 
flammable •nd Class lloombuslible liquid speci81 
operations In ahove-;JOllld tanks. Requires AH.I aPl)nr,,al 
and a SpaclaVCondiil>nal Use Pem'lit f/Q!II 111e C0t.n1y. 

23-1589 C 52 of 67 



Mm1111strnive ne8d to add Distnct name. Eslabhll18d hm,ts 

Administrati-ro add1fon of District 11,1me 
as required by lhe Fire Code Offldal for Flammable 

5806.2 N Established &mitsas set fonhmlhe Fire Code 
Localy arlopled and amended Cty0genic flwds in stationary conLainers. Requires AHJ 

appn:iv,11 and a Special/Condtional Use Pennit from the 
County. 

Establislles distances between LPG slorageand 
dispensaries lhat aredlreclly relaled to safett for resi(jeotial 

Eslilbf&Shed limlS fOr LPG storage and disilensi!lll 
de-rolopmeots and h1gh-dens,ty hotels. molels. apartments. 

61042 N Locally adcpled and amended etc. where a release by leak or explosion ofLP--Gas would 
near or adjacent to res,dential development haveah,ghpro0.al:lil1ty of injury, inhalatiOn, ordeath. 

Req~ires AHJ acproval and a ~cial/Ccndillonal Use 
Pennit from the County. 

In previous 2019 ordinanc;e, H,gh 

6112 y Elevation Liquefied Petroleum Giis Locally adopted and added Any new LPG 111st<1llaliori requirements. 
Installations (5.000 foot elevations and 

above) 

6113.1 y Permits- shall be required Locally adopted and added 
Plans shall be submitted for all underground 

tank installations as approved by AHJ 

6113.2 y Lease/Ownership Locally adopted and added 
Underground LPG tanks shall be prohibited 
from be,ng sold and retained by the the LPG 

company under a lease-type system. 

6114 y Natural Gas Locally adopted and added Natural Gas Installation requirements 

Unlawful for a supplier to provide service that 
61 15.1 y Violations Locally adopted and added does not comp1y with the provisions of 6112 or 

6113 

61152 y Meter protection Loe.illy adopted and added 
Failure to provide a cover to the meter is a 

vio1ation of this code 

23-1589 C 53 of 67 



Dismantled and slorad ""'1ides present 51gru~nl lire lo.ids 
(batterlea, flammable and combustible lquids. lJl)hOlstety. 

Chaple! 80, NFPA. 1- Provides fire access and dear.mce to property lines 
etr:.) and risk to V"!jetat1on and aqacent pr0pertil!S. This 

N t.oca!y crealed snd adopted requirement pro.tides l ire access and clearance lo 
22 for Automobile Wreelcirig Yards. vegetation ,nautomoblle wreel<ing ~ard operationi; 1ll aid in 

flrefightiPg operations am reduction d fire eldl!nsion to 
adjacent properties and/or Open lands. 

Aroonded to ir1dude on-stte sprillklerheais andwrencil on· 
$lie for emer~ent repairs. the inclusion of alocal waler now 
alann to ere ale an audible alert for1he ffo.v of water lnthil 

NFPA 130-16 ofChapter80oflht Flre Code of the event olwat8raetivatlon Ina vacant stn.icMe, and 

Ct'llpler 80, NFPA 
) 

District has been amended to update vanous I..Ocally adopted and amended 
lljdrostatic tesbng requirements IC assure prCf)ef 130 

130-16 provisions penalning to lhe installation of sprinkler spmlder system ,nstllla!ion deaeaStng the nsl<. ofwall!r 

systems inooeand two-family dwelHngs ctam;;ge from pipe falur11. Pas.Ive purge l'llQuiremenls 
were also added to ensure waler drrualion ll'loogh the 
s-;~larn, reducing stagnant water and bacldlow coocems 
(EID erio::mrages 1h1s type of system) 

Allows us lo match what dell8iopera end re61dents are used 

Cllarlged500GPM to1.000 GPM inn.,jor 
toin regards to GPM flre flow r~uirernenlB lhathave been 

Appemh B: Table useil fer over a dee.ad& in EOG. Alsoprovide:;a rrinlrrum 

8105 1(1) 
N subdivlslorls lie!ow 5000 fool elevation, lo match Locaiy adopted and amended lavelof available water tor~reflghting pul]loseslnlhe even! 

fir~ ffow preeederits used In EDC for years o1 house to house, holse lo vegetalion, adnror ~egeletr,on 
to house lgM1on 

"4,~ench B. Table 
EstaU,shed arrinimurn requirementol 1.500 GPM, A!!owius to malchvmatdevelopers 111d residents areased 

8105,2 
N below 5000 footelevalion. for all commercial Loc~ny .dopled and amended to mregards toGPM fire flowrequJrements 11181 have been 

prOjeclS used foro11er a decade in EDC 

Appendix O 0100 1 N Aaded ao exception ro, rasioonl~ drivew3)'! Locally adopted and amendeli 
ll!suPreasonable torequi~ a residential ~y Ill 
conslruct a26footwide spaceloracceis fo a hydrant 

Tdle14r~1resustoonly accept up IC 16"/o dnveways, 

Appen<lix O: D103.2 N 
Amended to meet Slate law of grades no grea1er Locally adop~ and amended 

aoy exaiptioos would require aP!Jroval by theAHJ. lnour El 

than16% within Wtldland Urban Interface Dorado County Tille 14adoption weellow grealer lhan 16% 
gradewithAHJapproval and hard sunace. 

App.ndll O 0103 3 N Adiled text lo include cwbs and gutters Localy adopted and ameoeled 
20 tool road widths $hall not include curbs and gullers due 
topotentlal access ~sues Md tumi119 radius ooncems 

Requires mirimum 15-H wide gales where installed 
Where fire apparatus access roads cori.lst of a divkled 

Appood1x 0:D103.5 N Localy adopted and emended roadway the gale width shall nol be less lhan 15 feel due to 
on fire ap?<tratus access roads apparatus turning radius. 

No pa ricing oo roads allowed on roadways le~ than 26 Feet 

Appendix O· 0103 61 N Road widths 20 to 2ll feet Locally adoptlld illld amended 
inwidlh above 5000 feet. Lower lhan 5000 feet1hisdoes 
not apply. Thissec1ion is adopted a~itslands in Ille Fire 
Code Appendix Dsection 103 6 1 ror all other elevations. 

23-1589 C 54 of 67 



Parting an one sideonlyooioads from 28fllelto36 feet 

Roaos WK1ths mare than 2.9 leet but less then 36 
allowed. This lsnotreqLlired less than 5000 feel of 

Append< D: D103.6.2 N feetinwidth 
Locally adopled arll amanded elevation. Lower than 5000 reellhis does not a~ly. The 

seclK!fl Is adopted as It stands ii 1he He Code AppendiX D 
Section 103 6 2 for allothere1evat1ons. 

Wien required bt the fire CQ(le offic:1al, a fie apparatus 

Appendix D: D104.4 N Added to r~ire eirrumfereotialfie apparatJS Locally aeati!d aoo ~ 
access road shall beconstr\lded toencmipass Ille entire 

access roads strudLJe and shall prov,de ar.ontinuous meall$af 
emergency vehide access. 

Adopted with no Amendments 
101 1 It-rough 101.5 N 

Adopted toestablish scope, .iten~ severabily and Locally adopted Adm11iilratl~e c:lality 
valldi1'/ 

11021 lhroogi 10212 N Referen<:es, subjeds not regulated by the Cooe Localty adopted Admi'lislrati>e clarity 

104 1 thrnugh 
N Ablity toenforoe theaide lOv.1I1'/ FJdopted Admnistralive clarity 

104.12 3 

105.1 through N Time tmit.tIon ti' appicatoo Locally adopted AdmmIstratIve darily 
105.6.24 

106. l through 100.4 N 
Adopted 1his sedlon for administrative darily and 

l.oollly adopted f E!jj sct,edules for pennts 
fire and hie safety inspections 

107.1 through 1076 N 
Adopted this sedion fcraitruniSlraliue clarity and 

Loc:al~ adopted lnspecfm authonty I fire and life safety inspections 

AdoJxed this sedioo foraltn1m~trati.e clarity and 
Mainteniil'!ce d safeguards, testing and opera~on of 

100.1 Ill'~ 100 6 N 
fire il'1d r fl! safely 10Specicns 

Loc;illy adopted eq.;Ipment, re-11spedion and tes11ng, ~keeping. 
su~erv1.ion. rendertng eq.iipment iloperable, overcrowdng. 

113 N 
Adoi:te</ this sedion fur admnistrat1•e darity and Locally adopted Slop wor1< order 
~re and hfe s;,raty inspections 

114 1 lllrolJgh 114.7 N 
Ado!:(ea this sectiM rcw aaniniMl!1~ cl;ri.y and 

localy adopted Unsafe struclltes or etJJi:-r.ert 
fire and hfesatety inspections 

Asphalt kettles contaill highly flanYmble substa-,ces and 
require stringent safeguards. Managing ~nilon sources 

30\ 1 through 306 5 N AdoJ)le-d !his section for fl'1l and lfe safety loealy adopted throulJh responsible app11cat1011 of standards wit reduce lhe 
number of fires in various settings. (Climatic gedog1c.al, 
andtopograph1cal) 

General requrements rellitilg to smoking. Vacant premises 
condrtion an<I safety lltlJ.llrements, abandoned premises, 

310' through 3114 N Adopled llilssectiCI' for fire and ire safety LocaDy adopted 
tenant spaces, safeguarding vacanl premi9es, sea,lity, fire 
protection, fre separation, remo,ar ol combUS1ibles, 
remo,al of hazardous materials. (Climatic, geological, an<! 
lllpograph1cal). 

1
32:l.1 N Adol)led 1h1s section f<lr fre and 1te safety Locally adop\ed 

General requirerrents for roa,Js_ 1-nnels, and bridges. 
(Cl1mat1c, ge~o~cal, and topographical) 

Provides evacuation dnns for hazardous and insti1Utlona 
403.6 through 403.7.6 N AApteo this $~on !OI' fire aio ,t. ~ Locally adopted oa:upar;;ies (occupan~s will lllCfeasEd potential for Ide 

loss). 

400 9 through 403.9 4 N Adopted this section f01 hra and life saretr Locally adopted 
Provides evacuatlon <tills tor hotel/motel oa:upancIes 
(ocruparries with iraeased paential ror 'ife loss) 

405 1 tlm:111gh 405.10 N Adopled this section for file and life 9alety Locally adopted 
Emergency plar,ning and l!C0!ti keeping (Climatic, 
geo10g1cal, and topographical). 

510.3 N 
Adopted this seciion fur administrative clarly 811d locally adopted 

ApennR isrequred 1oremef9ellCY responcrer radio systems 
fire and l~e safety inspecllons (Cimatic, geological. and topographical). 

800.1 through 006.4 N 
Adopted this section fer administraive clanty Md 

local~ adopted 
Decoralive vegetation poses an increase nllaz.ard, 

fire and life safety inspections 11ammabilily and increased riSk. 

Walcove<ings n (P'O<JPE occupancies.(Schools) sets a 

807.1 lt-iough 80i.5.6 N 
Mopted lhis secilon for sdminislrative caIly and Locally adq)ted 

maximum amount of ~ammable waJI coverings in 

fire and life safety 1nspecbons educational lacilities {Ctima~c. gedcgieal. and 

I topographical). 

23-1589 C 55 of 67 



Adopted this SEcoon for administrative clarly nl 
Combustiblefumislllrig pose a slgnirkar!lflammab11ity and 

aos.1 th!WQh eoe.s N Locally~ed ~ li(e safely hazard ,, nstiMional ,rid mlege dolm 
fire and hfe safety rnspec1I011s type OOCUJ)anCIOS 

Adopted this seaion for ildmn,stratille clarfy and 
Proviles clarity on acceptance ~ itg 1/. aulOmatic fre 

904 41 N Locally adopted e1<1lngulshln9 systems. (Clmatlc, geological, and 
fire aid hfe sarety inspections topograptical). 

1101.1111rough 1102. N 
Ado?ed this section fur admir,;stra1Ne clariy and Locally adopted Adm1nislrat1W1 darIty 
fire and life safety inspeclials 

Emiirgency Responder radio coverage r, exislr.g bu~.ng$. 
A I bl..lldings will ~ef'\9quued 10 aUaw emergeocy rflSl)Onilm 
to receive and1ransmit emergency redlo traffic toand from 
each other and the emergency dispatch center. Time 

Ad~d this seaion i1 axtstrlg buik1119s fer the 
frames can he developed to come ilto compIIe11ce and the 
pt,as,ng III of a system 011er a period cf time, de:ermt,ed by 

11032 r safetyotflrellghlers and other emergency Locally adopted !he fire cxide offit111I. ,saC($!)table. The mllOnale behind !his 
responde!S secilOfl is that on almost all emergency respooder mjuy or 

1 ta!alf.y Incici.ots communication Is a key Issue. This 
situation can l!c corrected with the addition of radio 
eQI.IPlllSn! to boost the signal lnareas that do not /lave 
strong signal {Climatic, geological, and topograp~ical) 

Requires installa1ion ol ffre sprinkler systems i1 exis~ng 

11035 1 
AdQ?ed this section ~rtJie safetyofthe pllblic, 

Locally ooooteo 
ocaipaooes wI!ll hogh Ire safety risk and In oonformance 

fi'efighlers, and olller emergency responders Wi!h prevlcus UnHorm Fire Codes. (Climatic. ~ological, and 
'.Opogll!pt\cal). 

Ado~ted this sectiOn for the s.ie!y of the public, 
Requires instlllabon c:J carbor monoxide alamls in 

1103 9 N 
firefigl1ter1, and other emergen~y responders 

Localy adopted oa:upancies wth h~h !He safety rislc (Clmahc, geo/OgIcal, 
and topographical) 

1104, 1 t11rougl\ AdOp!ed 1111s sectoo forlhe saretyd'thepulliic. 
Pro-1de1 a minimum level of salely wrtl1 re!>'rd to cgren 

N Locally adoplEd fr0m eXlSting buildiigs 110USing 0CC1Jp;,,1Cle$ will a h,gh!1fe 
1104.25 f,reflgl,ters, and other emergency responders safety risk. (Climatic, geologcal, and IO!)Ograpilc:a~ 

1106 1 thrwgh Adopted tlus section for the s:le'rj of the putdic, 
PrO"rdes a mrimLIII level of safely a! 1,re Slorage yards 

N Locallr adopl2d \l(fh high levels of nammable ru!)l)er material. {Clmai::, 
110612 rreffghters, and olller emergency responders geo'ogical, and t0p0graphi~). 

AppendixO:D101.1 N 
Adop!ed tli,s ~it,~ for the safety of lhe public. 

Locally edople:l 
General re(Jliraments for fire apparatus aCGe$$ roads 

through 0104.1 l irefit11ters, and <JfJler emergency responders lndudirlg loads {Clmatic, geological, and topographical). 

Appeodix 0: 0104.2 
N 

Adopted this section forllie safety of1hepubl1c, Loaillyadopted 
C01m1e1oaf illd industrial develojYnenl freapparalus 

(exciudmg exceptioo) firefiglile15, and other emergency responders access roads (Climatic, geological and topographi::aff. 

Appendix 0:0104.3 
N 

Adopted this section fortlie safety of the public, locally adopled 
Conmilloal aid industrial dewlopment fire appaf'31us 

through 0105 4 firefigt,ters, srvi ot!ler emergency rasponders =ss roads (Cfmatic. geological and 1opographicaO. 

Appendix D: D11)5 1 N 
Adopted this section lorlhe safety of lhe p,,,bic, 

locally adopted 
Fire apparatus access IQads fur multiple-fam!y residemial 

lexckldng e:iceptionJ f,refighlers, and Olher emergency respor,ders developmenls {Clir'1at1c, geolog,cal, andloflO!lrapmcaQ. 

Appendix D.D106.2 N Adopted this section IOI the safety cf the publi::, 
locally adopted 

Fire apparatus access road3 lo!" rrul11le-fill11dy residential 
through D106.3 firefighters. and other emergency responders developmer,ts (Climatic, gaol0g1cal, and topographical). 

One-or!Ylo-dwel6ng resldenlial d811elopment$ ,hall be 
Appendix 0. 0107.1 N 

Adopted th,ssedion fQrthe sllfetyofihepubllc, 
locally adopted 

equi!)Ped throughout >Mlh two sperate and approved fire 
(excWng exceptions ) firefighters. and other emergency resJ)0!1ders apparli!Js access roa:lsduetotopograpluc, gqraph c and 

climatic con~ ons, 

One-or two-dwelling resident al developments sllaUbe 
Appendix D· 0107.2 

N 
AdC!lted !his section fortl1e safety of the pL.tihc, Locally adoplBd 

equipped lhroughout wilh two spera!e and approved fire 
through 0108.1 flreflghters, and other emergency responders al)l)a'llfus acces$ roads due to topographic, geographi: anc 

ctimaticconditlOl'S. 

Grey cells are previoLis~ amended, adopted, or changed code sections that are being adopted again in this code cycle. 

23-1589 C 56 of 67 



Wr1te cel:s are newly ame11ded, adopted, or cha~ged code sections that differ from previous code adoptions. 

I 

I 
I 

l. 

23-1589 C 57 of 67 



FIRST NOTICE 
Notice of Intent to Adopt the 2022 Fire Code Ordinance 

Notice is hereby given oftnc intention of the Lake Valley Fire Protection District to 
adopt a Fire Code Ordinance. The District shall hold its first public hearing at 17 :00 on 
Thursday December 8th, 2022 at the Lake Valley Fire Protection District Station 7, 2211 
Keetak St, South Lake Tahoe, CA, regarding the adoption of the 2022 Fire· Code 
Ordinance pursuant to Health and Safety Code Sections 13869 and 13869.7. Copies of 
the code section referred to and any secondary code sectfons referred to, adopted by 
reference, are on file with the Secretary of the District and are open to public inspection. 
Adoption of the Fire Code Ordinance will adopt the California Fire Code as currently 
published in Title 24, Part 9, of the California Code of Regulations, governing fire 
prevention and building standards related to fire and panic safety with some amendments. 
ln some instances the Lake Valley Fire Protection District's proposed Fire Code 
Ordinance proposes building standards more stringent than those minimum building 
standards adopted by the State Fire Marshal and contained in the California Building 
Standards Code. 

23-1589 C 58 of 67 



!fColumn 

OFFICIAL AD PROOF 
' This is the proof ol your ad scheduled to run in Tahoe Daily Tribune on the dates indicat ed below. If 

changes are needed. please co11tact us prlor to deadline at (530) 541-3880. 

Notice ID. 03ORKMKDbuaRVoYAoJrF I Proof Updated: Nov. 23, 2022 al 12:56pm PST 
Notice Name: 8CD06 Notice al Intent Lake Valley Fire I Publisher JD: 251403 

This is not an ,nvoice. Below is an e~imated price, and it is 

subject to change. YDLI will rec<?ive an invoice with the final 

price upon invoice creation by the publisher. 

Chad Stephen 

s1epheP@l!ike11a11eyrJn:.org 

(530) 577-3737 

Columns Wide: 2 

11125/2022: Other Notice 

1'.Y0~/2012: Other Notice 

Alfldavit flat cllarge 

lnt~rnet Flat Fee ChargE-

FILING FOR 

Tahoe Daily Tr1bu,1e 

Ad Class: Legals 

Subtotal 

Tax% 

Total 

72.84 

72.84 

8.52 

4'1.50 

$198.70 

0.00 

$198.70 

See Proof on Next Page 

8CD06 Notice of Intent Lake Valley Fire - Page 1 of 2 

23-1589 C 59 of 67 



FIRST NOTICE 
Notice ot ln~nt 10 ,Wt,pt 111& 202.2. Fire C<lde 

Ordinance 

~ ~ (14(',',t,y g,,ir, "1 lf>P. Inta111""' or tho l.Ji~ 
Vimey Fta f'ro~n D•swi;,;, 111 Ddoa't II Fll8 :co~ti 
Onll,i~nci,'. U,e-!JrWfollrill.,. !1tUfftt.111I p!ltllk.he~r4ng 
a117:l)Oor, TIIUt~'J O~oe,y,t,e, 8tr,.2ll22'1tU, Lal,., 
1/llllet F11<> l'roi,1coor1 Jb!,,,::, S!afiQ<• 7 2211 
K.elsk 1'11. SOull1 !.Jlk,t. lan,i,; CA, "'fl'lr.imQ ll'le 
!lllllPlllli'I ot ~ 2.D22 Fn CQr.!,. O!dlnenllil ])<.J~uaru 
10 Weolh "'llj Gol&ly 0"'1!!I :Jec,tionf, 13000 i.1d 
l2S':19J. CopiK al 1111, c,J(l,o wcIIon ,.,., .... : 1u om1 
!!llY wcandltTy cQ<I~ ~ >#l1',[1""1 to. lldcpted by 
r&hJ,~ ont oo ftfe-Mh th-= ~.actiiLYy "' 1~ DDb"CI 
r.n(I Ii/II ~r, ;o pul:lll.:::insp,,ctton M~f?IIM <>I 1he F~e 
CollaO<dnQrw,n•1l1 adq,1111 .. c.~1tkirn1.0 Fir1t.Codi as 
eun.,.,tty p1.1t:1i~he<f , 1\d& :u Pn,1 ~- -,rn,,, ea,rv1,,G 
C..<hi a Jilll9•"1~t>i~. g<1;,,r'1Ulq rll'e pre,,onr,"" »11-.1 
r.,uilal~ .t-..riclnrd& ••'•'~" to fl(er Mli panic ,~fa.71 
w1~ -sorn• ~nt&. In st1me lm;:1ance1>.. 1ri-, UJ!<.e 
\In!!!'/ Fir( Prote,:tion C'm:11101"0 ,,.,,,.,..Old F"e Cod!! 
') JinanNI f.<cpo._b.nl<l,o,,, IIB'1Ul!Jds III0!'1's1ll!>ilf;l1l 
U>iH Iha<,~ lll• \o1llull LUIIO.Jl,; ~!gr.Jard; :Uln!)(>rl .t,y 
~~ ~ Fu"<?. Mc.r-..i~Mll 1,lNt ~,Gmad a1 tl•a C-b.lomi.11 
::Jt..l,Nl!l Slo11,J..-,;1~ CQ</e 

Publlahed: November ZS. Oecember 2. 2022. 

8CD06 Notice of Intent Lake Valley Fire - Page 2 of 2 

23-1589 C 60 of 67 



SECOND NOTICE 

Notice of Intent to Adopt the 2022 Fire Code Ordinance 

Notice is hereby given of the intention of the Lake Valley Fire Protection District to adopt a Fire 
Code Ordinance. The District sh.all hold its second publfc hearing at 16:00 on Thursday January 
5th, 2023 at the Lake Valley Fire Protection District Station 7, 2211 Keetak St, South Lake 
Tahoe, CA, regarding the adoption of the 202Z Fire Code Ordinance pursuant to Health and 

Safocy Code Sections 13869 and 13869.7. Copies of the code section referred to and any 

secondary code sections referred to adopted by reference, are on file with the Secretary of 

the District and are open to public inspection. Adoption of the Fire Code Ordinance will adopt 
the California Fire Code as currently published in Title 24, Part 9, of the California Code of 
Regulations, governing fire prevention and building standards related to fire and panic safety 
with some amendments. In some instances the Lake Valley Fire Protection District's proposed 
Fire Code Ordinance proposes building standards more stringent than those minimum building 
standards adopted by the State Fire Marshal and contained in the California Building Standards 

Code. 

23-1589 C 61 of 67 



aColt1mn 

OFFICIAL AD PROOF 
This js the proof of your ad scheduled to run in Tahoe Dally Tribune on the oates indicated below. Jf 

changes are needed, please contact us prior to deadline at (530) 541-3680. 

Notice ID: c:JTBabOtXut<eZn9H,kpSr ! Proof Updated: Dec. 21, 2022 at 01:43pm PST 
Notice Name: BCD06 Lake Valley Rre Protection Disuict, 2 I Publisher :o· 255488 

This is not an invoice. Below is an estimated price, and it is 

subject to chan!:Je. You will receive an invoice wilh the final 

price t,pon ,nvo,ce c.reatioo by the publisher. 

FILER 

Chad Steph,m 

s1ephen@lakevalleyiire.org 

(530) 577.3737 

Columns Wide: 2 

12/2312022: Other N0~Ct, 

Affittavit flat charge 

h1Lemet Flat Fee Cha1ge 

FILltJG FOR 

Tal1oe Daily Tribune 

Ad Class: Lege.ls 

Subtotal 

Tax (0%) 

Total 

90.29 

4 00 

40.00 

$134.29 
$0.00 

$134.29 

See Proof on Next Page 

---------------------------- -

I 

8CD06 Lake Valley Fire Protection District, 2 - Page 1 of 2 

23-1589 C 62 of 67 



SECOND NOTICl!: 

No1lce 6f Intent IOAdcptm.2022 F"n Cede 
Ordln:tnc• 

No11ci: is heml>Y g,,i;;n <i• Iii" lnlontioll o! \he ~ 
Vflll.JY Fifll P~n (i();tr,o! l!j oxtopl ll 1'1rao 
C9oe C/din.inoO' °Tt'• O~racl '1t11111 ~-:1'1 ~~ aooond 
l'ulll,, inlaring Ill 10:00 M Tn•.ll'>di.Y J-ry 
",,,· :ro:n at the- uota 111,m,y F-re Pmtt,C1t0,, Otl1!Tiol 
$.'llnon 7. 2i11 K,,~u.k 61. Si:;11111 1..a~11 
r,:,1,,:,, CA ,e,;a""llQ 11W oll!Qp!lon of 1110 2Mi' Fire 
C'.1"6 Oi~;,;,,,_ pu<5'1m'll lO HUl,f, 01,d 
S.Jel<i Cod~ S..cbOfJ& 13368 and 1:,i,ae,; 0,pies of 
..,.,W<1e _,.,.. ralo(t,,d 'O - arw 
~ ooo~ $a<ll1011• .,,,,,uert m, ltll<lp•£',;I by 
r1;fflr11;."\l,II!!, ~rr on hl& ...,.,h th9 'SfJm!IIJtN)' of 

:.%~~:~~:J.~:~i~~..:~n «h,plfLI• 
ffl& Clttfl>,r,n; Fms ca,,,~ ,:trn-antty r u:;ii,Mii II'( 'lil!f. 
~- l'al\9.ollhdC.alilbt,,iat,o~"ct 
;iegulllll""". 9"""""1119 ~R> ;>T6""1lll07\ am/ building 
.ruN"<llllt~ ,alal.;d lo fir<> 2f,a ;,-,,o,.; ,ali<fy 
Mlh ~ Qmerldmeu~ 1n 30ITli' in.nauc.e!i>. T..Y ~ 
Vn,iev i',re i'IOle!'!liOrl D15:b:1'1i piqpaa:;,o 
Fir• C<J.:16 1)r('((ne,1a; n•~• lru,ldin] olardlwl~ 

~~~~~i~d •~:~.ns":: ~::~rshal and 
c.;,~uiinod ,r, 11'1& CAG10<r1m l!oilt.lk\'.] S)lJ!mll'.lls 
C.:ttiJ 

Publiohed, December 23, 2022 

8CD06 Lake Valley Fire Protection District, 2 - Page 2 of 2 

23-1589 C 63 of 67 



1212B/22. 11:15AM http&authtahaenow comstary112520221ake-va11ey-fire-protecl1on-<listnct-adopl-new-h re-codeR>ctid~lwAR21GV1 SsV4 YUzRZvSFj .png 

11:14 

X 

~ 
lvt r H t1• 

Lake Valley Fire Pr ... 
C, southtahoenow.com 

•l \f•N@W, 
J . • J ' ,~ \• H A A.'J,;/DJ"J,l-U. l <i•+ 

,,tf?(lU 

□ 

-
1.., .... :.: ... ,. SNOW REMOVAL 

OPERATIONS IN EFFECT 

Lill'\:;• \fiJ!1·.,- P.ffl! Prt1:.t:lia:-i Dbtrir.: 10 :11d qx r.\.ww nrw c~c 

View 1Jlt.'l'I~ 

.~!, ,, . , ' ~ .J'h 

--"-• ·.: .. hw,. "f! ~n.ktJ•L-., V ::,,h,-:.1. ;1~ ~•.J~ " . .,::, P,J'!.J .. ! r~~·, c: 
, ii I t.0:1_ 1 lllo:-' J.Ji.•• •. ;;, ,...,_.,,. IJ•C"•l.<'\1h' 

_;,:;-~, llf,II ~lt>'iJ t.• .,. ~l '-1 "" h 1;,ll' I a : Si 1 I •• T • 'v. 
re,.::.-~ .... ?I ,.a:, " ;;......., • ... 1. taJ i.. .:-ctu Str\i.--:t. ""' 

flPE~ OIROlLM 
•~ ;,.i..,; ~ ', a;, . It.._. P'I• e. ;,•.!1~ 

T ,i,r:,,- :in1;.·ffJ1: ,;,.Lt,:;i!t:c 

,A,. .1.;,,...c..11.A 

,-,,,.~ .... -. .. 
\i: I , • • • 

~ i'"'• f •' i O, --~ 1 l (o 

v . . ~ :i,•~ ;,,-; i.. .--1 . ~1 '· "1" 
:t. •{ il ·c ...... , :.::.:11>• uf 

1:ti;.~ t"\I,, ,~""4/•01.~ l.11' 

• _ .. ... .,.,~ ... ~ ..... ,1 
1'l4' ( )1 •5 '" -,~. \L '°' ·,.. .c01,J 

f .,. ,( ~ .. ~,• w C• ;,IJ'll'lif! 

.. t'f1 

l t ..a 1C ~tll"1.tJ~\1'111 :o11":. t/~I •, .:s •flrr;,t, .. t :•. C,..;tr.t.t'i 
'l'V~-=.:l' Fire. Cn:a CHI 1.r1 •• P 'T~ , t~·oJ ~ s. -,nd .,. 
'('• ~ <;.tt1VJ<,t',r·--.i1.,,~.,,r-:, t ,r, ) d&.:llrn•,u,r"""'"'1-id:T-·.1:·: 
'1, ,.,._ ~ .. h tJe ~d·.:i• :a~~ .--.·ntr,, ...--t ••·i• r.-il!'orn n-
!I . .. lrl .... (tilfJL,1,u '-0 ,. 

T l ,-'\(,"l,,.•,~Of(l~<", ,tC~ tr, 

a- . ~ 1i111 .. 

p 0 

. ... ... 11,iy ~ 
•• 41f; l c.,,,;'&, 2023 

., ..... 
~··· 'Iii 

,,. ,._~.,-

'"' .,;,,,, -. 
.::, =~= ...... 

-t 

., 
... 

https:/lmail.google.comlrnaiVulO/#inbox/FMfcgzGrblbtvwbTkPRdFvlxnVxCjnfg?p<ojecto~1 &messagePertld;Q.1 112 

23-1589 C 64 of 67 



12128/22, 11·15 AM 

11:15 

X 

..... .... 

< Lake Valley Fire Pr ... 
• southtahoenow.com 

l ike Va•te/ FW's Ptpt.N::f.JQf o:strl~ ~o rol,d -..4CtN1'1 ;,ubll E: 
hn rtn" 011 M'IV H re coo.-. 

v, •• ,;,~ .cu:n·-; 

J•-•' 

L ~i •·-IJ,.-, f~•e F• .1!.I:..~· .... 91!..·1.~ j ,VfP.::, ~~ , '·•'••"•l t ••-t 
(1,,&~· """' ' ,, J ht• l"r.Kih·, ~ ,.rm·Jr-.1t),; -...v,-,, ·• 7: 1131 
Hil~.')f.._{' ti, ,._, ,,. 3 l'~ t:1 f.t.dt: ~:·,1•1~. •.,. If, 

--i1C:l~U:l,H.1Jl l • ~Jl~ !',,,t_,.,,-j~i.,L>I'~ 10lt<")'J,J, ~'lt- ll ' k 'J)hCo1 

f.! rl-. :1 :' ,1. - 't • ... t,• ('h.Jo .. '\. •1 ;~l ·1 • I t t l~Jna JII.', .:,:it,,_,,y 

.,, ~t:0 ; r~ Vf1 .v,-..::1; "l,•,·,u ... , ). :-ia. i..~ t .... v. ~ .r-.1 ,.,,. 
Td ·v,, .::a ~ 

.. ' 
,t, . 1 r 

.. , ... . .,. 
I ,,J • 

~1,-~ 

I=~-~ ~HROU M.ll'II r:.:.: . ,,. 
~ "'"MM,.., 

I r.,,..,,. . <f ~ .- ... ....:'..:::l\"t I/ ••• 

~ 

.,; YI 

lt1 «,r,,u1,.-~o1.r'-l 1,,-p•·• 1: 

9.1!,.-:.: 11 ,..:CO.XC·:i::1o1o1 .. t: 
p !,&~"'!.,~~ t:tJl,::.r..,• ~?M:J&l.,.:i. 
r,,, .. • •J1""" (',Lt hi!, I ♦ 

m,•9.1.;-:11 :.ioU1o.> , ~ ,1"•:'.:) iJl!
dJ~:..:J t!1 (l'JC !.; .-.~· f1t (; 

M.:,1·l ,n,i. .Jot',1 ,. /, Jt,\#)-(l 1tJ ,;,t 

'!."dl;,,,... ~1,,i,<4.,1,1 ~f ; 1:1<•.1 '1 

c.,,. 
ot:::ll li'..-

0 

httpsouthtahoenow.com$1ory 12212D22Iake-valley-fire-protection-distr,cl-hold-sacond-public-hearing-new-11re-cod e .png 

,111?(!1 

□ 

M.ntl.ly Ul-c 
C,.,.h.f· ~Oll 

( · 

~!~,· 

~ ::.:i~~~":!:t I'-·· • 
,LjU 

.. ,_,....,.,..,,_ 
a -...._.,..,.,;l,71f 

... 

hltps· //mai I .goog l0.com/maillu/O/#1n box/FMfcgzGrblbtvwb TsCdJfSL V Jghm SMQb?projector= 1 &messageParUdacO. 1 112 

23-1589 C 65 of 67 



12128/22, 11:16AM 

< 

NOTICE OF 
INTENT TO 
ADOPT THE 2022 
FIRE CODE 
ORDINANCE 
LI\' Marlh u olut.:Hg No;; 15. 2022 I N!!W5 

AA lakevaUeyfire.org 

c!J m 
C 

(o 

Notice of Intent to Adopt the 2022 Fire Code Oroimince Lake Valley F,re.png 

https:J/ma1l.google.comlmaill1J10/#inbox/FMfcgzGrblbtvwZsHwvxdwwCQhm kRRZC?projector=1&messageParttd=0.1 112 

23-1589 C 66 of 67 



12126/22. 11:14 AM 

NOTICE OF 
INTENT TO 
ADO PT THE 2022 
FIRE CODE 
ORDINANCE 
SECOND NOTICE 
tr; M.; rli f' C.J'.Jl::lLer~ ; )c ... 2 1, 2J2::. : r·,c1.s · 0 

C•:!l llf'lc tl~S 

ii lakcvnUeyfire.urg 

No~ce of Intent 10 Adopt the 2022 Fire Code Ordinance - Second Notice Lake Valley Flre.png 

https·/lmail.google.comlmall/U/0/#lnboxlFMfcgzGrblbhrwllCLdZNRNwHOtVj•ZTm?p.-ojector=1&mllSsagePartld:c0.1 112 

23-1589 C 67 of 67 




