RESOLUTION NO. 134-2023
OF THE BOARD OF SUPERVISORS OF THE COUNTY OF EL DORADO

(REPEALING RESOLUTION NO. 041-2020)

WHEREAS, the California Code of Regulations, Title 24, Part 9, the California Fire Code, is updated by the
State every three years; and -

WHEREAS, the 2022 California Fire Code became effective on January 1, 2023; and,

WHEREAS, California Health and Safety Code Sections 17958, 17958.5, 17958.7 and 18941.5 permits a
county to make such local amendments and modifications as the county determines are reasonably
necessary because of local climatic, geological or topographical conditions; and,

WHEREAS, the California Code of regulations, Health and Safety Code, Division 12, Part 2, Chapter 1,
Article 12, Section 13146, assigns responsibility for enforcement of safety regulations to the local level
and grants authority to delegate enforcement to the chief building official, or his or her authorized
representative, or the chief of the fire protection district, or his or her representative; and,

WHEREAS, the County of Ei Dorado desires to delegate enforcement of the Fire Code to the chief of the
fire authority, or the chief’s authorized representative; and,

WHEREAS, the fire protection district and County have agreed to develop, implement and maintain a
memorandum of understanding that describes the roles and responsibilities pertaining to the inspection
of certain building standards found in the Fire Code; and,

WHEREAS, on January 5, 2023, The Board of Directors of the Lake Valley Fire Protection District adopted
Ordinance No. 2022-01, which adopted the 2022 California Fire Code with amendments the District
deemed necessary to deal with local climate, geological or topographical conditions.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that the Board of Supervisors of the County of El Dorado ratifies
Ordinance No. 2022-01 of the Lake Valley Fire Protection District and delegates the enforcement of the
ordinance to the Lake Valley Fire District Chief, or his or her representative.

These changes include amendments and additions to the California Fire Code in the following sections:

101.1, 105.5, 105.5.55, 105.6, 105.6.25, 105.6.26, 107.5, 107.5.1, 107.7, 111.5, 112.4, 112.4.2,
113.4, 202, 302.1, 307.4.4, 401.2.1, 503.2.1, 503.2.5, 503.2.6, 503.3.1, 503.3.2, 503.3.3, 503.6,
505.1, 507.5.1, 509.3, 510.4.2.3, 603.2, 903.2.1.1, 903.2.1.2, 903.2.1.3, 903.2.1.4, 903.2.3, 903.2.4,
903.2.7, 903.2.7.2, 903.2.8.5, 903.2.9, 903.2.10, 903.2.10.1, 903.2.22, 903.2.23, 903.6, 907.2,
907.2.1.4, 907.2.2.3, 907.2.3.11, 907.2.4.1, 907.2.5.2, 907.2.6.6, 907.2.7.2, 907.2.8.4, 907.2.9.4,

23-1589 C 1 of 67



907.2.10.1, 507.2.30, 907.6.5, 907.6.2.1, 907.9, 1203.1.3, 3311.3, 3313.1, 50001.7, 5601.2,
5704.2.9.6.1, 5706.2.4.4, 5806.2, 6104.2, Chapter 80 NFPA 1-22 Section 22.3, Chapter 80 NFPA 1-
22 Section 22.10, Chapter 80 NFPA 13D-22: Sections 4.6, 5.1.1.2, 7.6, 11.2.1.1, Appendix B: Table
B105.1{1), Appendix B: Table B105.2, Appendix D Sections D103.1 through D103.3, Appendix D
103.5, Appendix D 103.6.1, Appendix D103.6.2, Appendix D104.4

The Lake Valley Fire District adopts the 2022 California Fire Code, Title 24, Part 9, in its entirety, including
Appendices, incorporating those sectfons of the International Fire Code, 2021 edition not adopted by the
state, with the exclusions listed below:

103, 309, 311.5, 311.6, 318, 403.3, 403.5, 403.8, 403.10, 403.11, 404, 408, 903.3.1.2, 504.1.1,
1103.1, 1103.3-1103.4, 1103.6, 1105, Chapter 26, D104.2 (exception only}, D106.1 (exception only),
D107.1 (exception only), Appendix A, Appendix G, Appendix J, Appendix K, Appendix L, Appendix
M, Appendix N, Appendix O.

Appendices not adopted can be used for reference in enforcing other sections of the 2022 California Fire
Code.

PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of Supervisors of the County of El Dorado at a regular meeting of said
BOARD, held the 12th day of September, 2023 by the following vote of said Board

Ayes: Thomas, Hidahl, Turnboo, Parlin, Laine
Attest: Noes: None
Kim Dawson Absent: None
Clerk of the Board of Supervisors

y 2 UenAey 7Ppned—

Deputy Cl€rk Wendy Thomas,éhair, Board of Supervisors
Kyle Kuperus

23-1589 C 2 of 67



LAKE VALLEY FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT

“Serving the Community Since 1947"”
Chad Stephen, Fire Chief

Board of Directors

John Rice
Brian Hogan ARE VALL gy
X

Leona Allen A
Ron biiten

Irenc Kachn
PIRE s TRICY
January 5. 2022

Daon Ashton, Chief Administrative Officer
El Dorado County Board of Supervisors
330 Fair Lane

Ptacerville, CA 95667

Subject: Resolution Ratifying Ordinance No. 2022-01 of the Lake Valley
Fire District, which adopts the 2022 California Fire Code with
amendments related to local climatic, geographic and
topographic conditions.

Dear Mr. Ashtom:

The Lake Valley Fire Protection District (LVFPD] is reguesting the Board of Supervisors (BOS) ratify its Ordinance No.
2022-01, which adopts the 2022 California Fire Code as amended due to specific iocal climatic, geographic and
topographic conditions. California Health and Safety Cade Section 13869.7 require the legislative body of the city or

county where the ardinance will apply to ratify, modify or deny the adopted ordinance. The BOS must also
delegate enforcement of the ardinance to aither the Fire District {or its representative} or the Chief Building Official.

Therefore, we request the County Board of Supervisors ratify Crdinance Na. 2022-01 with amendments o the 2022
California Fire Code, and delegate the enforcement of that Ordinance to the LVFPD Fire Chief. A proposed BOS
resolution is enclosed for your review and use on this topic.

This reselution has nc direct fiscal impact to the County.

Sincerely,

Chad Stephen
Fire Chief

23-1589 C 3 of 67



LAKE VALLEY FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT
ORDINANCE NO. 2022-01

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS OF THE LAKE VALLEY FIRE
PROTECTION DISTRICT AS FOLLOWS:

An ordinance of the Lake Valley Fire Protection District (L.VFPD)} adopting the 2022
Edition of the California Fire Code, incorporating the 2021 Edition of the International Fire Code,
regulating and governing the safeguarging of life and property from fire and explosion hazards’
arising from the storage, handling and use of hazardous substances, materials, and devices,
and from conditions hazardous to life or property in the occupancy of buildings and premises in
the LVFPD; providing for the issuance of permits and collection of fees therefor; Repealing
Ordinance No. 2019-01 of the LVFPD and all other ordinances and parts of the ordinances in
conflict therewith.

Be it ORDAINED by the Board of Directors of the LVFPD, also known as the LAKE
VALLEY FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT:

Section 1: FINDINGS OF FACTS

Section 2. ADOPTION OF CODE WITH EXCLUSIONS
Section 3: LOCAL AMENDMENTS

Section 4. CONFLICT

Section5: SEVERABILITY

Section 6: EFFECTIVE DATE AND PUBLICATION

SECTION 1: FINDINGS OF FACTS

The LVFPD makes certain changes (listed below) to the California Fire Code, 2022
Edition, pursuant to Health & Safely Code Sections 13869.7, 17958.5, 17958.7, and 18941.5
during this code adoption process. Such changes are necessary because of local climatic,
gealogical, and/or topographical conditions. The LVFPD has adopted, pursuant to Section
18941.5 of the California Health & Safety Code, the findings of facts relative to these conditions
by Resolution #2019-01 of the LVFPD dated December 12, 2019.

23-1589 C 4 of 67



SECTION 2: ADOPTION QF CODE WITH EXCLUSIONS
The LVFPD adopts the 2022 California Fire Code, Title 24, Part 9, in_its entirety,

including Appendices, incorporating those sections of the infernational Fire Code, 2021 edition
not adopted by the state, with the exclusions listed below:

Exclusions; 103, 309, 311.5, 311.6, 313, 403.3, 403.5, 403.8, 403.10, 403.11, 404, 406,
803.3.1.2, 904.1.1, 1103.1, 1103.3-1103.4, 1103.8, 1105, Chapter 26, D104.2 {(Exception only),
D106.1 (Exception enly), D107.1 (Exceptions only), Appendix A, Appendix G, Appendix J,
Appendix K, Appendix L, Appendix M, Appendix N, Appendix O.

Appendices not adopted can be used for reference in enforcing other sections of the 2022

California Fire Code.

SECTION 3: AMENDMENTS TO THE 2022 CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE
The following Sections are hereby amended or added:

Chapter 1
SECTION 101.1 “TITLE” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 101.1 TITLE. These reguiations shall be known as the Fire Code of LVFPD,
hereinafter referred to as “this code.”

SECTION 105.5 "REQUIRED OPERATIONAL PERMITS” [S AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 105.5 Required operational permits.  The fire code official is authorized to issue
operational permits for the operations set forth in Sections 105.5.2 through 105.5.525.

SECTION 105.5.55 “AUTOMOBILE WRECKING YARDS" IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 105.5.55 Automobile wrecking yards. An operational permit is required for the
operation of automobile wrecking yards.

SECTION 105.6 “REQUIRED CONSTRUCTION PERMITS” IS AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 105.6 required construction permits.  The fire code official is authorized to issue
construction permits for work as set forth in sections 105.6.1 through 105.6.246.

SECTION 105.6.25 "AUTOMOBILE WRECKING YARDS” IS ADRED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 105.6.25 Automobile wrecking yards. Construction permits are required for the
instaflation of or modification of aufomobile wrecking yards.

23-1589 C 5 of 67



SECTION 105.6.26 “TRAFFIC CALMING DEVICES” IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

105.6.26 Traffic calming devices.  Construction permiis are required for the installation or
modification of fraffic calming devices.

SECTION 107.5 “PERMIT, PLAN REVIEW AND INSPECTION FEES™ SHALL BE ADDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 107.5 Permif. A schedule of fees adopted by the district board of directors for plan
review, inspecfions, and the issuance of permits by the District may be found in the most current
district fee schedule (Heallh & Safety Code 17951).

SECTION 107.5.1 "COST RECOVERY FEES” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 107.5.1 Cost Recovery Fees. Fire service fees may be charged to any person, firm,
corporation, or business that, through negligence, violation of the law, or as a result of
carelessness, is responsible for the cause of the District fo respond o the scene of an incident.
A district board may charge a fee ta cover the cost of any service which the District provides or
the cost of enforcing any regutation for which the fee is charged (Health & Safety Code 13916).
The fee shall not exceed the actual cost of suppressing the fire and/or responding to the scene

of an incident.
SECTION 107.7 “"ADMINISTRATIVE COSTS” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 107.7 Administrative Costs. When a fest or inspection is scheduled, and the
contractor fails to perform to the satisfaction of the authority having jurisdiction (AHJ), the AHJ
may bill the confractor for actual time spent traveling fo and from the fest/inspection location
and the time spent af the lest/inspection site as well as administrative costs.

SECTION 111.5 “APPEAL PROCEDURES AND TIMELINES® SHALL BE ADDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 111.5 Appeal Procedures and Timelines. Any perscon or entity who believes they may
be adversely affected by an order, decision, or determination made by the fire code official
through a written notice may appeal this matter within 15 calendar days of the postmark cn the
notice. Alf such appeals shall be filed in writing with the Secretary of the Governing Board for the
District. A timely appeal shail stay further action by the fire code official uniff the matter is
determined by the Appeal Board as outlined in Section 109.2 unfess the issue poses an
imminent fire or life safety hazard to members of the public. The fire code official shall notify the
appeflant by certified mail of the date and time of such hearing. The hearing shall be scheduled
to take place no sooner than 20 calendar days from the date shown on the certified mail. The
appeifant shall have the right to appear in person or by agent at the hearing and present oral,
written, and/or photographic evidence fo the Appeal Board.

SECTION 112.4 “VIOLATION PENALTIES" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 112.4 Violation Penalties. Persons who shall violate a provision of this code or shall
fail to comply with any of the requirements thereof or who shall erect, install, alter, repair, or do
work in violation of the approved construction documents or directive of the fire code official, or

23-1589 C 6 of 67



of a permit or certificate used under provisions of this code, shall be guilty of a misdemeanor or
infraction, at the discretion of the prosecuting attorney or agency, punishable by a fine not more
than $100.00 for a first violation; A fine not exceeding $500.00 for a second violation of the
same provision within one year; A fine not exceeding $1000.00 for each additional violation of
the same provision within one year, or by imprisonment not exceeding 780 days, or both such
fine and imprisonment. Each day that a violation continues after due notice has been served
shall be deemed a separate offense. (Health & Safety Code Sections 13145 and 17995).
SECTION 112.4.2 “"CITATIONS” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 112.4.2 Citations. The Fire Chief, or hisfher duly authorized representative, may issue
citations for infractions or misdemeanor viclations of this code pursuant fo Section 13871 of the
Health & Safety Code of the State of California and Chapter 5¢ (commencing with Section
853.6) of Title 3 of Part 2 of the Penal Code of the State of California.

SECTION 113.4 “FAILURE TO COMPLY” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 113.4 Failure to Comply. Any persan who shall continue any work after having been
served with a stop work order, except such work as that person is directed to perform to remove

a violation or unsafe condition, shall be punishable by a fine or imprisonment or both as
described in Section 112.4 {(Health & Safety Code Sections 13145 and 17995).

Chapter 2

SECTION 202 “CAMPFIRE” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

CAMPFIRE. A fire that is used for cooking, personal warmth, lighting, or aesthetic purposes.
SECTION 202 “DISTRICT" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

DISTRICT. The District and all other areas within the exierior boundaries thereof now or
hereafter established.

SECTION 202 “DRIVEWAY" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

DRIVEWAY. A vehicuiar access that serves up fo two (2) parcefs with no more than fwo (2)
residential units and any number of non-commercial or industrial buildings on each parcel.

SECTION 202 "EXECUTIVE BODY" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:;
EXECUTIVE BODY. The Board of Directors of the District.
SECTICN 202 "FIRE CHIEF” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

FIRE CHIEF. The Chief Executive Fire Officer of the Fire department/disirict serving the
jurisdiction or a duly authorized represeniative.

SECTION 202 “FIRE HAZARD" SHALL BE ADDED AS FCLLOWS:

23-1589 C 7 of 67



FIRE HAZARD. Any condition, arrangement, or act which will increase, or may cause an
increase of, the hazard or menace of fire to a greater than custornarily recognized as normal
by-persons in the public service of preventing, suppressing, or extinguishing fire; or which may
obstruct, delay, or hinder, or may become the cause of obstruction, delay or hinderance fo the
prevention, suppression, or extinguishment of fire.

SECTION 202 “OPEN BURNING" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

OPEN BURNING. The buming of materials wherein products of combustion are emitted directly
into the ambient air without passing through a stack or chimney from an enclosed chamber.
Open burning does not include road flares, smudge-pots and similar devices associated with
safety or occupational uses typically considered open flames. For the purpose of this definition,
a chamber shall be regarded as enclosed when, during the time combustion occurs, only
apertures, ducts, stacks, flues or chimneys necessary to provide combustion air and permit the
escape of exhaust gas are open.

Open burning shall also include campfires, bonfires, porfable outdoor fireplaces, ceremonial
fires, and recreational fire as defined in the Fire Code.

Exception:

1. UL or ASMI listed LPG or natural gas outdoor flame devices, such as gas BBQ's or
gas fire pits that comply with the Fire Code.

2. For one-or two-family dwelfings, fixed or portable outdoor flame devices that meet the
following:

a. Devices shail comply with the Fire Code.

b. Devices shail be used per the manufacturer's specifications.

c. Minimum 10-foot clearance from device to alf flammable material and vegetation.
d.

No burning shalf be conducted during high or extreme fire weather conditions
(e.g., National Weather Service Red Flag Warnings).

3. Campfires on privafe lands. Where required by the fire code official, a permit shali be
issued by the fire code official.

4. Ceremonial andfor religious burning with the foflowing safety measures:
a. Maximum 4-foot x 4-foot burn area.

b. Minimum 10-foof clearance from the edge of the burn area {o alf flammable
material and vegetalion.

An approved waler supply is focated within 500 feet of the burn area.
The burn area is located no less than 30 feet from adjoining property lines.
An adult is present with a shovel until the fire is extinguished.

No burning shail be conducted during high or extreme fire weather conditions
fe.q., National Weather Service Red Flag Warnings).

™o oR 0

SECTION 202 “TRAINED CROWD MANAGER" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

23-1589 C 8 of 67



TRAINED CROWD MANAGER. Standby personnei, usually a security guard or usher
personnel, who are trained in the proper procedure to exit people from a tent or other place of
public assembiage in an orderly and calm fashion in the event of an emergency

Chapter 3

SECTION 302.1 “DEFINITIONS” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:
3D PRINTER.

ADDITIVE MANUFACTURING.
BONFIRE.

CAMPFIRE.

HI-BOY.

HIGH-VOLTAGE TRANSMISSION LINE.
OPEN BURNING.

PORTABLE OUTDOOR FIREPLACE.
POWERED INDUSTRIAL TRUCK.
RECREATIONAL FIRE.

SKY LANTERN.

SECTION 307.4.4 "OPEN BURNING RESTRICTIONS" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 307.4.4 Open Burning Restrictions. Open burning on all lands within the junisdiction
of the LAKE VALLEYFIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT (LVFPD), including the Local Response
Area (LRA), is prohibited when the Caiifornia Department of Forestry and Fire Protection {Cal
Fire) issues a burn suspension in the State Responsibility Area (SRA). This prohibition shall be
made effective 24-hours following its commencement in the SRA.

Open burning is also prohibited on afl lands within the jurisdiction of LYFPD at any time the fire
code official that atmospheric conditions or other local circumstances make such fires
hazardous, including factors such as high winds, low fuel moisture, fire weather, the issuance of
red flag wamings, the severe threat of wildland fire, or present risk of destruction by wildfire to
lifs, wildlife, property, or natural resources.

Chapter 4
SECTION 401.2.1 "PRE-FIRE PLANS" IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 401.2.1 Pre-fire plans. Where required by the fire code official, a pre-fire pfan shali be
provided and approved by the fire code official for all new commercial structures.

Chapter 5
SECTION 503.2.1 “DIMENSIONS” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 503.2.1 Dimensions. Fire apparatus access roads shall have an unobstructed width of

not less than 20 feet (6096 mm), exclusive of shoulders, as measured from face of curb fo face
of curb, except for approved security gates in accordance with Section 503.6, and an

23-1589 C 9 of 67



unobstructed vertical clearance of not less than 15 feel. Driveways shall have an unobstructed
width of not less than 12 feet wide.

SECTION 503.2.5 “DEAD ENDS" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 503.2.5 Dead Ends. Dead-end fire apparatus access roads and driveways in excess of
150 feet (45,720 mm) in length shall be provided with an approved area for turning around fire
apparatus.

SECTION 503.2.6 “BRIDGES AND ELEVATED SURFACES” SHALL BE AMENDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 503.2.6 Bridges and Elevated Surfaces. Where a bridge or an elevated surface is
part of a fire apparatus access road, the bridge shall be constructed and maintained in
accordance with AASHTQ HB-17, the current El Dorado County Transportation Division Bridge
Standard or Appendix D of the current California Fire Code, whichever is more restrictive.
Bridges and elevated surfaces shall be designed for a live load sufficient to carry the imposed
loads of fire apparatus. Vehicle load limits shall be posted at both entrances to bridges when
required by the fire code official. Where elevated surfaces designed for emergency vehicle use
are adjacent to surfaces that are not designed for such use, approved barriers, approved signs
or both shall be installed and maintained where required by the fire code official.

SECTION 503.3.1 “NO PARKING IN FIRE LANES” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 503.3.1 No Parking in Fire Lanes. No person shall stop, park, or leave standing any
vehicle, whether attended or unattended, except when necessary fo avoid confiict with other
traffic or in compliance with the directions of the Fire Chief, or his/her duly authorized
representative, Peace Officer, or official traffic control device along the edge of any highway, af
any curb, or in any location in a publicly or privately owned or operated off-sireet parking facility,
designated as a fire lane by the District with jurisdiction over the area in which the place is
located. The designation shall be indicated (1)} by a sign posted immediately adjacent to, and
visible from, the designated place clearly stating in lelters not less than one inch in height that
the place is a fire lane, (2) by outlining or painting the place in red and, in confrasting coior,
marking the place with the words “FIRE LANE,” which are clearly visible from a vehicle, or (3)
by a red curb or red paint on the edge of the roadway upon which is clearly marked the words
“FIRE LANE.”

SECTION 503.3.2 "NO PARKING IN FRONT OF HYDRANTS" SHALL BE ADDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 503.3.2 No Parking in Front of Hydrants. No person shall stop, park, or leave
standing any vehicle within 15 feet of a fire hydrant except as follows: (a) If the vehicle is
atfended by a ficensed driver who is seated in the front seat and who can immediately move
such vehicle in case of necessity, (b) If the vehicie is owned or operated by a fire department
and is clearly marked as a fire department vehicle.

SECTION 503.3.3 “FIRE LANES BASED ON ROAD WIDTH” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

23-1589 C 10 of 67



Section 503.3.3 Fire Lanes Based on Road Width. Fire lanes shall be based on road width as
required in Appendix D as amended by the District.

SECTION 503.6 “SECURITY GATES” IS AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 503.6 Security Gates. The installation of security gates across a fire apparatus access
road shall be approved by the fire code official and shall comply with the District gate standard.
Where security gates are installed, they shall have an approved means of emergency operation.
The security gates and the emergency operation shall be maintained operational at all times.
Electric gate operators, where provided, shall be listed in accordance with UL 325. Gates
intended for automatic operation shall be designed, constructed, and installed to comply with
the requirements of ASTM F2200.

SECTION 505.1 "ADDRESS IDENTIFICATION" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS :

Section 505.1 Address ldentification. Addresses for new and existing buiidings shall comply
with the District address standard as approved by the fire code official. The address
identification shall be legible and placed in a position that is visible from the street or road
fronting the property. Address identification characters shall contrast with their background.
Address numbers shall be Arabic numbers or alphabetical letters. Numbers shall not be spelled
out. Each character shall be not less than 4 inches (102 mm) high with @ minimum stroke width
of ', inch (12.7 mm). Where required by the fire code official, address identification shall be
provided in additional approved locations to facilitate emergency response. access is by means
of a private road and the building cannot be viewed from the public way, a monument, pole or
other sign or means shall be used to identify the structure. Address identification shall be
maintained.

SECTION 507.5.1 “WHERE REQUIRED" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 507.51 Where Required. Where a portion of the facility or building hereafter
constructed or moved into or within the jurisdiction is more than 150 feet from a hydrant on a fire
apparatus access road, as measured by an approved route around the exterior of the facility or
building, on-site fire hydrants and mains capable of supplying the required fire flow shall be
provided where required by the fire code official.

Exceptions:

1. For Group R-3 and Group U occupancies, the distance requirement shall be 600 feet
(183 mj.

SECTION 508.3 “FIRE CONTROL ROCM" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 509.3 Fire Control Room. Fire sprinkler risers, fire alarm control panels, solar
photovoltaic power system rapid shutoff switches, and other fire detection, suppression, or
simifar control elements shall be located inside a single fire control room for the building. The
fire control room shall have minimum dimensions of five feet by seven feet in size with a total
usable area of not less than 35 square feel. The room shall be located within the building on an
outside wall at a location approved by the Fire Code Official and shall be accessible from the
exterior. An exterior access door with a clear width of not less than 32 inches and height of not
fess than 80 inches shalil be provided for access info the room. A durable sign shail be affixed lo
the exterior of the door with the words “FIRE CONTROL ROOM” in letters not less than 4

23-1589 C 11 of 67



inches in height. A key box complying with Section 506 shall be installed on the exterior side of
the fire controf room door opening.

The room must be capabie of maintaining a minirmum temperature of 40 degrees Fahrenheit. A
clearance of 12 inches shall be provided from the fire sprinkler risers {o any adjacent walls. This
room can be shared with other building utiiities or fire protection equipment that is not
incornpatible. An approved cabinet or container shall be provided to store record plans of the
fire sprinkler system and other fire protection equipment. This room shail not be used for any
other slorags.

Exception: One-and two-family dwellings, manufactured homes, or similar uses defined
as either a Group R-3, R3.1, or R-4 occupancy.

SECTION 510.4.2.3 “STANDBY POWER" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 510.4.2.3 Standby power. In-building, two-way emergency responder communication
radio coverage systems shall be provided with dedicated standby batteries or provided with
2-hour standby batteries and connected to the facility generator power system in accordance
with Section 1203. The standby power supply shall be capable of operating the in-building,
two-way emergency responder communication coverage systern at 100-percent system
capacity for a duration of not less than 72 hours.

Chapter 9
SECTION 903.2 “WHERE REQUIRED" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 903.2 Where Required. Approved automatic sprinkler systems in new buildings and
structures, when constructed or relocated within the jurisdiction, shall be provided in the
jocations described in Sections 903.2.1 through 903.2.12 and Sections 903.2.14 through
903.2.23.

Exception: Agricultural buildings not under a special use permit used for commercial
purposes.
SECTION 903.2.1.1 “GROUP A-1" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLL.OWS:

Section 903.2.1.1 Group A. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout stories
containing Group A-1 occupancies and throughout all stories from the Group A-1 occupancy to
and including the levels of exit discharge serving that occupancy where one of the following
conditions exists:

1. The fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet.
2. The fire area has an occupant load of 300 ar more.

3. The fire area is located on a floor other than a level of exit discharge serving such
oceupancies.

4. The fire area contains a mutti-theater complex
SECTION 903.2.1.2 “GROUP A-2" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 903.2.1.2 Group A-2. An automatic sprinkler system shali be provided throughout
stories containing Group A-2 occupancies and throughout all stories from the Group A-2

23-1589 C 12 of 67



occupancy to and including the levels of exit discharge serving that accupancy where one of the
foliowing conditions exists:

1. The fire area exceeds 3,600 square fest;
2. The fire area has an occupant ioad of 100 or more.

3. The fire area is located on a floor other than a level of exit discharge serving such
accupancies,

4. The structure exceeds 3,600 square feet, contains more than one fire area containing a
Group A-2 occupancy, and is separated into two or more buildings by fire walls of less
than 4-hour fire-resistance rating without openings.

SECTION 903.2.1.3 “GROUP A-3" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 903.2.1.3 Group A-3. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout
stories containing Group A-3 occupancies and throughout all stories from the Group A-3
occupancy to and including the levels of exit discharge serving that occupancy where one of the
following conditions exists:

1. The fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet.
2. The fire area has an occupant load of 300 or more.

3. The fire area is located on a floor other than a level of exit discharge serving such
occupancies.

4. The structure exceeds 3,600 square feef, contains more than one fire area containing
exhibition and display rooms, and is separated into two or more buildings by fire walls of
less than 4-hour fire-resistance rating without openings.

SECTION 903.2.1.4 "GROUP A-4” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 903.2.1.4 Group A-4. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout
stories containing Group A-4 occupancies and throughout all stories from the Group A-4
occupancy to and including the levels of exit discharge serving that occupancy where one of the
fallowing conditicns exists:

1. The fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet.
2. The fire area has an occupant load of 300 or more.

3. The fire area is located on a floor other than a level of exit discharge serving such
occupancies.

SECTION 903.2.3 “GROUP E” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 903.2.3 Group E. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided for Group E
occupancies as follows:

1. Throughout all Group E fire areas greater than 3,600 square feet in area.

2. The Group E fire area is located on a floor other than a level of exit discharge serving
such occupancies.

23-1589 C 13 of 67



Exception: In buildings where every classroom has not fewer than one exterior exit
door at ground level, an automatic sprinkler system is not required in any
area below the lowest level of exit discharge serving that area.

3. The Group E fire area has an occupant load of 300 or more.

4. In rooms or areas with special hazards such as iaboratories, vocational shops and other
such areas where hazardous materials in quantities not exceeding the maximum
allowable quantity are used or stored.

5. Throughout any Group E structure greater than 3,600 square feet in area, which contains
more than one fire area, and which is separated into two or more buildings by fire walls of
less than 4-hour fire resistance rating without openings.

6. For public school, and state-funded coenstruction projects see Section 803.2.19.
7. For public school campuses, Kindergarten through 12" grade, see Section 903.2.20

SECTICN 903.2.4 “GROUP F-1" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 903.2.4 Group F-1.  An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout all
buildings containing a Group F-1 occupancy where one of the following conditions exists:

1. A Group F-1 fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet.
2. A Group F-1 fire area is located more than three stories above grade plane.

3. The combined area of all Group F-1 fire areas on all floors, including any mezzanines,
exceeds 3,600 square feet.

SECTION 903.2.7 “GROUP M” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 903.2.7 Group M. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout buildings
containing a Group M occupancy where one of the following conditions exists:

1. A Group M fire area exceeds 3,600 sguare feet.
2. A Group M fire area is located more than three stories above grade plane.

3. The combined area of all Group M fire areas on all floors, including any mezzanines,
exceeds 3,600 square feet.

5. The structure exceeds 3,600 square feet, contains more than one fire area containing a
Group M occupancy, and is separated into two or more buildings by fire walls of less than
4-hour fire-resistance rating without openings.

SECTION 903.2.7.2 “GROUP M UPHOLSTERED FURNITURE OR MATTRESSES" SHALL BE
AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 903.2.7.2 Group M Upholstered Furniture or Mattresses. An automatic sprinkler
system shall be provided throughout a Group M fire area where the area used for the display
and sale of upholstered furniture or mattresses exceeds 3,600 square feet.

SECTION 903.2.8.5 "MANUFACTURED HOMES" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

23-1589 C 14 of 67



Section 903.2.8.5 Manufactured Homes. An awtomatic fire sprinkler system shall be required
in alt new manufactured homes and multi-family manufactured homes intended for use as a
one-and two-family dwelling. The design and installation of such systems shall be in accordance
with California Code of Regulations, Title 25, §4300.

Exceptions:

1. Manufactured homes located within an existing mobile home park complying with
California Health and Safety Code, Division 13, Part 2.1 or 2.3.

2. Manufactured homes that do not exceed 1,200 square feet in size and serve as an
accessory dweliing unit, as defined in Government Code Section 658502; when the
existing primary residence on the property is not required to comply with California
Residential Code Section R313.2.

3. Manufactured homes that do not exceed 320 square feet in size.
SECTION 903.2.9 “GROUP 8-1" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 903.2.9 Group S-1. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout all
buildings containing a Group S-1 occupancy where one of the following conditions exists:

1. A Group S-1 fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet.
2. A Group S-1 fire area is located more than three stories above grade plane.

3. The combined area of all Group S-1 fire areas on all floors, inciuding any mezzanines,
exceeds 3,600 square feel.

4. A Group S-1 fire area used for the storage of commercial motor vehicles where the fire
area exceeds 3,600 square feet.

SECTION 803.2.10 “GROUP S-2" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 903.2.10 Group $-2.  An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout
buildings classified as parking garages where any of the following conditions exist:

1. Where the fire area of the enclosed parking garage, in accordance with Section 406.6 of
the California Building Code, exceeds 3,600 square feet.

2. Where the enclosed parking garage, in accordance with Section 406.6 of the California
Building Code, is located beneath other groups.

Exception: Enclosed parking garages located beneath Group R-3 occupancies.

3. Where the fire area of the open parking garage, in accordance with Section 406.5 of the
California Building Code, exceeds 3,600 square feet.

SECTION 903.2.10.1 “COMMERCIAL PARKING GARAGES" SHALL BE AMENDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 903.2.10.1 Commercial Parking Garages. An automatic sprinkler system shall be
provided throughout buildings used for storage of commercial motor vehicles where the fire
area exceeds 3,500 square feet.

23-1589 C 15 of 67



SECTION 803.2.22 “GROQUP B" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 903.2.22 Group B. An automatic sprinkler system shail be provided throughout all
buildings containing Group B occupancies where the fire area exceeds 3,600 square feef.

SECTION 803.2.23 “GROUP F-2" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Saction 903.2.23 Group F-2. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout aif
buildings containing Group F-2 occupancies where the fire area exceeds 3,600 square feet.

SECTION 903.6 “WHERE REQUIRED IN EXISTING BUILDINGS AND STRUCTURES” IS
AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 903.6 Where Required In Existing Buildings and Structures. An autornatic sprinkler
system shall be provided in existing buildings and structures where required in Chapter 11 and
as follows:

1. When there is a change in occuparncy classification that results in an increased life safety
or fire risk, as determined by the fire code official, and the structure exceeds 3,600
square feet, an automatic fire sprinkier system shall be installed throughout the building.

2. In existing buildings 3,600 square feet or greater, other than one and two-famify dwelling
units, and agricultural buildings not under special use permit for commercial purposes,
where the floor area of the building or structure is increased, such building or structure
shall be made to conform to Segfion 903.2.

Exception: When the building increase is less than 500 square feet.

3. In existing buildings 3,600 square feet or less, other than one-and two-family dwelling
units, and agricuftural buildings not under special use permit for commercial purposes,
where the fioor area of the building or structure is increased to a fotal square footage
over 3,600 square feet, such building or structure shall be made to conform o Section
903.2.

Exception: When the building increase is less than 500 square feef.

SECTION 807.2. “WHERE REQUIRED — NEW BUILDINGS AND STRUCTURES" SHALL BE
AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 907.2. Where Required — New Buildings and Structures. An approved fire alarm
system installed in accordance with the provisions of this code and NFPA 72 shall be provided
in new buildings and structures in accordance with Sections 907.2.1 through 907.2.2830 and
provide occupant notification in accordance with Section 907.5, uniess other requirements are
provided by another section of this code.

Not fewer than one manual fire alarm box shail be provided in an approved [ocation to initiate a
fire alarm signal for fire alarm systems empioying automatic fire detectors or water flow
detection devices. Where other sections of this code allow the elimination of fire alarm boxes
due to sprinklers or automatic fire alarm systems, a single fire alarm box shall be installed at a
location approved by the enforcing agency.

Exceptions:

23-1589 C 16 of 67



1. The manual fire alarm box is naot required for fire alarm control units systems
dedicated to elevator recall control, supervisory service and fire sprinkler
monitoring.

2. The manuail fire alarm box is not required for Group R-2 occupancies unless
required by the fire code official to provide a means for fire watch personnel to
initiate an alarm during a sprinkler system impairment event. Where provided, the
manual fire alarm box shall not be located in an area that is open to the public.

3. The manual fire alarm box is not required fo be installed when approved by the fire
code official.

4. A fire alarm system is not required in one and two-family dwellings, agricultural
buildings, and other occupancies classified as Group U not under special use
permit and/or not used for commercial purposes (e.g. retail sales, food service,
and/or special events).

5. Buildings with a floor area less than 500 square feet may be exempt, as determined
by the fire code official based on building construction material and features,
iocation, occupancy type, and distance to exposures.

SECTION 907.2.1.4 “GROUP A UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET” SHALL BE ADDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 907.2.1.4 Group A Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shall be
instalfed in alf group A buildings with a fioor area fess than 3,600 sguare feet.

SECTION 907.2.2.3 “GROUP B UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET" SHALL BE ADDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 907.2.2.3 Group B Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shall be
instafled in aff group B buildings with a floor area less than 3,600 square feet.

SECTION 907.2.3.11 "GROUP E UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET" SHALL BE ADDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 907.2.3.11 Group E Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shall
be instalted in all group E buildings with a floor area less than 3,600 square feet.

SECTION 907.2.4.1 “GROUP F UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET" SHALL BE ADDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 907.2.4.1 Group F Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shall be
installed in alf group F buildings with a floor area less than 3,600 square feet.

SECTION 907.2.5.2 “GROUP H UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET” SHALL BE ADDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 907.2.5.2 Group H Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shall be
installed in all group H buildings with a floor area less than 3,600 square feel.

23-1589 C 17 of 67



SECTION 907.2.6.6 “GROUP | UNDER 3.600 SQUARE FEET" SHALL BE ADDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 907.2.6.6 Group | Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shall be
instalied in ail group I buildings with a floor area less than 3,600 square feef.

SECTION 907.2.7.2 “"GROUP M UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET” SHALL BE ADDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 907.2.7.2 Group M Under 3,600 Square Feef. An approved fire alarm system shall be
installed in all group M buiidings with a floor area fess than 3,600 square feet.

SECTION 907.2.8.4 “GROUP R-1 UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET" SHALL BE ADDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 907.2.8.4 Group R-1 Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shall
be instalfed in all group R-1 buildings with a floor area less than 3,600 square feet,

SECTION 907.2.9.4 "GROUP R-2, R-2.1, R-2.2 UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET" SHALL BE
ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 807.2.9.4 Group R-2, R-2.1, R-2.2 Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm
systern shall be instafled in all group R-2, R-2.1, R-2.2 buildings with a floor area less than
3,600 square feet.

SECTION 907.2.10.1 "GROUP S UNDER 3,600 SQUARE FEET" SHALL BE ADDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 907.2.10.1 Group S Under 3,600 Square Feet. An approved fire alarm system shall
be installed in all group S buildings with a floor area less than 3,600 square feet.

907.2.30 "TYPE | HOOD INSTALLATIONS” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

907.2.30 “Type | Hood Installations. The requirement of installation, or replacement, of a Type
| Hood System shall require a fire alarm/sprinklfer monitoring system to be installed, or for the
hood system fo be connected fo an existing fire alarm/sprinkler monitoring system for that
building.

807.6.5 "MONITORING™ SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

907.6.5 Monitoring, Fire alarm systems required by this chapter or by the California Building
Code shall be monitored by an approved, UL certified, Type A Full Service central, proprietary
or remote station service, which gives audible and visual signals at a constanily attended
location. All sprinklered buildings shalf be monitored.
Exceptions:
1. One- and two-family dwellings (R-3 Occupancies and other occupancies classified as
u).

23-1589 C 18 of 67



2. Agricuftural buildings not under special use permit and/or not used for commercial
purposes (e.g., relails sales, food service, and/or special events).

SECTION 907.6.2.1 “SECONDARY POWER SUPPLY" SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

SECTION 907.6.2.1 SECONDARY POWER SUPPLY. Where required by the fire code official,
in accordance with NFPA 72, the secondary power supply providing a minimum 24-hour power
capacity under quiescent load (system operating in a non-alarm condition} shall be amended fo
a minimum 72-hour power capacity.

Exception: The existence of an emergency back-up power supply that meets or exceed
the requirements of California Fire Code Chapter 12.

SECTION 807.9 "WHERE REQUIRED IN EXISTING BUILDINGS" SHALL BE AMENDED A3
FOLLOWS:

SECTION 967.9 Where Required. An approved fire alarm system shall be provided in existing
buildings and structures where required in Chapter 11 and in existing buildings with a fioor area
fess than 3,600 square feet without an approved automatic sprinkler system, other than one- or
two-family dwelling units, agricultural building not under special use permit for commercial
purposes where a fire alarm detection system does not exist and the fioor area of the building or
structure is increased

Exception: When the building increase is less than 500 square feet.

Chapter 12
SECTION 1203.1.3 "INSTALLATION" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 1203.1.3 Installation. Emergency power systems and standby power systems shall be
installed in accordance with the California Building Code, the California Electrical Code, NFPA
110 and NFPA 111. Alf buildings, other than one- and two-family dwelling units, and agricultural
buildings not used for commercial purposes, with standby power, shail have a shunt trip device
that disconnects aill power saurces to the building, approved by the fire code official. Existing
installations shall be maintained in accordance with the original approval.

Chapter 33
SECTION 3311.3 “PREMISE IDENTIFICATION” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 3311.3 Premise Identification. Prior to and during construction, an approved address
sign shall be provided at each fire and emergency vehicle access road entry into the project.

SECTICN 3313.1 “WHEN REQUIRED” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 3313.1 When Required. An approved water supply for fire protection, either temporary
or permanent, shail be installed and maintained in continuous operation as soon as combustible
building materials arrive on site, the commencement of vertical combustible construction and on
installation of a standpipe system in buildings under construction, in accordance with Sections

3313.2 through 3313.5.

23-1589 C 19 of 67



Exception: The fire code official is authorized to reduce the fire-flow requirements for
isolated buildings or a group of buildings in rural areas or small communities where the

development of full fire-flow requirements is impragctical.

Chapter 50
SECTION 5001.7 “LIABILITY FOR DAMAGES” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 5001.7 Liability for Damages. Any damages or cost resulting from the negligence,
violation of the law, careless handling, spilf or discharge of any hazardous materials shalf
constitute debt against any such person, firm or corporation causing such spifl or discharge.
This debt is collectibie by the Fire Chief, or his/her duly authorized representative, in the same
manner as in the case of an obiigation under contract, expressed or implied.

Chapter 56
SECTION 5601.2 “PERMIT REQUIRED"” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 5601.2 Permit Required. Permits shall be required as set forth in Section 105.5 and
regulated in accordance with this section. Where fireworks permits are required, they shall be
issued by the Fire Chief, or his/her duly authorized representative, and the E! Dorado County
Board of Supervisors.

Chapter 57

SECTION 5704.2.9.6.1 “LOCATIONS WHERE ABOVE-GROUND TANKS ARE PROHIBITED”
SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

SECTION 5704.2.9.6.1 Locations Where Above-Ground Tanks are Prohibited. Storage of
Class | and Class |l flammable liquids in above-ground tanks outside of buildings is prohibited
within the limits established by law as the limits of districts in which such storage is prohibited.
Storage of Class I and Class If flammable liquids in above-ground tanks outside of buildings is
prohibited unless approved by the fire code official.

SECTION 5706.2.4.4 “LOCATIONS WHERE ABOVE-GROUND TANKS ARE PROHIBITED"
SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS :

SECTION 5706.2.4.4 Locations Where Above-Ground Tanks are Prohibited. The storage of
Class | and Class Il liquids in above-ground tanks is prohibited within the limits established by

law as the limits of districts in which such storage is prohibited. Storage of Class | and Class if
liquids in above-ground tanks is prohibited unless approved by the fire code official.

Chapter 58

SECTION 5806.2 “LIMITATIONS” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

23-1589 C 20 of 67



SECTION 5806.2 Limitations. Storage of flammable cryogenic fluids in stationary containers
outside of buildings is prohibited within the limits established by law as the limits of districts in
which such storage is prohibited. Storage of flammable cryogenic fluids in stationary containers
oulside of buildings is prohibited unless approved by the fire code official.

Chapter 61

SECTION 6104.2 “MAXIMUM CAPACITY WITHIN ESTABLISHED LIMITS" SHALL BE
AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

SECTION 6104.2 Maximum Capacity within Established Limits. Within the limits established
by law restricting the storage of liquefied petroleum gas for the protection of heavily populated
or congested areas, the aggregate capacity of any one installation shall not exceed a water
capacity of 2,000 gallons. The storage of liquefied petroleurn gas in excess of an aggregate of
2.000-gallon water capacity when located al least one-half (1/2) miie from property zoned or
designated for residential use and at least one-half (1/2) mile from existing residential
development with a density greater than one (1) dwelling unit per acre and at least cne-haff
(1/2) mile from any hotel or motei is allowed when approved by the fire code official, and a
special/conditional tse permit is issued by the County of El Dorado.

Dispensing within established limits. Within the limits established by law restricting the
dispensing of fiquefied petroleum gas for the protection of heavily popufated or congested
areas, the aggregate capacity of any one installation shall not exceed a water capacity of 2,000
gaflons. The dispensing of liquefied petroleum gas in excess of an aggregate of 2,000-galfon
water capacity when located at least one-half (1/2) mile from properly zoned or designated for
residential use and at least one-haif (1/2) mile from any hotel or motel is alfowed when
approved by the fire code official and a special/conditional use permit is issued by the County of
E! Dorado.

Section 6112 High Elevation Liquefied Petroleum Gas Installations (5,000

foot efevations and above) shalf be added as follows:

Any new LPG instailation shall comply with the following:

1. A permit is required by this Code for individual LPG containers of 125
gallons or greater. At the time of application by any person for a permit [0
install an LPG system as required by this Code, the applicant shall submit an
LPG plot plan to the District for approval and shall contain the following:

a. Stamp of approval of the prospective LPG supplier.

b. Tank location showing distances to structure and edge to edge of

pavement or other identifying mark.

23-1589 C 21 of 67



c. Tank capacity in US gallons.

d. Location of riser pipe af building.

e. Property boundaries.

f. An outline of alf existing/proposed buildings on the lot and a depiction of the

roof ridge fine of any building to be supplied with LPG.

2. Two stage reguiator systems shall be installed on all L PG installations in
accordance with manufacturer's instructions. All first stage regulators and
connecting pigtaifs shall be installed under a protective valve cover on the
tank. All requlators installed under this cover shall be listed and approved for
this use and position of mounting. A connector providing flexibility shall be
used to connect the first stage reguiator to the main service valve on the tank.

All copper pigtails shall be internally tinned and use only forged flare nuts.

3. The riser from the yard piping shall be a minimum of Schedule 80 and shalf be
located not more than 3 inches horizontalfy from the walls of the tank, and
swing joints wifl be used above and below tank level to provide for tank
movement (street elbows shall not be used). An approved flexible altemative is
preferred in lieu of rigid steel pipe for the tank riser. This shail include but not
be limited to plastic (PE), copper tubing, stainless steel. ALL FLEXIBLE
MATERIAL USED FOR THE TANK RISER SHALL BE SHEATHEQ IN AN
APPROVED STEEL COVER FOR PROTECTION. As swing joints are
eliminated in an approved flexible alfternative, sufficient slack must be
maintained to affow for tank movement and/or expansion and contraction of the
alternative material. All piastic pipe shail be buried at least 18" below finished
grade. An electrically continuous corrosion resistant {racer wire (min. A WG 14)
or tape shalf be buried with the plastic pipe to facilitate locating. One end shall

be brought above ground at the building wall or riser and the other end shall be

23-1589 C 22 of 67



brought above ground at the tank.

. The second stage regulator and riser pipe shall be installed on the gable end
of the building, as close as practical to the building wall, unless this is not
feasible due to structural or topographical constraints. An approved gas shutoff
valve rated for a minimum of 125 PSI shall be installed immediately prior to the
second stage regulator. An approved gas shut off sign or other identifier shall
be installed directly above the gas shut off valve, on the building in a visible
location within three (3) feet of the eaves of the roof or roof line if no eaves are
present. If the second stage reguiator or a combination first/second stage
regulator is used at the tank, then an approved gas shut off valve shall be
located at the building.

. A profective cover shall be installed over the second stage regulator and meter
(if installed) at the buitding. The minimum design for the protective cover shall
be equal to, or greater than, the Building Design Load (determined by the
building department), and shall be securely supported to the ground or
diagonally to the building wall. When supported to the ground, the footing for
the supports shall be found 6 inches below finished grade. Precast concrete
piers may be used in lieu of poured footings, provided they are placed on
stable soil. If second stage regulator/meter assemblies could be subject to
vehicle damage, then a minimum of 3" steel crash posts filled with concrete
shall be instalied for protection. Crash posts shall have a minimum depth in the
ground of 24", embedded in concrete.

Observation and inspection, if any, by the District shall not constitute an
approval of the work of installation of the aforementionad protective cover, nor
shall it be deemed to create any liability or responsibility on the part of the
District for the design or construction of the protective cover, nor to any third
party or entity whatsoever.

. The riser pipes for the yard piping shall not be embedded in concrete, asphalt
or other rigid substance. Such substance placed around a riser shall be held

back at least 3 inches from afi sides of the pipe. All exposed exterior gas piping

23-1589 C 23 of 67



used for runs along walls or roofs shalf be minimum schedufe 80 steel pipe
supported and secured by approved siraps at intervals not fo exceed four (4)
feet.

8. LPG tanks shall be permanently marked by a square or other approved equal
stake of wood or other material with a minimum dimension of 2" X 2" or a
cross sectional width of 2\ nominal lumber.

9. Such stakes shall be of sufficient height to rise above the anticipated snow
depth, with the minimum height being 10 feet. The snow stakes shall be yellow
in color and will be placed on the opposite side of the tank from the rises, and
directly opposite the tank vaives. The top twelve inches of the stake shall be
painted orange. The side of the stake adjacent to the tank shall continue with

the orange color a minimum of 18 inches from the top of the stake.

1 0. instaliation and maintenance of all tank stakes shall be the responsibility of
the LPG supplier. No tank shafl be filled or serviced uniess staked as provided
in this chapter,

11. Any supplier supplying propane to a tank must affix a label or other means of
identification to the inside of the tank valve protective cover. The label or other
device must be waterproof and contain the supplier's name and emergency
telephone number.

12, Alf LPG tanks shall be placed on approved concrete supports. Acceptable tank
supports shall include, but not be limited to: Precast reinforced concrete pads,
reinforced concrete siab, or precast reinforced concrete saddies. Use of
un-reinforced cinder building blocks is specifically prohibited. If saddies are
used they shalf contact a minimum of 110 degrees of the tank circumference.
Asphalt impregnated felt of not less than 3/8" thickness shalil be instatled
between the container and the concrete saddle. Support may be poured in
place in leu of prefabricated supports. if poured in place it shail be @ minimurm
of 4 inches thick and reinforced with not less than WWF 6X12, W16 by W26 or
4 #3 rebar in each direction. In areas where tanks may be subject to shifting

snow, unstable ground or other hazardous conditions, the Fire Chief may

23-1589 C 24 of 67



require additional tank support, securing or protection.

Section 6113 Underground LPG Tanks Installations and Ownership shall be
added as follows:
6§113.1 Permits and Plans. Permits shail be required, and plans shalf be

submitted for all underground tank instaflations as approved by the AHJ.

§113.2 Underground LPG Tank Ownership. Underground LPG tanks shall be
prohibited from being sold to end-users and shall be retained by the LPG company

under a lease-type system to ensure proper annual maintenance requirements are

met and

recorded.
Section 6114 Naturaf Gas shall be added as follows:

Existing natural gas installations shail comply with the following:

1. The meter assembly shall be installed on the gable end of the building, as
close as practical to the building wall, uniess this is not feasible due to

structural or topographical constraints.

2. A protective cover, designed to be equal to or greater than the Building Design
Load (determined by the building department), approved by the supplier, shall
be installed over the meter assembly, securely supported to the ground or

diagonally to the building wall.

When supported fo the ground, the footing for the supports shail be founded
6 inches below finished grade. Pre-cast concrete piers may be used in lieu

poured footings, provided they are placed on stable soil.

23-1589 C 25 of 67



Section 6115 Vicfations shall be added as follows:
61151 Violations. it shalf be uniawful for an LPG supplier to provide setvice fo
a LPG instalfation, which does not comply with the provisions in section 6112 or

6113.

6115.2 Failure to Provide Cover. Failure by the customer fo provide a cover as
required for a natural gas meter assembly is a violation of this code and will subject

the customer to a one hundred dollar (§100.00) fine.

Chapter 80

SECTION 80, NFPA 1-22, CHAPTER 22 “AUTOMOT!IVE WRECKING YARDS" IS ADOPTED.
AMENDED SECTIONS AS FOLLOWS:

Revise Section 22.3 as follows.

22.3 Fire department access roads shall be in accordance with the California Fire Code, Section
503 and Appendix D.

Add new Section 22.10 as follows:

22.10 Stored vehicles, boats, recreational vehicles, parts, and equipment shail not be stored
within 30 feet of adjacent property lines.

SECTION 80, NFPA, 13D-22 — "STANDARD FOR THE INSTALLATION OF SPRINKLER
SYSTEMS IN ONE-AND TWO FAMILY DWELLINGS AND MANUFACTURED HOMES" IS
AMENDED AS FOLLOWS: 903.3.1.3, 803.3.5.1.1

23-1589 C 26 of 67



NFPA 13D, Amended Sections as follows:

Add new Section 4.6 as follows:
4.6 Residential fire sprinkler systems installed in all new one-and two-family dweliings shall
utilize a “Passive Purge” system design unless otherwise approved by the fire code official.

Exception: Manufactured home installed, tested and approved by the California
Department of Housing and Community Development.

Revise Section 5.1.1.2 as follows:

5.1.1.2 A supply of at least one of each type and temperature sprinkler used within the premises
shall be maintained on the property at an approved location. Spare sprinkiers shall be kepfin a
mounted and accessible cabinet.

Revise Section 7.6 as follows:

7.6 A local audio/visual device activated upon water flow shall be provided on all fire sprinkier
systerns in homes at an approved location on the exterior of the dwelling.

Revise Section 11.2.1.1 as follows:

11.2.1.1 Where a fire department pumper connection is not provided, the system shall be
hydrostatically tested at a minimum pressure of 150 pounds per square inch gauge for no less
than 2 30-minute duration without evidence of leakage. Such a tost shafl be witnessed by the

fire code official.
Appendix B - Fire Flow Requirements for Buildings

TABLE B105.1(1) “REQUIRED FIRE FLOW FOR ONE- AND TWO-FAMILY DWELLINGS,
GROUP R-3, AND R-4 BUILDINGS AND TOWNHOUSES®” SHALL BE AMENDED AS

FOLLOWS:

TABLE B105.1(1) REQUIRED FIRE FLOW FOR ONE- AND TWO-FAMILY DWELLINGS,
GROUP R-3, AND R~4 BUILDINGS AND TOWNHOUSES

FIRE-FLOW AUTOMATIC MINIMUM | FLOW DURATION
CALCULATIO SPRINKLER SYSTEM FIRE-FLOW | {hours)
N AREA {Design Standard) {gallons per
{square feet) minute)
0 - 3,600 No automatic gprinkler | 1,000 1
system
3,601 and greater | No  automatic  gprinkler | Value in Taple | Duration in Table
| system B105.1(2) B105.1(2) 4t the

23-1589 C 27 of 67



required
rate

fire-flow

MAJOR SUBDIVISIONS (5 PARCELS OR GREATER)

Fire Code or Section
313.3 of the
Residential Code

CA

0-3,600 Section 903.3.1.3 of the CA | 1,000
Fire Code or Section
313.3 of the CA
Residential Code
3,601 and greater | Section 903.3.1.3 ofthe CA | 1/2 vailue of |

Table B105.1(2)
(min. 1000 GPM)

OTHER RESIDENTIAL DEVELOPMENT

0-3,600

Section 903.3.1.3 of the CA
Fire Code or Section
313.3 of the
Residential Code

CA

500

3,601 and greater

Section 303.3.1.3 of the CA
Fire Code or Section
313.3 of the
Residential Code

CA

1/2 value of Table
B105.1(2) (min.
750 GPM)

TABLE B105.2 "REQUIRED FIRE FLOW FOR BUILDINGS OTHER THAN ONE- AND
TWO-FAMILY DWELLINGS, GROUP R-3, AND R-4 BUILDINGS AND TOWNHOUSES"
SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

TABLE B105.2 REQUIRED FIRE FLOW FOR BUILDINGS OTHER THAN ONE- AND
TWO-FAMILY DWELLINGS, GROUP R-3, AND R-4 BUILDINGS AND

TOWNHOUSES
AUTOMATIC MINIMUM FIRE-FLOW | FLOW DURATION
SPRINKLER SYSTEM (gallons per minute) (hours)
{Design Standard)

No automatic sprinkier
system

i

Value in Table
B105.1(2)

Duration in Table B105.1(2)

Section 903.3.1.1 of the
CA Fire Code

25% of the value in
Table B105.1(2) ®

Duration in Table B105.1(2) at
the reduced flow rate

1

b. The reduced fire flow shall not be less than 1,500 GPM

Appendix D - Fire Apparatus Access Roads

23-1589 C 28 of 67




SECTION D103.1 “ACCESS ROAD WIDTH WITH A HYDRANT" SHALL BE AMENDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section D103.1 Access Road Width with a Hydrant. Where a fire hydrant is located on a fire
apparatus access road, the minimum road width shall be 26 feet (7925 mm), exclusive of

shoulders (see Figure D103.1}.
Exception: Driveways

SECTION D103.2 “GRADE" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

SECTION D103.2 Grade. Fire apparatus access roads and driveways shall not exceed 15.9%
in grade unless approved by the fire code official or by the Ef Dorado County amended
California Public Resource Code Title 14 / Design and Improvement Standards Manual,

SECTION D103.3 "TURNING RADIUS" SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

SECTION D103.3 Tuming Radius. The minimum turning radius shail be determined by the fire
code official; and shaill not include curb and gutier.

SECTION [03.5 “FIRE APPARATUS ACCESS ROAD GATES” SHALL BE AMENDED AS
FOLLOWS:

SECTION D103.5 Fire Apparatus Access Road Gates. Gales securing the fire apparatus
access roads shall comply with all of the following criteria:

1. Where a single gate is provided, the gate width shall be not less than 20 feet (6096 mm).
Where a fire apparatus road consists of a divided roadway, the gate width shall be not
less than 15 feet {3658 mm).

2. Gates shall be of the horizontal swing, horizontal slide, vertical lift, or veriical pivot type.
3. Construction of gates shall be of materials that allow manual operation by one person.

4. Gate components shall be maintained in an operative condition at all times and replaced
or repaired when defective.

5. Electric gates shall be equipped with a means of opening the gate by fire department
personnel for emergency access. Emergency opening devices shall be approved by the
fire code official.

6. Methods of locking shall be submitted for approval by the fire code official.
7. Electric gate operators, where provided, shall be listed in accordance with UL 325.
8. Gates intended for automatic operation shall be designed, constructed, and installed fo
comply with the requirements of ASTM F2200.
SECTION D103.6.1 “ROADS 20 TO 29 FEET IN WIDTH” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

SECTION D103.6.1 Roads 20 to 29 feet in width. Fire lane signs, as specified in Section
D103.6 shall be posted on both sides of fire apparatus access roads that are 20 to 29 fest wide

(6096 ta 8534.4 mm),

23-1589 C 29 of 67



SECTION D103.6.2 “ROADS MORE THAN 29 FEET IN WIDTH" SHALL BE AMENDED AS
FOLLOWS:

SECTION D103.6.2 Roads more than 29 feet in Width. Fire lane signs, as specified in
Section D103.6, shall be posted on one side of fire apparatus access roads more than 29 feet
wide (8534.4 mm) and less than 36 feet wide (10972.8 mm).

SECTION D104.4 “CIRCUMFERENTIAL FIRE APPARATUS ACCESS ROADS” SHALL BE
ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

SECTION D104.4 Circumferential Fire Apparatus Access Roads. When required by the fire
code official, a fire apparatus access road shali be constructed to encompass the entirety of a
structure and shall provide a continuous means of emergency vehicle access.

SECTION 4: CONFLICT
That Ordinance No. 2019-01 of the LVFPD and all other ordinances or parts of ordinances

herewith are hereby repealed.

SECTION 5: SEVERABILITY

If any Ordinance, article, subsection or subdivision thereof, provision, sentence, clause, or
phrase of this code, or any application thereof, is for any reason held to be invalid by a court of
competent jurisdiction, such decision shall not affect the remaining provisions of this code,
which can be given effect without the invalid portions and, therefore, such invalid portions are
declared to be severable. The LVFPD hereby declares that it would have enacted this
Ordinance and each of its articles, sections, subsections, or subdivisions thereof, provisions,
sentences, clauses, or phrases, irrespective of the fact that one or more of them is declared

invalid.

SECTION 6: EFFECTIVE DATE AND PUBLICATION
This Ordinance shall take effect thirty (30) days after its adoption. The LVFPD Board Secretary

is directed to publish this Ordinance in a newspaper of general circulation in the District. In lieu
of publication of the full text of the Ordinance, a summary of the Ordinance may be published by
the by the Board Secretary within fifteen (15} days after its passage and a certified copy shall be
posted in the office of the LVFPD pursuant to Government Code Section 36933(c) (1).

23-1589 C 30 of 67



The above Qrdinance will be introduced at a meeting of the Board of Directors of the LVFPD on
December 8, 2022, and it will then be read for the first time. A public hearing will be set for the

Ordinance to be read for the second time no earlier than 10 days after 1st reading, and

approved by the following vote:

PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of Directors of the LVFPD on the ) day of

m\um}/ . 2023,

AYES: >
NOES: O
ABSENT O
agsTAN: O

@Wﬁ'ﬂ/\

John Rice, Board Chairperson

ATTEST:

Lo Kaeds

{irene Kaelin, Board Secretary

23-1589 C 31 of 67



LAKE VALLEY FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT

RESOLUTION NO: 2022-01

A RESOLUTION OF THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS OF THE LAKE
VALLEY FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT ADOPTING FINDINGS
SUPPORTING AMENDMENTS TO THE CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE

A resolution for the Lake Valley Fire Protection District setting forth findings with
respect to local conditions within the Fire District which make certain modifications and
changes to the Califomia Fire Code reasonably necessary for preserving firc and life
safely in the Lake Valley Fir¢ Protection Districl.

The Governing Board of the Lake Valley Fire Protection District finds and
resolves as follows:

WHEREAS, Iiealth & Safety Code Section 17958.5 pennits a Firc Protection
District lo adopt an ordinance which changes or modifics the State Housing regulations
adopted pursuant to Health & Safety Code Scction 17922 upon a determination that such
changes or modifications are necessary due to local conditions that pertain regulations
governing conditions hazardous to life, property and the envirenmeni from fire,
explosion, hazardous materials and hazardous uses; and

WHEREAS, Health & Safety Code Section 17958.7 requires that a District's Board
of Directors making any changes or modifications pursuant to Health & Safety Code Section
17958.5 shall make an cxpress finding that such changes or modifications arc needed;
and shall file a copy of such changes or modifications with the Department of Housing
and Conununity Development; and

WHEREAS, the unique loeal climalic, geological, and topographical conditions
existing within the boundaries of the Thstrict make it reasonably necessary for the
District to impose more stringent requircments than set forth in the California Fire Code
and pursnant to California Health and Safety Codc sections 13869.7 and 17958.7, the
District desires to make express findings to that effect; and

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that thc 3oard of Dirsctors of the
Lake Valley Fire Protcction District, after having duly noticed and held public hearings,
herehy adopts the following findings concerning current unique local condifions that
together make each modification to the California Fire Code, reasonably necessary to
provide adequatc and cffective protection of life, property and the environment more

specitically set forth as follows:

23-1589 C 32 of 67



SECTION 2: FINDINGS OF FACTS

in connection with the amendments enacted by Section 2 and 3 relating to
the California Fire Code and its appendix, 2022 edition, the LAKE VALLEY
FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT (LVFPD) makes the following findings
pursuant to Health and Safety Code Section 17958.5, 17958.7, and
18941.5. The changes are reasonably necessary because of local climatic,
topographical, or geclogical conditions.

LVFPD hereby adopts, pursuant to Section 18941.5 of the California
Health and Safety Code, the following findings of fact:

{a) Under this adopting ordinance, specific amendments have been
established which are of a mare restrictive nature than those adopted by the
State of California (State Buildings Siandards Code, State Housing &
Community Development Codes), commonly referred to as Title 24 & Title
25 of the California Code of Regutations. The LVFPD has recognized these
amendments to the California Fire Code 2022 edition to address the fire
problems, concerns, and future direction by which LVFPD can establish and
maintain an environment that will afford a level of fire and life safety to all
who live and work within its boundary.

(b} The International Code Council has assumed responsibility for the
International Fire Code and intermational Fire Code Standards. The
International Code Council provided a means for participation by all code
enforcement officials  from throughout the country and industry
representatives, consultants, and other private parties interested in the
International Fire Code.

{(c) The Internationat Fire Code, being the 2021 edition thereof,
published by the International Code Council, is a nationally recognized
compilation of proposed rules, regulations, and standards of said
Association,

(d) Said International Fire Code has been printed and published as a
Code in book form within the meaning of Section 50022.1 of the
Government Code of the State of California.

(e) Under Section 18941.5 of the Health and Safety Code, local
amendments are based on climatic, topographical, and geological
conditions. The findings of fact herein address each of these situations and
present the local situation, which, either singularly or in combination,
caused the aforementioned amendments to be adopted.

Page 1 of 10

23-1589 C 33 of 67



2022 CFC FINDINGS

LOCAL CONDITIONS

A. These amendments are justified on the basis of a local climatic
condition. LVFPD is subject to precipitation, relative humnidity,
temperature extremes, and high velocity winds.

1. Precipitation & relative humijdity

a. Conditions

Precipitation. Annual precipitation fluctuates greatly.
Approximately 90 - 95 percent of the precipitation occurs
during the months of November through April, and 5 - 10
percent oceurs from May through October. This area has
experienced major droughts in the recent past; one in
1977 - 1978, one which started in 1989 and lasted into 1994,
others from 19992004, and 2006-2004, Droughis gontinue to
cyele to this day. Electrical storms are frequent and are usvally
accompanied by little rainfall, potentially creating numerous
lightning caused fires. Snow storms, loss of access and
avalanches are routine. Heavy winter snows are responsible
for delays in response and access to buildings and patieits at
emergency scenes. Winter snow storms along with heavy tourist
traffic routinely bring all community traffic lo a standstill
during weekends and holidays.

Relative Humidity. During the months of June through
September, the daily humidity ranges around 30 percent, and
often drops to the low teens. Low rclative humidity have
allowed for greater spread of wildfires and caused structure
fires to readily spread to the wildland interface

Temperatures. During the months of June through
September, daily temperatures exceed 70 degrees to 90
degrees Fahrenheit. Winter temperatures can drop
to below O degrees Fahrenheit. The highest rccorded
temperatuwre was 99 degrees Fahrenheit in 1988 with
the lowest being negative 13 degrees Fahrenheit
February of2019.

Page 2 of 10

23-1589 C 34 of 67



Winds. Prevailing winds are out of the south and southwest.
However, north and cast winds occur during the spring (May
through June), the fall (late September and October), and
occasionally during the summer months. Wind velocitics
generally range from five to fifteen miles per hour, gusting to
thirty miles per hour during the summer months

SUMMARY

These local climatic conditions affect the community's acceleration,
intensity and size of a fire. Times of little or no rainfall and high
temperatures create extremely hazardous conditions, mainly
residential roof fires and wildfire conflagrations. The climatic
conditions are one of the most significant impacts to fire behavior and
other major emergency gvents due fo their uncontrollable nature.

These amendments are justified based on local geologic and
topographic conditions, LVFPD is subject to terrain, slopes, increased
vegetation, surface fealures, hazardous building operations, and
terrain risk factors.

1. Geological locaticn
a. Conditions
Geological Location. The fire environment of a community is
primarily a combination of two factors: the physical geographic
charactcristics of the area and the historic pattern of development. These

two factors create a mixture of environments that ultimately determines
the area's fire protection needs.

The Lake Valley Fire Protection District provides fire prevention, fire
protection, advanced emergency medical and rescue services for

unincorporated El Dorado and Alpine County areas within the Lake Tahoe
Basin.

The Lake Valley Fire Protection District serves 85 square miles via Station
7. located at 2211 Keetak, Station 6, located at 1286 Golden Bear Trail. Station 5

located at 1009 Boulder Mountain Court is staffed by Calfire via a lease
agreement with the District.

Page 3 of 10

23-1589 C 35 of 67



The Lake Valley Fire Protection District service area includes: California State
Highway 50 from Camp SacramentoT to the City of South Lake Tahoe
boundary; California State Highway 89 South from Alpine County Willow
Creek Road to California State Highway 50 in Meyers.

Extending along California State Highway 89 North, the Fire District
extends from the Northern boundary of the City of South Lake Tahoe {West
Way) 10 Eagle Creek in Emerald Bay.

The service area has a varied topography and vegetative cover. It has
relatively flat areas afong the shorcline of Lake Tahoe along Pope and
Baldwin Beach areas (6225 feet at Lake level), Steep hills and mountain
pezks ever 10,000 feet are part of the Tahoe Basin. The most prominent
peak in the fire District is Mount Tallac at 8§735. Vegetative cover
ranges from stands of manzanita to dense forests of fir and pine trees.

The main commercial areas are in Meyers and Tahoe Paradise along the
highway 50 corridor. Businesses as well as the California Agricultural
Station, the Meyers Blementary School, two golf courses and the local
Tahoe Paradise Park are in this area.

Neighborhoods in the vicinity of Pioncer Trail include: Elks Club, Golden
Bear, Cold Creck, High Meadow, Black Bart, Kokanee Trail,
Monigomery Estates, Washoan. This corridor also includes the Sievra
House School and the South Tahoe Public Utilities District worl sites.

The neighborhoods of North Upper Truckee, Echo View Estates,
Mountain View Estates, and Tahoe Mountain werc affecied by the Angora
Fire of 2006 with the loss of 254 homes. The area secs significant traffic delays
due fo tourist travel and is highly prone to heavy snows,

The neighborhoods of South Upper Truckee and Christmas Valley off of
both State Highway 50 at Echo Summit and State Highway 89 to Alpine
County also suffer traffic delays from tourist travcl and heavy snows. Echo
Summit, via State Highway 50, is a funnel for traffic congestion and
highly prone to winter avalanches.

Page 4 of 16

23-1589 C 36 of 67



The State Highway 89 corridor, north to Emerald Bay, is the most heavily
traveled road in the Lake Tahoe Basin. Of the estimated 20 million
tourists visiting the Tahoe Basin annually, roughly 4.9 million stop to take
a picture of Emerald Bay. This busy highway runs through Camp
Richardson Resort, Pope, Kiva and Baldwin Beaches and USFS historic
sitcs. Traveling north the Mount Tallac trailhead, access to Fallen Leaf
Lake, the Cascade Lake and residential area, the Spring Creek summer
residential areas are passed along the way to Inspiration Point and
Gmerald Bay, Vikings Holm and the Eagle Falls Creek. The Fire District
extends along State Highway 50, over Echo Summit on the west side of
the Sierrs crest to the Echo Snow Park- Adventure Mountain and Siemra at Tahoe Ski
Resort. Additionally the District serves the hamiets of Litile Norway, the
Mount Ralston Subdivision, Echo Lakes, Philips, Sierra Pines, Bryan

Creek, Tamarack Park, Sayies Canyon and Camp Sacramento.

Due to the remoteness of the communities and recreational arcas of
Strawberry, Twin Bridges, HorseTail Falls, Lover's Leap and the 38 mile
tract, Lake Valley Fire District personnel are called to serve these areas
within the El Dorado County Fire Protection District.

Seismic Location.

The relatively young geological processes that created the Tahoe Basin are
still active. The district's entire land surface is in the high-to-moderate seismic hazard
zones.

Size and Population.

The District covers 85 square miles with a population of 13,000, swelling to
over 100,000 during the summer months. The District has 3 fire stations;
two staffed by 22 safety personnel and onc (1) fire station via Cal fire
conlract. The District has four (4} Chiel Officers, including the Fire Chief,
one {1) Fire Prevention Technician, one (1) Mechanic/Fleet Manager and
one (1) Administrative Manager. Overall, there 29 fire total District
personnel. The District oversight is via the five (5) members of the Fire
Board ot Diractors.

Page 5 of 10

23-1589 C 37 of 67



Roads and Streets.

Many roads are sub-standard; narrow widths, on-street parking, less than 20 feet of
unobstructed pavement and ingress and egress issues during peak population
fluctuations. Some areas are served by single lane roads, severely restricting
emergency vebicles.

Topography.

The topography of the District varies from near level to terrain in excess of a 40
percent slope. As a rule of thumb, the rate of fire spread doubles as the slope
percentage doubles, all other factors remaining the same. Most residential and
commercial structures are in, or are surrounded by forested areas. Due to drought,
beetle infestations, and heavy vegetation, many the area have dead or dying
trees, contributing to fire danger. Elevation ranges from about 6200 feet at
lake level to over 7200 feet on mountain pass roads with peaks exceeding

9000 feet in elevation.

Vegetation.

Vegetation in the Fire District varies from sub-alpine forests of aspen and pine to pine
and cedar forests, with substantial brush fields of manzanita, snow brush, and white thorn.
Residential development in the Fire District is generally concentrated in heavily
forested areas. This situation allows fire to travel easily from home to home, forest 10
home, or home to forest by radiation, convected heat and/or flying embers Often
dwellings are completely surrounded by highly combustible vegetation, compounding
the fire problem.

SUMMARY

The above climatic, geological, and topographical conditions increase
the magnitude, exposure, accessibility problems, and fire hazard the
District must handle. As an example, fire following an earthquake has
the potential to cause greater loss of life and damage to property than
an earthquake itself. Wildland fire has seen some significant changes
in spread dynamics due to drought and fire history in the area.

CONCLUSION

Local climatic, geographic and topographic conditions described above increase the
frequency, intensity, and size of fires involving buildings in the Fire District. Further,
these conditions impact potential damage to structures from an earthquake and
subsequent fire. Theretore, it is reasonably necessary that the California Fire Code be
modified to mitigate the effects ol the above conditions. Page 6 of 10

23-1589 C 38 of 67



2022 CFC Code Section Tidle Adopted | Amended | Added | Deleted Finding
103.6.24 Tents X Administrative
106.1-106.4 [Construction X Administrative
Documents
07 1 Fees X Administrative
107.5 Relaled Fees Administrative
107.5.1 ICost Recovery Administrative
197.6 Refunds X Administrative
107.7 dministrative Adminisirative
ICosis
Section 108 Ingpeclions X Administrative
|Section 109 Maintenance X Administrative
l111.5 Appeals Administrative
[112.4 Violation X il
: Administrative
| Penalties
1241 Abalcment of X iy
; : Administrative
Viclations
1124.2 Citations Administrative f
Section 113 Slop Work
Ll " i Administrative l
Order |
113, Failure to X .
J 2 ,c Administrative l
Comply |
|
I Sect Unsaf
Section 114 nsafe X A st
Structures
202 Definitions X Administrative |
Section 302 Definitions Administrative ’
Section 303 Asphalt Kettles 1AL, A2. A3, Bl, B2. B3. B34,BS
ies
3023 Definitions X Administrative
Section 304 Combustible X Al, A2, A3.Bl, B2, B3. B4,BS
Waste B

23-1589 C 39 of 67



2022 CFC Cade Section Title Adopted | Amended ) Added | Deleted Finding
Scetion 305 [gnition Sources X Al, A2, A3,Bl, B2. B3. B4, BS
136
Section 306 Motion Picture X I, B2. B3, B4.BS, B6
Section 307 Open Burning X Al A2, A3, Bl, B2. B3, B4,BS,
86
30744 Open Burning Al, A2, A3.Bl, B2. B3. B4,BS,
136
Section 308 Open Flames X Al, AZ,A3,BIl, B2. B3. B4,BS,
Ins
Section 309 Powered X Al A2, A3, Bl, B2. B3. B4, B35,
Industrial 136
Trucks
Section 310 Smoking X Al A2, A3, Bl, B2. B3, 34, BS)
86
Section 311 Vacant Premises X AL, A2, A3, Bl, B2. B3. B4.BS,
B&
Section 320 BD Pr'intinﬁ_g X Bl, B2. B3. B4, BS,B6
Section 321 Artificial X Al, A2.A3,Bl, B2, B3. B4,BS
Vegetation Bé
t03.2- 403.24 Group A X liAl, A2, A3, Bl, B2. B3. B4, B35,
B6
403.6- 403.6.1.4 Group F X Al, A2, A3, Bl, B2. B3. B4, BS]
B6
3.9~ 403,934 Group R X Al, A2 A3,BIl, B2, B3. B4, BS|
B6
503.2.1 Dimensions X [Al, A2, A3, Bl B2. B3. 34,08
B6
303.2.5 Dead Ends X 1AL AZ, A3, Bl, B2. B3. B4,BS.
B6
503.2.6 Bridges X Al, A2.A3.Bl B2. B3. B4, BS
B6
503.3.1 No Parking- 1A1, A2, A3,Bl, B2. B3. B4,BS5.
Firc Lancs Bé
503.3.2 No Parking- Al, A2, A3, B, B2.B3. B4,BS
Fire Hydrants B6

23-1589 C 40 of 67



2022 CFC Code Section Title Adopred | Amended | Added | Delered Finding
503.3.3 Fire Lane Width Al A2.A3,Bl, B2, B3. B4,8S,
B6
503.6 Security Gates X il, A2, A3, Bl, B2. B3. B4,BS.
IBé&
505.1 Address X AL, A2, A3.Bl, B2, B3. B4,BS
IB6
507.5.1 Where Required X Al, A2, A3, Bl, B2, B3. B4,BS,
- Fire Hydrants B6
509.3 Fire Controel Bl, B2. B3. B4, B5,B6
Rooms
30752 Group E X Bl, B2. B3. B4, BS, B6
903.2 Where Reguired X Al A2, A3, Bl, B2, B3. B4, BS,
Fire Sprinklers B6
903.2.1.1 Group A X 1Al, A2, A3, Bl, B2, B3. B4, BS,
B6
903.2.1.2 Group A-2 X Al A2, A3, Bl, B2. B3. B4, B8
B6
903.2.1.3 Group A-3 X Al, A2, A3.8I1, B2. B3. B4, BS1
B6
903.2.14 Group A-4 X Al, A2, A3, Bl, B2. B3, B4,BS
B6
003.2.3 Group IX X Al. A2, A3,Bl, B2, B3. B4.BS
Bo
903.2.4 Group F-1 X Al, A2, A3, BI, B2. B3. B4, BS.
Bé6
903.2.7 Group M X 1AL, AZ, A3.Bl, B2. B3 B4.BS.
B6
903.2.7.2 Group M- X Al A2, A3, Bl, B2. B3. B4, DS,
Mattresses B6

23-1589 C 41 of 67



R Code Sectivn Title Adopied | Amended | Added § Deleted Finding
QU3.2.8.5 Manufactured [Al, A2, A3, Bl B2,
Homes B3, B4, B5,B6
90329 Group 5-1 X Al A2, A3 Bl, B2. B3 B84,BS,
B6
905.2.10 Group §-2 X IVAI-AZ, A3, Bl B2. B3. B4.BS
36
903.2.10.1 Parking Garages X 1AL A2, A3, BL B2. B3, B4, BS)
B6
22 Ciroup B AL A2 A3 BL B2, B3. B4. BS:
B6
903.2.23 Group F-2 [AL A2, A3, I, B2, B3. B4, BS,
B6
where Required X FAL A2, A3, Bl B2. B3. B4, B5;
Fire Sprinklers Bo6
H07.2 Vhere Required X AL A2, A3.Bl, B2. B3. B4, BS,
Firc Alarm B6
Systems
907214 Group A Al A2 A3.DBl, B2, B3. B4.BS
B6
Croup B AlL A2, A3 Bl B2. B33 B4,BS&
B6
I Group 2 Al AZ A3 Bl B2 B3 B4, BSr
B6
1 Group F-1 1AL, A2, A3. BL, B2. B3. B4.BS|
1B6
W)7.2.5.2 Group 11 1AL AZ. A3 Bi. B2. B3. 34, BS,
Bo
J07.2.6.6 Group | IAlLL A2, A3 BL B2, B3 B4.8S
B6
907.2.7.2 Group M AL, A2, A3 Bl B2. B3, B4, BS
B6
2.8.4 Group R-1 IAL A2, A3, Bl B2. B3. B4.BS|

186

23-1589 C 42 of 67



(2022 CPE Code Section 1irle Adopted | Amended | Added | Deleted Finding
%07.294 Group R-2, R- iAl, A2, A3, Bl. B2. B3. B4, B3.
2.1,R-22 |Bs
907.2.10.1 Group S 1AL, A2, A3.BL B2. B3. B4, BS]
B6
907.2.30 Type 1 Hoods Bl, B2. B3. B4, B5, B6
907.6.3 Maonitoring X Bl, BZ. B3. B4, BS, B6
‘907.6.2.1 Secondary Powe] [ALL A2, A3, B, B2. B3. B4,B5
I Supply B6
1907.9 Where Required X Al A2, A3, Bl, B2. B3. B4,BS3,
I L Fire Alarm Bé
Saction | 101 General X Al A2, A3, Bl. B2. B3. B4, B35,
Bé
Section 1102 Definitions X AL A2, A3.BIl, B2. B3, 34,B5/
Bé
111032 Responder X Al A2, A3, Bl, B2, B3. B4, B4,
: Communication B6
1103.5- 1103.5.5 Sprinkler X Al, A2, A3,Bl, B2. B3. B4,B5
Systems B6
1103.7 -1103.7.6.10 Fire Alarm X Al, A2, A3, Bl B2. B3. B4, B5i
Systems B6
§103.8 -1103.8.5.3 Smoke Alarms X iAl, A2, A3. Bl B2. B3, B4, B3,
B6 f
1103.9 -1103.9.1 Carbon X Al A2, A3 Bl, BZ. B3. B4, BS,
Monoxide Ba
Alarms |
Section 1104 Egress X Bl1, B2. B3. B4, B5,.B6 |
Section 1106 Outdoor X Al A2, A3.Bl, B2. B3. B4, B5,]
Cperations B6 E
11203.1.3 Installation X IAL AZ, A3, Bl, B2. B3. B4, BS|
| B6 |
3311.3 Address X IAl,A2, A3,Bl, B2. B3. B4, BS'
B6 |
3313.1 When Required - X IAL.A2, A3, BI, B2, B3. B4, B3

Water Supply |

B&

23-1589 C 43 of 67



2022 CFC Code Section Title Adopred | Amended | Added | Deleted Finding
Liabili
A {atEydac Administrative
Damages
5601.2 Permit Required X Administrative
5704.2.9.6.1 Locations- X A, A2, A3, Bl B2, B3. B4,B5
IAhove Ground 36
Tanks
5706.2.4.4 Locations - X Al A2, A3, Bl, B2. B3. B4, B5,
Abave Ground B6
Tanks
5806.2 Limitations X FAI,A}I, A3.Bl, B2, B3. B4,B5,
Bs
6104.2 Maximum X [Al, AZ, A3, Bl, B2. B3, B4,B5,
Capacity 131
6112 High X i P o .
: Climalic, Administrative,
Elevation- .
. Geologicul
L.PG
6113.1 Permits X Climatic, Administrative,
and Plans Geologieal
6113.2 LPG- X Climatic, Administrative,
Own Geological
6114 Natural X Climatic, Administrative,
Gas Geological
6115.1 Viclations X Climatic, Administrative,
Geological
61152 Failure to X e - ,
; Climatic, Administrative,
provide :
Geological
gover
Chapter 80 Referenced X Al,AZ,A3.Bl, B2, B3. B4,B5.
Siandards B6
Appendix B Fire Flow - X [Al,A2.A3.Bl, B2. B3. B4,
Table B105.1 (1) Residential B3,B6
Appendix B Firc Flow - X Al, A2,A3,Bl. B2. B3. B4, B5,
Table B105.2 Commercial Bé
Appendix D Fire Apparatus X Al, A2, A3,Bl, B2. B3. B4,B5,
Acccss Roads B6
Appendix D, Access Road X Al, A2, A3,Bl, BZ. B3. B4.B5
DI103.1 Width Beé
Appendix D. Grade X Al A2, A3, Bl B2 B]. B4, B3]
D103.2 B6

23-1589 C 44 of 67



Appendix D, Turning Radius JAlL A2, A3,Bl, B2, B3. B4, B3]
D103.3 Bé

Appendix D, Gates A1, A2, A3.Bl. B2. B3. B4, B5|
12103.5 Bé

Appendix D, Fire Lane TAl, A2, A3, Bl, B2. 33. B4, B5.
D103.6.1 Marking Bé6

Appendix D. Firc Lane 1A1, A2, A3, Bl, B2. B3. B4.B3
D103.6.2 Marking Bo6

Appendix I, Circumferential TIAL A2, A3, Bl B2. B3, B4,
D104.4 Fire Access B5,

B6

23-1589 C 45 of 67



LAKE VALLEY FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT

INTRODUCED at a regular meeting of the Board of Directors of the Lake
Valley Fire Protection District on December §, 2022,

PASSED AND ADOPTED at a regular meeting ot the Board of
Directors of the Lake Valley Fire Protection District on January 5, 2023 by
the following roll call vote:

Aye: Nay: Abslain
Jotn
U‘i& | Rice
B E ' " Brian B
N {ogan
Leona
J‘l? Allen
o, - . | I
m Sitton
7 ' lrene B
‘ T Kaelin
VOTE ON PASSAGE: Aye 5 NayZ?  Absting?) Present (2
John Rice, Board Chair IRl Q _
Signature

I, Irene Kaelin, Secretary 1o the Board, do hereby certify that the Jorcgoing Resotution
No. 2022-02 was voted upon and approved by a najority vote of the Board, on the 5 day
of Jannary 2023; and I further certifir the compliance with the Codified Resolutivn and
tre Laws of the Bourd,

_ T Kaeles

Secretary

23-1589 C 46 of 67



Whatls the Change?

Amend with the name of the jurisdicton

Amended

bcally E

amended Administrative need
v o ”‘““w““‘w Wk | cally adopted andamended | Adrministrfive need due to addHion of section 105555,
Allows the fire code official fo enforca the fire code (specific
1o fire access, vegetstion clearances, hazamious materials,
Add section to require opersional permit for : : :
105.5.55 focally created and edopled gic.). withn ausmebile wreckng yard operatons. This was
Automobite Whecking Yards. a demonsiraled need experienced wihin the Oiamond
Springs Fire Department.
Add section to require consiructicn permit for Administrative need due ke addifion of section 105.6.25 and
M54 Automobile Wrecking Yands. boally credled andadopled 5 ¢ 35,
Allows the fire code official fo enforee the fire code (specific
Add section to require consiruction permit far o fre acoass, vegetafion clearances. hazardous matertals,
Ho3eas Automobile Wrecking Yards. Locally created andadopted | ) ivin newly constructed andior modifiad automoblie
Allows the fire codg officiat to review and approved taffic
calming devices prior %0 installation. Fire Cada curently
105.6.26 mmszm it Locally crogted and acepied | permits the fire coce officil 1 reguiste kalfic calming
dlevices. However, a permit isn't cumently required prior 1o
Installation causing undue hardship to
l Adapiing this seclion toallow for the creation and issuance
: of foes fo cover actual costs. Secton 105.6 defires pemaits,
1075 Section Added. Previously secioni6.6. Locally adopted and amended plan checiks, and inspections s allowed inHealth 8Safety
Code 1795]. RN o
10751 Secion added. Pravously seclion 1066.4 Localy cresed ndacoplad | seeron 10701 Cast Recovery Foes Toracover thcost o
’ Section 107.7 To recover theachual costs of avoidable
1017 Section added, Previously sedtion 106.7 Locally craated and adoptad faled n Syeniin
Section 111.5 siChapter 1 cf LheFire Code of the Distictis
added fo read as follows:
111.5 Appea! Procedures and Timelines: The intent of this
provision is tp clarlfy the procedures and imelinas foran
1115 Secten added. Previously seclion 1094 Locally sdopled andamended | ndividual orentity o file an appeal o the Board of Appeals
regarding an ordar, dec'sion, or determination by tha Fire
Code Official. Based on the Courty of £ Dorado's
Vegeation Management Ordinance Board of Appesls’
timeine, ‘
\
Is by seciion 110.4. Compleled the section by Akmlﬁeﬂ:ir;fmmglhmmﬁmmdem
filing in the blank portions that were not completed poiucks o 5 m‘”“’: o how fioh spditat o
1124 by the SFH. 1t s betier oht o Socallies to cetemmine Loeally adapled and amended malch fhe fees and panalties as deemed approprate by the
e G ; District Attormey's Office. The change to the language 1o
the feesfpenalties for fheir respective areas N tha leemiiiactons.
| 112.4.2 Clations is added % read as foliows; 112.4.2
Citaticns
TheFire Chief or histher duly autharized representative(s),
1124 ; 2 may Issue cifations for Infractions ormisdemeanor
123 Socioryiced. Sreaday saor (14 Locallycreatedandadopted 4 1ot of this code pursuant o Section 13871 of the
Health and Safety Code of the Stale of California and
Chapter Sc (coramencing with section 853.8) of Titie 3 of
Part 20f the Penal Code of the Stale of California.
Previausly section 1124, Completed the section by
filing i the blank portions hat wers not completed E
1134 by the SFM. ltis betiar leR tolocalities o Localy adogled and amended | A ioiafions of the cude hewve been consoldsted under

| datermine the fess/penalties for thelr reepective

lamas

Section 112.4 toinclude tha penallies for viglations.

23-1589 C 47 of 67




Added dafinitions for: Camplira, Drivewsay, Districl,
Execulive Body, Fire Chief, Fire Hazard, Open Suming, and

202 Added definltions for clarty Locally created and adopled Crowd Manager. Definition of open buming shall
notinclude residentlel LPG, natural gas fuelsd, orwood
burning appliancas nor ceremonial burning,

302.1 Added definition ef campfire to Secfon Lacely creaied and adopted | Added definttion for clariy.
-l Ll Due fothe high ire danger that existsin E Dorado County
307.4.4 Larguegn gl g i Localy creeled and adopied (we hove wiitten more stfagent rules perlalning 1o open fires
encompass full scope of open burning withingrass, brssh, and tree covered areas.
requirements.
. Provides the creation of a floor plan for the purpose of
40121 Aled secon o mepes pre-fie plins for asw locally reatied end adopted [emeryency planning to be ullized by emergency tesponse
andor medified congtruction. persannel.
Fire apparatus are becoming larger and mller. A verlical
clezrance of 15 faet provides proper clearance for
apparaius fo pass under without damaging apparafus
compaonents. also allows an extended tme frame before
having torecut the growth of the vegetstion. Additiona!
50321 a;;’#e‘: V;'gz’jemm lo15foet and road Locally adopiad and amended | heiht forvenetsiion clearances acts asan increased buffor
e forithe spread of e, Afoad width of 20 faet exclusive of
shoulders, as measured face of curb o face of curbis
needed, Thasa siructures can be difficult tonavigate with
fire apparatus and should not be counted In the total
drivable road surface,
P — Fire apperalus require areas for tuming around when
F‘ireCo?teandTmTF‘gg::e Regulations ::‘e misticle vehicies are on the s0ene of an emergency, This
5032.5 h 85 ey require fumarmunde ordre locally adopted and amended  |inciudes fire vehicles as wall ascivillan vehicles, Provides
i mr:‘"; ariiays apperas hetter access for ingressiegress. Addiionally, adds fum
around for apparaius in driveways greater than 157,
Allows codes and slandards for Bridges and Elevated
Changed the section for Bridges and Elevated Surfaces of Ei Donado County and Appsndix Defthe
Surfaces tostate and match Ei Dorado County ] cumrent Fire Cods, whicheveris more resflictive, to be
503.2.6 Transportation Dhision in addifon toMSHTO HB | LCCaly adopted and amenced | coiory throughout county agendes and s alowed 350
17 (minirmum CFC required) allemate means & method thal isnot less restrictive than
the Fire Code.
Freviously section 503.4.2. Added seclion regarding This section clearly defines the "No Parking in Fire Lanas’
- na parking infire lanes Localy crealed and adopted | o a1y ia consistent with the Callforia Vehioia Code.
; This section clearty defines the “No Parking in frontof fire
Previously seclion 503.4.3, Added section regarding s &
503.32 o parking Infront of rydrants Locally created and adopted mm" nes andls consistent with the Cafifomia Vehicle
) ! i This secfion clearty defines Caiifomia Fire Code Appendix D
Previously section 503.4.4. Added section regardi !
503.33 ﬁmTa:l\eibas edn e d:‘\ Secion fegardng Locally created and adopled as the reference formad lane width and their refation 1o fira
g;;‘g";sowm:?ﬂnrngf'& Croaiad and adopked Hlows fire districts the authority to approve gates on
X rgency access and 1 onthe Distict's gwe sindend, providing
503.6 consistency throughall roaciway gates In El Dorado Locally created and adopiad Rkl provic
County, refaring to the gate standards adopted by e Mmm e s
theFPQO's respanse times.
Added secfion pertzining lothe visual addressing of Allows fire districts the aulhodity b approve addressing
o buidings Localy adopted and amended | . an the Distrct's addressing standards.
) Commendial properias are requined loinstall hydrants at
Added more consarvative standard for the +
507.5.1 placernent of hydrans and theic refaionship 1 Localy adopted and amended | 200 foatintervals, hus they should never be autside of 150

cemmercial buildings

foet frem any given hydrant at amytime (haif the distance

inbeween).

23-1589 C 48 of 67




Added verbiage to bring all of he necassary fire

Bufldings are getling mora szable in the county. IEismore
commen o have new buildings with solar arays that
centinue o genemis powsr even whan the bulldings
general utififles have bean shut off. When thera isan

5093 Localy created and adopted emergency, Lisvital that we have rapid acesss o all of the
cantrols for abulding to one location controls i one kocation for public evacuation and firefighter
safety. Due to the fire danger prasent in ElDurade County
throughout most of the year, this change isapproprats and
advisable.
Emergency Responder Radio System Sacondary Amend i 72hour capacity for back-UP power dua o
510423 Powar Supply Modification Localy edopled and amended | 00 and PGAE safaly related power outages.
Adds arequirement for sprinkler system instaliation .
2032 innewbulldings and struciures 3,600 square feelor|  Locally sdopted and amended f“,aa"g;‘:‘“"”d 00 o x5 of section W2.2.22 and
greater whhin the distric 1
Due tothe topographic, climatic, and gecgraphic congitions
A of ElDorade County and thelr contributing faciors. loour
Previousty Mﬂ:‘ :Eéz.t_ Ad::;::qeuimmx for increased response times, slong with the fact that fires
903.2.1.1 m;mr;; i "“""'3 i Locally adopted and amended | double in sizaeach and every minute, we fequire sprinklers
i “:m. . "“‘d “m' At to be instafled in siruchures once they reach 3,600 scuare
ke PR featinsize as they relate to fire behavior and rate of
gpreed.
Due to the [xpographic, dimetiz, and geographic conditions
; of E! Dorado County and their contributing factors to our
bk il e e s st e
903212 v e e Locally adopied ang amended | doublelnsize each and every minute, werequire sprinklers
m""g i et b L io beinstalied n structures once they reach 3,600 square
racias i tha i feetin size asthey relete o fire behavior and rate of
spread.
Due o $he npographic, climatic, and geagraphic conditions
of ElDorado County and thelr confributing factors toour
= Wi Increased response limes, aiong With fhe fact that fires
9032.1.3 oprinite syutaen Foalion ey Grovn Localy adopted and amended | double n size each andevery mimds, we require spinklers
bl anciacaionrés 3.0 dousos et ar io be installed instfuch.res onco they Feach 3,600 square
apmcriiin B feetin size as they relate tofire behavicr andrate of
spread.
Dre tothe topographic, ¢limalic, and geographic conditions
of ElDorado County and their contributing factors toour
qus";m&;mn:ﬁ;mm:ih incraased response times, along with the fact that fires
903214 Spim il 3600 eiepet Localy adopted and amendad doutie in size each and every minute, wa require sprinklers
mﬁm‘"ﬁ“":ﬁ““m S feator o be installed in stuctures ance they reach 3,60C square
9 . feetinsize as they relate toira behavior and rate of
spread,
Due to the lopographic. fimafic, and geographic conditions
' " of Ei Corado County and their canfributing factors to our
mﬁg&m jmm;m:m: o increasad response limes, along with the fact that fires
903.2.3 ansmﬁmmaemsth’g’w Locally adopled andamended | clouble In size each and every minute, we requite spriners
oreater within the distrir.t' fo be installed in structures once they reach 3,800 square
feet in size as thay relate lofire behavior and rate of
spread,
Duetothe fopographic, climatic, and geagraphic conditions
of El Dorado County and their contribuiing factors to our
Adt a requirement for sprinkler system installation increased response times, along with the fact that fires
90324 in new Group Fbuildings and sfructures 3,600 Localy adopted and amended double in sizg each and every minute, we require sprinklers
square feet or greater within the districl to be instalied in struetres onee they reach 3,600 square
fuetin size asthey relats to fire behavior and rate of
spread.
Due o Lhe wpographic, climatic, and geographic condiions
of El Deredo Counly and their contributing faclors toour
Adds a requirement for sprinkler system installation increased respanse times, alang wilh he fact (hat fires
90327 in new Group M buildings and structures 3,800 Locally adopled and amended | double n size each and every minute, wanequire sprinklers

square feetor greater within the district

tobeinstaled i structures anca they raach 3,600 square
feelinsize as they relate to fire behavior and rate of
spread,

23-1589 C 49 of 67




9203272

Previously section 303.2.7. Adds arequiremsnt for
sprinder system installation innew Group M with
Upholstered Fumiture or Matiressas bulkdings and
structures 3,600 square feel or greater within the
district

Localy adapled and amendes

Due ko ta topographic, <imafic, and geographic canditions
of E1Dorado County ani thelr contribuling factors toour
increased responsa imes, along with the fact that fires
double insize each and every minute, we requlre sprinklers
t0 be Instabied in structunes once they reach 3,600 square
faetinsize as they relte to fire behavior and rate of

spread.

90328.5

Previcusly seclion 903.2 8.2, This section was
created toinclude manufaciured residential single
family R-3 in the residential sprinkler program.

Locally adopted and amended

tanufactured Homes- The intent of this code sectionis o
engure hatmenufactured homes that serve as @ one or wo-
family dwellings are consisient with the provisions found in
CRC Section 313 pertaining to buik dwellings of a similar
natyra, Manufactured homes placed intha wiklland _urban
interfaca have a heightened risk of rapid fire consumpticn
dus to tha light-weight neture of their construction. The
rapict fire: spread throughout these siruclures presents a
significant rigk 1o their occupants. Residentlal sprinkler
sysiems have been Incorparated to dacrease this sk
successfully inmany Califoria cemmunities.

905.2.9

Previously secti9 903.2.6. Adds arequirement for
sprinkler system instaliation innew Group 5
buildings and structures 3,600 squane feetor
greater within the district

Locally adopled and amended

Due tothe topographic, climalic, and geographic condibions
of E1 Daradc County and their contribullng factors to our

increased response times, along with the fact that fires
[doubia in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers
ta be installed in stuchres once they reach 3,600 square
featin size as they relate to fire behavior and rate of

spread.

$03.2.10

Previously section B0J.2. Adds a requirement for
sprinker system installetion innew Group 5-2
buileings and stuctures 3,600 square feet of
grezter within the districl

Locafly adopted and amended

Dus to e topographic, climalie, and geographic conditions
i ElDgrado Courty and their contributing factors fo our
increased response times, alongwith the fack that fires
double insize each and avary minute, we require sprinklers
1 be nstalied in struchires onca they reach 3,600 square
feetingize as they refate Lo firabehavior and rate of
spraad,

903.2.10.1

Previously section 903.2.10. Adds a requirement for
sprinkier system instaliation innewCommercial
Patking Garage buildings and struciures 3,600
square feet of greater within tha district

Locally adopted and amended

Due 1o the topographic, cimatic;, and geographic conditions
of ElDorado County and their contriouting factors to our
increased reaponse times, along with the factthat fires
dolblain sizecach and every minule, we reguire sprinklers
1o be installed Instructures ance they reach 3,600 squara
feetinsize as they relate to fire behavior and rete of
spragd.

993.2.22

Previcusly section 503.2.7. Adds a requirement for
sprinkler system Installation innew Group B
buildings and structurss 3,600 square leet or
greatarwithin the district

Locally adopted and amended

Dus i the topographic, climafic, and gecgraphic conditions
of EtDorado County and theircontributing faclors toour
increased response limes, along with the fact that fires
double in size sach and every minute, we require sprinklers
1o be installed in structures ance they reach 3,600 square
feetinsize a5 thayralate o fire behavior and rate of
spread.

903.223

Previcusly section 903.2. Adds a requirement for
sprinkler system installation innew Group F-2
bulldings and siruclures 3,600 square feetor
greater within thedistrict

Locally adopied ang amended

Dure to the fopographic, dimatic, and geographic canditons
of El Dorado County and their corfributing factors to our
increased response times, along with the fact that fires
double in size each and every minute, we require sprinklers
{ohe installed in struchres once they reach 3,600 square
faelin size as they refate to irebehavior and rate of
spread.

803.6

Previously secfion 903.2a. Adds a rsquirement o
Instzil sprinklers for existing buildings #at undergo
a change in uss of greater hazard or an increase in
$ize greatar than 500 square faet and the resulting
square feetis geeatar than 3,600 squara feet.
Previously appliad tn addifion of more than 30% or
1,000 square feet.

Locally created and adoptzd

Cue i the topagraphic, climatic, and geographic conditicns
oFEl Dorade County and their confributing faclors to o
increased respange times, atong with the fact thal fires
double instze each and every minule, we require sprinklers
{0 bainstalled in sruciures once they reach 3,600 squere
festin size as they relate 1o fire behavier snd rate of
spread,

23-1589 C 50 of 67




| | Adds arequirament for fire alarm aysien

!

9072 N | inslaliztion innew buikiings and structures 3,800 locally adoped andtamended  Adminisirative need due te-addiion aof section 903.2.30.
O bsauors lestotless wimin hadietic A e e = e .
Previously seclon 907.2a. Adced occupant
| proteciion forfira alarms in Group Abuiidings witha Provides o
z proper emergency aotification for scoupancies that
w7als | N | Teorarealessthan 3600, excant R3, AGDUINGS | ooy, cpusied and adopled pubic use and ensures Fire Department notiicafion in
ol used for commercial purposes, and bulidings P
{ with & floor area of iess than 500 square feslas i
i | approved by the fire cade ofical
R, S5 . _f_, - ez
Previously section 907.2a. Added octupant |
| ;"fg.g:;ﬂ?g&":’;‘g g;“:glu;;ﬁh a !Prwldas praper emergency nofification for occupancles that
907223 N it : ngs Locally craated and adopted wallow pubc use and ensures Fire Department notification In
] not used lor commertial purposes. and bulkiings svent ofa firaor smake,
| with afioor area of less than 500 square fest 2s 5
| | approves by the fira code offidal
i; ,_I—t_ i T ok | . T Sl > .
| Praviousty section 907.2a. Added accupant
protaction for fire alarms in Group Ebulidings witha .
W23 N | Toorarealemsthan3gld, ewoplR3AGbuIINgs | o oy ndadoped low pl;jzm . ::: rmm m;'l_!wﬂ: abﬁmapamnhr i1 noll:::or Iar:
=] it used for commarciai prrposes, and buiidings i adop B o;"s':. .
‘ i with afloor area ofless than 500 squar feetas | SVCI OIS IN RSO
1 ‘ appraved by the firecoda oficiat
§
L_. s b i _!.w T ee——. . |
| i
| Previously section 907.2a, Added accupent
| protaclion forfire alamms in Gra i
! floor m:w less thano ;,;0. excapt R;p:aﬁm:g;:h s Provides proper emergency nofification, for mpande? that
907241 ; ot used for commercial purpases, and IGRGS Localfy crealed and adopled allow public yse and ensures Fire Department nolification in
| with ficor area of lasa than 500 squars feel as the aventofa fira or smoke.
.5 approved by the Ere code official
|
1 |
| Previously ssction 807 2a. Added accupant
| protection for fire alamsain Group Hbuitdings with ‘
a floorfarea less than 3,800, except R3, AQ Provides proper emergency ntiication far occupancies that
97252 buildings notused forcommereial purposes, and Locally crealed and adopied alow public use and ansures Fire Depariment notification in {
Duildings with a Noor area ofless than 500 square | the event of afireor smoke, 1
feet 85 approved by the firg code ofcial
s : - I e
{ i
| i Prevously saction 907 26, Added ceeupant
f proteciion forfire alams In Group | Bulldings with a ; .
N fioor area less fhan 3,600, axcept B3, AG buildngs Frovides prper mergeacy noffication for acoupaitdies It
[tk T R notusad forcommercial purpcses, and buildings ! Logally created and adopled gllow public use and ensures Fira Department notification In
 withafloor area ofiesa han 500 squars feelas ' the eventofafire or smoke.
approved by the fia code official
1 AV S, S — e e e e 1 I==E
i ;|
] Previously section 907 2a. Added occupané
i | pratection for fire alarms in Group M bulldings with
; & fioor area lass dhan 3,600, except R3, A Provides proper emergency nolfication for occupancies that
807272 | buikdings not used for commerclal purposes, and | Locally created and adopted |ailow public use and ensures Fire Depariment netification in
! buildings with a floor sres ofless hen 500 square theeventofa fire orsmoke.
| i feelasapproved by (he fire cods officlal
l i
| Previcussly section 907.2a. Added eoeupant
pratection for fire alarms in Group R-1 buildings
witha area less than 3,600, excepl R3, Provides praper emergency notfcafion for sccupandies that
1 997.2.54 buidhgs not used forcommarcial purpeses, and Lecally created and adopled hlow public use and ensures Fire Department notification in
H buildings wilh afloor area of fess than 500 square the aventofa fire of smake,
| fest a4 approved by the fire code official
n L = 1 | |

23-1589 C 51 of 67



Previously section 907.2a. Added occupant
protaciion for fire alaavs inCroup R-2, R-2.1, andR
2.2 hulldings with a floor area less than 3,600,

Provides proper emengency nolifcation fqr accupandles that
allow public usé and ensures Fire Department. notification in

907.2.9.4 except R3, AG buildings not used for commercial Locally eraated and adopied
purpezes, and buildings with a flcor ama of less the event of atire orsmake.
than 500 square feelas approved by thefirecode
official
Previously seciion 807.2a. Added octupant #
protection forfire alarms in Group S buikdings with a Provides ; ;
proper emergency notification for accupancies that
97,2101 foor aree less ten 3600, exceptR3, AGLUKINGS, 1oy, crostod ard adopted |allow public use and snsures Fite Oepartent nofficafion n
notused forcommercial prrposas, and buildings the eventof 2 fireor smake.
with affaor area ofless than 500 square feetas
approved by the fire code official
E::;;:;E mg:];f;ﬁsmmm Provides proper emergency nolification for ocoupancies (hal
ted i
907.2.30 Jtoamoniiored Erealam i Locally created and adop! talht:wwp:‘kd?ﬁarg m Fie Depariment notification in
installed or replaced
Provides proger esponse and mainfenance "runner senvica™
of firs alamm systems. NFPA 72 spectiies required response
times for fire alarm touble and suparviscry signals o
: ensure Systems remain operational, A Type AUL lsted
9U7.6.5 oy ﬁ"’:‘a":““f‘:a’gs""’“m""”’“d WUL | |ocaly qested and sfopted | ceniral iaion meets the NFPA required fre alasm response
P P Ol Sltbol ensuring an operational fire alarm system at 2l imes.
ULType A listing requires centra stations to provids this
"umner service” or conlract with another enlity o provide
this service 10 obtain the listing.
Primary Secondary Alarm Power Sugply Amend 1 72 hour capacity for back-up power due to
Ml Mod#ication Localty created and adopied weather andPG&E safely related power outages.
Praviously section §07.20. Added ocrupant
protecion foredsting tuikdings without automatic Provices proper emegency natificalion for oecupances that
9079 spiinkler sysiems ko install afire alam § they add Locally created andadopted allow putdic use and ensures Fire Depariment noffiication in
mare than 30% ar 1,000 square feet o the theevent of afireor smoke.
slructure, whichever isless
This section adds 2 Shunt Trip powsar shutoff devices o
1203.1.3 Shunt trip power safety devices Locally adopted and amended eitsure emergency powershut offduring the use of back-up
pawer supplies.
Previously seetion 3310, Address requirements for Addressing forconstiuction sites isimporam toassist
33113 tonstrction sites Localy crested end adopted | oo ing emergency crews.
Prenlousy saction 3312.1. Water supplies et Water must be on site prlor 10 combustibie material being
Rl construction sttas with combustible malerials an-site Rty Aoy pe e stored orverlical construction commencing.
Aoy datages r s fom gt o bl ey
2l m"‘ﬂﬁ r: t{f;?;:ohfd:: al belden Locally created and adoptexd process orpractice the actual costwil be passed on b the
1y negligent parties. ]
ﬁ:mmi Chiet ;:@;gasmﬁﬁ Allows agencies thatineed to know about explosives and ’
56012 locally adopted and amended fireworks to a0prove them and hava a elsar understanding
axplastvas, ard by the Fire Ghief and the Baard of of the applications ofh il beused
Supendsors for fireworks applications ofhow they wil beused.
Establishad limis asrequired by the Fire Code forClass 1
. flamrmable and Class llcombustibie liguid sterage in above
5704.2.9.6.1 Established limits as set forthin e Fire Code: Loslly adooted and amended it kg g M) spprounl i
SoacialiCondilional Use Permit from the County.
Estabdished limits asrequised by the Fire Code forClass 1
5706.2.4.4 Estabiished it a5 set orinthe Fire Code Localy adopted andamendeq | Bermmable.and Class lcombustible lkud special

oparatiens In shove—ground tarks, Requires AHY approval
and a SpaciaVCondilional Lise Permit from the County.

23-1589 C 52 of 67



Administrative addilion of District name

Agminisirtire nesd 0 add Distngt name, Established limits
2 requirad by e Fire Coce Cfficial for Flammable
Gryonenic fluids in stationary containers. Requires AHJ

. y : : > i
silie Established limits as set forthinthe Fire Code acay,adopiad and amenced approval and a Speciz!iConliional Use Pemmit fom the
County.
Establishes distances batween LPG storage and
dispensaries lhat aredirectly relaled 1o safety for residential
y . . davelopments and migh-density hotels, molels, gpartments,
68104 2 ESW[S":? lmlts:m LPS s!;r?gd;a;ddzne?smg Locally adopled and amended eie. where a reiease by leak or explogion of LP--Gas would
L sbe ot ot 2 og oy haveahigh prabability o injury, inkalatian, or dealh,
Requiras AHJ anproval and a SpecialCandifiona Use
Pemit from the: County.
In previous 2019 ordinance, High
Elsvation Liquefied Petroleum Gas .
Bt12 Installations {5.000 foot slevations and Locally adepted and added Any new LPG installation requirements,
above)
: Plans shall be submitted for all underground
61131 Permits shall be required Locally adopted and added tank installations as appraved by AHJ
Underground LPG tanks shall be prohibited
84132 LeasetOwnership Locally adopted and added from beng sold and retained by the the LPG
company uncer a lease-type system.
 §
|
5114 Natural Gas Locally adopted and added Maturai Gas installation requirements
|
Unlawful for a supplier to provide service that
6115.1 Violations Locally adopted and added | does not comply with the provisions of 6112 or
5113
Failure tg provide a cover to the meteris a
61152 Meter protection Locally adopted and added vioiation of this code

23-1589 C 53 of 67




Dismantied and stored vehides present sigrificant firg loads
{battaries, flammable and combustlble lquids, upholstery
etn) and risk to vegetaticr and adizcerd properties. This

¢ tfz Wt N ?:ﬂi?:mﬁr:bﬁ:eﬁ de:l:z:e Iopapelytes Locaky created and adopted requiremeant pravides fire accass and clearance to
! ing : vagatation inautomoblle wregking yard aperations to aid in
firefighting operations and reduction of fine extension to
|adjaoenl properties and/or open lands.
|
|Amended toinclude onesite sprinkier haads andwrench on-
site far emevgest repairs, theirclusion of alocal water flaw
| alann to create anaudibie aler for the flow of waterinthe
NFPA 130-16 of Chapter30 of the Fire Code of the event of wateractivation Ina yacant struclure, and [
Chapter 80, NFPA ‘, District has been amended to update vangus Locally adopted and amendst | Iydrostatic testing requirements o assure proper 130
130-16 ’ provisions pentalning to the inslallation of spnnkder ViAOCRIRE 281 sprinkler system installation decreasing fe nsk of weter
systems inone and twa-family dweikings damage from pipe fallure. Passive purge requirements
wese also added fo ensure waier drcufation trough the
system, reducing stagnant wates and backflow concerns
{EID encourages this type of system}
|
Allows us tomatch what devalopers and residents are used
ol toin regerds lo GPM fire fiow requirements thathave been |
Appendi E: Table Gl 0.3 11y 1000 GrRn gl used for over @ recade in EDG. Also provides a minimum
L subdivislons below 5000 foot alevation, o match Locally adopted and amended )
8105 4(1) fire fw precedents used InEDC foryears Ipvel of svailable water for firefighting pumposes In the event
ol housa tohouse, halse 10 vegetation, adnfor vegetainorn
tohause Ignition
AoperdixB. Tatle Establishad aminimysm requirament of 1,500 GPM, Allgws us to maich what developers and regidents are used
B #1052 N below 5000 feot elevaricn, for alf commercial Localy adopied and amended  [4o inregands to GPM fire flow requirements that have been
] proyects usedforoveradecade n ERC |
|
g i Q itisunreasonabie Lo require aresgential dmweway o |
Appendix O D101 N Acded an exception for residental driveways Lotally adopled and amended onalzra 5 ot spars kirAccevs o hydswl
Tille 14 requires us toonly accept 1#p to 16% dnveways,
i Ameandexi o meet State law of grades no greater any excapiions would require appraval by the AHJ. Inour Bl
Appendx Q0152 ™ than16% within Wildland Urban Interiace Ligsaly-edopten awtacarided Dorado County Titke 14 atoption we llow graater Lhan 16%
grade with AHJ approval and hard suriace.
. " 204oot road widths shall notinclude cutbs and guiters due
Appendx O $1033 N Adced text o inciude curbs and guiters Locally adopted and amended 1o potential s Is5UES &7 being radius Concems
3 wg i ‘Where fire apparatus 3ccess mads conslst of a divided
i
Appendi 0:D103.5 N Rﬁ':::"es mmr':l':m mfsa\gdies irerpialed Locally adopted and amended roadway the gele width shall ngt be less than 15 feet due o
oniieappamis.a apparatus tumning radios.
No parking on roads allowed on roadways less than 28 Feet
inwidth I § i
Aplendi D10361 N { Roadwidihs 201028 feed epdisiopiei mndamende | MATECIVEAICTISY. LoWer 30 neiihivioss

ot apply. This section is adopted as it stands in lhe Fire
Code Appendix Dsection 103 6 1 forall other lovations.

23-1589 C 54 of 67



Parking on one side only anroads from 23 fest o 36 feat
allowed. This isnotrequired less then 5000 feet of
Appendix D: D10362 iﬁ?ﬁﬁ%‘&m than 23 tee bk A i 16 Locally adopted and amended | elevation. Lower than 5000 feelthis doss ncl apply. The
section 1s adopled as it stands in the Fire Code Appendic D
‘ Section 103 & 2 for allother eigvations.
, |
| vhen required by the frs code offciel, a fre apparatus
: Added to require circumierentialfire appacatus access ad shall heconstructed toencompass e antire
Agpendw [ 1044 accessroads Losally areated and adopted structure and shall prowide a contineous means of
amergency vehicle accass.
Adopted with no Amendments
191 1 hrough 1015 é:ﬁgf;d e Localy adopted Adniistrathe clarity
| 102 1 through 102 12 References, subjects not regulated by the Cede Locally adepted Adminisirative clarily
L%ﬂ ;hgnugh Aaifity to enforee theoode Locaily adaptad Admnisiratve clarity
1%2162;0“9'" Timg ‘mitation of appication Lagally adopted Administrative clarity
' Adapted this ssclion for administralve dlarly and ]
166.1 through 106.4 fre and He safety insgections Locally adopted Fee schedules for pennits
Adopted this sechion for admunisirative clanty and
1671 through 107 & fire and hfa safety inspactons Locailly edopted Inspection authonty
. ; Maintenance of safeguards, testing and operstion of
108.1 thvough 1096 giftfiff:’g;ﬁ;‘fmmm i Locally adopted aquipment, re-msoecion and fegling, recondkeeping
i o~ supervision. rendering equipment naperable, avercrowding,
Adopted this secion for admimistrative dlardy and
113 firesandi e safety Inspections Locally adepted Stop work order
Adopied this saction for arkministrative darily and
114 1 though 147 fre and o safity speciicns Localy adopted Unsafe struchures or 2qupment
Asphalt kattles contain highly flammable substances and
require siringent safeguards. Managing ignition sourees
301 1 threugh 308 5 Adogted this sedlio for fire and Ife safely Locally adopted through respensible appkcation of standands wil reduce the
number of fires In various settings. (Climatic geologieal,
and topographical)
Generat requirements relaling to smoking. Vacant premises
cendition and safaty requirements, abandoned premises,
4 - {fenant spaces, safeguarding vacand gremises, secudy, fire
3101 through 3114 Adoglad this section for fire and ife safely Locally adopted orolection, firs saparation, fermoval of combusties,
temnoval of hazardous matenals, (Climatic, gealegical, and
tapographical).
; ; ; General requigments for roads, funnels, and bridges.
‘ 3231 Agopted this section for fira and fe safety Locally adepled (Chmatic, geologlcal, and topographical)
]
Provides evacuation drifls for hazardous and institutiona
403.6 through 40376 Adopied this section lor fire and ife safety Locally adopted occupancies {occupancies wilncreased potential for lde
l0ss).
; o Provides evacuation drills for holelimole! occupancies
403 § through 40394 Adopted twe section for firs and e safely Locally adopted {occupancies with increased potentialfor e loss)
. ! Emergency planning and record keaping {Climatic,
‘405.1 fhrough 405.10 Adopied this section for flre and e salety Locally aciopted geakgical, and topographital).
' 5103 Adapied this section for administrative clarty and Locally adopted Apenni is retuked for emergency respender rad systems
e fire and life safety inspections i (Climatic, geclogical. and topographical).
Adcpted this section for adminisirative clarity and Decormtive vegetation poses an increase inhazard,
1806.1 B firg andl life safety inspections Lol s flammathlity and increased risk,
Wk coverings in group E occupancies.(Schoasis) sets a
& Adopted |his section for adminisirative charity and maximum amount of fammable wall coverings in
il fire and fe safely inspaclions esliraopied educational faciies {Cimaic, geclogical and
! topographical).

23-1589 C 55 of 67




-

' : s o Combustible fumishing pese a significant flammatyhity and
Adopted this sechion for administrative clarily and r { 55
808.1 through BOAS N ; Locally adupted | Ingreased e safely hazard n ngtifutional and college dom
fire and hfe safety mspections ey ype cocupancies
; ; ; Providas glarlty onacceptance lesling of autamatic fire
80441 N ﬁi?ﬂ':;ﬁ?ﬂg’f;’fﬁm Lo Locally adapted extinguishing systems, {Climate, gactogicsl, and
) tapograghical).
Adopted this seclion for administrative clarity and .
1101.1 through 1902, N fice and ffe safely inspeciions Locally edopted Admriskatve clanty
Emergency Responder racic coverage n exising buidngs
Albulidings will herequired to-alow emergency responders
to receive andiransmit emergency redie traffic te.and from
each other and the emergency dispalch center. Time
Al s spclon i exstngtkdrgs ke he el o ML e s
Y  EET gy
11028 i:ﬁ!g:;lr:ﬂgﬂers L o bocaly ackipted the firg sode official. 1sacceptabla, The rationale kefind this
section is that on aimost all emergency responder IRy or
fatality Incidents communicetion sa keylssue. This
situation can be corrected with the addition ofradls
equipment to hoost the signal inaraas that danet have
strong signal {Climatic, geclogical, and topographical)
Requiras installation of fire spriniler systems in existing
Adopted this saction for the safety of the public, oczupancies with high Irfe sefety risk and In conformance
11 bt
033 % firefighters, and other emergency respanders Locally adooted with previeus Uniforn Fire Codes. (Climatic, geslegical, and
topographical).
L. y Requires nstallatron of carbon monoxide alams in
Adopted this section lor the salety of the pubic, 2 T i
110239 N Localy adopted occupancies with high e safaty rsk {Clmalic, geclegica,
firsfighters, 2nd other emergency responders andiopograpieal)
8 Provdes amnimum level of safety with regard o egress
113112? HgH N ﬁ;ﬁg?@ﬁﬂ? e f?gi:;ﬁﬂz': Locatly adopled from exsting Buiidings housing oczupancies wilh a hightife
' - safety risk. (Climatic, geological, and topagraphical)
. ' Provdes a mnimum level of salely at e storage yards |
1106 1 through Adopted ffs section for the safety of the pubhc, . : :
i N Lazally adopied win high levels of flammable nuder material, (Chmatc,
1081.2 firgfighters, ant other emergency responders ' geoiogical, and topographica).
Appendix D: D011 N Adopted this section for the safety of the public. - | Genaral requirsments for fife aparalus access mads
through D104.1 firefighters, arkl other emergency responders ofied | Including loads {Cmatic, geclegical, and topographical).
.
Appendix 0:0104.2 N Adopted this section for the safety ofthepublic, Locally adoptad | Commeicial and industrial development fire apparatus. |
{excluding exception) firefighters, and other emergency responders 5 l‘ access roads (Chmealic, geological, and topographical).
Appandix 0.0M04.3 N Adopied this section for the safety of the public, Localy adanted | Commarcal and mcugtnal development fire apparaius
thraugh D105 4 firefighters, and other amergancy rasponders By aciop aceess roads (Climatic, gealagical, ang fopegraphical).
Appendix D:D106.1 N Adopted this section for the salety of tha pubiic, localiv adopted Fire apparatus aceess roads for multipte-family residential
I [excluding exception) fuefighters, and other emergency respenders Y.RAoH developments {Climalic, geclogical, ancHtepograpnical).
Appandix D, D106.2 N Adopted this section for the safety of the public, ocally adaotad Fire apparatus sccess roads for multple-family residerdial
through D106.3 firefighters. and other emergency responders faap developments {Climalic, geological, and topogrephical).
One- ortwo-dwelling residential develapments shail e
Bprendix D. D107.1 N Adopled this secticn for the safety ofthe public, lncally acoplad equipped thraughout with two sperate and aporoved fire
{exchuding exceptions|) firefighters. and olher emergency responders apparaiils access roads due to topographic, geographc ang
climatic conditons,
— - —
One-or two-dwelling residental developments shallbe |
Appendix I D1G7.2 N Adopted this saclion for the safety of the public, Locally adopied equipped hroughout with two sperate and approved fire
through D181 firetigiters, and other emergency responders op spparaius acoess roads due to topograghic, gecgraphic and
climatic conditions,

Grey cells are previously amended, adapted, or changed code sections that are being adapted again inthis code cycle.

23-1589 C 56 of 67



White calis are newly amended, adopted, of charged code sections that differ from previous code adoptions,

23-1589 C 57 of 67



FIRST NOTICE

Noftice of Intent te Adopt the 2022 Fire Code Ordinance

Notice is hereby given of the intention of the Lake Valley Fire Protection District to
adopt a Fire Code Ordinance. The District shall hold its first public hearing at 17:00 on
Thursday December 8th, 2022 at the Lake Valley Fire Protection District Station 7, 2211
Keetak St, South Lake Tahoe, CA, regarding the adoption of the 2022 Fire-Code
Ordinance pursuant to Health and Safety Code Sections 13869 and 13869.7. Copies of
the code section referred to and any secondary code sections referred to, adopted by
reference, are on file with the Secretary of the District and are open to public inspection,
Adopticn of the Fire Code Ordinance will adopt the California Fire Code as currently
published in Title 24, Part 9, of the California Code of Regulations, governing fire
prevention and building standards related to fire and panic safety with some amendments.
In some instances the Lake Valley Fire Protection District’s proposed Fire Code
Ordinance proposes building standards more stringent than those minimum building
standards adopted by the State Fire Marshal and contained in the California Building
Standards Code.

23-1589 C 58 of 67



|

OFFICIAL AD PROOF

This is the procf of your ad scheduled to run in Tahoe Dafly Tribune on the dates indicated below. {f
changes are needed. piease contact us prior to deadline at {(530) 541-3830.

Notice ID. 03CRKMKDBUARVOYACXF | Proof Updated: Nov. 23, 2022 at 12:58pm PST
Notice Nams: 8CD06 Norce of intent Lake Valley Fire | Publisher 1D: 251403

See Proof on Next Page

This is not an mveice. Below is an estimated price, and itis
subject to change. You will receive an inveice with the final

price Lpon Invaice creaton by the publisher,

FILER FILING FOR

Chad Stephen Tahoe Daily Tribune
stepher@lakevalleytine org
(530) 577-3727

Columns Wide: 2 Ad Class: Legals

11/25/2022; Other Notice T2.84

12/02/2022; Other Notice 72.84

Aflldavit fiat charge 8.52
Internet Flat Fes Charge A:3,50 |
|

Subtotal pise. 70

Tax &4 0.00

Total $193.70

BCDO6 Notice of Intent Lake Valley Fire - Page 1 of 2

23-1589 C 59 of 67



FIRST NQTICE
Nefice of intent 1 At 1he 2022 Fim Cods
Ordinance

MNidee s hartky anar ol the intanton of e Like
Vatay Firs Profeedion Disipes to ndopt o Fie Souw
Oethnancr, Thea Distnat ohall bead s st poullc: headng
ar 1200 on Thivadoy Daderries 81, 2022 atthe Lole
Valiarg Fi7a Protecon Disit Slaton 7 2211

Keetak it Souh Lake Yarms O4, mgardeg ihe

any caile seclions »etenad 1o, adoled by
sinrencs, oma on file Wik the Qaesetary of e Distrel
znd are ope o pulzncpaction Adaphon of tha Fira
Sote Ordmanes will wd?t the Cawlomia Fiee Code as
currently putfished «© Tide 23 Pl 3, of the Cailotiva
Caotie & Begykabuvs, gmemng‘ fis prevenyon orig
tudlaing stardeeds wated e her and panic satey
Wil SEINR In some § 5, 102 Loke
Vahey Fire Protection Cremols pinposed Frne Goda
D finonra proposes. tulding stamiards MOTS ST

ihan ¥ioes MEwluG) LUILDE Stapdends fnowd v
(e State Fire WMarshe! and oot i the Ceafomis
Subeimg Standtards Code

Pubiished: Novemiber 25. December 2, 2022

8CDO06 Natice of Intent Lake Valley Fire - Page 2 of 2

23-1589 C 60 of 67



SECOND NOTICE

Notice of Intent to Adopt the 2022 Fire Code Ordinance

Notice is hereby given of the intention of the Lake Valley Fire Protection District to adopt a Fire
Code COrdinance. The District shall hold its second public hearing at 16:00 on Thursday January
5th, 2023 at the Lake Valley Fire Protection District Station 7, 2211 Keetsk St, South Lake
Tahoe, CA, regarding the adoption of the 2022 Fire Code Ordinance pursuant to Health and
Safety Code Sections 13869 and 13869.7. Copies of the code section referred to and any
secondary code sections referred to adopted by reference, are on file with the Secretary of
the District and are open to public inspection. Adoption of the Fire Code Ordinance will adopt
the California Fire Code as currently published in Title 24, Part 9, of the California Code of
Regulations, governing fire prevention and building standards related to fire and panic safety
with seme amendments. In $6me instances the Lake Valley Fire Protection Distriet's proposed
Fire Code Ordinance proposes building standards more siringent than those minimum building

standards adopted by the State Fire Masshal and contained in the California Building Standards
Code.

23-1589 C 61 of 67



= Column

OEFICIAL AD PROOF

This is the proof of your ad scheduled to run in Tahoe Daily Tribune on the qates indicated helow. If
changes ars needed, please contact us prior to deadline at (530} 541-3880.

Notice 1D: dTBabOtXukeZn9tSkpsr | Proof Uptated: Dec. 21, 2022 at 01:43pm1 PST
Motice Name BCDOS Lake Valley Fire Protection District, 2 | Publisher [D: 255488

See Proof on Next Page

Thig is not an invoice. Below is an estimated price, and itis
subject 1 chanye, You will receive an involce with the final

price upon iNvoice creation by the puklisher,

FILER FILING FOR !

Chad Stephen Tehoe Daily Tribune
stephengPlakevalleyiire.arg
{530) 577.3737 |

Columne Wide: 2 Ad Class: Legals
12/23/2022: Other Notice 50,29
Aflidavit flat charge 400
intemet Fiat Fee Charge A0.00
l
Subitotal $134.29 i
Tax (0%) $0.00

Total $134.29 ‘

B8CD06 Lake Valley Fire Protection District, 2 - Page 1 of 2

23-1589 C 62 of 67



SECOND NOTICE

Notice of Intant o Mepl the 2022 Fue Cede
Ordinance

Moo 1 hereby givan ot s indenton of the Lake
vallsy ﬂm Protacien Distoot i & Fie
Cone (rlinarcs Toe Ditract shell l"‘!rl g cacontd
puttfy fraring st 1600 on Thigstiay Juswiary
S, 2073 Y the Lake Uiioy Fra Pratedtiaa Diemol
Eemiion 7. D211 Kestak al Sqisn Lake
Tohow CA regareng the atepnan af tha A3 Fire
Loge Osu-name s i Healm wd
Saloty Code Sachciis 13867 and 14k80./ Cupies of
the Coda semnr rEfated 0O and Any
socde seolione vafeald @, nﬁop*":l by

refaranps, 're 1 g Wil e Seamtary o
tng Dignet and ore opan © pubikc msnecaon Ach iz
#tine Fice Gode Jedinanna will stdept
macsmmnm Era Code s currantly pLiEsed i Tile
249, Panl 9, of e Californea Sone of
R-gulamans qovernng s provenkon and builng
Slencaris stala e frs 2hd ane; gataly
with Egme amaromens. (o smne mnancea T s
Vrskey Fus Protaztion Disinel's o
Fire Code Drdinance uropcﬁes im-unq standards
Finra snisent han thess snmum euld ug

sandards apoosd oy the Swuam Fre Barshal and
£d n}zmaﬁ 1Py e Cmmmm Buddiay Swndandg

% il

Published: Docamber 23, 2022

8CDO6 Lake Valley Fire Protection District, 2 - Page 2 of 2

23-1589 C 63 of 67



12128422, 11:16 AM httpsouthtahoenow comstory 1125202 2lake-valley-fire-profeclion-distrct-adopt-rew-fire-codelbelid=iwAR2IGV 1 SsV4YUzRZvSF png

1114 ath T &

>< Lake Valley Fire Pr... l]
6 southtahoenow.com

SouthTahoeN®Weonm

Yew ¢ Vine } Fwos Idese Vosem o Pyforsadiion oy

L T T T R LA B S ]

gt - SNOW REMOVAL
.. OPERATIONS IN EFFECT

1)

™ LEARN HOW TO PREPARE YOUR PROPERTY @

Luke Volliy Fiee Prowesian Dislic) 1o wdopd cow Fivg Cude
View Viow dems

LR ST}

B Mondhly Billing
wn Covming: 2023
el fary ¢ -

e

cha Valien e Preachiia Dadncd (LS00 4ls e tal Sfdlie
B el e 20D T e M TYTRATE
STl eE B T e e Sa o o Ty,
Cettt oo Bozd Blacs = LU B3R kactas Stnert. e

| &
OPER EMROLLMENT | e,

a3 cma Todsof

B gLt oA, gowerning e
ponm Al ke

m'."".‘? R R R S
I

arre

i e £ et

Biok 1o wban L, W LaK: ¥t i B oot ak n Dedns
Bwaczd FFC Coda Bra v o needs s bed s and ¢
A Gl AR D e P ko B ook tanderds admotes
by o by e Mokl ¥ 350 ook e 4 i D abdean g
Bl Stpndarcy (6 e
T s~ e ord nac e can kg
L L

-

n rrmire

o 5 vou

hitps:/fmaik.google. comimailiuiDftinboxFMfegzGrolbivwb ThPRAFvLxnVxCinfg ?projecior=1&messagePartld=0.1

142

23-1589 C 64 of 67



12/28/22, 11-15 AM

1115

Lake Vallay Fire Pr...
# souihtaghoenow.com

hitpscuthtahoenow.comstary 122120221ake-valley-fire-protection-distncl-hold-second-public-hearing-new-fire-code .ong

ll" "? E

]

Lake Valey Fius Protection Disticl (o rold woo o sablic

Fening on ew e Code

Vidw Vi dams

B e
i 4 a4 S

T e

Lot wolow Fire Prote Vo Dl NP 5 0 Foaviosig Hoodt

runke They v d e Fraiy

A mod g 2 ils

FES e T RUPSERE N TR S (ol

T DIl Tl iraB Dok NS st eG4 et g, Wi e RQLOA
Bt o0 ¥ % T ade fdia s it A o v Thond sy, Jeaawy
3, 2022 poehe LR 9tatl A 2258 ke banowr, St e e

Tajna,

¥ e
1

& ur

Ve g

[ ]

miter

DIPEN EMRCGL MERY

i
oy il il
A 3K

o

&

hitps-/imail. goagle.commailiu0/#in box/FifegzGrblbvwb TsCAJESLY dghm SMQb Pprojector=1&messageParlld=0.1

It girmt Te s ey, MR S
Pty Fav Code C-dnteny
Prigetds Eubnay? stadnda s
(U ERS AT L L R
[T & It BT B SENE S Rl Y
adopled By Eng £ s PG

Fo st Wi
LAkt ne Tuaddats 51 5 s
Codr

L L

Menthly Billmy

— R
“-l gt Homgnp.
N B, G s

12

23-1589 C 65 of 67



12¢28/22 11:16 AM Notice of Inient to Adopt the 2022 Fire Code Ordinance Lake Valley Fire.png

NOTICE OF
INTENT TO
ADOPT THE 2022
FIRE CODE
ORDINANCE

by Marlin Goldberg  Mov é5, 2022 | Nows

ad lakevalleyfire.org &

< M M 0

hitps:#mail google.comimailwQi#inbox FMfcgzGrblbtvwZsHuwvadwwCOhmkRRZC ?projector=1&messageParlid=0.1 12

23-1589 C 66 of 67




1228122, 1114 AM Notce of Intent to Adopt the 2022 Fire Code Ordinance — Second Nolice Lake Valley Fire,png

NOTICE OF
INTENTTO
ADOPT THE 2022
FIRE CODE
ORDINANCE -
SECOND NOTICE

fyy Mariir Goldiers | Dec 24, 2022 | jews - 0

{oinme s

& akcvalleyfire.oig

httpes-fimail gacgle.com/mailwd#nboxiFiicgz Grbiotvwb CLAZNRNwHONV i« Z T m?projector=1&messagePartid=0.1 W2

23-1589 C 67 of 67






