Bid # 24-0028 Office Fumniture- Category 1 - Office Master Chairs

* Evaluation
Interior Spaces Corp. Wies Tre‘aster > Burketts Office Supplies V;alkelris Olffice
- Sacramento, CA Assaciates Sacramento, CA HpjLes; IRG.
Chairs ’ Sacramento, CA ’ Rocklin, CA
Bid Item | UOM Description Model # Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price
OM Paramount mutti-function task chair wf
1 Each bariceret et nir st b cic st 7780 $395.02 $677.02 $418.53 $45562
OM Paramount multi-function task chair wf =
= Each expanded seat pan and back rest 8 $447.77 $734.30 $479.06 $517.84
3 Each COhMai:’es Series mid back, multi-function executive vS84 $352.74 $603.84 $341.33 $376.11
4 Each |OM (DB) Discovery Back multi-function task chair DB74 $396.70 $678.84 $420.53 $457.59
OM Paramount, large & tall build, muiti-funciton - 5
3 Esah tash chair wiexpanded seat & back rest PREMBST $671.86 $912.48 abkte) $711.42
OM Value Series, large & tall build, multi-funciton
6 Each bask chair Wexpanded seat'& back st PAGS $308.79 $583.39 $319.73 $353.89
7 Each |OM Classic Lab Staol CLSB1 $290.79 $563.84 $299.06 $332.65
Sub-total Chairs $2,863.67 $4,753.71 $2,945.44 $3,205.12
Arm Kits
Bid ltem | UOM Description Model # Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price
8 Each |Office Master height & width adjustable T-arms KR-200 $64.81 $77.95 $57.06 $58.77
Average height, height & width adjustable T-arms
9 Each |wismooth fore-aft, side-to-side & pivoting motion KR200-45 $108.77 $125.68 $107.46 $110.62
arm caps
10 Each ':;’:;age height, ultra mobility anm wimemnesoftarm| e 56 50 $117.41 $134.77 $117.06 $120.49
1 Each |Tallest height, height & width adjustable T-arms KR300 $75.28 $89.31 $69.06 $71.11
Average height, height & width adjustable T-arms
12 Each |wismooth fore-aft, side-to-side & pivoting motion KR300-45 $119.23 $137.04 $119.485 $122.96
arm caps
13 | Eacn |T2e Balgfit, ultramebilly anmiwitmenoseltanm | .ypaoas $127.60 $146.13 $129.06 $132.84
Sub-total Arm Kits $613.10 $710.88 $599.16 $616.79
Sub-total - Office Master $3,476.77 $5,464.59 $3,544.60 $3,821.91
Discount Terms 0% 2% - 0% 0%
Less: LVP 5% % 0% 0% 0%
Gategpry®.-Bid Totals $3,476.77 $5,355.30 $3,544.60 $3,821.91
Delivery 3 Weeks ARO 20 Working Days ARO 20 Days ARO 15 Days ARO
Terms 2%115 Days 2%/20 Days Net 45 Days Net 45 Days
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Bid # 24-0028 Office Furniture- Category 2 - HON

Evaluation*

Interior Spaces Corp.

Miles Treaster &

Burkett's Office Supplies

Walker's Office Supplies,

Sacramento, CA Sa?rsasrﬁ::\at:e,sc A Sacramento, CA Roclltrl‘icr';, cA

Sample Accumulative Order at List Price % 5,000.00 3 5,000.00 $ 5,000.00 5 5,000.00
Percentage off MSRP 0.00% 54.00% 0.00% 48.00%
Subtotal $ 5,000.00 $ 2,300.00 $ 5,000.00 $ 2,600.00
Less Terms Discount 0% 2% 0% 0%
Less: LVP 5% 0% 0% 0% 0%
Category 2 - Bid Totals $ - $ 2,254.00 $ 5,000.00 $ 2,600.00

DT‘"; 'r‘:ﬁ;y NO BID 20 ;!Z:g’fa?:ys NO BID ;5:757 vang('z gs;?:gisal_gtrc:jikr

Net 45 Days

*Evaluation is exclusive of sales tax
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Bid # 24-0028 Office Furniture- Category 3 - Performance Line (CLS)

Evaluation*

Interior Spaces Corp.

Miles Treaster &

Burkett's Office Supplies

Walker's Office Supplies.

Associates Inc.
Sacramento, CA SaEraNENtG. Ch Sacramento, CA Rockiin, CA
Sample Accumulative Order at List Price $ 145000.00 $ 145.000.00 $ 145,000.00 $ 145,000.00
Percentage off MSRP 55.00% 79,750 55.00% 75¢ 0.00% $0.00 60.00%
Subtotal - Product $65,250.00 $65,250.00 $145,000.00 $58,000.00
Delivery / install charges Trips
Round trip Charges from Vendors place of
business to all West Slope Locations
(Placerville, Shingle Springs. Diamond Springs. 10 § 33000| % 330000 % 64196| 5 641960 $0.0 $0.00 $ - $ Z
Zip Codes: 95667, 95682, 95619
Round trip Charges from Vendors place of
business to all East Slope Locations (South 5 $ ©66000(§ 330000 (% 1008923 5.04460 %0.0 $0.00 $ - $ -
Lake Tahoe, Zip Code: 96150
HRS
Hourly Rate for Assembly / Install
CoRe. M, -arie Hstir) 10 $ 8500(8% 85000 | ¢ 83403 83400 | $ - $ = $ 6000|% 600,00
Subtotal - Deliver/lnstall $ 7,450.00 $ 12,298.20 $ = $ 600.00
Total- Product/Travelinstall $ 7270000 $ 77,548.20 $145,000.00 $ 58,600.00
Less Terms Discount 0% 2% 0% 0%
Less: LVP 5% 0% 0% 0% %
Category 3 - Bid Totals $ 72,700.00 $ 7599724 $0.00 $ 58,600.00
Delivery 20 Days ARO 15 Working Days NO BID 5-10 Working Days
Terms 2%/15 Days 2%/20 Days Net 45 Days

*Evaluation is exclusive of sales fax
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Bid # 24-0028 Office Furniture- Category 4 - Workrite Keyborad Trays

Miles Treaster &
Associates

Waiker's Office Supplies,

Burkett's Office Supplies e,

Interior Spaces Corp.

Sacramento, CA Sacramento, CA

Sacramento, CA Rocklin, CA

Category 4 - Workrite

Bid Item

Modei #

Description

QTy

Bid Price

EXT. Price

Bid Price

EXT. Price

Bid Price

EXT. Price

Bid Price

EXT. Price

2128-22

Workrite Banana Board System: Mouse-
Forward platform, left or right mousing,
Platform Dimensions: 19w x 13d; Sliding
Mouse Tray: Bw x 4/8.5d w/ Pinnacle 2
Adjutsable Arm (#3170-22TG)

$0.00

$0.00

$291.36

$2,330.88

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

UB188-25

Warkrite Universal Ultra-Thin Platform,
right or left handed mousing, removabie
LeatheRite palm support; Dimensions:
27.75w x 11.5d Platform Color: Black
Palm Support Color: Midnight

$0.00

$0.00

$115.91

$115.91

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

10

3170-22TG

Workrite Pinnacle 2 Adjustable Keyboar
Arm, Tilt Indicator, Lift-N-Lock Height
adjustment, Thin Glide Ball Bearing
Track, 3602 swivel, Height Range: Flush
to 6" below worksurface; Til Range; -
15" to +10"

$0.00

$0.00

$149.09

$298.18

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

Sub-total Workrite product

$0.00

$2,744.97

$0.00

$0.00

Workrite: Delivery / Install Charges

Bid Item

UOoM

Description

QrTy

Bid Price

EXT. Price

Bid Price

EXT. Price

Bid Price

EXT. Price

Bid Price

EXT. Price

11

Trip

Round trip Charges from Vendors place
of business to all West Slope Locations
(Placerville, Shingle Springs, Diamond
Springs, Zip Codes: 95667, 95682,
95619

$0.00

$0.00

$641.96

$3,209.80

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

12

Trip

Round trip Charges from Vendors place
of business to all East Slope Locations
(South Lake Tahoe, Zip Code: 96150

$0.00

$0.00

$1,008.92

$2,017.84

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

13

Hour

Hourly Rate for Assembly f Install (one
man, one hour)

10

$0.00

$0.00

$83.40

$834.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

Sub-total Workrite Delivery f Install

$0.00

$6,061.64

£0.00

$0.00

Total - PreductMravel/install

$0.00

$8,806.61

$0.00

$0.00

Payment Discount Terms

Less Terms Discount
Less: LVP 5%

0%
0%

2%
0%

0%
0%

0%
0%

Category 4 - Workrite Bid Totals

$0.00

$8,630.48

$0.00

$0.00

Delivery
Terms

NO BID

20 Working Days
2%/20 Days

NO BID

NO BID
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$0.00

$0.00

$0.00






