
RESOLUTION NO. 040-2011 

OF THE BOARD OF SUPERVISORS OF THE COUNTY OF EL DORADO 

(REPEALING RESOLUTION NO. 41-2008) 

WHEREAS, the California Code of Regulations, Title 24, Part 9, the California Fire Code, is updated by the 
State every three years; and, 

WHEREAS, the 2010 California Fire Code became effective on January 1,2011; and, 

WHEREAS, local jurisdictions may establish more restrictive building standards reasonably necessary because 
oflocal climatic, geological or topographical conditions; and, 

WHEREAS, the California Code of Regulations, Health and Safety Code, Division 12, Part 2, Chapter 1, 
Article 2, Section 13146, assigns responsibility for enforcement of fire safety regulations to the local level and 
grants authority to delegate enforcement to the chief building official, or his or her authorized representative, or 
to the chief of the fire protection district, or his or her representative; and, 

WHEREAS, enforcement of the Fire Code in the County of El Dorado has historically been shared by the 
County Building Official and the local Fire Agencies according to the knowledge and skills each possesses; 
and, 

WHEREAS, on November 17, 2010, the Board of Directors of the Cameron Park Community Service District 
(Cameron Park Fire Department) adopted Ordinance No. 2010.11.17, which adopted the 2010 California Fire 
Code with amendments the District deemed necessary to deal with local climate, geological or topographical 
conditions. 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that the Board of Supervisors of the County ofEl Dorado ratifies 
the following building code Amendments to the California Fire Code adopted by the Cameron Park Community 
Service District, attached as Exhibit A, with the clarifications attached as Exhibit B: Chapter 1 - 10S.6.27; 
Chapter S - S07.S.1; Chapter 6 - 604.1; Chapter 9 - 903.2, 903 .2.a, 903.2.b, 903.2.8, 903.2.8.1, 903.2.1.1, 
903.2.1.2,903.2.1.3,903.2.1.4,903.2.2.1,903.2.3, 903.2.4, 903.2.7, 903.2.9, 903.2.10, 907.2.a, 907.2.b, 
907.2.c; Chapter 38 - 3804.3 Footnote "d," 3812, 3812.1, 3812.2, 3812.3, 3812.4, 3813.1; Appendix B­
B10S.1, BlOS.2. 

mmacfarland
Typewritten Text
11-0163
Item 21
3/29/11



Resolution No. __ 0_4_0_-_2_0_1_1 __ Page 2 of2 

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that the Board of Supervisors of the County of El Dorado delegates the 
enforcement of the Building Standards of the 2010 Fire Code for one and two family dwellings, and accessory 
structures thereto, to the County Building Official, or his or her authorized representative, and for all other fIre 
code enforcement to the Chief of the Cameron Park Fire Department, or his or her authorized representative, for 
the territory served by that Department. 

PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of Supervisors of the County of El Dorado at a regular meeting of said 
Board, held the ~ day of March , 20 jJ. by the following vote of said Board: 

Attest: 
Suzanne Allen de Sanchez 

Cl~7?i:f~rs 
By. ~.£ 

Depu 

I CERTIFY THAT: 

Ayes: Knight, Sweeney, Nutting 
Noes: Briggs 
Absent: Santiago 

Chair, Board of upervisors 
Raymond J. Nutting 

THE FOREGOING INSTRUMENT IS A CORRECT COPY OF THE ORIGINAL ON FILE IN THIS OFFICE. 

Attest: Suzanne Allen de Sanchez, Clerk of the Board of Supervisors of the County of EI Dorado, State of 
California. 

By: Date: 
Deputy Clerk 



· ORDINANCE NO. 2010.11.17 · . 
AN ORDINANCE OFe the CAMERON PARK COMMUNITY SERVICE DISTRICT 

"CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE" WITHIN CAMERON PARK COMMUNITY SERVICE 
DISTRICT 

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CAMERON PARK COMMUNtTY SERVICE DISTRICT AS FOLLOWS: 

An ordinance of the Cameron Park Community Service District adopting the 2010 edition of the california Fire Code, 
based upon the 2009 edition of the International Fire Code, regulating and governing the safeguarding of life and 
property from fire and explosion hazards arising from the storage, handling and use of hazardous substances, materials 
and devices, and from conditions hazardous to life or property in the occupancy of buildings and premises in the 
cameron Park Community Service DIstrict; providing for the issuance of permits and collection of fees therefore; 
repealing Ordinance No. 2008.01.16 of the Cameron Park Community Service District and all other ordinances and 
parts of the ordinances In conflict therewith. 

SectIon 1: ADOPTION OF CODE: 
Section 2: CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE. AMENDMENIS; 
SectIon 3: ESTABUSHING UMIIS; 
section 4: CONFUCI 
section 5: SEVERABILITY 
Sectlon·.S: EFFECTIVE DATE AND PUBLICATION: 

Section 1: ADOPTION OF CODE: 

That a certain document, three (3) copies of which are on file In the office of the Secretary of the cameron Park 
Community Service District Board, being marked and designated as the California Fire Code, 2010 edition, !n...i1I 
entirety, and the following International Fire Code SectIons and ApDeridjces not adOPted bv the State of Califomla: 
101.3.103.1 tbru 103.4.1.104.1 thru 104.11.3.106.1.107.1 thru 107.6. 108.1 thru 108.3. 112.113.1 thru 113.6.1. 303.1 
thru 303.9.305.1 thru 305.4.307.1. tIlru 307.5.308.1 thru 308.5. 408.1 thru 408.11.3. and APpendix 0101.0103.1. 
0103.4; 0103.5. 0103.6. 0105.1 th", 0105.3. 0107.1 ' F. and J. based on the 2009 edition of the International Fire 
Code as published by the International Code Council, be and is hereby adopted as the Fire Code of the Cameron Park 
Community Service District, in the S~ of california regulating and governing the safeguarding of life and .property from 
fire and explosion hazards arising from the storage, handling and use of hazardous substances, materials and devices, 
and from conditions hazardous to life or property in the occupancy of buildings and premises 88 herein provided; 
providing for the issuance of permits and collection of fees therefore; and each. and aU of the regulations, provisions, 
penalties, conditions and terms of said Fire Code on file in the office of the Cameron Park Community Service Oistr:ict 
are hereby referred to, adopted, and made a part hereof, as if fully set out in this ordinance, with the additions, 
insertions, deletions and changes, if any, prescribed In Section 2 of this ordinance. 

Section 2: CAUFORNIA FIRE CODE. AMENDMENTS: 

The following sections are hereby amended or added: 

California Fire Cod .. Chaptlr1 Amenclmentl- Scope and Administration: 

Section 105 - Pennlts 

Section 105.8.28 II amended _ follOW!: LP Gu. 

Ord.-2010.02 Page 1 

Exhibit A 



Section 105.6.27 of Chapter 1 of the Fire Code of the Cameron Pam, Community SeIVice District is amended to ' 
read as follows, baaed on climatiC, geological and topographical conditions: ' 

105.8.27 - LP G .. 

1. Storage and use of LP-gas. 

exception: A permit is not required for individual containers with a 500 ~ ganon water capacity or less 
serving,occupancies In Group R-3. " 

Section 1 09 - ViOlation! 

SectIon 101.3 II WInded .. foIIowI; VIolation panama· 

Section 109.3 of Chapter 1 of the Fire Code of the Cameron Park Community Service District is amended to 
read as follows: 

SectIon 109.3 VIolation .,......... Persons who shall violate a provision of this code or shall fall to comply 
with any of the requirements thereof or who shan erect, Instan, alter, repair or do wom' in violation of the 
approved construction documents or directive of the fire code official, or' of a permit or certificate used under 
provisions of this code, shall be guilty of a misdemeanor. punishable by a fine of not mora than $1000.00 dollars 
and/or by imprisonment not exceeding 6 months. or both such fine and imprisonment Each day that a violation 
continues after due notice has been served shall be deemed a separate offense. (Health & Safety Code Section 
13145 and 17995). ' 

Section 11,.- StOp Work Order! 

SectIon 111.4 II amended. foIloWI: FIIIYI! to comply. 

Section 111.4 of Chapter 1 of the Fire Code of the Cameron Park Community Service District is amended to 
read as follows; 

111.4. Fallul! to comply. Any person who shall continue any wom after having been served with' a stop work 
order, except such work as that person is directed to perform to remove a violation or unsafe condition', shall be 
liable to a fine of not less than I§gQ., or not more than $1.000. (Health & Safety Code Section 13145 and 
17995). 

Section 113.8 and 113.8.1 al! added .. foliowl: Fw. 

Sections 113.6 and 113.6.1 of Chapter 1 of the Fire Code of the Cameron, Park Community Service District are 
added to read as fonows: ' 

, 113.8 Peonlt. Plan Reylew and IMpectIon Feet. A schedule' of fees adopted by ,the Fire Pistrict Board of 
Directors for Plan Review. Inspections and the issuanCe of permits by the Fire Pistrict may be found in the most 
current Cameron Park Community SeNice District fee schedule (HeaHh & Safety Code 17951). 

113.8.1 Coat RHovery Fw. Fire service fees may be charged to any person, firm. corporation or busjness 
that throygh negligence. violation of the law. or as a result of carelessness, is responsible for the cause of the 
FJI'e District to respond to the scene of an incident A district board may chame a fee to cover the cost of any 
service which the district PrPYides or the cost of enforcing any regulation for which the fee is charged. (Health 
and Safety Code 13916). The fee shall not exceed the actual cost of supPressing the fire and lor responding to 
the scene of an incident ' 

Ord.-2010.02 Page 2 

Exhibit A 



California, FI" COde* Chapter 5 Amandmenta'· FI,.-Sialse Ftabril 

Section 507"- Fill Protection Water Supplla 

Sections 507.5.1 of ~hapter 5 otthe-Fire-Code of the Cameron Park Community: Service District are amended 
to read as follows: · 

SectIOn 507.5•1 "amended to read - follOwti 

Section' 507.5.1 Wh.,. required. Where a portion of the faCility or building hereafter constructed or moved Into 
or within the jurisdiction is more the 400· .1S ,"t- ttom-a hydrant on ~ fire apparatus access road, as measured 
by an , approved route around' the' exterior of the facility or building, on-site fire hydrants and mains shall be 
provided where required by the flre.code official. 

California FI,.. Cod •• Chapter' Amindmentl- Building StaleR and Syatam 

Section 604 - Emergency and Standby PO)!!r SyttImI 

Sections 604.1 of Chapter 8 of tI)e Fire Code of the Cameron Park· Community Service District are amended to 
read as follows: 

Section 804.1 "Am'ndm,nt _ follqwtj 

Section 604.1 InetallatlOila. Emergency and standby power systems required by this code or the Califomia 
Building Code shall be installed In accordance with this code, NFPA 110 and NFPA 111. All buildings. other 
than agricultural buildings not used for commercial Pyrpose. with Stand-bv power shall have a shunt bip device 
that disconnects all POWer sources to the building. approved by the Fire Code OfficIal. Existing installations 
shall be maintained in accordance with the original approval. 

California Fire Code. Chapter 9 AmlndIlllPtl- Fire Protection Syat9mI 

SectIon 903 - AutogtIc Sprtolder Sy!temI 

:;ection 903.2 " amended to read • follow!; -

Section 903.2 of Chapter 9 of the Fire Code of the Cameron Park Community Service District is amended to 
read as follows, based on climatic, geological and topographical conditions: 

103.3 'MI,,. ,. .. 111,.... App~ fwteFAatia spAAkler eyateFA. iA Aew bwil"iAga fA" _.,Fe •• 1:1811 be 
pFettida4il iA tI:Ie 196aIieA. "eaGFibed iA 8eatieAI 903,~.1 thf8wgI:l9g3j~.1~. 

903.2 Where Mulred. Apqroved. NFPA 13 automatic sprinlsler sYStem shall be required and installed in all 
buildings or structures. greater than 3600 square feel when constructed or relocated within the lurisdiction. 

Exc,ptlon.; 

1. One and two family dwelling units (B-3 OccuPancies)' 

2. Agricultural buildings not under Soecjal Use Permit used for commercial purposes. 

Section. 903.2.a and 903.2.b are 8c1dtd to read • follon: Statua of existing bulldlnu. 

Sections 903.2.a and 903.2.b of Chapter 9 of the Fire Code of the Cameron Park Community Service District 
are added to read as follows, ~ on climatic, geological and topographical conditions: 

Ord.-2010.02 Page 3 

Exhibit A 



· . 
903.2., Statu! of gldna build .... · gru1Ir "'In 3.1OO·HVI,.. faet.. In exjsting buildings 3600 sqyare feet 
or greater. other than one- and two1amjly dwelling units. and aqricU!ttirai bUilding. not ynder Special Use Permit 
for commercial ourposes.' where' the ftoor arM of the byildlng Of structu"·,, ;ncrusad· bY. an'addjtion o"'no". 
than thirty percent-<3Q%l Of 1.000 square feel whichever is less. suet! building. or structure shall be· made to 
conform to Section 903,2;' . . '. 

903.2,0 Statui of Hitting· buIlding 1M than 3,800 BVI" _In existing bulldjngS 3.600 .squara feet or 
lest. other than onHnd two=fariJjly·dwelllnq.unjtl. and agricultural bylldings not under spacial: Ust Permit for 
commercjal' purpos8t.· whefe the: flOor area of the building or strUcture is increSsed· to a total: square' footage 
over 3.600 sQyare feeti bv an addjt!on of more than thirty percent'C30%) or l ;OQO'sqy.ra feel whjcheyer js less· 
such building or structure shafl bam. to conform to Section 903.2. . 

Section 903.2.8" amendld. foIlowIj ' Group R Occvpancl. 

Section 903.2.8.1 of Chapter 9 of the Fire Code of the Cameron Park Community Service District is added to . 
read as follows, based on Climatic. geological and topographical conditions: .. 

Section 903.2.8,1 " added to .M foIlowI; 

Section 903.2.8.1 of Chapter 9 of the Fire Code of the Cameron Park Community service District is added to 
read as follows, based on climatic, geological and topographlesl conditions: . 

903.2.8.1 AutomatIc .prlnlder IV!t!mIlnetalltclln Grgup R. DIy"lon 3 _gunc" 'hI" con(oQD to th. 
followflJlltlncla,.. In addItIOn to NEPA Standlrd 130. 2010 edition; 

1. An interior homIstrobe shalt be mounted In a central location audible from the master bedroom uDOQ 
activation of a flow switch mountedllnstallad at the sPrinkler rjser, 
a. Alternatlv. to interior hom/strobe: An acceotable altarnatiye to the interior ham/strobe is to interconnect 

the flow switch hardwired smoke detectgrs. Upon actiVation of the flow switch. all smoke detectors shall 
~ . 

2. All automatic sPrinkler svstams shall be hydraulically designed and the plans and hydrayllc caJcyIations 
stamPed by a California Ijcenaed C-18 fire PrOtection contractpr or a professional Engineer. 

Th. fAllowing IICtIcm! ar, amendtd by chana Ina california FIre Codt requl"m.nII to 3'- .qgl" feet (or fire 
sprinkler 1"",11ItI00 •.• ·follow! Ctb! complatt tgt gf lb' aactlon " not provided); 

903.2.1.1 9roupA-1. Change 12.000 SQuare feet to 3.600 SQuare feel 
903.2.1.2 Group A-2. Change 5.000 square feet to 3.600 square feet 
903.2.1.3 Groyp A-3. Change 12.000 square feet to 3.600 square feet 
903.2,1.4 Group A-4. Change 12,000 sqys" feet to 3.800 sqyare feet 
903.2.2.1 Group B. All GrouP B OCCUpanctes over 3·600 SQyare feet 
903.2.3 GrouP E. Change 12,000 SQua" feet to 3.800 square feet. 
903.2.4 Group F-l. Change 12.000 square feet to 3.600 square feet 
903.2.7 GroyP M. Change 12.000 sqya" feet to 3,600 square feet 
903.2.. Group 5-1. Change 12.000 square feet to 3.600 square feet 
903.2.10 Group 5-2. Change 12.000 square feet to 3,600 sqyare feet. 

SectIon 807 - Fire Alann and DetactIon Sy!tamt 

Sectlo .. 907.2.1. 907.2.b. and 107.2& are added to rud M folloni 

Sections 907.2.a, 907.2.b and 907.2.c of Chapter 9 of the Fire Code of the Cameron Park Community Service 
District are added to read as follows, based on cfimatic, geological and topographical conditions: 

907.2.1 An apprpyed fire a'inn/detectlon autem shall be installed in all buildings with a ftoor area less than 

Ord.-2010,02 Page 4 

Exhibit A 



3.600 SQuare feet. " 

exceptio .. : 

1. One and two family dwellings (84 3 OccuP8ncies). 

2. Agricultural bYildlngs not under SpeciBl Use Permit used for commercial purposes. 

3. Buildings With a floor area 1_ than 500 sayara feet mav bf exempt as. det8nnined by the fire Chief. based 
on building construction material and features. location. occuP8ncy type~ and distance to exposures, 

9OZ.2.b Statui of nlltlna bylld ..... to extiung buildings without an aQDroved automatic sprinkler system. 
other than one: or two-family dwelling units. agriculturat bYilding not UDder Special Use permit for cornmWal 
purposes where a fire alarm/detection system does not exist and the floor area of th' building or structure is 
increased or modified by mora than thirty percent (30%) or 1.000 sauare feet whjch,ver is less. such building or 
structure shall be made to conform to SectIon 907. Building. with a floor Ii. Ie8s than 500 sauare fee may be 
exempt. as determined by the fil! Chief. based on building construction materials and features. location. 
OCCUpancy tyoe. and distance to exPOSUres. 

907.2.c. Monitoring. All fire alarm/detection systems shall be connected directly through and monitored by a 
U.L. approved central. proprjelary or remote station service. which gjyes audible and visual Signals at a 
coostanUy attended lOcatIon. 

California fir! Cod', Chapter 33 Amendmenta - Exp'OIlva and Flrmo"" 

SectIon 3391.2 " added M {o11oWl: WhIr! _Oliva ptnnttll'lCluJred. 

SectIon 3301.2 of Chapter 33 of the Fire Code of the Cameron Park Community Service District is added to 
read as follows, based on climatic, geological and topographical conditions: 

3301.2 - Eplgtlya Penn",. Where 8XD!osiyeI permjts are reauired. they shaH be Issued by the Fire Chief 
and the EI Dorado County Sheriffs Department 

Section 3308.2 II addld M foIlowI: WIw! "!!WOrD pennttll'lClulnpd. 

Section 3308.2 of Chapter 33 of the Fire Code of the Cameron Park Community Service District is added to 
read as follows, based on climatic, geological and topographical conditions: 

3308·2 - Fll!W9rD Permttl. Where fireworks Permits are required. they shall be issued by the Fire Chief and 
the EI Dorado County Board of Supervisors. 

California FIr! Code. Ch!_ 38 Amendments -llqueftad Pttrofeum Gaul 

Table 3804.3 Footnote "d" " amlnded to I!8d .. folloWl: 

Table 3804.3 Footnote -d- of Chapter 38 of the fire Code of the Cameron Park Community Service District is 
amended to read as follows, based on climatic, geological arid topographical conditions: 

3804.3 footnote "d" • CiOO gallGA8 becomes 250 gallons. Installation of DOT tanks. with setbacks from 
structures less than 10 feet mutt b8 approved by the AHJ. 

SectIon 3812 II added II {oItOWl; High Altltudl Llquafted Petroleum Gal Installatio'" 
(4,000' and Above'. 

Section 3812•1 "added at to'lowa; Rlgulatol!· 

Ord.-2010,02 P'Ie 5, 

Exhibit A 



· . 
Section 3812:1 of-Chapter 38 of the Fire Code of th8 Cameron Park CommunitY Service Pistrict is added to-· .. 
read as follows, based on climatic, geological and topographicalconditionl! 

3812.1 RagulaJp!'!.i Two-stage regulator system shaBbt ins!aHed.IO accordance wjth manytacturer 
requirements" , . .'. . .' 

1-. First staga regulator and connactingplgtajt shall be installed under a protectiVe valVe cover on the :­
tanlt The mounting DOSitiqn of· the·first stage regulator shall be listed -for-thiS applIcatIOn. 

Section 3812~21t addecl." fOllow.: VerVel' Vlrd Rfter Piping, \: 

Section 3812.2 of Chapter 3& of the Fire. COde of the-cameron. Park Community Service District is added to 
rea~- as.followsi based. on'c~I~' geological an-d topographical conditions: 

3812.3 VlrtIcaI Rlar Plplna. ., . . 
1. Minimum of Schedule 4CHi'on piDjna, _ 
2. Riser shall be within' 3 InCh"' hOrizontally of the tank. 
3. Swing lojots shall be Installed above and belOW tank !evel to provide for the tank 
movement -(Street e!bowa shaD not be used;) . 
4. A listed _lb. rtsar constnJCted of copper or stainless steel tubing and protectadby a steel-coyered 
sheathed mater1aJ 'may be used Initaad of swing joints, The flexlble-
atternatjya shaD proylda auffjcient alack to allow, for tank movement; 

Section 3812.3 Ie added. totlOWli Itconct Staal Reautatoa.-

SectIon 3812.3 of Chapter 38 of the Fire Code of the Cameron Park Community Service District Is added to 
read as follows. basad on climatic, geological and topographical conditions: . 

3812.3 Second Staat Reau .... 

1. The riser and second stag. regulator shall be installed on the gable end of the building 
al etOH as-Practicat to-tha building wall. 

Exception: "not feasible due to structural or topograPh!calconstraints. 
2. The riser shall be equipped wjtb a·l_ gas shut off va"" Prior to the second stage 
reaulatot· .' 
3. A protectiyJt covar shall be installed· oyer the second stage regulator and meter (If. 
Installed) at the building; The 'mlnlmum design for the Protective cover and support 
structu,. shall be equal to or gr!l!!r than the bYilding desjgn load as determined by the 
BuildinG-OeP8rtment The suPPOrt structure shalt be securely attached to the building 
wall or ground surfa¢e. . -
4. Riser piping shall not be embedded In asphalt or concrete. 

Exception: If 1 Incb of annular clearance is maintained from all side of the pipjng, 

Section 3I12A Ie added • foIlowIi Middnaa Ind LocItIona. 

Section 3812.4 of Chapter 38 of the Fire Code of the camaron Park Community Service District is added to 
read as follows, based on climatic, geological and topographical conditions: 

3112.4 Marking and LqcatIonI, 
,. An approved sign shall be located directly above the riser shyt off valve on the 
building in a visible location. 
2. The liquefied DItroleum gas supplier shall affix a WeatherProof jdentificat!oo tag to the insjde of the tank valye 
Protecting cover. This tag shall contain the sUARl.S name and emergency telephone numbet 
3. Tank installation shall be D8IlDanently marked by a metal or wood material snow marker. with a minimum 
dimensjoo of 2 inches by 2 Inchea. The snow marKer shall 
be of sufficient height to rise aboye the annual snow depth and shall be a minimum of 
'10 feet in height The snow martsers shall be painted yellow and located on ODposjte 
ends of the tank. 

Onl.-2010.0~ Page 6 

Exhibit A 



· . 
SectIon 3813 II added to read .101_: Und.mround,Llqu ..... PetroleumGMJank'DIta'laJIon •. 

Section 3813 of Chapter'38 of the Fire COde of the Cameron Park Community Service District Is added to read , ' 
as follows; based on climatic, geological and topographical conditions: ' 

Stction 3813.111 added to "'"' • to'Ion;' Petmltl and p ..... 

Section ,3813.1' of Chapter, 38'of the Fire COd&of the cameron Park Community Service' District Is added to 
read as follows, ~sect-.On'cllmatic; geologiCal and topographical:.conditlOns: - ' 

3813.1 - Ptrmltt ,and,p'aOl.,Plrmitl shall be reoyjred and plans shall be submjtted for all ynderground tank 
installations and aPDl'Oved by the AHJ. 

Appendix B - FIr! Flow R9qU'rementl for Bulldln. 

Section B1OS.1 .hall be am'nded 'M foUow!; 

Section B105.1 of Appendix B of the Fire Code of the Cameron Park Community Service Olsbict Is amended to 
read as follows, based on climatic, geological and topographical conditions: 

SectIon B101.1 Is am.nd., _ foll9wl; 

Exception: A reduction In required fire flow of 50 percent, as approved, is allowed When the buHdlng is provlded 
with an approved automatic sprinkler system as long as the redyction in fire flOW Is not less than 1000 gallons 
oer mjnute. 

Section B105.2 - Building. oth" than, on. and two family mllin.; 

Section B105.2 of Appendix B of the Fire Code of the Cameron Park Community Service District Is amended to 
read as follows, based on climatic, geological and topographical conditions: 

SectIon B1M.2 II amended _ foIlOW!i 

ExcePtions; 

1. A reduction in required fire flow up to -16 50 percent, as approved, is aHowed When the building Is 
provided with an,aPProved automatic sprinkler system installed In accordance with Sections 
903.3.1.1 or 903.3.1.2. The resulting fire flow shall not be less than 1,500 gallons per minute for the 
prescribed duration as specified' in Table B1 05.1. 

Appendix D - Fire Appandul Accw RoIcIa 

SectIon D103 - Minimum SQ8CIflcatlOOI 

Section D103.6.1 .hall bt amended _ foiloWl; Road. from 20 to 21 feet In width. 

Section 0103.6.1 of Appendix 0 of the Fire Code of the Cameron Park Community Service District is amended 
to read as foHows, ba~ on climatic, geological and topographical conditions: 

D103.8.1 Road! from 20 to 21 flit In Width. Fire aparatus access roads. 20 to 29 feet wide. shall be POSted 
on both sides as'a fire lane. with no parking allowed on either side of the roadway. 

Section D103.8.2 .h,1I be amended u folloW!; ROId. from 30 to 35 feet In width. 

SectIon 0103.6.2 of Appendix 0 of the Fire Code of the Cameron Park Community Service District is amended 

Ord.-2010.02 Page 7 

Exhibit A 



.. 
to read, as foDOWSi basad on climatic, geologjcal and topograp~lcal conditions: 

0103.&.2 Boadafrom,3gto'31fft1lnwldtlt;;' Fire'apparatus access roads. W ,tf) 3S_wide. shall be 'POsted 
on one side as No Psrislnq, Fire t.8ne,' wjVi .,ang aI!owect onIv on tne opposite side of the roadway. , 

Section 0103.8.3: shall-be Iddtd'. follows; ROt'" 38 flit aof gm'" 1ft wJdIb,;; " 

Section 0103.6.3 of AppendbcO of the-Fire Code of the Cameron Park COmmunity S8fVice District is added to : 
read 88 follows, based on'climatlct g,QtogIc8I>8nc:t topographical-cOnditions;, ' ' . . - . 

0103.8.3 Rc)adI '31-,.-and gr..r '''width. 'Fire IpparaMaccesa road§, 38 feet and greater in wjdtb. rDay, 
allow parking, on-'?Ovrsjdea'or the roadway. 

section 0104 - Commercial and IndMltrlaI DeY ..... ; 

Section 0104.3 shall bt amended to IUd II fol",; 

Section 104.3 of Appendix 0 of the Fire Code,of the Cameron Park Community Service District is amended to · 
read as folton; baled on ,climate, geological and topographical conditions: 

SectIon 0104.3 Remotenwr . Where two access roads are required, they shaD be placed a distanc:& apart 
equal to not less than' one half of the length of the maximum overall diagonal dimension of the property or area 
to be served, measufed In a s~ht line between accesses. 

Exception: Fire apDllltus mads cannot be installed because of location an proD8rtv. topography. waterways. 
nonnegotiable grades or similar condjtion. and an approved alternative means of fire protection IS provided. 

Section 0107 - 0 ..... or _family _Ulog ",ldtntlll dev.lopm.ntl 

Sectioo 0107.1 shall bt a,",oded to !'lid - foll9Wl; 0,"", or two-flmlly clwellina "'1d.ntIa' d!y!Ioprnentl. 

~ D107.1 -af AppendiX 0 of, the Fim Code of the Cameron Park Community Service District is amended to 
read as follows, based on climatic, geological and topographical conditions: 

0107.1 One- or twoiImlly dwelling !Did_a' davalopmentl; Developments Qf one- or two- family 
dwellings where the number of dwelling units exceed 30 ~ shall be provided with separate and approved fire 
apparatus access roads and shall meet the requirements of section 0104.3. 

&M6aptiaA8: 

1. ~eA theM aM ~are than 30 dwelllAI YAita aA a siAl1e pyblle ar pm_ appaFatYs aG988S F8H aAcj all 
cjwelliAI YAlta are .qYiP. &hFeYlhaut 'iM&h aA a,.revH aYteFRaIia spARkler syata~ iR aeeaAiaAG8 .. -. 
a_aAs 9Q3.3.1.1, 903.3.1.2 ar 903.3.1.3, aSG868 lieFR "'va aif86tiaA8 ahall Rat be f'e'lYiAKi. 

~. Th. AYFRbar at .v.IIiAI YAita aA a siRgle 1M appa'FatYs aGsala Feast shall be iRGAla8M YRIeeI fiM apparatus 
aGG8S8 Feaas'tAlI G9RReet .. fytyM &8\'elapFR.Rl, 88 stataRRiRM by &he' fire 69&e affIslal. 

Section 3. ESTMUSHING YMITS: 

That the geographic limits referred to in certain sections of the Fire Code of Cameron Park COmmunity Service 
District are hereby established 88 follows: 

SectIoo 3204.2.1.8.1 - Geoaraphlc 11m"' in which storage of flammable cryogenic fluids In atatIonary 

Ord.-2010.02 Page 8 

Exhibit A 



· . 
contll"", II problbltad: .. 

The limits referred to in s,ction 3204.2.9.6.1 of the Fire Code of cameron· Park Community $&Nice District in 
which storage of flammable cryogenic fluids In stationary ,containers is prohibited are h~reby established as the . 
limits of the cameron PaikCommunlty.Service District, County of EI Dorado. 

The sloraoe of flammable cryogenic flujds In statlonarv containers is allowed in an AHJ approyad Commercjal, 
Industrial Zone With· a SD8CialiConditionat: Usa permit· Rued by the County·of EI Dorado, 

SectiODt 34Qf.2M·· Gtoarapblc 11m", 'n whteb, flam_bl. or combustible liqUid! In .boVHfOund 
tanka 0UtI1d! of bu11dlba! II PI'Ohlbltad; · . 

The limits, referred to in Sections 3406.2.4.4 of the Fire Code of Cameron Park COmmunity Serv~ District in 
which the storage of Class I flanimable liquids or Class II combustible Hqulds in above-ground tanks outside of 
buildings Is restricted, are hereby established as the limits of the Cameron Park Community Service District, 
County of EI Dorado. 

The storage of Clm I flammable liquid, or Class " combustible liquids in aboye-around tanks outside of 
buildings is allowed· in an AHJ approved CommercjaJ. Industrial Zone wjth a SpecjaVCondltlona' Usa permit 
issued by the County of EI DoradO. 

S!ctloM 3 .. 2 • GeograPhIC Ibn"' In whlcb flammable or comb_bl.llgu.'n aboyHround tanka II 
D!'Oblblt!di 

The limits, referred to in Sections 3506.2 of the Fire Code of Cameron Park Corrmunity Service District in which 
the storage of Class I flammable liquids or Class " combustible liquids in above-ground tanks is restricted, are 
hereby established as the limits of the Cameron Park Community Service District, County of EI Dorado. 

The·storage of Class I flammable liquids or Class" combustible liquids In aboye-ground tanks js allowed in an 
AHJ approved ComrDert:ia1. IndQstrjaI Zone With, a Special/Conditional Use Permit issyed by the County of EI 
Dorado. 

SectIon 3804.2 • Gaoaraphlc limit! In which Ito •• of Ilquefted petroleum a .... II to be !!8trIct!d for the 
protection of beaylly populatld and COnantad a!lll; , 

The limits, refe(red to in Section 3804.2 of the California Fire Code, in which storage of liquefied petroleum gas in 
excess of an aggregata of 2,000 gallons water capacity Is restricted, are herebY established as limits of the 
Cameron Park Community Service District, County of EI Dorado. 

1. The storaoe of liquefied oetroleum 9U in excess of an aggregate of 2.000 gallons water caD8Cjty when 
located at least onHalf (112) mile from property zoned or designated for residential use and at least one­
half (112) mile from existing residential develoPment with a density greater than one (1) dweRlng unit per 
acre and at least one-half (112) mile from any hotel or motel js allowed when AHJ approved and a 
SceclaVCondltional Use Perrott is issued by the County of EI Dorado. . 

2.' DiSPensing within astabljshed limits. Within the limits established bv law restrjcting the dispersion of 
liquefied petroleum gas for the protection of heavily populated or congested areas. the aggregate capacjty 
of anyone installation shag not exceed a water capacity of 2.000 gallons. The dispensing of liquefied 
PBtroleum gas in excess of an aggregate of 2.000 gallons water caoacity when located at least one-half 
(112) mile from property zoned or designated for residential usa and at least one-half (112) mile from existing 
residential deVelopment With a densitY greater than one (1) dwelling unit per acre and at least onHalf (112) 
mHe from any hotel or motel is allowed when AHJ approved and a SoecjallCondjtional Use Pewit is issued 
by the County of EI Dorado. . 

Section 4: CONFLICT 

Ord.-2010.02 Page 9 

Exhibit A 



" . 
That Ordlnance'No. 2008.01.16 o'-the Cameron Park Community Servlce'DIstrict. and a11·other ordinances. or 
parts of ordinances herewlth'are hereby repealect. · . . 

Section- 5: SEVERABlurt· 

If any Ordinance; article. subsection or subdtvlslon thereof, provl8lon, sentence, clause or phraae.rJf this' code. or 
any application' thereof,: Is for any reason. held to be invalid. by. a court·of competent jurisdiction, such decision­
shaH not affact the remaining provisions· ot.thls code; whlctr 'can be giVen effect without the Invalid: portions and~ 
thereforej.· such Invalid portions· are ,declared· to be severable; The ,Cameron Park COmmunity· Serlfce .Olstrfct . . 
hereby declares that It would· have eriacted this: Ordinance ai1d eactt. of· ItS, articIea, sectIona, subsections, or '. 
subdIVisions thereof, provisions, sentences. clauseS or phrases Irrespec:tlveof the'fact that'one or more of them 
is declared Invalid. 

SecOon 8: .FFECJNE PATE AND' PUBUCATlQNi. 

this Ordinance shan take effect thirty (30) days after its, adoption. The Cameron Park Community Service. 
. Dlstrfct Board Secretary Ia dlrectad to publish thla ordinance I" -= newspaper of general circulation In the DI8trk:l 

In lieu of publication of the fuU text of the ordinance, a SUlTV"ary of Qte ordinance may be .publ/ahed by the by the 
Board secretary within fifteen (15) days after Ita paasage and a certified copy shall be posted"ln the offtce of the 
Cameron Park Community ServIca Dlstrfct, pursuant to Govemment Code sectIOn 38933(c) (1). ' 

The above Ordinance was Introduced at a meeting of the Board of Olractora of the Cameron Park COmmunity ServIce 
District on the 22111 day of October, 2010 and It was then read tor the first tlma. The Ordinance was read tor the second 
time on the 1"" day of November, 2010 and approved by the following vote: 

PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of Olrectora of the Cameron Park Community Service District thla, 17'" day of 
November, 2010. . 

AYES: (,02:8. (':d~UN I JOibl!lotlJ CLA~\cf.. 

NOES: 

ABSENT: 

ABSTAIN: 

Ord.-2010.02 Page 
10 

Exhibit A 



EXHIBITB 

CALIFORNIA CODE OF REGULATIONS, TITLE 24, PART 9, CALIFORNIA 
FIRE CODE, AMENDMENTS 

CLARIFICATIONS (UNDERLINED PORTIONS) 

Chapter 9, Section 903.2: 

Exceptions: 

1. One and two family dwelling units (R-3 Occupancies). (See Section R313 of 
the 2010 California Residential Code that requires all one and two family 
dwellings to be equipped with an NFPA 13D sprinkler system.) 

2. Agricultural buildings, except any agricultural building which is flot \:lftaer 
speeial use permit used for commercial purposes (e.g. retail sales. food service 
and/or special events). 

Chapter 9, Section 907.2.a: 

Exceptions: 
1. One and two family dwellings (R-3 Occupancies and other occupancies 

classified as "U. ") 

2. Agricultural buildings, except any agricultural building which is flot 1:1fiaer 
speeial use permit used for commercial purposes (e.g. retail sales. food service 
and/or special events). 

Chapter 38, Section 3804.3: 

Footnote "d" - becomes 250 gallons. Installation of DOT tanks, with setbacks 
from structures less than 10 feet, must be approved by the Fire AHJ.!. 

Chapter 38, Section 3813: 

Permits and Plans. Permits shall be required and plans shall be submitted for all 
underground tank installations and approved by the Fire AHJ. 




