
RESOLUTION NO. 042-2011 

OF THE BOARD OF SUPERVISORS OF THE COUNTY OF EL DORADO 

(REPEALING RESOLUTION NO. 32-2008) 

WHEREAS, the California Code of Regulations, Title 24, Part 9, the California Fire Code, is updated by the 
State every three years; and, 

WHEREAS, the 2010 California Fire Code became effective on January 1, 2011; and, 

WHEREAS, local jurisdictions may establish more restrictive building standards reasonably necessary because 
of local climatic, geological or topographical conditions; and, 

WHEREAS, the California Code of Regulations, Health and Safety Code, Division 12, Part 2, Chapter 1, 
Article 2, Section 13146, assigns responsibility for enforcement of fIre safety regulations to the local level and 
grants authority to delegate enforcement to the chief building offIcial, or his or her authorized representative, or 
to the chief of the fIre protection district, or his or her representative; and, 

WHEREAS, enforcement of the Fire Code in the County of EI Dorado has historically been shared by the 
County Building OffIcial and the local Fire Agencies according to the knowledge and skills each possesses; and, 

WHEREAS, on December 8,2010, the EI Dorado County Fire Protection District Board of Directors adopted 
Ordinance No. 2011-01, which adopted the 2010 California Fire Code with amendments the District deemed 
necessary to deal with local climate, geological or topographical conditions. 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that the Board of Supervisors of the County ofEI Dorado ratifIes 
the following building code Amendments to the California Fire Code adopted by the E1 Dorado County Fire 
Protection District, attached as Exhibit A, with the clarifIcations attached as Exhibit B: Chapter 1 - 105.6.27; 
Chapter 5 - 507.5.1; Chapter 6 - 604.1; Chapter 9 - 903.2, 903.2.a, 903.2.b, 903 .2.8, 903.2.8.1, 903.2.1.1, 
903.2.1.2,903 .2.1.3,903.2.1.4,903.2.2.1,903.2.3, 903.2.4, 903.2.7, 903.2.9, 903.2.10, 907.2.a, 907.2.b, 
907.2.c; Chapter 38 - 3804.3 Footnote lid," 3812, 3812.1, 3812.2, 3812.3, 3812.4, 3813.1; Appendix B­
BI05.1, BI05.2. 

mmacfarland
Typewritten Text
11-0163
Item 21
3/29/11

mmacfarland
Typewritten Text

mmacfarland
Typewritten Text

mmacfarland
Typewritten Text
11-0163
Item 21
3/29/11

mmacfarland
Typewritten Text



Resolution No. __ 04_2_-_2_0_11 __ Page 2 of2 

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that the Board of Supervisors of the County of El Dorado delegates the 
enforcement of the Building Standards of the 2010 Fire Code for one and two family dwellings, and accessory 
structures thereto, to the County Building Official, or his or her authorized representative, and for all other fire 
code enforcement to the Chief of the El Dorado County Fire Protection District, or his or her authorized 
representative, for the territory served by that District. 

PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of Supervisors of the County ofEl Dorado at a regular meeting of said 
Board, held the 29th day of March , 20 ~ by the following vote of said Board: 

Attest: 
Suzanne Allen de Sanchez 

ClerkOftheBoardO~ 

BY:~ 
Dep rk 

I CERTIFY THAT: 

Ayes: Knight, Sweeney, Nutting 
Noes: Briggs 
Absent Santiago 

~~tftoors 
Raymond J. Nutting 

THE FOREGOING INSTRUMENT IS A CORRECT COpy OF THE ORIGINAL ON FILE IN THIS OFFICE. 

Attest: Suzanne Allen de Sanchez, Clerk of the Board of Supervisors of the County of EI Dorado, State of 
California. . 

By: Date: 
Deputy Clerk 



. . t . ORDINANCE NO. 2011-01 
., , , AN ORDINANCE OF EL DORADO COUNTY FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT 

"CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE" WITHIN EL DORADO COUNfY 

BE IT ORDAINED BY TIlE EI DORADO COUNTY FIRE DISTRICT AS FOLLOWS: 

An ordinance of the E1 Dorado County Fire Protection District adopting the 2010 edition of the California Fire 
Code, based upon the 2009 edition of the International Fire-Code, regulating and governing the safeguarding 
of life and property from fire and explosion hazards arising from the storage, bandling and use of hazardous 
substances, materials and devices, and ftom conditions hazardous to life or property in the occupancy of 
buildinp and premises in the EI Dorado County Fire Protection District; providing for the issuance of permits 
and collection of fees therefore; repealing Ordinance No. 2007-01 of the EI Dorado County Fire Protection 
District and all other ordinances and parts of the ordinances in contlict therewith. 

SectiOD 1: ADOPfION OF CODE: 
SeetiOD Z: CAIJFOBNIA FIRE CODE, AMENDMENTS: 
SeetioD 3: ESTAB1.Rm!NG LIMITS; 
SeetiOD 4: CONlLlCl' 
SeetiOD 5: SEYERABp·m 
SeetiOD 6: EMCI'IYE DATE AND PUBLICATION: 

SeetioD I: ADQmoN OF CODE: 

That a certain document, three (3) copies of which are on file in the office of the Secretary of the EI Dorado 
County Fire Protection District Board, being marked and designated as the California Fire Code, 2010 edition, 
in its entirety, and the following lnternational Fire Code Sections and Anmicnces not adQpted by the State of 
California; 101.3. 103.1 thru 103.4.1. 104.1 tbru 104.11.3. 106.1. 107.1 tbru 107.6. 108.1 thru 108,3. 112. 
113.1 tbru 113.6.1. 303.1 tbru 303,9. 305.1 thru 305.4. 307.1. tbru 307.5. 308.1 thru 308.5. 408.1 tbru 
408.11.3. and Appendix 0101. 0103.1. 0103.4. 0103.5. 0103.6. 0105.1 tbru 0105.3. 0107.1 F. and J. 
based on the 2009 edition of the International Fire Code as published by the International Code Council, be 
and is hereby adopted as the Fire Code of the EI Dorado County Fire Protection District, in the State of 
California regulating and governing the safeguarding of life and property from fire and explosion hazards 
arising ftom the storage, handling and use of hazardous substances, materials and devices, and from conditions 
hazardous to life or property in the occupancy of buildings and premises as herein provided; providing for the 
issuance of permits and collection of fees therefore; and each and all of the regulations, provisions, penalties" 
conditions and terms of said Fire Code on file in" the office of the El Dorado County Fire Protection District 
are hereby referred to, adopted, and made a part hereof, as if fully set out in this ordinance, with the additions, 
insertions, deletions and changes, if any, prescribed in Section 2 of this ordinance. 

Seetion Z: California Fire Code, Chapter 1 AmeDdment! - Ssope and AdministratioD: 

The foUowing SeetiODJ are hereby aJ:lleDded: 

Ord.-2010.02 Page 1 

Exhibit A 



. . Section'lOS-- Permits 

SectioB 105.6.26 Is ameDded u foUm.: LP Gu. 

Section 105.6.27 of Chapter 1 of tho Fire Code of the EI Dorado County Fire Protection District is 
amended to read as follows, based on climatic, geological and topographical conditions: 

105.6.27 - LP Gu 

1. Storage and use of LP-gas. 

Exeeption: A permit is not required for individual containers with a ~ 100 gallon water capacity or 
less serving occupancies in Group R-3. 

Seetiop 109 - VlolatioDl 

Seetlon 109.3 is amended u followI; ViOlatiOD pen.lties. 

Section 109.3 of Chapter 1 of tho Fire Code of the EI Dorado County Fire Protection District is 
amended to read as follows: 

SectiOD 109.3 Violation penaltl.. Persons who sball violate a provision of this code or shall fail to 
comply with any of the requirements thereof or who shall erect, install, alter, repair or do work in 
violation of the approved construction documents or directive of the fire code official, or of a permit or 
certificate used under provisions of this code, shall be guilty of a misdemeanor. ptmjsbable by a fine of 
not more than $1000.00 dollars and/or by imprisonment not exceeding 6 months. or both such fine and 
imprisonment Each day that a violation continues after due notice has been served shall be deemed a 
separate offense. (Health & Safety Code Section 13145 and 17995). 

SestioD 111- Stop Work Orden 

Seetin 111.4 is ameDded u foDml: faDm to comply. 

Section 111.4 of Chapter 1 of the Fire Code of the EI Dorado County Fire Protection District is 
amended to read as follows: 

111.4. Failure to comply. Any person who shall continue any work after having been served with a 
stop work order, except such work as that person is directed to perform to remove a violation or unsafe 
condition, sball be liable to a fine of not less than 5500. or not more than $1,000. (Health & Safety 
Code Section 13145 and 17995). 

Sectfog 113.6 and 113.6.1 an added u (oUo",.: Fees. 

Sections 113.6 and 113.6.1 of Chapter 1 of the Fire Code of the EI Dorado County Fire Protection 
District are added to read as follows: 

Ord.-Z010.OZ Page 2 

Exhibit A 



113.6 Permit, Ply Review aad I_ecti0n Fees. A schedule of fees adopted by the Fire District 
Board of Directors for Plan Review. Inspections and the issuance of Permits by the Fire District·may 
be found in the most current El Dorado County Fire Protection District fee schedule <Health & Safety 
Code 179Sl). 

113.6.1 Cost Recoyea Fees. Fire service fees maY be charged to any person. firm.. corporation or 
blL1inm that thmugh negligence. violation of the Jaw. or as a result of rmkmn". is responsible for 
the cause of the Fire District to respond to the scene of an incident A district board maY cham a fee 
to COver tho cost of any seryice which the district proyides or the cost of enforcina any regulation for 
which tho fee is charaed. <Health gnd Safety Code 13916>. The fee ,hall DOt exceed the actual cost of 
suqpres.trins the fire and lor npmdins to the gne ofan incident 

California Fire Code, Chepter 5 4mepdmepg- Fire Sema Fgtgm 

Section 507 - Fire Proteetlop Water SuppH. 

Sections S07.5.1 of Chapter S of the Fire Code of the El Dorado County Fire Protection District is 
amended to read as follows: 

Sestio. 507.5.1 "_'Deled to read M foDows; 

Section 507.5.1 When required. Where a portion of the facility or building hereafter constructed or 
moved into or within the jurisdiction is more than 400 150 feet from a hydrant on a fire apparatus 
access road, as measured by an approved route around the exterior of the facility or building, on-site 
fire hydrants and mains shall be provided where required by the fire code official. 

CaUforDla Fire Code, Chapter 6 Amendmeats - BuDdinl Seryiees aDd System 

Seetion 604 - Emerge. agd Standby Power SysteJIII 

Sections 604.1 of Chapter 6 of the Fire Code of the El Dorado County Fire Protection District is 
amended to read as follows: 

Section 604.1 it amended M foDows; 

Section 604.1 JutallatioaL Emergency and standby power systems required by this code or the 
California Building Code shall be installed in accordance with this code, NFPA 110 and NFP A Ill. 
All building other than Agricultural BuiJdinp not used for commercial purpose. with Stand-by power 
shall have a shunt trip device that disconnect;c& all power sources to the building. approved by the Fire 
Code Official. Existing installations shall be maintained in accordance with the original approval. 

CaHfomia FIre Code. Chuter 9 Amendments - Fire ProteetioD SystelD! 

Section 903 - Automatic Sprinkler SnteDII 

Ord.-2010.02 Page 3 

Exhibit A 



Sestion;903.1 is amended to pad a. follow,; 
, 

Sedion 9032 of Chapter ~ of the Fire Code of tho EI Dorado County Fire Protection District is 
amended to read as follows, based on climatic, geological and topographical conditions: 

9Naa WheN Nfl .... l'\pPIU·JeEI a_lBMio spliBldar ~ ill MW hMil" _ &tI1IetYIe8 slIaU 
he pre'lided ill .,lee.eM deaeRhed ill 8ee&8B8 900.2.1 thre1lgll99a,2J2. 

903.2 When-nagind. Approved. NFPA 13 autOmatic pinkler system !!h,n be required and 
installed -in all building or structures. sreater than 3600 square feet. when constructed or relocated 

• thin th • urisdicU' ~_el oD. 

Exceptio ... ; 

I. One and two famHy dwelling units CR-3 Occupancies). 

2. A&ricultural building not under Special Use Permit used for commercial PWQOses. 

SestiODl 903.1. gel 903,2.b an .dded to read M follows; Statu ofgistiDl bgildlDa. 

Sections 903.2.8 and 903.2.b of Chapter 9 of the Fire Code of the EI Dorado County Fire Protection 
District are added to read as follows, based on climatic, geological and topograpbical oonditions: 

903.1.. Statui of eDstlpl buDding mater thy 3.6" "JIll'! feet. In exWing .building 3600 
square feet or pater. other than one: and two::fiunily dwelling units. and agricultural hnildinp not 
under Special Use Permit for commercial purposes. where the floor area of the miwtinR or structure is 
increased by an addition of more thAD thirty percent (30%) or 1.000 square feet. whichever is less. such 
building or structure shall be made to conform to Section 903.2. 

903.2.b StaN, of eptip. buildiDa leu the! 3.600 "pm feet. In exffltjng building 3.600 square 
feet or less. other than one-anci two-family dwelling units. and agricultural hniJdinp not under Special 
Use Permit fQr commercial pumoses. where the floor area of the building or structure is increased to 8 

total SQuare footage oyer 3.600 square feet. by an addition of more thAD thirty percent (30%) or 1.000 
SQuare feet. whichever is less. such building or structure WIl be mnde to conform to Section 903,2. 

Seetion 903,2,8 is amepded u foROWI; Group R Ossupandes 

Section 903.2.8,1 of Chapter 9 of the Fire Code of the EI Dorado County File Protection District is 
added to read as follows, based on climatic, geological and topographical conditions: 

Section 203.1.8.1 is added to read M foRow,; 

Section 903.2,8.1 of Chapter 9 of the Fire Code of the EI Dorado County Fire Protection District is 
added to read as follows, based on climatic, geological and topographical conditions: 

903~8.1 Automatic sprinkler mteDII ilytalled in Group R. Divbion 3 oeeupansies shall 

Ord.-Z010,OZ Page 4 

Exhibit A 



. 
. . eODfol'Dl to the (oHow. standards, in addition· to NFP A StandanlI3D; 2010 edition;. -

t. An interiorhomlstrobe shall bet-mounted. in a' central location audible from the master bedroom,: : 
upon activation ofa-flow switch mounted/installed at the. ginkler riser. . . 
a. Altemativeto interior hom/strobe: An acce,ptable alternative'to the interior hornlstl'obe is to . 

interconnect taw ·flow switch hardwired smoke detectors; UPOn activation of the . flow switch. ... 
all smoke detectors Mall sound. . , 

2. AU automatic ginlder systems Mall be hydlauncallv desianed And· the: plan!! and· hydlaullc .. 
calculations-groped by a California licensed-C-16 fire protectiOn contractor or a PiOfessional -
fingins' . 

The followint HStfoDl are amended by shlpliD' C.llforpia FIre Code requirements to 3.600 agum feet 
for fin 'prinldtr iDltaUatfog, M foUsnu (the eomplete tat of the section if not Droyided); 

903.11.1 OroupA-1. Change 12000 square feet to 3,600 SQuare feet. 
903.2.1,2 GroupA-2. Chango S,ooo square feet to 3.600 SQuare feet. 
903.l.1.3 GroupA-3. CbanIl8 12.000 square feet to 3.600 square feet. 
903.11.4 GroupA-4. Chang 12.000 SQuare feet to 3,600 SQuare feet. 
903.2.1.1 GroupB. All Oroup B occupancies OVer 3,600 square feet. 

GroupE. Change 12,000 square feet to 3,600 sgyare feet. 
903,y GroypF-1. ChRllF 12.000 square feet to3,6OQ square feet. 
903JJ GroupM. Change 12.000 square feet to 3.600 square feet. 
903.2.2 GroypS-1. Chanfl!!i 12.000 sgyare feet to 3.600 square feet. 
903,2.10 GrouoS-2. ChAPge J2,QQO square feet to 3,600 sguare feel 

Seetion 907 - FIre Alarm and Detection SvstelDl 

SeetioDl907.1.a. 907.2.b, and 907.1e are added to read as foHow.: 

Sections 907.2.8, 907.2.b and 907.2.c of Chapter 9 of the Fire Code of the EI Dorado County Fire 
Protection District are added to read as follows, based on climatic, geological and topographical 
conditions: 

907.2 .. All approved fire "arm/detection system shall be installed in all buildings with a floor area 
less thaD 3,600 square feet. 

Exeeptions: 

1. One and two family dwellings CR-3 Occupancies) 

2. Agricultural building!! not lDlder Special Use Permit used for commercial purposes. 

3. BuiJdinW! with a floor area less than SOO sguare feet may be exempt as determined by the Fire 
Chief, based on bui1dina construction material and features, location. occupancy type, and distance to 
exposures. 

Ord.-Z010.0Z Pap 5 

Exhibit A 



· . 907.l.b Statal of eutin. buildiDa. In existing building without an approved·automatic sprinkler 
SYstem. other than one- or two-familY dwelling units. agricultural building not under Special Use· 
permit for commercial pw;poses where a fire alarm/detection system does not exist and the floor area 
of the building or structure is increased or modified by more than thirty percent (30%) or 1.000 square 
feet. whichever is· I. such buildina or structure Mall be made to confOrm to Section 907. BniliJinp . 
with a. floor area less thAD 500 Square fee may be exempt. as determined by the Fire Chiet: based on 
building construction material, and features, location. oCC1JP8DCY typCh and distance to exposures· 

907.J.e. Moattorba. All fire alarm/detection systems pH be connected directly thmupb and 
monitored by a U .L. approved central. proprietary or remote station seryiCC2; which giyes audible and 
visual signal, at a constantly attended location. 

CaUfoml. Fire Code. Chapter 33 Amendments - EJ:plOliyes and FJmvorks 

Section 3301.2 ·Is added as fOUOWIi Where emlOliyes pengitI required. 

Section 3301.2 of Chapter 33 of the Fire Code of the EI Dorado County F4'e Protection District is 
added to read as follows, based· on climatic, geological and topographical conditions: 

3301,2 - Emlosiyet Permits. Where explof!iyes permits are required. they Mall be issued by the Fire 
Chiefand the EI Dorado County Sheriff's Dgmtmenl 

Section 33N is added y f011o!!li Where fimvorks permit! required. 

Section 3308.2 of Chapter 33 of the Fire Code of the EI Dorado County Fire Protection District is 
added to read as follows, based on climatic, geological and topographical conditions: 

3308.2 - Fireworks Permits. Where fireworks permits are required. they Mall be issued by the Fire 
Chief and the EI Dorado County Board of Supervisors. 

CaUfomi. Fire Cod" Chapter 38 Amendments - Liquefied Petroleum Gases 

Table 3804.3 Footnote lad" is .ended to read 81 foUOWI: 

Table 3804.3 Footnote lid" of Chapter 38 of the Fire Code of the EI Dorado County Fire Protection 
District is amended to read as follows, based on clima~c, geological and topographical conditions: 

3804.3 Footnote lad" - Sgg gaIIS88 becomes 250 gallons. Installation of DOT tanks. with ,etbacb 
from structures less than 10 feet must be approved by the AHJ. 

Sectiop 3812 It added IS foUen,,: mph Altitude Liquefied remleu .. Gas Installetionl 
(4.000' IDd Above). 

Seetion 3812.1 il added M foUows; Renlaton. 
Section 31112.1 of Chapter 38 of the Fire Code of the EI Dorado County Fire Protection District is 
added to read as follows, based on climatic, geological and topographical conditions: 

Oni.·Z010.0Z Page 6 

Exhibit A 



· . j812 •• Rwlaton. Two-stage regulator system shall be installed in accordance with manufacturer 
requirements. 

1. First stage regulator and connecting pigtail shall be installed under a protective valvo cover 
on the tank, The mounting position of the first stage regulator shall be listed for thi!! 
application. 

Sectiop 3812.2 it added u loDOlfS; vertical Yard Riser Plgine. 

Section 3812.2 of Chapter 38 of the Fire Code of the EI Dorado County Fire Protection District is 
added to read as follows, based on climatic, geological and topographical conditions: 

3812.1 veJtlgl Riser Pigip!: 
1. Minimum of Schedule 40-iron piping. 
2. Riser ShAn be within 3 inches horizontally of tho tank, 
3. Swina joints shall be installed above and below tAnk level to provide for the tank 
movement (Street elbows shall not be used,) 
4. A listed flexible riser constructed ofCQp'per or @inless steel tubing and protected by a steel 
covered sheathed mAterial maY be used instead ofswin& joints. The flexible 
alternative !lib," proyide fflJfficient slA£* to allow for tank movement 

Seetiop 38113 is added u 'oDOWI; Second Stag Replaton. 

Section 3812.3 of Chapter 38 of tho Fire Code of the EI Dorado County Fire Protection District is 
added to read as follows, based on climatic, geological and topographical conditions: 

3812.3 Second Stage Renlaton. 

I. The riser and second stye regnlatnI MAn be installed on the gaMe end of the building 
as close as practical to the building wall. 

Exception: Ifnot feyible due to structural or topographical constraints. 
2. The riser "ban be equipped with a listed US shut off valve prior to the second stage 
regulAtor. 
3. A protective coyer "ban be installed OVer the ses;ond staae regulator and meter (if 
installed) at the building. The minimum design for the protective COVer and syp,port 
structure sbaH be equal to or mater than the building desi8ll10ad as detenninpi by the 
Building De,partment. The sYP,POrt structure shall be securely attached to the buiJding 
wall or ground surface. . 
4. Riser piping shaH not be embedded in asphalt or concrete. 

Exception: If 1 inch of annular clearance is mAintained from all side of the piping. 

Section 3812.4 is added u loDo",; MBrIdnp and Locations. 

Section 3812.4 ofCbapter 38 of the Fire Code of the EI Dorado County Fire Protection District is 
added to read as follows, based on climatic, geological and topographical conditions: 

3812.4 Markin. and LoeatiODL 
1. An gpproved sign shall be located directly above the riser shut off valve on the 

Ord.-2010.02 Page 7 

Exhibit A 



.bOOdina in a visible location. 
. , 2. The liguefied petroleum gas supplier shall affix a weatherproof identification ty to the inside oftbe 

tank valve protecting COVer. This tag shall contain the supplier's name and emergency telephone 
number. 
3. Tank "llation shall be permanently mlrked by a metal or wood material snow marker. with a 
minimum dimension of2 inches by 2 inches. The snow marker shall 
be ofsufticient· height to rise above the '"nuel snow dej)th and mall be a minimum of 
10 feet in height. The snow markers §hall be painted yellow and located on QP,POsite 
ends of the tank. 

Seetiol 3813 " added to read M foUO!!!; UDdel'll'OaDd Llguet1ed Petro1epm Gy l.nk Tmfpllatlou. 

Section 3813.1 of Chapter 38 of the Fire Code of the HI Dorado County Fire Protection District is 
added to read as follows, based on climatic, geological and topographical conditions: 

Seetioa 3113.1 Is added to read u foUows; Perpaip IDd pl .... 

3813.1 - Penpitl lAd P.'PI. Penni*! shtll be required and plans maJ' be submitted for all 
underground tJmk jtwtaI1ations apd approved by the AHJ. 

AppeDcih B - FIn Flow RegpimpeDts for BuOdID. 

SeetiOD BI05 - Flre-Fiow Rea .... eg .. for BniId'pPi 

Sedlon BI05.1 shall be lIDeaded M foUO!!I; 

Section BIOS.I of Appendix B of the Fire Code of the El Dorado ColUlty Fire Protection District is 
amended to read as follows, based on climatic, geological and topographical conditions: 

Section BI05.1 Is amended u fOllcnni 

Exception; A reduction in required fire flow of 50 percent, as approved, is allowed when the building 
is provided with an approved automatic sprinkler system as long as the reduction in fire flow is not less 
than 1000 pllons per minute. 

Section BI05.1- BuildiDp other than ODe yd two '.mily dweJHnp; 

Section BI05.2 of Appendix B of the Fire Code of the El Dorado County Fire Protection District is 
amended to read as follows, based on climatic, geological and topographical conditions: 

Seetlon BI05.1 is amended IS follows; 

Exceptions: 

1. A reduction in required fire flow up to ~ SO percent, as approved, is allowed when the 
building is provided with an approved automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance 
with Sections 903.3.1.1 or 903.3.1.2. The resulting fire flow shall not be less than 1,500 

Ord.-Z010.0Z Page 8 

Exhibit A 



gall0D8 per minute for the prescribed duration as specified in Table BI0S.l. 
, , 
Appendix D - Fire Appantus Access Road. 

Seetiog DI03 - MlD"pm Specifications 

Seetiop DI03.6.1 sh,lI be amended u foRm.: Roads from 20 to 29 feet in width. 

Section DI03.6.1 of Appendix D of the Fire Code oftbe EI Dorado County Fire Protection District is 
amended to read as follows, based on climatic, geological and topographical coDditions: 

DI03.6.1 Roads from 20 to 29 feet in width. Fire apparatus access roads. 20 to 29 feet wide. M,ll be 
posted on both sides as a fire lane. with no parking allowed on either side of the roadway. 

SeetioD DI03.6,2 ,hID be !DI!Ddeci u foDowa: Road! from 30 to 35 feet in width. 

Section DI03.6.2 of Appendix D of the Fire Code of the El Dorado County Fire Protection District is 
amended to read as follows, based on climatic, geological and topographical COliditi0D8: 

DI03.6.2 Road! fro .. 30 to 35 feet in widtlt. Fire apparatus access roads.. 30 to 35 fest wide. shall be 
posted on one side as No Parking. Fire Lane. with parkini allowed only on the OJ}posite side of the 
roadway. 

Section DI03.6.3 ,h,1I be added u follows: Road! 36 feet "d &reIter in width. 

Section DI03.6.3 of A~dix D of the Fire Code of the EI Dorado County Fire Protection District is 
added to read as follows, based on climatic, geological and topographical conditions: 

DI03.6.3 Ro. 36 feet and mater in width. Fire apparatus access rold, 36 feet and greater in 
width. may allow parkjni on both sides of the roadway. 

Section DI04 - Co •• mialpd Industrial Developmeng: 

Section 0104,3 .hall be amended to ...,.d u foUow': 
Section 104.3 of Appendix D of the Fire Code of the EI Dorado County Fire Protection District is 
amended to read as follows, based on climate, geological and topographical conditions: 

Section 0104,3 Remotenes.: Where two access roads are required, they shall be placed a distance 
apart equal to not less than one half of the length of the maximum overall diagonal dimension of the 
property or area to be served, measured in a straight line between accesses. 

Exception: Fire apparatus roads cannnt be installed because of location on property. toPOmPhy. 
waterways. nonnegotiable Pes or similar condition. and an approved gltmultive means of fire 
protection is provided. 

Ord.-2010.02 Page 9 

Exhibit A 



.Sp. 0107 - Oa .. or two-family dwelUnl residential deyelopmeats 
, , 

Sestiog 0107.1 shaD be ameaded to read u foUm; Os,.. or two-family !lwellln, resideptial 
developmegg. 

Section 0107.1 of Appendix 0 of the Fire Code of the EI Dorado County Fire Protection District is 
amended to read as follows, based on climatic, geological and topographical conditiOD8: 

0107.1 Os .. or two-'amily cfweUlnl micleptial deyelomapts; Developmen13 of one- or two­
family dwellings where the number of dwelling units exceed ao 25 shall be provided with separate and 
approved fire apparatus access roads and shall meet the requiranents of section 0104.3. 

8JEoeptiamn 

1. What theN are mete dIaB 39 ~ _te 8ft a siB8le JNWia af pWJ8te ~ asll. Mati BBd 
all d\wIIiRa IIBitfJ lIN efIYi"ed thte88l!eut "'1idI 8B appRMMi alllelB8Ba spJiBW. aye.. is 
Haeld ... fIJi. seetieB8 9Q3.3al.l, 993.3.1.2 er 993.3.1.3, Hae. frem WIe direeti8IHI shall Bet he 
NIlIIiRcI. 

~. The B1IIHer ef d7Jl8lliBg ate 8ft a siBale fiN .. ,... Maess reM shall lM iBeNl&ed YBIess fire 
8fJJ.... .88M Nalla will e&BBeet VIHh future develepJBeBt; 1& deterJBiBed .". tile fife eade 
eftieiaL 

Seetfon 3. ESTABltfflJ!JNG LIMITS: 

That the geographic limits referred to in certain secUOD8 of the Fire Code ofEI Dorado County Fire 
Protection District are hereby established as follows: 

Won 3204~.6.1 - GeoIJ"p'ie "mig in wide, stome of gem_ble errol_Ie OPiela ig 

Statton,ry COn!!inen is prohibited; 

The limits referred to in Section 3204.2.9.6.1 of the Fire Code of EI Dorado County Fire Protection 
District in which storage of flammable cryogenic fluids in stationary containers is prohibited are 
hereby established as the limits of the EI Dorado County Fire Protection District, County of El Dorado. 

The storage of flammable crvollenic fluids in stationary containers is allowed in an AHJ apmro:d 
Commercial. Industrial Zone with a SoeciaVConditional Use Pennit issued by the County of El 
Dorado. 

SectiON 3406.2.4.4 - GeomphJc limit! in whish flammable or sombJutfble UguJds in aboye­
mUd tang ou_lde of buDdln. is prohibited; . 

The limits, referred to in Sections 3406.2.4.4 of the Fire Code of EI Dorado County Fire Protection 
District in which the storage of Class I flammable liquids or Class II combustible liquids in above­
ground tanks outside of buildings is restrict~ are hereby established as the limits of the EI Dorado 

Ord.-2010.02 Page 
10 

Exhibit A 



. , 

. 
County Fire Protection District 

The storage of Class I flammable liguids or Class II combustible liquids in above-mund hlng outside 
of building is allowed in an AHJ apj)!'OVed Commercial. Industrial Zone with a Special/Conditional 
Use Pennit issued by the County ofE! Dorado. 

SectioD!' 3W.2 - GeompNe limits in whleh fI.m.1ble or eo.butibie Uggid! in lboyHro'Dd 
tanp II prohibited; 

The limits, referred to in Sections 3506.2 of the Fire Code ofEl Dorado County Fire Protection District 
in which the storage of Class I flammable liquids or Class II combustible liquids in above-ground tanks 
is restricted, are hereby established as the limits of the HI Dorado County Fire Protection District 

The storage of Class I flAJPmRhJe liguids or Class II combustible liquids in abovt=armmd tank, i, 
allowed in an AIU aqproved Commercial. Industrial Zone with a Special/Conditional Use Permit 
issued by the COunty of E! Dorado. 

Sectiog 3804.2 - GeompNs lim", iD wIdch stonD of Uqaeflecl petroleum pHI II to be restrlsted for 
the protection of hayily popplated IUld collated areu; 

The limits, referred to in Section 3804.2 of the California Fire Code, in which storage of liquefied 
petroleum gas in excess of an aggregate of 2,000 gallons water capacity is restricted, are hereby 
established as limits of the EI Dorado County Fire Protection District, County of El Dorado. 

1. The storage of liquefied petroleum gas in excess of an ymsate of 2.000 Allons water cgpacity in 
an Industrial Zone. when located at least one-half (112) mile from property zoned or desjrwA!ed for 
residential use and at least one=ba,lf(ll2) mile from exjJtina residential development with a densitv 
greater than one (ll dwelJina unit per acre !lid at least one-half (112) mile from any hotel or motel 
is allowed when AID approyed and a SpeciaVConditjonal Use Permit is issued by the County ofE! 
Dorado. 

2. Dispensing within established limits. Within the Umjg etltAhJished by law mWictjna the diprsion 
of liquefied petroleum gas for the protection of heavily POPulated or congested 8Ie8S. the ap;mepte 
capacity of anyone installation shall not exceed a water capacity of 2,000 Allons. The d.ispcmsina 
of ligyefied petroleum gas in excess of an yare. of 2.000 sallons water CIlJICity when located 
at least one-half 1112l milo from J)1'Ol!el1y zoned or desigpntr4 for residential use and at least one­
half (1/2) mile from gWina residential develomnent with a density mater dum one (1) dwelling 
unit per acre and at least ODe-hRJf (1/2) milo from any hotel or motel is allowed when AHJ 
aqproved and a Special/Conditional Use Permit is issued by the County of EI Dorado. 

SeetiOD 4: CONFLICT 

That Ordinance No. 2007-01 of the El Dorado County Fire Protection District, and all other ordinances 
or parts of ordinances herewith are hereby repealed. 

Section 5: SEVERABILITY 

Ord.-Z010.0Z Page 
11 

Exhibit A 



If Uly Ordinana:c, IIttcle, 8Ub8cCtioD -cir-sUMlvUiODmmc,"r: pru"IIUUI&, lJQJ~u w~~: ;:~ . :.~ .. 
Ibis code, or any application thaeo( is for any reason held to be Imalid by a court of competent 
jurisdiction. mch decision IIhaII not affect the remainj. provisioas of this code. which can be aiven 
offect without the lDvalid portioas IIDd, tberefcn. such invalid portions .... declared to be aevaabIe. 
The Ht Dorado County Fire Protection District hereby declares that it would have enacted this 
OrdiDllllOO aDd each of its articles, BCCticms, IUbIecdons, or subdivisicms tbcmJ£ JIIO\fisloDs. acatences. 
clauses or phraes jqcspective of tho fact that 0ft0 or more oftbem is declared invalid. 

Sec". ,= WICTIYI DATI AND puBLICATION I 

This 0ntinInce .... 11 .. etfed thirty (30) days after i1B adoption. The fJ Dando County Fire 
ProlecUOII .District Board SecreIary is directed to publish this ordinai1ce in • DCWsptper of pneral 
circulation iD the District. In lieu of publicatioo of tba fUll text of the ordinance, a IUIDIDIr)' of the 
ordinance may be publisbad by the Board SecreIary within fthen (IS) clays after ill .... 1DCl. 
c:crtificd copy shall be posted in the office of tho Bl Dorado County Fire Protection District, pursuant to 
OovetDllUiat Code Section 36933(c) (1). 

The abovo Ordinance was in1nJduced at a mcetina oftbc 8oa'd of Directors of1he HI DonIdo County Fire 
Protection District on the 1" day ofNovcmber, 2010 aDd it WIll 1ben read for the fJrst 1imo:1'hc OrdiDlllCC 

was read for the second timo on the 8" day ofDcccmber, 2010 IIUi approved by the (oRowing vote: 

PASSED AND ADOPTED by tbo Board of DiRctora of the 
e {L CA"an. L .. , (4-,; ~~ C)e r4. this. ~dayof Qecq".,.b.o.2010. 

AYES: (Y)ObA"~I~'~' ~","CL, ~.~~ 

NOES: 0=42 h.L. 

ABSENT: h, ern I « 

ABSTAIN: n (5n. c 

ATJ'EST: 

cS~CA~i.< 
SecreIary to the Board of Dircotors Presidea,to the Board of Dircdora 

Ord.-Z010.oZ Pap 
12 

Exhibit A 



EXHIBITB 

CALIFORNIA CODE OF REGULATIONS, TITLE 24, PART 9, CALIFORNIA 
FIRE CODE, AMENDMENTS 

CLARIFICATIONS (UNDERLINED PORTIONS) 

Chapter 9, Section 903.2: 

Exceptions: 

1. One and two family dwelling units (R-3 Occupancies). (See Section R313 of 
the 2010 California Residential Code that requires all one and two family 
dwellings to be equipped with an NFP A 13D sprinkler system.) 

2. Agricultural buildings, except any agricultural building which is ftOt lHider 
sfleeiaJ use flermit used for commercial purposes (e.g. retail sales, food service 
and/or special events). 

Chapter 9, Section 907.2.a: 

Exceptions: 
1. One and two family dwellings (R-3 Occupancies and other occupancies 

classified as "U. ") 

2. Agricultural buildings, except any agricultural building which is Bot Ufider 
sfleeiaJ use flermit used for commercial purposes (e.g. retail sales, food service 
and/or special events). 

Chapter 38, Section 3804.3: 

Footnote "d" - becomes 250 gallons. Installation of DOT tanks, with setbacks 
from structures less than 1 0 feet, must be approved by the Fire AHJ.:. 

Chapter 38, Section 3813: 

Permits and Plans. Permits shall be required and plans shall be submitted for all 
underground tank installations and approved by the Fire AHJ. 




