RESOLUTION NO. XXXX-2026
OF THE BOARD OF SUPERVISORS OF THE COUNTY OF EL DORADO

(REPEALING RESOLUTION NO. 007-2023)

WHEREAS, the California Code of Regulations, Title 24, Part 9, the California Fire Code, is updated by the
State every three years; and

WHEREAS, the 2025 California Fire Code became effective on January 1, 2026; and,

WHEREAS, California Health and Safety Code Sections 17958, 17958.5, 17958.7 and 18941.5 permits a
county to make such local amendments and modifications as the county determines are reasonably
necessary because of local climatic, geological or topographical conditions; and,

WHEREAS, the California Code of regulations, Health and Safety Code, Division 12, Part 2, Chapter 1,
Article 12, Section 13146, assigns responsibility for enforcement of safety regulations to the local level
and grants authority to delegate enforcement to the chief building official, or his or her authorized
representative, or the chief of the fire protection district, or his or her representative; and,

WHEREAS, the County of El Dorado desires to delegate enforcement of the Fire Code to the chief of the
fire authority, or the chief’s authorized representative; and,

WHEREAS, the fire protection district and County have agreed to develop, implement and maintain a
memorandum of understanding that describes the roles and responsibilities pertaining to the inspection
of certain building standards found in the Fire Code; and,

WHEREAS, on September 17, 2025, The Board of Directors of the Cameron Park Community Services
District adopted Ordinance No. 2025.09.17, which adopted the 2025 California Fire Code with
amendments the District deemed necessary to deal with local climate, geological or topographical
conditions.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that the Board of Supervisors of the County of El Dorado ratifies
Ordinance No. 2025.09.17 of the Cameron Park Community Services District and delegates the
enforcement of the ordinance to the Cameron Park Department Chief, or his or her representative.

These changes include amendments and additions to the California Fire Code in the following sections:

101.1, 105.5, 105.5.60, 105.6, 105.6.26, 105.6.27, 108.5.1, 108.5.2, 108.7, 112.5, 113.4, 113.4.2,
114.4, 202, 302.1, 307.4.4,401.2.1, 503.2.1, 503.2.5, 503.2.6, 503.3.1, 503.3.2, 503.3.3, 503.6, 505.1,
505.1.1, 507.5.1, 509.3, 903.2, 903.2.1.1, 903.2.1.2, 903.2.1.3, 903.2.1.4, 903.2.2, 903.2.3, 903.2.4,
903.2.7,903.2.7.2,903.2.8.4, 903.2.9, 903.2.10, 903.2.10.1, 903.4.3, 903.6, 907.2, 907.2.1.4,

26-0184 C 1 of 46



907.2.2.4,907.2.3.11, 907.2.4.2,907.2.5.2, 907.2.6.6, 907.2.7.3, 907.2.8.4, 907.2.9.4, 907.2.10.3,
907.2.30, 907.6.6, 907.9, 1203.1.3, 3306, 3307.2, 3307.6, 5001.7, 5601.2, 5704.2.9.6.1, 5706.2.4.4,
5806.2, 6104.2, Chapter 80 NFPA 1-24 Section 22.3 and 22.10, Chapter 80 NFPA 1D Section 5.1.1.2,
7.6 and 11.2.1.1, Appendix B: Table B105.1(1), Appendix B: Table B105.2, Appendix C: Table C102.1,
Appendix D: Sections D103.1, D103.2, D103.3, D103.5, D103.6.1, D103.6.2, D104.4, and D105.2.

The Cameron Park Community Services District adopts the 2025 California Fire Code, Title 24, Part 9, in its
entirety, including Appendices, incorporating those sections of the International Fire Code, 2024 edition
not adopted by the state, with the exclusions listed below:

103,309, 311.5,311.6,318,903.3.1.2,904.1.1,1103.1-1103.1.1,1103.3-1103.3.2, 1103.4-1103.6.2,
1105.1-1105.11.2, Chapter 26, D104.2 (exception only), D106.1 (exception only), D107.1
(Exceptions only), Appendix A, Appendix G, Appendix J, Appendix K, Appendix L, Appendix M,
Appendix N, Appendix O.

Appendices not adopted can be used for reference in enforcing other sections of the 2025 California Fire
Code.

PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of Supervisors of the County of El Dorado at a regular meeting of said

BOARD, held the day of ,20___, by the following vote of said Board
Ayes:

Attest: Noes:

Kim Dawson Absent:

Clerk of the Board of Supervisors

By:

Deputy Clerk ,Chair, Board of Supervisors

26-0184 C 2 of 46



Docusign Envelope ID: DOF2C698-42CE-448B-BA4D-9EE86D93BAC3

Cameron Park Fire Department
3200 Country Club Drive
Cameron Park, CA 95682

Office: (530) 677-6191
www.cameronpark.org

09/30/2025

Sue Hennike, Interim Chief Administrative Officer
El Dorado County Board of Supervisors

330 Fair Lane

Placerville, CA 95667

Subject: Resolution Ratifying Ordinance No. 2025.09.17 of the Cameron Park Community District,
which adopts the 2025 California Fire Code with amendments related to local climatic,
geological and topographic conditions.

Dear Ms. Hennike:

The Cameron Park Community District (CPCSD) is requesting the Board of Supervisors (BOS) ratify its Ordinance
No. 2025.09.17, which adopts the 2025 California Fire Code as amended due to specific local climatic, geological
and topographic conditions. California Health and Safety Code Section 13869.7 requires the legislative body of the
city or county where the ordinance will apply to ratify, modify or deny the adopted ordinance. The BOS must also
delegate enforcement of the ordinance to either the Fire District (or its representative) or the Chief Building Official.

Therefore, we request the County Board of Supervisors ratify Ordinance No. 2025.09.17 with amendments to the
2025 California Fire Code, and delegate the enforcement of that Ordinance to the CPCSD Fire Chief.

This resolution has no direct fiscal impact to the County.

Sincerely,

DocuSigned by:

Mike Plankondiim

1958A3E570F948D...

Mike Blankenheim

Unit / Fire Chief

ATTACHMENTS:
1. CPCSD Ordinance 2025.09.17 with Findings of Fact
2. Proof of Publication

26-0184 C 3 of 46



CAMERON PARK COMMUNITY SERVICES DISTRICT
CAMERON PARK FIRE DEPARTMENT
ORDINANCE NO. 2025.09.17

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS OF THE CAMERON
PARK COMMUNITY SERVICES DISTRICT AS FOLLOWS:

An ordinance of the Cameron Park Community Services District (CPCSD) adopting
the 2025 Edition of the California Fire Code, incorporating the 2024 Edition of the
International Fire Code, regulating and governing the safeguarding of life and property
from fire and explosion hazards arising from the storage, handling and use of hazardous
substances, materials and devices, and from conditions hazardous to life or property in
the occupancy of buildings and premises in the CPCSD; providing for the issuance of
permits and collection of fees therefor; Repealing Ordinance No. 2022-02 of the CPCSD
and all other ordinances and parts of the ordinances in conflict therewith.

Be it ORDAINED by the Board of Directors of the CPCSD, also known as the
Cameron Park Fire Department:

Section 1: FINDINGS OF FACTS

Section 2: ADOPTION OF CODE WITH EXCLUSIONS
Section 3: LOCAL AMENDMENTS

Section 4: CONFLICT

Section 5: SEVERABILITY

Section 6: EFFECTIVE DATE AND PUBLICATION

SECTION 1: FINDINGS OF FACTS

The CPCSD makes certain changes (listed below) to the California Fire Code,
2025 Edition, pursuant to Health & Safety Code Sections 13869.7, 17958.5, 17958.7
and 18941.5 during this code adoption process. Such changes are necessary because
of local climatic, geological and/or topographical conditions. The CPCSD has
adopted, pursuant to Section 18941.5 of the California Health & Safety Code, the
findings of facts relative to these conditions by Resolution 2025-17 of the CPCSD
dated September 17, 2025.

Ordinance 2025.09.17 26-0184Plaée41c%f428



SECTION 2: ADOPTION OF CODE WITH EXCLUSIONS

The CPCSD adopts the 2025 California Fire Code, Title 24, Part 9, in _its
entirety, including Appendices, incorporating those sections of the International Fire
Code, 2024 edition not adopted by the state, with the exclusions listed below:

Exclusions: 103, 309, 311.5, 311.6, 318, 903.3.1.2, 904.1.1, 1103.1-1103.1.1,
1103.3-1103.3.2, 1103.4-1103.6.2, 1105.1-1105.11.2, Chapter 26, D104.2 (Exception
only), D106.1 (Exception only), D107.1 (Exceptions only), Appendix A, Appendix G,
Appendix J, Appendix K, Appendix L, Appendix M, Appendix N, Appendix O.

Appendices not adopted can be used for reference in enforcing other sections of
the 2025 California Fire Code.

SECTION 3: AMENDMENTS TO THE 2025 CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE
The following Sections are hereby amended or added:

Chapter 1
SECTION 101.1 “TITLE” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 101.1 TITLE. These regulations shall be known as the Fire Code of CPCSD,
hereinafter referred to as “this code”.

SECTION 105.5 “REQUIRED OPERATIONAL PERMITS” IS AMENDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 105.5 Required operational permits. The fire code official is authorized to
issue operational permits for the operations set forth in.Sections 105.5.2 through
105.5.60.

SECTION 105.5.60 “AUTOMOBILE WRECKING YARDS" IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 105.5.60 Automobile wrecking yards. An operational permit is required for
the operation of automobile wrecking yards.

SECTION 105.6 “REQUIRED CONSTRUCTION PERMITS” IS AMENDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 105.6 required construction permits. The fire code official is authorized to
issue construction permits for work as set forth in sections 105.6.1 through 105.6.27.

SECTION 105.6.26 “AUTOMOBILE WRECKING YARDS” IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Ordinance 2025.09.17 26-0182688§0%f£8



Section 105.6.26 Automobile wrecking yards. Construction permits are required for
the installation of or modification to automobile wrecking yards.

SECTION 105.6.27 “TRAFFIC CALMING DEVICES” IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

105.6.27 Traffic calming devices. Construction permits are required for the
installation or modification of traffic calming devices.

SECTION 108.5.1 “PERMIT, PLAN REVIEW AND INSPECTION FEES” SHALL BE
ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 108.5.1 Permit. A schedule of fees adopted by the district board of directors
for plan review, inspections and the issuance of permits by the district may be found
in the most current district fee schedule (Health & Safety Code 17951).

SECTION 108.5.2 “COST RECOVERY FEES” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 108.5.2 Cost Recovery Fees. Fire service fees may be charged to any
person, firm, corporation or business that through negligence, violation of the law, or
as a result of carelessness, is responsible for the cause of the district to respond to
the scene of an incident. A district board may charge a fee to cover the cost of any
service which the district provides or the cost of enforcing any regulation for which the
fee is charged (Health & Safety Code 13916). The fee shall not exceed the actual cost
of suppressing the fire and/or responding to the scene of an incident.

SECTION 108.7 “ADMINISTRATIVE COSTS” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 108.7 Administrative Costs. When a test or inspection is scheduled, and the
contractor fails to perform to the satisfaction of the authority having jurisdiction (AHJ),
the AHJ may bill the contractor for actual time spent traveling to and from the
test/inspection location and the time spent at the test/inspection site as well as
administrative costs.

SECTION 112.5 “APPEAL PROCEDURES AND TIMELINES” SHALL BE ADDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 112.5 Appeal Procedures and Timelines. Any person or entity who believes
they may be adversely affected by an order, decision, or determination made by the
fire code official through a written notice may appeal this matter within 15 calendar

Ordinance 2025.09.17 26-01 BIZaéeSngfEéa



days of the postmark on the notice. All such appeals shall be filed in writing with the
Secretary of the Governing Board for the district. A timely appeal shall stay further
action by the fire code official until the matter is determined by the Appeal Board as
outlined in Section 112.1, unless the issue poses an imminent fire or life safety hazard
to members of the public. The fire code official shall notify the appellant by certified
mail of the date and time of such hearing. The hearing shall be scheduled to take place
no sooner than 20 calendar days from the date shown on the certified mail. The
appellant shall have the right to appear in person or by agent at the hearing and present
oral, written and/or photographic evidence to the Appeal Board.

SECTION 113.4 “VIOLATION PENALTIES” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 113.4 Violation Penalties. Persons who shall violate a provision of this code
or shall fail to comply with any of the requirements thereof or who shall erect, install,
alter, repair or do work in violation of the approved construction documents or directive
of the fire code official, or of a permit or certificate used under provisions of this code,
shall be guilty of a misdemeanor or infraction, at the discretion of the prosecuting
attorney or agency, punishable by a fine not more than $700.00 for a first violation; A
fine not exceeding $500.00 for a second violation of the same provision within one
year; A fine not exceeding $1000.00 for each additional violation of the same provision
within one year, or by imprisonment not exceeding 180 days, or both such fine and
imprisonment. Each day that a violation continues after due notice has been served
shall be deemed a separate offense. (Health & Safety Code Sections 13145 and
17995).

SECTION 113.4.2 “CITATIONS” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 113.4.2 Citations. The Fire Chief, or his/her duly authorized representative,
may issue citations for infractions or misdemeanor violations of this code pursuant to
Section 13871 of the Health & Safety Code of the State of California and Chapter 5¢
(commencing with Section 853.6) of Title 3 of Part 2 of the Penal Code of the State of
California.

SECTION 114.4 “FAILURE TO COMPLY” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 114.4 Failure to Comply. Any person who shall continue any work after
having been served with a stop work order, except such work as that person is directed
to perform to remove a violation or unsafe condition, shall be punishable by a fine or
imprisonment or both as described in Section 113.4 (Health & Safety Code Sections
13145 and 17995).

Ordinance 2025.09.17 26-0182888740%%69



Chapter 2
SECTION 202 “CAMPFIRE” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

CAMPFIRE. A fire which is used for cooking, personal warmth, lighting, or aesthetic
purposes.

SECTION 202 “DISTRICT” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

DISTRICT. The district and all other areas within the exterior boundaries thereof now
or hereafter established.

SECTION 202 “DRIVEWAY” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

DRIVEWAY. A vehicular pathway that serves no more than four (4) Residential Units and
any number of non-commercial or non-industrial Utility or Miscellaneous Group U
Buildings on each parcel. A Driveway shall not serve commercial or industrial uses at any
size or scale.

SECTION 202 “EXECUTIVE BODY” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

EXECUTIVE BODY. The Board of Directors of the District.

SECTION 202 “FIRE CHIEF” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:
FIRE CHIEF. The Chief Executive Fire Officer of the Fire department/district serving
the jurisdiction or a duly authorized representative.

SECTION 202 “FIRE HAZARD” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

FIRE HAZARD. Any condition, arrangement, or act which will increase, or may cause
an increase of, the hazard or menace of fire to a greater than customarily recognized
as normal by-persons in the public service of preventing, suppressing or extinguishing
fire; or which may obstruct, delay, or hinder, or may become the cause of obstruction,
delay or hinderance to the prevention, suppression, or extinguishment of fire.

SECTION 202 “OPEN BURNING” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

OPEN BURNING. The burning of materials wherein products of combustion are
emitted directly into the ambient air without passing through a stack or chimney from an
enclosed chamber. Open burning does not include road flares, smudge-pots and similar
devices associated with safety or occupational uses typically considered open flames.

Ordinance 2025.09.17 26-0182868850%]:@



For the purpose of this definition, a chamber shall be regarded as enclosed when, during
the time combustion occurs, only apertures, ducts, stacks, flues or chimneys necessary
to provide combustion air and permit the escape of exhaust gas are open.

Open burning shall also include campfires, bonfires, portable outdoor fireplaces,
ceremonial fires, and recreational fire as defined in the Fire Code.

Exception:

1. UL or ANSI listed LPG or natural gas outdoor flame devices, such as gas BBQ’s
or gas fire pits that comply with the Fire Code.

2. Campfires on private lands. Where required by the fire code official, a permit
shall be issued by the fire code official.

3. Ceremonial and/or religious burning when approved by the fire code official and
with the following safety measures:

a. Maximum 4-foot x 4-foot burn area.

Minimum 10-foot clearance from edge of burn area to all flammable material
and vegetation.

An approved water supply is located within 500-feet of the burn area.

The burn area is located no less than 30-feet from adjoining property lines.
An adult is present with a shovel until the fire is extinguished.

No burning shall be conducted during high or extreme fire weather
conditions (e.g., National Weather Service Red Flag Warnings).

o

= o Qo

SECTION 202 “TRAINED CROWD MANAGER” SHALL BE ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

TRAINED CROWD MANAGER. Standby personnel, usually a security guard or usher
personnel, who are trained in the proper procedure to exit people from a tent or other
place of public assemblage in an orderly and calm fashion in the event of an
emergency

Chapter 3
SECTION 302.1 “DEFINITIONS” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

3D PRINTER.

ADDITIVE MANUFACTURING.
BONFIRE.

CAMPFIRE.

HI-BOY.

Ordinance 2025.09.17 26-0182858960%%8



HIGH-VOLTAGE TRANSMISSION LINE.
OPEN BURNING.

PORTABLE OUTDOOR FIREPLACE.
POWERED INDUSTRIAL TRUCK.
RECREATIONAL FIRE.

SKY LANTERN.

VALET TRASH COLLECTION.

SECTION 307.4.4 “OPEN BURNING RESTRICTIONS” SHALL BE ADDED AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 307.4.4 Open Burning Restrictions. Open burning on all lands within the
jurisdiction of the Cameron Park Fire Department (CPFD), including the Local Response
Area (LRA), is prohibited when the California Department of Forestry and Fire Protection
(Cal Fire) issues a burn suspension in the State Responsibility Area (SRA). This
prohibition shall be made effective 24-hours following its commencement in the SRA.

Open burning is also prohibited on all lands within the jurisdiction of CPFD at any time
the fire code official determines that atmospheric conditions or other local circumstances
make such fires hazardous, including factors such as high winds, low fuel moisture, fire
weather, the issuance of red flag warnings, severe threat of wildland fire, or present risk
of destruction by wildfire to life, wildlife, property, or natural resources.

Exception: Ceremonial and/or religious burning with a permit obtained from the
fire code official.

Chapter 4
SECTION 401.2.1 “PRE-FIRE PLANS” IS ADDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 401.2.1 Pre-fire plans. Where required by the fire code official, a pre-fire plan
shall be provided and approved by the fire code official for all new commercial
structures.

Chapter 5
SECTION 503.2.1 “DIMENSIONS” SHALL BE AMENDED AS FOLLOWS:

Section 503.2.1 Dimensions. Fire apparatus access roads shall have an

unobstructed width of not less than 20 feet (6096 mm), exclusive of shoulders, as
measured from face of curb to face of curb, except for approved security gates in

Ordinance 2025.09.17 26_0184P8g]eo70%ff8
































































































26-0184 C 42 of 46



THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS HEREBY DIRECTS District staff to publish and post
this Summary of Ordinance No. 2025.09.17 as provided in Government Code Section 25124.

Cameron Park Community Services District

J
Dated: September 17, 2025 By: \,‘ { el

Director Dawn Wolfson, President

Board of Directors

ATTEST:

I HEREBY CERTIFY that the foregoing Summary of Ordinance No. 2025.09.17 was
duly adopted by a majority vote of the Board of Directors at a regular meeting of the Board
of Directors of the Cameron Park Community Services District on September 17, 2025 and

was duly adopted by the following vote at a regular meeting;:

AYES: N ly_(’,.j'%%[ ms f-ﬁ

NOES: 1,Omd,
ABSENT: YOY\{__ / /
\ ‘ urlce ]ohnson
Secretary of the Board
Summary of Ordinance No. 2025.09.17 Page 2 of 2

26-0184 C 43 of 46



Resolution No. 2025-17
OF THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS
OF THE CAMERON PARK COMMUNITY SERVICES DISTRICT EXERCISES ITS
STATUORY AUTHORITY TO ADOPT STATE MANDATED FIRE
CODE REVISIONS
September 17, 2025

WHEREAS, The California State Fire Marshal has adopted an amended 2025 ICC
Model Fire Code and the amended code is referred to as CA Title 24 Ch.9 “California
Fire Code” that will go into effect on January 1, 2026; and

WHEREAS, this base code is for all fire jurisdictions in the state to use and

enforce unless further amended into a local ordinance; and

WHEREAS, the unique local climatic, geological, and topographical conditions
existing within the boundaries of the District make it reasonably necessary for the
District to impose more stringent requirements than set forth in the California Fire Code
and pursuant to California Health and Safety Code sections 13869.7 and 17958.7, the
District desires to make express findings to that effect; and

WHEREAS, Cameron Park Fire Department staff recommend that the Cameron
Park Community Services District make certain changes to the California Fire Code,
2025 Edition, pursuant to Health & Safety Code Sectxons 13869.7, 17958. 5 17958.7 and
18941.5 durmg this code adoption process; and

WHEREAS, Ordinance 2022-02 will be replaced by Ordinance 2025.09.17 thereby
insuring that the Cameron Park Community Services District is compliant with the
California Fire Code; and

WHEREAS, the Board held a public meeting and public hearing on the proposed
amended code referred to as CA Title 24 Ch.9 “California Fire Code” on August 20,
2025, and September 17, 2025, where the Board heard and considered any objections or
protests to the amended code.

Resolution No. 2025-17 Page 2 of 2
26-0184 C 44 of 46



NOW THEREFORE, the Board of Directors of the Cameron Park Community
Services District resolves as follows:

1. The District hereby resolves to adopt the amended code referred to as CA Title 24
Ch.9 “California Fire Code” and Ordinance 2025.09.17, including the associated finding

of facts. The Ordinance shall supersede any prior fire code ordinance within the District.

PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of Directors of the Cameron Park
Community Services District at a meeting on the 17* day of September 2025, by the
following vote of said Board:

aves: D[ kAR M | T

NOES: |\n\OWg
ABSENT: \nh OV Q

ABSTAIN: '\ © r\g\

>\/ ///Ah - st

Dawn Wolfson, President l\/z(u ce ]ohnS(ZA (@eneral Manager
Board of Directors 5

cretary to the Board

Resolution No. 2025-17 Page 2 of 2
26-0184 C 45 of 46



fHlountain IDemocrat

PROOF OF PUBLICATION
(2015.5.C.C.P.)

STATE OF CALIFORNIA
County of El Dorado

I am a citizen of the United States and a resident

of the County aforesaid; I'm over the age of
eighteen years, and not a party to or interested in
the above-entitled matter. I am principal clerk of
the printer at the Mountain Democrat, 2889 Ray
Lawyer Drive, a newspaper of general circulation,
printed and published Wednesday and Friday, in
the City of Placerville, County of El Dorado, and
which newspaper has been adjudged a newspaper
of general circulation by the Superior Court to the
County of El Dorado, State of California, under the
date of March 7, 1952, Case Number 7258; that the
notice, of which the annexed is a printed copy

(set in type no smaller than non-pareil), has been
published in each regular and entire issue of said
newspaper and not in any supplement thereof on
the following dates, to-wit:

9/3
ALL IN THE YEAR 2025

I certify (or declare) under penalty of perjury that
the foregoing is true and correct.

Dated at Placerville, California, this 3rd day
of SEPTEMBER, 2025

B, S L) ’
MAisor Rawns

Signature
Allison Rains
Legals Clerk

Proof of Publication
ORDINANCE

CAMERON PARK COMMUNITY
SERVICES DISTRICT

OFFICIAL SUMMARY OF
ORDINANCE NO. 2025.09.17

AN ORDINANCE OF THE
CAMERON PARK COMMUNITY
SERVICES DISTRICT ADOPTING
THE 2025 EDITION OF THE
CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE WITHIN
CAMERON PARK COMMUNITY
SERVICES DISTRICT

The Board of Directors of the
Cameron Park Community Services
District is considering the adoption
of Ordinance No. 2025.09.17, which
would adopt the 2025 edition of the
California Fire Code, based upon
the 2024 Edition of the International
Fire Code, regulating and governing
the safeguarding of life and
property from fire and explosion
hazards arising from the storage,
handling and use of hazardous
substances, materials and devices,
and from conditions hazardous to
life or property in the occupancy
of buildings and premises in the
Cameron Park Community Services
District; providing for the issuance
of permits and collection of fees
therefore; repealing Ordinance
No. 2022-02 of the Cameron Park
Community Services District and
all other ordinances and parts of
the ordinances in conflict therewith.
Adoption of the 2025 California
Fire Code will enable all District
personnel to follow one set of rules
and regulations with regard to the
health and safety of the public and
the District’s response.

The public hearing is scheduled to
occur on Wednesday, September
17,2025, at 6:30 pm, at the Cameron
Park Community Services District,
2502 Country Club Drive, Cameron
Park, California 95682.

A printed copy of the proposed
Ordinance is available for inspection
by any person during regular office
hours in the administrative offices
of the District at 2502 Country Club
Drive, Cameron Park, CA 95682.
A copy of the Ordinance and this
summary are also posted on the
District’s website. This summary
has also been published pursuant
to the requirements of California
Government Code Sections 25120
through 25132.

9/3 15081

26-0184 C 46 of 46



	1a - Cameron Park - Reso for CoCo_r1.pdf
	1-BOS request letter - CAM CFC 2025.docx.pdf
	2-CSD Executed 2025 CFC Ordinance.pdf
	3-Affidavit of Public Hearing Notice for Fire Code Ordinance No. 2025.09.17.pdf



