Bid #14-680-024 Ammunition

Evaluation*
(A) San Diego Police C) Lawmen's & Shooters (D) Adamson Police
Equipment Co., Inc  San Supply, Inc. Vero Products Hayward,
Category I: Federal Ammunition Diego, CA Beach, FL CA
Bid Description # of Rounds # of Cases Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension
Item # (Thousands)
5.56mm 55 grain, MCBT M193 Ball Ammunition
#XM193AF90 (900 rounds 24 55 $ 15795| $ 8,687.25 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE!
1 [per case)
HST .40 cal 180 grain JHP #P40HST1 52 52 $ 33874 $ 17,614.48 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE!
2 (1,000 rounds per case)
American Eagle .40 cal. 180 grain FMJ
#AE40R1 192 192 $ 26281 | $ 50,459.52 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE!
3 [(1,000 rounds per case)
HST .45 ACP cal 230 grain +PJHP #P45HST1 18 18 $ 38153| % 6,867.54 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE!
4 1(1,000 rounds per case)
2 3/4" 12 gauge Rifle Slug #F-130-RS 05 2 $ 14527|$ 29054 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE!
5 [(250 rounds per case)
45 ACP, 230 grain FMJ #AE45A100 21 42 $ 15755|$  6,617.10 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE!
6 [(500 rounds per case)
.38 Special, 130 grain, FMJ #AE38K 2 2 $ 31748 $ 634.96 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE!
7 [(1,000 rounds per case)
12 Gauge Classic 12 pellet, OO buckshot # F-
130-00 (250 4 16 $ 12598 | $ 2,015.68 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE!
8 [rounds per case)
223 Remington 55 grain, FMJBT #AE223AF 15 17 $ 31590|$ 5,370.30 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE!
9 [(900 rounds per case)
223 Rem.Tactical Bonded 55 grain #LE223T1 1 5 $ 24427 1,221.35 No Bid #VALUE!| | No Bid #VALUE!
10 [(200 rounds per case)
..223 Rem.Tactical Bonded 55 grain Hi Shok SP . | ; .
11 |#T223A (500 rounds per case) 3 6 $ 269.18| $ 1,615.08 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE!
Speer Gold DOT 38 Special +P 135 grain GDHP-| . , . .
12 |SB #53921 (1,000 rounds per case) 1 1 $ 389.76 | $ 389.76 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE!
Speer , Lawman 38 special +P 158 grain TMJFN . | ; .
13 |#53833 (1,000 rounds per case) 2 2 $ 274341 % 548.68 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE!
308 Cal. 165 grain Tactical Bonded #LE308T1 10 50 $ 27365 $ 13,682.50 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE!
14 [(200 rounds per case)
Speer gold DOT .223 Rem. 55 grain GDSP . | ; .
15 |#24446 (500 rounds per case) 1 2 $ 28845] $ 576.90 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE!
Tactical ‘00" Flight control buckshot #LE132 00 1 4 $ 12182|s 48728 No Bid #vALUE!| | No Bid #VALUE!
16 [(250 rounds per case)
Subtotal $ 117,078.92 No Bid No Bid
Less 5% LVP 0% $0.00 0% #VALUE! N/A #VALUE!
Less Terms Discount 0% $0.00 0% #VALUE! #VALUE!
Evaluation $ 117,078.92 No Bid No Bid
Delivery ARO 210-300 Days ARO 120-180 Days ARO 180 Days ARO

13-1505 A 1 of 4



(A) San Diego Police

C) Lawmen's & Shooters

(D) Adamson Police

Equipment Co., Inc  San Supply, Inc. Vero Products Hayward,
Category Il: Winchester Ammunition Diego, CA Beach, FL CA
Description # of Rounds # of Cases Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension
(Thousands)

Ranger .45 cal ACPSXT 230 grain #RA45T (500 5 10 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #vaLUE!| [ $ 23250 s 2,325.00
17 |rounds per case)

12 gauge AA Trap 1 1/8 oz. load #9 shot  # . | . |
18 |AASC129 (250 rounds per case) 2 8 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE! $ 9850 | $ 788.00

12 gauge AA Trap 1 1/8 oz. load #9 shot  # . , . ,
10 |AAM129 (250 rounds per case) 2 8 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE! $ 95.00| $ 760.00

12 Gauge Buckshot, 9 Pellet # RA1200 (250 No Bid #vAaLUE!| | No Bid #vALUE!| | $ 12875|$  5.150.00
20 |rounds per case) 10 40

12 Guage Buckshot, 9 pellet #XB1200 (250 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE! $ 14000 $ 5,600.00
21 |rounds per case) 10 40

12 Gauge Slug, 1 0z # RA12RS15 (250 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #aALUE!| [ $ 14750] $ 501500
22 |rounds per case) 8.5 34

12 Gauge Slug, 1 0z # X12RS15 (250 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE! $ 14375 % 4,600.00
23 |rounds per case) 8 32

12 Guage Black Powder Blanks #XBP12 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #ALUE!| [ $ 22125 | 885.00
24 |(250 rounds per case) 1 4

Subtotal No Bid No Bid $ 25,123.00

Less 5% LVP 0% #VALUE! 0% $0.00

Less Terms Discount 0% #VALUE! 0% $0.00

Evaluation No Bid No Bid $ 25,123.00

Delivery ARO 210-300 Days ARO 120-180 Days ARO 180 Days ARO
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(A) San Diego Police

C) Lawmen's & Shooters

(D) Adamson Police

Equipment Co., Inc  San Supply, Inc. Vero Products Hayward,
Category lll: Hornady Ammunition Diego, CA Beach, FL CA
Description # of Rounds # of Cases Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension
(Thousands)

223 Rem. 55 grain TAP #83276HP 12 60 No Bid #ALUE!| | $ 12242 |$ 734520 |$ 15375 $  9,225.00
25 |(200 rounds per case)

308 Win-A-Max TAP 168 grain # 80965 (200 10 50 No Bid #vALUE!| | $ 19177 |$ 958850 || $ 24250|$ 1212500
26 |rounds per case)

.300 Win. Mag 178 grain TAP AMAX #8203 ( 1 5 No Bid #VALUE! $ 27490 | $ 1,374.50 $ 331.25 1,656.25
27 1200 rounds per case)

338 Lapua 250 grain BTHP #8230 (200 2 10 No Bid #VALUE!| | $ 62072 | $ 6,207.20 | [ ¢ 80000 | $  8,000.00
28 |rounds per case)

338 Lapua 285 grain BTHP Match #82306 (200 2 10 No Bid #ALUE!| [ $ 622.29 6,22290 | | $ 80000 |$  8000.00
29 |rounds per case)

50BMG 750 grain AMAX #8270 (100 2 20 No Bid #vALUE!| | $ 51853 |$ 1037060 | $ 575.00| $  11,500.00
30 |rounds per case)

Subtotal No Bid $ 41,108.90 $ 50,506.25

Less 5% LVP N/A $ - 0% $0.00 0% $0.00

Less Terms Discount 0% #VALUE! 0% $0.00 0% $0.00

Evaluation No Bid $ 41,108.90 $ 50,506.25

Delivery ARO 210-300 Days ARO 120-180 Days ARO 180 Days ARO
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(A) San Diego Police

C) Lawmen's & Shooters

(D) Adamson Police

Equipment Co., Inc  San Supply, Inc. Vero Products Hayward,
Category IV: CCI Ammunition Diego, CA Beach, FL CA
Description # of Rounds # of Cases Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension
(Thousands)
Velocitor .22 cal Long rifle 40 grain Copper
Plated Hollow Point (CPHP) #0047 (5,000 5 1 $ 324.56 $324.56 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE!
31 |rounds per case)
Subtotal $324.56 No Bid No Bid
Less 5% LVP 0% $0.00 #VALUE! N/A #VALUE!
Less Terms Discount 0% $0.00 #VALUE! 0% #VALUE!
Evaluation $324.56 No Bid No Bid
Delivery ARO 210-300 Days ARO 120-180 Days ARO 180 Days ARO

* Evaluation is exclusive of sales tax
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