
 
 

RESOLUTION NO.  

OF THE BOARD OF SUPERVISORS OF THE COUNTY OF EL DORADO 

 
(REPEALING RESOLUTION NO. 45-2011) 

 

WHEREAS, the California Code of Regulations, Title 24, Part 9, the California Fire Code, is updated by the 

State every three years; and, 

 

WHEREAS, the 2013 California Fire Code became effective on January 1, 2014; and, 

 

WHEREAS, local jurisdictions may establish more restrictive building standards reasonably necessary because 

of local climatic, geological or topographical conditions; and, 

 

WHEREAS, the California Code of Regulations, Health and Safety Code, Division 12, Part 2, Chapter 1, 

Article 2, Section 13146, assigns responsibility for enforcement of fire safety regulations to the local level and 

grants authority to delegate enforcement to the chief building official, or his or her authorized representative, or 

to the chief of the fire protection district, or his or her representative; and, 

 

WHEREAS, enforcement of the Fire Code in the County of EI Dorado has historically been shared by the 

County Building Official and the local Fire Agencies according to the knowledge and skills each possesses; and, 

 

WHEREAS, on December 12, 2013, the Board of Directors of the Georgetown Fire District adopted Ordinance No. 13-01  

which adopted the 2013 California Fire Code with amendments the District deemed necessary to deal with local climate, 

geological or topographical conditions. 

 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that the Board of Supervisors of the County of EI Dorado ratifies 

the following building code Amendments to the California Fire Code adopted by Georgetown Fire District: 

 

These changes include amendments and additions to the California Fire Code in the following sections: 

105.6.26-27,109.4, 111.4, 113.6, 113.6.1, 507.5.1, 604.1, 903.2, 903.2a, 903.2b, 903.2.1.1, 903.2.1.2, 903.2.1.3, 903.2.1.4, 

903.2.2.1, 903.2.3, 903.2.4, 903.2.7, 903.2.9, 903.2.10, 907.2a, 907.2b, 907.2c, 5601.2, 5608.2, Table 6104.3 Footnote 

“d”, 6112.1, 6112.2, 6112.3, 6112.4, 6113.1, Appendix B105.2.   

 

These changes also include the following International Fire Code Sections and Appendices not adopted by the State of 

California; 101.1 thru 101.5, 102.6 thru 102.8, 102.10 thru 102.12, 103.1 thru 104.1, 104.3 thru 104.4, 104.6 thru 104.6.4, 

104.8, thru 104.9.2, 104.10.1 thru 104.11.3, 105.2.3, 105.3.1 thru 105.3.2, 105.6.9, Table 105.6.10, 105.6.12, 105.6.16 thru 

105.6.19, 105.6.27 thru 105.6.42, 105.6.44 thru 105.6.45, 105.7.15 thru 105.7.16, 106.1, 107.1 thru 108.3, 109.3.2 thru 

109.4.1, 112.1, 113.1 thru 115.5, 303.1-303.9, 305.1-305.4, 307.1, thru 307.5, 308.1 thru 308.5, 408.1 thru 408.11.3, 503  

F, J, and K, based on the 2012 edition of the International Fire Code as published by the International Code Council. 

 

 

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that the Board of Supervisors of the County of El Dorado delegates the enforcement 

of the Building Standards of the 2013 Fire Code for one and two family dwellings, and accessory structures thereto, to the 

County Building Official, or his or her authorized representative, and for all other fire code enforcement to the Chief of the 

Georgetown Fire District a or his or her authorized representative, for the territory served by that Department. 

 

 

 

 

 

14-1478 E 1 of 21



Resolution ________________ 

Page 2 of 2 

 

 

 

 

 

 

PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of Supervisors of the County of El Dorado at a regular meeting of said 

Board, held the _____ day of _____________________, 20__, by the following vote of said Board: 

 

 Ayes: 

Attest: Noes: 

James S. Mitrisin Absent: 

Clerk of the Board of Supervisors  

 

By: _____________________________________ _____________________________________ 

 Deputy Clerk Chair, Board of Supervisors 

 

14-1478 E 2 of 21



GEOR 0 F DIS CT 

Ottice Phone: S30-333-4111 
Facsimile: 530·333-4020 
www.gaorgetownfiredepartment.com 

ORDINANCE No. 13-01 

Post Office Box 120 
BZB3 Main Street 

Georgetown, California SSS31-0120 

~== == == ===== ;;== = ====== ====== === ======== 
BE IT ORDAINED BY THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS OF THE GEORGETOWN FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT AS 

FOLLOWS: 

AN ORDINANCE OF GEORGETOWN PROTECTION DISTRICT ADOPTING THE 2013 EDITION 

THE CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE, BASED UPON THE 2012 EDITION INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE. 

REGULATING AND GOVERNING THE SAFEGUARDING OF LIFE AND PROPERTY FROM FIRE AND 

EXPLOSION HAZARDS ARISING FROM THE STORAGE. HANDLING AND USE OF HAZARDOUS 

SUBSTANCES. MATERIALS AND DEVICES. AND FROM CONDITIONS HAZARDOUS TO LIFE OR PROPERTY 

IN THE OCCUPANCY OF BUILDINGS AND PREMISES IN THE GEORGETOWN FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT: 

PROVIDING FOR THE ISSUANCE OF PERMITS AND OF THEREFORE; REPEALING 

ORDINANCE NO. 10-1 THE GEORGETOWN FIRE PROTEcnON DISTRICT ANDAll OTHER 

ORDINANCES AND PARTS OF THE ORDINANCES IN CONFLICT THEREWITH. 

Be it ordained by the Board Directors of the Georgetown Fire Protection District. also known as the 
Georgetown Department: 

Section 1: ~:.=...:..:'"-'-== 

Section 

SECTION 1: ;.....:.;;....:=-::..= 

Georgetown Fire Protection District makes certain (listed below) to the California Fire 
Code. 2013 Edition, pursuant to Health and Safety Code Section 13869.7. t 7958.7 and 18941.5 during 
this code process. Such changes are necessary because local climatic. geological and/or 
topographic conditions. Georgetown Protection District has adopted. pursuant to Section 

Ord.13-01 
"Neighbors helping Neighbors . Since 1951" 

14-1478 E 3 of 21



18941.5 of the California Health and Safety the findings of facts relative to these conditions by 
Resolution 2013-04 of the Georgetown Fire Protection District dated November 14. 2013. 

These changes include amendments and additions to the California Fire in the following sections: 
105.6.26-27.109.4.111.4.113 11 1. 503. 507.5.1. 604.1.903.2.903 903.2b,903.2.1.1. 
903.2.1.2,903.2.1.3.903.2.1.4.903.2.2.1. 903.2.3.903.2.4.903.2.7.903.2.9.903.2.10, 907.2a, 
907.2b. 907.2c. 5601.2. 5608.2. Table 6104.3 Footnote ,6112.1. 6112.2,611 3.6112.4.6113.1. 
Appendix These changes are itemized in SECTION 2: of this 
ordinance. 

These changes also i ncl ude the follow i ng lDl!IT.!J@l!.Qll!ill~..hS~~£lli2.Dl.1!D&U1QI2m:'~&JJQu!!;!QfllitQ 
.1 thru 101.5. 102.6 thru 102.8, 102.10 thru 102.12. 103.1 thru 104.1. 104.3 

thru 104.4. 104.6 thru 104.6.4. 104.8. thru 104.9.2. 104.10.1 thru 104.11.3. 105.2.3, 105.3.1 thru 
105.3.2.105.6.9. Table 105.6.10,105.6.1 105.6.16 thru 105.6.19. 105.6.27 thru 105.6.42.105.6.44 
thru 105.6.45. 105.7.15 thru 105.7.16,106.1. 107.1 thru 108.3, 199.3.2 thru 109.4.1, 112.1. 113.1 thru 
1 

on the 2012 edition of the International Fire Code as published by the International Code 
Council. 

SECTION 2: 

That a certain document, three (3) copies of which are on file in the office of the Secretary of the Board of 

Directors of the Georgetown Fire Protection District. being marked and designated as the California Fire Code. 

2013 edition. ioits entirety. and the following International Fire Code and Appendices not adopted 
by the State of California:JOl.l thru 101 thru 102.8,102.10 thru 102.12.103.1 thru 104.1. 104.3 thru 
104.4,104.6 thru 104.6.4, 104.8, thru 104.9.2,104.10.1 thru 104.11.3. 105.2.3. 105.3.1 thru 105.3.2, 105.6.9. 
Table 105.6.10. 105.6.12. 105.6.16 thru 105.6.19. 105.6.27 thru 105.6.42. 105.6.44 thru 105.6.45, 105 5 
thru 105.7.16,106.1. 107.1 thru 108.3,109.3.2 thru 109.4.1. 112.1. 113.1 thru 11 

on the 
Council and the 2013 

California Fire Code. and is hereby adopted as the Fire of the Georgetown Fire Protection District. in 

the State of California regulating and governing the safeguarding of life and property from fire and explosion 

hazards ariSing from the storage. handling and use of hazardous substances. materials and devices. and from 

conditions hazardous to life or property in the occupancy of buildings and premises as herein provided; 
providing for the of permits and collection of therefore: and and aU of the regulations, 
provisions, penalties. conditions and terms of said Fire Code on file in the office of the Georgetown Fire 
Protection District are hereby referred to. adopted. and made a hereof, as if fully set out in this ordinance. 

with the additions. insertions. deletions and changes. if any. prescribed in Section 3 of this ordinance. 

The following Sections are hereby amended or added: 

Section 105 - Permits 

Ord.13-01 2!Page 14-1478 E 4 of 21



Section 105.6.27 of Chapter 1 of the Fire Code of the Georgetown Fire Protection District is amended 

to read as follows: 

105.6.27 - LP Gas 

1. Storage and use of LP-gas. 

Exception: A permit is not required for individual containers with a §GG 100 gallon water capacity or 

less serving occupancies in Group 

Section 109.4 of Chapter 1 of the Fire Code of the Georgetown Fire Protection District is amended to 

as follows: 

Section 109.4 Violation penalties. Persons who shall violate a provision of this code or shall fail to 

comply with any of the requirements thereof or who shall erect, install. alter, repair or do work in 

violation of the approved construction documents or directive of the code official. or of a permit 

or under provisions of this code. shall be guilty of a misdemeanor. punishable by a fine 

of not more than by imprisonment not exceeding or both such fine 

imprisonment. day that a violation continues after notice has served shall 
separate offense. (Health &. Safety Code Section 13145 and 17995). 

Section 111.4 is amended as follows: Failure to comply. 

Section 111.4 of Chapter 1 the of the Georgetown Fire Protection District is rr":>Jnru:'" to 

read as follows: 

111.4. Failure to comply. Any person who shall continue any work after having been served with a 
stop work order. except such work as that person is directed to perform to remove a violation or 

unsafe condition. shall liable to a fine of not less than $500 or not more than $1,000. (Health &. 
Code Section 13 and 1.7995). 

Sections 113.6 and 11 of Chapter 1 of the Code the Georgetown Protection District are 

added to as follows: 

business that through negligence, violation of the law, or as a result of carelessness, is responsible for 

Ord.13-01 3iPage 
14-1478 E 5 of 21



Section 503 - Fire Apparatus Access Roads 

503 of the Fire Code of 
read as follows: 

503.1 Where required. 

Georgetown Protection District is adopted and 

Fire apparatus access roads shall be provided and maintained in accordance with ~~~-=:.!.!.!..!. 
through ~== 

503.1.1 Buildings and faciliti~s. 
Approved fire apparatus access roads shall provided for every facility, building or portion of a 
building hereafter constructed or moved into or within the jurisdiction. fire apparatus access 

to 

shall comply with the requirements of this section and shali extend to within 1 feet (45 720 mm) of 
all portions of the facility and all portions the exterior walls of the first story of the building as 
measured by an approved route around the exterior of the building or facility. 

'Exception: The fire 
where: 

officialis authorized to increase the dimension of 150 feet (45 720 mm) 

1. The building is equipped throughout with an approved automatic sprinkler system installed in 
accordance with or ~='-'-'-!.= 

2. apparatus access roads cannot be installed 
waterways. nonnegotiable grades or other 
fire protection is 

of location on property, topography. 
conditions. and an approved alternative means of 

3. are not more than two Group or Group U occupancies. 

503.1.2 Additional access. 
The fire code official is authorized to more than one fire apparatus access road based on the 
potential for impairment of 'a road by vehicle congestion. condition of terrain. climatic 
conditions or other factors that could limit access. 

503.1.3 High-plied storage. 
Fire department vehicle access to buildings used 
the applicable provisions of Chapter 32. 

503.2 Specifications. 

high-piled combustible ctl'1r~t:r", shall comply with 

All fire apparatus access roads shall be installed and arranged in accordance with ==~=~c!..!. 
through 503.2.8. 

[California Code Regulations. Title 19. Division 1.13.05(a)] Fire Department Access and Egreff. 
(Roads) 

Ord. 13-01 4 I P age 14-1478 E 6 of 21



(a) Roads. Required access roads from every building to a public street shall be all-weather hard-
surfaced (suitable for use by fire apparatus) right-of-way not than 20 (6096 mm) in width. 
Such right-ot-way shall be unobstructed and maintained only as access to the public street. 

Exception: The enforcing agency may waive or modify this requirement if in his opinion such aI/-
weather hard surfaced condition is not in the of public safety and welfare. 

503.2.1 Dimensions. 

503.2.2 Authority. 
The fire code officia/shall have the authority to require an increase in the minimum access widths 
where they are inadequate for fire or rescue operations. 

503.2.3 Surface. 
Fire access roads shall be and maintained to support loads of fire 
apparatus and shall be surfaced so as to provide all-weather driving capabilities. All weather surfaces 
shall asphalt. concrete or ot~er approved driving surface. 

503.2.4 Turning radius. 
The required turning radius a fire apparatus access road shall by the fire official. 

503.2.5 Dead ends. 

apparatus access roads in excess of 150 (45720 
mm) in length shall be provided with an approved area for turning around fire 

503.2.6 Bridges and elevated surfaces. 
Where a bridge or an elevated surface is part of a fire apparatus access road. the bridge shall be 
constructed and maintained in accordance with the current EI Dorado County Transportation Division 
bridge standard. Bridges and elevated surfaces shall be designed for a live load sufficient to carry the 
imposed loads of fire apparatus. Vehicle limits shall posted at both entrances to bridges when 
required by the fire code official. Where elevated surfaces designed for vehicle use are 
adjacent to surfaces which are not designed for such use. approlled barriers. approved signs or both 
shall be installed and maintained when required by the fire code official. 

Ord.13-01 51Page 

14-1478 E 7 of 21



503.2.7 Grade. 
grade the fire access shall within limits by the code official 

on the fire department's apparatus. 

503.2.8 Angles approach. and departure. 
The angles of approach and departure for fire apparatus access roads shall be within the limits 
established by the fire code official based on the department's apparatus. 

503.3 Marking. 
Where required the code or other approved notices or markings that 

the words NO PARKlNG-FIRE LANE shall provided for apparatus access to 
identify roads or prohibit the obstruction thereof. The means by which lanes are deSignated 
shall be maintained in a clean and legible condition at all times and shall be replaced or when 
necessary to provide adequate visibility. 

503.4 Obstruction of fire apparatus access roads. 
Fire apparatus access roads shall not be obstructed in any manner, including the parking vehicles. 

minimum widths and clearances established in be maintained at all 

503.4.1. Traffic calming 
Traffic calming devices shall be prohibited unless approvedby the fire official. 

503.4.2 Fire Apparatus Access Gates 
Apparatus Road shall meet the standards identified in the Department's Gate 

Standard. 

503.4.3 Roads from 20 to 29 feet in width. 

Section 503.4.3 of the Fire Code of the Georgetown Fire Protection District is amended to read as 
follows: 

Section .4.4 of the Fire Code of the Georgetown Fire Protection District is amended to read as 
follows: 

Section 503.4.5 shall be added as follows: Roads 36 feet and greater in width. 

Section 
follows: 

Ord.13-01 

of the Fire of the Georgetown Fire Protection District is added to read as 

6iPage 

14-1478 E 8 of 21



503.5 Required gates or barricades. 
The fire code official is authorized to require the installation maintenance of gates or other 
approved barricades across fire apparatus access or other accessways. not including public 
streets. alleys or highways. Electric operators. where provided, shall be listed in accordance with 
UL 325. Gates intended automatic operation shall be designed. constructed and installed to comply 
with the requirements of ASTM F 2200. 

503.5.1 Secured gates and barricades. 
When and barricades shall secured in an approved manner. Roads. trails other 
accessways that have been closed and obstructed in the manner prescribed by ;:;..;::..;:='-'-'-';:;,.;::;.::;..:.;::;.. shall not 
be trespassed on or used unless authorized by the owner and the fire code official. 

Exception: The restriction on use shall not apply to public officers acting within the scope of duty. 

503.5.2 Fences and gates. School grounds may be fenced and gates therein may be equipped with 
locks. provided that safe difpersal areas based on 3 (0.28 rr?) occupant are located 
between the JChool and the fence. Such required dispersal areas shall not be located less than 50 
feet (15240 mm) from JChool buildings. Every public and private school shall conform with Section 
32020 of the Education Code. which stateS: The governing board of every public school district. and 
the governing authority of every private school. which maintains any building used for the instruction 
or housing of JChool pupils on land enclosed (except for building walls) by or walls. 
shall. through cooperation with the local law enforcement and fire-protection agencies having 
jurisdiction the area. make provision for the erection of gates in such fences or walk The gates shall 
be of sufficient size to permit the entrance the ambulances. police equipment and fire-fighting 
apparatus used by the law enforcement and fire-protection agencies. There shall be no less than one 
fUch acceSf gate there shall be as many such gates as to assure access to all major buildings 
and ground areas. If such are to be equipped with locks. the locking devices shall be designed to 
permit ready entrance by the use of the chain or bolt-cutting devices with which the local law 
enforcement and fire-protection agencies may be equipped 

503.6 Security gates. 
The installation of security gates across a fire apparatus access road shall be approved by the fire chief. 

Where security gates are installed, they shall have an approved means of operation. 
and the emergency operation shall operational at ai/ times. Electric 

operators, where provided, shall listed in with UL Gates intended for automatic 

operation shall designed, constructed and installed to comply with the requirements of ASTM F 

2200. 

structure. 

area of more than 62,000 square feet (5760 m2) shall be provided with two separate and approved 

Ord.13-01 71Page 

14-1478 E 9 of 21



to read as follows: 

13-01 81Page 14-1478 E 10 of 21



1. 

Sections 604.1 of Chapter 6 of the 

to read as follows: 
Code of the Georgetown 

Section 604.1 Is Amendment as follows: 

Protection District are 

Section 604.1 Installations. Emergency and standby power systemnequired by this or the 
California Building Code shall be Installed in accordance with this code. NFPA 110 and NFPA 111. 

==~=....;'-!..!.-'=c.==~::':""'::~:':'=-:"'::":::"-=L..!.!~:"'==-.:!::=""-'=== Existing. i nsta lIa tions 5 h all be ma i ntai ned in 
accordance with the original approval. 

California Fire Code. Chapter 9 Amendments - Fire Protection Systems 

Section 903 of Chapter 9 of the 

read as follows: 
of the Georgetown Protection District is to 

903.2 Where required. I\ppro'v'cd automatic sprinkler systems in new buildings and structures shall be 

in all buildings or structures, greater than 3600 square feet, when constructed or relocated within the 

2. Agricultural buildings not under 5pecial Use Permit used for commercial purposes. 

5ections 903.2.a and 903.2.b of Chapter 9 of the Fire Code of the Georgetown Protection District 
are Q\ .. '~'<:::\..A to as follows: 

Ord.13 .. 01 91Page 14-1478 E 11 of 21



903.2.a Status of existing buildings greater than 3,600 square feet. In existing buildings 3600 square 

feet or greater, other than one- and two-family dwelling units, and agricUltural buildings not under 

Special Use Permit for commercial purposes, where the floor area of the building or structure is 
increased by an addition of more than thirty percent (30%) or 1.000 square feet, whichever is less, 

such building or structure shall be made to conform to Section 903.2. 

903.2.b Status of existing buildings less than 3,600 square feet. In existing buildings 3,600 square feet 
or less, other than one-and two-family dwelling units, and agricultural buildings not under Special Use 

Permit for commercial purposes, where the floor area of the building or structure is increased to a total 

square footage over 3,600 square feet, by an addition of more than thirty percent (30%) or 1,000 

square feet, whichever is less. such building or structure shall be made to conform to Section 903.2. 

The following sections are amended by changing Califomia Fire Code requirements to 3.600 square 

feet for fire sprinkler installation, as follows (the complete text of the section Is not provided): 

903.2.1.1 Group A-l. 
903.2.1.2 Group A-2. 
903.2.1.3 Group A-3. 
903.2.1.4 Group A·4. 
903.2.2.1 Group B. 
903.2.3 Group E. 
903.2.4 Group F-1. 

903.2.7 Group M. 
903.2.9 Group S-1. 

903.2.10 Group S-2. 

Change 12,000 square feet to 3,600 square feet. 
Change 5.000 square feet to 3,600 square feet. 
Change 12,000 square feet to 3,600 square feet. 
Change 12,000 square feet to 3,600 square feet. 
All Group B occupancies over 3,600 square feet. 
Change 12,000 square feet to 3,600 square feet. 
All Group F-1 except manufacturing of upholstered fumitureand 
mattresses and wood working operations exceeding 2500 square 
feet. 
Change 5000 square feet to 3,600 square feet. 
All Group S-l except Storage of upholstered furniture and 
mattresses exceeding 2500 square feet. 
Change 12,000 square feet to 3,600 square feet. 

Section 907 - Fire Alarm and Detection Systems 

Sections 907.2.a. 907.2.b. and 907.2.c are added to read as follows: 

Sections 907.2.a. 907.2.b and 907.2.c of Chapter 9 of the Fire Code of the Georgetown Fire 

Protection District are added to read as follows: 

907.2.8 An approved fire alarm/detection system shall be installed in all buildings with a floor area less 
than 3,600 square feet. 

Exceptions: 

1. One and two family dwellings (R-3 Occupancies) 

2. Agricultural buildings not under Special Use Permit used for commercial purposes. 

3. Buildings with a floor area less than 500 square feet may be exempt, as determined by the Fire 

Chief, based on building construction material and features. location. occupancy type, and distance to 
expOsures. 

Ord.13-01 10 I P age 14-1478 E 12 of 21



California Fire Code. Chapter 56 Amendments - Explosives and Fireworks 

Section 5601.2 of Chapter 56 of the 

read as follows: 

Section 5608.2 of 

Code of the Georgetown Fire Protection District is added to 

Appropriate District is added to read as follow: 

Table 6104.3 Footnote "d" of Chapter 61 of the Fire Code the Georgetown Fire Protection District is 

amended to read as follows: 

Section 6112 is added as follows: High Altitude Uquefied Petroleum Gas Installations (4.000' and Above). 

Section 6112 of Chapter 61 of the Fire Code of the Georgetown Fire Protection District is added to read 
as follows: 

Ord.13-01 lllPage 
14-1478 E 13 of 21



Section 6112.2 is added as follows: Vertical Yard Riser Piping. 

Section 6112.2 of 
read as follows: 

61 of Fire Code of the Georgetown Fire Protection District is added to 

Section 611 Chapter 61 of the Fire of the Georgetown Fire Protection District is added to 

Ord.13-01 

as follows: 

6112.4 of Chapter 610f the 
as follows: 

of the Georgetown Fire Protection District is added to 

12IPage 
14-1478 E 14 of 21



Section 6113 Chapter 61 of the Fire of the Georgetown Fire Protection District is added to read 

as follows: 

Section 6 t t 3. t of Cha pter 61 of the Fire 

read as follows: 

Appendix B - Fire Flow Requirements for Buildings 

Section 8105.2 - Buildings other than one and two family dwellings: 

Protection District is added to 

Section 8105.2 of Appendix B of the Fire Code of the Georgetown Fire Protection District is 
to read as follows: 

Section 8105.2 is amended as follows: 

1. A reduction in required fire flow up to percent, as approved, is allowed when the 

building is provided with an approved automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance 
with Sections 903.3.1.1 or 903.3.1.2. The resulting flow shall not be than 1.500 
gallons per minute for the nro<rr. duration as specified in Table 8105.1. 

SECTION 4. EST ABUSHING LIMITS: 

That the geographic limits to in certain sections of the Fire Code of Georgetown Fire 
Protection District are hereby established as follows: 

tanks outside of buildings Is prohibited: 

The limits, referred to in Sections 5704.2.9.6.1 of the Fire Code of Georgetown Fire Protection District 
in which of I flammable liquids or 1/ combustible liquids in 

outside of buildings is restricted, are hereby established as the limits of the Georgetown Fire Protection 
District. County of EI Dorado. 

tanks is prohibited: 

The limits. referred to in Sections 5706.2.4.4 of the Fire Code of Georgetown Fire Protection District in 

which the storage of Class I flammable liquids or Class II combustible liquids in above-ground tanks is 

Ord.13-01 13jPage 

14-1478 E 15 of 21



restricted, are hereby established as the limits the Georgetown Fire Protection District. County E! 

Dorado. 

The limits referred to in Section 5806.2 of Fire Code of Georgetown Fire Protection District in 

which storage of flammable .cryogenic fluids in stationary containers is prohibited are hereby 

established as limits of the Georgetown Fire Protection District. County of EI Dorado. 

The limits. referred to in Section 6104.2 of the California Fire Code. in which storage of liquefied 

petroleum gas in excess of an aggregate of 2,000 gallons water capacity is restricted, are 

established as limits of the Georgetown Protection District. County of El Dorado. 

1. 

2. 

. SECTION 5: 

That Ordinance No. 10-01 of Georgetown Protection District. and all other ordinances or parts 
of ordinances herewith are hereby repealed. 

SECTION 6: 

If any Ordinance. article. subsection or subdivision thereof. provision. sentence. clause or this 
code. or any application thereof. is for any reason held to invalid by a court of competent 
jurisdiction. decision shall not affect remaining provisions of this code. which can be given 
effect without invalid portions and. therefore, such invalid portions are declared to be severable. 

Ord.13-01 14 I P age 

14-1478 E 16 of 21



The Georgetown Fire Protection District hereby declares that it would have enacted this Ordinance and 
its articles, sections, subsections, or subdivisions thereof, provisions, sentences, clauses or 

phrases irrespective of the fact that one or more of them is declared invalid. 

SEcnON 7: 

This Ordinance shall take effect thirty (30) days after its adoption. Georgetown Fire 

District Board is directed to publish this ordinance in a newspaper of general circulation in the 

District. In lieu of publication full text of the ordinance. a summary of the ordinance may be 
published by the by the Board Secretary within fifteen (1 days after its passage a certified copy 

shall be posted in the office of the Georgetown Protection District, pursuant to Government Code 

Section 36933(c) (1). 

The above Ordinance was introduced at a meeting the Board of,Directors of the Georgetown 
Protection District on the 141h day of November 2013 it was then for the first time. The 
Ordinance was read for the second time on the 121h day of December 2013 and approved by the 

following vote: 

PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of Directors of the Georgetown Fire Protection District this 12fh 
day of December 2013. f " {(. 

f) M\+h I ~\0hCLd n I we laMS 
A YES: __ ---'-__ f\ 

NOES: 

ABSENT: 
J . 

ABSTAIN: 

ArrEST: 

Ord,13-01 IPage 

14-1478 E 17 of 21



btEORGETOWN FIRE DISTRICT 

Omes Phone: 530-3334111 
Facsimile: 530-3334020 
www.georgetowntiredepartment.com 

Post Ottice Box 420 
S2S3 Main Street 

Georgetown, California 95S34-0420 

RESOLUTION 2013-04 

WHEREAS, the Georgetown Fire 
adopt an ordinance adopting the California 

District Board intends to 
Code, 2013 Edition. and prescribing 

regulations governing conditions to life. property the environment 
from fire. explosion. and hazardous uses; and 

WHEREAS, the unique local climatic, geological and topographical 
conditions existing within the boundaries of the District make it reasonably necessary 
for the District to impose more stringent requirements than set forth in the ifornia 

Code pursuant to California Health Safety Code sections 13869.7 and 
17958. the District desires to make express findings to that effect. 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that the Fire 
Protection District hereby adopts the following findings concerning current unique 
local conditions that together make each modification to the California Fire Code. 
2013 Edition. reasonably to provide adequate and effective protection of 
life, property and the environment. 

CLIMATE 
Precipitation. Average annual precipitation ranges from approximately 69 to 
inches per year. Approximately 88% the rainfall occurs during the 
months of November through April and 12% from May through October. This area 
has experienced major droughts in the last two one in 1986 that lasted 
through 1991. and the last drought which started in 2007 and lasted through 2009. 
It is possible that more droughts will occur in the future. 

Relative Humidity. During the summer months (May through September), the daily 
humidity generally ranges around 20% and occasionally drops to the low teens. 

"Neighbors helping Neighbors -Since 1954" 
14-1478 E 18 of 21



an earthquake has the potential of causing greater loss of life and damage to 
property than the itself. 

Other variables may tend to increase the situation: 
• damage that may occur to the water system, and: 
• extent of isolation due to roadway damage, bridge collapse and debris 

blocking the roadway. 

PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of Directors the Georgetown Fire 
Protection District. this 14th day of November 201 by the following vote: 

AYES: 

NOES: 

ABSENT: » 
ABSTAIN: 

ATTEST: 

J0.~ 
Administrative Assistant 

14-1478 E 19 of 21



PROOF OF PUBLICATION 
(2015.5 C.c.P.) 

OF CALIFORNIA 
County El 

I am a citizen of United States and a resident 
of the County aforesaid; I'm over the of 

and not a party to or interested in 
above-entitled matter. I am a principal 

of and/or the publisher of Dorado Gazette, 
Town a newspaper 

circulation printed and published 
once week the town Georgetown, 
Ponderosa Judicial District, County of El 
Dorado, and which newspaper has been 
adjudged a newspaper of general circulation 
by the Superior Court to the County EI 

Dorado, State California, under the date 
April 1970, Number 18589; that the 
notice, attached is a printed copy 
(set in type no than has 
published in each regular and issue said 

UOJU.",~. and not in any supplement thereof on 
the following dates, to-wit: 

10124, 10/31 

All in 2013 

I (or declare) penalty perjury that 
the foregoing is true and correct. 
Dated at Placerville, California, this 31st 
day of OCTOBER, 2013 

Proof of Publication of 
NOTICE INTENT TO ADOPT 

2013 CALIFORNIA CODE 

14-1478 E 20 of 21



PROOF OF PUBLICATION 
(2015.5 C.c.P.) 

CALIFORNIA 

1 am a citizen the a resident 
of County aforesaid; I'm over the of 

and not a party to or interested in 
above-entitled matter. I am a principal agent 

of the publisher EI 
Georgetown & 
of circulation printed published 
once each week in town of Georgetown, 
Ponderosa Judicial County 
Dorado, which newspaper 

a newspaper 
Court to 

Dorado, of California, the 
April 3, 1970, Number 18589; that the 
notice, which attached is a copy 
(set in type no smaller than non-pareil), has 
published in regular and issue 
newspaper and not supplement thereof on 
the following dates, to-wit 

11128, 12/05 

All in the 2013 

] certify (or declare) penalty of that 
the is true and correct. 

at California, 8th 
JANUARY, 2014 

Proof of Publication of 
INTENT TO ADOPT 

2013 CALIFORNIA CODE 

the 2013 Calfiomia Fire 
Notice is hereby 10 the intention of the 
Georgetown Fire District to adopt 
the 2013 Calilomla Fire Code. 'The District 
shall hold its second' public at 2:30 
P.M. on December 12. 2013. at Main 
Street. California, the 
adoption of California 

10 Health and Safety Code Section 
Copies of the cooe section referred 

10 and any secondary code sections referred 
to, adopted by reference, are on !i!e with the 
Secretary of the District and are open to 
lie inspection. Adoption 01 the 2013 
flia Fire Code will enable all District personnel 
to follow one set 01 rules and regulations with 
regard 10 the heallh and safety 01 the public 
and the DIs triers response thereto. 
11128. 1215 06541664 

14-1478 E 21 of 21




