
 
 

RESOLUTION NO.  

OF THE BOARD OF SUPERVISORS OF THE COUNTY OF EL DORADO 

 

 

WHEREAS, the California Code of Regulations, Title 24, Part 9, the California Fire Code, is updated by the 

State every three years; and, 

 

WHEREAS, the 2013 California Fire Code became effective on January 1, 2014; and, 

 

WHEREAS, local jurisdictions may establish more restrictive building standards reasonably necessary because 

of local climatic, geological or topographical conditions; and, 

 

WHEREAS, the California Code of Regulations, Health and Safety Code, Division 12, Part 2, Chapter 1, 

Article 2, Section 13146, assigns responsibility for enforcement of fire safety regulations to the local level and 

grants authority to delegate enforcement to the chief building official, or his or her authorized representative, or 

to the chief of the fire protection district, or his or her representative; and, 

 

WHEREAS, enforcement of the Fire Code in the County of EI Dorado has historically been shared by the 

County Building Official and the local Fire Agencies according to the knowledge and skills each possesses; and, 

 

WHEREAS, on December 17, 2013, the Board of Directors of the Meeks Bay Fire Protection District adopted Ordinance 

No. 13-1  which adopted the 2013 California Fire Code with amendments the District deemed necessary to deal with local 

climate, geological or topographical conditions. 

 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that the Board of Supervisors of the County of EI Dorado ratifies 

the following building code Amendments to the California Fire Code adopted by Meeks Bay Fire Protection District: 

 

These changes include amendments and additions to the California Fire Code in the following sections: 

105.6.26-27,109.4, 111.4, 113.6, 113.6.1, 507.5.1, 604.1, 903.2, 903.2a, 903.2b, 903.2.1.1, 903.2.1.2, 903.2.1.3, 903.2.1.4, 

903.2.2.1, 903.2.3, 903.2.4, 903.2.7, 903.2.9, 903.2.10, 907.2a, 907.2b, 907.2c, 5601.2, 5608.2, Table 6104.3 Footnote 

“d”, 6112.1, 6112.2, 6112.3, 6112.4, 6113.1, Appendix B105.2.   

 

These changes also include the following International Fire Code Sections and Appendices not adopted by the State of 

California; 101.1 thru 101.5, 102.6 thru 102.8, 102.10 thru 102.12, 103.1 thru 104.1, 104.3 thru 104.4, 104.6 thru 104.6.4, 

104.8, thru 104.9.2, 104.10.1 thru 104.11.3, 105.2.3, 105.3.1 thru 105.3.2, 105.6.9, Table 105.6.10, 105.6.12, 105.6.16 thru 

105.6.19, 105.6.27 thru 105.6.42, 105.6.44 thru 105.6.45, 105.7.15 thru 105.7.16, 106.1, 107.1 thru 108.3, 109.3.2 thru 

109.4.1, 112.1, 113.1 thru 115.5, 303.1-303.9, 305.1-305.4, 307.1, thru 307.5, 308.1 thru 308.5, 408.1 thru 408.11.3, 503  

F, J, and K, based on the 2012 edition of the International Fire Code as published by the International Code Council. 

 

 

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that the Board of Supervisors of the County of El Dorado delegates the enforcement 

of the Building Standards of the 2013 Fire Code for one and two family dwellings, and accessory structures thereto, to the 

County Building Official, or his or her authorized representative, and for all other fire code enforcement to the Chief of the 

Meeks Bay Fire Protection District or his or her authorized representative, for the territory served by that Department. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

14-1480 B 1 of 26



Resolution ________________ 

Page 2 of 2 

 

 

 

 

 

PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of Supervisors of the County of El Dorado at a regular meeting of said 

Board, held the _____ day of _____________________, 20__, by the following vote of said Board: 

 

 Ayes: 

Attest: Noes: 

James S. Mitrisin Absent: 

Clerk of the Board of Supervisors  

 

By: _____________________________________ _____________________________________ 

 Deputy Clerk Chair, Board of Supervisors 

 

14-1480 B 2 of 26



14-1480 B 3 of 26

MEEKS BAY FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT 

ORDINANCE 
No: 1 

IT ORDAINED BY 

TIIEBOARDOF 

AS FOllOWS: 

AN ORDINANCE OF MEEKS FIRE PROTECTION ADOPTING 1HE 2013 EDmON OF 1HE 

CALIFORNIA FIRE BASED UPON 1HE 2012 EDmON OF 1HE INTERNATIONAL CODE, 

REGULATING AND GOVERNING 1HE SAFEGUARDING OF LlFE AND PROPERTY FROM FIRE AND 

EXPLOSION HAZARDS ARISINGFROMTIIE STORAGE, HANDLING AND USE OF HAZARDOUS SUBSTANCES, 

MATERIALS AND AND FROM CONDffiONS HAZARDOUS TO LlFE OR PROPERTY IN 1HE 

OCCUPANCY OF BUILDINGS AND PREMISES IN PROTECTION PROVIDING 

FOR 1HE ISSUANCE OF PERMITS AND COLLECTION OF FEES REPEALING ORDINANCE No. 
35 OF MEEKS BAY PROTECTION DISTRICT AND ALL OTHER ORDINANCES AND PARTS OF 1HE 

ORDINANCES IN CONFLICT THEREWITH. 

it ordained by the Board of Directors of Meeks Bay Fire Protection District: 

SECTION 1: FINDINGS: 

Protection District makes certain changes (listed below) to the California Fire Code, 
.._,""''""'·"· pursuantto Health and Code Section 13869.7, 17958.7 18941.5 during this 

code adoption process. Such are necessary because of climatic, geological and/or 
topographic conditions. Bay Fire Protection District has adopted, pursuant to Section 18941.5 
of California Safety Code, of relative to conditions by 
Resolution 2013-06 ofMeeks Protection dated October , 2013. 

changes include amenctnum 
.:>vVCJlVU.:>, 105.6.26-27,109.4, 111 

and additions to the Fire 
113.6, 113.6.1, 503, 507.5.1, 604.1, 

Ord.13-1 
Pagel ofl7 



14-1480 B 4 of 26

903.2.1.1, 903.2.1 903.2.1 903.2.1 903.2.2.1, 903.2.3, 903.2.4, 903.2.7, 903.2.9, 903 
907.2a, 907.2b, 907.2c, 5601 5608.2, Table 04.3 Footnote "d", 6112.1, 6112.2, 6112.3, 6112.4, 

13.1, Appendix These are SECTION 2: of 
this v• ............... ...,v. 

==~t..=~~~~~~· 101.1 thru 101 102.6 102.8,102.10 102. 103.1 thru 
1, 104.3 thru 104.4, 1 thru 104.6.4, 104.8, thru 104.9.2, 104.10.1 thru 104.11.3, 105.2.3, 

thru 105.3.2, 105.6.9, Table 105.6.10, 105.6.12, 105.6.16 thru 105.6.19, 105.6.27 thru 
105.6.42, 105.6.44 thru 105.6.45, 105.7.15 thru 105.7.1 106.1, 107.1 thru 108.3, 109.3.2 thru 
109.4.1, 1 113.1 thtu 11 
408.1 thru 408.11.3, 503 F, J, and K, based on 
published by the International Code Council. 

That a document, three (3) copies of are on in 
of Directors (Fire District), being marked and """~"5'-''"'"'""' 

Code, edition, in entirety, and following International Code Sections and 
Appendices not adopted by of 101.1 thru 101 102.6 thru 102.8, 102.10 thru 
102. 103.1 1, 104.3 104.4, 104.6 104.6.4, 104.8, thru 104.9.2, 104.10.1 
104.11 105.2.3, 105.3.1 thru 105.3.2, 105.6.9, Table 1 10,1 12, 1 16thru 105.6.19, 
105.6.27 105.6.42, 105.6.44 thru 105.6.45, 105.7.15 thru 105.7.16, 106.1, thru 1 
109.3.2 thru 109.4.1, 112.1, 113.1 115.5,=-'-"-"==='-'-"-'-~'-'-"-'=~:..:....:.:L~-'-"-'-=::...::::...::...:....=..:~ 

as published by 
Fire Code, be and is adopted as Fire m 

of California regulating and governing and property from fire and 
explosion hazards arising from the storage, handling and use ofhazardous materials and 

and conditions hazardous to life or property in the occupancy buildings and 
premises as herein provided; providing for issuance of permits and collection of fees 
and and all of the regulations, provisions, penalties, conditions and terms of said Code on 

in the office ofMeeks Bay Protection are hereby to, adopted, and made a 
hereof, as if fully set out this ordinance, the additions, insertions, deletions and vuaJ.l!';'-""• 

any, prescribed Section 3 of this ordinance. 

following 

Chapter 1, Division II of Fire of Meeks Fire Protection 
District is Ull.l''u'·"''"' to as follows: 

Section 102.13 Application of this code to existing one and two-family dwellings. 

Ord.13-1 
2 of 17 



14-1480 B 5 of 26

105.6.27 of Chapter 1 of the 
to read as follows: 

105.6.27- LP Gas 
1. Storage use ofLP-gas. 

Gas 

Exception: A pennit is not required for individual containers with a 1 00 gallon water 
capacity or occupancies in Group 

uvv'LlVH } 09.4 1 the 
as follows: 

Section 111.4 of Chapter 1 ofthe 
to read as follows: 

Code of Meeks 

ofMeeksBay 

Protection District is 

Protection District is amended 

111.4. Failure to comply. Any person shall continue any work having been 
with a stop order, except such as that person is directed to perform to remove a 
violation or condition, shall be liable to a of not less than $500 or not more than 
$1,000. Safety Code Section 13 and 17995). 

Sections 113.6 11 
are added to read as follows: 

Ord.13-l 
3 of 

Code of Meeks Fire Protection District 



14-1480 B 6 of 26

Code Protection District is adopted and amended to 

503.1 Where required. 
apparatus access roads shall be provided and maintained accordance with ~Qlli~ 

=-="-'-"'=through==="'"· 

503.1.1 Buildings and facilities. 
Approved apparatus access roads shall for facility, building or portion 
a building constructed or into or within the jurisdiction. The apparatus 
access road comply with requirements of this section and shall extend to within 150 

720 mm) of all portions of the facility all portions of the exterior walls of the first story 
of the building as by an approved route around the exterior of the or facility. 

Exception: 
nun) where: 

is authorized to the dimension 150 

1. The building is I.UIJIIJ"U throughout with an approved automatic sprinkler 
accordance with or 

Ord.13-l 
Page 4 of 17 

:....==.:..=::... 

(45 720 

installed 



14-1480 B 7 of 26

access roads cannot be installed because of location on property, topography, 
grades or similar and an alternative 

means of fire protection is provided. 

3. are not more two Group or Group U occupancies. 

503.1.2 Additional access. 
The fire official is authorized to more than one apparatus access based on 

potential for impairment single road by vehicle congestion, condition of terrain, climatic 
conditions or that could access. 

503.1.3 High-piled "~'"'.,.."'""' 
department 

with the applicable 

503.2 Specifications. 

for 

All apparatus access shall be installed 
through==="'· 

Code of Regulations, Title 19, 
(Roads) 

shall comply 

05(a)] 

(a) Roads. Required access roads from building to a street shall all-weather 
hard-suifaced (suitable for use by fire apparatus) right-of-way not less 20 feet (6096 mm) 
in width. Such right-of-way shall be maintained only as access to the public 
street. 

· The agency waive or this requirement if in his opinion such 
all-weather hard surfaced condition is not necessary in the interest of public safety and welfare. 

access roads shall have 

503.2.2 Authority. 
The fire code official shall have the authority to require an increase in the minimum access 
widths where they are inadequate for or rescue operations. 

Ord.l3-1 
5 of 17 



14-1480 B 8 of 26

503.2.3 Surface. 
Fire apparatus access roads and maintained to support 
apparatus and be surfaced so as to provide driving ""'~'uuu<e''"'"· 
surfaces be asphalt, concrete or other approved surface. 

503.2.4 Turning 
The required turning 
official. 

a fire 

503.2.6 Bridges and elevated surfaces. 

access road shall be by code 

a bridge or an elevated surface is part of a apparatus access road, the bridge shall be 
constructed maintained in accordance with the current Dorado County Transportation 
Division bridge standard. Bridges and elevated surfaces shall designed for a live load 
sufficient to carry imposed loads of fire apparatus. Vehicle load limits be posted at both 
entrances to when by the fire code official. elevated surfaces designed 
for emergency vehicle use are adjacent to surfaces which are not designed such use, approved 

approved signs or both shall installed maintained when required by the .fire 
official. 

503.2.7 Grade. 
within the limits established by code 

£-:u.J'"' .. -" of approach departure. 
The of approach and departure apparatus access shall within 
established by code official based on the agency's apparatus. 

503.3 Marking. 
Where required by code official, approved signs or other approved or •uuu·u'"o"' 
that include the words NO LANE be for apparatus access 
roads to identify means by which fire lanes 
are designated be maintained a clean and legible condition at times and shall be 
replaced or repaired when necessary to provide adequate visibility. 

503.4 Obstruction of fire apparatus access roads. 
Fire apparatus access roads shall not be obstructed any manner, including the of 

'-'U'"'""''"'· The minimum widths and established in 503 shall be maintained 

503.4.1. Traffic '-<UJLILLUJ<~ devices. 
calming shall prohibited unless approved 

Ord.l3-l 
Page 6 of 17 

official. 



14-1480 B 9 of 26

503.4.3 Roads from 20 to 29 feet in width. 
Section 503.4.3 the Fire of Meeks Protection 
follows: 

Protection District is amended to as 
follows: 

Protection District is to read as 
follows: 

Required gates or barricades. 
code official is authorized to the installation and of gates or 

approved barricades across apparatus access roads, or other accessways, not ='"''''"'"'·'-.U"" 
public streets, or Electric operators, provided, shall be 
accordance intended for operation be constructed 
and installed to comply with the requirements ASTM F 2200. 

503.5.1 Secured and barricades. 
When gates barricades secured in an approved manner. Roads, 
other that have been closed n<'T'MlE'TPrl in by Section 

1th1"1n~rPrl by the owner and the fire official. 

not apply to public officers within scope of 
duty. 

503.5.2 Fences and gates. grounds may be fenced and therein may be equipped. 
with locks, provided that safe dispersal areas on 3 square feet (0.28 occupant are 
located between the school and the fence. Such required safe dispersal areas shall not be located 
less 50 feet (15 240 mm) from school buildings. public and private school shall 
conform with 32020 of the Education Code, which states: The governing board of every 

school district, and the authority of every private school, which maintains any 

Ord.l3-l 
7 of 17 



14-1480 B 10 of 26

building the instruction or of school pupils on land 
for building walls) shall, through cooperation with the local law 
and fire-protection of the area, make provision for 
gates in such fences or walls. shall be of sufficient size to permit the entrance of the 
ambulances, police equipment and fire-fighting apparatus used by the law enforcement and 
fire-protection shall be no less than one such access gate and there shall 
many such gates as to assure access to all major buildings and ground areas. 
gates are to be with locks, the locking devices shall be designed to permit ready 
entrance by the use of the or bolt-cutting devices with which the local law enforcement and 
fire-protection na,?'fli"'JP .... 

503.6 Security 
The installation 
chief. 

for each structure. 

protection is provided. 

roadway. 

apparatus access road shall 
they shall have an 

Pn'IP.r<rTPY\I'Ur\t"\.>TQT1r\Tl shall be U~U"-H<UJ..L.IvUfYrH>r<lTl£\n 

be listed in accordance with 
designed, constructed and installed to comply with 

Ord.13-l 
8 of 17 



14-1480 B 11 of 26

Ord.13-1 
9 ofl? 



14-1480 B 12 of 26

VVHVUU 604.1 of Meeks 
to read as follows: 

Section 604.1 is Amendment as follows: 

Section 604.1 Installations. and standby power systems required by this or the 
California Building Code shall be installed in accordance with this code, 110 and NFP A 
111. M!mtlillill~~::.tm!rrm:~!!!!t!~:tm:~~fu.!!J~~!!m!:Wi~~Dm!tmn~m 

Section 903.2 is amended to as follows: 

Section Chapter 9 of the Code is amended 
to as follows: 

automatic sprinkler system required and installed in all buildings or structures, 
greater than 3600 square when constructed or relocated the jurisdiction. 

Exceptions: 

Sections 903 .2.b 
are added to read as follows: 

Ord.l3-1 
Page 10 ofl7 

Code 



14-1480 B 13 of 26

Ord.l3-l 
llofl7 



14-1480 B 14 of 26

907.2.b 907.2.c of 
are added to read as follows: 

One and two family dwellings (R-3 Occupancies) 

to read as follows: 

1. 

Ord.13-1 
Page 12 ofl7 

Fire of Meeks Fire 



14-1480 B 15 of 26

5601.2 of Chapter 56 
as follows: 

Section 5608.2 of 
follow: 

11d" ofChapter 
u.u''"'"' .. "''"' to read as follows: 

Section 6112 of Chapter 61 of the 
read as follows: 

Code of Meeks Bay Protection District is 

is added to as 

ofMeeksBay 

Ord.l3-l 
13 of 17 

Protection District is added to 



14-1480 B 16 of 26

.._,,.,,.,. .. v .. 61 of Chapter 61 of the Code of 
as follows: 

U'-''-''L>VU 6112,3 of Meeks 
to read as follows: 

U'-'\JLIU'" 61 of Chapter of the Fire of Meeks 
read as follows: 

Ord.B-1 
Page 14 ofl7 

Bay Protection District is 

District is added to 



14-1480 B 17 of 26

Section 61 
to read as 

the area. 

Section 61 of '-"Ll''-'IJV'-'' 

as follows: 
of the Fire 

Meeks Protection District is added 

of Meeks Protection is to 

Section 6113.1 is added to read as follows: Permits and Plans. 

Section 6113.1 of Chapter 61 of the of Meeks Fire 
to read as 

Section 05.2 of Appendix B of Code Meeks Bay Protection is 
amended to read as 

1. A reduction required flow up to IJ'-'''"''"''·"· as approved, is allowed the 
building is provided an approved aUJ:onlatllC sprinkler system installed accordance 
with 903.3 .1.1 or resulting fire shall not than 1 ,500 

duration as 05.1. 

Ord.13-1 
15 of 17 



14-1480 B 18 of 26

geographic limits to 
Protection District are hereby established as follows: 

limits, rpt,p.rr,,rt to in Sections 5704.2.9.6.1 of the Code Bay Protection 
District in of Class I flammable liquids or II combustible liquids 
above-ground tanks of buildings is restricted, are hereby established as limits 
Bay Protection El Dorado. 

limits, referred to in Sections of the of Meeks Bay Fire Protection 
in the storage Class I liquids or II combustible liquids in above-ground 
tanks is restricted, are established as the limits of Meeks Bay Fire District, County 
of Dorado. 

The limits referred to Section 5806.2 of the Code 
storage of flammable fluids stationary cot1taJ:ne1rs 

established as of" ... '"'"'""' l:'rc,tec:tton District, County 

Section 6104.2 - Geographic limits in which storage of liquefied petroleum gases is to be 
restricted for the protection of heavily populated and congested areas: 

The limits, referred to in Section 6104.2 of the Fire in which ofliquefied 
petroleum gas in excess of an of 2,000 gallons water capacity is restricted, are hereby 
established as limits District, County 

Ord.13-l 
Page 16 of 17 



14-1480 B 19 of 26

SECTION 5: CONFLICT: 

District, all other ordinances or of 

If any Ordinance, article, subsection or subdivision thereof, provision, clause of 
code, or any application is for any reason held to be invalid by a court of competent 

jurisdiction, decision shall not the provisions of this code, can be given 
without the invalid portions and, therefore, invalid portions are declared to severable. 

Meeks Protection District hereby declares that it would have this Ordinance and 
sections, subsections, or subdivisions provisions, sentences, or 

1rrf'oo:n,P'I't1vP of the fact one or more them is invalid. 

Tbis shall thirty days after 
District Board Secretary is to publish 

the District. of publication of the full text the ordinance, a summary the ordinance 
published by the Secretary within fifteen (15) days after its passage and a 
copy shall posted in office of Bay Fire Protection pursuant to 

Government Code 36933 (1). 

PASSED AND ADOPTED BY THE BOARD OF DIRECfORS OF MEEKS BAY FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT, COUNTY 

OF ELDORADO AT A REGULAR BOARD MEETING OF SAID BOARD, HELD 

THE FOLLOWING VOTE OF SAID BOARD: 

AYES: 

NOES: 0 

ABSTENTIONS: () 

ABSENT: \ 

DIRECTORS ON THE DATE THEREIN SET FORTH. 

C:\Uscn\Shawn\Do<Umeo!SIOffice\Board\Ordinances\l3·1 Ftre Code.wpd 

BY: Edward I Miller 



14-1480 B 20 of 26

I 
I 

I 
I 



14-1480 B 21 of 26

J Meeks Bay Fire Protection District 

RESOLUTION 
of the Board of Directors 

No: 2013-06 

WHEREAS, the District intends to adopt an adopting the Code, 2013 Edition, and 
n .... ULUl"'- COnditions hazardOUS tO life, nrnnPT"t'\1 environment 

'"'""I"U'"u'lL, naz~rrct•ous materials and uses; and 

WHEREAS, the climatic, topographical within the uvuw.uat 

of the District make it reasonably necessary the District to impose more stringent requirements than set 
forth in the Fire Code and ""'"~""·nt to California Health and Code sections 13869.7 

.u.u.•""-'-'l=>" to that effect. 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that the of Directors of the Bay Fire Protection...,.,, .... ,,,,. 
hereby adopt findings concerning current unique local conditions that together make each 
modification to the Fire 2013 reasonably necessary to provide and 
effective property, and 

General. due consideration, the Board of Directors ofthe Meeks Protection District, 
finds that due to local climatic, geologic, and conditions as within this there 
is a need to provide the modifications and changes contained in the adoptive Ordinance of the 2013 
California Such changes are to be reasonably necessary to provide and 
effective protection of life, property, and 

fire protection, fire prevention, EMS, and rescue services 
county areas County with a size of6.06 square miles. The 

omma:anes extend from Boundary in to the El 
boundary line. District also includes the two Emerald Bay tracts on 

of the Bay. The includes the private and structure between the shore of 
Lake Tahoe and the upper streets in . along the 89 conidor. It not include 
the lands belonging to the California State Parks or USFS. The District has established one full time 
staffed one volunteer station to provide emergency services to the Fire 
Station 61 is at 8041 Emerald Road in Meeks Bay. Fire 62 is located in the Tahoma 
subdivision on 7th Ave. The District is staffed with full time and administrative personnel and is 

nru1:-nme and along with staff and a fuels reduction staff. 

The District has numerous athletic events that occur yearly or go through the as well as a 
significant runount of tourism due to the to Lake and many world class 
a reasonable of the District boundaries. Such events and can present significant mcreases 
of vehicular and population the District. These increased conditions result in a demand 
for providing emergency services. 



14-1480 B 22 of 26

!::::.!.!:~~· The Protection District is within a region. 
is subject to seasons with annual average snow fall in the winter months armmd 240 inches 

(20 feet) in addition to an average rainfall of inches per year. A years ago, we 
experienced precipitation amounts that were double figures. These weather conditions 
create severe hazardous road conditions as as and rock along the main 
access roads within, as well as into the District from the surrounding areas. ofheavy snow 
and rainfall, along with repeated road closures, the ability of the Fire to provide 
=""·""' ....... «''"' emergency response is often delayed. These same climatic conditions 
a number of vehicular accidents that place extreme on the 
to emergency rescue, first aid, hazardous 
conditions often result in a or total lack of District to respond 
l..l..l.lJ..U....,, ........ , • ...,,, to other of emergency situations occur. Examples of these emergency situations 
include structure wildland and forest fires, materials incidents, calls, 
vehicle accidents, or rescues. The mutual agreements established with adjoining fire 

might not be to adverse climatic conditions having or totally blocked 
access into the District. 

se1:SillllC Zone 
"'-'l•i>Ull'-' geological 

..., ..... a.n.':."''"' of water mains, major breakage of 
collapsed structures, of propane 

and a large number calls for emergency aid, of which may occur simultaneously 
a seismic event. The water districts have numerous water-pumping for fue 

suppression water as well as water storage providing water pressure. All of the 
pwmpmg systems are on electrical power operation. Such electrical 

v"''"''"v·"" during a seismic event. Water storage tanks for the storage 
water may also in such an event forcing the needs to traJnStJIOrt 

of fire will a on the 

cm:noos{:a of areas that are considered by the State severity 
zone mapping system to high fire severity zones wildland. Much is located 
within mountainous terrain covered with highly combustible vegetation including the presence of many 
coniferous forested areas. elevation within ranges from lake at feet to over 
8,000 feet at the highest within the District ranges from 0 degrees to (0-200%). 
Some of the structures areas of mountainous have very access due to 
narrow roadways with poor road The preserrce of many existing 
structures within the very hazard severity zone areas provides for a very of a 
structure fire spreading into a wildland or forest fire as well as the potential 

fue spreading to structures. 

PASSED AND ADOPTED BY THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS OF THE MEEKS BAY FIRE PROTECI10N DISTRICT OF THE 
COUNTY OF ELDORADO AT A REGULAR BOARD MEETING OF SAID BOARD, HELD ON THE 21st DAY 

BYTHEFOLLOWINGVOTEOFSAIDBOARD: ~ n 0 ~< A YES: 3 Miller, Warmack) ~\.f,(}., 
NOES: 2 Massie) ..__.. 

ABSTENTIONS: 0 PRESIDENT, BOARD OF DIRECTORS 

ABSENT: 0 BY: Edward I Miller 
I CERTIFY TI!AT THE FOREGOING IS A CORRECT COPY OF A RESOLUTIO.-::-N::-:D-UL~Y-AD~-::---TE--:-D-:-B-Y-S~--:--::---:-:--O~F 
DIRECTORS ON THE DATE THEREIN SET FORTH. 

BY: Shawn R. Crawford 



14-1480 B 23 of 26

SIERRA SUN 
P.O. Box 1888 City, NV 89702 
(775) 881-1201 FAX: (775) 887-2408 

Customer Account: # 1 066595 

Legal Account 
Meeks Bay Fire Protection District 
PO Box 1 
Tahoma, CA 96142 
Attn: Shawn Crawford 

Victoria Lopez 
(s)he is a clerk of the SIERRA 

SUN, a newspaper published Wednesday and 
at Truckee, in the of California. 

Copy Line 
NOI Adopt Fire Code 2013 

PO#: 

Ad #: 96506280 
of which a copy is hereto 
published in for 
required period of 1 time(s) commencing on 
10/23/2013, and ending on 10/23/201 all 

inclusive. 

City 

Price:$ 

Subscribed and sworn to before me this day 
of __ _ 

Notary Public 

Proof and Statement of Publication 
Ad #: 96506280 

olln!ent to Adopt the 
California Fire Code 

Notlce Is hereby given to the Intention of Meeks 
Bay Fire Protection District to adopt the 2013 
California Fire Code. The District shall hold Us first 
public hearing at 2:00pm on November 23, 2013, at 
8041 Hwy 89, Meeks Bay, CA, regarding the 
adoption of the 2013 California Fire Code pursuant 
to Health and Safety Code Section 13869. Copies 
of the code section referred to and any secondary 
code sections referred to, adopted by reference, 
are on file with the Secretary of the District and are 
open to public Inspection. Adoption of the 2013 
California Fire Code will enable all District 
personnel to follow one set of rules and regulations 
with regard to I he health and safety of the public 
and the District's response !hereto. 

Pub: October 23, 2013 Ad/19650628 



14-1480 B 24 of 26

RRASUN 
P.O. Box 1 City, NV 89702 
(775) 881-1201 FAX: (775) 887-2408 

Customer Account: # 1 066595 

legal Account 
Meeks Bay Protection District 

Box 189 
Tahoma, 96142 
Attn: Shawn Crawford 

Victoria ...... 1-Jl .. '"'-

That (s)he is a of SIERRA 
SUN, a newspaper published Wednesday and 
Friday at Truckee, in the of California. 

Copy Line 
NOI Adopt Fire Code 3 

PO#: 

Ad#: 96506660 

of which a copy is hereto attached, was 
published in said newspaper for the full 
required period of 1 time(s) commencing on 
10/30/201 and ending on 10/30/2013, all 
days inclusive. 

Price: $ 50.620 

Subscribed and sworn to me this 
of __ _ 

Notary Public 

Proof and Statement of Publication 
Ad #: 96506660 

Notice of Intent to Adopt the 
2013 California Fire Code 

Notice Is hereby given to the Intention of Meeks 
Bay Fire Protection District to adopt the 2013 
California Fire Coda. The District shall hold Its first 
public hearing at 2:00pm on November 23, 2013, at 
8041 Hwy 69, Meeks Bay, CA. regarding the 
adoption of the 2013 California Fire Code pursuant 
to Health and Safety Code Section 13869. Copies 
of the code section referred to and any secondary 
code sections referred to, adopted by reference, 
are on file with the Secretary ollhe District and are 
open to public Inspection. Adoption of the 2013 
California Fire Code will enable all District 
personnel to follow of rules and regulations 
with regard to the and safety of the public 
and the District's response thereto. · 

Date: October 30, 2013 
Shawn R. Crawford 
Clerk of the Board of Directors 
Meeks Bay Fire Protection District 

Pub: October 30, 2013 Ad#9650666 



14-1480 B 25 of 26

SIERRA SUN 
P.O. Box 1888 Carson City, NV 89702 

881-1201 FAX: (775) 887-2408 

Customer Account:# 1 

Meeks Bay Fire Protection District 
PO Box 189 
Tahoma, CA 96142 
Attn:· Shawn Crawford 

Victoria lopez 
That (s)he is a legal clerk of the SIERRA 
SUN, a newspaper published Wednesday and 

at Truckee, in the State of California. 

Copy 
Change of Meeting Date 

PO#: 

Ad#: 9714919D 
of which a copy is hereto attached, was 
published in newspaper for the full 
required period of 1 time(s) commencing on 
11/15/2013, and ending on 11/15/2013, all 
days inclusive. 

City 

Price: $ 60.430 

Subscribed and sworn to me this day 
of __ _ 

Notary Public 

Proof and Statement of Publication 
Ad 9714919D 

Notice of Change of Meeting Date and Time, and 
Intent to Adopt the 2013 California Are Code 

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that the regular 
mee!lng of the Board of Directors, lor the month of 
November, will be held on November 22nd, at 
2:00pm, at 8041 Hwy 89, Meeks Bay, CA. 

NOTICE IS FURTHER GIVEN to the intention of 
Meeks Bay Fire Protecllon District to adopt the 
2013 California Fire Code. The District shall hold Its 
second public hearing at 2:00pm on December 17, 
2013, at8041 Hwy 89, Meeks Bay, CA, regarding 
the adoption of the 2013 California Fire Code 
pursuant to Heallh and Safely Code Section 13869. 
Caples of the code section referred to and any 
secondary code sections referred to, adopted by 
reference, are on file with the Secretary of the 
District and are open to public lnspecllon. Adoplion 
of the 2013 California Fire Code will enable all 
District personnel to follow one set ol rules and 
regulations with regard to the health and safety of 
the public and the District's response thereto. 

Date: November 15, 2013 
Shawn R. Crawford 
Clerk of !he Board of Directors 
Meeks Bay Fire Protection District 

Pub: November 15, 2013 Ad"9714919 



14-1480 B 26 of 26

SIERRA SUN 
1888 Carson City, NV 89702 
-1201 FAX: (775) 887-2408 

Account: # 1 066595 

Attn: Shawn Crawford 

Jody Mudgett says: 
That (s)he is a legal clerk of the SIERRA 
SUN, a newspaper published Wednesday and 

at Truckee, in the State of California. 

of Meeting Date and 

1410 

which a copy is hereto attached, was 
published in said newspaper for the full 
required period of 1 time(s) commencing on 
12/6/201 and ending on 12/6/2013, all 

Notary Public 

Proof and Statement of Publication 
Ad 97711410 

Notice of Change of 
Meeting Date and Time, 

and Intent to 
Adopt the 2013 

California Fire Code 

NOTICE IS FURTHER 
GIVEN to the Intention of 
Meeks Bay Fire 
Prolecllon District to 
adopt the 2013 California 
Fire Code. The District 
shall hold Its second 
public hearing at 2:00pm 
on December 17, 2013, 
at 8041 Hwy 89, Meeks 
Bay, CA, regarding the 
adoption of the 2013 
California Fire Code 
pursuant to Health and 
Safety Code Section 
13869. Copies of the 
code section referred to 
and any secondary code 
sections referred to, 
adopted by reference, 
are on tile with the 
Secretary of the District 
and are open to public 
lnspecllon. Adoption of 
the 2013 California Fire 
Code will enable all 
District personnel to 
follow one set ol rules 
and regulations with 
regard to the health 
safely ollhe public 
the District's response 
thereto. 

., 




